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Chronological Index to Joint Appendix 
 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

12/29/2010 Complaint 1 JA000001-
JA000006 

01/14/2011 Amended Complaint 1 JA000007-
JA000012 

02/11/2011 Amended Summons 1 JA000013-
JA000016 

03/02/2011 Answer to Amended Complaint 1 JA000017-
JA000023 

10/25/2011 Transcript re Discovery Conference  1 JA000024-
JA000027 

11/08/2011 Scheduling Order 1 JA000028-
JA000030 

11/29/2011 Order Setting Civil Non-Jury Trial 1 JA000031-
JA000032 

12/15/2011 Stipulated Confidentiality Agreement and 
Protective Order 

1 JA000033-
JA000039 

12/16/2011 Notice of Entry of Stipulated 
Confidentiality Agreement and Protective 
Order 

1 JA000040-
JA000048 

08/27/2012 Transcript re Hearing 1 JA000049-
JA000050 

08/29/2012 Stipulation and Order to Extend Discovery 
Deadlines (First Request)  

1 JA000051-
JA000054 

08/30/2012 Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to 
Extend Discovery Deadlines (First 
Request)  

1 JA000055-
JA000060 

09/21/2012 Amended Order Setting Civil Non-Jury 
Trial  

1 JA000061-
JA000062 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

10/24/2012 Defendant's Motion for Summary 
Judgment  

1 JA000063-
JA000082 

10/24/2012 Appendix of Exhibits in Support of 
Defendant's Motion for Summary 
Judgment 

1 JA000083-
JA000206 

10/24/2012 Declaration of Aaron D. Shipley in 
Support of Defendant's Motion for 
Summary Judgment 

1 JA000207-
JA000211 

10/25/2012 Appendix of Exhibits in Support of 
Defendant's Motion for Summary 
Judgment – filed under seal

2 JA000212-
JA000321 

11/07/2012 Opposition to Defendant's Motion for 
Summary Judgment and Plaintiffs' Counter 
Motion for Partial Summary Judgment  

2 JA000322-
JA000351 

11/09/2012 Appendix of Exhibits to Plaintiffs' 
Memorandum of Points and Authorities in 
Opposition to Defendant's Motion for 
Summary Judgment and in Support of 
Plaintiffs' Counter Motion for Summary 
Judgment  – sections filed under seal

3-6 JA000352-
JA001332 

11/13/2012 Appendix of Exhibits to Plaintiffs' 
Memorandum of Points and Authorities in 
Opposition to Defendant's Motion for 
Summary Judgment and in Support of 
Plaintiffs' Counter Motion for Summary 
Judgment  

7-12 JA001333-
JA002053 

11/29/2012 Defendant's Opposition to Plaintiff's 
Counter Motion for Partial Summary 
Judgment Re: Real Parties in Interest 

13 JA002054-
JA002065 

12/06/2012 Transcript re Status Check 13 JA002066-
JA002080 

01/07/2013 Reply Brief in Support of Defendant's 
Motion for Summary Judgment  

13 JA002081-
JA002101 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

01/17/2013 Plaintiffs' Reply in Further Support of 
Their Counter Motion for Partial Summary 
Judgment  

13 JA002102-
JA002144 

03/01/2013 Defendant's Motion in Limine to Exclude 
Plaintiffs' Claim for Attorneys' Fees as an 
Element of Damages (MIL #1)  

13 JA002145-
JA002175 

03/01/2013 Defendant's Motion in Limine to Exclude 
Plaintiffs' Claim for Damages in the Form 
of Compensation for Time (MIL #2) 

13 JA002176-
JA002210 

03/05/2013 Transcript of Proceedings - March 5, 2013 14 JA002211-
JA002350 

03/14/2013 Order re Order Granting Plaintiffs 
Countermotion for Summary Judgment  

14 JA002351-
JA002353 

03/15/2013 Notice of Entry of Order re Order Granting 
Plaintiffs Countermotion for Summary 
Judgment  

14 JA002354-
JA002358 

03/20/2013 Plaintiffs Opposition to Defendant's 
Motion in Limine to Exclude Plaintiffs 
Claim for Attorney’s Fees as an Element 
of Damages MIL 1 

15 JA002359-
JA002408 

03/20/2013 Plaintiffs Opposition to Defendants 
Motion in Limine to Plaintiffs Claim for 
Damages in the form of compensation for 
time MIL 2  

15 JA002409-
JA002433 

03/21/2013 Motion to File Second Amended 
Complaint 

15 JA002434-
JA002461 

04/02/2013 Order re Order Denying Defendants 
Motion for Summary Judgment 

16 JA002462-
JA002464 

04/03/2013 Notice of Entry of Order re Order Denying 
Defendants Motion for Summary 
Judgment 

16 JA002465-
JA002470 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

04/08/2013 Defendant's Opposition to Plaintiffs' 
Motion for Leave to File a Second 
Amended Complaint 

16 JA002471-
JA002500 

04/17/2013 Second Amended Order Setting Civil Non-
Jury Trial  

16 JA002501-
JA002502 

04/23/2013 Plaintiffs Reply in Further Support of 
Motion for Leave to File Second Amended 
Complaint  

16 JA002503-
JA002526 

04/26/2013 Transcript re Hearing 16 JA002527-
JA002626 

05/10/2013 Plaintiffs Supplement to Motion for Leave 
to File a Second Amended Complaint 
Pursuant to the Courts order on Hearing on 
April 26, 2013  

16 JA002627-
JA002651 

05/10/2013 Defendant's Supplemental Brief in Support 
of Its Opposition to Plaintiffs' Motion for 
Leave to File a Second Amended 
Complaint 

16 JA002652-
JA002658 

05/30/2013 Order Granting Plaintiffs Motion for 
Leave to File a Second Amended 
Complaint 

16 JA002659-
JA002661 

06/05/2013 Order Granting Plaintiffs Motion for 
Leave to File a Second Amended 
Complaint 

16 JA002662-
JA002664 

06/05/2013 Notice of Entry of Order Granting 
Plaintiffs Motion for Leave to File a 
Second Amended Complaint

16 JA002665-
JA002669 

06/06/2013 Second Amended Complaint  16 JA002670-
JA002677 

07/03/2013 Answer to Second Amended Complaint 
and Counterclaim 

16 JA002678-
JA002687 

07/09/2013 Transcript re Hearing 17 JA002688-
JA002723 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

07/15/2013 Plaintiffs Reply to Defendants 
Counterclaim  

17 JA002724-
JA002731 

07/18/2013 Plaintiffs' Motion in Limine To Permit 
James J. Jimmerson, Esq. To Testify 
Concerning Plaintiffs' Attorney's Fees and 
Costs (MIL #25) 

17 JA002732-
JA002771 

07/22/2013 Defendant's Motion for Partial Summary 
Judgment  

17 JA002772-
JA002786 

07/22/2013 Plaintiffs Supplemental Opposition to 
Defendants Motion in Limine to Plaintiffs 
Claim for Damages in the Form of 
Compensation for Time MIL 2 

17 JA002787-
JA002808 

07/23/2013 Transcript re Status Check 17 JA002809-
JA002814 

08/05/2013 Defendant Pardee Homes of Nevada's 
Response to Plaintiffs' Motions in Limine 
#1-5; And #20-25

17 JA002815-
JA002829 

08/06/2013 Plaintiffs Opposition to Defendants 
Motion for Partial Summary Judgment  

17 JA002830-
JA002857 

09/16/2013 Reply in Support of Defendant's Motion 
for Partial Summary Judgment  

17 JA002858-
JA002864 

09/16/2013 Reply in Support of Defendant's Motion in 
Limine to Exclude Plaintiff's Claim for 
Attorney's Fees As An Element of 
Damages  

17 JA002865-
JA002869 

09/16/2013 Reply in Support of Defendant's Motion in 
Limine to Exclude Plaintiffs' Claim For 
Damages in the Form of Compensation for 
Time  

17 JA002870-
JA002874 

09/23/2013 Transcript re Hearing 18 JA002875-
JA002987 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

09/27/2013 Plaintiffs Supplement to Their Opposition 
to Defendants Motion for Partial Summary 
Judgment  

19-21 JA002988-
JA003203 

09/27/2013 Supplemental Brief in Support of 
Defendant's Motion for Partial Summary 
Judgment  

21 JA003204-
JA003209 

10/23/2013 Order Denying Motion for Partial 
Summary Judgment  

21 JA003210-
JA003212 

10/23/2013 Transcript re Trial 22 JA003213-
JA003403 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit A 23 JA003404-
JA003544 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit B – filed under seal 23 JA003545-
JA003625 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit C 23 JA003626-
JA003628 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit D 23 JA003629-
JA003631 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit E – filed under seal 23 JA003632-
JA003634 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit F 23 JA003635-
JA003637 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit G 23 JA003638 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit H 23 JA003639-
JA003640 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit I 23 JA003641-
JA003643 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit J – filed under seal 24 JA003644-
JA003669 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit K 24 JA003670-
JA003674 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit L 24 JA003675-
JA003678 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit M 24 JA003679-
JA003680 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit N 24 JA003681-
JA003683 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit O – filed under seal 25-26 JA003684-
JA004083 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit P 27 JA004084 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit Q 27 JA004085 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit R 27 JA004086-
JA004089 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit S 27 JA004090 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit T 27 JA004091-
JA004092 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit U 27 JA004093 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit V 27 JA004094 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit W 27 JA004095-
JA004096 



 

8 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit X 27 JA004097 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit Y 27 JA004098 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit Z 27 JA004099-
JA004100 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit AA 27 JA004101-
JA004102 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit BB 27 JA004103 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit CC 27 JA004104 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit DD 27 JA004105 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit EE 27 JA004106-
JA004113 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit FF 27 JA004114-
JA004118 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit GG 27 JA004119-
JA004122 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit HH 27 JA004123 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit II 27 JA004124 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit JJ 27 JA004125 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit KK 27 JA004126-
JA004167 



 

9 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit LL 27 JA004168 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit MM 27 JA004169 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit NN 27 JA004170-
JA004174 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit OO 27 JA004175-
JA004183 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit PP 27 JA004184-
JA004240 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit QQ 27 JA004241-
JA004243 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit RR 27 JA004244-
JA004248 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit SS 27 JA004249-
JA004255 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit TT 27 JA004256-
JA004262 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit UU 27 JA004263-
JA004288 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 1 27 JA004289-
JA004292 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 6 – filed under seal 27 JA004293-
JA004307 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 7 – filed under seal 27 JA004308-
JA004310 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 8 – filed under seal 27 JA004311-
JA004312 



 

10 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 9 – filed under seal 27 JA004313-
JA004319 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 10 – filed under seal 27 JA004320-
JA004329 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 11 – filed under seal 28 JA004330-
JA004340 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 12 – filed under seal 28 JA004341-
JA004360 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 13 – filed under seal 28 JA004361-
JA004453 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 21 28 JA004454 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 25 28 JA004455-
JA004462 

10/24/2013 Transcript re Trial 29-30 JA004463-
JA004790 

10/24/2013 Trial Exhibit VV 31 JA004791 

10/24/2013 Trial Exhibit 26 31 JA004792-
JA004804 

10/24/2013 Trial Exhibit 30 31 JA004805-
JA004811 

10/25/2013 Notice of Entry of Order Denying Motion 
for Partial Summary Judgment  

31 JA004812-
JA004817 

10/25/2013 Plaintiffs Trial Brief Pursuant to EDCR 
7.27 

31 JA004818-
JA004847 

10/28/2013 Transcript re Trial – filed under seal 32-33 JA004848-
JA005227 



 

11 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

10/28/2013 Trial Exhibit 15 34 JA005228-
JA005232 

10/28/2013 Trial Exhibit 18 34 JA005233-
JA005235 

10/28/2013 Trial Exhibit 19 34 JA005236-
JA005237 

10/28/2013 Trial Exhibit 20 34 JA005238-
JA005254 

10/28/2013 Trial Exhibit 23 34 JA005255-
JA005260 

10/28/2013 Trial Exhibit 24 34 JA005261-
JA005263 

10/29/2013 Transcript re Trial – filed under seal 35 JA005264-
JA005493 

10/29/2013 Trial Exhibit 28 36 JA005494-
JA005497 

10/29/2013 Trial Exhibit 29 36 JA005498-
JA005511 

10/30/2013 Transcript re Trial 37-38 JA005512-
JA005815 

10/30/2013 Trial Exhibit 23a 39 JA005816-
JA005817 

10/30/2013 Trial Exhibit 27 39 JA005818-
JA005820 

12/09/2013 Transcript re Trial – filed under seal 40-41 JA005821-
JA006192 

12/10/2013 Transcript re Trial 42-43 JA006193-
JA006530 



 

12 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

12/10/2013 Trial Exhibit WW 43 JA006531-
JA006532 

12/12/2013 Transcript re Trial – filed under seal 44-45 JA006533-
JA006878 

12/12/2013 Trial Exhibit XX 46 JA006879-
JA006935 

12/12/2013 Trial Exhibit 39 46 JA006936-
JA006948 

12/12/2013 Trial Exhibit 40 46 JA006949-
JA006950 

12/12/2013 Trial Exhibit 41 46 JA006951-
JA006952 

12/13/2013 Transcript re Trial - Part 1 46 JA006953-
JA007107 

12/13/2013 Transcript re Trial - Part 2 47-48 JA007108-
JA007384 

12/13/2013 Trial Exhibit 31a 48 JA007385-
JA007410 

06/24/2014 Pardee's Motion to Expunge Lis Pendens –  
section filed under seal 

48 JA007411-
JA007456 

06/25/2014 Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law and 
Order  

48 JA007457-
JA007474 

06/27/2014 Notice of Entry of Findings of Fact, 
Conclusions of Law and Order  

48 JA007475-
JA007494 

07/14/2014 Opposition to Pardee's Motion to Expunge 
Lis Pendens 

48 JA007495-
JA007559 

07/15/2014 Reply in Support of Pardee's Motion to 
Expunge Lis Pendens 

48 JA007560-
JA007570 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

07/24/2014 Order Granting Motion to Expunge Lis 
Pendens 

48 JA007571-
JA007573 

07/25/2014 Notice of Entry of Order Granting Motion 
to Expunge Lis Pendens 

48 JA007574-
JA007578 

07/17/2014 Transcript re Hearing 49 JA007579-
JA007629 

07/31/2014 Transcript re Hearing 49 JA007630-
JA007646 

08/25/2014 Plaintiff's Accounting Brief Pursuant to the 
court's Order Entered on June 25, 2014 

49 JA007647-
JA007698 

08/25/2014 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Supplemental 
Brief Regarding Future Accounting  

49 JA007699-
JA007707 

05/13/2015 Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law 
and Supplemental Briefing re Future 
Accounting 

49 JA007708-
JA007711 

05/13/2015 Notice of Entry of Order on Findings of 
Fact and Conclusions of Law and 
Supplemental Briefing re Future 
Accounting 

49 JA007712-
JA007717 

05/28/2015 Pardee's Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

49 JA007718-
JA007734 

05/28/2015 Appendix of Exhibits to Pardee's Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs  

50-51 JA007735-
JA008150 

06/15/2015 Judgment 52 JA008151-
JA008153 

06/15/2015  Notice of Entry of Judgment 52 JA008154-
JA008158 

06/19/2015 Plaintiffs, James Wolfram and Walt 
Wilkes' Memorandum of Costs and 
Disbursements  

52 JA008159-
JA008191 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

06/24/2015 Pardee's Motion to Retax Plaintiffs' 
Memorandum of Costs Filed June 19, 
2015 

52 JA008192-
JA008215 

06/29/2015 Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

52-53 JA008216-
JA008327 

06/29/2015 Motion to Strike "Judgment", Entered June 
15, 2015 Pursuant To NRCP. 52 (B) And 
N.R.C.P. 59, As Unnecessary and 
Duplicative Orders Of Final Orders 
Entered on June 25, 2014 and May 13, 
2015, and as Such, is a Fugitive Document 

53 JA008328-
JA008394 

06/29/2015 Plaintiffs' Motion Pursuant to NRCP 52(b) 
and 59 to Amend The Court's Judgment 
Entered on June 15, 2015, to Amend the 
Findings of Fact/conclusions of Law and 
Judgment Contained Therein, Specifically 
Referred to in the Language Included in 
the Judgment at Page 2, Lines 8 Through 
13 and the Judgment At Page 2, Lines 18 
Through 23 to Delete the Same or Amend 
The Same to Reflect the True Fact That 
Plaintiff Prevailed On Their Entitlement to 
the First Claim for Relief For an 
Accounting, and Damages for Their 
Second Claim for Relief of Breach of 
Contract, and Their Third Claim for Relief 
for Breach of the Implied Covenant for 
Good Faith and Fair Dealing and That 
Defendant Never Received a Judgment in 
its Form and Against Plaintiffs 
Whatsoever as Mistakenly Stated Within 
the Court's Latest "Judgment  – sections 
filed under seal 

54-56 JA008395-
JA008922 

06/30/2015 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Pardee's Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs  

57-58 JA008923-
JA009109 



 

15 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

06/30/2015 Supplement to Plaintiffs' Pending Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs, Motion to 
Strike Judgment, Motion Pursuant to 
NRCP 52(b) and NRCP 59 to Amend the 
Court's Judgment, and Plaintiffs' 
Opposition to Pardee's Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs  

59 JA009110-
JA009206 

07/02/2015 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Motion to 
Amend Judgment  

59 JA009207-
JA009283 

07/08/2015 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Pardee's Motion to 
Retax Costs 

60-61 JA009284-
JA009644 

07/08/2015 Errata to Motion to Strike "Judgment", 
Entered June 15, 2015 Pursuant to NRCP 
52(b) and NRCP 59, as Unnecessary and 
Duplicative Orders of Final Orders 
Entered on June 25, 2014 and May 13, 
2015, and as such, is a Fugitive Document 

62 JA009645-
JA009652 



 

16 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

07/08/2015 Errata to Plaintiffs' Motion Pursuant to 
NRCP 52(b) and 59 to Amend the Court's 
Judgment Entered on June 15, 2015, to 
Amend the Findings of Fact/Conclusions 
of Law and Judgment Contained Therein, 
Specifically Referred to in the Language 
Included in the Judgment at Page, 2, Lines 
8 through 13 and the Judgment at Page 2, 
Lines 18 through 23 to Delete the Same or 
Amend the Same to Reflect the True Fact 
that Plaintiff Prevailed on their Entitlement 
to the First Claim for Relief for an 
Accounting, and Damages for their Second 
Claim for Relief of Breach of Contract, 
and Their Third Claim for Relief for 
Breach of the Implied Covenant for Good 
Faith and Fair Dealing and that Defendant 
Never Received a Judgment in its form 
and Against Plaintiffs Whatsoever as 
Mistakenly Stated Within the Court's 
Latest "Judgment" 

62 JA009653-
JA009662 

07/08/2015 Pardee's Emergency Motion to Stay 
Execution of Judgment: and Ex Parte 
Order Shortening Time 

62 JA009663-
JA009710 

07/08/2015 Pardee's Supplemental Briefing in Support 
of its Emergency Motion to Stay 
Execution of Judgment  

62 JA009711-
JA009733 

07/10/2015 Transcript re Hearing 62 JA009734-
JA009752 

07/10/2015 Order on Pardee's Emergency Motion to 
Stay Execution of Judgment; and Ex Parte 
Order Shortening Time  

62 JA009753-
JA009754 



 

17 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

07/10/2015 Notice of Entry of Order on Pardee's 
Emergency Motion to Stay Execution of 
Judgment; and Ex Parte Order Shortening 
Time  

62 JA009755-
JA009758 

07/15/2015 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Opposition to 
Plaintiff's Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

62 JA009759-
JA009771 

07/15/2015 Appendix of Exhibits to Pardee Homes of 
Nevada's Opposition to Plaintiffs' Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs  

63 JA009772-
JA009918 

07/15/2015 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Consolidated 
Opposition To: (1) Plaintiff's Motion to 
Strike Judgment Entered on June 15, 2015 
Pursuant to NRCP 52(b) and NRCP 59; 
and (2) Plaintiffs' Motion Pursuant to 
NRCP 52(b) and 59 to Amend the Court's 
Judgment Entered on June 15, 2015  

63 JA009919-
JA009943 

07/15/2015 Appendix of Exhibits to Pardee Homes of 
Nevada's Consolidated Opposition to: (1) 
Plaintiff's Motion to Strike Judgment 
Entered on June 15, 2015 Pursuant to 
NRCP 52(b) and NRCP 59; and Plaintiffs' 
Motion Pursuant to NRCP 52(b) and 59 to 
Amend the Court's Judgment Entered on 
June 15, 2015  

64 JA009944-
JA010185 

07/16/2015 Errata to Pardee Homes of Nevada's 
Opposition to Plaintiffs' Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs  

65 JA010186-
JA010202 

07/17/2015 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Pardee Homes of 
Nevada's Motion to Amend Judgment and 
Countermotion for Attorney's Fees  

65-67 JA010203-
JA010481 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

07/24/2015 Plaintiffs' Motion for Reconsideration, Ex 
Parte (With Notice) of Application for 
Order Shortening Time Regarding Stay of 
Execution and Order Shortening Time 
Regarding Stay of Execution  

67 JA010482-
JA010522 

07/24/2015 Declaration of John W. Muije, Esq. In 
Support of Motion for Reconsideration  

67 JA010523-
JA010581 

08/10/2015 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Opposition to 
Plaintiffs' Motion for Reconsideration of 
the Order on Pardee's Emergency Motion 
to Stay Execution of Judgment  

67 JA010582-
JA010669 

08/17/2015 Reply Points and Authorities in Support of 
Motion for Reconsideration  

67 JA010670-
JA010678 

08/24/2015 Minute Order Denying Plaintiff's Motion 
for Reconsideration, Ex Parte (With 
Notice) of Application for Order 
Shortening Time Regarding Stay of 
Execution and Order Shortening Time 
Regarding Stay of Execution 

67 JA010679 

09/11/2015 Plaintiffs' Reply to Defendant's Opposition 
to Plaintiff's Motion for Attorney's Fees 
and Costs  

68 JA010680-
JA010722 

09/11/2015 Plaintiffs' Reply to Defendant's Opposition 
to Plaintiff's Motion to Strike "Judgment" 
Entered June 15, 2015 Pursuant to NRCP 
52(b) and NRCP 59  

68 JA010723-
JA010767 

09/11/2015 Plaintiffs' Reply to Defendant's Opposition 
to Plaintiff's Motion Pursuant to NRCP 
52(b) and NRCP 59 to Amend the Court's 
Judgment Entered on June 15, 2015  

68 JA010768-
JA010811 



 

19 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

09/12/2015 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Consolidated 
Reply in Support of (1) Motion to Retax 
Plaintiffs' Memorandum of Costs Filed 
June 19, 2015; and (2) Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs 

68 JA010812-
JA010865 

12/08/2015 Plaintiffs' Supplement to Plaintiffs' 
Opposition to Pardee's Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs

68 JA010866-
JA010895 

12/08/2015 Notice of Defendant Pardee Homes of 
Nevada's Non-Reply and Non-Opposition 
to "Plaintiff's Opposition to Pardee Homes 
of Nevada's Motion to Amend Judgment 
and Countermotion for Attorney's Fees"  

69 JA010896-
JA010945 

12/30/2015 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Consolidated 
Response to: (1) Plaintiffs' Notice of Non-
Reply and Non-Opposition to Plaintiffs' 
Opposition to Pardee's Motion to Amend 
Judgment and Countermotion for 
Attorney's Fees; and (2) Plaintiffs' 
Supplement to Plaintiffs' Opposition to 
Pardee's Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

69 JA010946-
JA010953 

01/11/2016 Plaintiffs' Reply to Defendants 
Consolidated Response to (1) Plaintiffs' 
Notice of Non-Reply and Non-Opposition 
to Plaintiff's Opposition to Pardee's Motion 
to Amend Judgment and Countermotion 
for Attorney's Fees And (2) Plaintiffs' 
Supplement to Plaintiffs' Opposition to 
Pardee's Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

69 JA010954-
JA010961 

01/15/2016 Transcript re Hearing 70 JA010962-
JA011167 



 

20 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

03/14/2016 Plaintiffs' Motion to Settle Two (2) 
Competing Judgments and Orders  

70 JA011168-
JA011210 

03/16/2016 Release of Judgment  71 JA011211-
JA011213 

03/23/2016 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Response to 
Plaintiffs' Motion to Settle Two (2) Sets of 
Competing Judgments and Orders 

71 JA011214-
JA011270 

04/20/2016 Plaintiffs' Reply to Defendant's Response 
and Supplement to Plaintiffs' Motion to 
Settle Two (2) Sets of Competing 
Judgments and Orders 

71 JA011271-
JA011384 

04/26/2016 Order from January 15, 2016 Hearings  71 JA011385-
JA011388 

05/16/2016 Judgment 71 JA011389-
JA011391 

05/17/2016 Notice of Entry of Judgment 71 JA011392-
JA011396 

05/23/2016 Plaintiffs' Memorandum of Costs and 
Disbursements  

71 JA011397-
JA011441 

05/31/2016 Pardee's Motion to Retax Plaintiffs' 
Memorandum of Costs Filed May 23, 
2016 

71 JA011442-
JA011454 

06/01/2016 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Motion to 
Amend Judgment 

72 JA011455-
JA011589 

06/06/2016 Pardee's Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs 

72 JA011590-
JA011614 

06/06/2016 Appendix of Exhibits to Pardee Homes 
Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs - 
Volume 1  

73-74 JA011615-
JA011866 



 

21 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

06/06/2016 Appendix of Exhibits to Pardee Homes 
Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs - 
Volume 2  

75-76 JA011867-
JA012114 

06/08/2016 Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs 

77 JA012115-
JA012182 

06/20/2016 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Pardee's Motion to 
Retax Plaintiffs' Memorandum of Costs 
Filed May 23, 2016  

77-79 JA012183-
JA012624 

06/21/2016 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Pardee's Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs  

80 JA012625-
JA012812 

06/21/2016 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Defendant, Pardee 
Homes of Nevada's, Motion to Amend 
Judgment and Plaintiffs' Countermotion 
for Attorneys' Fees and Costs Pursuant to 
NRS 18.010 and EDCR 7.60  

81 JA012813-
JA013024 

06/27/2016 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Opposition to 
Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

82 JA013025-
JA013170 

06/30/2016 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Reply in 
Support of Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

82 JA013171-
JA013182 

06/30/2016 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Reply in 
Support of Motion to Amend Judgment; 
and Opposition to Plaintiffs' 
Countermotion for Attorney's Fees 

82 JA013183-
JA013196 

07/01/2016 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Reply in 
Support of Motion to Retax Plaintiffs' 
Memorandum of Costs Filed May 23, 
2016 

82 JA013197-
JA013204 

08/02/2016 Plaintiffs' Reply in Support of Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs  
 

83-84 JA013205-
JA013357 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

08/02/2016 Plaintiffs' Reply in Support of 
Countermotion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

84-85 JA013358-
JA013444 

08/15/2016 Transcript re Hearing - August 15, 2016 86 JA013445-
JA013565 

09/12/2016 Plaintiffs' Brief on Interest Pursuant to the 
Court's Order Entered on August 15, 2016  

86 JA013566-
JA013590 

10/17/2016 Pardee's Supplemental Brief Regarding 
Pre- and Post-Judgment Interest Pursuant 
to the Court's Order  

86 JA013591-
JA013602 

11/04/2016 Plaintiffs' Reply Brief in Support of Brief 
on Interest Pursuant to the Court's Order 
Entered on August 15, 2016  

86 JA013603-
JA013612 

01/09/2017 Order and Judgment from August 15, 2016 
Hearings Regarding Defendants Motion to 
Amend Judgment 

86 JA013613-
JA013615 

01/09/2017 Order and Judgment from August 15, 2016 
Hearings Regarding Plaintiff's Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs  

86 JA013616-
JA013618 

01/09/2017 Order and Judgment from August 15, 2016 
Hearings Regarding Defendant's Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs 

86 JA013619-
JA013621 

01/10/2017 Notice of Entry of Order and Judgment 
from August 15, 2016 Hearings Regarding 
Plaintiff's Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

86 JA013622-
JA013628 

01/10/2017 Notice of Entry of Order and Judgment 
from August 15, 2016 Hearings Regarding 
Defendant's Motion for Attorney's Fees 
and Costs 

86 JA013629-
JA013635 
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01/10/2017 Notice of Entry of Order and Judgment 
from August 15, 2016 Hearings Regarding 
Defendant's Motion to Amend Judgment 

86 JA013636-
JA016342 

01/12/2017 Order on Plaintiffs' Countermotion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs Pursuant to 
NRS 18.010 and EDCR 7.60  

86 JA013643-
JA013644 

01/12/2017 Notice of Entry of Order on Plaintiffs' 
Countermotion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs Pursuant to NRS 18.010 and EDCR 
7.60  

86 JA013645-
JA013648 

01/12/2017 Order on Defendant's Motion to Retax 
Plaintiffs' Memorandum of Costs Filed 
May 23, 2016  

86 JA013649-
JA013651 

01/13/2017 Notice of Entry of Order on Defendant's 
Motion to Retax Plaintiffs' Memorandum 
of Costs Filed May 23, 2016  

86 JA013652-
JA013656 

02/08/2017 Pardee Notice of Appeal 86 JA013657-
JA013659 

04/07/2017 Pardee's Motion to Stay Execution of 
Judgment and Post-Judgment Orders 

86 JA013660-
JA013668 

04/07/2017 Appendix of Exhibits in Support of 
Pardee's Motion to Stay Execution of 
Judgment and Post-Judgment Orders, 
[Volume I]  

87 JA013669-
JA013914 

04/07/2017 Appendix of Exhibits in Support of 
Pardee's Motion to Stay Execution of 
Judgment and Post-Judgment Orders, 
[Volume II]  

88 JA013915-
JA014065 

04/27/2017 Plaintiffs' Response to Pardee's Motion to 
Stay Execution of Judgment and Post-
Judgment Orders  

88 JA014066-
JA014068 
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05/10/2017 Pardee's Reply in Support of Motion to 
Stay Execution of Judgment and Post-
Judgment Orders  

88 JA014069-
JA014071 

05/12/2017 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Pardee's Motion 
Stay Execution of Judgment and Post-
Judgment Orders  

88 JA014072-
JA014105 

07/12/2007 Supplemental Order Regarding Plaintiffs' 
Entitlement to, and Calculation of, 
Prejudgment Interest 

88 JA014106-
JA014110 

07/14/2017 Notice of Entry of Supplemental Order 
Regarding Plaintiffs' Entitlement to, and 
Calculation of, Prejudgment Interest 

88 JA014111-
JA014117 

10/12/2017 Amended Judgment 88 JA014118-
JA014129 

10/13/2017 Notice of Entry of Amended Judgment 88 JA014130-
JA014143 

10/12/2017 Order Re: Defendant Pardee Homes of 
Nevada's Motion to Stay Execution of 
Judgment and Post-Judgment Orders  

88 JA014144-
JA014146 

10/13/2017 Notice of Entry of Order Re: Defendant 
Pardee Homes of Nevada's Motion to Stay 
Execution of Judgment and Post-Judgment 
Orders  

88 JA014147-
JA014151 

11/02/2017 Pardee Amended Notice of Appeal 88 JA014152-
JA014154 
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Alphabetical Index to Joint Appendix 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

01/14/2011 Amended Complaint 1 JA000007-
JA000012 

10/12/2017 Amended Judgment 88 JA014118-
JA014129 

09/21/2012 Amended Order Setting Civil Non-Jury 
Trial  

1 JA000061-
JA000062 

02/11/2011 Amended Summons 1 JA000013-
JA000016 

03/02/2011 Answer to Amended Complaint 1 JA000017-
JA000023 

07/03/2013 Answer to Second Amended Complaint 
and Counterclaim 

16 JA002678-
JA002687 

10/24/2012 Appendix of Exhibits in Support of 
Defendant's Motion for Summary 
Judgment 

1 JA000083-
JA000206 

10/25/2012 Appendix of Exhibits in Support of 
Defendant's Motion for Summary 
Judgment – filed under seal

2 JA000212-
JA000321 

04/07/2017 Appendix of Exhibits in Support of 
Pardee's Motion to Stay Execution of 
Judgment and Post-Judgment Orders, 
[Volume I]  

87 JA013669-
JA013914 

04/07/2017 Appendix of Exhibits in Support of 
Pardee's Motion to Stay Execution of 
Judgment and Post-Judgment Orders, 
[Volume II]  

88 JA013915-
JA014065 

06/06/2016 Appendix of Exhibits to Pardee Homes 
Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs - 
Volume 1  

73-74 JA011615-
JA011866 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

06/06/2016 Appendix of Exhibits to Pardee Homes 
Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs - 
Volume 2  

75-76 JA011867-
JA012114 

07/15/2015 Appendix of Exhibits to Pardee Homes of 
Nevada's Consolidated Opposition to: (1) 
Plaintiff's Motion to Strike Judgment 
Entered on June 15, 2015 Pursuant to 
NRCP 52(b) and NRCP 59; and Plaintiffs' 
Motion Pursuant to NRCP 52(b) and 59 to 
Amend the Court's Judgment Entered on 
June 15, 2015  

64 JA009944-
JA010185 

07/15/2015 Appendix of Exhibits to Pardee Homes of 
Nevada's Opposition to Plaintiffs' Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs  

63 JA009772-
JA009918 

05/28/2015 Appendix of Exhibits to Pardee's Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs  

50-51 JA007735-
JA008150 

11/09/2012 Appendix of Exhibits to Plaintiffs' 
Memorandum of Points and Authorities in 
Opposition to Defendant's Motion for 
Summary Judgment and in Support of 
Plaintiffs' Counter Motion for Summary 
Judgment – sections filed under seal 

3-6 JA000352-
JA001332 

11/13/2012 Appendix of Exhibits to Plaintiffs' 
Memorandum of Points and Authorities in 
Opposition to Defendant's Motion for 
Summary Judgment and in Support of 
Plaintiffs' Counter Motion for Summary 
Judgment  

7-12 JA001333-
JA002053 

12/29/2010 Complaint 1 JA000001-
JA000006 

10/24/2012 Declaration of Aaron D. Shipley in 
Support of Defendant's Motion for 
Summary Judgment 

1 JA000207-
JA000211 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

07/24/2015 Declaration of John W. Muije, Esq. In 
Support of Motion for Reconsideration  

67 JA010523-
JA010581 

08/05/2013 Defendant Pardee Homes of Nevada's 
Response to Plaintiffs' Motions in Limine 
#1-5; And #20-25

17 JA002815-
JA002829 

07/22/2013 Defendant's Motion for Partial Summary 
Judgment  

17 JA002772-
JA002786 

10/24/2012 Defendant's Motion for Summary 
Judgment  

1 JA000063-
JA000082 

03/01/2013 Defendant's Motion in Limine to Exclude 
Plaintiffs' Claim for Attorneys' Fees as an 
Element of Damages (MIL #1)  

13 JA002145-
JA002175 

03/01/2013 Defendant's Motion in Limine to Exclude 
Plaintiffs' Claim for Damages in the Form 
of Compensation for Time (MIL #2) 

13 JA002176-
JA002210 

11/29/2012 Defendant's Opposition to Plaintiff's 
Counter Motion for Partial Summary 
Judgment Re: Real Parties in Interest 

13 JA002054-
JA002065 

04/08/2013 Defendant's Opposition to Plaintiffs' 
Motion for Leave to File a Second 
Amended Complaint 

16 JA002471-
JA002500 

05/10/2013 Defendant's Supplemental Brief in 
Support of Its Opposition to Plaintiffs' 
Motion for Leave to File a Second 
Amended Complaint 

16 JA002652-
JA002658 

07/08/2015 Errata to Motion to Strike "Judgment", 
Entered June 15, 2015 Pursuant to NRCP 
52(b) and NRCP 59, as Unnecessary and 
Duplicative Orders of Final Orders 
Entered on June 25, 2014 and May 13, 
2015, and as such, is a Fugitive Document 

62 JA009645-
JA009652 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

07/16/2015 Errata to Pardee Homes of Nevada's 
Opposition to Plaintiffs' Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs 

65 JA010186-
JA010202 

07/08/2015 Errata to Plaintiffs' Motion Pursuant to 
NRCP 52(b) and 59 to Amend the Court's 
Judgment Entered on June 15, 2015, to 
Amend the Findings of Fact/Conclusions 
of Law and Judgment Contained Therein, 
Specifically Referred to in the Language 
Included in the Judgment at Page, 2, Lines 
8 through 13 and the Judgment at Page 2, 
Lines 18 through 23 to Delete the Same or 
Amend the Same to Reflect the True Fact 
that Plaintiff Prevailed on their 
Entitlement to the First Claim for Relief 
for an Accounting, and Damages for their 
Second Claim for Relief of Breach of 
Contract, and Their Third Claim for Relief 
for Breach of the Implied Covenant for 
Good Faith and Fair Dealing and that 
Defendant Never Received a Judgment in 
its form and Against Plaintiffs Whatsoever 
as Mistakenly Stated Within the Court's 
Latest "Judgment" 

62 JA009653-
JA009662 

05/13/2015 Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law 
and Supplemental Briefing re Future 
Accounting 

49 JA007708-
JA007711 

06/25/2014 Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law and 
Order  

48 JA007457-
JA007474 

06/15/2015 Judgment 52 JA008151-
JA008153 

05/16/2016 Judgment 71 JA011389-
JA011391 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

08/24/2015 Minute Order Denying Plaintiff's Motion 
for Reconsideration, Ex Parte (With 
Notice) of Application for Order 
Shortening Time Regarding Stay of 
Execution and Order Shortening Time 
Regarding Stay of Execution 

67 JA010679 

03/21/2013 Motion to File Second Amended 
Complaint 

15 JA002434-
JA002461 

06/29/2015 Motion to Strike "Judgment", Entered 
June 15, 2015 Pursuant to N.R.C.P. 52 (B) 
And N.R.C.P. 59, As Unnecessary and 
Duplicative Orders of Final Orders 
Entered on June 25, 2014 And May 13, 
2015, And as Such, Is A Fugitive 
Document  

53 JA008328-
JA008394 

12/08/2015 Notice of Defendant Pardee Homes of 
Nevada's Non-Reply and Non-Opposition 
to "Plaintiff's Opposition to Pardee Homes 
of Nevada's Motion to Amend Judgment 
and Countermotion for Attorney's Fees"  

69 JA010896-
JA010945 

10/13/2017 Notice of Entry of Amended Judgment 88 JA014130-
JA014143 

06/27/2014 Notice of Entry of Findings of Fact, 
Conclusions of Law and Order  

48 JA007475-
JA007494 

06/15/2015 Notice of Entry of Judgment 52 JA008154-
JA008158 

05/17/2016 Notice of Entry of Judgment 71 JA011392-
JA011396 

01/10/2017 Notice of Entry of Order and Judgment 
from August 15, 2016 Hearings Regarding 
Defendant's Motion for Attorney's Fees 
and Costs 

86 JA013629-
JA013635 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

01/10/2017 Notice of Entry of Order and Judgment 
from August 15, 2016 Hearings Regarding 
Defendant's Motion to Amend Judgment 

86 JA013636-
JA016342 

01/10/2017 Notice of Entry of Order and Judgment 
from August 15, 2016 Hearings Regarding 
Plaintiff's Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

86 JA013622-
JA013628 

10/25/2013 Notice of Entry of Order Denying Motion 
for Partial Summary Judgment  

31 JA004812-
JA004817 

07/25/2014 Notice of Entry of Order Granting Motion 
to Expunge Lis Pendens 

48 JA007574-
JA007578 

06/05/2013 Notice of Entry of Order Granting 
Plaintiffs Motion for Leave to File a 
Second Amended Complaint

16 JA002665-
JA002669 

01/13/2017 Notice of Entry of Order on Defendant's 
Motion to Retax Plaintiffs' Memorandum 
of Costs Filed May 23, 2016  

86 JA013652-
JA013656 

05/13/2015 Notice of Entry of Order on Findings of 
Fact and Conclusions of Law and 
Supplemental Briefing re Future 
Accounting 

49 JA007712-
JA007717 

07/10/2015 Notice of Entry of Order on Pardee's 
Emergency Motion to Stay Execution of 
Judgment; and Ex Parte Order Shortening 
Time  

62 JA009755-
JA009758 

01/12/2017 Notice of Entry of Order on Plaintiffs' 
Countermotion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs Pursuant to NRS 18.010 and EDCR 
7.60  

86 JA013645-
JA013648 

04/03/2013 Notice of Entry of Order re Order 
Denying Defendants Motion for Summary 
Judgment 

16 JA002465-
JA002470 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

03/15/2013 Notice of Entry of Order re Order 
Granting Plaintiffs Countermotion for 
Summary Judgment 

14 JA002354-
JA002358 

10/13/2017 Notice of Entry of Order Re: Defendant 
Pardee Homes of Nevada's Motion to Stay 
Execution of Judgment and Post-Judgment 
Orders  

88 JA014147-
JA014151 

12/16/2011 Notice of Entry of Stipulated 
Confidentiality Agreement and Protective 
Order 

1 JA000040-
JA000048 

08/30/2012 Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order 
to Extend Discovery Deadlines (First 
Request)  

1 JA000055-
JA000060 

07/14/2017 Notice of Entry of Supplemental Order 
Regarding Plaintiffs' Entitlement to, and 
Calculation of, Prejudgment Interest

88 JA014111-
JA014117 

11/07/2012 Opposition to Defendant's Motion for 
Summary Judgment and Plaintiffs' 
Counter Motion for Partial Summary 
Judgment  

2 JA000322-
JA000351 

07/14/2014 Opposition to Pardee's Motion to Expunge 
Lis Pendens 

48 JA007495-
JA007559 

01/09/2017 Order and Judgment from August 15, 
2016 Hearings Regarding Defendant's 
Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs

86 JA013619-
JA013621 

01/09/2017 Order and Judgment from August 15, 
2016 Hearings Regarding Defendants 
Motion to Amend Judgment 

86 JA013613-
JA013615 

01/09/2017 Order and Judgment from August 15, 
2016 Hearings Regarding Plaintiff's 
Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs  

86 JA013616-
JA013618 

10/23/2013 Order Denying Motion for Partial 
Summary Judgment  

21 JA003210-
JA003212 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

04/26/2016 Order from January 15, 2016 Hearings  71 JA011385-
JA011388 

07/24/2014 Order Granting Motion to Expunge Lis 
Pendens 

48 JA007571-
JA007573 

05/30/2013 Order Granting Plaintiffs Motion for 
Leave to File a Second Amended 
Complaint 

16 JA002659-
JA002661 

06/05/2013 Order Granting Plaintiffs Motion for 
Leave to File a Second Amended 
Complaint 

16 JA002662-
JA002664 

01/12/2017 Order on Defendant's Motion to Retax 
Plaintiffs' Memorandum of Costs Filed 
May 23, 2016  

86 JA013649-
JA013651 

07/10/2015 Order on Pardee's Emergency Motion to 
Stay Execution of Judgment; and Ex Parte 
Order Shortening Time  

62 JA009753-
JA009754 

01/12/2017 Order on Plaintiffs' Countermotion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs Pursuant to 
NRS 18.010 and EDCR 7.60  

86 JA013643-
JA013644 

04/02/2013 Order re Order Denying Defendants 
Motion for Summary Judgment 

16 JA002462-
JA002464 

03/14/2013 Order re Order Granting Plaintiffs 
Countermotion for Summary Judgment  

14 JA002351-
JA002353 

10/12/2017 Order Re: Defendant Pardee Homes of 
Nevada's Motion to Stay Execution of 
Judgment and Post-Judgment Orders  

88 JA014144-
JA014146 

11/29/2011 Order Setting Civil Non-Jury Trial 1 JA000031-
JA000032 

11/02/2017 Pardee Amended Notice of Appeal 88 JA014152-
JA014154 
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07/15/2015 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Consolidated 
Opposition To: (1) Plaintiff's Motion to 
Strike Judgment Entered on June 15, 2015 
Pursuant to NRCP 52(b) and NRCP 59; 
and (2) Plaintiffs' Motion Pursuant to 
NRCP 52(b) and 59 to Amend the Court's 
Judgment Entered on June 15, 2015  

63 JA009919-
JA009943 

09/12/2015 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Consolidated 
Reply in Support of (1) Motion to Retax 
Plaintiffs' Memorandum of Costs Filed 
June 19, 2015; and (2) Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs 

68 JA010812-
JA010865 

12/30/2015 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Consolidated 
Response to: (1) Plaintiffs' Notice of Non-
Reply and Non-Opposition to Plaintiffs' 
Opposition to Pardee's Motion to Amend 
Judgment and Countermotion for 
Attorney's Fees; and (2) Plaintiffs' 
Supplement to Plaintiffs' Opposition to 
Pardee's Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

69 JA010946-
JA010953 

06/01/2016 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Motion to 
Amend Judgment 

72 JA011455-
JA011589 

07/02/2015 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Motion to 
Amend Judgment  

59 JA009207-
JA009283 

06/27/2016 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Opposition to 
Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

82 JA013025-
JA013170 

07/15/2015 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Opposition to 
Plaintiff's Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

62 JA009759-
JA009771 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

08/10/2015 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Opposition to 
Plaintiffs' Motion for Reconsideration of 
the Order on Pardee's Emergency Motion 
to Stay Execution of Judgment  

67 JA010582-
JA010669 

06/30/2016 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Reply in 
Support of Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

82 JA013171-
JA013182 

06/30/2016 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Reply in 
Support of Motion to Amend Judgment; 
and Opposition to Plaintiffs' 
Countermotion for Attorney's Fees  

82 JA013183-
JA013196 

07/01/2016 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Reply in 
Support of Motion to Retax Plaintiffs' 
Memorandum of Costs Filed May 23, 
2016  

82 JA013197-
JA013204 

03/23/2016 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Response to 
Plaintiffs' Motion to Settle Two (2) Sets of 
Competing Judgments and Orders 

71 JA011214-
JA011270 

08/25/2014 Pardee Homes of Nevada's Supplemental 
Brief Regarding Future Accounting  

49 JA007699-
JA007707 

02/08/2017 Pardee Notice of Appeal 86 JA013657-
JA013659 

07/08/2015 Pardee's Emergency Motion to Stay 
Execution of Judgment: and Ex Parte 
Order Shortening Time 

62 JA009663-
JA009710 

06/06/2016 Pardee's Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs 

72 JA011590-
JA011614 

05/28/2015 Pardee's Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

49 JA007718-
JA007734 

06/24/2014 Pardee's Motion to Expunge Lis Pendens 
– section filed under seal 

48 JA007411-
JA007456 
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06/24/2015 Pardee's Motion to Retax Plaintiffs' 
Memorandum of Costs Filed June 19, 
2015  

52 JA008192-
JA008215 

05/31/2016 Pardee's Motion to Retax Plaintiffs' 
Memorandum of Costs Filed May 23, 
2016  

71 JA011442-
JA011454 

04/07/2017 Pardee's Motion to Stay Execution of 
Judgment and Post-Judgment Orders 

86 JA013660-
JA013668 

05/10/2017 Pardee's Reply in Support of Motion to 
Stay Execution of Judgment and Post-
Judgment Orders 

88 JA014069-
JA014071 

10/17/2016 Pardee's Supplemental Brief Regarding 
Pre- and Post-Judgment Interest Pursuant 
to the Court's Order  

86 JA013591-
JA013602 

07/08/2015 Pardee's Supplemental Briefing in Support 
of its Emergency Motion to Stay 
Execution of Judgment 

62 JA009711-
JA009733 

08/25/2014 Plaintiff's Accounting Brief Pursuant to 
the court's Order Entered on June 25, 2014

49 JA007647-
JA007698 

09/12/2016 Plaintiffs' Brief on Interest Pursuant to the 
Court's Order Entered on August 15, 2016 

86 JA013566-
JA013590 

05/23/2016 Plaintiffs' Memorandum of Costs and 
Disbursements  

71 JA011397-
JA011441 

06/08/2016 Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs 

77 JA012115-
JA012182 

06/29/2015 Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

52-53 JA008216-
JA008327 

07/24/2015 Plaintiffs' Motion for Reconsideration, Ex 
Parte (With Notice) of Application for 
Order Shortening Time Regarding Stay of 
Execution and Order Shortening Time 
Regarding Stay of Execution  

67 JA010482-
JA010522 
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07/18/2013 Plaintiffs' Motion in Limine To Permit 
James J. Jimmerson, Esq. To Testify 
Concerning Plaintiffs' Attorney's Fees and 
Costs (MIL #25) 

17 JA002732-
JA002771 

06/29/2015 Plaintiffs' Motion Pursuant to NRCP 52(b) 
and 59 to Amend The Court's Judgment 
Entered on June 15, 2015, to Amend the 
Findings of Fact/conclusions of Law and 
Judgment Contained Therein, Specifically 
Referred to in the Language Included in 
the Judgment at Page 2, Lines 8 Through 
13 and the Judgment At Page 2, Lines 18 
Through 23 to Delete the Same or Amend 
The Same to Reflect the True Fact That 
Plaintiff Prevailed On Their Entitlement to 
the First Claim for Relief For an 
Accounting, and Damages for Their 
Second Claim for Relief of Breach of 
Contract, and Their Third Claim for Relief 
for Breach of the Implied Covenant for 
Good Faith and Fair Dealing and That 
Defendant Never Received a Judgment in 
its Form and Against Plaintiffs 
Whatsoever as Mistakenly Stated Within 
the Court's Latest "Judgment  – sections 
filed under seal

54-56 JA008395-
JA008922 

03/14/2016 Plaintiffs' Motion to Settle Two (2) 
Competing Judgments and Orders  

70 JA011168-
JA011210 

06/21/2016 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Defendant, 
Pardee Homes of Nevada's, Motion to 
Amend Judgment and Plaintiffs' 
Countermotion for Attorneys' Fees and 
Costs Pursuant to NRS 18.010 and EDCR 
7.60  

81 JA012813-
JA013024 

08/06/2013 Plaintiffs Opposition to Defendants 
Motion for Partial Summary Judgment  

17 JA002830-
JA002857 
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03/20/2013 Plaintiffs Opposition to Defendant's 
Motion in Limine to Exclude Plaintiffs 
Claim for Attorney’s Fees as an Element 
of Damages MIL 1  

15 JA002359-
JA002408 

03/20/2013 Plaintiffs Opposition to Defendants 
Motion in Limine to Plaintiffs Claim for 
Damages in the form of compensation for 
time MIL 2  

15 JA002409-
JA002433 

07/17/2015 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Pardee Homes of 
Nevada's Motion to Amend Judgment and 
Countermotion for Attorney's Fees  

65-67 JA010203-
JA010481 

06/30/2015 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Pardee's Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs  

57-58 JA008923-
JA009109 

06/21/2016 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Pardee's Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs  

80 JA012625-
JA012812 

05/12/2017 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Pardee's Motion 
Stay Execution of Judgment and Post-
Judgment Orders 

88 JA014072-
JA014105 

07/08/2015 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Pardee's Motion 
to Retax Costs 

60-61 JA009284-
JA009644 

06/20/2016 Plaintiffs' Opposition to Pardee's Motion 
to Retax Plaintiffs' Memorandum of Costs 
Filed May 23, 2016  

77-79 JA012183-
JA012624 

11/04/2016 Plaintiffs' Reply Brief in Support of Brief 
on Interest Pursuant to the Court's Order 
Entered on August 15, 2016  

86 JA013603-
JA013612 

04/23/2013 Plaintiffs Reply in Further Support of 
Motion for Leave to File Second 
Amended Complaint  
 

16 JA002503-
JA002526 
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01/17/2013 Plaintiffs' Reply in Further Support of 
Their Counter Motion for Partial 
Summary Judgment 

13 JA002102-
JA002144 

08/02/2016 Plaintiffs' Reply in Support of 
Countermotion for Attorney's Fees and 
Costs  

84-85 JA013358-
JA013444 

08/02/2016 Plaintiffs' Reply in Support of Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs  

83-84 JA013205-
JA013357 

01/11/2016 Plaintiffs' Reply to Defendants 
Consolidated Response to (1) Plaintiffs' 
Notice of Non-Reply and Non-Opposition 
to Plaintiff's Opposition to Pardee's 
Motion to Amend Judgment and 
Countermotion for Attorney's Fees And 
(2) Plaintiffs' Supplement to Plaintiffs' 
Opposition to Pardee's Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs 

69 JA010954-
JA010961 

07/15/2013 Plaintiffs Reply to Defendants 
Counterclaim  

17 JA002724-
JA002731 

09/11/2015 Plaintiffs' Reply to Defendant's 
Opposition to Plaintiff's Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs 

68 JA010680-
JA010722 

09/11/2015 Plaintiffs' Reply to Defendant's 
Opposition to Plaintiff's Motion Pursuant 
to NRCP 52(b) and NRCP 59 to Amend 
the Court's Judgment Entered on June 15, 
2015  

68 JA010768-
JA010811 

09/11/2015 Plaintiffs' Reply to Defendant's 
Opposition to Plaintiff's Motion to Strike 
"Judgment" Entered June 15, 2015 
Pursuant to NRCP 52(b) and NRCP 59  

68 JA010723-
JA010767 

04/20/2016 Plaintiffs' Reply to Defendant's Response 
and Supplement to Plaintiffs' Motion to 
Settle Two (2) Sets of Competing 
Judgments and Orders 

71 JA011271-
JA011384 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

04/27/2017 Plaintiffs' Response to Pardee's Motion to 
Stay Execution of Judgment and Post-
Judgment Orders  

88 JA014066-
JA014068 

05/10/2013 Plaintiffs Supplement to Motion for Leave 
to File a Second Amended Complaint 
Pursuant to the Courts order on Hearing 
on April 26, 2013 

16 JA002627-
JA002651 

12/08/2015 Plaintiffs' Supplement to Plaintiffs' 
Opposition to Pardee's Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs

68 JA010866-
JA010895 

09/27/2013 Plaintiffs Supplement to Their Opposition 
to Defendants Motion for Partial 
Summary Judgment 

19-21 JA002988-
JA003203 

07/22/2013 Plaintiffs Supplemental Opposition to 
Defendants Motion in Limine to Plaintiffs 
Claim for Damages in the Form of 
Compensation for Time MIL 2 

17 JA002787-
JA002808 

10/25/2013 Plaintiffs Trial Brief Pursuant to EDCR 
7.27 

31 JA004818-
JA004847 

06/19/2015 Plaintiffs, James Wolfram and Walt 
Wilkes' Memorandum of Costs and 
Disbursements  

52 JA008159-
JA008191 

03/16/2016 Release of Judgment  71 JA011211-
JA011213 

01/07/2013 Reply Brief in Support of Defendant's 
Motion for Summary Judgment  

13 JA002081-
JA002101 

09/16/2013 Reply in Support of Defendant's Motion 
for Partial Summary Judgment  

17 JA002858-
JA002864 

09/16/2013 Reply in Support of Defendant's Motion in 
Limine to Exclude Plaintiff's Claim for 
Attorney's Fees as An Element of 
Damages  

17 JA002865-
JA002869 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

09/16/2013 Reply in Support of Defendant's Motion in 
Limine to Exclude Plaintiffs' Claim for 
Damages in the Form of Compensation for 
Time  

17 JA002870-
JA002874 

07/15/2014 Reply in Support of Pardee's Motion to 
Expunge Lis Pendens 

48 JA007560-
JA007570 

08/17/2015 Reply Points and Authorities in Support of 
Motion for Reconsideration  

67 JA010670-
JA010678 

11/08/2011 Scheduling Order 1 JA000028-
JA000030 

06/06/2013 Second Amended Complaint  16 JA002670-
JA002677 

04/17/2013 Second Amended Order Setting Civil 
Non-Jury Trial  

16 JA002501-
JA002502 

12/15/2011 Stipulated Confidentiality Agreement and 
Protective Order 

1 JA000033-
JA000039 

08/29/2012 Stipulation and Order to Extend Discovery 
Deadlines (First Request)  

1 JA000051-
JA000054 

06/30/2015 Supplement to Plaintiffs' Pending Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs, Motion to 
Strike Judgment, Motion Pursuant to 
NRCP 52(b) and NRCP 59 to Amend the 
Court's Judgment, and Plaintiffs' 
Opposition to Pardee's Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs  

59 JA009110-
JA009206 

09/27/2013 Supplemental Brief in Support of 
Defendant's Motion for Partial Summary 
Judgment  

21 JA003204-
JA003209 

07/12/2007 Supplemental Order Regarding Plaintiffs' 
Entitlement to, and Calculation of, 
Prejudgment Interest 

88 JA014106-
JA014110 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

03/05/2013 Transcript of Proceedings - March 5, 2013 14 JA002211-
JA002350 

10/25/2011 Transcript re Discovery Conference  1 JA000024-
JA000027 

08/27/2012 Transcript re Hearing 1 JA000049-
JA000050 

04/26/2013 Transcript re Hearing 16 JA002527-
JA002626 

07/09/2013 Transcript re Hearing 17 JA002688-
JA002723 

09/23/2013 Transcript re Hearing 18 JA002875-
JA002987 

07/17/2014 Transcript re Hearing 49 JA007579-
JA007629 

07/31/2014 Transcript re Hearing 49 JA007630-
JA007646 

07/10/2015 Transcript re Hearing 62 JA009734-
JA009752 

01/15/2016 Transcript re Hearing 70 JA010962-
JA011167 

08/15/2016 Transcript re Hearing - August 15, 2016 86 JA013445-
JA013565 

12/06/2012 Transcript re Status Check 13 JA002066-
JA002080 

07/23/2013 Transcript re Status Check 17 JA002809-
JA002814 

10/23/2013 Transcript re Trial 22 JA003213-
JA003403 



 

42 

Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

10/24/2013 Transcript re Trial 29-30 JA004463-
JA004790 

10/28/2013 Transcript re Trial – filed under seal 32-33 JA004848-
JA005227 

10/29/2013 Transcript re Trial – filed under seal 35 JA005264-
JA005493 

10/30/2013 Transcript re Trial 37-38 JA005512-
JA005815 

12/09/2013 Transcript re Trial – filed under seal 40-41 JA005821-
JA006192 

12/10/2013 Transcript re Trial 42-43 JA006193-
JA006530 

12/12/2013 Transcript re Trial – filed under seal 44-45 JA006533-
JA006878 

12/13/2013 Transcript re Trial - Part 1 46 JA006953-
JA007107 

12/13/2013 Transcript re Trial - Part 2 47-48 JA007108-
JA007384 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit A 23 JA003404-
JA003544 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit B – filed under seal 23 JA003545-
JA003625 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit C 23 JA003626-
JA003628 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit D 23 JA003629-
JA003631 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit E – filed under seal 23 JA003632-
JA003634 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit F 23 JA003635-
JA003637 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit G 23 JA003638 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit H 23 JA003639-
JA003640 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit I 23 JA003641-
JA003643 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit J – filed under seal 24 JA003644-
JA003669 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit K 24 JA003670-
JA003674 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit L 24 JA003675-
JA003678 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit M 24 JA003679-
JA003680 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit N 24 JA003681-
JA003683 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit O – filed under seal 25-26 JA003684-
JA004083 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit P 27 JA004084 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit Q 27 JA004085 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit R 27 JA004086-
JA004089 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit S 27 JA004090 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit T 27 JA004091-
JA004092 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit U 27 JA004093 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit V 27 JA004094 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit W 27 JA004095-
JA004096 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit X 27 JA004097 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit Y 27 JA004098 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit Z 27 JA004099-
JA004100 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 1 27 JA004289-
JA004292 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 10 – filed under seal 27 JA004320-
JA004329 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 11 – filed under seal 28 JA004330-
JA004340 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 12 – filed under seal 28 JA004341-
JA004360 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 13 – filed under seal 28 JA004361-
JA004453 

10/28/2013 Trial Exhibit 15 34 JA005228-
JA005232 

10/28/2013 Trial Exhibit 18 34 JA005233-
JA005235 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

10/28/2013 Trial Exhibit 19 34 JA005236-
JA005237 

10/28/2013 Trial Exhibit 20 34 JA005238-
JA005254 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 21 28 JA004454 

10/28/2013 Trial Exhibit 23 34 JA005255-
JA005260 

10/30/2013 Trial Exhibit 23a 39 JA005816-
JA005817 

10/28/2013 Trial Exhibit 24 34 JA005261-
JA005263 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 25 28 JA004455-
JA004462 

10/24/2013 Trial Exhibit 26 31 JA004792-
JA004804 

10/30/2013 Trial Exhibit 27 39 JA005818-
JA005820 

10/29/2013 Trial Exhibit 28 36 JA005494-
JA005497 

10/29/2013 Trial Exhibit 29 36 JA005498-
JA005511 

10/24/2013 Trial Exhibit 30 31 JA004805-
JA004811 

12/13/2013 Trial Exhibit 31a 48 JA007385-
JA007410 

12/12/2013 Trial Exhibit 39 46 JA006936-
JA006948 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

12/12/2013 Trial Exhibit 40 46 JA006949-
JA006950 

12/12/2013 Trial Exhibit 41 46 JA006951-
JA006952 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 6  – filed under seal 27 JA004293-
JA004307 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 7 – filed under seal 27 JA004308-
JA004310 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 8 – filed under seal 27 JA004311-
JA004312 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit 9 – filed under seal 27 JA004313-
JA004319 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit AA 27 JA004101-
JA004102 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit BB 27 JA004103 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit CC 27 JA004104 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit DD 27 JA004105 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit EE 27 JA004106-
JA004113 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit FF 27 JA004114-
JA004118 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit GG 27 JA004119-
JA004122 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit HH 27 JA004123 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit II 27 JA004124 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit JJ 27 JA004125 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit KK 27 JA004126-
JA004167 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit LL 27 JA004168 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit MM 27 JA004169 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit NN 27 JA004170-
JA004174 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit OO 27 JA004175-
JA004183 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit PP 27 JA004184-
JA004240 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit QQ 27 JA004241-
JA004243 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit RR 27 JA004244-
JA004248 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit SS 27 JA004249-
JA004255 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit TT 27 JA004256-
JA004262 

10/23/2013 Trial Exhibit UU 27 JA004263-
JA004288 

10/24/2013 Trial Exhibit VV 31 JA004791 
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Date Document Description Volume Labeled 

12/10/2013 Trial Exhibit WW 43 JA006531-
JA006532 

12/12/2013 Trial Exhibit XX 46 JA006879-
JA006935 

 

Dated this 28th day of February, 2018. 

McDONALD CARANO LLP 

 
 
By:   /s/ Rory T. Kay   

Pat Lundvall (NSBN 3761) 
Rory T. Kay (NSBN 12416) 
2300 W. Sahara Ave., 12th Floor 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89102 
Telephone:  (702) 873-4100 
Facsimile:  (702) 873-9966 
lundvall@mcdonaldcarano.com 
rkay@mcdonaldcarano.com  

Attorneys for Appellant 
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE 

 I hereby certify that I am an employee of McDonald Carano LLP, and on the 

28th day of February, 2018, a true and correct copy of the foregoing document was 

e-filed and e-served on all registered parties to the Supreme Court's electronic 

filing system: 

 
     /s/ Beau Nelson      
    An Employee of McDonald Carano LLP 
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Mcdonald carano wilson llp
2300 West Sahara Avenue, Suite 1200
Las Vegas, Nevada 89102
(702) 873-4100
(702) 873-9966 Facsimile
lundvall@mcdonaldcarano.com
rkav@mcdonaldcarano.com
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1
CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

2
I HEREBY CERTIFY that I am an employee of McDonald Carano Wilson LLP and

day of May, 2015, I served a true and correct copy of the APPENDIX OF

EXHIBITS TO PARDEE'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES AND COSTS via Wiznet

electronic service as utilized by the Eighth Judicial District in Clark County, Nevada.

James J. Jimmerson, Esq.
Lynn Hansen, Esq.
JIMMERSON, HANSEN, P.C.
415 S. Sixth Street, Ste 100
Las Vegas, NV 89101
Attorney for Plaintiffs

3
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Pat Lundvall - Parte- - McDonald, Carano and Wilson Law Firm5/26/2015

HOME I NEWSROOM ] BLOG [ CONTACT

McDONALD-CARANO-WILSONj
AFFILIATIONS ! COMMUNITY SERVICEiABOUT US 1 PRACTICE AREAS ! ATTORNEYS RESOURCES RECRUITMENT

— I |l-
Phone 702-873-4100

Fax 702-873-9966
Pat Lundvall
Partner

lundvall@mcwlaw.com

AREAS OF PRACTICE

Commercial & Complex Litigation; Employments Labor Law; GovemmentAffairs &
Advocacy; Intellectual Property

PROFESSIONAL BACKGROUND

Pat Lundvall, a partner in the firm and Chair of the firm's Employment & Labor Law Practice
Group, has vast experience in every phase of commercia! litigation - from pleading and
motion practice through discovery, settlement, trial and appeal. Ms. Lundvall has
successfully represented clients in judge and jury trials in state and federal court, as well

as on appeal to the Nevada Supreme Court, the Ninth Circuit Court of Appeals and the
U.S. Supreme Court. In addition, she has served as local and coordinating counsel for
large, multidistrict, complex litigation. One adjective is repeatedly used to describe her
litigation style - aggressive.

ADMITTED TO PRACTICE
1989 Nevada; U.S. Court of Appeals,
Ninth Circuit and U.S. Supreme Court

LAWSCHOOL
Valedictorian, with Great Distinction,
Order of the Coif. University of the
Pacific McGeorge School of Law, 1989

BAR ADMISSIONS AND LICENSES

Federal Bar Association
American Bar Association
State Bar of Nevada

AREAS OF EXPERIENCE

Commercial & Complex Litigation

Ms. Lundvall has particular expertise handling complex business disputes and the
substantive claims those disputes typically raise: breach of contract, interference with
contract, business entity dissolutions, shareholder derivative claims, fraud, conversion,
invasion of privacy, bad faith, unfair trade practices, unfair competition, Lanham Act
violations, RICO and antitrust, to name only a few. She also has extensive background in
employment law.

UNDERGRADUATE
BS, Exercise Sciences, University of
Nebraska at Lincoln, 1960

GRADUATE
MS, Exercise Sciences, University of
Nebraska at Lincoln, 1983

RESIDENT OFFICEREPRESENTATIVE ENGAGEMENTS

Ms. Lundvall has handled hundreds of cases across the last 20 years. Some of her more
recent representations include; Governor James Gibbons in Chrissy Mazzeo v. James
Gibbons et. al., a case alleging assault and deprivation of constitutional rights; California
Franchise Tax Board in Gilbert P. Hyatt v. FTB, a case alleging invasion of privacy and
government fraud; Amerco, the parent company of U-Haul Internationa!, in Paul Shoen v.

Amerco eta!., a shareholder derivative case alleging insider dealing; Bristol-Myers Squibb
in State of Nevada v, Bristol-Myers Squibb et. al., a case alleging price fixing; D.R. Norton,
Inc., in multiple homeowner cases alleging mortgage fraud; Landmark Homes and
Development in Sierra Gateway Ventures v. Landmark, et. al. a case alleging breach of
contract and bad faith; Pardee Homes of Nevada and WRECO, in J. P. Morgan v. Pardee
et. al., a case alleging breach of contract; Southwest Gas Corporation in Richard de los
Reyes v. Southwest Gas Corporation, a case alleging employment discrimination; George
Stephanopoulos and Little Brown Company in Gennifer Flowers v. James Carville et. al., a

case alleging defamation; Southern Wine and Spirits of America, Inc., in SWS v. Bacardi-
Martini USA, a case alleging unfair trade practices. Ail of these matters are the subject of
reported decisions or public dockets.

Las Vegas. Nevada

MARTINDALE HUBBELL RATING
AV Peer Review Rated

AWARDS/RECOGNITION
Legal Elite 2011

"Best Lawyers in America" (Commercial
Litigation; Litigation- Labor and

Employment) 2013-2015

Outstanding Lawyers of America

Super Lawyers

Silver Slate's Top 100

Chambers USA 2011.2012

Board Certified in Cfv0 Litigation by
National Board ofTrial Advocacy

Board Certified as Civil Trial Advocacy
Specialist by State Bar of Nevada

Presented with Award for "New Thinking
About Thinking" by Keep Memory ASve /
The Cleveland Clinic Lou Ruvo Center
for Brain Health

PUBLICATIONS

Author. "The Rise and Fall of the Antitrust Exemption for the Business of Insurance,"John
Stauffer Memorial published by the University of the Pacific McGeorge School of Law.
June 1989

Chapter on "Pretrial Conferences," Nevada Civil Practice Manual (4th, 5th, and 6th
editions)

Numerous publications for professional seminars
"Distinguished Nevadan" Award
presented by University of Nevada, Las
Vegas

Certified Advocate. National Board of
Civil Pretrial Practice Advocacy

Recognized among "Female Business
Leaders" by Las Vegas Business Press

PROFESSIONAL ACTIVITIES
Nevada Trial Lawyers Association and
The Association ofTrial Lawyers of
America

ATTORNEY NEWS

Commissioner: Nevada State Athletic
Commission

Public Private Partnership Advisory
Panel to Nevada Department of
Transportation

1/2http7/vvww.mcdonaldcarano.ccHTi/attormy_detail.cfm?AiD=31
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5/26/2015 Pat Lundvail - Partner - McDonald, Carano and Wilson Law Firm

Fellow: LHlgation Counsel of America

Co-Founder: Complex Commercial

LHigalian Institute (CCLI)

CIVIC ACTIVITIES

Board Member: Friends of the Nevada
Mansion

Twenty-One McDonald Carano Wilson Attorneys Named in 2015

Best Lawyers in America
8/18/2014

Seventeen McDonald Carano VMIson Attorneys Named
Mountain States Super Lawyers

6/26/2014

Twenty McDonald Carano Wilson Attorneys Named in 2014 Best
Lawyers in America

8/19/2013

'-x

iisirGE 3s

Next

HOME i ABOUT | PRACTICE": AREAS | RECRUITMENT j AFFILIATIONS | COMMUNITY SERVICE \ NEWSROOM | CONTACT

ALL CONTENT •*) 2009 MCDONALD CARANO WILSON, LLP

Your use of (his web site does not create an attorney -client relationship between you and McDonald Carano Wlson LLP. A Limited Liability Partnership ("McDonald Carano Wlson LLP "). The information accessible
at this web site is provided for informational purposes ortty and does not constitute legal advice, if you desire legal advice with respect to any particular issue or set of circumstances, you should contact your
attorney. Similarly, e-mail messages sent to McDonald Carano Wlson LLP or any of its attorneys or employees do not create an attorney-client relationship and should nol contain privileged or confidential
information. If you choose to contact McDonald Carano Wlson LLP through this web site, you should be aware that any information transmitted electronlcaVy may not be secure. In some instances the opinions

expressed in certain materials contained on this web site arc the opinions of the individual authors and may not reflect the opinions of McDonald Carano Wlson LLP.

— :

j*

2/2httpyAvww.mcdonaldcarano.c(xn/attorney_detail.cfTn?AlD=31

003

JA007740



Exhibit B

004

JA007741



5/26/2015 Aaron Shipley - Partner - McDonald, Carano and Wilson Law Firm

HOME | NEWSROOM | BLOG | CONTACT

Mcdonald-carano-wilson5
PRACTICE AREAS 1 ATTORNEYS ! RESOURCES AFFILIATIONS ! COMMUNITY SERVICEABOUT US RECRUITMENT

Aaron Shipley

Partner

ashipley@mcwlaw.com

Phone 702-873-4100

Fax 702-873-9966

r

AREAS OF PRACTICE
A

Commercial & Complex Litigation; Trust & Estates; Employment & Labor Law

PROFESSIONAL BACKGROUND

Aaron Shipley is a Partner in the firm's Las Vegas office, and has worked on significant

matters representing local business, several national and multinational corporations, and

government agencies. He has extensive experience in every phase of litigation - from

pleading and motion practice through discovery, settlement and trial. ADMITTED TO PRACTICE

Nevada. 2002; Utah, 2002

LAW SCHOOL
University of Utah CoBege of Law, 2001

AREAS OF EXPERIENCE

Commercial & Complex Litigation BAR ADMISSIONS AND LICENSES

Federal Bar
American Bar
State Bar of Nevada
State Bar of Utah
Clark County Bar

Mr. Shipley has particular experience handling complex business disputes and the

substantive claims that typically arise in those disputes, including breach of contract,

interference with contract, business entity dissolutions, fraud, conversion, breach of

fiduciary duty and bad faith.

UNDERGRADUATE
BS, Communication. University of Utah,
1996ATTORNEY NEWS

RESIDENT OFFICE
Las Vegas, NevadaMcDonald Carano Wilson LLP Adds Four New Partners

2/14/2012

McDonald Carano Wlson Attorneys Honored in 2010 Mountain
States Super Lawyers

8/12/2010

McDonald Carano Wlson LLP Attorneys Named in Mountain

States Super Lawyers

8/1 8/2009

AWARDS/RECOGNITION

Mountain States Super Lawyers - 2009

PRINTPAGE ©

'mm

Z:-

HOME ' ABOUT j PRACTICE AREAS j RECRUITMEN'I I AFFILIATIONS I COMMUNITY SERVICE | NEWSROOM J CONTACT

ALL CONTENT C ?Q0S MCDONALD CARANO VAIL SON. LLP

Your use of Ihis web site does nol create an attorney-client relationship between you and McDonald Carano Wlson LLP. A Limited Liability Partnership ("McDonald Carano Wlson LLP "). "The inlormalion accessible
at this web site Is provided for informational purposes only and does not constitute legal advice. If you desire legal advice with respect to any particular issue or set of circumstances, you should contact your

attorney. Similarly, e-mail messages sent to McDonald Carano Wlson LLP or any of its attorneys or employees do not create an attorney-client relationship and should not contain privileged or confidential

information. If you choose to contact McDonald Carano Wlson LLP through this web site, you should be aware that any information transmitted electronically may not be secure. In some instances the opinions

expressed In certain materials contained on this web site are the opinions of the individual authors and may not reflect the opinions of McDonald Carano Wlson LLP.
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Rory Kay - Associate - McDonald, Carano and Wilson Law Firm5/26/2015

LAHOME I NEWSROOM | BLOG | CONTACT

wt

Mcdonald•carano-wilson5
RECRUITMENT s AFFILIATIONSATTORNEYS ! RESOURCESPRACTICE AREASABOUT US COMMUNITY SERVICE

Rory Kay

Associate

rkay@mcwlaw.com

Phone 702-873-4100

Fax 702-873-9966

AREAS OF PRACTICE

Commercial & Complex Litigation; Employment & Labor Law; Appellate Practice

PROFESSIONAL BACKGROUND

Rory Kay, an associate in the firm's Las Vegas office, attended the University of Nebraska,

graduating in 2006 with a Bachelor of Science in Business Administration and a Bachelor

of Arts in Economics and Political Science. Mr. Kay continued his education at the

University of San Diego School of Law, graduating in 201 1 .
ADMITTED TO PRACTICE

Nevada - 2011, California -2013

LAW SCHOOL
University of San Diego, School of Law,
2011

Lead Articles Editor of the San Diego
Law Review

National Team Member, University of
San Diego Moot Court
One of only three graduates in the Class
of 2011 to serve on the executive
boards of both the San Diego Law

Review and San Diego Moot Court

During law school, Mr. Kay was Lead Articles Editor of the San Diego Law Review and a

National Team Member of the University of San Diego Moot Court program. He was one

of only three graduates in the Class of 201 1 to serve on the executive boards of both the

San Diego Law Review and San Diego Moot Court.

Before joining McDonald Carano Wilson, Mr. Kay worked as a law clerk at The Law Firm of

Hogue/Belong in San Diego, where he conducted legal research for cases involving

wrongful termination, harassmentand discrimination, and wage and hour violations. In this

role, he gained experience obtaining information for discovery purposes and drafting

documents for civil litigation.

Mr. Kay also worked as a research assistant for Professor Orly Lobel in the areas of

employment intellectual property (EIP), non-competition agreements, and employer trade

secrets. He gathered data regarding labor migration and employee innovation and

emerging legal trends and issues in the area of EIP.

UNDERGRADUATE
BS. Business Administration, University
of Nebraska, 2006
BA, Economics and Political Science,
University of Nebraska, 2006

Deans List in both the College of
Business Administration and the College
of Arts and Sciences

ATTORNEY NEWS

No news article has been found for this category.
RESIDENT OFFICE

Las Vegas, Nevada

CIVIC ACTIVITIES

Boy Scouts Volunteer
ASUN Racial Affairs Advisory Council
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ALL CONTENT 2009 MCDONALD CARANO WILSON. LLP

Your use of this web site does not create an attorney-client relationship between you and McDonald Carano Wlson LLP. A Limited Liability Partnership ("McDonald Carano Wlson LLP "). The information accessible
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Mcdonald• carano •wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1 173815

My 28, 2010

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through June 30, 2010:

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

Re:

$232.Current Fees 50

j*

10% Fees Discount $ (23.25)

Adjusted Fees $209. 25

Total This Invoice $ 209.25

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89S01

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 891 02

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

&
s frr s

Am F
P.O. BOX 2670, RENO. NEVADA 89S0S

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1 173815

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

Re:

HoursDate Description of Services

06/07/10 E-mail communications with J. Shirley regardini

phone conference with C. Hallman regarding®

Attorney

PL 0.50

Rate/Hour AmountTimekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

ours

0.50 465.00 232.50

$232. 50Current Fees

$10% Fees Discount (23.25)

$209.Adjusted Fees 25

010
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Mcdonald carano•wilsoni
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1173815

July 28, 2010

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through June 30, 2010

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM
Re:

Remit To:

McDONALDCARANOWILSONuP

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$232.Current Fees 50

$1 0% Fees Discount (23.25)

$209.Adjusted Fees 25

$ 209.25Total This Invoice

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment

011
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Mcdonald-carano •wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Invoice No. 1 181617

March 17,2011

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)
Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through January 3 1 , 20 1 1 :
Coyote Springs / BOI 700 1 0 / 7 1 3 1 800 1 . 1 508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

$348. 75Current Fees

$ (34.88110% Fees Discount

$313. 87Adjusted Fees

$ 313.87Total This Invoice

2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VECAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET, 10™ FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

•A b

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM

P.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89S05

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020
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Invoice No. 1 181617

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Date Description of Services

01/06/1 1 Email communication with C. Hallman concerning

01/23/1 1 Email communication with C. Curtis regarding

01/24/1 1 Email communication with C. Curtis regarding

communication with C. Curtis regarding^^H

HoursAttorney

PL 0.25

PL 0.25

email PL 0.25

Rate/HourTimekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

Amountours

465.000.75 348.75

$348.Current Fees 75

$10% Fees Discount (34.88)

$313.Adjusted Fees 87
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Mcdonald • carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1 181617

March 17,2011

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through January 31, 201 1

Coyote Springs / BOl 700 1 0 / 7 1 3 1 800 1 . 1 508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALDCARANOWILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$348.Current Fees 75

$10% Fees Discount (34,88)

$313.Adjusted Fees 87

Total This Invoice $ 313.87

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our
Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Mcdonald • carano-wilsons
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1 183263

May 04, 2011

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through March 3 1, 201 1 :

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Current Fees $ 8,92 6.50

10% Fees Discount $ (892.65)

Adjusted Fees $ 8,03 3.85

Current Disbursements $ 0.75

Total This Invoice $ 8,034.60

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET, 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-4100

FAX 702-873-9966

to
z{~y~r\$

HI )°
P.O. BOX 26 70, RENO, NEVADA 89505

775-788-2000 FAX 775-788-2020
*eSifc

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1 183263

Page 2
McDONALD- CARANO- WILSONLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Description of Services

Email communication with C. Hallman concernini

communication with C. Hallman forwardingBBl

Date Attorney Hours

02/09/1 1 email PL 1.00

Emai^ommunication with C. Curtis concerning02/10/11 PL 0.20

Email communication with A. Shipley regardin;02/11/11 PL 1.00

Email communication with C. Curtis regarding

Review

between

Email communication with A. Shipley regarding

into documents

Email communication with C. Curtis and A. Shipley regar^ng|m|

Review client documents

02/14/11 PL 0.10

I^H; strategize reH|^H
l Pa^^mavall and Charle^urtis

02/14/11 ; review emails ADS 0.80

02/15/11 PL 1.20

02/16/11 PL 0.10

02/16/11 ADS 2.80

Continue reviewing client documents; research02/17/11 ADS 3.30

; send email to Pat Lundvall re

Email communication with A. Shipley regardingHf^^^^^^^^^H
email communication wit^^^^Curti^^garamg

02/18/11 PL 0.30

Send email to Chuck Curtis re

Begin drafting answer to amended complaint

Review past correspondence between client and plaintiffs (including

plaintiffs' counsel) and continue drafting answer to amended complaint

Review and

communication with A. Shipley and C. Curtis regardin;

analyze

Continue drafting answer to amended complaint; send email to Chuck Curtis

re same

Email communication with C. Curtis regardin;

communication with A. Shipley regarding^!

Exchange emails with Chuck Curtis re

Review and revise

regarding^m

Revise answer to amended complaint

Finalize answer to amended complaint

02/18/11 ADS 0.50

02/23/1 1 ADS 1.30

02/24/1 1 ADS 2.30

02/25/1 1 email PL 1.00

review and

02/25/1 1 ADS 1.50

02/28/1 1 email PL 0.20

02/28/11 ADS 0.30

03/01/11 email with A. Shipley PL 0.20

03/01/11 ADS 1.00

03/02/1 1 ADS 0.80
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Invoice No. 1 183263

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Email communication with A. Renz and A. Shipley concerning

Date

0.10PL03/08/11

review and revise 0.80Review email from Allison Renz re ADS03/08/11

email communication with

; email communication with C. Curtis and A.

email communication with A. Renz and

email

PL 0.20Review and analyze03/10/11

A. Shipley regardini

Shipley regardingB
A. Shipley concerning

communication with A. Shipley regarding

telephone conference with Allison ADS 1.80Continue revising

Renz

Email communication with A. Shipley concerning

communication with A. Renz, Jon Lash, K. Andrews an

analyze

03/10/11

email PL 0.1003/1 1/1 1
. Jordano

; review and

; review final 0.30Exchange emails with Pat Lundvall re ADS03/11/11

Email communication to A. Shipley regarding

Draft discovery plan

Review and revise

PL 0.1003/20/1 1

ADS 1.5003/21/11

email communication with A. Shipley PL 0.1003/22/1 1

regarding|
1.50Continue drafting

Email communication with A. Shipley regarding

ADS03/22/1 1

0.10PL03/27/1 1

Email communication with A. Shipley and C. Curtis regarding 0.10PL03/28/1 1

and email same to Chuck Curtis and ADS 0.50Finalize^^H
Chris Hallman

03/28/11

Rate/Hour AmountTimekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

ours

6.10 465.00

290.00

2,836.50

6,090.0021.00

$ 8,92 6.50Current Fees

$ (892.65)1 0% Fees Discount

S 8,03 3.85Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

0.75Photo Copies

£ 0.75Current Disbursements
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Invoice No. 1 183263

Page 4
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

$ 8.034.60Total Fees & Disbursements

018
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Mcdonald • carano-wilson*
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Invoice No. 1 183263

May 04, 2011

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel
Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through March 3 1, 201 1

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALD CARANO WILSONLLP

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 8,92 6.50Current Fees

$ (892.65110% Fees Discount

$ 8,03 3.85Adjusted Fees

$ 0.75Current Disbursements

$ 8,034.60Total This Invoice

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our
Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment

019
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Mcdonald •carano-wilson5
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel
Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

Invoice No. 1185397

June 29, 2011

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through May 31, 201 1:

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

$9,31 3.50Current Fees

1 0% Fees Discount $ (931.351

Adjusted Fees $ 8,38 2.15

$Current Disbursements 230.00

Total This Invoice $ 8,612.15

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89S01

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

NEVADA 891 02

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

A ic
LAS VEGAS

A Ml JSP.O. BOX 2670, RENO. NEVADA 89505

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1 185397

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Email communication with C. Curtis and A. Shipley in
continued email communication with A.

Date

inn. Shipley regarding

PL 0.9004/01/11

exchange emails with ADS 0.30Exchange emails with Chuck Curtis re

Pat LundvallH^H
04/01/11

and communication with A. Shipley and C. PL

Curtis regarding same; continued email communication with A. Shipley and
; email communication with A.

1.00Review and revise04/04/1 1

C. Curtis regarding^^^^^^H
Shipley and C. Charles regarding

exchange emails ADS 1.80

with PaLLundvain^ame; send email to Chuck Curtis re
04/04/1 1

0.10Email communication with C. Curtis regarding

Email communication wjth A. Shipley regarding

PL04/05/1 1

0.10PL04/06/1 1

ADS 0.10Leave voice mail message for Allison Renz re

Extensive email communication with A. Shipley, C. Curtis and C. Hallman

regarding

04/06/1 1

0.70PL04/07/1 1

Exchange emails with Chuck Curtis re ADS 1.5004/07/1 1

; review emails from Allison Renz re same;

one conference with Allison Renz reteuegh<

ADS 2.80Review

Email communication with A. Shipley concernin

communication with A. Shipley regarding^^J

Research

Email communication with A. Shipley concerning

04/12/11

email PL 0.2004/27/1 1

0.50ADS04/27/1 1

PL 0.1005/02/1 1

1.10ADSExchange emails with Allison Renz re^H
exchange emails with Pat LundvalHe

^^ggj^emails with Allison Renz re

05/02/11

review

ADS 0.3005/03/11

email communication with A. PL 0.20Review and analyze

Shipley regarding®

Review^^^^^H

05/05/1 1

0.80; research ADS05/05/1 1

021
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Invoice No. 1 185397

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Email communication with A. Shipley

Research

Date

PL 0.1005/06/1 1

ADS 1.1005/06/1 1
exchange emails with Pat Lundvall re

Email communication with A. Shipley concerning PL 0.1005/07/1 1

and

Email communication with A. Shipley and C. Curtis concerning

email communication with C. Hallman. A

PL 0.1005/09/1 1

C. Curtis regardmg^^^^^^^^H

Exchange emails with Pat Lundvall re research ADS

; send email to Chuck

1.5005/09/1 1

urtis re

0.10Review and

email communication with A. Shipley and C. Curtis regarding

PL05/12/11

ADSContinue reviewin; 2.7005/12/11 ; review

sen; researc

email to client

Email communication with C. Curtis regarding^HH||
HHjn; email communication with A. Shipley regarding
email communication with C. Hallman, C. Curtis and A. !

0.20PL05/13/11

hipley

; exchange emails with Chuck ADS 0.90Continue research reH
Curtis rejUH finalize

05/13/11

0.10PLReview and analyze

Review emails between Chris Hallman and Pat Lundvall re

continue

05/16/11

ADS 1.8005/16/11

Email communication with A. Shipley regarding PL 0.1005/18/11

0.20L email communication with C. PLReview and analyze05/19/11

^gj^^arding ; review and analyze^^^^^^^^H

email communication with A. Shipley regarding

Draft opposition to plaintiffs' petition for exemption for arbitration ADS 3.7005/19/11

0.20Email communication with C. Curtis regardini

communication with A. Shipley concerningB
and analyze^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^l

email

I review
PL05/20/1 1

email communication with C. Curtis concerning

Continue drafting opposition to petition for exemption from arbitration; ADS 1.5005/20/11

ADS 1.5005/26/11 Continue reviewing

05/27/1 1 ResearchjHUH ADS 1.00
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Invoice No. 1 185397

Page 4
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

AmountTimekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

Rate/Hourours

2,092.50
7,221.00

4.50 465.00

290.0024.90

$9,31 3.50Current Fees

10% Fees Discount $ (931.35)

$ 8,38 2.15Adjusted Fees

AmountDescription

Filing Fee-Court/Complaint - - Paid To: Tyler

Technologies, Inc.

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Tyler Technologies, Inc.

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Tyler Technologies, Inc.

Disbursement

223.0004/04/1 1

3.5004/11/11

04/11/11 3.50

$Current Disbursements 230.00

$ 8.612.15Total Fees & Disbursements

023
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Mcdonald • carano-wilson1;
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1 185397

June 29, 2011

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through May 31, 201 1

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALD-CARANO-WILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$9,31 3.50Current Fees

10% Fees Discount $ (931.35)

$ 8,38 2.15Adjusted Fees

$ 230.00Current Disbursements

$ 8,612.15Total This Invoice

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1 .50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment

024
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Mcdonald • carano-wilson*
FEDERAL TAX ID 8E-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1187258

August 22, 20 1 1

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through July 31, 201 1:

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

$ 987.Current Fees 50

10% Fees Discount (98.75J$

Adjusted Fees $ 888. 75

Current Disbursements $ 106.92

Total This Invoice $ 995.67

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. I 0™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 8950 1

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-4100

FAX 702-873-9966

A Co.
*

a in y®
P.O. BOX 2670, RENO. NEVADA 8950S

77S-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1 187258

Page 2
Mcdonald carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

HoursDescription of Services

Email communication with A. Shipley and C. Curtis concerning

Exchange emails with Chuck Curtis

AttorneyDate

PL 0.1006/02/1 1

0.50ADS06/02/1 1

0.60Review and analyze^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^B
email communication with A. Shipleyregaramg^H
with A. Shipley, C. Hallman and C. Curtis regarding

PL06/03/1 1

email communication

ADS 0.50Review

exchange emails with Chris Hallman and Chuck Curtis re

Email communication with J. Foote regarding^^HH||
communication with J. Foote regarding

06/03/1 1

email PL 0.6006/04/1 1

Email communications with J. Foote regarding PL 0.2006/05/1 1

review and analyze|HHH|

email communicatioi^itr^n'oote
regarding

Rate/Hour AmountTimekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

ours

697.50

290.00

1.50 465.00

290.00LOO

$987. 50Current Fees

$ (98.75)10% Fees Discount

$ 888. 75Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

Telephone

Outside Copying Service - - Paid To: Intel eDiscovery

Solutions, LLC

0.00

106.9206/02/1 1

$ 106.92Current Disbursements

i 995.67Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald • carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel
Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1 187258

August 22, 201 1

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through July 3 1, 201 1
Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALDCARANOWILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$987. 50Current Fees

$ (98.75)10% Fees Discount

$ 888. 75Adjusted Fees

$ 106.92Current Disbursements

Total This Invoice $ 995.67

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1 .50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa
or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment

027
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Mcdonald • carano •wilson5
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1 188564

September 30, 2011

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through August 3 1 , 201 1 :

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 995.67

Payments Received Since Previous Statement I 0.00

Balance Forward $995. 67

Current Fees $4,82 0.50

1 0% Fees Discount $ (482,05)

Adjusted Fees $ 4,33 8.45

Current Disbursements i 0.07

Total Balance Due $ 5,334.19

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 10™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 69S01

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1000

LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

A fc

til y~
P.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 895 0S

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1188564

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Date Description of Services

Review and analyze^^^^^^^^^^H
communication with A. Shipley regarding

Review

Attorney Hours

08/15/11 email PL 0.10

08/15/11 ADS 0.10

08/16/11 Review and analyze L email communication with A. Shipley PL 0.10

regardingm

08/16/11 Exchange emails with Chuck Curtis

^^^Hexchange emails with attorney Odunze (Plaintiffs) re
ADS 0.50

08/19/11 Continued email communication with A. Shipley regardingH^^H
prepare for and attend early case conference; reviewing analyze

review and analyze^HHHHHj
communication wm^^Smple^egatmng

PL LOO

j^^^gfor and attend early case conference; review08/19/11 ADS 1.50

Email communication with A. Shipley concerning08/20/1 1 PL 0.20

08/22/1 1 Review and analyze PL 0.40

email communication with C. Curtis

and A. Shipley regardmg^^^^^^^^^^^^H

Send email to Chuck Curtis and Chris Hallaman re08/22/1 1 ADS 3.70

review review

Email communication with A. Shipley regarding

Compile

Review and analyze

email communication with A. Shipley and C. Curtis regardin

communication with C. Curtis and A. Shipley regarding^J
review and analyze

regarding^

Exchange emails with Chuck Curtis re^^H
continue reviewing

08/25/11 PL 0.20

08/25/1 1 ADS 2.00

08/26/1 1 , PL 0.90

; emai

, email communication with A. Shipley

08/26/1 1 ADS 2.00

08/29/11 Prepare

Continue to

KS 0.90

08/30/11 KS 3.30prepare prepare
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Invoice No. 1188564

Page 3
Mcdonald carano • wilsonLLP

Timekeeper H Rate/Hour Amountours

2.90 1,348.50

2,842.00

630.00

465.00

290.00

150.00

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley 9.80

Karen Surowiec 4.20

$ 4,82 0.50Current Fees

$ (482.05)1 0% Fees Discount

$ 4,33 8.45Adjusted Fees

AmountDescriptionDisbursement

Photo Copies 0.07

i 0.07Current Disbursements

S 4.338.52Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald•carano-wilson
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Invoice No. 1 188564

September 30, 201 1

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel
Pardee Homes

10880 Wiishire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through August 31, 201 1

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

tml

Remit To:

McDONALDCARANOWILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 995.67Balance Due From Previous Statement

$ 0.00Payments Received Since Previous Statement

$995. 67Balance Forward

$ 4,82 0.50Current Fees

$ (482,05)10% Fees Discount

$ 4,33 8.45Adjusted Fees

$ 0.07Current Disbursements

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa
or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Invoice No. 1 1 88564

Page 5Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

$ 5,334.19Total Balance Due

OUTSTANDING INVOICES:

Invoice Invoice Amount Payments/AdjustmentsDate Balance

08/22/11 1187258 $995.67 $0.00 $995.67

032

JA007769



Mcdonald • carano-wilsons
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1 1 89460

October 24, 20 1 1

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through September 30, 20 1 1 :

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Current Fees $3,24 1.50

1 0% Fees Discount $ (324.15^

Adjusted Fees $2,91 7.35

Current Disbursements $ 2.57

Total This Invoice $ 2,919.92

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 10™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

& to

ATu7*
P.O. BOX 2670, RENO

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

NEVADA 89505

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1189460

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

HoursDate Description of Services

09/0 1/1 1 Review and analyzeHHHHH
A. Shipley and C. Curtis regarding

Attorney

L email communication with PL 0.10

send email to Chuck

telepnon^onferen^ re|^|

I email communication with C.
review

09/01/11 Reviewj
Curtis re

09/02/1 1 Review and analyze^^|^H|H
Hallman and A. Shiple^^^garamg

ADS 1.50

PL 0.20

09/02/1 1 Revise ADS 0.70

09/02/11 Prepare and finalize

09/07/1 1 Email communication with C. Curtis regarding

09/09/1 1 Email communication with C. Hallman and C. Curtis regardingm|

KS 2.30

PL 0.10

PL 0.10

Review ADS 1.0009/09/1 1

Email communication with A. Shipley, C. Hallman and C. Curtis regardin: PL 0.3009/12/11

^cohnnuea email communication regarding

Exchange emails with Chris Hallman re^^^B

Review and analyze

with L. Harrison and A. Shipley regaramg^^F

Emailcommunicationw^ ing

ADS 1.5009/12/11

email communication PL 0.1009/16/11

PL 0.2009/19/11

exchange emailsReview and revise

with Amanda Brookhyser re

ADS 1.0009/19/11

Review^^HH^^PHHHH^^j email communication with L.
HarrisorvA^mpI^^n^AJBrooK!tysenegarding|J|

Review^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^l strategize re

PL 0.2009/20/1 1

ADS 0.7009/22/1 1

Email communication with A. Shipley regardin,

review and analyze

PL 0.2009/26/1 1

Conference with Pat Lundvall re

Prepare deposition notices to James Wolfram and Walt Wilkes

Review and analyze

communication with A. Shipley regarding

ADS 0.2009/26/1 1

KS 0.7009/26/1 1

email PL 0.2009/27/1 1
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Invoice No. 1 189460

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Description of Services

09/27/1 1 Exchangeemail^vithopposi^ case conference report;

Attorney HoursDate

ADS 0.30

Timekeeper H Rate/Hour Amountours

Pat Lundvall 1.70 465.00

290.00

150.00

790.50

2,001.00

450.00
Aaron D. Shipley 6.90

Karen Surovviec 3.00

$3,24 1.50Current Fees

$1 0% Fees Discount (324.15)

$2,91 7.35Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

Photo Copies 2.57

$Current Disbursements 2.57

Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald • carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

Invoice No. 1189460

October 24, 2011

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through September 30, 201 1

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

Mcdonald carano wilsonllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

Current Fees $ 3,24 1.50

S10% Fees Discount G24.151

Adjusted Fees $2,91 7.35

Current Disbursements $ 2.57

Total This Invoice $ 2,919.92

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1 .50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Mcdonald •carano •wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1 190367

November 18, 201 1

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through October 3 1 , 20 1 1 :

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 2,919.92

Payments Received Since Previous Statement I 0.00

Balance Forward $2,91 9.92

Current Fees $ 5,63 6.00

10% Fees Discount $ (563.60)

Adjusted Fees $ 5,07 2.40

£Current Disbursements 4.67

Total Balance Due $ 7,996.99

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2500 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1000

LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-875-9966

* v 1 1 1 J *P.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 8950S

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1 190367

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Review and analyze

conference with Aaron Shipley re:

ReviewflH^^^HIHI^H

Date

0.20PL10/04/11

ADS 0.5010/04/11 ; review

Email communication with A, Shipley and C. Curtis concernin: PL 0.2010/05/11

0.50Exchange emails with Chuck Curtis re ADS10/05/11

Email communication with A. Shipley concerning PL 0.2010/17/11

ADS 0.50Conference with Pat Lundvall re10/18/11 review

0.30Review and analyze PL10/24/1 1

emai

communication with A. Shipley regarding

Review

telephone conference with Chuck Curtis re^M~exchange emails wit]
Chuck Curtis re^^J prepare

Prepare for and attend

email communicanoiU^C^urti^egarain^^^^^^^^^^^

Prepare for and attend

4.20draft ADS10/24/11

PL 3.0010/25/11

continue drafting ADS 2.0010/25/11

0.30Review and analyze PL10/26/11

review email communication

etween A. Shipley and C. Curtis regarding

Continue drafting

Prepare

Telephone conference with attorneys Hansen and Brookyser re

ADS 3.5010/26/11

KS 1.7010/26/11

0.30ADS10/27/11

Email communication with A. Shipley regarding PL 0.2010/31/11
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Invoice No. 1190367

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Timekeeper H Rate/Hour Amountours

4.40 2,046.00

3,335.00

255.00

Pat Lundvall 465.00

290.00

150.00

Aaron D. Shipley 11.50

Karen Surowiec 1.70

$ 5,63 6.00Current Fees

$ (563.60110% Fees Discount

$ 5,07 2.40Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

Mileage

Photo Copies

4.44

0.23

$ 4.67Current Disbursements

$ 5.077.07Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald • carano-wilsons
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hailman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1 190367

November 18, 201 1

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through October 3 1 , 20 11

Matter ID PAR 00045 (NY) and 00046 (LV)

South Edge: JP Morgan Chase Bank v

Pardee Homes and WRE

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALDCARANO-WILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 2,919.92

Payments Received Since Previous Statement $ 0.00

Balance Forward $2,91 9.92

$5,63 6.00Current Fees

S (563.60)10% Fees Discount

Adjusted Fees $5,07 2.40

$Current Disbursements 4.67

Payment is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Invoice No. 1 190367

Page 5
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

$ 7,996.99Total Balance Due

OUTSTANDING INVOICES:

Invoice Amount Payments/Adjustments BalanceInvoiceDate

$2,919.92$2,919.92 $0.0010/24/11 1189460
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Mcdonald • carano •wilson5
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1 193790

March 02, 2012

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through December 31, 201 1:

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

REVISED INVOICE

Re:

Current Fees $35,8 17.50

10% Fees Discount $ (3.581,75^

Adjusted Fees $ 32,2 35.75

$ 2.134.64Current Disbursements

Total This Invoice $ 34,370.39

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET, 10™ FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-4100

FAX 702-873-9966

•A (o.
ifS2T)5

Ml h
P.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89505

775-788-2000 • FAX 77S-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice Mo. 1 193790

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

REVISED INVOICE

Re:

Date Description of Services

Email communication with A. Shipley regardin,

communication with K. Franck re:^^^^^M
analyze

Attorney Hours

1 1/02/1 1 email

; review and

PL 0.70

1 1/02/1 1 ADS 1.50review

Email project from Pat Lundvall re:1 1/02/1 1 KDF 0.10

Review and prepare for

^^Hireview|BM
1 1/03/1 1 PL 6.00

email communication with A. Shipley re

Review1 1/03/1 1 ADS 1.50; review

1 1/03/1 1 Begin background research and reports re:

Prepare

communication with A. ShipleyreT^^^B

KDF 3.90

11/04/11 email PL 4.00

Conference with Pat Lundvall re1 1/04/1 1 research ADS 2.00

1 1/04/1 1 Continue KDF 4.90

email to Pat Lundvall re

11/07/11 Continue to PL 4.00

; review and analyze

; email communications with C. Curtis, C. Hallman

and A. Shipley reH

review and analyze

review and

analyze

Continue researchin.1 1/07/1 1 ADS 2.20

exchange emails with Pat Lundvall re

review

Prepare for, attend and take deposition of plaintiff, James Wolfram; review

; reviewB
11/08/11 PL 8.00

email from A. Shipley re

Extensive telephone conversation with Chuck Curtis re:

conference with A. Shipley re:HHIHHHHHI
11/09/11 PL 1.60
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Invoice No. 1 193790

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Description of Services Attorney

ADS

HoursDate

Exchange emails with attorney Brookhyser re

review

11/09/11 0.70

conference with PatLundvall re

Meet with Pat regarding

Email communications with A. Shipley

telephone conference with A. Shipley regardin;

SF 0.7011/09/11

11/10/31 PL 0.40

Research11/10/11 SF 0.60

11/11/11 Continue research SF 1.10

11/13/11 Continue SF 2.40

email communications with PLReview^^H

A. Shiple^e:
11/14/11 2.20

arrange for transmission o

Continue drafting

Email communication with C. Curtis re:

Review

11/14/11 0.70SF

PL 0.1011/15/11

11/15/11 ADS 0.80

Edited11/15/11 SF 0.50

Review and analyze 1.0011/16/11 PL

Continue editing

Review email communication with A. Shipley re:

SF11/16/11 1.90

31/17/11 PL 0.30

Telephone conference with attorney Brookyser re 0.5011/17/11 ADS

Strategize re11/18/11 ADS 0.50

revie^email re:^^Conference with A. Shipley re: PL11/21/11 1.20

; review

draftReview ADS11/21/11 4.50

Research SF 0.6011/21/11

email communications with A. ShipleyReview1 1/22/1 1 PL 0.60

re:

Continue drafting^^^B
HHj; review
^continue reviewing

ADS 3.5011/22/11

11/23/11 Review SF 0.30

044
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Invoice "No. 1 193790

Page 4
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

HoursAttorneyDescription of Services

Prepare

Shipley

Date

review, analyze emails from A. PL 6.0011/27/11

SFContinue reviewing. 0.5011/27/11

Prepare for and take deposition of Walt Wilkes; email communication with PL 7.0011/28/11
A. Shipley re:

Email communications re:

Exchange emails with attorney Brookhyser re

email to Chuck Curtis re^^^H

PL 0.4011/30/11

ADS 1.2011/30/11

Review and analyze PL 2.6012/01/11
review and analyze

review and analyze^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^H

email correspondence with Aaron Shipley regarding!

Review and analyze PL 1.0012/02/11

Review 0.4012/05/11 ; review

PLReview and revise LOO12/08/11

Exchange emails with attorney Brookhyser re ADS 2.5012/08/11

; review

; revise I ; review

PLReview and analyze

Review and analyze

email correspondence with Aaron Shipley regarding

0.2012/09/11

PL 0.3012/09/1 1

; exchangeReview^^^^^^^^^H
emails with Chuck Curtis re

Brookhyser

ADS 1.8012/09/11
exchange emails witruittome"

H| strategize reHHj

ADS 1.5012/12/11

Continue ADS 1.0012/14/11

Review and analyze PL 0.2012/15/11

ADSContinue 1.5012/15/11

Continue ADS12/19/11 1.50

Emailcoiresponder^ regarding PL 0.1012/21/11

Review correspondence from attorney Brookhyser to Stewart Title re ADS 1.5012/21/11

draft
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Invoice No. 1 193790

Page 5
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Review and analyze

Continue drafting

Curtis re^H

Review and revise

Review

Exchange emails with attorney Brookhyser re

Date

0.20PL12/22/1 1

; exchange emails with Chuck ADS 0.5012/22/11

ADS 1.2012/27/11

PL 0.1012/30/11

ADS 0.5012/30/11

Rate/Hour AmountTimekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

Seth Floyd

Krystal Franck

ours

49.20

32.80

465.00

290.00

225.00

150.00

22,878.00

9,512.00

2,092.50

1,335.00

9.30

8.90

$35,8 17.50Current Fees

$ (3.581.75)10% Fees Discount

$ 32,2 35.75Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

Mileage

Westlaw

On-Line Research

5.55

0.00

76.00

Photo Copies

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Transcript - - Paid To: Litigation Services &. Technologies

23.79

9.0011/17/11

11/17/11

11/18/11

11/29/11

75.00

9.00

977.10

Inc.

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Transcript - - Paid To: Litigation Services & Technologies

3.5012/19/11

12/19/11 955.70

Inc.

$ 2.134.64Current Disbursements

£ 34.370.39Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald • carano-wilsons
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Invoice No. 1193790

March 02, 2012

Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through December 3 1, 201 1

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

REVISED INVOICE

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALDCARANOWILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$35,8 17.50Current Fees

$ (3.581.75110% Fees Discount

$32,2 35.75Adjusted Fees

$ 2.134.64Current Disbursements

Total This Invoice $ 34,370.39

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Mcdonald-carano-wilsons
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

Invoice No. 1 194174

March 16,2012

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through February 29, 2012:

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOl 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Balance Due From Previous Statement S 34,370.39

Payments Received Since Previous Statement S 0.00

Balance Forward $ 34,3 70.39

Current Fees $ 24,3 27.50

10% Fees Discount $ f2.432.75J

Adjusted Fees $21,8 94.75

Current Disbursements $ 49.09

Total Balance Due $ 56,314.23

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 10'" FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

& (o
*rr^r\%
-V in FP.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89505

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1 194174

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Description of ServicesDate Attorney Hours

Review01/03/12 ADS 1.50

Review01/04/12 PL 0.20

01/04/12 Review ADS 1.50

continue draftin;

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding!01/05/12 PL 0.30

Continue reviewing

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding

01/05/12 ADS 3.50

01/06/12 PL 0.20

Continue

send email to Chuck Curtis re^^Bcontinue draffing^^^^B
^^^^^^^^^^Hexchange emails with attorney Brookhyser

01/06/12 ADS 2.80

Email correspondence with C. Curtis, S. Levy, and A. Shipley regarding01/09/12 PL 1.50

extended conversation with A. Shipley re:

Review emails between Chuck Curtis and Steve Levy re01/09/12 ADS 3.00

send email to Steve Lew re continue drarting^^^^^H

; telephone conference with Stevy Levy

re

01/10/12 Continue ADS 1.50

Review

Review and edit^H
A. Shipley regarding

01/12/12 ADS 0.30

; email correspondence with PL01/13/12 0.60

Continue01/13/12 ADS 4.50

Email correspondence with A. Shipley01/17/12 PL 0.20

Exchange emails with attorney Brookhyser re01/17/12 ADS 0.30

s

Exchang^m^ Brookhyser re^^^mi continue01/18/12 ADS 1.30

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding01/19/12 PL 0.30
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Invoice No. 1 194174

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Revise

conference with attorney Brookyser re

Review and analyze

Review and analyze

Date

; telephone ADS 2.5001/19/12

0.10PL01/20/12

PL 0.1001/23/12

Review

Review and anatyzeHH|H||HHH||^^H
correspondence with A^nipie^egarding^^r

Finalize

from attorney Brookhyser

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding

ADS 1.5001/23/12

email PL 0.3001/24/12

continue ADS

review correspondence

1.3001/24/12

PL 0.2001/25/12

Exchange emails with Chuck Curtis re ADS 0.2001/25/12

ADS 2.0001/26/12

raft email to Chuck Curtis re

; continue reviewing

Review and edit^^^^^^^^H

S. Levy and C. Chane^egarding

Send email to Chuck Curtis reH

email correspondence with A. Shipley, PL 1.0001/27/12

; send email to Steven Levy re ADS 1.5001/27/12

draft

etter to attorney Brookhyser re

Exchange emails with Chuck Curtis and Jim Rizzi re ADS01/30/12 1.50

; send email to attorney

review emails and documentsBrookhyser reH

from Jim Rizzi re

Review and edit draft letter to opposing counsel in response letter re __

email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding^

; continue drafting ADS

0.60PL01/31/12

2.2001/31/12 Review

; review

Review PL 0.2002/01/12

Exchange emails with attorney Brookhyser re

continue reviewingl

Continue reviewing

Review

Review and analyze email from A. Shipley

H email communication with C. Hallmar^n^ransrmt

continue reviewing

ADS 2.8002/01/12

ADS 2.5002/02/12

PL02/03/12 0.20

PL 0.3002/06/12

to him

Draft! ADS 3.5002/06/12
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Invoice No. 1 194174

Page 4
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of ServicesDate

Transmit draft letter to J. Lash directed to A. Seeno PL 0.2002/07/12

Continue reviewin: ADS 1.3002/07/12 review

ADS 2.0002/08/12 Review review

Continue reviewing^^^^^^^^^^^^^!
exchange email^witl^tazerootzinge^

Review documents

reviewing^^^^H

Continue reviewing

Continue reviewing

Continue reviewing

Review and

telephone call with Jimmerson Hansen with regard to the setting o;

deposition of J. Lash and Linda Jones; email correspondence with A. Shipley

regarding^^^^^^^H^^

Send email to Jon Lash re

ADS02/09/12 4.50

continue ADS 2.0002/14/12

ADS 1.3002/15/12

ADS 2.0002/17/12

ADS 2.0002/20/12

02/21/12 PL 1.00

ADS 0.5002/21/12 review

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding PL 0.1002/22/12

Review

Review and analyze

email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding

ADS 1.6002/22/12

PL 0.3002/23/12

continue reviewing document: ADS 1.0002/23/12 Review

02/27/12 Continue reviewing ADS 3.50

ADSContinue reviewing

conference with Pat Lundvall re

witRnucI^urtis
with Jon Lash's assistantre^^^^^^^^^^H

4.5002/28/12

; telephone conference

II exchange emails

Review PL 0.2002/29/12

Review emails

conference with Linda Jones re

continue!

telephone ADS 3.0002/29/12
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Invoice No. 1194174

Page 5
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Rate/Hour AmountTimekeeper H ours

3,766.50

20,561.00

465.00

290.00

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

8.10

70.90

$ 24,3 27.50Current Fees

S f2.432.75)1 0% Fees Discount

$ 21,8 94.75Adjusted Fees

AmountDescriptionDisbursement

26.08Mileage '

Photo Copies

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center

Copies of Court Documents - - Paid To: Pacer Service

Center

5.39

10.5001/20/12

01/25/32 7.12

$ 49.09Current Disbursements

S 21.943.84Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald • carano •wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hailman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1194174

March 16,2012

10880 WilshireBIvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through February 29, 2012

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

Mcdonald caranowilsonlip

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 34,370.39

Payments Received Since Previous Statement $ 0.00

Balance Forward $34,3 70.39

$24,3 27.50Current Fees

$ C2.432.75I10% Fees Discount

Adjusted Fees $21,8 94.75

Current Disbursements $ 49.09

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Invoice No. II 94 174

Page 7
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

$ 56,314.23Total Balance Due

OUTSTANDING INVOICES:

Invoice Amount Payments/Adjustments BalanceDate Invoice

S0.00 $34,370.39$34,370.3903/02/12 1193790
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Mcdonald•carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

cc: wrecoLaw@wrecol.com Invoice No. 1195071

April 12, 2012

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through March 31, 2012:

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 56,314.23

Payments Received Since Previous Statement $ (34.370.391

Balance Forward $21,9 43.84

$4,13Current Fees 7.50

$ (413.75110% Fees Discount

Adjusted Fees $ 3,72 3.75

Total Balance Due $ 25,667.59

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET, 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

NEVADA 89102

702-873-4100

FAX 702-873-9966

A <5

ill r

LAS VEGAS

P.O. BOX 2670. RENO, NEVADA 89 505

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1 195071

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Description of Services

Continue reviewing

Email correspondence with Pardee team regarding

email correspondence with M. Merrill and A. Shipley regarding

Date Attorney Hours

03/01/12 ADS 1.50

03/02/12 PL 0.20

03/02/12 Continue

conference with attorney Brookhyser re

telephone ADS 1.70

03/05/12 Review!

research

ADS 0.50

Email correspondence with M. Merrill and A. Shipley regarding

Review and analyze

03/06/12 PL 0.20

Send email to Jon Lash re03/06/12 ADS 0.30review

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Email correspondence with A. Shipley and A. Brookhyser regarding

03/07/12 PL 0.10

03/08/12 PL 0.10

Exchange emails with attorney Brookhyser re

Continue reviewing

Emai^oncspondenc^itl^^toft^^ypley and J. Foote reH^|H
request re-noticing ofaeposition

for May 9th in Reno; emai^on^sponden^vith A. Shipley and A.
Brookhyser regardingHH^HHI^H^H

Exchange emails with attorney Brookhyser re

03/08/12 ADS 0.30

03/12/12 ADS 1.50

03/16/12 PL 0.60

03/16/12 ADS 0.30

03/21/12 Review and analyze

Review^^^^^H
Brookhyserre^^J

Review

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding

review and analyze^^^l

PL 0.10

; draft letter to attorney03/21/12 ADS 1.50

03/23/12 ADS 0.10

03/26/12 PL 0.20
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Invoice No. 1 195071
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Page 3

Description of Services Attorney HoursDate

Exchange emails with attorney Brookhyser re 1.70review ADS03/26/12

exchange emailswith Jon Lash re

exchange emails with attorney Brookhyser rel

Review and analyze 0.60PL03/30/12

Review103/30/12 ADS 1.50

Rate/HourTimekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

Amountours

2.10 465.00

290.00

976.50

3,161.0010.90

$4,13 7.50Current Fees

$ (413.75)10% Fees Discount

$ 3,72 3.75Adjusted Fees
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Mcdonald• carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1197272

June 14,2012

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through May 3 1, 2012:

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 25,667.59

Payments Received Since Previous Statement S f21.943.84J

Balance Forward S 3,72 3.75

$ 5,86 5.00Current Fees

10% Fees Discount S (586.50)

Adjusted Fees $ 5,27 8.50

Total Balance Due $ 9,002.25

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

A io

atnv*
P.O. BOX 2670. RENO. NEVADA 89505

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No- 1197272

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

HoursAttorneyDescription of ServicesDate

PL 0.30Review and analyze04/02/12

Review

E mail correspondence with M. Merrill and opposing counsel regarding

rescheduling of Linda Jones deposition

Review and distribute

ADS 2.5004/02/12

PL 0.1004/04/12

PL 0.1004/06/12

Continue reviewing

Review

Email correspondence with Pardee team re

ADS 1.8004/06/12

ADS 0.7004/10/12

PL 0.1004/12/12

ADS 0.5004/12/12

review

Email correspondence with A. PL* 0.10Review and edit^H

Shipley regarding*

Continue reviewing

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding

Exchange emails with attorney Brookyser re^B
email to Jon Lashre^^^H^^^^^^^^^|

; review

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding

Exchange emails with Jimmerson's office re depositionsched^

Lash and Linda Jones (Stewart Title); review

Continue reviewing

04/13/12

1.50ADS04/17/12

PL 0.1004/19/12

; send ADS 1.5004/19/12

; review

PL 0.1004/27/12

ADS 0.5004/27/12

ADS 1.5005/01/12

Continue reviewing

Review

Continue reviewing

Email correspondence with Pardee team re

1.00ADS05/03/12

ADS 1.0005/08/12

ADS {.3005/1 1/I2

PL 0.2005/16/12

Continue reviewing ADS 1.2005/18/12

osing counsel re 0.30ADS05/22/12

Review and analyze PL 0.1005/30/12
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Invoice No. 1 197272

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

HoursDescription of Services

05/30/12 exchange emails with opposing counsel re
depositioru>Oormisr^^

05/3 1/12 Continue reviewingHHHHHHHHHI and drafting^^|

Attorney

ADS

Date

1.50

ADS 1.50

Rate/HourTimekeeper H Amountours

558.00

5,307.00

1.20 465.00

290.00

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley 18.30

$ 5,86 5.00Current Fees

S (586.50*11 0% Fees Discount

$ 5,27 8.50Adjusted Fees

060
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Mcdonald• carano•wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1197272

June 14, 2012

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through May 31, 2012

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

Mcdonald carano wilsonup

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 25,667.59

Payments Received Since Previous Statement I (21.943.84)

$3,72Balance Forward 3.75

$5,86Current Fees 5.00

$ (5S6.5Q)10% Fees Discount

Adjusted Fees $ 5,27 8.50

Total Balance Due $ 9,002.25

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Invoice No. 1 197272

Page 5
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

OUTSTANDING INVOICES:

Invoice Amount Payments/Adjustments

$3,723.75

Date Invoice Balance

$0.00 $3,723.7504/12/12 1195071

062
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Mcdonaldcarano-Wilsoni
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1 199245

August 13, 2012

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through June 30, 2012:

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

$4,17 0.50CurrentJFees

10% Fees Discount $ (417.05)

Adjusted Fees $ 3,75 3.45

Total This Invoice $ 3,753.45

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

'<5

^rnrit"N Hi A
P.O. BOX 2670. RENO. NEVADA 89S05

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1 199245

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

HoursAttorney

ADS

Description of Services

Continue reviewing

Continue reviewing

Continue reviewing

Continue reviewing

Review

Date

3.0006/01/12

3.50ADS06/04/12

ADS 2.0006/14/12

ADS 2.5006/18/12

ADS 1.0006/20/12

Continue reviewing

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding;

ADS 1.5006/26/12

0.10PL06/28/12

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding PL 0.1006/28/12

Exchange voice mail messages with opposing counsel re schedulin^^

g^gon of Jon Lash; exchange emails with Pat Lundvall reHm
ADS 0.4006/28/12

0.1006/29/ 1 2 Review and analyze^^^^^^HH^^^^H
email corresponaenc^win^^VexIenfe

PL

Rate/Hour AmountTimekeeper H ours

465.00

290.00

139.50

4,031.00

0.30Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley 13.90

$4,17 0.50Current Fees

S (4 17.05110% Fees Discount

S 3,75 3.45Adjusted Fees
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Mcdonald• carano •wilsonh
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Invoice No. 1199245

August 13, 2012

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)
Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through June 30, 2012
Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALDCARANOWILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$4,17 0.50Current Fees

$ (417.05110% Fees Discount

$ 3,75 3.45Adjusted Fees

$ 3,753.45Total This Invoice

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa
or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Mcdonald •carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

Invoice No. 1200067

September 06, 2012

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through July 31, 2012:

Coyote Springs - Jeff WIfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Current Fees $ 2,75 5.00

10% Fees Discount $ f275.50)

Adjusted Fees $ 2,47 9.50

Total This Invoice $ 2,479.50

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET, 10™ FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 89S01

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2 BOO WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

A
jj/TTls
-v in rP.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89505

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1200067

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Date Description of Services

07/04/ 1 2 Continue reviewing

HoursAttorney

ADS 2.00

07/19/12 Review ADS 1.50

07/20/12 Review ; continue reviewing

begin

ADS 3.00

07/23/12 Continue drafting^J
research re

ADS 3.00

07/24/12 Research ADS 0.00

Timekeeper H Rate/Hour Amountours

Aaron D. Shipley 9.50 290.00 2,755.00

$ 2,75 5.00Current Fees

$ t275.50^10% Fees Discount

Adjusted Fees S 2,47 9.50

Telephone 0.00

067
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Mcdonald •carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Invoice No. 1200067

September 06, 2012

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through July 31, 2012
Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram
v. Pardee Homes/BOI 700 1 1 0

71318001.1508-22020 -

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALDCARANOWILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 2,75 5.00Current Fees

$ (275.50)10% Fees Discount

$ 2,47 9.50Adjusted Fees

$ 2,479.50Total This Invoice

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa
or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment

068
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Mcdonald •carano-wilsoni
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1201643

October 16, 2012

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through August 31, 2012:

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

$ 11,4 02.50Current Fees

$ (L 140,25110% Fees Discount

$ 10,2 62.25Adjusted Fees

$ 6.68Current Disbursements

Total This Invoice $ 10,268.93

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-4100

FAX 702-873-9966

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 10™ FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 89501	
v X*-
T-V\~

A
5

P.O. BOX 2670. RENO, NEVADA 895 05

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020
WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1201643

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Continue reviewing

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Date

ADS 1.0008/03/12

0.2008/06/12 PL

ADS 0.3008/06/12

exchange emails

witnPat Lundvall reH|

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 0.4008/09/12

Exchange emails with Pat Lundvall re

Continue

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regardin

ADS 0.2008/09/12

ADS 0.2008/13/12

PL 0.2008/14/12

Draft ADS 2.0008/14/12

Review and analyze PL 1.0008/15/12
emai

correspondence with A. Shipley re

Continue drafting^^^^^^^^l

review

ADS 2.0008/15/12 ; review

; begin drafting

Continue drafting

conference with Pat Lundvall re

ADS 2.0008/16/12

; continue drafting

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re 1.00PL08/17/12

telephone ca;

with A. Shipley rel

Continue draftingI
attorney Hansen re

I; exchange emails with
continue drafting^^H

ADS 2.0008/17/12

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 0.3008/20/12

Continue drafting

attorney Jimmerson re motion to extend discovery deadlines and the Lash

deposition; exchange emails with Pat Lundvall re^l

Review and analyze

correspondence with A. Shipley re

email correspondence with A. Shipley re

email correspondence re

; telephone conference with ADS 2.0008/20/12

email PL 1.2008/21/12

review
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Invoice No. 1201643

Page 3
Mcdonald carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney Hours

ADS

Description of Services

Continue drafting

Date

1.30i; draft08/21/12

PL 0.30Review and analyze08/22/12

email correspondence with A. Shipley re

email PL 0.30Review and analyze^^^^^^H
correspondence with A. Shipley re

08/22/12

telephone call

with A. Shipley re

Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re proposed stipulation;
; exchange emails with attorney

2.00ADS08/22/12

revise

Jimmerson re same; continue drafting

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re 0.20PL08/23/12

ADS 1.50Telephone conference with attorney Jimmereonre

continue drafting^^^^^^H
08/23/12

; email correspondence 0.30PLReview and analyze

with A. Shipley reB

Exchange emails with attorney Jimmerson re status of production of CSI
documents

08/24/12

ADS 0.2008/24/12

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 0.5008/27/12

; email correspondence with D. Stoft

and A. Shipley re

review and analyze

^maiJ correspondence with C. Curtis re

ADSPrepare for 4.5008/27/12

attencontinue drafting	

hearing on Plaintiffs' motion to extend discovery deadlines; send email to

Chuck Curtis re^H exchange email^wiftnittorne^^ Coyote
Springs' document production; reviewjjjj^^^^^^^^^^^H

Review and analyze^^^^^^^^^^^^^^f
Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding

Email correspondence with M. Merrill re

Review and analyze

Phillips, David StoftH^maiHorrespondence with Pardee team r<

PL 2.1008/28/12

0.10PL08/29/12

; Conference Call with John Foote, Lisa 3.20PL08/29/12

I' Virw iiihl editB

Email correspondence with D. Stoft re

Pardee team

email correspondence with
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Invoice No. 1201643

Page 4
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Timekeeper H Rate/Hour Amountours

5,254.50

6,148.00

11.30

21.20

465.00

290.00

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

$11,4 02.50Current Fees

S (1. 140.25)10% Fees Discount

$ 10,2 62.25Adjusted Fees

AmountDescriptionDisbursement

0.00Telephone

Mileage

Photo Copies

6.66

0.02

$ 6.68Current Disbursements

$ 10.268.93Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonaldcarano-WILSON
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1201643

October 16, 2012

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through August 31, 2012

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram
v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JEFF WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALD-CARANO-WILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 1 1,4 02.50Current Fees

10% Fees Discount $ 0 J 40.251

Adjusted Fees $ 10,2 62.25

Current Disbursements $ 6.68

Total This Invoice $ 10,268.93

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Mcdonald • carano•wilson5
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hailman, Senior VP/Genera] Counsel

invoice No. 1202272

November 08, 2012

Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through September 30, 2012:

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

$21,8 66.50Current Fees

$ (2. 186.65 J1 0% Fees Discount

$ 19,6 79.85Adjusted Fees

$Current Disbursements 4937

$ 19,729.22Total This Invoice

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET, 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

fc.

P.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89S0S

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1202272

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano-wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

HoursAttorney

ADS

Description of Services

Continue reviewing

Continue reviewing

Continue reviewing

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding

Date

1.5009/06/12

ADS 1.5009/07/12

ADS 2.5009/10/12

PL 0.2009/11/12

ADS 2.00Continue reviewing

Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re issues re CSI documents
designated as privileged; continue reviewing^mm^^J

Preparation for^^f^^ Review and analyze^H^^|^|^j|
HH, Email con^spondence with A. Shipley

09/11/12

ADS 1.0009/12/12

PL 3.0009/17/12

ADS 4.00Continue reviewin;09/17/12
revise

PL 3.00

email correspondence with M. Pfeffer regarding

; continue

09/18/12

ADS 4.50Continue reviewin;09/18/12

reviS1

Email correspondence A. Shipley and M. Merrill re

Continue reviewin;

PL 0.1009/19/12

ADS 1.80; continue09/19/12

1.80; continue ADSContinue reviewin;09/20/12

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 0.00Prepare for09/21/12

ADS 3.50Continue reviewin;

Prepare for

Prepare for

Prepare for

and analyze"^	
correspondence with A. Shipley re

Prepare for

09/21/12

PL 1.0009/22/12

PL 2.0009/23/12

Review PLmeeting with A. Shipley r< 4.2009/24/12

, emai

ADS 0.0009/24/12
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Invoice No. 1202272

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Prepare for and attend

correspondence with A. Shipley an<

Date

; email PL 8.0009/25/12

exler reH

review and analyze]

email correspondence with A. Shipley reB

review and analyze!

Prepare for an^tten^neetin^itl^oi^^sh re

strategize re|||mm||

Prepare for and attend the Depositioi^noi^ash^mai^ormsponden^

with C. Mailman and C. Curtis

Prepare for and attend deposition of Jon Lash (No Charge 7.50 Hours)

Email correspondence and meeting with A. Shipley

^^HBIBH email correspondence with
^^^^HemaiTcorrespondence with A. Shipley

ADS 3.0009/25/12

PL 7.0009/26/12

ADS 0.0009/26/12

PL 1.0009/27/12

ADS LOOContinue drafting09/27/12

Rate/HourTimekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

Amountours

29.50

28.10

13,717.50

8,149.00

465.00

290.00

$21,8 66.50Current Fees

$ (2.186.65J1 0% Fees Discount

$ 19,6 79.85Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

0.00Telephone

Mileage

Photo Copies

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

17.76

18.61

7.0009/17/12

09/17/12 6.00

$ 49.37Current Disbursements

$ 19.729.22Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald*cajrano •wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1202272

November 08, 2012

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through September 30, 2012

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 700 1 1 0

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALD-CARANO-WILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$21,8 66.50Current Fees

10% Fees Discount $ (2.186.65)

Adjusted Fees $ 19,6 79.85

£Current Disbursements 49.37

Total This Invoice $ 19,729.22

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Mcdonald • carano •wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1203309

November 30, 2012

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through October 31, 2012:

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 700110

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Balance Due From Previous Statement 19,729.22$

Payments Received Since Previous Statement £ 0.00

Balance Forward $ 19,7 29.22

$31,6 17.50Current Fees

1 0% Fees Discount $ f3, 161.751

$ 28,4 55.75Adjusted Fees

Current Disbursements £ 142.99

Total Balance Due $ 48,327.96

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89501	

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-4100

FAX 702-873-9966
NEVADA 89505P.O. BOX 2670. RENO

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1203309

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

10/01/12 Email correspondence with M. Bedfordregardine^^^H^H
correspondence with K. Franck

Review and analyzeHjj^HJHHj^^^^^^J
EmaiHonespondence with C. Hallmar^nOn!asine^^^^|
^^^^^^^^^^HEmailcorrespondence with A. Shipley re

Date

; Email 1. 10PL

Receipt of project request from Pat Lundvall; brief review o: 0.70KDF10/01/12

research and

Review and analyze^^^HHHHHHHHHHHHHH|^|
correspondence with C. Hallman, J. Lash, M. McGee and A. Shipley

regarding|U prepare for and attend meeting with L. Hansen re settlement
discussions

Email correspondence and telephone conversation with J. Jimmerson re

proposed settlement

Review and analyze

with S. Wexler rel

Continue revisingI

email 3.10PL10/02/12

PL 0.2010/06/12

Email correspondence PL 3.0010/08/12

ADS 2.5010/08/12 ; review

0.30Review and analyze PL10/09/12

email to Pardee team re

ADS 0.90Review10/09/12

ra'

Emailcon^spondencewithC Pardee team re^m 0.30PL10/10/12

Review emails re research ADS 1.3010/10/12

.ratt1

; Email 1.00Review and analyze

correspondence with A^nipleyre
PL10/11/12

Continue drafting ADS 3.0010/11/12

continue revising

Email correspondence with S. Wexler and A. Shipley regardin£^H_
Review and analysis

correspondence wittH*arae^eam re
^Hbmail correspondence with A. Shipley re^^^^^B

1.00PL10/12/12

Exchange emails with Chuck Curtis re^H
HHjHHH continue drafting

ADS 2.0010/12/12 ; revise
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Invoice No. 1203309

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of ServicesDate

email

remai^orrespondence with
10/15/12 Review and analyze^H

correspondence with A.

PL 1.70

ipiey regardin

A. Shipley re

Continue researching and revising ADS 3.0010/15/12

Review and analyzeH^^IH
Wexler and M. Merriinegarding
Shipley, Lynn Hansen and L. Harrison r<

Review

email correspondence with A. Shipley, S. PL

Email correspondence with A.
0.7010/16/12

; draft ADS 3.3010/16/12

continue revising

!; Review and

KEmail__

Email to S. Wexler

analyze

correspondence with A. Shipleyre^^B
Email correspondence with S. Wexler re

Review and analyze

PL 3.2010/17/12

Draft noticere^^^^H
revising^^^^^^^^H

Prepare

with A. Shiple^egaram

; continue10/17/12 ADS 2.00

Email correspondence 0.80PL10/18/12

Analyze and review

Continue revising

Email to A. Shipley re

ADS 4.5010/18/12

10/19/12 PL 4.00

Prepare for and attend the

deposition of HarveyWhittemore, Emai^OTespondencew^
regarding same; Review and analyze^^|^^^^|HHH^^H^^H

send email to client reContinue revising ADS 5.5010/19/12

Email to A. Shipley

review

Review and analyze^^^^^^^^H
correspondence with A. ShlpIe^m^B
Merrill and A. ShipleyreHHjH^B
with S. WexlerreJHH^^^^HH
analyze

Pardee team^^^^^^^^

Exchange emails with Chuck Curtis re

PL 3.0010/21/12

Email

mail correspondence with M.

HHBBEmail correspondence
Review and

^emaiTcorrespondence to

PL10/22/12 2.10

; revise ADS 3.8010/22/12

Review and analyze PL 1.5010/23/12

mail correspondence with Pardee team re

mail correspondence with A. Shipley re
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Invoice No. 1203309

Page 4
Mcdonald • carano wilsonLLP

Attorney Hours

ADS

Description of ServicesDate

4.00Draft10/23/12

continue compihn;

draft; continue revising

0.00DJSDiscussion with A. Shipley re

search system for^^^HH
10/23/12

3.00Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Review and analysis

analyze

PL10/24/12
.eview and

email correspondence with A. Shipley re

ADS 3.00Continue drafting

revise

10/24/12

; revise

; email PL 1.30Review and analysis®
correspondence with A.

10/25/12

M. Merrilfre^^^^^^^^^H
I; Email correspondence withA7
; Review and analyze^^^^^|

ipley am

lpley re

ADS 1.50Revise10/25/12

research issues re

0.10Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL10/26/12

0.40Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL10/27/12

Email correspondence with A. Shipley, S. Wexler andJMLMerrilhje
Review and analyze

PL 3.0010/29/12

Review and analyze

Email to A. Shipley re

Review and

; Review and analyze

email to Pardee team re

analyze

; draft ADS 7.50Review10/29/12

; conference with Pat Lundvall re

PL 0.10Email correspondence with M. Merrill re10/30/12

ADS 2.5010/30/12

continue reviewing

email

mail correspondence with M.

Review and analyze

PL 1.00Review and analyze

correspondence with Pardee team re

Merrill and A. Shipley

10/31/12
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Invoice No. 1203309

Page 5
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

HoursDescription of Services

10/31/12 Continue reviewing|HHHH|HHHHHg|
telephone conference with Judge Barley's office re

Attorney

ADS

Date

0.80

AmountTimekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

Krystal Franck

Rate/Hourours

16,693.50

14,819.00

105.00

465.00

290.00

150.00

35.90

51.10

0.70

$31,6 17.50Current Fees

$ G. 161.75110% Fees Discount

$ 28,4 55.75Adjusted Fees

AmountDescriptionDisbursement

14.43Mileage

Photo Copies

Overnight Delivery Service - - Paid To: FedEx

Overnight Delivery Service - - Paid To: FedEx

23.49

25.9610/30/12

10/30/12 79.11

$ 142.99Current Disbursements

$ 28.598.74Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald • carano •wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Invoice No. 1203309

November 30, 2012

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel
Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through October 3 1, 2012
Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 700 1 1 0

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALDCARANOWILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 19,729.22Balance Due From Previous Statement

Payments Received Since Previous Statement S 0.00

$ 19,7 29.22Balance Forward

$31,6 17.50Current Fees

S	(3,161.75)10% Fees Discount

$ 28,4 55.75Adjusted Fees

$ 142.99Current Disbursements

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our
Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Invoice No. 1203309

Page 7Mcdonald • carano wilsonLLP

$ 48,327.96Total Balance Due

OUTSTANDING INVOICES:

Payments/AdjustmentsInvoice Invoice Amount BalanceDate

$0.0011/08/12 1202272 $19,729.22 $19,729.22
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Mcdonald• carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074233

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1206551

March 12, 2013

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through February 28, 2013:

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 700 1 1 0

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Current Fees $ 69,3 30.50

10% Fees Discount S C6.933.05J

Adjusted Fees $ 62,3 97.45

Current Disbursements $ 4.123.85

Total This Invoice $ 66,521.30

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 10™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 895 01

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

A fo

III )°P.O. BOX 2670, RENO. NEVADA 89 505

775-788-2000 • FAX 77S-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1206551

Page 2
Mcdonald carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Attorney Hours

0.10

Description of Services

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Date

PL11/01/12

PL 0.3011/02/12

Email correspondence with M. Merrill and S. Wexler re PL 0.1011/04/12

Review and analyze PL 0.6011/05/12

email to S. Wexler re

mail correspondence with A. Shipley re

Exchange emails with attorney Jimmerson re discovery issues and re

scheduling the hearing on the motion for summary judgment

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

0.50ADS11/05/12

PL 0.1011/06/12

Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re various issues re motion ADS

foi^ummary judgment^xchang^mail^vitl^a^undvall

Email correspondence with M Merrill and A. Shipley re

review and analyze

correspondence with J. Jimmerson and A. Shipleyrej|	
email correspondence with A. Shiple^and M^ernlUe

review and analyzeHjj^^^^^
and analyze cour^^^^^^^^H

1.8011/06/12

PL 2.8011/07/12

email

Exchange emails with attorney Jimmerson re ADS 1.8011/07/12

telephone conferences

with attorney Jimmerson re exhibits filed under seal, plaintiffs' opposition to
the motion for summary judgment, and issues re plaintiffs' final disclosure of

documents

Email correspondence with A. Shipley and M. Merrill refl^Hi

review

1.7011/08/12 PL

. Jimmerson; email correspondence with A. Shiplecall with A. ipley an*

re

email correspondence with A.

review and analyze^^^^|
rpley re

; conference

I outline
Review

with Pat Lundvall re

ADS 3.5011/08/12

ra:
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Invoice No. 1206551

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Description of ServicesDate Attorney Hours

11/09/12 Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 2.00

review and analyze^^^^^^^^^H

email finalized letter to J. Jimmerson; email correspondence with A.

; review and analyze

ipie-

re

telephone conversation with J. Jimmerson re letter; review and

analyze

Review11/09/12 draft ADS 2.80

; telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re same;

iratt

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Prepay for and attend meeting with A. Shipley

HHH email correspondence with A. Shipley
HHB email correspondence with A. Shipley an^^immereoiin^iearing
or^onon for Summary Judgment

Outline arguments for

11/12/12 PL 0.10

11/13/12 PL 0.90

11/13/12 ADS 1. 10

ema^^^^BLon withEmail correspondence with A. Shipley and M. Merrill re11/14/12 PL 0.30

A. Shipley re

email correspondence wit] ipley re

11/14/12 Begin draftin; ADS 2.50

telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re

various issue re exhibits

Review and revise11/15/12 PL 1.00

Draft draft!11/15/12 ADS 3.00

reviewj PLEmail correspondence with A. Shipley re11/16/12 0.10

11/16/12 Prepare for and attend meeting with attorney Jimmerson re inspection of

documents; continue drafting

ADS 1.80

11/17/12 Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 0.10

11/19/12 Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

analysis

PL 1 .00

Draft ; draft11/20/12 ADS 5.50

ra:
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Attorney HoursDescription of ServicesDate

3.60review and PLEmail correspondence with A. Shipley re

analyze

11/21/12

review and analyze

Continue draftin: ADS 7.5011/21/12

telephone conference with

attorney Jimmerson re hearing on motion^bi^umm^

emails with Pat Lundvall re same; revise^^HHH|[H|^H^^^H

1.00Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL11/24/12

orward edited versions of

HHHHHHH to s.
exler for fmalization and distribution

Review and analyze PL 3.2011/26/12

ADSContinue draftin: 4.5011/26/12

exchange emails with attorney Jimmerson re

tearing on motion for summary judgment

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

review and revise

PL 1.9011/27/12

Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re issues re motion for

^urmj^jjyug^gent; continue revisingimmUmmi
ADS 2.5011/27/12

Email correspondence with S. Wexler re PL 3.2011/28/12

; review and revise

H email correspondence with A.
; final reviewof^H|^^^^^^H^^^H

email correspondence with A. Shipley re

tnpley re

Continue revisin 3.00ADS11/28/12

Email correspondence with S. Wexler re PL 0.1011/29/12

Review and analyze court filed PL 2.0011/30/12

2.90Emai^oirespondence with A. Shiple\^e

research re|BHH
PL12/03/12

Review and revise PL 5.2012/04/12

ADSContinue drafting 3.5012/04/12

Emailcorrespondence withS/Wexlei^^>hiple\^i^^

revie^an^nalyze

PL 2.0012/05/12
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Description of Services

Review

research

conference with attorney Jimmerson re status check; review

Date Attorney Hours

12/05/12 H; continue
; telephone

ADS 3.50

Prepare for and attend status conference hearing; email correspondence with

C. Hallman and C. Curtis

12/06/12 PL 1.30

Prepare for and attend status hearing; draft12/06/12 ADS 2.70

Review and analyze

Review and analyze

with Pardee team re

Review and analyze

regarding review

Revise

Review

12/14/12 PL 0.20

email correspondence PL12/17/12 0.10

12/18/12 email correspondence with A. Shipley 0.20PL

12/18/12 ADS 1.20

01/03/13 ADS 0.50

Review and edit01/07/13 PL 2.00

email correspondence with J. Riesenmy re

review and analyze B

ADS01/07/13 Review strategize re 0.80

Edit JSR01/07/13 3.90

Start searchin01/08/13 KS 1.80

Email correspondence with M. Merrill re01/09/13 PL 0.10

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

revise

review and

review and revise

01/14/13 PL 0.10

Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson

revise exchange emau^vitl^ttorn^
01/14/13 ADS 0.50

Jimmerson re same

Review and analyze01/17/13 PL 0.20

email correspondence with A. Shipley

email correspondence with A.re

Shipley re^^^^B

Review and prepare

reviewB
ADS01/17/13 2.50
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Date Description of Services

Review and analyze

Attorney Hours

01/18/13 PL 0.10

01/18/13 Exhang^mails witjnittorneWimmei^

BHB fmalize^^^BI^H^BB!
ADS 0.50

01/21/13 Strategize re ADS 1.00

Telephone call with A. Shipley to discuss

correspondence with J. Lash re^^^^B

Telephone conference with judge's law clerk re courtesy copies of motions

and related exhibits; continue preparingHH|HH|||^H

01/22/13 email PL 0.90

01/22/13 ADS 1.50

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re01/23/13 PL 1.20

email correspondence with C. Hallman and C. Curtis re

n ii 'i II n i him ' s

summary o

Prepare for

Review and analyzeflB|H^B|
correspondence with^^Smple^n

Continue preparin.

01/23/13 ADS 5.00

, email PL01/24/13 0.20

erri

01/24/13 ADS 0.50

Review and analyze

^^^B review!
01/28/13 PL 0.10

Draft ADS01/28/13 0.70

Meet with A. Shipley re

review and analyze^T

Continue preparing for

Email correspondence with Jon Holpuch re

Review

Prepare for

01/30/13 PL 0.20

01/30/13 ADS 1.00

02/04/13 PL 0.10

prepare for|02/05/13 PL 7.10

; review and analyze PL

email

02/06/13 5.60

correspondence to Pardee team^^^B

Review correspondence from^^^^^^^B
attorney Jimmerson re various pre-trial issues

Email correspondence with M. Merrill re

email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re stipulating to postpone

trial date; research|BHH|BB^B

; telephone conference with ADS02/06/13 0.70

02/08/13 PL 0.20

02/08/13 ADS 0.70

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re02/11/13 PL . 0.10
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Description of Services

Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re continuing the trial date ADS

and/or re-scheduling the hearing on the cross motions for summary

judgment; research^

Research

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Attorney HoursDate

02/11/13 1.50

ADS 4.2002/12/13

PL 0.1002/13/13

Continue review and strategizing re

continue drafting!
ADS02/13/13 5.20

email02/14/13 Review and analyze^^^^^^H
correspondence with A. Shipley re

Continue drafting

PL 0.20

; continue outliningmm ADS02/14/13 5.50

Review and revise02/15/13 PL 0.20i; review

; draftRevise ADS02/15/13 2.50

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL02/19/13 0.20

02/19/13 Follow up on status o: strategize re ADS 1.30

research

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re02/20/13 PL 0.10

Telephone conference with law clerk to Judge Earley re motion to continue ADS

trial date; continue researching

02/20/13 3.00

Continue researchin ; begin drafting ADS 3.0002/21/13

Email correspondence with M. Merril and A. Shipley re PL02/25/13 0.20

review and analyze

Continue researchin; continue drafting ADS02/25/13 5.50

Review and analyze02/26/13 PL 1 .00

A. Shipley re

prepare for^J^H
email correspondence wit!

; research issues ADSContinue draftin;02/26/13 6.50

re

telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re potential issues re motions

in limine

Review and PL 2.0002/27/13
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Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Continue researching and draftin:

Date

7.5002/27/13 ADS

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

review and anaiyzeHHI^^HHH
PL 2.1002/28/13

review and analyze

Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re various issueyDertainin

to possible motions in limine; continue researching and drafting^^^^H
02/28/13 ADS 7.50

review

Rate/Hour AmountTimekeeper H ours

525.00

465.00

325.00

290.00

210.00

165.00

12,757.50

17,716.50

22,457.50

15,283.00

819.00

297.00

24.30

38.10

69.10

52.70

Pat Lundvall

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

Aaron D. Shipley

Jeffry Riesenmy

Karen Surowiec

3.90

1.80

$ 69,3 30.50Current Fees

$ (6.933.05)10% Fees Discount

$ 62,3 97.45Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

30.05Mileage

Westlaw

On-Line Research

Photo Copies

Transcript - - Paid To: Litigation Services & Technologies

0.00

50.30

13.60

1,122.3511/02/12

Inc.

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Air Fare - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Transcript - - Paid To: Jennifer Church

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To; Bankcard Center - ADS

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center

Business Meal - - Paid To: Bankcard Center

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

5.5011/15/12

11/15/12

11/15/12

11/15/12

11/28/12

11/28/12

12/10/12

12/20/12

12/20/12

12/20/12

12/20/12

12/20/12

12/20/12

01/10/13

01/10/13

7.50

17.50

209.50

169.80

66.00

65.52

3.50

3.50

7.00

43.00

75.04

0.00

6.00

6.00
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Depositions - - Paid To: Litigation Services & Technologies 1,082.1301/14/13

Inc.

Outside Copying Service - - Paid To: Quivx eDiscovery

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

1,133.0602/19/13

02/21/13

02/21/13

3.50

3.50

$ 4.123.85Current Disbursements

$ 66.521.30Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald •carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Invoice No. 1206551

March 12,2013

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel
Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through February 28, 2013

Coyote Springs - Jeff Wlfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALD CARANO WILSON LLP

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 69,3 30.50Current Fees

S (6.933.05)10% Fees Discount

$ 62,3 97.45Adjusted Fees

$ 4.123.85Current Disbursements

$ 66,521.30Total This Invoice

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our
Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

Invoice No. 1208264

April 24, 2013

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through March 31, 2013:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 700110

7131 800 1 . 1 508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 66,521.30

Payments Received Since Previous Statement I 0.00

Balance Forward $66,5 21.30

Current Fees $33,9 60.00

10% Fees Discount $ (3.396.00^

Adjusted Fees $ 30,5 64.00

Current Disbursements $ 704.40

Payment Applied $(152.2 0J

Total Balance Due $ 97,637.50

100 WEST II8ERTY STREET, 10™ FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 8950 1 	

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 000

LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-4100

FAX 702-873-9966

£
5

in F
P.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89S05

775-788-2000 FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Description of Services

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Date Attorney Hours

03/01/13 PL 3.10

; review and analyze

Continue revising

Jimmerson re various topics of the motions in limine

Prepare for

Prepare for

Email correspondence with A. Shipley and M. Merrill

prepare

Research issuesreH^HH|H|HH|HHHHHHflH|H|H;
prepare

Prepare for and attendhearingonmotion for summary judgment; email to

client representatives

Prepare and attend hearing on motion for summary judgment; telephone

conference with attorney Jimmerson re various pre-trial issues and order re

counter motion for summary judgment on standing issue

Review and analyze

Follow up research re

Review and analyze!

telephone conference with attorney03/01/13 ADS 4.50

03/02/13 PL 5.00

03/03/13 PL 6.00

03/04/13 PL 2.00

03/04/13 ADS 3.50

03/05/13 PL 6.70

03/05/13 ADS 6.00

03/06/13 PL 0.20

03/07/13 ADS 1.00

03/08/13 PL 0.70

email correspondence with A. ipiey re

review and analyze^^^^^^^^H

^ email correspmiaenc^witn^A

Review

errill and A. Shipley re

03/08/13 ADS 0.70

exchange emails with attorney Jimmerson re

same

Email correspondence with A. Shipley

telephone call with Plaintiffs counsel re additional dates

Exchang^mail^vitJ^t^^ motions in limine; research

issues

03/11/13 PL 0.60

03/11/13 ADS 3.00

Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re various pre-trial issues and ADS

motions in limine

Review and analyze

03/12/13 0.70

03/13/13 email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 0.10

Review and analyze03/14/13 PL 0.20
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Description of Services

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Date Attorney Hours

03/15/13 PL 1 .00

email correspondence with A.

lpley re

review and analyze

03/15/13 Research

begin planning re

review

ADS 4.50

; continue03/18/13 Review

researching^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^l

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

ADS 2.50

03/19/13 PL 0.10

conferenc^witi^ttoni^Tiimnersoin^anou^r^ianssuS

Email correspondence with A. Shipley in preparation of^^H

telephone03/19/13 ADS 1.50

03/20/13 PL 4.20

email correspondence with A. Shipley reB

review and analyze

review and analyze

review and analyze

review and analyze

Continue researching issue o03/20/13 ADS 1.00

Review and analyze03/21/33 PL 1.00

email correspondence with C. Hallman re^^^B
email correspondence with S. Wexlerre

; emai

correspondence witl errill re

Review ADS03/21/13 3.30reviev^^^H

continue research re

Email correspondence with S. Wexler re03/22/13 PL 0.20

review and analyze

review and analyze

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re03/25/13 PL 0.40

review and analyze

email correspondence

errill and A. Shipley rewit;

Continue outlining

Conference with A. Shipley to discuss

Begin drafting

ADS03/25/13 2.00

03/26/13 PL 0.50

03/26/13 ADS 4.50
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Date Description of Services Attorney Hours

03/27/13 Continue researching issues re ADS 4.00

03/28/13 Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 0.10

03/28/13 Continue drafting ADS 1.50

03/29/13 Review email correspondence from J. Jimmerson re PL 1.20

^^Bemail correspondence with A. Shipley re

review and analyze

correspondence with A. Shipleyre^^^^^H
; emai

03/29/13 Continue drafting!
^1 research exchange emails
wltrHittoniey Jimmersor^^nneHelepnor^ with attorney
Jimmerson re multiple pre-trial issues

ADS 6.50

Timekeeper H Rate/Hour

525.00 „

325.00

Amountours

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

17,482.50

16,477.50

33.30

50.70

Current Fees S 33,9 60.00

10% Fees Discount S (3.396.00)

Adjusted Fees $ 30,5 64.00

DescriptionDisbursement Amount

Mileage

Photo Copies

Transcript - - Paid To: Jennifer Church

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

6.78

3.22

03/13/13

03/15/13

687.40

7.00

$Current Disbursements 704.40

Total Fees & Disbursements $ 31.268.40
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Mcdonald•carano •wilson5
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1208264

April 24, 2013

10880 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 1900

Los Angeles, CA 90024

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through March 31, 2013

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

Mcdonald carano-wilsonllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$Balance Due From Previous Statement 66,521.30

Payments Received Since Previous Statement $ 0.00

$66,5Balance Forward 21.30

$33,9Current Fees 60.00

$ f3.396.0Q)10% Fees Discount

$ 30,5 64.00Adjusted Fees

$Current Disbursements 704.40

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment

099

JA007836



Invoice No. 1208264

Page 6
Mcdonald carano • wilsonLLP

Payment Applied $(152.2 0^

Total Balance Due $ 97,637.50

OUTSTANDING INVOICES:

Invoice Invoice Amount Payments/Adjustments BalanceDate

03/12/13 1206551 $66,521.30 $0.00 $66,521.30
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Mcdonald • carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1209681

June 13, 2013

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through May 31, 2013:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

$44,7 31.50Current Fees

10% Fees Discount for $39,645.00 = $3,964.50 + Courtesy Discount for

B. Grubb $3,151.50 and C. Stanko $1,935.00 Fees $ (9.051.001

$ 35,6 80.50Adjusted Fees

Current Disbursements $ 337.24

Total This Invoice $36,017.74

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 200

LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

& fa

in A
P.O. BOX 2670, RENO. NEVADA 89 505

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Description of Services

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

review and revise^^H

Attorney HoursDate

04/01/13 PL 0.10

04/01/13 Draft letter to Judge Earley re

attorney Jimmerson re joint pre-trial memorandumTcontinue draftin;
!; exchange emails with ADS 4.70

Conference with Aaron Shipley re04/01/13 BAG 0.40

04/02/13 Review email correspondence from J. Jimmerson to A. Shipley and attached PL

letter to the court re calendar call

0.10

04/02/13 Continue drafting ADS 4.50

; exchange emails with attorney Jimmerson re pre-trial issues

Begin review o BAG04/02/13 2.10

Conference with A. Shipley re|HHHH^MH
correspondence with J. Jimme^oi^n^A^nipl^n^cheai
conference

Continue

04/03/13 i; email

ule telephone

PL 0.30

04/03/13 ADS 6.50

Continue reviewin04/03/13 BAG 4.50

Prepare for and attend conference call with counsel

Continue researching and drafting

04/04/13 PL 0.20

04/04/13 ADS 5.00

telephone conference with attorney

immerson re various pre-trial issues

Continue reviewin:04/04/13 BAG 5.50

Review and analyze PL04/05/13 0.80

; review and revise

Continue researching and drafting ADS04/05/13 4.50

telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson

re pre-trial issues; outline

Continue reviewing^^B04/05/13 BAG 5.10

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re04/07/13 PL 0.10
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Page 3

Description of ServicesDate Attorney Hours

Multipl^mai^one^ondence with A. Shipley

review email from J. JimmersoiHcrt^
04/08/13 PL 1.20

ipley re trial

ates; email correspondence with C. Hallman, C. Curtis, J. Lash and K.

Andrews re email correspondence with A. Shipley re

04/08/13 Draft telephone

conference with court clerk re trial scheduling issues; telephone conference

with attorney Jimmerson re pre-trial issues^e^e^orrespondenc^mm

court clerk re continuance of trial; revise

ADS 4.00

Continue reviewing04/08/13 BAG 1.50

; conference with Aaron Shipley re

04/09/13 Continued email correspondence with C. Hallman, J. Lash and K. Andrews

; email correspondence with J. Jimmerson and A. Shipley re trial

PL 0.40

re

dates

Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re pre-trial disclosures and ADS

trial scheduling issues

04/09/13 0.40

Review and analyze04/10/13 ; review PL 0.10

Draft04/12/13 ADS 3.00

email correspondence from M. Merrill re

correspondence with A. Shipley re^^|

Review^	
telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re same; research issues for

04/15/13 PL 0.20

emai

04/15/13 ADS 3.50

Review email correspondence of J. Jimmerson to A. Shipley re case status PL

and management

Review and revise

04/16/13 0.10

04/16/13 ADS 0.30

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Exchange emails with attorney Jimmei^i^epresemtion of Wilkes1 trial

testimony; continue researchingfl^HHHHHH|||H|

Begin drafting

Review and analyze

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

04/17/13 PL 0.10

04/17/13 ADS .50

04/18/13 ADS 0.80

04/21/13 PL 0.10

04/22/13 PL 0.20

review court enter©

04/23/13 . Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 0.20

review ana analyze
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Description of Services

Review

Attorney HoursDate

04/23/13 ADS 4.30

prepare tor

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

^^^^^review and compare^^^H
discuss^^^^^H

04/24/13 PL 0.30

with A. Shipley in preparation for

Continue preparing for04/24/13 ADS 1.70

04/25/13 Continue preparing fori ADS 2.00

Prepare for and attend hearing on plaintiffs motion for leave to file a second

amended complaint, email correspondence with J. Church

04/26/13 PL 5.00

Prepare for and attend hearing on plaintiffs' motion for leave to file second

amended complaint

Review and analyze

correspondence with Parde^earine^^^^

research issues re

04/26/13 ADS 2.50

L email04/29/13 PL 0.30

04/29/13 Review ADS 1.70

Research issue re ADS04/30/13 1.90

Email correspondence with C. Hallman re

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Continue researching issue re^^^^^l

05/01/13 PL 0.10

05/02/13 PL 0.20

05/02/13 ADS 5.00

Review and revise05/03/13 email correspondence with PL 0.10

A. Shipley re

Continue researching issue re05/03/13 ADS 3.00review

Revise order re hearing on April 26, 2013; continue research for05/06/13 ADS 2.70

Review05/07/13 PL 0.10

Continue draftin:05/07/13 ADS 4.00

telephone conference witrfattorney

immerson re proposed order re hearing on April 26, 20 1 3

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re05/08/13 PL 0.10
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Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Page 5

Attorney Hours

ADS

Description of Services

Continue drafting^^H

Date

5.5005/08/13

0.10PLReview and revise05/09/13

email

^matRon^spondence with A.
review

0.40PLContinued revision

correspondence with A. Shipley re

Shipley

05/10/13

review

ADS 3.50Review05/10/13
telephone conference with attorney

Jimmerson re order re hearing on April 24, 20 1 3

0.20Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL05/14/13
review

and analyze

Review^M ADS 1.0005/14/13

Exchangeemailswit^ re discovery plan; strategize re ADS

IHHBIHHI conference call with Pat Lundvall and
2.0005/15/13

attorney Jimmerson re discovery plan; research

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson and A^Shipleyre
review and analyze

^^^HemaiRorrespondence with A. Shipleyre^^^B

PL 0.1005/16/13

Exchange emails with attorney Jimmerson re scheduling deposition of ADS 1.5005/16/13

Wolfram; draft

0.10Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re
email correspondence with J. Lash an<

PL05/17/13

PL 0.3005/20/13
. Andrews re

ADS 0.20Research case law re05/20/13

PL 0.60Review and analyze

m|||[, Email corresponoencewitn A. Shipley regarding

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Review

05/22/13

PL 0.2005/23/13

ADS 2.20; begin draftin;05/23/13

; research issu<

ADS 1. 10Research issues re

Call with Mr. Shipley: looking at docs to get oriented on the case From A. CS
Shipley and P. Lundvall (courtesy discount)

Researching

05/24/13

0.4005/24/13

CS 4.9005/27/13
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Attorney HoursDescription of Services

05/28/13 Email correspondence with A. Shipley re
analyze

Date

; review and 0.70PL

review

1.40ADSReview case law re05/28/13

CS 1.20Began writing

Review and analyze^B
correspondence with A.

Shipley re^^H^^H

05/28/13

email

email correspondence with A.

Hi review^^^^^^^^H

2.90PL05/29/13

ipley re

•reparation for review and revise

ADS 4.50Draft!05/29/13 revise

telephone

conference with attorney Jimmerson re same

Finished 6.40CS05/29/13

2.50Review and analyze

email correspondenc^ronnHmimersonre
deposition of James Wolfram

Review^ 	
deposition of James Wolfram; send email to attorney Jimmerson re order

granting motion for leave to file second amended complaint

PL05/31/13

prepare for andattem

attend ADS 1.7005/31/13

Rate/Hour AmountTimekeeper H ours

18.50 9,712.50

29,932.50

3,151.50

1,935.00

525.00

325.00

165.00

150.00

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley 92.10

19.10Brian Grubb

12.90Chris Stanko

$44,7 31.50Current Fees

10% Fees Discount for $39,645.00 = $3,964.50 +
Courtesy Discount B. Grubb $3,151.50 and C.

Stanko $1,935.00 $(9.051 .00^

$35,6 80.50Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

8.48Mileage

Westlaw

On-Line Research

Photo Copies

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Transcript - - Paid To: Jennifer Church, Court Reporter

0.00

11.20

0.29

3.5004/08/13

04/08/13

04/08/13

04/08/13

04/08/13

05/08/13

14.00

14.00

14.00

18.00

207.50
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05/13/13

05/15/13

05/15/13

05/21/13

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

12.00

17.50

12.00

MISCELLANEOUS COSTS - - Paid To: AT&T 1.71

Teleconference Services - Conference call

MISCELLANEOUS COSTS - - Paid To: AT&T 3,0605/21/13

Teleconference Services - Conference call

$Current Disbursements 337.24

$ 36.017.74Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald • carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX fD 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel
Pardee Homes

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

El Segundo, CA 90245

Invoice No. 1209681

June 13, 2013

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through May 3 1 , 201 3

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 700 1 1 0

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

Mcdonald carano wilsonllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$44,7 31.50Current Fees

10% Fees Discount for $39,645.00 - $3,964.50 + Courtesy Discount for

B. Grubb $3,151.50 and C. Stanko $1,935.00 Fees $ (9.051.001

$ 35,6 80.50Adjusted Fees

Current Disbursements i 337.24

Total This Invoice $ 36,017.74

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

El Segundo, CA 90245

Invoice No. 1212963

September 1 9, 20 1 3

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through August 31, 2013:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

$ 55,0 02.00Current Fees

$ f5.5Q0.20J10% Fees Discount

Adjusted Fees $49,5 01.80

Current Disbursements $ 1,023.52

Total This Invoice $ 50,525.32

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 200

LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-4100

FAX 702-873-9966

•^^9-9
A

>f'V T ; ~

P.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89505

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Description of Services

Review and analyze

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

review and analyze

Date Attorney Hours

06/03/13 PL 0.40

06/04/13 PL 0.40

; review and analyze

06/04/13 Review ADS 0.60

Review and analyze06/06/13 PL 0.60

review and analyze

06/06/13 Draft ADS 1.50

06/10/13 Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 0.30

06/11/13 Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 0.10

06/11/13 Exchange emails with attorney Jimmerson re motions in limine; conference

with Pat Lundvall re^HHBHBHIIIII^HIHHHIIII^^^^^^^I
ADS 0.40

reviewJEmail correspondence with A. Shipley re06/12/13 PL 0.20

Exchange emails with attorney Jimmerson requesting an extension to the

second amended complaint; telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson

re same

Strategize re

Research issues

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding^^lHHH

06/12/13 ADS 0.70

06/17/13 ADS 0.30

06/18/13 ADS 0.50

06/20/13 PL 0.10

06/20/13 Research issue ADS 1.80

06/21/13 ADS 1.00

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding06/24/13 PL 0.20

I, review email correspondence of A. Shipley
and J. Jimmerson re

06/24/ 1 3 Telephone confeiencewithattome

HH|; research
Jimmerson re same^ontmu^cHiraft^B

06/25/13 Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Jimmerson

^exchangeemails with attorney
ADS 1.50

PL 0.10
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Attorney HoursDescription of ServicesDate

i, email correspondence with PL 0.20Review and revise06/27/13
A. Shipley re review and analyze

ADS 1.00Continue drafting

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

06/27/13

PL 0.1006/28/13

1.50ADS06/28/13

0.80Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re scheduling pre-trial

conference

Review email correspondence of J. Jimmerson with A. Shipley

ADS07/01/13

0.10PL07/02/13

1.50ADSContinue drafting07/02/13

PL 0.30Email correspondence with A. Shipley re07/03/13

ADS 1.20Finalize

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Review emails from attorney Jimmerson re

07/03/13

0.10PL07/05/13

0.20ADS"07/05/13

PL 0.70Email correspondence with A. Shipley re07/08/13

ADS 1.80Draft07/08/13
Ira:

Prepare for and attend hearing on motions; email correspondence with A. PL 3.0007/09/13

Shipley ref^

0.10Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL07/10/13

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re 2.267 conference; email
correspondence with A. Shipley re

0.20PL07/11/13

MR
; review ^

, email correspondence with A"

ADS 1.80Draft07/11/13 ; review

0.10Email correspondence with C. Hallman and D. Stoft re PL07/12/13

ADS 1.20Research issues re07/12/13
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Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Date

1.00PL07/15/13

email correspondence with J.

to discuss stipulations; email correspondence with C.
review and

j immerson re meetin,

Curtis re^^^^^H
analyze

Revise^	
Jimmerson re same^elephon^onfereiKes with attorney Jimmerson re pre

trial issues; review

exchange emails with attorney ADS 1.7007/15/13

Email correspondence with A. Shiple^n^^imme^oruj^Wolfmm
deposition notes; review and analyze^^^^^^^^^^^^^^H

PL 0.2007/16/13

Draft email ADS 1.3007/16/13

research issues re

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 1.2007/17/13

email correspondence and

"telephone conversation with J. Jimmerson re requested documents; review

transcript re^
correspondence wit]

review

email

. Jimmerson re documents to stipulate admissibility;

Continue researchin ADS 2.0007/17/13

iegin drafting

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re depositions, dates for discovery

and documents for admissibility; email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re

H. Whittemore testimony; email correspondence with B. Grubb
in ii w md analyze

PL 2.0007/18/13

email correspondence with A.

Shipley re^M

Continue draftin; ; draft ADS 2.0007/18/13

^H^B email
review and revise

Email correspondence with B. Grubbre

correspondence with A. Shipley re^B
PL 3.0007/19/13

review and analyze

Continue drafting

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re trial subpoena to J. Lash

Review correspondence from J. Jimmerson re hearing on motions in limine;

review and

ADS 1.5007/19/13

PL 0.1007/20/13

PL 0.2007/22/13

0.60Review PL07/23/13

review and analyze

prepare for and attend status conference
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Page 5

Attorney HoursDate Description of Services

Begin

Review

BAG 3.0007/23/13

PL 0.7007/24/13

review and analyze

; review

; review Jimmersoi

Continue review o: BAG 3.5007/24/13

conference with

continueLeah Sutton anc^all^wexler re

preparation ofjHHHHl

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re J. Lash trial subpoena and H.

Whittemore appearance; review

and attend Rule 2.67 conference

0.30PL07/25/13

; prepare for

Telephone conference with Stephanie/Jimerson re disclosures; continue

preparation oifm^ participate in Rule 2.67 conference

Email correspondence with M. Merrill and A. Shipley re^^^H

BAG 7.6007/25/13

PL 0.7007/26/13

reviewreview

BAGTelephone conference with Stephanie/Jimerson re disclosures; finalize 6.3007/26/13

ADS 2.50Review

reviewl
07/29/13 review

telephone

conference with attorney Jimmerson re pre-tnaiissues

Conference with Aaron Shiplevre^^H
email to opposing counsel re^^^^^H

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

draft BAG 0.6007/29/13

PL 0.3007/30/13

Continue preparation BAG 4.2007/30/13

email correspondence with

emai^onesponaenc^wim A. Shipley

begin drafting

PL 0.20Review

A. Shiple^e
07/31/13

ADS 4.5007/31/13 Prepare

Besin reviewin, BAG 3.0007/31/13

revie*

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re 0.90PL08/01/13

email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re

request to withdraw motions in limine; email correspondence with C.

Hallman re email correspondence with A. Shipley re
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Description of Services

Continue drafting

Continue reviewin:

Attorney Hours

ADS

BAG

Date

5.5008/01/13

5.7008/01/13

egin reviewin;

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re Jon Lash appearance at trial;

email correspondence with A. Shipley

Continue drafting

Continue reviewin:

PL 0.1008/02/13

ADS 3.8008/02/13

BAG08/02/13 4.80

continue reviewin;

review

review

, emailReview and revise

correspondence witnATSmpleyre

PL 0.1008/03/13

review and analyze

Continue drafting

Review and continued revision

email correspondence witr^^Snipie^e

Continue drafting

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re request to withdraw various

motions in limine; continued revision

^^^^HemaiTcorrespondence with C. Royce

ADS08/03/13 2.00

08/04/13 PL 0.20

ADS 4.0008/04/13

0.4008/05/13 PL

Continue drafting

Draft email to Plaintiffs' counsel re

Aaron Shipley

preparation

ADS08/05/13 7.70

conference with

continue

BAG 3.8008/05/13

PL 0:3008/06/13

Draftl ADS 2.0008/06/13

draftReview and organize BAG 2.8008/06/13

Multiple email correspondence with Pardee team re

review and revise^^^^^^H
email correspondence with A. Smpieyre^^B

PL 0.9008/07/13

review and analyze

Continue draftin; ; revise ADS 5.6008/07/13
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Description of Services

Continue preparation for

HoursDate Attorney

BAG08/07/13 3.80

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re

review and revise

PL08/08/13 0.20

email correspondence with A. Shipley reH

email correspondence with B. Grubb anoA^
Shipley re^^^H

Continue drafting

Continue preparation for

review|

08/08/13 ADS 5.50

08/08/13 BAG 5.20

Review ADS 0.7008/09/13

Draft letter to opposing counsel re

Review and analvze^^^^^^H
Jimmerson

Review^^^^H^^^^HH

BAG08/09/13 0.30

; review B. Grubb letter to J.08/12/13 PL 0.20

08/12/13 ADS 1.50

Finalize letter to opposing counsel re08/12/13 ; draft email re review BAG 1.40

Continue drafting08/13/13 ADS 1.50

Finalize review o BAG 0.5008/13/13

Review and analyze^H
m|; review and analyze

Begin drafting

Continue drafting

08/14/13 PL 0.20

ADS08/14/13 1.50

ADS08/16/13 1.70

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re proposed exhibit list

Review

08/18/13 PL 0.10

email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 0.1008/19/13

Continue drafting

Review and revise

ADS 2.4008/19/13

08/20/13 PL 0.20

Continue draftin:

drafting^^^H
08/20/13 ; continue ADS 6.50

Continue draftin ADS08/21/13 2.50

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re08/22/13 PL 0.10
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Description of Services

Continue draftinj

Date Attorney Hours

08/22/13 ADS 3.50

malize

Review and prepare08/22/13 BAG 1.80

Review and revise08/23/13 PL 0.10

email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Continue draftin; ADS08/23/13 4.20

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Continue drafting^	
telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re moving the hearing on our

motion for partial summary judgment and motion to compel production of

notes

08/26/13 PL 0.10

08/26/13 ADS 4.10

Draft ADS08/27/13 1.50

email same to attorney

Jimmerson; telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re same; continue

drafting

Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re discovery issues; continue ADS

drafting^^HHHHHHHHHHH
08/28/13 1.60

Timekeeper H Rate/Hour Amountours

Pat Lundvall 525.00

325.00

165.00

22.00

104.10

58.30

11,550.00

33,832.50

9,619.50

Aaron D. Shipley

Brian Grubb

$ 55,0 02.00Current Fees

10% Fees Discount $ (5.500.20)

$ 49,5 01.80Adjusted Fees

DescriptionDisbursement Amount

Mileage

Photo Copies

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Transcript - - Paid To: Litigation Services & Technologies

23.73

20.32

06/20/13

06/27/13

3.50

493.50

Inc.

Transcript - - Paid To: Jennifer Church, Court Reporter

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center

Overnight Delivery Service - - Paid To: FedEx

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center

07/18/13

08/06/13

08/06/13

08/07/13

08/20/13

08/20/13

08/20/13

226.70

3.50

209.50

27.77

3.50

3.50

8.00

$ 1.023.52Current Disbursements

116

JA007853



Invoice No. 1212963

Page 9
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

$ 50.525.32Total Fees & Disbursements

117

JA007854



Mcdonald •carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

EI Segundo, CA 90245

Invoice No. 1212963

September 19, 2013

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through August 3 1 , 20 1 3

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALD'CARANO'WILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 55,0 02.00Current Fees

10% Fees Discount $ (5.500.201

$49,5 01.80Adjusted Fees

Current Disbursements $ 1.023.52

Total This Invoice $ 50,525.32

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Mcdonald• carano •wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

EI Segundo, CA 90245

Invoice No. 1213484

October 1 1, 2013

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through September 30, 2013:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 50,525.32

Payments Received Since Previous Statement $ 0.00

Balance Forward $ 50,5 25.32

Current Fees $ 19,5 88.50

No Charge $2,340.00 & 10% Fees Discount

$1,724.85 $ (4,064 .85)

Adjusted Fees $ 15,5 23.65

Current Disbursements $ 628.63

Payment Applied $039.2 51

Total Balance Due $ 66,538.35

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET , 10™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 200

LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

£
•sfTryt
A in A

P.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89505

775-788-2000 • FAX 77 S-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Continue drafting

Date

ADS 1.5009/02/13

Review and analyze PL 0.1009/05/13

ADSContinue drafting 1.7009/05/13

continue draftin

Continue draftin; ADS 4.5009/09/13

continue drafting

Continue draftin; ADS 6.3009/10/13

continue drafting

I begin drafting

^Continue drafting

Review and revise

ADS 2.3009/11/13

PL 2.7009/16/13

email

conference with A. Shipley to

; review and analyze

correspondence with A. Shiple>rre

discuss

ADSContinue revisingHHHHH^H^|^^|^HHHHH|^|;
telephone conference^MnHuage^a\^lenH^monon^iHimine; draft

2.5009/16/13

Email correspondence with Pardee team re^m 0.10PL09/17/13

ADS 1.4009/17/13 ; review

BAG 0.50Review

Review email correspondence of B. Grubb and J. Jimmerson re joint pre-trial PL

memorandum

09/17/13

0.1009/18/13

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re 0.20PL09/20/13

•repare for ; prepare ADSRevise 3.7009/20/13

for

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re^mm^j PL 0.1009/22/13
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Description of Services Attorney HoursDate

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson and A. Shipley re pretriai/calendar

call; review

PL 6.4009/23/13

review

prepare tor and attend hearing on multiple

motions

Prepare for and attend hearing on all outstanding and pending motions (no

charge)

09/23/13 ADS 3.50

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson scheduling meeting to discuss

pretriai/calendar call and case management; review and reviseHHHh
email correspondenc^witl^.

09/24/13 PL 0.30

Shipley re

Review® I; draft09/24/13 ADS 5.00

; research issues re

Conference with Pat Lundvall re

review^^^^^^H
BAG09/24/13 0.80

prepare clean copies to replace

Review and revise

correspondence with A. Shipley re

Continue drafting

j, email09/25/13 PL 2.00

ADS 1.0009/25/13

Continued revision to PL 0.6009/26/13

email correspondence wit]

proposec^xnimts; email correspondence with A. Shipley re
. Jimmerson re copies o

review and analyze

Continue draftin ADS 1.0009/26/13

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re PL 1.2009/27/13

review o:

; prepare for and attend meeting with J. Jimmerson re

case management; review and analyze

review and analyze review and analyze

email correspondence with A.

Attend meeting with opposingcounselreexhil^ and trial preparation; draft

email to opposing counsel re|||||

Email correspondence with J. Stringer, C. Curtis and A. Shipley re^^^B
BBB n 1 n ind analyze^^^^^^^^®®®®^^^^^^^®

ipley re

BAG09/27/13 0.60

PL 1.0009/30/13

review

Review;09/30/13 ADS 1.00

telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re scheduling deposition of

Chuck Curits and Jim Stringer; reviewHHHHHjl
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Timekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

Brian Grubb

Rate/Hour Amountours

7,770.00

11,505.00

313.50

14.80 525.00

325.00

165.00

35.40

1.90

$ 19,5 88.50Current Fees

No Charge $2,340.00 & 10% Fees Discount

$1,724.85 $ (4.064 .85^

$ 15,5 23.65Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

Mileage

Photo Copies

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Transcript - - Paid To: Loree Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

Transcript - - Paid To: Loree Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

4.52

5.91

10.5009/17/13

09/23/13 439.40

09/26/13 168.30

$ 628.63Current Disbursements

$ 16.152.28Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald • carano-wilsons
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)
Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel
Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1213484

October 1 1, 2013

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through September 30, 2013
Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10
71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

Mcdonald carano wilsonllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 50,525.32Balance Due From Previous Statement

$ 0.00Payments Received Since Previous Statement

$ 50,5 25.32Balance Forward

$ 19,5 88.50Current Fees

No Charge $2,340.00 & 10% Fees Discount
$ (4.064 .85)$1,724.85

$ 15,5 23.65Adjusted Fees

$ 628.63Current Disbursements

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa
or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003
Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Page 6
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

$ (139.2 5)Payment Applied

$ 66,538.35Total Balance Due

OUTSTANDING INVOICES:

Invoice Amount Payments/Adjustments BalanceInvoiceDate

$50,525.32 $0.00 $50,525.3209/19/13 1212963
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Mcdonald • carano •wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-00742S3

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

2 1 20 Park Place, Suite 1 20

Invoice "No. 1214251

November 08, 2013

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through October 3 1 , 20 1 3 :

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Current Fees S 124, 856.00

5% Fees Discount $5,609.06 + A. Shipley

Courtesy Discount $12,809.88 $ (18.284.06)

Adjusted Fees $ 106, 571.94

Current Disbursements $ 2,424.3 1

Jimmerson Hansen PC Payment Applied $ (652.50)

Total This Invoice $108,343.75

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET, 10" FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 200

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

& 'e

AluJ-
P.O. BOX 26 70, RENO. NEVADA 89S05

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1214251

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano wilsonl l p

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Description of Services HoursDate Attorney

10/01/13 Analyze^^^^^
with J. Jimmerson re same

email correspondence PL 0.40

1 0/02/ 1 3 Review and revise

email correspondence with A. Shipley re

PL 0.40

10/02/13 Revise ADS 0.80review

; exchange emails with attorney

immerson re dratt order; review

10/03/13 Review and analyze PL 0.10

1 0/04/1 3 Email correspondence with B. Grubb re PL 0.10

1 0/04/ 1 3 Research BAG 2.00

draft email to trial team re telephone conference with Frances

utier

10/07/13 Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

correspondence with A. Shipieyre^^T

review and PL 2.00

email

review and analyze

10/07/13 Draft! review and revise ADS 2.00

; review

1 0/07/ 1 3 Pick up trial preparation, amend

assist in preparation oj
BAG 3.50

assist m finalizing

10/08/13 Email correspondence with J, Jimmerson re pretrial memorandum; review

email correspondence with

^^^^^emaiicorrespondence with K, Andrews re
email correspondence with H. WhittemorereH

multiple email correspondence with C. Mailman

email correspondenc^itl^^Shipley reHHHHHHHj^^
and analyzeBHHHHH|^H|

10/08/13 Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re joint pre-trial

; review

PL 4.00

and revise

S. Levy re

review

ADS 1.00

memorandum; review

1 0/08/ 1 3 Miscellaneous trial preparation includin; BAG 5.60

ra:

; draft ; assist in finalizing
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Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Email correspondence with A. Shiple^re

correspondence with C. Hallman reMM__
Jimmerson re settlement; email correspondence with C. Hallman re

^ and analyze^^^^^H^^^^^H

Date

email PL 4.0010/09/13

telephone call with J.

BAG 1.50Continue10/09/13

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson, C. Curtis ancU^tringen^

settlement^mailcon^pondence with A. Shipley reH^f^^HH
email correspondence with JJmunersor^e

revisions to orders on motion to compel and motion fonxulial summar^^^

judgment; email correspondence with A. Shipley reB^B^B reviewBB|

PL 6.0010/10/13

Continue preparation

MB|; exchang^manswitr^^stii^S)u^Clerk re trial;
communicate with opposing counsel re exhibits and trial transcripts.

Emailcon^spondence with C. Curtis and J. Stringer reHUj^H
MMHKprepare for and attend depositions of C. Curtis and J. Stringer,

BAG 3.5010/10/13

PL 8.0010/11/13

BAG 1.80Continue10/11/13

exchange emails with opposing counsel re trial transcripts

and exhibits;

Telephone conference with S. Levy re

K. Andrews

Continu^mpai'ation °fj|jjBHHH	
exchang^man^vlth Kristin/Court Clerk re trial

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re H. Whittemore trial testimony;

email correspondence with A. Shipley re^^H
correspondence with B. Grubb and A. Shipley r<

and revise^

Exchange emails with team re	

Stephanie/Jimmerson Hansen re trial transcripts and payment for same;

review and respond to emails with Kristin/Court Clericretrialan^

preparation; conference with Brandon Morgan re||^H|HBHBB|
continue

; email correspondence with PL 9.0010/14/13

BAG 4.0010/14/13

9.00PL10/15/13

; email

review

telephone conference with BAG 2.0010/15/13

Email correspondence with B. Grubbre^^H
correspondence with A. Shipley re^^^^^|
^B; email correspondence with A. Shipley re

email 9.00PL10/16/13

continue reviewin; ADS 1.00Revise10/16/13 ; review

Continue BAG 5.8010/16/13
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Invoice No. 121425 1

Page 4
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Email correspondence with J. Lash reBBBBH' emai^orrespondence PL
withLJimmerson re J. Lash testimony^ontmuec^aits

email correspondence with A. Shipley re(|^preparation

Date

10.0010/17/13

tor

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re testimony of J. Lash; email

email correspondence

9.00PL10/18/13

correspondence with C. Hallman re

with A. Shipley re^^^^^^^^B

BAG 3.20Continue

Review and revise

email correspondence with A. Shipley re

10/18/13

8.00PL10/19/13

ADS 1.00Draft10/19/13

email correspondence with K. Andrews PL

^^^^B ema'l correspondence with
8.00Prepare notes fori

prepare!

H. wnittemore re

10/20/13

PL 10.00Continued revision to10/21/13

email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Whittemore re

telephone conference with H.

; email correspondence with A. Shipley re

email correspondence with Pardee team re

BAGReview 1.0010/21/13

email correspondence with A. Shipley re

preparation off^|jjj||
Continued revision to^^^^B
continued prepamtioiHor

PL 10.0010/22/13

BAGContinue 4.1010/22/13
conference with Pat Lundvail re

Email correspondence with C. Hallman re

correspondence with H. Whittemore re^	
J. Jimmerson re testimony of J. Lash; review and" analyze
^emailcorrespondence with C. Hallman re^^f
^Hl prepare for and attend bench trial

Prepare for and attend trial (Dayl)^raviewBIBBBi

email PL 11.0010/23/13

; email correspondence with

review 9.50ADS10/23/13

Assist during trial with presentation of exhibits for display on court monitors BAG

and other trial assistance

Prepare for and attend bench trial; email correspondence with C. Hallman PL

and J. Lash re

Attend trial (Day 2) (courtesy discount)

Continue to assist during trial with presentation of exhibits for display on BAG

court monitors and other trial assistance; prepare|

5.0010/23/13

10.0010/24/13

ADS 7.5010/24/13

6.0010/24/13
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Page 5
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Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Email correspondence with J. Church re^^^^H
correspondence with J. Lash and K. AnarewsreH

; review and analyze

Date

email 9.00PL10/25/13

continued

Conference with trial team re ADS 1.50i 0/25/13 ; review.

Continued 6.00PL10/26/13

email correspondence with J. Lash and C. PLContinued!
Hallman re

8.0010/27/13

Continued preparation and appearance at trial; email correspondence with K. PL

; email correspondence with J. Lash and C. Hallman re
review and

11.0010/28/13

Andrews re

H| emailcomsponBencewitl^^Shipley re
analyze

Attend trial (Day 3); conference with trial team re ADS 9.5010/28/13

Continue to assist during trial with presentation of exhibits for display on

court monitors and other trial assistance; reviewBBBH^^^^^^^B
BAG 9.2010/28/13

conference with Pat

undvali and Aaron Shipley re

Continued preparation and appearance at trial; email correspondence with A. PL

Shipley re

11.0010/29/13
; email correspondence with Pardee team re

review and analyze

attend trial (Day 4);Review ADS 12.5010/29/13

draft,

Continue to assist during trial with presentation of exhibits for display on BAG

conference with

Pat Lundvall and Aaron Shipley misc. preparation for trial tomorrow

ipearanceat trial; email correspondence with PL

email correspondence with A.

^ma!norrespondence with B. Grubb re^f

9.7010/29/13

court monitors and other trial assistance; create

Continued preparation and a1

Pardee teamre^^^^^^H
Shipley

11.0010/30/13

Continue drafting

attend trial (day 5)

Continue to assist during trial with presentation of exhibits for display on BAG

court monitors and other trial assistance; conference with Pat Lundvall and

Aaron Shipley re^

gj^^sr and attend conference call with Pardee team re

ADS 1 .0010/30/13

7.0010/30/13

PL 1.0010/31/13
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Timekeeper H Rate/Hour Amountours

Pat Lundvall 97,125.00

15,372.50

12,358.50

185.00

47.30

74.90

525.00

325.00

165.00

Aaron D. Shipley

Brian Grubb

$ 124, 856.00Current Fees

5% Fees Discount $5,609.06 + A. Shipley

Courtesy Discount $12,809.88 $ (18.284.061

$ 106, 571.94Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

54.80Mileage

Westlaw

Photo Copies

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Witness Fee - - Paid To: Frances Butler Dunlap

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - STF

Transcript - - Paid To: Jennifer Church, Court Reporter

Transcript - - Paid To: Loree Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - JPS

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - JPS

Transcript - - Paid To: Jennifer Church, Court Reporter

Transcript - - Paid To: Loree Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

0.00

10.51

14.0009/30/13

10/04/13

10/08/13

10/16/13

10/16/13

100.00

21.00

515.00

790.00

10/18/13

19/18/13

10/18/13

10/28/13

10/28/13

3.50

7.00

14.00

56.25

382.50

Transcript - - Paid To: Litigation Services & Technologies 455.7510/29/13

Inc.

$ 2.424.31Current Disbursements

Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald • carano-wilsons
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

Invoice No. 1214251

November 08, 2013

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through October 31, 2013

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

Mcdonald caranowilsonllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 124, 856.00Current Fees

5% Fees Discount $5,609.06 + A. Shipley
Courtesy Discount $12,809.88 $ U8.284.06J

Adjusted Fees $ 106, 571.94

Current Disbursements $ 2,424.31

Jimmerson Hansen PC Payment Applied (652.50)$

Total This Invoice $108,343.75

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Out-

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Mcdonald• carano •wilson5
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

Invoice No. 1215141

December 05. 2013

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through November 30, 2013:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 108,343.75

Payments Received Since Previous Statement I 0.00

Balance Forward $ 108, 343.75

$3,67Current Fees 8.00

10% Fees Discount $ (367.80)

Adjusted Fees $3,31 0.20

Current Disbursements $ 5.162.10

Total Balance Due $116,816.05

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET, 10™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89S01

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 200

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

A, (o

-V in )*P.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89505

77S-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1215141

Page 2
McDONALD- CARANO- WILSONLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

HoursDescription of Services

Email correspondence with S. Vokey re

analyze

Review

Exchange emails with court report reporter re transcripts; reviewBI

AttorneyDate

0.60review and PL11/01/13

BAG 0.3011/01/13

BAG 2.2011/04/13

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re potential settlement discussions

Email correspondence with C. Hallman and J. Lash re

PL 0.2011/05/13

0.40PL11/08/13

Gather documents requested by Pat Lundvall' conference with Sally re^|

Emai^orospondence with S. Vokey, C. Hallman and J. Lash re^f^m

0.10BAG11/13/13

PL 0.2011/14/13

Review prior emails re trial transcript payment amounts; send email to court

reporter re same and request update on delivery

BAG 0.1011/19/13

Email correspondence with Pardee team re^^^^^^£| PL 0.1011/20/13

PL 0.20Email correspondence with C. Royce re11/21/13

4.00Review and analyze

Exchange emails with court reporters re status of trial transcripts; prepare

PL11/23/13

BAG 0.5011/25/13

Email correspondence with Pardee team re

analyze

S. Levy re^^T^^^

review and

email correspondence with

0.30PL11/26/13

Rate/Hour AmountTimekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

Brian Grubb

ours

3,150.00

528.00

6.00 525.00

165.003.20

$ 3,67 8.00Current Fees

$ (367.8QJ10% Fees Discount

$3,31 0.20Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

12.43Mileage

Photo Copies

Transcript - - Paid To: Jennifer Church, Court Reporter

0.17

468.7511/04/13
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Transcript - - Paid To: Jennifer Church, Court Reporter

Transcript - - Paid To: Loree Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

Parking - - Paid To: Brian Grubb

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Harvey Whittemore

Transcript - - Paid To: Clark County Treasurer

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Air Fare - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

518.50

1,750.80

11/04/13

11/04/13

140.00

1,387.70

97.45

11/06/13

11/07/13

11/15/13

11/18/13

11/18/13

11/18/13

11/18/13

11/18/13

11/18/13

11/18/13

11/26/13

11/26/13

11/26/13

11/26/13

11/26/13

11/26/13

11/26/13

11/26/13

11/26/13

7.00

9.50

20.00

20.00

20.00

20.00

20.00

449.80

25.00

31.00

62.00

20.00

20.00

20.00

20.00

22.00

$ 5.162.10Current Disbursements

5R 8.472.30Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald • carano wilsqnl
FEDERAL TAX iD 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel
Pardee Homes

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

Invoice No. 1215141

December 05, 2013

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through November 30, 2013
Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALD -CARANO WILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 108,343.75

Payments Received Since Previous Statement $ 0.00

$ 108, 343.75Balance Forward

$ 3,67 8.00Current Fees

$ (367.80)10% Fees Discount

$3,31 0.20Adjusted Fees

$ 5.162.10Current Disbursements

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa
or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Invoice No. 121 5 141

Page 5
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

$116,816.05Total Balance Due

OUTSTANDING INVOICES:

Invoice Invoice Amount Payments/Adjustments BalanceDate

($652.50) $108,343.7511/08/13 1214251 $108,996.25
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Mcdonald*carano -WILSON^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1217030

Januaiy 30, 2014

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through December 31, 2013:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 700 1 1 0

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

$ 79,8 72.50Current Fees

S C7.987.25J1 0% Fees Discount

S 71,8 85.25Adjusted Fees

$ 1,237.77Current Disbursements

Payment From Jimmerson Hansen Applied $ (550.Q0J

Total This Invoice $ 72,573.02

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET, 10™ FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 89S01

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 200

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

a

"A in rP.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89S05

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1217030

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Description of Services Attorney HoursDate

12/02/13 Review and analyze

Shipley re

	 L email correspondence with A.
email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re scheduling of

witnesses; email correspondence with J. Lash re

correspondence with C. Hallman re^^^^^H

PL 6.00

email

^revie^and analyze|
continued

12/02/13 Review ADS LOO

12/02/13 Begin reviewin. BAG 2.80

send

email to client re prepare

Multipleemm with C.

email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re scheduling
^^^^^ses^emailcorrespondence withA^Shipleyre^^^^^^^^B

review and analyze|^M^^|^|^^^^^^^^^|
^^^^^repare for and attend monthl^ontemnc^alf^ontinuea^H

12/03/13 PL 6.00

1 2/03/1 3 Telephone conference with Mara Weber of the Clark County Department of

Comprehensive Planning regardin^^^^^H^^^^^^^^^^^^H
ADS 0.20

review

send email to client re^j1 2/03/1 3 Continue reviewing^^^^^^mjjj^^J
begin preparation

1 2/04/1 3 Email correspondence with A. Shipley reB
correspondence with K. Andrews re^^^f
correspondence with A. Shipley and B. Grubb re

continued

BAG 2.00

email PL 6.00

email

12/04/13 Continue BAG 3.50

1 2/05/1 3 Email correspondence with C. Hallman re

correspondence with A. Shipley re^^^B
H; email
; prepare for and

PL 8.00

1 2/05/1 3 Telephone conference with attorney Jimmerson re documents obtained from

Clark County and proposed new trial exhibits; send email to Pat Lundvall re

same

ADS 0.30

1 2/06/1 3 Email correspondence with J. Lash re

call with J. Lashrel
and J. Lash re^^|
with K. Andrews re

telephone

multiple email correspondence with J. Rizzi

prepare for and attend telephone conference

| review and analyzeHHHHMHH

PL 8.00

12/06/13 Review ADS 0.50

12/06/13 Continue BAG 2.00
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Invoice No. 1217030

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Preparation for

Preparation for

Date

6.00PL12/07/13

8.00review and analyze

I email correspondence with Pardee team re
PL12/08/13

Preparation for and appearance at bench trial; review and revise PL 10.0012/09/13

Prepare for and attend trial (Day 6)

Continue to assist during trial with presentation of exhibits for display on

court monitors and other trial assistance; trial preparation for tomorrow

Preparation for and appearance at bench trial; email correspondence with K.

Andrews

Prepare for and attend trial (Day 7)

Continue to assist during trial with presentation of exhibits for display on

court monitors and other trial assistance; trial preparation for tomorrow

; email correspondence with J.

^emailcon^spondence with J. Rizzi reH^^H;
email corresponaenc^with A.

; email comesponaenc^witn J. Jimmerson re K. Andrews
testimony; email correspondence with C. Hallman, K, Andres and J. Lash re

review and analyze

ADS 9.0012/09/13

BAG 8.0012/09/13

PL 10.0012/10/13

ADS 8.5012/10/13

BAG 8.0012/10/13

8.60Meet with K. Andrews re

Lash re^^^^^H
review and analyze

PL12/11/13

Shipley re

; review

and analyze

Draft ADS 3.0012/11/13

; continue!

telephone conference with County re

review

BAG 6.00Reviewl
gather®
continue

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re^H
correspondence with J. Jimmerson re proposei

review and revise^
correspondence with C. Hallman re

continued bench trial

12/11/13

email

oHoin^uash Subpoena;
email

preparation for and appearance at

10.00PL12/12/13

ADS 8.00Attend trial (Day 8)

Continue to assist during trial with presentation of exhibits for display on

court monitors and other trial assistance; trial preparation for tomorrow

Prepare for and attend continued benchtriahemail correspondence with C.

Hallman, J. Lash and K. Andrews re^^^^BH

Research issues re

12/12/13

BAG 8.7012/12/13

PL 14.0012/13/13

; attend trial (Day 9)

Continue to assist during trial with presentation of exhibits for display on

court monitors and other trial assistance

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

ADS 12.0012/13/13

BAG 9.5012/13/13

0.30PL12/14/13
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Invoice No. 1217030

Page 4
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Draft, review and revise]

Continued revisions to

research^^^^

Continued revisionsJ

correspondence with S. Wexier an*

letter to Judge Early re^^HH||

Draft letter to the judge re^^^H

Date

4.00PL12/15/13

; review and PL 2.0012/16/13

email

[review and revise

PL 1.2012/17/13

ipley re

3.00ADS12/17/13 ; revise

Rate/Hour AmountTimekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

Brian Grubb

ours

56,752.50

14,787.50

8,332.50

108.10

45.50

50.50

525.00

325.00

165.00

$ 79,8 72.50Current Fees

S (7.987.25)10% Fees Discount

$71,8 85.25Adjusted Fees

AmountDescriptionDisbursement

17.52Mileage

Photo Copies

Transcript - - Paid To: Jennifer Church, Court Reporter

Transcript - - Paid To: Loree Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

Parking - - Paid To: Brian Grubb

20.25

550.00

550.00
12/04/13

12/04/13

100.0012/17/13

S L237.77Current Disbursements

$ 73.123.02Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald•carano•wilson
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

invoice No. 1217030

January 30, 2014

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through December 31, 2013

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram
v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

Mcdonald caranowilsonllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 79,8 72.50Current Fees

S C7.987.25J10% Fees Discount

$71,8 85.25Adjusted Fees

$ 1,237.77Current Disbursements

Payment From Jimmerson Hansen Applied $ (550.00J

$ 72,573.02Total This Invoice

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our
Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Mcdonald• carano •wilson5
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

InvoiceNo. 1218432
March 17, 2014

cc: Email To: wrecolaw@wrecol.com

Mail To: 2120 Park Place, Suite 120

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through February 28, 2014:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOl 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Current Fees $4,39 6.00

10% Fees Discount $ (439.60)

Adjusted Fees $ 3,95 6.40

Current Disbursements $ 1.333.21

Total This Invoice $ 5,289.61

Unallocated Balance $ 8,472.30

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET, 10™ FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 89S01

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1200

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 891 02

702-873-4100

FAX 702-873-9966

•A, rc
>pr-rA~

HI /'°P.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89S05

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1218432

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding

Date

PL 0.2001/13/14

Exchange emails with Pat Lundvail and court reporters re trial transcripts

Exchange emails with court reporters re trial transcripts

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

0.50BAG01/13/14

0.20BAG01/14/14

0.40PL01/15/14

Conferences and email exchanges with Court Reporters re trial transcripts

Exchange emails with court reporters re trial transcripts; send email to trial

team re same

Research issues

0.50BAG01/16/14

0.50BAG01/21/14

2.70ADS01/28/14

Continue researching and drafting1 2.30ADS01/29/14

Continue researching and drafting 1.00ADS01/30/14

Exchange emails with court reporters re trial transcripts 0.30BAG01/31/14

Continue exchanging emails with court reporters; gather 0.60BAG02/03/14

; draft email to client

Continue draftin; 2.7002/05/14

Continue drafting ADS 2.5002/06/14

Rate/HourTimekeeper H Amountours

0.60 545.00

325.00

165.00

327.00

3,640.00

429.00

Pat Lundvail

Aaron D. Shipley 11.20

2.60Brian Grubb

$ 4,39 6.00Current Fees

$ (439,60)10% Fees Discount

$ 3,95 6.40Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

Mileage

Photo Copies

Air Fare - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

1.12

0.09

449.8001/14/14
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Invoice No. 1218432

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano wilsonLLP

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Travel Expenses - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Transcript - - Paid To: Clark County Treasurer

Transcript - - Paid To: Loree Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

Transcript - - Paid To: Jennifer Church

01/14/14

01/14/14

01/14/14

01/14/14

01/14/14

01/17/14

01/17/14

25.00

33.00

20.00

20.00

60.00

93.90

215.05

01/17/14 415.25

Current Disbursements S 1.333.21

Total Fees & Disbursements S 5.289.61
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Mcdonald • carano •wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Invoice No. 1218432

March 17,2014
Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel
Pardee Homes

cc; Email To: wrecolaw@wrecol .com

Mail To: 2120 Park Place, Suite 120
El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through February 28, 2014
Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

Remit To:

Mcdonald caranowilsonllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$4,39 6.00Current Fees

$ (439.60)10% Fees Discount

$ 3,95 6.40Adjusted Fees

$ 1.333.21Current Disbursements

$ 5,289,61Total This Invoice

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1 .50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa
or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Mcdonald •carano-wilson^,
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

REVISED

Invoice No. 1220759

June 06, 2014

EI Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through April 30, 2014:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

cc: Email wrecolaw@wrecol .com

$ 2,87 4.50Current Fees

10% Fee Discount S (287.45)

$ 2,58 7.05Adjusted Fees

Total This Invoice $ 2,587,05

Unallocated Balance $ 8,472.30

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 10™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1200

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

A in F
P.O. BOX 2670. RENO. NEVADA 8950S

775-788-2000 • FAX 7 75-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1220759

Page 2
McDONALD- CARANO- WILSONLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

cc: Email wrecolaw@wrecol.com

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Email correspondence with Pardee Team re

Research

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding

email correspondence with C. Hallman anc^^volteyre
anaanalyze

Date

0.10PL03/07/14

ADS 1.5003/20/14

LOOPL03/26/14

review

4.00Continue researching ADS03/26/14

send email to Pat Lundvall re

0.50Continue researching ADS03/27/14

04/ 17/14 Revie^^cen^as^a^mmth^Nevada Supreme Court re ADS 1.00

Timekeeper H Rate/Hour Amountours

599.50

2,275.00

1. 10Pat Lundvall

Aaron D. Shipley

545.00

325.007.00

$ 2,87 4.50Current Fees

S 1287.45)10% Fee Discount

$ 2,58 7.05Adjusted Fees

0.00Westlaw
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Mcdonald • carano-wilson*;
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

REVISED

Invoice No. 1220759

June 06, 2014

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through April 30, 2014

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

cc: Email wrecolaw@wrecol.com

Remit To:

McDONALD -CARANOWILSON LLP

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 2,87 4.50Current Fees

S (287,45)10% Fee Discount

$ 2,58 7.05Adjusted Fees

$ 2,587.05Total This Invoice

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Mcdonald• carano-wilsons
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Invoice No. 1221855

June 30, 2014

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through May 31, 2014:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

cc: Email wrecolaw@wrecol.com

$218. 00Current Fees

$ (21.80)10% Fees Discount

$ 196. 20Adjusted Fees

$ 196.20Total This Invoice

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1200

LAS VECAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET, 10™ FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 89501
£ •<?

-V Hi JsP.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89505

77S-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020
WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1221855

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

cc: Email wrecoIaw@wrecol.com

Date Description of Services

05/28/14 Review and analyze proposed Stipulation and Order to Substitute Parties,

email correspondence with Jessica Dennis re same

Attorney Hours

PL 0.40

Timekeeper H

Pat Lundvall

Rate/Hour Amountours

0.40 545.00 218.00

S 218.Current Fees 00

SCourtesy Discount (21.80^

$ 196.Adjusted Fees 20
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Mcdonald •carano-wilsonj
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

Invoice No. 1221855

June 30, 2014

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through May 31, 2014

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10
71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

cc: Email wrecolaw@vvrecol.com

Remit To:

Mcdonaldcarano •wi lsonllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

S 218. 00Current Fees

I (21.80110% Fees Discount

$ 196. 20Adjusted Fees

$ 196.20Total This Invoice

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Mcdonald • carano-wilsons
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Conrad J. Smucker

Chief Competition Counsel

Weyerhaeuser Company

Accounts Payable

Invoice No. 1223884

September 09, 2014

P.O. Box 9752

Federal Way, WA 98063-9752

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through August 31, 2014:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM & WALT WILKES

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

PAR 00073 cc: Email wrecolaw@wrecol.com

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 196.20

Payments Received Since Previous Statement $ 0.00

Balance Forward $ 196. 20

Current Fees $36,4 83.00

10% Fee Discount $ f3.661.10J

Adjusted Fees $32,8 21.90

Current Disbursements $ 90,07

Total Balance Due $ 33,108.17

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 10™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 200

LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966
P.O. BOX 2670. RENO, NEVADA 89S0S

77S-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1223884

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM & WALT WILKES

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

PAR 00073 cc: Email wrecolaw@wrecol.com

HoursAttorneyDescription of Services

Email correspondence with Jessica Dennis re

email correspondence with

Date

0.30PL06/02/14

exchange ADS 0.50Review^^^^^^^^^H
emails with Pat Lundvall re

06/02/14

PL 0.30Review and analyze06/03/14

AMP 4.90Research06/03/14

compose

Email correspondence with Burak Ahmed re Wilkes will and Stipulation to

Substitute Parties

Email correspondence with Burak Ahmed re Wilkes Estate

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Telephone conference with Burak Ahmed re proposed stipulation to

substitute parties; review

PL 0.2006/05/14

PL 0.1006/06/14

PL 0.1006/10/14

ADS 1.0006/10/14

research

Email correspondence with Burak Ahmed re Wilkes estate and stipulation;
email correspondence with A. Shipley

Continue researching^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^l

PL 0.2006/11/14

ADS 1.1006/11/14

0.50AMPResearch

Review and analyze

Review^^^^^H

06/11/14

0.20PL06/12/14

ADS 2.2006/12/14

researc.

PL 0.10Review and analyze

Research issues

Email correspondence with A. Shipley reH|
review and revise dra-

06/16/14

ADS 1.5006/16/14

PL 1.0006/18/14

Research issues and draft ADS 3.5006/18/14

RK 5.90Begin draftin,06/18/14
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Invoice No. 1223884

Page 3
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

HoursDescription of Services

Review and reviseHHHH|
correspondence witlH^Ka^re

Continue drafting

Email correspondence with R. Kay

and revise^^^^^^^^B
email correspondence with A.

AttorneyDate

; email PL 0.3006/19/14

RK 4.4006/19/14

PL 0.9006/20/14

lpley re

Finalize and file

Revise and finalize

Review and analyze

email corresponaenc^vitnAA
	allman, Vokey and Smucker re

Hallman and Lash;

Review

Conference with Pat Lundvall re

send email reauestins^^^^H

RK 1.2006/20/14

RK 0.9006/23/14

PL 3.0006/25/14

!Ph lpley re	 ; email correspondence

; telephone conference with

send email to Pat Lundvall re ADS 0.8006/25/14

BAG 0.3006/26/14

0.90Analyze PL06/27/14

email correspondence with R. Kay re

with Matthew Ichinose

email correspondence

Review RK 0.3006/27/14

Continue BAG 0.6006/27/14

Continued review and revision of^B
email correspondence witRT

correspondence with K. Stewart reH
email correspondence with Conrad Smucker re

0.7006/30/14 PL

ipiey re emai

Email correspondence with Jessica Dennis re|BB^^H
email correspondence with A^hiple^e

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

PL 0.2007/02/14

PL07/09/14 0.10

Telephone conference with Jim Jimmerson re

send email to Pat Lundvall

Review and analyze

07/09/14 ADS 0.60

PL 0.3007/14/14

email correspondence with R. Kay re

Review ADS 0.8007/14/14

Review

beginI
RK 6.9007/14/14

Email correspondence with R. Kay reHH|HHHHH||HHHH^^^
review and reviseB|HHHHH^^^H|||

j, email correspondenc^vitRHFloycueB(^^^^^

PL 1.0007/15/14

RK 3.30Continue07/15/14
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Invoice No. 1223884

Page 4
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Review couit filed^^B
email correspondence witi

prepare for^^^^^^B

Date

PL 0.2007/16/14

jpley re

Review ADS 0.3007/16/14

Email con^spondencewithParde^eam^^^^^^^^MB; review and PL
revise flJ^HHHH^H^H^^HjHJ^^^^^^^^i^mai^oiTespondence
with F^<!a^^^^B^mai^OTesponaenc^vitinHimmerson re draft
proposed Orde^irtlotion; email correspondence with Burak Ahmedre draft
proposed Order on Motion, email correspondence with R. Kay re^^f

Prepay for and atten^iearin^^iotioiM^xpunge lis pendens; draftBB
incorporateJ^BB|BB||^ email opposing counse^fth

proposed order; fmaliz^n^uDmi^rde^^^

Email correspondence with R. Kay re

0.4007/17/14

RK 4.0007/17/14

review and analyze PL 0.3007/18/14

Exchange emails with Pat Lundvall re RK 0.2007/18/14

; teleconfer with judge's chambers re same; exchange emails wit]

opposing counsel;

0.10Email correspondence with R. Kay regarding PL07/22/14

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re^^^^^^B
email correspondence with C. Smucker re

PL 1.0007/24/14

review andanalyze^^^B
IH review and analyze

ADS 1.50Review!

research

07/24/14

RK 0.70Draft research07/24/14

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re
review

PL 0.2007/25/14

Send email to attorney Jimmerson re procedural defects in his petition for

confirmation of appointment of Angela L. Limbocker-Wilkes as successor

trustee of the Wilkes Living Trust and for substitution of real party in

interest; review correspondence from attorney Ahmed

Begin drafting

ADS 1.5007/25/14

ADS 0.5007/29/14

Research AMP 0.8007/29/14

Review and analyze PL 0.2007/30/14

email correspondence with A. ipley

re
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Invoice No. 1223884

Page 5
McDONALD- CARANO- WILSONLLP

Description of Services

Prepare for

Email correspondence with A. Shipleyre^^^^^H
^^^^^^^^Hreview and revise

email correspondence with A.

Prepare for attend hearing on plaintiffs' motion to substitute parties;

conference with attorneWimme^oin|enegotiatin^utu

review and

HoursDate Attorney

ADS07/30/14 2.50

07/31/14 PL 0.30

ipley re

07/31/14 ADS 3.60

Prepare for and attend hearing on plaintiffs' motion to substitute party

Contact Lincoln Cnty. Reporter re

RK 1.9007/31/14

AMP 0.3007/31/14

08/01/14

Revise

Review

email corresponaenc^itl

PL 0.10

08/01/14 ADS 0.70

PL 0.3008/04/14

ipley re I review

email correspondence with A.

Shipley re^H

Research issues

attorney Jimmersonre^^T

Email correspondence with A. Shipley r<

forwardHH
correspondence with C. Smucker re

Revise

draft letter to08/04/14 ADS 5.50

PL08/05/14 0.30

emailto C. Smucker; review

08/05/14 ADS 2.50

continue drafting

Review and analyze

Smucker re^^l
email correspondence with C. PL 0.2008/07/14

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regardin;08/12/14 PL 0.30

email correspondence with

R. Kay

Review case law

continue researching^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^H

Teleconfer with Lincoln County Recorder's office re

email Pat Lundvall rem

Email correspondence with A. Shipley regarding

08/12/14 ADS 2.50

08/12/14 RK 0.30

08/13/14 PL 0.10

Begin drafting

Email correspondence with R. Kay re

Teleconfer with Lincoln County District Attorney's office re^H
jjj^H^^^^^^^^^^^H^draftemailtoPatKundvall re^; review

ADS08/13/14 1.30

PL 0.1008/14/14

RK08/14/14 1.30

Continue drafting08/15/14 ADS 2.50
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Invoice No. 1223884

Page 6
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

Attorney HoursDescription of Services

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

Date

PL 0.2008/18/14

Draft ADS 1.3008/18/14

email PL 1.00Review and revise^^^^^^JH
correspondence witl^^sniple^e

Continue draftingHHHH^H

08/19/14

ADS 6.0008/19/14
continue^^M

Continued review and revision of^^^J
email correspondence with A. Shipley re

PL 0.6008/20/14

continue draftingRevise ADS 3.5008/20/14

Email correspondence with A. Shipley re

correspondence with C. Smucker re^^

Continue drafting

Review and analyze^^H
Smucker and A. Shipley re

Revi

email PL 0.2008/21/14

ADS 1.7008/21/14

email correspondence with C. PL 0.7008/22/14

ADS 2.5008/22/14 ; revise

; ar^i

Continued review and revision

correspondence with A. Shipley regarding

Review and revisejHH^^H^^H
correspondence witl^^hiple^e^^Br

email PL 0.2008/24/14

email 0.20PL08/25/14

inal review o

; draft ADS 3.40Revise08/25/14

0.10Review PL08/26/14

Review ADS 1.1008/26/14

continue drafting

Continue drafting ADS 1.0008/28/14
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Invoice No. 1223884

Page 7Mcdonald • carano wilsonLLP

Rate/Hour AmountTimekeeper H ours

9,030.00

18,655.00

7,512.00

1,137.50

148.50

17.20 525.00

325.00

240.00

175.00

165.00

Pat Lundvall

57.40

31.30

Aaron D. Shipley

Rory Kay

6.50Alexander M Perry

Brian Grubb 0.90

$36,4 83.00Current Fees

$ (3.661.10')10% Fee Discount

$32,8 21.90Adjusted Fees

DescriptionDisbursement Amount

Telephone

Mileage

Westlaw

0.00

19.60

0.00

2.85Photo Copies

MISCELLANEOUS COSTS - - Paid To: AT&T 1.6206/24/14

Teleconference Services

Transcript - - Paid To: Loree Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - RTK

Marking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - ADS

Parking - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - PL

08/13/14 30.00

24.0008/19/14

08/20/14

08/25/14

6.00

6.00

$ 90.07Current Disbursements

$ 32.911.97Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald •carano •wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID SS-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Invoice No. 1223884

September 09, 2014

Conrad J. Smucker

Chief Competition Counsel

Weyerhaeuser Company

Accounts Payable

P.O. Box 9752

Federal Way, WA 98063-9752

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through August 31, 2014
Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM & WALT WILKES

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

Re:

PAR 00073 cc: Email wrecolaw@wrecol.com

Remit To:

McDONALDCARANO-WILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 196.20Balance Due From Previous Statement

Payments Received Since Previous Statement $ 0.00

$ 196.Balance Forward 20

$36,4 83.00Current Fees

$ (3.661. 10)10% Fee Discount

$32,8 21.90Adjusted Fees

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our
Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Invoice No. 1223884

, Page 9
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

$ 90.07Current Disbursements

Total Balance Due $ 33,108.17

OUTSTANDING INVOICES:

Invoice Invoice Amount Payments/AdjustmentsDate Balance

$0.0006/30/14 1221855 $196.20 $196.20
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Mcdonald • carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Conrad J. Smucker Invoice No. 1225727

October 24, 2014Chief Competition Counsel

Weyerhaeuser Company

Accounts Payable

P.O. Box 9752

Federal Way, WA 98063-9752

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through September 30, 2014:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM & WALT WILKES

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

PAR 00073

Re:

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 33,108.17

Payments Received Since Previous Statement £ (\96.2Q)

Balance Forward $32,9 11.97

Current Fees $ 1,33 3.50

10% Fee Discount $ (258.65J

Adjusted Fees $ 1,07 4.85

Current Disbursements $ 6.16

Total Balance Due $ 33,992.98

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2500 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 200

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

£ f<2

A Ml A
P.O. BOX 2 6 70, RENO. NEVADA 89505

775-788-2000 • FAX 77 5-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1225727

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM & WALT WILKES

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

PAR 00073

Re:

Description of Services

Prepare

correspondence with C. Smucker and T. Stocks

Date Attorney Hours

L email09/10/14 PL 1.60

09/10/14 Assist in gathering

send email to John Foote re

BAG 0.80

(no|e; conference with Pat Lundvall re

charge .7)

09/11/14

conference with Pat Lundvall re

Prepare

Email correspondence with J. Jimmerson re Pardee's Notice of Submission

and letter

Prepare and send email response to J. Jimmerson re letter and Notice of

Submission

BAG 0.60

09/12/14 PL 0.20

09/15/14 PL 0.10

09/16/14 PL 0.20

HoursTimekeeper Title

Pat Lundvall

Brian Grubb

Rate/Hour Amount

Partner

Paralegal

2.10 525.00

165.00

1,102.50

231.001.40

$ 1,33 3.50Current Fees

$10% Fee Discount (258.65)

$1,07 4.85Adjusted Fees

DescriptionDisbursement Amount

Mileage 6.16

$Current Disbursements 6.16

Total Fees & Disbursements $ 1.081.01
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McDONALD-CARANO - WILSONS
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Conrad J. Smucker Invoice No. 1225727

October 24, 2014Chief Competition Counsel

Weyerhaeuser Company

Accounts Payable

P.O. Box 9752

Federal Way, WA 98063-9752

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through September 30, 2014

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM & WALT WILKES

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

PAR 00073

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALD CARANO-WILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 33,108.17

Payments Received Since Previous Statement £ (196.20)

Balance Forward $32,9 11.97

Current Fees $ 1,33 3.50

10% Fee Discount (258.65)$

$ 1,07 4.85Adjusted Fees

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Invoice No. 1225727

Page 4
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

$ 6.16Current Disbursements

$ 33,992.98Total Balance Due

OUTSTANDING INVOICES:

Invoice Amount Payments/Adjustments BalanceInvoiceDate

$32,911.97$0.00$32,911.9709/09/14 1223884
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Mcdonald • carano •wilson5
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Conrad J. Smucker

Chief Competition Counsel

Weyerhaeuser Company

Accounts Payable

Invoice No. 1226300

November 18, 2014

P.O. Box 9752

Federal Way, WA 98063-9752

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through October 31, 2014:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM & WALT WILKES

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

PAR 00073

Re:

Balance Due From Previous Statement $ 33,992.98

Payments Received Since Previous Statement $ (32.91 1.97)

Balance Forward $ 1,08 1.01

$52.5Current Fees 0

10% Fee Discount (43.201$

Adjusted Fees $9.30

Current Disbursements $ 3.50

Total Balance Due $ 1,093.81

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. 1 0™ FLOOR

RENO. NEVADA 89S01

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1 200

LAS VEGAS. NEVADA 89102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

v'MVfy.
fc

II I )sP.O. BOX 2670, RENO. NEVADA 89505

775-788-2000 • FAX 77S-788-2020

WWW.MCDONALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1226300

Page 2
Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM & WALT WILKES

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

PAR 00073

Re:

Date Description of Services

10/03/14 Email correspondence with C. Smucker re status of case

HoursAttorney

0.10PL

Timekeeper Title

Pat Lundvall

Hours Rate/Hour Amount

Partner 0.10 52.50525.00

Current Fees $52.5 0

$10% Fee Discount ("43.20)

$9.30Adjusted Fees

Description AmountDisbursement

Westlaw

Filing Fee-Court - - Paid To: Bankcard Center - JAS

0.00

10/17/14 3.50

Current Disbursements $ 3.50

Total Fees & Disbursements £ 12M

166

JA007903



Mcdonald •carano •Wilsons
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Conrad J. Smucker

Chief Competition Counsel

Weyerhaeuser Company

Accounts Payable

P.O. Box 9752

Invoice No. 1226300

November 18, 2014

Federal Way, WA 98063-9752

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through October 31, 2014

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM & WALT WILKES

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

PAR 00073

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALDCARANOWILSONUP

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

Balance Due From Previous Statement S 33,992.98

Payments Received Since Previous Statement $ (32.91 1.97)

Balance Forward $ 1,08 1.01

Current Fees $52.5 0

10% Fee Discount $ (43.20)

Adjusted Fees $9.30

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt. We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa

or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Invoice No. 1226300

Page 4Mcdonald • carano • wilsonLLP

ICurrent Disbursements 3.50

$ 1,093.81Total Balance Due

OUTSTANDING INVOICES:

Invoice Invoice Amount Payments/Adjustments BalanceDate

$1,081.01 $0.0010/24/14 1225727 $1,081.01
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Mcdonald•carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1229668

March 11,2015

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through February 28, 2015:

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10
71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM & WALT WILKES

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

PAR 00073 A-10-632338-C

Re:

Current Fees $ 4,299.50

1429.95110% Fees Discount £

Adjusted Fees $ 3,869.55

Current Disbursements $ 460

Total This Invoice $ 3,874.15

100 WEST LIBERTY STREET. TO™ FLOOR

RENO, NEVADA 89501

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2300 WEST SAHARA AVENUE

SUITE 1200

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA B9102

702-873-41 00

FAX 702-873-9966

>/W\~
ill )*

P.O. BOX 2670, RENO, NEVADA 89S05

775-788-2000 • FAX 775-788-2020
WWW.MCDON ALDCARANO.COM
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Invoice No. 1229668

Page 2
McDONALD-CARANO-WILSON LLP

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM & WALT WILKES

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

PAR 00073 A-10-632338-C

Re:

Description of Services

Review

email correspondence with R. Kay and C. Smucker re

Review

HoursDate Attorney

PL 0.4002/11/15

ADS 0.2002/11/15

PL 0.2002/12/15 Email correspondence with C. Smucker re cas<

RK 1.0002/17/15 Begin

Review BAG 0.5002/17/15

0.60Email correspondence with R. Kay re

Review and revise

PL02/19/15

PL 1.0002/19/15

I, email correspondence with R. Kay and C. Smucker re

L forward same to J. PL 0.20Continued

Jimmerson for review

02/19/15

RK 0.70Draft02/19/15

PL 0.90Review02/20/15

BAG 0.70Conference with Rory Kay re02/20/15

RK 2.90Draft! ; continue02/23/15

RK 5.00Continue02/26/15

Hours Rate/HourTitle AmountTimekeeper

2,304.00

1,732.50

198.00

9.60 240.00

525.00

165.00

325.00

Associate

Partner

Paralegal

Partner

Rory Kay

Pat Lundvail

Brian Grubb

Aaron D. Shipley

3.30

1.20

65.000.20

$ 4,299.50Current Fees

$ (429,95110% Fees Discount

$ 3,869.55Adjusted Fees

Disbursement Description

Local Travel

Amount

4.60
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Invoice No. 1229668

Page 3
McDONALD-CARANO-WILSON LLP

I 4.60Current Disbursements

S 3.874.15Total Fees & Disbursements
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Mcdonald-carano-wilson^
FEDERAL TAX ID 88-0074283

REMITTANCE PAGE

For Professional Services Rendered

Pardee Homes and Weyerhaeuser Real Estate Company (WRECO)

Chris Hallman, Senior VP/General Counsel

Pardee Homes

Invoice No. 1229668

March 11,2015

2120 Park Place, Suite 120

El Segundo, CA 90245

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED through February 28, 2015

Coyote Springs - James Wolfram

v. Pardee Homes/BOI 7001 10

71318001.1508-22020

014155-000003

PARDEE ET AL. ADV. JAMES WOLFRAM & WALT WILKES

LITIGATION: BUSINESS TO BUSINESS

PAR 00073 A-10-632338-C

Re:

Remit To:

McDONALD-CARANO-WILSONllp

P.O. Box 2670

Reno, Nevada 89505

$ 4,299.50Current Fees

S (429.95110% Fees Discount

$ 3,869.55Adjusted Fees

$Current Disbursements 4.60

$ 3,874.15Total This Invoice

Payment Is Due Upon Receipt We Prefer to Avoid the Accrual of Interest; However, the Rate

of 1.50% Will Be Charged Monthly, Compounded, on Any Balance After 30 Days. Thank You.

For Your Convenience, McDonald Carano Wilson LLP Will Accept Payment Via MasterCard, Visa
or American Express Credit Cards. If You Wish to Utilize This Payment Method, Please Contact Our

Accounting Department at (775) 788-2000.

To Insure Proper Credit Refer To Matter No. 014155-000003

Please Return This Copy With Your Payment
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Pardee Homes of Nevada's Cost Breakdown

TotalsExhibitCost Type:

$867.501&2Clerk's Costs (filing fees)

$5,086.53Reporters' Costs for Depositions 3

$1,487.70Fees for Witnesses 4

$8,228.27Official Reporters' Fees 5

Tofiife; j-

$152.13Photocopy Costs (internal) 1

$1,239.98- Outside Copying Service 6

Photocopy Costs, Combined, Total:

Long Distance Telephone Calls

$6.39- AT&T Teleconference Services 7

Postage Costs

$132.84- Fed Ex Overnight Delivery 8

i^bsiajge Cc^ts

Costs for Travel & Parking

$1,069.40- Air Fare 9

$521.04-Travel Expenses 9

$606.00- Parking 9

$2 196 44	 Costs for Travel & Parking Total

Other Reasonable Costs

$144.62- Legal Research: 10

$264.71- Runner/Deliveries: 11

Other Reasonable Costs, combinded, Total: $409.33

$19,807.11Combinded Total:
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COST SUMMARY REPORT COST CODE SORT. FINALIZED BATCHES ONLY.15:32:54 PAGE 1Mar 11 2015

COST DETAILDISBURSEMENT DATES: 010100 TO 031115

* INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN BILLED.NOTE:

DISB

* * - -DESCRIPTION- - - * CODE INDEX AMOUNT BILLING DATE DESCRIPTION*MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT

00 * 031011 Telephone

.00 * 040611 Telephone

.00 * GG0211 Telephone

00 * 012612 Telephone

.00 * 022812 Telephone

.00 * 052412 Telephone

.00 * 053012 Telephone

.00 * 053012 Telephone

00 * 053112 Telephone

.00 * 071012 Telephone

.00 * 081012 Telephone

.00 * 082212 Telephone

.00 * 082812 Telephone

.00 * 082812 Telephone

00 * 092412 Telephone

.00 * 100312 Telephone

00 * 081214 Telephone

.00 * 081414 Telephone

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007014155-000003 1028583 3.75

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007014155-000003 1032354 .81

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007014155-000003 1042952 4.03

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007 1079383014155-000003 16.12

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007014155-000003 1084523 15.32

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ST AL. ADV. 007C14155-000003 1096411 4.03

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007 1097628 1.61014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007

Pardee Homes and vi PARDEE ET AL. ADV. CC7

1.61014155-000003 1097630

1097841 3 . 2.2014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007 1102262 .81014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007 1110481 3.22014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 00?

Ill 1690 .81014155-000003

1.611112348014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. 709V. 007 1112352 1. 61014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007 1115295 1.61014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007 1117757 1.62014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007 1157614 2.11014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 007

TOTAL FOR : 007 (Telephone)

1.481197868014155-000003

65.38 . 00

100.00 * 100413 Witness FeePardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 014 1161664 100.00 Paid To:

Frances Butler Dunlap

014155-000003

TOTAL FOR : 014 (Witness Fee) 100 . 00 100 00

25.96 * 103012 Overnight. Delivery Service

- Paid To: FedEx

79.11 * 103012 Overnight Delivery Service

- Paid To: FedEx

27.77 * 080713 Overnight Delivery Service

- Paid To: FedEx

25.96Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET ?vL. ADV. 015 1120516014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 015 1120519 79.11014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 015 1154996 27.77014155-000003

TOTAL FOR : 015 (Overnight Delivery Service) 132.84 132.84

3.50 * 041111 Filing Fee-Court

Tyler Technologies, Inc.

3.50 * 041111 Filing Fee-Court

Tyler Technologies, Inc.

3.50 * 121911 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

10.50 * 012012 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

7.oo * 051712 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

5.50 * 111512 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

17.50 * 111512 Filing Fee-Court

3ankcard Center

209.50 * 111512 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

7.50 * 111512 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center - ADS

3.50 * 122012 Filing Fee-Court - -

Paid To-.3 50Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1033379014155-000003

Paid TO:Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1033381 3 .50014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1073264 3.50 Paid To:014155-000003

ADS

Paid To:Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 10.501075956014155-000003

7 .00 Paid To-.Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1114251014155-000003

ADS

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 5.50 Paid To:1124220014155-000003

ADS

17.50 Paid To:Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1124222014155-000003

ADS

Paid To:Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 209.5011242230141S5-000003

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 7 .50 Paid To:1124224014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 3 .50 Paid To:1128535014155-000003
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DISBURSEMENT DATES: 010100 TO 031115 COST DETAIL

NOTE: * INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN BILLED.

DISS

* *- -DESCRIPTION	* CODE*MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT INDEX AMOUNT BILLING DATE DESCRIPTION

Bankcard Center

3.50 * 122012 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

7.00 * 122012 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

3 50 * G221I3 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

3.50 * 022113 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

7.00 * 031513 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

3.50 * 040813 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

14.00 * 040813 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Cencer

14.00 * 040813 Filing Fee-Court

5ankcard Center

14.00 * 040813 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center •

17.50 * 051513 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

3.50 * 062013 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center -

3.50 * 080613 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

209.50 * 080613 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

3 50 * 082013 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

3 50 * 082013 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

10.50 * 091713 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center

21.00 * 100813 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center •

7 00 * 101813 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center •

3.50 * 101813 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center -

9.50 * 111813 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center •

7.00 * 111813 Filing Fee-Court

Bankcard Center •

3.50 * 101714 Filing Fee-Court

3ankcard Center •

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023014155-000003 1128537 Paid To:3 .SO

ADS

014155-000003 Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1128539 7 00 Paid To:

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023014155-000003 1136151 3 50 Paid To:

ADS

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023014155-000003 1136153 3.50 Paid To:

ADS

014155-000003 Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1139303 7 . 00 Paid To:

ADS

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1141678014155-000003 3 . 50 Paid To:

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023014155-000003 1141680 14 . 00 Paid To:

ADS

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 Paid To:
014155-000003 1142281 14 . 00

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1142284 14 . 00014155-000003
Paid To:

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 17.50 Paid To:1146247014155-000003

ADS

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1150165 3.50 Paid To:
014155-000003

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. adv. 023 1155766 3.50 Paid To:
014155-000003

1155767Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 209.50 Paid To:
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1156486 2.50014155-000003 Paid To:

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1156499 3.50 Paid To:
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV 023 1159177 10.50 Paid To:
014155-000003

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV 023 1162872 21 . 00 Paid To:
014155-000003

STF

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1163035 7 . 00 Paid To:
014155-000003

ADS

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 023 Paid To:1163038 3.50014155-000003

JPS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1166750 9.50 Paid To:
014155-000003

PL

014155-000003 Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 1166802 7.00 Paid To:

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 023 3.501205073 Paid To:
014155-000003

JAS

TOTAL FOR : 023 (Filing Fee-Court) 644.50 644.50

223.00 * 040411 Filing Fee-Court/Complaint

- Paid To-. Tyler

Technologies, Inc.

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 025 1031805 223.00014155-000003

TOTAL FOR : 025 (Filing Fee-Court/Complaint) 223 .00 223.00
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COST SUMMARY REPORT COST CODE SORT.Mar 11 2015 15:32:54 FINALIZED BATCHES ONLY. PAGE 3

DISBURSEMENT DATES: 010100 TO 031115 COST DETAIL

* INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN 3ILLED.NOTE:

DISB

*MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT * '--DESCRIPTION---* CODE INDEX AMOUNT BILLING DATE DESCRIPTION

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 047 159 80 • 112812 Air Fare Paid To:

Bankcard Center - PL

Paid To:

Bankcard Center - PL

Paid To:

Bankcard Center - PL

014155-000003 1125039 159.80

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV.0x4155-000003 047 1157756 449.80 * 112613 Air Fare449.80

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 047 1172527014155-000003 449.80 * 011414 Air Pare449.80

TOTAL FOR : 047 {Air Fare) 1069.40 1069 40

Pax-dee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 9.00 * 111711 Travel Expenses -

3ankcard Center

75.00 * 111711 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center

9.00 * 111811 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center -

6 00 * 091712 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center -

66.00 * 112812 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center -

43.00 * 122012 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center

75.04 * 122012 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center

6.00 * 011013 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center -

6.00 * 011013 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center -

18.00 * 040813 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center -

12.00 * 051313 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center

12.00 * 051513 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center -

8.00 * 082013 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center

1387.70 * 110713 Travel Expenses -

Harvey Whittemore

25 00 * 112513 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center -

31.00 * 112613 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center -

62.00 * 112613 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center -

25.00 * 011414 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center -

33.00 * 011414 Travel Expenses -

Bankcard Center -

048 1070189014155-000003 9.00 Paid TO:

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 1070190014155-000003 048 75 . 00 Paid To:

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 048 1070378014155-000003 9.00 Paid To:

ADS

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 048 1114250014155-000003 6 00 Paid TO:

ADS

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 046 1125041 66.00014155- 000003 Paid To:

PL

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 048 1128453 43.00 Paid To:014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 048 1128454 75. 04 Paid TO:014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 048 1130699 6.00014155-000003 Paid To:

JDS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 048 1131020 6 . 00 Paid To:014155-000003

PL

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 1142282048 18.00 Paid TO:014155-000003

ADS

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 048 1145123 12.00 Paid To:014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 048 1146249 12.00 Paid To:014155-000003

ADS

Pardee Homes and V? PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 048 1156491 8.00 Paid To:014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 048 1165176 1387.70 Paid To:0141S5-0Q0003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 1167773 25.00048 Paid To:014155-000003

PL

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ST AL. ADV. 048 1167774 31.00 Paid To:014155-000003

PL

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 048 1167785 52 00 Paid To:014155-000003

PL

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 04 8 1172530 25.00 Paid To:014155-000003

PL

Pardee Hemes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 048 1172531 33.00 Paid To:014155-000003

PL

TOTAL FOR : 043 (Travel Expenses) 1903.74 1908.74

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 049 1128456 60.16 .00 * 122012 Business Meal Paid To:014155-000003

Bankcard Center

177

JA007914



Mar 11 2015 COST SUMMARY REPORT15:32 :54 COST CODE SORT. FINALIZED BATCHES ONLY. PAGE 4

DISBURSEMENT DATES: 010100 TO 031115 COST DETAIL

NOTE: * INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN BILLED.

DIS3

* *- -DESCRIPTION	* CODE'MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT INDEX AMOUNT BILLING DATE DESCRIPTION

Pardee Hemes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. .00 * 111813 Business Meal -

Bankcard Center

00 * 112613 Business Meal -

Bankcard Center - PL

014155-000003 04S 1166680 208.63 Paid To:

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 049014155-000003 1167763 54 50 Paid To:

014155-000003 Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 049 1167765 .00 * 112613 Business Meal26.57 Paid To:

Bankcard Center PL

00 * 112613 Business MealPardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 049014155-000003 1167776 51.13 Paid To:

Bankcard Center - PL

014155-000003 Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 049 1167778 112613 Business Meal42.47 .00 * Paid TO:

Bankcard Center - PL

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV.014155-000003 049 1167779 .00 * 112613 Business Meal71 94 Paid To:

Bankcard Center

.00 * 112613 Business Meal -

3ankcard Center

.00 * 112613 3usiness Meal -

PL

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 049014155-000003 1167780 69.91 Paid TO:

PL

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 049 1167766014155-000003 118.97 Paid To:

Bankcard Center - PL

011414 Business MealPardee Homes and w PARDEE ST AL. ADV.014155-000003 049 1172532, 15 44 . 00 Paid TO:

Bankcard Center - PL

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 011414 Business Meal -

Bankcard Center - PL

011414 Business Meal -

Bankcard Center - PL

049 1172533 51.34 00014155-000003
Paid To:

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 049 1172535 32 .64014155-000003 . 00 Paid To:

011414 Business MealPardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 049 1172536 11.35014155-000003 . 00 Paid To:

Bankcard Center* - PL

011414 Business Meal - - Paid To:

Bankcard Center PL

011414 Business Meal - -

Bankcard Center - PL

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. adv. 049 1172538 33 11 00014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 049 1172533 67 . 70 .00 Paid TO:
014155-000003

TOTAL FOR : 049 (Business Meal) 915 . 86 00

4.44 * 100511 Mileage -

Kuykendall

4.44 * 121411 Mileage

Kuykendall

1 11 * 122311 Mileage -

Hubbard

3.88 * 011912 Mileage -

Hubbard

2.22 « 020312 Mileage -

Hubbard

3.88 * 020712 Mileage -

Kuykendall

ll.io * 021512 Mileage -

Baranello

2.22 * 083012 Mileage -

3araneilo

4.44 * 083012 Mileage -

Lanccon

17.76 * 092712 Mileage -

Langcon

1.11 * 103112 Mileage -

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1062571 Paid To: Andrew4 .44014155-000003

Paid To: AndrewPardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1073036 4 .44014155-000003

050 Paid To: FrankPardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 1074414 1.11014155-000003

Paid To: FrankPardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV 050 1075801 3.88014155-000003

Paid To: FrankPardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1080978 2 .22014155-000003

Paid To: AndrewPardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1081460 8.88014155-000003

Paid To: JosephPardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1082377 11.10014155-000003

Paid To: JosephPardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL, ADV. 050 1112499 2.22014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. Paid To: Reilly050 1112537 4 . 44014155-000003

Paid To: ReillyPardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1115661 17 . 76014155-000003

Paid To: FrankPardee Homes and W PARDEE ST AL. ADV. 050 1121074 1.11014 155 - 000003
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* INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN BILLED.NOTE:

DISB

- DESCRIPTION	* CODE*MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT INDEX
*

AMOUNT BILLING DATE DESCRIPTION

Hubbard

4.44 * 103112 Mileage -

Hubbard

4.44 * 103112 Mileage -

Kuykendall

4.44 * 103112 Mileage -

Kuykendal )

4 44 * 110812 Mileage -

Hubbax-a

4 44 * 111612 Mileage -

Baranello

2.22 * 120612 Mileage -

Hubbard

3.33 * 122012 Mileage -

Langcon

2.22 * 122012 Mileage -

Baranello

4.44 * 012213 Mileage -

Hubbard

4.44 * 012513 Mileage -

Kuykendall

4 52 * 022013 Mileage -

Baranello

4.52 * 030713 Mileage - •

Hubbai'd

1.13 * 031313 Mileage -

Baranello

1 13 * 032113 Mileage - •

Kuykendal 1

2.26 * 041113 Mileage - •

Kuykendall

2 26 * 041813 Mileage - •

Hubbard

3.96 * 051613 Mileage - •

Langcon

4.52 * 072613 Mileage - •

Lang ton

4 52 * 072613 Mileage - •

Hubbard

2.26 * 080213 Mileage - •

Hubbard

4. 52 * 080213 Mileage - •

Langcon

3.39 * 080213 Mileage - •

Langton

4.52 - 081413 Mileage - •

Hubbard

2.26 * 090513 Mileage - •

Baranello

2.26 * 0S0513 Mileage - •

Baranello

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050014155-000003 1121075 4.44 Paid To: Frank

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050014155-000003 1121086 Paid To: Andrew4 . 44

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV 050014155-000003 1121087 4.44 • Paid To : Andrew

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050034155-000003 1121775 Paid To: Frank4 44

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050014155- 000003 1124313 Paid To: Joseph4 . 44

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050014155-000003 1126559 2.22 Paid To: Frank

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050014155-000003 1128495 3 . 33 Paid To: Reilly

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV 050014155-000003 1128551 Paid To: Joseph2.22

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1131745 Paid To: Frank
014155- 000003 4.44

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1132137 Paid To: Andrew
014155-000003 4 . 44

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1135876 Paid To: Joseph
014155-000003 4 . 52

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 Paid To: Frank
014155-000003 1137581 4 . 52

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1138262 1.13 Paid To: Joseph
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1139743 Paid To : Andrew1.13014155-000003

Pardee Hemes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1142053 2 . 26 Paid To: Andrew
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1142633 2.26 Paid To: Frank
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1146701 3.96 Paid To: Reilly
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1153730 4.52 Paid To: Reilly
014155-0C0003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 Paid To: Frank1153740 4.52014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1154590 Paid To: Frank2.26014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1154603 Paid To: Reilly4 . 52014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 Paid To: Reilly1154606 3.3901415S-000QG3

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1155817 Paid To: Frank4.52014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 2.26 Paid To: Joseph1158158014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 2 .26 Paid To: Joseph1158159014155-000003
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DIS3

* - -DESCRIPTION	* CODE*MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT- - INDEX AMOUNT BILLING DATE DESCRIPTION

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL.014155-000003 ADV. 050 1261259 4.52 * 100313 Mileage -

Kuykendall

1.69 * 100313 Mileage -

Hubbard

4.52 * 100313 Mileage -

Hubbard

4.52 * 101113 Mileage -

Hubbard

4.52 * 101813 Mileage -

3aranello

4.52 * 102413 Mileage -

Wozniak

1 13 * 102413 Mileage -

Wozniak

4.52 * 102913 Mileage -

Hubbard

4.52 * 102913 Mileage -

Hubbard

7.35 * 102913 Mileage -

Hubbard

3.95 * 102913 Mileage -

Hubbard

4.52 * 102913 Mileage - •

Hubbard

4 S2 * 202913 Mileage -

Sutton

1.23 * 110713 Mileage - •

Hubbard

2 26 * 110713 Mileage - •

wozniak

2.26 * 110713 Mileage - •

Wozniak

2.26 * 110713 Mileage - •

Wozniak

4.52 * 110713 Mileage - •

Wozniak

4.52 * 121013 Mileage - •

Baranello

4.52 * 121913 Mileage - •

Hubbard

1.70 * 121913 Mileage - •

Hubbard

4.52 * 122413 Mileage - -

3aranello

2.26 * 122412 Mileage - -

Blacksmith

1.12 * 012224 Mileage - -

Hubbard

3.52 * 070214 Mileage - •

Hubbard

1.S8 * 070214 Mileage - •

Paid To: Andrew4 . 52

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050014155-000003 1261263 1 69 Paid To: Frank

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL.014155-000003 ADV. 050 1161273 Paid To: Frank4.52

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL.014155-000003 ADV. 050 1162165 Paid To:4.52 Frank

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL.014155-000003 1163061ADV. 050 Paid To: Joseph4 . 52

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1163607014155-000003 4 . 52 Paid TO: Evan

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL.014155-000003 ADV. 050 2163610 Paid To:1.13 Evan

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL.014155-000003 ADV. 050 1164255 4.52 Paid To: Frank

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1164261 Paid To-.
014155-000003 4 . 52 Frank

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. 1164263ADV. 050 7.35 Paid To:
024155-000003

Frank

Pardee Homes and V? PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1164266 Paid To:
014255-000003 3 . 95 Frank

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 Paid TO:1164269024155-000003 4 , 52 Frank

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 Paid To:1164286 4 52014155-000003
Leah

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1165633 Paid To:
014155-000003 1 . 13 Frank

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 3165652 2 26 Paid To:
014155-000003

Evan

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 2165652 Paid To: Evan2.26014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1165661 2.26 Paid To : Evan
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1165663 4.52 Paid To: Evan
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1169076 Paid To: Joseph4.52024155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1170263 Paid To:4.52 Frank
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 05C Paid To:1170264 2.70 Frank
014155-000003

Pardee Homes anc w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1170571 4.52 Paid To: Joseph
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 1170578 2.26 Paid To: Ashley
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ST AL. ADV. 050 Paid To:1173301 1.12 Frank
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ST AL. Paid To:ADV. 050 1153633 3 . 92 Frank
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050 Paid To:1153635 1.68 Frank
014155-000003
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Hubbard

1.6B * 070214 Mileage -

Hubbard

i.12 * 370214 Mileage -

Blacksmith

4.48 * 072414 Mileage -

Hubbard

4 48 * 072414 Mileage -

Hubbard

1.12 * 073114 Mileage -

Baranello

1.12 * 082114 Mileage -

Hubbard

3.92 * 090314 Mileage - •

Hubbard

2 24 * 091814 Mileage -

Hubbard

4.50 * 022615 Mileage - •

Blacksmith

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 050014155-000003 1193636 1 .68 Paid To: Frank

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV014155-000003 050 1193658 1 . 12 Paid To: Ashley

Pardee Homes and VJ PARDEE ET AL. AJOV014155-000003 050 1195610 4 48 Paid To: Frank

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV.014155-000003 050 1195618 4.48 Paid To: Frank

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV.014155-000003 050 1196299 1. 12 Paid To: Joseph

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 050014155-000003 1198616 1.12 Paid To: Frank

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV.014155-000003 050 1199668 3 . 92 Paid To; Frank

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ST AL. ADV.014155-000003 050 1201170 2 .24 Paid To: Frank

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 050014155-000003 1221300 4.60 Paid To-. Ashley

TOTAL FOR - 050 (Mileage) 264 . 71264 .71

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1026514 00.58 00 022811 westlaw014155-000003 Paid To-. West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Pardee Homes and vj PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1037469 .00 043011 Westlaw014155-000003 100. 36

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1072070 543.69 00 * 113011 Westlaw014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1097917 00 05311 2 Westlaw014155-000003 24 .25

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid Tc: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1120952 161.67 .00 103112 Westlaw014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 1121004051 141.01 00 103112 Westlaw014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1125932 64.77 .00 * 113012 Westlaw014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1125933 549 51 00 * 113012 Westlaw014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1129576 .00 * 123112 Westlaw344 .32014155-000003

Pardee Homes and VJ PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1133888 234.81 .00 * 013113 westlaw014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV, 051 1137195 165.95 00 * 022813 Westlaw014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1140849014155-000003 66.72 .00 033113 VJest law

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ST AL. ADV 051 1144790 23 . 43 .00 * 043013 Westlaw014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1148274 .00 * 053113 Westlaw118.96014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1148275 .00 * 053113 Westlaw137.94014155-000003
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Mar 11 2015 15:32:54 COST SUMMARY REPORT COST CODE SORT. FINALIZED BATCHES ONLY. PAGE 8

COST DETAILDISBURSEMENT DATES: 010100 TO 031115

* INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN BILLED.NOTE:

DISS

* * - - DESCRIPTION	* CODE*MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT INDEX AMOUNT BILLING DATE DESCRIPTION

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 051014155-000003 1148310 222.06 ,00 * 053113 West law Paid To: West:

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

.00 093013 Westlav; - - Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To.- West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: west

Publishing Corporation

.00 * 033114 Westlav/ - - Paid To: west

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: Ji/esc

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Paid To: West

Publishing Corporation

Pardee Homes and v? PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051014155-000003 1154212 221 51 00 073113 Westlav;

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051014155-000003 1157814 .00 083113 West law446.21

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV 051014155-000003 1160986 772.96

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051014155-000003 1164842 540.96 .00 * 103113 Westlav;

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051014155-000003 1164843 276.93 00 * 103113 Wesclaw

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051014155-000003 1183899 93.75

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. C51014155-000003 1193534 .00 * 063014 Westlav;231.70

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1193536 .00 * 063014 Westlaw014155-000003 528.13

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 1196569 00 * 073114 Westlaw014155-000003 212 . 04

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 .00 * 083114 Westlaw1199547 82.89014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. adv. 051 .00 * 103114 Westlav:1208049 224 .54014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 051 00 113014 Westlaw1211189 43.26014155-000003

TOTAL FOR : 051 {Westlaw) 6654.93 .00

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 052 76.00 * 121211 On-Line Research1072947 76.00 Paid To:
014155-000003

Lexis-Nexis

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 052 50 30 * 110912 On-Line Research1121815 50.30 Paid To:
014155-000003

Lexis-Nexis

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 052 1142717 11.20 11.20 * 041913 On-Line Research Paid To:
014155-000003

Pacer Service Center

TOTAL FOR : 052 (On-Line Research) 137.50 137.50

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. adv. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

.75 * 021611 Photo Copies

00 * 052011 Photo Copies

.07 * 081811 Photo Copies

2.51 * 090211 Photo Copies

.06 * 092711 Photo Copies

.23 * 102411 Photo Copies

5.68 * 110711 Photo Copies

9.24 * 110711 Photo Copies

.20 * 110711 Photo Copies

.15 * 110711 Photo Copies

.04 * 110911 Photo Copies

.03 * 110911 Photo Copies

8.44 * 112811 Photo Copies

.16 * 012412 Photo Copies

.16 * 012412 Photo Copies

1024783 3.75014155-000003

1040688 5.75014155-000003

1054440 1.75014155-000003

1056569 62.75014155-000003

1061978 1.50014155-000003

1068148 5.75014155-000003

1068843 142. 00014155-000003

1068845 231.00014155-000003

1068847 5.00014155-000003

1068877 4 . 00014155-000003

10690C5 1.00014155-000003

1069044 .75014155-000003

1071571 211 .0C014155-000003

1078701 4 .00014155-000003

1078866 4.00014155-000003
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15:32:54 COST SUMMARY REPORTMar 11 2015 COST CODE SORT. FINALIZED BATCHES ONLY. PAGE 9

DISBURSEMENT DATES: 010100 TO 031115 COST DETAIL

NOTE: * INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN BILLED.

D1SB

*- -DESCRIPTION	* CODEMATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT- - 3ILLINGINDEX AMOUNT DATE DESCRIPTION- - *

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ST AL. ADV. 1081899 .14 * 020812 Photo Copies

4.92 * 020912 Photo Copies

01 * 020912 Photo Copies

02 * 083112 Photo Copies

361* 091812 Photo Copies

2.18 * 092412 Photo Copies

A 28 * 092512 Photo Copies

3.82 * 092512 Photo Copies

4.68 * 092512 Photo Copies

04 * 092512 Photo Copies

01 * 101212 Photo Copies

.07 * 101212 Photo Copies

12 93 * 101712 Photo Copies

32 * 101712 Photo Copies

4.32 * 101712 Photo Copies

.64 * 101712 Photo Copies

1.60 * 101712 Photo Copies

.11 * 101Q12 Photo Copies

.20 * 102212 Photo Copies

.30 * 102312 Photo Copies

05 * 102312. Photo Copies

01 * 102312 Photo Copies

12 * 102312 Photo Copies

02 * 102312 Photo Copies

.01 * 102312 Phcto Copies

.02 * 102412 Photo Copies

.16 * 102412 Photo Copies

01 * 102412 Photo Copies

.03 * 102412 Photo Copies

15 * 102412 Photo Copies

03 * 102412 Photo Copies

.21 * 102412 Photo Copies

.40 * 102412 Photo Copies

1.24 * 102412 Photo Copies

06 * 102412 Photo Copies

.33 * 102512 Photo Copies

.07 * 102912 Photo Copies

07 * 103012 Photo Copies

.19 * 110212 Photo Copies

.02 * 110512 Photo Copies

. 04 * 110512 Photo Copies

.18 * 110712 Photo Copies

.20 * 111412 Photo Copies

10 * 112912 Photo Copies

.02 * 112912 Photo Copies

.16 * 120512 Photo Copies

.83 * 012313 Photo Copies

9.72 * 012313 Photo Copies

.16 * 012313 Photo Copies

.71 * 012913 Photo Copies

10 * 020513 Photo Copies

014155-000003 053 3.50

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053 1082068 123.00014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV.014155-000003 053 1082081 25

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL.014155-000003 ADV. 053 1112667 . 50

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL.014155-000003 ADV. 053 1114543 90 25

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053 1115247014155-000003 54.50

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. 1115327014155-000003 ADV. 053 107 00

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. 1115329014155-000003 ADV. 053 95.50

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 1115332014155-000003 053 117.00

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL.014 155 - 000003 ADV. 053 1115333 1 00

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. 1118433ADV. 053 .25014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053 1118473014155-000003 1.75

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. 1118957ADV. 053 323 25014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053 1118960 8 . 00014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053 1118963 108.00014155-000003

Pardee Homes ana w PARDEE ET AL. 053 1118970 16.00ADV.014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053 1118971 40 . 00014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053 1119362 2.75014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053 1119862 5 00014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ST AL. ADV. 053 1119956 7 . 50014155-000003

Pardee Homes and V) PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053 1119976 1.25014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053 1119932 25014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053 1120003 3.00014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL.

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL.

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL.

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL.

ADV. 053 1120013 .50014155-000003

ADV. 053 1120024 25014155-000003

ADV 053 1120106 .50014155-000003

ADV. 053 1120149 4 . 00014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. 1120166ADV. 053 25014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. adv

Pardee Homes and v; PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

053 1120172 . 75014155-000003

1120174 3.75014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. 1120175 75ADV. 053014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 1120178053 5 . 25014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053 1120181 10.00014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. 053 1120183ADV. 31.00014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w Pardee et al. adv. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Hemes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. adv. 053

1120185 1 50014155-000003

1120293 8 .25014155-000003

1120539 1.75014155-000003

1120670 1.75014155-000003

1121277 4.75014155-OGOOQ3

1121439 .50014155-000003

1121491 1.00014155-000003

1121668 4.50014155-000003

1124131 5 . 00014155-000003

1125676 2.50014155-000003

1125678 50014155-000003

1126428 4 . 00014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL.

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL.

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL.

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL.

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL.

1131954 20.75ADV. 053014155-000003

243 00ADV. 053 1131955014155-000003

ADV. 053 1131963 4.00014155-000003

ADV. 053 1132583 17.75014155-000003

ADV. 053 1134318 2 . 50014155-000003
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DISBURSEMENT DATES: 010100 TO 031115 COST DETAIL

NOTE: * INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN BILLED.

DISB

*MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT * * - -DESCRIPTION	* CODE DESCRIPTIONINDEX AMOUNT BILLING DATE

Pardee Hemes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV.

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV.

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV.

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV.

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV.

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV.

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV.

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV.

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV.

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. adv.

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV.

014155-000003 05 * 020713 Photo Copies

38 * 021513 Photo Copies

16 * 021513 Photo Copies

.16 * 021513 Photo Copies

41 * 022513 Photo Copies

.03 - 030113 Photo Copies

40 * 030113 Photo Copies

.04 * 030113 Photo Copies

.21 * 030113 Photo Copies

2. IS * 03 0113 Photo Copies

.29 * 030813 Photo Copies

.02 * 031313 Photo Copies

.01 * 031513 Photo Copies

.04 * 032513 Photo Copies

.03 * 041513 Photo Copies

06 * 041513 Photo Copies

.06 * 042313 Photo Copies

06 * 042913 Photo Copies

01 * 050613 Photo Copies

.02 * 051412 Photo Copies

.01 * 051713 Photo Copies

04 * 052113 Photo Copies

03 * 060413 Photo Copies

0D * 060413 Photo Copies

07 * 071713 Photo Copies

.25 * 072313 Photo Copies

2 15 * 072313 Photo Copies

37 * 072313 Photo Copies

.37 * 072413 Photo Copies

1.58 * 072413 Photo Copies

06 * 072413 Photo Copies

09 * 072413 Photo Copies

.01 * 072413 Photo Copies

01 * 072413 Photo Copies

3.39 * 072513 Photo Copies

1.56 * 072513 Photo Copies

.52 * 072513 Photo Copies

07 * 072513 Photo Copies

.02 * 072613 Photo Copies

.03 * 072613 Photo Copies

13 * 072413 Photo Copies

.03 * 072413 Photo Copies

2.32 * 072413 Photo Copies

53 * C72413 Photo Copies

70 * C72413 Photo Copies

.01 * 072413 Photo Copies

.28 * 072413 Photo Copies

2.11 * 072513 Photo Copies

.05 * 072513 Photo Copies

.14 * 072513 Photo Copies

.48 * 072513 Photo Copies

053 1134628 1.50

014155-000003 053 1135708 9 50

014155-000003 1135709053 4 . 00

014155-000003 053 1135710 4 00

014155-000003 1136628 10. 25053

014155-000003 053 1137327 . 75

014155-000003 1137360 10.00053

014155-000003 053 1137356 1 00

014155-000003 053 1137371 5.25

014155-000003 053 1137378 54 . 50

014155-000003 053 1138129 7.25

014155-000003 053 1138710 .50

014155-000003 1139206 25053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL.

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL.

ADV. 053 1140114014155-000003 1.00

014155-000003 ADV. 053 1142393 75

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w Pardee et al. adv. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

014155-000003 1142400 1 . 50

1143973014155-000003 053 1 . 50

1144494 1.50014155-000003

1145717 .25014155-000003

014155-000003 114G455 .50

1146869 •35014155-000003

1147254 1 . 00014155-000003

1148523 . 75014155-000003

1148528 .25014155-000003

1153042 1 75014155-000003

6.251153509014155-000003

014155-000003

014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and V? PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Hemes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET .AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. AJDV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET A.L. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET .AL. ADV

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes ana W PARDEE ST AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes ar.d W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and VJ PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

1153544 33.75

1153545 9 25

1153594 9.25014155-000003

1153595 39.50014155-000003

1153613 1-50014155-000003

2 251153635014155-000003

1153642 .25014155-000003

1153647 .25014155-000003

1153801 84 75053014155-000003

1153805 39.50014155-000003

1153808 13.00014155-000003

1153810 1 75014155-000003

1153882 .50053014155-000003

1153914 .75014155-000003

1154728 3 . 25014155-000003

1154732 . 75014155-000003

58.001154723014155-000003

1154735 13.25014155-000003

1154736 17 .50014155-000003

1154737 . 25014155-000003

1154738 7.00014155-000003

52.751154739014155-000003

1.251154742014155-000003

3.501154743014155-000003

1154744 12.00014155-000003
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* INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN 3ILLED.NOTE:

DISB

*MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT *- -DESCRIPTION	* CODS INDEX AMOUNT 3ILLING DATE DESCRIPTION

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Hemes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Hemes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. adv. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ST AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and v; PARDEE ET AL. ADV 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Hemes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and V? PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes ana W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ST AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET Al,. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and v; PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

014155-000003 52 * 072513 Photo Copies

.10 * 072513 Photo Copies

.02 * 073113 Phoco Copies

08 * 080513 Phoco Copies

2.18 * 080613 Phoco Copies

03 * 082313 Phoco Copies

04 * 020613 Phoco Copies

.06 * 021913 Photo Copies

02 * 091913 Photo Copies

5.27 * 091913 Photo Copies

02 * 092313 Phoco Copies

05 * 092713 Photo Copies

.01 * 093013 Photo Copies

.01 * 093013 Photo Copies

43 * 093013 Photo Copies

.02 * 100313 Photo Copies

.02 * 100313 Phoco Copies

03 * 100413 Photo Copies

.05 * 100813 Phoco Copies

1 . 04 * 1.00813 Photo Copies

02 «• 100812 Phoco Copies

.01 * I00ei3 Phoco Copies

.07 * 100913 Photo Copies

07 * 100913 Phoco Copies

28 * 100913 Photo Copies

.06 * 100913 Photo Copies

28 * 101013 Photo Copies

.24 * 101013 Photo Copies

.04 * 101413 Photo Copies

07 * 101413 Photo Copies

01 * 101513 Photo Copies

.03 * 101613 Phoco Copies

35 * 101613 Photo Copies

98 * 101613 Phoco Copies

.01 * 101713 Photo Copies

4.22 * 102213 Phoco Copies

74 » 102213 Photo Copies

.78 * 102313 Phoco Copies

1.04 * 102313 Phoco Copies

01 * 102813 Photo Copies

.01 * 102813 Photo Copies

.01 * 102813 Photo Copies

01 * 103013 PhoCo Copies

.01 * 103113 Phoco Copies

.09 * 110413 Photo Copies

.03 * 110513 Phoco Copies

13.60 * 120213 Photo Copies

.01 * 120213 Phoco Copies

.03 * 121113 Photo Copies

.07 * 121113 Phoco Copies

.02 * 121113 Photo Copies

1154745 13 . 00

014155-000003 1154747 2.50

014155-000003 1154771 .50

014155-000003 1155052 2 00

014155-000003 1155172 54 . 50

014155-000003 115712" . 75

014155-000003 1158349 1 .00

014155-000003 1159695 1.50

014155-000003 1159700 50

014155-000003 1159706 131.75

014155-000003 1160032 .50

014155-000003 1160705 1.25

014155-000003 1160817 25

014155-000003 1160850 .25

1160885014155-000003 10.75

014155-000003 1161395 .50

014155-000003 1161408 .50

1161473014155-000003 75

1161884014155-000003 1 . 25

1161896014155-000003 26 . 00

1161899014155-000003 50

1161904014155-000003 . 25

1161978 1.75014155-000003

1161990 1 75014155-000003

1161994 7.00014155-000003

1161997 1 . 50014155-000003

1162244 7 . 00014155-000003

1162261 6.00014155-000003

1162509 1.00014155-000003

1162529 1.75014155-000003

1162627 25014155-000003

1162750014155-000003 75

1162767 8.75014155-000003

1162769 24.50014155-000003

1163192 .25014155-000003

1163760 105.50014155-000003

1163762 18.50014155-000003

1163945 19.5001415S - 000003

1163947 26.00014155-000003

1164377 25014155-000003

1164380 . 25014155-000003

1164381 .25014155-000003

1164596 .25014155-000003

1164715 25014155-000003

1165236 2.25014155-000003

1165353 2 . 00014155-000003

1168334 340.00014155-000003

1168349 .25014155-000003

1169389 .75014155-000003

1169405 1.75014155-000003

1169430 .50014155-000003
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Mar 11 2015 15:32:55 COST SUMMARY REPORT COST CODE SORT. FINALIZED 3ATCHES ONLY. PAGE 12

DISBURSEMENT DATES: 010100 TO 031115 COST DETAIL

* INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN BILLED.NOTE:

DIS5

*MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT- - * - - DESCRIPTION	* CODE INDEX BILLING DATS DESCRIPTIONAMOUNT

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ST AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL, ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 052

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ST AL. ADV. 053

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 053

TOTAL FOR : 053 (Phoco Copies)

014155-000003 .56 * 121113 Phoco Copies

01 * 121133 Photo Copies

07 * 121113 Phoco Copies

3.85 * 121113 Photo Copies

02 * 121113 Photo Copies

04 * 121113 Photo Copies

1.65 * 121213 Photo Copies

32 * 121813 Photo Copies

.09 * 011614 Photo Copies

07 * 061614 Photo Copies

46 * 062314 Photo Copies

.92 * 062414 Photo Copies

.46 * 071514 Photo Copies

.04 * 071714 Photo Copies

90 * 082514 Photo Copies

1169440 14.00

014155-000003 1169444 25

014155-000003 1169451 1.75

014155-000003 1169452 96 .25

014155-000003 1169466 50

014155-000003 1169467 1 00

014155-000003 1169549 41.25

014155-000003 1170157 8 00

014155-000003 1173015 2 . 25

014155-000003 1192269 1.75

014155-000003 1192903 11.50

014155-000003 1193017 23.00

014155-000003 1194798 11.50

Q 14155- 00 0003 1195141 1.00

014155-000003 1198961 2.25

3773.75 152 13

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 054 1076101 7.12 * 012512 Copies of Court Documents - -

Paid To-. Pacer Service Center

014155-000003 7 . 12

TOTAL FOR : 054 (Copies of Court Documents) 7 . 12 7 . 12

106.92 * 060211 Outside Copying Service -

Paid To: Intel eDiscovery

Solutions, LLC

1133.06 * 021913 Outside Copying Service •

Paid To: Quivx eDiscovery

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 055 1042472 206.92014155-000003

Par-dee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 055 1133 061135775014155-000003

TOTAL FOR : 055 (Outside Copying Service) 1239.98 1239.98

Paid To:

Litigation Services &

Technologies Inc .

955.70 * 121911 Transcript

Pardee Homes and V? PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1C71512 977.10 977.10 * 112911 Transcript
014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 955 70 Paid To:

Litigation Services &

Technologies Inc.

1073313014155-000003

1122 35 * 110212 Transcript Paid To:

Litigation Services &

Technologies Inc.

65 52 * 121012 Transcript - -

Jennifer Church

687.40 * 031313 Transcript - -

Jennifer Church

207.50 * 050813 Transcript - -

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1121137 1122.35014155-000003

Paid Tc:
Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1126885 55.52014155-000003

Paid To:Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1138255 587.40014155-000003

Paid To

Jennifer Church, Court

1145422Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 207.50014155-000003
:

Reporter

493.50 * 062713 TranscriptPardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 Paid To:

Litigation Services &

Technologies Inc.

1150947 493.50014155-000003

226.70 * 071813 Transcript Paid To:

Jennifer Church, court

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1153053 226.70014155-000003

Reporter

435.40 * 092313 Transcript Paid To: Lores
Pardee Homes and V/ PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1159860 439.40014155-000003
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Mar 11 2015 15:32:55 COST SUMMARY REPORT COST CODE SORT. FINALIZED BATCHES ONLY. PAGE 13

DISBURSEMENT DATES: 010100 TO 031115 COST DETAIL

NOTE: * INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS 3EER BILLED.

DISB

* * - -DESCRIPTION- - - * CODE*MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT INDEX BILLING DATE DESCRIPTIONAMOUNT

Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

168.30 * 022613 Transcript -

Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

515.00 * 101613 Transcript

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064014155-000003 1160395 168.30 Paid To: Loree

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1162469014155-000003 515.00 Paid To:

Jennifer Church, Court

Reporter

790.00 * 101613 TranscriptPardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064014155-000003 1162470 790.00 Paid To: Loree

Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

56.25 * 102813 TranscriptPardee Homes and w PARDEE ST AL. ADV. 064014155-000003 1164216 56.25 Paid To:

Jennifer1 Church, Court

Reporter

382.50 * 102813 TranscriptPardee Homes ana W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1164217014155-000003 382.50 Paid To: Loree

Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

455.75 * 102913 TranscriptPardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1164297 455.75 Paid To:

Litigation Services &

Technologies Inc.

014155-000003

468.75 * 110413 TranscriptPardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 11G5040 458.75 Paid To:

Jennifer Church, Court

014155-000003

Reporter

518 50 * 130413 TranscriptPardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 518.501165041 Paid To:

Jennifer Church, Court

014155-000003

Reporter

1750.80 * 110413 TranscriptPardee Hemes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 Paid To: Loree

Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

97.45 * 111513 Transcript

County Treasurer

550.00 * 120413 Transcript

1165042 1750.80014155-000003

Paid To: ClarkPardee Homes and v; PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 1165972 97.45064014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1168313 550.00 Paid To:

Jennifer Church, Court

014155-000003

Reporter

550 00 * 120413 Transcript Paid To: Loree

Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

415.25 * 011714 Transcript - -

Jennifer Church

215.05 * 011714 Transcript - -

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1168314 550 00014155-000003

1172980 415.25 Paid To:Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. adv. 064014155-000003

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1172981 Paid To: Loree215.05034155-000003

Murray, Court Reporter

District Court IV

93.90 * 011714 Transcript

County Treasurer

30.00 * 081314 Transcript

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1172982 Paid To: Oark93 .90014155-000003

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 064 1197187 30 . 00 Paid To: Loree

Murray, Court Reporter,

District Court IV

014155-000003

TOTAL FOR : 064 (Transcript) 12232.67 12232.67

1082.13 * 011413 Depositions

Litigation Services &

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 065 1130981 Paid To:1082.13014155-000003
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Mar 11 2015 15:22:55 COST SUMMARY REPORT COST CODE SORT. FINALIZED BATCHES ONLY. PAGE 14

DISBURSEMENT DATES: 010100 TO 031115 COST DETAIL

NOTE: * INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN BILLED.

DISB

MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT- - * - -DESCRIPTION	 * CODE INDEX AMOUNT 3ILLING DATE DESCRIPTION

Technologies Inc.

TOTAL FOR : 065 (Depositions) 1082.13 1082.13

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AD. adv. 077014155-000003 1162936 34.00 14.00 * 093013 Parking

Center

14.00 * 101813 Parking

Center

140.00 * 110613 Parking

Grubb

20.00 * 111813 Parking

Center •

20.00 * 111813 Parking

Center -

20.00 * 111813 Parking

Center •

20.00 * 111813 Parking

Center •

20 00 * 111613 Parking

Center •

22 00 * 112613 Parking

Center •

20.00 * 112613 Parking

Center -

20.00 * 112613 Parking

Center -

20.00 * 112613 Parking

Center •

20.00 * 112613 Parking

Center -

100 00 * 121713 Parking

Grubb

60.00 * 011414 Parking

Center - ADS

20.00 * 011414 Parking

Center

20.00 * 011414 Parking

Center

24.00 * 081914 Parking

Center

6.00 * 082014 Parking

Center

6.00 * 082514 Parking

Center

Paid To: Bankcard

PL

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077014155-000003 1163036 14.00 Paid To: 3ankcard

JPS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077014155-000003 1165160 140. 00 Paid To: Brian

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077014155-000003 1156809 20.00 Paid To: Bankcard

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077014155-000003 1166B10 20. 00 Paid to: Bankcard

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077014155-000003 1166812 20. 00 Paid To: Bankcard

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077014155-000003 1166813 20. 00 - Paid To: Bankcard

ADS

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077014155-000003 1166814 20. 00 Paid TO: Bankcard

ADS

Pardee Homes and V? PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077 1167772014155-000003 22.00 Paid To: Bankcard

PL

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077 1167777014155-000003 20. 00 Paid To: Bankcard

PL

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV 077 1167781014155-000003 20. 00 Paid To: Bankcard

PL

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077 1167782 20.00014155-000003 Paid To: Bankcard

PL

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077 1167784 20.00014155-000003 Paid To: Bankcard

PL

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077 1169867 100.00014155-000003 Paid To: Brian

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077 1172476 SO . 00014155-000003 Paid TO: Bankcard

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077 1172534 20.00014155-000003 Paid To: Bankcard

PL

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077 1172537 20.00014155-000003 Paid To: Bankcard

PL

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077 1198183 24.00 Paid To: Bankcarc014155-000003

RTK

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077 1198456 6.00 Paid To: Bankcard014155-000003

ADS

Pardee Homes and W PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 077 1198868 6.00014155-000003 Paid To: Bankcard

PL

TOTAL FOR : 077 (Parking) 606 . 00 606 . 00

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. adv. 087 3.061146982014155-000003 3.06 * 052113 MISCELLANEOUS COSTS - -

To: AT&T Teleconference

Services - Conference call

Paid

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 087 114S988 1.71 1.71 * 052113 MISCELLANEOUS COSTS - -

To: AT&T Teleconference

Services - Conference call

014155-000003 Paid
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15:32:55 COST SUMMARY JIEFORT COST CODE SORT.Mar 11 2015 FINALIZED BATCHES ONLY. PAGE 15

DISBURSEMENT DATES: 010100 TO 031115 COST DETAIL

* INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN BILLED.NOTE:

DISS

*MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT- - '---DESCRIPTION	* CODE INDEX AMOUNT 3ILLINC- DATE DESCRIPTION

Pardee Homes and w PARDEE ET AL. ADV. 08?014155-000003 1192761 1.62 1 62 * 062414 MISCELLANEOUS COSTS - -

TO: AT&T Teleconference

Services

Paid

TOTAL FOR : 08? (Miscellaneous Coses) 6.39 6 39

GRAND TOTAL : 31064 90 19807.11
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15:32:55 COST SUMMARY REPORT COST CODE SORT.Mar 11 2015 FINALIZED BATCHES ONLY. PAGE 16

DISBURSEMENT DATES: 010100 TO 031115

NOTE: - INDICATES THAT THE COST HAS BEEN BILLED.

COST DETAIL

DISB

•MATTER NUMBER* *	 CLIENT- - * - -DESCRIPTION	 * CODE INDEX BILLING DATE DESCRIPTIONAMOUNT

SQL STATEMENT USED:

SELECT FROM TA3LES : cost , client , matter , batch

WHERE CONDITION: cost . cmatter=matter . mmacter AND matter .mclient=client clnum AND cost cbatch=batch.bbatch AND (batch. b

findt IS NOT NULL OR cost . cstatus= ' AJD ' 5 AND (matter. mmatter » '014155-000003'} AND

: IS NULL OR cpaddfl IN CY'.'N')) AND cdisbdt<=? AND cdisbdt>=?

1=1 AND (cpaidfl
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INVOICE

Remittance:
Tyler Technologies, inc. (FEIN 75-2303920)

P.O. Box 678 1S4

Dallas, TX 75267-8 1S4

184163 1

technologies Questions: 03/24/2011
6500 International Parkway

Piano, TX 75093

Phone: 972-713-3770

SOLD TO SHIP TO

McDonald Carano Wilson LLP

PO Box 2670

Reno, NV 89505

McDonald Carano Wilson LLP

PO Box 2670

Reno, NV 89505

~*a t. tr:;

2580T104117-0
Due in 15 days

"jfr
%&- •&TS4J:*',

Court Fees for February 27, 20 1 1 thru March 5, 201 1.1.00 223.00 EA $223.00

RECEIVED

1 9 2BI

MCW LLP " Accounting Dept

POSTED .

\y2M^VOUCHER#

P&V0ATE JLltL-H

COMMENTS: SALE AMOUNT $223.00

ALL payments

must be sent to the remittance

address shown above.

SALES TAX 0.00

H
IISTAI.

53®

All software provided by Ty!er Technologies. Inc. to the Customer, including the programs and telaied documentation, are confidential, trade secrets, and the proprietary property of Tyler Technologies, Inc.

Any unauthorized use, examination, modification, replication, recompSIarion, transfer, reverse engineering, or disclosure is strictly prohibited.
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7yler 7eitwt>lo$Us>

DATEF1LED FILINGTITLE USERFILINGNU1 AMOUNTEFILEID IUSERID mTLE

SOU/5-inswer to Amended Complaintella Sam

' i'14155-31575600 1 Delia SamdA632338 ' 3.50 iX

*
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Page 1 of 1

MC2207

10/01/2011 - 12/31/2011
CUSTOMER NUMBER t

DATE RANGE: 1PAGE:

TIME IN TIME OUT TIME /PAGES AMOUNT
• DESCRIPTION

COURT

SEARCH CRITERIA

DATE

SUBTOTAL FOR CLIENT CODE: 14155-3

10.48TOTAL:

INVQICE
ii

<

Invoice Date: 01/04/2012

Usage From: 10/01/2011 to: 12/31/2011

Public Access to Court Electronic Records

("Account Summary )

Account ID: MC2207

MC2207-Q420 1 1

02/07/2012

$10.48

RECEIVED

JAN 1 8 2012

131 Invoice #:Pages;

Rate:

Subtotal:

$0.08

$10.48
Due Date:

Amount Due:

MOW LLP - Accounting Dept. 0Audio Files;

Rate:

Subtotal:

$2.40 f

$0.00
"\

Contact Us
$10.48Current Billed Usage:

San Antonio: (210) 301-6440

Toll Free: (800) 676-6856

Hours: 8 am - 6 pm CT M-F

pacer@psc, uscourts.gov

iVOUCHEB#

lppS DATE „Previous Balance:

Current Balance:

$0.00

$10.48

See www.pacer.gov/billing for

detailed billing transactions,

instructions for disputing

transactions, FAQs and more.

It's quick and easy to pay your

bill online with a credit card. Visit

the Manage My PACER Account

section of the PACER Service

Center web site at

wuvw.pacer.gov

£ TotalAmount Due: $10.48)

NEW! Free PACER Training Site Available

The Judiciary has launched a new PACER training site where future users

can learn how to use PACER and current users can sharpen their record-
searching skills. The "PACER Training Site" link is located at www.pacer.gov
under "Frequently Used."

A "training" login and password are posted on the Welcome Page so future

users can give PACER a try before registering for an account. Current users
have the added convenience of using their own PACER login and

password to access the PACER training site or the option to use the

training login and password.

There is no charge for accessing this training area.

The PACER Federal Tax ID is:

74-2747938

Questions about the invoice?

Visit www.pacer.gov/billing

J V

1/23/2012https://www.pacer.gov/psco/ogi-bin/billrpt.pl
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INVOICE

Invoice Date: 04/04/201 3

Usage From: 01/01/2013 to: 03/31/2013
Public Access to Court Electronic Records

r a
received MC0413Account ZD:

19,010

$0.10

$1,901.00

Invoice #: MC0413-Q12013Pages:

Rate:

Subtotal:

u<

05/08/2013Due Date;

;W UP -Accounting Dept Amount Due:

*	

$1,901.00

Audio Files:

Rate:

Subtotal:

	j

$2.40

$0.00

$1,901.00

r
*\

Contact Us
POSTED

Current Billed Usage:
VOUCHER $	 _	

PAY DATE j
San Antonio: (210) 301-6440

Toll Free: (800) 676-6856

Hours: 8 am - 6 pm CT M-F

pacer@psc.uscourts.gov
$0.00

$1,901.00

Previous Balance:

Current Balance:

See www.pacer.gov/billing for

detailed billing transactions,

instructions for disputing

transactions, FAQs and more.

It's quick and easy to pay your

bill online with a credit card. Visit

the Manage My PACER Account

section of the PACER Service

Center web site at

wvyw.pacer.gov

The PACER Federal Tax ID is:

74-2747938

\

^ TotalAmount Due: $1,901.00
/

Account Security Information

in the coming months, improvements to the PACER system will include the addition of a self-

service login retrieval and password reset feature. Once this feature is in place, all PACER

accounts will be required to have a valid email address, security question/answer, and a date

of birth on file. Please take a moment to verify that your PACER account contains the

required information. Follow these steps:

1) Go to www.pacer.gov and log in to Manage My PACER Account.

2) Under Maintenance Options, select Set Security Information.

3) Add any missing information, including email address, security question & answer, and date

of birth; then click Submit.

If you need assistance with these updates, please call the PACER Service Center at (800)

676-6856, or email us at pacer@psc.uscourts.gov.

~\
Questions about the invoice?

Visit www.pacer.gov/bilHng

J V

S UBTOTAL FOR CLIENT CODE: 14155-3 11.20

file:///C:/Users/brosse/AppData/Local/Temp/Low/GPL7FE47.htm 4/17/2013
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0 INVOICE
3770 Howard Hughes Pfcwy,

Suite 300

Las Vegas. NV 89169

Phone: 8D.D-33G-1112

SERVICES Fax: 702-631-7351
ohcovery + DepojiHons * Decitiom wwwliligalionservices.com

Invoice No. Invoice Date lob No.

88B199

igafion
11/11/2011 145442

lob Date Case No.

11/8/2011

Case Name

Wolfram, et al. vs. Pardee Homes of Nevada

Aaron Shipley, Esq.

McDonald Carano Wilson LLP

2300 West Sahara Avenue

Suite 1000

Las Vegas, NV 89102

Payment Terms

Due upon receipt

ORIGINAL AND 1 CERTIFIED COPY OF TRANSCRIPT OF:

lames Wolfram
977.10

$977.10

$1,074.81

TOTAL DUE »>

AFTER 12/11/2011 PAY

Thank you for your business!

Questions or corrections must be received in writing within 30 days of invoice date.

^A 3% service charge will be added for processing credit card payments.

»,fC*
Vouches #jgW. ,
pjydate *receive t

/

JMVLP-

Phone: 702-873-4100 Fax:702-873-9966
Tax ID: 88-0428399

Please detach bottom portion and return with payment.

BU ID : LV-CRJob No. : 145442

Case No. :

Case Name : Wolfram, et al. vs. Pardee Homes of Nevada
Aaron Shipley, Esq.

McDonald Carano Wilson LLP

2300 West Sahara Avenue

Suite 1000

Las Vegas, NV 89102
Invoice Date : 11/11/2011Invoice No. : 888199

Total Due : $ 977.10

AFTER 12/11/2011 PAY $1,074.81

PAYMENT WITH CREDIT CARD IBB vm
r.-resswa

Cardholder's Name:

Card Number:

Remit To: Litigation Services and Technologies of
Nevada, LLC

3770 Howard Hughes Parkway
Suite 300

Las Vegas, NV 89169

Exp. Date: Phone#:

Billing Address:

Zip: Card Security Code:

Amount to Charge:

Cardholder's Signature:
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3770 Howard Hughes Pkwy,
Suite 300
Las Vegas, NV 89169

Phone:800-330-1112

SERVICES Fax: 702-631-7351

Job No.Invoice DateInvoice No.:

888983 11/30/2011 147615
igation

Job Date Case No.

Discovery * Depositions Decisions WVWJitigationseFViCeS.com 11/28/2011

Case Name

Wolfram, et al. vs. Pardee Homes of Nevada

Aaron Shipley, Esq.

McDonald Carano Wilson LLP
2300 West Sahara Avenue
Suite 1000

Las Vegas, NV 89102

Payment Terms

Due upon receipt

ORIGINAL AND 1 CERTIFIED COPY OF TRANSCRIPT OF:

Walter Wilkes 955.70

$955.70

$1,051.27

TOTAL DUE >»

AFTER 12/30/2011 PAY

Thank you for your businessl

Questions or corrections must be received in writing within 30 days of invoice date.

A 3% service charge will be added for processing credit card payments.
DEC 1 k 2011

MCW LLP - Accounting Oepi

' POSTED
VOUCHER# I^IKU-IS
PAY DATE '

r

mm
u

Vs

J.	:• '» :'f-- :

Phone:702-873-4100 Fax:702-873-9966Tax ID: 88-0428399

Pfo/ixe detach bottom portion and return with payment.
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3770 Howard Hughes Pkwy,

Suite 300
Invoice No Invoice Date lob No.

906159 10/24/2012igation 167740Las Vegas, NV 89169

Phone: 800-330-1112

SERVICES Fax:702-631-7351
Job Date Case No.

oijcovery + Depositions + Decision* www.litfgationservices.com
10/19/2012 A-10-632338-C

Case Name

Wolfram, et at. vs. Pardee Homes of Nevada i

i

Pat Lundvall, Esq.
McDonald Carano Wilson LLP
2300 West Sahara Avenue

Suite 1200
Las Vegas, NV 89102

>Payment Terms

Due upon receipt

ONE EXPEDITED COPY OF THE TRANSCRIPT OF:

Harvey Whittemore, Esq. 1,122.35

TOTAL DUE »>

AFTER 11/23/2012 PAY

$1,122.35

$1,234.59

Thank you for your business!

Received
Litigation Services newest office has opened .in UTAH.
Please call us today at 1-800-330-1112 for statewide coverage.

; *

MOW LLP - Accounting Dept. \

PAY DATE 2\

Phone: 702-873-4100 Fax:702-873-9966Tax ID: 27-5114755

Please detach bottom portion and return with payment.

Job No. : 167740

Case No. : A-10-632338-C

Case Name : Wolfram, et al. vs. Pardee Homes of Nevada

BU ID : LV-CRO

Pat Lundvall, Esq.

McDonald Carano Wilson LLP

2300 West Sahara Avenue
Suite 1200

Las Vegas, NV 89102 Invoice No. : 906159

Total Due : $ 1,122.35

AFTER 11/23/2012 PAY $1,234.59

Invoice Date : 10/24/2012 .

5
PAYMENT WITH CREDIT CARD AMEK: WS4 i •I

Cardholder's Name:
!

Card Number:
Remit To: Litigation Services and Technologies of

Nevada, LLC
PO Box 98869

Las Vegas, NV 89193-8869

Phone#:Exp. Date:

Billing Address:

Card Security Code:Zip:

Amount to Charge:

Cardholder's Signature:
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V-

Invoice No. Invoice Date lob No.3770 Howard Hughes Pkvvy,

STE 300

Las Vegas NV 89169

Phone- 800-3301 112

Fax; 702-631-7351

www.litigationservices.coni

V.

925717 6/17/2013 182441

lob Date Case No.Litigation
^ SERVICES

5/31/2013 A-10-632338-C

Case Name

Wolfram, et al. vs. Pardee Homes of Nevada

Aaron Shipley, Esq.
McDonald Carano Wilson LLP

2300 West Sahara Avenue

Suite 1000

Las Vegas, NV 89102

Payment Terms

Due upon receipt

ORIGINAL AND 1 CERTIFIED COPY OF TRANSCRIPT OF:

James Frederick Wolfram * 493.50
•iV

$493.50

a. $542.85

TOTAL DUE »>

AFTER 7/17/2013 PAY
- i

' -.

i'
Thank you for'your business!

.

JUN 2 7 2013

MCW LLP- Accounting Depi
7

QUti fAJU[ p<r

i& A

POSTED
VOUCHER i

PAY DATE 1-lnMT.
(MiTTcS

ill
-r

Phone: 702-873-4100 Fax:702-873-9.9661Tax ID: 27-5114755
I
•:

Please detach bottom portion and return with payment.
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STATEMENT
3770 Howard Hughes Pkwy.

pBjfe* Suite 300
lWTlI I C"i "I* I f~S n Las Vegas, NV 891 69
» n f 1 1 y v-4 1 1 w l I Phone: 800-330-1112

SER ViCES Fax: 702-631-7351

DateAccount No.

1/3/2013F2935

Discovery * Depositions * oecWons www.iiligailonservices.coni
60 Days30 DaysCurrent

$1,082.13$2,494.64$290.00

Total Due120 Days & Over90 Days

Accounts Payable
McDonald Carano Wilson LLP

2300 West Sahara Avenue

Suite 1200

Las Vegas, NV 89102

$3,866.77$0.00$0.00

Page 1 of 1

Invoice
No.

10/8/2012 &bbo^04769

Invoice

Date

Case NameWitnessBalance Job Date

Jon Lash IBIS'S*" 3 Wolfram, et al. vs. Pardee Homes of9/26/20121,082.13

POSTED
vouches p above
PAY DATE

Phone: 702-873-4100 Fax:702-873-9966
Tax ID: 27-5114755

Please detach bottom portion and return with payment.

: F2935

: 1/3/2013

Account No.

Date
Accounts Payable

McDonald Carano Wilson LLP

2300 West Sahara Avenue

Suite 1200
Las Vegas, NV 89102

Total Due : $ 3,866.77

PAYMENT WITH CREDIT CARP vts*'Km

Cardholder's Name:

Card Number:

Phone#:Exp, Date:

Billing Address:
Remit To: Litigation Services & Technologies of

Nevada, LLC
PO Box 98869

Las Vegas, NV 89193-8869
Card Security Code:mi

Amount to Charge:

Cardholders Signature;
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WJCUUNrtLD UAHANU VVILtiUIN UL.r

Date Amount $
$100.00Oct 08, 2013

Invoice Description Amount PaidInvoice Date Invoice Number

$100.00PL / 14155.3 - Witness FeePL/10081310-08-13

RACEIDMrHlSIDQGUMENT4HASgAtCOtIOREDfBACKGRDUND-CONiWHrrBRAHERaa

22134NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

MCDONAID-CARANO-WILSON5
94-77/1224

2300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000
LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

(702) 873-4100

ONE HUNDRED AND 00/100 Dollars

PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Frances Butler Dunlap

DATE AMOUNT

<

$
******

Oct>08, 2013 '100.00

ESREOLJiRgpTF OVER $2500.002 SJ

/
Ljfi RED

gl SECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK, fi

22134Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Inv. DateInv. No. AmountCost CodeMatter I.D.

100.00

G/L Acct.

10-08-13PL/100813211407 $100.00200050

PRINTED IN U.S.A.JAY JOHNSON & ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FOflUS 775-329-0200 / FAX 77S-329-4507WL65112M1
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CHECK REQUEST
Date/Time needed: 10/08/13 by 3 pmYes NoRUSH

Client# 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter# 00003 Matter Name: Wolfram v. Pardee

Expense code: Type Description: Witness Fee

Amount of check : 100.00 Requested by: Brian Grubb for PL

Reason for check: Witness Fee

Payable to: Frances Butler Dunlap

Vendor # Batch #

Voucher # G/L#

Miscellaneous notation:
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 11/8/2013 2pmRUSH Yes No

Client name: PardeeClient# 14155

Matter Name; WolframMatter Name: 3

Type Description:Expense code: 0

Requested by: PL/swAmount of check:

$ 1,387.70

Reason for check: Reimbursement of travel expenses for trial

appearances as a result of a subpoena	

Payable to: Harvey Whittemore, P.O. Box 8069, Reno, NV 89507

m

Vendor # Batch #

Voucher# ' G/L#

Miscellaneous notation:

. U

LLP - AcUhiMbiiq u*? •

?S?Jgg
VOUCHERS
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iviuuwjvnuw unnnjvu i_i_i

Date Amount $
$65.52. Dec 10, 2012 .

Invoice Description

ADS / 14155.3 -Transcript
Status Check 12/6/12
Proceedings-

Invoice Date Invoice Number

ADS/121012

Amount Paid

$65.5212-10-12

21392NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

McEXDNALD-CARANO*WILSON 5
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
(702) 873-4100

SIXTY-FIVE AND 52/100 Dollars

PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Jennifer Church

DATE AMOUNT

$********65.52

TURgS.apQUtH^FoVER $2500,00

10, 2012

A
2

JE

m

/'

21392Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Matter I.D. Cost Code Inv. No. Inv. Date

12-10-12

G/L Acct. Amount

$65.52205315 ADS/12101265.52200050

JAY JOHNSON A ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORMS 775-323-0200 / FAX 775-323-4507 PRINTED IN U.S.A.WL85112M1
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CHECK REQUEST

Yes No Date/Time needed: 12/10/12RUSH

Client name: PardeeClient# 14155

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Type Description:Expense code: 064

Requested by: ADS/MMAmount of check:

$ $65.52

Reason for check: Transcript- Status Check 12/6/12 Proceedings

Payable to: Jennifer Church

Vendor # Batch #

G/L#Voucher #

Miscellaneous notation:
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I IMcdonald .carano wilson llp

Date Amount $
$687.40Mar 13, 2013

Invoice Description

PL / 14155.3 - Expedited
Transcript - Summary Judgment
Notion Hearing - 3/5/13

Amount Paid

$687.40

Invoice NumberInvoice Date

PL/03131303-13-13

21621NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Llborly Slreei
Reno, Nevada 89501

McDONALD-CARANO-WILSON d
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
(702) 873-4100

SIX HUNDRED EIGHTY-SEVEN AND 40/100 Dollars

PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Jennifer Church

DATE AMOUNT

$*Mar 13, 2013
***** *

687.40

2 SIQNATURI REQUIRED IF OVER $2500.00

n
f/j 1*=B"

	 WPJ

/
/

1/
WITH

.A

21621Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Cost Code Inv. No. Inv. DateMatter I.D. AmountG/L Acct.

03-13-13 $687.40PL/031313207391687.40200050

JAY JOHNSON St ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORMS 775-323-0200 / FAX 775-323-4507 PRINTED IN U.S.A.WLB5112M1
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 3/13/13 2pmRUSH Yes No

Client name: PardeeClient# 14155

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Type Description:Expense code: 064

Requested by: PL/swAmount of check:

$ $687.40

Reason for check: Expedited Transcript- Summary Judgment Motion

Hearing - 3/5/13

Payable to: Jennifer Church

FOR ACCOUNTING ONLY

Vendor # Batch #

G/L#Voucher #

Miscellaneous notation:
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Brand$&osse

Elizabeth HelmsFrom:

Sent: Wednesday, May 08, 2013 9:53 AM

Brandy Rosse; Pamela Queen

Pat Lundvall

To:

Cc:

FW: Wolfram v. Pardee 14155-3Subject:

Can we please have a check made payable to: Jennifer Church (Tax ID #46-1388957) for $207.50?

Thank you!

Elizabeth Helms | Assistant to

Pal Lundvall and

Jessica Woelfel

Mcdonald Carano Wilson llp
100 West Liberty Street. IOEil Floor | Reno. NV 89501
phone (775) 788-2000 facsimile (775) 788-2020 | direct (775) 326-4349

POSTEI
vouchers dO$>
PAY DATE ^'8- (3

From: Jennifer Church [mailto:church.iennifer568@qmail.coml

Sent: Wednesday, May 08, 2013 9:49 AM

To: Elizabeth Helms

Subject: Fwd: Wolfram v. Pardee

	 Forwarded message 	

From: Jennifer Church <church.iennifer568@gmaiLcom>

Date: Fri, Apr 26, 2013 at 3:51 PM

Subject: Wolfram v. Pardee

To: imi@iimmersonhansen.com. plundvall@mcdonaldcarano.com, Sally Wexlcr
<swexler@mcdonaldcarano.com>

Mr. Jimmerson,

Ms. Lundvall,

Good afternoon,

It's my understanding that you wish tosgii SsbeLfhe transcript from today's hearing.

The estimated cost for the transonpt is $207.50 each. J
Standard transcript delivery fonthis transcript is appixpaifiately 14 days from the date payment is received.

Also, please let me know if you prefer a full size or condensed transcript and if you need an ASCII or PDF via

e-mail.

Pursuant to statute, reporting fees, including transcript costs, are due prior to the production of the

transcript. You may send payment to the P.O. Box address below or hand-deliver a check to Dept. 4 to my

attention. Please make check payable to Jennifer Church (Tax ID #46-1388957).

l
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\Cto~ NEVADA STATE BANKfMj .1 West Liberty Street
1 - Reno, Nevada 89501

HEiFACE.QF^THIS DOCUMENT: HAS A'COLDRED?BACKGROUND;OI

% 1 f. :

21940
• ; ; •

McDONALD-CAFANO-WILSONS J-

. 94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000
LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

{702) 873-4100
V

:
*

;

-

. •

v.-

,

,;v
' *.

DATEPAY TO THE ORDER OF : AMOUNT

2013 $226.70
' ' . V:-} '

Quired if over S25oo.on

• •
-

July 1.

•• %

Jennifer Church •
/•

2 SIGNATUI
.

.
;

:

•"V -
r

•• ; vswn>>\:

:

;
• ' ;

21 940
-

Mcdonald carano wilson llp . , -

:

:
-

r

- ••

; •. - 15

Amount ^

$226.70 '

Cost Code Inv. Date

07-17-13

Matter I.D.

226.70

j r Inv.. No.
t • i. ' . > • .

PL/071713
G/L Acct. .

*.
' ,

/V. ; :v
;*. *v *
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JAY JOHNSON & ASSOCIATES BUSINESS R3RMS 77S-323-0200 / FAX 775-323-4507WU5112M1 PRINTED IN U.S.A.
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CHECK REQUEST

RUSH Date/Time needed: 7/17/13 3:00pmYes No

Client# 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter Name: 3 Matter Name: Wolfram

Expense code: 064 Type Description:

Amount of check: Requested by: PL/Sally

$ $226.70

Reason for check: Transcript- 7/9/13 Proceedings

Payable to: Jennifer Church

FOR ACCOUNTING ONLY

Vendor # Batch #

Voucher # G/L#

Miscellaneous notation:
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WICUUIMALU UAKANU WIL5SUN LLf

Date Amount $
$439.40Sep 23, 2013

Amount Paid

$439.40

invoice Description

PL / 14155.3 - Expedited
Transcript - 9/23713

Invoice Number

PL/092313

invoice Date

09-23-13

22103NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

MCDONALD-CARANO-WILSON5
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
<702} 873-4100

FOUR HUNDRED THIRTY-NINE AND 40/1 00 Dollars

DATE AMOUNTPAY TO THE ORDER OF

$
*******

Loree Murray Sep 23, 2013 439.40

URED IF OVER $2500.002 SIGNATURES

pED it.

wrrx *

(xl SECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK, fil

22103Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Inv. Date AmountInv. No.Cost Code

211148

Matter I.D.G/L Acct.

09-23-13 $439.40PL/092313439.40200050

PRINTED IN USAJAY JOHNSON £ ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORMS 77S-323-C200 / FAX 77S-323-4507WL85112M1
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 9/24/13 10:00a.m.Yes NoRUSH

Client# 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Type Description: Hearing transcriptExpense code: 064

Amount of check: Requested by: PL/Sally

$ 439.40

Reason for check: Expedited Transcript- 9/23/13 hearing

Payable to: Loree Murray

SOMAmSi

Vendor # Batch #

Voucher # G/L#

Miscellaneous notation:
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iviot-'wiNf-iuLS unnniiu vviuowiv uur

Date Amount $
$168.30• Sep 26, 2013

Amount PaidInvoice Description

PL / 14155.3 - Expedited .
Transcript - 9/23/13 hearing

Invoice Date invoice Number

$168.3009-26-13 PL/092613

lS2S^g^&?THHFAEE£OBgrHISIDDeU^Em?HAS7ASCOEOREDrBACKGRQyND2QN;WHiTSPAf?ER

22108NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

McDONALD-CARANO-WILSON5
94-77/1224

2300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000
LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

(702) 873-4100

ONE HUNDRED SIXTY-EIGHT AND 30/100 Dollars

PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Loree Murray

AMOUNTDATE

Sep 26, 2013 $
*******

168.30

2 SIGNATURES REQUIBEDJF OVER $2500.00

mx—

	

ft SECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK. Q

22108Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Inv. Date AmountCost Code

211212

Inv. No.Matter I.D,

168.30

G/L Acct.

200050 09-26-13PL/092613 $168.30

PRINTED INILSAJAY JOHNSON A ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORMS 775-323-0200/ FAX 775-323-4507WU5112M1
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 9/26/13 11:00a.m.RUSH Yes No

Client# 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Expense code: 064 Type Description: Hearing transcript

Amount of check: Requested by: PL/Sally

$ 168.30

Reason for check: Expedited Transcript- 9/23/13 hearing

Payable to: Loree Murray

Batch #Vendor #

G/L#Voucher #

Miscellaneous notation:
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Date Amount $
Oct 16, 2013 '

Invoice Description

$515.00f.
. "i

Amount PaidInvoice Date Invoice Number

PL / 14155.3 - Trial
Transcript '

$515.0010-16-13 PL/101613

IEEAtSgDlTOISiDDCUMENBHASa>^"'r"W^"iBACKSRODNDlDNaWBITB.'BARERj

22163NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

MCDONALD-CARANO-WILSON5
94-77/1224

2300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000
LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

(702) 873-4100

FIVE HUNDRED FIFTEEN AND 00/100 Dollars

PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Jennifer Church

AMOUNTDATE

Oct 16, 2013 $
*******

515.00

•QUIRED IF OVER $2500.002 SIGNATURl

WITH ^

«l SECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK. fT

22163Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Inv. Date AmountCost Code

211555

Inv. No.Matter I.D.

515.00

G/L Acct.

200050 10-16-13PL/101613 $515.00

PRINTED IN U.8A
JAY JOtftSON & ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORMS 775-323-C200 / FAX 775323-4507WU5112M1
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V

CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 10/16/13 2:00p.m.Yes NoRUSH

Client# 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Type Description: Trial transcriptExpense code: 064

Requested by: PL/SallyAmount of check:

$ 515.00

Reason for check: Trial Transcript-

Payable to: Jennifer Church

HP ONLY

Vendor # Batch #

G/L#Voucher #

Miscellaneous notation:
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Date Amount $
$790.00Oct 16, 2013

Invoice Description Amount PaidInvoice Date invoice Number

PL / 14155.3 - Trial
Transcript

$790.00PL/10161310-16-13

fflEHAGEiQF£JHtSlDQCUMENTi;HASs&!CDLOREDZBACKGRQlJND.;OEJflVHnEifiAREItil

22164NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

McEXDNALD-CARANO-WILSONt
94-77/1224

2300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000
LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

(702) 873-4100

SEVEN HUNDRED NINETY AND 00/100 Dollars

DATE AMOUNTPAY TO THE ORDER OF

Loree Murray Oct 16, 2013 $
*******

790.00

2 SIGNATURESJ36QU1RED IF OVER $2500.00

Vw-/

7"

5 SECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK. £j

22164Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Inv. DateInv. No. AmountCost Code

211556

G/L Acct. Matter I.D.

790.00 PL/101613 10-16-13 $790.00200050

JAY JOHNSON A ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORKS 775-323-C200 / FAX 775-323-4507 PRINTED IN U.S.A.WL85112M1

220

JA007957



CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 10/16/13 2:00p.m.Yes NoRUSH

Client# 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Type Description: Trial transcriptExpense code: 064

Requested by: PL/SallyAmount of check:

$ 790.00

Reason for check: Trial Transcript-

Payable to: Loree Murray

Y

Batch #Vendor #

Voucher # G/L#

Miscellaneous notation:

221
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Date Amount $
$56.25Oct 28, 2013

Invoice Description

PL / 14155.3 - Expedited
Transcript

/>

Amount PaidInvoice Date Invoice Number

$56.25PL/10281310-28-13

;<gg7aU2£rHEfPACEtQKgrHlS£DDCIIMENTijHASEA'xCOlIPREDlBACKGROUND.vON.WHITEiPARER

22188NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

McDONALD-CARANO-WILSONi
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
(702) 873-4100

FIFTY-SIX AND 25/100 Dollars

PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Jennifer Church

DATE AMOUNT

Oct 28, 2013 $
********

56.25

2 SIGNATURES REQUIRED IF OVER $2500.00

!£.RED I
0*

7

Q SECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK. Si

22188Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Inv. Date Amount

$56.25

Cost Code

211790

Inv. No.

PL/102813

Matter I.D.

56.25

G/L Acct.

10-28-13200050

PRINTED IN USAJAY JOHNSON & ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORKS 775-323-0200/ FAX 77^323-4507WL85112M1
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 10/28/13 2pmYes NoRUSH

Client# 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Type Description:Expense code: 064

Amount of check: Requested by: PL/sw

$ 56.25

Reason for check: Expedited Transcript-

Payable to: Jennifer Church

Vendor # Batch #

Voucher # G/L#

Miscellaneous notation:

223
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Pate Amount $ .
$382.50. Oct 28, 2013

Invoice Description Amount PaidInvoice Date Invoice Number

$382.50PL / 14155.3 - Expedited
"ranscript-of Friday,
0/25/13 hearing

PL/10281310-28-13

1

IBEABgOCTB15fDOSOMENT^AggAtCOlIQREDreACKGROUNDiPNfWHiT>EIRftRER'EE

22189NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

McDONALD-CARANO-WILSONS
94-77/1224

2300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000
LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102

(702) 873-4100

THREE HUNDRED EIGHTY-TWO AND 50/100 Dollars

PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Loree Murray

DATE AMOUNT

Oct 28, 2013 $
*******

382.50

2 SIGNATURES REQUIRED IF OVER $2500.00

J
MP

>

t I

22189Mcdonald carano wilson llp

inv. DateInv. No. AmountCost Code

211791

Matter l.D.G/L Acct.

PL/102813382.50 10-28-13 $382.50200050

PRINTED \U U.S.A.
JAY JOHNSON & ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORMS 77&-323-020G I FAX 775-323-4507V/L8S112M1

224
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 10/28/13 2pmYes NoRUSH

Client# 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Expense code: 064 Type Description:

Requested by: PL/swAmount of check:

$ $382.50

Reason for check: Expedited Transcript- ofFriday, 10/25/13 hearing

Payable to: Loree Murray

FOR ACCOUNTING ONLY

Batch #Vendor #

G/L#Voucher #

• Miscellaneous notation:

225
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An Ccm Got |iviuu/wi^ut-r unnMiNu vviuouin mr

v*

Date Oct 30, 2013 Amount $ 4 68.75

Invoice Date Invoice Description
PL / 14155.3

of Jon Lash testimony

invoice Number Amount Paid

Expedited Transcipt $468 . 75PL/10301310-30-13

22201NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

*

McDONALD-CARANO-WILSONi
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
(702) 873-4100

PAY TO THE ORDER OF DATE

Oct 30, 2013
AMOUNT

$468.75
Jennifer Church , Court Reporter

2 signa3NATU

''s /
RES REQUIRED IF OVER $2500.00

m•At,

wrW

22201Mcdonald carano wilson llp

G/L Acct. Cost Code Inv. No. Inv. DateMatter l.D.

468.75

Amount

PL/103013 10-30-13 $468.75

WL85112M1 JAY JOHNSON Be ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORMS 775-323-0200 / FAX 775-323-4507 PRINTED IN U.S.A.

226
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 10/30/13 1pmYes NoRUSH

Client name: PardeeClient# 14155

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Expense code: 064 Type Description:

Requested by: PL/swAmount of check:

$ 468.75

Reason for check: Expedited Transcript- of Jon Lash testimony

Payable to: Jennifer Church, Court Reporter

I ING O.N I Y

Vendor # Batch #

G/L#Voucher #

Miscellaneous notation:

227

JA007964



Date Oct 31, 2013 Amount $ 518 • 50

Invoice Date Invoice Description

PL / 14155.3

of trial testimony

Amount PaidInvoice Number

PL/103113 Expedited transcript $518.5010-31-13

22202NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

McDONALD*CARANO'WILSON5
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
{702)873-4100

DATE

Oct 31, 2013

AMOUNT

$518.50
PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Jennifer Church

Court Reporter 2 SIGN, JRES REQUIRED IF OVER $2500.00

V
wrtw

© SECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK, ffl

22202Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Inv. DateCost Code Inv. No.G/L Acct. Matter I.D.

518.50
Amount

PL/103113 10-31-13 $518.50

JAY JOHNSON & ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORKS 775-323-0200 / FAX 775-323-4607WL8S112M1 PRINTED IN U.S.A.
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 10/31/13 2pmYes NoRUSH

Client name: PardeeClient# 14155

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Type Description:Expense code: 064

Requested by: PL/swAmount of check:

$ 518.50

Reason for check: Expedited transcript- of trial testimony

Payable to: Jennifer Church, Court Reporter

MR ACCOUNTING ONLY

Batch #Vendor #

G/L#Voucher #

Miscellaneous notation:

229

JA007966



...-T

Date Oct 31, 2013 Amount $1/750. 80

Amount PaidInvoice Description

PL / 14155.3

of trial testimony

Invoice Date invoice Number
PL/103113 Expedited transcript $1 , 750 . 8010-31-13

NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

McDONALD*CARANO-WILSON5
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
{702) 873-4100

DATE

Oct 31, 2013
AMOUNT

$1,750.80
PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Loree Murray

Court Reporter Dept. IV 2SIG

7
URES REQUIRED IF OVER $2500.00

£
"M

%

WlT«<

[±j SECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK, fil

22203Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Cost Code Inv. No. Inv. Date AmountMatter I.D.
1750.80

G/L Acct.
PL/103113 10-31-13 $1,750.8

JAY JOHNSON & ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORl.tS 775-323-0200 / FAX 77S-32M507 PRINTED IN U.S.A.WL05112M1

230
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 10/31/13 2pmYes NoRUSH

Client name: PardeeClient# 14155

Matter Name: 3 Matter Name: Wolfram

Expense code: 064 Type Description:

Amount of check: Requested by: PL/sw

$ 1,750.80

Reason for check: Expedited transcript- of trial testimony

Payable to: Loree Murray, Court Reporter Dept. IV

FOR ACCOUNTING ONI V

Vendor # Batch #

G/L#. Voucher #

Miscellaneous notation:

231

JA007968



ft m> Cm. r— Cm* V
MCDONALD CARANO WILSON LLP

Date Amount $
$97.45Nov 15, 2013

Invoice Description Amount PaidInvoice Date Invoice Number

S97.45PL / 14155.3 - Hearing
Transcript - 10/31/13

PL/11151311-15-13

22229NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

Mcdonald•carano-wilson^
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
(702) 873-4100

NINETY-SEVEN AND 45/100 Dollars

PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Clark County Treasurer

DATE AMOUNT

$
******A*

Nov 15, 2013 '7.45

ilGNATORES REQUIRED OVER $; mo
f/.

" •' "M

/*<

V
V/iTM

(S mSECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK.

22229Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Inv. No. Inv. DateCost Code AmountMatter I.D.G/L Acct.

PL/1] 1513 11-15-1397.45 212166 $97.45200050

PRINTED IN U.S.A.JAY JOHNSON & ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORKS 775-323-0200 ! FAX 775-323-4507WL85112M1

232

JA007969



CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 11/15/13 10:00a.m.Yes NoRUSH

Client# 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter Name: 3 Matter Name: Wolfram

Expense code: 064 Type Description: Hearing transcript

Amount of check: Requested by: PL/Sally

$ 97.45

Reason for check: HearingTranscript- 10/31/13

Payable to: Clark County Treasurer

Y
suae

Vendor # Batch #

Voucher # G/L#

Miscellaneous notation:

233
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Date December 4, 2013 Amount $550.00

- ^

Amount Paid

$550.00

Invoice Date Invoice Description

PL/14155 . 3-Preparation of
trial transcript

Invoice Number

PL/12041312-04-13

rHHHABEGgrHISlgOCDMEN1«HflSfASGGIiBBEDIBABKGROUNDIGNIWHlTHPAREBl0

22267NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

McDONAID*CARANO-WILSON5
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
<702) 873-4100

DATE

Dec 04, 2013

AMOUNT

$550.00
PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Jennifer Church

IRES REQUIRED IF OVER $2500.002 SiG!

2

1 				

SECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK, fij

22267Mcdonald carano wilson llp

AmountInv. DateCost Code

064
Inv. No.

PL/120413
Matter I.D.

550.00
G/L Acct.
20005.0 12/04/13 $550.00

PRINTED m U.SAJAY JOHNSON & ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORMS 775-323-C200 / FAX 775-323-4507WU5112M1

234
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed : 1 2/4/20 1 3 2pmRUSH Yes No

Client# 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter Name: 3 Matter Name: Wolfram

Expense code: 0 Type Description:

Amount of check: Requested by: PL/sw

$ 550.00

Reason for check: Preparation of trial transcript

Payable to: Jennifer Church

si \

Vendor # Batch #

Voucher # G/L#

Miscellaneous notation:

235

JA007972



Date Amount $ 550 _ 00
December 4, 2013

Invoice Description

PL/14155.3-Preparation of
trial transcript

Amount PaidInvoice NumberInvoice Date

PL/12041312-04-13 $550.00

fl3E^CBPHSratStDOSUMENTaasmiCOUOHEDIBftBKGRPUNDyPNSWHrrEg>ftPER;

22268NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

MCDONALD-CARANO-WILSON5
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

IAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
(702) 873-4100

DATE

Dec 04 , 2013

AMOUNT

$550.00
PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Loree Murray

2 SIGNATURES REQUIRED IF OVEJ 10.00

W,

^WfTH ^ 	

3} SECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK. 3

Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Inv. DateInv. No.Cost Code

064-

AmountMatter I.D.

550.00

G/L Acct.

20005.0 PL/120413 12/04/13 $550.00

JAY JOHNSON & ASSOCIATES BUSINGS FORKS 775-323-0200/ FAX 775-323-4507 PRINTED m U.SAWL85112M1
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CHECK REQUEST

Yes No Date/Time needed: 12/4/2013 2pmRUSH

Client# 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Expense code: 0 Type Description:

Amount of check: Requested by: PL/sw

$ 550.00

Reason for check: Preparation of trial transcript

Payable to: Loree Murray

W ACCOUNTING ONLY

Vendor # Batch #

Voucher # G/L#

Miscellaneous notation:

237

JA007974



Date Amount $
Jan 17,2014 $415.25e<

-«

Amount Paid

$415.25

Invoice Desciiption

PL / 14155.3 - Transcript of
trial testimony 12/12/1
12/13/13

Invoice Date Invoice Number »

PL/01171401-17-14
&

NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

22364

McDONALD-CARANO-WILSONi
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
(702) 873-4100

FOUR HUNDRED FIFTEEN AND 25/100 Dollars

PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Jennifer Church, Court Reporter

DATI AMOUNT

$
*******

Jan 17, £01 4 415.25

URED IF,OVER $2500.002 SlGI

VSwm4^

TTJ?
j

S SECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK. / 17

22364Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Inv. No. Inv. DateCost Code AmountG/L Acct. Matter I.D.

213587 PL/011714 01-17-14 $415.25415.25200050

JAY JOHNSON A ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORMS 775-323-0200 / FAX 775*234507 PANTED IN U.S.A.WL85112M1
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 1/10/14 2pmYes NoRUSH

Client # 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Type Description: TranscriptsExpense code: 064

Amount of check: Requested by: PL/sw

$ 415.25

Reason for check: Transcript- of trial testimony 12/12/13 & 12/13/13

Payable to: Jennifer Church, Court Reporter

Vendor # Batch #

G/L#Voucher #

Miscellaneous notation:

239
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. Date Amount $
Jan 17,2014

Invoice Description

$215.05.

Amount PaidInvoice Date Invoice Number

PL / 14155.3 - Transcript of
trial testimony 12/09/13

$215.05PL/01171401-17-14

22365NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

McDONAID-CARANO-WILSON5
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
(702) 873-4100

TWO HUNDRED FIFTEEN AND 05/100 Dollars

PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Loree Murray, Court Reporter, District Court IV
812 Baymist Avenue
Henderson, NV 89502

DATE AMOUNT

Jan^7, 2014 $
*******

215.05

!SREQU0ib-iF"OVER $2500.002 S!G|

BED IK
%

HP
*^5 WfTH ^

Z
I t

22365Mcdonald carano wilson llp

Inv. DateInv. No. AmountCost CodeMatter I.D.

215.05

G/L Acct.

PL/011714 01-17-14213588 $215.05200050

JAY JOHNSON & ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORMS 77&32&0200 / FAX 77S-323-4S07 PRINTED INU.SAWLBS112M1
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 1/10/13 2pmYes NoRUSH

Client name: PardeeClient# 14155

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Type Description: TranscriptExpense code: 064

Requested by: PL/swAmount of check:

$ 215.05

Reason for check: Transcript- of trial testimony 12/9/13

Payable to: Loree Murray, Court Reporter Dept. IV

Batch #Vendor #

G/L#Voucher #

Miscellaneous notation:

241
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Date Amount $
Jan 17, 2014 $93.90

**2

Amount Paidinvoice Description

PL / 14155.3 - Hearing
transcript - 1/3/14

Invoice Date Invoice Number

PL/01171401-17-14 $93.90

• • THE FACE'OF THIS DOCUMENT HAS A COLORED BACKGROUND ON WHITE PAPER -

$ 22366NEVADA STATE BANK
1 West Liberty Street
Reno, Nevada 89501

McDONALD-CARANO-WILSONi
94-77/12242300 W. SAHARA AVENUE, #1000

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89102
(702) 873-4100

NINETY-THREE AND 90/100 Dollars

DATE AMOUNT

^ $*****"*£390

fES REQUIRED IF-OVER $2500.00

PAY TO THE ORDER OF

Clark County Treasurer Jan 17,2014

2 IA*

cy WL

& m//

WITW /

T] SECURITY FEATURES INCLUDED. DETAILS ON BACK.

22366Mcdonald carano wilson llp

inv. DateInv. No. AmountCost CodeG/L Acct.

200050

Matter I.D.

93.90 PL/011714213589 01-17-14" $93.90

JAY JOHNSON ft ASSOCIATES BUSINESS FORMS 775-323-0200 / FAX 775-323-4507 PRINTED m U.SAWU5112M1
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 1/10/14 2:00p.m.Yes NoRUSH

Client# 14155 Client name: Pardee

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Type Description: Hearing transcriptExpense code: 064

Requested by: PL/SallyAmount of check:

$ 93.90

Reason for check: HearingTranscript- 1/3/14

Payable to: Clark County Treasurer

Kir:

raa-

Vendor # Batch #

Voucher # G/L#

Miscellaneous notation:

243
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CHECK REQUEST

Date/Time needed: 8/13/2014 9:00amNoRUSH

Client Name: PardeeClient# 14155

Matter Name: WolframMatter Name: 3

Type Description: Transcript of 7/14/14

hearing	 	

Expense code: 0

Requested by: PL/swAmount of check:

$ 30.00

Reason for check: Transcript of 7/17/14 hearing

Payable to: Loree Murray,

rgfri

Vendor # Batch #

Voucher # G/L#

Miscellaneous notation:

r

b '

&
£

W;'

SIM
mm

'U
m

U"

' fe
P

T'il
W'

fei;

1 :.v.

0
m
fSf':

Si
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Exhibit 6
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p.O Box 614
M^iCii ..i vawT- .

Las Vegas, NV 89125 Invoice
Date 5/17/2011

mrnmmm8mmmmmmrn:ms
McDonald Carano WilsonMcDonald Carano Wilson

2300 W. Sarah Ave. #1000

Las Vegas, NV 89102

2300 W. Sarah Ave. #1000

Las Vegas, NV 89102

USA

11191Invoice #

Client Matter: Pardee/Wolfran

Ordered By: Melissa M.

Project Consultant: Ron

Ship Date

Due Date

Terms:

Tracking #:

5/17/2011

6/16/2011

Net 30

2151b

. - .. Wm&M
Blowbacks j Printing of B&W Documents from disc or file without document breaks, (per page) ! 249 0.10 24.90T

PDF Conver... • (EDD) Processing client files from original format to PDF, TIFF, etc... 0.1 800.00 80.00

I Client ft/fatter: Pardee/Wolfran
!

RECEIVED

MOW LLP - Accounting Dept.
!

i

;
;

POSTED
VOUCHERS,

PAY DATE U-ft- U

i
	 —

Thank you for business, it is greatly appreciated.

We recognize that clients may bill these expenses to their customers. In any case, our client remains

responsible to pay within the terms regardless of their receivabies. Thank You. Tax ID# 80-0332294

Subtotal

Sales Tax (8.1%)

Total

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

$104.90

$2.02

$106.92

$0.00

$106.92

INTEL eOiscovery Solutions, LLC

accounting@intel-ediscovery.com

www.intel-ediscovery.com

702-308-0296

702-974-3305

246
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Invoice720 E. Charleston Blvd

Suite 203
Las Vegas, NV 89104

Phone: 702.384.3840

Fax: 702.384.1853

M B

'1 Invoice #Date

2/1/2013 13FEB-82675
l BDiscavery Sl Document Solutions

Bill To:

McDonald Carano & Wilson

2300 West Sahara Avenue

Suite 1 000

Las Vegas, NV 89102

Phone 702-873-4100 Fax 702-873-9966

Ship Date Ordered By QUiVX Job# Client Matter#
P.O. No. Terms Rep

Pardee/WoiframMelissa 841902/5/2013Net 30 JJH

item Amount
Qty Description

Video Technicia... 525.00
5.25 Graphic Design - Billed per hour

Exhibit Board - 8... 562.50T
5 B/W Exhibit Board - 40" x 60"

Sales Tax
45.56

CEIVEO

t 9 2013

[CW LLP - Accounting iter

D.

WfPffE

Received by:
Total $1,133.06

Printed Name:Signature:

Invoices past due will incur a 1.5% late fee each month.

We recognize that some ofour customers may be billing these expenses to their clients. However, QUiVX's customers remain ultimately

responsible for payment within otir terms regardless oftheir receivables.

Please make checks payable to: QUiVX

Tax Information: CHOICE LEGAL DOCUMENT SOLUTIONS, INC. Tax ID# 56-2317932
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