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INVOICE FOR DANIEL S. SIMON
EDGEWORTH v. LANGE, ET AL.

Date Description Time
5/27/16 Email Chain with Client Re: Representation 25
5/28/16 Email Chain with Client Re: Client Meeting 40
5/31/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From Client 40
6/1/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From Client 40
6/2/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From Client 40
6/2/16 Email Chain with Client | 40
6/3/16 Email Chain with Client with Attachment .50
6/3/16 Email Chain From Client with Website Attachment 40
6/3/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Viking and to Client 40
6/5/16 Email Chain with Client 40
6/10/16 Email Chain with Client 75
6/13/16 Draft and Send Email to Client 25
6/14/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
6/22/16 Email Chain with Client 40
7/11/16 Email Chain with AD, SC, SR; Re: Representation of Lange 25
7/12/16 - Email Chain with Client 1.25
7/13/16
7/14/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
7/14/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Viking, Forward to Client | 1.75

with Attachments; Receive, Review and Analyze Response from

Client; Review File; Email Chain with Client
7/18/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 75
7/19/16 Email Chain with Client .50
7/19/16 Draft and Send Email to AD; Re: SAO Amend Complaint 25
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7/20/16 Email Chain with SH, AD with Attachments; Re: Stipulation to .50
Amend and Extension
8/4/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 40
8/4/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
8/4/16 - Receive, Review and Analyze Emails from M. Giberti .50
8/5/16
8/5/16 - Email Chain with Client 75
8/8/16
8/9/16 Call with Client 25
8/11/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Dalacas with Report; 40
Forward to Client
8/11/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Emails from Giberti with Attachment | .75
8/11/16 Email Chain with A. Dalacas, Scott Holcomb; Re: Rimkus Report 75
with Attachment
8/11/16 Email Chain with SH, AD, GB; Re: Stipulations 25
8/11/16 Email Chain with AD, SH; Re: Home Inspection 1.25
8/15/16 Email Chain with Client 25
8/15/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 40
(9:21am)
8/16/16 Email Chain with SH, AD, GB; Re: Chain of Custody 25
8/16/16 Draft and Send Email to AD; Re: Lange Coverage 40
8/16/16 Email Chain with Client 40
8/19/16 Email Chain with AD; Re: Inspection 25
8/19/16 Email Chain with Client 40
8/22/16 - Email Chain with Client 40
8/24/16
8/22/16 Call with Client 15
8/25/16 Call with Client 15
9/1/16 Email Chain with AD, SH; Re: Transfer of Sprinkler Heads and 75

Chain of Custody
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9/7/16 Email Chain with Client with Attachment 75
9/8/16 Email Chain with Client 75
9/12/16 Call with Client 15
9/12/16 Email Chain from Ivey with Attachments; Email Chain with Client .50
9/12/16 Email Chain with RP, KH, GR with Attachments; Re: Retention 1.25
9/14/16 Email Chain with RP, KH; Re: Retention and Telephone Call with 1.35
Bill Ivey Re: Retention
9/15/16 Email Chain with RP; Re: List of Cases .50
9/16/16 Email Chain with RP; Re: Signed Retainer Agreement and Check .50
9/19/16 Email Chain with RP, KH; Re: Shipping of Sprinklers from Rimkus. | .75
Telephone Call with Hastings.
9/22/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From AD with Attachment from 40
Kreason
9/28/16 Email Chain with Client .50
9/28/16 Email Chain with Client Re: Installation Guide Info., with 75
Attachments
9/28/16 Call with Client 40
9/29/16 Draft Email to JW .10
9/29/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Dalacas 25
9/30/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Emails with Website Info.; Recetve, .85
Review and Analyze Email from B. Lange and Client; Draft Email to
Jw
10/3/16 Email Chain with Client 50
10/4/16 Call with Client 25
10/4/16 Call with Client .15
10/4/16 Email Chain with Client .50
10/6/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment .50
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10/6/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Dalacas; Forward Email to | .75
Client; Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client; Receive,
Review and Analyze Email from B. Lange; S. Simmons Emails
included
10/6/16 Call with Client 40
10/7/16 Call with Client 15
10/7/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client .50
10/7/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Giberti 25
10/7/16 Draft Email to Dalacas; Forward Email to Client 75
10/11/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
10/11/16 Draft Email to Dalacas with Attachments 25
10/12/16 Email Chain with KB, KH, and File Manager; Re: Travel for .50
Inspection
10/12/16 Call with Client 15
10/12/16 Call with Client .10
10/12/16 Call with Client 25
10/13/16 Call with Client 40
10/13/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
10/13/16 Email Chain with S. Holcomb and Dalacas and Client 1.25
10/13/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Emails from Client with Email Chain | .50
from Viking/Lange
10/13/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
10/14/16 Email Chain with Client .50
10/14/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti with 1.25
Attachments; Forward Emails '
10/14/16 Email Chain with Client 75
10/15/16 Call with Client 25
10/15/16 Draft Email to Client with Attachments 25
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10/15/16 Draft and Send Email to KH; Re: Sprinkler Heads to Take Back to 15
San Diego
10/15/16 Prepare, Revise and Finalize Affidavit for DSS, Re: Chain of .50
Custody
10/16/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 40
10/17/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti 40
10/17/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 40
10/17/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Dalascas; Email Chain .90
with Client; Email from S. Holcomb; Email to Client
10/17/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti 15
10/17/16 Email Chain with Client Re: Website 40
10/17/16 Receive, Review, and Analyze Letter from Dalacas 25
10/18/16 Email Chain with Client Re: Dalacas Ladder .50
10/18/16 Call with Client 15
10/ 19/16 Call with Client 10
10/19/16 Call with Client .10
10/20/16 Email Chain with KH; Re: Receipt of Sprinkler Heads 25
10/21/16 Call with Client 25
10/21/16 Email Chain with Client and Dalacas with Attachments 1.25
10/22/16 - Email Chain with Dalacas and Client 1.25
10/24/16
10/24/16 Call with Client 15
10/24/16 Email Chain with Dalacas/Holcomb, A. Bullock and Client with 75
Attachments
10/25/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client .50
10/26/16 Send Email Chain with Client; Receive, Review and Analyze Email | .75
from Dalacas with Attachments
11/4/16 Email Chain with Client; Email Chain with Dalacas .80
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11/9/16 Email Chain with Client with Attachment 50
11/9/16 Draft and Send Email to KH with ECC Disclosures 35
11/10/16 Email Chain with KH; Re: Visual Inspection of Sprinklers 25
11/10/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti 25
11/17/16 Email Chain with Client and Dalacas 75
11/18/16 Email Chain with Dalacas 40
11/18/16 Email Chain with Client with Attachment 1.0
11/21/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
11/21/16 Call with Client 25
11/22/16 Draft and Send Email to Dalacas and Client 40
11/29/16 Email Chain with M. Giberti and Client 75
11/29/16 Draft and Send Email to Dalacas .50
11/29/16 Email Chain with Client 40
11/30/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Dalacas; Draft and Email .50
Chain with Client
11/30/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti and Client .50
12/2/16 Email Chain with Client with Attachments 75
12/2/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Ivey and Forward to Client | .25
12/2/16 Call with Client .50
12/3/16 Call with Client 25
12/5/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti 35
12/5/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
12/5/16 Draft and Send Email to Duggan with Attachments 50
12/5/16 T/C with Duggan 40
12/5/16 Draft and Send Email to Dalacas 75
12/5/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Dalacas 40
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12/5/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 40
Re: Updated Damages Estimate
12/6/16 Email Chain with Client with Attachments .50
12/6/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Dalacas; Forward to 40
Client; Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti
12/7/16 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti 25
12/13/16 Email Chain with JY, KH; Re: Retainer with Attachment 75
12/22/16 Email Chain with AD; Re: Mediation 25
1/3/17 Email Chain with KH; Re: Visual Inspection in San Diego 25
1/3/17 Email Chain with Blumberg 35
1/4/17 Email Chain with JP and AD 75
1/4/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From JP; Re: Mediation 15
1/4/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from JW to Pancoast; Receive, | .50
Review and Analyze Email from JP; Receive, Review and Analyze
Email from Dalacas
1/4/17 Draft email to JP and Receive and Review Email from JP 40
1/4/17 Draft and Send Email to Client .50
1/4/17 Email Chain with Client 5
1/6/17 Received, reviewed and responded to email from AF Lange K inserts | .15
added to MSJ
1/10/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachment 25
1/10/17 Email Chain with KH; Re: Metallurgist .50
1/11/17 Call with Client 15
1/11/17 Call with Client 25
1/11/17 Draft and send email to AF re making small changes to MSJ .15
1/11/17 Email Chain with Client with attachment 25
1/17/17 Draft and Send Email to JP and Response 25
1/17/17 Draft and Send Email to GZ 15
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1/17/17 Draft and send email to AF re preparing written discovery and depo 15
notices

1/19/17 Draft and Send Email to KH with Attachment MSJ; Re: Request for | .20
Call

1/19/17 Email chain with AF re Viking’s Opposition to MSJ .50

1/20/17 Email chain with AF re Stackiewcz case and Discussion with AF .50

1/23/17 Received, reviewed and responded to email from AF re business 15
court judge

1/23/17 Received, reviewed and responded to email from AF re draft notices | .15
and SDT for review

1/24/17 Call with Client 15

1/24/17 Email chain with AF re business court jurisdiction and discussion 35
with AF

1/24/17 Email chain with AF re breach of contract COAs and discussion with | .50
AF

1/24/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti 25

1/24/17 Review COR Depositions and Forward to Client via Email .50

1/24/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from G. Zamiski; Email Chain .50
with Client

1/24/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From GZ; Re: Scope of Work 15

1/25/17 Draft and Send Email to GZ; Re: Starting Work and Retainer 25

1/25/17 Draft and Send Email to AF and JW; Objection to Subpoena; Review | .50
of COR’s, Analyze Objections

1/25/17 Email Chain with AD, AF; Re: Depositions 25

1/26/17 Draft and send email to AF re Lange 30(b)(6) depo and discussion 35
with AF

1/27/17 Email Chain with Client with Attachments .50

1/27/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachment 25

1/27/17 Call with Client 25
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1/27/17 Draft and send email to AF re preparing Viking 30(b)(6) depo notice | .15

1/28/17 Draft and Send Email to KH; Re: Ziminsky, Depositions, Requestto | .25
Discuss Case

1/28/17 Draft and Send Email to KH with Viking 16.1 Disclosures 25

1/30/17 Call with AMF 15

1/30/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti 25

1/31/17 Email Chain with Client 25

2/1/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25

2/3117 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 25

2/3/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From KH; Re: Viking Expert 15
Opinions and Request for a TC

2/3/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client to S. Dugan 25

2/6/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from S. Dugan and Response 25

2/6/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client Re: Trailer Temps | .50
and Website Attachment

2/6/17 Draft and send email to AF re email client sent re trailer temperatures | .50
and link

2/6/17 Call with Client 40

2/6/17 Email chain with AF re Motion to Amend Complain 15

2/6/17 Draft and Send Email to JP 25

2/7/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From JP and Response 25

2/7/17 Draft and send email to AF re Viking 30(b)(6) notice 15

2/9/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Letter from Dalacas re Lange 30(b)(6) | .25
depositions

2/9/17 Call with Client 15

2/10/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Letter from Dalacas re Lange 30(b)(6) | .15
depositions and Brandon Lange Deposition

2/10/17 Email chain with AF re response to Pancoast re Dustin Hamer 15
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2/10/17 Draft and send email to AF re correspondence from Sia about 15
moving depos
2/10/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From JP and Response 25
2/10/17 Email Chain with JP and AD .95
2/12/17 Email chain with AF re re-noticing depos of Hamer and Diorio 25
2/13/17 Email chain with AF re court’s availability for MSJ hearing 15
2/13/17 Call with Client 15
2/13/17 Email Chain with AD, JP and JR 35
2/15/17 Call with AMF 40
2/15/17 Draft and Send Email to AD and JP 25
2/15/17 Email Chain with AD, JP and AF; Re: Depositions 25
2/15/17 Draft and send email to AF re document needing to be supplemented | .25
(attachment)
2/15/17 Draft and send email to AF re noticing depos of Lange employees 15
2/15/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti with Attached | .50
Letter
2/17/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From JP; Re: Depositions 25
2/21/17 Draft and send email to AF to print Exhibits 1-8 15
2/21/17 Email chain with AF re exhibits for Dustin Hamer depo 15
2/22/17 Email Chain with Client; T/C with Dalacas .50
2/25/17 Email Chain with Client 25
2/26/17 Received, reviewed and responded to email from AF 15
re draft reply to motion to amend
2/27/17 Email chain with AF re COR Depos for Giberti and American 15
Grating
2/27/17 Draft and Send Email to AD; Re: Kreason .15
2/28/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From AD; Re: Kreason .15
2/28/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From AD; Re: Kreason 15
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2/28/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 75
2/28/17 Call with Client 25
2/28/17 Call with Client 10
2/28/17 Call with AMF 15
2/28/17 Call with AMF .10
2/28/17 Call with AMF 15
2/28/17 Draft and Send Email to JP 25
3/1/17 Received, reviewed and responded to email from AF 15
re Pancoast coming to office to review documents
3/1/17 Call with AMF 15
3/1/17 Call with Client 15
3/1/17 Call with Client 10
3/1/17 Received, reviewed and responded to email from AF 15
re Edgeworth trial order
3/2/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachment 25
3/7/17 Email Chain with AF, AD and JP; Re: Orders 15
3/7/17 Email Chain with AD; Re: Brandon Lange Deposition 35
3/7/17 Email Chain with AF, AD, JW; Re: Calculation of Damages .35
3/8/17 Email Chain with AD, JW, AF, JP; Re: Depositions 30
3/8/17 Email Chain with JP, AF, AD; Re: Motions To Amend 15
3/9/17 -3/14/17 | Email Chain with AD, JW, AF, JP; Re: Deposition .95
3/9/17 Call with Client 15
3/10/17 Call with Client 15
3/10/17 Email chain with AF re letter from Sia on withdrawing MSJ and her | .25
signature on proposed orders
3/13/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Dalacas; Forward Email to | .65

Client with Attachment
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3/13/17 Text Message with AMF .10
3/13/17 Call with AMF .10
3/13/17 Call with AMF 15
3/13/17 Call with Client 15
3/14/17 Call with Client 65
3/14/17 Email Chain with Client with Attachments .50
3/15117 Call with AMF 10
3/15/17 Call with AMF 15
3/15/17 Call with AMF 25
3/16/17 Email Chain with Client 40
3/16/17 Email Chain with AD, AF, JP; Re: Bate Stamps 15
3/17/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From AD; Re: OOJ 25
3/17/17 Email Chain with AD, AF; Re: OJ .15
3/17/17 Email chain with AF re extension for Lange’s response to OOJ 25
3/20/17 Email Chain with AD, AF; Re: Bate Stamp 25
3/20/17 | Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachment 25
3/21/17 Email chain with AF re documents attached to supplement and 15
review of the Kinsale file
3/21/17 Email Chain with AF. AD, JP; Re: Bate Stamps 25
3/24/17 Email Chain with AF, AD, JW; Re: Service .50
3/24/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from JP; Forward Email to .65
Client
3/27/17 Email Chain with JF, AD, LV, LF; Re: Lawyer Contact 25
3/28/17 Review Lange 5™ Supp and Email Chain with Client .50
3/29/17 Email Chain with Client 25
3/29/17 Call with AMF 15
3/29/17 Call with AMF 15
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3/29/17 Call with AMF 10
3/29/17 Email Chain with Client 25
3/31/17 Call with AMF .15
3/31/17 Email Chain with JP, AF, JR, TG, AD; Re: Deposition of Viking 15
4/3/17 Email Chain with AD, JP, JW, JR; Re: Depositions .50
4/3/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 25
4/4/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15
4/5/17 Email chain with AF re exhibits he needs for Kreason and Brandon 15
Lange depo
4/6/17 Received, reviewed and responded to email from AF .50
re: 3 day notice of intent to default Lange and discussion with AF
4/6/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Questions Email from Client .50
4/6/17 Email Chain with Client 25
4/6/17 Draft and Send Email to KH with Attachments; Re: Visual 25
Inspection
4/6/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 25
4/6/17 Email Chain with Client 25
4/6/17 - 4/20/17 | Email Chain with AD, JP; Re: Inspection of Sprinklers .65
4/6/17 Email Chain with AD, AF; Re: Testing of Heads 15
4/7/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment .50
4/7/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment; 50
Receive, Review and Analyze Email from JW
4/7/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
4/10/17 Email Chain JP, AD, JR; Re: PMK of Viking .50
4/13/17 Draft and send email to AF re re-notice depo of Viking 30(b)(6) 20
4/18/17 Draft and send email to AF re dropping off cc to Judge of Motionto | .15
compel Kreason
4/18/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachment 75
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4/18/17 T/C with Attorney Hulet and Draft and Send Email to Client .50
4/18/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
4/18/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 40
4/18/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 40
4/18/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
4/18/17 Email Chain with AD, AF, Re: Kreason Deposition 25
4/19/17 Call with Client .50
4/19/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 65
4/19/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachments .50
4/20/17 Email Chain with Client .50
4/20/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachments .50
4/20/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti 15
4/20/17 Email Chain with AD, AF; Re: Testing of Heads 25
4/21/17 Email Chain with AD, JP, AF; Re: Written Protocol .50
4/23/17 Draft and send email to AF re research on the contract prior to the .15
MSJ hearing
4/24/17 Draft and send email to AF re printing 3 party complaint Lange 15
filed against Viking
4/24/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachment 25
4/24/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15
4/24/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15
4/24/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachments 25
4/24117 Draft and Send Email to Client 15
4/25/17 Draft and Send Email to Bullock with Attachment and Draft and .50
Send Email to Client
4/25/17 Call with Client 40
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4/25/17 Draft and send email to AF re emailing 3™ party complaint Lange 15
filed against Viking

4/25/17 Email Chain with Client and Office .50

4/26/17 Email Chain with Client 75

4/26/17 Email Chain with Client .40

4/26/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25

4/26/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client and Draft and Send | .35
Email to AF

4/27/17 Draft and send email to AF re draft notice of depo and SDT for Dan | .15
Cadden

4/27/17 Draft and send email to AF re what motions we need to file in 20
Edgeworth and begin drafting

4/27/17 Email chain with AF and JW re written discovery for Viking 15

4/27/17 Draft and send email to AF re pulling invoices from Viking to Lange | .15
showing heads purchased

4/27/17 Draft and send email to AF re forward from client 40

4/28/17 Draft and Send Email to GZ; Re: Protocol with Attachments .15

4/28/17 Email chain with AF re American Grating ECC and EFT Supp 15

4/28/17 Review and analyze Viking’s responses to written discovery 1.25

5/1/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachment .50

5/1/17 Email Chain with Client 25

5/1/17 Draft and send email to AF re Viking’s 2™ Supp .50

51217 Email chain with AF requesting Viking 30(b)(6) notice, 3™ party 20
complaint and amended complaint emailed and printed

512117 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15

512117 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15

5/2/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25

512717 Email Chain with KH with Attachment - Care & Handling 25
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5/2/17 Email Chain with KH with Attachments; Re: Testing Protocol .50
5/2/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client .50
5/2/17 Email Chain with AD, JP; Re: PMK Deposition 25
512/17 T/C with Expert Hastings 25
512117 Call with Client 1.15
512117 Call with Client 15
5/3/17 Call with Client .10
5/3/17 Call with Client 15
5/3/17 Email chain with attachments to AF forwarded from Hastings and 25
Viking supply invoices
5/13/17 Draft and Send Email to Client 15
5/3/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment .50
5/4/17 Call with Client 75
5/4/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti with .50
Attachments
5/4/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
5/4/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 25
5/4/17 Draft and Send Email to Kinsale 40
5/4/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Kinsale and Forward to 15
Client
5/4/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 25
5/4/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 40
5/4/17 Email Chain with AD, AC, LF; Re: Giberti’s 3" Party Complaint 25
5/5/17 Email Chain with AD, AF; Re: Names of Employees 25
5/5/17 Email chain with AF and Janelle re June 7" hearing 15
5/5/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
5/5/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachments 40
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5/5/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachments; | .50
Email to AF
5/5/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Kinsale 40
5/5/17 Draft and Send Email to M. Giberti with Attachment 40
5/5/17 Email Chain with JP, AD, AF 25
5/5/17 Draft and send email to AF re Bullock re 3™ party complaint 20
5/5/17 Draft and send email to AF with attachments that were forwarded 25
from client re gate entries
5/8/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
5/8/17 Email Chain with Client .50
5/8/17 Draft and Send Email to JO with Attachment; Re: Lost Basis 25
Summary and Attachments
5/8/17 Email Chain with AD, AF, JP; Re: Order Denying MSJ 35
5/8/17 Email Chain with AD, JP, JW; Re: SAO to Continue Hearing on 15
Plaintiff’s Motion for Order to Show Cause
5/8/17 Email Chain with Client 75
5/9/17 Draft and send email to AF re reference to Edgeworth house 15
5/10/17 Email Chain with JP, AF, AD, JR; Re: Site Inspection .50
5/11/17 Email chain with AF re Mason depo scheduling 15
5/11/17 Email chain with AF re weather expert 15
5/11/17 T/C with Expert Hastings 25
S5/11/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client .50
5/11/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachments; | 1.25
Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti
5/11/17 Draft and Send Email to Client Re: Attorney Referral 25
5/11/17 Draft and Send Email to Client .50
5/11/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachment 20
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5/11/17 Email Chain with GZ; Re: Testing Dates and Travel to Las Vegas 50
5/12/17 Email Chain with JP, AD, AF; Re: Protective Order 15
5/12/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
5/12/17 Draft and Send Email to Client A5
5/12/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachment 25
5/12/17 Email Chain with Client 20
5/12/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti with 40
Attachment
5/12/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti with 40
Attachment
5/12/17 Draft and Send Email to M. Giberti 25
5/15/17 Email Chain JP; Re: PMK Conflict A5
5/15/17 Email chain with AF re Opp to Lange’s motion to compel sprinkler 15
heads
5/16/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
5/16/17 Draft and Send Email to Client 15
5/16/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti 50
5/17/17 Email Chain with JP, AD, AF, JR, TJ; Re: Expert Availability and 25
Extensions for Briefing
5/18/17 Email Chain with AD, JP, AF; Re: Site Inspection 25
5/18/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachments 25
5/18/17 Email Chain with KH; Re: Testing in Las Vegas 35
5/18/17 Email Chain with Client 40
5/18/17 Email Chain with M. Giberti 65
5/18/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachments 15
5/18/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachments 15
5/18/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15
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5/19/17 Email Chain with M. Giberti 25
5/19/17 Email Chain with AD, JP; Re: Testing 25
5/22/17 Email Chain with AD, AF, JP; Re: DCRR 25
5/22/17 Draft and send email to AF re returning Amanda Kern call from City | .15
of Henderson

5/22/17 Email chain with AF re changes to DCRR 15
5/23/17 Email Chain with AF, AD, JP; Re: DCRR 25
5/124/17 Draft and send email to AF re professors for weather expert 15
5/24/17 Email Chain with AF, KH with Link; Re: Rimkus Documents 15
5/23/17 Email Chain with Client 25
5/24/17

5125117 Email Chain with Client 40
5/25/17 Email Chain with AD, AF; Re: 2.34 25
5/26/17 Email chain with AF re Sia’s email to withdraw MSJ 15
5/26/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachments 15
5/28/17 Email Chain with JP, AF, AD; Re: Extension for Discovery 25

Responses

5/30/17 Email Chain with AF, AD, JP; Re: Testing 15
5/30/17 Email Chain with JP, AF, AD; Re: Stipulated Protective Order 15
5/30/17 Email Chain with AF, JP, AD; Re: Inspection 25
5/30/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Link 40
5/30/17 Email chain with AF re start time of 6/22/17 testing 25
5/30/17 Email chain with AF re weather expert Mike Schwob 15
5/30/17 Draft and send email to AF re preparation of expert designation 15
5/30/17 Email chain with AF re Stipulated Protective Order 25
5/31/17 Email chain with AF re draft of Reply to limited Opp to Motion to 15

Compel Kreason
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5/31/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from M. Giberti 25
5/31/17 Email Chain with JP, AF; Re: Deposition of Supply Net 25
5/31/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 25
5/31/17 Email Chain with JP, AF, AD; Re: State Inflamation Deposition 25
6/1/17 Email Chain with AD, AF, JP; Re: Plaintiff’s Motion to Compel 15
6/1/17 Email Chain with AD, AF, JP; Re: Inspection 25
6/1/17 Email Chain with JP, AD, AF; Re: Stipulated Protective Order .15
6/1/17 Email Chain with AF, JP; Re: Inspection of Wharehouse 15
6/1/17 Email Chain with AD, AF; Re: Attendance for Inspection 15
6/1/17 Draft and send email to AF re book (Real Estate Damages) to be 15

ordered
6/1/17 Draft and Send Email to Client; Receive, Review and Analyze Email | .35

from AF; Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client (7:15

am); Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client (8:19 am);

Receive, Review and Analyze Email from AF
6/6/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Link 50
6/2/17 Email Chain with JP, AD, M. Nunez; Re: Giberti Appearance 15
6/2/17 Email Chain with JP, AD, AF, MN; Re: Prior Pleadings 15
6/2/17 Call with AMF 15
6/2/17 Email chain with AF re producing prior pleadings to Nunez 15
6/5/17 Email Chain with AF, JP; Re: Supply Tech Wharehouse Inspection A5
6/5/17 Email Chain with AD, AF, JP; Re: Protective Order .50
6/5/17 Email Chain with JP, AF, AD; Re: Wharehouse Inspection 15
6/5/17 Email Chain with JP, AF, AD, MN; Re: Protective Order 25
6/5/17 Email Chain with JP, AD, AF, MN; Re: Johnson Deposition 25
6/5/17 Email chain with AF re Reply to Compel Lange 30(b)(6) 15
6/5/17 Email chain with AF and Pancoast re inspection email sent to 25

Pancoast and follow up
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6/6/17 Draft and send email with link to AF re UPS petition and notice of 40
30(b)(6)
6/6/17 Call with Client 40
6/6/17 Call with Client .10
6/6/17 Call with Client 25
6/6/17 Email Chain with AD, AF, JP;; Re: Cadden Deposition, Johnson .50
Deposition and COR Deposition
6/6/17 Email Chain with JP, AD, MN; Re; Protective Order 25
6/6/17 Draft and Send Email to Client 25
6/6/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15
6/6/17 Draft and Send Email to AF 25
6/6/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from AF 15
6/6/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client (7:25 pm); Receive, | .35
Review and Analyze Email from AF(9:25 pm)
6/7/17 Draft and send email to AF re Johnson depo exhibits and response 15
6/7/17 Email Chain with KH; Re: Expert Reports 15
6/7/17 Email Chain with AD, AF; Re: Lange Employees .15
6/7/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment; 25
Draft and Send Email to Client
6/7/17 Draft and Send Email to Client 25
6/7/17 Draft and Send Email to Client .15
6/7/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 25
6/8/17 Email Chain with Client 25
6/8/17 Call with Client 15
6/8/17 Call with Client 15
6/8/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 25
6/8/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15
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6/8/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15
6/8/17 Email Chain with AF 15
6/8/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15
6/8/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15
6/8/17 Email Chain with AD, JP, AF; Re: Testing Protocol AS
6/8/17 Email chain with AF re COR Depo of City of Henderson 15
6/9/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 35
6/9/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 25
6/9/17 Email Chain with KH with Attachments; Re: Testing Protocol 25
6/9/17 Email Chain with GZ: Re: Testing Protocol and Sprinkler Heads 25
6/9/17 Email chain with AF re name of Viking SupplyNet worker A5
6/10/17 Email Chain with GZ, AF; Re: Testing Protocol 25
6/10/17 Email Chain with GV, KH and File Manager; re: Picking Up Heads | .50
in Long Beach
6/10/17 Draft and Send Email to KH; Re: Picking Up Heads and Inspection 15
6/12/17 Email Chain with AD, JW, AF, JP; Re: Deposition of Diorio 75
6/12/17 Email Chain with JP, MN, AD, AF; Re: Protective Order .15
6/12/17 Email Chain with Client .50
6/12/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client; Receive, Review 15
and Analyze Email from AF to Client
6/12/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15
6/12/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client 15
6/12/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachments 15
6/12/17 Email Chain with JO; Re: Real Estate Damages 50
6/12/17 Call with Client 25
6/13/17 Call with Client 40
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6/13/17 Call with Client 40
6/13/17 Draft and Send Email to JO with Attachments; Re: Nonphysical 15
Defects
6/13/17 Email chain with AF and Hastings re documents 15
6/13/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachments A5
6/13/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 25
6/13/17 Email Chain with AF, KH with Link; Re: Depositions and Exhibits 15
6/14/17 Email Chain JP, AF, AD; Re: Protocol .50
6/14/17 Email Chain with KH; Re: Temperature Readers 25
6/15/17 Email Chain with KH, AF with Attachments; Re: Testing Protocol 25
6/15/17 Email Chain with AD, JP, AF; Re: Sixth Supp 25
6/15/17 Email Chain with AD, JP; Re: DCRR 6/7/17 15
6/15/17 Email Chain with JP, AD, MN, AF; Re: P1'o§ective Order .15
6/15/17 Call with Client 25
6/16/17 Call with Client 15
6/16/17 Call with Client 15
6/16/17 Email chain with AF re Zamiski’s signature page for written protocol | .15
for testing
6/16/17 Email Chain with NG, JP, AD, AF; Re: Giberti Extension .50
6/16/17 Email Chain with JP, MN, AD; Re: Design Documents .50
6/16/17 Draft and send email to AF re locating document for client 15
6/16/17 Email Chain with GZ with Design Document 15
6/16/17 Email chain with AF re Giberti’s Stip and Order to Extend Discovery | .15
6/16/17 Email Chain with Client; Review UL Docs 1.50
6/16/17 Draft and Send Email to Client with Attachments 15
6/16/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 25
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6/16/17 Email Chain with Client 15
6/16/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 25
6/17/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment 25
6/19/17 Email Chain with Client 15
6/19/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from JP; Forward to Client with | .50
Attachments
6/19/17 Draft and Send Email to KH with Attachments; Re: Design A5
Documents
6/19/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment .35
6/19/17 Email Chain with JP, MN, AD, AF; Re: Design Documents 50
6/19/17 Email chain with AF re demand for prior pleadings by Giberti 15
6/19/17 Call with Client 40
6/19/17 Call with Client 25
6/19/17 Call with Client 15
6/20/17 Call with Client .15
6/20/17 Call with AMF 15
6/20/17 Call with Client .50
6/20/17 Email Chain with JP, AF, AD, MN; re: Kreason Deposition, 75
Hearing, UPS Deposition and Diorio Deposition
6/20/17 Email to Dalacas; Re: Supps 15
6/20/17 Email chain with AF re phone call with Don Koch 15
6/20/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from AF to Client with 15
Attachment
6/20/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachments 35
6/22/17 Email Chain with AF, AP, TM; re: Supply Net Deposition 75
6/20/17 Email chain with AF and Janelle re hearing date for Kreason motion | .15
to compel
6/20/17 Email chain with AF re list of exhibits from depos with attachment 15
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6/21/17 Call with Client .10
6/21/17 Call with Client 25
6/22/17 Call with Client 10
6/22/17 Call with AMF .10
6/22/17 Call with Client 15
6/22/17 Call with Client 15
6/22/17 Call with AMF 15
6/23/17 Email chain with AF re downloading and sending screenshots of nest | .15
energy history
6/23/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachment; .65
Forward to AF; Discussion with AF
6/23/17 Call with AMF .10
6/23/17 Call with AMF 15
6/23/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from AF 25
6/26/17 Email chain with AF re documents for Kreason depo (specifically 20
Rimkus documents)
6/27/17 Email Chain with GZ; Re: Viking Deposition and Confidentiality 15
6/27/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Letter from Nunez re prior pleadings 15
6/28/17 Email chain with AF re vacating Kreason Motion to compel 20
6/28/17 Call with AMF 15
6/28/17 Email chain with AF re Kyle Mao depo (AF thoughts, exhibits 1.0
pulled)
6/30/17 Call with Client 40
6/30/17 Text Message with AMF .10
6/30/17 Text Message with AMF .10
6/30/17 Email Chain with JP, AF; Re: VKG 0036-0039 75
7/3/17 Email Chain with KH; Re: Expert Reports 25
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7/3/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client with Attachments 25
7/4/17 Email Chain with JP, AD, AF, MN; Re: Carnahan Deposition 15
7/5/17 Email Chain with GZ; Re: Expert Reports 25
7/6/17 Email Chain with JP, AF, AD, MN; Re: Sixth Supp .15
7/6/17 Email Chain with AD, AF; Re: Expert Testing Results 15
7/6/17 Email chain with AF re Lange expert raw data from testing 25
7/6/17 Email chain with AF re sending documents to Hastings 15
7/6/17 Email chain with AF re moving Carnahan depo 15
7/17/17 Call with AMF .10
77717 Call with AMF 25
7/10/17 Email chain with AF re documents Zamiski requested 15
7/10/17 Email chain with AF re documents Viking produced and what 20
experts need what
7/10/17 Received, reviewed and responded to email from AF 25
with important Viking emails from recent production
7/10/17 Email chain with AF re Johnson depo exhibits 20
7/10/17 Email chain with AF with attachments re ACORE report and invoice | .25
7/10/17 Email chain with AF re Opposition 15
7/10/17 Email chain with AF re Opp to Motion to extend discovery deadlines | .25
7/10/17 Email Chain with GZ; Re: Exhibits for Martorano Deposition 15
7/10/17 Email Chain with GZ; Re: Report and Return of Sprinklers 40
7/10/17 Email Chain with AF, GZ; Re: Shipment of Sprinklers and Chain of | .25
Custody
7/10/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Client and AF 25
7/10/17 Review Appraisal and Forward to Client 75
7/10/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email From JO with Appraisal and 25

Invoice
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7/10/17 Draft and Send Email to JO Requesting CV and Testimony History 15
7/10/17 Email Chain with JP, AF, AD, MN, TU; Re: JCCR 15
7/11/17 Email Chain with AF, AD, TU, JP; Re: 7/12/17 Hearing 40
7/11/17 Email Chain with AD, JP, MN, TU; Re: Discovery Motions 25
7/11/17 Email Chain with AD, AF; Re: Lange Motions 50
7/11/17 Draft and send email with attachments to AF re Olivas CV 15
7/11/17 Email Chain with JO; Re: CV and Testimony History 25
7/11/17 TC with Hastings. Email Chain with AF, KH; Re: Nest History .50
7/11/17 Email Chain with Client Re: Appraisal 25
7/11/17 Receive, Review and Analyze Email from Hastings with .50
Attachments; Forward to client; Email Chain with Client
7/12/17 Email Chain with JP, TU, AD, AF; Re: Discovery Deadlines 25
7/12/17 Email chain with AF re revised supplemental JCCR 25
7/12/17 Email Chain with NG, JP, AD, AF; Re: SAO to Extend Discovery 35
7/12/17 Email chain with AF and Zamiski re sprinklers being sent to Vollmer | .50
Grey
7/13/17 Email Chain with JP, MN, TU, AD, AF; Re: Supp, JCCR .25
7/13/17 Email Chain with MN, JP; Re: Mediation 25
7/13/17 Email chain with AF re Rimkus subpoe