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EIGHTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT
CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA
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LAS VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL, Case No.: A-16-747289-W
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Petitioner, Dept. No.: VIII

—
—

VS. PETITIONER LLAS VEGAS REVIEW-
JOURNAL’S MOTION FOR
CITY OF HENDERSON, ATTORNEY’S FEES AND COSTS

—_
[\S}
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ATTORNEYS AT LAW
701 EAST BRIDGER AVE., SUITE 520

Respondent. Hearing Date: March 19, 2020
Hearing Time: 9:00 a.m.

Petitioner the Las Vegas Review-Journal (the “Review-Journal”), by and through

LAS VEGAS, NV 89101
(702)728-5300 (T) / (702)425-8220 (F)

[S—
(o)

WWW.NVLITIGATION.COM
[a—
(V)]

its counsel of record, hereby moves this Court pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2), for

[S—
-

L
T
O
|_
L
—
O
>

an award of reasonable attorney’s fees in the amount of $122,455.00, and costs in the amount

[S—
(o/¢]

of $1,336.55. This amount represents the fees and costs the Review-Journal incurred in this

[a—
O

public records proceeding.

o}
S

This Motion is based on the attached memorandum of points and authorities, any

\]
[—

attached exhibits, the attached Declaration of Attorney Margaret A. McLetchie, the papers

N
\S]

and pleading on file in this matter, and any oral argument the Court may permit at the hearing

\S]
(98]

of this Motion.

(\O]
N

DATED this 6 day of February, 2020.

\O]
(9]

/s/ Margaret A. McLetchie

MARGARET A. MCLETCHIE, Nevada Bar No. 10931
ALINA M. SHELL, Nevada Bar No. 11711
MCLETCHIE LAW

Attorneys for Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal
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MEMORANDUM OF POINTS AND AUTHORITIES

L. INTRODUCTION

The stated purpose of Nevada’s Public Records Act (Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.001 et
seq., the “NPRA”) is to foster democratic principles by providing members of the public with
access to governmental records. Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.001(1). The NPRA’s provisions are
designed to further that purpose—and this Court “must” interpret them in a manner that
favors access. Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.001(2) and (3). To ensure that governmental entities
provide access to records and comply with the NPRA, the Act explicitly provides that if a
governmental entity denies a request for records, a requester may petition the court for relief.
Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(1). And, the NPRA additionally provides that a prevailing
requester is entitled to fees and costs. Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2).

This case started because the City of Henderson (“Henderson’) denied the Review-
Journal’s request for public records regarding the extent of the business relationship between
Henderson and a political consultant that got many Henderson leaders elected. Instead of
allowing for transparency, Henderson threw up a roadblock by demanding exorbitant fees
just to conduct a privilege review to determine whether it would even disclose the requested
records. Because of Henderson’s denial of its public records request, the Review-Journal had
to file suit to get records and, in so doing, caused Henderson to voluntarily produce a large
swath of the requested records before the Court entered an order on the merits of the Review-
Journal’s Petition for Writ of Mandamus. Subsequently, following two appeals and a limited
order of remand from the Nevada Supreme Court, Henderson voluntarily produced additional
records it had withheld from the Review-Journal pursuant to its assertion that the records
were protected by the deliberate process privilege.

Under the plain language of the NPRA, the Review-Journal has “prevailed” in this
litigation because although it did not obtain a// the relief it requested, it succeeded in the most
important aspect of the litigation: obtaining public records. Thus, the Review-Journal is
entitled to an award of its costs and reasonable attorney’s fees, including the attorney’s fees

it incurred on appeal.

2 JA0732
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IL. RELEVANT FACTS AND PROCEDURAL HISTORY

A. Henderson Denies Access to Public Records.

On October 4, 2016, the Review-Journal submitted a public records request to the
City of Henderson pursuant to the NPRA seeking certain documents pertaining to the public
relations/communications firm Trosper Communications and its principal, Elizabeth
Trosper. (Exh. 1 to November 29, 2016, Petition (‘“Petition”), on file with this Court.) Trosper
Communications had a contract with Henderson, and Trosper assisted with the campaigns of
elected officials. (/d.)

Henderson did not provide records in response to the request. Instead, on October
11, 2016, Henderson indicated it required additional time to search for responsive documents
but that, due to the time required to review the documents for privilege and confidentiality,
it intended to charge the Review-Journal $5,787.89 for “extraordinary use” of Henderson
personnel, citing Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.055, Henderson Municipal Code 2.47.085 (the
“Code”), and Henderson’s public records policy (the “Policy”). (Exh. 2 to Petition (October
11,2016, email); see also Exh. 3 to Petition (Henderson Public Records Policy).) Henderson
demanded a deposit of $2,893.94 just to continue its search for documents. (Exh. 2.)

Henderson claimed it was entitled to fees for any time in excess of thirty (30)
minutes spent by City staff or any City contractor “to locate the requested public records, to
review the records in order to determine whether any requested records are exempt from
disclosure, to segregate exempt records, to supervise the requester’s inspection of original
documents, to copy records, to certify records as true copies, and to send records by special
or overnight methods such as express mail or overnight delivery.” (Exh. 3, p. 3, § V (Fees
provision).)

B. The Review-Journal Petitions the District Court.

After attempts to negotiate access to the requested records proved unfruitful, the
Review-Journal initiated legal action to the records on November 26, 2016. In its Petition,
the Review-Journal demanded access to the public records Henderson wrongfully withheld.

The Review-Journal also sought declaratory and injunctive relief to address the rights of the

3 JA0733
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parties and the applicability of Henderson’s Code and Policy. (See generally Petition.)

On December 20, 2016, Henderson produced a log of withheld records (Exh. 4 to
February 8, 2017, Amended Petition, on file with this Court), and subsequently produced
revised versions of the privilege log after the Review-Journal requested additional
information. (Exhs. 5 and 6 to Amended Petition.) The Review-Journal then amended its
Petition to address the privilege log, contending Henderson failed to provide sufficient bases
for withholding and redacting. (See generally Amended Petition.) In the Amended Petition,
the Review-Journal again asked the district court to order Henderson to “immediately make

available complete copies of all records requested.” (Amended Petition, p. 12:7-10.)

C. The Review-Journal Requested Copies of the Records After Henderson
Allowed for Inspection.

After the Review-Journal filed suit, counsel for the Review-Journal met and
conferred with Henderson City Attorneys and obtained an interim agreement to allow a
Review-Journal reporter to inspect the records while litigation was pending. (Exh. E to
Henderson’s (December 14, 2016, email from Review-Journal counsel summarizing meet
and confer discussion).) Counsel for the Review-Journal asked for electronic copies of the
records reviewed after the in-person inspection was conducted. (See Exh. 16 to Review-
Journal’s March 23, 2017, Reply in support of its Amended Petition.) Henderson declined
this request. (Id.)

D. Henderson Finally Provides the Requested Copies Records Only at the
Hearing on the Amended Petition, and Only After Being Directed to Do
So by the Court

The district court conducted a hearing on the Review-Journal’s Amended Petition
on March 30, 2017. (See minutes and transcript of March 30, 2017, hearing, on file with this
Court.) During the hearing, counsel for Henderson finally agreed to provide the Review-
Journal a USB drive with copies of the requested documents. (March 30, 2017, hearing
transcript, p. 8:8-10.) At the conclusion of the hearing, the district court directed Henderson
to provide the Review-Journal with a “USB drive with [the requested documents] on it.” (/d.,

p. 24:15-22.) Subsequently, on May 15, 2017, the district court entered an order denying the
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Amended Petition as moot even though the Court had ordered the most significant relief
sought—access to the records. (See May 15, 2017, Notice of Entry of Order, on file with this
Court.)

E. The Review-Journal Sought Attorney’s Fees.

Because it obtained access to the records as a result of the litigation it initiated, the
Review-Journal filed a motion on June 1, 2017, pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2)
seeking an award of $30,931.50 in attorney’s fees and $902.84 in costs. (See June 1, 2017,
Motion for Attorney’s Fees and Costs, on file with this Court.)

The district court conducted an initial hearing on that motion on August 3, 2017,
and heard argument. (See minutes and transcript of August 3, 2017, hearing, on file with this
Court.) Counsel for the Review-Journal stated the newspaper was willing to waive
approximately $350.00 in attorney’s fees for time expended by a law clerk, thereby reducing
the request for fees to approximately $30,581.50. (August 3, 2017, hearing transcript, pp.
21:9-22-10:7.) The district court did not rule on the Review-Journal’s motion at the August
3, 2017, hearing, instead instructing the parties to return a week later for its decision. (/d.,
pp. 24:14-25:10.)

At the subsequent August 10, 2017, hearing, the district court found that the
Review-Journal was a prevailing party because it had obtained the requested records. (See
transcript of August 10, 2017, hearing (on file with this Court), p. 5:21-25.) The district court
stated it had considered the Brunzell' factors and arguments Henderson had made regarding
a reduced award for the work performed by Review-Journal counsel and had determined the
Review-Journal was entitled all its costs, but only $9,010.00 of the $30,931.50 requested
attorney’s fees. (Id., pp. 6:23-7:2.)

F. Appellate Proceedings

The Review-Journal appealed the district court’s denial of the Amended Petition,
and each party appealed the district court’s award of attorney’s fees. (See Nevada Supreme

Court Case No. 73287 (“Petition Appeal”) and Case No. 75407 (“Fees Appeal”).)

' Brunzell v. Golden Gate National Bank, 85 Nev. 345, 349, 455 P.2d 31, 33 (1969).

5 JA0735
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In the Petition Appeal, on May 24, 2019, the Supreme Court issued an unpublished
disposition affirming in part and reversing in part the district court’s denial of the Review-
Journal’s Amended Petition. See Las Vegas Review-Journal v. City of Henderson, 441 P.3d
546,2019 WL 2252868 (Nev. 2019) (unpublished). Relevant here, the Supreme Court agreed
with the Review-Journal’s assertion that the district court had failed to consider whether
Henderson had proved by a preponderance of evidence that several documents it had
declined to disclose were properly withheld pursuant to the deliberative process privilege
and thus “that its interest in nondisclosure clearly outweighs the public’s interest in access,”
and the Supreme Court therefore reversed and remanded the matter to this Court to conduct
that inquiry. Henderson, 2019 WL 2252868 at *4 (quotation omitted).

In the Fees Appeal, the Supreme Court entered another unpublished decision
reversing the district court’s partial award of attorney’s fees to the Review-Journal on
October 17, 2019. See City of Henderson v. Las Vegas Review-Journal, 450 P.3d 387, 2019
WL 5290874 (Nev. 2019) (unpublished) (Henderson II). Central to that reversal was the
Supreme Court’s finding in the Petition Appeal that the district court had abused its discretion
in failing to conduct the appropriate analysis regarding the documents Henderson had
withheld pursuant to the deliberative process privilege. Henderson 11,2019 WL 5290874 at
*2. Because the Supreme Court had reversed the district court’s order on that ground, the
Supreme Court concluded the Review-Journal “cannot be a ‘prevailing party’ as to that issue
before the action has proceeded to a final judgment.” Id.; see also id. (“Because the sole
remaining issue that the LVRJ raised in its underlying action has not yet proceeded to a final

judgment, we conclude that the LVRIJ is not a prevailing party.”) (citations omitted).

G. Post-Appeal, Henderson Discloses Records Previously Withheld
Pursuant to the Deliberative Process Privilege.

On July 24, 2019, two months after the Supreme Court issued its opinion in the
Petition Appeal, Henderson provided the documents that were withheld pursuant to the
deliberative process privilege. (McLetchie Decl., § 5.) Thus, the Review-Journal has now

prevailed in obtaining the last documents at issue in this case.

6 JAO0736
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III.  ARGUMENT

A. Under the Plain Language of the NPRA, the Review-Journal
“Prevailed” in This Matter.

The NPRA provides that “all public books and public records of a governmental
entity, the contents of which are not otherwise declared by law to be confidential, must be
open at all times during office hours to inspection by any person.” Nev. Rev. Stat. §
239.010(1). The purpose animating this presumption of access to public records is to “foster
democratic principles by providing members of the public with prompt access to inspect,
copy, or receive a copy of public books and records to the extent permitted by law.” Nev.
Rev. Stat. § 239.001(1); see also DR Partners v. Bd. of Cnty. Comm rs of Clark Cnty., 116
Nev. 616, 622, 6 P.3d 465, 468 (2000) (“The purpose of the Act is to ensure the accountability
of the government to the public by facilitating public access to vital information about
governmental activities.”). Further, “[t]he provisions of [the NPRA] must be construed
liberally to carry out this important purpose.” Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.001(2).

Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011, if a governmental entity refuses to disclose
public records, the requester may “apply to the district court in the county in which the book
or record is located for an order” either permitting the requester to inspect or copy the records,
or requiring the governmental entity to provide a copy of the records to the requester. Nev.
Rev. Stat. § 239.011(1) (a) and (b). Further, “[i]f the requester prevails, the requester is
entitled to recover his or her costs and reasonable attorney’s fees in the proceeding from the
governmental entity whose officer has custody of the book or record.” Id.

The NPRA does not define “prevails” and, as such, the Court must interpret the
plain language of the statute. See, e.g., Savage v. Pierson, 123 Nev. 86, 89, 157 P.3d 697,
699 (2007) (“When examining a statute, a purely legal inquiry, this court should ascribe to
its words their plain meaning, unless this meaning was clearly not intended.”); see also S.
Nevada Homebuilders Ass’n v. Clark County, 121 Nev. 446, 449, 117 P.3d 171, 173 (2005)
(“When interpreting a statute, this court must give its terms their plain meaning, considering
its provisions as a whole so as to read them in a way that would not render the words or

phrases superfluous or a make a provision nugatory.”).
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As the Nevada Supreme Court has explained, “...by its plain meaning, [Nev. Rev.
Stat. § 239.011(2)] grants a requester who prevails in NPRA litigation the right to recover
attorney fees and costs, without regard to whether the requester is to bear the costs of
production.” LVMPD v. Blackjack Bonding, 131 Nev. Adv. Op. 10, 343 P.3d 608, 615
(2015), reh’g denied (May 29, 2015), reconsideration en banc denied (July 6, 2015). The

Supreme Court went on to explain that a party need only prevail on “any significant issue:”

A party prevails “if it succeeds on any significant issue in litigation which
achieves some of the benefit it sought in bringing suit.” Valley Elec. Ass’n
v. Overfield, 121 Nev. 7, 10, 106 P.3d 1198, 1200 (2005) (emphasis added)
(internal quotations omitted). To be a prevailing party, a party need not
succeed on every issue. See Hensley v. Eckerhart, 461 U.S. 424, 434, 103
S.Ct. 1933, 76 L.Ed.2d 40 (1983) (observing that “a plaintiff [can be]
deemed ‘prevailing’ even though he succeeded on only some of his claims
for relief™).

Id. at 615; see also DR Partners v. Bd. of Cty. Comm'rs of Clark Cty., 116 Nev. 616, 628—
29,6 P.3d 465, 473 (2000) (reversing an order denying access and remanding to district court
to award fees).?

Here, the Review-Journal had to seek judicial intervention to obtain the records
Henderson was withholding. This is exactly what the NPRA created a judicial mechanism to
achieve, and exactly what the attorney’s fees provision of the NPRA is designed to
compensate. As discussed above, the Review-Journal repeatedly requested copies of the
withheld record, and Henderson would only begin searching for and reviewing responsive
records upon payment of an illegal, exorbitant, and impermissible fee.® Although the

Review-Journal did not obtain all the information and relief it sought in this litigation,

2 Other Nevada Supreme Court cases likewise make clear that a party who substantially
prevailed is entitled to recoup all attorney’s fees and costs, even if the party did not ultimately
succeed on all claims. See, e.g., University of Nevada v. Tarkanian, 110 Nev. 581, 595-598,
879 P.2d 1180, 1189-90 (1994).

3 Counsel for the Review-Journal and Henderson City Attorney Josh Reid agreed to allow
inspection of the requested records as an interim measure. Mr. Reid, however, refused to
provide copies of the documents even in electronic form, and indicated that Henderson was
“interested in having the courts provide clarity to the meaning and application of NRS
239.055.” (Exh. 12 to Reply to Response to Amended Position, p. 5.)
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Henderson did not produce a substantial amount of the records until after the Review-Journal
submitted and fully briefed its Petition and Amended Petition, then prepared for and attended
a hearing on the Amended Petition. Moreover, only following the Supreme Court’s partial
reversal of this Court’s order denying the Review-Journal’s Amended Petition, did
Henderson disclosed the public records it had withheld pursuant to the deliberative process

privilege.
B. Other States Have Held That a Requester “Prevails” When a

Governmental Entity Unilaterally Discloses Records After Litigation
Has Commenced.

Other states with provisions similar to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2) have held that
a requester “prevails” for the purposes of an award of costs and attorney’s fees when a
governmental entity releases previously withheld records after being hailed into court. In
Mason v. City of Hoboken, 951 A.2d 1017 (N.J., 2008), the New Jersey Supreme Court
considered the application of the catalyst theory* to the attorney’s fees provision in that
state’s public records act, which contained broad language providing that “a requestor who
prevails in any proceeding shall be entitled to a reasonable attorney’s fee.” Id. at 1031 (N.J.
2008) (emphasis added). In addition to the statute’s broad use of the term “prevails”—as
opposed to the legal term of art “prevailing party”—the New Jersey Supreme Court found
that “Plaintiff and amici rightly advance another reason why the catalyst theory should apply
to OPRA: the potential for abuse should an agency deny access, vigorously defend against a
lawsuit, and then unilaterally disclose the documents sought at the eleventh hour to avoid the
entry of a court order and the resulting award of attorney’s fees.” Id. at 1031.

The Illinois Court of Appeals reached the same conclusion when assessing that
state’s attorney’s fees provision, which contained similarly broad language: “[i]f a person
seeking the right to inspect or receive a copy of public record prevails in a proceeding under
this Section, the court shall award such person reasonable attorneys’ fees and costs.” Uptown

People’s Law Ctr. v. Dep’t of Corr., 7N.E.3d 102, 104 (I1l. Ct. App. 2014) (emphasis added).

* The catalyst theory is an “alternate theory for determining the prevailing party [in public
records litigation] if no relief on the merits is obtained.” Kilgour v. City of Pasadena, 53 F.3d
1007, 1010, as modified on denial of reh’g (9th Cir. 1995).
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Accordingly, the Illinois Court of Appeals confirmed that a judgment on the merits is not a
prerequisite to an award of attorney’s fees in public records litigation. /d.

The District of Columbia Court of Appeals reached the same conclusion in Frankel
v. Dist. of Columbia Office for Planning and Econ. Dev., 110 A.3d 553, 557 (D.C. Ct. App.
2015). In that case, the court found that the D.C. Council’s s use of the phrase “prevails in
whole or in part”—as opposed to “prevailing party”— “suggests that the D.C. Council
intended to authorize attorney’s fees in [D.C.] FOIA cases more often than in other types of
cases.” Id. (emphasis added).

California has long recognized that the catalyst theory applies to its public records
act, which provides that a “court shall award court costs and reasonable attorney fees to the
plaintiff should the plaintiff prevail in litigation filed pursuant to this section.” See Belth v.
Garamendi, 232 Cal.App.3d 896, 902 (Cal. Ct. App. 1991) (“A plaintiff is considered the
prevailing party if his lawsuit motivated defendants to provide the primary relief sought or
activated them to modify their behavior, or if the litigation substantially contributed to or was
demonstrably influential in setting in motion the process which eventually achieved the

desired result.”) (internal citations omitted) (emphasis added).

C. The Review-Journal is Entitled to Its Reasonable Attorney’s Fees on
Appeal.

In addition to all costs and reasonable attorney’s fees incurred during the litigation
before this Court, the Review-Journal is also entitled to the reasonable attorney’s fees it
incurred in the Petition Appeal and the Fees Appeal. The NPRA explicitly provides that a
prevailing requester is “entitled to recover from the governmental entity that has legal
custody or control of the record his or her costs and reasonable attorney’s fees in the
proceeding.” Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2) (emphasis added).

Nothing within the plain language of Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2) limits attorney’s
fees to those incurred at the district court. See In re Estate of Miller, 125 Nev. 550, 555, 216
P.3d 239, 243 (2009) (holding that the fee-shifting provisions of Nev. R. Civ. P. 68 and Nev.
Rev. Stat. § 17.115, concerning offers of judgment, extend to fees and costs on appeal

because “nothing in the language of NRCP 68 and NRS 17.115 suggests that their fee-
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shifting provisions cease operation when the case leaves trial court™). Instead, construing
Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2)’s costs and fees provision to include fees incurred on appeal is
consistent with the intent of the provision: permitting members of the public to recoup the
fees and costs they incurred to obtain public records that were wrongfully withheld by a
governmental entity. Moreover, such an interpretation of the statute is consistent with the
NPRA’s mandate that its provisions “must be construed liberally” to carry out the Act’s
purpose: fostering democratic principles by providing prompt access to public records’, and
that any exemptions must be “construed narrowly.”®

Given these explicit mandates from the Nevada Legislature, Nev. Rev. Stat. §
239.011(2) must be interpreted liberally to encompass attorney’s fees incurred on appeal.
The entire purpose of § 239.011(2) is to make requesters whole after they have had to fight
for access to public records that were improperly withheld. The costs associated with
appellate litigation can be prohibitive, and requesters who have legitimate public records
requests that are denied may simply give up if they are faced with the high costs of appeal
with no possibility to recover those costs even if they prevail. Such a result would deter
requesters from exercising their right to copy and inspect public records and thus directly
work against the NPRA’s express purpose of fostering democratic principles. This would be
an absurd result, which this Court must avoid. Tate v. State, Bd. of Med. Exam’rs, 131 Nev.
675, 678, 356 P.3d 506, 508 (2015) (“Statutes should be construed so as to avoid absurd
results.”) (citation omitted). Accordingly, this Court must interpret Nev. Rev. Stat. §

239.011(2) liberally to include appellate fees incurred on appeal.

D. The Court Should Award the Review-Journal Attorney’s Fees in the
Amount of $122,455.00.

1. The Review-Journal’s Attorney’s Fees Are Reasonable.

Any fee-setting inquiry begins with the calculation of the “lodestar:” the number of

> Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.001(2); see also Reno Newspapers, Inc. v. Gibbons, 127 Nev. 873,
878, 266 P.3d 623, 626 (2011) (holding that the NPRA “must be liberally construed to
maximize the public's right of access”).

6 Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.001(3).
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hours reasonably expended multiplied by a reasonable hourly rate. See, e.g., Blum v. Stenson,
465 U.S. 886, 896-97 (1984); accord Herbst v. Humana Health Ins. of Nevada, 105 Nev.
586, 590, 781 P.2d 762, 764 (1989). Relevant factors include the preclusion of other
employment by the attorney due to acceptance of the case; time limitations imposed by the
client or the circumstances; the amount involved and results obtained; the undesirability of
the case; the nature and length of the professional relationship with the client; and awards in
similar cases. Kerr v. Screen Extras Guild, Inc., 526 F.2d 67, 69—70 (9th Cir.1975). In most
cases, the lodestar figure is a presumptively reasonable fee award. Camacho v. Bridgeport

Financial, Inc., 523 F.3d 973, 978 (9th Cir. 2008).

2. The Review-Journal is Entitled to a Full Award of its Reasonable
Attorney’s Fees for All the Work Performed by its Counsel.

As the Ninth Circuit has explained in the context of § 1983 cases, “where a plaintiff
in a § 1983 action alleges multiple interrelated claims based on the same underlying facts,
and some of those claims are frivolous and some are not, a court may award defendants
attorney’s fees with respect to the frivolous claims only when those claims are not
‘intertwined.”” Tutor-Saliba Corp. v. City of Hailey, 452 F.3d 1055, 1063-64 (9th Cir. 2011);
accord Fox v. Vice, 563 U.S. 826, 839-40 (2011) (discussing the “interrelated[ness]” of
plaintiffs’ frivolous and non-frivolous claims); see also McCown v. City of Fontana, 711 F.
Supp. 2d 1067, 1070 (C.D. Cal. 2010), aff’d, 464 F. App’x 577 (9th Cir. 2011) (holding that
although the plaintiff’s claims involved “different legal theories against different
defendants,” the court “should not attempt to divide the request for attorney’s fees on a claim
by claim basis” because each of claims “arose from a common core of facts”); cf. Cain v.
J.P. Prods., 11 F. App’x 714, 716 (9th Cir. 2001) (holding that, in the context of a Lanham
Act case, “no apportionment was needed because the claims are so inextricably intertwined
that even an estimated adjustment would be meaningless”) (citing Gracie v. Gracie, 217 F.3d
1060, 1068, (9th Cir.2000); other citation omitted).

The Review-Journal anticipates that Henderson will argue that it is not entitled to

any award of attorney’s fees at all, and alternatively argue that any award should be reduced
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to reflect that the Review-Journal did not obtain all of the relief it sought in its Amended
Petition. However, where, as here, the claims asserted by the Review-Journal in its petition
for a writ of mandamus and the work done to obtain disclosure of the records are so
interrelated that this Court should not separate those claims for the purposes of awarding
attorney’s fees. The Review-Journal obtained access to the withheld records while the
litigation was pending before this Court by inspection and by receiving the USB drive from
Henderson after the hearing on the Review-Journal’s Amended Petition, and received
additional previously withheld documents from Henderson after the conclusion of the
appeals.

The Review-Journal prevailed in this litigation by obtaining most of the records
Henderson had refused to disclose. Furthermore, the issues raised by the Review-Journal that
were not successful were not frivolous, and the work on those issues was all interrelated to
the ones on which the Review-Journal prevailed. See, e.g., Braunstein v. Arizona Dep’t of|
Transp., 683 F.3d 1177, 1187 (9th Cir. 2012). Accordingly, the Review-Journal is entitled to

an award of attorneys’ fees for all the work performed in this case.

3. The Review-Journal Seeks Fees for a Reasonable Number of
Hours and Exercised Appropriate Billing Judgment.

Pursuant to Nev. R. Civ. P. 54(d)(2)(B), statements “swearing that the fees were
actually and necessarily incurred and were reasonable” are set forth in the attached
declaration of Margaret A. McLetchie (“McLetchie Decl.”) and supported by the billings for
the Review-Journal’s attorney fees and costs attached hereto as Exhibits 1, 2, and 3.

The litigation in this matter was complex and time-consuming. As detailed in the
prior Motion for Attorney’s Fees and Costs filed with this Court, the Review-Journal met
and conferred extensively with Henderson City Attorneys regarding the records request—
both before and after filing the Petition in this matter. In addition, the Review-Journal was
obligated to brief the matter extensively before this Court, including amending the Petition
after receiving additional records and information from Henderson, filing extensive

pleadings in support of the Amended Petition, filing extensive pleadings in support of its
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prior Motion for Attorney’s Fees and Costs, and attending multiple hearings. In the Petition
and Fees Appeals, the Review-Journal was again required to engage in extensive briefing,
and counsel was required to dedicate substantial time to preparing for and arguing the
Petition Appeal before the Supreme Court. In addition, on remand to this Court, counsel for
the Review-Journal has been required to prepare for and attend additional hearings and has
been obligated to submit this Motion.

The Review-Journal’s counsel exercised appropriate billing judgment and
structured work on this case to maximize efficiencies, and the hours listed in the fee request
are neither duplicative, unnecessary nor excessive. (Declaration of Margaret A. McLetchie
at 99 7-8.) See also Hensley v. Eckerhart, 461 U.S. 424, 434 (1983) (“Counsel for the
prevailing party should make a good faith effort to exclude from a fee request hours that are
excessive redundant, or otherwise unnecessary, just as a lawyer in private practice ethically
is obligated to exclude such hours from his fee submission.”).

To keep billing as low as possible, attorney Alina Shell conducted work where
appropriate. Further, counsel utilized a student law clerk and a paraprofessional to perform
tasks such as research and organization to assure that attorneys with higher billing rates were
not billing for tasks that lower billers could perform. (McLetchie Decl. at 9 7, 15.)
Potentially duplicative or unnecessary time has not been included. (/d. at § 8.) In all these
ways, counsel for the Review-Journal has charged a reasonable and reduced rate for the
attorneys’ time. (/d. at § 16.) Counsel also exercised appropriate billing judgment by not
including in this application certain time, even time which would likely be compensable. (/d.
at9 18.)

4.  The Brunzell Factors

In addition to calculating the lodestar, a court must also consider the requested
amount in light of the factors enumerated by the Nevada Supreme Court in Brunzell v.
Golden Gate Nat. Bank, 85 Nev. 345, 455 P.2d 31 (1969). Pursuant to Brunzell, a court must

consider four elements in determining the reasonable value of attorneys’ services:

(1) the qualities of the advocate: his ability, his training, education,
experience, professional standing and skill; (2) the character of the work to
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be done: its difficulty, its intricacy, its importance, time and skill required,
the responsibility imposed and the prominence and character of the parties
where they affect the importance of the litigation; (3) the work actually
performed by the lawyer: the skill, time and attention given to the work; (4)
the result: whether the attorney was successful and what benefits were
derived.

Brunzell, 85 Nev. at 349, 455 P.2d at 33 (citation omitted); accord Shuette v. Beazer Homes
Holding Corp., 121 Nev. 837, 864-65, 124 P.3d 530, 548-49 (2005).

a. The Advocates’ Skills Support a High Award

In determining the reasonable value of an attorney’s services, this Court must
consider the qualities of the advocate, including ability, training, education, experience,
professional standing, and skill. Brunzell, 85 Nev. at 349, 455 P.2d at 33.

Margaret A. McLetchie, working a total of 129.1 hours on this case, is the lead
attorney at, and owner of, McLetchie Law, with almost 17 years of experience, and admitted
to the bar in both California and Nevada. After working at a large corporate law firm in
California, Ms. McLetchie became a Staff Attorney, then Legal Director of the American
Civil Liberties Union of Nevada. While with the ACLU of Nevada, Ms. McLetchie litigated
several complex civil rights cases, including cases focused on freedom of speech. Ms.
McLetchie has extensive experience handling First Amendment cases, public records cases,
court access cases, and similar matters. In 2018, Ms. McLetchie was named a First
Amendment Champion by the Nevada Press Association in recognition of her years of efforts
to further public access to records and protect the freedom of the press.” Ms. McLetchie’s
work on this matter was billed at a rate of $450.00 per hour, for a total of $57,420.00.

Alina Shell, working a total of 168.6 hours on this case, is a senior attorney at
McLetchie Law with over ten years of experience. Prior to transitioning into private practice,
Ms. Shell was an attorney with the Federal Public Defender (FPD) for the District of Nevada.
While employed by the FPD, Ms. Shell represented numerous defendants in a variety of

criminal cases, including complex mortgage fraud and sentencing cases, and criminal cases

7 https://www.reviewjournal.com/local/local-las-vegas/las-vegas-attorney-mcletchie-

named-first-amendment-champion/

15 JA0745



https://www.reviewjournal.com/local/local-las-vegas/las-vegas-attorney-mcletchie-named-first-amendment-champion/
https://www.reviewjournal.com/local/local-las-vegas/las-vegas-attorney-mcletchie-named-first-amendment-champion/

LAW|

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
701 EAST BRIDGER AVE., SUITE 520

L
T
O
|_
L
—
O
>

LAS VEGAS, NV 89101
(702)728-5300 (T) / (702)425-8220 (F)

WWW.NVLITIGATION.COM

O o0 9 O n Bk~ W N =

NN NN N N N N N /) ko e e e e e e e
0 I N L R WD = O O 0NN R WD = O

implicating the First Amendment. Ms. Shell also wrote and argued several complex criminal
appeals before the United States Court of Appeals for the Ninth Circuit. Since moving into
private practice, Ms. Shell has represented parties in state and federal court in a variety of
civil matters, including First Amendment, NPRA, court access, and defamation cases. Ms.
Shell’s work in this matter was billed at a rate of $300.00 per hour, for a total of $50,370.00.

Leo S. Wolpert, working a total of 35.9 hours, is a research and writing attorney at
McLetchie Law. Mr. Wolpert is 2011 graduate of the University of Virginia School of Law
with seven years of legal experience, including experience with First Amendment and
defamation matters. Mr. Wolpert’s time on this case was billed at a rate of $250.00 per hour,
for a total billed of $8,975.00.

Pharan Burchfield, working a total of 40.7 credited hours on this case, is a
paraprofessional at McLetchie Law. Ms. Burchfield has an associate’s degree in paralegal
studies and has been a paralegal for five years. Ms. Burchfield’s time on this case was billed
at the rate of $100.00 per hour, for a total billed of $4,050.00.

Lacey Ambro, working a total of 4.3 credited hours on this case, is a
paraprofessional at McLetchie Law with over seven years of experience in the legal field.
From 2007 to 2012, Ms. Ambro worked as a legal assistant at a firm specializing in medical
malpractice defense. Ms. Ambro has been employed at McLetchie Law as a legal assistant
since August 2017. Ms. Ambro’s time on this case was billed at the rate of $100.00 per hour,
for a total billed of $430.00.

Gabriel Czop, working a total of 15.7 credited hours on this case, was a law clerk
at McLetchie Shell, while enrolled at the William S. Boyd Law School at the University of
Nevada Las Vegas. Mr. Czop’s time on this case was billed at the rate of $125.00 per hour,
for a total billed of $1,087.50.

In addition, the Review-Journal utilized paraprofessional to perform administrative
tasks in this matter. Administrative tasks were billed at a rate of $50.00 per hour for 4.9
hours, for a total billed of $122.50.

/1]
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In sum, the attorneys and employees at McLetchie Law billed 399.2 hours on this
case, for a total of $122,455.00, at what would be a blended average of approximately
$306.00 per hour—well under market for the experience brought to bear on this action.
Reasonable costs for documents, filing fees, and the like were calculated for a total billed of
$1,336.50. With costs, the total billed for McLetchie Shell is $123,791.50. Further
qualification and qualities, along with an itemization of these bills are included in the
attached declaration of Ms. McLetchie and Exhibits 1, 2, and 3.

b. The Work Performed, Including Skill, Time, and Attention.

The work actually performed by the lawyer is relevant to the reasonableness of
attorneys’ fees, including the skill, time, and attention given to the work. Brunzell, 85 Nev.
at 349, 455 P.2d at 33. As demonstrated by the billing statement attached in Exh. 1 and the
attached declaration of Ms. McLetchie, a substantial portion of the work in this case was
done by attorneys and paraprofessional staff with low billing rates. Counsel for the Review-
Journal fully briefed this matter, including filing a petition, amending that petition, fully
briefing its original Motion for Attorney’s Fees and Costs, and fully briefing two appeals. In
addition, Ms. McLetchie was required to dedicate 29.5 hours to preparing for and
representing the Review-Journal at oral argument before the Nevada Supreme Court in the
Petition Appeal. (Exh. 2, LVRJ087-88 (documenting work performed by Ms. McLetchie in
preparing for and participating in oral argument).) Even though some of the work was done
by lower-billing attorneys and paraprofessional staff, Ms. McLetchie was still required to
analyze the research and apply it strategically to the various arguments posed by Henderson.

c.  The Result.

Lastly, “the result: whether the attorney was successful and what benefits were
derived” is relevant to this inquiry. Brunzell, 85 Nev. at 349, 455 P.2d at 33. As noted above,
the Review-Journal prevailed in this matter because it succeeded in obtaining previously
withheld records from Henderson. Because each of these factors weighs in the Review-
Journal’s favor, this Court should exercise its discretion and award the Review-Journal

reasonable attorneys’ fees and costs in the sum of $123,791.50.
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IV.  CONCLUSION
For these reasons, and for the reasons set forth in the Review-Journal’s original
June 1, 2017, Motion for Attorney’s Fees and its supporting documentation, the Review-
Journal prevailed in this litigation pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2) because it
achieved the most significant goal in this litigation: obtaining improperly withheld public
records from the City of Henderson. Accordingly, the Review Journal is entitled to an award

of its costs and reasonable attorney’s fees.

DATED this 6 day of February, 2020.

/s/ Margaret A. McLetchie

MARGARET A. MCLETCHIE, Nevada Bar No. 10931
ALINA M. SHELL, Nevada Bar No. 11711
MCLETCHIE LAW

701 E. Bridger Avenue, Suite 520

Las Vegas, NV 89101

Telephone: (702) 728-5300; Fax (702) 728-5300
Email: maggie@nvlitigation.com

Attorneys for Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal
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EXHIBIT 1



Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Margaret | Emails re Public Records Act
11/3/2016 | McLetchie | request responses. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Emails with team re status on
11/4/2016 | McLetchie | Trosper matter. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
11/9/2016 | McLetchie | Emails re setting up meeting. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret
11/10/2016 | McLetchie | Prepare for and attend client call. 1.2 | $450.00 | $540.00 $540.00
Margaret
11/27/2016 | McLetchie | Work on Petition; research re same. 1.8 | $450.00 | $810.00 $810.00
Begin review of draft complaint.
Check citations and find Henderson
Public Records policy and relevant
Alina Henderson Municipal code re fee
11/28/2016 | Shell schedule. 1.8 | $300.00 | $540.00 $540.00
Attention to compiling
Margaret | documentation for petition and
11/28/2016 | McLetchie | drafting same. Circulate. 4.2 | $450.00 | $1,890.00 $1,890.00
Voicemail for Mr. Reeves at City of
Alina Henderson re accepting service of
11/29/2016 | Shell petition. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Alina Review and finalize petition for writ
11/29/2016 | Shell of mandamus. 1.2 | $300.00 | $360.00 $360.00
Margaret
11/29/2016 | McLetchie | Attention to finalizing filing. 2.0 | $450.00 | $900.00 $900.00
Prepare and file Public Records
Application and petition for Writ of
Pharan Mandamus. Draft and file Initial
11/29/2016 | Burchfield | Appearance Fee Disclosure and 0.9 | $100.00 | $90.00 $90.00

JA
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Civil Cover Sheet to create a new
civil case in Eighth Judicial District
Court. Attention to scheduling a
legal process server re same. Email
clients re same.
Margaret
12/2/2016 | McLetchie | Review emails re service. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Review and respond to letter from
12/5/2016 | McLetchie | Josh Reid. Circulate letter to clients. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Further emails with Josh Reid.
Margaret | Emails with his office re setting up
12/6/2016 | McLetchie | meeting. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret | Emails with RJ team regarding
12/7/2016 | McLetchie | status and next steps. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret
12/7/2016 | McLetchie | Review pertinent media coverage. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Prepare for and attend call with Josh
Reid and two deputy City of
Henderson attorneys. Negotiate for
Margaret | in-person inspection. Update clients
12/14/2016 | McLetchie | re same. 1.7 | $450.00 | $765.00 $765.00
Margaret | Emails re documents available for
12/19/2016 | McLetchie | inspection. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Pharan
12/19/2016 | Burchfield | File Affidavit of Service. 0.1 [ $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Attention to issues with review.
Preliminary review of “privilege
Margaret | log.” Call with client re litigation
12/20/2016 | McLetchie | strategy. Confer with City of 2.4 | $450.00 | $1,080.00 $1,080.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Henderson attorney Brian Reeve
and plan meeting.
Emails with Henderson and with
clients. Successfully address issue
Margaret | with how documents were presented
12/21/2016 | McLetchie | for review/ Attempt to obtain CD. 0.8 | $450.00 | $360.00 $360.00
Margaret | Emails re document review at City
12/23/2016 | McLetchie | of Henderson. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Follow up to Henderson to get
Margaret | Wednesday access for Natalie
12/27/2016 | McLetchie | Bruzda. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Email re log re documents withheld
1/4/2017 | McLetchie | by City of Henderson. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Attention to compiling pertinent
1/5/2017 | McLetchie | legislative history. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Trosper: Review NRS 34 to confirm
Alina compliance with same in submitting
1/9/2017 | Shell petition to Court. 0.3 | $300.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Call with Henderson City Attorneys
1/9/2017 | McLetchie | and follow up with client re same. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Margaret | Calendaring - check Henderson
1/9/2017 | McLetchie | deadline to respond to writ. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Preliminary review of supplemental
Margaret | log received from City of
1/10/2017 | McLetchie | Henderson. 0.7 | $450.00 | $315.00 $315.00
Receive redacted documents from
City of Henderson; create City of
Pharan Henderson portal account to
1/10/2017 | Burchfield | download, print, and save redacted 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
3
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
documents from Public Records Act
request (re Trosper).
Edits to stipulation, call with and
Margaret | emails with City of Henderson
1/11/2017 | McLetchie | attorneys. 0.6 | $450.00 | $270.00 $270.00
Margaret
1/12/2017 | McLetchie | Execute stipulation. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret
1/12/2017 | McLetchie | Call with client. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Compile legislative history of the
Nevada Public Records Act for Ms.
Gabriel McLetchie; send same to Ms.
1/13/2017 | Czop McLetchie. 0.6 | $125.00 | $75.00 $75.00
Research assignment from Ms.
Gabriel McLetchie - compiling legislative
1/13/2017 | Czop history. 0.7 | $125.00 | $87.50 $87.50
Margaret
1/17/2017 | McLetchie | Emails with client. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Review privilege log for Ms.
Gabriel McLetchie, analyze re what has
1/24/2017 | Czop been claimed as privileged. 2.4 | $125.00 | $300.00 | $(300.00) | $-
Gabriel Review documents attached to
1/24/2017 | Czop pleadings. 0.3 | $125.00 | $37.50 $37.50
Gabriel Continue researching the legislative
1/24/2017 | Czop history for NRS 239. 1.6 | $125.00 | $200.00 $200.00
Attention to scheduling of review of
Margaret | privilege log, amending complaint,
1/24/2017 | McLetchie | and filing supporting brief. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Calls and emails with opposing
counsel and court re case status,
Margaret | scheduling. Begin plans for
1/24/2017 | McLetchie | amending. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Attention to emails with court and
Margaret | opposing counsel re scheduling;
1/25/2017 | McLetchie | update to clients re same. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Email communications with Ms.
Pharan Boyd (City of Henderson) re signed
1/25/2017 | Burchfield | Stipulation re extension. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Gabriel Research for Ms. McLetchie about
1/26/2017 | Czop the requirements of a privilege log. 1.8 | $125.00 | $225.00 $225.00
Meet with Ms. McLetchie to discuss
Gabriel the privilege log received from City
1/26/2017 | Czop of Henderson. 0.3 | $125.00 | $37.50 $37.50
Continue reviewing privilege log
Gabriel provided by City of Henderson,
1/26/2017 | Czop provide analysis to Ms. McLetchie. 1.8 | $125.00 | $225.00 $225.00
Gabriel Update privilege log analysis
1/27/2017 | Czop document for Ms. McLetchie. 0.4 | $125.00 | $50.00 $(50.00) $-
Research the attorney/client
Gabriel privilege and work product
1/27/2017 | Czop privilege. 3.8 | $125.00 | $475.00 | $(475.00) | $-
Finalize privilege log analysis and
Gabriel provide same to Ms. McLetchie for
1/30/2017 | Czop review. 0.2 | $125.00 | $25.00 $25.00
Gabriel Continue reviewing documents
2/1/2017 | Czop received from City of Henderson. 1.1 ] $125.00 | $137.50 $137.50
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Confer with Ms. McLetchie
regarding amending petition for
relief and drafting supporting brief.
Review correspondence between
Ms. McLetchie and City of
Alina Henderson. Begin drafting brief in
2/8/2017 | Shell support of petition. 8.6 | $300.00 | $2,580.00 $2,580.00
Print out copies of the redacted
Gabriel documents received from City of
2/8/2017 | Czop Henderson. 0.4 | $125.00 | $50.00 $(50.00) $-
Amend and expand petition/
application; research issues; edit
brief in support of petition/
Margaret | application, declaration, and check
2/8/2017 | McLetchie | exhibits. 6.2 | $450.00 | $2,790.00 $2,790.00
Prepare exhibits to brief and
amended petition; begin drafting
declaration in support of amended
Pharan petition. File and serve/mail re
2/8/2017 | Burchfield | same. 1.4 | $100.00 | $140.00 $140.00
Margaret
3/9/2017 | McLetchie | Emails with client re rely. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Draft public records request letter to
City of Henderson for records
pertaining to payment of law firm
Alina Bailey Kennedy for legal
3/14/2017 | Shell representation in this matter. 0.3 | $300.00 | $90.00 $(90.00) $-
Alina Review City of Henderson response
3/20/2017 | Shell to amended petition and 1.0 | $300.00 | $300.00 $300.00
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Date

Biller

Note

Quantity

Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

memorandum; confer with Ms.
McLetchie re same.

3/20/2017

Alina
Shell

Revise and finalize PRA letter to
City of Henderson requesting
records pertaining to payments to
Bailey Kennedy for representation
in Las Vegas Review-Journal v.
City of Henderson.

0.4

$300.00

$120.00

$(120.00)

$-

3/20/2017

Margaret
McLetchie

Review and analyze Henderson’s
response to our opening brief.
Direct Ms. Shell re work on reply.

1.1

$450.00

$495.00

$495.00

3/20/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Finalize and send (mail/email)
Public Records Act request re
Bailey Kennedy to City of
Henderson’s City Attorney.

0.2

$100.00

$20.00

$(20.00)

3/21/2017

Alina
Shell

Legal research regarding exclusive
remedies argument raised by
Henderson in its response to
opening brief. Research regarding
declaratory relief. Review of order
entered in Gray v. Clark County
School District matter regarding
extraordinary use. Attention to
drafting reply to Henderson’s
response.

43

$300.00

$1,290.00

$1,290.00

3/21/2017

Gabriel
Czop

Research for Ms. Shell re statutory
interpretation.

0.2

$125.00

$25.00

$25.00

3/21/2017

Gabriel
Czop

Meet with Ms. McLetchie and Ms.
Shell re: research assignment to

0.1

$125.00

$12.50

$12.50
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Date

Biller

Note

Quantity

Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

locate cases that discuss legislative
history is not needed when the
statute is clear.

3/22/2017

Alina
Shell

Continue drafting reply to response
to amended petition/memorandum
in support of petition.

5.1

$300.00

$1,530.00

$1,530.00

3/22/2017

Alina
Shell

Review and edit stipulation for
extension of time.

0.2

$300.00

$60.00

$60.00

3/22/2017

Margaret
McLetchie

Further review and analysis of
Henderson’s response to petition for
work on reply; direct Ms.
Burchfield to circulate response to
clients.

1.8

$450.00

$810.00

$810.00

3/22/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Draft Stipulation (re extension for
Reply) for attorneys’ review; email
communications with Mr. Kennedy
re same.

0.3

$100.00

$30.00

$30.00

3/23/2017

Alina
Shell

Resume drafting reply to Henderson
response. Review Henderson’s
Third Privilege Log. Review
communications with Henderson for
inclusion in statement of facts.
Legal research regarding scope of
deliberative process privilege and
attorney-client privilege. Edit
declaration.

9.6

$300.00

$2,880.00

$2,880.00

3/23/2017

Margaret
McLetchie

Revising and editing of reply;
attention to declaration; research
and draft section re mootness.

6.8

$450.00

$3,060.00

$3,060.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Review external communications
with City of Henderson re potential
exhibits re Reply; draft Ms.
McLetchie’s declaration re same;
Pharan finalize, file, and serve/mail Reply
3/23/2017 | Burchfield | re same. 2.1 ] $100.00 | $210.00 $210.00
File Stipulation and Order for
Extension to Allow Las Vegas
Review-Journal to File its Reply to
Pharan Respondent City of Henderson’s
3/27/2017 | Burchfield | Response to Amended Petition. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan Draft, file, and serve/mail Notice of
3/28/2017 | Burchfield | Entry of Order (reply extension). 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Alina Review briefing and cases in
3/29/2017 | Shell preparation for upcoming hearing. 1.7 | $300.00 | $510.00 $510.00
Prepare for and attend hearing on
Alina petition re Henderson public
3/30/2017 | Shell records. 1.6 | $300.00 | $480.00 $480.00
Margaret | Attend hearing; call to client; email
3/30/2017 | McLetchie | summary to clients. 0.5 | $450.00 | $225.00 | $(675.00) | $(450.00)
Review and circulate response to
request for fees information for
Margaret | Henderson’s outside counsel, Bailey
4/4/2017 | McLetchie | Kennedy (records received). 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Draft edits and commentary to
Henderson’s proposed order re
Alina NPRA petition. Review transcript of
4/14/2017 | Shell hearing on petition. 0.8 | $300.00 | $240.00 $240.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Update redline to proposed order re
petition for public records. Circulate
Alina to Ms. McLetchie for further
4/21/2017 | Shell review. 0.5 | $300.00 | $150.00 $150.00
Draft letter to Honorable Judge
Thompson re competing orders to
be delivered to chambers with
proposed order; email
Pharan communications with opposing
4/27/2017 | Burchfield | counsel re same. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Phone call with Al, law clerk in
Pharan Department 18, re competing
5/11/2017 | Burchfield | proposed order. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Review order re petition for writ of
mandamus. Verify calculated
Alina deadlines for filing motion for
5/15/2017 | Shell attorney’s fees and notice of appeal. 0.1 [ $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Margaret
5/23/2017 | McLetchie | Email re renewing fees request. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Alina
5/31/2017 | Shell Draft application for attorney fees. 3.2 | $300.00 | $960.00 $960.00
Prepare charts/Excel spreadsheets of
attorneys’ time and expenses for
Pharan Motion for Attorney’s Fees
5/31/2017 | Burchfield | Application. 0.5 [ $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Review spreadsheet of attorney fees
Alina to be included as exhibit to motion
6/1/2017 | Shell for attorney fees. Edit and update 1.1 | $300.00 | $330.00 $330.00
10
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
draft motion. Circulate to Ms.
McLetchie.
Attention to revised spreadsheets of
Alina costs and fees for inclusion in
6/1/2017 | Shell motion for attorney fees and costs. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Draft declaration for Ms. McLetchie
Alina in support of motion for attorney
6/1/2017 | Shell fees. Compile proposed exhibits. 0.7 | $300.00 | $210.00 $210.00
Draft renewed PRA request to City
of Henderson for payments to
Bailey Kennedy for legal services
Alina provided in this matter. Edit and
6/1/2017 | Shell finalize letter. 0.5 | $300.00 | $150.00 $150.00
Incorporate edits to motion for
attorney fees and supporting
Alina declaration provided by Ms.
6/1/2017 | Shell McLetchie and Mr. Wolpert. 1.7 | $300.00 | $510.00 $510.00
Leo Edit/proofread motion for attorney’s
6/1/2017 | Wolpert fees. 1.5 | $250.00 | $375.00 $375.00
Margaret
6/1/2017 | McLetchie | Edit motion for fees. 0.9 | $450.00 | $405.00 $405.00
Finalize (proof and prepare
exhibits), file and serve/mail
Pharan Application/Motion for Attorneys’
6/1/2017 | Burchfield | Fees. 0.9 | $100.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Finalize and send (mail/email)
Public Records Act request to Mr.
Pharan Reid at City of Henderson re Bailey
6/1/2017 | Burchfield | Kennedy. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
11 JA
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Review City of Henderson’s
response to our most recent Public
Records Act Request regarding
Bailey Kennedy’s representation in
Las Vegas Review-Journal v. City
Pharan of Henderson case. Email copy to
6/8/2017 | Burchfield | clients re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Alina
6/9/2017 | Shell Draft case appeal statement. 1.1 | $300.00 | $330.00 $330.00
Margaret | Direct work on Notice of Appeal
6/9/2017 | McLetchie | and Case Appeal Statement. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Draft Notice of Appeal and Case
Pharan Appeal Statement. File and
6/9/2017 | Burchfield | serve/mail re same. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Margaret | Agree to extension with opposing
6/14/2017 | McLetchie | counsel. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Respond to opposing counsel’s
6/15/2017 | McLetchie | email re Stipulation re extension. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Paid Bond on Appeal to the Nevada
District Court (Check #2059) at the
Regional Justice Center - 200 Lewis
Admin Ave. Las Vegas, NV, 89101 3rd
6/19/2017 | Admin Floor. 0.9 | $25.00 | $22.50 $22.50
Margaret | Review and edit Stipulation re
6/19/2017 | McLetchie | extension; email opposing counsel. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
6/19/2017 | McLetchie | Follow up re appellate filing fee. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret
6/19/2017 | McLetchie | Attention to extension stipulation. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
12
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Paid Appeal Filing fee to Nevada
Supreme Court (Check # 2060) at
Admin 408 East Clark Street Las Vegas,
6/20/2017 | Admin NV 89101. 0.7 | $25.00 | $17.50 $17.50
Pharan APPEAL: Begin drafting Docketing
6/22/2017 | Burchfield | Statement. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Attention to preparing docketing
statement for filing with Nevada
Supreme Court. Address docketing
statement questions regarding
nature of action, issues on appeal,
jurisdiction, retention by the
Supreme Court, and other areas.
Review and incorporate changes
Alina and edits to same provided by Ms.
7/10/2017 | Shell McLetchie. 2.0 | $300.00 | $600.00 $600.00
Margaret
7/10/2017 | McLetchie | Edit docketing statement. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Prepare Docketing Statement
(prepare draft and exhibits);
Pharan integrate attorneys’ edits to final
7/10/2017 | Burchfield | draft; file and serve/mail re same. 1.2 | $100.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Margaret | Attention to scheduling of
7/12/2017 | McLetchie | settlement conference. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
TROSPER: Work with Ms. Laux re
Margaret | legislative history re “extraordinary
7/13/2017 | McLetchie | use” for appeal purposes. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Attention to scheduling of attorney
7/14/2017 | McLetchie | fee hearing. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Prepare for and attend conference
call with opposing counsel and
settlement judge. Email to clients re
scheduling of settlement
conference, and representations
Margaret | from City of Henderson re what
7/19/2017 | McLetchie | they are charging. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Margaret | Emails re status of requests to City
7/19/2017 | McLetchie | of Henderson. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret | Attention to scheduling of
7/19/2017 | McLetchie | settlement conference. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Emails with client re scheduling
7/20/2017 | McLetchie | settlement conference. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Email to counsel for City of
Henderson regarding issue with the
City’s exhibits in its opposition to
Alina Las Vegas Review-Journal’s motion
7/21/2017 | Shell for attorney’s fees. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Margaret | Confer with paralegal re issues with
7/21/2017 | McLetchie | opposition. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Review City of Henderson’s
Opposition re Motion for Attorney’s
Fees; notice issues (missing and
mislabeled exhibits); bring to Ms.
McLetchie’s attention (how to
proceed); begin creating Judge’s
Pharan courtesy copy for upcoming hearing
7/21/2017 | Burchfield | re same. 0.6 | $100.00 | $60.00 $60.00
14
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Phone call with Ms. Togo re call
she had received from Jimmerson
Law Office (settlement judge);
Pharan attempted call to Jimmerson’s office
7/21/2017 | Burchfield | re clarification re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Margaret | Follow up re scheduling settlement
7/24/2017 | McLetchie | conference. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Review and address Ms.
McLetchie’s edits to reply to
Alina opposition to motion for attorney’s
7/27/2017 | Shell fees and costs. 7.0 | $300.00 | $2,100.00 $2,100.00
Margaret | Edit reply to opposition to motion
7/27/2017 | McLetchie | for attorney’s fees and costs.. 1.2 | $450.00 | $540.00 $540.00
Confer with Ms. Shell re strategy re
Margaret | atty fee applications. Research
7/27/2017 | McLetchie | issues re “catalyst theory.” 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Prepare Reply to City of
Henderson’s Opposition to Las
Vegas Review-Journal’s Motion for
Pharan Attorney’s Fees and Costs for filing;
7/27/2017 | Burchfield | file and serve/mail re same. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Email clients briefing re Motion for
Pharan Attorney’s Fees and reminder of
7/28/2017 | Burchfield | hearing re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Dropped off Attorneys’ Fees
briefing binder at the Las Vegas
Admin Phoenix Building: 330 S 3rd St. Las
7/31/2017 | Admin Vegas NV, 89101 Department 18. 0.3 | $25.00 | $7.50 $7.50
15 JA

LV

0768
RJO15




Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Prepare for hearing on motion for
attorney’s fees. Review pleadings
Alina and draft outline of points to
8/2/2017 | Shell address during hearing. 1.6 | $300.00 | $480.00 $480.00
Attention to attorney’s fees hearing
Margaret | and follow up re obtaining copy of
8/2/2017 | McLetchie | ordinance from City of Henderson. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Margaret | Attention to preparations for
8/2/2017 | McLetchie | hearing on fees application. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret | Attempt to follow up with City of
8/2/2017 | McLetchie | Henderson re draft ordinance. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Prepare for hearing on motion for
attorney’s fees. In court for
argument on same. Memo to Ms.
Alina McLetchie regarding outcome of
8/3/2017 | Shell hearing. 2.7 | $300.00 | $810.00 $810.00
Prepare for continued hearing on
Alina motion for attorney’s fees. Appear
8/10/2017 | Shell in court re same. 3.0 | $300.00 | $900.00 $900.00
Discuss continued hearing on
Alina motion for attorney’s fees with Ms.
8/10/2017 | Shell McLetchie. Discuss next steps. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Margaret
8/10/2017 | McLetchie | Attention to attorney’s fees hearing. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Discuss proposed order re motion
for attorney’s fees with Ms.
Alina McLetchie. Email City of
8/24/2017 | Shell Henderson attorneys regarding 0.3 | $300.00 | $90.00 $90.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
stipulation for extension of time for
submitting proposed order.
Draft proposed stipulation and order
re extension of time for submitting
Alina order to court. Email to Josh Reid re
8/24/2017 | Shell same. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Re-draft stipulation to extend time
Alina for submitting proposed order as
8/24/2017 | Shell motion for extension of time. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Finalize Motion for Extension of
Time to Allows Las Vegas Review-
Journal to Submit a Proposed Order
Granting Las Vegas Review-
Journal’s Motion for Attorney’s
Fees and Costs and draft Notice of
Pharan Submission of Proposed Order re
8/24/2017 | Burchfield | same. File and serve/mail re same. 0.6 | $100.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Draft proposed order granting
motion for attorney’s fees and costs.
Alina Email same to Ms. McLetchie for
8/31/2017 | Shell review. 2.7 | $300.00 | $810.00 $810.00
Margaret
9/2/2017 | McLetchie | Follow up re attorney fee motion. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Review and discuss Ms.
McLetchie’s edits to proposed order
granting motion for attorney’s fees
Alina and costs. Incorporate edits into
9/7/2017 | Shell draft order. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00

17
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Alina Draft confidential settlement
9/7/2017 | Shell statement. 0.3 | $300.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Phone call to Brian Reeves at
Henderson City Attorney’s office to
obtain Henderson’s position
Alina regarding additional extension of
9/7/2017 | Shell time for submitting proposed order. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Review and edit second motion for
Alina extension of time for submitting
9/7/2017 | Shell proposed order. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Margaret
9/7/2017 | McLetchie | Edit order. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Prepare Proposed Order re
attorneys’ fees for attorneys’
review; email to opposing counsel
re same. Draft second motion for
Pharan extension for attorneys’ review; file
9/7/2017 | Burchfield | and serve/mail re same. 0.4 | $100.00 | $40.00 $40.00
Review Mr. Reeves’ redline edit of
order re attorney fees. Edit and
Alina revise redline. Circulate to Ms.
9/20/2017 | Shell McLetchie for review. 0.6 | $300.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Margaret
9/20/2017 | McLetchie | Emails re order. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Email Mr. Moyer and Mr. Cook
update re settlement conference
Pharan being scheduled. Confirm
9/20/2017 | Burchfield | attendance. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00

18
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, revise
Alina proposed order regarding motion for
9/21/2017 | Shell attorney’s fees. 0.6 | $300.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Emails with Brian Reeve re order re
Margaret | fees; attention to submission of
9/21/2017 | McLetchie | LVRIJ’s order to court. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Revisions to order on fees. Send to
Brian Reeve. Finalize our proposed
Margaret | order and accompanying letter to
9/21/2017 | McLetchie | judge. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret
9/21/2017 | McLetchie | Follow up re proposed revision. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Draft cover letter to Honorable
Judge Bailus in anticipation of
submitting competing proposed
orders re order granting attorney’s
Pharan fees. Email opposition counsel re
9/21/2017 | Burchfield | same. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Drop off cover letter to Honorable
Judge Bailus re and including
competing proposed orders re order
granting attorney’s fees at Phoenix
Pharan Building, Eleventh Floor located at
9/21/2017 | Burchfield | 330 South Third Street. 0.5 [ $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Resume drafting settlement
statement for upcoming settlement
conference. Review Henderson’s
Alina proposed revision to its municipal
9/25/2017 | Shell code regarding fees for fulfilling 2.3 1 $300.00 | $690.00 $690.00
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Date

Biller

Note

Quantity

Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

public records requests, and
incorporate facts and analysis re
same into settlement statement.
Draft legal argument. Identify
exhibits for inclusion with
settlement statement.

9/25/2017

Margaret
McLetchie

Revise draft settlement statement
and confer with Ms. Shell re same.

0.8

$450.00

$360.00

$360.00

9/28/2017

Alina
Shell

Additional edits to draft settlement
statement. Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, research legislative history
of NRS 239.055.

33

$300.00

$990.00

$990.00

9/28/2017

Margaret
McLetchie

Emails with client re settlement
conference, Henderson’s proposed
revised ordinance.

0.2

$450.00

$90.00

$90.00

9/28/2017

Margaret
McLetchie

Attention to providing comment to
Henderson (including NPRA and
NPRI) re proposed Henderson
policy and fees.

1.1

$450.00

$495.00

$495.00

9/29/2017

Margaret
McLetchie

Review/revise/finalize settlement
conference brief.

1.0

$450.00

$450.00

$450.00

9/29/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Incorporate Ms. McLetchie’s edits
to Ms. Shell’s draft of Confidential
Settlement Statement; prepare
exhibits re same; finalize and send
(mail/email) Settlement Judge Jay
Young re same. Email Mr. Moyer
and Mr. Cook re same.

1.5

$100.00

$150.00

$150.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Margaret | Emails with NPRI re Henderson
10/2/2017 | McLetchie | proposed ordinance. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Per Ms. McLetchie’s request,
research legislative history of NRS
239.055 (fees provision) and NRS
239.012 (bad faith provision) in
Alina preparation for settlement
10/9/2017 | Shell conference. 1.6 | $300.00 | $480.00 $480.00
Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, draft
proposed language for revision to
Alina Henderson Municipal Code
10/9/2017 | Shell 2.47.085 0.3 | $300.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Call with settlement judge. Prepare
10/9/2017 | McLetchie | for settlement conference. 4.5 | $450.00 | $2,025.00 $2,025.00
Prepare binders, exhibits, and case
law for tomorrow’s settlement
conference. Email reminder to Mr.
Moyer and Mr. Cook re same.
Attention to payments re settlement
Pharan figures; chart for Ms. McLetchie re
10/9/2017 | Burchfield | same. 1.0 | $100.00 | $100.00 $100.00
Settlement preparation: assist Ms.
McLetchie in preparing for
settlement conference by drafting
Alina talking points regarding issues with
10/10/2017 | Shell Henderson’s privilege log. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Margaret | Prepare for settlement conference.
10/10/2017 | McLetchie | Direct Ms. Burchfield re items 4.2 | $450.00 | $1,890.00 $1,890.00
21 IA

LV

0774
RJ021




Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
needed. Attend settlement
conference. Update team re same.
Margaret | Continued work on proposed
10/10/2017 | McLetchie | revision to Henderson ordinance. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Final preparation (update settlement
Pharan chart) for today’s settlement
10/10/2017 | Burchfield | conference. 0.3 | $100.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, email
to Court requesting hearing to
Alina obtain clarification re order on
10/11/2017 | Shell motion for attorney’s fees. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Margaret | Emails with counsel for Henderson
10/11/2017 | McLetchie | re motion for clarification. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Email to NPRI director Bob Fellner
and Nevada Press Assoc. director
Barry Smith re instructions for
submitting written comments on
Alina Henderson City Council agenda
10/18/2017 | Shell items. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Margaret | Attention to new City of Henderson
10/18/2017 | McLetchie | proposed ordinance. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Review minutes and video of
October 17 Henderson City Council
meeting to determine what
happened to proposed revision to
Henderson Municipal Code
Alina regarding public records fees. Email
10/19/2017 | Shell to Ms. McLetchie re same. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Draft motion for reconsideration of
Alina order regarding limited award of
10/26/2017 | Shell attorney’s fees. 1.0 | $300.00 | $300.00 $300.00
Alina Finalize motion for reconsideration
10/26/2017 | Shell for filing. 0.1 [ $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Review Nevada Rules of Appellate
Procedure regarding transcript
requests. Discuss same with Ms.
Burchfield in re preparation of
Alina required transcript request. Review
10/26/2017 | Shell and edit draft transcript request. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Alina Review and approve request for
10/26/2017 | Shell transcript of proceedings. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Reviewing District Court docket to
confirm whether or not to request
transcripts for appeal; confirm
decision not to request transcript
with attorneys; and draft and
Pharan file/serve Certificate That No
10/26/2017 | Burchfield | Transcript Is Being Requested. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Discuss motion for clarification
with Ms. McLetchie. Address her
Alina edits and suggestions and circulate
11/8/2017 | Shell new draft of motion. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Margaret | Confer with Ms. Shell re Motion;
11/8/2017 | McLetchie | revise same. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Pharan Finalize, file, and serve/mail Motion
11/8/2017 | Burchfield | for Clarification. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Alina Phone call from Brian Reeves to
11/17/2017 | Shell discuss procedural issues re appeals. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Phone call from Brian Reeves
regarding possible consolidation of
appeals or, alternatively, requesting
Alina clustering of appeals pursuant to
11/20/2017 | Shell Supreme Court Internal procedures. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Review Opposition to motion for
clarification of award of attorney’s
Alina fees and draft Reply. (1.0). Legal
12/4/2017 | Shell research re same. (0.5). 1.5 | $300.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Edit reply to opposition to motion
Alina for clarification of order re
12/5/2017 | Shell attorney’s fee award. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Address Ms. McLetchie’s final edit
Alina to reply to opposition to motion for
12/5/2017 | Shell clarification. 0.3 | $300.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Prepare courtesy copy for Judge
Pharan Bailus re hearing on Motion for
12/5/2017 | Burchfield | Clarification re Attorney’s Fees. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Finalize, file, and serve/mail Reply
Pharan to City of Henderson’s Opposition
12/5/2017 | Burchfield | to Motion for Clarification. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Dropped off courtesy binder for
Hearing of Motion for Clarification
at the Las Vegas Regional Justice
Admin Center: 200 Lewis Ave. Las Vegas,
12/7/2017 | Admin NV, 89101 Department 18. 0.3 | $25.00 | $7.50 $7.50
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
In court for hearing on motion for
Alina clarification of award of attorney’s
12/13/2017 | Shell fees. 2.0 | $300.00 | $600.00 $600.00
Email to Ms. McLetchie
summarizing hearing on motion for
Alina clarification of court’s award of
12/13/2017 | Shell attorney’s fees. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Margaret | Confer with Ms. Shell re outcome
12/13/2017 | McLetchie | of hearing. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Review NRAP 30 and register of
actions and compile list of
Alina documents for proposed joint
1/3/2018 | Shell appendix for the opening brief. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Alina Email Mr. Reeve proposed joint
1/3/2018 | Shell appendix list for discussion. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Margaret | Approve list of items for inclusion
1/3/2018 | McLetchie | in proposed joint appendix. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Alina Edit motion for extension of time
1/9/2018 | Shell for filing opening brief. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Phone call to Mr. Reeve to ascertain
Alina Henderson’s position regarding
1/9/2018 | Shell motion for extension of time. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Further edits to motion for
Alina extension of time pursuant to
1/9/2018 | Shell comments from Ms. McLetchie. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Margaret
1/9/2018 | McLetchie | Revise motion for extension. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Pharan Draft Motion for Extension re
1/9/2018 | Burchfield | Opening Brief and Appendix for 0.4 | $100.00 | $40.00 $40.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
attorneys’ review. File and serve re
same.
Respond to email from Mr. Reeve
regarding documents Henderson
Alina would like included in Joint
1/10/2018 | Shell Appendix for appeal. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Begin gathering and prepare
Pharan potential exhibits for upcoming
1/10/2018 | Burchfield | Joint Appendix re appeal filing. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Pharan Draft Joint Appendix; combine
1/11/2018 | Burchfield | exhibits into volumes. 0.4 | $100.00 | $40.00 $40.00
Pharan Finalize (Bates-stamp and volume)
1/18/2018 | Burchfield | Joint Appendix. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Alina Begin drafting preliminary parts of
2/6/2018 | Shell opening brief. 2.0 | $300.00 | $600.00 $600.00
Resume drafting Opening Brief:
attention to statement of facts and
Alina standard of review. Begin drafting
2/7/2018 | Shell argument section. 3.0 | $300.00 | $900.00 $900.00
Alina Complete argument section of
2/8/2018 | Shell opening brief. 7.7 1 $300.00 | $2,310.00 $2,310.00
Draft, file, and serve Unopposed
Motion for Extension of Time to
Pharan File Appellant’s Opening Brief and
2/9/2018 | Burchfield | Appendix [Second Request]. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Margaret
2/12/2018 | McLetchie | Attention to opening brief. 1.8 | $450.00 | $810.00 $810.00
Margaret | Continued attention to work on
2/15/2018 | McLetchie | opening brief. 2.3 ] $450.00 | $1,035.00 $1,035.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Leo Edit, cite check, and proofread
2/16/2018 | Wolpert Opening Brief., 3.5 | $250.00 | $875.00 $875.00
Margaret
2/16/2018 | McLetchie | Revisions to Opening Brief. 1.2 | $450.00 | $540.00 $540.00
Margaret | Continued attention to Opening
2/16/2018 | McLetchie | Brief. 5.9 | $450.00 | $2,655.00 $2,655.00
Prepare/format Opening Brief,
including Table of Contents, Table
of Authorities, Certificate of
Compliance, and Certificate of
Service; incorporate final edits from
Pharan attorneys and file/serve Opening
2/16/2018 | Burchfield | Brief. 1.9 | $100.00 | $190.00 $190.00
Margaret | Follow up re status re service of
2/21/2018 | McLetchie | brief and appendix. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Review draft stipulation sent by
Henderson City Attorney Brian
Alina Reeve and email approval for e-
3/14/2018 | Shell signature. 0.1 [ $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Consider/plan strategy and update
to clients advising regarding no
need to file notice of appeal,
Margaret | desirability of cross-appeal after
3/14/2018 | McLetchie | Henderson files Notice of Appeal. 0.5 | $450.00 | $225.00 $225.00
Review Nevada Rules of Appellate
Procedure to confirm deadline for
Alina filing cross-appeal. Memo to Ms.
3/16/2018 | Shell McLetchie re same. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Alina Edit notice of cross-appeal and case
3/23/2018 | Shell appeal statement. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Draft Notice of Cross-Appeal and
Pharan Case Appeal Statement for
3/23/2018 | Burchfield | attorney’s review/approval. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Final review and edit of notice of
cross-appeal and case appeal
Alina statement re order on motion for
3/26/2018 | Shell attorney fees. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Finalize, file, and serve/mail Notice
Pharan of Cross-Appeal and Case Appeal
3/26/2018 | Burchfield | Statement. 0.1 [ $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Margaret | Call with City of Henderson
3/28/2018 | McLetchie | attorneys’ attention to issues. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Draft Notice of Submission of
(September 21, 2017) Proposed
Pharan Order for Ms. McLetchie’s
3/28/2018 | Burchfield | review/approval. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Margaret | Emails regarding settlement; City of
3/29/2018 | McLetchie | Henderson Ordinance. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Email to Henderson regarding fees
4/3/2018 | McLetchie | payment. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
FEES APPEAL: Download and
review Notice of Cross-Appeal;
Pharan calendar deadline to file transcript
4/3/2018 | Burchfield | request and docketing statement. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Emails with Mr. Reeve regarding
Margaret | contempt (Henderson’s failure to
4/4/2018 | McLetchie | comply with fees and costs order). 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
FEES APPEAL: Begin drafting
Alina settlement statement for mandatory
4/5/2018 | Shell Supreme Court Settlement Program. 1.1 | $300.00 | $330.00 $330.00
FEES APPEAL: Resume drafting
settlement statement. Complete
sections regarding summary of legal
issues and suitability for settlement.
Alina Send draft to Ms. McLetchie for
4/6/2018 | Shell review. 2.2 | $300.00 | $660.00 $660.00
FEES APPEAL: Incorporate Ms.
Alina McLetchie’s edits into settlement
4/6/2018 | Shell statement. 0.7 | $300.00 | $210.00 $210.00
FEES APPEAL: Address questions
from Ms. Burchfield regarding
Alina exhibits for settlement statement
4/6/2018 | Shell and formatting of brief. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Alina Research regarding timeliness of
4/6/2018 | Shell motion to stay. 0.6 | $300.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Draft opposition to motion to stay
pending appeal, countermotion for
Leo order to show cause why Henderson
4/6/2018 | Wolpert isn’t in contempt. 6.5 | $250.00 | $1,625.00 $1,625.00
FEES APPEAL: Prepare exhibits in
support of confidential settlement
statement; finalize settlement
Pharan statement; and send (mail/email) to
4/6/2018 | Burchfield | Settlement Judge Kunin re same. 1.1 | $100.00 | $110.00 $110.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Research and draft regarding Order
Leo to Show Cause, orders without
4/7/2018 | Wolpert deadlines. 2.5 | $250.00 | $625.00 $625.00
Draft declaration for Ms. McLetchie
Alina in support of opposition to motion
4/9/2018 | Shell for stay. 0.5 | $300.00 | $150.00 $150.00
draft opposition to motion for stay,
particular attention to untimeliness
Leo and the unlikelihood of prevailing
4/9/2018 | Wolpert on appeal 5.3 | $250.00 | $1,325.00 $1,325.00
Incorporate Ms. Shell’s edits,
Leo further edits to opposition to motion
4/9/2018 | Wolpert to stay. 0.5 | $250.00 | $125.00 $125.00
Confer with Ms. Shell and Mr.
Margaret | Wolpert regarding Opposition to
4/9/2018 | McLetchie | Motion to Stay. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Proofread Mr. Wolpert’s draft of
opposition to motion for stay of
Alina order granting the Review-Journal
4/10/2018 | Shell attorney fees and costs. 0.5 | $300.00 | $150.00 $150.00
Hearing preparation: review cases
Alina cited in briefs and identify cases
4/10/2018 | Shell needed for argument. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Drop off courtesy copy of
Petitioner’s Opposition to
Respondent’s Motion for Stay
Pending Appeal and Countermotion
Admin for Order to Show Cause to Judge
4/10/2018 | Admin Bailus, Dept. 18 at the Phoenix 0.4 | $25.00 | $10.00 $10.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Building, located at 330 S 4th St,
Las Vegas, NV 89101.
Leo Final edits and cite checks to
4/10/2018 | Wolpert Opposition to motion to stay. 1.8 | $250.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Finalize, file, and serve/mail
Petitioner’s Opposition to
Respondent’s Motion for Stay
Pending Appeal and Countermotion
for Order to Show Cause; email
Pharan courtesy copy to opposing counsel
4/10/2018 | Burchfield | re same. 0.7 | $100.00 | $70.00 $70.00
Preparation for hearing on motion
Alina for stay of order awarding Review-
4/11/2018 | Shell Journal attorney fees. 0.5 | $300.00 | $150.00 $150.00
In court for hearing on Henderson’s
Alina motion for stay of order awarding
4/11/2018 | Shell attorney fees to Review-Journal. 0.8 | $300.00 | $240.00 $240.00
Memo to Ms. McLetchie regarding
outcome of hearing on Henderson’s
Alina motion for stay of order granting
4/11/2018 | Shell Review-Journal fees and costs. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
FEES APPEAL: Review appeal
docketing statement filed by
Alina Henderson regarding appeal of
4/11/2018 | Shell attorney fees. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Calls with Mr. Cook and Sandy
Margaret | regarding City of Henderson’s
4/11/2018 | McLetchie | current conduct re NPRA requests. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
FEES APPEAL: Prepare for and
attend premeditation call; Follow up
Margaret | with client regarding outcome and
4/11/2018 | McLetchie | plans regarding handling same. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
FEES APPEAL: Emails regarding
Margaret | attendance at settlement conference
4/12/2018 | McLetchie | by Ms. King. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Pharan Check docket for Court’s Minutes
4/12/2018 | Burchfield | re hearing re stay. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Save and review
Early Case Assessment Report;
Pharan calendar settlement conference re
4/12/2018 | Burchfield | same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan Check docket for Court’s Minutes
4/13/2018 | Burchfield | re hearing re stay. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan Check docket for Court’s Minutes
4/16/2018 | Burchfield | re hearing re stay. 0.1 [ $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Alina FEES APPEAL: Draft Nevada
4/18/2018 | Shell Supreme Court docketing statement. 0.9 | $300.00 | $270.00 $270.00
Check docket for Court’s Minutes
Pharan re hearing re stay; download and
4/18/2018 | Burchfield | save. 0.1 [ $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan FEES APPEAL: Begin drafting
4/18/2018 | Burchfield | Docketing Statement. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Margaret | FEES APPEAL: Revision to
4/23/2018 | McLetchie | Docketing Statement. 0.5 | $450.00 | $225.00 $225.00
FEES APPEAL: Finalize Docketing
Pharan Statement (prepare exhibits re
4/23/2018 | Burchfield | same); file and serve/mail re same. 0.6 | $100.00 | $60.00 $60.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
FEES APPEAL: Phone call with
Ms. Walker, assistant to Settlement
Pharan Judge Kunin, to confirm settlement
5/14/2018 | Burchfield | conference date. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Attention to case schedule; Possible
cancel of settlement conference;
Margaret | Call to Mr. Reeves and follow up
5/17/2018 | McLetchie | with office of settlement judge. 0.5 | $450.00 | $225.00 $225.00
FEES APPEAL: Follow up
Margaret | regarding Settlement Conference,
5/21/2018 | McLetchie | extension regarding Reply. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Alina FEES APPEAL: Edit and approve
5/23/2018 | Shell motion for extension of time. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
FEES APPEAL: Follow up
Margaret | regarding scheduling of Settlement
5/23/2018 | McLetchie | Conference. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
FEES APPEAL: Begin preparing
Unopposed Motion for Extension re
Reply Brief for attorneys’
Pharan review/approval. File and serve re
5/23/2018 | Burchfield | same. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
and review Amended Early Case
Pharan Assessment Report; calendar re
5/24/2018 | Burchfield | same; and email clients re same. 0.1 $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, review,
and save Order Granting Extension
Pharan to File Reply Brief; update
5/31/2018 | Burchfield | calendars and attorneys accordingly. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, email Mr. Reeve and Mr.
Kemble regarding staying briefing
Alina in appeal pending settlement
6/28/2018 | Shell conference. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
APPEAL: Review Henderson’s
Answering Brief and begin
organizing/outlining Reply. Shell
Alina document and begin responding to
7/12/2018 | Shell Henderson’s statement of facts. 0.9 | $300.00 | $270.00 $270.00
APPEAL: Resume drafting reply to
Alina Henderson’s statement of facts in its
7/13/2018 | Shell answering brief. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
APPEAL: Resume drafting reply
Alina brief: begin drafting reply to
7/19/2018 | Shell Henderson’s legal arguments. 6.6 | $300.00 | $1,980.00 $1,980.00
APPEAL: Resume drafting Reply
Brief: finish drafting legal
Alina arguments and email to Ms.
7/20/2018 | Shell McLetchie for review. 7.0 | $300.00 | $2,100.00 $2,100.00
Margaret
7/22/2018 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Revise reply. 2.9 | $450.00 | $1,305.00 $1,305.00
APPEAL: Attention to completing
Reply Brief: address Ms.
McLetchie’s revisions to draft, and
adding suggested facts and
argument; edit motion for leave to
Alina file excess pages; review NRAP to
7/23/2018 | Shell ensure compliance with rules for 7.1 |1 $300.00 | $2,130.00 $2,130.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
filing oversized brief and motion for
leave to file excess pages; conduct
additional legal research.
APPEAL.: Edit, proofread, enter Ms.
Leo McLetchie’s changes into reply
7/23/2018 | Wolpert brief. 2.7 | $250.00 | $675.00 $675.00
Margaret
7/23/2018 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Attention to reply brief. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Margaret | APPEAL: Attention to finalizing
7/23/2018 | McLetchie | Reply and associated filings. 3.0 | $450.00 | $1,350.00 $1,350.00
APPEAL: Finalize Motion for
Excess Pages/Type Volume; file
and serve re same. Finalize (format
Table of Contents, Table of
Authorities, Certificate of
Compliance, and Certificate of
Service) Appellant’s Reply Brief
Pharan (and addendum); file and serve re
7/23/2018 | Burchfield | same. 1.4 | $100.00 | $140.00 $140.00
APPEAL: Phone call with Ms.
Boyd (assistant) re Motion for
Excess Pages and Reply Brief;
Pharan email Ms. Boyd copy of proposed
7/30/2018 | Burchfield | Reply Brief. 0.1 [ $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL.: Call with Brian
Margaret | Reeve; attention to preparation for
8/8/2018 | McLetchie | settlement conference. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret | FEES APPEAL: Emails regarding
8/9/2018 | McLetchie | mediation. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
FEES APPEAL: Attention to
Margaret | preparation for settlement
8/13/2018 | McLetchie | conference. 3.0 | $450.00 | $1,350.00 $1,350.00
FEES APPEAL: Prepare for
Settlement Conference; Calls/emails
to client representatives regarding
same. Review municipal code
Margaret | provisions received from Mr.
8/13/2018 | McLetchie | Reeve. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
FEES APPEAL: Prepare post-
Pharan application chart re fees and costs
8/13/2018 | Burchfield | versus what client paid. 0.8 | $100.00 | $80.00 $80.00
Margaret | FEES APPEAL: Prepare for and
8/14/2018 | McLetchie | attend Mediation. 4.0 | $450.00 | $1,800.00 $1,800.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
Pharan and review Order Reinstating
8/17/2018 | Burchfield | Briefing; calendar accordingly. 0.1 [ $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Margaret | FEES APPEAL: Emails with Mr.
8/27/2018 | McLetchie | Reeve regarding transcript. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
FEES APPEAL: Email with
Margaret | opposing counsel regarding
8/28/2018 | McLetchie | transcript. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
FEES APPEAL: Incorporate Ms.
McLetchie’s responses to
Pharan Settlement Program Survey; mail to
8/28/2018 | Burchfield | Nevada Supreme Court re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Margaret | FEES APPEAL: Emails with Mr.
8/29/2018 | McLetchie | Reeve re consolidation inquiry. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
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Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

8/29/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Draft, file, and
send/serve Request for Transcript of
Proceedings into District Court
case; file and serve the District
Court’s file-stamped copy of
Request for Transcript of
Proceedings into Nevada Supreme
Court case.

0.2

$100.00

$20.00

$20.00

10/2/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Phone calls with
Ms. Page, Court Reporter for
Department 18, re status of
requested transcripts. Phone calls
with Ms. Martin, Court Reporter
with Litigation Services, re
requested transcripts. Phone call and
email communications with
Litigation Services re requested
transcripts re same.

0.2

$100.00

$20.00

$20.00

10/3/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Follow-up email
communications with Litigation
Services re status of requested
transcripts.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

10/4/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL.: Follow-up email
communications with Litigation
Services re status of requested
transcripts; receive transcripts; save
and review re same.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

10/15/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

APPEAL: Draft, file, and serve
Notice of Change of Firm Name.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
FEES APPEAL: Draft, file, and
Pharan serve Notice of Change of Firm
10/15/2018 | Burchfield | Name. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan Draft, file, and serve/mail Notice of
10/16/2018 | Burchfield | Change of Firm Name. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Attention to Supplemental Notice of
Authorities: Review pleadings filed
in case to identify pages of briefs
Alina being supplemented by recent
10/24/2018 | Shell decision in PERS v. NPRI. 0.9 | $300.00 | $270.00 $270.00
Margaret | APPEAL: Attention to revising
10/29/2018 | McLetchie | Notice of Supplemental Authority. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Pharan APPEAL: Finalize and file/serve
10/29/2018 | Burchfield | Notice of Supplemental Authority. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL: Download, save, and
Pharan review Order re Scheduling Oral
11/27/2018 | Burchfield | Argument; email attorneys re same. 0.1 [ $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Margaret | APPEAL: Review Notice
12/4/2018 | McLetchie | Scheduling Oral Argument. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
APPEAL: Download, save. and
review Notice of Oral Argument
Setting; and calendar deadlines as
Pharan appropriate. Email update to Mr.
12/4/2018 | Burchfield | Cook and Ms. Hendrix re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL: Draft Notice of
Pharan Appearance for Oral Argument for
12/10/2018 | Burchfield | attorneys’ review. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
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12/17/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Begin draft of
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on
cross appeal in attorney’s fee
appeal. Draft preliminary portions
of brief, including disclosure,
routing statement, jurisdictional
statement, and statement of the
issues for review. Draft statement of
facts.

24

$300.00

$720.00

$720.00

12/17/2018

Alina
Shell

APPEAL: Draft Motion to Continue
Oral Argument.

0.6

$300.00

$180.00

$180.00

12/17/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Drafting
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on
cross-appeal: draft standards of
review section.

0.2

$300.00

$60.00

$60.00

12/17/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Attention to
Answering Brief and Opening Brief
on cross appeal: Draft legal
argument regarding why the
Review-Journal was the prevailing
party. Research cases cited by
Henderson to rebut legal arguments
regarding same.

1.6

$300.00

$480.00

$480.00

12/17/2018

Margaret
McLetchie

APPEAL: Attention to Motion to
Continue Oral Argument.

0.2

$450.00

$90.00

$90.00

12/17/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

APPEAL.: Finalize and file/serve
Appellant’s Unopposed Motion to
Continue Oral Argument.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00
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12/18/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Continue work on
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on
cross-appeal: Resume drafting
arguments regarding why the
Review-Journal was the prevailing
party. Draft argument regarding
why NRS 239.012 does not
immunize Henderson from
attorney’s fees. Draft argument
regarding district court’s failure to
adequately address Brunzell factors.

4.1

$300.00

$1,230.00

$1,230.00

12/18/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Begin preparing
Respondent/Cross-Appellant’s
Appendix.

0.3

$100.00

$30.00

$30.00

12/19/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Resume drafting
answering brief/opening brief on
cross-appeal: Complete argument
regarding Brunzell, draft statement
of the case, and draft summary of
the argument. Add additional case
and record citations.

24

$300.00

$720.00

$720.00

12/19/2018

Leo
Wolpert

FEES APPEAL: Edit Answering
Brief/Opening Brief in attorney’s
fees appeal.

23

$250.00

$575.00

$575.00

12/20/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Continued work on
answering brief/opening brief on
cross-appeal: address Ms.
McLetchie’s preliminary edits to
first draft of brief. Insert citations to

34

$300.00

$1,020.00

$1,020.00
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Respondent’s Appendix. Re-
organize and expand statement of
facts to address LVRIJ’s request for
clarification of order on motion for
attorney’s fees, other related appeal,
and Henderson’s actions after filing
of petition.

12/20/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Address Ms.
McLetchie’s edits to draft of
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on
cross-appeal. Review, edit, and
proofread entire brief.

23

$300.00

$690.00

$690.00

12/20/2018

Leo
Wolpert

FEES APPEAL.: Final hardcopy
edits and proofreading of
Answering/Opening Brief re
attorney’s fees and costs.

1.4

$250.00

$350.00

$350.00

12/20/2018

Margaret
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Revise brief.

2.0

$450.00

$900.00

$900.00

12/20/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Finalize
Respondent/Cross-Appellant’s
Appendix; file and serve re same.
Format and create Table of
Contents, Table of Authorities,
Certificate of Compliance, and
Certificate of Service. Finalize
Answering Brief and Opening Brief
on Cross-Appeal; file and serve re
same.

1.4

$100.00

$140.00

$140.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Margaret
12/27/2018 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Review order. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Email communication with Ms.
Page, court reporter, confirming
Pharan receipt of hearing transcripts from
12/28/2018 | Burchfield | relief court reporter, Ms. Martin. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Emails to City of
Margaret | Henderson agreeing to extension;
1/3/2019 | McLetchie | attention to stipulation re same. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
and review Notice of Court
Reporter Ms. Page re requested
Pharan transcripts (Certificate of
1/8/2019 | Burchfield | Acknowledgment). 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL: Download, save, and
review City of Henderson’s Notice
of Appearance at Oral Argument;
confirm with Ms. McLetchie when
Pharan she would like to file Las Vegas
1/18/2019 | Burchfield | Review-Journal’s Notice re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL: Draft Notice of
Pharan Appearance at Oral Argument for
1/18/2019 | Burchfield | Ms. McLetchie’s review. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL: Download, save, and
Pharan review Oral Argument Reminder
1/23/2019 | Burchfield | Notice; confirm calendar re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL.: Finalize, file, and serve
Pharan Notice of Appearance for Oral
1/23/2019 | Burchfield | Argument. 0.1 $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Lacey APPEAL: Prepare binder for Ms.
1/28/2019 | Ambro McLetchie for Oral Argument. 0.9 | $100.00 | $90.00 $90.00
APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, review briefs filed in appeal
Alina and identify cases for Ms. Ambro to
2/1/2019 | Shell print in preparation for argument. 0.7 | $300.00 | $210.00 $210.00
APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, begin outlining argument
Alina regarding insufficiency of
2/1/2019 | Shell Henderson’s privilege log. 1.5 | $300.00 | $450.00 $450.00
APPEAL: Prepare cases and
Lacey authorities for Ms. McLetchie for
2/1/2019 | Ambro Oral Argument prep. 2.4 | $100.00 | $240.00 $240.00
Margaret
2/1/2019 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Margaret
2/2/2019 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 5.0 | $450.00 | $2,250.00 $2,250.00
APPEAL: Research adequacy of
privilege log in Nevada and 9th
circuit, compare to ones provided
by Henderson, research
Leo reasonable/standard rates for
2/3/2019 | Wolpert document review. 0.9 | $250.00 | $225.00 $225.00
Margaret
2/3/2019 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 3.0 | $450.00 | $1,350.00 $1,350.00
APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in
Leo preparation for Oral Argument,
2/4/2019 | Wolpert including updating outline of cases 2.5 ] $250.00 | $625.00 $625.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
and further research on public
records act cases.
Margaret | APPEAL: Travel and Argument
2/4/2019 | McLetchie | Prep. 8.0 | $450.00 | $3,600.00 $3,600.00
APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in
Leo Oral Argument prep by reviewing
2/5/2019 | Wolpert documents / privilege log. 0.8 | $250.00 | $200.00 $200.00
Margaret | APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep.
2/5/2019 | McLetchie | Argument. [REDUCED ENTRY] 6.5 | $450.00 | $2,925.00 $2,925.00
Margaret | Attention to Motion for Attorney
2/5/2019 | McLetchie | Fees. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
2/6/2019 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Travel. 4.0 | $450.00 | $1,800.00 $1,800.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
and review City of Henderson’s
Reply Brief on Appeal and
Answering Brief on Cross-Appeal;
Pharan calendar accordingly; and update
2/12/2019 | Burchfield | attorneys and Mr. Lipman re same. 0.1 [ $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Phone call with
Nevada Supreme Court Clerk re
extension for Reply Brief on Cross-
Appeal; download, save, and review
Order Granting Telephonic
Pharan Extension re same; update attorneys
2/20/2019 | Burchfield | and calendars accordingly. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Begin drafting
Alina Reply Brief on Cross-Appeal,
3/4/2019 | Shell review Henderson’s Answering 1.8 | $300.00 | $540.00 $540.00
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Brief/Reply Brief, research legal
issue regarding whether the
Amended Petition superseded the
original Petition, and begin drafting
legal arguments.

3/4/2019

Margaret
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL.: Attention to Reply
Brief: provide direction to Ms.
Shell.

0.4

$450.00

$180.00

$180.00

3/11/2019

Margaret
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Attention to Reply
Brief: confer with Ms. Shell re
status and provide her with
direction.

0.4

$450.00

$180.00

$180.00

3/12/2019

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Resume drafting
Reply Brief on cross-appeal and
address direction from Ms.
McLetchie; draft legal arguments
regarding statutory interpretation,
the legal landscape regarding
“prevailing” parties, and the court’s
reduction of the LVRJ’s fee award.
Review Henderson’s Reply
Brief/Answering Brief and identify
any additional arguments that need
to be addressed.

6.6

$300.00

$1,980.00

$1,980.00

3/12/2019

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Review and
incorporate Mr. Lipman’s edits to
Reply Brief; conduct hard copy edit
of final draft.

1.3

$300.00

$390.00

$390.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
FEES APPEAL: Draft policy
Leo argument sections of Reply Brief,
3/12/2019 | Wolpert proofreading. 3.7 | $250.00 | $925.00 $925.00
FEES APPEAL: Revisions to Reply
Margaret | Brief/approve final version for
3/12/2019 | McLetchie | filing. 1.1 | $450.00 | $495.00 $495.00
FEES APPEAL: Incorporate
attorneys’ edits to Reply Brief on
Cross-Appeal; format, create Table
of Authorities, Table of Contents,
Certificate of Compliance, and
Certificate of Service; finalize
Pharan Reply Brief of Cross-Appeal and
3/12/2019 | Burchfield | file/serve re same. 1.3 | $100.00 | $130.00 $130.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
and review Reply Brief on Cross-
Pharan Appeal; and email Mr. Lipman re
3/13/2019 | Burchfield | same. 0.1 [ $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Margaret | APPEAL: Review order. Update to
5/28/2019 | McLetchie | client re same. 0.6 | $450.00 | $270.00 $270.00
APPEAL: Download, save, and
review Order Affirming in Part,
Pharan Reversing in Part and Remanding;
5/28/2019 | Burchfield | ad update attorneys re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL: Download, save, and
review
Pharan Issued Remittitur; and update
7/17/2019 | Burchfield | attorneys re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
and review Order Submitting for
Pharan Decision Without Oral Argument;
7/22/2019 | Burchfield | and update attorneys re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Email with Mr. Lipman re case.
Margaret | Follow up via email / leave message
7/24/2019 | McLetchie | for Henderson. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Obtain documents from Henderson
7/24/2019 | McLetchie | and provide to client. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
FEES APPEAL: Email Mr. Lipman
and Ms. Togo file-stamped copy of
Pharan the Order Submitting for Decision
7/29/2019 | Burchfield | Without Oral Argument. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Margaret
10/17/2019 | McLetchie | Review order. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
Pharan and review Order of Reversal; and
10/17/2019 | Burchfield | update attorneys re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Phone call with Mr. Reeve
Alina regarding possible resolution of
10/24/2019 | Shell case. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Download, save, and review Order
Setting Further Proceedings
consistent with Supreme Court
Pharan Order; update attorneys and
11/8/2019 | Burchfield | calendar accordingly. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
Pharan and review Issued Remittitur; and
11/26/2019 | Burchfield | update attorneys re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Prepare for and attend status check
Alina on remand and draft update memo
12/12/2019 | Shell to file re same. 1.2 | $300.00 | $360.00 $360.00
Margaret | Confer with Ms. Shell re hearing,
12/12/2019 | McLetchie | status of case, next steps. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Confer with Ms. Shell re briefing
12/13/2019 | McLetchie | schedule; plans re same. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Download, save, and review Court
Minutes from 12/12/19 hearing re
Status Check Order Setting Further
Proceedings re Supreme Court
Pharan Order; update attorneys and
12/17/2019 | Burchfield | calendar accordingly. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Follow up phone call and email to
Alina Mr. Kennedy regarding need to set
12/31/2019 | Shell briefing schedule. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Email Court regarding extension of
Pharan time to submit a proposed order re
12/31/2019 | Burchfield | briefing schedule. 0.1 [ $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Email communications with
Pharan Department 8 re extension of
1/3/2020 | Burchfield | proposed order. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Phone call with Brian Reeve re
Alina setting briefing schedule for
1/6/2020 | Shell attorney’s fees issue. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Draft Stipulation and Order re
Briefing Schedule on Motion for
Lacey Attorney’s Fees. Circulate to Ms.
1/6/2020 | Ambro McLetchie and Ms. Shell. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
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1/7/2020

Alina
Shell

Review stipulation regarding
attorney’s fees briefing schedule
and email same to Mr. Reeve.

0.1

$300.00

$30.00

$30.00

1/8/2020

Admin
Admin

Travel to/from office to City of
Henderson to pick up signed
Stipulation and Order Regarding
Briefing Schedule for Motion for
Attorney’s Fees.

1.3

$25.00

$32.50

$32.50

1/8/2020

Admin
Admin

Travel to/from Phoenix Building -
Dept. 8 to drop off Stipulation and
Order Regarding Briefing Schedule
for Motion for Attorney’s Fees

0.6

$25.00

$15.00

$15.00

1/8/2020

Pharan
Burchfield

Coordinate with Mr. Reeve at the
City of Henderson re pick-up
original signatures on Stipulation
and Order Regarding Briefing
Schedule for Motion for Attorney’s
Fees; and direct Ms. Barker to pick-
up and deliver to Department 8
accordingly.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

1/10/2020

Admin
Admin

Travel to/from office to Phoenix
Building - Dept. 8 to pick up
Stipulation and Order Re Briefing
Schedule for Motion for Attorneys’
Fees.

0.4

$25.00

$10.00

$10.00

1/10/2020

Pharan
Burchfield

File Stipulation and Order
Regarding Briefing Schedule for
Motion for Attorney Fees; draft,
file, and serve Notice of Entry of

0.2

$100.00

$20.00

$20.00
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Stipulation and Order Regarding
Briefing Schedule for Motion for
Attorney Fees; update attorneys and
calendar accordingly.

1/30/2020

Alina
Shell

Begin drafting new motion for
attorney’s fees: start drafting
introduction and statement of facts.

1.1

$300.00

$330.00

$330.00

2/2/2020

Alina
Shell

Finish draft of renewed motion for
attorney’s fees: complete legal
argument and verify record
citations.

3.6

$300.00

$1,080.00

$1,080.00

2/3/2020

Alina
Shell

Expand renewed motion for
attorney’s fees consistent with
comments and direction from Ms.
McLetchie.

2.0

$300.00

$600.00

$600.00

2/3/2020

Margaret
McLetchie

Review initial draft of Fees Motion.
Review applicable Supreme Court
orders. Confer with Ms. Shell re
approach. Direct her to further
research.

0.3

$450.00

$135.00

$135.00

2/3/2020

Pharan
Burchfield

Prepare exhibits (create charts re
fees and costs; redact) and Ms.
McLetchie’s Declaration for
upcoming Attorney Fees
Application to be reviewed by
attorneys.

3.7

$100.00

$370.00

$370.00

2/3/2020

Alina
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, draft
memo for client explaining renewed
motion for attorney’s fees.

0.2

$300.00

$60.00

$60.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Attention to attorney’s fees motion:
review spreadsheet of costs
prepared by Ms. Burchfield and edit
Alina spreadsheet to exclude non-
2/3/2020 | Shell reimbursable costs. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Margaret
2/4/2020 | McLetchie | Attention to Fees Motion. 1.5 | $450.00 | $675.00 $675.00
Prepare exhibits (fees; hours) for
attorneys’ review and approval;
Pharan organize by date and by user
2/4/2020 | Burchfield | specific. 1.1]$100.00 | $110.00 $110.00
Attention to motion for attorney’s
fees: review and edit spreadsheet of
attorney’s fees to reduce entries that
we previously agreed to reduce at
Alina hearing on first motion for
2/5/2020 | Shell attorney’s fees. 0.3 | $300.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Finalize exhibits (fees by date; fees
by user); Bates-label exhibits;
finalize Ms. McLetchie’s
Pharan Declaration in Support of Renewed
2/5/2020 | Burchfield | Motion for Attorney’s Fees. 2.1 | $100.00 | $210.00 $210.00
Review and finalize Ms.
Alina McLetchie’s declaration in support
2/5/2020 | Shell of motion for attorney’s fees. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Review and confirm declaration in
Margaret | support of motion for attorney’s
2/6/2020 | McLetchie | fees; sign re same. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Finalize Renewed Motion for
Attorney’s Fees and exhibits;
Lacey prepare filing; file and serve re
2/6/2020 | Ambro same. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Finalize Renewed Motion for
Alina Attorney’s Fees and confirm
2/6/2020 | Shell exhibits re same. 0.5 | $300.00 | $150.00 $150.00
TOTALS 399.2 $(1,780.00) | $122,455.00
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6/19/2017

Admin
Admin

Paid Bond on Appeal to the Nevada
District Court (Check #2059) at the
Regional Justice Center - 200 Lewis
Ave. Las Vegas, NV, 89101 3rd
Floor.

0.9

$25.00

$22.50

$22.50

6/20/2017

Admin
Admin

Paid Appeal Filing fee to Nevada
Supreme Court (Check # 2060) at
408 East Clark Street Las Vegas, NV
89101.

0.7

$25.00

$17.50

$17.50

7/31/2017

Admin
Admin

Dropped off Attorneys’ Fees
briefing binder at the Las Vegas
Phoenix Building: 330 S 3rd St. Las
Vegas NV, 89101 Department 18.

0.3

$25.00

$7.50

$7.50

12/7/2017

Admin
Admin

Dropped off courtesy binder for
Hearing of Motion for Clarification
at the Las Vegas Regional Justice
Center: 200 Lewis Ave. Las Vegas,
NV, 89101 Department 18.

0.3

$25.00

$7.50

$7.50

4/10/2018

Admin
Admin

Drop off courtesy copy of
Petitioner’s Opposition to
Respondent’s Motion for Stay
Pending Appeal and Countermotion
for Order to Show Cause to Judge
Bailus, Dept. 18 at the Phoenix
Building, located at 330 S 4th St,
Las Vegas, NV 89101.

0.4

$25.00

$10.00

$10.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Travel to/from office to City of
Henderson to pick up signed
Stipulation and Order Regarding
Admin Briefing Schedule for Motion for
1/8/2020 | Admin Attorney’s Fees. 1.3 | $25.00 | $32.50 $32.50
Travel to/from Phoenix Building -
Dept. 8 to drop off Stipulation and
Admin Order Regarding Briefing Schedule
1/8/2020 | Admin for Motion for Attorney’s Fees 0.6 | $25.00 | $15.00 $15.00
Travel to/from office to Phoenix
Building - Dept. 8 to pick up
Stipulation and Order Re Briefing
Admin Schedule for Motion for Attorneys’
1/10/2020 | Admin Fees. 0.4 | $25.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Totals for Admin Admin 4.9 $122.50
Begin review of draft complaint.
Check citations and find Henderson
Public Records policy and relevant
Alina Henderson Municipal code re fee
11/28/2016 | Shell schedule. 1.8 | $300.00 | $540.00 $540.00
Voicemail for Mr. Reeves at City of
Alina Henderson re accepting service of
11/29/2016 | Shell petition. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Alina Review and finalize petition for writ
11/29/2016 | Shell of mandamus. 1.2 | $300.00 | $360.00 $360.00
Trosper: Review NRS 34 to confirm
Alina compliance with same in submitting
1/9/2017 | Shell petition to Court. 0.3 | $300.00 | $90.00 $90.00
2
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Date

Biller

Note

Quantity

Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

2/8/2017

Alina
Shell

Confer with Ms. McLetchie
regarding amending petition for
relief and drafting supporting brief.
Review correspondence between
Ms. McLetchie and City of
Henderson. Begin drafting brief in
support of petition.

8.6

$300.00

$2,580.00

$2,580.00

3/14/2017

Alina
Shell

Draft public records request letter to
City of Henderson for records
pertaining to payment of law firm
Bailey Kennedy for legal
representation in this matter.

0.3

$300.00

$90.00

$(90.00)

3/20/2017

Alina
Shell

Review City of Henderson response
to amended petition and
memorandum; confer with Ms.
McLetchie re same.

1.0

$300.00

$300.00

$300.00

3/20/2017

Alina
Shell

Revise and finalize PRA letter to
City of Henderson requesting
records pertaining to payments to
Bailey Kennedy for representation in
Las Vegas Review-Journal v. City of
Henderson.

0.4

$300.00

$120.00

$(120.00)
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Date

Biller

Note

Quantity

Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

3/21/2017

Alina
Shell

Legal research regarding exclusive
remedies argument raised by
Henderson in its response to opening
brief. Research regarding declaratory
relief. Review of order entered in
Gray v. Clark County School
District matter regarding
extraordinary use. Attention to
drafting reply to Henderson’s
response.

4.3

$300.00

$1,290.00

$1,290.00

3/22/2017

Alina
Shell

Continue drafting reply to response
to amended petition/memorandum in
support of petition.

5.1

$300.00

$1,530.00

$1,530.00

3/22/2017

Alina
Shell

Review and edit stipulation for
extension of time.

0.2

$300.00

$60.00

$60.00

3/23/2017

Alina
Shell

Resume drafting reply to Henderson
response. Review Henderson’s Third
Privilege Log. Review
communications with Henderson for
inclusion in statement of facts. Legal
research regarding scope of
deliberative process privilege and
attorney-client privilege. Edit
declaration.

9.6

$300.00

$2,880.00

$2,880.00

3/29/2017

Alina
Shell

Review briefing and cases in
preparation for upcoming hearing.

1.7

$300.00

$510.00

$510.00

3/30/2017

Alina
Shell

Prepare for and attend hearing on
petition re Henderson public records.

1.6

$300.00

$480.00

$480.00

JA
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Draft edits and commentary to
Henderson’s proposed order re
Alina NPRA petition. Review transcript of
4/14/2017 | Shell hearing on petition. 0.8 | $300.00 | $240.00 $240.00
Update redline to proposed order re
Alina petition for public records. Circulate
4/21/2017 | Shell to Ms. McLetchie for further review. 0.5 | $300.00 | $150.00 $150.00
Review order re petition for writ of
mandamus. Verify calculated
Alina deadlines for filing motion for
5/15/2017 | Shell attorney’s fees and notice of appeal. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Alina
5/31/2017 | Shell Draft application for attorney fees. 3.2 | $300.00 | $960.00 $960.00
Review spreadsheet of attorney fees
to be included as exhibit to motion
for attorney fees. Edit and update
Alina draft motion. Circulate to Ms.
6/1/2017 | Shell McLetchie. 1.1 | $300.00 | $330.00 $330.00
Attention to revised spreadsheets of
Alina costs and fees for inclusion in
6/1/2017 | Shell motion for attorney fees and costs. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Draft declaration for Ms. McLetchie
Alina in support of motion for attorney
6/1/2017 | Shell fees. Compile proposed exhibits. 0.7 | $300.00 | $210.00 $210.00
Draft renewed PRA request to City
of Henderson for payments to Bailey
Kennedy for legal services provided
Alina in this matter. Edit and finalize
6/1/2017 | Shell letter. 0.5 [ $300.00 | $150.00 $150.00
5
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Date

Biller

Note

Quantity

Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

6/1/2017

Alina
Shell

Incorporate edits to motion for
attorney fees and supporting
declaration provided by Ms.
McLetchie and Mr. Wolpert.

1.7

$300.00

$510.00

$510.00

6/9/2017

Alina
Shell

Draft case appeal statement.

1.1

$300.00

$330.00

$330.00

7/10/2017

Alina
Shell

Attention to preparing docketing
statement for filing with Nevada
Supreme Court. Address docketing
statement questions regarding nature
of action, issues on appeal,
jurisdiction, retention by the
Supreme Court, and other areas.
Review and incorporate changes and
edits to same provided by Ms.
McLetchie.

2.0

$300.00

$600.00

$600.00

7/21/2017

Alina
Shell

Email to counsel for City of
Henderson regarding issue with the
City’s exhibits in its opposition to
Las Vegas Review-Journal’s motion
for attorney’s fees.

0.1

$300.00

$30.00

$30.00

7/27/2017

Alina
Shell

Review and address Ms.
McLetchie’s edits to reply to
opposition to motion for attorney’s
fees and costs.

7.0

$300.00

$2,100.00

$2,100.00

8/2/2017

Alina
Shell

Prepare for hearing on motion for
attorney’s fees. Review pleadings
and draft outline of points to address
during hearing.

1.6

$300.00

$480.00

$480.00

JA
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Prepare for hearing on motion for
attorney’s fees. In court for
argument on same. Memo to Ms.
Alina McLetchie regarding outcome of
8/3/2017 | Shell hearing. 2.7 [ $300.00 | $810.00 $810.00
Prepare for continued hearing on
Alina motion for attorney’s fees. Appear in
8/10/2017 | Shell court re same. 3.0 | $300.00 | $900.00 $900.00
Discuss continued hearing on motion
Alina for attorney’s fees with Ms.
8/10/2017 | Shell McLetchie. Discuss next steps. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Discuss proposed order re motion for
attorney’s fees with Ms. McLetchie.
Email City of Henderson attorneys
Alina regarding stipulation for extension of
8/24/2017 | Shell time for submitting proposed order. 0.3 | $300.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Draft proposed stipulation and order
re extension of time for submitting
Alina order to court. Email to Josh Reid re
8/24/2017 | Shell same. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Re-draft stipulation to extend time
Alina for submitting proposed order as
8/24/2017 | Shell motion for extension of time. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Draft proposed order granting
motion for attorney’s fees and costs.
Alina Email same to Ms. McLetchie for
8/31/2017 | Shell review. 2.7 [ $300.00 | $810.00 $810.00
7

JA
LV

0813
RJO59




Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Review and discuss Ms.
McLetchie’s edits to proposed order
granting motion for attorney’s fees
Alina and costs. Incorporate edits into draft
9/7/2017 | Shell order. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Alina Draft confidential settlement
9/7/2017 | Shell statement. 0.3 | $300.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Phone call to Brian Reeves at
Henderson City Attorney’s office to
obtain Henderson’s position
Alina regarding additional extension of
9/7/2017 | Shell time for submitting proposed order. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Review and edit second motion for
Alina extension of time for submitting
9/7/2017 | Shell proposed order. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Review Mr. Reeves’ redline edit of
order re attorney fees. Edit and
Alina revise redline. Circulate to Ms.
9/20/2017 | Shell McLetchie for review. 0.6 | $300.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, revise
Alina proposed order regarding motion for
9/21/2017 | Shell attorney’s fees. 0.6 | $300.00 | $180.00 $180.00
8
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Date

Biller

Note

Quantity

Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

9/25/2017

Alina
Shell

Resume drafting settlement
statement for upcoming settlement
conference. Review Henderson’s
proposed revision to its municipal
code regarding fees for fulfilling
public records requests, and
incorporate facts and analysis re
same into settlement statement. Draft
legal argument. Identify exhibits for
inclusion with settlement statement.

23

$300.00

$690.00

$690.00

9/28/2017

Alina
Shell

Additional edits to draft settlement
statement. Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, research legislative history
of NRS 239.055.

3.3

$300.00

$990.00

$990.00

10/9/2017

Alina
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request,
research legislative history of NRS
239.055 (fees provision) and NRS
239.012 (bad faith provision) in
preparation for settlement
conference.

1.6

$300.00

$480.00

$480.00

10/9/2017

Alina
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, draft
proposed language for revision to
Henderson Municipal Code 2.47.085

0.3

$300.00

$90.00

$90.00

10/10/2017

Alina
Shell

Settlement preparation: assist Ms.
McLetchie in preparing for
settlement conference by drafting
talking points regarding issues with
Henderson’s privilege log.

0.4

$300.00

$120.00

$120.00
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Date

Biller

Note

Quantity

Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

10/11/2017

Alina
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, email
to Court requesting hearing to obtain
clarification re order on motion for
attorney’s fees.

0.1

$300.00

$30.00

$30.00

10/18/2017

Alina
Shell

Email to NPRI director Bob Fellner
and Nevada Press Assoc. director
Barry Smith re instructions for
submitting written comments on
Henderson City Council agenda
items.

0.1

$300.00

$30.00

$30.00

10/19/2017

Alina
Shell

Review minutes and video of
October 17 Henderson City Council
meeting to determine what happened
to proposed revision to Henderson
Municipal Code regarding public
records fees. Email to Ms.
McLetchie re same.

0.1

$300.00

$30.00

$30.00

10/26/2017

Alina
Shell

Draft motion for reconsideration of
order regarding limited award of
attorney’s fees.

1.0

$300.00

$300.00

$300.00

10/26/2017

Alina
Shell

Finalize motion for reconsideration
for filing.

0.1

$300.00

$30.00

$30.00

10/26/2017

Alina
Shell

Review Nevada Rules of Appellate
Procedure regarding transcript
requests. Discuss same with Ms.
Burchfield in re preparation of
required transcript request. Review
and edit draft transcript request.

0.2

$300.00

$60.00

$60.00

10
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Alina Review and approve request for
10/26/2017 | Shell transcript of proceedings. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Discuss motion for clarification with
Ms. McLetchie. Address her edits
Alina and suggestions and circulate new
11/8/2017 | Shell draft of motion. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Alina Phone call from Brian Reeves to
11/17/2017 | Shell discuss procedural issues re appeals. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Phone call from Brian Reeves
regarding possible consolidation of
appeals or, alternatively, requesting
Alina clustering of appeals pursuant to
11/20/2017 | Shell Supreme Court Internal procedures. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Review Opposition to motion for
clarification of award of attorney’s
Alina fees and draft Reply. (1.0). Legal
12/4/2017 | Shell research re same. (0.5). 1.5 ] $300.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Edit reply to opposition to motion
Alina for clarification of order re
12/5/2017 | Shell attorney’s fee award. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Address Ms. McLetchie’s final edit
Alina to reply to opposition to motion for
12/5/2017 | Shell clarification. 0.3 | $300.00 | $90.00 $90.00
In court for hearing on motion for
Alina clarification of award of attorney’s
12/13/2017 | Shell fees. 2.0 | $300.00 | $600.00 $600.00
11
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Email to Ms. McLetchie
summarizing hearing on motion for
Alina clarification of court’s award of
12/13/2017 | Shell attorney’s fees. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Review NRAP 30 and register of
actions and compile list of
Alina documents for proposed joint
1/3/2018 | Shell appendix for the opening brief. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Alina Email Mr. Reeve proposed joint
1/3/2018 | Shell appendix list for discussion. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Alina Edit motion for extension of time for
1/9/2018 | Shell filing opening brief. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Phone call to Mr. Reeve to ascertain
Alina Henderson’s position regarding
1/9/2018 | Shell motion for extension of time. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Further edits to motion for extension
Alina of time pursuant to comments from
1/9/2018 | Shell Ms. McLetchie. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Respond to email from Mr. Reeve
regarding documents Henderson
Alina would like included in Joint
1/10/2018 | Shell Appendix for appeal. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Alina Begin drafting preliminary parts of
2/6/2018 | Shell opening brief. 2.0 [ $300.00 | $600.00 $600.00
Resume drafting Opening Brief:
attention to statement of facts and
Alina standard of review. Begin drafting
2/7/2018 | Shell argument section. 3.0 | $300.00 | $900.00 $900.00
12
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Alina Complete argument section of
2/8/2018 | Shell opening brief. 7.7 | $300.00 | $2,310.00 $2,310.00
Review draft stipulation sent by
Henderson City Attorney Brian
Alina Reeve and email approval for e-
3/14/2018 | Shell signature. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Review Nevada Rules of Appellate
Procedure to confirm deadline for
Alina filing cross-appeal. Memo to Ms.
3/16/2018 | Shell McLetchie re same. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Alina Edit notice of cross-appeal and case
3/23/2018 | Shell appeal statement. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Final review and edit of notice of
cross-appeal and case appeal
Alina statement re order on motion for
3/26/2018 | Shell attorney fees. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
FEES APPEAL: Begin drafting
Alina settlement statement for mandatory
4/5/2018 | Shell Supreme Court Settlement Program. 1.1 | $300.00 | $330.00 $330.00
FEES APPEAL: Resume drafting
settlement statement. Complete
sections regarding summary of legal
issues and suitability for settlement.
Alina Send draft to Ms. McLetchie for
4/6/2018 | Shell review. 2.2 | $300.00 | $660.00 $660.00
FEES APPEAL: Incorporate Ms.
Alina McLetchie’s edits into settlement
4/6/2018 | Shell statement. 0.7 | $300.00 | $210.00 $210.00
13
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
FEES APPEAL: Address questions
from Ms. Burchfield regarding
Alina exhibits for settlement statement and
4/6/2018 | Shell formatting of brief. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Alina Research regarding timeliness of
4/6/2018 | Shell motion to stay. 0.6 | $300.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Draft declaration for Ms. McLetchie
Alina in support of opposition to motion
4/9/2018 | Shell for stay. 0.5 | $300.00 | $150.00 $150.00
Proofread Mr. Wolpert’s draft of
opposition to motion for stay of
Alina order granting the Review-Journal
4/10/2018 | Shell attorney fees and costs. 0.5 | $300.00 | $150.00 $150.00
Hearing preparation: review cases
Alina cited in briefs and identify cases
4/10/2018 | Shell needed for argument. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Preparation for hearing on motion
Alina for stay of order awarding Review-
4/11/2018 | Shell Journal attorney fees. 0.5 [ $300.00 | $150.00 $150.00
In court for hearing on Henderson’s
Alina motion for stay of order awarding
4/11/2018 | Shell attorney fees to Review-Journal. 0.8 | $300.00 | $240.00 $240.00
Memo to Ms. McLetchie regarding
outcome of hearing on Henderson’s
Alina motion for stay of order granting
4/11/2018 | Shell Review-Journal fees and costs. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
14 JA
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
FEES APPEAL: Review appeal
docketing statement filed by
Alina Henderson regarding appeal of
4/11/2018 | Shell attorney fees. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Alina FEES APPEAL: Draft Nevada
4/18/2018 | Shell Supreme Court docketing statement. 0.9 | $300.00 | $270.00 $270.00
Alina FEES APPEAL.: Edit and approve
5/23/2018 | Shell motion for extension of time. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, email Mr. Reeve and Mr.
Kemble regarding staying briefing in
Alina appeal pending settlement
6/28/2018 | Shell conference. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
APPEAL: Review Henderson’s
Answering Brief and begin
organizing/outlining Reply. Shell
Alina document and begin responding to
7/12/2018 | Shell Henderson’s statement of facts. 0.9 | $300.00 | $270.00 $270.00
APPEAL: Resume drafting reply to
Alina Henderson’s statement of facts in its
7/13/2018 | Shell answering brief. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
APPEAL: Resume drafting reply
Alina brief: begin drafting reply to
7/19/2018 | Shell Henderson’s legal arguments. 6.6 | $300.00 | $1,980.00 $1,980.00
APPEAL: Resume drafting Reply
Brief: finish drafting legal arguments
Alina and email to Ms. McLetchie for
7/20/2018 | Shell review. 7.0 | $300.00 | $2,100.00 $2,100.00
15 JA
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Date

Biller

Note

Quantity

Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

7/23/2018

Alina
Shell

APPEAL: Attention to completing
Reply Brief: address Ms.
McLetchie’s revisions to draft, and
adding suggested facts and
argument; edit motion for leave to
file excess pages; review NRAP to
ensure compliance with rules for
filing oversized brief and motion for
leave to file excess pages; conduct
additional legal research.

7.1

$300.00

$2,130.00

$2,130.00

10/24/2018

Alina
Shell

Attention to Supplemental Notice of
Authorities: Review pleadings filed
in case to identify pages of briefs
being supplemented by recent
decision in PERS v. NPRI.

0.9

$300.00

$270.00

$270.00

12/17/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Begin draft of
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on
cross appeal in attorney’s fee appeal.
Draft preliminary portions of brief,
including disclosure, routing
statement, jurisdictional statement,
and statement of the issues for
review. Draft statement of facts.

24

$300.00

$720.00

$720.00

12/17/2018

Alina
Shell

APPEAL: Draft Motion to Continue
Oral Argument.

0.6

$300.00

$180.00

$180.00

12/17/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Drafting Answering
Brief/Opening Brief on cross-appeal:
draft standards of review section.

0.2

$300.00

$60.00

$60.00

16
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Date

Biller

Note

Quantity

Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

12/17/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Attention to
Answering Brief and Opening Brief
on cross appeal: Draft legal
argument regarding why the
Review-Journal was the prevailing
party. Research cases cited by
Henderson to rebut legal arguments
regarding same.

1.6

$300.00

$480.00

$480.00

12/18/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Continue work on
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on
cross-appeal: Resume drafting
arguments regarding why the
Review-Journal was the prevailing
party. Draft argument regarding why
NRS 239.012 does not immunize
Henderson from attorney’s fees.
Draft argument regarding district
court’s failure to adequately address
Brunzell factors.

4.1

$300.00

$1,230.00

$1,230.00

12/19/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Resume drafting
answering brief/opening brief on
cross-appeal: Complete argument
regarding Brunzell, draft statement
of the case, and draft summary of the
argument. Add additional case and
record citations.

24

$300.00

$720.00

$720.00

17
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Date

Biller

Note

Quantity

Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

12/20/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Continued work on
answering brief/opening brief on
cross-appeal: address Ms.
McLetchie’s preliminary edits to
first draft of brief. Insert citations to
Respondent’s Appendix. Re-
organize and expand statement of
facts to address LVRIJ’s request for
clarification of order on motion for
attorney’s fees, other related appeal,
and Henderson’s actions after filing
of petition.

3.4

$300.00

$1,020.00

$1,020.00

12/20/2018

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Address Ms.
McLetchie’s edits to draft of
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on
cross-appeal. Review, edit, and
proofread entire brief.

23

$300.00

$690.00

$690.00

2/1/2019

Alina
Shell

APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, review briefs filed in appeal
and identify cases for Ms. Ambro to
print in preparation for argument.

0.7

$300.00

$210.00

$210.00

2/1/2019

Alina
Shell

APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, begin outlining argument
regarding insufficiency of
Henderson’s privilege log.

1.5

$300.00

$450.00

$450.00

18
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Date

Biller

Note

Quantity

Price

Subtotal

Deduction

Total

3/4/2019

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Begin drafting
Reply Brief on Cross-Appeal, review
Henderson’s Answering Brief/Reply
Brief, research legal issue regarding
whether the Amended Petition
superseded the original Petition, and
begin drafting legal arguments.

1.8

$300.00

$540.00

$540.00

3/12/2019

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Resume drafting
Reply Brief on cross-appeal and
address direction from Ms.
McLetchie; draft legal arguments
regarding statutory interpretation,
the legal landscape regarding
“prevailing” parties, and the court’s
reduction of the LVRJ’s fee award.
Review Henderson’s Reply
Brief/Answering Brief and identify
any additional arguments that need
to be addressed.

6.6

$300.00

$1,980.00

$1,980.00

3/12/2019

Alina
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Review and
incorporate Mr. Lipman’s edits to
Reply Brief; conduct hard copy edit
of final draft.

1.3

$300.00

$390.00

$390.00

10/24/2019

Alina
Shell

Phone call with Mr. Reeve regarding
possible resolution of case.

0.2

$300.00

$60.00

$60.00

12/12/2019

Alina
Shell

Prepare for and attend status check
on remand and draft update memo to
file re same.

1.2

$300.00

$360.00

$360.00

19

JA
LV

0825
RJO71




Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Follow up phone call and email to
Alina Mr. Kennedy regarding need to set
12/31/2019 | Shell briefing schedule. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Phone call with Brian Reeve re
Alina setting briefing schedule for
1/6/2020 | Shell attorney’s fees issue. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Review stipulation regarding
Alina attorney’s fees briefing schedule and
1/7/2020 | Shell email same to Mr. Reeve. 0.1 | $300.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Begin drafting new motion for
Alina attorney’s fees: start drafting
1/30/2020 | Shell introduction and statement of facts. 1.1 | $300.00 | $330.00 $330.00
Finish draft of renewed motion for
Alina attorney’s fees: complete legal
2/2/2020 | Shell argument and verify record citations. 3.6 | $300.00 | $1,080.00 $1,080.00
Expand renewed motion for
attorney’s fees consistent with
Alina comments and direction from Ms.
2/3/2020 | Shell McLetchie. 2.0 | $300.00 | $600.00 $600.00
Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, draft
Alina memo for client explaining renewed
2/3/2020 | Shell motion for attorney’s fees. 0.2 | $300.00 | $60.00 $60.00
Attention to attorney’s fees motion:
review spreadsheet of costs prepared
by Ms. Burchfield and edit
Alina spreadsheet to exclude non-
2/3/2020 | Shell reimbursable costs. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Attention to motion for attorney’s
fees: review and edit spreadsheet of
attorney’s fees to reduce entries that
we previously agreed to reduce at
Alina hearing on first motion for attorney’s
2/5/2020 | Shell fees. 0.3 | $300.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Review and finalize Ms.
Alina McLetchie’s declaration in support
2/5/2020 | Shell of motion for attorney’s fees. 0.4 | $300.00 | $120.00 $120.00
Finalize Renewed Motion for
Alina Attorney’s Fees and confirm exhibits
2/6/2020 | Shell re same. 0.5 [ $300.00 | $150.00 $150.00
Totals for Alina Shell 168.6 $50,370.00
Compile legislative history of the
Nevada Public Records Act for Ms.
Gabriel McLetchie; send same to Ms.
1/13/2017 | Czop McLetchie. 0.6 | $125.00 | $75.00 $75.00
Research assignment from Ms.
Gabriel McLetchie - compiling legislative
1/13/2017 | Czop history. 0.7 | $125.00 | $87.50 $87.50
Review privilege log for Ms.
Gabriel McLetchie, analyze re what has been
1/24/2017 | Czop claimed as privileged. 2.4 | $125.00 | $300.00 | $(300.00) | $-
Gabriel Review documents attached to
1/24/2017 | Czop pleadings. 0.3 | $125.00 | $37.50 $37.50
Gabriel Continue researching the legislative
1/24/2017 | Czop history for NRS 239. 1.6 | $125.00 | $200.00 $200.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Gabriel Research for Ms. McLetchie about
1/26/2017 | Czop the requirements of a privilege log. 1.8 | $125.00 | $225.00 $225.00
Meet with Ms. McLetchie to discuss
Gabriel the privilege log received from City
1/26/2017 | Czop of Henderson. 0.3 | $125.00 | $37.50 $37.50
Continue reviewing privilege log
Gabriel provided by City of Henderson,
1/26/2017 | Czop provide analysis to Ms. McLetchie. 1.8 | $125.00 | $225.00 $225.00
Gabriel Update privilege log analysis
1/27/2017 | Czop document for Ms. McLetchie. 0.4 | $125.00 | $50.00 $(50.00) $-
Gabriel Research the attorney/client
1/27/2017 | Czop privilege and work product privilege. 3.8 | $125.00 | $475.00 | $(475.00) | $-
Finalize privilege log analysis and
Gabriel provide same to Ms. McLetchie for
1/30/2017 | Czop review. 0.2 | $125.00 | $25.00 $25.00
Gabriel Continue reviewing documents
2/1/2017 | Czop received from City of Henderson. 1.1 | $125.00 | $137.50 $137.50
Print out copies of the redacted
Gabriel documents received from City of
2/8/2017 | Czop Henderson. 0.4 | $125.00 | $50.00 $(50.00) $-
Gabriel Research for Ms. Shell re statutory
3/21/2017 | Czop interpretation. 0.2 | $125.00 | $25.00 $25.00
Meet with Ms. McLetchie and Ms.
Shell re: research assignment to
locate cases that discuss legislative
Gabriel history is not needed when the
3/21/2017 | Czop statute is clear. 0.1 $125.00 | $12.50 $12.50
Totals for Gabriel Czop 15.7 $1,087.50
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Lacey APPEAL: Prepare binder for Ms.
1/28/2019 | Ambro McLetchie for Oral Argument. 0.9 | $100.00 | $90.00 $90.00
APPEAL: Prepare cases and
Lacey authorities for Ms. McLetchie for
2/1/2019 | Ambro Oral Argument prep. 2.4 $100.00 | $240.00 $240.00
Draft Stipulation and Order re
Briefing Schedule on Motion for
Lacey Attorney’s Fees. Circulate to Ms.
1/6/2020 | Ambro McLetchie and Ms. Shell. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Finalize Renewed Motion for
Lacey Attorney’s Fees and exhibits;
2/6/2020 | Ambro prepare filing; file and serve re same. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Totals for Lacey Ambro 4.3 $430.00
Leo Edit/proofread motion for attorney’s
6/1/2017 | Wolpert fees. 1.5 ] $250.00 | $375.00 $375.00
Leo Edit, cite check, and proofread
2/16/2018 | Wolpert Opening Brief. 3.5 ] $250.00 | $875.00 $875.00
Draft opposition to motion to stay
pending appeal, countermotion for
Leo order to show cause why Henderson
4/6/2018 | Wolpert isn’t in contempt. 6.5 | $250.00 | $1,625.00 $1,625.00
Research and draft regarding Order
Leo to Show Cause, orders without
4/7/2018 | Wolpert deadlines. 2.5 | $250.00 | $625.00 $625.00
draft opposition to motion for stay,
particular attention to untimeliness
Leo and the unlikelihood of prevailing on
4/9/2018 | Wolpert appeal 5.3 ] $250.00 | $1,325.00 $1,325.00
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Leo Incorporate Ms. Shell’s edits, further
4/9/2018 | Wolpert edits to opposition to motion to stay. 0.5 | $250.00 | $125.00 $125.00
Leo Final edits and cite checks to
4/10/2018 | Wolpert Opposition to motion to stay. 1.8 | $250.00 | $450.00 $450.00
APPEAL.: Edit, proofread, enter Ms.
Leo McLetchie’s changes into reply
7/23/2018 | Wolpert brief. 2.7 | $250.00 | $675.00 $675.00
FEES APPEAL: Edit Answering
Leo Brief/Opening Brief in attorney’s
12/19/2018 | Wolpert fees appeal. 2.3 | $250.00 | $575.00 $575.00
FEES APPEAL.: Final hardcopy
edits and proofreading of
Leo Answering/Opening Brief re
12/20/2018 | Wolpert attorney’s fees and costs. 1.4 | $250.00 | $350.00 $350.00
APPEAL: Research adequacy of
privilege log in Nevada and 9th
circuit, compare to ones provided by
Henderson, research
Leo reasonable/standard rates for
2/3/2019 | Wolpert document review. 0.9 | $250.00 | $225.00 $225.00
APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in
preparation for Oral Argument,
including updating outline of cases
Leo and further research on public
2/4/2019 | Wolpert records act cases. 2.5 | $250.00 | $625.00 $625.00
APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in
Leo Oral Argument prep by reviewing
2/5/2019 | Wolpert documents / privilege log. 0.8 | $250.00 | $200.00 $200.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
FEES APPEAL: Draft policy
Leo argument sections of Reply Brief,
3/12/2019 | Wolpert proofreading. 3.7 | $250.00 | $925.00 $925.00
Totals for Leo Wolpert 35.9 $8,975.00
Margaret | Emails re Public Records Act
11/3/2016 | McLetchie | request responses. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Emails with team re status on
11/4/2016 | McLetchie | Trosper matter. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
11/9/2016 | McLetchie | Emails re setting up meeting. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret
11/10/2016 | McLetchie | Prepare for and attend client call. 1.2 | $450.00 | $540.00 $540.00
Margaret
11/27/2016 | McLetchie | Work on Petition; research re same. 1.8 | $450.00 | $810.00 $810.00
Attention to compiling
Margaret | documentation for petition and
11/28/2016 | McLetchie | drafting same. Circulate. 4.2 | $450.00 | $1,890.00 $1,890.00
Margaret
11/29/2016 | McLetchie | Attention to finalizing filing. 2.0 | $450.00 | $900.00 $900.00
Margaret
12/2/2016 | McLetchie | Review emails re service. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Review and respond to letter from
12/5/2016 | McLetchie | Josh Reid. Circulate letter to clients. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Further emails with Josh Reid.
Margaret | Emails with his office re setting up
12/6/2016 | McLetchie | meeting. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
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Margaret | Emails with RJ team regarding status
12/7/2016 | McLetchie | and next steps. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret
12/7/2016 | McLetchie | Review pertinent media coverage. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Prepare for and attend call with Josh
Reid and two deputy City of
Henderson attorneys. Negotiate for
Margaret | in-person inspection. Update clients
12/14/2016 | McLetchie | re same. 1.7 | $450.00 | $765.00 $765.00
Margaret | Emails re documents available for
12/19/2016 | McLetchie | inspection. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Attention to issues with review.
Preliminary review of “privilege
log.” Call with client re litigation
strategy. Confer with City of
Margaret | Henderson attorney Brian Reeve and
12/20/2016 | McLetchie | plan meeting. 2.4 | $450.00 | $1,080.00 $1,080.00
Emails with Henderson and with
clients. Successfully address issue
Margaret | with how documents were presented
12/21/2016 | McLetchie | for review/ Attempt to obtain CD. 0.8 | $450.00 | $360.00 $360.00
Margaret | Emails re document review at City
12/23/2016 | McLetchie | of Henderson. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Follow up to Henderson to get
Margaret | Wednesday access for Natalie
12/27/2016 | McLetchie | Bruzda. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Email re log re documents withheld
1/4/2017 | McLetchie | by City of Henderson. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
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Margaret | Attention to compiling pertinent
1/5/2017 | McLetchie | legislative history. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Margaret | Call with Henderson City Attorneys
1/9/2017 | McLetchie | and follow up with client re same. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Margaret | Calendaring - check Henderson
1/9/2017 | McLetchie | deadline to respond to writ. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Preliminary review of supplemental
Margaret | log received from City of
1/10/2017 | McLetchie | Henderson. 0.7 | $450.00 | $315.00 $315.00
Edits to stipulation, call with and
Margaret | emails with City of Henderson
1/11/2017 | McLetchie | attorneys. 0.6 | $450.00 | $270.00 $270.00
Margaret
1/12/2017 | McLetchie | Execute stipulation. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret
1/12/2017 | McLetchie | Call with client. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
1/17/2017 | McLetchie | Emails with client. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Attention to scheduling of review of
Margaret | privilege log, amending complaint,
1/24/2017 | McLetchie | and filing supporting brief. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Calls and emails with opposing
counsel and court re case status,
Margaret | scheduling. Begin plans for
1/24/2017 | McLetchie | amending. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Attention to emails with court and
Margaret | opposing counsel re scheduling;
1/25/2017 | McLetchie | update to clients re same. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Amend and expand petition/
application; research issues; edit
brief in support of petition/
Margaret | application, declaration, and check
2/8/2017 | McLetchie | exhibits. 6.2 | $450.00 | $2,790.00 $2,790.00
Margaret
3/9/2017 | McLetchie | Emails with client re rely. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Review and analyze Henderson’s
Margaret | response to our opening brief. Direct
3/20/2017 | McLetchie | Ms. Shell re work on reply. 1.1 | $450.00 | $495.00 $495.00
Further review and analysis of
Henderson’s response to petition for
Margaret | work on reply; direct Ms. Burchfield
3/22/2017 | McLetchie | to circulate response to clients. 1.8 | $450.00 | $810.00 $810.00
Revising and editing of reply;
Margaret | attention to declaration; research and
3/23/2017 | McLetchie | draft section re mootness. 6.8 | $450.00 | $3,060.00 $3,060.00
Margaret Attend hearing; call to client; email
3/30/2017 | McLetchie | summary to clients. 0.5 | $450.00 | $225.00 | $(675.00) | $(450.00)
Review and circulate response to
request for fees information for
Margaret | Henderson’s outside counsel, Bailey
4/4/2017 | McLetchie | Kennedy (records received). 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
5/23/2017 | McLetchie | Email re renewing fees request. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
6/1/2017 | McLetchie | Edit motion for fees. 0.9 | $450.00 | $405.00 $405.00
Margaret | Direct work on Notice of Appeal and
6/9/2017 | McLetchie | Case Appeal Statement. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
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Margaret | Agree to extension with opposing
6/14/2017 | McLetchie | counsel. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Respond to opposing counsel’s
6/15/2017 | McLetchie | email re Stipulation re extension. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Review and edit Stipulation re
6/19/2017 | McLetchie | extension; email opposing counsel. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
6/19/2017 | McLetchie | Follow up re appellate filing fee. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret
6/19/2017 | McLetchie | Attention to extension stipulation. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
7/10/2017 | McLetchie | Edit docketing statement. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Attention to scheduling of settlement
7/12/2017 | McLetchie | conference. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
TROSPER: Work with Ms. Laux re
Margaret | legislative history re “extraordinary
7/13/2017 | McLetchie | use” for appeal purposes. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Attention to scheduling of attorney
7/14/2017 | McLetchie | fee hearing. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Prepare for and attend conference
call with opposing counsel and
settlement judge. Email to clients re
scheduling of settlement conference,
and representations from City of
Margaret | Henderson re what they are
7/19/2017 | McLetchie | charging. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Margaret | Emails re status of requests to City
7/19/2017 | McLetchie | of Henderson. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
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Margaret | Attention to scheduling of settlement
7/19/2017 | McLetchie | conference. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Emails with client re scheduling
7/20/2017 | McLetchie | settlement conference. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Confer with paralegal re issues with
7/21/2017 | McLetchie | opposition. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Follow up re scheduling settlement
7/24/2017 | McLetchie | conference. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Edit reply to opposition to motion
7/27/2017 | McLetchie | for attorney’s fees and costs.. 1.2 | $450.00 | $540.00 $540.00
Confer with Ms. Shell re strategy re
Margaret | atty fee applications. Research issues
7/27/2017 | McLetchie | re “catalyst theory.” 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Attention to attorney’s fees hearing
Margaret | and follow up re obtaining copy of
8/2/2017 | McLetchie | ordinance from City of Henderson. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Margaret | Attention to preparations for hearing
8/2/2017 | McLetchie | on fees application. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret | Attempt to follow up with City of
8/2/2017 | McLetchie | Henderson re draft ordinance. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
8/10/2017 | McLetchie | Attention to attorney’s fees hearing. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Margaret
9/2/2017 | McLetchie | Follow up re attorney fee motion. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret
9/7/2017 | McLetchie | Edit order. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret
9/20/2017 | McLetchie | Emails re order. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Emails with Brian Reeve re order re
Margaret | fees; attention to submission of
9/21/2017 | McLetchie | LVRJ’s order to court. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Revisions to order on fees. Send to
Brian Reeve. Finalize our proposed
Margaret | order and accompanying letter to
9/21/2017 | McLetchie | judge. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret
9/21/2017 | McLetchie | Follow up re proposed revision. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Margaret | Revise draft settlement statement
9/25/2017 | McLetchie | and confer with Ms. Shell re same. 0.8 | $450.00 | $360.00 $360.00
Emails with client re settlement
Margaret | conference, Henderson’s proposed
9/28/2017 | McLetchie | revised ordinance. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Attention to providing comment to
Henderson (including NPRA and
Margaret | NPRI) re proposed Henderson policy
9/28/2017 | McLetchie | and fees. 1.1 | $450.00 | $495.00 $495.00
Margaret | Review/revise/finalize settlement
9/29/2017 | McLetchie | conference brief. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Margaret | Emails with NPRI re Henderson
10/2/2017 | McLetchie | proposed ordinance. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Call with settlement judge. Prepare
10/9/2017 | McLetchie | for settlement conference. 4.5 | $450.00 | $2,025.00 $2,025.00
Prepare for settlement conference.
Direct Ms. Burchfield re items
Margaret | needed. Attend settlement
10/10/2017 | McLetchie | conference. Update team re same. 4.2 | $450.00 | $1,890.00 $1,890.00
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Margaret | Continued work on proposed
10/10/2017 | McLetchie | revision to Henderson ordinance. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Margaret | Emails with counsel for Henderson
10/11/2017 | McLetchie | re motion for clarification. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Attention to new City of Henderson
10/18/2017 | McLetchie | proposed ordinance. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Confer with Ms. Shell re Motion;
11/8/2017 | McLetchie | revise same. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret | Confer with Ms. Shell re outcome of
12/13/2017 | McLetchie | hearing. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Approve list of items for inclusion in
1/3/2018 | McLetchie | proposed joint appendix. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
1/9/2018 | McLetchie | Revise motion for extension. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret
2/12/2018 | McLetchie | Attention to opening brief. 1.8 | $450.00 | $810.00 $810.00
Margaret | Continued attention to work on
2/15/2018 | McLetchie | opening brief. 2.3 | $450.00 | $1,035.00 $1,035.00
Margaret
2/16/2018 | McLetchie | Revisions to Opening Brief. 1.2 | $450.00 | $540.00 $540.00
Margaret | Continued attention to Opening
2/16/2018 | McLetchie | Brief. 5.9 | $450.00 | $2,655.00 $2,655.00
Margaret | Follow up re status re service of
2/21/2018 | McLetchie | brief and appendix. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
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Consider/plan strategy and update to
clients advising regarding no need to
file notice of appeal, desirability of
Margaret | cross-appeal after Henderson files
3/14/2018 | McLetchie | Notice of Appeal. 0.5 | $450.00 | $225.00 $225.00
Margaret | Call with City of Henderson
3/28/2018 | McLetchie | attorneys’ attention to issues. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Margaret | Emails regarding settlement; City of
3/29/2018 | McLetchie | Henderson Ordinance. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | Email to Henderson regarding fees
4/3/2018 | McLetchie | payment. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Emails with Mr. Reeve regarding
Margaret | contempt (Henderson’s failure to
4/4/2018 | McLetchie | comply with fees and costs order). 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Confer with Ms. Shell and Mr.
Margaret | Wolpert regarding Opposition to
4/9/2018 | McLetchie | Motion to Stay. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Calls with Mr. Cook and Sandy
Margaret | regarding City of Henderson’s
4/11/2018 | McLetchie | current conduct re NPRA requests. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
FEES APPEAL: Prepare for and
attend premeditation call; Follow up
Margaret | with client regarding outcome and
4/11/2018 | McLetchie | plans regarding handling same. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
FEES APPEAL: Emails regarding
Margaret | attendance at settlement conference
4/12/2018 | McLetchie | by Ms. King. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | FEES APPEAL: Revision to
4/23/2018 | McLetchie | Docketing Statement. 0.5 | $450.00 | $225.00 $225.00
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Attention to case schedule; Possible
cancel of settlement conference; Call
Margaret | to Mr. Reeves and follow up with
5/17/2018 | McLetchie | office of settlement judge. 0.5 | $450.00 | $225.00 $225.00
FEES APPEAL: Follow up
Margaret | regarding Settlement Conference,
5/21/2018 | McLetchie | extension regarding Reply. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
FEES APPEAL: Follow up
Margaret | regarding scheduling of Settlement
5/23/2018 | McLetchie | Conference. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
7/22/2018 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Revise reply. 2.9 | $450.00 | $1,305.00 $1,305.00
Margaret
7/23/2018 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Attention to reply brief. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Margaret | APPEAL: Attention to finalizing
7/23/2018 | McLetchie | Reply and associated filings. 3.0 | $450.00 | $1,350.00 $1,350.00
FEES APPEAL.: Call with Brian
Margaret | Reeve; attention to preparation for
8/8/2018 | McLetchie | settlement conference. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret | FEES APPEAL: Emails regarding
8/9/2018 | McLetchie | mediation. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
FEES APPEAL: Attention to
Margaret | preparation for settlement
8/13/2018 | McLetchie | conference. 3.0 | $450.00 | $1,350.00 $1,350.00
FEES APPEAL: Prepare for
Settlement Conference; Calls/emails
to client representatives regarding
Margaret | same. Review municipal code
8/13/2018 | McLetchie | provisions received from Mr. Reeve. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
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Margaret | FEES APPEAL: Prepare for and
8/14/2018 | McLetchie | attend Mediation. 4.0 | $450.00 | $1,800.00 $1,800.00
Margaret | FEES APPEAL: Emails with Mr.
8/27/2018 | McLetchie | Reeve regarding transcript. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
FEES APPEAL: Email with
Margaret | opposing counsel regarding
8/28/2018 | McLetchie | transcript. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | FEES APPEAL: Emails with Mr.
8/29/2018 | McLetchie | Reeve re consolidation inquiry. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | APPEAL: Attention to revising
10/29/2018 | McLetchie | Notice of Supplemental Authority. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret | APPEAL: Review Notice
12/4/2018 | McLetchie | Scheduling Oral Argument. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Margaret | APPEAL: Attention to Motion to
12/17/2018 | McLetchie | Continue Oral Argument. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
12/20/2018 | McLetchie | FEES APPEAL: Revise brief. 2.0 | $450.00 | $900.00 $900.00
Margaret
12/27/2018 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Review order. 0.1 | $450.00 | $45.00 $45.00
FEES APPEAL: Emails to City of
Margaret | Henderson agreeing to extension;
1/3/2019 | McLetchie | attention to stipulation re same. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret
2/1/2019 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 1.0 | $450.00 | $450.00 $450.00
Margaret
2/2/2019 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 5.0 | $450.00 | $2,250.00 $2,250.00
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Margaret
2/3/2019 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 3.0 | $450.00 | $1,350.00 $1,350.00
Margaret | APPEAL: Travel and Argument
2/4/2019 | McLetchie | Prep. 8.0 | $450.00 | $3,600.00 $3,600.00
Margaret | APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep.
2/5/2019 | McLetchie | Argument. [REDUCED ENTRY] 6.5 | $450.00 | $2,925.00 $2,925.00
Margaret | Attention to Motion for Attorney
2/5/2019 | McLetchie | Fees. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
2/6/2019 | McLetchie | APPEAL: Travel. 4.0 | $450.00 | $1,800.00 $1,800.00
Margaret | FEES APPEAL: Attention to Reply
3/4/2019 | McLetchie | Brief: provide direction to Ms. Shell. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
FEES APPEAL.: Attention to Reply
Margaret | Brief: confer with Ms. Shell re status
3/11/2019 | McLetchie | and provide her with direction. 0.4 | $450.00 | $180.00 $180.00
Margaret | FEES APPEAL: Revisions to Reply
3/12/2019 | McLetchie | Brief/approve final version for filing. 1.1 | $450.00 | $495.00 $495.00
Margaret | APPEAL: Review order. Update to
5/28/2019 | McLetchie | client re same. 0.6 | $450.00 | $270.00 $270.00
Email with Mr. Lipman re case.
Margaret | Follow up via email / leave message
7/24/2019 | McLetchie | for Henderson. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Obtain documents from Henderson
7/24/2019 | McLetchie | and provide to client. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret
10/17/2019 | McLetchie | Review order. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
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Margaret | Confer with Ms. Shell re hearing,
12/12/2019 | McLetchie | status of case, next steps. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Margaret | Confer with Ms. Shell re briefing
12/13/2019 | McLetchie | schedule; plans re same. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Review initial draft of Fees Motion.
Review applicable Supreme Court
orders. Confer with Ms. Shell re
Margaret | approach. Direct her to further
2/3/2020 | McLetchie | research. 0.3 | $450.00 | $135.00 $135.00
Margaret
2/4/2020 | McLetchie | Attention to Fees Motion. 1.5 | $450.00 | $675.00 $675.00
Review and confirm declaration in
Margaret | support of motion for attorney’s
2/6/2020 | McLetchie | fees; sign re same. 0.2 | $450.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Totals for Margaret McLetchie 129.1 $57,420.00
Prepare and file Public Records
Application and petition for Writ of
Mandamus. Draft and file Initial
Appearance Fee Disclosure and
Civil Cover Sheet to create a new
civil case in Eighth Judicial District
Court. Attention to scheduling a
Pharan legal process server re same. Email
11/29/2016 | Burchfield | clients re same. 0.9 | $100.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Pharan
12/19/2016 | Burchfield | File Affidavit of Service. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
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Receive redacted documents from
City of Henderson; create City of
Henderson portal account to
download, print, and save redacted
Pharan documents from Public Records Act
1/10/2017 | Burchfield | request (re Trosper). 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Email communications with Ms.
Pharan Boyd (City of Henderson) re signed
1/25/2017 | Burchfield | Stipulation re extension. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Prepare exhibits to brief and
amended petition; begin drafting
Pharan declaration in support of amended
2/8/2017 | Burchfield | petition. File and serve/mail re same. 1.4 | $100.00 | $140.00 $140.00
Finalize and send (mail/email)
Public Records Act request re Bailey
Pharan Kennedy to City of Henderson’s
3/20/2017 | Burchfield | City Attorney. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $(20.00) $-
Draft Stipulation (re extension for
Reply) for attorneys’ review; email
Pharan communications with Mr. Kennedy
3/22/2017 | Burchfield | re same. 0.3 | $100.00 | $30.00 $30.00
Review external communications
with City of Henderson re potential
exhibits re Reply; draft Ms.
McLetchie’s declaration re same;
Pharan finalize, file, and serve/mail Reply re
3/23/2017 | Burchfield | same. 2.1 {$100.00 | $210.00 $210.00
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File Stipulation and Order for
Extension to Allow Las Vegas
Review-Journal to File its Reply to
Pharan Respondent City of Henderson’s
3/27/2017 | Burchfield | Response to Amended Petition. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan Draft, file, and serve/mail Notice of
3/28/2017 | Burchfield | Entry of Order (reply extension). 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Draft letter to Honorable Judge
Thompson re competing orders to be
delivered to chambers with proposed
Pharan order; email communications with
4/27/2017 | Burchfield | opposing counsel re same. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Phone call with Al, law clerk in
Pharan Department 18, re competing
5/11/2017 | Burchfield | proposed order. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Prepare charts/Excel spreadsheets of
attorneys’ time and expenses for
Pharan Motion for Attorney’s Fees
5/31/2017 | Burchfield | Application. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Finalize (proof and prepare exhibits),
file and serve/mail
Pharan Application/Motion for Attorneys’
6/1/2017 | Burchfield | Fees. 0.9 | $100.00 | $90.00 $90.00
Finalize and send (mail/email)
Public Records Act request to Mr.
Pharan Reid at City of Henderson re Bailey
6/1/2017 | Burchfield | Kennedy. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
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6/8/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Review City of Henderson’s
response to our most recent Public
Records Act Request regarding
Bailey Kennedy’s representation in
Las Vegas Review-Journal v. City of
Henderson case. Email copy to
clients re same.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

6/9/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Draft Notice of Appeal and Case
Appeal Statement. File and
serve/mail re same.

0.5

$100.00

$50.00

$50.00

6/22/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

APPEAL: Begin drafting Docketing
Statement.

0.2

$100.00

$20.00

$20.00

7/10/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Prepare Docketing Statement
(prepare draft and exhibits);
integrate attorneys’ edits to final
draft; file and serve/mail re same.

1.2

$100.00

$120.00

$120.00

7/21/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Review City of Henderson’s
Opposition re Motion for Attorney’s
Fees; notice issues (missing and
mislabeled exhibits); bring to Ms.
McLetchie’s attention (how to
proceed); begin creating Judge’s
courtesy copy for upcoming hearing
re same.

0.6

$100.00

$60.00

$60.00

7/21/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Phone call with Ms. Togo re call she
had received from Jimmerson Law
Office (settlement judge); attempted
call to Jimmerson’s office re
clarification re same.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00
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7/27/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Prepare Reply to City of
Henderson’s Opposition to Las
Vegas Review-Journal’s Motion for
Attorney’s Fees and Costs for filing;
file and serve/mail re same.

0.5

$100.00

$50.00

$50.00

7/28/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Email clients briefing re Motion for
Attorney’s Fees and reminder of
hearing re same.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

8/24/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Finalize Motion for Extension of
Time to Allows Las Vegas Review-
Journal to Submit a Proposed Order
Granting Las Vegas Review-
Journal’s Motion for Attorney’s Fees
and Costs and draft Notice of
Submission of Proposed Order re
same. File and serve/mail re same.

0.6

$100.00

$60.00

$60.00

9/7/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Prepare Proposed Order re attorneys’
fees for attorneys’ review; email to
opposing counsel re same. Draft
second motion for extension for
attorneys’ review; file and
serve/mail re same.

0.4

$100.00

$40.00

$40.00

9/20/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Email Mr. Moyer and Mr. Cook
update re settlement conference
being scheduled. Confirm
attendance.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00
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9/21/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Draft cover letter to Honorable
Judge Bailus in anticipation of
submitting competing proposed
orders re order granting attorney’s
fees. Email opposition counsel re
same.

0.2

$100.00

$20.00

$20.00

9/21/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Drop off cover letter to Honorable
Judge Bailus re and including
competing proposed orders re order
granting attorney’s fees at Phoenix
Building, Eleventh Floor located at
330 South Third Street.

0.5

$100.00

$50.00

$50.00

9/29/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Incorporate Ms. McLetchie’s edits to

Ms. Shell’s draft of Confidential
Settlement Statement; prepare
exhibits re same; finalize and send
(mail/email) Settlement Judge Jay
Young re same. Email Mr. Moyer
and Mr. Cook re same.

1.5

$100.00

$150.00

$150.00

10/9/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Prepare binders, exhibits, and case
law for tomorrow’s settlement
conference. Email reminder to Mr.
Moyer and Mr. Cook re same.
Attention to payments re settlement
figures; chart for Ms. McLetchie re
same.

1.0

$100.00

$100.00

$100.00

10/10/2017

Pharan
Burchfield

Final preparation (update settlement

chart) for today’s settlement
conference.

0.3

$100.00

$30.00

$30.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Reviewing District Court docket to
confirm whether or not to request
transcripts for appeal; confirm
decision not to request transcript
with attorneys; and draft and
Pharan file/serve Certificate That No
10/26/2017 | Burchfield | Transcript Is Being Requested. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Pharan Finalize, file, and serve/mail Motion
11/8/2017 | Burchfield | for Clarification. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Prepare courtesy copy for Judge
Pharan Bailus re hearing on Motion for
12/5/2017 | Burchfield | Clarification re Attorney’s Fees. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Finalize, file, and serve/mail Reply
Pharan to City of Henderson’s Opposition to
12/5/2017 | Burchfield | Motion for Clarification. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Draft Motion for Extension re
Opening Brief and Appendix for
Pharan attorneys’ review. File and serve re
1/9/2018 | Burchfield | same. 0.4 | $100.00 | $40.00 $40.00
Begin gathering and prepare
Pharan potential exhibits for upcoming Joint
1/10/2018 | Burchfield | Appendix re appeal filing. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Pharan Draft Joint Appendix; combine
1/11/2018 | Burchfield | exhibits into volumes. 0.4 | $100.00 | $40.00 $40.00
Pharan Finalize (Bates-stamp and volume)
1/18/2018 | Burchfield | Joint Appendix. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
Draft, file, and serve Unopposed
Motion for Extension of Time to File
Pharan Appellant’s Opening Brief and
2/9/2018 | Burchfield | Appendix [Second Request]. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
Prepare/format Opening Brief,
including Table of Contents, Table
of Authorities, Certificate of
Compliance, and Certificate of
Service; incorporate final edits from
Pharan attorneys and file/serve Opening
2/16/2018 | Burchfield | Brief. 1.9 | $100.00 | $190.00 $190.00
Draft Notice of Cross-Appeal and
Pharan Case Appeal Statement for
3/23/2018 | Burchfield | attorney’s review/approval. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
Finalize, file, and serve/mail Notice
Pharan of Cross-Appeal and Case Appeal
3/26/2018 | Burchfield | Statement. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Draft Notice of Submission of
(September 21, 2017) Proposed
Pharan Order for Ms. McLetchie’s
3/28/2018 | Burchfield | review/approval. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
FEES APPEAL: Download and
review Notice of Cross-Appeal;
Pharan calendar deadline to file transcript
4/3/2018 | Burchfield | request and docketing statement. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
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FEES APPEAL: Prepare exhibits in
support of confidential settlement
statement; finalize settlement
Pharan statement; and send (mail/email) to
4/6/2018 | Burchfield | Settlement Judge Kunin re same. 1.1 | $100.00 | $110.00 $110.00
Finalize, file, and serve/mail
Petitioner’s Opposition to
Respondent’s Motion for Stay
Pending Appeal and Countermotion
for Order to Show Cause; email
Pharan courtesy copy to opposing counsel re
4/10/2018 | Burchfield | same. 0.7 | $100.00 | $70.00 $70.00
Pharan Check docket for Court’s Minutes re
4/12/2018 | Burchfield | hearing re stay. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Save and review
Early Case Assessment Report;
Pharan calendar settlement conference re
4/12/2018 | Burchfield | same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan Check docket for Court’s Minutes re
4/13/2018 | Burchfield | hearing re stay. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan Check docket for Court’s Minutes re
4/16/2018 | Burchfield | hearing re stay. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan Check docket for Court’s Minutes re
4/18/2018 | Burchfield | hearing re stay; download and save. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan FEES APPEAL: Begin drafting
4/18/2018 | Burchfield | Docketing Statement. 0.5 | $100.00 | $50.00 $50.00
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4/23/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL.: Finalize Docketing
Statement (prepare exhibits re
same); file and serve/mail re same.

0.6

$100.00

$60.00

$60.00

5/14/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Phone call with Ms.

Walker, assistant to Settlement
Judge Kunin, to confirm settlement
conference date.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

5/23/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Begin preparing
Unopposed Motion for Extension re
Reply Brief for attorneys’
review/approval. File and serve re
same.

0.2

$100.00

$20.00

$20.00

5/24/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
and review Amended Early Case
Assessment Report; calendar re
same; and email clients re same.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

5/31/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, review,
and save Order Granting Extension
to File Reply Brief; update calendars
and attorneys accordingly.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

7/23/2018

Pharan
Burchfield

APPEAL: Finalize Motion for
Excess Pages/Type Volume; file and
serve re same. Finalize (format
Table of Contents, Table of
Authorities, Certificate of
Compliance, and Certificate of
Service) Appellant’s Reply Brief
(and addendum); file and serve re
same.

1.4

$100.00

$140.00

$140.00
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APPEAL: Phone call with Ms. Boyd
(assistant) re Motion for Excess
Pharan Pages and Reply Brief; email Ms.
7/30/2018 | Burchfield | Boyd copy of proposed Reply Brief. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Prepare post-
Pharan application chart re fees and costs
8/13/2018 | Burchfield | versus what client paid. 0.8 | $100.00 | $80.00 $80.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
Pharan and review Order Reinstating
8/17/2018 | Burchfield | Briefing; calendar accordingly. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Incorporate Ms.
McLetchie’s responses to Settlement
Pharan Program Survey; mail to Nevada
8/28/2018 | Burchfield | Supreme Court re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Draft, file, and
send/serve Request for Transcript of
Proceedings into District Court case;
file and serve the District Court’s
file-stamped copy of Request for
Pharan Transcript of Proceedings into
8/29/2018 | Burchfield | Nevada Supreme Court case. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
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FEES APPEAL: Phone calls with
Ms. Page, Court Reporter for
Department 18, re status of
requested transcripts. Phone calls
with Ms. Martin, Court Reporter
with Litigation Services, re
requested transcripts. Phone call and
email communications with
Pharan Litigation Services re requested
10/2/2018 | Burchfield | transcripts re same. 0.2 | $100.00 | $20.00 $20.00
FEES APPEAL: Follow-up email
communications with Litigation
Pharan Services re status of requested
10/3/2018 | Burchfield | transcripts. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Follow-up email
communications with Litigation
Services re status of requested
Pharan transcripts; receive transcripts; save
10/4/2018 | Burchfield | and review re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan APPEAL: Draft, file, and serve
10/15/2018 | Burchfield | Notice of Change of Firm Name. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL.: Draft, file, and
Pharan serve Notice of Change of Firm
10/15/2018 | Burchfield | Name. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan Draft, file, and serve/mail Notice of
10/16/2018 | Burchfield | Change of Firm Name. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Pharan APPEAL: Finalize and file/serve
10/29/2018 | Burchfield | Notice of Supplemental Authority. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total
APPEAL: Download, save, and
Pharan review Order re Scheduling Oral
11/27/2018 | Burchfield | Argument; email attorneys re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL: Download, save. and
review Notice of Oral Argument
Setting; and calendar deadlines as
Pharan appropriate. Email update to Mr.
12/4/2018 | Burchfield | Cook and Ms. Hendrix re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL: Draft Notice of
Pharan Appearance for Oral Argument for
12/10/2018 | Burchfield | attorneys’ review. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL: Finalize and file/serve
Pharan Appellant’s Unopposed Motion to
12/17/2018 | Burchfield | Continue Oral Argument. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Begin preparing
Pharan Respondent/Cross-Appellant’s
12/18/2018 | Burchfield | Appendix. 0.3 | $100.00 | $30.00 $30.00
FEES APPEAL: Finalize
Respondent/Cross-Appellant’s
Appendix; file and serve re same.
Format and create Table of Contents,
Table of Authorities, Certificate of
Compliance, and Certificate of
Service. Finalize Answering Brief
Pharan and Opening Brief on Cross-Appeal;
12/20/2018 | Burchfield | file and serve re same. 1.4 | $100.00 | $140.00 $140.00
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Email communication with Ms.
Page, court reporter, confirming
Pharan receipt of hearing transcripts from
12/28/2018 | Burchfield | relief court reporter, Ms. Martin. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
and review Notice of Court Reporter
Pharan Ms. Page re requested transcripts
1/8/2019 | Burchfield | (Certificate of Acknowledgment). 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL: Download, save, and
review City of Henderson’s Notice
of Appearance at Oral Argument;
confirm with Ms. McLetchie when
Pharan she would like to file Las Vegas
1/18/2019 | Burchfield | Review-Journal’s Notice re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL: Draft Notice of
Pharan Appearance at Oral Argument for
1/18/2019 | Burchfield | Ms. McLetchie’s review. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL: Download, save, and
Pharan review Oral Argument Reminder
1/23/2019 | Burchfield | Notice; confirm calendar re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
APPEAL.: Finalize, file, and serve
Pharan Notice of Appearance for Oral
1/23/2019 | Burchfield | Argument. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
and review City of Henderson’s
Reply Brief on Appeal and
Answering Brief on Cross-Appeal;
Pharan calendar accordingly; and update
2/12/2019 | Burchfield | attorneys and Mr. Lipman re same. 0.1 $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
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2/20/2019

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Phone call with
Nevada Supreme Court Clerk re
extension for Reply Brief on Cross-
Appeal; download, save, and review
Order Granting Telephonic
Extension re same; update attorneys
and calendars accordingly.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

3/12/2019

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Incorporate
attorneys’ edits to Reply Brief on
Cross-Appeal; format, create Table
of Authorities, Table of Contents,
Certificate of Compliance, and
Certificate of Service; finalize Reply
Brief of Cross-Appeal and file/serve
re same.

1.3

$100.00

$130.00

$130.00

3/13/2019

Pharan
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
and review Reply Brief on Cross-
Appeal; and email Mr. Lipman re
same.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

5/28/2019

Pharan
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save, and
review Order Affirming in Part,
Reversing in Part and Remanding;
ad update attorneys re same.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

7/17/2019

Pharan
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save, and
review

Issued Remittitur; and update
attorneys re same.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00
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FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
and review Order Submitting for
Pharan Decision Without Oral Argument;
7/22/2019 | Burchfield | and update attorneys re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Email Mr. Lipman
and Ms. Togo file-stamped copy of
Pharan the Order Submitting for Decision
7/29/2019 | Burchfield | Without Oral Argument. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
Pharan and review Order of Reversal; and
10/17/2019 | Burchfield | update attorneys re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Download, save, and review Order
Setting Further Proceedings
consistent with Supreme Court
Pharan Order; update attorneys and calendar
11/8/2019 | Burchfield | accordingly. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
FEES APPEAL: Download, save,
Pharan and review Issued Remittitur; and
11/26/2019 | Burchfield | update attorneys re same. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Download, save, and review Court
Minutes from 12/12/19 hearing re
Status Check Order Setting Further
Proceedings re Supreme Court
Pharan Order; update attorneys and calendar
12/17/2019 | Burchfield | accordingly. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
Email Court regarding extension of
Pharan time to submit a proposed order re
12/31/2019 | Burchfield | briefing schedule. 0.1 | $100.00 | $10.00 $10.00
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1/3/2020

Pharan
Burchfield

Email communications with
Department 8 re extension of
proposed order.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

1/8/2020

Pharan
Burchfield

Coordinate with Mr. Reeve at the
City of Henderson re pick-up
original signatures on Stipulation
and Order Regarding Briefing
Schedule for Motion for Attorney’s
Fees; and direct Ms. Barker to pick-
up and deliver to Department 8
accordingly.

0.1

$100.00

$10.00

$10.00

1/10/2020

Pharan
Burchfield

File Stipulation and Order Regarding
Briefing Schedule for Motion for
Attorney Fees; draft, file, and serve
Notice of Entry of Stipulation and
Order Regarding Briefing Schedule
for Motion for Attorney Fees; update
attorneys and calendar accordingly.

0.2

$100.00

$20.00

$20.00

2/3/2020

Pharan
Burchfield

Prepare exhibits (create charts re
fees and costs; redact) and Ms.
McLetchie’s Declaration for
upcoming Attorney Fees Application
to be reviewed by attorneys.

3.7

$100.00

$370.00

$370.00

2/4/2020

Pharan
Burchfield

Prepare exhibits (fees; hours) for
attorneys’ review and approval;
organize by date and by user
specific.

1.1

$100.00

$110.00

$110.00

53
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Date Biller Note Quantity | Price Subtotal | Deduction | Total

Finalize exhibits (fees by date; fees

by user); Bates-label exhibits;

finalize Ms. McLetchie’s

Pharan Declaration in Support of Renewed
2/5/2020 | Burchfield | Motion for Attorney’s Fees. 2.1 | $100.00 | $210.00 $210.00
Totals for Pharan Burchfield 40.7 $4,050.00
54
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ATTORNEYS AT LAW

LAS VEGAS, NV 89101
(702)728-5300 (T) / (702)425-8220 (F)
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Date Description Amount

11/29/2016 | E-filing fee: Public Records Act Application Pursuant to $281.60
NRS 239.001 / Petition for Writ of Mandamus (Amount:
$3.50; Court Fee: $270.00; Card Fee: $8.10).

11/29/2016 | E-filing fee: Initial Appearance Fee Disclosure (NRS $3.50
Chapter 19).

12/19/2016 | E-filing fee: Affidavit of Service. $3.50

12/29/2016 | Junes Legal Service Invoice: EP125103 served Summons $43.00
and Complaint to City of Henderson.

12/31/2016 | Copying Costs: December 1, 2016 — December 31, 2016: 4 $0.32
pages at $0.08 per page.

12/31/2016 | Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 47 transactions $123.50
for 2016.

01/31/2017 | Copying Costs: January 1, 2017 — January 31, 2017: 168 $13.44
pages at $0.08 per page.

02/08/2017 | E-filing fee: Memorandum in Support of Application $3.50
Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/ Petition for Writ of
Mandamus/ Application for Declaratory and Injunctive
Relief.

02/08/2017 | E-filing fee: Amended Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. $3.50
Stat. 239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus/ Application
for Declaratory and Injunctive Relief.

02/28/2017 | Copying Costs: February 1, 2017 — February 28, 2017: 290 $23.20
pages at $0.08 per page.

02/28/2017 | Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 51 transactions $38.77
for February 2017.

03/23/2017 | Mileage: Travel to/from Bailey Kennedy 8984 Spanish $16.96
Ridge Ave, Las Vegas, NV 89148. Total miles: 31.4 at
$0.54/mile. (Roundtrip)

03/23/2017 | E-filing fee: Reply to Respondent City of Henderson’s $3.50
Response to Amended Public Records Act Application
Pursuant To NRS 239.001/ Petition For Writ Of Mandamus/
Application For Declaratory And Injunctive Relief.

03/27/2017 | E-filing fee: Stipulation and Order for Extension to Allow $3.50
Las Vegas Review-Journal to File its Reply to Respondent
City of Henderson’s Response to Amended Petition.

03/28/2017 | E-filing fee: Notice of Entry of Order. $3.50

03/31/2017 | Copying Costs: March 1, 2017 — March 31, 2017: 1,459 $116.72
pages at $0.08 per page.

04/30/2017 | Copying Costs: April 1, 2017 — April 30, 2017: 133 pages at $10.64
$0.08 per page.

03/31/2017 | Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 190 transactions $178.30
for March 2017.

05/31/2017 | Copying Costs: May 1, 2017 — May 31, 2017: 2 pages at $0.16
$0.08 per page.

1 JA0862
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Date Description Amount

06/01/2017 | E-filing fee: Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal’s Motion $3.50
for Attorney’s Fees and Costs.

06/09/2017 | E-filing fee: Notice of Appeal and Case Appeal Statement. $28.22

06/30/2017 | Copying Costs: June 1, 2017 — June 30, 2017: 689 pages at $55.12
$0.08 per page.

07/27/2017 | E-filing fee: Reply to City of Henderson’s Opposition to Las $3.50
Vegas Review-Journal’s Motion for Attorney’s Fees and
Costs.

07/31/2017 | Copying Costs: July 1, 2017 — July 31, 2017: 523 pages at $41.84
$0.08 per page.

07/31/2017 | Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 27 transactions $20.85
for July 2017.

08/24/2017 | E-filing fee: Motion for Extension of Time to Allows Las $3.50
Vegas Review-Journal to Submit a Proposed Order Granting
Las Vegas Review-Journal’s Motion for Attorney’s Fees and
Costs.

08/25/2017 | E-filing fee: Notice of Submission of Proposed Order. $3.50

08/31/2017 | Copying Costs: August 1, 2017 — August 31, 2017: 230 $18.40
pages at $0.08 per page.

08/31/2017 | Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 26 transactions $20.01
for August 2017.

09/07/2017 | E-filing fee: Motion for Extension of Time to Allow Las $3.50
Vegas Review-Journal to Submit a Proposed Order Granting
Las Vegas Review-Journal’s Motion for Attorney’s Fees and
Costs (Second Request).

09/30/2017 | Copying Costs: September 1, 2017 — September 30, 2017: $12.16
152 pages at $0.08 per page.

09/30/2017 | Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 9 transactions $10.18
for September 2017.

10/31/2017 | Copying Costs: October 1, 2017 — October 31, 2017: 691 $55.28
pages at $0.08 per page.

10/31/2017 | Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 8§ transactions $7.28
for October 2017.

11/08/2017 | E-filing fee: Motion for Clarification. $3.50

11/30/2017 | Copying Costs: November 1, 2017 — November 30, 2017: $9.92
124 pages at $0.08 per page.

12/05/2017 | E-filing fee: Reply to City of Henderson’s Opposition to $3.50
Motion for Clarification.

12/31/2017 | Copying Costs: December 1, 2017 — December 31, 2017: 67 $5.36
pages at $0.08 per page.

12/31/2017 | Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 14 transactions $15.43
for December 2017.

02/28/2018 | Copying Costs: January 1, 2018 — February 28, 2018: 602 $48.64
pages at $0.08 per page.

2 JA0863
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Date Description Amount

02/28/2018 | Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 121 transactions $54.72
for February 2018.

03/28/2018 | E-filing fee: Notice of Submission of Proposed Order. $3.50

03/31/2018 | Copying Costs: March 1, 2018 — March 31, 2018: 4 pages at $0.32
$0.08 per page.

10/16/2018 | E-filing fee: Notice of Change of Firm Name. $3.50

10/31/2018 | Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 6 transactions $4.42
for October 2018.

01/08/2020 | Mileage: Travel to/from City of Henderson located at 240 $18.79
Water Street, Henderson, NV 89015: 32.4 miles at
$0.58/mile. (Roundtrip)

01/10/2020 | E-filing fee: Stipulation and Order Regarding Briefing $3.50
Schedule for Motion for Attorney Fees.

01/10/2020 | E-filing fee: Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order $3.50
Regarding Briefing Schedule for Motion for Attorney Fees.

TOTAL COSTS AND EXPENSES $1,336.55
3 JA0864

LVRI109




11/29/2016

E-Filing Details

Details of filing: Public Records Act Application Pursuant to NRS 239.001 / Petition for Writ of Mandamus
Filed in Case Number: A-16-747289-wW

E-File ID:

Lead File Size:
Date Filed:

Case Title:

Case Name:
Filing Title:

Filing Type:
Filer's Name:
Filer's Email:
Account Name:
Filing Code:
Amount:

Court Fee:

Card Fee:
Payment:
Comments:
Courtesy Copies:
Firm Name:

Your File Number:
Status:

Date Accepted:
Review Comments:

Reviewer:

File Stamped Copy:

Documents:

Data Reference ID:

Credit Card
Response:

8834353

7953230 bytes

2016-11-29 11:21:42.0

A-16-747289-W

LAS VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL VS. CITY OF HENDERSON

Public Records Act Application Pursuant to NRS 239.001 / Petition for Writ of Mandamus
EFO

Margaret A. Mcletchie

efile@nvitigation.com

Margaret A. McLetchie

PMAN

$3.50

$ 270.00

$8.10

29-NOV-2016 02:31:07 PM: Approved $281.60 on American_Express account "Margaret A. McLetchie" [****-1007]

efile@nvitigation.com; maggie@nwlitigation.com; alina@nvitigation.com

McLetchie Shell, LL.C

Accepted - (A)
2016-11-29 11:31:10.0

Joshua Raak

A-16-747289-W-
8834353 PMAN Public Records Act Application Pursuant to NRS 239 001

Cover Document: LVRI-HENDERSON - 2016.11.29 Civil Cover Sheet (signed).pdf 454264 bytes
LVRI-HENDERSON - 2016.11.29 Petition.pdf 7953230 bytes

Petition for Writ of Manda.pdf

Lead Document:

System Response: AX3CFO8B56ES
Reference:

JA0865

LVRJI10 ¥

https:/fwiznet. wiznet.com/clarknv/Details Submit.do?efileid= 8834353



11/29/2016

E-Filing Details

Details of filing: Initial Appearance Fee Disclosure (NRS Chapter 19)
Filed in Case Number: A-16-747289-W

E~File 1D:

Lead File Size:
Date Filed:

Case Title:

Case Name:
Filing Title:

Filing Type:
Filer's Name:
Filer's Email:
Account Name:
Filing Code:
Amount:

Court Fee:

Card Fee:
Payment:
Comments:
Courtesy Copies:
Firm Name:

Your File Number:
Status:

Date Accepted:
Review Comments:
Reviewer:

File Stamped Copy:

Documents:

Data Reference ID:

Credit Card Response:

https:/iwiznet.wiznet.com/ciarknv/Details Submit.do?efileid=8834360

8834360

359333 bytes

2016-11-29 11:22:41.0

A-16-747289-W

LAS VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL VS, CITY OF HENDERSON
Initial Appearance Fee Disclosure (NRS Chapter 19)
EFO

Margaret A. McLetchie

efile@nwlitigation.com

Margaret A. MclLetchie

IAFD

$3.50

$0.00

$0.00

29-NOV-2016 02:51:02 PM: Approved $3.50 on American_Express account "Margaret A. McLetchie" [**¥*-1007]

efile@nvitigation.com; maggie@nWitigation.com; alina@nvitigation.com

McLetchie Shell, LLC

Accepted - (A)
2016-11-29 11:51:05.0

Judit Angyalne Kiss

A-16-747289-W-8834360 IAFD Initial Appearance Fee Disclosure NRS Chapter 19 .pdf

Cover Document:

Lead Document: LVRJ-HENDERSON - 2016.11.29 IAFD Initial Appearance Fee Disclosure.pdf 359333 bytes

System Response: AS3CEEABD487
Reference:

JA0866
LVRIJI11
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12/19/2016

E-Filing Details

Details of filing: Affidavit of Service
Filed in Case Number: A-16-747289-W

E-File ID:

Lead File Size:
Date Filed:

Case Title:

Case Name:
Filing Title:

Filing Type:
Filer's Name:
Filer's Email:
Account Name:
Filing Code:
Amount:

Court Fee:

Card Fee:
Payment:
Comments:
Courtesy Copies:
Firm Name:

Your File Number:
Status:

Date Accepted:
Review Comments:
Reviewer:

File Stamped Copy:

Documents:

Data Reference ID:

Credit Card Response:

8899516

85829 bytes
2016-12-19 10:11:21.0
A-16-747289-W

Las Vegas Review-Journal, Plaintiff(s) vs. Henderson City of, Defendant(s)
Affidavit of Service
EFO

Margaret A. McLetchie
efile@nvitigation.com
Margaret A. Mcletchie
AOS

$3.50

$0.00

$0.00

Processing complete. Payment not yet captured.

efile@nvlitigation.com; maggie@nwvitigation.com; alina@nwitigation.com

Mcletchie Shell, LLC

Accepted - (A)
2016-12-19 10:28:39.0

Judit Angyaine Kiss

A-16-747289-W-8899516 AQS Affidavit of Service.pdf
Cover Document:
Lead Document: LVRI-HENDERSON - 2016.12.19 AQS Affidavit of Service.pdf

System Response: 0
Reference:

hitps:/fwiznet.wiznet.com/ciarknv/Details Submit.do?efileid=8899516

85829 bytes

JA0867
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Junes Legal Service, Inc.

U8 11
?“"-’ Q)

630 South Tenth St. Suite B

PROCESS INVOICE

Las Vegas, NV 89101 12/9/2016 EP125103
E—SEV’Q = Federal ID#27-0626741
ourts, Copying
N s INVOICE DATE INVOICE #
CLIENT BILLING INFO
MCLETCHIE LAW ATTN: PHARAN
ATTORNEYS AT LAW
701 E BRIDGER AVE., STE 520
LAS VEGAS, NV 89101
STATUS Rep SERVER ID DATE COMPLETE TIME INTERNAL FILE #
Subserve JACK 12/1/2016 1345
Description Qty Amount
LEFT WITH AUTHORIZED AGENT CITY OF HENDERSON C/O CITY 43.00
ATTORNEY BY SERVING BRIDGETTE RODRIGUEZ
ADD: 240 WATER ST HENDERSON, NV 89015
DOCUMENT TYPE SUMMONS AND COMPLAINT 0.00
RE: LAS VEGAS REVIEW JOURNAL V. CITY OF HENDERSON; CASE# 0.00
A-16-747289-W
Subtotal $43.00
Sales Tax (8.1 c'/CI) $0.00
GET 24/7 STATUS ON-LINE
SIGNED AFFIDAVIT READY FOR EFILING Total $43.00
Payments/Credits -$43.00
Balance Due $0.00
NV - Process Servers License # 1068 Www_JunesLegal‘com
Phone # Fax # E-mail Web Site
(702) 579-6300 (702) 259-6249 PROCESS@JunesLegal.com www.JunesLegal.com
JAO0868
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Model name Account ID Account name Print (total) Timestamp

JA0869
LVRI114



TASKalfa 3051ci 0452 LVRI - Trosper (Henderson) 12/16/2016 3:58:22 PM

JA0870
LVRIJI115



Date: Wednesday, January 04, 2017 Account: MCLETCHIE SHELL LLC, LAS VEGAS, NV
89101-5554 (1004835492)

Time: 11:04:04 AM Friday, January 01, 2016 - Saturday,
December 31, 2016

Products: WestlawNext

Content Families: All Content Families

Database
Connect Standard Special Pricing Total
Account by Client by User by Day Time  Transactions
Docs/Lines Time Charge Charge Charge

Account 1004835492

JA0871
LVRI116



Client LVRI - HPD PRA

User Name SHELL,ALINA (14115985)

Day 11/10/2016

Totals for Included
474 .00
Totals for Day 11/10/2016
474 .00
Day 11/28/2016

Totals for Included
714.00
Totals for Day 11/28/2016
714.00

Day 11/29/2016

Totals for Included

192.00
Totals for Excluded

74 .00
Totals for Day 11/29/2016

266.00
Totals for User Name SHELL,

usb

usb
ALTINA

17.e@ USD

17.08 USD

25.61 USD

25.61 USD

6.89 USD
@.00 UsSD

6.89 USD
(14115985)

.00

.00

.61

.61

.89

.00

usb

usb

usb

usb

usb

usb

usb

17

17

21

21

47

JA0872
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1,454 .00 USD 49,50 USD 123.50 USD
Totals for Client LVRJ - HPD PRA 47
1,454.00 USD 49,50 USD 123.50 USD

JAO873
LVRI118



Model name Account ID Account name Print (total) Timestamp

JA0874
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TASKalfa 3051ci 0452 LVRJ - Trosper (Henderson) 1/31/2017 4:54:03 PM

JAO875
LVRIJ120



2/9/2017

E-Filing Details

Details of filing: Memorandum in Support of Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus/
Application for Declaratory and Injunctive Relief
Filed in Case Number: A-16-747289-W

E-File ID:
Lead File Size:
Date Filed:
Case Title:

Case Name:
Filing Title:

Filing Type:
Filer's Name:
Filer's Email:

Account Name:
Filing Code:
Amount:

Court Fee:
Card Fee:
Payment:
Comments:

Courtesy
Copies:

Firm Name:

Your File
Number:

Status:

Date Accepted:

Review
Comments:

Reviewer:

File Stamped
Copy:

Documents:

Data Reference
ID:

Credit Card
Response:

https ./wiznet.wiznet.com/clarknv/Details Submit.do?efileid= 9065531

9065531

1893902 bytes

2017-02-08 21:55:32.0

A-16-747289-W

Las Vegas Review-Journal, Plaintiff(s) vs. Henderson City of, Defendant(s)

Memorandum in Support of Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus/ Application for
Declaratory and Injunctive Relief

EFS

Margaret A. McLetchie
efile@nvlitigation.com
Margaret A. McLetchie
MEMO

$3.50

$ 0.00

$0.00

09-FEB-2017 09:46:26 AM: Approved $3.50 on American_Express account "Margaret A. McLetchie" [****-1007]

efile@nvlitigation.com; maggie@nuitigation.com; alina@nMitigation.com; josh.reid@cityofhenderson.com;
brandon.kemble@cityofhederson.com; brian.reeve@cityofhenderson.com

Mcletchie Shell, LLC

Accepted - (A)
2017-02-09 06:46:33.0

Patty Azucena

A-16-747289-W-

9065531 MEMQO Memorandum in Support_of Application Pursuant to Nev Rev Stat 239 001 _Petitio.pdf

Cover Document:

Lead Document: 1893902 bytes

LVR]-HENDERSON - 2017.02.08 Memorandum ISO Petition.pdf

System Response: AT3CF4769081
Reference:

JA0876

LVRIJ121 "



2/9/2017

E-Filing Details

Details of filing: Amended Public Records Act Application Pursuant to NRS 239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus / Application
for Declaratory and Injunctive Relief - Expedited Matter Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.011
Filed in Case Number: A-16-747289-W

E-File ID:
Lead File Size:
Date Filed:
Case Title:

Case Name:
Filing Title:

Filing Type:
Filer's Name:
Filer's Email:

Account
Name:

Filing Code:
Amount:
Court Fee:
Card Fee:
Payment:

Comments:

Courtesy
Copies:

Firm Name:

Your File
Number:

Status:

Date
Accepted:

Review
Comments:

Reviewer:

File Stamped
Copy:

Documents:

Data
Reference ID:

Credit Card
Response:

hitps:/Awiznet.wiznet.com/clarknv/Details Submit.do?efileid=9065524

9065524

7523624 bytes

2017-02-08 21:31:27.0

A-16-747289-W

Las Vegas Review-Journal, Plaintiff(s) vs. Henderson City of, Defendant(s)

Amended Public Records Act Application Pursuant to NRS 239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus / Application for Declaratory and
Injunctive Relief - Expedited Matter Pursuant to Nev. Rev, Stat. 239.011

EFS

Margaret A. McLetchie
efile@nwitigation.com
Margaret A. McLetchie
APET

$3.50

$0.00

$0.00
09-FEB-2017 06:41:41 PM: Approved $3.50 on American_Express account "Margaret A, Mcletchie" [****-1007]

efile@nviitigation.com; maggie@nMitigation.com; alina@nwlitigation.com; josh.reid@cityofhenderson.com;
brandon.kemble@cityofhederson.com; brian.reeve@cityofhenderson.com

McLetchie Shell, LLC

Accepted - (A)

2017-02-09 15:41:44.0

Michelle McCarthy

A-16-747285-W-9065524 APET Amended Public Records Act Application Pursuant to NRS 239 001 Petition for Writ o.pdf

Cover Document:

Lead Document: LVRI-HENDERSON - 2017.02.08 Amended Petition.pdf 7523624 bytes

System Response: AT3CF47D03AE
Reference:

JAO877
LVRI122
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Model name Account ID Account name Print (total) Timestamp

JAO878
LVRJ123



TASKalfa 3051ci 0452 LVRIJ - Trosper (Henderson) 290

1E |

3/1/2017 7:21:08 AM

JAO879
LVRI124
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2/3/2020

https://www.mapquest.com/directions/list/1/us/nv/las-vegas/89101/701-bridger-ave-36.165789,-115.139553/to/us/nevada/las-vegas/89148-1302/8984-. .

701 Bridger Ave to 8984 Spanish Ridge Ave Directions - MapQuest

YOUR TRIP TO:

8984 Spanish Ridge Ave

20MIN | 15.7M1 £

Est. fuel cost: $1.75
Trip time based on traffic conditions as of 3:32 PM on February 3, @

2020. Current Traffic: Heavy

1. Start out going northwest on Bridger Ave toward S 7th St.

Then 0.17 miles

‘1 2. Turn left onto Las Vegas Blvd/Las Vegas Boulevard State Scenic Byway/NV-
604.
If you reach S 4th St you've gone a little too far.

Then 0.63 miles

r) 3. Turn right onto E Charleston Blvd/NV-159.
E Charleston Blivd is just past Hoover Ave.

If you reach Park Paseo you've gone about 0.1 miles too far.
Then 0.78 miles

zﬁv 4. Turn left to take the I-15 S ramp.

Then 0.02 miles

T|:t 5. Merge onto I-15 S,

Then 4.68 miles

:ﬁr 6. Take the Russell Road exit, EXIT 36, toward County Hwy-215 W.

Then 0.42 miles

zﬁv 7. Keep left to take the ramp toward County Hwy-215/1-215/1-15.

Then 1.30 miles

mwr B, Keep right to take the County Hwy-215 W/I-215 E ramp toward Henderson.

Then 0.14 miles

T}:t 9. Merge onto County Hwy-215 W,

Then 6.82 miles

zﬁv 10. Take the Russell Road exit, EXIT 19.

Then 0.30 miles

MeSevesT

Print a full health report of your car with HUM
vehicle diagnostics (800) g06-2501

0.17 total miles

0.80 total miles

1.57 total miles

1.60 total miles

6.28 total miles

6.70 total miles

8.00 total miles

8.13 total miles

14.95 total miles

15.25 total miles

JA0882
LVRIJ127
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2/3/2020 701 Bridger Ave to 8984 Spanish Ridge Ave Directions - MapQuest
T}:t 1. Merge onto Brent Thurman Way.

Then 0.40 miles 15.65 total miles

12. Turn right onto Spanish Ridge Ave.

If you reach W Hacienda Ave you've gone about 0.2 miles too far.
Then 0.03 miles 15.689 total miles

13. 8984 Spanish Ridge Ave, Las Vegas, NV 89148-1302, 8984 SPANISH RIDGE
" AVE is on the left.

If you reach S Riley St you've gone about 0.2 miles too far.

% Save to My Maps

Use of directions and maps is subject to our Terms of Use. We don’t guarantee accuracy, route conditions or usability. You assume al} risk of use.

JA0883

LVRIJ128
https://www.mapquest.com/directions/list/1/us/nv/las-vegas/89101/701-bridger-ave-36.165789,-115.139553/to/us/nevada/las-vegas/89148-1302/8984—... 2/2



3/24/2017

E-Filing Details

Details of filing: Reply to Respondent City of Henderson’s Response to Amended Public Records Act Application Pursuant To NRS
239.001/ Petition For Writ Of Mandamus/ Application For Declaratory And Injunctive Relief
Filed in Case Number: A-16-747289-W

E-File ID:
Lead File Size:
Date Filed:
Case Title:

Case Name:
Filing Title:
Filing Type:

Filer's Name:

Filer's Email:

Account
Name:

Filing Code:
Amount:
Court Fee:
Card Fee:
Payment:
Comments:

Courtesy
Copies:

Firm Name:

Your File
Number:

Status:

Date
Accepted:

Review
Comments:

Reviewer:

File Stamped
Copy:

Documents:

Data
Reference ID:

Credit Card
Response:

hitps:/iwiznet.wiznet.com/clarknv/Details Submit.do?efileid=9216188

9216188

167383 bytes

2017-03-23 21:04:27.0

A-16-747289-W

Las Vegas Review-Journal, Plaintiff(s) vs. Henderson City of, Defendant(s)

Reply to Respondent City of Henderson's Response to Amended Public Records Act Application Pursuant To NRS 239.001/ Petition
For Writ Of Mandamus/ Application For Declaratory And Injunctive Relief

EFS

Margaret A. Mcletchie

efile@nviitigation.com

Margaret A. McLetchie

RPLY

$3.50

$ 0.00

$0.00

24-MAR-2017 03:08:01 PM: Approved $3.50 on American_Express account "Margaret A. McLetchie" [****-1007]

efile@nviitigation.com

McLetchie Sheli, LLC

Accepted - (A)

2017-03-24 12:07:44.0

Judit Angyalne Kiss

A-16-747289-W-
9216188 RPLY Reply to Respondent City of Henderson s Response to Amended Public Records Act Appl.pdf

Cover Document:

Lead Document: 167383 bytes

LVRI-HENDERSON - 2017.03.23 - Reply to Response to Petition.pdf
LVRI-HENDERSON - 2017.03.23 MM Declaration (Reply).pdf
Exhibits 8-21.pdf

Attachment # 1: 299149 bytes

Attachment # 2: 10017159 bytes

System Response: AR3CES6E46AB

Reference:

JA0884

LVRI129 "



3/28/2017

Details of filing:

E-Filing Details

Stipulation and Order for Extension to Allow Las Vegas Review-Journal to File its Reply to Respondent City of

Henderson's Response to Amended Petition
Filed in Case Number; A-16-747289-W

E-File 1D:
Lead File Size:
Date Filed:
Case Title:

Case Name:
Filing Title:

Filing Type:
Filer's Name:
Filer's Email:

Account Name:
Filing Code:
Amount:

Court Fee:

Card Fee:
Payment:
Comments:
Courtesy Copies:
Firm Name:

Your File Number:
Status:

Date Accepted:

Review
Comments:

Reviewer:

File Stamped
Copy:

Documents:

Data Reference
ID:

Credit Card
Response:

https:/iwiznet.wiznet.com/clarknv/Details Submit.do?efileid=9222965

9222965

124049 bytes

2017-03-27 11:17:35.0

A-16-747289-W

Las Vegas Review-Journal, Plaintiff(s) vs. Henderson City of, Defendant(s)

Stipulation and Order for Extension to Allow Las Vegas Review-Journal to File its Reply to Respondent City of Henderson's
Response to Amended Petition

EFS

Margaret A. McLetchie

efile@nviitigation.com

Margaret A. Mcletchie

SAO

$3.50

$ 0.00

$0.00

28-MAR-2017 12:51:35 AM: Approved $3.50 on American_Express account "Margaret A. McLetchie" [¥***-1007]

efile@nvlitigation.com

McLetchie Shell, LLC

Accepted - (A)
2017-03-27 21:51:18.0

Ivonne Hernandez

A-16-747289-W-
9222965 SAQ_Stipulation and Order for Extension to Allow las Vegas Review Journal to File its Re.pdf

Cover Document:

Lead Document: 124049 bytes

LVRI-HENDERSON - 2017.03.23 SAQ (signed).pdf

System Response: AQ3CES5597C87
Reference:

JAO885
LVRIJ130

7



3/28/2017

E-Filing Details

Details of filing: Notice of Fntry of Order
Filed in Case Number: A-16-747289-W

E-File ID:

Lead File Size:
Date Filed:

Case Title:

Case Name:
Filing Title:

Filing Type:
Filer's Name:
Filer's Email:
Account Name:
Filing Code:
Amount:

Court Fee:

Card Fee:
Payment:
Comments:
Courtesy Copies:
Firm Name:

Your File Number:
Status:

Date Accepted:
Review Comments:
Reviewer:

File Stamped Copy:

Documents:

Data Reference ID:

Credit Card Response:

https /iwiznet. wiznet.com/clarknv/Details Submit.do?efileid=9226767

9226767
262285 bytes

2017-03-28 07:51:45.0

A-16-747289-W

Las Vegas Review-Journal, Plaintiff(s) vs. Henderson City of, Defendant(s)
Notice of Entry of Order

EFS

Margaret A. McLetchie

efile@nwlitigation.com

Margaret A. McLetchie

NEOJ]

$3.50

$ 0.00

$0.00

28-MAR-2017 11:43:10 AM: Approved $3.50 on American_Express account "Margaret A. McLetchie" [****-1007]

efile@nwitigation.com; maggie@nwitigation.com; alina@nviitigation.com

McLetchie Shell, LLC

Accepted - (A)
2017-03-28 08:42:54.0

Irish Lapira
A-16-747289-W-9226767 NEOJ Notice of Entry of Order.pdf

Cover Document:

Lead Document: LYRI-HENDERSON - 2017.03.28 NEQJ Notice of Entry of Order.pdf 262285 bytes

System Response: AU3CF6689BB7
Reference:

JA0886
LVRIJ131

11



Model name Account ID Account name Print (total) Timestamp

JA0887
LVRJ132



TASKalfa 3051ci 0452 LVRJ - Trosper (Henderson) 1459 3/31/2017 7:47:56 AM

JAO888
LVRJ133




Model name Account ID Account name Print (total) Timestamp

JA0889
LVRJ134



i B

TASKalfa 3051ci 0452

LVRI - Trosper {Henderson)

4/20/2017 8:10:53 AM

i

JA0890
LVRJ135
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Model nameBccount IDBccount namePrint (total)fimestamp

JA0894
LVRIJ139



TASKalfa 3051ci 452 LVRI - Trosper (Henderson) 2 6/1/2017 7:31

JA0895
LVRIJ140



7/28/2017 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Envelope Information

Envelope Id Submitted Date
1027440 6/1/2017 8:20 PM PST

Case Information

Location Category
Department 18 Civil

Case Initiation Date Case #
11/29/2016 A-16-747289-W

Assigned to Judge
Bailus, Mark B

Filings

Filing Type Filing Code

Submitted User Name
efile@nvlitigation.com

Case Type

Writ of Mandamus

EFileAndServe Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs -

MAFC
Filing Description
Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's

Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status Accepted Date
Accepted 6/2/2017 8:09 AM PST

Lead Document

File Name
LVRJ-COH - 2017.06.01 MAFC Motion
Attorney Fees and Costs.pdf

eService Details

Status Name Firm

Sent Alina M Shell McLetchie Shell, LLC
Sent Margaret A McLetchie McLetchie Shell, LLC
Sent Alina Shell .

Sent Bailey Kennedy .

Security
Public Filed Document

Served
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

hitps:/inevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1027440

Download
Original File
Court Copy

Date Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened

6/2/2017 8:36 AM PST

JA0896
LVRIJ141 173



Qdyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Firm

7/28/2017
Status Name
Sent Brandon P. Kembile .
Sent Cheryl Boyd .
Sent Dennis L. Kennedy .
Sent E-File .
Sent Margaret McLetchie .
Sent Susan Russo .

Parties with No eService

Name

Henderson City of

Fees

Address

Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs - MAFC

Description
Filing Fee

Total Filing Fee
E-File Fee

Party Responsible for
Fees

Payment Account
Filing Attorney

Transaction Response

© 2017 Tyler Technologies

Las Vegas Review-Jour...

Margaret A. Mcletchie
Margaret McLetchie

Payment Complete

Served  Date Opened
Yes 6/2/2017 8:13 AM PST
Yes 6/5/2017 8:57 AM PST
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Amount
$0.00
Filing Total: $0.00
$0.00
$3.50
Envelope Total: $3.50
Transaction Amount $3.50
Transaction Id 1516512

Order Id

https:/inevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1027440

001027440-0

Version: 3.16.2.5794

JA0897

LVRI142 213



7/28/2017 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

JA0898

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1027440 LVRIJ143 313



712812017

Envelope Information

Envelope Id
1066211

Case Information

Location
Department 18

Case Initiation Date
11/29/2016

Assigned to Judge
Bailus, Mark B

Filings
Filing Type
EFileAndServe

Filing Description
Notice of Appeal

Courtesy Copies
efile@nvlitigation.com

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status
Accepted

Lead Document

File Name

LVRJ - HENDERSON - 2017.06.09

Notice of Appeal.pdf

eService Details

Status Name

Sent Alina M Shell

Sent Margaret A McLetchie
Sent Alina Shell .

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Submitted Date
6/9/2017 3:32 PM PST

Category
Civil

Case #
A-16-747289-W

Filing Code
Notice of Appeal - NOAS

Accepted Date
6/12/2017 8:56 AM PST

Firm
MclLetchie Shell, LLC

Mcletchie Shell, LLC

Submitted User Name
efile@nvlitigation.com

Case Type
Writ of Mandamus

Security Download
Public Filed Document Original File
Court Copy

Served Date Opened

Yes Not Opened

Yes Not Opened

Yes Not Opened
JA0899

https://nevada tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope ?id=1066211

LVRIJ144 14



7/28/2017
Status Name
Sent Bailey Kennedy .
Sent Brandon P. Kemble .
Sent Cheryl Boyd .
Sent Dennis L. Kennedy .
Sent E-File .
Sent Margaret McLetchie .
Sent Susan Russo .
Filing Type

EFileAndServe

Filing Description
Case Appeal Statement

Courtesy Copies
efile@nvlitigation.com

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status
Accepted

Lead Document
File Name

LVRJ - HENDERSON - 2017.06.09
Case Appeal Statement.pdf

eService Details

Status Name

Sent Margaret A McLetchie
Sent Alina Shell .

Sent Bailey Kennedy .
Sent Brandon P. Kemble .

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?Id=1066211

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Firm

Filing Code
Case Appeal Statement - ASTA

Accepted Date
6/12/2017 8:56 AM PST

Firm

MclLetchie Shell, LLC

Served
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

Public Filed Document

Served
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

Date Opened

6/12/2017 11:13 AMPST
Not Opened

6/12/2017 8:58 AM PST
6/12/2017 12:52 PM PST
6/12/2017 11:33 AM PST
Not Opened

Not Opened

Download
Original File
Court Copy

Date Opened

Not Opened

Not Opened

6/12/2017 11:22 AM PST

6/12/2017 9:05 AM PST

JA0900
LVRI145 24



7/28/2017 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Status Name Firm Served
Sent Cheryi Boyd . Yes
Sent Dennis L. Kennedy . Yes
Sent E-File . Yes
Sent Margaret McLetchie . Yes
Sent Susan Russo . Yes
Sent Alina M Shell MclLetchie Shell, LLC Yes
Parties with No eService
Name Address
Henderson City of

Fees
Notice of Appeal - NOAS
Description Amount
Filing Fee $24.00

Case Appeal Statement - ASTA

Description
Filing Fee

Total Filing Fee
Payment Service Fee

E-File Fee
Party Responsible for Las Vegas Review-Jour...
Fees
Payment Account Margaret A. McLetchie
Filing Attorney Alina Shell
Transaction Response Payment Complete

Filing Total: $24.00

Amount
$0.00

Filing Total: $0.00

$24.00
$0.72
$3.50

Envelope Total: $28.22

Transaction Amount

Transaction Id
Order Id

https:/inevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintable Envelope?ld=1066211

Date Opened

6/12/2017 9:00 AM PST
6/12/2017 1249 PM PST
Not Opened

Not Opened

Not Opened

Not Opened

$28.22

1561875
001066211-0

JA0901
LVRI146 34



712812017 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

© 2017 Tyler Technologies Version: 3.16.2.5794

JA0902

https://nevada.tylerhost.net’OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1066211 LVRI147 4/4



Model name Account ID Account name Print (total) Timestamp

JA0903
LVRIJ148



TASKalfa 3051ci 452 LVRJ - Trosper (Henderson) 689 6/22/2017 11:35

JA0904
LVRIJ149



7/28/2017

Envelope Information

Submitted Date
7/127/2017 6:20 PM PST

Envelope Id
1280024

Case Information

Location Category
Department 18 Civil
Case Initiation Date Case #

11/29/2016 A-16-747289-W

Assigned to Judge

Bailus, Mark B

Filings

Filing Type Filing Code
EFileAndServe Reply - RPLY

Filing Description

Reply to City of Henderson's Opposition
to Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for
Attorney's Fees and Costs

Courtesy Copies
efile@nviitigation.com

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Accepted Date
7/28/2017 7:47 AM PST

Filing Status
Accepted

Lead Document

File Name

LVRJ - HENDERSON - 2017.07.27
Reply to Opposition to Motion for
Attorney Fees.pdf

eService Details

Status Name Firm
Sent Alina M Shell McLetchie Shell, LLC
Sent Margaret A McLetchie McLetchie Shell, LLC

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?id=1280024

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Submitted User Name
efile@nvlitigation.com

Case Type
Writ of Mandamus

Security Download
Public Filed Document Original File
Court Copy

Served Date Opened
Yes 7/28/2017 8:01 AM PST
Yes Not Opened

JA0905

LVRI150 1/3



7/2812017

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Status Name

Sent Alina Shell .

Sent Bailey Kennedy .
Sent Brandon P. Kemble .
Sent Cheryl Boyd .

Sent Dennis L. Kennedy .
Sent E-File .

Sent Margaret McLetchie .
Sent Susan Russo .

Sent Brian R. Reeve

Parties with No eService

Name
Henderson City of

Fees

Reply - RPLY

Description
Filing Fee

Total Filing Fee
E-File Fee

Party Responsible for
Fees

Payment Account
Filing Attorney

Transaction Response

© 2017 Tyler Technologies

Firm Served Date Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes 7/28/2017 7:52 AM PST
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
City of Henderson Yes Not Opened
Address
Amount
$0.00
Filing Total: $0.00
$0.00
$3.50
Envelope Total: $3.50
Las Vegas Review-Jour... Transaction Amount $3.50
Margaret A. McLetchie Transaction Id 1799246

Margaret McLetchie

Payment Complete

Order Id

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1280024

001280024-0

Version: 3.16.2.5794

JA0906
LVRJI51 23



7/28/2017 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

JA0907

https:/nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1280024 LVRI152 3/3



Model name Account iD Account name Print (total) Timestamp

JA0908
LVRJ153



523 7/31/2017 4:52:39 PM

0452

TASKaIfa 3051ci LVRJ - Trosper (Henderson)

JA0909
LVRI154



westLaw - Client Billing Costs July 2017
Date: Tuesday, August 01, 2017 Account: MCLETCHIE SHELL LLC, LAS VEGAS, NV

89101-5554 (1004835492)

Time: 09:27:02 AMm

July 31, 2017

Products: westlawNext

Content Families: A1l Content Families

Connect  Standard Sgecia1 Pricing
i Account by Client by uUser by Day
Docs/Lines Time Charge Charge

Saturday, July 01, 2017 - Monday,

Databhase
Total . .
Time  Transactions

JA0910
LVRIJ155



WestLaw - Client Billing Costs July 2017

I
]
]
||
M X
I
[ |
M .
|
|
R
Client LVRJ - TROSPER
User Name MCLETCHIE,MAGGIE (14115986)
Day 07/27/2017
Totals for Included 10
296.00 UsD 9.21 usb 9.21 usD
Totals for Day 07/27/2017 10
296.00 UsD 9.21 usb 9.21 usD
Totals for User Name MCLETCHIE,MAGGIE (14115986) 10
296.00 usD 9.21 usb 9.21 usD
User Name SHELL,ALINA (14115985)
Day 07/27/2017
Totals for Included 17
374.00 uUsD 11.64 usD 11.64 usD
Totals for Day 07/27/2017 17
374.00 usD 11.64 usbD 11.64 usD
Totals for User Name SHELL,ALINA (14115985) 17
374.00 UsD 11.64 usb 11.64 usD
Totals for Client LVRJ - TROSPER 27
670.00 UsD 20.85 usb 20.85 usD
I
]
]
|
I . n
EEEEEE
]
_— [ |
N
| ]
JAO911

LVRI156



8/28/2017

Envelope Information

Envelope Id
1405130

Case Information

Location
Department 18

Case Initiation Date
8/26/2017

Assigned to Judge
Bailus, Mark B

Filings

Filing Type
EFileAndServe

Filing Description

Motion for Extension of Time to Allows
Las Vegas Review-Journal to Submit a
Proposed Order Granting Las Vegas
Review-Journal's Motion for Attorney's
Fees and Costs

Courtesy Copies
efile@nvilitigation.com

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status
Accepted
Lead Document
File Name
LVRJ - HENDERSON - 2017.08.24

Motion (extend.proposed order re atty
fees).pdf

eService Details

Status Name

Sent Alina M Shell

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Submitted Date
8/24/2017 7:07 PM PST

Category
Civil

Case #
A-16-747289-W

Filing Code
Motion - MOT

Accepted Date
8/25/2017 4:54 PM PST

Firm

McLetchie Shell, LLC

Security

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAnd ServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?id=1405130

Submitted

User Name

efile@nviitigation.com

Case Type

Writ of Mandamus
Download
Original File
Court Copy

Served Date Opened

Yes Not Opened

JA0912

LVRI157 14



8/28/2017
Status Name
Sent Alina Shell .
Sent Bailey Kennedy .
Sent Brandon P. Kemble .
Sent Cheryl Boyd .
Sent Dennis L. Kennedy .
Sent E-File .
Sent Brian R. Reeve
Sent Margaret McLetchie .
Sent Susan Russo .
Sent Margaret A McLetchie
Filing Type

EFileAndServe

Filing Description
Notice of Submission of Proposed Order

Courtesy Copies
efile@nvlitigation.com

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status
Rejected

Lead Document
File Name

LVRJ - HENDERSON - 2017.08.24
Notice of Proposed Order.pdf

eService Details

Status Name

Not Sent Alina M Shell

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Firm Served Date Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes 8/28/2017 8:07 AM PST
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
City of Henderson Yes 8/25/2017 5:32 PM PST
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
McLetchie Shell, LLC Yes Not Opened
Filing Code
Notice - NOTC
Security Download
Original File
Firm Served  Date Opened
McLetchie Shell, LLC No Not Opened
JA0913

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1405130 LVRIJ158 2/4



8/28/2017

Status

Not Sent
Not Sent
Not Sent
Not Sent
Not Sent
Not Sent
Not Sent
Not Sent
Not Sent

Not Sent

Parties with No eService

Name

Henderson City of

Fees

Name

Bailey Kennedy .
Brandon P. Kemble .
E-File .

Margaret McLetchie .
Cheryl Boyd .

Dennis L. Kennedy .
Margaret A McLetchie
Alina Shell .

Susan Russo .

Brian R. Reeve

Motion - MOT

Description

Filing Fee

Notice - NOTC

Description

Filing Fee

Total Filing Fee
E-File Fee

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Address

Firm

McLetchie Shell, LLC

City of Henderson

Amount
$0.00

Filing Total: $0.00

Amount
$0.00

Filing Total: $0.00

$0.00
$3.50

Envelope Total: $3.50

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?id=1405130

Served
No
No
No
No
No
No
No
No
No

No

Date Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened

Not Opened

JA0914
LVRJ159

3/4



8/28/2017

Party Responsible for
Fees

Payment Account
Filing Attorney

Transaction Response

© 2017 Tyler Technologies

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Las Vegas Review-Jour... Transaction Amount
Margaret A. McLetchie Transaction Id
Alina Shell Order Id

Payment Complete

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1405130

$3.50

1947262
001405130-0

Version: 3.16.2.5794

JA0915
LVRIJ160

4/4



8/28/2017

Envelope Information

Envelope Id
1411240

Case Information

Location
Department 18

Case Initiation Date
8/26/2017

Assigned to Judge
Bailus, Mark B

Filings
Filing Type
EFileAndServe

Filing Description
Notice of Submission of Proposed Order

Courtesy Copies
efile@nvlitigation.com;
dept18ic@clarkcountycourts.us

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status
Accepted

Lead Document
File Name

LVRJ - HENDERSON - 2017.08.24
Proposed Order.pdf

eService Details

Status Name

Sent Alina M Shell

Sent Margaret A McLetchie
Sent Alina Shell .

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Submitted Date Submitted User Name
8/25/2017 5:34 PM PST efile@nvlitigation.com
Category Case Type
Civil Writ of Mandamus
Case #
A-16-747289-W
Filing Code
Notice - NOTC
Accepted Date
8/28/2017 6:54 AM PST
Security Download
Original File
Court Copy
Firm Served Date Opened
McLetchie Shell, LLC Yes Not Opened
McLetchie Shell, LLC Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
JA0916

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1411240

LVRIJ161 13



Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Firm

8/28/2017
Status Name
Sent Bailey Kennedy .
Sent Brandon P. Kemble .
Sent Cheryl Boyd .
Sent Dennis L. Kennedy .
Sent E-File .
Sent Margaret Mcl etchie .
Sent Susan Russo .
Sent Brian R. Reeve

City of Henderson

Parties with No eService

Name

Henderson City of

Fees

Notice - NOTC

Description
Filing Fee

Total Filing Fee
E-File Fee

Party Responsible for
Fees

Payment Account
Filing Attorney

Transaction Response

© 2017 Tyler Technologies

Address

Las Vegas Review-Jour...

Margaret A. MclLetchie
Alina Shell

Payment Complete

Served Date Opened

Yes 8/28/2017 8:31 AM PST

Yes Not Opened

Yes Not Opened

Yes Not Opened

Yes Not Opened

Yes Not Opened

Yes Not Opened

Yes 8/28/2017 9:15 AM PST
Amount

$0.00

Filing Total: $0.00

$0.00
$3.50

Envelope Total: $3.50

Transaction Amount

Transaction id
Order id

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?id=1411240

$3.50

1948451
001411240-0

Version: 3.16.2.5794

JA0917
LVRJ162 23



8/28/2017 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

JA0918

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1411240 LVRIJ163 3/3



Model name Account ID Account name Print (total) Timestamp

TASKaIfa 3051ci 0452

LVRJ - Trosper (Henderson) 230

r

8/31/2017 12:29:35 PM

JA0919
LVRJ164
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9/8/2017 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Envelope Information

Envelope Id Submitted Date
1463876 9/7/2017 6:09 PM PST

Case Information

Location Category
Department 18 Civil

Case Initiation Date Case #
11/29/2016 A-16-747289-W

Assigned to Judge
Bailus, Mark B

Filings

Filing Type Filing Code
EFileAndServe Motion - MOT

Filing Description

Motion for Extension of Time to Allow Las
Vegas Review-Journal to Submit a
Proposed Order Granting Las Vegas
Review-Journal's Motion for Attorney's
Fees and Costs (Second Request)

Courtesy Copies
efile@nviitigation.com

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status Accepted Date
Accepted 9/8/2017 7:50 AM PST

Accept Comments

This motion was straight filed only as no
"notice of motion" is included within this
pleading.

Lead Document

File Name

LVRJ - HENDERSON - 2017.09.07
Second Motion (extend.proposed order
re atty fees).pdf

eService Details

Security

https:/inevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1463876

Submitted User Name

efile@nvlitigation.com

Case Type
Writ of Mandamus

Download
Original File
Court Copy

JA0922
LVRJ167 113



9/8/2017 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Status Name Firm Served
Sent Alina M Shell Mcletchie Shell, LLC Yes
Sent Margaret A McLetchie Mcletchie Shell, LLC Yes
Sent Alina Shell Yes
Sent Bailey Kennedy . Yes
Sent Brandon P. Kemble . Yes
Sent Cheryl Boyd . Yes
Sent Dennis L. Kennedy . Yes
Sent E-File . Yes
Sent Margaret McLetchie . Yes
Sent Susan Russo . Yes
Sent Brian R. Reeve City of Henderson Yes
Parties with No eService

Name Address

Henderson City of

Fees

Motion - MOT

Description Amount
Filing Fee $0.00

Total Filing Fee
E-File Fee

Party Responsible for

Fees
Payment Account Margaret A. McLetchie
Filing Attorney Margaret McLetchie

Transaction Response Payment Complete

Las Vegas Review-Jour...

Filing Total: $0.00

$0.00
$3.50

Envelope Total: $3.50

Transaction Amount

Transaction Id
Order Id

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1463876

Date Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
9/8/2017 8:14 AM PST
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened

Not Opened

2008095
001463876-0

JA0923
LVRIJ168 2/3



9/8/2017 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

© 2017 Tyler Technologies Version: 3.16.2.5794

JA0924

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope ?id=1463876 LVRJ169 3/3



Model name Account ID Account name Print (total} Timestamp

TASKalfa 3051ci 452 LVRI - Trosper (Henderson) 152 10/2/2017 7:05

JA0925
LVRJ170




wWestLaw - Client Billing Costs September 2017
Date: Monday, October 02, 2017 Account: MCLETCHIE SHELL LLC, LAS VEGAS, NV

89101-5554 (1004835492)

Time: 12:42:42 PM Friday, September 01, 2017 - Saturday,

September 30, 2017
Products: westlawNext .
content Families: A1l Content Families

Connect  Standard Sgecia1 Pricing
) Account by Client by User by Day
Docs/Lines Time Charge Charge

Database

Time Transactions

Account 1004835492

JA0926
LVRIJI71



WestLaw - Client Billing Costs September 2017

E-==_-':_=

Client LVR] - TROSPER

User Name SHELL,ALINA (14115985)

pay 09/07/2017

Totals for Included
22.00 usD

Totals for Day 09/0752017
2.

00 usD
Day 09/25/2017

Totals for Included
126.00 usD
Totals for Day 09/25/2017
126.00 usD
Day 09/28/2017

Totals for Included
202.00 usD
Totals for Day 09/28/2017
202.00 usD

Totals for User Name SHELL,ALINA

350.00 usD

Totals for Client LVR] - TROSPER

350.00 usD

I

I

L

I

I

I

I

I

L

0.64 USD  0.64 USD

0.64 USD  0.64 USD

3.67 USD  3.67 USD

3.67 USD  3.67 USD

5.88 USD  5.88 USD

5.88 USD  5.88 USD

(14115985)

10.18 USD 10.18 usD

10.18 usD 10.18 USD
L

=

O W A N

JA0927
LVRI172



Model name Account ID  Account name Print {total) Timestamp

691

TASKalfa 3051ci

0452 LVRJ - Trosper {Henderson)

11/1/2017 7:11:08 AM

JA0928
LVRIJ173



11/1/2017 QuickView+ - Report

Account: MCLETCHIE SHELL LLC, LAS VEGAS NV (1004835492)

Date Range: October 01, 2017 - October 31, 2017

Report Format: Summary-Account by Client by User by Day

Products: WestlawNext

Content Families: All Content Families

Account by Client by User by Day Database Time Transactions DocsiLines  Connect Time Standard Charge SPeclal Pricing  poiy oo e

Charge

Account: 1004835492

||.|. |||||||||| ||||||| |||||||||| |||||“||||| ||||||| ||||||| ||||||||||

https:/iwww.quickview.com/Reports/UsageReportPrintable.aspx LVRI174 114



111172017 QuickView+ - Report

WWWM

Client LVRJ - TROSPER
User Name MCLETCHIE,MAGGIE (14115986)
Day 10/10/2017

Totals for Day 10/10/2017 2 82,00 USD 2.37UsD 2,37 Usb
Totals for User Name MCLETCHIE,MAGGIE
(14115986) 2 82.00 USD 2,37 USD 2.37 UsSD

User Name SHELL,ALINA (14115985)

r Day X 4.91 U 4.91USD
Totals for User Name SHELL,ALINA (14115985) 6 170.00 USD 4.91 USD 4.91 USD
Totals for.Client LVRJ.~TROSPER ‘ : 8 ; ; +5:252,00 USD - 7.28USD 7.28.USD

JA0930

https:/Avww.quickview.com/Reports/UsageReportPrintable.aspx LVRI175

IWWWWWW

2/4



11/9/2017

Envelope Information

Envelope Id
1740778

Case Information

Location
Department 18

Case Initiation Date
11/29/2016

Assigned to Judge
Bailus, Mark B

Filings
Filing Type
EFileAndServe

Filing Description
Motion for Clarification

Courtesy Copies
efile@nvlitigation.com

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status
Accepted

Lead Document
File Name

LVRJ - HENDERSON - 2017.11.08
Motion for Clarification.pdf

eService Details

Status Name

Sent Alina M Shell

Sent Margaret A McLetchie
Sent Alina Shell .

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope ?1d=1740778

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Submitted Date
11/8/2017 5:20 PM PST

Category
Civil

Case #
A-16-747289-W

Filing Code

Motion for Clarification - MCLA

Accepted Date
11/8/2017 5:57 PM PST

Firm

Mcl.etchie Shell, LLC

MclLetchie Shell, LLC

Submitted User Name
efile@nvlitigation.com

Case Type
Writ of Mandamus

Download
Original File
Court Copy

Served Date Opened

Yes 11/8/2017 6:01 PM PST
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
JA0931
LVRI176

13



11/9/2017
Status Name
Sent Bailey Kennedy .
Sent Brandon P. Kemble .
Sent Cheryl Boyd .
Sent Dennis L. Kennedy .
Sent E-File .
Sent Margaret McLetchie .
Sent Susan Russo .
Sent Brian R. Reeve

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Parties with No eService

Name
Henderson City of

Fees

Motion for Clarification - MCLA

Description
Filing Fee

Total Filing Fee
E-File Fee

Party Responsible for
Fees

Payment Account
Filing Attorney

Transaction Response

© 2017 Tyler Technologies

Alina Shell

Firm Served Date Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
City of Henderson Yes 11/8/2017 6:03 PM PST
Address
Amount
$0.00

Filing Total: $0.00

$0.00
$3.50

Envelope Total: $3.50

Las Vegas Review-Jourr... Transaction Amount

Transaction Id
Order id

Margaret A. McLetchie

Payment Complete

https:/nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintable Envelope?ld=1740778

$3.50

2321748
001740778-0

Version: 3.16.2.5794

JA0932
LVRIJ177

2/3



11/9/2017 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

JA0933

https:/inevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1740778 LVRIJ178 33



Model name Account ID Account name Print (total)

0452 LVRIJ - Trosper {Henderson)

E |

Timestamp

TASKalfa 3051ci 11/22/2017 12:20:03 PM

JA0934
LVRJ179



Model name Account ID Account nhame Print (total) Timestamp

TASKalfa 5052ci 0452 LVRS - Trosper (Henderson) 12/1/2017 7:55:50 AM

JA0935
LVRIJ180



12/5/2017 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Envelope Information

Envelope Id Submitted Date
1846559 12/5/2017 4:38 PM PST

Case Information

Location Category
Department 18 Civil

Case Initiation Date Case #
12/6/2017 A-16-747289-W

Assigned to Judge

Bailus, Mark B

Filings

Filing Type Filing Code
EFileAndServe Reply - RPLY (CIV)

Filing Description
Reply to City of Henderson's Opposition
to Motion for Clarification

Courtesy Copies
efile@nvlitigation.com

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status Accepted Date
Accepted 12/5/2017 4.49 PM PST

Lead Document

File Name

LVRJ - HENDERSON - 2017.12.05
RPLY Reply to Opposition to Motion for
Clarification.pdf

eService Details

Status Name Firm

Sent Alina M Shell McLetchie Shell, LLC
Sent Margaret A McLetchie MclLetchie Shell, LLC
Sent Alina Shell .

Submitted

User Name

efile@nvlitigation.com

Case Type

Wirit of Mandamus

Security

Served
Yes
Yes

Yes

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintable Envelope?ld=1846559

Download
Original File
Court Copy

Date Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened

Not Opened

JA0936
LVRIJ181

1/3



Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

12/5/2017
Status Name
Sent Bailey Kennedy .
Sent Brandon P. Kemble .
Sent Cheryl Boyd .
Sent Dennis L. Kennedy .
Sent E-File .
Sent Margaret Mcl.etchie .
Sent Susan Russo .
Sent Brian R. Reeve

Parties with No eService

Name
Henderson City of

Fees

Reply - RPLY (CIV)

Description
Filing Fee

Total Filing Fee
E-File Fee

Party Responsible for
Fees

Payment Account
Filing Attorney

Transaction Response

© 2017 Tyler Technologies

Firm Served Date Opened
Yes 12/5/2017 451 PM PST
Yes 12/5/2017 4:50 PM PST
Yes 12/5/2017 4:50 PM PST
Yes Not Opened
Yes 12/5/2017 4:53 PM PST
Yes Not Opened
Yes Not Opened
City of Henderson Yes Not Opened
Address
Amount
$0.00
Filing Total: $0.00
$0.00
$3.50
Envelope Total: $3.50
Las Vegas Review-Jour... Transaction Amount $3.50
Margaret A. McLetchie Transaction Id 24430893

Alina Shell

Payment Complete

Order Id

https.//nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=1846559

001846558-0

Version: 3.16.2.5794

JA0937
LVRIJ182 23



12/5/2017 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

JA0938

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?1d=1846559 LVRIJ183 3/3



Model name Account ID Account name Print (total)

[

Timestamp

TASKalfa 5052ci 0452 LVRIJ - Trosper {Henderson) 12/29/2017 7:53:26 AM

JA0939
LVRJ184



12/29/2017 QuickView+ - Report

Account: MCLETCHIE SHELL LLC, LAS VEGAS NV (1004835492)

Date Range: December 01, 2017 - December 25, 2017

Report Format: Summary-Account by Client by User by Day

Products: WestlawNext

Content Families: All Content Families

Account by Client by User by Day Database Time Transactions Docsilines  Connect Time Standard Charge SPecial Pricing  q545 oparge

Charge

Account: 1004835492

|
L] ]

' ||||||I ||||||I |1|||||| ||||||I |1|||||||| ||||,||.|. ||||||I ||||||.

T:'I

https:/iwww.quickview.com/Reports/UsageReportPrintable.aspx LVRIJ185 1/3



12/29/2017 QuickView+ - Report

Client 0452
User Name SHELL, ALINA (14115985)
Day 12/04/2017

¥ 422,00 USD 15.43 USD
Totals for User Name SHELL, ALINA (14115985) 14 422,00 USD 15.43 USD
Totals for Client 0452 : : 422,00 USD 15.43'USD

st

https:/iwww.quickview.com/Reports/UsageReportPrintable.aspx

D
15,43 USD
15.43 USD
15.43 USD

LVRI186

213



Model nameBccount IDBccount namePRrint (total)Eimestamp

TASKalfa 5052ci 452 LVRI - Trosper (Henderson) 602 3/1/20187:29

JA0942
LVRJ187



3/1/2018 QuickView+ - Report

Account: MCLETCHIE SHELL LLC, LAS VEGAS NV (1004835492)

Date Range: February 01, 2018 - February 28, 2018

Report Format: Summary-Account by Client by User by Day

Products: WestiawNext

Content Families: All Content Families

Account by Client by User by Day Database Time Transactions Docs/Lines  Connect Time Standard Charge SPecial Pricing Total Charge

Charge

Account: 1004835492

TN

Client 0452
User Name SHELL,ALINA {14115985)
Da

103.00 USD 1.15USD

Totals for Day 02/08/2018
Day 02/09/2018

ISD
SD

us

Totals for Day 02/09/2018 17 X 3
Totals for User Name SHELL ALINA (14115985) 85 3,508.00 USD 39.24 USD 39.24 USD
User Name WEAVER MELINDA (14282746)
Day 02/09/2018

T ‘ ]
Totals for Day 02/09/2018 9 252,00 USD 2,82 USD 2.82UsSD

Day 02/11/2018
17

https://www.quickview.com/Reports/UsageReportPrintable.aspx LVRIJ188

1/6



3/1/2018 QuickView+ - Report

Totals for Day 02/11/2018 1 28.00 USD 0.31USD 0.31 USD
Day 02/16/2018

Totals for Day 02/16/2018 7 196.00 USD 2.19USD 2.13 USD

Totals for User Name WEAVER, MELINDA

(14282745) 17 476.00 USD 5.32USD 5.32 USD

Totals for Client 0452 : : 102 : 3,984.00 USD 44.56 4SD 44.58°UsSD

Client 0452- TROSPER
User Name MCLETCHIE,MAGGIE (14115986)
Day 02/15/201

Totals for Day 02/15/2018 A 3 L

Totals for User Name MCLETCHIE, MAGGIE

(14115986) 19 908.00 USD 10.16 USD 10.16 USD
Totals for Client 0452: TROSPER : e 19 | 808.00-USD 10,46 USD 10.48 UsSD

,||||,|. ||||||' ||||||I |]|l|lll|' |]I|I|l I]I"I"I"I"||I"l"|'

https:/Aww.quickview.com/Reports/UsageReportPrintable.aspx LVRIJ189

. JA0944

2/6



3/30/2018

Envelope Information

Envelope Id
2341747

Case Information

Location
Department 18

Case Initiation Date
11/29/2016

Assigned to Judge
Bailus, Mark B

Filings
Filing Type
EFileAndServe

Filing Description
Notice of Submission of Proposed Order

Courtesy Copies
efile@nvlitigation.com

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status
Accepted

Lead Document

File Name

LVRJ-HENDERSON - 2018.03.28
NOTC Notice of Submission of
Proposed Order.pdf

eService Details

Status Name

Sent Alina M Shell

Sent Margaret A McLetchie
Sent Alina Shell .

Submitted Date
3/28/2018 12:53 PM PST

Category

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Case Type

Submitted User Name
efile@nvlitigation.com

Writ of Mandamus

Case #
A-16-747289-W

Filing Code
Notice - NOTC (CIV)

Accepted Date
3/28/2018 1:52 PM PST

Security
Firm Served
Mcletchie Shell, LLC Yes
MclLetchie Shell, LLC Yes
Yes

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope ?1d=2341747

Download
Original File
Court Copy

Date Opened
3/29/2018 7:53 AM PST
Not Opened

Not Opened

JA0945
LVRJ190 12



Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Firm

3/30/2018
Status Name
Sent Bailey Kennedy .
Sent Brandon P. Kemble .
Sent Cheryl Boyd .
Sent Dennis L. Kennedy .
Sent E-File .
Sent Margaret McLetchie .
Sent Susan Russo .
Sent Brian R. Reeve

City of Henderson

Parties with No eService

Name

Henderson City of

Fees

Notice - NOTC (CIV)

Description
Filing Fee

Total Filing Fee
E-File Fee

Party Responsible for
Fees

Payment Account
Filing Attorney

Transaction Response

© 2018 Tyler Technologies

Address

Las Vegas Review-Jour...

Margaret A. McLetchie
Margaret McLetchie

Payment Complete

Served

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Amount

$0.00

Filing Total: $0.00

$0.00
$3.50

Envelope Total: $3.50

Transaction Amount

Transaction Id
Order id

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=2341747

Date Opened
3/28/2018 1:.54 PM PST
Not Opened

3/28/2018 2:01 PM PST
Not Opened

Not Opened

Not Opened

Not Opened

3/28/2018 2:36 PM PST

$3.50

3006439
002341747-0

Version: 3.16.2.5794

JA0946
LVRIJ191 2/2



Model name AccountiD Account name Print (total} Timestamp

P

TASKalfa 5052ci 0452 LVRJ - Trosper (Henderson)

E

4/2/2018 7:23:43 AM

JA0947
LVRJ192



10/16/2018

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Case # A-16-747289-W - Las Vegas Review-Journal, Plaintiff(s)vs.He

Envelope Information

Envelope Id
3302376

Case Information

Location
Department 18

Case Initiation Date
11/29/2016

Assigned to Judge
Bailus, Mark B

Filings

Filing Type

EFileAndServe

Filing Description

Notice of Change of Firm Name

Courtesy Copies
efile@nvlitigation.com

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status
Accepted

Lead Document

File Name
HENDERSON -2018.10.16 NCFN
Notice of Change of Firm Name.pdf

eService Details

Status Name

Submitted Date Submitted User Name
10/16/2018 9:59 AM PST efile@nviitigation.com
Category Case Type

Civil Wit of Mandamus

Case #

A-16-747289-W

Filing Code
Notice of Change of Firm Name - NCFN
(Clv)

Accepted Date
10/16/2018 10:51 AM PST

Description Security
Notice of Change of Firm
Name - NCFN (CIV)

Firm Served

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=3302376

Download
Original File
Court Copy

Date Opened

JA0948
LVRJ193

13



10/16/2018

Status

Sent

Sent

Sent

Sent

Sent

Sent

Sent

Sent

Sent

Sent

Sent

Sent

Sent

Sent

Parties with No eService

Name

Name

Alina M Shell
Margaret A McLetchie
Alina Shell .

Bailey Kennedy .
Brandon P. Kemble .
Cheryl Boyd .
Dennis L. Kennedy .
E-File .

Margaret McLetchie .
Susan Russo .

Brian R. Reeve
Laura Kopanski
Alycia Grier

Robin Page

Henderson City of

Fees

QOdyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Firm
McLetchie Shell, LLC

McLetchie Shell, LLC

City of Henderson

City of Henderson

Address

Notice of Change of Firm Name - NCFN (CIV)

Description
Filing Fee

Total Filing Fee

E-File Fee

https:/inevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope ?1d=3302376

Served
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

Amount
$0.00

Filing Total: $0.00

$0.00
$3.50

Envelope Total: $3.50

Date Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened

Not Opened

10/16/2018 10:34 AM PST

Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened
Not Opened

Not Opened

JA0949
LVRJ194

213



10/16/2018

Party Responsible for
Fees

Payment Account
Filing Attorney

Transaction Response

© 2018 Tyler Technologies
Version: 2017.2.5.7059

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Las Vegas Review-Jour... Transaction Amount
Margaret A. McLetchie Transaction Id
Margaret McLetchie Order Id

Payment Complete

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?1d=3302376

$3.50

4095690

003302376-0

JA0950
LVRIJ195

33



11/9/2018 QuickView+ - Report

Account: MCLETCHIE SHELL LLC, LAS VEGAS NV (1004835492)

Date Range: October 01, 2018 - October 31, 2018

Report Format: Summary-Account by Client by User by Day

Products: Westlaw

Content Families: All Content Families

Account by Client by User by Day Database Time Transactions DocsiLines  Connect Time Standard Charge  SPecial Prcing  poiay cpapge

Charge

Account: 1004835492

.||||||||||||||||||||||||I |||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||1||||.
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Client 0452
User Name SHELL,ALINA (14115685)
Day 10/24/2018

Totals for Day 10/24/2018 1 28,00 USD 0.49USD 0.49 USD
Day 10/25/2018

0

0.98 USD

otals for Day 10/25/2018 2 56.00 USD 0.99 USD

. 2,94 USD
Totals for User Name SHELL,ALINA (14115885) 6 251.00 USD 4.42 USD 4.42 USD
Totals for Client 0452 8 : 251.00.USD 4.42.USD 4,42 USD

===
T S e
==

JA
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701 Bridger Ave to 240 S Water St, Henderson, NV, 89015-7227 Directions - MapQuest

YOUR TRIP TO: meioevesk

240 S Water St, Henderson, NV, 89015-7227

22MIN | 16.2MI1 =

Est. fuel cost: $1.81

Trip time based on traffic conditions as of 4:36 PM on February 3,

@ Print a full health report of your car with HUM
2020. Current Traffic: Heavy

vehicle diagnostics (800) 9g06-2501

1. Start out going northwest on Bridger Ave toward S 7th St.

AV

Then 0.03 miles 0.03 total miles

I_) 2. Take the 1st right onto S 7th St.
If you reach S 6th St you've gone a little too far.

Then 0.09 miles 0.12 total miles

<-| 3. Turn left onto E Carson Ave.

If you reach Fremont St you've gone a little too far.
Then 0.14 miles 0.26 total miles

I_) 4. Turn right onto Las Vegas Blvd/Las Vegas Boulevard State Scenic Byway/NV-
604.
Las Vegas Blvd is just past S 6th St.

If you reach S 4th St you've gone a little too far.
Then 0.38 miles 0.64 total miles

T}:t 5. Merge onto 1-515 S/US-95 S/US-93 S toward Phoenix/Needles.

If you reach E Bonanza Rd you've gone about 0.1 miles too far.
Then 12.40 miles 13.04 total miles

T}:t 6. Merge onto W Lake Mead Pkwy/NV-564 E via EXIT 61B.

Then 2.67 miles 15.71 total miles

I_) 7. Turn right onto S Water St.
S Water Stis 0.2 miles past W Atlantic Ave.

If you are on E Lake Mead Pkwy and reach E Victory Rd you've gone about 0.2
miles too far.

Then 0.52 miles 16.23 total miles

@_ 8. 240 S Water St, Henderson, NV 89015-7227, 240 S WATER ST is on the right.
Your destination is just past W Atlantic Ave.

If you reach E Basic Rd you've gone about 0.1 miles too far.

JA0953
LVRIJ198
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2/3/2020 701 Bridger Ave to 240 S Water St, Henderson, NV, 89015-7227 Directions - MapQuest

b Save to My Maps

Use of directions and maps is subject to our JTerms of Use. We don't guarantee accuracy, route conditions or usability. You assume all risk of use.

JA0954
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Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Case # A-16-747289-W - Las Vegas Review-Journal, Plaintiff(s)vs.He

Envelope Information

Envelope Id
5468232

Case Information

Location
Department 8

Case Initiation Date
11/29/2016

Assigned to Judge
Atkin, Trevor

Filings

Filing Type
EFileAndServe

Filing Description

Stipulation and Order Regarding Briefing

Schedule for Motion for Attorney Fees

Courtesy Copies
efile@nvlitigation.com

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status
Accepted

Lead Document

File Name
LVRJ-HENDERSON - SAQ Briefing
Schedule (signed).pdf

eService Details

Status Name

Submitted Date Submitted User Name
1/10/2020 1:48 PM PST efile@nvlitigation.com
Category Case Type

Civil Wit of Mandamus

Case #

A-16-747289-W

Filing Code
Stipulation and Order - SAQ (CIV)

Accepted Date
1/10/2020 2:02 PM PST

Description Security
Stipulation and Order - SAQ
(CIV)

Firm Served

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?ld=5468232

Download
Original File
Court Copy

Date Opened

JA0955
LVRJ200 13



1/10/2020 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Status Name Firm Served  Date Opened

Sent Alina M Shell MclLetchie Law Yes 1/10/2020 1:58 PM PST
Sent Margaret A Mcletchie MclLetchie Law Yes Not Opened

Sent Alina Shell . Yes Not Opened

Sent Bailey Kennedy . Yes 1/10/2020 2:05 PM PST
Sent Brandon P. Kembie . Yes Not Opened

Sent Cheryl Boyd . Yes Not Opened

Sent Dennis L. Kennedy . Yes Not Opened

Sent E-File . Yes Not Opened

Sent Margaret McLetchie . Yes Not Opened

Sent Susan Russo . Yes Not Opened

Sent Brian R. Reeve City of Henderson Yes Not Opened

Sent Laura Kopanski City of Henderson Yes Not Opened

Sent Alycia Grier Yes Not Opened

Sent Robin Page Yes 1/10/2020 1:58 PM PST

Parties with No eService

Name Address
Henderson City of

Fees

Stipulation and Order - SAQ (CIV)

Description Amount
Filing Fee $0.00
Filing Total: $0.00

Total Filing Fee $0.00
E-File Fee $3.50
Envelope Total: $3.50

JA0956
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1/10/2020

Party Responsible for
Fees

Payment Account

Filing Attorney

Transaction Response

© 2020 Tyler Technologies
Version; 2018.1.7.8190

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Las Vegas Review-Jour... Transaction Amount
MLAW (AMEX) Transaction Id
Alina Shell Order Id

Payment Complete

https:/nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?|d=5468232

$3.50

6563855

005468232-0

JA0957
LVRJ202
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1/10/2020 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Case # A-16-747289-W - Las Vegas Review-Journal, Plaintiff(s)vs.He

Envelope Information

Envelope Id Submitted Date Submitted User Name
5468507 1/10/2020 2:10 PM PST efile@nvlitigation.com

Case Information

Location Category Case Type
Department 8 Civil Wit of Mandamus
Case Initiation Date Case #

11/29/2016 A-16-747289-W

Assigned to Judge
Atkin, Trevor

Filings

Filing Type Filing Code
EFileAndServe Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order -
NTSO (CIV)

Filing Description

Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order
Regarding Briefing Schedule for Motion
for Attorney Fees

Courtesy Copies
efile@nvlitigation.com

Filing on Behalf of
Las Vegas Review-Journal

Filing Status Accepted Date
Accepted 1/10/2020 2:11 PM PST

Accept Comments
Auto Review Accepted

Lead Document

File Name Description Security Download
HENDERSON - 2020.01.10 NTSO Notice of Entry of Stipulation Original File
Notice of Entry of Stip and Order re and Order - NTSO (CIV) Court Copy
Briefing Schedule re Atty Fees.pdf

JA0958
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1/10/2020 Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

eService Details

Status Name Firm Served Date Opened

Sent Alina M Shell McLetchie Law Yes 1/10/2020 2:11 PM PST
Sent Margaret A McLetchie McLetchie Law Yes Not Opened

Sent Alina Shell . Yes Not Opened

Sent Bailey Kennedy . Yes 1/10/2020 2:16 PM PST
Sent Brandon P. Kemble . Yes Not Opened

Sent Cheryl Boyd . Yes Not Opened

Sent Dennis L. Kennedy . Yes Not Opened

Sent E-File . Yes Not Opened

Sent Margaret McLetchie . Yes Not Opened

Sent Susan Russo . Yes Not Opened

Sent Brian R. Reeve City of Henderson Yes Not Opened

Sent Laura Kopanski City of Henderson Yes Not Opened

Sent Alycia Grier Yes Not Opened

Sent Robin Page Yes 1/10/2020 2:12 PM PST

Parties with No eService

Name Address
Henderson City of

Fees

Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order - NTSO (CIV)

Description Amount
Filing Fee $0.00
Filing Total: $0.00

Total Filing Fee $0.00
E-File Fee $3.50

JA0959
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1/10/2020

Party Responsible for
Fees

Payment Account

Filing Attorney

Transaction Response

© 2020 Tyler Technologies
Version: 2018.1.7.8190

Odyssey File & Serve - Envelope Receipt

Envelope Total: $3.50

Las Vegas Review-Jour... Transaction Amount $3.50
MLAW (AMEX) Transaction Id 6564044
Margaret Mcletchie Order Id 005468507-0

Payment Complete

https://nevada.tylerhost.net/OfsWeb/FileAndServeModule/Envelope/ViewPrintableEnvelope?1d=5468507

JA0960
LVRIJ205
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