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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE 

 I hereby certify that the foregoing JOINT APPENDIX - VOLUME VII was 

filed electronically with the Nevada Supreme Court on the 14th day of January, 

2021. Electronic service of the foregoing document shall be made in accordance 

with the Master Service List as follows: 

Nicholas G. Vaskov, Brandon P. Kemble, and Brian R. Reeve 
CITY OF HENDERSON’S ATTORNEY OFFICE 
240 Water Street, MSC 144 
Henderson, NV 89015 
 
Dennis L. Kennedy, Sarah P. Harmon, and Kelly B. Stout 
BAILEY KENNEDY 
8984 Spanish Ridge Avenue 
Las Vegas, NV 89148 
 
Counsel for Respondent City of Henderson 

 
 

      /s/ Pharan Burchfield    
      Employee of McLetchie Law 
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EXHS 
MARGARET A. MCLETCHIE, Nevada Bar No. 10931 
ALINA M. SHELL, Nevada Bar No. 11711 
MCLETCHIE LAW 
701 E. Bridger Avenue, Suite 520 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 
Telephone: (702) 728-5300; Fax: (702) 425-8220 
Email: maggie@nvlitigation.com 
Attorneys for Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal 

 
EIGHTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT 

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA 
 

LAS VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL, 
 
Petitioner, 
 

vs. 
 
CITY OF HENDERSON,  
  

Respondent. 

 Case No.: A-16-747289-W
 
Dept. No.: VIII 
 
APPENDIX OF EXHIBITS IN 
SUPPORT OF PETITIONER LAS 
VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL’S 
AMENDED MOTION FOR 
ATTORNEY’S FEES AND COSTS 
 
Hearing Date: June 18, 2020 
Hearing Time: 9:00 a.m. 

 

INDEX OF EXHIBITS 

Exhibit Description Bates-Labeled 

n/a Declaration of Margaret A. McLetchie n/a 

1 McLetchie Law Billing: Fees by Date LVRJ001 – LVRJ055 

2 McLetchie Law Billing: Fees by User LVRJ056 – LVRJ110 

3 McLetchie Law Billing: Costs and Expenses LVRJ111 – LVRJ209 
 

DATED this 11th day of May, 2020. 
 
    /s/ Margaret A. McLetchie      

MARGARET A. MCLETCHIE, Nevada Bar No. 10931 
ALINA M. SHELL, Nevada Bar No. 11711 
MCLETCHIE LAW 
Attorneys for Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal 

  

Case Number: A-16-747289-W

Electronically Filed
5/11/2020 4:45 PM
Steven D. Grierson
CLERK OF THE COURT

JA1149
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE 

Pursuant to Administrative Order 14-2 and N.E.F.C.R. 9, I hereby certify that on 

this 11th day of May, 2020, I did cause a true copy of the foregoing APPENDIX OF 

EXHIBITS IN SUPPORT OF PETITIONER LAS VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL’S 

AMENDED MOTION FOR ATTORNEY’S FEES AND COSTS in Las Vegas Review-

Journal v. City of Henderson, Clark County District Court Case No. A-16-747289-W, to be 

served using the Odyssey E-File & Serve electronic court filing system, to all parties with an 

email address on record. 
 

   
 
        /s/ Pharan Burchfield      
        EMPLOYEE of McLetchie Law  
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EXHIBIT 1 
 

JA1151
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

11/3/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails re Public Records Act request 
responses. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

11/4/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with team re status on Trosper 
matter. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

11/9/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie Emails re setting up meeting. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

11/10/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie Prepare for and attend client call. 1.2 $450.00 $540.00 $540.00 

11/27/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie Work on Petition; research re same. 1.8 $450.00 $810.00 $810.00 

11/28/2016
Alina 
Shell

Begin review of draft complaint. 
Check citations and find Henderson 
Public Records policy and relevant 
Henderson Municipal code re fee 
schedule. 1.8 $300.00 $540.00 $540.00 

11/28/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to compiling documentation 
for petition and drafting same. 
Circulate. 4.2 $450.00 $1,890.00 $1,890.00 

11/29/2016
Alina 
Shell

Voicemail for Mr. Reeves at City of 
Henderson re accepting service of 
petition. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

11/29/2016
Alina 
Shell

Review and finalize petition for writ 
of mandamus. 1.2 $300.00 $360.00 $360.00 

11/29/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie Attention to finalizing filing. 2.0 $450.00 $900.00 $900.00 

LVRJ001

JA1152



 

  

2

 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

11/29/2016
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare and file Public Records 
Application and petition for Writ of 
Mandamus. Draft and file Initial 
Appearance Fee Disclosure and Civil 
Cover Sheet to create a new civil case 
in Eighth Judicial District Court.
Attention to scheduling a legal 
process server re same. Email clients 
re same. 0.9 $100.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/2/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie Review emails re service. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

12/5/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review and respond to letter from 
Josh Reid. Circulate letter to clients. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

12/6/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Further emails with Josh Reid. Emails 
with his office re setting up meeting. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

12/7/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with RJ team regarding status 
and next steps. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

12/7/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie Review pertinent media coverage. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/14/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Prepare for and attend call with Josh 
Reid and two deputy City of 
Henderson attorneys. Negotiate for in-
person inspection. Update clients re 
same. 1.7 $450.00 $765.00 $765.00 

12/19/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails re documents available for 
inspection. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

12/19/2016
Pharan 
Burchfield File Affidavit of Service. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

LVRJ002

JA1153
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

12/20/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to issues with review. 
Preliminary review of “privilege log.”
Call with client re litigation strategy. 
Confer with City of Henderson 
attorney Brian Reeve and plan 
meeting. 2.4 $450.00 $1,080.00 $1,080.00 

12/21/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with Henderson and with 
clients. Successfully address issue 
with how documents were presented 
for review/ Attempt to obtain CD. 0.8 $450.00 $360.00 $360.00 

12/23/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails re document review at City of 
Henderson. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/27/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Follow up to Henderson to get 
Wednesday access for Natalie Bruzda. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

1/4/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Email re log re documents withheld 
by City of Henderson. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/5/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to compiling pertinent 
legislative history. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

1/9/2017
Alina 
Shell

Trosper: Review NRS 34 to confirm 
compliance with same in submitting 
petition to Court. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/9/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Call with Henderson City Attorneys 
and follow up with client re same. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

1/9/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Calendaring - check Henderson 
deadline to respond to writ. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/10/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Preliminary review of supplemental 
log received from City of Henderson. 0.7 $450.00 $315.00 $315.00 

LVRJ003

JA1154
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

1/10/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Receive redacted documents from 
City of Henderson; create City of 
Henderson portal account to 
download, print, and save redacted 
documents from Public Records Act 
request (re Trosper). 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

1/11/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Edits to stipulation, call with and 
emails with City of Henderson 
attorneys. 0.6 $450.00 $270.00 $270.00 

1/12/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Execute stipulation. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

1/12/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Call with client. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/13/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Compile legislative history of the 
Nevada Public Records Act for Ms. 
McLetchie; send same to Ms. 
McLetchie. 0.6 $125.00 $75.00 $75.00 

1/13/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Research assignment from Ms. 
McLetchie - compiling legislative 
history. 0.7 $125.00 $87.50 $87.50 

1/17/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Emails with client. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/24/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Review privilege log for Ms. 
McLetchie, analyze re what has been 
claimed as privileged. 2.4 $125.00 $300.00 $(300.00) $-

1/24/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Review documents attached to 
pleadings. 0.3 $125.00 $37.50 $37.50 

1/24/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Continue researching the legislative 
history for NRS 239. 1.6 $125.00 $200.00 $200.00 

LVRJ004

JA1155
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

1/24/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to scheduling of review of 
privilege log, amending complaint, 
and filing supporting brief. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

1/24/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Calls and emails with opposing 
counsel and court re case status, 
scheduling. Begin plans for amending. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

1/25/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to emails with court and 
opposing counsel re scheduling; 
update to clients re same. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

1/25/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Email communications with Ms. 
Boyd (City of Henderson) re signed 
Stipulation re extension. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/26/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Research for Ms. McLetchie about the 
requirements of a privilege log. 1.8 $125.00 $225.00 $225.00 

1/26/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Meet with Ms. McLetchie to discuss 
the privilege log received from City of 
Henderson. 0.3 $125.00 $37.50 $37.50 

1/26/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Continue reviewing privilege log 
provided by City of Henderson, 
provide analysis to Ms. McLetchie. 1.8 $125.00 $225.00 $225.00 

1/27/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Update privilege log analysis 
document for Ms. McLetchie. 0.4 $125.00 $50.00 $(50.00) $-

1/27/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Research the attorney/client privilege 
and work product privilege. 3.8 $125.00 $475.00 $(475.00) $-

1/30/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Finalize privilege log analysis and 
provide same to Ms. McLetchie for 
review. 0.2 $125.00 $25.00 $25.00 

LVRJ005

JA1156
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

2/1/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Continue reviewing documents 
received from City of Henderson. 1.1 $125.00 $137.50 $137.50 

2/8/2017
Alina 
Shell

Confer with Ms. McLetchie regarding 
amending petition for relief and 
drafting supporting brief. Review 
correspondence between Ms. 
McLetchie and City of Henderson. 
Begin drafting brief in support of 
petition. 8.6 $300.00 $2,580.00 $2,580.00 

2/8/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Print out copies of the redacted 
documents received from City of 
Henderson. 0.4 $125.00 $50.00 $(50.00) $-

2/8/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Amend and expand petition/ 
application; research issues; edit brief 
in support of petition/ application, 
declaration, and check exhibits. 6.2 $450.00 $2,790.00 $2,790.00 

2/8/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare exhibits to brief and amended 
petition; begin drafting declaration in 
support of amended petition. File and 
serve/mail re same. 1.4 $100.00 $140.00 $140.00 

3/9/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Emails with client re rely. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

3/14/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft public records request letter to 
City of Henderson for records 
pertaining to payment of law firm 
Bailey Kennedy for legal 
representation in this matter. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $(90.00) $-

LVRJ006

JA1157
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

3/20/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review City of Henderson response to 
amended petition and memorandum; 
confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. 1.0 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 

3/20/2017
Alina 
Shell

Revise and finalize PRA letter to City 
of Henderson requesting records 
pertaining to payments to Bailey 
Kennedy for representation in Las 
Vegas Review-Journal v. City of 
Henderson. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $(120.00) $-

3/20/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review and analyze Henderson’s
response to our opening brief. Direct 
Ms. Shell re work on reply. 1.1 $450.00 $495.00 $495.00 

3/20/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize and send (mail/email) Public 
Records Act request re Bailey 
Kennedy to City of Henderson’s City 
Attorney. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $(20.00) $-

3/21/2017
Alina 
Shell

Legal research regarding exclusive 
remedies argument raised by 
Henderson in its response to opening 
brief. Research regarding declaratory 
relief. Review of order entered in 
Gray v. Clark County School District 
matter regarding extraordinary use. 
Attention to drafting reply to 
Henderson’s response. 4.3 $300.00 $1,290.00 $1,290.00 

3/21/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Research for Ms. Shell re statutory 
interpretation. 0.2 $125.00 $25.00 $25.00 

LVRJ007

JA1158
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

3/21/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Meet with Ms. McLetchie and Ms. 
Shell re: research assignment to locate 
cases that discuss legislative history is 
not needed when the statute is clear. 0.1 $125.00 $12.50 $12.50 

3/22/2017
Alina 
Shell

Continue drafting reply to response to 
amended petition/memorandum in 
support of petition. 5.1 $300.00 $1,530.00 $1,530.00 

3/22/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review and edit stipulation for 
extension of time. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

3/22/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Further review and analysis of 
Henderson’s response to petition for 
work on reply; direct Ms. Burchfield 
to circulate response to clients. 1.8 $450.00 $810.00 $810.00 

3/22/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Stipulation (re extension for 
Reply) for attorneys’ review; email 
communications with Mr. Kennedy re 
same. 0.3 $100.00 $30.00 $30.00 

3/23/2017
Alina 
Shell

Resume drafting reply to Henderson 
response. Review Henderson’s Third 
Privilege Log. Review 
communications with Henderson for 
inclusion in statement of facts. Legal 
research regarding scope of 
deliberative process privilege and 
attorney-client privilege. Edit 
declaration. 9.6 $300.00 $2,880.00 $2,880.00 

3/23/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Revising and editing of reply; 
attention to declaration; research and 
draft section re mootness. 6.8 $450.00 $3,060.00 $3,060.00 

LVRJ008

JA1159
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

3/23/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Review external communications with 
City of Henderson re potential 
exhibits re Reply; draft Ms. 
McLetchie’s declaration re same; 
finalize, file, and serve/mail Reply re 
same. 2.1 $100.00 $210.00 $210.00 

3/27/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

File Stipulation and Order for 
Extension to Allow Las Vegas 
Review-Journal to File its Reply to 
Respondent City of Henderson’s
Response to Amended Petition. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

3/28/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft, file, and serve/mail Notice of 
Entry of Order (reply extension). 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

3/29/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review briefing and cases in 
preparation for upcoming hearing. 1.7 $300.00 $510.00 $510.00 

3/30/2017
Alina 
Shell

Prepare for and attend hearing on 
petition re Henderson public records. 1.6 $300.00 $480.00 $480.00 

3/30/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attend hearing; call to client; email 
summary to clients. 0.5 $450.00 $225.00 $(675.00) $(450.00)

4/4/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review and circulate response to 
request for fees information for 
Henderson’s outside counsel, Bailey 
Kennedy (records received). 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

4/14/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft edits and commentary to 
Henderson’s proposed order re NPRA 
petition. Review transcript of hearing 
on petition. 0.8 $300.00 $240.00 $240.00 

LVRJ009

JA1160
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

4/21/2017
Alina 
Shell

Update redline to proposed order re 
petition for public records. Circulate 
to Ms. McLetchie for further review. 0.5 $300.00 $150.00 $150.00 

4/27/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft letter to Honorable Judge 
Thompson re competing orders to be 
delivered to chambers with proposed 
order; email communications with 
opposing counsel re same. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

5/11/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Phone call with Al, law clerk in 
Department 18, re competing 
proposed order. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

5/15/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review order re petition for writ of 
mandamus. Verify calculated 
deadlines for filing motion for 
attorney’s fees and notice of appeal. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

5/23/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Email re renewing fees request. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

5/31/2017
Alina 
Shell Draft application for attorney fees. 3.2 $300.00 $960.00 $960.00 

5/31/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare charts/Excel spreadsheets of 
attorneys’ time and expenses for 
Motion for Attorney’s Fees 
Application. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

6/1/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review spreadsheet of attorney fees to 
be included as exhibit to motion for 
attorney fees. Edit and update draft 
motion. Circulate to Ms. McLetchie. 1.1 $300.00 $330.00 $330.00 

LVRJ010
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6/1/2017
Alina 
Shell

Attention to revised spreadsheets of 
costs and fees for inclusion in motion 
for attorney fees and costs. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

6/1/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft declaration for Ms. McLetchie 
in support of motion for attorney fees. 
Compile proposed exhibits. 0.7 $300.00 $210.00 $210.00 

6/1/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft renewed PRA request to City of 
Henderson for payments to Bailey 
Kennedy for legal services provided 
in this matter. Edit and finalize letter. 0.5 $300.00 $150.00 $150.00 

6/1/2017
Alina 
Shell

Incorporate edits to motion for 
attorney fees and supporting 
declaration provided by Ms. 
McLetchie and Mr. Wolpert. 1.7 $300.00 $510.00 $510.00 

6/1/2017
Leo 
Wolpert

Edit/proofread motion for attorney’s
fees. 1.5 $250.00 $375.00 $375.00 

6/1/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Edit motion for fees. 0.9 $450.00 $405.00 $405.00 

6/1/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize (proof and prepare exhibits), 
file and serve/mail 
Application/Motion for Attorneys’
Fees. 0.9 $100.00 $90.00 $90.00 

6/1/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize and send (mail/email) Public 
Records Act request to Mr. Reid at 
City of Henderson re Bailey Kennedy. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

LVRJ011
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6/8/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Review City of Henderson’s response 
to our most recent Public Records Act 
Request regarding Bailey Kennedy’s
representation in Las Vegas Review-
Journal v. City of Henderson case.
Email copy to clients re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

6/9/2017
Alina 
Shell Draft case appeal statement. 1.1 $300.00 $330.00 $330.00 

6/9/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Direct work on Notice of Appeal and 
Case Appeal Statement. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

6/9/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Notice of Appeal and Case 
Appeal Statement. File and serve/mail 
re same. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

6/14/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Agree to extension with opposing 
counsel. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

6/15/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Respond to opposing counsel’s email 
re Stipulation re extension. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

6/19/2017
Admin 
Admin

Paid Bond on Appeal to the Nevada 
District Court (Check #2059) at the 
Regional Justice Center - 200 Lewis 
Ave. Las Vegas, NV, 89101 3rd 
Floor. 0.9 $25.00 $22.50 $22.50 

6/19/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review and edit Stipulation re 
extension; email opposing counsel. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

6/19/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Follow up re appellate filing fee. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

6/19/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Attention to extension stipulation. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

LVRJ012

JA1163



 

  

13

 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

6/20/2017
Admin 
Admin

Paid Appeal Filing fee to Nevada 
Supreme Court (Check # 2060) at 408 
East Clark Street Las Vegas, NV 
89101. 0.7 $25.00 $17.50 $17.50 

6/22/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Begin drafting Docketing 
Statement. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

7/10/2017
Alina 
Shell

Attention to preparing docketing 
statement for filing with Nevada 
Supreme Court. Address docketing 
statement questions regarding nature 
of action, issues on appeal, 
jurisdiction, retention by the Supreme 
Court, and other areas. Review and 
incorporate changes and edits to same 
provided by Ms. McLetchie. 2.0 $300.00 $600.00 $600.00 

7/10/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Edit docketing statement. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

7/10/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare Docketing Statement (prepare 
draft and exhibits); integrate 
attorneys’ edits to final draft; file and 
serve/mail re same. 1.2 $100.00 $120.00 $120.00 

7/12/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to scheduling of settlement 
conference. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

7/13/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

TROSPER: Work with Ms. Laux re 
legislative history re “extraordinary 
use” for appeal purposes. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

7/14/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to scheduling of attorney fee 
hearing. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

LVRJ013
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7/19/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Prepare for and attend conference call 
with opposing counsel and settlement 
judge. Email to clients re scheduling 
of settlement conference, and 
representations from City of 
Henderson re what they are charging. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

7/19/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails re status of requests to City of 
Henderson. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

7/19/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to scheduling of settlement 
conference. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

7/20/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with client re scheduling 
settlement conference. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

7/21/2017
Alina 
Shell

Email to counsel for City of 
Henderson regarding issue with the 
City’s exhibits in its opposition to Las 
Vegas Review-Journal’s motion for 
attorney’s fees. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

7/21/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with paralegal re issues with 
opposition. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

7/21/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Review City of Henderson’s
Opposition re Motion for Attorney’s
Fees; notice issues (missing and 
mislabeled exhibits); bring to Ms. 
McLetchie’s attention (how to 
proceed); begin creating Judge’s
courtesy copy for upcoming hearing 
re same. 0.6 $100.00 $60.00 $60.00 

LVRJ014
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7/21/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Phone call with Ms. Togo re call she 
had received from Jimmerson Law 
Office (settlement judge); attempted 
call to Jimmerson’s office re 
clarification re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

7/24/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Follow up re scheduling settlement 
conference. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

7/27/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review and address Ms. McLetchie’s
edits to reply to opposition to motion 
for attorney’s fees and costs. 7.0 $300.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 

7/27/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Edit reply to opposition to motion for 
attorney’s fees and costs.. 1.2 $450.00 $540.00 $540.00 

7/27/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with Ms. Shell re strategy re 
atty fee applications. Research issues 
re “catalyst theory.” 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

7/27/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare Reply to City of Henderson’s
Opposition to Las Vegas Review-
Journal’s Motion for Attorney’s Fees 
and Costs for filing; file and 
serve/mail re same. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

7/28/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Email clients briefing re Motion for 
Attorney’s Fees and reminder of 
hearing re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

7/31/2017
Admin 
Admin

Dropped off Attorneys’ Fees briefing 
binder at the Las Vegas Phoenix 
Building: 330 S 3rd St. Las Vegas 
NV, 89101 Department 18. 0.3 $25.00 $7.50 $7.50 

LVRJ015
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8/2/2017
Alina 
Shell

Prepare for hearing on motion for 
attorney’s fees. Review pleadings and 
draft outline of points to address 
during hearing. 1.6 $300.00 $480.00 $480.00 

8/2/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to attorney’s fees hearing 
and follow up re obtaining copy of 
ordinance from City of Henderson. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

8/2/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to preparations for hearing 
on fees application. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

8/2/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attempt to follow up with City of 
Henderson re draft ordinance. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

8/3/2017
Alina 
Shell

Prepare for hearing on motion for 
attorney’s fees. In court for argument 
on same. Memo to Ms. McLetchie 
regarding outcome of hearing. 2.7 $300.00 $810.00 $810.00 

8/10/2017
Alina 
Shell

Prepare for continued hearing on 
motion for attorney’s fees. Appear in 
court re same. 3.0 $300.00 $900.00 $900.00 

8/10/2017
Alina 
Shell

Discuss continued hearing on motion 
for attorney’s fees with Ms. 
McLetchie. Discuss next steps. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

8/10/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Attention to attorney’s fees hearing. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

8/24/2017
Alina 
Shell

Discuss proposed order re motion for 
attorney’s fees with Ms. McLetchie. 
Email City of Henderson attorneys 
regarding stipulation for extension of 
time for submitting proposed order. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00 

LVRJ016
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8/24/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft proposed stipulation and order 
re extension of time for submitting 
order to court. Email to Josh Reid re 
same. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

8/24/2017
Alina 
Shell

Re-draft stipulation to extend time for 
submitting proposed order as motion 
for extension of time. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

8/24/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize Motion for Extension of 
Time to Allows Las Vegas Review-
Journal to Submit a Proposed Order 
Granting Las Vegas Review-Journal’s
Motion for Attorney’s Fees and Costs 
and draft Notice of Submission of 
Proposed Order re same. File and 
serve/mail re same. 0.6 $100.00 $60.00 $60.00 

8/31/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft proposed order granting motion 
for attorney’s fees and costs. Email 
same to Ms. McLetchie for review. 2.7 $300.00 $810.00 $810.00 

9/2/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Follow up re attorney fee motion. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

9/7/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review and discuss Ms. McLetchie’s
edits to proposed order granting 
motion for attorney’s fees and costs. 
Incorporate edits into draft order. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

9/7/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft confidential settlement 
statement. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00 

LVRJ017
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9/7/2017
Alina 
Shell

Phone call to Brian Reeves at 
Henderson City Attorney’s office to 
obtain Henderson’s position regarding 
additional extension of time for 
submitting proposed order. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

9/7/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review and edit second motion for 
extension of time for submitting 
proposed order. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

9/7/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Edit order. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

9/7/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare Proposed Order re attorneys’
fees for attorneys’ review; email to 
opposing counsel re same. Draft 
second motion for extension for 
attorneys’ review; file and serve/mail 
re same. 0.4 $100.00 $40.00 $40.00 

9/20/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review Mr. Reeves’ redline edit of 
order re attorney fees. Edit and revise 
redline. Circulate to Ms. McLetchie 
for review. 0.6 $300.00 $180.00 $180.00 

9/20/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Emails re order. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

9/20/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Email Mr. Moyer and Mr. Cook 
update re settlement conference being 
scheduled. Confirm attendance. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

9/21/2017
Alina 
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, revise 
proposed order regarding motion for 
attorney’s fees. 0.6 $300.00 $180.00 $180.00 
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9/21/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with Brian Reeve re order re 
fees; attention to submission of 
LVRJ’s order to court. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

9/21/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Revisions to order on fees. Send to 
Brian Reeve. Finalize our proposed 
order and accompanying letter to 
judge. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

9/21/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Follow up re proposed revision. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

9/21/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft cover letter to Honorable Judge 
Bailus in anticipation of submitting 
competing proposed orders re order 
granting attorney’s fees. Email 
opposition counsel re same. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

9/21/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Drop off cover letter to Honorable 
Judge Bailus re and including 
competing proposed orders re order 
granting attorney’s fees at Phoenix 
Building, Eleventh Floor located at 
330 South Third Street. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 
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9/25/2017
Alina 
Shell

Resume drafting settlement statement 
for upcoming settlement conference. 
Review Henderson’s proposed 
revision to its municipal code 
regarding fees for fulfilling public 
records requests, and incorporate facts 
and analysis re same into settlement 
statement. Draft legal argument. 
Identify exhibits for inclusion with 
settlement statement. 2.3 $300.00 $690.00 $690.00 

9/25/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Revise draft settlement statement and 
confer with Ms. Shell re same. 0.8 $450.00 $360.00 $360.00 

9/28/2017
Alina 
Shell

Additional edits to draft settlement 
statement. Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, research legislative history of 
NRS 239.055. 3.3 $300.00 $990.00 $990.00 

9/28/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with client re settlement 
conference, Henderson’s proposed 
revised ordinance. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

9/28/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to providing comment to 
Henderson (including NPRA and 
NPRI) re proposed Henderson policy 
and fees. 1.1 $450.00 $495.00 $495.00 

9/29/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review/revise/finalize settlement 
conference brief. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 
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9/29/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Incorporate Ms. McLetchie’s edits to 
Ms. Shell’s draft of Confidential 
Settlement Statement; prepare exhibits 
re same; finalize and send 
(mail/email) Settlement Judge Jay 
Young re same. Email Mr. Moyer and 
Mr. Cook re same. 1.5 $100.00 $150.00 $150.00 

10/2/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with NPRI re Henderson 
proposed ordinance. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

10/9/2017
Alina 
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, research 
legislative history of NRS 239.055 
(fees provision) and NRS 239.012 
(bad faith provision) in preparation for 
settlement conference. 1.6 $300.00 $480.00 $480.00 

10/9/2017
Alina 
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, draft 
proposed language for revision to 
Henderson Municipal Code 2.47.085 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00 

10/9/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Call with settlement judge. Prepare 
for settlement conference. 4.5 $450.00 $2,025.00 $2,025.00 

10/9/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare binders, exhibits, and case 
law for tomorrow’s settlement 
conference. Email reminder to Mr. 
Moyer and Mr. Cook re same. 
Attention to payments re settlement 
figures; chart for Ms. McLetchie re 
same. 1.0 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 
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10/10/2017
Alina 
Shell

Settlement preparation: assist Ms. 
McLetchie in preparing for settlement 
conference by drafting talking points 
regarding issues with Henderson’s
privilege log. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

10/10/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Prepare for settlement conference. 
Direct Ms. Burchfield re items 
needed. Attend settlement conference.
Update team re same. 4.2 $450.00 $1,890.00 $1,890.00 

10/10/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Continued work on proposed revision 
to Henderson ordinance. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

10/10/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Final preparation (update settlement 
chart) for today’s settlement 
conference. 0.3 $100.00 $30.00 $30.00 

10/11/2017
Alina 
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, email to 
Court requesting hearing to obtain 
clarification re order on motion for 
attorney’s fees. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

10/11/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with counsel for Henderson re 
motion for clarification. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

10/18/2017
Alina 
Shell

Email to NPRI director Bob Fellner 
and Nevada Press Assoc. director 
Barry Smith re instructions for 
submitting written comments on 
Henderson City Council agenda items. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

10/18/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to new City of Henderson 
proposed ordinance. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 
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10/19/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review minutes and video of October 
17 Henderson City Council meeting to 
determine what happened to proposed 
revision to Henderson Municipal 
Code regarding public records fees. 
Email to Ms. McLetchie re same. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

10/26/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft motion for reconsideration of 
order regarding limited award of 
attorney’s fees. 1.0 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 

10/26/2017
Alina 
Shell

Finalize motion for reconsideration 
for filing. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

10/26/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review Nevada Rules of Appellate 
Procedure regarding transcript 
requests. Discuss same with Ms. 
Burchfield in re preparation of 
required transcript request. Review 
and edit draft transcript request. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

10/26/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review and approve request for 
transcript of proceedings. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

10/26/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Reviewing District Court docket to 
confirm whether or not to request 
transcripts for appeal; confirm 
decision not to request transcript with 
attorneys; and draft and file/serve 
Certificate That No Transcript Is 
Being Requested. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 
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11/8/2017
Alina 
Shell

Discuss motion for clarification with 
Ms. McLetchie. Address her edits and 
suggestions and circulate new draft of 
motion. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

11/8/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with Ms. Shell re Motion; 
revise same. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

11/8/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize, file, and serve/mail Motion 
for Clarification. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

11/17/2017
Alina 
Shell

Phone call from Brian Reeves to 
discuss procedural issues re appeals. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

11/20/2017
Alina 
Shell

Phone call from Brian Reeves 
regarding possible consolidation of 
appeals or, alternatively, requesting 
clustering of appeals pursuant to 
Supreme Court Internal procedures. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

12/4/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review Opposition to motion for 
clarification of award of attorney’s
fees and draft Reply. (1.0). Legal 
research re same. (0.5). 1.5 $300.00 $450.00 $450.00 

12/5/2017
Alina 
Shell

Edit reply to opposition to motion for 
clarification of order re attorney’s fee 
award. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

12/5/2017
Alina 
Shell

Address Ms. McLetchie’s final edit to 
reply to opposition to motion for 
clarification. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/5/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare courtesy copy for Judge 
Bailus re hearing on Motion for 
Clarification re Attorney’s Fees. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 
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12/5/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize, file, and serve/mail Reply to 
City of Henderson’s Opposition to 
Motion for Clarification. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

12/7/2017
Admin 
Admin

Dropped off courtesy binder for 
Hearing of Motion for Clarification at 
the Las Vegas Regional Justice 
Center: 200 Lewis Ave. Las Vegas, 
NV, 89101 Department 18. 0.3 $25.00 $7.50 $7.50 

12/13/2017
Alina 
Shell

In court for hearing on motion for 
clarification of award of attorney’s
fees. 2.0 $300.00 $600.00 $600.00 

12/13/2017
Alina 
Shell

Email to Ms. McLetchie summarizing 
hearing on motion for clarification of 
court’s award of attorney’s fees. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

12/13/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with Ms. Shell re outcome of 
hearing. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/3/2018
Alina 
Shell

Review NRAP 30 and register of 
actions and compile list of documents 
for proposed joint appendix for the 
opening brief. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

1/3/2018
Alina 
Shell

Email Mr. Reeve proposed joint 
appendix list for discussion. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

1/3/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Approve list of items for inclusion in 
proposed joint appendix. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/9/2018
Alina 
Shell

Edit motion for extension of time for 
filing opening brief. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

1/9/2018
Alina 
Shell

Phone call to Mr. Reeve to ascertain 
Henderson’s position regarding 
motion for extension of time. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 
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1/9/2018
Alina 
Shell

Further edits to motion for extension 
of time pursuant to comments from 
Ms. McLetchie. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

1/9/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie Revise motion for extension. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

1/9/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Motion for Extension re 
Opening Brief and Appendix for 
attorneys’ review. File and serve re 
same. 0.4 $100.00 $40.00 $40.00 

1/10/2018
Alina 
Shell

Respond to email from Mr. Reeve 
regarding documents Henderson 
would like included in Joint Appendix 
for appeal. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

1/10/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Begin gathering and prepare potential 
exhibits for upcoming Joint Appendix 
re appeal filing. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

1/11/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Joint Appendix; combine 
exhibits into volumes. 0.4 $100.00 $40.00 $40.00 

1/18/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize (Bates-stamp and volume) 
Joint Appendix. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

2/6/2018
Alina 
Shell

Begin drafting preliminary parts of 
opening brief. 2.0 $300.00 $600.00 $600.00 

2/7/2018
Alina 
Shell

Resume drafting Opening Brief: 
attention to statement of facts and 
standard of review. Begin drafting 
argument section. 3.0 $300.00 $900.00 $900.00 

2/8/2018
Alina 
Shell

Complete argument section of 
opening brief. 7.7 $300.00 $2,310.00 $2,310.00 
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2/9/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft, file, and serve Unopposed 
Motion for Extension of Time to File 
Appellant’s Opening Brief and 
Appendix [Second Request]. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

2/12/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie Attention to opening brief. 1.8 $450.00 $810.00 $810.00 

2/15/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Continued attention to work on 
opening brief. 2.3 $450.00 $1,035.00 $1,035.00 

2/16/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

Edit, cite check, and proofread 
Opening Brief. 3.5 $250.00 $875.00 $875.00 

2/16/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie Revisions to Opening Brief. 1.2 $450.00 $540.00 $540.00 

2/16/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie Continued attention to Opening Brief. 5.9 $450.00 $2,655.00 $2,655.00 

2/16/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare/format Opening Brief, 
including Table of Contents, Table of 
Authorities, Certificate of 
Compliance, and Certificate of 
Service; incorporate final edits from 
attorneys and file/serve Opening 
Brief. 1.9 $100.00 $190.00 $190.00 

2/21/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Follow up re status re service of brief 
and appendix. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

3/14/2018
Alina 
Shell

Review draft stipulation sent by 
Henderson City Attorney Brian Reeve 
and email approval for e-signature. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 
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3/14/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Consider/plan strategy and update to 
clients advising regarding no need to 
file notice of appeal, desirability of 
cross-appeal after Henderson files 
Notice of Appeal. 0.5 $450.00 $225.00 $225.00 

3/16/2018
Alina 
Shell

Review Nevada Rules of Appellate 
Procedure to confirm deadline for 
filing cross-appeal. Memo to Ms. 
McLetchie re same. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

3/23/2018
Alina 
Shell

Edit notice of cross-appeal and case 
appeal statement. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

3/23/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Notice of Cross-Appeal and 
Case Appeal Statement for attorney’s
review/approval. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

3/26/2018
Alina 
Shell

Final review and edit of notice of 
cross-appeal and case appeal 
statement re order on motion for 
attorney fees. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

3/26/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize, file, and serve/mail Notice of 
Cross-Appeal and Case Appeal 
Statement. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

3/28/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Call with City of Henderson 
attorneys’ attention to issues. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

3/28/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Notice of Submission of 
(September 21, 2017) Proposed Order 
for Ms. McLetchie’s review/approval. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

3/29/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails regarding settlement; City of 
Henderson Ordinance. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 
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4/3/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Email to Henderson regarding fees 
payment. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

4/3/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download and 
review Notice of Cross-Appeal; 
calendar deadline to file transcript 
request and docketing statement. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

4/4/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with Mr. Reeve regarding 
contempt (Henderson’s failure to 
comply with fees and costs order). 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

4/5/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Begin drafting 
settlement statement for mandatory 
Supreme Court Settlement Program. 1.1 $300.00 $330.00 $330.00 

4/6/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Resume drafting 
settlement statement. Complete 
sections regarding summary of legal 
issues and suitability for settlement. 
Send draft to Ms. McLetchie for 
review. 2.2 $300.00 $660.00 $660.00 

4/6/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Incorporate Ms. 
McLetchie’s edits into settlement 
statement. 0.7 $300.00 $210.00 $210.00 

4/6/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Address questions 
from Ms. Burchfield regarding 
exhibits for settlement statement and 
formatting of brief. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

4/6/2018
Alina 
Shell

Research regarding timeliness of 
motion to stay. 0.6 $300.00 $180.00 $180.00 
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4/6/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

Draft opposition to motion to stay 
pending appeal, countermotion for 
order to show cause why Henderson 
isn’t in contempt. 6.5 $250.00 $1,625.00 $1,625.00 

4/6/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Prepare exhibits in 
support of confidential settlement 
statement; finalize settlement 
statement; and send (mail/email) to 
Settlement Judge Kunin re same. 1.1 $100.00 $110.00 $110.00 

4/7/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

Research and draft regarding Order to 
Show Cause, orders without 
deadlines. 2.5 $250.00 $625.00 $625.00 

4/9/2018
Alina 
Shell

Draft declaration for Ms. McLetchie 
in support of opposition to motion for 
stay. 0.5 $300.00 $150.00 $150.00 

4/9/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

draft opposition to motion for stay, 
particular attention to untimeliness 
and the unlikelihood of prevailing on 
appeal 5.3 $250.00 $1,325.00 $1,325.00 

4/9/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

Incorporate Ms. Shell’s edits, further 
edits to opposition to motion to stay. 0.5 $250.00 $125.00 $125.00 

4/9/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with Ms. Shell and Mr. 
Wolpert regarding Opposition to 
Motion to Stay. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 
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4/10/2018
Admin 
Admin

Drop off courtesy copy of Petitioner’s
Opposition to Respondent’s Motion 
for Stay Pending Appeal and 
Countermotion for Order to Show 
Cause to Judge Bailus, Dept. 18 at the 
Phoenix Building, located at 330 S 
4th St, Las Vegas, NV 89101. 0.4 $25.00 $10.00 $10.00 

4/10/2018
Alina 
Shell

Proofread Mr. Wolpert’s draft of 
opposition to motion for stay of order 
granting the Review-Journal attorney 
fees and costs. 0.5 $300.00 $150.00 $150.00 

4/10/2018
Alina 
Shell

Hearing preparation: review cases 
cited in briefs and identify cases 
needed for argument. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

4/10/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

Final edits and cite checks to 
Opposition to motion to stay. 1.8 $250.00 $450.00 $450.00 

4/10/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize, file, and serve/mail 
Petitioner’s Opposition to 
Respondent’s Motion for Stay 
Pending Appeal and Countermotion 
for Order to Show Cause; email 
courtesy copy to opposing counsel re 
same. 0.7 $100.00 $70.00 $70.00 

4/11/2018
Alina 
Shell

Preparation for hearing on motion for 
stay of order awarding Review-
Journal attorney fees. 0.5 $300.00 $150.00 $150.00 

4/11/2018
Alina 
Shell

In court for hearing on Henderson’s
motion for stay of order awarding 
attorney fees to Review-Journal. 0.8 $300.00 $240.00 $240.00 

LVRJ031

JA1182



 

  

32

 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

4/11/2018
Alina 
Shell

Memo to Ms. McLetchie regarding 
outcome of hearing on Henderson’s
motion for stay of order granting 
Review-Journal fees and costs. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

4/11/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Review appeal 
docketing statement filed by 
Henderson regarding appeal of 
attorney fees. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

4/11/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Calls with Mr. Cook and Sandy 
regarding City of Henderson’s current 
conduct re NPRA requests. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

4/11/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Prepare for and 
attend premeditation call; Follow up 
with client regarding outcome and 
plans regarding handling same. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

4/12/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Emails regarding 
attendance at settlement conference 
by Ms. King. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

4/12/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Check docket for Court’s Minutes re 
hearing re stay. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

4/12/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Save and review 
Early Case Assessment Report; 
calendar settlement conference re 
same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

4/13/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Check docket for Court’s Minutes re 
hearing re stay. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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4/16/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Check docket for Court’s Minutes re 
hearing re stay. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

4/18/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Draft Nevada 
Supreme Court docketing statement. 0.9 $300.00 $270.00 $270.00 

4/18/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Check docket for Court’s Minutes re 
hearing re stay; download and save. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

4/18/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Begin drafting 
Docketing Statement. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

4/23/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Revision to 
Docketing Statement. 0.5 $450.00 $225.00 $225.00 

4/23/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Finalize Docketing 
Statement (prepare exhibits re same); 
file and serve/mail re same. 0.6 $100.00 $60.00 $60.00 

5/14/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Phone call with Ms. 
Walker, assistant to Settlement Judge 
Kunin, to confirm settlement 
conference date. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

5/17/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to case schedule; Possible 
cancel of settlement conference; Call 
to Mr. Reeves and follow up with 
office of settlement judge. 0.5 $450.00 $225.00 $225.00 

5/21/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Follow up regarding 
Settlement Conference, extension 
regarding Reply. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

5/23/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Edit and approve 
motion for extension of time. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

5/23/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Follow up regarding 
scheduling of Settlement Conference. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 
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5/23/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Begin preparing 
Unopposed Motion for Extension re 
Reply Brief for attorneys’
review/approval. File and serve re 
same. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

5/24/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Amended Early Case 
Assessment Report; calendar re same; 
and email clients re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

5/31/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, review, 
and save Order Granting Extension to 
File Reply Brief; update calendars and 
attorneys accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

6/28/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, email Mr. Reeve and Mr. 
Kemble regarding staying briefing in 
appeal pending settlement conference. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

7/12/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Review Henderson’s
Answering Brief and begin 
organizing/outlining Reply. Shell 
document and begin responding to 
Henderson’s statement of facts. 0.9 $300.00 $270.00 $270.00 

7/13/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Resume drafting reply to 
Henderson’s statement of facts in its 
answering brief. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

7/19/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Resume drafting reply 
brief: begin drafting reply to 
Henderson’s legal arguments. 6.6 $300.00 $1,980.00 $1,980.00 
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7/20/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Resume drafting Reply 
Brief: finish drafting legal arguments 
and email to Ms. McLetchie for 
review. 7.0 $300.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 

7/22/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Revise reply. 2.9 $450.00 $1,305.00 $1,305.00 

7/23/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Attention to completing 
Reply Brief: address Ms. McLetchie’s
revisions to draft, and adding 
suggested facts and argument; edit 
motion for leave to file excess pages; 
review NRAP to ensure compliance 
with rules for filing oversized brief 
and motion for leave to file excess 
pages; conduct additional legal 
research. 7.1 $300.00 $2,130.00 $2,130.00 

7/23/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

APPEAL: Edit, proofread, enter Ms. 
McLetchie’s changes into reply brief. 2.7 $250.00 $675.00 $675.00 

7/23/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Attention to reply brief. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

7/23/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

APPEAL: Attention to finalizing 
Reply and associated filings. 3.0 $450.00 $1,350.00 $1,350.00 

LVRJ035

JA1186



 

  

36

 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

7/23/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Finalize Motion for Excess 
Pages/Type Volume; file and serve re 
same. Finalize (format Table of 
Contents, Table of Authorities, 
Certificate of Compliance, and 
Certificate of Service) Appellant’s
Reply Brief (and addendum); file and 
serve re same. 1.4 $100.00 $140.00 $140.00 

7/30/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Phone call with Ms. Boyd 
(assistant) re Motion for Excess Pages 
and Reply Brief; email Ms. Boyd 
copy of proposed Reply Brief. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

8/8/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Call with Brian 
Reeve; attention to preparation for 
settlement conference. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

8/9/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Emails regarding 
mediation. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

8/13/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Attention to 
preparation for settlement conference. 3.0 $450.00 $1,350.00 $1,350.00 

8/13/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Prepare for 
Settlement Conference; Calls/emails 
to client representatives regarding 
same. Review municipal code 
provisions received from Mr. Reeve. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

8/13/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Prepare post-
application chart re fees and costs 
versus what client paid. 0.8 $100.00 $80.00 $80.00 

8/14/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Prepare for and 
attend Mediation. 4.0 $450.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 

LVRJ036

JA1187



 

  

37

 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

8/17/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Order Reinstating Briefing; 
calendar accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

8/27/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Emails with Mr. 
Reeve regarding transcript. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

8/28/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Email with opposing 
counsel regarding transcript. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

8/28/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Incorporate Ms. 
McLetchie’s responses to Settlement 
Program Survey; mail to Nevada 
Supreme Court re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

8/29/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Emails with Mr. 
Reeve re consolidation inquiry. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

8/29/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Draft, file, and 
send/serve Request for Transcript of 
Proceedings into District Court case; 
file and serve the District Court’s file-
stamped copy of Request for 
Transcript of Proceedings into Nevada 
Supreme Court case. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

10/2/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Phone calls with Ms. 
Page, Court Reporter for Department 
18, re status of requested transcripts. 
Phone calls with Ms. Martin, Court 
Reporter with Litigation Services, re 
requested transcripts. Phone call and 
email communications with Litigation
Services re requested transcripts re 
same. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 
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10/3/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Follow-up email 
communications with Litigation 
Services re status of requested 
transcripts. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

10/4/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Follow-up email 
communications with Litigation 
Services re status of requested 
transcripts; receive transcripts; save 
and review re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

10/15/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Draft, file, and serve Notice 
of Change of Firm Name. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

10/15/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Draft, file, and serve 
Notice of Change of Firm Name. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

10/16/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft, file, and serve/mail Notice of 
Change of Firm Name. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

10/24/2018
Alina 
Shell

Attention to Supplemental Notice of 
Authorities: Review pleadings filed in 
case to identify pages of briefs being 
supplemented by recent decision in 
PERS v. NPRI. 0.9 $300.00 $270.00 $270.00 

10/29/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

APPEAL: Attention to revising 
Notice of Supplemental Authority. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

10/29/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Finalize and file/serve 
Notice of Supplemental Authority. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

11/27/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Order re Scheduling Oral 
Argument; email attorneys re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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12/4/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

APPEAL: Review Notice Scheduling 
Oral Argument. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

12/4/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save. and 
review Notice of Oral Argument 
Setting; and calendar deadlines as 
appropriate. Email update to Mr. 
Cook and Ms. Hendrix re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

12/10/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance 
for Oral Argument for attorneys’
review. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

12/17/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Begin draft of 
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on 
cross appeal in attorney’s fee appeal. 
Draft preliminary portions of brief, 
including disclosure, routing 
statement, jurisdictional statement, 
and statement of the issues for review. 
Draft statement of facts. 2.4 $300.00 $720.00 $720.00 

12/17/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Draft Motion to Continue 
Oral Argument. 0.6 $300.00 $180.00 $180.00 

12/17/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Drafting Answering 
Brief/Opening Brief on cross-appeal: 
draft standards of review section. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 
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12/17/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Attention to 
Answering Brief and Opening Brief 
on cross appeal: Draft legal argument 
regarding why the Review-Journal 
was the prevailing party. Research 
cases cited by Henderson to rebut 
legal arguments regarding same. 1.6 $300.00 $480.00 $480.00 

12/17/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

APPEAL: Attention to Motion to 
Continue Oral Argument. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/17/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Finalize and file/serve 
Appellant’s Unopposed Motion to 
Continue Oral Argument. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

12/18/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Continue work on 
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on 
cross-appeal: Resume drafting 
arguments regarding why the Review-
Journal was the prevailing party. Draft 
argument regarding why NRS 
239.012 does not immunize 
Henderson from attorney’s fees. Draft 
argument regarding district court’s
failure to adequately address Brunzell 
factors. 4.1 $300.00 $1,230.00 $1,230.00 

12/18/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Begin preparing 
Respondent/Cross-Appellant’s
Appendix. 0.3 $100.00 $30.00 $30.00 
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12/19/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Resume drafting 
answering brief/opening brief on 
cross-appeal: Complete argument 
regarding Brunzell, draft statement of 
the case, and draft summary of the 
argument. Add additional case and 
record citations. 2.4 $300.00 $720.00 $720.00 

12/19/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

FEES APPEAL: Edit Answering 
Brief/Opening Brief in attorney’s fees 
appeal. 2.3 $250.00 $575.00 $575.00 

12/20/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Continued work on 
answering brief/opening brief on 
cross-appeal: address Ms. 
McLetchie’s preliminary edits to first 
draft of brief. Insert citations to 
Respondent’s Appendix. Re-organize 
and expand statement of facts to 
address LVRJ’s request for 
clarification of order on motion for 
attorney’s fees, other related appeal, 
and Henderson’s actions after filing of 
petition. 3.4 $300.00 $1,020.00 $1,020.00 

12/20/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Address Ms. 
McLetchie’s edits to draft of 
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on 
cross-appeal. Review, edit, and 
proofread entire brief. 2.3 $300.00 $690.00 $690.00 
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12/20/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

FEES APPEAL: Final hardcopy edits 
and proofreading of 
Answering/Opening Brief re 
attorney’s fees and costs. 1.4 $250.00 $350.00 $350.00 

12/20/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie FEES APPEAL: Revise brief. 2.0 $450.00 $900.00 $900.00 

12/20/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Finalize 
Respondent/Cross-Appellant’s
Appendix; file and serve re same.
Format and create Table of Contents, 
Table of Authorities, Certificate of 
Compliance, and Certificate of 
Service. Finalize Answering Brief and 
Opening Brief on Cross-Appeal; file 
and serve re same. 1.4 $100.00 $140.00 $140.00 

12/27/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Review order. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

12/28/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Email communication with Ms. Page, 
court reporter, confirming receipt of 
hearing transcripts from relief court 
reporter, Ms. Martin. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/3/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Emails to City of 
Henderson agreeing to extension; 
attention to stipulation re same. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

1/8/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Notice of Court Reporter Ms. 
Page re requested transcripts 
(Certificate of Acknowledgment). 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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1/18/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review City of Henderson’s Notice of 
Appearance at Oral Argument; 
confirm with Ms. McLetchie when 
she would like to file Las Vegas 
Review-Journal’s Notice re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/18/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance 
at Oral Argument for Ms. 
McLetchie’s review. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/23/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Oral Argument Reminder 
Notice; confirm calendar re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/23/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve 
Notice of Appearance for Oral 
Argument. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/28/2019
Lacey 
Ambro

APPEAL: Prepare binder for Ms. 
McLetchie for Oral Argument. 0.9 $100.00 $90.00 $90.00 

2/1/2019
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, review briefs filed in appeal 
and identify cases for Ms. Ambro to 
print in preparation for argument. 0.7 $300.00 $210.00 $210.00 

2/1/2019
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, begin outlining argument 
regarding insufficiency of 
Henderson’s privilege log. 1.5 $300.00 $450.00 $450.00 

2/1/2019
Lacey 
Ambro

APPEAL: Prepare cases and 
authorities for Ms. McLetchie for Oral 
Argument prep. 2.4 $100.00 $240.00 $240.00 

LVRJ043

JA1194
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

2/1/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

2/2/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 5.0 $450.00 $2,250.00 $2,250.00 

2/3/2019
Leo 
Wolpert

APPEAL: Research adequacy of 
privilege log in Nevada and 9th 
circuit, compare to ones provided by 
Henderson, research 
reasonable/standard rates for 
document review. 0.9 $250.00 $225.00 $225.00 

2/3/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 3.0 $450.00 $1,350.00 $1,350.00 

2/4/2019
Leo 
Wolpert

APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in 
preparation for Oral Argument, 
including updating outline of cases 
and further research on public records 
act cases. 2.5 $250.00 $625.00 $625.00 

2/4/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Travel and Argument Prep. 8.0 $450.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 

2/5/2019
Leo 
Wolpert

APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in 
Oral Argument prep by reviewing 
documents / privilege log. 0.8 $250.00 $200.00 $200.00 

2/5/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 
Argument. [REDUCED ENTRY] 6.5 $450.00 $2,925.00 $2,925.00 

2/5/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to Motion for Attorney 
Fees. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

2/6/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Travel. 4.0 $450.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 

LVRJ044

JA1195
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

2/12/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review City of Henderson’s Reply 
Brief on Appeal and Answering Brief 
on Cross-Appeal; calendar 
accordingly; and update attorneys and 
Mr. Lipman re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

2/20/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Phone call with 
Nevada Supreme Court Clerk re 
extension for Reply Brief on Cross-
Appeal; download, save, and review 
Order Granting Telephonic Extension 
re same; update attorneys and 
calendars accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

3/4/2019
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Begin drafting Reply 
Brief on Cross-Appeal, review 
Henderson’s Answering Brief/Reply 
Brief, research legal issue regarding 
whether the Amended Petition
superseded the original Petition, and 
begin drafting legal arguments. 1.8 $300.00 $540.00 $540.00 

3/4/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Attention to Reply 
Brief: provide direction to Ms. Shell. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

3/11/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Attention to Reply 
Brief: confer with Ms. Shell re status 
and provide her with direction. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

LVRJ045

JA1196
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

3/12/2019
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Resume drafting 
Reply Brief on cross-appeal and 
address direction from Ms. 
McLetchie; draft legal arguments 
regarding statutory interpretation, the 
legal landscape regarding “prevailing”
parties, and the court’s reduction of 
the LVRJ’s fee award. Review 
Henderson’s Reply Brief/Answering 
Brief and identify any additional 
arguments that need to be addressed. 6.6 $300.00 $1,980.00 $1,980.00 

3/12/2019
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Review and 
incorporate Mr. Lipman’s edits to 
Reply Brief; conduct hard copy edit of 
final draft. 1.3 $300.00 $390.00 $390.00 

3/12/2019
Leo 
Wolpert

FEES APPEAL: Draft policy 
argument sections of Reply Brief, 
proofreading. 3.7 $250.00 $925.00 $925.00 

3/12/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Revisions to Reply 
Brief/approve final version for filing. 1.1 $450.00 $495.00 $495.00 

3/12/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Incorporate 
attorneys’ edits to Reply Brief on 
Cross-Appeal; format, create Table of 
Authorities, Table of Contents, 
Certificate of Compliance, and 
Certificate of Service; finalize Reply 
Brief of Cross-Appeal and file/serve 
re same. 1.3 $100.00 $130.00 $130.00 

LVRJ046

JA1197
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

3/13/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Reply Brief on Cross-Appeal; 
and email Mr. Lipman re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

5/28/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

APPEAL: Review order. Update to 
client re same. 0.6 $450.00 $270.00 $270.00 

5/28/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Order Affirming in Part, 
Reversing in Part and Remanding; ad 
update attorneys re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

6/11/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Draft and send settlement demand to 
Henderson. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00

6/24/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with Brian Reeve regarding
possible resolution. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00

7/10/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie Emails regarding possible settlement. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00

7/17/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review 
Issued Remittitur; and update 
attorneys re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

7/19/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Forward documents received from 
Henderson to Mr. Lipman. Additional 
discussion regarding possible 
settlement. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 180.00

LVRJ047

JA1198
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7/22/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Order Submitting for Decision 
Without Oral Argument; and update 
attorneys re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

7/24/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Email with Mr. Lipman re case. 
Follow up via email / leave message 
for Henderson. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

7/24/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Obtain documents from Henderson 
and provide to client. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

7/29/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Email Mr. Lipman 
and Ms. Togo file-stamped copy of 
the Order Submitting for Decision 
Without Oral Argument. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

10/17/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie Review order. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

10/17/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Order of Reversal; and update 
attorneys re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

10/24/2019
Alina 
Shell

Phone call with Mr. Reeve regarding 
possible resolution of case. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

11/8/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

Download, save, and review Order 
Setting Further Proceedings consistent 
with Supreme Court Order; update 
attorneys and calendar accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

11/26/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Issued Remittitur; and update 
attorneys re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

LVRJ048

JA1199
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12/12/2019
Alina 
Shell

Prepare for and attend status check on 
remand and draft update memo to file 
re same. 1.2 $300.00 $360.00 $360.00 

12/12/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with Ms. Shell re hearing, 
status of case, next steps. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/13/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with Ms. Shell re briefing 
schedule; plans re same. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/17/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

Download, save, and review Court 
Minutes from 12/12/19 hearing re 
Status Check Order Setting Further 
Proceedings re Supreme Court Order; 
update attorneys and calendar 
accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

12/31/2019
Alina 
Shell

Follow up phone call and email to Mr. 
Kennedy regarding need to set 
briefing schedule. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

12/31/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

Email Court regarding extension of 
time to submit a proposed order re 
briefing schedule. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/3/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Email communications with 
Department 8 re extension of 
proposed order. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/6/2020
Alina 
Shell

Phone call with Brian Reeve re setting 
briefing schedule for attorney’s fees 
issue. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

1/6/2020
Lacey 
Ambro

Draft Stipulation and Order re 
Briefing Schedule on Motion for 
Attorney’s Fees. Circulate to Ms. 
McLetchie and Ms. Shell. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

LVRJ049

JA1200
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1/7/2020
Alina 
Shell

Review stipulation regarding 
attorney’s fees briefing schedule and 
email same to Mr. Reeve. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

1/8/2020
Admin 
Admin

Travel to/from office to City of 
Henderson to pick up signed 
Stipulation and Order Regarding 
Briefing Schedule for Motion for 
Attorney’s Fees. 1.3 $25.00 $32.50 $32.50 

1/8/2020
Admin 
Admin

Travel to/from Phoenix Building -
Dept. 8 to drop off Stipulation and 
Order Regarding Briefing Schedule 
for Motion for Attorney’s Fees 0.6 $25.00 $15.00 $15.00 

1/8/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Coordinate with Mr. Reeve at the City 
of Henderson re pick-up original 
signatures on Stipulation and Order 
Regarding Briefing Schedule for 
Motion for Attorney’s Fees; and direct 
Ms. Barker to pick-up and deliver to 
Department 8 accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/10/2020
Admin 
Admin

Travel to/from office to Phoenix 
Building - Dept. 8 to pick up 
Stipulation and Order Re Briefing 
Schedule for Motion for Attorneys’
Fees. 0.4 $25.00 $10.00 $10.00 

LVRJ050

JA1201
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1/10/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

File Stipulation and Order Regarding 
Briefing Schedule for Motion for 
Attorney Fees; draft, file, and serve 
Notice of Entry of Stipulation and 
Order Regarding Briefing Schedule 
for Motion for Attorney Fees; update 
attorneys and calendar accordingly. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

1/30/2020
Alina 
Shell

Begin drafting new motion for 
attorney’s fees: start drafting 
introduction and statement of facts. 1.1 $300.00 $330.00 $330.00 

2/2/2020
Alina 
Shell

Finish draft of renewed motion for 
attorney’s fees: complete legal 
argument and verify record citations. 3.6 $300.00 $1,080.00 $1,080.00 

2/3/2020
Alina 
Shell

Expand renewed motion for attorney’s
fees consistent with comments and 
direction from Ms. McLetchie. 2.0 $300.00 $600.00 $600.00 

2/3/2020
Alina 
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, draft 
memo for client explaining renewed 
motion for attorney’s fees. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

2/3/2020
Alina 
Shell

Attention to attorney’s fees motion: 
review spreadsheet of costs prepared 
by Ms. Burchfield and edit 
spreadsheet to exclude non-
reimbursable costs. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

2/3/2020
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review initial draft of Fees Motion. 
Review applicable Supreme Court 
orders. Confer with Ms. Shell re 
approach. Direct her to further 
research. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

LVRJ051

JA1202



 

  

52

 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

2/3/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare exhibits (create charts re fees 
and costs; redact) and Ms. 
McLetchie’s Declaration for 
upcoming Attorney Fees Application 
to be reviewed by attorneys. 3.7 $100.00 $370.00 $370.00 

2/4/2020
Margaret 
McLetchie Attention to Fees Motion. 1.5 $450.00 $675.00 $675.00 

2/4/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare exhibits (fees; hours) for 
attorneys’ review and approval; 
organize by date and by user specific. 1.1 $100.00 $110.00 $110.00 

2/5/2020
Alina 
Shell

Attention to motion for attorney’s
fees: review and edit spreadsheet of 
attorney’s fees to reduce entries that 
we previously agreed to reduce at 
hearing on first motion for attorney’s
fees. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00 

2/5/2020
Alina 
Shell

Review and finalize Ms. McLetchie’s
declaration in support of motion for 
attorney’s fees. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

2/5/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize exhibits (fees by date; fees by 
user); Bates-label exhibits; finalize 
Ms. McLetchie’s Declaration in 
Support of Renewed Motion for 
Attorney’s Fees. 2.1 $100.00 $210.00 $210.00 

2/6/2020
Alina 
Shell

Finalize Renewed Motion for 
Attorney’s Fees and confirm exhibits 
re same. 0.5 $300.00 $150.00 $150.00 

LVRJ052

JA1203
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2/6/2020
Lacey 
Ambro

Finalize Renewed Motion for 
Attorney’s Fees and exhibits; prepare 
filing; file and serve re same. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

2/6/2020
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review and confirm declaration in 
support of motion for attorney’s fees; 
sign re same. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

2/27/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Download, save, and review City of 
Henderson's Opposition to Petitioner 
Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs and 
Appendix; update attorneys and 
confirm calendar accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00

3/11/2020
Admin 
Admin

Travel to/from office to City of 
Henderson Attorney's office to pick 
up signed Stipulation and Order to 
Extend Deadline to File Reply and 
then drop off at court - Dept. 8. 1.7 $25.00 $42.50 $42.50

3/11/2020
Alina 
Shell

Edit draft stipulation to extend 
deadline for reply in support of 
motion for attorney's fees. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00

3/11/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Stipulation and Order re 
extension of Reply to Opposition to 
Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs 
for attorneys' review and approval.  
Email and phone calls with Mr. 
Kemble at City of Henderson re same. 0.4 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00

LVRJ053

JA1204
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3/16/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

File and serve Stipulation and Order 
to Extend the Deadline to File Reply 
to Opposition to Motion for Attorney 
Fees and Costs; draft, file, and serve 
Notice of Entry of Order. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00

3/23/2020
Alina 
Shell

Edit stipulation to extend deadline for 
reply in support of renewed motion 
for fees. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00

3/23/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Third Stipulation re extension to 
file Reply in support of Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs.  Email 
communications with Mr. Reeve.  
Submit/email to Department 8 re 
same. 0.3 $100.00 $30.00 $30.00

3/30/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Download, save, and review 
Stipulation and Order to Extend the 
Deadline to File the Reply to 
Opposition to Motion for Attorney 
Fees and Costs; draft, file, and serve 
Notice of Entry of Stipulation and 
Order to Extend the Deadline to File 
the Reply to Opposition to Motion for 
Attorney Fees and Costs; update 
attorneys and calendar accordingly. 0.3 $100.00 $10.00 $30.00

4/9/2020
Alina 
Shell

Phone call to Brian Reeve regarding 
new briefing schedule on Motion for 
Attorney's Fees. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00

LVRJ054

JA1205
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4/16/2020
Alina 
Shell

Attention to stipulation re new 
briefing schedule for motion for 
attorney's fees: review draft 
stipulation prepared by Mr. Reeve, 
firm calendar, and suggest dates for 
filing motion, response, and reply. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00

4/27/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Download, save, and review (1) 
Stipulation and Order Setting Briefing 
Schedule; and (2) Notice of Entry of 
Order; update attorneys and calendar 
accordingly. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00

5/1/2020
Alina 
Shell

Attention to renewed motion for 
attorney’s fees: read Nevada Supreme 
Court opinion in CIR v. LVMPD to 
assist in drafting renewed motion. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00

5/4/2020
Alina 
Shell

Attention to renewed motion for 
attorney’s fees: edit and expand 
motion to include analysis re Nevada 
Supreme Court's opinion in Center for 
Investigative Reporting adopting the 
catalyst theory for fees awards in 
public records cases. 2.6 $300.00 $780.00 $780.00

5/4/2020
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review and edit revised draft of 
renewed motion for attorney’s fees. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00

5/11/2020
Alina 
Shell

Attention to renewed motion for 
attorney’s fees: update exhibits and 
supporting declaration and finalize 
renewed motion. 3.5 $300.00 $750.00 $1,050.00

LVRJ055

JA1206
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

6/19/2017
Admin 
Admin

Paid Bond on Appeal to the Nevada 
District Court (Check #2059) at the 
Regional Justice Center - 200 Lewis 
Ave. Las Vegas, NV, 89101 3rd 
Floor. 0.9 $25.00 $22.50 $22.50 

6/20/2017
Admin 
Admin

Paid Appeal Filing fee to Nevada 
Supreme Court (Check # 2060) at 408 
East Clark Street Las Vegas, NV 
89101. 0.7 $25.00 $17.50 $17.50 

7/31/2017
Admin 
Admin

Dropped off Attorneys’ Fees briefing 
binder at the Las Vegas Phoenix 
Building: 330 S 3rd St. Las Vegas 
NV, 89101 Department 18. 0.3 $25.00 $7.50 $7.50 

12/7/2017
Admin 
Admin

Dropped off courtesy binder for 
Hearing of Motion for Clarification at 
the Las Vegas Regional Justice 
Center: 200 Lewis Ave. Las Vegas, 
NV, 89101 Department 18. 0.3 $25.00 $7.50 $7.50 

4/10/2018
Admin 
Admin

Drop off courtesy copy of Petitioner’s
Opposition to Respondent’s Motion 
for Stay Pending Appeal and 
Countermotion for Order to Show 
Cause to Judge Bailus, Dept. 18 at the 
Phoenix Building, located at 330 S 
4th St, Las Vegas, NV 89101. 0.4 $25.00 $10.00 $10.00 

LVRJ056

JA1208
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1/8/2020
Admin 
Admin

Travel to/from office to City of 
Henderson to pick up signed 
Stipulation and Order Regarding 
Briefing Schedule for Motion for 
Attorney’s Fees. 1.3 $25.00 $32.50 $32.50 

1/8/2020
Admin 
Admin

Travel to/from Phoenix Building -
Dept. 8 to drop off Stipulation and 
Order Regarding Briefing Schedule 
for Motion for Attorney’s Fees 0.6 $25.00 $15.00 $15.00 

1/10/2020
Admin 
Admin

Travel to/from office to Phoenix 
Building - Dept. 8 to pick up 
Stipulation and Order Re Briefing 
Schedule for Motion for Attorneys’
Fees. 0.4 $25.00 $10.00 $10.00 

3/11/2020
Admin 
Admin

Travel to/from office to City of 
Henderson Attorney's office to pick 
up signed Stipulation and Order to 
Extend Deadline to File Reply and 
then drop off at court - Dept. 8. 1.7 $25.00 $42.50 $42.50

Totals for Admin Admin 6.6 $165.00

11/28/2016
Alina 
Shell

Begin review of draft complaint. 
Check citations and find Henderson 
Public Records policy and relevant 
Henderson Municipal code re fee 
schedule. 1.8 $300.00 $540.00 $540.00 

11/29/2016
Alina 
Shell

Voicemail for Mr. Reeves at City of 
Henderson re accepting service of 
petition. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

LVRJ057

JA1209
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11/29/2016
Alina 
Shell

Review and finalize petition for writ 
of mandamus. 1.2 $300.00 $360.00 $360.00 

1/9/2017
Alina 
Shell

Trosper: Review NRS 34 to confirm 
compliance with same in submitting 
petition to Court. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00 

2/8/2017
Alina 
Shell

Confer with Ms. McLetchie regarding 
amending petition for relief and 
drafting supporting brief. Review 
correspondence between Ms. 
McLetchie and City of Henderson. 
Begin drafting brief in support of 
petition. 8.6 $300.00 $2,580.00 $2,580.00 

3/14/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft public records request letter to 
City of Henderson for records 
pertaining to payment of law firm 
Bailey Kennedy for legal 
representation in this matter. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $(90.00) $-

3/20/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review City of Henderson response to 
amended petition and memorandum; 
confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. 1.0 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 

3/20/2017
Alina 
Shell

Revise and finalize PRA letter to City 
of Henderson requesting records 
pertaining to payments to Bailey 
Kennedy for representation in Las 
Vegas Review-Journal v. City of 
Henderson. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $(120.00) $-

LVRJ058

JA1210
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3/21/2017
Alina 
Shell

Legal research regarding exclusive 
remedies argument raised by 
Henderson in its response to opening 
brief. Research regarding declaratory 
relief. Review of order entered in 
Gray v. Clark County School District 
matter regarding extraordinary use. 
Attention to drafting reply to 
Henderson’s response. 4.3 $300.00 $1,290.00 $1,290.00 

3/22/2017
Alina 
Shell

Continue drafting reply to response to 
amended petition/memorandum in 
support of petition. 5.1 $300.00 $1,530.00 $1,530.00 

3/22/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review and edit stipulation for 
extension of time. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

3/23/2017
Alina 
Shell

Resume drafting reply to Henderson 
response. Review Henderson’s Third 
Privilege Log. Review 
communications with Henderson for 
inclusion in statement of facts. Legal 
research regarding scope of 
deliberative process privilege and 
attorney-client privilege. Edit 
declaration. 9.6 $300.00 $2,880.00 $2,880.00 

3/29/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review briefing and cases in 
preparation for upcoming hearing. 1.7 $300.00 $510.00 $510.00 

3/30/2017
Alina 
Shell

Prepare for and attend hearing on 
petition re Henderson public records. 1.6 $300.00 $480.00 $480.00 

LVRJ059

JA1211
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

4/14/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft edits and commentary to 
Henderson’s proposed order re NPRA 
petition. Review transcript of hearing 
on petition. 0.8 $300.00 $240.00 $240.00 

4/21/2017
Alina 
Shell

Update redline to proposed order re 
petition for public records. Circulate 
to Ms. McLetchie for further review. 0.5 $300.00 $150.00 $150.00 

5/15/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review order re petition for writ of 
mandamus. Verify calculated 
deadlines for filing motion for 
attorney’s fees and notice of appeal. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

5/31/2017
Alina 
Shell Draft application for attorney fees. 3.2 $300.00 $960.00 $960.00 

6/1/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review spreadsheet of attorney fees to 
be included as exhibit to motion for 
attorney fees. Edit and update draft 
motion. Circulate to Ms. McLetchie. 1.1 $300.00 $330.00 $330.00 

6/1/2017
Alina 
Shell

Attention to revised spreadsheets of 
costs and fees for inclusion in motion 
for attorney fees and costs. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

6/1/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft declaration for Ms. McLetchie 
in support of motion for attorney fees. 
Compile proposed exhibits. 0.7 $300.00 $210.00 $210.00 

6/1/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft renewed PRA request to City of 
Henderson for payments to Bailey 
Kennedy for legal services provided 
in this matter. Edit and finalize letter. 0.5 $300.00 $150.00 $150.00 

LVRJ060
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

6/1/2017
Alina 
Shell

Incorporate edits to motion for 
attorney fees and supporting 
declaration provided by Ms. 
McLetchie and Mr. Wolpert. 1.7 $300.00 $510.00 $510.00 

6/9/2017
Alina 
Shell Draft case appeal statement. 1.1 $300.00 $330.00 $330.00 

7/10/2017
Alina 
Shell

Attention to preparing docketing 
statement for filing with Nevada 
Supreme Court. Address docketing 
statement questions regarding nature 
of action, issues on appeal, 
jurisdiction, retention by the Supreme 
Court, and other areas. Review and 
incorporate changes and edits to same 
provided by Ms. McLetchie. 2.0 $300.00 $600.00 $600.00 

7/21/2017
Alina 
Shell

Email to counsel for City of 
Henderson regarding issue with the 
City’s exhibits in its opposition to Las 
Vegas Review-Journal’s motion for 
attorney’s fees. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

7/27/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review and address Ms. McLetchie’s
edits to reply to opposition to motion 
for attorney’s fees and costs. 7.0 $300.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 

8/2/2017
Alina 
Shell

Prepare for hearing on motion for 
attorney’s fees. Review pleadings and 
draft outline of points to address 
during hearing. 1.6 $300.00 $480.00 $480.00 

LVRJ061

JA1213
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

8/3/2017
Alina 
Shell

Prepare for hearing on motion for 
attorney’s fees. In court for argument 
on same. Memo to Ms. McLetchie 
regarding outcome of hearing. 2.7 $300.00 $810.00 $810.00 

8/10/2017
Alina 
Shell

Prepare for continued hearing on 
motion for attorney’s fees. Appear in 
court re same. 3.0 $300.00 $900.00 $900.00 

8/10/2017
Alina 
Shell

Discuss continued hearing on motion 
for attorney’s fees with Ms. 
McLetchie. Discuss next steps. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

8/24/2017
Alina 
Shell

Discuss proposed order re motion for 
attorney’s fees with Ms. McLetchie. 
Email City of Henderson attorneys 
regarding stipulation for extension of 
time for submitting proposed order. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00 

8/24/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft proposed stipulation and order 
re extension of time for submitting 
order to court. Email to Josh Reid re 
same. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

8/24/2017
Alina 
Shell

Re-draft stipulation to extend time for 
submitting proposed order as motion 
for extension of time. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

8/31/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft proposed order granting motion 
for attorney’s fees and costs. Email 
same to Ms. McLetchie for review. 2.7 $300.00 $810.00 $810.00 

9/7/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review and discuss Ms. McLetchie’s
edits to proposed order granting 
motion for attorney’s fees and costs. 
Incorporate edits into draft order. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

LVRJ062

JA1214
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

9/7/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft confidential settlement 
statement. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00 

9/7/2017
Alina 
Shell

Phone call to Brian Reeves at 
Henderson City Attorney’s office to 
obtain Henderson’s position regarding 
additional extension of time for 
submitting proposed order. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

9/7/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review and edit second motion for 
extension of time for submitting 
proposed order. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

9/20/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review Mr. Reeves’ redline edit of 
order re attorney fees. Edit and revise 
redline. Circulate to Ms. McLetchie 
for review. 0.6 $300.00 $180.00 $180.00 

9/21/2017
Alina 
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, revise 
proposed order regarding motion for 
attorney’s fees. 0.6 $300.00 $180.00 $180.00 

9/25/2017
Alina 
Shell

Resume drafting settlement statement 
for upcoming settlement conference. 
Review Henderson’s proposed 
revision to its municipal code 
regarding fees for fulfilling public 
records requests, and incorporate facts 
and analysis re same into settlement 
statement. Draft legal argument. 
Identify exhibits for inclusion with 
settlement statement. 2.3 $300.00 $690.00 $690.00 

LVRJ063

JA1215
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

9/28/2017
Alina 
Shell

Additional edits to draft settlement 
statement. Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, research legislative history of 
NRS 239.055. 3.3 $300.00 $990.00 $990.00 

10/9/2017
Alina 
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, research 
legislative history of NRS 239.055 
(fees provision) and NRS 239.012 
(bad faith provision) in preparation for 
settlement conference. 1.6 $300.00 $480.00 $480.00 

10/9/2017
Alina 
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, draft 
proposed language for revision to 
Henderson Municipal Code 2.47.085 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00 

10/10/2017
Alina 
Shell

Settlement preparation: assist Ms. 
McLetchie in preparing for settlement 
conference by drafting talking points 
regarding issues with Henderson’s
privilege log. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

10/11/2017
Alina 
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, email to 
Court requesting hearing to obtain 
clarification re order on motion for 
attorney’s fees. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

10/18/2017
Alina 
Shell

Email to NPRI director Bob Fellner 
and Nevada Press Assoc. director 
Barry Smith re instructions for 
submitting written comments on 
Henderson City Council agenda items. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

LVRJ064

JA1216
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

10/19/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review minutes and video of October 
17 Henderson City Council meeting to 
determine what happened to proposed 
revision to Henderson Municipal 
Code regarding public records fees. 
Email to Ms. McLetchie re same. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

10/26/2017
Alina 
Shell

Draft motion for reconsideration of 
order regarding limited award of 
attorney’s fees. 1.0 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 

10/26/2017
Alina 
Shell

Finalize motion for reconsideration 
for filing. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

10/26/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review Nevada Rules of Appellate 
Procedure regarding transcript 
requests. Discuss same with Ms. 
Burchfield in re preparation of 
required transcript request. Review 
and edit draft transcript request. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

10/26/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review and approve request for 
transcript of proceedings. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

11/8/2017
Alina 
Shell

Discuss motion for clarification with 
Ms. McLetchie. Address her edits and 
suggestions and circulate new draft of 
motion. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

11/17/2017
Alina 
Shell

Phone call from Brian Reeves to 
discuss procedural issues re appeals. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

LVRJ065

JA1217
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

11/20/2017
Alina 
Shell

Phone call from Brian Reeves 
regarding possible consolidation of 
appeals or, alternatively, requesting 
clustering of appeals pursuant to 
Supreme Court Internal procedures. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

12/4/2017
Alina 
Shell

Review Opposition to motion for 
clarification of award of attorney’s
fees and draft Reply. (1.0). Legal 
research re same. (0.5). 1.5 $300.00 $450.00 $450.00 

12/5/2017
Alina 
Shell

Edit reply to opposition to motion for 
clarification of order re attorney’s fee 
award. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

12/5/2017
Alina 
Shell

Address Ms. McLetchie’s final edit to 
reply to opposition to motion for 
clarification. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/13/2017
Alina 
Shell

In court for hearing on motion for 
clarification of award of attorney’s
fees. 2.0 $300.00 $600.00 $600.00 

12/13/2017
Alina 
Shell

Email to Ms. McLetchie summarizing 
hearing on motion for clarification of 
court’s award of attorney’s fees. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

1/3/2018
Alina 
Shell

Review NRAP 30 and register of 
actions and compile list of documents 
for proposed joint appendix for the 
opening brief. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

1/3/2018
Alina 
Shell

Email Mr. Reeve proposed joint 
appendix list for discussion. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

1/9/2018
Alina 
Shell

Edit motion for extension of time for 
filing opening brief. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

LVRJ066

JA1218
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

1/9/2018
Alina 
Shell

Phone call to Mr. Reeve to ascertain 
Henderson’s position regarding 
motion for extension of time. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

1/9/2018
Alina 
Shell

Further edits to motion for extension 
of time pursuant to comments from 
Ms. McLetchie. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

1/10/2018
Alina 
Shell

Respond to email from Mr. Reeve 
regarding documents Henderson 
would like included in Joint Appendix 
for appeal. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

2/6/2018
Alina 
Shell

Begin drafting preliminary parts of 
opening brief. 2.0 $300.00 $600.00 $600.00 

2/7/2018
Alina 
Shell

Resume drafting Opening Brief: 
attention to statement of facts and 
standard of review. Begin drafting 
argument section. 3.0 $300.00 $900.00 $900.00 

2/8/2018
Alina 
Shell

Complete argument section of 
opening brief. 7.7 $300.00 $2,310.00 $2,310.00 

3/14/2018
Alina 
Shell

Review draft stipulation sent by 
Henderson City Attorney Brian Reeve 
and email approval for e-signature. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

3/16/2018
Alina 
Shell

Review Nevada Rules of Appellate 
Procedure to confirm deadline for 
filing cross-appeal. Memo to Ms. 
McLetchie re same. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

3/23/2018
Alina 
Shell

Edit notice of cross-appeal and case 
appeal statement. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

LVRJ067
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

3/26/2018
Alina 
Shell

Final review and edit of notice of 
cross-appeal and case appeal 
statement re order on motion for 
attorney fees. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

4/5/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Begin drafting 
settlement statement for mandatory 
Supreme Court Settlement Program. 1.1 $300.00 $330.00 $330.00 

4/6/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Resume drafting 
settlement statement. Complete 
sections regarding summary of legal 
issues and suitability for settlement. 
Send draft to Ms. McLetchie for 
review. 2.2 $300.00 $660.00 $660.00 

4/6/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Incorporate Ms. 
McLetchie’s edits into settlement 
statement. 0.7 $300.00 $210.00 $210.00 

4/6/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Address questions 
from Ms. Burchfield regarding 
exhibits for settlement statement and 
formatting of brief. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

4/6/2018
Alina 
Shell

Research regarding timeliness of 
motion to stay. 0.6 $300.00 $180.00 $180.00 

4/9/2018
Alina 
Shell

Draft declaration for Ms. McLetchie 
in support of opposition to motion for 
stay. 0.5 $300.00 $150.00 $150.00 

4/10/2018
Alina 
Shell

Proofread Mr. Wolpert’s draft of 
opposition to motion for stay of order 
granting the Review-Journal attorney 
fees and costs. 0.5 $300.00 $150.00 $150.00 

LVRJ068
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

4/10/2018
Alina 
Shell

Hearing preparation: review cases 
cited in briefs and identify cases 
needed for argument. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

4/11/2018
Alina 
Shell

Preparation for hearing on motion for 
stay of order awarding Review-
Journal attorney fees. 0.5 $300.00 $150.00 $150.00 

4/11/2018
Alina 
Shell

In court for hearing on Henderson’s
motion for stay of order awarding 
attorney fees to Review-Journal. 0.8 $300.00 $240.00 $240.00 

4/11/2018
Alina 
Shell

Memo to Ms. McLetchie regarding 
outcome of hearing on Henderson’s
motion for stay of order granting 
Review-Journal fees and costs. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

4/11/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Review appeal 
docketing statement filed by 
Henderson regarding appeal of 
attorney fees. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

4/18/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Draft Nevada 
Supreme Court docketing statement. 0.9 $300.00 $270.00 $270.00 

5/23/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Edit and approve 
motion for extension of time. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

6/28/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, email Mr. Reeve and Mr. 
Kemble regarding staying briefing in 
appeal pending settlement conference. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

LVRJ069
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

7/12/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Review Henderson’s
Answering Brief and begin 
organizing/outlining Reply. Shell 
document and begin responding to 
Henderson’s statement of facts. 0.9 $300.00 $270.00 $270.00 

7/13/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Resume drafting reply to 
Henderson’s statement of facts in its 
answering brief. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

7/19/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Resume drafting reply 
brief: begin drafting reply to 
Henderson’s legal arguments. 6.6 $300.00 $1,980.00 $1,980.00 

7/20/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Resume drafting Reply 
Brief: finish drafting legal arguments 
and email to Ms. McLetchie for 
review. 7.0 $300.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 

7/23/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Attention to completing 
Reply Brief: address Ms. McLetchie’s
revisions to draft, and adding 
suggested facts and argument; edit 
motion for leave to file excess pages; 
review NRAP to ensure compliance 
with rules for filing oversized brief 
and motion for leave to file excess 
pages; conduct additional legal 
research. 7.1 $300.00 $2,130.00 $2,130.00 

LVRJ070
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10/24/2018
Alina 
Shell

Attention to Supplemental Notice of 
Authorities: Review pleadings filed in 
case to identify pages of briefs being 
supplemented by recent decision in 
PERS v. NPRI. 0.9 $300.00 $270.00 $270.00 

12/17/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Begin draft of 
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on 
cross appeal in attorney’s fee appeal. 
Draft preliminary portions of brief, 
including disclosure, routing 
statement, jurisdictional statement, 
and statement of the issues for review. 
Draft statement of facts. 2.4 $300.00 $720.00 $720.00 

12/17/2018
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Draft Motion to Continue 
Oral Argument. 0.6 $300.00 $180.00 $180.00 

12/17/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Drafting Answering 
Brief/Opening Brief on cross-appeal: 
draft standards of review section. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

12/17/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Attention to 
Answering Brief and Opening Brief 
on cross appeal: Draft legal argument 
regarding why the Review-Journal 
was the prevailing party. Research 
cases cited by Henderson to rebut 
legal arguments regarding same. 1.6 $300.00 $480.00 $480.00 

LVRJ071
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12/18/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Continue work on 
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on 
cross-appeal: Resume drafting 
arguments regarding why the Review-
Journal was the prevailing party. Draft 
argument regarding why NRS 
239.012 does not immunize 
Henderson from attorney’s fees. Draft 
argument regarding district court’s
failure to adequately address Brunzell 
factors. 4.1 $300.00 $1,230.00 $1,230.00 

12/19/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Resume drafting 
answering brief/opening brief on 
cross-appeal: Complete argument 
regarding Brunzell, draft statement of 
the case, and draft summary of the 
argument. Add additional case and 
record citations. 2.4 $300.00 $720.00 $720.00 

12/20/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Continued work on 
answering brief/opening brief on 
cross-appeal: address Ms. 
McLetchie’s preliminary edits to first 
draft of brief. Insert citations to 
Respondent’s Appendix. Re-organize 
and expand statement of facts to 
address LVRJ’s request for 
clarification of order on motion for 
attorney’s fees, other related appeal, 
and Henderson’s actions after filing of 
petition. 3.4 $300.00 $1,020.00 $1,020.00 

LVRJ072
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12/20/2018
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Address Ms. 
McLetchie’s edits to draft of 
Answering Brief/Opening Brief on 
cross-appeal. Review, edit, and 
proofread entire brief. 2.3 $300.00 $690.00 $690.00 

2/1/2019
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, review briefs filed in appeal 
and identify cases for Ms. Ambro to 
print in preparation for argument. 0.7 $300.00 $210.00 $210.00 

2/1/2019
Alina 
Shell

APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie’s
request, begin outlining argument 
regarding insufficiency of 
Henderson’s privilege log. 1.5 $300.00 $450.00 $450.00 

3/4/2019
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Begin drafting Reply 
Brief on Cross-Appeal, review 
Henderson’s Answering Brief/Reply 
Brief, research legal issue regarding 
whether the Amended Petition
superseded the original Petition, and 
begin drafting legal arguments. 1.8 $300.00 $540.00 $540.00 

LVRJ073
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3/12/2019
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Resume drafting 
Reply Brief on cross-appeal and 
address direction from Ms. 
McLetchie; draft legal arguments 
regarding statutory interpretation, the 
legal landscape regarding “prevailing”
parties, and the court’s reduction of 
the LVRJ’s fee award. Review 
Henderson’s Reply Brief/Answering 
Brief and identify any additional 
arguments that need to be addressed. 6.6 $300.00 $1,980.00 $1,980.00 

3/12/2019
Alina 
Shell

FEES APPEAL: Review and 
incorporate Mr. Lipman’s edits to 
Reply Brief; conduct hard copy edit of 
final draft. 1.3 $300.00 $390.00 $390.00 

10/24/2019
Alina 
Shell

Phone call with Mr. Reeve regarding 
possible resolution of case. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

12/12/2019
Alina 
Shell

Prepare for and attend status check on 
remand and draft update memo to file 
re same. 1.2 $300.00 $360.00 $360.00 

12/31/2019
Alina 
Shell

Follow up phone call and email to Mr. 
Kennedy regarding need to set 
briefing schedule. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

1/6/2020
Alina 
Shell

Phone call with Brian Reeve re setting 
briefing schedule for attorney’s fees 
issue. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

1/7/2020
Alina 
Shell

Review stipulation regarding 
attorney’s fees briefing schedule and 
email same to Mr. Reeve. 0.1 $300.00 $30.00 $30.00 

LVRJ074
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1/30/2020
Alina 
Shell

Begin drafting new motion for 
attorney’s fees: start drafting 
introduction and statement of facts. 1.1 $300.00 $330.00 $330.00 

2/2/2020
Alina 
Shell

Finish draft of renewed motion for 
attorney’s fees: complete legal 
argument and verify record citations. 3.6 $300.00 $1,080.00 $1,080.00 

2/3/2020
Alina 
Shell

Expand renewed motion for attorney’s
fees consistent with comments and 
direction from Ms. McLetchie. 2.0 $300.00 $600.00 $600.00 

2/3/2020
Alina 
Shell

Per Ms. McLetchie’s request, draft 
memo for client explaining renewed 
motion for attorney’s fees. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00 

2/3/2020
Alina 
Shell

Attention to attorney’s fees motion: 
review spreadsheet of costs prepared 
by Ms. Burchfield and edit 
spreadsheet to exclude non-
reimbursable costs. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

2/5/2020
Alina 
Shell

Attention to motion for attorney’s
fees: review and edit spreadsheet of 
attorney’s fees to reduce entries that 
we previously agreed to reduce at 
hearing on first motion for attorney’s
fees. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00 

2/5/2020
Alina 
Shell

Review and finalize Ms. McLetchie’s
declaration in support of motion for 
attorney’s fees. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 

2/6/2020
Alina 
Shell

Finalize Renewed Motion for 
Attorney’s Fees and confirm exhibits 
re same. 0.5 $300.00 $150.00 $150.00 

LVRJ075
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3/11/2020
Alina 
Shell

Edit draft stipulation to extend 
deadline for reply in support of 
motion for attorney's fees. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00

3/23/2020
Alina 
Shell

Edit stipulation to extend deadline for 
reply in support of renewed motion 
for fees. 0.3 $300.00 $90.00 $90.00

4/9/2020
Alina 
Shell

Phone call to Brian Reeve regarding 
new briefing schedule on Motion for 
Attorney's Fees. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00

4/16/2020
Alina 
Shell

Attention to stipulation re new 
briefing schedule for motion for 
attorney's fees: review draft 
stipulation prepared by Mr. Reeve, 
firm calendar, and suggest dates for 
filing motion, response, and reply. 0.2 $300.00 $60.00 $60.00

5/1/2020
Alina 
Shell

Attention to renewed motion for 
attorney’s fees: read Nevada Supreme 
Court opinion in CIR v. LVMPD to 
assist in drafting renewed motion. 0.4 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00

5/4/2020
Alina 
Shell

Attention to renewed motion for 
attorney’s fees: edit and expand 
motion to include analysis re Nevada 
Supreme Court's opinion in Center for 
Investigative Reporting adopting the 
catalyst theory for fees awards in 
public records cases. 2.6 $300.00 $780.00 $780.00

LVRJ076
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5/11/2020
Alina 
Shell

Attention to renewed motion for 
attorney’s fees: update exhibits and 
supporting declaration and finalize 
renewed motion. 3.5 $300.00 $750.00 $1,050.00

Totals for Alina Shell 176.0 $52,590.00

1/13/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Compile legislative history of the 
Nevada Public Records Act for Ms. 
McLetchie; send same to Ms. 
McLetchie. 0.6 $125.00 $75.00 $75.00 

1/13/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Research assignment from Ms. 
McLetchie - compiling legislative 
history. 0.7 $125.00 $87.50 $87.50 

1/24/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Review privilege log for Ms. 
McLetchie, analyze re what has been 
claimed as privileged. 2.4 $125.00 $300.00 $(300.00) $-

1/24/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Review documents attached to 
pleadings. 0.3 $125.00 $37.50 $37.50 

1/24/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Continue researching the legislative 
history for NRS 239. 1.6 $125.00 $200.00 $200.00 

1/26/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Research for Ms. McLetchie about the 
requirements of a privilege log. 1.8 $125.00 $225.00 $225.00 

1/26/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Meet with Ms. McLetchie to discuss 
the privilege log received from City of 
Henderson. 0.3 $125.00 $37.50 $37.50 

1/26/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Continue reviewing privilege log 
provided by City of Henderson, 
provide analysis to Ms. McLetchie. 1.8 $125.00 $225.00 $225.00 
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1/27/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Update privilege log analysis 
document for Ms. McLetchie. 0.4 $125.00 $50.00 $(50.00) $-

1/27/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Research the attorney/client privilege 
and work product privilege. 3.8 $125.00 $475.00 $(475.00) $-

1/30/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Finalize privilege log analysis and 
provide same to Ms. McLetchie for 
review. 0.2 $125.00 $25.00 $25.00 

2/1/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Continue reviewing documents 
received from City of Henderson. 1.1 $125.00 $137.50 $137.50 

2/8/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Print out copies of the redacted 
documents received from City of 
Henderson. 0.4 $125.00 $50.00 $(50.00) $-

3/21/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Research for Ms. Shell re statutory 
interpretation. 0.2 $125.00 $25.00 $25.00 

3/21/2017
Gabriel 
Czop

Meet with Ms. McLetchie and Ms. 
Shell re: research assignment to locate 
cases that discuss legislative history is 
not needed when the statute is clear. 0.1 $125.00 $12.50 $12.50 

Totals for Gabriel Czop 15.7 $1,087.50 

1/28/2019
Lacey 
Ambro

APPEAL: Prepare binder for Ms. 
McLetchie for Oral Argument. 0.9 $100.00 $90.00 $90.00 

2/1/2019
Lacey 
Ambro

APPEAL: Prepare cases and 
authorities for Ms. McLetchie for Oral 
Argument prep. 2.4 $100.00 $240.00 $240.00 

1/6/2020
Lacey 
Ambro

Draft Stipulation and Order re 
Briefing Schedule on Motion for 
Attorney’s Fees. Circulate to Ms. 
McLetchie and Ms. Shell. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 
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2/6/2020
Lacey 
Ambro

Finalize Renewed Motion for 
Attorney’s Fees and exhibits; prepare 
filing; file and serve re same. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

Totals for Lacey Ambro 4.3 $430.00 

6/1/2017
Leo 
Wolpert

Edit/proofread motion for attorney’s
fees. 1.5 $250.00 $375.00 $375.00 

2/16/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

Edit, cite check, and proofread 
Opening Brief. 3.5 $250.00 $875.00 $875.00 

4/6/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

Draft opposition to motion to stay 
pending appeal, countermotion for 
order to show cause why Henderson 
isn’t in contempt. 6.5 $250.00 $1,625.00 $1,625.00 

4/7/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

Research and draft regarding Order to 
Show Cause, orders without 
deadlines. 2.5 $250.00 $625.00 $625.00 

4/9/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

draft opposition to motion for stay, 
particular attention to untimeliness 
and the unlikelihood of prevailing on 
appeal 5.3 $250.00 $1,325.00 $1,325.00 

4/9/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

Incorporate Ms. Shell’s edits, further 
edits to opposition to motion to stay. 0.5 $250.00 $125.00 $125.00 

4/10/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

Final edits and cite checks to 
Opposition to motion to stay. 1.8 $250.00 $450.00 $450.00 

7/23/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

APPEAL: Edit, proofread, enter Ms. 
McLetchie’s changes into reply brief. 2.7 $250.00 $675.00 $675.00 

12/19/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

FEES APPEAL: Edit Answering 
Brief/Opening Brief in attorney’s fees 
appeal. 2.3 $250.00 $575.00 $575.00 
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12/20/2018
Leo 
Wolpert

FEES APPEAL: Final hardcopy edits 
and proofreading of 
Answering/Opening Brief re 
attorney’s fees and costs. 1.4 $250.00 $350.00 $350.00 

2/3/2019
Leo 
Wolpert

APPEAL: Research adequacy of 
privilege log in Nevada and 9th 
circuit, compare to ones provided by 
Henderson, research 
reasonable/standard rates for 
document review. 0.9 $250.00 $225.00 $225.00 

2/4/2019
Leo 
Wolpert

APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in 
preparation for Oral Argument, 
including updating outline of cases 
and further research on public records 
act cases. 2.5 $250.00 $625.00 $625.00 

2/5/2019
Leo 
Wolpert

APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in 
Oral Argument prep by reviewing 
documents / privilege log. 0.8 $250.00 $200.00 $200.00 

3/12/2019
Leo 
Wolpert

FEES APPEAL: Draft policy 
argument sections of Reply Brief, 
proofreading. 3.7 $250.00 $925.00 $925.00 

Totals for Leo Wolpert 35.9 $8,975.00 

11/3/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails re Public Records Act request 
responses. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

11/4/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with team re status on Trosper 
matter. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

11/9/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie Emails re setting up meeting. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 
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11/10/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie Prepare for and attend client call. 1.2 $450.00 $540.00 $540.00 

11/27/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie Work on Petition; research re same. 1.8 $450.00 $810.00 $810.00 

11/28/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to compiling documentation 
for petition and drafting same. 
Circulate. 4.2 $450.00 $1,890.00 $1,890.00 

11/29/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie Attention to finalizing filing. 2.0 $450.00 $900.00 $900.00 

12/2/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie Review emails re service. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

12/5/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review and respond to letter from 
Josh Reid. Circulate letter to clients. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

12/6/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Further emails with Josh Reid. Emails 
with his office re setting up meeting. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

12/7/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with RJ team regarding status 
and next steps. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

12/7/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie Review pertinent media coverage. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/14/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Prepare for and attend call with Josh 
Reid and two deputy City of 
Henderson attorneys. Negotiate for in-
person inspection. Update clients re 
same. 1.7 $450.00 $765.00 $765.00 

12/19/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails re documents available for 
inspection. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 
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12/20/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to issues with review. 
Preliminary review of “privilege log.”
Call with client re litigation strategy. 
Confer with City of Henderson 
attorney Brian Reeve and plan 
meeting. 2.4 $450.00 $1,080.00 $1,080.00 

12/21/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with Henderson and with 
clients. Successfully address issue 
with how documents were presented 
for review/ Attempt to obtain CD. 0.8 $450.00 $360.00 $360.00 

12/23/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails re document review at City of 
Henderson. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/27/2016
Margaret 
McLetchie

Follow up to Henderson to get 
Wednesday access for Natalie Bruzda. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

1/4/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Email re log re documents withheld 
by City of Henderson. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/5/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to compiling pertinent 
legislative history. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

1/9/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Call with Henderson City Attorneys 
and follow up with client re same. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

1/9/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Calendaring - check Henderson 
deadline to respond to writ. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/10/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Preliminary review of supplemental 
log received from City of Henderson. 0.7 $450.00 $315.00 $315.00 

1/11/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Edits to stipulation, call with and 
emails with City of Henderson 
attorneys. 0.6 $450.00 $270.00 $270.00 

1/12/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Execute stipulation. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 
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1/12/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Call with client. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/17/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Emails with client. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/24/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to scheduling of review of 
privilege log, amending complaint, 
and filing supporting brief. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

1/24/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Calls and emails with opposing 
counsel and court re case status, 
scheduling. Begin plans for amending. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

1/25/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to emails with court and 
opposing counsel re scheduling; 
update to clients re same. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

2/8/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Amend and expand petition/ 
application; research issues; edit brief 
in support of petition/ application, 
declaration, and check exhibits. 6.2 $450.00 $2,790.00 $2,790.00 

3/9/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Emails with client re rely. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

3/20/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review and analyze Henderson’s
response to our opening brief. Direct 
Ms. Shell re work on reply. 1.1 $450.00 $495.00 $495.00 

3/22/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Further review and analysis of 
Henderson’s response to petition for 
work on reply; direct Ms. Burchfield 
to circulate response to clients. 1.8 $450.00 $810.00 $810.00 

3/23/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Revising and editing of reply; 
attention to declaration; research and 
draft section re mootness. 6.8 $450.00 $3,060.00 $3,060.00 
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3/30/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attend hearing; call to client; email 
summary to clients. 0.5 $450.00 $225.00 $(675.00) $(450.00)

4/4/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review and circulate response to 
request for fees information for 
Henderson’s outside counsel, Bailey 
Kennedy (records received). 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

5/23/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Email re renewing fees request. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

6/1/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Edit motion for fees. 0.9 $450.00 $405.00 $405.00 

6/9/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Direct work on Notice of Appeal and 
Case Appeal Statement. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

6/14/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Agree to extension with opposing 
counsel. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

6/15/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Respond to opposing counsel’s email 
re Stipulation re extension. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

6/19/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review and edit Stipulation re 
extension; email opposing counsel. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

6/19/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Follow up re appellate filing fee. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

6/19/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Attention to extension stipulation. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

7/10/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Edit docketing statement. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

7/12/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to scheduling of settlement 
conference. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

7/13/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

TROSPER: Work with Ms. Laux re 
legislative history re “extraordinary 
use” for appeal purposes. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 
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7/14/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to scheduling of attorney fee 
hearing. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

7/19/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Prepare for and attend conference call 
with opposing counsel and settlement 
judge. Email to clients re scheduling 
of settlement conference, and 
representations from City of 
Henderson re what they are charging. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

7/19/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails re status of requests to City of 
Henderson. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

7/19/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to scheduling of settlement 
conference. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

7/20/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with client re scheduling 
settlement conference. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

7/21/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with paralegal re issues with 
opposition. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

7/24/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Follow up re scheduling settlement 
conference. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

7/27/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Edit reply to opposition to motion for 
attorney’s fees and costs.. 1.2 $450.00 $540.00 $540.00 

7/27/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with Ms. Shell re strategy re 
atty fee applications. Research issues 
re “catalyst theory.” 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

8/2/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to attorney’s fees hearing 
and follow up re obtaining copy of 
ordinance from City of Henderson. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

8/2/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to preparations for hearing 
on fees application. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 
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8/2/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attempt to follow up with City of 
Henderson re draft ordinance. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

8/10/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Attention to attorney’s fees hearing. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

9/2/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Follow up re attorney fee motion. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

9/7/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Edit order. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

9/20/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Emails re order. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

9/21/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with Brian Reeve re order re 
fees; attention to submission of 
LVRJ’s order to court. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

9/21/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Revisions to order on fees. Send to 
Brian Reeve. Finalize our proposed 
order and accompanying letter to 
judge. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

9/21/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie Follow up re proposed revision. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

9/25/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Revise draft settlement statement and 
confer with Ms. Shell re same. 0.8 $450.00 $360.00 $360.00 

9/28/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with client re settlement 
conference, Henderson’s proposed 
revised ordinance. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

9/28/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to providing comment to 
Henderson (including NPRA and 
NPRI) re proposed Henderson policy 
and fees. 1.1 $450.00 $495.00 $495.00 
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9/29/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review/revise/finalize settlement 
conference brief. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

10/2/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with NPRI re Henderson 
proposed ordinance. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

10/9/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Call with settlement judge. Prepare 
for settlement conference. 4.5 $450.00 $2,025.00 $2,025.00 

10/10/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Prepare for settlement conference. 
Direct Ms. Burchfield re items 
needed. Attend settlement conference.
Update team re same. 4.2 $450.00 $1,890.00 $1,890.00 

10/10/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Continued work on proposed revision 
to Henderson ordinance. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

10/11/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with counsel for Henderson re 
motion for clarification. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

10/18/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to new City of Henderson 
proposed ordinance. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

11/8/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with Ms. Shell re Motion; 
revise same. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

12/13/2017
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with Ms. Shell re outcome of 
hearing. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/3/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Approve list of items for inclusion in 
proposed joint appendix. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

1/9/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie Revise motion for extension. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

2/12/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie Attention to opening brief. 1.8 $450.00 $810.00 $810.00 
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2/15/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Continued attention to work on 
opening brief. 2.3 $450.00 $1,035.00 $1,035.00 

2/16/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie Revisions to Opening Brief. 1.2 $450.00 $540.00 $540.00 

2/16/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie Continued attention to Opening Brief. 5.9 $450.00 $2,655.00 $2,655.00 

2/21/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Follow up re status re service of brief 
and appendix. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

3/14/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Consider/plan strategy and update to 
clients advising regarding no need to 
file notice of appeal, desirability of 
cross-appeal after Henderson files 
Notice of Appeal. 0.5 $450.00 $225.00 $225.00 

3/28/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Call with City of Henderson 
attorneys’ attention to issues. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

3/29/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails regarding settlement; City of 
Henderson Ordinance. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

4/3/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Email to Henderson regarding fees 
payment. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

4/4/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with Mr. Reeve regarding 
contempt (Henderson’s failure to 
comply with fees and costs order). 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

4/9/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with Ms. Shell and Mr. 
Wolpert regarding Opposition to 
Motion to Stay. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

4/11/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Calls with Mr. Cook and Sandy 
regarding City of Henderson’s current 
conduct re NPRA requests. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 
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4/11/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Prepare for and 
attend premeditation call; Follow up 
with client regarding outcome and 
plans regarding handling same. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

4/12/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Emails regarding 
attendance at settlement conference 
by Ms. King. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

4/23/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Revision to 
Docketing Statement. 0.5 $450.00 $225.00 $225.00 

5/17/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to case schedule; Possible 
cancel of settlement conference; Call 
to Mr. Reeves and follow up with 
office of settlement judge. 0.5 $450.00 $225.00 $225.00 

5/21/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Follow up regarding 
Settlement Conference, extension 
regarding Reply. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

5/23/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Follow up regarding 
scheduling of Settlement Conference. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

7/22/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Revise reply. 2.9 $450.00 $1,305.00 $1,305.00 

7/23/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Attention to reply brief. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

7/23/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

APPEAL: Attention to finalizing 
Reply and associated filings. 3.0 $450.00 $1,350.00 $1,350.00 

8/8/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Call with Brian 
Reeve; attention to preparation for 
settlement conference. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

8/9/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Emails regarding 
mediation. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 
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8/13/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Attention to 
preparation for settlement conference. 3.0 $450.00 $1,350.00 $1,350.00 

8/13/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Prepare for 
Settlement Conference; Calls/emails 
to client representatives regarding 
same. Review municipal code 
provisions received from Mr. Reeve. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

8/14/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Prepare for and 
attend Mediation. 4.0 $450.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 

8/27/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Emails with Mr. 
Reeve regarding transcript. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

8/28/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Email with opposing 
counsel regarding transcript. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

8/29/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Emails with Mr. 
Reeve re consolidation inquiry. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

10/29/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

APPEAL: Attention to revising 
Notice of Supplemental Authority. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

12/4/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

APPEAL: Review Notice Scheduling 
Oral Argument. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 

12/17/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie

APPEAL: Attention to Motion to 
Continue Oral Argument. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/20/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie FEES APPEAL: Revise brief. 2.0 $450.00 $900.00 $900.00 

12/27/2018
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Review order. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00 
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1/3/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Emails to City of 
Henderson agreeing to extension; 
attention to stipulation re same. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

2/1/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00 

2/2/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 5.0 $450.00 $2,250.00 $2,250.00 

2/3/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 3.0 $450.00 $1,350.00 $1,350.00 

2/4/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Travel and Argument Prep. 8.0 $450.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 

2/5/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

APPEAL: Oral Argument Prep. 
Argument. [REDUCED ENTRY] 6.5 $450.00 $2,925.00 $2,925.00 

2/5/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Attention to Motion for Attorney 
Fees. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

2/6/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie APPEAL: Travel. 4.0 $450.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 

3/4/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Attention to Reply 
Brief: provide direction to Ms. Shell. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

3/11/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Attention to Reply 
Brief: confer with Ms. Shell re status 
and provide her with direction. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00 

3/12/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

FEES APPEAL: Revisions to Reply 
Brief/approve final version for filing. 1.1 $450.00 $495.00 $495.00 

5/28/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

APPEAL: Review order. Update to 
client re same. 0.6 $450.00 $270.00 $270.00 

6/11/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Draft and send settlement demand to 
Henderson. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 $180.00
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6/24/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Emails with Brian Reeve regarding
possible resolution. 0.1 $450.00 $45.00 $45.00

7/10/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie Emails regarding possible settlement. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00

7/19/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Forward documents received from 
Henderson to Mr. Lipman. Additional 
discussion regarding possible 
settlement. 0.4 $450.00 $180.00 180.00

7/24/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Email with Mr. Lipman re case. 
Follow up via email / leave message 
for Henderson. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

7/24/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Obtain documents from Henderson 
and provide to client. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

10/17/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie Review order. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 

12/12/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with Ms. Shell re hearing, 
status of case, next steps. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/13/2019
Margaret 
McLetchie

Confer with Ms. Shell re briefing 
schedule; plans re same. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

2/3/2020
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review initial draft of Fees Motion. 
Review applicable Supreme Court 
orders. Confer with Ms. Shell re 
approach. Direct her to further 
research. 0.3 $450.00 $135.00 $135.00 
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2/4/2020
Margaret 
McLetchie Attention to Fees Motion. 1.5 $450.00 $675.00 $675.00 

2/6/2020
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review and confirm declaration in 
support of motion for attorney’s fees; 
sign re same. 0.2 $450.00 $90.00 $90.00 

5/4/2020
Margaret 
McLetchie

Review and edit revised draft of 
renewed motion for attorney’s fees. 1.0 $450.00 $450.00 $450.00

Totals for Margaret McLetchie 131.2 $58,365.00 

11/29/2016
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare and file Public Records 
Application and petition for Writ of 
Mandamus. Draft and file Initial 
Appearance Fee Disclosure and Civil 
Cover Sheet to create a new civil case 
in Eighth Judicial District Court.
Attention to scheduling a legal 
process server re same. Email clients 
re same. 0.9 $100.00 $90.00 $90.00 

12/19/2016
Pharan 
Burchfield File Affidavit of Service. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/10/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Receive redacted documents from 
City of Henderson; create City of 
Henderson portal account to 
download, print, and save redacted 
documents from Public Records Act 
request (re Trosper). 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

1/25/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Email communications with Ms. 
Boyd (City of Henderson) re signed 
Stipulation re extension. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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2/8/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare exhibits to brief and amended 
petition; begin drafting declaration in 
support of amended petition. File and 
serve/mail re same. 1.4 $100.00 $140.00 $140.00 

3/20/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize and send (mail/email) Public 
Records Act request re Bailey 
Kennedy to City of Henderson’s City 
Attorney. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $(20.00) $-

3/22/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Stipulation (re extension for 
Reply) for attorneys’ review; email 
communications with Mr. Kennedy re 
same. 0.3 $100.00 $30.00 $30.00 

3/23/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Review external communications with 
City of Henderson re potential 
exhibits re Reply; draft Ms. 
McLetchie’s declaration re same; 
finalize, file, and serve/mail Reply re 
same. 2.1 $100.00 $210.00 $210.00 

3/27/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

File Stipulation and Order for 
Extension to Allow Las Vegas 
Review-Journal to File its Reply to 
Respondent City of Henderson’s
Response to Amended Petition. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

3/28/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft, file, and serve/mail Notice of 
Entry of Order (reply extension). 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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4/27/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft letter to Honorable Judge 
Thompson re competing orders to be 
delivered to chambers with proposed 
order; email communications with 
opposing counsel re same. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

5/11/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Phone call with Al, law clerk in 
Department 18, re competing 
proposed order. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

5/31/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare charts/Excel spreadsheets of 
attorneys’ time and expenses for 
Motion for Attorney’s Fees 
Application. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

6/1/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize (proof and prepare exhibits), 
file and serve/mail 
Application/Motion for Attorneys’
Fees. 0.9 $100.00 $90.00 $90.00 

6/1/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize and send (mail/email) Public 
Records Act request to Mr. Reid at 
City of Henderson re Bailey Kennedy. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

6/8/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Review City of Henderson’s response 
to our most recent Public Records Act 
Request regarding Bailey Kennedy’s
representation in Las Vegas Review-
Journal v. City of Henderson case.
Email copy to clients re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

6/9/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Notice of Appeal and Case 
Appeal Statement. File and serve/mail 
re same. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 
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6/22/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Begin drafting Docketing 
Statement. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

7/10/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare Docketing Statement (prepare 
draft and exhibits); integrate 
attorneys’ edits to final draft; file and 
serve/mail re same. 1.2 $100.00 $120.00 $120.00 

7/21/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Review City of Henderson’s
Opposition re Motion for Attorney’s
Fees; notice issues (missing and 
mislabeled exhibits); bring to Ms. 
McLetchie’s attention (how to 
proceed); begin creating Judge’s
courtesy copy for upcoming hearing 
re same. 0.6 $100.00 $60.00 $60.00 

7/21/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Phone call with Ms. Togo re call she 
had received from Jimmerson Law 
Office (settlement judge); attempted 
call to Jimmerson’s office re 
clarification re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

7/27/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare Reply to City of Henderson’s
Opposition to Las Vegas Review-
Journal’s Motion for Attorney’s Fees 
and Costs for filing; file and 
serve/mail re same. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

7/28/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Email clients briefing re Motion for 
Attorney’s Fees and reminder of 
hearing re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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8/24/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize Motion for Extension of 
Time to Allows Las Vegas Review-
Journal to Submit a Proposed Order 
Granting Las Vegas Review-Journal’s
Motion for Attorney’s Fees and Costs 
and draft Notice of Submission of 
Proposed Order re same. File and 
serve/mail re same. 0.6 $100.00 $60.00 $60.00 

9/7/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare Proposed Order re attorneys’
fees for attorneys’ review; email to 
opposing counsel re same. Draft 
second motion for extension for 
attorneys’ review; file and serve/mail 
re same. 0.4 $100.00 $40.00 $40.00 

9/20/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Email Mr. Moyer and Mr. Cook 
update re settlement conference being 
scheduled. Confirm attendance. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

9/21/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft cover letter to Honorable Judge 
Bailus in anticipation of submitting 
competing proposed orders re order 
granting attorney’s fees. Email 
opposition counsel re same. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

9/21/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Drop off cover letter to Honorable 
Judge Bailus re and including 
competing proposed orders re order 
granting attorney’s fees at Phoenix 
Building, Eleventh Floor located at 
330 South Third Street. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 
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9/29/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Incorporate Ms. McLetchie’s edits to 
Ms. Shell’s draft of Confidential 
Settlement Statement; prepare exhibits 
re same; finalize and send 
(mail/email) Settlement Judge Jay 
Young re same. Email Mr. Moyer and 
Mr. Cook re same. 1.5 $100.00 $150.00 $150.00 

10/9/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare binders, exhibits, and case 
law for tomorrow’s settlement 
conference. Email reminder to Mr. 
Moyer and Mr. Cook re same. 
Attention to payments re settlement 
figures; chart for Ms. McLetchie re 
same. 1.0 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 

10/10/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Final preparation (update settlement 
chart) for today’s settlement 
conference. 0.3 $100.00 $30.00 $30.00 

10/26/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Reviewing District Court docket to 
confirm whether or not to request 
transcripts for appeal; confirm 
decision not to request transcript with 
attorneys; and draft and file/serve 
Certificate That No Transcript Is 
Being Requested. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

11/8/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize, file, and serve/mail Motion 
for Clarification. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

12/5/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare courtesy copy for Judge 
Bailus re hearing on Motion for 
Clarification re Attorney’s Fees. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 
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12/5/2017
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize, file, and serve/mail Reply to 
City of Henderson’s Opposition to 
Motion for Clarification. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

1/9/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Motion for Extension re 
Opening Brief and Appendix for 
attorneys’ review. File and serve re 
same. 0.4 $100.00 $40.00 $40.00 

1/10/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Begin gathering and prepare potential 
exhibits for upcoming Joint Appendix 
re appeal filing. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

1/11/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Joint Appendix; combine 
exhibits into volumes. 0.4 $100.00 $40.00 $40.00 

1/18/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize (Bates-stamp and volume) 
Joint Appendix. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

2/9/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft, file, and serve Unopposed 
Motion for Extension of Time to File 
Appellant’s Opening Brief and 
Appendix [Second Request]. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

2/16/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare/format Opening Brief, 
including Table of Contents, Table of 
Authorities, Certificate of 
Compliance, and Certificate of 
Service; incorporate final edits from 
attorneys and file/serve Opening 
Brief. 1.9 $100.00 $190.00 $190.00 

3/23/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Notice of Cross-Appeal and 
Case Appeal Statement for attorney’s
review/approval. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 
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3/26/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize, file, and serve/mail Notice of 
Cross-Appeal and Case Appeal 
Statement. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

3/28/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Notice of Submission of 
(September 21, 2017) Proposed Order 
for Ms. McLetchie’s review/approval. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

4/3/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download and 
review Notice of Cross-Appeal; 
calendar deadline to file transcript 
request and docketing statement. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

4/6/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Prepare exhibits in 
support of confidential settlement 
statement; finalize settlement 
statement; and send (mail/email) to 
Settlement Judge Kunin re same. 1.1 $100.00 $110.00 $110.00 

4/10/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize, file, and serve/mail 
Petitioner’s Opposition to 
Respondent’s Motion for Stay 
Pending Appeal and Countermotion 
for Order to Show Cause; email 
courtesy copy to opposing counsel re 
same. 0.7 $100.00 $70.00 $70.00 

4/12/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Check docket for Court’s Minutes re 
hearing re stay. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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4/12/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Save and review 
Early Case Assessment Report; 
calendar settlement conference re 
same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

4/13/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Check docket for Court’s Minutes re 
hearing re stay. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

4/16/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Check docket for Court’s Minutes re 
hearing re stay. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

4/18/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Check docket for Court’s Minutes re 
hearing re stay; download and save. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

4/18/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Begin drafting 
Docketing Statement. 0.5 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 

4/23/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Finalize Docketing 
Statement (prepare exhibits re same); 
file and serve/mail re same. 0.6 $100.00 $60.00 $60.00 

5/14/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Phone call with Ms. 
Walker, assistant to Settlement Judge 
Kunin, to confirm settlement 
conference date. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

5/23/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Begin preparing 
Unopposed Motion for Extension re 
Reply Brief for attorneys’
review/approval. File and serve re 
same. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

5/24/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Amended Early Case 
Assessment Report; calendar re same; 
and email clients re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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5/31/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, review, 
and save Order Granting Extension to 
File Reply Brief; update calendars and 
attorneys accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

7/23/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Finalize Motion for Excess 
Pages/Type Volume; file and serve re 
same. Finalize (format Table of 
Contents, Table of Authorities, 
Certificate of Compliance, and 
Certificate of Service) Appellant’s
Reply Brief (and addendum); file and 
serve re same. 1.4 $100.00 $140.00 $140.00 

7/30/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Phone call with Ms. Boyd 
(assistant) re Motion for Excess Pages 
and Reply Brief; email Ms. Boyd 
copy of proposed Reply Brief. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

8/13/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Prepare post-
application chart re fees and costs 
versus what client paid. 0.8 $100.00 $80.00 $80.00 

8/17/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Order Reinstating Briefing; 
calendar accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

8/28/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Incorporate Ms. 
McLetchie’s responses to Settlement 
Program Survey; mail to Nevada 
Supreme Court re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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8/29/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Draft, file, and 
send/serve Request for Transcript of 
Proceedings into District Court case; 
file and serve the District Court’s file-
stamped copy of Request for 
Transcript of Proceedings into Nevada 
Supreme Court case. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

10/2/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Phone calls with Ms. 
Page, Court Reporter for Department 
18, re status of requested transcripts. 
Phone calls with Ms. Martin, Court 
Reporter with Litigation Services, re 
requested transcripts. Phone call and 
email communications with Litigation
Services re requested transcripts re 
same. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 

10/3/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Follow-up email 
communications with Litigation 
Services re status of requested 
transcripts. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

10/4/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Follow-up email 
communications with Litigation 
Services re status of requested 
transcripts; receive transcripts; save 
and review re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

10/15/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Draft, file, and serve Notice 
of Change of Firm Name. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

10/15/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Draft, file, and serve 
Notice of Change of Firm Name. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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10/16/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft, file, and serve/mail Notice of 
Change of Firm Name. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

10/29/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Finalize and file/serve 
Notice of Supplemental Authority. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

11/27/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Order re Scheduling Oral 
Argument; email attorneys re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

12/4/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save. and 
review Notice of Oral Argument 
Setting; and calendar deadlines as 
appropriate. Email update to Mr. 
Cook and Ms. Hendrix re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

12/10/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance 
for Oral Argument for attorneys’
review. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

12/17/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Finalize and file/serve 
Appellant’s Unopposed Motion to 
Continue Oral Argument. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

12/18/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Begin preparing 
Respondent/Cross-Appellant’s
Appendix. 0.3 $100.00 $30.00 $30.00 
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12/20/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Finalize 
Respondent/Cross-Appellant’s
Appendix; file and serve re same.
Format and create Table of Contents, 
Table of Authorities, Certificate of 
Compliance, and Certificate of 
Service. Finalize Answering Brief and 
Opening Brief on Cross-Appeal; file 
and serve re same. 1.4 $100.00 $140.00 $140.00 

12/28/2018
Pharan 
Burchfield

Email communication with Ms. Page, 
court reporter, confirming receipt of 
hearing transcripts from relief court 
reporter, Ms. Martin. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/8/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Notice of Court Reporter Ms. 
Page re requested transcripts 
(Certificate of Acknowledgment). 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/18/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review City of Henderson’s Notice of 
Appearance at Oral Argument; 
confirm with Ms. McLetchie when 
she would like to file Las Vegas 
Review-Journal’s Notice re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/18/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance 
at Oral Argument for Ms. 
McLetchie’s review. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/23/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Oral Argument Reminder 
Notice; confirm calendar re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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1/23/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve 
Notice of Appearance for Oral 
Argument. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

2/12/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review City of Henderson’s Reply 
Brief on Appeal and Answering Brief 
on Cross-Appeal; calendar 
accordingly; and update attorneys and 
Mr. Lipman re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

2/20/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Phone call with 
Nevada Supreme Court Clerk re 
extension for Reply Brief on Cross-
Appeal; download, save, and review 
Order Granting Telephonic Extension 
re same; update attorneys and 
calendars accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

3/12/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Incorporate 
attorneys’ edits to Reply Brief on 
Cross-Appeal; format, create Table of 
Authorities, Table of Contents, 
Certificate of Compliance, and 
Certificate of Service; finalize Reply 
Brief of Cross-Appeal and file/serve 
re same. 1.3 $100.00 $130.00 $130.00 

3/13/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Reply Brief on Cross-Appeal; 
and email Mr. Lipman re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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5/28/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Order Affirming in Part, 
Reversing in Part and Remanding; ad 
update attorneys re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

7/17/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review 
Issued Remittitur; and update 
attorneys re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

7/22/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Order Submitting for Decision 
Without Oral Argument; and update 
attorneys re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

7/29/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Email Mr. Lipman 
and Ms. Togo file-stamped copy of 
the Order Submitting for Decision 
Without Oral Argument. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

10/17/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Order of Reversal; and update 
attorneys re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

11/8/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

Download, save, and review Order 
Setting Further Proceedings consistent 
with Supreme Court Order; update 
attorneys and calendar accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

11/26/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and 
review Issued Remittitur; and update 
attorneys re same. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 
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12/17/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

Download, save, and review Court 
Minutes from 12/12/19 hearing re 
Status Check Order Setting Further 
Proceedings re Supreme Court Order; 
update attorneys and calendar 
accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

12/31/2019
Pharan 
Burchfield

Email Court regarding extension of 
time to submit a proposed order re 
briefing schedule. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/3/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Email communications with 
Department 8 re extension of 
proposed order. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/8/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Coordinate with Mr. Reeve at the City 
of Henderson re pick-up original 
signatures on Stipulation and Order 
Regarding Briefing Schedule for 
Motion for Attorney’s Fees; and direct 
Ms. Barker to pick-up and deliver to 
Department 8 accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00 

1/10/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

File Stipulation and Order Regarding 
Briefing Schedule for Motion for 
Attorney Fees; draft, file, and serve 
Notice of Entry of Stipulation and 
Order Regarding Briefing Schedule 
for Motion for Attorney Fees; update 
attorneys and calendar accordingly. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

2/3/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare exhibits (create charts re fees 
and costs; redact) and Ms. 
McLetchie’s Declaration for 
upcoming Attorney Fees Application 
to be reviewed by attorneys. 3.7 $100.00 $370.00 $370.00 

2/4/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Prepare exhibits (fees; hours) for 
attorneys’ review and approval; 
organize by date and by user specific. 1.1 $100.00 $110.00 $110.00 

2/5/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Finalize exhibits (fees by date; fees by 
user); Bates-label exhibits; finalize 
Ms. McLetchie’s Declaration in 
Support of Renewed Motion for 
Attorney’s Fees. 2.1 $100.00 $210.00 $210.00 

2/27/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Download, save, and review City of 
Henderson's Opposition to Petitioner 
Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion 
for Attorney's Fees and Costs and 
Appendix; update attorneys and 
confirm calendar accordingly. 0.1 $100.00 $10.00 $10.00

3/11/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Stipulation and Order re 
extension of Reply to Opposition to 
Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs 
for attorneys' review and approval.  
Email and phone calls with Mr. 
Kemble at City of Henderson re same. 0.4 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00
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 Date Biller Note Quantity Price Subtotal Deduction Total 

3/16/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

File and serve Stipulation and Order 
to Extend the Deadline to File Reply 
to Opposition to Motion for Attorney 
Fees and Costs; draft, file, and serve 
Notice of Entry of Order. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00

3/23/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Draft Third Stipulation re extension to 
file Reply in support of Motion for 
Attorney's Fees and Costs.  Email 
communications with Mr. Reeve.  
Submit/email to Department 8 re 
same. 0.3 $100.00 $30.00 $30.00

3/30/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Download, save, and review 
Stipulation and Order to Extend the 
Deadline to File the Reply to 
Opposition to Motion for Attorney 
Fees and Costs; draft, file, and serve 
Notice of Entry of Stipulation and 
Order to Extend the Deadline to File 
the Reply to Opposition to Motion for 
Attorney Fees and Costs; update 
attorneys and calendar accordingly. 0.3 $100.00 $10.00 $30.00

4/27/2020
Pharan 
Burchfield

Download, save, and review (1) 
Stipulation and Order Setting Briefing 
Schedule; and (2) Notice of Entry of 
Order; update attorneys and calendar 
accordingly. 0.2 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00

Totals for Pharan Burchfield 42.2 $4,200.00 
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Date Description Amount
11/29/2016 E-filing fee: Public Records Act Application Pursuant to 

NRS 239.001 / Petition for Writ of Mandamus (Amount: 
$3.50; Court Fee: $270.00; Card Fee: $8.10). 

$281.60

11/29/2016 E-filing fee: Initial Appearance Fee Disclosure (NRS 
Chapter 19). 

$3.50

12/19/2016 E-filing fee: Affidavit of Service. $3.50
12/29/2016 Junes Legal Service Invoice: EP125103 served Summons 

and Complaint to City of Henderson.
$43.00

12/31/2016 Copying Costs: December 1, 2016 – December 31, 2016: 4 
pages at $0.08 per page.

$0.32

12/31/2016 Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 47 transactions 
for 2016.

$123.50

01/31/2017 Copying Costs: January 1, 2017 – January 31, 2017: 168 
pages at $0.08 per page.

$13.44

02/08/2017 E-filing fee: Memorandum in Support of Application 
Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/ Petition for Writ of 
Mandamus/ Application for Declaratory and Injunctive 
Relief.

$3.50

02/08/2017 E-filing fee: Amended Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. 
Stat. 239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus/ Application 
for Declaratory and Injunctive Relief. 

$3.50

02/28/2017 Copying Costs: February 1, 2017 – February 28, 2017: 290 
pages at $0.08 per page.

$23.20

02/28/2017 Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 51 transactions 
for February 2017.

$38.77

03/23/2017 Mileage: Travel to/from Bailey Kennedy 8984 Spanish 
Ridge Ave, Las Vegas, NV 89148. Total miles: 31.4 at 
$0.54/mile. (Roundtrip)

$16.96

03/23/2017 E-filing fee: Reply to Respondent City of Henderson’s 
Response to Amended Public Records Act Application 
Pursuant To NRS 239.001/ Petition For Writ Of Mandamus/ 
Application For Declaratory And Injunctive Relief.

$3.50

03/27/2017 E-filing fee: Stipulation and Order for Extension to Allow 
Las Vegas Review-Journal to File its Reply to Respondent 
City of Henderson’s Response to Amended Petition. 

$3.50

03/28/2017 E-filing fee: Notice of Entry of Order. $3.50
03/31/2017 Copying Costs: March 1, 2017 – March 31, 2017: 1,459 

pages at $0.08 per page.
$116.72

04/30/2017 Copying Costs: April 1, 2017 – April 30, 2017: 133 pages at 
$0.08 per page.

$10.64

03/31/2017 Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 190 transactions 
for March 2017. 

$178.30

05/31/2017 Copying Costs: May 1, 2017 – May 31, 2017: 2 pages at 
$0.08 per page.

$0.16
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Date Description Amount
06/01/2017 E-filing fee: Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal’s Motion 

for Attorney’s Fees and Costs.
$3.50

06/09/2017 E-filing fee: Notice of Appeal and Case Appeal Statement. $28.22
06/30/2017 Copying Costs: June 1, 2017 – June 30, 2017: 689 pages at 

$0.08 per page.
$55.12

07/27/2017 E-filing fee: Reply to City of Henderson’s Opposition to Las 
Vegas Review-Journal’s Motion for Attorney’s Fees and 
Costs.

$3.50

07/31/2017 Copying Costs: July 1, 2017 – July 31, 2017: 523 pages at 
$0.08 per page.

$41.84

07/31/2017 Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 27 transactions 
for July 2017.

$20.85

08/24/2017 E-filing fee: Motion for Extension of Time to Allows Las 
Vegas Review-Journal to Submit a Proposed Order Granting 
Las Vegas Review-Journal’s Motion for Attorney’s Fees and 
Costs.

$3.50

08/25/2017 E-filing fee: Notice of Submission of Proposed Order. $3.50
08/31/2017 Copying Costs: August 1, 2017 – August 31, 2017: 230 

pages at $0.08 per page.
$18.40

08/31/2017 Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 26 transactions 
for August 2017.

$20.01

09/07/2017 E-filing fee: Motion for Extension of Time to Allow Las 
Vegas Review-Journal to Submit a Proposed Order Granting 
Las Vegas Review-Journal’s Motion for Attorney’s Fees and 
Costs (Second Request).

$3.50

09/30/2017 Copying Costs: September 1, 2017 – September 30, 2017: 
152 pages at $0.08 per page.

$12.16

09/30/2017 Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 9 transactions 
for September 2017.

$10.18

10/31/2017 Copying Costs: October 1, 2017 – October 31, 2017: 691 
pages at $0.08 per page.

$55.28

10/31/2017 Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 8 transactions 
for October 2017.

$7.28

11/08/2017 E-filing fee: Motion for Clarification. $3.50
11/30/2017 Copying Costs: November 1, 2017 – November 30, 2017: 

124 pages at $0.08 per page.
$9.92

12/05/2017 E-filing fee: Reply to City of Henderson’s Opposition to 
Motion for Clarification.

$3.50

12/31/2017 Copying Costs: December 1, 2017 – December 31, 2017: 67 
pages at $0.08 per page.

$5.36

12/31/2017 Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 14 transactions 
for December 2017.

$15.43

02/28/2018 Copying Costs: January 1, 2018 – February 28, 2018: 602 
pages at $0.08 per page.

$48.64
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Date Description Amount
02/28/2018 Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 121 transactions 

for February 2018.
$54.72

03/28/2018 E-filing fee: Notice of Submission of Proposed Order. $3.50
03/31/2018 Copying Costs: March 1, 2018 – March 31, 2018: 4 pages at 

$0.08 per page.
$0.32

10/16/2018 E-filing fee: Notice of Change of Firm Name. $3.50
10/31/2018 Legal Research: WestLawNext - charges for 6 transactions 

for October 2018.
$4.42

01/08/2020 Mileage: Travel to/from City of Henderson located at 240 
Water Street, Henderson, NV 89015: 32.4 miles at 
$0.58/mile. (Roundtrip)

$18.79

01/10/2020 E-filing fee: Stipulation and Order Regarding Briefing 
Schedule for Motion for Attorney Fees.

$3.50

01/10/2020 E-filing fee: Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order 
Regarding Briefing Schedule for Motion for Attorney Fees.

$3.50

TOTAL COSTS AND EXPENSES $1,336.55
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