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INDEX TO PETITIONERS’ APPENDIX 

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Complaint (filed 12/17/2013) Vol. 1, 1–17 

Declaration of Salvatore Morabito in Support of Snowshoe 
Capital’s Motion to Dismiss for Lack of Personal 
Jurisdiction (filed 05/12/2014) 

Vol. 1, 18–21 

Defendant Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc.’s Motion to Dismiss 
Complaint for Lack of Personal Jurisdiction NRCP 12(b)(2) 
(filed 05/12/2014) 

Vol. 1, 22–30 

JH, Inc., Jerry Herbst, and Berry Hinckley Industries 
Opposition to Motion to Dismiss (filed 05/29/2014) 

Vol. 1, 31–43 

Exhibits to Opposition to Motion to Dismiss   
Exhibit Document Description  

1 Affidavit of John P. Desmond (filed 05/29/2014) Vol. 1, 44–48 
2 Fifth Amendment and Restatement of the Trust 

Agreement for the Arcadia Living Trust (dated 
09/30/2010) 

Vol. 1, 49–88 

3 Unanimous Written Consent of the Directors and 
Shareholders of CWC (dated 09/28/2010) 

Vol. 1, 89–92 

4 Unanimous Written Consent of the Board of 
Directors and Sole Shareholder of Superpumper 
(dated 09/28/2010) 

Vol. 1, 93–102 

5 Plan of Merger of Consolidated Western 
Corporation with and into Superpumper, Inc. 
(dated 09/28/2010) 

Vol. 1, 103–107 

6 Articles of Merger of Consolidated Western 
Corporation with and into Superpumper, Inc. 
(dated 09/29/2010) 

Vol. 1, 108–110 

7 2009 Federal Income Tax Return for P. Morabito Vol. 1, 111–153 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Exhibits to Opposition to Motion to Dismiss (cont.)  
8 May 21, 2014 printout from New York Secretary 

of State 
Vol. 1, 154–156 

9 May 9, 2008 Letter from Garrett Gordon to John 
Desmond 

Vol. 1, 157–158 

10 Shareholder Interest Purchase Agreement (dated 
09/30/2010) 

Vol. 1, 159–164 

11 Relevant portions of the January 22, 2010 
Deposition of Edward Bayuk 

Vol. 1, 165–176 

13 Relevant portions of the January 11, 2010 
Deposition of Salvatore Morabito 

Vol. 1, 177–180 

14 October 1, 2010 Grant, Bargain and Sale Deed Vol. 1, 181–187 
15 Order admitting Dennis Vacco (filed 02/16/2011) Vol. 1, 188–190 

JH, Inc., Jerry Herbst, and Berry Hinckley Industries, Errata 
to Opposition to Motion to Dismiss (filed 05/30/2014) 

Vol. 2, 191–194 

Exhibit to Errata to Opposition to Motion to Dismiss  
Exhibit Document Description  

12 Grant, Bargain and Sale Deed for APN: 040-620-
09, dated November 10, 2005 

Vol. 2, 195–198 

Answer to Complaint of P. Morabito, individually and as 
trustee of the Arcadia Living Trust (filed 06/02/2014) 

Vol. 2, 199–208 

Defendant, Snowshow Petroleum, Inc.’s Reply in Support 
of Motion to Dismiss Complaint for Lack of Personal 
Jurisdiction NRCP 12(b)(2) (filed 06/06/2014) 

 

Vol. 2, 209–216 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Exhibit to Reply in Support of Motion to Dismiss 
Complaint for Lack of Personal Jurisdiction NRCP 
12(b)(2) 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Declaration of Salvatore Morabito in Support of 

Snowshow Petroleum, Inc.’s Reply in Support of 
Motion to Dismiss Complaint for Lack of 
Personal Jurisdiction (filed 06/06/2014) 

Vol. 2, 217–219 

Defendant, Superpumper, Inc.’s Motion to Dismiss 
Complaint for Lack of Personal Jurisdiction NRCP 12(b)(2) 
(filed 06/19/2014) 

Vol. 2, 220–231 

Exhibit to Motion to Dismiss Complaint for Lack of 
Personal Jurisdiction NRCP 12(b)(2) 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Declaration of Salvatore Morabito in Support of 

Superpumper, Inc.’s Motion to Dismiss for Lack 
of Personal Jurisdiction (filed 06/19/2014) 

Vol. 2, 232–234 

JH, Inc., Jerry Herbst, and Berry Hinckley Industries, 
Opposition to Motion to Dismiss (filed 07/07/2014) 

Vol. 2, 235–247 

Exhibits to Opposition to Motion to Dismiss  

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Affidavit of Brian R. Irvine (filed 07/07/2014) Vol. 2, 248–252 
2 Fifth Amendment and Restatement of the Trust 

Agreement for the Arcadia Living Trust (dated 
09/30/2010) 

Vol. 2, 253–292 

3 BHI Electronic Funds Transfers, January 1, 2006 
to December 31, 2006 

Vol. 2, 293–294 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Exhibits to Opposition to Motion to Dismiss (cont.)  

4 Legal and accounting fees paid by BHI on behalf 
of Superpumper; JH78636-JH78639; JH78653-
JH78662; JH78703-JH78719 

Vol. 2, 295–328 

5 Unanimous Written Consent of the Directors and 
Shareholders of CWC (dated 09/28/2010) 

Vol. 2, 329–332 

6 Unanimous Written Consent of the Board of 
Directors and Sole Shareholders of Superpumper 
(dated 09/28/2010) 

Vol. 2, 333–336 

7 Plan of Merger of Consolidated Western 
Corporation with and into Superpumper, Inc. 
(dated 09/28/2010) 

Vol. 2, 337–341 

8 Articles of Merger of Consolidated Western 
Corporation with and into Superpumper, Inc. 
(dated 09/29/2010) 

Vol. 2, 342–344 

9 2009 Federal Income Tax Return for P. Morabito Vol. 2, 345–388 
10 Relevant portions of the January 22, 2010 

Deposition of Edward Bayuk 
Vol. 2, 389–400 

11 Grant, Bargain and Sale Deed for APN: 040-620-
09, dated November 10, 2005 

Vol. 2, 401–404 

12 Relevant portions of the January 11, 2010 
Deposition of Salvatore Morabito 

Vol. 2, 405–408 

13 Printout of Arizona Corporation Commission 
corporate listing for Superpumper, Inc.  

Vol. 2, 409–414 

Defendant, Superpumper, Inc.’s Reply in Support of 
Motion to Dismiss Complaint for Lack of Personal 
Jurisdiction NRCP 12(b)(2) (filed 07/15/2014) 

Vol. 3, 415–421 

Order Denying Motion to Dismiss as to Snowshoe 
Petroleum, Inc.’s (filed 07/17/2014) 

Vol. 3, 422–431 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Notice of Entry of Order Denying Motion to Dismiss as to 
Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc.’s (filed 07/17/2014) 

Vol. 3, 432–435 

Exhibit to Notice of Entry of Order Denying Motion to 
Dismiss as to Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc.’s 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Order Denying Motion to Dismiss as to Snowshoe 

Petroleum, Inc.’s 
Vol. 3, 436–446 

Order Denying Superpumper, Inc.’s Motion to Dismiss 
Complaint for Lack of Personal Jurisdiction NRCP 12(b)(2) 
(filed 07/22/2014) 

Vol. 3, 447–457 

Notice of Entry of Order Denying Superpumper, Inc.’s 
Motion to Dismiss Complaint for Lack of Personal 
Jurisdiction NRCP 12(b)(2) (filed 07/22/2014) 

Vol. 3, 458–461 

Exhibit to Notice of Entry of Order Denying 
Superpumper, Inc.’s Motion to Dismiss Complaint 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Order Denying Superpumper, Inc.’s Motion to 

Dismiss Complaint for Lack of Personal 
Jurisdiction NRCP 12(b)(2) (filed 07/22/2014) 

Vol. 3, 462–473 

Answer to Complaint of Superpumper, Inc., and Snowshoe 
Petroleum, Inc. (filed 07/28/2014) 

Vol. 3, 474–483 

Answer to Complaint of Defendants, Edward Bayuk, 
individually and as trustee of the Edward William Bayuk 
Living Trust, and Salvatore Morabito (filed 09/29/2014) 

Vol. 3, 484–494 

Notice of Bankruptcy of Consolidated Nevada Corporation 
and P. Morabito (filed 2/11/2015) 

Vol. 3, 495–498 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Supplemental Notice of Bankruptcy of Consolidated 
Nevada Corporation and P. Morabito (filed 02/17/2015) 

Vol. 3, 499–502 

Exhibits to Supplemental Notice of Bankruptcy of 
Consolidated Nevada Corporation and P. Morabito 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Involuntary Petition; Case No. BK-N-13-51236 

(filed 06/20/2013) 
Vol. 3, 503–534 

2 Involuntary Petition; Case No. BK-N-13-51237 
(06/20/2013) 

Vol. 3, 535–566 

3 Order for Relief Under Chapter 7; Case No. BK-
N-13-51236 (filed 12/17/2014) 

Vol. 3, 567–570 

4 Order for Relief Under Chapter 7; Case No. BK-
N-13-51237 (filed 12/17/2014) 

Vol. 3, 571–574 

Stipulation and Order to File Amended Complaint (filed 
05/15/2015) 

Vol. 4, 575–579 

Exhibit to Stipulation and Order to File Amended 
Complaint 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 First Amended Complaint Vol. 4, 580–593 

William A. Leonard, Trustee for the Bankruptcy Estate of 
P. Morabito, First Amended Complaint (filed 05/15/2015) 

Vol. 4, 594–607 

Stipulation and Order to Substitute a Party Pursuant to 
NRCP 17(a) (filed 05/15/2015) 

Vol. 4, 608–611 

Substitution of Counsel (filed 05/26/2015) Vol. 4, 612–615 

Defendants’ Answer to First Amended Complaint (filed 
06/02/2015) 

Vol. 4, 616–623 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Amended Stipulation and Order to Substitute a Party 
Pursuant to NRCP 17(a) (filed 06/16/2015) 

Vol. 4, 624–627 

Motion to Partially Quash, or, in the Alternative, for a 
Protective Order Precluding Trustee from Seeking 
Discovery Protected by the Attorney-Client Privilege (filed 
03/10/2016) 

Vol. 4, 628–635 

Exhibits to Motion to Partially Quash, or, in the 
Alternative, for a Protective Order Precluding Trustee 
from Seeking Discovery Protected by the Attorney-
Client Privilege 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 March 9, 2016 Letter from Lippes Vol. 4, 636–638 
2 Affidavit of Frank C. Gilmore, Esq., (dated 

03/10/2016) 
Vol. 4, 639–641 

3 Notice of Issuance of Subpoena to Dennis 
Vacco (dated 01/29/2015) 

Vol. 4, 642–656 

4 March 10, 2016 email chain  Vol. 4, 657–659 

Minutes of February 24, 2016 Pre-trial Conference (filed 
03/17/2016) 

Vol. 4, 660–661 

Transcript of February 24, 2016 Pre-trial Conference  Vol. 4, 662–725 

Plaintiff’s (Leonard) Opposition to Defendants’ Motion to 
Partially Quash, or, in the Alternative, for a Protective Order 
Precluding Trustee from Seeking Discovery Protected by 
the Attorney-Client Privilege (filed 03/25/2016) 

Vol. 5, 726–746 

Exhibits to Opposition to Motion to Partially Quash or, 
in the Alternative, for a Protective Order Precluding 
Trustee from Seeking Discovery Protected by the 
Attorney-Client Privilege 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Declaration of Teresa M. Pilatowicz in Support 

of Plaintiff’s Opposition to Defendants’ Motion 
to Partially Quash (filed 03/25/2016) 

Vol. 5, 747–750 

2 Application for Commission to take Deposition 
of Dennis Vacco (filed 09/17/2015) 

Vol. 5, 751–759 

3 Commission to take Deposition of Dennis 
Vacco (filed 09/21/2015) 

Vol. 5, 760–763 

4 Subpoena/Subpoena Duces Tecum to Dennis 
Vacco (09/29/2015) 

Vol. 5, 764–776 

5 Notice of Issuance of Subpoena to Dennis 
Vacco (dated 09/29/2015) 

Vol. 5, 777–791 

6 Dennis C. Vacco and Lippes Mathias Wexler 
Friedman LLP, Response to Subpoena (dated 
10/15/2015)  

Vol. 5, 792–801 

7 Condensed Transcript of October 21, 2015 
Deposition of Dennis Vacco 

 Vol. 5, 802–851 

8 Transcript of the Bankruptcy Court’s December 
22, 2015, oral ruling; Case No. BK-N-13-51237 

Vol. 5, 852–897 

9 Order Granting Motion to Compel Responses to 
Deposition Questions; Case No. BK-N-13-
51237 (filed 02/03/2016) 

Vol. 5, 898–903 

10 Notice of Continued Deposition of Dennis 
Vacco (filed 02/18/2016) 

Vol. 5, 904–907 

11 Debtor’s Objection to Proposed Order Granting 
Motion to Compel Responses to Deposition 
Questions; Case No. BK-N-13-51237 (filed 
01/22/2016) 

Vol. 5, 908–925 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Reply in Support of Motion to Modify Subpoena, or, in the 
Alternative, for a Protective Order Precluding Trustee from 
Seeking Discovery Protected by the Attorney-Client 
Privilege (filed 04/06/2016) 

Vol. 6, 926–932 

Plaintiff’s Motion to Compel Production of Documents 
(filed 04/08/2016) 

Vol. 6, 933–944 

Exhibits to Plaintiff’s Motion to Compel Production of 
Documents 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Declaration of Teresa M. Pilatowicz in Support 

of Plaintiff’s Motion to Compel (filed 
04/08/2016) 

Vol. 6, 945–948 

2 Bill of Sale – 1254 Mary Fleming Circle (dated 
10/01/2010) 

Vol. 6, 949–953 

3 Bill of Sale – 371 El Camino Del Mar (dated 
10/01/2010) 

Vol. 6, 954–958 

4 Bill of Sale – 370 Los Olivos (dated 
10/01/2010) 

Vol. 6, 959–963 

5 Personal financial statement of P. Morabito as 
of May 5, 2009 

Vol. 6, 964–965 

6 Plaintiff’s First Set of Requests for Production 
of Documents to Edward Bayuk (dated 
08/14/2015) 

Vol. 6, 966–977 

7 Edward Bayuk’s Responses to Plaintiff’s First 
Set of Requests for Production (dated 
09/23/2014) 

Vol. 6, 978–987 

8 Plaintiff’s First Set of Requests for Production 
of Documents to Edward Bayuk, as trustee of 
the Edward William Bayuk Living Trust (dated 
08/14/2015) 

Vol. 6, 988–997 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Exhibits to Plaintiff’s Motion to Compel Production of 
Documents (cont.) 

 

9 Edward Bayuk, as trustee of the Edward 
William Bayuk Living Trust’s Responses to 
Plaintiff’s First Set of Requests for Production 
(dated 09/23/2014) 

Vol. 6, 998–1007 

10 Plaintiff’s Second Set of Requests for 
Production of Documents to Edward Bayuk 
(dated 01/29/2016) 

Vol. 6, 1008–1015 

11 Edward Bayuk’s Responses to Plaintiff’s 
Second Set of Requests for Production (dated 
03/08/2016) 

Vol. 6, 1016–1020 

12 Plaintiff’s Second Set of Requests for 
Production of Documents to Edward Bayuk, as 
trustee of the Edward William Bayuk Living 
Trust (dated 01/29/2016) 

Vol. 6, 1021–1028 

13 Edward Bayuk, as trustee of the Edward 
William Bayuk Living Trust’s Responses to 
Plaintiff’s Second Set of Requests for 
Production (dated 03/08/2016) 

Vol. 6, 1029–1033 

14 Correspondences between Teresa M. Pilatowicz, 
Esq., and Frank Gilmore, Esq. (dated 
03/25/2016) 

Vol. 6, 1034–1037 

Opposition to Plaintiff’s Motion to Compel Production of 
Documents (filed 04/25/2016) 

Vol. 7, 1038–1044 

Reply in Support of Plaintiff’s Motion to Compel 
Production of Documents (filed 05/09/2016) 

Vol. 7, 1045–1057 

Exhibits to Reply in Support of Plaintiff’s Motion to 
Compel Production of Documents 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Declaration of Gabrielle A. Hamm, Esq., in 

Support of Reply in Support of Plaintiff’s 
Motion to Compel (filed 05/09/2016) 

Vol. 7, 1058–1060 

2 Amended Findings, of Fact and Conclusion of 
Law in Support of Order Granting Motion for 
Summary Judgment; Case No. BK-N-13-51237 
(filed 12/22/2014) 

Vol. 7, 1061–1070 

3 Order Compelling Deposition of P. Morabito 
dated March 13, 2014, in Consolidated Nevada 
Corp., et al v. JH. et al.; Case No. CV07-02764 
(filed 03/13/2014) 

Vol. 7, 1071–1074 

4 Emergency Motion Under NRCP 27(e); Petition 
for Writ of Prohibition, P. Morabito v. The 
Second Judicial District Court of the State of 
Nevada in and for the County of Washoe; Case 
No. 65319 (filed 04/01/2014) 

Vol. 7, 1075–1104 

5 Order Denying Petition for Writ of Prohibition; 
Case No. 65319 (filed 04/18/2014) 

Vol. 7, 1105–1108 

6 Order Granting Summary Judgment; Case No. 
BK-N-13-51237 (filed 12/17/2014) 

Vol. 7, 1109–1112 

Recommendation for Order RE: Defendants’ Motion to 
Partially Quash, filed on March 10, 2016 (filed 06/13/2016) 

Vol. 7, 1113–1124 

Confirming Recommendation Order from June 13, 2016 
(filed 07/06/2016)  

Vol. 7, 1125–1126 

Recommendation for Order RE: Plaintiff’s Motion to 
Compel Production of Documents, filed on April 8, 2016 
(filed 09/01/2016) 

Vol. 7, 1127–1133 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Confirming Recommendation Order from September 1, 
2016 (filed 09/16/2016) 

Vol. 7, 1134–1135 

Plaintiff’s Application for Order to Show Cause Why 
Defendant, Edward Bayuk Should Not Be Held in 
Contempt of Court Order (filed 11/21/2016)  

Vol. 8, 1136–1145 

Exhibits to Plaintiff’s Application for Order to Show 
Cause Why Defendant, Edward Bayuk Should Not Be 
Held in Contempt of Court Order 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Order to Show Cause Why Defendant, Edward 

Bayuk Should Not Be Held in Contempt of 
Court Order (filed 11/21/2016) 

Vol. 8, 1146–1148 

2 Confirming Recommendation Order from 
September 1, 2016 (filed 09/16/2016) 

Vol. 8, 1149–1151 

3 Recommendation for Order RE: Plaintiff’s 
Motion to Compel Production of Documents, 
filed on April 8, 2016 (filed 09/01/2016) 

Vol. 8, 1152–1159 

4 Plaintiff’s Motion to Compel Production of 
Documents (filed 04/08/2016) 

Vol. 8, 1160–1265 

5 Opposition to Plaintiff’s Motion to Compel 
Production of Documents (filed 04/25/2016) 

Vol. 8, 1266–1273 

6 Reply in Support of Plaintiff’s Motion to 
Compel Production of Documents (filed 
05/09/2016) 

Vol. 8, 1274–1342 

7 Correspondences between Teresa M. Pilatowicz, 
Esq., and Frank Gilmore, Esq. (dated 
09/22/2016) 

Vol. 8, 1343–1346 

8 Edward Bayuk’s Supplemental Responses to 
Plaintiff’s Second Set of Requests for 
Production (dated 10/25/2016) 

Vol. 8, 1347–1352 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Opposition to Plaintiff’s Application for Order to Show 
Cause Why Defendant Should Not Be Held in Contempt of 
Court Order (filed 12/19/2016 

Vol. 9, 1353–1363 

Exhibits to Opposition to Plaintiff’s Application for 
Order to Show Cause Why Defendant Should Not Be 
Held in Contempt of Court Order 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Declaration of Edward Bayuk in Support of 

Opposition to Plaintiff’s Application for Order to 
Show Cause (filed 12/19/2016) 

Vol. 9, 1364–1367 

2 Declaration of Frank C. Gilmore, Esq., in Support 
of Opposition to Plaintiff’s Application for Order 
to Show Cause (filed 12/19/2016) 

Vol. 9, 1368–1370 

3 Redacted copy of the September 6, 2016, 
correspondence of Frank C. Gilmore, Esq.  

Vol. 9, 1371–1372 

Order to Show Cause Why Defendant, Edward Bayuk 
Should Not Be Held in Contempt of Court Order (filed 
12/23/2016) 

Vol. 9, 1373–1375 

Response: (1) to Opposition to Application for Order to 
Show Cause Why Defendant Should Not Be Held in 
Contempt of Court Order and (2) in Support of Order to 
Show Cause (filed 12/30/2016) 

Vol. 9, 1376–1387 

Minutes of January 19, 2017 Deposition of Edward Bayuk 
in RE: insurance policies (filed 01/19/2017) 

Vol. 9, 1388 

Minutes of January 19, 2017 hearing on Order to Show 
Cause (filed 01/30/2017) 

Vol. 9, 1389 

Motion to Quash Subpoena, or, in the Alternative, for a 
Protective Order Precluding Trustee from Seeking 
Discovery from Hodgson Russ LLP (filed 07/18/2017) 

Vol. 9, 1390–1404 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Exhibits to Motion to Quash Subpoena, or, in the 
Alternative, for a Protective Order Precluding Trustee 
from Seeking Discovery from Hodgson Russ LLP 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Correspondence between Teresa M. Pilatowicz, 

Esq., and Frank Gilmore, Esq., dated March 8, 
2016 

Vol. 9, 1405–1406 

2 Correspondence between Teresa M. Pilatowicz, 
Esq., and Frank Gilmore, Esq., dated March 8, 
2016, with attached redlined discovery extension 
stipulation 

Vol. 9, 1407–1414 

3 Jan. 3 – Jan. 4, 2017, email chain from Teresa M. 
Pilatowicz, Esq., and Frank Gilmore, Esq. 

Vol. 9, 1415–1416 

4 Declaration of Frank C. Gilmore, Esq., in Support 
of Motion to Quash (filed 07/18/2017) 

Vol. 9, 1417–1420 

5 January 24, 2017 email from Teresa M. 
Pilatowicz, Esq.,  

Vol. 9, 1421–1422 

6 Jones Vargas letter to HR and P. Morabito, dated 
August 16, 2010 

Vol. 9, 1423–1425 

7 Excerpted Transcript of July 26, 2011 Deposition 
of Sujata Yalamanchili, Esq.  

Vol. 9, 1426–1431 
 
 

8 Letter dated June 17, 2011, from Hodgson Russ 
(“HR”) to John Desmond and Brian Irvine on 
Morabito related issues  

Vol. 9, 1432–1434 

9 August 9, 2013, transmitted letter to HR Vol. 9, 1435–1436 
10 Excerpted Transcript of July 23, 2014 Deposition 

of P. Morabito 
Vol. 9, 1437–1441 

11 Lippes Mathias Wexler Friedman LLP, April 3, 
2015 letter 

Vol. 9, 1442–1444 
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LOCATION 

Exhibits to Motion to Quash Subpoena (cont.)  

12 Lippes Mathias Wexler Friedman LLP, October 
20, 2010 letter RE: Balance forward as of bill 
dated 09/19/2010 and 09/16/2010  

Vol. 9, 1445–1454 

13 Excerpted Transcript of June 25, 2015 Deposition 
of 341 Meeting of Creditors 

Vol. 9, 1455–1460 

(1) Opposition to Motion to Quash Subpoena, or, in the 
Alternative, for a Protective Order Precluding Trustee from 
Seeking Discovery from Hodgson Russ LLP; and                   
(2) Countermotion for Sanctions and to Compel Resetting 
of 30(b)(3) Deposition of Hodgson Russ LLP (filed 
07/24/2017) 

Vol. 10, 1461–1485 

Exhibits to (1) Opposition to Motion to Quash 
Subpoena, or, in the Alternative, for a Protective Order 
Precluding Trustee from Seeking Discovery from 
Hodgson Russ LLP; and (2) Countermotion for 
Sanctions and to Compel Resetting of 30(b)(3) 
Deposition of Hodgson Russ LLP 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
A Declaration of Teresa M. Pilatowicz, Esq., in 

Support of (1) Opposition to Motion to Quash 
Subpoena, or, in the Alternative, for a Protective 
Order Precluding Trustee from Seeking 
Discovery from Hodgson Russ LLP (filed 
07/24/2017) 

Vol. 10, 1486–1494 

A-1 Defendants’ NRCP Disclosure of Witnesses and 
Documents (dated 12/01/2014) 

Vol. 10, 1495–1598 

A-2 Order Granting Motion to Compel Responses to 
Deposition Questions; Case No. BK-N-13-51237 
(filed 02/03/2016) 

Vol. 10, 1599–1604 
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LOCATION 

Exhibits to (1) Opposition to Motion to Quash 
Subpoena; and (2) Countermotion for Sanctions (cont.) 

 

A-3 Recommendation for Order RE: Defendants’ 
Motion to Partially Quash, filed on March 10, 
2016 (filed 06/13/2016) 

Vol. 10, 1605–1617 

A-4 Confirming Recommendation Order from 
September 1, 2016 (filed 09/16/2016) 

Vol. 10, 1618–1620 

A-5 Subpoena – Civil (dated 01/03/2017) Vol. 10, 1621–1634 

A-6 Notice of Deposition of Person Most 
Knowledgeable of Hodgson Russ LLP (filed 
01/03/2017) 

Vol. 10, 1635–1639 

A-7 January 25, 2017 Letter to Hodgson Russ LLP  Vol. 10, 1640–1649 

A-8 Stipulation Regarding Continued Discovery 
Dates (Sixth Request) (filed 01/30/2017) 

Vol. 10, 1650–1659 

A-9 Stipulation Regarding Continued Discovery 
Dates (Seventh Request) (filed 05/25/2017) 

Vol. 10, 1660–1669 

A-10 Defendants’ Sixteenth Supplement to NRCP 
Disclosure of Witnesses and Documents (dated 
05/03/2017) 

Vol. 10, 1670–1682 

A-11 Rough Draft Transcript of Garry M. Graber, 
Dated July 12, 2017 (Job Number 394849) 

Vol. 10, 1683–1719 

A-12 Sept. 15-Sept. 23, 2010 emails by and between 
Hodgson Russ LLP and Other Parties  

Vol. 10, 1720–1723 

Reply in Support of Motion to Quash Subpoena, or, in the 
Alternative, for a Protective Order Precluding Trustee from 
Seeking Discovery from Hodgson Russ LLP, and 
Opposition to Motion for Sanctions (filed 08/03/2017) 

Vol. 11, 1724–1734 
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DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Reply in Support of Countermotion for Sanctions and to 
Compel Resetting of 30(b)(6) Deposition of Hodgson Russ 
LLP (filed 08/09/2017)  

Vol. 11, 1735–1740 

Minutes of August 10, 2017 hearing on Motion to Quash 
Subpoena, or, in the Alternative, for a Protective Order 
Precluding Trustee from Seeking Discovery from Hodgson 
Russ LLP, and Opposition to Motion for Sanctions (filed 
08/11/2017) 

Vol. 11, 1741–1742 

Recommendation for Order RE: Defendants’ Motion to 
Quash Subpoena, or, in the Alternative, for a Protective 
Order Precluding Trustee from Seeking Discovery from 
Hodgson Russ LLP, filed on July 18, 2017 (filed 
08/17/2017) 

Vol. 11, 1743–1753 

Motion for Partial Summary Judgment (filed 08/17/2017) Vol. 11, 1754–1796 

Statement of Undisputed Facts in Support of Motion for 
Partial Summary Judgment (filed 08/17/2017) 

Vol. 11, 1797–1825 

Exhibits to Statement of Undisputed Facts in Support of 
Motion for Partial Summary Judgment 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Declaration of Timothy P. Herbst in Support of 

Separate Statement of Undisputed Facts in 
Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment 

Vol. 12, 1826–1829 
 
 
 

2 Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law, and 
Judgment in Consolidated Nevada Corp., et al v. 
JH. et al.; Case No. CV07-02764 (filed 
10/12/2010) 

Vol. 12, 1830–1846 

3 Judgment in Consolidated Nevada Corp., et al v. 
JH. et al.; Case No. CV07-02764 (filed 
08/23/2011) 

Vol. 12, 1847–1849 
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Exhibits to Statement of Undisputed Facts (cont.)  

4 Excerpted Transcript of July 12, 2017 Deposition 
of Garry M. Graber 

Vol. 12, 1850–1852 

5 September 15, 2015 email from Yalamanchili RE: 
Follow Up Thoughts  

Vol. 12, 1853–1854 

6 September 23, 2010 email between Garry M. 
Graber and P. Morabito  

Vol. 12, 1855–1857 

7 September 20, 2010 email between Yalamanchili 
and Eileen Crotty RE: Morabito Wire  

Vol. 12, 1858–1861 

8 September 20, 2010 email between Yalamanchili 
and Garry M. Graber RE: All Mortgage Balances 
as of 9/20/2010 

Vol. 12, 1862–1863 

9 September 20, 2010 email from Garry M. Graber 
RE: Call  

Vol. 12, 1864–1867 

10 September 20, 2010 email from P. Morabito to 
Dennis and Yalamanchili RE: Attorney client 
privileged communication  

Vol. 12, 1868–1870 

11 September 20, 2010 email string RE: Attorney 
client privileged communication 

Vol. 12, 1871–1875 

12 Appraisal of Real Property: 370 Los Olivos, 
Laguna Beach, CA, as of Sept. 24, 2010 

Vol. 12, 1876–1903 

13 Excerpted Transcript of March 21, 2016 
Deposition of P. Morabito 

Vol. 12, 1904–1919 

14 P. Morabito Redacted Investment and Bank 
Report from Sept. 1 to Sept. 30, 2010 

Vol. 12, 1920–1922 

15 Excerpted Transcript of June 25, 2015 Deposition 
of 341 Meeting of Creditors 

Vol. 12, 1923–1927 

16 Excerpted Transcript of December 5, 2015 
Deposition of P. Morabito 

Vol. 12, 1928–1952 
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Exhibits to Statement of Undisputed Facts (cont.)  

17 Purchase and Sale Agreement between Arcadia 
Trust and Bayuk Trust entered effective as of 
Sept. 27, 2010 

Vol. 12, 1953–1961 

18 First Amendment to Purchase and Sale 
Agreement between Arcadia Trust and Bayuk 
Trust entered effective as of Sept. 28, 2010 

Vol. 12, 1962–1964 

19 Appraisal Report providing market value estimate 
of real property located at 8355 Panorama Drive, 
Reno, NV as of Dec. 7, 2011 

Vol. 12, 1965–1995 

20 An Appraisal of a vacant .977± Acre Parcel of 
Industrial Land Located at 49 Clayton Place West 
of the Pyramid Highway (State Route 445) 
Sparks, Washoe County, Nevada and a single-
family residence located at 8355 Panorama Drive 
Reno, Washoe County, Nevada 89511 as of 
October 1, 2010 a retrospective date 

Vol. 13, 1996–2073 

21 APN: 040-620-09 Declaration of Value (dated 
12/31/2012) 

Vol. 14, 2074–2075 

22 Sellers Closing Statement for real property 
located at 8355 Panorama Drive, Reno, NV 89511 

Vol. 14, 2076–2077 

23 Bill of Sale for real property located at 8355 
Panorama Drive, Reno, NV 89511 

Vol. 14, 2078–2082 

24 Operating Agreement of Baruk Properties LLC Vol. 14, 2083–2093 
25 Edward Bayuk, as trustee of the Edward William 

Bayuk Living Trust’s Answer to Plaintiff’s First 
Set of Interrogatories (dated 09/14/2014) 

Vol. 14, 2094–2104 

26 Summary Appraisal Report of real property 
located at 1461 Glenneyre Street, Laguna Beach, 
CA 92651, as of Sept. 25, 2010 

Vol. 14, 2105–2155 
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Exhibits to Statement of Undisputed Facts (cont.)  

27 Appraisal of Real Property as of Sept. 23, 2010: 
1254 Mary Fleming Circle, Palm Springs, CA 
92262 

Vol. 15, 2156–2185 
 

28 Appraisal of Real Property as of Sept. 23, 2010: 
1254 Mary Fleming Circle, Palm Springs, CA 
92262 

Vol. 15, 2186–2216 
 

29 Membership Interest Transfer Agreement 
between Arcadia Trust and Bayuk Trust entered 
effective as of Oct. 1, 2010 

Vol. 15, 2217–2224 
 

30 PROMISSORY NOTE [Edward William Bayuk 
Living Trust (“Borrower”) promises to pay 
Arcadia Living Trust (“Lender”) the principal 
sum of $1,617,050.00, plus applicable interest] 
(dated 10/01/2010) 

Vol. 15, 2225–2228 
 

31 Certificate of Merger dated Oct. 4, 2010 Vol. 15, 2229–2230 

32 Articles of Merger Document No. 20100746864-
78 (recorded date 10/04/2010) 

Vol. 15, 2231–2241 

33 Excerpted Transcript of September 28, 2015 
Deposition of Edward William Bayuk 

Vol. 15, 2242–2256 

34 Grant Deed for real property 1254 Mary Fleming 
Circle, Palm Springs, CA 92262; APN: 507-520-
015 (recorded 11/04/2010) 

Vol. 15, 2257–2258 
 

35 General Conveyance made as of Oct. 31, 2010 
between Woodland Heights Limited (“Vendor”) 
and Arcadia Living Trust (“Purchaser”) 

Vol. 15, 2259–2265 
 

36 Appraisal of Real Property as of Sept. 24, 2010: 
371 El Camino Del Mar, Laguna Beach, CA 
92651 

Vol. 15, 2266–2292 
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Exhibits to Statement of Undisputed Facts (cont.)  

37 Excerpted Transcript of December 6, 2016 
Deposition of P. Morabito 

Vol. 15, 2293–2295 
 

38 Page intentionally left blank Vol. 15, 2296–2297 
39 Ledger of Edward Bayuk to P. Morabito Vol. 15, 2298–2300 

40 Loan Calculator: Payment Amount (Standard 
Loan Amortization) 

Vol. 15, 2301–2304 

41 Payment Schedule of Edward Bayuk Note in 
Favor of P. Morabito 

Vol. 15, 2305–2308 

42 November 10, 2011 email from Vacco RE: Baruk 
Properties, LLC/P. Morabito/Bank of America, 
N.A. 

Vol. 15, 2309–2312 

43 May 23, 2012 email from Vacco to Steve Peek 
RE: Formal Settlement Proposal to resolve the 
Morabito matter  

Vol. 15, 2313–2319 

44 Excerpted Transcript of March 12, 2015 
Deposition of 341 Meeting of Creditors 

Vol. 15, 2320–2326 

45 Shareholder Interest Purchase Agreement 
between P. Morabito and Snowshoe Petroleum, 
Inc. (dated 09/30/2010) 

Vol. 15, 2327–2332 
 

46 P. Morabito Statement of Assets & Liabilities as 
of May 5, 2009 

Vol. 15, 2333–2334 
 

47 March 10, 2010 email from Naz Afshar, CPA to 
Darren Takemoto, CPA RE: Current Personal 
Financial Statement  

Vol. 15, 2335–2337 
 

48 March 10, 2010 email from P. Morabito to Jon 
RE: ExxonMobil CIM for Florida and associated 
maps  

Vol. 15, 2338–2339 
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Exhibits to Statement of Undisputed Facts (cont.)  

49 March 20, 2010 email from P. Morabito to Vacco 
RE: proceed with placing binding bid on June 
22nd with ExxonMobil  

Vol. 15, 2340–2341 
 

50 P. Morabito Statement of Assets & Liabilities as 
of May 30, 2010 

Vol. 15, 2342–2343 
 

51 June 28, 2010 email from P. Morabito to George 
R. Garner RE: ExxonMobil Chicago Market 
Business Plan Review  

Vol. 15, 2344–2345 
 

52 Plan of Merger of Consolidated Western Corp. 
with and into Superpumper, Inc. (dated 
09/28/2010) 

Vol. 15, 2346–2364 
 

53 Page intentionally left blank Vol. 15, 2365–2366 
54 BBVA Compass Proposed Request on behalf of 

Superpumper, Inc. (dated 12/15/2010) 
Vol. 15, 2367–2397 

55 Business Valuation Agreement between Matrix 
Capital Markets Group, Inc. and Superpumper, 
Inc. (dated 09/30/2010) 

Vol. 15, 2398–2434 
 

56 Expert report of James L. McGovern, CPA/CFF, 
CVA (dated 01/25/2016) 

Vol. 16, 2435–2509 

57 June 18, 2014 email from Sam Morabito to 
Michael Vanek RE: SPI Analysis  

Vol. 17, 2510–2511 

58 Declaration of P. Morabito in Support of 
Opposition to Motion of JH, Inc., Jerry Herbst, 
and Berry-Hinckley Industries for Order 
Prohibiting Debtor from Using, Acquiring, or 
Disposing of or Transferring Assets Pursuant to 
11 U.S.C. §§ 105 and 303(f) Pending 
Appointment of Trustee; Case No. BK-N-13-
51237 (filed 07/01/2013) 

Vol. 17, 2512–2516 
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Exhibits to Statement of Undisputed Facts (cont.)  

59 State of California Secretary of State Limited 
Liability Company – Snowshoe Properties, LLC; 
File No. 201027310002 (filed 09/29/2010) 

Vol. 17, 2517–2518 

60 PROMISSORY NOTE [Snowshoe Petroleum 
(“Maker”) promises to pay P. Morabito 
(“Holder”) the principal sum of $1,462,213.00] 
(dated 11/01/2010) 

Vol. 17, 2519–2529 

61 PROMISSORY NOTE [Superpumper, Inc. 
(“Maker”) promises to pay Compass Bank (the 
“Bank” and/or “Holder”) the principal sum of 
$3,000,000.00] (dated 08/13/2010) 

Vol. 17, 2530–2538 

62 Excerpted Transcript of October 21, 2015 
Deposition of Salvatore R. Morabito 

Vol. 17, 2539–2541 

63 Page intentionally left blank Vol. 17, 2542–2543 

64 Edward Bayuk’s Answers to Plaintiff’s First Set 
of Interrogatories (dated 09/14/2014) 

Vol. 17, 2544–2557 

65 October 12, 2012 email from Stan Bernstein to P. 
Morabito RE: 2011 return  

Vol. 17, 2558–2559 

66 Page intentionally left blank Vol. 17, 2560–2561 

67 Excerpted Transcript of October 20, 2015 
Deposition of Dennis C. Vacco 

Vol. 17, 2562–2564 

68 Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc.’s letter of intent to set 
out the framework of the contemplated 
transaction between: Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc.; 
David Dwelle, LP; Eclipse Investments, LP; 
Speedy Investments; and TAD Limited 
Partnership (dated 04/21/2011) 

Vol. 17, 2565–2572 
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Exhibits to Statement of Undisputed Facts (cont.)  

69 Excerpted Transcript of July 10, 2017 Deposition 
of Dennis C. Vacco 

Vol. 17, 2573–2579 

70 April 15, 2011 email from P. Morabito to 
Christian Lovelace; Gregory Ivancic; Vacco RE: 
$65 million loan offer from Cerberus  

Vol. 17, 2580–2582 

71 Email from Vacco to P. Morabito RE: $2 million 
second mortgage on the Reno house 

Vol. 17, 2583–2584 

72 Email from Vacco to P. Morabito RE: Tim Haves Vol. 17, 2585–2586 
73 Settlement Agreement, Loan Agreement 

Modification & Release dated as of Sept. 7, 2012, 
entered into by Bank of America and P. Morabito 

Vol. 17, 2587–2595 

74 Page intentionally left blank Vol. 17, 2596–2597 
75 February 10, 2012 email from Vacco to Paul 

Wells and Timothy Haves RE: 1461 Glenneyre 
Street, Laguna Beach – Sale  

Vol. 17, 2598–2602 

76 May 8, 2012 email from P. Morabito to Vacco 
RE: Proceed with the corporate set-up with Ray, 
Edward and P. Morabito 

Vol. 17, 2603–2604 

77 September 4, 2012 email from Vacco to Edward 
Bayuk RE: Second Deed of Trust documents  

Vol. 17, 2605–2606 

78 September 18, 2012 email from P. Morabito to 
Edward Bayuk RE: Deed of Trust  

Vol. 17, 2607–2611 

79 October 3, 2012 email from Vacco to P. Morabito 
RE: Term Sheet on both real estate deal and 
option  

Vol. 17, 2612–2614 

80 March 14, 2013 email from P. Morabito to Vacco 
RE: BHI Hinckley  

Vol. 17, 2615–2616 

81 Page intentionally left blank Vol. 17, 2617–2618 
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Exhibits to Statement of Undisputed Facts (cont.)  

82 November 11, 2011 email from Vacco to P. 
Morabito RE: Trevor’s commitment to sign  

Vol. 17, 2619–2620 

83 November 28, 2011 email string RE: Wiring 
$560,000 to Lippes Mathias 

Vol. 17, 2621–2623 

84 Page intentionally left blank Vol. 17, 2624–2625 
85 Page intentionally left blank Vol. 17, 2626–2627 
86 Order for Relief Under Chapter 7; Case No. BK-

N-13-51236 (filed 12/22/2014) 
Vol. 17, 2628–2634 

87 Report of Undisputed Election (11 U.S.C § 702); 
Case No. BK-N-13-51237 (filed 01/23/2015)  

Vol. 17, 2635–2637 

88 Amended Stipulation and Order to Substitute a 
Party to NRCP 17(a) (filed 06/11/2015)  

Vol. 17, 2638–2642 

89 Membership Interest Purchase Agreement, 
entered into as of Oct. 6, 2010 between P. 
Morabito and Edward Bayuk  

Vol. 17, 2643–2648 

90 Complaint; Case No. BK-N-13-51237 (filed 
10/15/2015) 

Vol. 17, 2649–2686 

91 Fifth Amendment and Restatement of the Trust 
Agreement for the Arcadia Living Trust (dated 
09/30/2010) 

Vol. 17, 2687–2726 

Objection to Recommendation for Order filed August 17, 
2017 (filed 08/28/2017) 

Vol. 18, 2727–2734 
 

Exhibit to Objection to Recommendation for Order   
Exhibit Document Description  

1 Plaintiff’s counsel’s Jan. 24, 2017, email 
memorializing the discovery dispute agreement 

Vol. 18, 2735–2736 
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Opposition to Objection to Recommendation for Order filed 
August 17, 2017 (filed 09/05/2017) 

Vol. 18, 2737–2748 

Exhibit to Opposition to Objection to Recommendation 
for Order 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
A Declaration of Teresa M. Pilatowicz, Esq., in 

Support of Opposition to Objection to 
Recommendation for Order (filed 09/05/2017) 

Vol. 18, 2749–2752 

Reply to Opposition to Objection to Recommendation for 
Order filed August 17, 2017 (dated 09/15/2017) 

Vol. 18, 2753–2758 

Defendants’ Opposition to Plaintiff’s Motion for Partial 
Summary Judgment (filed 09/22/2017) 

Vol. 18, 2759–2774 

Defendants’ Separate Statement of Disputed Facts in 
Support of Opposition to Plaintiff’s Motion for Partial 
Summary Judgment (filed 09/22/2017) 

Vol. 18, 2775–2790 

Exhibits to Defendants’ Separate Statement of Disputed 
Facts in Support of Opposition to Plaintiff’s Motion for 
Partial Summary Judgment 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Judgment in Consolidated Nevada Corp., et al v. 

JH. et al.; Case No. CV07-02764 (filed 
08/23/2011) 

Vol. 18, 2791–2793 

2 Excerpted Transcript of October 20, 2015 
Deposition of Dennis C. Vacco 

Vol. 18, 2794–2810 

3 Order Denying Motion to Dismiss Involuntary 
Chapter 7 Petition and Suspending Proceedings 
Pursuant to 11 U.S.C §305(a)(1); Case No. BK-
N-13-51237 (filed 12/17/2013) 

Vol. 18, 2811–2814 
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Exhibits to Defendants’ Separate Statement of Disputed 
Facts (cont.) 

 

4 Excerpted Transcript of March 21, 2016 
Deposition of P. Morabito 

Vol. 18, 2815–2826 

5 Excerpted Transcript of September 28, 2015 
Deposition of Edward William Bayuk  

Vol. 18, 2827–2857 

6 Appraisal  Vol. 18, 2858–2859 
7 Budget Summary as of Jan. 7, 2016 Vol. 18, 2860–2862 
8 Excerpted Transcript of March 24, 2016 

Deposition of Dennis Banks 
Vol. 18, 2863–2871 

9 Excerpted Transcript of March 22, 2016 
Deposition of Michael Sewitz 

Vol. 18, 2872–2879 

10 Excerpted Transcript of April 27, 2011 
Deposition of Darryl Noble 

Vol. 18, 2880–2883 

11 Copies of cancelled checks from Edward Bayuk 
made payable to P. Morabito 

Vol. 18, 2884–2892 

12 CBRE Appraisal of 14th Street Card Lock 
Facility (dated 02/26/2010) 

Vol. 18, 2893–2906 

13 Bank of America wire transfer from P. Morabito 
to Salvatore Morabito in the amount of 
$146,127.00; and a wire transfer from P. 
Morabito to Lippes for $25.00 (date 10/01/2010) 

Vol. 18, 2907–2908 

14 Excerpted Transcript of October 21, 2015 
Deposition of Christian Mark Lovelace 

Vol. 18, 2909–2918 

15 June 18, 2014 email from Sam Morabito to 
Michael Vanek RE: Analysis of the Superpumper 
transaction in 2010  

Vol. 18, 2919–2920 

16 Excerpted Transcript of October 21, 2015 
Deposition of Salvatore R. Morabito 

Vol. 18, 2921–2929 
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Exhibits to Defendants’ Separate Statement of Disputed 
Facts (cont.) 

 

17 PROMISSORY NOTE [Snowshoe Petroleum 
(“Maker”) promises to pay P. Morabito 
(“Holder”) the principal sum of $1,462,213.00] 
(dated 11/01/2010) 

Vol. 18, 2930–2932 

18 TERM NOTE [P. Morabito (“Borrower”) 
promises to pay Consolidated Western Corp. 
(“Lender”) the principal sum of $939,000.00, plus 
interest] (dated 09/01/2010) 

Vol. 18, 2933–2934 

19 SUCCESSOR PROMISSORY NOTE 
[Snowshoe Petroleum (“Maker”) promises to pay 
P. Morabito (“Holder”) the principal sum of 
$492,937.30, plus interest] (dated 02/01/2011) 

Vol. 18, 2935–2937 

20 Edward Bayuk’s wire transfer to Lippes in the 
amount of $517,547.20 (dated 09/29/2010) 

Vol. 18, 2938–2940 

21 Salvatore Morabito Bank of Montreal September 
2011 Wire Transfer  

Vol. 18, 2941–2942 

22 Declaration of Salvatore Morabito (dated 
09/21/2017) 

Vol. 18, 2943–2944 

23 Edward Bayuk bank wire transfer to 
Superpumper, Inc., in the amount of $659,000.00 
(dated 09/30/2010) 

Vol. 18, 2945–2947 

24 Edward Bayuk checking account statements 
between 2010 and 2011 funding the company 
with transfers totaling $500,000 

Vol. 18, 2948–2953 

25 Salvatore Morabito’s wire transfer statement 
between 2010 and 2011, funding the company 
with $750,000 

Vol. 18, 2954–2957 

26 Payment Schedule of Edward Bayuk Note in 
Favor of P. Morabito 

Vol. 18, 2958–2961 
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Exhibits to Defendants’ Separate Statement of Disputed 
Facts (cont.) 

 

27 September 15, 2010 email from Vacco to 
Yalamanchili and P. Morabito RE: Follow Up 
Thoughts  

Vol. 18, 2962–2964 

Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment 
(dated 10/10/2017)  

Vol. 19, 2965–2973 
 

Order Regarding Discovery Commissioner’s 
Recommendation for Order dated August 17, 2017 (filed 
12/07/2017) 

Vol. 19, 2974–2981 

Order Denying Motion for Partial Summary Judgment 
(filed 12/11/2017) 

Vol. 19, 2982–2997 

Defendants’ Motions in Limine (filed 09/12/2018) Vol. 19, 2998–3006 
 

Exhibits to Defendants’ Motions in Limine  
Exhibit Document Description  

1 Plaintiff’s Second Supplement to Amended 
Disclosures Pursuant to NRCP 16.1(A)(1) (dated 
04/28/2016) 

Vol. 19, 3007–3016 

2 Excerpted Transcript of March 25, 2016 
Deposition of William A. Leonard 

Vol. 19, 3017–3023 

3 Plaintiff, Jerry Herbst’s Responses to Defendant 
Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc.’s Set of Interrogatories 
(dated 02/11/2015); and Plaintiff, Jerry Herbst’s 
Responses to Defendant, Salvatore Morabito’s 
Set of Interrogatories (dated 02/12/2015) 

Vol. 19, 3024–3044 

Motion in Limine to Exclude Testimony of Jan Friederich 
(filed 09/20/2018)  

Vol. 19, 3045–3056 
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Exhibits to Motion in Limine to Exclude Testimony of 
Jan Friederich 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Defendants’ Rebuttal Expert Witness Disclosure 

(dated 02/29/2016) 
Vol. 19, 3057–3071 

2 Condensed Transcript of March 29, 2016 
Deposition of Jan Friederich 

Vol. 19, 3072–3086 

Opposition to Defendants’ Motions in Limine (filed 
09/28/2018) 

Vol. 19, 3087–3102 

Exhibits to Opposition to Defendants’ Motions in 
Limine 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
A Declaration of Teresa M. Pilatowicz, Esq. in 

Support of Opposition to Defendants’ Motions in 
Limine (filed 09/28/2018) 

Vol. 19, 3103–3107 

A-1 Plaintiff’s February 19, 2016, Amended 
Disclosures Pursuant to NRCP 16.1(A)(1) 

Vol. 19, 3108–3115 

A-2 Plaintiff’s January 26, 2016, Expert Witnesses 
Disclosures (without exhibits) 

Vol. 19, 3116–3122 

A-3 Defendants’ January 26, 2016, and February 29, 
2016, Expert Witness Disclosures (without 
exhibits) 

Vol. 19, 3123–3131 

A-4 Plaintiff’s August 17, 2017, Motion for Partial 
Summary Judgment (without exhibits) 

Vol. 19, 3132–3175 

A-5 Plaintiff’s August 17, 2017, Statement of 
Undisputed Facts in Support of his Motion for 
Partial Summary Judgment (without exhibits) 

Vol. 19, 3176–3205 

Defendants’ Reply in Support of Motions in Limine (filed 
10/08/2018) 

Vol. 20, 3206–3217 
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Exhibit to Defendants’ Reply in Support of Motions in 
Limine 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Chapter 7 Trustee, William A. Leonard’s 

Responses to Defendants’ First Set of 
Interrogatories (dated 05/28/2015) 

Vol. 20, 3218–3236 

Defendants’ Opposition to Plaintiff’s Motions in Limine to 
Exclude the Testimony of Jan Friederich (filed 10/08/2018) 

Vol. 20, 3237–3250 

Exhibits to Defendants’ Opposition to Plaintiff’s 
Motions in Limine to Exclude the Testimony of Jan 
Friederich 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Excerpt of Matrix Report (dated 10/13/2010) Vol. 20, 3251–3255 
2 Defendants’ Rebuttal Expert Witness Disclosure 

(dated 02/29/2016) 
Vol. 20, 3256–3270 

3 November 9, 2009 email from P. Morabito to 
Daniel Fletcher; Jim Benbrook; Don Whitehead; 
Sam Morabito, etc. RE: Jan Friederich entered 
consulting agreement with Superpumper  

Vol. 20, 3271–3272 

4 Excerpted Transcript of March 29, 2016 
Deposition of Jan Friederich 

Vol. 20, 3273–3296 

Defendants’ Objections to Plaintiff’s Pretrial Disclosures 
(filed 10/12/2018) 

Vol. 20, 3297–3299 

Objections to Defendants’ Pretrial Disclosures (filed 
10/12/2018) 

Vol. 20, 3300–3303 

Reply to Defendants’ Opposition to Plaintiff’s Motion in 
Limine to Exclude the Testimony of Jan Friederich (filed 
10/12/2018) 

Vol. 20, 3304–3311 
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Minutes of September 11, 2018, Pre-trial Conference (filed 
10/19/2018) 

Vol. 20, 3312 

Stipulated Facts (filed 10/29/2018) Vol. 20, 3313–3321 

Defendants’ Points and Authorities RE: Objection to 
Admission of Documents in Conjunction with the 
Depositions of P. Morabito and Dennis Vacco (filed 
10/30/2018) 

Vol. 20, 3322–3325 

Plaintiff’s Points and Authorities Regarding Authenticity 
and Hearsay Issues (filed 10/31/2018) 

Vol. 20, 3326–3334 

Clerk’s Trial Exhibit List (filed 02/28/2019) Vol. 21, 3335–3413 

Exhibits to Clerk’s Trial Exhibit List  

Exhibit Document Description  

1 Certified copy of the Transcript of September 13, 
2010 Judge’s Ruling; Case No. CV07-02764 

Vol. 21, 3414–3438 

2 Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law, and 
Judgment; Case No. CV07-02764 (filed 
10/12/2010) 

Vol. 21, 3439–3454 

3 Judgment; Case No. CV07-0767 (filed 
08/23/2011) 

Vol. 21, 3455–3456 

4 Confession of Judgment; Case No. CV07-02764 
(filed 06/18/2013) 

Vol. 21, 3457–3481 

5 November 30, 2011 Settlement Agreement and 
Mutual Release 

Vol. 22, 3482–3613 

6 March 1, 2013 Forbearance Agreement Vol. 22, 3614–3622 
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Exhibits to Clerk’s Trial Exhibit List (cont.)  

8 Order Denying Motion to Dismiss Involuntary 
Chapter 7 Petition and Suspending Proceedings, 
Case 13-51237. ECF No. 94, (filed 12/17/2013) 

Vol. 22, 3623–3625 

19 Report of Undisputed Election– Appointment of 
Trustee, Case No. 13-51237, ECF No. 220 

Vol. 22, 3626–3627 

20 Stipulation and Order to Substitute a Party 
Pursuant to NRCP 17(a), Case No. CV13-02663, 
May 15, 2015 

Vol. 22, 3628–3632 

21 Non-Dischargeable Judgment Regarding 
Plaintiff’s First and Second Causes of Action, 
Case No. 15-05019-GWZ, ECF No. 123, April 
30, 2018 

Vol. 22, 3633–3634 

22 Memorandum & Decision; Case No. 15-05019-
GWZ, ECF No. 124, April 30, 2018 

Vol. 22, 3635–3654 

23 Amended Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law 
in Support of Judgment Regarding Plaintiff’s 
First and Second Causes of Action; Case 15-
05019-GWZ, ECF No. 122, April 30, 2018 

Vol. 22, 3655–3679 

25 September 15, 2010 email from Yalamanchili to 
Vacco and P. Morabito RE: Follow Up Thoughts 

Vol. 22, 3680–3681 

26 September 18, 2010 email from P. Morabito to 
Vacco 

Vol. 22, 3682–3683 

27 September 20, 2010 email from Vacco to P. 
Morabito RE: Spirit 

Vol. 22, 3684–3684 

28 September 20, 2010 email between Yalamanchili 
and Crotty RE: Morabito -Wire 

Vol. 22, 3685–3687 

29 September 20, 2010 email from Yalamanchili to 
Graber RE: Attorney Client Privileged 
Communication  

Vol. 22, 3688–3689 
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30 September 21, 2010 email from P. Morabito to 
Vacco and Cross RE: Attorney Client Privileged 
Communication 

Vol. 22, 3690–3692 

31 September 23, 2010 email chain between Graber 
and P. Morabito RE: Change of Primary 
Residence from Reno to Laguna Beach 

Vol. 22, 3693–3694 

32 September 23, 2010 email from Yalamanchili to 
Graber RE: Change of Primary Residence from 
Reno to Laguna Beach 

Vol. 22, 3695–3696 

33 September 24, 2010 email from P. Morabito to 
Vacco RE: Superpumper, Inc. 

Vol. 22, 3697–3697 

34 September 26, 2010 email from Vacco to P. 
Morabito RE: Judgment for a fixed debt 

Vol. 22, 3698–3698 

35 September 27, 2010 email from P. Morabito to 
Vacco RE: First Amendment to Residential Lease 
executed 9/27/2010 

Vol. 22, 3699–3701 

36 November 7, 2012 emails between Vacco, P. 
Morabito, C. Lovelace RE: Attorney Client 
Privileged Communication  

Vol. 22, 3702–3703 

37 Morabito BMO Bank Statement – September 
2010 

Vol. 22, 3704–3710 

38 Lippes Mathias Trust Ledger History Vol. 23, 3711–3716 

39 Fifth Amendment & Restatement of the Trust 
Agreement for the Arcadia Living Trust dated 
September 30, 2010 

Vol. 23, 3717–3755 

42 P. Morabito Statement of Assets & Liabilities as 
of May 5, 2009 

Vol. 23, 3756–3756 
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43 March 10, 2010 email chain between Afshar and 
Takemoto RE: Current Personal Financial 
Statement  

Vol. 23, 3757–3758 
 

44 Salazar Net Worth Report (dated 03/15/2011) Vol. 23, 3759–3772 
45 Purchase and Sale Agreement Vol. 23, 3773–3780 
46 First Amendment to Purchase and Sale 

Agreement 
Vol. 23, 3781–3782 

47 Panorama – Estimated Settlement Statement Vol. 23, 3783–3792 
48 El Camino – Final Settlement Statement Vol. 23, 3793–3793 
49 Los Olivos – Final Settlement Statement Vol. 23, 3794–3794 
50 Deed for Transfer of Panorama Property Vol. 23, 3795–3804 
51 Deed for Transfer for Los Olivos Vol. 23, 3805–3806 
52 Deed for Transfer of El Camino Vol. 23, 3807–3808 
53 Kimmel Appraisal Report for Panorama and 

Clayton 
Vol. 23, 3809–3886 

54 Bill of Sale – Panorama Vol. 23, 3887–3890 
55 Bill of Sale – Mary Fleming Vol. 23, 3891–3894 
56 Bill of Sale – El Camino Vol. 23, 3895–3898 
57 Bill of Sale – Los Olivos Vol. 23, 3899–3902 
58 Declaration of Value and Transfer Deed of 8355 

Panorama (recorded 12/31/2012) 
Vol. 23, 3903–3904 

60 Baruk Properties Operating Agreement Vol. 23, 3905–3914 

61 Baruk Membership Transfer Agreement Vol. 24, 3915–3921 

62 Promissory Note for $1,617,050 (dated 
10/01/2010) 

Vol. 24, 3922–3924 
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63 Baruk Properties/Snowshoe Properties, 
Certificate of Merger (filed 10/04/2010) 

Vol. 24, 3925–3926 

64 Baruk Properties/Snowshoe Properties, Articles 
of Merger 

Vol. 24, 3927–3937 

65 Grant Deed from Snowshoe to Bayuk Living 
Trust; Doc No. 2010-0531071 (recorded 
11/04/2010) 

Vol. 24, 3938–3939 

66 Grant Deed – 1461 Glenneyre; Doc No. 
2010000511045 (recorded 10/08/2010) 

Vol. 24, 3940–3941 

67 Grant Deed – 570 Glenneyre; Doc No. 
2010000508587 (recorded 10/08/2010) 

Vol. 24, 3942–3944 

68 Attorney File re: Conveyance between Woodland 
Heights and Arcadia Living Trust 

Vol. 24, 3945–3980 

69 October 24, 2011 email from P. Morabito to 
Vacco RE: Attorney Client Privileged 
Communication  

Vol. 24, 3981–3982 

70 November 10, 2011 email chain between Vacco 
and P. Morabito RE: Baruk Properties, LLC/Paul 
Morabito/Bank of America, N.A. 

Vol. 24, 3983–3985 

71 Bayuk First Ledger Vol. 24, 3986–3987 

72 Amortization Schedule Vol. 24, 3988–3990 

73 Bayuk Second Ledger Vol. 24, 3991–3993 

74 Opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment and 
Declaration of Edward Bayuk; Case No. 13-
51237, ECF No. 146 (filed 10/03/2014)  

Vol. 24, 3994–4053 

75 March 30, 2012 email from Vacco to Bayuk RE: 
Letter to BOA 

Vol. 24, 4054–4055 
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76 March 10, 2010 email chain between P. Morabito 
and jon@aim13.com RE: Strictly Confidential  

Vol. 24, 4056–4056 

77 May 20, 2010 email chain between P. Morabito, 
Vacco and Michael Pace RE: Proceed with 
placing a Binding Bid on June 22nd with 
ExxonMobil 

Vol. 24, 4057–4057 

78 Morabito Personal Financial Statement May 2010 Vol. 24, 4058–4059 
79 June 28, 2010 email from P. Morabito to George 

Garner RE: ExxonMobil Chicago Market 
Business Plan Review  

Vol. 24, 4060–4066 

80 Shareholder Interest Purchase Agreement Vol. 24, 4067–4071 
81 Plan of Merger of Consolidated Western 

Corporation with and Into Superpumper, Inc. 
Vol. 24, 4072–4075 

82 Articles of Merger of Consolidated Western 
Corporation with and Into Superpumper, Inc. 

Vol. 24, 4076–4077 

83 Unanimous Written Consent of the Board of 
Directors and Sole Shareholder of Superpumper, 
Inc. 

Vol. 24, 4078–4080 

84 Unanimous Written Consent of the Directors and 
Shareholders of Consolidated Western 
Corporation 

Vol. 24, 4081–4083 

85 Arizona Corporation Commission Letter dated 
October 21, 2010 

Vol. 24, 4084–4091 

86 Nevada Articles of Merger Vol. 24, 4092–4098 
87 New York Creation of Snowshoe Vol. 24, 4099–4103 
88 April 26, 2012 email from Vacco to Afshar RE: 

Ownership Structure of SPI 
Vol. 24, 4104–4106 

90 September 30, 2010 Matrix Retention Agreement Vol. 24, 4107–4110 

mailto:jon@aim13.com
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91 McGovern Expert Report Vol. 25, 4111–4189 
92 Appendix B to McGovern Report – Source 4 – 

Budgets 
Vol. 25, 4190–4191 

103 Superpumper Note in the amount of 
$1,462,213.00 (dated 11/01/2010) 

Vol. 25, 4192–4193 

104 Superpumper Successor Note in the amount of 
$492,937.30 (dated 02/01/2011) 

Vol. 25, 4194–4195 

105 Superpumper Successor Note in the amount of 
$939,000 (dated 02/01/2011) 

Vol. 25, 4196–4197 

106 Superpumper Stock Power transfers to S. 
Morabito and Bayuk (dated 01/01/2011) 

Vol. 25, 4198–4199 

107 Declaration of P. Morabito in Support of 
Opposition to Motion of JH, Inc., Jerry Herbst, 
and Berry- Hinckley Industries for Order 
Prohibiting Debtor from Using, Acquiring or 
Transferring Assets Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 105 
and 303(f) Pending Appointment of Trustee, Case 
13-51237, ECF No. 22 (filed 07/01/2013) 

Vol. 25, 4200–4203 

108 October 12, 2012 email between P. Morabito and 
Bernstein RE: 2011 Return 

Vol. 25, 4204–4204 

109 Compass Term Loan (dated 12/21/2016) Vol. 25, 4205–4213 
110 P. Morabito – Term Note in the amount of 

$939,000.000 (dated 09/01/2010) 
Vol. 25, 4214–4214 

111 Loan Agreement between Compass Bank and 
Superpumper (dated 12/21/2016) 

Vol. 25, 4215–4244 

112 Consent Agreement (dated 12/28/2010)  Vol. 25, 4245–4249 
113 Superpumper Financial Statement (dated 

12/31/2007)  
Vol. 25, 4250–4263 
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114 Superpumper Financial Statement (dated 
12/31/2009)  

Vol. 25, 4264–4276 

115 Notes Receivable Interest Income Calculation 
(dated 12/31/2009) 

Vol. 25, 4277–4278 

116 Superpumper Inc. Audit Conclusions Memo 
(dated 12/31/2010) 

Vol. 25, 4279–4284 

117 Superpumper 2010 YTD Income Statement and 
Balance Sheets 

Vol. 25, 4285–4299 

118 March 12, 2010 Management Letter  Vol. 25, 4300–4302 
119 Superpumper Unaudited August 2010 Balance 

Sheet 
Vol. 25, 4303–4307 

120 Superpumper Financial Statements (dated 
12/31/2010) 

Vol. 25, 4308–4322 

121 Notes Receivable Balance as of September 30, 
2010 

Vol. 26, 4323 

122 Salvatore Morabito Term Note $2,563,542.00 as 
of December 31, 2010 

Vol. 26, 4324–4325 

123 Edward Bayuk Term Note $2,580,500.00 as of 
December 31, 2010 

Vol. 26, 4326–4327 

125 April 21, 2011 Management letter  Vol. 26, 4328–4330 
126 Bayuk and S. Morabito Statements of Assets & 

Liabilities as of February 1, 2011 
Vol. 26, 4331–4332 

127 January 6, 2012 email from Bayuk to Lovelace 
RE: Letter of Credit 

Vol. 26, 4333–4335 

128 January 6, 2012 email from Vacco to Bernstein Vol. 26, 4336–4338 
129 January 7, 2012 email from Bernstein to Lovelace Vol. 26, 4339–4343 
130 March 18, 2012 email from P. Morabito to Vacco Vol. 26, 4344–4344 
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131 April 21, 2011 Proposed Acquisition of Nella Oil Vol. 26, 4345–4351 
132 April 15, 2011 email chain between P. Morabito 

and Vacco 
Vol. 26, 4352 

133 April 5, 2011 email from P. Morabito to Vacco Vol. 26, 4353 
134 April 16, 2012 email from Vacco to Morabito Vol. 26, 4354–4359 
135 August 7, 2011 email exchange between Vacco 

and P. Morabito 
Vol. 26, 4360 

136 August 2011 Lovelace letter to Timothy Halves Vol. 26, 4361–4365 
137 August 24, 2011 email from Vacco to P. Morabito 

RE: Tim Haves 
Vol. 26, 4366 

138 November 11, 2011 email from Vacco to P. 
Morabito RE: Getting Trevor’s commitment to 
sign 

Vol. 26, 4367 

139 November 16, 2011 email from P. Morabito to 
Vacco RE: Vacco’s litigation letter  

Vol. 26, 4368 

140 November 28, 2011 email chain between Vacco, 
S. Morabito, and P. Morabito RE: $560,000 wire 
to Lippes Mathias 

Vol. 26, 4369–4370 

141 December 7, 2011 email from Vacco to P. 
Morabito RE: Moreno 

Vol. 26, 4371 

142 February 10, 2012 email chain between P. 
Morabito Wells, and Vacco RE: 1461 Glenneyre 
Street - Sale 

Vol. 26, 4372–4375 

143 April 20, 2012 email from P. Morabito to Bayuk 
RE: BofA 

Vol. 26, 4376 

144 April 24, 2012 email from P. Morabito to Vacco 
RE: SPI Loan Detail 

Vol. 26, 4377–4378 
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145 September 4, 2012 email chain between Vacco 
and Bayuk RE: Second Deed of Trust documents 

Vol. 26, 4379–4418 

147 September 4, 2012 email from P. Morabito to 
Vacco RE: Wire  

Vol. 26, 4419–4422 

148 September 4, 2012 email from Bayuk to Vacco 
RE: Wire 

Vol. 26, 4423–4426 

149 December 6, 2012 email from Vacco to P. 
Morabito RE: BOA and the path of money 

Vol. 26, 4427–4428 

150 September 18, 2012 email chain between P. 
Morabito and Bayuk 

Vol. 26, 4429–4432 

151 October 3, 2012 email chain between Vacco and 
P. Morabito RE: Snowshoe Properties, LLC 

Vol. 26, 4433–4434 

152 September 3, 2012 email from P. Morabito to 
Vacco RE: Wire  

Vol. 26, 4435 

153 March 14, 2013 email chain between P. Morabito 
and Vacco RE: BHI Hinckley 

Vol. 26, 4436 

154 Paul Morabito 2009 Tax Return Vol. 26, 4437–4463 
155 Superpumper Form 8879-S tax year ended 

December 31, 2010 
Vol. 26, 4464–4484 

156 2010 U.S. S Corporation Tax Return for 
Consolidated Western Corporation 

Vol. 27, 4485–4556 

157 Snowshoe form 8879-S for year ended December 
31, 2010 

Vol. 27, 4557–4577 

158 Snowshoe Form 1120S 2011 Amended Tax 
Return 

Vol. 27, 4578–4655 

159 September 14, 2012 email from Vacco to P. 
Morabito  

Vol. 27, 4656–4657 
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160 October 1, 2012 email from P. Morabito to Vacco 
RE: Monday work for Dennis and Christian 

Vol. 27, 4658 

161 December 18, 2012 email from Vacco to P. 
Morabito RE: Attorney Client Privileged 
Communication 

Vol. 27, 4659 

162 April 24, 2013 email from P. Morabito to Vacco 
RE: BHI Trust 

Vol. 27, 4660 

163 Membership Interest Purchases, Agreement – 
Watch My Block (dated 10/06/2010) 

Vol. 27, 4661–4665 

164 Watch My Block organizational documents Vol. 27, 4666–4669 
174 October 15, 2015 Certificate of Service of copy of 

Lippes Mathias Wexler Friedman’s Response to 
Subpoena 

Vol. 27, 4670 

175 Order Granting Motion to Compel Responses to 
Deposition Questions ECF No. 502; Case No. 13-
51237-gwz (filed 02/03/2016) 

Vol. 27, 4671–4675 

179 Gursey Schneider LLP Subpoena Vol. 28, 4676–4697 
180 Summary Appraisal of 570 Glenneyre Vol. 28, 4698–4728 
181 Appraisal of 1461 Glenneyre Street Vol. 28, 4729–4777 
182 Appraisal of 370 Los Olivos Vol. 28, 4778–4804 
183 Appraisal of 371 El Camino Del Mar Vol. 28, 4805–4830 
184 Appraisal of 1254 Mary Fleming Circle Vol. 28, 4831–4859 
185 Mortgage – Panorama Vol. 28, 4860–4860 
186 Mortgage – El Camino Vol. 28, 4861 
187 Mortgage – Los Olivos Vol. 28, 4862 
188 Mortgage – Glenneyre Vol. 28, 4863 
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189 Mortgage – Mary Fleming Vol. 28, 4864 
190 Settlement Statement – 371 El Camino Del Mar Vol. 28, 4865 
191 Settlement Statement – 370 Los Olivos Vol. 28, 4866 
192 2010 Declaration of Value of 8355 Panorama Dr Vol. 28, 4867–4868 
193 Mortgage – 8355 Panorama Drive Vol. 28, 4869–4870 
194 Compass – Certificate of Custodian of Records 

(dated 12/21/2016) 
Vol. 28, 4871–4871 

196 June 6, 2014 Declaration of Sam Morabito – 
Exhibit 1 to Snowshoe Reply in Support of 
Motion to Dismiss Complaint for Lack of 
Personal Jurisdiction – filed in Case No. CV13-
02663 

Vol. 28, 4872–4874 

197 June 19, 2014 Declaration of Sam Morabito – 
Exhibit 1 to Superpumper Motion to Dismiss 
Complaint for Lack of Personal Jurisdiction – 
filed in Case No. CV13-02663 

Vol. 28, 4875–4877 

198 September 22, 2017 Declaration of Sam Morabito 
– Exhibit 22 to Defendants’ SSOF in Support of 
Opposition to Plaintiff's MSJ – filed in Case No. 
CV13-02663 

Vol. 28, 4878–4879 

222 Kimmel – January 21, 2016, Comment on Alves 
Appraisal 

Vol. 28, 4880–4883 

223 September 20, 2010 email from Yalamanchili to 
Morabito 

Vol. 28, 4884 

224 March 24, 2011 email from Naz Afshar RE: 
telephone call regarding CWC 

Vol. 28, 4885–4886 

225 Bank of America Records for Edward Bayuk 
(dated 09/05/2012) 

Vol. 28, 4887–4897 
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226 June 11, 2007 Wholesale Marketer Agreement Vol. 29, 4898–4921 
227 May 25, 2006 Wholesale Marketer Facility 

Development Incentive Program Agreement 
Vol. 29, 4922–4928 

228 June 2007 Master Lease Agreement – Spirit SPE 
Portfolio and Superpumper, Inc. 

Vol. 29, 4929–4983 

229 Superpumper Inc 2008 Financial Statement 
(dated 12/31/2008) 

Vol. 29, 4984–4996 

230 November 9, 2009 email from P. Morabito to 
Bernstein, Yalaman RE: Jan Friederich – entered 
into Consulting Agreement 

Vol. 29, 4997 

231 September 30, 2010, Letter from Compass to 
Superpumper, Morabito, CWC RE: reducing face 
amount of the revolving note 

Vol. 29, 4998–5001 

232 October 15, 2010, letter from Quarles & Brady to 
Vacco RE: Revolving Loan Documents and Term 
Loan Documents between Superpumper and 
Compass Bank 

Vol. 29, 5002–5006 

233 BMO Account Tracker Banking Report October 
1 to October 31, 2010  

Vol. 29, 5007–5013 

235 August 31, 2010 Superpumper Inc., Valuation of 
100 percent of the common equity in 
Superpumper, Inc on a controlling marketable 
basis 

Vol. 29, 5014–5059 

236 June 18, 2014 email from S. Morabito to Vanek 
(WF) RE: Analysis of Superpumper Acquisition 
in 2010 

Vol. 29, 5060–5061 

241 Superpumper March 2010 YTD Income 
Statement 

Vol. 29, 5062–5076 
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244 Assignment Agreement for $939,000 Morabito 
Note 

Vol. 29, 5077–5079 

247 July 1, 2011 Third Amendment to Forbearance 
Agreement Superpumper and Compass Bank 

Vol. 29, 5080–5088 

248 Superpumper Cash Contributions January 2010 
thru September 2015 – Bayuk and S. Morabito 

Vol. 29, 5089–5096 

252 October 15, 2010 Letter from Quarles & Brady to 
Vacco RE: Revolving Loan documents and Term 
Loan documents between Superpumper Prop. and 
Compass Bank 

Vol. 29, 5097–5099 

254 Bank of America – S. Morabito SP Properties 
Sale, SP Purchase Balance 

Vol. 29, 5100 

255 Superpumper Prop. Final Closing Statement for 
920 Mountain City Hwy, Elko, NV 

Vol. 29, 5101 

256 September 30, 2010 Raffles Insurance Limited 
Member Summary 

Vol. 29, 5102 

257 Equalization Spreadsheet Vol. 30, 5103 
258 November 9, 2005 Grant, Bargain and Sale Deed; 

Doc #3306300 for Property Washoe County 
Vol. 30, 5104–5105 

260 January 7, 2016 Budget Summary – Panorama 
Drive 

Vol. 30, 5106–5107 

261 Mary 22, 2006 Compilation of Quotes and 
Invoices Quote of Valley Drapery 

Vol. 30, 5108–5116 

262 Photos of 8355 Panorama Home Vol. 30, 5117–5151 

263 Water Rights Deed (Document #4190152) 
between P. Morabito, E. Bayuk, Grantors, RCA 
Trust One Grantee (recorded 12/31/2012) 

Vol. 30, 5152–5155 
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265 October 1, 2010 Bank of America Wire Transfer 
–Bayuk – Morabito $60,117 

Vol. 30, 5156 

266 October 1, 2010 Check #2354 from Bayuk to P. 
Morabito for $29,383 for 8355 Panorama funding 

Vol. 30, 5157–5158 

268 October 1, 2010 Check #2356 from Bayuk to P. 
Morabito for $12,763 for 370 Los Olivos Funding 

Vol. 30, 5159–5160 

269 October 1, 2010 Check #2357 from Bayuk to P. 
Morabito for $31,284 for 371 El Camino Del Mar 
Funding 

Vol. 30, 5161–5162 

270 Bayuk Payment Ledger Support Documents 
Checks and Bank Statements 

Vol. 31, 5163–5352 

271 Bayuk Superpumper Contributions Vol. 31, 5353–5358 
272 May 14, 2012 email string between P. Morabito, 

Vacco, Bayuk, and S. Bernstein RE: Info for 
Laguna purchase 

Vol. 31, 5359–5363 

276 September 21, 2010 Appraisal of 8355 Panorama 
Drive Reno, NV by Alves Appraisal 

Vol. 32, 5364–5400 

277 Assessor’s Map/Home Caparisons for 8355 
Panorama Drive, Reno, NV 

Vol. 32, 5401–5437 

278 December 3, 2007 Case Docket for CV07-02764 Vol. 32, 5438–5564 

280 May 25, 2011 Stipulation Regarding the 
Imposition of Punitive Damages; Case No. CV07-
02764 (filed 05/25/2011) 

Vol. 33, 5565–5570 

281 Work File for September 24, 2010 Appraisal of 
8355 Panorama Drive, Reno, NV 

Vol. 33, 5571–5628 

283 January 25, 2016 Expert Witness Report Leonard 
v. Superpumper Snowshoe 

Vol. 33, 5629–5652 
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284 February 29, 2016 Defendants’ Rebuttal Expert 
Witness Disclosure 

Vol. 33, 5653–5666 

294 October 5, 2010 Lippes, Mathias Wexler 
Friedman, LLP, Invoices to P. Morabito 

Vol. 33, 5667–5680 

295 P. Morabito 2010 Tax Return (dated 10/16/2011) Vol. 33, 5681–5739 
296 December 31, 2010 Superpumper Inc. Note to 

Financial Statements 
Vol. 33, 5740–5743 

297 December 31, 2010 Superpumper Consultations Vol. 33, 5744 
300 September 20, 2010 email chain between 

Yalmanchili and Graber RE: Attorney Client 
Privileged Communication 

Vol. 33, 5745–5748 

301 September 15, 2010 email from Vacco to P. 
Morabito RE: Tomorrow 

Vol. 33, 5749–5752 

303 Bankruptcy Court District of Nevada Claims 
Register Case No. 13-51237 

Vol. 33, 5753–5755 

304 April 14, 2018 email from Allen to Krausz RE: 
Superpumper 

Vol. 33, 5756–5757 

305 Subpoena in a Case Under the Bankruptcy Code 
to Robison, Sharp, Sullivan & Brust issued in 
Case No. BK-N-13-51237-GWZ 

Vol. 33, 5758–5768 

306 August 30, 2018 letter to Mark Weisenmiller, 
Esq., from Frank Gilmore, Esq.,  

Vol. 34, 5769 

307 Order Granting Motion to Compel Compliance 
with the Subpoena to Robison, Sharp, Sullivan & 
Brust filed in Case No. BK-N-13-51237-GWZ 

Vol. 34, 5770–5772 

308 Response of Robison, Sharp, Sullivan & Brust’s 
to Subpoena filed in Case No. BK-N-13-51237-
GWZ 

Vol. 34, 5773–5797 
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309 Declaration of Frank C. Gilmore in support of 
Robison, Sharp, Sullivan & Brust’s Opposition to 
Motion for Order Holding Robison in Contempt 
filed in Case No. BK-N-13-51237-GWZ 

Vol. 34, 5798–5801 

Minutes of October 29, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 1 (filed 
11/08/2018) 

Vol. 35, 5802–6041 

Transcript of October 29, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 1 Vol. 35, 6042–6045 

Minutes of October 30, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 2 (filed 
11/08/2018) 

Vol. 36, 6046–6283 

Transcript of October 30, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 2 Vol. 36, 6284–6286 

Minutes of October 31, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 3 (filed 
11/08/2018) 

Vol. 37, 6287–6548 

Transcript of October 31, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 3 Vol. 37, 6549–6552 

Minutes of November 1, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 4 (filed 
11/08/2018) 

Vol. 38, 6553–6814 

Transcript of November 1, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 4 Vol. 38, 6815–6817 

Minutes of November 2, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 5 (filed 
11/08/2018) 

Vol. 39, 6818–7007 

Transcript of November 2, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 5 Vol. 39, 7008–7011 

Minutes of November 5, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 6 (filed 
11/08/2018) 

Vol. 40, 7012–7167 

Transcript of November 5, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 6 Vol. 40, 7168–7169 
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Minutes of November 6, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 7 (filed 
11/08/2018) 

Vol. 41, 7170–7269 

Transcript of November 6, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 7 Vol. 41, 7270–7272 
Vol. 42, 7273–7474 
 

Minutes of November 7, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 8 (filed 
11/08/2018) 

Vol. 43, 7475–7476 

Transcript of November 7, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 8 Vol. 43, 7477–7615 

Minutes of November 26, 2018, Non-Jury Trial, Day 9 
(filed 11/26/2018) 

Vol. 44, 7616 

Transcript of November 26, 2018, Non-Jury Trial – Closing 
Arguments, Day 9 

Vol. 44, 7617–7666 
Vol. 45, 7667–7893 

Plaintiff’s Motion to Reopen Evidence (filed 01/30/2019) Vol. 46, 7894–7908 
Exhibits to Plaintiff’s Motion to Reopen Evidence  

Exhibit Document Description  

1 Declaration of Gabrielle A. Hamm, Esq. in 
Support of Plaintiff’s Motion to Reopen 

Vol. 46, 7909–7913 

1-A September 21, 2017 Declaration of Salvatore 
Morabito 

Vol. 46, 7914–7916 

1-B Defendants’ Proposed Findings of Fact, 
Conclusions of Law, and Judgment (Nov. 26, 
2018) 

Vol. 46, 7917–7957 

1-C Judgment on the First and Second Causes of 
Action; Case No. 15-05019-GWZ (Bankr. D. 
Nev.), ECF No. 123 (April 30, 2018) 

Vol. 46, 7958–7962 
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LOCATION 

Exhibits to Plaintiff’s Motion to Reopen Evidence 
(cont.) 

 

1-D Amended Findings of Fact and Conclusions of 
Law in Support of Judgment Regarding Plaintiffs’ 
First and Second Causes of Action; Case No. 15-
05019-GWZ (Bankr. D. Nev.), ECF No. 126 
(April 30, 2018) 

Vol. 46, 7963–7994 

1-E Motion to Compel Compliance with the 
Subpoena to Robison Sharp Sullivan Brust; Case 
No. 15-05019-GWZ (Bankr. D. Nev.), ECF No. 
191 (Sept. 10, 2018) 

Vol. 46, 7995–8035 

1-F Order Granting Motion to Compel Compliance 
with the Subpoena to Robison Sharp Sullivan 
Brust; Case No. 15-05019-GWZ (Bankr. D. 
Nev.), ECF No. 229 (Jan. 3, 2019) 

Vol. 46, 8036–8039 

1-G Response of Robison, Sharp, Sullivan & Brust[] 
To Subpoena (including RSSB_000001 – 
RSSB_000031) (Jan. 18, 2019) 

Vol. 46, 8040–8067 

1-H Excerpts of Deposition Transcript of Sam 
Morabito as PMK of Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc. 
(Oct. 1, 2015) 

Vol. 46, 8068–8076 

Errata to: Plaintiff’s Motion to Reopen Evidence (filed 
01/30/2019) 

Vol. 47, 8077–8080 

Exhibit to Errata to: Plaintiff’s Motion to Reopen 
Evidence 

 

Exhibit Document Description  

1 Plaintiff’s Motion to Reopen Evidence  
 

Vol. 47, 8081–8096 
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LOCATION 

Ex Parte Motion for Order Shortening Time on Plaintiff’s 
Motion to Reopen Evidence and for Expedited Hearing 
(filed 01/31/2019) 

Vol. 47, 8097–8102 

Order Shortening Time on Plaintiff’s Motion to Reopen 
Evidence and for Expedited Hearing (filed 02/04/2019) 

Vol. 47, 8103–8105 

Supplement to Plaintiff’s Motion to Reopen Evidence (filed 
02/04/2019) 

Vol. 47, 8106–8110 

Exhibits to Supplement to Plaintiff’s Motion to Reopen 
Evidence 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Supplemental Declaration of Gabrielle A. Hamm, 

Esq. in Support of Plaintiff’s Motion to Reopen 
Evidence (filed 02/04/2019) 

Vol. 47, 8111–8113 

1-I Declaration of Frank C. Gilmore in Support of 
Robison, Sharp Sullivan & Brust’s Opposition to 
Motion for Order Holding Robison in Contempt; 
Case No. 15-05019-GWZ (Bankr. D. Nev.), ECF 
No. 259 (Jan. 30, 2019) 

Vol. 47, 8114–8128 

Defendants’ Response to Motion to Reopen Evidence 
(02/06/2019) 

Vol. 47, 8129–8135 

Plaintiff’s Reply to Defendants’ Response to Motion to 
Reopen Evidence (filed 02/07/2019) 

Vol. 47, 8136–8143 

Minutes of February 7, 2019 hearing on Motion to Reopen 
Evidence (filed 02/28/2019) 

Vol. 47, 8144 

Rough Draft Transcript of February 8, 2019 hearing on 
Motion to Reopen Evidence  

Vol. 47, 8145–8158 
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LOCATION 

[Plaintiff’s Proposed] Findings of Fact, Conclusions of 
Law, and Judgment (filed 03/06/2019) 

Vol. 47, 8159–8224 

[Defendants’ Proposed Amended] Findings of Fact, 
Conclusions of Law, and Judgment (filed 03/08/2019) 

Vol. 47, 8225–8268 

Minutes of February 26, 2019 hearing on Motion to 
Continue ongoing Non-Jury Trial (Telephonic) (filed 
03/11/2019) 

Vol. 47, 8269 

Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law, and Judgment (filed 
03/29/2019) 

Vol. 48, 8270–8333 

Notice of Entry of Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law, 
and Judgment (filed 03/29/2019) 

Vol. 48, 8334–8340 

Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements (filed 
04/11/2019) 

Vol. 48, 8341–8347 

Exhibit to Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements  
Exhibit Document Description  

1 Ledger of Costs Vol. 48, 8348–8370 

Application for Attorneys’ Fees and Costs Pursuant to 
NRCP 68 (filed 04/12/2019) 

Vol. 48, 8371–8384 

Exhibits to Application for Attorneys’ Fees and Costs 
Pursuant to NRCP 68 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Declaration of Teresa M. Pilatowicz In Support of 

Plaintiff’s Application for Attorney’s Fees and 
Costs Pursuant to NRCP 68 (filed 04/12/2019) 

Vol. 48, 8385–8390 

2 Plaintiff’s Offer of Judgment to Defendants 
(dated 05/31/2016) 

Vol. 48, 8391–8397 
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LOCATION 

3 Defendant’s Rejection of Offer of Judgment by 
Plaintiff (dated 06/15/2016) 

Vol. 48, 8398–8399 

4 Log of time entries from June 1, 2016 to March 
28, 2019 

Vol. 48, 8400–8456 

5 Plaintiff’s Memorandum of Costs and 
Disbursements (filed 04/11/2019)  

Vol. 48, 8457–8487 

Motion to Retax Costs (filed 04/15/2019) Vol. 49, 8488–8495 

Plaintiff’s Opposition to Motion to Retax Costs (filed 
04/17/2019) 

Vol. 49, 8496–8507 

Exhibits to Plaintiff’s Opposition to Motion to Retax 
Costs 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Declaration of Teresa M. Pilatowicz In Support of 

Opposition to Motion to Retax Costs (filed 
04/17/2019) 

Vol. 49, 8508–8510 

2 Summary of Photocopy Charges  Vol. 49, 8511–8523 
3 James L. McGovern Curriculum Vitae Vol. 49, 8524–8530 
4 McGovern & Greene LLP Invoices Vol. 49, 8531–8552 
5 Buss-Shelger Associates Invoices  Vol. 49, 8553–8555 

Reply in Support of Motion to Retax Costs (filed 
04/22/2019) 

Vol. 49, 8556–8562 

Opposition to Application for Attorneys’ Fees and Costs 
Pursuant to NRCP 68 (filed 04/25/2019) 

Vol. 49, 8563–8578 

Exhibit to Opposition to Application for Attorneys’ Fees 
and Costs Pursuant to NRCP 68 
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LOCATION 

Exhibit Document Description  
 

1 Plaintiff’s Bill Dispute Ledger Vol. 49, 8579–8637 

Defendants, Salvatore Morabito, Snowshoe Petroleum, 
Inc., and Superpumper, Inc.’s Motion for New Trial and/or 
to Alter or Amend Judgment Pursuant to NRCP 52, 59, and 
60 (filed 04/25/2019) 

Vol. 49, 8638–8657 

Defendant, Edward Bayuk’s Motion for New Trial and/or 
to Alter or Amend Judgment Pursuant to NRCP 52, 59, and 
60 (filed 04/26/2019) 

Vol. 50, 8658–8676 

Exhibits to Edward Bayuk’s Motion for New Trial 
and/or to Alter or Amend Judgment Pursuant to NRCP 
52, 59, and 60 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 February 27, 2019 email with attachments Vol. 50, 8677–8768 
2 Declaration of Frank C. Gilmore in Support of 

Edward Bayuk’s Motion for New Trial (filed 
04/26/2019) 

Vol. 50, 8769–8771 

3 February 27, 2019 email from Marcy Trabert Vol. 50, 8772–8775 
4 February 27, 2019 email from Frank Gilmore to 

eturner@Gtg.legal RE: Friday Trial  
Vol. 50, 8776–8777 

Plaintiff’s Reply in Support of Application of Attorneys’ 
Fees and Costs Pursuant to NRCP 68 (filed 04/30/2019)  

Vol. 50, 8778–8790 

Exhibit to Plaintiff’s Reply in Support of Application of 
Attorneys’ Fees and Costs Pursuant to NRCP 68 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Case No. BK-13-51237-GWZ, ECF Nos. 280, 

282, and 321 
Vol. 50, 8791–8835 

mailto:eturner@Gtg.legal
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LOCATION 

Plaintiff’s Opposition to Defendants’ Motions for New 
Trial and/or to Alter or Amend Judgment (filed 05/07/2019) 

Vol. 51, 8836–8858 

Defendants, Salvatore Morabito, Snowshoe Petroleum, 
Inc., and Superpumper, Inc.’s Reply in Support of Motion 
for New Trial and/or to Alter or Amend Judgment Pursuant 
to NRCP 52, 59, and 60 (filed 05/14/2019) 

Vol. 51, 8859–8864 

Declaration of Edward Bayuk Claiming Exemption from 
Execution (filed 06/28/2019)  

Vol. 51, 8865–8870 

Exhibits to Declaration of Edward Bayuk Claiming 
Exemption from Execution 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Copy of June 22, 2019 Notice of Execution and 

two Write of Executions  
Vol. 51, 8871–8896 

2 Declaration of James Arthur Gibbons Regarding 
his Attestation, Witness and Certification on 
November 12, 2005 of the Spendthrift Trust 
Amendment to the Edward William Bayuk Living 
Trust (dated 06/25/2019) 

Vol. 51, 8897–8942 

Notice of Claim of Exemption from Execution (filed 
06/28/2019) 

Vol. 51, 8943–8949 

Edward Bayuk’s Declaration of Salvatore Morabito 
Claiming Exemption from Execution (filed 07/02/2019) 

Vol. 51, 8950–8954 

Exhibits to Declaration of Salvatore Morabito Claiming 
Exemption from Execution 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Las Vegas June 22, 2019 letter Vol. 51, 8955–8956 
2 Writs of execution and the notice of execution  Vol. 51, 8957–8970 
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LOCATION 

Minutes of June 24, 2019 telephonic hearing on Decision on 
Submitted Motions (filed 07/02/2019) 

Vol. 51, 8971–8972 

Salvatore Morabito’s Notice of Claim of Exemption from 
Execution (filed 07/02/2019) 

Vol. 51, 8973–8976 

Edward Bayuk’s Third Party Claim to Property Levied 
Upon NRS 31.070 (filed 07/03/2019) 

Vol. 51, 8977–8982 

Order Granting Plaintiff’s Application for an Award of 
Attorneys’ Fees and Costs Pursuant to NRCP 68 (filed 
07/10/2019) 

Vol. 51, 8983–8985 

Order Granting in part and Denying in part Motion to Retax 
Costs (filed 07/10/2019) 

Vol. 51, 8986–8988 

Plaintiff’s Objection to (1) Claim of Exemption from 
Execution and (2) Third Party Claim to Property Levied 
Upon, and Request for Hearing Pursuant to NRS 21.112 and 
31.070(5) (filed 07/11/2019) 

Vol. 52, 8989–9003 

Exhibits to Plaintiff’s Objection to (1) Claim of 
Exemption from Execution and (2) Third Party Claim 
to Property Levied Upon, and Request for Hearing 
Pursuant to NRS 21.112 and 31.070(5) 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Declaration of Gabrielle A. Hamm, Esq. Vol. 52, 9004–9007 

2 11/30/2011 Tolling Agreement – Edward Bayuk Vol. 52, 9008–9023 
3 11/30/2011 Tolling Agreement – Edward William 

Bayuk Living Trust 
Vol. 52, 9024–9035 

4 Excerpts of 9/28/2015 Deposition of Edward 
Bayuk 

Vol. 52, 9036–9041 
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LOCATION 

Exhibits to Plaintiff’s Objection (cont.)  

5 Edward Bayuk, as Trustee of the Edward William 
Bayuk Living Trust’s Responses to Plaintiff’s 
First Set of Requests for Production, served 
9/24/2015 

Vol. 52, 9042–9051 

6 8/26/2009 Grant Deed (Los Olivos) Vol. 52, 9052–9056 

7 8/17/2018 Grant Deed (El Camino) Vol. 52, 9057–9062 

8 Trial Ex. 4 (Confession of Judgment) Vol. 52, 9063–9088 

9 Trial Ex. 45 (Purchase and Sale Agreement, dated 
9/28/2010) 

Vol. 52, 9089–9097 

10 Trial Ex. 46 (First Amendment to Purchase and 
Sale Agreement, dated 9/29/2010) 

Vol. 52, 9098–9100 

11 Trial Ex. 51 (Los Olivos Grant Deed recorded 
10/8/2010) 

Vol. 52, 9101–9103 

12 Trial Ex. 52 (El Camino Grant Deed recorded 
10/8/2010) 

Vol. 52, 9104–9106 

13 Trial Ex. 61 (Membership Interest Transfer 
Agreement, dated 10/1/2010) 

Vol. 52, 9107–9114 

14 Trial Ex. 62 ($1,617,050.00 Promissory Note) Vol. 52, 9115–9118 

15 Trial Ex. 65 (Mary Fleming Grant Deed recorded 
11/4/2010) 

Vol. 52, 9119–9121 

Notice of Entry of Order Denying Defendants’ Motions for 
New Trial and/or to Alter or Amend Judgment (filed 
07/16/2019) 

Vol. 52, 9122–9124 
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LOCATION 

Exhibit to Notice of Entry of Order Denying 
Defendants’ Motions for New Trial and/or to Alter or 
Amend Judgment 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Order Denying Defendants’ Motions for New 

Trial and/or to Alter or Amend Judgment (filed 
07/10/2019) 

Vol. 52, 9125–9127 

Notice of Entry of Order Granting Plaintiff’s Application 
for an Award of Attorneys’ Fees and Costs Pursuant to 
NRCP 68 (filed 07/16/2019) 

Vol. 52, 9128–9130 

Exhibit to Notice of Entry of Order Granting Plaintiff’s 
Application for an Award of Attorneys’ Fees and Costs 
Pursuant to NRCP 68 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Order Granting Plaintiff’s Application for an 

Award of Attorneys’ Fees and Costs Pursuant to 
NRCP 68 (filed 07/10/2019) 

Vol. 52, 9131–9134 

Notice of Entry of Order Granting in Part and Denying in 
Part Motion to Retax Costs (filed 07/16/2019) 

Vol. 52, 9135–9137 

Exhibit to Notice of Entry of Order Granting in Part and 
Denying in Part Motion to Retax Costs 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Order Granting in Part and Denying in Part 

Motion to Retax Costs (filed 07/10/2019) 
Vol. 52, 9138–9141 

Plaintiff’s Objection to Notice of Claim of Exemption from 
Execution Filed by Salvatore Morabito and Request for 
Hearing (filed 07/16/2019) 

Vol. 52, 9142–9146 

Reply to Objection to Claim of Exemption and Third Party 
Claim to Property Levied Upon (filed 07/17/2019) 

Vol. 52, 9147–9162 
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LOCATION 

Exhibits to Reply to Objection to Claim of Exemption 
and Third Party Claim to Property Levied Upon 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 March 3, 2011 Deposition Transcript of P. 

Morabito 
Vol. 52, 9163–9174 

2 Mr. Bayuk’s September 23, 2014 responses to 
Plaintiff’s first set of requests for production  

Vol. 52, 9175–9180 

3 September 28, 2015 Deposition Transcript of 
Edward Bayuk 

Vol. 52, 9181–9190 

Reply to Plaintiff’s Objection to Notice of Claim of 
Exemption from Execution (filed 07/18/2019) 

Vol. 52, 9191–9194 

Declaration of Service of Till Tap, Notice of Attachment 
and Levy Upon Property (filed 07/29/2019) 

Vol. 52, 9195 

Notice of Submission of Disputed Order Denying Claim of 
Exemption and Third Party Claim (filed 08/01/2019) 

Vol. 52, 9196–9199 

Exhibits to Notice of Submission of Disputed Order 
Denying Claim of Exemption and Third Party Claim 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Plaintiff’s Proposed Order Denying Claim of 

Exemption and Third-Party Claim 
Vol. 52, 9200–9204 

2 Bayuk and the Bayuk Trust’s proposed Order 
Denying Claim of Exemption and Third-Party 
Claim 

Vol. 52, 9205–9210 

3 July 30, 2019 email evidencing Bayuk, through 
counsel Jeffrey Hartman, Esq., requesting until 
noon on July 31, 2019 to provide comments. 

Vol. 52, 9211–9212 
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LOCATION 

Exhibits to Notice of Submission of Disputed Order 
(cont.) 

 

4 July 31, 2019 email from Teresa M. Pilatowicz, 
Esq. Bayuk failed to provide comments at noon 
on July 31, 2019, instead waiting until 1:43 p.m. 
to send a redline version with proposed changes 
after multiple follow ups from Plaintiff’s counsel 
on July 31, 2019 

Vol. 52, 9213–9219 

5 A true and correct copy of the original Order and 
Bayuk Changes 

Vol. 52, 9220–9224 

6 A true and correct copy of the redline run by 
Plaintiff accurately reflecting Bayuk’s proposed 
changes 

Vol. 52, 9225–9229 

7 Email evidencing that after review of the 
proposed revisions, Plaintiff advised Bayuk, 
through counsel, that Plaintiff agree to certain 
proposed revisions, but the majority of the 
changes were unacceptable as they did not reflect 
the Court’s findings or evidence before the Court. 

Vol. 52, 9230–9236 

Objection to Plaintiff’s Proposed Order Denying Claim of 
Exemption and Third Party Claim (filed 08/01/2019) 

Vol. 53, 9237–9240 

Exhibits to Objection to Plaintiff’s Proposed Order 
Denying Claim of Exemption and Third-Party Claim 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Plaintiff’s Proposed Order Denying Claim of 

Exemption and Third-Party Claim  
Vol. 53, 9241–9245 

2 Defendant’s comments on Findings of Fact Vol. 53, 9246–9247 
3 Defendant’s Proposed Order Denying Claim of 

Exemption and Third-Party Claim 
Vol. 53, 9248–9252 
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LOCATION 

Minutes of July 22, 2019 hearing on Objection to Claim for 
Exemption (filed 08/02/2019) 

Vol. 53, 9253 

Order Denying Claim of Exemption (filed 08/02/2019) Vol. 53, 9254–9255 

Bayuk’s Case Appeal Statement (filed 08/05/2019) Vol. 53, 9256–9260 

Bayuk’s Notice of Appeal (filed 08/05/2019) Vol. 53, 9261–9263 

Defendants, Superpumper, Inc., Edward Bayuk, Salvatore 
Morabito; and Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc.’s, Case Appeal 
Statement (filed 08/05/2019) 

Vol. 53, 9264–9269 

Defendants, Superpumper, Inc., Edward Bayuk, Salvatore 
Morabito; and Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc.’s, Notice of 
Appeal (filed 08/05/2019) 

Vol. 53, 9270–9273 

Exhibits to Defendants, Superpumper, Inc., Edward 
Bayuk, Salvatore Morabito; and Snowshoe Petroleum, 
Inc.’s, Notice of Appeal 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law, and 

Judgment (filed 03/29/2019) 
Vol. 53, 9274–9338 

2 Order Denying Defendants’ Motions for New 
Trial and/or to Alter or Amend Judgment (filed 
07/10/2019) 

Vol. 53, 9339–9341 

3 Order Granting in Part and Denying in Part 
Motion to Retax Costs (filed 07/10/2019) 

Vol. 53, 9342–9345 

4 Order Granting Plaintiff’s Application for an 
Award of Attorneys’ Fees and Costs Pursuant to 
NRCP 68 (filed 07/10/2019) 

Vol. 53, 9346–9349 
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LOCATION 

Plaintiff’s Reply to Defendants’ Objection to Plaintiff’s 
Proposed Order Denying Claim of Exemption and Third-
Party Claim 

Vol. 53, 9350–9356 

Order Denying Claim of Exemption and Third-Party Claim 
(08/09/2019) 

Vol. 53, 9357–9360 

Notice of Entry of Order Denying Claim of Exemption and 
Third-Party Claim (filed 08/09/2019) 

Vol. 53, 9361–9364 

Exhibit to Notice of Entry of Order Denying Claim of 
Exemption and Third-Party Claim  

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Order Denying Claim of Exemption and Third-

Party Claim (08/09/2019) 
Vol. 53, 9365–9369 

Notice of Entry of Order Denying Claim of Exemption 
(filed 08/12/2019) 

Vol. 53, 9370–9373 

Exhibit to Notice of Entry of Order Denying Claim of 
Exemption 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Order Denying Claim of Exemption (08/02/2019) Vol. 53, 9374–9376 

Motion to Make Amended or Additional Findings Under 
NRCP 52(b), or, in the Alternative, Motion for 
Reconsideration (filed 08/19/2019) 

Vol. 54, 9377–9401 

Exhibits to Motion to Make Amended or Additional 
Findings Under NRCP 52(b), or, in the Alternative, 
Motion for Reconsideration 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Order Denying Claim of Exemption and Third 

Party Claim (filed 08/09/19) 
Vol. 54, 9402–9406 
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LOCATION 

Exhibits to Motion to Make Amended (cont.)  

2 Spendthrift Trust Amendment to the Edward 
William Bayuk Living Trust (dated 11/12/05) 

Vol. 54, 9407–9447 

3 Spendthrift Trust Agreement for the Arcadia 
Living Trust (dated 10/14/05) 

Vol. 54, 9448–9484 

4 Fifth Amendment and Restatement of the Trust 
Agreement for the Arcadia Living Trust (dated 
09/30/10) 

Vol. 54, 9485–9524 

5 P. Morabito's Supplement to NRCP 16.1 
Disclosures (dated 03/01/11) 

Vol. 54, 9525–9529 

6 Transcript of March 3, 2011 Deposition of P. 
Morabito 

Vol. 55, 9530–9765 

7 Documents Conveying Real Property Vol. 56, 9766–9774 
8 Transcript of July 22, 2019 Hearing Vol. 56, 9775–9835 
9 Tolling Agreement JH and P. Morabito (partially 

executed 11/30/11) 
Vol. 56, 9836–9840 

10 Tolling Agreement JH and Arcadia Living Trust 
(partially executed 11/30/11) 

Vol. 56, 9841–9845 

11 Excerpted Pages 8–9 of Superpumper Judgment 
(filed 03/29/19) 

Vol. 56, 9846–9848 

12 Petitioners' First Set of Interrogatories to Debtor 
(dated 08/13/13) 

Vol. 56, 9849–9853 

13 Tolling Agreement JH and Edward Bayuk 
(partially executed 11/30/11) 

Vol. 56, 9854–9858 

14 Tolling Agreement JH and Bayuk Trust (partially 
executed 11/30/11) 

Vol. 56, 9859–9863 

15 Declaration of Mark E. Lehman, Esq. (dated 
03/21/11) 

Vol. 56, 9864–9867 
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LOCATION 

Exhibits to Motion to Make Amended (cont.)  

16 Excerpted Transcript of October 20, 2015 
Deposition of Dennis C. Vacco 

Vol. 56, 9868–9871 

17 Assignment and Assumption Agreement (dated 
07/03/07) 

Vol. 56, 9872–9887 

18 Order Denying Morabito’s Claim of Exemption 
(filed 08/02/19) 

Vol. 56, 9888–9890 

Errata to Motion to Make Amended or Additional Findings 
Under NRCP 52(b), or, in the Alternative, Motion for 
Reconsideration (filed 08/20/2019) 

Vol. 57, 9891–9893 

Plaintiff’s Opposition to Motion to Make Amended or 
Additional Findings Under NRCP 52(b), or, In the 
Alternative, Motion for Reconsideration, and 
Countermotion for Fees and Costs Pursuant to NRS 7.085 
(filed 08/30/2019) 

Vol. 57, 9894–9910 

Errata to Plaintiff’s Opposition to Motion to Make 
Amended or Additional Findings Under NRCP 52(b), or, In 
the Alternative, Motion for Reconsideration, and 
Countermotion for Fees and Costs Pursuant to NRS 7.085 
(filed 08/30/2019) 

Vol. 57, 9911–9914 

Exhibits to Errata to Plaintiff’s Opposition to Motion to 
Make Amended or Additional Findings Under NRCP 
52(b), or, In the Alternative, Motion for 
Reconsideration, and Countermotion for Fees and Costs 
Pursuant to NRS 7.085 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Declaration of Gabrielle A. Hamm, Esq. Vol. 57, 9915–9918 
2 Plaintiff’s Amended NRCP 16.1 Disclosures 

(February 19, 2016) 
Vol. 57, 9919–9926 



Page 65 of 67 

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION 

 

LOCATION 

Exhibits to Errata (cont.)  

3 Plaintiff’s Fourth Supplemental NRCP 16.1 
Disclosures (November 15, 2016) 

Vol. 57, 9927–9930 

4 Plaintiff’s Fifth Supplemental NRCP 16.1 
Disclosures (December 21, 2016) 

Vol. 57, 9931–9934 

5 Plaintiff’s Sixth Supplemental NRCP 16.1 
Disclosures (March 20, 2017) 

Vol. 57, 9935–9938 

Reply in Support of Motion to Make Amended or 
Additional Findings Under NRCP 52(b), or, In the 
Alternative, Motion for Reconsideration, and 
Countermotion for Fees and Costs (filed 09/04/2019) 

Vol. 57, 9939–9951 

Exhibits to Reply in Support of Motion to Make 
Amended or Additional Findings Under NRCP 52(b), 
or, In the Alternative, Motion for Reconsideration, and 
Countermotion for Fees and Costs 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
19 Notice of Submission of Disputed Order Denying 

Claim of Exemption and Third Party Claim (filed 
08/01/19) 

Vol. 57, 9952–9993 

20 Notice of Submission of Disputed Order Denying 
Claim of Exemption and Third Party Claim (filed 
08/01/19) 

Vol. 57,  
9994–10010 

Order Denying Defendants’ Motion to Make Amended or 
Additional Findings Under NRCP 52(b), or, in the 
Alternative, Motion for Reconsideration and Denying 
Plaintiff's Countermotion for Fees and Costs Pursuant to 
NRS 7.085 (filed 11/08/2019) 

Vol. 57,  
10011–10019 

Bayuk’s Case Appeal Statement (filed 12/06/2019) Vol. 57,  
10020–10026 
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LOCATION 

Bayuk’s Notice of Appeal (filed 12/06/2019) Vol. 57, 
10027–10030 
 

Exhibits to Bayuk’s Notice of Appeal  
Exhibit Document Description  

1 Order Denying [Morabito’s] Claim of Exemption 
(filed 08/02/19) 

Vol. 57,  
10031–10033 
 

2 Order Denying [Bayuk’s] Claim of Exemption 
and Third Party Claim (filed 08/09/19) 

Vol. 57,  
10034–10038 
 

3 Order Denying Defendants’ Motion to Make 
Amended or Additional Findings Under NRCP 
52(b), or, in the Alternative, Motion for 
Reconsideration and Denying Plaintiff’s 
Countermotion for Fees and Costs Pursuant to 
NRS 7.085 (filed 11/08/19) 

Vol. 57,  
10039–10048 

Notice of Entry of Order Denying Defendants' Motion to 
Make Amended or Additional Findings Under NRCP 52(b), 
or, in the Alternative, Motion for Reconsideration and 
Denying Plaintiff's Countermotion for Fees and Costs 
Pursuant to NRS 7.085 (filed 12/23/2019) 

Vol. 57, 
10049–10052 

Exhibit to Notice of Entry of Order  
Exhibit Document Description  

A Order Denying Defendants’ Motion to Make 
Amended or Additional Findings Under NRCP 
52(b), or, in the Alternative, Motion for 
Reconsideration and Denying Plaintiff’s 
Countermotion for Fees and Costs Pursuant to 
NRS 7.085 (filed 11/08/19) 

Vol. 57, 
10053–10062 
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District Court Docket Case No. CV13-02663 Vol. 57,  
10063–10111 

Notice of Claim of Exemption and Third-Party Claim to 
Property Levied Upon, Case No. CV13-02663 (filed 
08/25/2020) 

Vol. 58,  
10112–10121  

Exhibits to Notice of Claim of Exemption and Third-
Party Claim to Property Levied Upon 

 

Exhibit Document Description  
1 Writ of Execution, Case No. CV13-02663 (filed 

07/21/2020) 
Vol. 58,  
10123–10130  

2 Superior Court of California, Orange County 
Docket, Case No. 30-2019-01068591-CU-EN-
CJC 

Vol. 58,  
10131–10139  

3 Spendthrift Trust Amendment to the Edward 
William Bayuk Living Trust (dated 11/12/2005) 

Vol. 58, 
10140–10190  
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GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP 
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ. 
Nevada Bar No. 6454 
E-mail:  eturner@gtg.legal
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ.  
Nevada Bar No. 9605 
E-mail:  tpilatowicz@gtg.legal
GABRIELLE A. HAMM 
Nevada Bar No. 11588 
E-mail:  ghamm@gtg.legal
650 White Drive, Ste. 100 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119 
Telephone 725-777-3000 
Special Counsel to Plaintiff,  
William A. Leonard, Trustee 

IN THE SECOND JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT OF 

THE STATE OF NEVADA, IN AND FOR THE COUNTY OF WASHOE 

WILLIAM A. LEONARD, Trustee for the 
Bankruptcy Estate of Paul Anthony 
Morabito, 

Plaintiff, 

vs. 

SUPERPUMPER, INC., an Arizona 
corporation; EDWARD BAYUK, 
individually and as Trustee of the EDWARD 
WILLIAM BAYUK LIVING TRUST; 
SALVATORE MORABITO, and individual; 
and SNOWSHOE PETROLEUM, INC., a 
New York corporation, 

Defendants. 

CASE NO.:  CV13-02663 

DEPT. NO.:  4 

NOTICE OF ENTRY OF 
FINDINGS OF FACT, CONCLUSIONS OF 
LAW, AND JUDGMENT 

/// 

/// 

/// 

/// 
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NOTICE OF ENTRY OF 
FINDINGS OF FACT, CONCLUSIONS OF LAW, AND JUDGMENT 

Notice is hereby given that on March 29, 2019, this Honorable Court entered its Findings 

of Fact, Conclusions of Law, and Judgment, a copy of which is attached hereto as Exhibit 1. 

Dated this 29th day of March, 2019. 

GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP 

_/s/ Teresa M. Pilatowicz, Esq.___________  
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ. 
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ. 
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ. 
650 White Drive, Ste. 100 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119 
Telephone 725-777-3000 
Special Counsel to Plaintiff,  
William A. Leonard, Trustee 

AFFIRMATION
Pursuant to NRS 239B.030 

The undersigned does hereby affirm that the preceding document does not contain the  

social security number of any person. 

Dated this 29th day of March, 2019. 

GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP 

_/s/ Teresa M. Pilatowicz, Esq.___________  
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ. 
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ. 
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ. 
650 White Drive, Ste. 100 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119 
Telephone 725-777-3000 
Special Counsel to Plaintiff,  
William A. Leonard, Trustee 
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE 

I certify that I am an employee of GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP, and that on this 

date, pursuant to NRCP 5(b), I am serving a true and correct copy of the attached NOTICE OF 

ENTRY OF FINDINGS OF FACT, CONCLUSIONS OF LAW, AND JUDGMENT on the 

parties as set forth below: 

 a. Placing an original or true copy thereof in a sealed envelope placed 

for collection and mailing in the United States Mail, postage prepaid, following ordinary 

business practices:   

Paul Morabito 
668 North Coast Hwy., Suite 1253 
Laguna Beach, CA 92651-1513 

Paul Morabito 
370 Los Olivos 
Laguna Beach, CA 92651 

Edward Bayuk 
668 North Coast Hwy. #517 
Laguna Beach, CA 92651

Edward Bayuk 
371 El Camino Del Mar 
Laguna Beach, CA 92651

David B. Shemano, Esq. 
Shemano Law 
1801 Century Park East, Suite 1600 
Los Angeles, CA 90067 

Frank Gilmore, Esq. 
Lindsay L. Liddell, Esq. 
ROBISON, SHARP, SULLIVAN & BRUST 
71 Washington Street 
Reno, NV 89503 

Michael Lehners, Esq. 
429 Marsh Avenue 
Reno, NV 89509 
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John Murtha, Esq. 
Woodburn & Wedge  
6100 Neil Road, Suite 500 
Reno, NV 89511 

Jeffrey L. Hartman, Esq. 
HARTMAN & HARTMAN 
510 West Plumb Lane, Suite B 
Reno, NV 89509 

Trey A. Monsour, Esq. 
Polsinelli, PC 
1000 Louisiana St., Suite 6400 
Houston, TX 77002 

US HF Cellular Communications LLC 
c/o Timothy A. Lukas, Esq. 
HOLLAND & HART, LLP 
5441 Kietzke Lane, 2nd Floor 
Reno, NV 89511 

VIRSENET LLC 
c/o Registered Agent: A Registered Agent, Inc. 
8 The Green, Suite A 
Dover, DE 19901 

Global HF Net, LLC 
c/o Registered Agent: Corporation Service Company 
251 Little Falls Drive 
Wilmington, DQ 19808 

Terlingua, LLC 
c/o Registered Agent: A Registered Agent, Inc. 
8 The Green, Suite A 
Dover, DE 19901 

Lippes Matthias Wexler Friedman, LLP 
Attn: Dennis Vacco 
665 Main Street, Suite 300 
Buffalo, NY 14203 

Ray Whiteman 
3202 Shortridge Lane 
Bowie, MD 20721 
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Joseph Jacobs 
c/o Wexford Capital LP 
411 West Putnam Ave. 
Greenwich, CT 06830 

JJ/CD Capital, LLC 
c/o Wexford Capital LP 
411 West Putnam Ave. 
Greenwich, CT 06830 

Meadow Farms Trust 
c/o Edward Bayuk 
8581 Santa Monica Blvd. #708 
West Hollywood, CA 90069 

Edward William Bayuk Living Trust dated August 13, 2009 
c/o Edward William Bayuk, Trustee 
668 North Coast Highway #517 
Laguna Beach, CA 92651 

Edward William Bayuk Living Trust  
c/o Edward William Bayuk, Trustee 
668 North Coast Highway #517 
Laguna Beach, CA 92651 

Jan Friederich 
9705 Pebble Beach Dr., NE 
Abuquerque, NM 87111 

Andrew Wegner 
c/o Eric J. Schindler, Esq. 
KROESCHE SCHINDLER, LLP 
2603 Main Street, Suite 200 
Irvine, CA 92614 

Bob Burke & Company Ltd. 
c/o Registered Agent: Robert B. Burke 
1100 S. Flower St., Suite 3300 
Los Angeles, CA 90015 

Robert B. Burke, Trustee 
Burke Living Trust 
1140 Alta Loma Road 
West Hollywood, CA 90069 

Jon Richmond 
301 N. Canon Dr. 
Beverly hills, CA 90210 
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Jon Richmond, COO 
US HF Cellular Communications LLC 
c/o Timothy A. Lukas, Esq. 
HOLLAND & HART, LLP 
5441 Kietzke Lane, 2nd Floor 
Reno, NV 89511 

Jackson Hole Trust Company 
185 West Broadway, Suite #101 
Jackson, WY 83001 

Jackson Hole Trust Company 
P.O. Box 1150 
Jackson, WY 83001 

Supermesa Fuel & Merc, LLC 
14631 N. Scottsdale Road 
Scottsdale, AZ 85254 

Supermesa Fuel & Merc, LLC 
8225 Washington Street NE, Suite A 
Albuquerque, NM 87113 

Galpin Motors, Inc. 
Attn: Alan Skobin, Esq. 
15505 Roscoe Blvd. 
North Hills, CA 91343-6503 

Jack Suddarth 
Equity Wave Lending 
2355 Main St., Suite 230 
Irvine, CA 92614 

Famille Holdings, L.P. 
27675 Chapala 
Mission Viejo, CA 92692 

Patrick Harkin 
Camano Group, Inc. 
900 E. Washington St., Suite 100 
Colton, CA 92324 
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I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct. 

DATED this 29th day of March, 2019. 

 /s/ Kelli Wightman  
An Employee of GARMAN TURNER 
GORDON LLP 
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GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP 
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ. 
Nevada Bar No. 6454 
E-mail:  eturner@gtg.legal  
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ. 
Nevada Bar No. 9605 
E-mail:  tpilatowicz@gtg.legal 
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ. 
Nevada Bar No. 11588 
E-mail:  ghamm@gtg.legal  
650 White Drive, Ste. 100 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119 
Telephone 725-777-3000 
Counsel to Plaintiff  

IN THE SECOND JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT OF 

THE STATE OF NEVADA, IN AND FOR THE COUNTY OF WASHOE 

WILLIAM A. LEONARD, Trustee for the 
Bankruptcy Estate of Paul Anthony 
Morabito, 

Plaintiff, 

vs. 

SUPERPUMPER, INC., an Arizona 
corporation; EDWARD BAYUK, 
individually and as Trustee of the EDWARD 
WILLIAM BAYUK LIVING TRUST; 
SALVATORE MORABITO, and individual; 
and SNOWSHOE PETROLEUM, INC., a 
New York corporation, 

Defendants. 

CASE NO.:  CV13-02663 

DEPT. NO.:  4 

MEMORANDUM OF COSTS AND 
DISBURSEMENTS 

NRS 18.005 Description1 Amount
(1) Odyssey E-File & E-Serve. $200.00
(2) Reporters’ fees for depositions, including a reporter’s fee for one copy of 

each deposition.
$18,200.50

(3) Jurors’ fees and expenses, together with reasonable compensation of an 
officer appointed to act in accordance with NRS 16.120.

$0.00

(4) Fees for witnesses at trial, pretrial hearings and deposing witnesses, 
unless the court finds that the witness was called at the instance of the 
prevailing party without reason or necessity.

$515.00

1 All costs are identified in the attached invoice of costs. 

F I L E D
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CV13-02663
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Jacqueline Bryant
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Transaction # 7215253 : csulezic
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NRS 18.005 Description1 Amount
(5) Reasonable fees of not more than five expert witnesses in an amount of 

not more than $1,500 for each witness unless the court allows a larger fee 
after determining that the circumstances surrounding the expert’s 
testimony were of such necessity as to require the larger fee.

$77,201.80

(6) Reasonable fees of necessary interpreters. $
(7) The fee of any sheriff or licensed process server for the delivery or service 

of any summons or subpoena used in the action, unless the court 
determines that the service was not necessary.

$1,552.95

(8) Compensation for the official reporter or reporter pro tempore. $6,071.25
(9) Reasonable costs for any bond or undertaking required as part of the 

action.
$

(10) Fees of a court bailiff or deputy marshal who was required to work 
overtime.

$

(11) Reasonable costs for telecopies. $
(12) Reasonable costs for photocopies. (.25 per page) $17,961.67
(13) Reasonable costs for long distance telephone calls. $
(14) Reasonable costs for postage. $5,184.05
(15) Reasonable costs for travel and lodging incurred taking depositions and 

conducting discovery.
$10,167.61

(16) Fees charged pursuant to NRS 19.0335. $
(17) Reasonable and necessary expense incurred in connection with the 

action
$1,795.46

Travel for Hearings and Trial $15,059.78
Messenger Service $1,032.16

TOTAL $154,942.24

Dated this 11th day of April, 2019. 

GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP 

/s/ Teresa M. Pilatowicz 
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ. 
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ. 
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ. 
650 White Drive, Ste. 100 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119 
Telephone 725-777-3000 
Counsel for Plaintiff 
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DECLARATION OF TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ. IN SUPPORT OF 
MEMORANDUM OF COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS 

1. I am an attorney with the law firm of Garman Turner Gordon, LLP, counsel for 

Plaintiff, William Leonard (“Plaintiff”), in the above-captioned matter. I am duly licensed to 

practice law in the State of Nevada. 

2. I make this declaration in support of Plaintiff’s Memorandum of Costs and 

Disbursements. I am over the age of eighteen and am competent to testify to the matters and facts 

set forth herein.  I state the following matters and facts upon my own personal knowledge, except 

where stated upon information and belief, and as to those statements made upon information and 

belief, I believe them to be true. 

3. The items contained in the above memorandum are true and correct to the best of 

my knowledge and belief; and the said disbursements have been necessarily incurred and paid in 

this action. 

4. The fees for the experts identified in Section (4), and specifically for James 

McGovern (valuation expert), William Kimmel (appraiser), and Ronald Buss (appraiser), are 

typical and commensurate of the fees charged by experts of similar experience and expertise, 

which experts could not be retained for less than the $1,500 limit.  Mr. McGovern, and associates 

working at McGovern and Greene LLP, bill at an hourly rate of between $350 and $400 for 

partners (Mr. McGovern at $400.00), between $200-$250 for managers, between $150 and $175 

for senior consultants,  $125 for consultants, and between $60 and $75 for paraprofessionals.  

McGovern & Greene billed a total of $64,076.80, which included travel associated with trial 

testimony.   Mr. Kimmel billed $2,000 for appraisals of two Nevada properties and completed and 

billed additional work and trial testimony at an hourly rate of $300.00, for a total billed of $3,200.  

Mr. Buss billed $9,000 for the appraisals of four California properties and  completed  additional 

work at an hourly rate of $350 for additional work, for a total billed of $9,925.00.  The rates 

charged are prevailing market rates and are the actual costs billed without mark up. 

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit 1 is a true and correct copy of a ledger of costs from the 

law firm of Garman Turner Gordon, LLP.   
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I declare under penalty of perjury under the law of the State of Nevada (NRS 53.045), that 

the foregoing is true and correct. 

Dated this 11 day of April, 2019.  

/s/ Teresa Pilatowicz  
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ
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AFFIRMATION

Pursuant to NRS 239B.030 

The undersigned does hereby affirm that the preceding document does not contain the  

social security number of any person. 

Dated this 11th day of April, 2019. 

GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP 

/s/   Teresa Pilatowicz            
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ. 
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ. 
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ. 
650 White Drive, Ste. 100 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119 
Telephone 725-777-3000 
Counsel for Plaintiff 
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INDEX OF EXHIBITS 

Exhibit Description Pages2

1 Ledger of Costs 23 

2 Exhibit pagination excludes exhibit slip sheets.  
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE  

I certify that I am an employee of GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP, and that on this 

date, pursuant to NRCP 5(b), I am serving a true and correct copy of the foregoing PLAINTIFF’S 

MEMORANDUM OF COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS  on the parties as set forth below: 

XXX  Placing an original or true copy thereof in a sealed envelope placed for collection 
and mailing in the United States Mail, Reno, Nevada, postage prepaid, following 
ordinary business practices addressed as follows: 

Edward Bayuk 
668 N. Pacific Coast Highway, #517 
Laguna Beach, CA 92651

Salvatore R. Morabito 
10645 N. Tatum Blvd. #200-626 
Phoenix, AZ 95028

Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc. 
10645 N. Tatum Blvd. #200-626 
Phoenix, AZ 95028

Superpumper, Inc. 
14631 N. Scottsdale Road, #125 
Scottsdale, AZ 85254-2711

   Certified Mail, Return Receipt Requested 

   Via Facsimile (Fax) 

    Via E-Mail 

   Placing an original or true copy thereof in a sealed envelope and causing the same 
to be personally Hand Delivered 

   Federal Express (or other overnight delivery) 

   X   By using the Court’s CM/ECF Electronic Notification System addressed to: 

Frank C. Gilmore, Esq. 
E-mail: fgilmore@rssblaw.com

Lindsay L. Liddell, Esq. 
E-mail: lliddell@rssblaw.com

Dated this 11th day of April, 2019. 

 /s/ Kelli Wightman  
An Employee of GARMAN TURNER  
GORDON LLP 
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(1) Date Description Amount
Odyssey E-File & E-
Serve

8/18/2017
Second Judicial District Court - Washoe 
County - E-Filing 200.00$                   
TOTAL 200.00$                  
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(2) Date Description Amount
Reporters’ fees for depositions, 
including a reporter’s fee for one 
copy of each deposition.

7/13/2015

Deposition transcript of Spencer 
Cavalier (Deposition in Baltimore on 
6/19/15) 326.40$                               

10/8/2015

Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1026046 - Original and Certified 
Copy of Transcript of Edward 
William Bayuk 1,579.00$                            

10/21/2015

Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1032617 - Original and certified 
copy of transcript of Salvatore R. 
Morabito and Christian Mark 
Lovelace 2,072.40$                            

10/30/2015

Litigation Services - Invoice 1031990 
- Original and certified copy of 
transcript of Dennis C. Vacco & 
Dennis C. Vacco, PMK of Snowshoe 
Petroleum, Inc. 245.00$                               

2/16/2016

Atkinson-Baker, Inc. - Invoice 
AA0075B AB - Video Conference 
room fee and electronic transcript of 
deposition of Mark S. Justmann, 
taken 01/27/2016 (7) 1,411.55$                            

3/31/2016

Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1059506 - Original and certified 
copy of Transcript of Paul Morabito 2,355.85$                            

4/5/2016

Litigation Services - Invoice 1060434 
- Videography Service of Paul 
Morabito 1,485.00$                            

4/6/2016

Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1056846 - Original and certified 
copy of transcript of Gary L. Krausz, 
C.P.A. 1,262.95$                            

4/6/2016

Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1059928 - Certified copy of William 
A. Leonard Transcript 403.40$                               

4/7/2016

Atkinson-Baker, Inc. - Invoice No. 
AA028A0 AB - Electronic transcript 
of Michael Sewitz deposition 159.70$                               

4/14/2016

Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1060728 - Certified copy of James 
L. McGovern, CPA/CFF, CVA 
transcript 731.55$                               

4/14/2016

Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1058104 - Certified copy of Ronald 
L. Buss Transcript 609.35$                               

8350



4/15/2016

Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1060235 - Original and certified 
copy of Dennis Banks transcript 349.00$                               

4/26/2016

Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1062924 - Original and certified 
copy of Jan Friederich transcript 788.00$                               

1/26/2017

Sunshine Litigation Services - 
Invoice #1126321 - Original and 
Certified Copy of Edward Bayuk 
Transcript 295.00$                               

6/6/2017

Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1153416 - Original and Certified 
Copy of Stanton R. Bernstein, CPA 
Transcript (7) 1,423.75$                            

7/20/2017

Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1164431 - Original and Certified 
Copy of Garry M. Graber Transcript 447.75$                               

8/9/2017

Jack W Hunt & Associates, Inc. - 
Invoice #291295 - ck #3481 - 
Original and Copy of Dennis C. 
Vacco Transcript 553.33$                               

8/17/2017

Jack W. Hunt & Associates, Inc. - 
Invoice #291564 - Transcript of 
Dennis C. Vacco 95.72$                                 

5/29/2018

Oasis Reporting Services - Invoice 
#33913 - Original and Certified Copy 
of Transcript and Index of Sujata 
Yalamanchili, Esq. 806.00$                               

5/29/2018

Oasis Reporting Services - Invoice 
#33912 - Original and Certified Copy 
of Transcript and Index of Garry 
Graber, Esq. 799.80$                               

TOTAL 18,200.50$                         
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(4) Date Description Amount

Fees for witnesses at trial, 
pretrial hearings and deposing 
witnesses, unless the court 
finds that the witness was 
called at the instance of the 
prevailing party without reason 
or necessity

8/4/2015

J & L Legal Service Inc. - Invoice 
2015344 - Service - Commission to take 
deposition - Witness Fee 65.00$                       

8/27/2015

J&L Legal Service Inc. - Invoice 
#2015344 - Service on William Leonard 
- Witness Fee 65.00$                       

3/7/2016
J&L Process Service - Invoice 2016009 - 
Issue 2 Commissions - Witness Fee 65.00$                       

8/4/2015

J & L Legal Service Inc. - Invoice 
2015344 - Service - Commission to take 
deposition (7) 65.00$                       

3/7/2016

J&L Process Service - Invoice 2016025 - 
File/issue commission to take deposition 
(Morabito) - Witness Fee 65.00$                       

1/25/2017
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1126260 - Civil Appearance Fee 60.00$                       

2/3/2017

J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-2086 
- Service on Washoe County Dist. Co. - 
Witness Fee 65.00$                       

2/10/2017

J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-2091 
- Service on AIG Property Casualty - 
Witness Fee 65.00$                       

TOTAL 515.00$                    
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(5) Date Description Amount

Reasonable fees of not more than five expert 
witnesses in an amount of not more than 
$1,500 for each witness unless the court 
allows a larger fee after determining that the 
circumstances surrounding the expert’s 
testimony were of such necessity as to require 
the larger fee.

11/1/2015

Advance Payment for McGovern & 
Green LLP fees and expenses of 
James McGovern, the Trustee’s 
valuation expert 10,000.00$             

11/1/2015 Kimmel Payment for Appraisals 2,000.00$               

1/6/2016
Buss-Shelger Associates - Invoice 
7405 - Appraisal Services 4,500.00$               

7/22/2016

McGovern & Green LLP fees and 
expenses of James McGovern, the 
Trustee’s valuation expert in the 
Superpumper Action with respect 
to the value of Superpumper 41,000.00$          

7/22/2016

Buss-Shelger Associates fees and 
expenses of Ronald Buss, the 
Trustee’s valuation expert in the 
Superpumper Action with respect 
to the value of the California real 
properties. 5,425.00$            

10/8/2018
McGovern & Greene LLP - Invoice 
#02-18-0206 1,160.00$               

11/5/2018
McGovern & Greene LLP - Invoice 
#02-18-0216 11,796.80$             

11/8/2018
William G. Kimmel - Invoice #15-064 
- Pre-Trial and Trial work 1,200.00$               

12/4/2018
McGovern & Greene LLP - Invoice 
#02-18-0242 120.00$                  

TOTAL 77,201.80$            
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(7) Date Description Amount
The fee of any sheriff or 
licensed process server for the 
delivery or service of any 
summons or subpoena used in 
the action, unless the court 
determines that the service was 
not necessary

2/9/2016

Nationwide Legal Nevada, LLC - 
Invoice 219092 - Service on Compass 
Bank in Phoenix, AZ 200.00$                     

2/10/2016

SoCal Subpoena Services LLC - Service 
on Gursey Schneider LLP, Hancock 
Insurance Services 225.33$                     

2/17/2016

SoCal Subpoena - Invoice 15122 - 
Service on PMK for Gursey Schneider 
LLP 7.00$                         

3/7/2016
J&L Process Service - Invoice 2016020 - 
Service on Dennis Banks 115.00$                     

3/7/2016
J&L Process Service - Invoice 2016022 - 
Service on Michele Salazar 115.00$                     

3/8/2016 SoCal Subpoena - Invoice 15259 8.62$                         

3/9/2016
J&L Process Service - Invoice 2016019 - 
Service on Paul Alves 115.00$                     

3/9/2016
J&L Process Service - Invoice 2016021 - 
Service on Darryl Noble 115.00$                     

3/31/2016 Nationwide Legal - Invoice #219349 102.00$                     

1/3/2017

Ryan P. Hanna - Execution & Personal 
Service/Subpoena for Hodgson Russ 
LLP 550.00$                     

TOTAL 1,552.95$                 
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(8) Date Description Amount
Compensation for the official 
reporter or reporter pro 
tempore

2/7/2017

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1126832 - Certified Copy of Hearing - 
Order to Show Cause Transcript 83.85$                       

11/20/2018

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1273647 - Original Transcript of Trial, 
Non Jury 653.80$                     

11/21/2018

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1273878 - Original and Certified Copy 
of Nonjury Trial Transcript (8) 314.60$                     

11/26/2018

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1274582 - Original and Certified Copy 
of Morabito vs. Superpumper 
Transcript 736.00$                     

11/26/2018

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1274604 - Original and Certified Copy 
of Morabito vs. Superpumper 
Transcript 454.40$                     

11/26/2018

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1274593 - Original and Certified Copy 
of Morabito vs. Superpumper 
Transcript 788.80$                     

11/26/2018

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1274590 - Original and Certified Copy 
of Morabito vs. Superpumper 
Transcript 751.20$                     

11/26/2018

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1274589 - Original and Certified Copy 
of Morabito vs. Superpumper 
Transcript 576.00$                     

11/26/2018

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1274598 - Original and Certified Copy 
of Morabito vs. Superpumper 
Transcript 788.80$                     

11/26/2018
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1274645 - Trial Non Jury 140.00$                     

11/27/2018
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1275076 20.00$                       

2/4/2019

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice 
#1288019 - Original Transcript of 
Closing Arguments 763.80$                     

TOTAL 6,071.25$                 
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(12) Date Description Amount
Reasonable costs for 
photocopies. 

12/31/2015 Photocopies - 45 pgs @ .25/pg 11.25$                       
1/31/2016 Photocopies 11.25$                       
2/29/2016 Photocopies 21.50$                       
3/29/2016 Photocopies 47.25$                       

4/5/2016
BBVA Compass - Invoice #03-16-0512 - 
Copies of Bank records 435.00$                     

4/29/2016 Photocopies 1,189.47$                  
5/31/2016 Photocopies 19.00$                       
6/30/2016 Photocopies 28.75$                       
7/15/2016 Photocopies 4.50$                         

7/22/2016

Chapman, Glucksman, Dean, Roeb & 
Barger - copies of documents produced 
by Stanton Bernstein pursuant to the 
Trustee’s discovery 2,896.24$                

9/12/2016
Photocopies - Second Stipulation 
Motion to Continue Trial 3.00$                         

11/8/2016

The Litigation Document Group - 
Invoice #16-11036 - Blowbacks, 3-Hole 
Drill, Slip Sheets, 3" 3-ring binders 424.33$                     

11/10/2016 Photocopies 77.50$                       
11/15/2016 Photocopies 1.00$                         
11/21/2016 Photocopies 604.50$                     
11/21/2016 Photocopies 536.75$                     
11/28/2016 Photocopies 18.50$                       
11/29/2016 Photocopies 7.00$                         
11/30/2016 Photocopies 7.50$                         

11/30/2016
Litigation Document Group - Invoice 
#16-11168 - Copies, Tabs, Binders 666.15$                     

12/8/2016 Photocopies 7.50$                         
12/14/2016 Photocopies 3.75$                         
12/16/2016 Photocopies 12.75$                       
12/22/2016 Photocopies 41.50$                       
12/23/2016 Photocopies 1.50$                         
12/27/2016 Photocopies 165.75$                     
12/28/2016 Photocopies 115.75$                     
12/29/2016 Photocopies 0.50$                         
12/30/2016 Photocopies 3.50$                         

1/3/2017 Photocopies 9.25$                         
1/23/2017 Photocopies 4.25$                         
1/24/2017 Photocopies 1.00$                         
1/27/2017 Photocopies 1.75$                         
1/30/2017 Photocopies 5.00$                         
1/31/2017 Photocopies 2.75$                         
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2/3/2017 Photocopies 4.00$                         
2/6/2017 Photocopies 2.75$                         

2/21/2017 Photocopies 15.00$                       
3/7/2017 Photocopies 44.50$                       
3/8/2017 Photocopies 17.50$                       
3/9/2017 Photocopies 234.50$                     

3/10/2017 Photocopies 251.25$                     
3/14/2017 Photocopies 1.50$                         
3/15/2017 Photocopies 5.50$                         
3/16/2017 Photocopies 270.25$                     
3/20/2017 Photocopies 2.00$                         
3/28/2017 Photocopies 1.50$                         
3/29/2017 Photocopies 7.25$                         
3/30/2017 Photocopies 47.25$                       
4/17/2017 Photocopies 1.00$                         
4/27/2017 Photocopies 2.00$                         
5/15/2017 Photocopies 523.75$                     
5/24/2017 Photocopies 8.50$                         
5/25/2017 Photocopies 3.00$                         

6/8/2017 Photocopies 39.75$                       
6/29/2017 Photocopies 0.25$                         

7/6/2017 Photocopies 150.00$                     
7/7/2017 Photocopies 242.00$                     

7/13/2017 Photocopies 23.00$                       
7/13/2017 Photocopies 2.75$                         
7/18/2017 Photocopies 9.00$                         
7/19/2017 Photocopies 3.75$                         
7/20/2017 Photocopies 1.00$                         
7/25/2017 Photocopies 3.25$                         

8/4/2017 Photocopies 2.75$                         
8/9/2017 Photocopies 15.25$                       

8/16/2017 Photocopies 71.25$                       
8/18/2017 Photocopies 432.50$                     
8/21/2017 Photocopies 274.25$                     
8/22/2017 Photocopies 127.00$                     
8/25/2017 Photocopies 234.25$                     
8/28/2017 Photocopies 5.25$                         
8/31/2017 Photocopies 2.50$                         

9/6/2017 Photocopies 8.75$                         
9/13/2017 Photocopies 2.25$                         

10/11/2017 Photocopies 0.25$                         
10/23/2017 Photocopies 2.25$                         
11/10/2017 Photocopies 6.25$                         
12/22/2017 Photocopies 4.00$                         

1/23/2018 Photocopies 0.25$                         
7/6/2018 Photocopies 2.00$                         

7/31/2018 Photocopies 2.00$                         
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8/9/2018 Photocopies 254.50$                     
8/17/2018 Photocopies 8.50$                         
8/23/2018 Photocopies - .10/page 244.60$                     
8/24/2018 Photocopies 0.75$                         
8/28/2018 Photocopies 9.50$                         
8/28/2018 Photocopies 24.50$                       

9/4/2018 Photocopies 23.75$                       
9/6/2018 Photocopies 38.75$                       
9/7/2018 Photocopies 52.75$                       

9/19/2018 Photocopies 43.00$                       
9/20/2018 Photocopies 3.00$                         
9/24/2018 Photocopies 11.75$                       
9/25/2018 Photocopies 21.00$                       
9/25/2018 Photocopies 25.25$                       
9/26/2018 Photocopies 1.50$                         
9/28/2018 Photocopies - .10/page 190.00$                     
10/1/2018 Photocopies (12) 564.50$                     
10/2/2018 Photocopies 5.25$                         
10/3/2018 Photocopies 0.50$                         
10/4/2018 Photocopies 105.50$                     
10/5/2018 Photocopies 72.25$                       
10/9/2018 Photocopies 145.50$                     

10/10/2018 Photocopies 17.25$                       
10/11/2018 Photocopies 8.25$                         
10/12/2018 Photocopies 205.75$                     
10/15/2018 Photocopies - .10/page 243.80$                     
10/16/2018 Photocopies 54.50$                       
10/17/2018 Photocopies 405.25$                     
10/18/2018 Photocopies 15.75$                       
10/19/2018 Photocopies 794.50$                     
10/22/2018 Photocopies 177.00$                     
10/23/2018 Photocopies - .10/page 210.70$                     
10/24/2018 Photocopies 19.50$                       
10/25/2018 Photocopies 244.50$                     
10/31/2018 Photocopies 4.00$                         
11/19/2018 Photocopies 399.00$                     
11/20/2018 Photocopies 35.25$                       
11/27/2018 Photocopies 15.00$                       
11/28/2018 Photocopies 8.25$                         
11/29/2018 Photocopies 5.50$                         

11/30/2018

Robison, Sharp, Sullivan & Brust - 
Invoice for share of costs for trial 
binders 682.63$                     

12/10/2018 Photocopies 1.00$                         
1/25/2019 Photocopies 0.50$                         
1/30/2019 Photocopies 55.25$                       

2/1/2019 Photocopies 2.00$                         
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2/4/2019 Photocopies 269.25$                     
2/6/2019 Photocopies 26.50$                       
2/7/2019 Photocopies (12) 146.50$                     
2/7/2019 Photocopies 146.50$                     
2/7/2019 Photocopies 146.50$                     

2/15/2019 Photocopies 1.25$                         
2/21/2019 Photocopies 6.50$                         
2/22/2019 Photocopies 3.00$                         
2/25/2019 Photocopies 486.50$                     
2/26/2019 Photocopies 17.75$                       
2/27/2019 Photocopies 72.75$                       
2/28/2019 Photocopies 0.75$                         

3/2/2019 Photocopies 9.75$                         
3/4/2019 Photocopies 16.25$                       

3/11/2019 Photocopies 1.75$                         
3/14/2019 Photocopies 0.25$                         
3/20/2019 Photocopies 5.50$                         
3/29/2019 Photocopies 655.00$                     

TOTAL 17,961.67$               
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(14) Date Description Amount

Reasonable costs for postage. 

6/11/2015
Federal Express - Invoice 4-969-39499 - 
Tracking #773815064813 25.75$                       

8/20/2015 Postage 0.48$                         

10/16/2015
Federal Express - Tracking number 
774757741763 - Deposition Exhibits 113.12$                     

11/4/2015
Federal Express - Tracking: 
774904843624 26.22$                       

11/4/2015
Federal Express - Tracking: 
774904824191 17.86$                       

1/28/2016 Postage 34.37$                       

2/3/2016

United Parcel Service from Laura Mitz-
Roberts to Jenifer Cannon - Tracking 
#1Z18E07VNT92680888 11.55$                       

2/3/2016 Postage 2.54$                         
2/5/2016 Postage 0.70$                         

2/10/2016 Postage 1.06$                         
2/18/2016 Postage 6.85$                         
2/19/2016 Postage 1.14$                         
2/23/2016 Postage 0.96$                         
2/26/2016 Postage 0.48$                         

3/8/2016 Postage 1.20$                         
3/11/2016 Postage 0.48$                         

3/14/2016
United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V0191582204 30.64$                       

3/14/2016
United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V0192737590 30.64$                       

3/17/2016 Postage 0.48$                         

3/18/2016

United Parcel Service - Invoice 
#000018E07V136 - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V4490575812 - Delivery to 
Teresa Pilatowicz 50.71$                       

3/18/2016

United Parcel Service - Invoice 
#000018E07V136 - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V4493818429 - Delivery to 
Teresa Pilatowicz 50.71$                       

3/18/2016 Postage 1.64$                         
3/23/2016 Postage 11.06$                       
3/31/2016 Postage 0.48$                         

4/4/2016 Postage 0.70$                         
4/6/2016 Postage 0.48$                         

4/29/2016 Postage 2.84$                         
5/3/2016 Postage 1.57$                         

5/31/2016 Postage 46.00$                       
9/12/2016 Postage 1.15$                         
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11/15/2016 Postage 1.15$                         
11/21/2016 Postage 3.25$                         

11/30/2016

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V0390231313 - Delivery to 
Teresa Pilatowicz 14.95$                       

11/30/2016 Postage 0.46$                         
12/14/2016 Postage 1.36$                         
12/21/2016 Postage 1.15$                         
12/23/2016 Postage 0.46$                         

12/29/2016

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V0394144197 - Delivery to 
Teresa Pilatowicz 13.28$                       

12/30/2016 Postage 1.36$                         
1/3/2017 Postage 1.57$                         

1/23/2017 Postage 0.46$                         
1/27/2017 Postage 1.19$                         
1/30/2017 Postage 1.86$                         
2/2/2017 Postage (14) 1.19$                           

2/6/2017 Postage 1.19$                         
2/15/2017 Postage 2.03$                         

3/14/2017

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V0193214081 - Delivery to 
John Murtha @ Woodburn & Wedge 20.58$                       

3/20/2017 Postage 1.19$                         
3/29/2017 Postage 0.67$                         
4/17/2017 Postage 0.46$                         
4/27/2017 Postage 0.67$                         
5/24/2017 Postage 1.86$                         

6/8/2017 Postage 23.46$                       

7/7/2017

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V4496320577 - Delivery to 
Teresa Pilatowicz 75.67$                       

7/25/2017 Postage 2.03$                         
8/9/2017 Postage 0.92$                         

8/18/2017

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V0390467140 - Delivery to 
Teresa Pilatowicz 15.68$                       

8/25/2017

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V0398698725 - Delivery to 
Second Judicial Court 12.07$                       

9/6/2017 Postage 2.28$                         
9/6/2017 Postage 2.28$                         

1/23/2018 Postage 0.47$                         

8/24/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07VP291122210 - Delivery to 
Teresa Pilatowicz 15.65$                       
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8/28/2018 Postage 1.64$                         

9/19/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V1391626653 - Delivery to 
Clerk of the Court in Reno, NV 37.38$                       

9/28/2018 Postage 1.63$                         
10/1/2018 Postage 9.59$                         

10/2/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V1590109700 - Delivery to 
Teresa Pilatowicz 147.55$                     

10/5/2018 Postage 0.68$                         
10/12/2018 Postage 9.43$                         

10/17/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V0796804696 - Delivery to 
Dept. 4, Second Judicial District Court 
in Reno, NV 52.72$                       

10/19/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V0295235526 - Delivery to 
Teresa Pilatowicz 31.32$                       

10/19/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V0298697906 - Delivery to 
John F. Murtha 47.62$                       

10/19/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V0299529514 - Delivery to 
John F. Murtha 56.68$                       

10/22/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V1399814748 - Delivery to 
Teresa Pilatowicz 22.06$                       

10/24/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V1396289983 - Delivery to 
Reno 174.62$                     

10/24/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V1397159951 - Delivery to 
Reno 205.33$                     

10/24/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V1398041576 - Delivery to 
Reno 174.31$                     

10/24/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V1398523564 - Delivery to 
Reno 204.13$                     

11/13/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z4708X61592336653 - Deliver trial 
boxes to Las Vegas from Reno 553.28$                     

11/13/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z4708X61590001268 - Deliver trial 
boxes to Las Vegas from Reno 285.62$                     
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11/13/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z4708X61591658870 - Deliver trial 
boxes to Las Vegas from Reno 294.84$                     

11/13/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z4708X61593209486 - Deliver trial 
boxes to Las Vegas from Reno 224.16$                     

11/13/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z4708X61590553092 - Deliver trial 
boxes to Las Vegas from Reno 224.16$                     

11/13/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z4708X61594589707 - Deliver trial 
boxes to Las Vegas from Reno 553.28$                     

11/13/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z4708X61591219317 - Deliver trial 
boxes to Las Vegas from Reno 376.73$                     

11/13/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z4708X61591341925 - Deliver trial 
boxes to Las Vegas from Reno 204.96$                     

11/13/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z4708X61590857531 - Deliver trial 
boxes to Las Vegas from Reno 235.25$                     

11/13/2018

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z4708X61590666149 - Deliver trial 
boxes to Las Vegas from Reno 171.14$                     

2/1/2019

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V1390887463 - Delivery to 
Washoe County Court 30.63$                       

2/5/2019

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V1394615070 - Delivery to 
Washoe County Court 17.26$                       

2/25/2019

United Parcel Service - Tracking 
#1Z18E07V1595608153 - Delivery to 
Washoe County Court, Department 4 72.34$                       

2/28/2019 Postage 0.50$                         
3/29/2019 Postage 66.50$                       

TOTAL 5,184.05$                 
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(15) Date Description Amount
Reasonable costs for travel and 
lodging incurred taking 
depositions and conducting 
discovery.

6/22/2015
Airfare (835.51), Taxi (64.35, Lodging 
(270.50) and Meals (36.04) 1,206.40$                  

9/28/2015
Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare, lodging, 
meals and car for deposition in CA 742.94$                     

10/19/2015
Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare for 
Deposition 361.82$                     

10/19/2015

Teresa Pilatowicz for Deposition of 
Dennis Vacco, S. Morabito and PMK of 
Snowshoe - Airfare (1530.30) Taxi 
(116.52) Lodging (59.53) and Meals 
(109.60) 1,815.95$                  

3/15/2016
Teresa Pilatowicz - lodging in LA for 
Deposition 273.31$                     

3/15/2016
Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare for 
Deposition 493.96$                     

3/15/2016
Teresa Pilatowicz - Transportation 
while in Los Angeles for Deposition 95.51$                       

3/15/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz - Fed Ex for copies 26.21$                       

3/20/2016
Teresa Pilatowicz - Lodging for 
Deposition 750.14$                     

3/20/2016
Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare for 
Deposition 493.96$                     

3/20/2016
Teresa Pilatowicz - Meals while in Los 
Angeles for deposition 34.54$                       

3/21/2016
Teresa Pilatowicz - Meals while in Los 
Angeles for deposition 65.67$                       

3/21/2016
Teresa Pilatowicz - Transportation 
while in Los Angeles for Deposition 185.63$                     

3/21/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz - Fed Ex for copies 91.77$                       

3/24/2016

Gabby Hamm - Airfare to Reno for 
Deposition of Dennis Banks & Bif 
Leonard 499.96$                     

3/24/2016

Gabby Hamm - Lodging while in Reno 
for Deposition of Dennis Banks & Bif 
Leonard 79.95$                       

3/24/2016

Gabby Hamm - Uber while in Reno for 
Deposition of Dennis Banks & Bif 
Leonard 50.56$                       
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3/24/2016

Gabby Hamm - Parking at Airport while 
in Reno for Deposition of Dennis Banks 
& Bif Leonard 25.00$                       

3/24/2016

Gabby Hamm - Meals while in Reno for 
Deposition of Dennis Banks & Bif 
Leonard 38.32$                       

5/15/2017

Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare, Taxi, Hotel, 
Meals and Parking while in Los 
Angeles, CA for Deposition of Stanton 
Bernstein 479.28$                     

7/9/2017

Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare, Lodging, 
Taxi and Meals while in Buffalo, NY 
for Deposition of Dennis Vacco & PMK 
of Hodgson Russ 1,273.47$                  

12/6/2017
Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare and Parking 
for Settlement conference 410.96$                     

4/30/2018

Teresa Pilatowicz - Travel expenses to 
attend deposition of person most 
knowledgeable of Hodgson Russ 672.30$                     

TOTAL 10,167.61$               
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(17) Date Description Amount

Reasonable and necessary 
expense incurred in connection 
with the action - Court costs, 
Certified Records for Trial & 
Legal Research.

10/14/2015 Pacer 3.70$                         
1/7/2016 Pacer 12.30$                       

3/7/2016
Sierra Document Management - Invoice 
MAR 16 012 - document production 112.74$                     

3/31/2016 Westlaw Research for March 2016 357.93$                     
3/31/2016 Pacer 7.50$                         
6/30/2016 Pacer 3.10$                         

9/1/2016 Pacer 26.30$                       
10/3/2016 Pacer 1.30$                         
11/1/2016 Pacer 16.40$                       

11/7/2016
New York Dept. of State, Division of 
Corporations 20.00$                       

1/3/2017 Pacer 7.00$                         
4/3/2017 Pacer (17) 10.10$                       

5/31/2017 Pacer (17) 6.70$                         
6/30/2017 Pacer 11.10$                       

8/1/2017 Pacer 3.40$                         

8/10/2017
Court Call ID: 8519396 - Motion 
Hearing 65.00$                       

10/2/2017 Pacer 4.80$                         

12/19/2017
Telephonic Conference Court Call - ID: 
8782205 (17) 65.00$                       

7/31/2018 Pacer (17) 1.40$                         

9/19/2018
Teresa Pilatowicz - Obtain California 
Court Records 22.50$                       

10/1/2018
U.S. Bankruptcy Court Clerk - ck #5335 
- Certified Copies 269.00$                     

10/1/2018
Orange County - Certified Copies - 
Order #148884 14.00$                       

10/1/2018
Riverside County Recorder - 
Transaction #74536076 32.50$                       

10/2/2018
Washoe County Recorder - Receipt: 
20181002-063550 - Certified Copies 14.49$                       

10/4/2018

Nevada Secretary of State - Job: 
C20181002-2119 - Entity Copies and 
Certification of Document 42.00$                       

10/4/2018

Nevada Secretary of State - Job: 
C20181002-2128 - Entity Copies and 
Certification of Document 50.00$                       
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10/12/2018

Clerk of the Court - United States 
Bankruptcy Court - ck #5400 - Certified 
Copies 298.00$                     

10/12/2018
New York Secretary of State - Certified 
Copies 85.00$                       

10/15/2018

Washoe County Recorder - Receipt 
#20181015-066448 - Certified Copy of 
Document 6.21$                         

10/19/2018 US Bankruptcy Court - Certified Copies 141.00$                     

10/19/2018
New York Secretary of State - Certified 
Copies 85.00$                       

TOTAL 1,795.47$                 
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Messenger Date Description Amount

5/29/2015

J & L Legal Service Invoice 2015282 - 
Service to Washoe 2nd Judicial Court 
(7) 72.50$                       

10/13/2015

J&L Legal Service - Invoice 2015385 - 
File/Sign 3 Commissions @ 2nd 
Judicial Court 73.00$                       

12/5/2016

Hot Shot Delivery, Inc. - Invoice 
#141344 - Delivery to Superior Court 
and Compass Bank 131.16$                     

1/3/2017

J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-1098 
- Delivery to Second Judicial Court - 
Reno (7) 65.00$                       

2/3/2017
J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-2043 
- Service on Washoe County Dist. Ct. 100.00$                     

6/14/2017

J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-2440 
- Rush Court Run in Reno and Copies 
(17) 68.50$                       

8/7/2017

J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-2599 
- Rush Court Run to Reno Discovery 
Commissioner (17) 65.00$                       

9/19/2017

J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-2673 
- Copies and Delivery to 71 Washington 
Street, Reno, NV (17) 190.00$                     

10/24/2018

J&L Process Service - Invoice #18-6542 
- CA Secretary of State/Certificate of 
Merger, Certified Copy Fees and Over 
Night Fees (17) 152.00$                     

11/3/2018

J&L Process Service - Invoice #18-6577 
- Certified Copy Fee and Court Run to 
Washoe County District Court (17) 60.00$                       

11/3/2018

J&L Process Service - Invoice #18-6541 
- Court Run to Washoe County District 
Court (17) 55.00$                       

TOTAL 1,032.16$                 
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Tarvel Related to Hearing & 
Trial Date Description Amount

2/23/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz - Travel to hearing 711.96$                     

2/23/2016
Teresa Pilatowicz - Siena Hotel Spar 
Casino for hearing 115.50$                     

2/23/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz - Uber 9.58$                         
2/24/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz - Uber 10.79$                       

2/24/2016
Gabby Hamm - Airfare to Reno for 
Pretrial Conference 477.96$                     

2/24/2016
Gabby Hamm - Transportation while in 
Reno for Pretrial Conference 22.61$                       

4/5/2016

Gerald Gordon - Ct Appearance, Motion 
to Compel 364, 331 - Airfare, Car 
Rental & Parking 295.50$                     

1/19/2017

Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare, Meals and 
Parking for travel to Reno to attend 
hearing for App for Order to show cause 
(Bayuk) 439.40$                     

9/11/2018 Erika Turner - Airfare to Reno 531.96$                     

9/11/2018
Teresa Pilatowicz - Travel Expenses to 
Reno to attend Pretrial Conference 282.66$                     

10/15/2018

Teersa Pilatowicz - Travel expenses to 
meet with Client for trial prep in Las 
Vegas 303.72$                     

10/25/2018

Teresa Pilatowicz - Hotel, Airfare, 
Parking, Uber and Meals while in Reno 
for trial 1,989.15$                  

10/25/2018 Gabby Hamm - Airfare to Reno 511.50$                     

10/25/2018
Gabby Hamm - Car Rental while in 
Reno for Trial 468.87$                     

10/25/2018
Gabby Hamm - Uber while in Reno for 
Trial 88.38$                       

10/25/2018
Gabby Hamm - Airport Parking while in 
Reno for Trial 25.75$                       

10/25/2018
Gabby Hamm - Lodging while in Reno 
for Trial 1,267.10$                  

10/25/2018
Gabby Hamm - Meals while in Reno for 
Trial 137.61$                     

10/25/2018
Gabby Hamm - Photocopies while in 
Reno for Trial 515.18$                     

10/25/2018
Gabby Hamm - Office Supplies while in 
Reno for Trial 243.83$                     

10/28/2018 Erika Turner - Airfare to Reno 531.96$                     
10/28/2018 Erika Turner - Hotel while in Reno 1,591.13$                  
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10/28/2018
Erika Turner - Car rental while in Reno 
for trial 1,100.74$                  

11/4/2018 Erika Turner  - Airfare to Reno 531.96$                     

11/6/2018
Erika Turner - Return flight from Reno 
while attending Trial 531.96$                     

11/25/2018
Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare to Reno for 
Closing Arguments at Trial 623.56$                     

11/25/2018
Teresa Pilatowicz - Uber for Closing 
Arguments at Trial 47.95$                       

11/25/2018
Teresa Pilatowicz - Meals for Closing 
Arguments at Trial 15.35$                       

11/25/2018
Teresa Pilatowicz - Lodging for Closing 
Arguments at Trial 241.63$                     

11/25/2018
Teresa Pilatowicz - Photocopies for 
Closing Arguments at Trial 9.52$                         

2/7/2019 Erika Turner - Hotel while in Reno 286.12$                     
2/7/2019 Erika Turner - Airfare to Reno 541.96$                     

2/10/2019 Erika Turner - Uber in Reno 14.97$                       
3/1/2019 Erika Turner - Airfare to Reno 541.96$                     

TOTAL 15,059.78$               
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GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP 
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ. 
Nevada Bar No. 6454 
E-mail:  eturner@gtg.legal  
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ. 
Nevada Bar No. 9605 
E-mail:  tpilatowicz@gtg.legal 
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ. 
Nevada Bar No. 11588 
E-mail:  ghamm@gtg.legal  
650 White Drive, Ste. 100 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119 
Telephone 725-777-3000 
Counsel to Plaintiff 

IN THE SECOND JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT OF 

THE STATE OF NEVADA, IN AND FOR THE COUNTY OF WASHOE 

WILLIAM A. LEONARD, Trustee for the 
Bankruptcy Estate of Paul Anthony 
Morabito, 

Plaintiff, 

vs. 

SUPERPUMPER, INC., an Arizona 
corporation; EDWARD BAYUK, 
individually and as Trustee of the EDWARD 
WILLIAM BAYUK LIVING TRUST; 
SALVATORE MORABITO, and individual; 
and SNOWSHOE PETROLEUM, INC., a 
New York corporation, 

Defendants. 

CASE NO.:  CV13-02663 

DEPT. NO.:  4 

APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES 
AND COSTS PURSUANT TO NRCP 68 

Plaintiff William A. Leonard (“Plaintiff”) by and through counsel, the law firm of Garman 

Turner Gordon LLP (“GTG”), applies to the Court for an award of attorneys’ fees and costs 

pursuant to Nevada Rule of Civil Procedure 68 (the “Application”) based on defendants’ (the 

“Defendants”) rejection of the $3,000,000 offer of judgment delivered on May 31, 2016 (the “Offer 

of Judgment”). 

This Application is made and based on the following Memorandum of Points and 

Authorities and supporting exhibits, including the declaration of Teresa M. Pilatowicz (the 

F I L E D
Electronically
CV13-02663

2019-04-12 12:51:58 PM
Jacqueline Bryant
Clerk of the Court

Transaction # 7216450 : yviloria
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“Pilatowicz Declaration”) attached hereto as Exhibit 1 and supporting exhibits; Plaintiff’s 

Memorandum of Costs, a copy of which was filed with the court on April 11, 2019 and is attached 

hereto as Exhibit 5; the other papers and pleadings already on file herein; and any oral argument 

of counsel that may be  permitted at the hearing of this matter. 

Dated this 12th day of April, 2019. 

GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP 

/s/ Teresa M. Pilatowicz
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ. 
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ. 
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ. 
650 White Drive, Ste. 100 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119 
Telephone 725-777-3000 
Special Counsel for Trustee 

I. 
INTRODUCTION 

The instant case was filed on December 17, 2013 in order to avoid and recover a series of 

transfers designed to prevent collection on a previous judgment issued by this Court against Paul 

Morabito. See Complaint, on file with this Court. After completing significant amounts of 

discovery and exchanging expert reports, on May 31, 2016, Plaintiff served Defendants with the 

$3,000,000.00 Offer of Judgment in favor of Plaintiff.  Defendants rejected the Offer of Judgment 

on June 15, 2016.  Ultimately, after an eight-day bench trial conducted in October and November 

2018, this Court entered judgment in favor of Plaintiff, avoiding the transfers and awarding 

Plaintiff $13,312,800 in damages (the “Judgment”).  Because the Judgment in favor of Plaintiff is 

more than four times Plaintiff’s Offer of Judgment, and Plaintiff’s requested fees and costs are 

reasonable, Plaintiff is entitled to an award of attorneys’ fees and costs incurred after May 31, 

2016. 
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II. 
SUMMARY OF RELEVANT FACTS 

1. On June 20, 2013, following Paul Morabito’s defaults on a settlement agreement 

and forbearance agreement related to an approximately $150,000,000 in favor of judgment, JH, 

Inc., Jerry Herbst, and Berry-Hinckley Industries (together, the “Herbst Parties”), the Herbst 

Parties commenced an involuntary bankruptcy against Paul Morabito in the U.S. Bankruptcy Court 

for the District of Nevada (the “Bankruptcy Court”).  See Judgment, ¶ 7. 

2. On December 17, 2013, the Herbst Parties commenced this action under NRS 

Chapter 112 (the “UFTA”) for fraudulent transfer against transferor Paul Morabito, individually 

and as Trustee of his Arcadia Living Trust (“Arcadia Trust”), as well as transferee Defendants.  

See id., ¶ 12. 

3. On December 17, 2014, the Bankruptcy Court entered an order adjudicating Paul 

Morabito a chapter 7 debtor.  See id., ¶ 8. 

4. On January 22, 2015, the Bankruptcy Court appointed Plaintiff as the trustee for 

the bankruptcy estate of Morabito.  On May 15, 2015, Plaintiff was substituted in place of the 

Herbst Parties in this case, and Paul Morabito and the Arcadia Trust were dismissed from the 

action with only transferees of Paul Morabito’s assets remaining in the case.  See id., ¶ 19. 

5. On May 31, 2016, Plaintiff made Defendants an apportioned offer of judgment, 

whereby Plaintiff would take judgment against Defendants in the amount of $3,000,000, allocated 

equally between the Defendants. See Offer of Judgment, attached hereto as Exhibit 2;  see also 

Pilatowicz Decl., ¶ 10. 

6.  On June 15, 2016, Defendants rejected the Offer of Judgment. See Exhibit 3, see 

also Pilatowicz Decl., ¶ 11. 

7. On March 29, 2019, following an eight-day bench trial and further submission of 

evidence following the trial, the Court entered a judgment in Plaintiff’s favor in the total amount 

of $13,312,800 broken down as follows: $7,908,799.95 against Edward Bayuk (“Bayuk”), 

individually and as Trustee of the Edward William Bayuk Living Trust (the “Bayuk Trust”), 
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$5,304,000 against Salvatore Morabito, and $9,899,000 against Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc.1  See 

Judgment, on file with the Court. 

8. Plaintiff plainly beat the Offer of Judgment of $3,000,000 with the Judgment 

amount. 

III. 
LEGAL ARGUMENT 

A. PLAINTIFF IS ENTITLED TO ATTORNEYS’ FEES AND COSTS BECAUSE 
PLAINTIFF SERVED A VALID OFFER OF JUDGMENT ON DEFENDANTS 
AND OBTAINED A HIGHER VERDICT AFTER A TRIAL ON THE MERITS.

A party is entitled to attorneys’ fees and costs if a statute, rule, or contractual clause permits 

their recovery. Rowland v. Lepire, 99 Nev. 308, 315, 662 P.2d 1332, 1336 (1983). NRCP 68 

permits a party to “serve an offer in writing to allow judgment to be taken.” NRCP 68(a). If the 

offeree rejects a valid offer of judgment and fails to obtain a more favorable judgment, then the 

offeree is precluded from recovery of “any costs or attorney’s fees” after the offer was made, 

NRCP 68(f)(1), and must “pay the offeror’s post-offer costs, applicable interest on the judgment,” 

and “reasonable attorney’s fees.” NRCP 68(f)(2). A party must file a written motion specifying 

the grounds for the award, the amount sought, and a declaration of counsel that the fees were 

reasonably and necessarily included. NRCP 54(d)(3)(A)-(B). 

The purpose of NRCP 68 is to promote and encourage settlement and save time and money 

for the court system, the parties, and the taxpayers.  See Muije v. A North Las Vegas Cab Co., 

Inc., 106 Nev. 664, 667, 799 P.2d 559, 561 (1990).  If an offer is not accepted and the case proceeds 

to trial a party who does not accept the offer and then fails to beat the offer will be subject to 

“serious consequences.”  See Nava v. Second Judicial Dist. Court ex rel. County of Washoe, 118 

Nev. 396, 399, 46 P.3d 60, 61 (2002).   

An offer of judgment made pursuant to NRCP 68 must be made 10-days prior to trial. 

NRCP 68(a);  see also Palace Station Hotel & Casino, Inc. v. Jones, 115 Nev. 162, 164-65, 978 

1 The total amount of damages allocated to the transfer of Paul Morabito’s interest in Superpumper, Inc.  (the 
“Superpumper Transfer”) is $9,898,000, which was awarded in the full amount against Snowshoe and $4,949,000 
each against Bayuk and Salvatore Morabito.  Ultimately, Plaintiff cannot recover more than a total of $9,898,000 (plus 
interest and fees) on account of the Superpumper Transfer. 
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P.2d 323, 324-25 (1999).  By the express terms of NRCP 68, if the offeree rejects an offer and 

fails to obtain a more favorable judgment at trial, “the offeree shall pay the offeror’s post-offer 

costs, applicable interest on the judgment from the time of the offer to the time of entry of the 

judgment and reasonable attorney’s fees, actually incurred by the offeror from the time of the 

offer.” NRCP 68(f)(2).  An offer is rejected if it is not accepted within 10 days of the offer being 

made. NRCP 68(e). 

Plaintiff served his Offer of Judgment on Defendants on May 31, 2016, offering to take 

judgment in favor of Plaintiff and against Defendants for $3,000,000.00. The Offer of Judgment 

was more than two years before trial and therefore timely. Defendants rejected the offer and  

Plaintiff recovered more at trial.  Plaintiff is entitled to reasonable attorneys’ fees and costs 

incurred since May 31, 2016.  

B. DEFENDANTS’ REJECTION OF PLAINTIFF’S GOOD FAITH OFFER OF 
JUDGMENT JUSTIFIES THE AWARD OF FEES AND COSTS.  

With specific attention to offers of judgment, the Nevada Supreme Court has set forth 

several additional factors to be considered by the Court when determining whether attorneys’ fees 

should be awarded pursuant to an offer of judgment, including: 

(1) whether Plaintiff’s claims were brought in good faith;  

(2) whether the Offer of Judgment was reasonable and in good faith 
in both its timing and amount;  

(3) whether Defendant’s decision to reject the offer and proceed to 
trial was grossly unreasonable or in bad faith; and  

(4) whether the fees sought by Plaintiff is reasonable and justified in 
amount.  

Beattie v. Thomas, 99 Nev. 579, 588-89; 668 P.2d 268, 274 (1983); see also Frazier v. Drake, 131 

Nev. Adv. Op. 64, 357 P.3d 365, 372 (Nev. App. 2015); Ozawa v. Vision Airlines, 216 P.3d 788, 

792 (Nev. 2009). None of these factors are outcome determinative, but each must be given 

appropriate consideration. Yamaha Motor Co., U.S.A. v. Arnoult, 114 Nev. 233, 252 n. 16, 955 

P.2d 661, 673 n. 16 (1998). While no factor is outcome determinative, when weighing the factors, 

they clearly favor an award of fees and costs to Plaintiff. 
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1. Plaintiff’s claims were premised on sound factual and legal bases. 

Plaintiff asserted claims seeking to avoid and recover fraudulent transfers.  See Complaint.  

As evidenced by the Judgment, Plaintiff’s claims were properly pursued and justified. This factor 

weighs in favor of awarding fees. 

2. Plaintiff’s Offer of Judgment was reasonable in timing and amount. 

Plaintiff sent the Offer of Judgment in June 2016, which was two and a half years before 

trial but after the parties had the opportunity to conduct discovery and disclose experts.  Defendants 

had access to the facts of the case in order to make an informed decision such that the Offer of 

Judgement was reasonable as to timing.  

Furthermore, Plaintiff’s Offer of Judgment was in the amount of $3,000,000.00, reflecting 

approximately one quarter of the amount eventually recovered.  A such, the Offer of Judgment 

was imminently reasonable in amount. 

3. Defendants’ rejection of the Offer of Judgment was unreasonable. 

As set forth above, Defendants had the benefit of discovery and the disclosure of experts 

at the time the Offer of Judgment was made. Furthermore, given that this was a fraudulent transfer 

action, Defendants always had the entirety of the relevant facts of their wrongdoing within their 

possession.  It has always been evident that Plaintiff was entitled to a substantial recovery for 

Defendants’ wrongful acts. Defendants’ rejection of the Offer of Judgment was therefore patently 

unreasonable.  

4. Plaintiff’s attorney’s fees are reasonable as the work required in connection with 
the case was difficult and time consuming, but necessary and performed by skilled 
counsel. 

The method upon which a reasonable fee is determined is subject to the discretion of the 

Court, which is tempered only by reason and fairness. Shuette v. Beazer Homes Holdings Corp., 

121 Nev. 837, 864, 124 P.3d 530, 548-49 (2005) (citation omitted). Accordingly, in determining 

the amount of fees to award, the Court is not limited to one specific approach; its analysis may 

begin with any method rationally designed to calculate a reasonable amount. Id. Whichever 

method is chosen as a starting point; however, the Court must continue its analysis by considering 
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the requested amount in light of the advocates’ professional qualities, the nature of the litigation, 

the work performed, and the result.  See id. at 549 (citing Brunzell v. Golden Gate National Bank, 

85 Nev. 345, 349, 455 P.2d 31, 33 (1969)).  The Brunzell factors are as follows: 

(1) the advocate’s qualities, including ability, training, education, 
experience, professional standing, and skill; 

(2) the character of the work, including its difficulty, intricacy, 
importance, as well as the time and skill required, the responsibility 
imposed, and the prominence and character of the parties when 
affecting the importance of the litigation; 

(3) the work performed, including the skill, time, and attention given 
to the work; and 

(4) the result—whether the attorney was successful and what 
benefits were derived. 

Wilfong, 121 Nev. at 623, 119 P.3d at 730; Shuette, 121 Nev. at 865, 124 P.3d at 549. 

Nevada courts often begin with the “lodestar” amount, which “involves multiplying the 

number of hours reasonably spent on the case by a reasonable hourly rate.” Shuette, 121 Nev. at 

864-65, 124 P.3d at 549. The “court must construe its analysis by considering the requested amount 

in light of the factors enumerated by [the Nevada Supreme Court] in Brunzell v. Golden State 

National Bank.” Id. at 865, 124 P.3d at 549 

a. Plaintiff’s counsel possesses excellent qualifications and experience. 

Plaintiff has been represented by the law firm of Garman Turner Gordon (“GTG”) since 

May 2015. The three attorneys primarily responsible for prosecution of the Complaint were Erika 

Pike Turner, Teresa Pilatowicz, and Gabrielle Hamm.  Ms. Pilatowicz and Ms. Hamm conducted 

the vast amount of discovery and handled the pre-trial matters, while Ms. Pike-Turner’s services 

were primarily in connection with the eight-day trial and post-trial matters. 

Erika Pike Turner is a partner at GTG with over 20 years of experience in commercial 

litigation. See Pilatowicz Decl., ¶ 7. She graduated from American University College of Law in 

2017. Id. Her market rate is $495 per hour, which is less than many others in the market with 

similar experience charge. Id. She is well respected within the legal community and her skills as 
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an advocate are well known by this Court. Ms. Turner is consistently recognized as a top lawyer 

in the state. Id.  

Teresa Pilatowicz performed the largest amount of work on this  matter.  She graduated 

from the University of Arizona James E. Rogers College of Law in 2005. Her rate per hour in this 

case was $365 per hour, which represents a discount for her normal market hourly rate during the 

majority of the case.  Id. at ¶ 6.  Specifically, from 2016 through January 1, 2019, Ms. Pilatowicz’s 

normal hourly rate was $385 and since January 1, 2019, bills $400 per hour. Id. Ms. Pilatowicz  

possesses 14 years of experience as an attorney. Id. She has been identified as a “rising star,” and 

her rates are consistent with market rates for attorneys with similar years and experience. Id.   

Gabrielle Hamm graduated from Georgetown University School of Law in 2003. Id. at ¶ 8 

Ms. Hamm’s hourly to rate is $385 per hour.  She possesses 15 years of experience as an attorney. 

Id. at ¶ 8. She has been identified as a “rising star,” and her rates are consistent with market rates 

for attorneys with similar years and experience. Id.

The remaining attorneys that participated in the prosecution on more discrete tasks, Gerald 

Gordon, Erick Gjerdingen, Mark Weisenmiller, Stephen Davis, and Andrew Dunning, are likewise 

skilled attorneys with hourly rates commensurate with their years and proactive and experience.  

Id. at ¶ 9. Thus, the hourly rates GTG billed for this matter are reasonable. 

b. The character of work, time, and skill required justifies the fees requested. 

In considering the nature of the litigation, courts look at “the character of the work to be 

done: its difficulty, its intricacy, its importance, time and skill required, the responsibility imposed 

and the prominence and character of the parties where they affect the importance of litigation.” 

Brunzell, 85 Nev. at 349, 455 P.2d at 33. Courts also consider “the work actually performed by 

the lawyer: the skill, time and attention given to the work.” Id.  

This litigation spanned five years. For much of the five years, attorneys with GTG was 

engaged in efforts to extract the relevant factual information from Defendants who consistently, 

even post-trial, sought to shield the discovery of the same. See Pilatowicz Decl. at ¶ 12. The 

discovery involved review of hundreds of thousands of pages of documents obtained via requests, 

subpoenas, and court orders.  Id. at ¶ 13.  Counsel also conducted a series of depositions spanning 
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the country from Los Angeles to Buffalo.  Id. at ¶ 14.  Counsel engaged and coordinated efforts of 

three separate experts, two of which were critical for trial purposes.  Id. at ¶ 15. Counsel also 

prepared for and participated in an eight day non-jury trial.  Id. at ¶ 16. 

More specifically, attorneys at GTG completed the following tasks during the relevant time 

period: 

1. Consulted with the Plaintiff to formulate and implement trial strategies; 

2. Participated in pre-trial conferences and hearings; 

3. Compiled and synthesized information and documents related to the action, 
including documents requested from, and the resolutions of multiple disputes 
regarding, Superpumper’s lender, BBVA Compass; Morabito’s former counsel, 
Dennis Vacco, Garry Graeber, and Sujata Yalamachili; Morabito’s former 
accountant, Stanton Bernstein; and American International Group (AIG). 

4.  Prepared for and participated in the depositions of Stanton Bernstein, 
Dennis Vacco, and two depositions of the law firm of Hodgson Russ, all of which 
occurred out-of-state; 

5. Prosecuted and defended motions in state and court to compel documents 
from Edward Bayuk and address privilege issues raised in, and attempts to quash, 
the Hodgson Russ depositions; 

6. Drafted an extensive motion for summary judgment which included 
preparing a detailed separate statement of facts; 

7. Drafted multiple stipulations related to procedural issues in the state court;  

8. Prepared and designated a list of 224 exhibits for Plaintiff’s use at trial, and 
analyzed a combined list of 299 total exhibits for admissibility and use issues; 

9. Prepared for and participated in an eight-day non-jury trial consisting of 
nine live witnesses, including four designated experts; 

10. Designated initial and rebuttal testimony for eight witnesses for which 
testimony was presented through deposition or video during trial; 

11. Analyzed and briefed various evidentiary issues raised during trial on 
accelerated basis; 

12. Prepared for and participated in full-day closing arguments; 

13. Analyzed trial testimony and exhibits to prepare extensive 62-page 
proposed findings of facts and conclusions of law in support of proposed judgment;  

14. Briefed, prosecuted, and defended three motions in limine related to trial, 
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including potentially case dispositive motions filed by Defendants; 

15. Briefed and argued a post-trial to reopen evidence and introduce payment 
records previously withheld during discovery evidencing a crucial component of 
the case. 

16. Performed other necessary legal services in connection with the prosecution 
of the action.   

See id., ¶ 17. 

        In total, attorneys at GTG spent 2,050.9 hours since the Offer of Judgment conducting the 

above tasks, finalizing discovery, and preparing for trial, which totals $731,116.  Id. at ¶ 18, 

Exhibit 4.  The hourly fee average amounts to $356.49 per hour which is abundantly reasonable 

given the skill required and result obtained.   Id. at ¶ 19.  As the foregoing professional services 

performed by GTG were necessary and appropriate and required significant time and work to 

complete, the  requested fees are reasonable and should be awarded. 

c. GTG was successful in obtaining a favorable result for Plaintiff. 

Through GTG’s diligence, Plaintiff was able to obtain a judgment properly reflecting the 

substantial assets that were fraudulently transferred.  As GTG was successful in obtaining the 

judgment, GTG has obtained a favorable result and an award of fees in justified. 

C. PLAINTIFF SHOULD BE AWARDED COSTS IN THE AMOUNT OF $111,512.54 
INCURRED SINCE JUNE 1, 2016.

NRS 18.005 defines those costs generally recoverable by a prevailing party, including:  

-Clerks’ fees 

-Reasonable costs for telecopies; 

-Reasonable costs for photocopies; 

-Any other reasonable and necessary expense incurred in connection 
with the action, including reasonable and necessary expenses for 
computerized services for legal research. 

NRS 18.005(1), (11), (12), and (17). 

In the Memorandum of Costs attached hereto as Exhibit 5, Plaintiff has detailed costs in 

the total amount of $154,942.24 for prosecution of the case. These costs are to be awarded under 

NRS 18.005.  The rejection of the Offer of Judgment presents a separate and independent basis for 
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an award of costs since June 1, 2016. Of the total fees requested in the Memorandum of Costs, 

$111,512.54 were incurred after June 1, 2016. See Pilatowicz Decl., ¶ 20. Even without application 

of NRS 18.005 Plaintiff is entitled to an award of costs in the amount of $111,512.54 as a result 

of the rejection of the Offer of Judgment. 

D. DEFENDANTS ARE ENTITLED TO A CREDIT OF $8,128.67 FOR PRIOR 
SANCTIONS PAID. 

Through various motions in this action, the Court has awarded Plaintiff sanctions that have 

been paid by Defendants and should be applied to offset the amount owed to Plaintiff as a result 

of fees awarded.  Specifically, on March 13, 2017, the Court ordered Bayuk to pay $1,664.50 in 

connection with Trustee’s application for order to show cause in connection with Bayuk’s refusal 

to produce insurance documents.  Pilatowicz Decl.,  ¶ 20. On December 7, 2017, the Court entered 

an Order Regarding Discovery Commissioner’s Recommendation for Order Dated August 17, 

2017, in which the Court confirmed the following sanctions related to the Defendants’ improper 

termination of the Hodgson Russ deposition: attorney’s fees and costs of the court reporter incurred 

for the July deposition of Hodgson Russ ($1,104.00) and travel costs associated with the 

rescheduled Hodgson Russ Deposition ($651.67), but remanding the award for the amount of 

sanctions in connection with the discovery disputes.  Id. at ¶ 21. On January 5, 2018, the State 

Court entered a Confirming Order, confirming the Recommendation for Order entered by the State 

Court discovery commissioner in which the Court ordered Defendants to pay $4,708.50 in 

connection with the discovery dispute fees.  Id. at ¶ 22. In total, Defendants have paid $8,128.67 

in sanctions since June 1, 2016, which amount should be deducted for the total award of fees and 

costs. 

. . . 

. . . 

. . . 
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IV. 
CONCLUSION 

Based on the foregoing, plaintiff respectfully requests that Defendants be ordered to pay 

Plaintiff's attorneys' fees in the amount of $773,116 and costs in the amount of $111,512.54 

pursuant to NRCP 68 and NRS 18.005, less $8,128.67 in sanctions already paid, which total 

$884,628.54. 

Dated this 12th day of April, 2019. 

GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP 

_/s/ Teresa Pilatowicz_______________
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ. 
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ. 
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ. 
650 White Drive, Ste. 100 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119 
Telephone 725-777-3000 
Counsel for Plaintiff 

AFFIRMATION

Pursuant to NRS 239B.030 

The undersigned does hereby affirm that the preceding document does not contain the  

social security number of any person. 

Dated this 12th day of April, 2019. 

GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP 

_/s/ Teresa Pilatowicz_______________ 
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ. 
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ. 
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ. 
650 White Drive, Ste. 100 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119 
Telephone 725-777-3000 
Counsel for Plaintiff 
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INDEX OF EXHIBITS 

Exhibit Description Pages2

1 Declaration of Teresa M. Pilatowicz In Support of Plaintiff’s 
Application for Attorney’s Fees and Costs Pursuant to NRCP 68 5 

2 Plaintiff’s Offer of Judgment to Defendants 6 

3 Defendant’s Rejection of Offer of Judgment by Plaintiff 1 

4 Log of time entries from June 1, 2016 to present 56 

5 Plaintiff’s Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements 30 

2 Exhibit pagination excludes exhibit slip sheets.  
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE  

I certify that I am an employee of GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP, and that on this 

date, pursuant to NRCP 5(b), I am serving a true and correct copy of the foregoing 

APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES AND COSTS PURSUANT TO NRCP 68 

on the parties as set forth below: 

XXX  Placing an original or true copy thereof in a sealed envelope placed for collection 
and mailing in the United States Mail, Reno, Nevada, postage prepaid, following 
ordinary business practices addressed as follows: 

Edward Bayuk, individually and as Trustee for the 
Edward William Bayuk Living Trust dated August 13, 2009 
668 N. Pacific Coast Highway, #517 
Laguna Beach, CA 92651

Salvatore R. Morabito 
10645 N. Tatum Blvd. #200-626 
Phoenix, AZ 95028 

Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc. 
10645 N. Tatum Blvd. #200-626 
Phoenix, AZ 95028

Superpumper, Inc. 
14631 N. Scottsdale Road, #125 
Scottsdale, AZ 85254-2711

Edward Bayuk, individually and as Trustee for the 
Edward William Bayuk Living Trust dated August 13, 2009 
371 El Camino Del Mar 
Laguna Beach, CA 92651

   Certified Mail, Return Receipt Requested 

   Via Facsimile (Fax) 

    Via E-Mail 

   Placing an original or true copy thereof in a sealed envelope and causing the same 
to be personally Hand Delivered 

   Federal Express (or other overnight delivery) 

   X   By using the Court’s CM/ECF Electronic Notification System addressed to: 

Frank C. Gilmore, Esq. Lindsay L. Liddell, Esq. 
E-mail: fgilmore@rssblaw.com E-mail: lliddell@rssblaw.com

Dated this 12th day of April, 2019. 

 /s/ Kelli Wightman  
An Employee of GARMAN TURNER  
GORDON LLP
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1520 
GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP 
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ. 
Nevada Bar No. 6454 
E-mail:  eturner@gtg.legal  
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ. 
Nevada Bar No. 9605 
E-mail:  tpilatowicz@gtg.legal 
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ. 
Nevada Bar No. 11588 
E-mail:  ghamm@gtg.legal  
650 White Drive, Ste. 100 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119 
Telephone 725-777-3000 
Counsel to Plaintiff 

IN THE SECOND JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT OF 

THE STATE OF NEVADA, IN AND FOR THE COUNTY OF WASHOE 

WILLIAM A. LEONARD, Trustee for the 
Bankruptcy Estate of Paul Anthony 
Morabito, 

Plaintiff, 

vs. 

SUPERPUMPER, INC., an Arizona 
corporation; EDWARD BAYUK, 
individually and as Trustee of the EDWARD 
WILLIAM BAYUK LIVING TRUST; 
SALVATORE MORABITO, and individual; 
and SNOWSHOE PETROLEUM, INC., a 
New York corporation, 

Defendants. 

CASE NO.:  CV13-02663 

DEPT. NO.:  4 

DECLARATION OF TERESA M. 
PILATOWICZ IN SUPPORT OF 
PLAINTIFF’S APPLICATION FOR 
ATTORNEYS’ FEES AND COSTS 
PURSUANT TO NRCP 68 

I, Teresa M. Pilatowicz, state that: 

1. I am over the age of eighteen (18) years and competent to testify on the matters set 

forth herein.  

2. At all relevant times, I have been of counsel with the law firm of Garman Turner 

Gordon LLP (“GTG”), counsel for Plaintiff William A. Leonard (“Plaintiff”). In such capacity, I 

have direct and personal knowledge of the matters set forth herein and know them to be true. 
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3. I am submitting this Declaration in support of Plaintiff’s Application for Attorneys’ 

Fees and Costs pursuant to NRCP 68 (the “Application”). 

4. GTG’s rates are reasonable in the light of the high quality and specialized nature of 

the services being provided. Additionally, GTG’s rates are consistent with the rates comparable 

attorneys charge in the current market, and are the customary hourly rates charged in commercial 

litigation matters. 

5. I am familiar with GTG’s work and billing practices.  Except as otherwise 

indicated, all of the facts set forth in this Declaration are based upon my personal knowledge of 

GTG’s operations and finances, information learned from my review of relevant documents, and 

information supplied to me by other employees of the firm.  If called upon to testify as to the 

content of this Declaration, I could and would do so. 

6. I performed the largest amount of work on this  matter. I graduated from the 

University of Arizona James E. Rogers College of Law in 2005. I have 14 years of experience as 

an attorney.  My hourly rate for this matter is $365, which represents a discount for my normal 

hourly rate during the majority of the case.  Specifically, from 2016 through January 1, 2019,  my 

standard hourly rate was $385 and since January 1, 2019,  I have billed $400 per hour. I have been 

identified as a “rising star,” and my rates are consistent with market rates for attorneys with similar 

years and experience.

7. Erika Pike Turner is a partner at GTG with over 20 years of experience in 

commercial litigation. She graduated from American University College of Law in 2017.  Her 

market rate is $495 per hour, which is less than many others in the market with similar experience 

charge. She is well respected within the legal community and her skills as an advocate are well 

known. Ms. Turner is consistently recognized as a top lawyer in the state. 

8. Gabrielle Hamm graduated from Georgetown University School of Law in 2003.  

Ms. Hamm’s hourly to rate is $385 per hour.  She possesses 15 years of experience as an attorney. 

She has been identified as a “rising star,” and her rates are consistent with market rates for attorneys 

with similar years and experience 
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9. The remaining attorneys that participated in the prosecution on more discrete tasks, 

Gerald Gordon, Erick Gjerdingen, Mark Weisenmiller, Stephen Davis, and Andrew Dunning, are 

likewise skilled attorneys with hourly rates commensurate with their years and proactive and 

experience. 

10. On May 31, 2016, Plaintiff made Defendants an offer of judgment, whereby 

Plaintiff would take judgment against Defendants in the amount of $3,000,000, allocated equally 

between the Defendants.  Attached to the Application as Exhibit 2 is a true and correct copy of 

the offer of judgment made by Plaintiff.  

11. On June 15, 2016, Defendants expressly rejected the Offer of Judgment. A true and 

correct copy of Defendants’ rejection is attached to the Application as Exhibit 3.

12. For much of the five years in the which this case was pending, attorneys with GTG 

were engaged in efforts to extract the relevant factual information from Defendants who 

consistently, even post-trial, sought to shield the discovery of the same.  

13. The discovery involved review of hundreds of thousands of pages of documents 

obtained via requests, subpoenas, and court orders.   

14. Counsel also conducted a series of depositions spanning the country from Los 

Angeles to Buffalo.   

15. Counsel engaged and coordinated efforts of three separate experts, two of which 

were critical for trial purposes.   

16.  Counsel also prepared for and participated in an eight day non-jury trial.   

17. More specifically, attorneys at GTG completed the following tasks since June 1, 

2016: 

1. Consulted with the Plaintiff to formulate and implement trial strategies; 

2. Participated in pre-trial conferences and hearings; 

3. Compiled and synthesized information and documents related to the action, 
including documents requested from, and the resolutions of multiple disputes 
regarding, Superpumper’s lender, BBVA Compass; Morabito’s former counsel, 
Dennis Vacco, Garry Graeber, and Sujata Yalamachili; Morabito’s former 
accountant, Stanton Bernstein; and American International Group (AIG). 

8388



1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28
Garman Turner Gordon

650 White Dr., Suite 100 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119 

(725) 777-3000  
4 

4.  Prepared for and participated in the depositions of Stanton Bernstein, 
Dennis Vacco, and two depositions of the law firm of Hodgson Russ, all of which 
occurred out-of-state; 

5. Prosecuted and defended motions in state and court to compel documents 
from Edward Bayuk and address privilege issues raised in, and attempts to quash, 
the Hodgson Russ depositions; 

6. Drafted an extensive motion for summary judgment which included 
preparing a detailed separate statement of facts; 

7. Drafted multiple stipulations related to procedural issues in the state court;  

8. Prepared and designated a list of 224 exhibits for Plaintiff’s use at trial, and 
analyzed a combined list of 299 total exhibits for admissibility and use issues; 

9. Prepared for and participated in an eight-day non-jury trial consisting of 
nine live witnesses, including four designated experts; 

10. Designated initial and rebuttal testimony for eight witnesses for which 
testimony was presented through deposition or video during trial; 

11. Analyzed and briefed various evidentiary issues raised during trial on 
accelerated basis; 

12. Prepared for and participated in full-day closing arguments; 

13. Analyzed trial testimony and exhibits to prepare extensive 62-page 
proposed findings of facts and conclusions of law in support of proposed judgment;  

14. Briefed, prosecuted, and defended three motions in limine related to trial, 
including potentially case dispositive motions filed by Defendants; 

15. Briefed and argued a post-trial to reopen evidence and introduce payment 
records previously withheld during discovery evidencing a crucial component of 
the case. 

16. Performed other necessary legal services in connection with the prosecution 
of the action. 

18. In total, attorneys at GTG spent 2,050.9 hours since the Offer of Judgment 

conducting the above tasks, finalizing discovery, and preparing for trial, which totals $731,116.  

The hourly fee average amounts to $356.48 per hour which is abundantly reasonable given the 

skill required and result obtained.   Such fees are reasonable and were necessary for the prosecution 

of the above-captioned case. 
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19. Attached to the Application as Exhibit 4 is a true and correct copy of the time 

entries that were actually and necessarily billed to Defendant from June1, 2016 to present. 

20. On the total fees requested in the Memorandum of Costs attached to the Application 

as Exhibit 5, $111,512.54 were incurred after June 1, 2016.  

21. On March 13, 2017, the Court ordered Bayuk to pay $1,664.50 in connection with 

Trustee’s application for order to show cause in connection with Bayuk’s refusal to produce 

insurance documents.   

22. On December 7, 2017, the State Court entered an Order Regarding Discovery 

Commissioner’s Recommendation for Order Dated August 17, 2017, in which the Court confirmed 

the following sanctions related to the Defendants’ improper termination of the Hodgson Russ 

deposition: attorney’s fees and costs of the court reporter incurred for the July deposition of 

Hodgson Russ ($1,104.00) and travel costs associated with the rescheduled Hodgson Russ 

Deposition ($651.67), but remanding the award for the amount of sanctions in connection with the 

discovery disputes.   

23. On January 5, 2018, the Court entered a Confirming Order, confirming the 

Recommendation for Order entered by the discovery commissioner in which the Court ordered 

Defendants to pay $4,708.50 in connection with the discovery dispute fees.   

I declare under penalty of perjury under the law of the State of Nevada that the foregoing 

is true and correct.  

Executed this 12th day of April, 2019. 

/s/ Teresa Pilatowicz  
 TERESA M. PILATOWICZ 
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FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL
6/1/2016 0.1 $365.00 Correspondence to client regarding deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/1/2016 0.3 $365.00

Multiple correspondence to W. Leonard (.1), F.
Gilmore (.1), and A. Wright regarding Bernstein
deposition (.1) $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/6/2016 0.2 $365.00
Call to A. Wright regarding Bernstein deposition;
Correspondence regarding same. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/7/2016 0.6 $365.00

Analysis of discovery status and remaining
discovery; Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding
same. $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/7/2016 0.1 $365.00
Draft notice of continued deposition of Stanton
Bernstein. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/7/2016 0.8 $365.00
Commence reviewing documents produced in
adversary. $292.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/8/2016 0.4 $365.00
Analysis of discovery deadlines and remaining
depositions. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/9/2016 1 $365.00
Review documents disclosed by Bayuk and
Meadows Trust in adversary proceeding. $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/13/2016 0.6 $365.00

Review and analysis of order denying motion to
quash (.5); Correspondence to client regarding same
(.1) $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/13/2016 0.4 $365.00 Strategize regarding $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/13/2016 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to A. Wright and F. Gilmore
regarding Bernstein deposition. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/14/2016 1.7 $365.00
Further analysis of additional documents produced
in bankruptcy case. $620.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/15/2016 0.1 $365.00 Amended notice of Bernstein depo. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/15/2016 0.2 $365.00
Review and analysis of letter rejecting offer of
judgment. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/15/2016 0.1 $365.00 Review status of expert payment. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
6/20/2016 0.4 $365.00 Review status of Vacco documents. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/20/2016 0.2 $365.00
Multiple correspondence to A. Wright regarding
Bernstein depo and payment of expenses. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/20/2016 0.6 $365.00 Further review Bernstein docs. $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/21/2016 0.3 $365.00
Review status of Vacco production; Correspondence
to Murtha regarding same. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/21/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Burke regarding Vacco
deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/21/2016 0.3 $365.00 Strategize regarding $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
6/22/2016 0.2 $365.00 Conference with J. McGovern regarding status. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/22/2016 0.7 $365.00
Review recent bankruptcy filings regarding

$255.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/23/2016 0.2 $365.00
Review and analysis from J. Murtha regarding

$73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
6/24/2016 0.7 $365.00 Draft fifth stipulation to extend discovery. $255.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/56
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FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

6/24/2016 0.4 $365.00
Research regarding procedures for discovery
commissioner recommendations. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/24/2016 0.2 $365.00
Review Bernstein privilege log and correspondence
to F. Gilmore regarding same. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/24/2016 1.2 $365.00 Further research regarding $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
6/27/2016 0.2 $365.00 Attention to expert payment issues. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
6/27/2016 0.4 $365.00 Review and analysis of $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/27/2016 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Burke regarding Vacco
deposition. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/28/2016 0.6 $365.00
Review revisions to stipulation to extend discovery
(.2); Review and analysis of withheld documents (.5) $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/29/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to J. Murtha regarding Vacco
documents. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/30/2016 0.2 $385.00 Conference with T. Pilatowicz regarding $77.00 Gabby Hamm

6/30/2016 0.2 $365.00 Strategize with G. Hamm regarding $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/30/2016 0.3 $365.00
Review and analysis of multiple correspondence
from J. Murtha regarding $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/1/2016 0.1 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from J.
McGovern regarding status. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/1/2016 1.2 $365.00 Commence review of Vacco documents. $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/1/2016 0.4 $365.00
Review and analysis of Bernstein e-mails (.3);
Correspondence to A. Wright regarding same (.1) $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/5/2016 0.1 $365.00 Attention to payment to professionals. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/5/2016 0.4 $365.00
Call with Kevin Burke regarding Vacco deposition
and documents. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/5/2016 1.9 $365.00 Review and analysis of $693.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/6/2016 4.3 $365.00 Further review and analysis of $1,569.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/7/2016 0.1 $365.00 Correspondence to K. Burke regarding Vacco order. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/7/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to A. Wright regarding document
production. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/7/2016 0.1 $365.00
Review order on discovery commissioner
recommendations. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/7/2016 0.6 $365.00 Further review Vacco documents. $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/8/2016 0.1 $365.00 Call to Kevin Burke regarding Vacco documents. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/8/2016 2.7 $365.00
Further review of Vacco documents and summary
and analysis of same. $985.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/56
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FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

7/11/2016 0.3 $365.00 Draft correspondence to client regarding $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/11/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Burke regarding Vacco
deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/13/2016 3.1 $365.00
Review and analyze documents produced from
Vacco produced by Gilmore. $1,131.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/13/2016 0.4 $365.00 Call with Frank Gilmore regarding trial continuance. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/14/2016 0.8 $365.00

Correspondence to/from J. Murtha regarding
deposition scheduling (.1); Correspondence with
same regarding $292.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/15/2016 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence with F. Gilmore regarding trial
continuance. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/15/2016 0.3 $365.00 Correspondence to J. Murtha regarding $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
7/18/2016 1.1 $365.00 Draft Stipulated Motion to Continue Trial. $401.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/18/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence with A. Wright regarding Bernstein
deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/19/2016 0.6 $365.00

Finalize Stipulated Motion to Continue; Draft
Notice of Submissions; Correspondence to F.
Gilmore regarding same. $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/20/2016 0.2 $365.00 Draft order on stipulated motion to continue. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
7/21/2016 0.4 $365.00 Address payment of professionals. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/21/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to A. Wright regarding Bernstein
deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/21/2016 0.3 $365.00 Commence review of $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
7/22/2016 0.7 $365.00 Review Murtha letter regarding $255.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/22/2016 0.1 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from Court
regarding stipulation for continuance. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/22/2016 1.3 $365.00 Further review Vacco documents. $474.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/26/2016 0.2 $365.00
Draft trial setting application; Correspondence with
F. Gilmore regarding same. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/27/2016 0.2 $365.00 Call with J. Murtha regarding Vacco production. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
7/27/2016 1.6 $365.00 Review and analysis of $584.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
7/29/2016 0.3 $365.00 Review and analysis of $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/4/2016 1.3 $365.00 Review and analysis of SPI NO PAM production. $474.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/10/2016 0.2 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from J.
Murtha regarding $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/10/2016 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to/from Kevin Burke regarding
status of production. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/12/2016 0.2 $365.00 Review documents regarding Vacco for deposition. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
8/18/2016 0.6 $365.00 Telephonic trial setting (.4); $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
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FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL
Correspondence to client and witnesses regarding
same (.2)

8/29/2016 0.2 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from J.
Murtha regarding $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/1/2016 0.2 $385.00
Review discovery decision regarding insurance
policies. $77.00 Gabby Hamm

9/7/2016 0.7 $365.00 Draft motion to continue trial and order thereon. $255.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
9/8/2016 0.3 $365.00 Finalize stipulation motion to continue. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/9/2016 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to and from J. Murtha regarding .

) $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
9/14/2016 5.4 $365.00 Commence preparing summary of $1,971.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/16/2016 0.2 $365.00
Review and analysis of correspondence from F.
Gilmore regarding insurance documents. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/16/2016 1.1 $365.00 Further prepare summary of $401.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/16/2016 0.1 $385.00
Review of emails regarding Bayuk insurance
documents. $38.50 Gabby Hamm

9/19/2016 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to/from Court regarding resetting
trial date. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/19/2016 0.8 $365.00

Prepare trial setting form (.2); participate in trial
setting (.2); Multiple correspondence to client and
witnesses regarding trial date (.3); Correspondence
to F. Gilmore regarding conflicts (.1) $292.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/19/2016 0.5 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from F.
Gilmore regarding Bayuk insurance documents. $182.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/19/2016 3 $365.00 Further review discovery to create $1,095.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/20/2016 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence from F. Gilmore; Correspondence
to T. Clements regarding trial date. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/20/2016 0.2 $365.00
Review and analysis of correspondence from F.
Gilmore regarding insurance documents. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/20/2016 0.1 $385.00
Review of response by T. Pilatowicz to Frank
Gilmore regarding insurance documents. $38.50 Gabby Hamm

9/21/2016 4.2 $365.00 Further review discovery to create $1,533.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/22/2016 0.3 $365.00
Correspondence to Trustee and witnesses regarding
trial date. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/22/2016 0.3 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding insurance
documents. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/22/2016 4.3 $365.00 Further review $1,569.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/23/2016 0.2 $365.00 Conference with Tim Herbst regarding trial date. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
9/23/2016 0.9 $365.00 Further review discovery regarding $328.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
9/27/2016 3.9 $365.00 Further review $1,423.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/27/2016 0.4 $365.00
Review and analysis of correspondence from J.
Murtha regarding $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
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FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL
9/28/2016 2.7 $365.00 Commence reviewing $985.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
9/29/2016 0.8 $365.00 Further review discovery. $292.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
9/30/2016 0.3 $365.00 Review notices of deposition for October. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
10/3/2016 2.8 $365.00 Review $1,022.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/4/2016 0.3 $365.00
Review and analysis of correspondence from F.
Gilmore regarding insurance claims. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/4/2016 0.2 $365.00
Research and respond to correspondence from G.
Gordon regarding $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/5/2016 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to A. Wright regarding Bernstein
documents and deposition. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/5/2016 1.2 $365.00 Further review $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
10/6/2016 2.7 $365.00 Review $985.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/6/2016 0.6 $365.00
Analysis of insurance policy responses and court
intervention for same. $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/7/2016 3.9 $365.00 Commence reviewing $1,423.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/10/2016 0.6 $365.00 Further research and analysis regarding $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/12/2016 1 $155.00

Produce out pdf format from Logikcull of all
documents bates stamped Gursey00001 -
Gursey023414. Upload to Box platform and send
link to T. Pilatowicz. $155.00 Michele Pori

10/13/2016 1.2 $365.00
Commence reviewing additional documents
provided from Dennis Vacco. $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/17/2016 2.3 $365.00
Further review additional document production for
Vacco. $839.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/18/2016 3.6 $365.00 Review $1,314.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/18/2016 6 $365.00
Further review and analysis of additional documents
produced by Vacco. $2,190.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/18/2016 0.4 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding Bayuk
insurance documents. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/19/2016 0.8 $365.00 Further attention to insurance issues. $292.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/24/2016 1.1 $365.00
Analysis of deadlines as a result of change in trial
date and strategize for same. $401.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/24/2016 4.4 $365.00

Further review documents produced regarding
updating disclosures (3.3); Commence drafting
fourth disclosures (1.1) $1,606.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/25/2016 0.5 $365.00
Prepare for (.2) and participate in (.3) call with F.
Gilmore regarding insurance documents. $182.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/25/2016 7 $365.00 Further review and analysis of $2,555.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
10/26/2016 1 $365.00 Further prepare fourth supplemental disclosure. $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/26/2016 3.6 $365.00 Review additional discovery needed. $1,314.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
10/26/2016 2.7 $365.00 Research regarding $985.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/2/2016 1.1 $155.00
Produce out all Lippes documents from the
Logikcull platform for production. $170.50 Michele Pori
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FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

11/4/2016 0.3 $155.00

Review docket for GTG's First Interim Fee
Application and supporting documents in order to
prepare for GTG's Second Interim Fee Application. $46.50 Michele Pori

11/4/2016 0.2 $365.00 Commence preparation of second fee application. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/7/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to A. Wright regarding Bernstein
deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/7/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Burke regarding Vacco
deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/9/2016 0.9 $365.00 Review time entries for second fee application. $328.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/9/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to Wright regarding Bernstein
production. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/9/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding Bernstein
deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/10/2016 1.2 $290.00
Research in connection with Bayuk OSC
application. $348.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/10/2016 3.6 $290.00
Drafting application for order to show cause re
Bauyk discovery dispute. $1,044.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/10/2016 7.4 $365.00
Commence preparing discovery analysis and
completion strategy. $2,701.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/10/2016 0.3 $365.00
Confer with E. Gjerdingen regarding discovery
motions. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/10/2016 1 $385.00
Meeting with T. Pilatowicz regarding outstanding
discovery issues and strategy. $385.00 Gabby Hamm

11/11/2016 1.6 $290.00 Review and analysis of Vacco production. $464.00 Erick Gjerdingen
11/11/2016 4.2 $290.00 Research and analysis $1,218.00 Erick Gjerdingen
11/11/2016 1.3 $290.00 Drafting NY show cause action application. $377.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/11/2016 6.5 $365.00
Further prepare discovery analysis and completion
strategy. $2,372.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/13/2016 0.6 $290.00
Revise Pilatowicz Dec re Bayuk app for order to
show cause. $174.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/13/2016 0.5 $290.00 Revise order to show cause re Bayuk. $145.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/14/2016 0.1 $365.00
Call and correspondence to K. Burke regarding
Vacco production. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/14/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to A. Wright regarding Bernstein
deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/14/2016 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding discovery
schedule. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/14/2016 3.7 $290.00 Drafting petition re Vacco compel action. $1,073.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/14/2016 2.2 $290.00
Drafting application for order to show cause re
Vacco. $638.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/14/2016 1.8 $290.00
Drafting affidavit re application for Vacco order to
show cause. $522.00 Erick Gjerdingen
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June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

11/14/2016 1.1 $290.00
Drafting order to show cause re Vacco compel
hearing. $319.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/14/2016 1.7 $365.00 Draft and finalize fourth supplemental disclosure. $620.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/14/2016 2.1 $365.00
Further analysis of final discovery schedule; Draft
correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding same. $766.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/14/2016 2 $ -
Organization of documents for final discovery
review (NO CHARGE). $ - Teresa Pilatowicz

11/15/2016 1.6 $290.00 Revise Vacco compel documents. $464.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/15/2016 1.8 $365.00
Further review documents provided by Gursey
regarding final discovery. $657.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/15/2016 1.2 $365.00
Review and revise motion to compel regarding
insurance documents. $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/15/2016 1.8 $365.00

Review and revise application to show cause/compel
in New York regarding Vacco documents (1.6);
Correspondence to client regarding status (.2). $657.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/15/2016 1 $ -
Attention to status of outstanding discovery items
(NO CHARGE). $ - Teresa Pilatowicz

11/16/2016 0.3 $290.00
Correspondence exchange with NY counsel re
Vacco docs. $87.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/16/2016 0.2 $365.00 Confer with R. Ayala regarding exhibit binders. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/16/2016 0.5 $365.00
Initial review of supplemental Bernstein production
in bankruptcy matter. $182.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/16/2016 0.4 $290.00 Call with NY counsel. $116.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/16/2016 0.9 $290.00
Prepare correspondence to NY counsel re compel
proceedings. $261.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/16/2016 0.7 $290.00 Research re Bayuk compel matter. $203.00 Erick Gjerdingen
11/16/2016 0.5 $290.00 Revise Bayuk compel motion. $145.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/16/2016 0.1 $290.00
Draft correspondence to NY counsel re retention
issues. $29.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/16/2016 0.4 $365.00 Analysis of $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/17/2016 0.4 $365.00
Draft subpoena documents for Compass person most
knowledge. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/17/2016 0.1 $290.00 Review Bayuk exhibits. $29.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/17/2016 0.4 $365.00
Final review of order to show cause regarding Bayuk
insurance documents. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/17/2016 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Burke regarding intent to file
motion to compel/OSC in New York. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/17/2016 0.2 $290.00 Final revisions to Bayuk Motion for OSC. $58.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/17/2016 0.1 $290.00
Correspondence to NY counsel re final demand on
Mr. Burke re Vacco deposition. $29.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/17/2016 0.1 $290.00
Additional correspondence to NY counsel re compel
motion status. $29.00 Erick Gjerdingen
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DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL
11/17/2016 0.2 $290.00 Call with Vacco's counsel re compel. $58.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/17/2016 0.1 $290.00 Correspondence to NY counsel re Vacco status. $29.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/17/2016 0.3 $365.00
Review and analysis response from K. Burke; Call
to K. Burke regarding same. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/17/2016 0.4 $155.00
Receive CD of Bernstein documents. Upload same
to Logikcull platform for review of same. $62.00 Michele Pori

11/17/2016 3.5 $155.00

Receive final culled costs and fees for GTG's
Second Interim Fee Application. Begin and
complete drafting GTG's 2nd Interim Fee
Application pleading with all supporting exhibits
and declarations. Draft proposed Order Approving
GTG's Second Interim Fee. Application. $542.50 Michele Pori

11/18/2016 0.8 $290.00 Revise OSC app re Bayuk. $232.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/18/2016 0.1 $290.00
Draft correspondence to NY counsel re status of
Vacco compel motion. $29.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/18/2016 0.7 $365.00
Call with Kevin Burke regarding documents missing
from Superpumper production. $255.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/18/2016 0.1 $365.00 Call with J. Murtha regarding $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
11/18/2016 0.4 $365.00 Research regarding $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/21/2016 0.2 $ -
Finalize Bayuk order to show cause motion (NO
CHARGE). $ - Teresa Pilatowicz

11/21/2016 0.9 $365.00
Finalize Nevada subpoena, Arizona subpoena, and
Notice of Deposition for Compass. $328.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/21/2016 0.1 $365.00 Finalize Bernstein amended notice of deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/22/2016 0.3 $365.00
Multiple correspondence to and from F. Gilmore
regarding Compass subpoena. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/22/2016 0.1 $365.00
Call with G. Gordon regarding

. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/23/2016 0.1 $365.00
Review correspondence from F. Gilmore regarding
Compass subpoena. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/23/2016 0.1 $ -
Correspondence to/from J,. Murtha regarding

(NO CHARGE). $ - Teresa Pilatowicz

11/28/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding meet and
confer re: Compass subpoena. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/28/2016 0.2 $290.00 Review status of Vacco discovery. $58.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/28/2016 0.1 $290.00
Review correspondence from Burke re Vacco
discovery production. $29.00 Erick Gjerdingen

11/28/2016 0.2 $365.00
Attention to Compass subpoena service issues and
deposition scheduling issues. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/28/2016 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to and from K. Burke regarding
Vacco documents. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
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11/28/2016 0.2 $365.00 Conference with G. Gordon regarding $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
11/28/2016 0.3 $365.00 Research regarding pending deposition. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
11/28/2016 0.4 $365.00 Review Bayuk documents for exhibit binders. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/29/2016 0.2 $365.00
Telephone call with F. Gilmore for meet and confer
on Compass subpoena. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/29/2016 1.6 $365.00 Review and analysis of $584.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
11/29/2016 0.2 $365.00 Further research regarding pending deposition. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/30/2016 0.4 $365.00

Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding Compass
deposition (.2); Conference with Compass rep
regarding deposition (.2). $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/1/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to A. Wright confirming Bernstein
deposition with notice. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/1/2016 0.1 $365.00

Correspondence to K. Burke confirming Vacco
deposition with notice and reviewing status of
additional production. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/1/2016 0.1 $365.00 Review $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
12/5/2016 1.1 $365.00 Review $401.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/5/2016 0.3 $365.00
Phone call with Lisa at Compass Bank regarding
subpoena. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/7/2016 0.1 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from F.
Gilmore regarding Compass documents. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/7/2016 2.9 $365.00
Revise second interim fee application and
declarations. $1,058.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/7/2016 0.3 $365.00 Receive and analysis of $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/7/2016 2.4 $365.00

Revise exhibits for fee applications (1.1); Redact
work-product privileged entries as necessary (.9);
Research regarding redaction of fee applications
(.4). $876.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/7/2016 0.3 $365.00
Review Compass documents and correspondence to
L. Rios regarding documents for authentication. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/8/2016 1.8 $155.00

Receive marked up Exhibit 2 fees and Exhibit 3
expenses. Revise accordingly and redact all detailed
fees as noted. $279.00 Michele Pori

12/8/2016 7.2 $365.00 Commence reviewing and analysis of $2,628.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
12/8/2016 0.6 $385.00 Review of $231.00 Gabby Hamm

12/9/2016 0.9 $155.00

Revise GTG's 2nd Interim Fee Application and all
supporting exhibits and declarations based on
revised invoicing. $139.50 Michele Pori

12/9/2016 4.5 $365.00 Further review and analysis of $1,642.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
12/9/2016 0.1 $365.00 Correspondence to client regarding $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
12/12/2016 0.1 $365.00 Correspondence to J. Murtha $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
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12/12/2016 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore and L. Rios regarding
Compass deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/12/2016 0.1 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from M.
Weisenmiller $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/12/2016 7.2 $365.00 Further review and analysis of $2,628.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
12/13/2016 8 $365.00 Further review and analysis of $2,920.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
12/14/2016 5.4 $365.00 Further review and analysis of $1,971.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/15/2016 1 $365.00
Call with Trustee, W. Leonard, G. Gordon, and J.
Murtha regarding $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/15/2016 4.7 $365.00 Further review and analysis of $1,715.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/15/2016 1 $365.00
Call with J. Murtha, G. Gordon, and M.
Weisenmiller regarding $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/16/2016 3.9 $365.00

Further analysis of final discovery schedule; Draft
correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding same.

$1,423.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
12/16/2016 0.2 $365.00 Finalize fee application and related documents. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
12/19/2016 3 $365.00 Further review and analysis of . ) $1,095.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
12/20/2016 3.1 $365.00 Research and analysis regarding $1,131.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/20/2016 0.3 $365.00
Multiple correspondence with F. Gilmore and Lisa
Rios (Compass) regarding Compass deposition. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/20/2016 0.6 $365.00 Review and analysis of $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
12/20/2016 1 $365.00 Further analysis of $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/21/2016 0.2 $365.00

Correspondence to telephone call with L. Rios
Carroll regarding Compass deposition and COR
affidavit. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/21/2016 0.3 $365.00 Draft and finalize Fifth Supplemental Disclosure. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/21/2016 2.1 $365.00
Further review of documents for trial in light of e-
mails received and reviewed. $766.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/21/2016 3.5 $155.00

Remove all emails from 6/20/2013 forward from
Vacco email upload in Logikcull. Tag emails being
produced and save. Being production of 14,000
native emails and attachments in to pdf format with
bates numbers. Download production and save to
flash drive for delivery to opposing counsel. $542.50 Michele Pori

12/21/2016 2 $155.00

Produce out all separated emails from 6/20/2013
forward from Vacco email upload in Logikcull for
use in an "In Camera" submission to the court. $310.00 Michele Pori

12/21/2016 3 $365.00 Further review and analysis of $1,095.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/22/2016 0.1 $365.00
Call with Court and to F. Gilmore regarding setting
OSC for hearing. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/22/2016 0.3 $365.00 Commence drafting subpoena to Hodkins Russ. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
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12/23/2016 0.9 $365.00

Correspondence to and call with Court regarding
setting Order to Show Cause (.3); Review order on
same (.1); Analysis of procedure and status
following same (.4); Correspondence to Trustee
regarding same (.1). $328.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/23/2016 0.1 $365.00
Review motion for in camera review of e-mails;
Correspondence to J. Murtha regarding same. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/27/2016 0.3 $365.00 Commend drafting subpoena to Hodgson Russ. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/28/2016 1.7 $365.00
Commence researching and drafting reply in support
of Order to Show Cause. $620.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/28/2016 2.7 $365.00

Further draft and finalize all documents (subpoenas,
notices, commission and application) for Hodgson
Russ subpoena. $985.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/28/2016 0.1 $365.00
E-mail to Kevin Burke regarding status of additional
documents. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/29/2016 4.8 $365.00
Further draft and revise reply in support of Order to
Show Cause. $1,752.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/29/2016 0.6 $290.00 Revisions to reply re Order to Show Cause. $174.00 Erick Gjerdingen

12/30/2016 1.5 $365.00 Finalize reply in support of Order to Show Cause. $547.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/30/2016 0.2 $365.00
Review status of Hodson Russ subpoena and
service. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/3/2017 0.2 $365.00
Multiple calls with Ryan Hanna regarding service of
subpoena. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/3/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence from/to F. Gilmore and A. Wright
regarding Bernstein deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/3/2017 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to/from J. Murtha regarding

. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/3/2017 0.3 $155.00
Burn Lippes Supplemental production to flash drive
for transmittal to counsel. $46.50 Michele Pori

1/4/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding meet and
confer request. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/4/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Burke regarding status;
Review response to same. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/5/2017 0.1 $365.00 Review bankruptcy case filings re: $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/9/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to R. Hanna regarding Hodgson
service; Call with R. Hanna regarding same. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/9/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore and A. Wright
regarding outstanding depositions. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/9/2017 0.1 $365.00 Review $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/9/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Burke regarding discovery
status. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
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FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

1/9/2017 0.3 $365.00
Call with F. Gilmore regarding meet and confer for
Hodgson Russ and other deposition issues. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/10/2017 0.6 $365.00 Review $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/11/2017 0.2 $365.00

Correspondence to S. Yalamchili regarding
subpoena to Hodgson Russ (.1); Call from/to G.
Graeber regarding same (.1). $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/11/2017 0.3 $365.00
Call with G. Graeber of Hodgson Russ regarding
subpoena. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/12/2017 0.1 $365.00
Call to Kevin Carney at Hogsun Ross regarding
subpoena. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/12/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to/from J. Murtha regarding

$36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/12/2017 0.1 $365.00
Attention to correspondence from T. Monsour
regrading production of disclosed e-mails. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/16/2017 0.2 $365.00

Call with A. Wright regarding Bernstein deposition
(.1); Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding same
(.1). $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/17/2017 0.1 $365.00 Call with K. Burke regarding invoices; Draft $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/17/2017 0.4 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from F.
Gilmore regarding e-mails produced by Vacco. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/17/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to and from Court regarding OSC
hearing. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/17/2017 0.2 $365.00
Review settlement offer from F. Gilmore regarding
OSC; Draft correspondence to client regarding same. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/18/2017 0.1 $365.00 Strategy regarding settlement of pending matters. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/18/2017 0.9 $365.00

Review reply pleadings in support of in camera
review (.2) Draft and finalize declaration in support
for reply for motion for in camera review (.7). $328.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/18/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to Hodgson Russ counsel regarding
subpoena status. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/18/2017 1 $365.00
Commence preparing for OSC re: Bayuk discovery
order. $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/18/2017 1 $170.00
Upload all 29070 images from Lippes Supplemental
production for use in sending to opposing counsel. $170.00 Michele Pori

1/19/2017 0.4 $775.00
conf with TP re

. $310.00 Gerald Gordon

1/19/2017 2.8 $365.00 Working Flight, further prepare for hearing on OSC. $1,022.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
1/19/2017 3.8 $182.50 Travel from Reno to Phoenix (Half Rate). $693.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
1/19/2017 2.7 $365.00 Hearing on Order to Show Cause. $985.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
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FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

1/19/2017 0.6 $365.00 Summarize outcome of hearing on OSC for Trustee. $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/20/2017 0.2 $365.00
Coordinate collection of Hodgson Russ
correspondence. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/23/2017 1.3 $365.00 Further review $474.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/24/2017 0.3 $365.00

Finalize review of Sujata emails (.2);
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding Hodgson
Russ emails (.1). $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/24/2017 0.1 $365.00 Draft Notice of Continued Bernstein deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/24/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to A. Wright regarding continued
Bernstein deposition date. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/25/2017 0.4 $365.00
Commence drafting letter to Hodgson Russ
regarding waiver of privilege. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/25/2017 0.1 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from F.
Gilmore regarding Hodgson Russ deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/25/2017 0.2 $365.00 Call with W. Leonard regarding $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/26/2017 3.7 $365.00
Draft and finalize letter regarding privilege waiver
to Hodgson Russ. $1,350.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/27/2017 1.1 $290.00 Drafting AIG subpoena. $319.00 Erick Gjerdingen

1/27/2017 0.7 $365.00
Draft stipulation and order for extension of
discovery. $255.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/27/2017 0.2 $365.00
Draft notices of continued depositions for Vacco and
Hodgson Russ. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/27/2017 0.2 $365.00 Strategize regarding AIG subpoenas. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/27/2017 0.3 $365.00

Revise letter to Hogsun Russ regarding privilege
waiver (.2); Correspondence to client regarding
same (.1). $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/27/2017 0.4 $365.00 Review OSC hearing transcripts. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/30/2017 0.1 $365.00
Finalize letter to Hodgsun Russ regarding attorney-
client privilege. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/30/2017 0.1 $365.00
Finalize stipulation and order to extend discovery;
Draft correspondence to G. Gilmore regarding same. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/30/2017 1.6 $290.00 Research and analysis re $464.00 Erick Gjerdingen
1/30/2017 0.1 $290.00 Correspondence to S. Adams re $29.00 Erick Gjerdingen
1/30/2017 1.4 $290.00 Drafting AIG subpoena. $406.00 Erick Gjerdingen

1/30/2017 1.2 $290.00
Analysis re AIG successor/merger for purpose of
subpoena service. $348.00 Erick Gjerdingen

1/30/2017 0.1 $290.00
Review correspondence from S. Adams re

$29.00 Erick Gjerdingen
1/31/2017 0.7 $290.00 Revise AIG subpoena. $203.00 Erick Gjerdingen
1/31/2017 0.2 $290.00 Draft notice of subpoena to AIG. $58.00 Erick Gjerdingen
1/31/2017 0.3 $365.00 Review and revise AIG subpoena. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/31/2017 0.2 $365.00
Commence drafting memorandum of costs for OSC
hearing. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
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June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

2/1/2017 0.2 $365.00
Review and an analysis of correspondence from F.
Gilmore regarding insurance policies. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/1/2017 0.2 $365.00
Call with Kevin Burke regarding unredacted
invoices. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/1/2017 0.3 $365.00
Call with K. Burke and J. Murtha regarding status of
additional production and Vacco deposition. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/2/2017 1.8 $290.00
Drafting memorandum of costs for OSC and related
research. $522.00 Erick Gjerdingen

2/2/2017 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Burke regarding unredacted
invoice (.1); Review response to same (.1). $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/2/2017 0.1 $365.00
Review correspondence from J. Murtha to F.
Gilmore regarding letter re: insurance policies. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/3/2017 0.3 $290.00 Revise and finalize AIG subpoena. $87.00 Erick Gjerdingen

2/6/2017 0.6 $290.00
Review and revise correspondence regarding
discovery dispute to Bayuk counsel. $174.00 Erick Gjerdingen

2/6/2017 0.7 $290.00
Revise memorandum of fees and costs following
TMP comments. $203.00 Erick Gjerdingen

2/6/2017 0.7 $290.00 Drafting order approving fees and costs. $203.00 Erick Gjerdingen

2/6/2017 1.3 $365.00
Draft and finalize response to F. Gilmore regarding
insurance policies. $474.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/6/2017 0.3 $365.00
Review and revise memorandum of costs in support
of OSC. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/6/2017 1.6 $365.00 Review unredacted invoices from Lippes Mathias. $584.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/7/2017 0.3 $365.00

Call with Barry Breslow regarding memorandum of
fees and costs and offer (.1); Confer with Trustee
regarding same. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/7/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Kearney regarding Hodgson
Russ subpoena. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/9/2017 0.4 $365.00 $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
2/9/2017 0.2 $365.00 Draft response to offer regarding on OSC fees. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/10/2017 0.2 $365.00
Draft supplement disclosure regarding
representation of Biff in Mega-C. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/14/2017 0.2 $365.00
Finalize supplemental declaration for G. Gordon
regarding special counsel employment application. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/15/2017 0.2 $365.00
Review pre-trial scheduling order and strategize
regarding $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/20/2017 0.9 $365.00
Commence drafting reply in support of
memorandum of fees. $328.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/21/2017 3.1 $290.00 Draft reply in support of memorandum of fees. $899.00 Erick Gjerdingen

2/21/2017 2.3 $290.00 Research in connection with fee memorandum reply. $667.00 Erick Gjerdingen
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FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL
2/21/2017 1.2 $290.00 Revisions to fee memorandum reply. $348.00 Erick Gjerdingen

2/21/2017 0.6 $290.00 Draft Pilatowicz Dec re reply to fee memorandum. $174.00 Erick Gjerdingen
2/21/2017 0.4 $290.00 Prepare Pilatowicz Dec exhibits. $116.00 Erick Gjerdingen

2/21/2017 1.3 $365.00
Finalize reply in support of memorandum of fees
and costs. $474.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/22/2017 0.3 $365.00 Review unredacted invoices provided by K. Burke. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
2/24/2017 1.2 $365.00 Review and analysis of $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/27/2017 0.5 $290.00
Draft and circulate order approving gtg second
interim fee application. $145.00 Mark Weisenmiller

2/27/2017 0.2 $365.00 Call with J. Murtha regarding Lippex documents. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/27/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Kearney regarding status of
production. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

2/28/2017 3.8 $365.00
Further review correspondence from Vacco's office
regarding 2010 transfers. $1,387.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/1/2017 0.5 $290.00

Review correspondence from chambers on gtg fee
order, revise order, and email trustee and USTs
office regarding approval of the GTG fee order. $145.00 Mark Weisenmiller

3/1/2017 2.6 $365.00
Review and analysis of new discovery production
from Vacco. $949.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/1/2017 4 $365.00 Review $1,460.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
3/2/2017 0.8 $290.00 Follow up re AIG subpoena. $232.00 Erick Gjerdingen

3/2/2017 4.9 $365.00
Further review Vacco correspondence regarding
exhibits for case. $1,788.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/3/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence from and to K. Kearney regarding
Hodgsun Russ subpoena responses. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/6/2017 0.2 $365.00 Call with G. Gordon regarding $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/8/2017 0.2 $290.00
Correspondence exchange with S. Adams re

$58.00 Erick Gjerdingen

3/8/2017 4.2 $365.00
Review and analysis of documents produced by
Hodgson Russ. $1,533.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/8/2017 0.5 $170.00

Locate bates stamped versions of specific emails
from 2012. Transmit bates stamped versions to T.
Pilatowicz. $85.00 Michele Pori

3/9/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to and from K. Kearney regarding
document production. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/13/2017 0.4 $290.00 Call to AIG re subpoena. $116.00 Erick Gjerdingen
3/13/2017 0.3 $290.00 Call from AIG re subpoena. $87.00 Erick Gjerdingen
3/13/2017 0.2 $290.00 Draft follow up e-mail to AIG re subpoena. $58.00 Erick Gjerdingen
3/13/2017 0.4 $290.00 Call with TMP re $116.00 Erick Gjerdingen
3/13/2017 0.9 $290.00 Follow up research re $261.00 Erick Gjerdingen
3/13/2017 0.4 $775.00 review Superpumper document re $310.00 Gerald Gordon
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FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL
3/13/2017 0.2 $365.00 Call with J. Murtha regarding $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
3/13/2017 0.7 $365.00 Review and analysis of $255.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/14/2017 1.1 $170.00

Produce out from Logikcull platform additional
Lippes documents bates stamped
LMWF_SUPP109096 - 109835. $187.00 Michele Pori

3/14/2017 0.7 $365.00 Review and analysis of $255.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
3/16/2017 0.5 $365.00 Call with acct regarding $182.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/16/2017 0.3 $365.00
Draft correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding
discovery issues. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/16/2017 0.2 $365.00
Attention to correspondence from J. Murtha
regarding $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/17/2017 0.2 $290.00 Review subpoena response. $58.00 Erick Gjerdingen

3/17/2017 1 $365.00 Review and analysis of Nineteenth Supplemental $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/17/2017 0.7 $365.00
Research regarding trial scheduled upon judge
retirement $255.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/17/2017 0.1 $365.00
Review response from K. Kearney regarding
additional discovery from Hodgsun Russ. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/20/2017 1.3 $290.00
Draft letter regarding insufficiency of Fourteenth
Supplemental Disclosure. $377.00 Erick Gjerdingen

3/20/2017 0.1 $365.00 Correspondence to J. Murtha regarding $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/20/2017 0.3 $365.00

Finalize letter to F. Gilmore regarding insurance
production and deficiencies in same, as well as
Hopkins appraisal. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/20/2017 0.2 $365.00 Draft and finalize Sixth Supplemental production. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
3/20/2017 1 $365.00 Gather and analysis of documents for review. $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
3/20/2017 0.6 $365.00 Commence reviewing $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
3/21/2017 2 $365.00 Review v(.6). $730.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/22/2017 0.2 $365.00
Multiple correspondence with F. Gilmore and K.
Kearney regarding Hodson depositions. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/23/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to and from F. Gilmore and K.
Kearney regarding Hodgson Russ deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/24/2017 3.2 $365.00 Review $1,168.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/26/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Kearney and J. Murtha
regarding Hodgsun deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/27/2017 1.3 $365.00 Commence reviewing $474.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/27/2017 0.1 $ -
Correspondence from and to F. Gilmore regarding
sanction payment (NO CHARGE). $ - Teresa Pilatowicz

3/28/2017 0.2 $365.00
Draft deposition notices' of Vacco and Hodgsun
Russ. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/30/2017 2 $365.00 Commence reviewing $730.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/30/2017 0.3 $365.00
Briefly review additional production of insurance
documents from Bayuk. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
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June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019
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3/30/2017 0.8 $365.00 Additional research regarding $292.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/31/2017 2.1 $290.00
Review additional insurance documents produced by
Bayuk. $609.00 Erick Gjerdingen

3/31/2017 1 $365.00
Various conferences with G. Gordon and W.
Weisenmiller regarding $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/3/2017 1.7 $365.00

Further review Vacco correspondence regarding
Morabito e mails (.6); Commence reviewing
bankruptcy court transcript of hearing regarding
same (1.1). $620.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/5/2017 0.6 $290.00
Conference and analysis re discovery and insurance
issues. $174.00 Erick Gjerdingen

4/5/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Kearney regarding notice of
deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/5/2017 0.3 $365.00
Analysis of service requirements for Vacco;
Correspondence to C. Valentino regarding same. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/5/2017 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding insurance
documents and Hopkins appraisal. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/5/2017 0.1 $365.00 Correspondence regrading analysis of documents. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
4/6/2017 0.1 $290.00 E-mail to Seth Adams re $29.00 Erick Gjerdingen

4/6/2017 0.1 $290.00 Review response from Seth Adams re $29.00 Erick Gjerdingen
4/6/2017 0.4 $290.00 Conference re $116.00 Erick Gjerdingen

4/6/2017 0.8 $290.00
Drafting correspondence to Scott Miller at AIG re
subpoena non-response. $232.00 Erick Gjerdingen

4/6/2017 0.3 $365.00 Review and analysis of $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/7/2017 0.4 $290.00
Review Miller (AIG) response and return
correspondence. $116.00 Erick Gjerdingen

4/7/2017 1.9 $290.00 Research re s $551.00 Erick Gjerdingen
4/7/2017 0.4 $290.00 Review orders re insurance production. $116.00 Erick Gjerdingen

4/7/2017 0.5 $290.00
Drafting letter to Gilmore re supplemental
production. $145.00 Erick Gjerdingen

4/7/2017 0.3 $290.00
Conference call with Scott Miller AIG counsel re
subpoena. $87.00 Erick Gjerdingen

4/7/2017 2.6 $365.00
Review deposition testimony of S. Morabito in light
of recent state court discovery and analysis of same. $949.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/7/2017 0.3 $365.00 Attention to $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/7/2017 0.6 $365.00
Review research regarding (.4); Conference with
AIG attorney regarding same (.2). $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/10/2017 0.4 $365.00

Draft Nevada subpoena for continued Vacco
deposition (.2); Correspondence to Trustee and C.
Valentio regarding (.2). $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
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DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL
4/10/2017 0.8 $365.00 Review a $292.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/10/2017 0.2 $365.00
Attention to scheduling issues with Vacco and
Bernstein deposition. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/11/2017 0.3 $365.00
Finalize Vacco amended subpoenas and notice of
deposition. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/17/2017 0.1 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from J.
Murtha $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/18/2017 0.9 $365.00

Call regarding review of transactions (.4); Prepare
correspondence regarding follow up and additional
documents (.5). $328.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/18/2017 1.7 $365.00 Review $620.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/20/2017 0.2 $365.00

Correspondence to and from J. Murtha regarding ;
Correspondence to and from K. Kearney regarding
same. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/21/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding Hodgson
depo and references to Hopkins appraisal. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/24/2017 0.6 $365.00 Review $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/27/2017 0.1 $365.00

Review correspondence from Hodgson regarding
deposition; Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding
Hogson Depo and Hopkins appraisal. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/2/2017 0.4 $365.00
Review correspondence from F. Gilmore regarding
insurance documents and draft response to same. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/9/2017 0.1 $290.00
Review correspondence from S. Miller at AIG re
subpoena. $29.00 Erick Gjerdingen

5/11/2017 1.9 $365.00 Commence preparing for Bernstein deposition. $693.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/12/2017 0.4 $365.00
Call with F. Gilmore regarding outstanding
discovery issues. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/12/2017 2.8 $365.00 Further prepare for Bernstein deposition. $1,022.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
5/12/2017 0.3 $365.00 Call regarding . $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/15/2017 1.1 $365.00
Further review documents in preparation for
Bernstein deposition. $401.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/15/2017 0.4 $365.00 Review exhibits from prior Bernstein depositions. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/15/2017 1.4 $365.00 Commence drafting Bernstein deposition outline. $511.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/16/2017 8.6 $365.00
Further prepare for Bernstein deposition (6.6);
Working travel to L.A. for deposition (2.0). $3,139.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/17/2017 6.5 $365.00 Conduct Bernstein deposition. $2,372.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
5/17/2017 1.8 $365.00 Further prepare for Bernstein deposition. $657.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/17/2017 1.5 $182.50 Travel from Bernstein deposition (HALF RATE). $273.75 Teresa Pilatowicz
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5/18/2017 0.3 $365.00
Draft summary of Bernstein deposition and related
issues for G. Gordon. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/23/2017 0.4 $365.00
Draft discovery requests to Snowshoe and
Superpumper regarding sale of assets/stock. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/24/2017 0.2 $365.00
Draft seventh stipulation and order to extend
discovery. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/24/2017 1.2 $365.00

Research regarding ; Draft correspondence to G.
Gordon regarding same. Research and analysis
regarding $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/24/2017 0.4 $365.00 Correspondence to J. Murtha regarding same. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/25/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence from and to F. Gilmore regarding
stipulation to extend discovery. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/25/2017 0.1 $365.00 Revise stipulation to extend discovery. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
5/26/2017 0.4 $365.00 Draft summary of Bernstein deposition. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
5/26/2017 0.3 $365.00 Attention to issues related to $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
5/26/2017 0.3 $775.00 T/C with Trustee re $232.50 Gerald Gordon
5/26/2017 1.2 $ - Review NO CHARGE. $ - Gerald Gordon
5/30/2017 0.4 $775.00 Report to Trustee re $310.00 Gerald Gordon
5/30/2017 0.2 $775.00 T/C with John Murtha $155.00 Gerald Gordon
6/2/2017 0.4 $365.00 Briefly review and analyze v $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/5/2017 0.1 $365.00 Call with W. Leonard's office regarding $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/5/2017 1.5 $290.00

Review correspondence and documents on
McGovern fee application (.5); and conduct research
on (.9). $435.00 Mark Weisenmiller

6/5/2017 0.1 $365.00 Follow up on status of Buffalo depositions. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
6/5/2017 0.2 $365.00 Briefly review $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/6/2017 1.1 $290.00
Draft third interim application for reimbursement of
expenses. $319.00 Mark Weisenmiller

6/6/2017 0.4 $290.00 Continue drafting third interim application. $116.00 Mark Weisenmiller
6/6/2017 0.3 $365.00 Attention to $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
6/6/2017 0.2 $365.00 Provide status update to G. Gordon. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/6/2017 0.4 $365.00 Commence outlining motion for summary judgment. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/7/2017 2.9 $290.00

Revise and finalize GTG third application for
approval of payment of expenses (1.9); draft
declarations of attorney and trustee in support of
same and circulate via email for approval (.9). $841.00 Mark Weisenmiller

6/7/2017 0.2 $365.00

Conference with M. Weisenmiller regarding third
application for expenses in bankruptcy case (.1);
Review and execute declaration in support
thereof(.1). $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/20/2017 0.2 $365.00
Court call for trial setting regarding pre-trial
conferences. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
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6/20/2017 0.2 $365.00 Correspondence to client regarding status of trial. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/24/2017 0.8 $365.00
Review Superpumper Sale documents produced in
16th supplement. $292.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/26/2017 0.1 $365.00 Review documents in Eighteenth supplement. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/26/2017 1.2 $365.00
Commence research for Motion for Summary
Judgment. $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/27/2017 3.1 $365.00
Commence researching and drafting Motion for
Summary Judgment. $1,131.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/28/2017 5 $365.00
Further research and draft motion for summary
judgment. $1,825.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/29/2017 2.7 $365.00 Further draft Motion for Summary Judgment. $985.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/30/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Kearney regarding Hodgson
Russ depositions. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

6/30/2017 0.1 $365.00 Correspondence to J. Murtha regarding $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/5/2017 4.2 $365.00

Commence reviewing and pulling documents for
Vacco supplemental productions for Vacco
deposition. $1,533.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/5/2017 3.1 $365.00
Further review and revise Motion for Summary
Judgment. $1,131.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/5/2017 0.1 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from R.
Buss $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/5/2017 0.1 $365.00
Review bill from Pullman & Farrow and address
payment of same. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/6/2017 3 $365.00
Review Hodgsun Russ documents for deposition
preparation. $1,095.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/6/2017 1.2 $365.00 Commence preparing for D. Vacco deposition. $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/6/2017 0.7 $365.00 Commence preparing for Hodgson Russ deposition. $255.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/6/2017 8.2 $170.00

Assist with deposition preparation for Dennis
Vacco. Begin pulling all identified native emails to
extract all bates stamped versions from Logikcull
productions. $1,394.00 Michele Pori

7/7/2017 5.3 $170.00

Continue and complete assistance with deposition
preparation for Dennis Vacco. Begin pulling all
identified native emails to extract all bates stamped
versions from Logikcull productions. $901.00 Michele Pori

7/9/2017 4 $365.00 Working travel to Buffalo. $1,460.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/9/2017 1.5 $182.50
Travel to Buffalo for Vacco and HR depositions
(non- working) - HALF RATE. $273.75 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/9/2017 2 $365.00 Further prepare for Vacco continued deposition. $730.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
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DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

7/10/2017 3.8 $365.00
Further prepare for (1.0) and take (2.8) deposition of
Dennis Vacco. $1,387.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/10/2017 6.5 $365.00 Attend Vacco 2004 exam. $2,372.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/11/2017 0.5 $365.00
Prepare for and take continued depositions of
Dennis Vacco. $182.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/11/2017 3.7 $365.00
Attend deposition of Dennis Vacco in related
adversary case. $1,350.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/11/2017 2.9 $365.00 Attend deposition of Christian Lovelace. $1,058.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
7/11/2017 1.2 $365.00 Further prepare for Hodgson Russ Depo. $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
7/12/2017 0.2 $775.00 Conference with Teresa P re $155.00 Gerald Gordon

7/12/2017 5.6 $182.50 Travel from Buffalo for depositions (HALF RATE). $1,022.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/12/2017 2 $365.00
Further prepare for and conduct deposition of
Hodgson Russ (1.8); Draft summary of same (.2). $730.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/13/2017 0.3 $365.00 Attention to $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/13/2017 0.1 $365.00 Correspondence with J. McGovern regarding case. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/18/2017 4.3 $250.00
Begin drafting motion for sanctions and to compel
deposition. $1,075.00 Michael Esposito

7/18/2017 0.7 $250.00
Review transcript and email communications for
purpose of motion to compel. $175.00 Michael Esposito

7/18/2017 0.2 $365.00
Conference with M. Esposito regarding motion to
compel and sanctions motion. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/19/2017 0.2 $250.00 Confer with Teresa re: filed Motion to Quash. $50.00 Michael Esposito
7/19/2017 0.9 $250.00 Review Motion to Quash. $225.00 Michael Esposito
7/19/2017 0.5 $250.00 Draft opposition to Motion to quash. $125.00 Michael Esposito

7/19/2017 0.8 $365.00
Review motion to quash (.3); Draft comments to
same for incorporation into opposition (.5). $292.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/20/2017 3.9 $250.00
Revise and supplement opposition to motion to
quash and countermotion. $975.00 Michael Esposito

7/21/2017 1 $365.00
Commence review and revisions to opposition to
motion to quash/countermotion for sanctions. $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/24/2017 4.8 $365.00

Further revisions to Opposition to Motion to Quash
and countermotion for sanctions; Revise declaration
in support of motion; Revise request for OST. $1,752.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/24/2017 4.6 $250.00
Revise and finalize Reply brief. Draft ex parte
application for OST. Draft Teresa declaration. $1,150.00 Michael Esposito

7/24/2017 0.3 $250.00

Follow up on additional inquiries from Teresa
regarding final filing of opposition and
countermotion. $75.00 Michael Esposito

7/24/2017 0.3 $250.00
Review and revise declaration according to TMP
changes. $75.00 Michael Esposito

7/26/2017 0.1 $250.00 Contact court re: discovery ost. $25.00 Michael Esposito
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June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019
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7/26/2017 0.2 $250.00 Confer with Teresa re: ex parte application for ost. $50.00 Michael Esposito

7/26/2017 1 $250.00
Finalize ex parte application for OST and submit to
court. $250.00 Michael Esposito

7/26/2017 0.1 $365.00
Call with Discovery Commissioner regarding OST
request. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/26/2017 0.3 $365.00 Attention to OST issues for motion for sanctions. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
7/27/2017 0.2 $250.00 Emails with Teresa re: OST questions. $50.00 Michael Esposito

7/27/2017 0.7 $365.00

Multiple calls with DC chambers regarding OST
request (.2); Correspondence to/from F. Gilmore
regarding same (.2); Multiple conferences with M.
Esposito regarding completion of same (.3). $255.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/31/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding OST
request. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/31/2017 0.3 $365.00

Multiple calls with discovery commissioners office
regarding OST; Call with F. Gilmore to D/C
regarding same. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/31/2017 0.3 $365.00

Correspondence to/from K. Kearney regarding HR
rescheduled deposition dates; Review response to
same; Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding
same. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/1/2017 6.5 $365.00 Further draft Motion for Summary Judgment. $2,372.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/1/2017 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to W. Kimmel and J. McGovern
regarding $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/2/2017 4.6 $365.00 Further draft motion for summary judgment. $1,679.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/2/2017 0.3 $365.00

Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding discovery
hearing (.2); Call to Discovery Commissioner
regarding scheduling of hearing (.1). $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/3/2017 4.1 $365.00 Further draft motion for summary judgment. $1,496.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
8/4/2017 0.4 $250.00 Receipt and review of reply and opposition. $100.00 Michael Esposito

8/4/2017 0.2 $365.00
Review and analysis of reply in support of motion to
quash. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/4/2017 0.9 $365.00 Research regarding $328.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
8/4/2017 1.3 $365.00 Further draft motion for summary judgment. $474.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
8/6/2017 4.4 $365.00 Further draft Motion for Summary Judgment. $1,606.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/7/2017 2 $250.00
Draft reply to opposition to countermotion for
sanctions. $500.00 Michael Esposito

8/7/2017 9 $365.00
Further research and draft motion for summary
judgment. $3,285.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/8/2017 5.5 $365.00
Further research and draft Motion for Summary
Judgment. $2,007.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
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June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

8/8/2017 1.6 $250.00
Revise and supplement reply iso countermotions for
sanctions. $400.00 Michael Esposito

8/8/2017 4.9 $365.00
Further research, draft, and revise Motion for
Summary Judgment. $1,788.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/8/2017 0.6 $365.00
Revise reply in support of countermotion or
sanctions. $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/8/2017 0.1 $385.00 Emails with T. Pilatowicz regarding MSJ. $38.50 Gabby Hamm

8/9/2017 1.7 $250.00

Revise Reply iso countermotion and circulate to
Teresa for final approval. Prepare related request for
submission. $425.00 Michael Esposito

8/9/2017 4.1 $365.00 Further revisions to motion for summary judgment. $1,496.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/9/2017 0.3 $365.00
Further revisions to reply in support of
countermotion for sanctions. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/9/2017 3.7 $385.00 Review and revise summary judgment motion. $1,424.50 Gabby Hamm
8/10/2017 1.2 $365.00 Further revise Motion for Summary Judgment. $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/10/2017 2.2 $365.00
Prepare for hearing on motion to compel (1.4);
Participate in hearing (.8). $803.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/10/2017 6.5 $385.00 Continue reviewing and editing MSJ. $2,502.50 Gabby Hamm
8/11/2017 3.2 $775.00 Review and revise draft s/j motion. $2,480.00 Gerald Gordon

8/11/2017 0.9 $365.00
Call with G. Hamm regarding revisions to Motion
for Summary Judgment. $328.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/11/2017 1 $365.00
Attention to status of case and scheduled trial;
Deadlines for same. $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/11/2017 0.9 $365.00
Further attention to motion for summary judgment
and revisions thereto. $328.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/11/2017 4.7 $385.00
Edit summary judgment motion (3.8); telephone
conference with T. Pilatowicz regarding same (.9). $1,809.50 Gabby Hamm

8/12/2017 3.1 $385.00
Legal research on issues raised in MSJ; revise legal
argument in MSJ. $1,193.50 Gabby Hamm

8/13/2017 4.6 $385.00
Research regarding arguments raised in MSJ;
continue revising legal argument. $1,771.00 Gabby Hamm

8/14/2017 1.2 $290.00 Revise MTD. $348.00 Erick Gjerdingen

8/14/2017 0.7 $170.00
Search Logikcull platform for specific Vacco
emails. $119.00 Michele Pori

8/14/2017 2.6 $365.00 Further revise Motion for Summary Judgment. $949.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/15/2017 1.5 $365.00

Further revise motion for summary judgment (1.3);
Correspondence to client regarding same (.1);
Correspondence to Herbst regarding same (.1). $547.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/15/2017 0.5 $290.00 Draft Motion to exceed page limits re MTD. $145.00 Erick Gjerdingen
8/15/2017 0.4 $290.00 Draft order to exceed page limits re MTD. $116.00 Erick Gjerdingen
8/15/2017 1.3 $290.00 Review and revise Motion to Dismiss. $377.00 Erick Gjerdingen
8/15/2017 0.3 $290.00 Revise motion to exceed page limits. $87.00 Erick Gjerdingen
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8/15/2017 0.4 $365.00 Draft and circulate Herbst declaration. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
8/15/2017 2.1 $365.00 Draft separate statement of facts. $766.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
8/15/2017 0.2 $290.00 Draft request for submission. $58.00 Erick Gjerdingen
8/16/2017 0.2 $290.00 Revise motion to exceed page limit. $58.00 Erick Gjerdingen

8/16/2017 5 $365.00
Revise SSOF with cites to exhibits; Further review
exhibits. $1,825.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/16/2017 1.4 $365.00 Further revise motion for summary judgment. $511.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/16/2017 0.5 $385.00
Conference with T. Pilatowicz regarding trial
evidence. $192.50 Gabby Hamm

8/17/2017 0.3 $775.00 Review discovery sanctions order. $232.50 Gerald Gordon

8/17/2017 3 $365.00
Further revise and finalize Motion for Partial
Summary Judgment. $1,095.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/17/2017 3 $365.00
Further revise and finalize Separate Statement of
Facts and Exhibits. $1,095.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/17/2017 0.4 $365.00

Review and analysis of recommendation for order
re: motion to quash/counter-motion for sanctions
(.3); Correspondence to client regarding same (.1). $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/18/2017 0.4 $365.00 Analysis of $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/21/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to J. McGovern regarding trial
scheduling. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/21/2017 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Kearney regarding discovery
recommendation and deposition scheduling. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/22/2017 0.1 $365.00 Review notice of recusal. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/25/2017 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding summary
judgment and HR deposition. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/25/2017 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to J. McGovern and Bill Kimmel
regarding trial scheduling. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/28/2017 0.6 $250.00
Review Objection to Report and Recommendation
for Order and related Recommendation for Order. $150.00 Michael Esposito

8/28/2017 0.2 $250.00 Confer with TMP re: objection. $50.00 Michael Esposito
8/28/2017 0.2 $250.00 Review response to objection deadline. $50.00 Michael Esposito

8/28/2017 2.6 $250.00
Draft Opposition to Objection to Recommendation
for Order. $650.00 Michael Esposito

8/28/2017 0.3 $365.00
Review and analysis of objection to
recommendation. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/29/2017 0.1 $365.00
Commence analysis of Ninth Circuit precedent
regarding fraudulent transfer damages. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/30/2017 0.2 $365.00
Email to Kevin Kearney regarding Superpumper
status. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/31/2017 0.3 $365.00 Correspondence to client regarding status. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/31/2017 1 $365.00
Further revisions to opposition to objection to
recommendation for order. $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
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8/31/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding status of
HR deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/1/2017 0.3 $365.00
Review standard of review for objection to
discovery commissioner recommendations. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/5/2017 2.5 $250.00
Review and revise objection to recommendation for
order. $625.00 Michael Esposito

9/5/2017 0.8 $250.00 Final Opposition to Objection and submit for filing. $200.00 Michael Esposito

9/5/2017 0.8 $365.00
Revise and finalize opposition to objection to
recommendation. $292.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/6/2017 0.3 $385.00
Brief review of opposition to objection to
recommendation for order. $115.50 Gabby Hamm

9/7/2017 0.2 $365.00
Call court regarding trial setting (.1);
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding same (.1). $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/9/2017 0.1 $365.00 Correspondence to Audrey regarding trial setting. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/10/2017 0.2 $365.00
Commence review of Vacco deposition to
supplement separate statement of facts. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/12/2017 0.1 $365.00
Finalize application for setting; Correspondence to
A. Austin regarding same. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/13/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to C. Kemper regarding trial
setting. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/13/2017 0.1 $365.00
Multiple correspondence to and from A. Austin and
F. Gilmore regarding trial setting. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/16/2017 0.1 $365.00
Review reply in response to discovery commissioner
order objection. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/20/2017 0.7 $365.00
Call with court for trial setting (.4); Correspondence
to and from client regarding same (.3). $255.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/22/2017 0.1 $365.00 Correspondence to Herbsts regarding trial date. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/22/2017 0.4 $365.00
Review and analysis of Opposition to Motion for
Summary Judgment. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

9/25/2017 0.1 $365.00

Correspondence with F. Gilmore and Court
regarding trial setting; Review trial setting filed by
Court. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/9/2017 1 $365.00
Review cases cited in Opposition to Summary
Judgment. $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/9/2017 1.2 $365.00
Review Defendants' separate statement of facts and
exhibits thereto. $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/9/2017 2.5 $365.00
Commence researching and drafting reply in support
of summary judgment. $912.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/10/2017 0.5 $290.00 Revise reply re MSJ. $145.00 Erick Gjerdingen

10/10/2017 6 $365.00
Further draft, revise, and finalize reply in support of
motion for summary judgment. $2,190.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
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10/11/2017 0.1 $365.00
Draft and finalize Request for Submission or Motion
for Summary Judgment. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/19/2017 0.4 $365.00 Research regarding $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/19/2017 0.3 $365.00
Review Vacco transcript regarding supplementing
Motion for Summary Judgment. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/24/2017 2 $200.00 Conduct legal research into $400.00 Stephen Davis

10/25/2017 0.1 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from J.
Murtha regarding ) $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

10/26/2017 0.2 $365.00
Review and revision to proposed stipulation
regarding settlement briefs. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/7/2017 0.5 $365.00
Research local rules regarding ; Analysis of same.

$182.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/10/2017 1.3 $365.00

Commence reviewing Murtha's draft of settlement
statement and revisions to same (.5); Commence
drafting Superpumper specific section (.8). $474.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/16/2017 1.2 $365.00

Review prior offers and analysis of (.6); Conference
with J. Murtha, G. Gordon, and M. Weisenmiller
(.6). ) $438.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/19/2017 2.4 $365.00 Further work on settlement statement. $876.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/20/2017 1.8 $365.00
Further revise settlement statement for
Superpumper. $657.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/21/2017 0.3 $365.00
Review proposed settlement offer and comments
regarding same. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/21/2017 0.1 $365.00 Review settlement offer from defendants. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/27/2017 1 $365.00
Review and comments to settlement conference
statement. $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

11/29/2017 0.2 $365.00 Strategize regarding settlement conference. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz
11/30/2017 0.4 $365.00 Review final settlement brief. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/6/2017 3 $365.00
Prepare for settlement conference; Review and
analysis of $1,095.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/7/2017 6 $365.00
Further prepare for (1.0) and attend (5.0) settlement
conference. $2,190.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/7/2017 0.3 $365.00

Review and analysis of order from state court
regarding objection to discovery commissioners
recommendations. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/8/2017 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to and from K. Kearney regarding
continued deposition of HR. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/12/2017 0.3 $200.00
Review file to perform requested legal research by
TMP. $60.00 Stephen Davis

12/12/2017 0.7 $200.00 Conduct legal research regarding . $140.00 Stephen Davis
12/12/2017 1.6 $200.00 Further research regarding $320.00 Stephen Davis

12/12/2017 0.1 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from B.
Hemmila regarding remanded hearing. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
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12/12/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding
rescheduled depositions; Review response to same. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/12/2017 0.3 $365.00

Correspondence to S. Davis with research
requirements; Review and analysis of response to
same. $109.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/13/2017 0.4 $365.00
Prepare summary of fees for disclosure to
Defendants in advance of sanctions hearing. $146.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/13/2017 0.5 $365.00

Review and analysis of order denying summary
judgment (.4); Correspondence to client regarding
same (.1). $182.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/14/2017 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding
Superpumper fees. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/15/2017 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding expenses
incurred in initial deposition. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/16/2017 0.8 $365.00
Draft letter to discovery commissioner regarding
fees incurred. $292.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/18/2017 0.6 $365.00

Finalize letter to Discovery Commissioner regarding
fees; Correspondence to B. Hemmila regarding
same. $219.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/19/2017 0.2 $250.00 Post hearing follow up with TMP. $50.00 Michael Esposito

12/19/2017 1 $365.00
Prepare for (.5) and participate (.5) in hearing on
amount of sanctions. $365.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/20/2017 0.1 $365.00 Review and analysis of order on sanctions. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

12/21/2017 0.2 $365.00
Review recommendation for order re: sanction
amount; Correspondence to client regarding same. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/5/2018 0.1 $365.00
Review order confirming discovery commissioner's
recommendation regarding amount of sanctions. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/9/2018 0.1 $365.00 Draft amended notice of deposition of PMK of HR. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/9/2018 0.1 $365.00
Review and respond to correspondence from F.
Gilmore regarding HR deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/11/2018 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence from and to F. Gilmore regarding
HR deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/12/2018 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Kearney regarding HR
deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/19/2018 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to/from F. Gilmore and K. Kearney
re: HR continued deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/22/2018 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding sanctions
payment status. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/22/2018 0.1 $365.00 Draft amended notice of deposition of HR. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

1/29/2018 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Kearney regarding amended
notice of deposition. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz
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2/5/2018 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to W. Leonard regarding
(REDACT) $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

3/15/2018 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to K. Kearney regarding HR
depositions. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/12/2018 0.8 $365.00
Draft summary of status and timeline for trial and
related events. $292.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/18/2018 0.2 $365.00 Review calculation of trial related to deadlines. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/30/2018 4.5 $365.00
Working travel to Buffalo for HR continued
deposition. $1,642.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

4/30/2018 2 $365.00
Further review documents in preparation for HR
deposition. $730.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/1/2018 8 $365.00
Further prepare for and attend deposition of PMK of
Hodgson Russ. $2,920.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/1/2018 3.1 $365.00 Travel from Buffalo Deposition (HALF RATE). $1,131.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

5/8/2018 0.2 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding
sanction/fees and expenses. $73.00 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/30/2018 1.3 $365.00
Review status of pending deadlines and draft
summary of outstanding items. $474.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/31/2018 0.5 $365.00
Review Superpumper fee issues; Correspondence to
G. Gordon regarding same. $182.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

7/31/2018 0.1 $365.00
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding pre-trial
order. $36.50 Teresa Pilatowicz

8/1/2018 5.1 185.00$

Receive accounting fees and costs from 11/1/16
through 7/31/2018. Begin and complete creation of
excel spreadsheet exhibits for Professional Fees,
Fees by Task Code and Expenses. Draft GTG 4th
Interim Fee Application and corresponding
declarations. 943.50$ Michele Pori

8/1/2018 0.6 365.00$ Attention to fee application issues 219.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
8/1/2018 0.4 365.00$ Research re: Morabito's current address 146.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/2/2018 0.1 365.00$
Correspondence to court regarding request for pre-
trial conference 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/6/2018 0.2 365.00$
Call to court clerk re: pre-trial conference;
Correspondence to opposing counsel regarding same 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/7/2018 0.1 365.00$ Contact court re: pre-trial conference 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/7/2018 0.1 365.00$
Conferences with court regarding scheduling on pre-
trial conference 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/8/2018 1.9 365.00$
Prepare for meeting with E. Turner and G. Hamm
regarding trial preparation and strategy 693.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/9/2018 3 365.00$

Further attention to trial strategy and trial
preparation; Review MSJ and order on same
regarding additional documents needed for trial 1,095.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
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8/10/2018 0.2 365.00$
Correspondence to and from court clerk re: pre-trial
issues 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/16/2018 0.8 365.00$
Commence developing trial theme and further
prepare strategy 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/16/2018 0.7 365.00$ Review time entries for 4th interim app 255.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
8/17/2018 0.3 365.00$ Attention to fee application issues 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/20/2018 0.8 365.00$
Review time entries for fourth interim fee
application 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/20/2018 0.9 365.00$ Review time entries for 4th fee application 328.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/27/2018 5.2 365.00$

Revise 4th interim fee application including
summary of status of application of sanctions
payments and finalize exhibits in support of same 1,898.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/28/2018 2.1 365.00$

Finalize 4th interim fee application (.9), declarations
in support of same (.4), Draft and finalize OST
documents (.5); Correspondence to/from client
regarding approval (.1); Correspondence to/from
opposing counsel regarding OST request (.2) 766.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/28/2018 3 365.00$
Commence trial strategy preparation for theme
development and opening/closing statements 1,095.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/29/2018 0.6 -$
Analysis of trial strategy and comments re same - No
Charge -$ Erick Gjerdingen

8/29/2018 5 365.00$
Analysis of trial strategy and documents supporting
same 1,825.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

8/30/2018 0.4 -$ Additional analysis re trial strategy - No Charge -$ Erick Gjerdingen

8/30/2018 4.9 365.00$
Further analysis of trial strategy and documents
supporting same 1,788.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/4/2018 6.5 185.00$

Trial preparation. Begin culling all operative
pleadings, all written responses to Interrogatories
and all deposition transcript with exhibits. 1,202.50$ Michele Pori

9/4/2018 1 365.00$ Further review documents for trial preparation 365.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/4/2018 0.1 365.00$ Correspondence to Bill Kimmel regarding trial dates 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/4/2018 0.1 365.00$
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding pre-trial
conference 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/4/2018 0.1 365.00$
Correspondence to client regarding trial scheduling
and pre-trial conference 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/5/2018 5.5 185.00$

Trial preparation. Continue and complete culling all
operative pleadings, all written responses to
Interrogatories and all deposition transcript with
exhibits. 1,017.50$ Michele Pori

9/5/2018 1 365.00$ Commence drafting pre-trial statement 365.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
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9/6/2018 0.3 495.00$ Review of scheduling order + follow up re same 148.50$ Erika Turner

9/6/2018 1.4 365.00$
Prepare for and participate in pre-trial conference all
with F. Gilmore; Draft summary of same 511.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/6/2018 0.2 365.00$
Correspondence to court regarding pre-trial
conference issues 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/6/2018 0.2 365.00$ Start exhibit list 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/6/2018 0.4 365.00$
Call with M. Pori regarding trial preparation strategy
and items needed 146.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/6/2018 0.1 365.00$
Correspondence to J. Murtha regarding Vacco
depositions 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/6/2018 1.7 365.00$ Attention to trial statement and stipulated facts 620.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
9/6/2018 2.5 365.00$ Review Morabito deposition transcript 912.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/7/2018 1.6 310.00$ Research and analysis re evidence issues for trial 496.00$ Erick Gjerdingen
9/7/2018 2 365.00$ Review files and identify trial issues to address 730.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/7/2018 0.1 365.00$
Correspondence to J. McGovern regarding trial
status 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/7/2018 1.8 365.00$ Further work on trial statement 657.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/10/2018 1.6 495.00$
Communications re pretrial matters + review
pleadings for Trial preparation 792.00$ Erika Turner

9/10/2018 0.6 -$
Telephone conference with E. Turner and T.
Pilatowicz regarding pretrial hearing. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

9/10/2018 1.5 365.00$
Research and analysis regarding potential
evidentiary issues to raise at pre-trial conference 547.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/10/2018 3.5 365.00$
Further attention to trial statement and issues to
address for trial 1,277.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/10/2018 0.2 365.00$ Draft notice of intent to use audio-visual equipment 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/10/2018 1.4 365.00$
Prepare for and participate in call regarding pre-trial
conference 511.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/11/2018 0.1 -$
Review of email from T. Pilatowicz regarding
pretrial conference. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

9/11/2018 3.9 365.00$
Work on Bernstein and Morabito designations of
deposition transcript 1,423.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/11/2018 1.1 365.00$ Prepare for and attend pre-trial conference 401.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/11/2018 0.7 365.00$
Draft summary of pre-trial conference and strategy
based on same 255.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/11/2018 0.3 365.00$
Review requirements and analysis for audio visual
needs and communicate with Court re same 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/11/2018 1 365.00$ Designations regarding Cavaliar deposition 365.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
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9/11/2018 0.6 365.00$ Research re: Moreno matter and relation to trial 219.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/12/2018 4 365.00$
work on designations of Gursey, Graeber, and Sevitz
depositions 1,460.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/12/2018 0.5 365.00$ Review and analysis of defendants' motion in limine 182.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/12/2018 1 365.00$
Attention to status of initial and supplemental
disclosures 365.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/13/2018 2.6 495.00$
Review Motion for SJ and other docs in file in
preparation for Trial 1,287.00$ Erika Turner

9/13/2018 0.4 495.00$
Review Motion in Limine recd from opposing
counsel + follow up re same 198.00$ Erika Turner

9/13/2018 0.2 365.00$
Review and respond to correspondence from EPT
regarding 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/13/2018 0.8 365.00$ Deposition designations for Yalamachili deposition 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
9/17/2018 0.5 495.00$ Attend to resolving pre-Trial issues 247.50$ Erika Turner

9/17/2018 1.2 365.00$

Attention to arguments in opposition to damages
Motion in Limine and in support of Freiderich MIL;
Conference with A. Dunning regarding same 438.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/17/2018 2.3 365.00$ Further attention to general trial issues 839.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/18/2018 0.2 365.00$
Finalize notice and request for technology use for
trial 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/18/2018 1.1 365.00$ Reviewing documents for exhibit list 401.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/18/2018 4.8 365.00$ Draft summary of trial strategy, issues, and evidence 1,752.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/19/2018 7.4 385.00$

Review of Jan Friedrich deposition transcript and
draft motion in limine; related research regarding
designation of non-retained expert witness. 2,849.00$ Gabby Hamm

9/19/2018 6 365.00$ Document review to further create exhibit list 2,190.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
9/19/2018 0.8 365.00$ Review and comment on motion in limine 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/20/2018 4.7 -$
Continue research regarding non-retained expert
witnesses and revise motion in limine. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

9/20/2018 3 185.00$

Trial preparation. Receive zip file of emails without
bates numbers. Begin search through Logikcull
platform to identify bates stamped versions.
Download same for use as trial exhibits. 555.00$ Michele Pori

9/20/2018 1.1 365.00$ Attention to finalizing Friederich MIL 401.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
9/20/2018 2.9 365.00$ Further supplement exhibit list 1,058.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/20/2018 1.3 365.00$

Further draft working summary for trial prep
identifying factual summary and additional items
needed for trial 474.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
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9/21/2018 2.8 775.00$ review and revise internal trial memorandum 2,170.00$ Gerald Gordon

9/21/2018 2.6 185.00$

Trial preparation. Receive zip file of emails without
bates numbers. Continue and complete search
through Logikcull platform to identify bates stamped
versions. Download same for use as trial exhibits. 481.00$ Michele Pori

9/21/2018 4.8 365.00$
Further draft working trial summary regarding
evidence needed and issues to address 1,752.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/21/2018 1.2 365.00$
Review additional documents to supplement exhibits
for trial 438.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/24/2018 6.9 235.00$ Continue drafting opposition to motion in limine 1,621.50$ Andrew Dunning

9/24/2018 3 495.00$

Meeting with TP re status and strategy on how to
proceed at Trial + follow up re same with review of
docs/pleadings 1,485.00$ Erika Turner

9/24/2018 3.5 385.00$
Review memoranda for trial preparation (2.4); meet
with T. Pilatowicz regarding trial preparation (1.1). 1,347.50$ Gabby Hamm

9/24/2018 2.5 185.00$

Trial preparation. Begin Summary of Voluminous
Documents Index for all documents for all 23,000
documents & emails received from Vacco/Lippes
Mathias bates stamped LMWF_SUPP_000001 -
106280. 462.50$ Michele Pori

9/24/2018 0.2 365.00$
Correspondence with expert witnesses regarding
appearance at trial 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/24/2018 0.5 365.00$
Review and revisions to opposition to motion in
limine 182.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/24/2018 3.5 365.00$
Further review exhibits in preparation for trial and
additional information needed 1,277.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/24/2018 1.6 365.00$ Further prepare trial strategy 584.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/25/2018 2.2 235.00$
Review and revise draft opposition to motion in
limine; conduct supplemental research 517.00$ Andrew Dunning

9/25/2018 0.7 495.00$
Analysis re standing of liquidation trustee for trial
strategy + related conference with Bk Co-counsel 346.50$ Erika Turner

9/25/2018 1 495.00$
Attend to pretrial issues with co-counsel + research
re same 495.00$ Erika Turner

9/25/2018 2.7 495.00$
Review transcripts and other papers in preparation
for trial 1,336.50$ Erika Turner

9/25/2018 0.7 775.00$
conferences with Erika T re UFTA and interplay
with bk 542.50$ Gerald Gordon

9/25/2018 2 185.00$

Trial preparation. Cull & compile all motions to
dismiss and corresponding orders and all discovery
commissioner recommendations for order and
corresponding court orders. Add all to trial binder
Operable Pleadings. 370.00$ Michele Pori
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9/25/2018 6 185.00$

Trial preparation. Continue Summary of
Voluminous Documents Index for all documents for
all 23,000 documents & emails received from
Vacco/Lippes Mathias bates stamped
LMWF_SUPP_000001 - 106280. 1,110.00$ Michele Pori

9/25/2018 0.3 365.00$ Call with Jim McGovern regarding trial 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
9/25/2018 0.2 365.00$ Call with Tim Herbst regarding trial 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/25/2018 0.9 365.00$
Prepare for and attend hearing on fourth interim fee
application 328.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/25/2018 0.2 365.00$
Finalize order on fee application; Correspondence to
N. Strozza regarding same 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/25/2018 1.6 365.00$
Further review and revisions to opposition to motion
in limine 584.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/25/2018 0.2 365.00$
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding request for
stipulation re Noble testimony 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/25/2018 1.3 365.00$

Review Nobel deposition in response to Defendants'
request for use of deposition transcript in lieu of
live testimony 474.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/25/2018 1.5 365.00$
Further review of documents regarding exhibits for
trial 547.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/26/2018 3.6 235.00$ Review and revise opposition to motion in limine 846.00$ Andrew Dunning
9/26/2018 0.2 495.00$ Review trust docs for use at trial 99.00$ Erika Turner

9/26/2018 0.2 495.00$
Communication with BLeonard re trial prep/trial +
follow up re meeting with THerbst and McGovern 99.00$ Erika Turner

9/26/2018 0.2 495.00$ Attend to witness list 99.00$ Erika Turner

9/26/2018 0.3 775.00$ conf with EPT re insiders under UFTA (NRS 112) 232.50$ Gerald Gordon

9/26/2018 2.6 300.00$
trial prep: Attend to preparation of exhibits for super
pumper trial 780.00$ Mark Weisenmiller

9/26/2018 6.5 185.00$

Trial preparation. Continue Summary of
Voluminous Documents Index for all documents for
all 23,000 documents & emails received from
Vacco/Lippes Mathias bates stamped
LMWF_SUPP_000001 - 106280. 1,202.50$ Michele Pori

9/26/2018 5.8 365.00$ Further revise exhibit list 2,117.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
9/26/2018 0.8 365.00$ Further revise opposition to motion in limine 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
9/26/2018 0.3 365.00$ Revise witness list 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/27/2018 2.3 235.00$

Review EPT revisions to opposition to motion in
limine; review and revise draft opposition for
approval 540.50$ Andrew Dunning

9/27/2018 0.6 495.00$
Review and revise witness list and follow up re
deposition transcripts 297.00$ Erika Turner

9/27/2018 2.1 495.00$ Review and revise Opposition to Motion in Limine 1,039.50$ Erika Turner
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9/27/2018 4.7 385.00$
Research regarding (3.8);
research regarding (.9). 1,809.50$ Gabby Hamm

9/27/2018 1.4 385.00$ Draft proposed findings and conclusions. 539.00$ Gabby Hamm

9/27/2018 0.3 775.00$ conf with Teresa P re 232.50$ Gerald Gordon

9/27/2018 7.2 185.00$

Trial preparation. Continue Summary of
Voluminous Documents Index for all documents for
all 23,000 documents & emails received from
Vacco/Lippes Mathias bates stamped
LMWF_SUPP_000001 - 106280. 1,332.00$ Michele Pori

9/27/2018 0.3 365.00$ Further attention to exhibit list issues 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
9/27/2018 0.3 365.00$ Review Salazar expert report 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/27/2018 1.3 365.00$
Legal analysis and summary regarding

474.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/27/2018 0.6 365.00$ Further revisions to Opposition to Motion in Limine 219.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/27/2018 0.2 365.00$
Correspondence to F. Gilmore regarding witness
availability 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/27/2018 0.8 365.00$ Update working summary of trial issues 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/28/2018 4.2 385.00$
Review discovery and prepare proposed findings
and conclusions. 1,617.00$ Gabby Hamm

9/28/2018 0.4 775.00$ t/c with Trustee re trial 310.00$ Gerald Gordon
9/28/2018 0.4 775.00$ further analysis of 310.00$ Gerald Gordon

9/28/2018 4.1 185.00$

Trial preparation. Continue and complete Summary
of Voluminous Documents Index for all documents
for all 23,000 documents & emails received from
Vacco/Lippes Mathias bates stamped
LMWF_SUPP_000001 - 106280. 758.50$ Michele Pori

9/28/2018 2.4 365.00$ Further work on exhibit list and documents for trial 876.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
9/28/2018 0.7 365.00$ Finalize pre-trial disclosures 255.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/28/2018 0.3 365.00$
Review and analysis of pre-trial disclosures from
Defendants 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/28/2018 1 365.00$ Further revisions to opposition to motion in limine 365.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

9/28/2018 0.8 365.00$
Strategize regarding case presentation and items
needed for trial 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/1/2018 0.3 235.00$
Review correspondence from counsel and
prospective research tasks 70.50$ Andrew Dunning

10/1/2018 0.7 235.00$
Attend trial strategy meeting; review correspondence
from counsel regarding research tasks 164.50$ Andrew Dunning
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10/1/2018 0.1 -$
Review of email from G. Gordon regarding insider
status of Ed Bayuk. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/1/2018 5.3 385.00$
Review of discovery produced by Defendants and
disclosures. 2,040.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/1/2018 2.8 -$
Review of dockets and discovery file; identify
further documents to be reviewed. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/1/2018 0.4 -$
Analysis of research issues for trial and discussion
with A. Dunning regarding same. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/1/2018 0.4 385.00$
Review of current draft of exhibit list and identify
additional certified copies needed. 154.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/1/2018 1.4 365.00$ Review McGovern Deposition 511.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/1/2018 2.6 365.00$ Review Bayuk Deposition 949.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/1/2018 1.9 365.00$ Review Sam Morabito Deposition 693.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/1/2018 0.8 365.00$ Designations of Lovelace Deposition 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/1/2018 2.4 365.00$ Designations of Vacco depositions 876.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/1/2018 0.5 365.00$ Further draft proposed stipulated facts 182.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/2/2018 0.4 -$
Attend strategy meeting regarding trial preparation -
No Charge -$ Andrew Dunning

10/2/2018 2.4 -$ Discovery and deposition management. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/2/2018 2.1 365.00$
Revise and proposed final of Vacco depo
designations and summary of testimony 766.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/2/2018 0.9 365.00$

Revise and proposed final of Bernstein depo
designations and summary of testimony; Analysis of
Bernstein as a witness 328.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/2/2018 0.3 365.00$

Revise and proposed final of Lovelace depo
designations and summary of testimony; Analysis of
Bernstein as a witness 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/2/2018 1.3 365.00$
Revise and proposed final of Graber depo
designations and summary of testimony 474.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/2/2018 1.1 365.00$
Revise and proposed final of Yalamanchili depo
designations and summary of testimony 401.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/2/2018 2 365.00$
Revise and proposed final of Morabito depo
designations and summary of testimony 730.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/2/2018 1.2 365.00$
Revise and proposed final of Kraus depo
designations and summary of testimony 438.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/2/2018 0.4 365.00$ Further attention to research items needed for trial 146.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/3/2018 0.6 -$ Continue file review - No Charge -$ Andrew Dunning

10/3/2018 3.5 495.00$
Prepare outline for determination of witnesses,
arguments and presentation of deposition/exhibits 1,732.50$ Erika Turner

10/3/2018 7.9 385.00$
Further review of discovery and deposition exhibits
for determination of evidence of trial. 3,041.50$ Gabby Hamm
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10/3/2018 0.3 365.00$
Call with and correspondence to J. McGovern
regarding prep 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/3/2018 1.5 365.00$
Review and analysis of McGovern documents in
preparation for call 547.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/3/2018 0.9 365.00$ Further analysis of exhibits 328.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/4/2018 2.4 495.00$
Trial preparation including review papers and
pleadings in file 1,188.00$ Erika Turner

10/4/2018 5.1 385.00$

Research in preparation for trial, including regarding
anticipated evidentiary objections and standing
evidence. 1,963.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/4/2018 3.2 385.00$ Review of proposed exhibits. 1,232.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/4/2018 2.2 365.00$ Further attention and revisions to Kraus designation 803.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/4/2018 2 365.00$ Further attention and revisions to Vacco designation 730.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/4/2018 0.8 365.00$
Further attention and revisions to Bernstein
designation 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/4/2018 0.7 365.00$
Further attention and revisions to Morabito
designation 255.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/4/2018 4.6 365.00$ Review proposed exhibit list and revisions to same 1,679.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/5/2018 1.5 235.00$ Continue research regarding 352.50$ Andrew Dunning

10/5/2018 2.9 235.00$ Continue research regarding evidentiary matters 681.50$ Andrew Dunning
10/5/2018 0.1 385.00$ Brief review of memo regarding . 38.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/5/2018 3.3 385.00$

Continue review of potential trial exhibits and other
documents produced in discovery to determine if
needed as exhibits. 1,270.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/5/2018 0.2 -$
Email to A. Dunning regarding

No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/5/2018 3.1 385.00$
Continue drafting proposed findings of fact and
conclusions of law. 1,193.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/5/2018 4.6 365.00$ Finalize deposition designations 1,679.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/6/2018 9.8 385.00$
Continue drafting proposed findings and
conclusions. 3,773.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/7/2018 0.8 385.00$

Emails regarding damages issues and Vacco and
Lovelace not appearing for trial (.4); review of
statute regarding damages (.4). 308.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/7/2018 2.2 385.00$
Review of depositions and exhibits for FFCL and
exhibits. 847.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/7/2018 1.9 365.00$

Review and analysis of Gilmore correspondence
regarding request for dismissal of Salvatore
Morabito 693.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
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10/8/2018 0.6 -$

Review correspondence from counsel regarding trial
preparation; prepare and upload research
memorandum to file - No Charge -$ Andrew Dunning

10/8/2018 0.3 495.00$
Review correspondence from FGilmore + review
and revise proposed response 148.50$ Erika Turner

10/8/2018 3.9 495.00$
Analysis and revisions to proposed FFCL + further
trial preparation 1,930.50$ Erika Turner

10/8/2018 0.2 385.00$
Review of draft correspondence regarding Sam
Morabito claims and related emails. 77.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/8/2018 0.4 -$
Review of comments by E. Turner to proposed
findings and conclusions. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/8/2018 4.9 385.00$
Further analysis of claims and continued review of
documents for evidence. 1,886.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/8/2018 1.3 -$
Review of designated deposition testimony.
No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/8/2018 0.7 365.00$

Draft response to Gilmore correspondence re:
Salvatore Morabito; Multiple additional
correspondence regarding same 255.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/8/2018 0.6 365.00$
Commence analysis of Defendants' deposition
designations 219.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/8/2018 1.5 365.00$ Further attention to trial exhibits 547.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/8/2018 0.5 365.00$
Review and analysis of reply in support of motion in
limine re: damages 182.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/8/2018 0.4 365.00$
Review and analysis of opposition to motion in
limine re: Freiderich 146.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/8/2018 0.5 365.00$
Commence review and revision to findings of fact
and conclusions of law 182.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/8/2018 0.2 365.00$
Correspondence to/from Bill Kimmel regarding
testimony 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/9/2018 0.2 235.00$
Review and analyze Defendants' reply in support of
their motions in limine 47.00$ Andrew Dunning

10/9/2018 2.4 235.00$
Review and analyze Defendants' opposition to
motion in limine; prepare to draft reply in support 564.00$ Andrew Dunning

10/9/2018 0.6 495.00$
Review Defendants' Opposition to Motion in Limine
+ follow up re strategy on same 297.00$ Erika Turner

10/9/2018 2.8 495.00$
Review file documents incl court€™s orders and
declarations in preparation for trial 1,386.00$ Erika Turner

10/9/2018 1.5 385.00$

General trial preparation, including review pretrial
filings (including disclosure and deposition
designations); determine outstanding pretrial matters
and dates due. 577.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/9/2018 3.9 -$

Continue review of depositions, exhibits, and
disclosures, and general analysis of trial
presentation. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm
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10/9/2018 3.1 -$
Further research regarding evidentiary issues. No
Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/9/2018 4 365.00$ Attend to exhibits/exhibit list 1,460.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/9/2018 1 365.00$
Revisions to proposed findings of fact and
conclusions of law 365.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/10/2018 1.7 235.00$
Finalize research/memorandum on admissibility of
docs. 399.50$ Andrew Dunning

10/10/2018 2.6 235.00$ Continue trial preparation research 611.00$ Andrew Dunning

10/10/2018 0.2 235.00$
Continue drafting reply in support of Motion in
Limine re Friederich 47.00$ Andrew Dunning

10/10/2018 4.8 495.00$
Review docs incl depos and discovery responses in
preparation for trial 2,376.00$ Erika Turner

10/10/2018 0.1 385.00$ Review of memo regarding evidence. 38.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/10/2018 4.3 385.00$
Continue gathering/reviewing depositions and
deposition exhibits for trial prep. 1,655.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/10/2018 4.3 365.00$
Further revise Defendants' designations and
commence preparing counter-designations 1,569.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/10/2018 0.9 365.00$
Further revise proposed findings of facts and
conclusions of law 328.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/10/2018 0.1 365.00$ Draft notice of appearance for EPT and GAH 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/10/2018 0.9 365.00$ Review and edit proposed final exhibit list 328.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/11/2018 4.3 235.00$
Draft, review, and finalize reply in support of
motion in limine re expert witness 1,010.50$ Andrew Dunning

10/11/2018 3.8 385.00$

Review of Sewitz and Justmann deposition
transcripts for counter-designation of deposition
testimony; further review of deposition designations
of professionals. 1,463.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/11/2018 3.8 365.00$ Revisions to exhibit list for proposed final draft 1,387.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/11/2018 3 365.00$ Revisions to counter-designations 1,095.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/11/2018 1 365.00$ Revisions to reply in support of Frederich MIL 365.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/11/2018 0.7 365.00$ Draft objection to pre-trial disclosures 255.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/12/2018 0.6 -$ Continue trial preparation research - No Charge -$ Andrew Dunning
10/12/2018 0.7 -$ Continue trial preparation research - No Charge -$ Andrew Dunning

10/12/2018 2.2 310.00$
Research re defendants' failure to disclose
deposition designations 682.00$ Erick Gjerdingen

10/12/2018 3.2 385.00$

Further review of discovery in connection with
identification of trial exhibits (3.1); email to team
regarding same (.1). 1,232.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/12/2018 1.4 385.00$
Review and revise draft reply in support of motion
in limine regarding Jan Friederich. 539.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/12/2018 1.4 385.00$
Review of proposed designated deposition testimony
of Dennis Vacco and comment regarding same. 539.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/12/2018 1.6 -$
Further research regarding anticipated evidentiary
objections. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm
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10/12/2018 0.4 385.00$
Review and provide comments to draft objection to
Defendants€™ pretrial disclosures. 154.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/12/2018 3.5 185.00$
Trial preparation. Continue work on finding bates
stamped versions of identified trial exhibits. 647.50$ Michele Pori

10/12/2018 4 365.00$ Further revisions to exhibit lists 1,460.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/12/2018 1.7 365.00$ Further revise and finalize counter-designations 620.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/12/2018 0.6 365.00$ Finalize pre-trial objections 219.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/12/2018 0.4 365.00$
Review and analysis of Defendants' pre-trial
objections 146.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/13/2018 8.2 385.00$

Trial preparation, including review of deposition
transcripts and exhibits, review of bankruptcy
docket and declarations; review of summary
judgment motion papers. 3,157.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/14/2018 1.5 365.00$
Commence trial witness preparation (Herbst and
McGovern) 547.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/15/2018 3.6 235.00$ Trial preparation regarding beneficiary liability 846.00$ Andrew Dunning

10/15/2018 5.8 495.00$
Trial preparation - review of exhibits and prep. of
testimony outline 2,871.00$ Erika Turner

10/15/2018 0.7 385.00$
Meeting with T. Pilatowicz regarding trial
preparation and presentation. 269.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/15/2018 2.2 -$
Prepare for and participate in meeting with Tim
Herbst. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/15/2018 2 385.00$
Prepare for and participate in telephone conference
with Jim McGovern. 770.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/15/2018 0.4 385.00$

Locate prior expert report; email to Jim McGovern
with Friederich documents, rebuttal expert
disclosure, and prior report. 154.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/15/2018 1.5 185.00$

Trial preparation. Receive additional documents to
be used as trial exhibits without bates stamp.
Research and locate all bates stamped versions or
unredacted versions. Transmit same to TMP for use
in creation of Trial Exhibits. 277.50$ Michele Pori

10/15/2018 3.5 365.00$
Prepare for and participate in pre-trial prep meeting
with J. McGovern 1,277.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/15/2018 4 365.00$
Prepare for and participate in pre-trial prep meeting
with T. Herbst 1,460.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/15/2018 2 365.00$ Attention to trial strategy 730.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/15/2018 0.3 365.00$
Call with F. Gilmore regarding trial procedural
issues 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/16/2018 0.3 495.00$ Review and revise power point slides 148.50$ Erika Turner

10/16/2018 3.3 -$
Review of pleadings and written discovery and
prepare case map. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/16/2018 2.2 -$
Review and analysis of summary judgment
documents. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm
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10/16/2018 1.3 385.00$
Continue review of depositions of Defendants€™
witnesses. 500.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/16/2018 0.7 385.00$
Review and analysis of demonstrative exhibit and
provide comments to same. 269.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/16/2018 4.5 185.00$

Trial preparation. Receive trial exhibit list without
bates stamped versions. Research and locate all
documents with the appropriate bates stamp for use
during trial. 832.50$ Michele Pori

10/16/2018 1.4 185.00$

Trial preparation. Receive list of 15 additional trial
exhibits which need to be certified. Track down
agencies and court's and request certified copies for
use during trial. 259.00$ Michele Pori

10/16/2018 4 365.00$ Draft power-point presentation slides for trial 1,460.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/16/2018 2.5 365.00$ Further revisions to exhibit list 912.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/16/2018 1.3 365.00$
Further strategize regarding presentation of
Superpumper transfer for trial 474.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/17/2018 6.2 385.00$ Doc review for proposed FFCL 2,387.00$ Gabby Hamm
10/17/2018 1.8 385.00$ Research regarding valuation issues. 693.00$ Gabby Hamm
10/17/2018 4 250.00$ Video editing for Morabito depo - Video I 1,000.00$ Michael Esposito

10/17/2018 0.3 365.00$

Review correspondence from Court regarding
Superpumper exhibits; Call with Marci regarding
same 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/17/2018 1.3 365.00$ Revise proposed slides 474.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/17/2018 1.3 365.00$
Revisions to proposed findings of fact and
conclusions of law 474.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/17/2018 2 365.00$
Review documents referenced by opposing counsel
in discovery responses 730.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/18/2018 1.5 495.00$ Prepare for trial 742.50$ Erika Turner

10/18/2018 4.9 385.00$
Trial preparation, including trial exhibits and
proposed findings and conclusions. 1,886.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/18/2018 2.8 250.00$ Morabito video Designation Video 2. 700.00$ Michael Esposito
10/18/2018 1.8 250.00$ Morabito Video Designation - Video 3. 450.00$ Michael Esposito
10/18/2018 1.2 250.00$ Finalize full Morabito designation video. 300.00$ Michael Esposito
10/18/2018 7.7 365.00$ Further attention to exhibits and exhibit list 2,810.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/18/2018 3 365.00$
Revisions to proposed findings of fact and
conclusions of law 1,095.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/18/2018 0.7 365.00$
Draft proposed stipulated findings of fact and
conclusions of law 255.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/18/2018 0.8 365.00$ Review transcript from non-discharge hearing 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/19/2018 0.2 235.00$
Review correspondence from counsel regarding
trail; supplemental legal research 47.00$ Andrew Dunning

10/19/2018 2.3 310.00$
Research re evidentiary issues for trial, including
record sealing 713.00$ Erick Gjerdingen

10/19/2018 2.8 495.00$ Trial preparation 1,386.00$ Erika Turner
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10/19/2018 1.9 385.00$
Review and analysis of revised exhibit list/exhibits;
emails regarding same; revise exhibit list. 731.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/19/2018 1.1 385.00$ Review and revise proposed stipulated facts. 423.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/19/2018 7.7 365.00$
Further revisions to and finalize exhibit list; Review
Plaintiff's exhibits; 2,810.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/20/2018 0.4 495.00$
Telephone conference with co-counsel re strategy on
how to proceed 198.00$ Erika Turner

10/20/2018 1.3 385.00$

Further revise proposed stipulated facts,
incorporating comments from E. Turner and
revisions by T. Pilatowicz, and revise proposed
findings and conclusions. 500.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/20/2018 2.5 385.00$ Review of original case files in prep for trial. 962.50$ Gabby Hamm
10/21/2018 1 235.00$ Continue trial preparation legal research 235.00$ Andrew Dunning

10/21/2018 3.6 385.00$

Review and revise proposed findings of fact and
conclusions of law; incorporate changes by E.
Turner, T. Pilatowicz. 1,386.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/21/2018 5.4 385.00$

Further research regarding evidentiary issues (2.8);
review of motion to compel and supporting
documents in connection with Lippes Mathias and
Hodgson Russ productions (2.6). 2,079.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/21/2018 0.1 385.00$ Email regarding meeting with Bill Kimmel. 38.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/21/2018 0.4 385.00$

Review and analysis of proposed order of witnesses
and email to T. Pilatowicz and E. Turner regarding
same. 154.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/21/2018 0.6 365.00$
Prepare proposed order of witnesses as required by
Court 219.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/21/2018 2.2 365.00$ Revisions to proposed stipulated facts 803.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/22/2018 0.9 -$
Continue trial preparation legal research - No
Charge -$ Andrew Dunning

10/22/2018 2.3 310.00$ Review and revise proposed FFCL 713.00$ Erick Gjerdingen

10/22/2018 1.1 -$ Analysis re evidentiary issues for trial - No Charge -$ Erick Gjerdingen

10/22/2018 2.3 310.00$
Continue research and analysis re introduction of
sealed and vacated judgment 713.00$ Erick Gjerdingen

10/22/2018 1.5 310.00$ Draft memo re sealed and vacated judgment 465.00$ Erick Gjerdingen

10/22/2018 0.7 495.00$
Review exhibit list and proposed FFCL in
preparation for trial 346.50$ Erika Turner

10/22/2018 1 495.00$ Trial preparation 495.00$ Erika Turner
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10/22/2018 13 385.00$

Trial preparation, including further review of
documents relating to real property transfers. Email
with T. Pilatowicz regarding exhibits. Emails with
T. Pilatowicz and E. Turner regarding admissibility
of exhibits; discuss same with E. Turner. Further
revise proposed findings of fact and conclusions of
law; synthesize revisions by T. Pilatowicz. Review
and analysis of appraisals and related documents. 5,005.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/22/2018 3 365.00$
Finalize proposed findings of fact and conclusions
of law 1,095.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/22/2018 1.8 365.00$
Review and analysis of Defendant's proposed
findings of facts and conclusions of law 657.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/22/2018 3 365.00$
Analysis of trial evidentiary issues and solutions for
same 1,095.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/22/2018 0.8 365.00$ Call with Tim Herbst re: trial 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/22/2018 1.1 365.00$ Call with J. McGovern regarding trial 401.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/23/2018 5.7 495.00$ Review depos/docs and further preparation for trial 2,821.50$ Erika Turner

10/23/2018 4.3 -$

Continue general trial preparation, including
preparation and review of personal working binders.
No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/23/2018 4.2 385.00$
Review and analysis of expert disclosures, reports,
and related document productions in prep for trial. 1,617.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/23/2018 2.1 -$
Continue review of deposition transcripts, including
Morabito deposition. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/23/2018 0.4 365.00$ Prepare Herbst testimony outline 146.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/23/2018 1 365.00$ Prepare for McGovern testimony 365.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/23/2018 0.8 365.00$ Prepare Bayuk outline of needed testimony 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/23/2018 1.3 365.00$ Review Morabito deposition video 474.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/23/2018 0.7 365.00$
review combined exhibit list and correspondence
with F. Gilmore regarding same 255.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/23/2018 1.6 365.00$
Strategize regarding presentation of Superpumper
receivables evidence 584.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/24/2018 5.8 495.00$
Trial preparation re strategy on how to proceed with
evidentiary matters 2,871.00$ Erika Turner

10/24/2018 1.8 -$

Gather materials needed for trial, including working
binders, key exhibits, notes, deposition comments
and expert report notes. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm
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10/24/2018 1.5 385.00$

Review of Defendants€™ revised proposed findings
of fact and conclusions of law, and email to T.
Pilatowicz and E. Turner regarding same. 577.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/24/2018 1.7 -$
Review of motions in limine, oppositions, and
replies. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/24/2018 1 -$
Coordinate shipping/delivery of trial materials. No
Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/24/2018 0.2 -$ Conference call re deposition exhibits. No Charge -$ Michael Esposito

10/24/2018 3 365.00$
Review deposition excerpt exhibits and revisions to
deposition transcripts 1,095.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/24/2018 1.8 365.00$ Review exhibits from Defendants 657.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/24/2018 0.7 365.00$ Finalize revisions to exhibits list 255.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/24/2018 0.3 365.00$
Multiple correspondence with opposing counsel
regarding exhibits, depositions designations 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/24/2018 1.5 365.00$ Further general trial strategy preparation 547.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/25/2018 10.5 495.00$ Trial preparation re party examination 5,197.50$ Erika Turner

10/25/2018 0.8 495.00$ Meet with client BLeonard in preparation for trial 396.00$ Erika Turner

10/25/2018 1.6 385.00$
Travel from Las Vegas to Reno. (3.2 hrs. billed at
1/2 time) 616.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/25/2018 2.8 385.00$

Exhibit marking and audio visual testing with clerk
at 2nd Judicial District Court; meeting with
opposing counsel and Judge Steinheimer in
chambers regarding trial schedule. 1,078.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/25/2018 3.5 -$

Review and organization of materials shipped from
Las Vegas, including exhibits, working binders, and
other trial materials (1.4); review of exhibit list and
exhibits (2.1). No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/25/2018 1.3 385.00$

Review of Kimmel appraisal, notes/questions
regarding same, and Defendants' exhibits regarding
Panorama property. 500.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/25/2018 0.5 365.00$ Further revise Herbst questions 182.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/25/2018 2 365.00$

Review and finalize exhibit list re: documents to
admit; Review Defendants' stipulated admitted
exhibits 730.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/25/2018 0.3 365.00$ Further revise McGovern questioning 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/25/2018 2.5 365.00$
Further strategize regarding exhibit admissions and
presentation of case facts 912.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/25/2018 1 365.00$
Further review and analysis of proposed revisions to
stipulated facts 365.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/25/2018 2.8 365.00$

Meeting with Court Clerk regarding exhibit marking
and meeting with judge regarding trial scheduling
issues 1,022.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
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10/26/2018 0.3 310.00$ Assist in trial prep re evidentiary strategy 93.00$ Erick Gjerdingen

10/26/2018 2.3 495.00$ Prepare for trial- witness exam and opening outlines 1,138.50$ Erika Turner

10/26/2018 4.6 -$
Review of exhibit binders and further analysis of
evidentiary issues. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

10/26/2018 2.2 385.00$
Meeting with Bill Kimmel and visit to property on
Panorama. 847.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/26/2018 1.4 385.00$
Prepare witness outline for Bill Kimmel, begin
analysis of Noble cross-exam. 539.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/26/2018 0.8 365.00$ Commence draft of Salazar cross 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/26/2018 0.8 365.00$ Further revise McGovern question 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
10/26/2018 1 365.00$ Review exhibit binders for further trial prep 365.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/26/2018 2.2 -$
Meeting with Bill Kimmel; View Panorama property
- No Charge -$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/26/2018 0.7 365.00$ Attend to stipulated facts 255.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/26/2018 1.8 365.00$
Further prepare strategy regarding presentation of
Superpumper evidence 657.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/27/2018 9 495.00$ Trial preparation- witness exam outlines/opening 4,455.00$ Erika Turner

10/27/2018 7.1 385.00$

General trial preparation, including review of
Defendants' trial exhibits and analysis of evidentiary
issues regarding same. 2,733.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/27/2018 0.6 385.00$ Review and analysis of revised stipulated facts. 231.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/27/2018 1.8 385.00$
Review of Sewitz and Justmann deposition
designations and mark objections to same. 693.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/27/2018 10.5 365.00$

Trial preparation including reviewing and revising
evidentiary issue summaries, reviewing and revising
stipulated facts, supplementing outline for Bayuk
and Morabito 3,832.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/28/2018 1.5 495.00$ Travel to Reno for trial (Billed half time) 742.50$ Erika Turner

10/28/2018 7.8 495.00$
Prepare for trial with exhibit/witness analysis and
preparation of witness exam detail 3,861.00$ Erika Turner

10/28/2018 7.3 385.00$

General trial preparation, including review of
Defendants' exhibits and proposed findings; analysis
of admissibility objections. 2,810.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/28/2018 1 385.00$

Meeting with E. Turner and T. Pilatowicz regarding
outstanding issues with exhibits, key issues, and trial
presentation. 385.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/28/2018 0.6 385.00$
Review of evidentiary objections memo and
supplement same. 231.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/28/2018 11 365.00$

Trial preparation including, refining Herbst
questions, preparing motion in limine arguments,
reviewing evidence for admissibility objections, 4,015.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/29/2018 11.5 495.00$ Prepare for and attend trial 5,692.50$ Erika Turner
10/29/2018 7.8 385.00$ Attend trial, day 1. 3,003.00$ Gabby Hamm
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10/29/2018 1.4 385.00$
Draft proposed statement of non-stipulated facts per
Court directive. 539.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/29/2018 11.3 365.00$

Trial Day, prep (2.0); in trial (7.5); revise FF&CL
consistent with judge's request (.8); review
evidentiary issues from trial (1.0) 4,124.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/30/2018 14 495.00$ Prepare for and attend trial 6,930.00$ Erika Turner
10/30/2018 3.5 385.00$ Attend morning portion of trial, day 2. 1,347.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/30/2018 9.6 385.00$

Review of defendants' trial brief regarding hearsay
and authenticity issues (.3); further research
regarding various evidentiary objections, including
cases cited by defendants, and research regarding
dates of relevant document productions (4.0); draft
trial brief regarding evidentiary objections (5.3). 3,696.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/30/2018 0.6 385.00$
Review document production regarding Glenneyre
lease. 231.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/30/2018 8.5 365.00$ Trial day 2 - Further prep and attendance 3,102.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/30/2018 2 365.00$
Commence review of designated transcripts in
anticipation of objections and responses to same 730.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/30/2018 0.9 365.00$
Attention to exhibit evidentiary issues raised at trial
and response to same 328.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/30/2018 1.4 365.00$
Analysis of items required for Bayuk's testimony for
FF&CL 511.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

10/31/2018 2.4 310.00$ Research re evidentiary issues for trial per TMP 744.00$ Erick Gjerdingen
10/31/2018 14 495.00$ Prepare for and attend trial 6,930.00$ Erika Turner
10/31/2018 3.1 385.00$ Attend afternoon portion of trial, day 3. 1,193.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/31/2018 2.5 385.00$
Review of document production vis-a-vis potential
rebuttal exhibits. 962.50$ Gabby Hamm

10/31/2018 2.6 385.00$
Finalize and file trial brief regarding evidentiary
objections. 1,001.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/31/2018 1.4 385.00$
Redact Paul Morabito deposition transcript per
Court directive. 539.00$ Gabby Hamm

10/31/2018 14.5 365.00$
Further prepare for trial and trial day; Prepare for
Thursday (McGovern, deposition changes) 5,292.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/1/2018 0.7 310.00$
Drafting brief memo re offset issues in BK with
fraudulent transfers 217.00$ Erick Gjerdingen

11/1/2018 12 495.00$ Prepare for and attend trial 5,940.00$ Erika Turner
11/1/2018 9.5 385.00$ Attend trial, day 4. 3,657.50$ Gabby Hamm

11/1/2018 2.8 385.00$
Review appraisal and notes, and revise direct exam
outline for Bill Kimmel. 1,078.00$ Gabby Hamm

11/1/2018 1.2 385.00$

Discuss client direct exam with E. Turner and client
(.6); review of LMWF document production issues
(.4); telephone call with J. Murtha regarding same
(.2). 462.00$ Gabby Hamm
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11/1/2018 11.5 365.00$ Further prepare for and trial day 4,197.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
11/2/2018 11.5 495.00$ Prepare for and attend trial 5,692.50$ Erika Turner
11/2/2018 1.5 -$ Travel re trial (billed half time) -$ Erika Turner
11/2/2018 6.7 385.00$ Attend trial, day 5. 2,579.50$ Gabby Hamm
11/2/2018 1 385.00$ Meet with Bill Kimmel. 385.00$ Gabby Hamm
11/2/2018 6.7 365.00$ Further prepare for and attend trial day 5 2,445.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/3/2018 2 495.00$
Prepare for trial re Salazar expected testimony and
cross 990.00$ Erika Turner

11/3/2018 1.8 385.00$ Research regarding Darryl Noble appraisal. 693.00$ Gabby Hamm
11/4/2018 1.5 -$ Travel re trial (billed half time) -$ Erika Turner

11/4/2018 2.8 385.00$

Review of designated deposition testimony of
defense witnesses (Dennis Vacco, Christian
Lovelace, Stanton Bernstein, Spencer Cavalier). 1,078.00$ Gabby Hamm

11/4/2018 4.8 385.00$

Review of deposition testimony of Darryl Noble,
appraisal, work file, and related exhibits, and
prepare cross-examination outline of Darryl Noble. 1,848.00$ Gabby Hamm

11/4/2018 0.7 385.00$
Brief review of Dennis Banks deposition testimony
and outline cross-examination. 269.50$ Gabby Hamm

11/4/2018 0.4 -$
Brief review of proposed findings of fact and
conclusions of law. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

11/4/2018 4.3 365.00$ Prepare for Frederich testimony 1,569.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
11/5/2018 11.5 495.00$ Prepare for and attend trial 5,692.50$ Erika Turner

11/5/2018 2.2 385.00$
Prepare for trial day 7, including witnesses Dennis
Banks and Darryl Noble. 847.00$ Gabby Hamm

11/5/2018 1.4 385.00$
Coordinate copies of revised deposition designations
for court, witness, opposing counsel. 539.00$ Gabby Hamm

11/5/2018 5.1 385.00$ Attend trial, day 6. 1,963.50$ Gabby Hamm
11/5/2018 8 365.00$ Further prepare for and attend trial day 6 2,920.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
11/6/2018 9.5 495.00$ Prepare for and attend trial 4,702.50$ Erika Turner
11/6/2018 9.5 385.00$ Prepare for and attend trial, day 7. 3,657.50$ Gabby Hamm

11/6/2018 0.6 -$
Discussion and analysis of trial testimony with E.
Turner, T. Pilatowicz, and client. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

11/6/2018 9.5 365.00$ Further prepare for and attend trial day 7 3,467.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
11/7/2018 4.9 310.00$ Research re judgment offset treatment in BK 1,519.00$ Erick Gjerdingen
11/7/2018 2.5 495.00$ Attend trial 1,237.50$ Erika Turner
11/7/2018 1 495.00$ Attend to preparation of closing argument 495.00$ Erika Turner
11/7/2018 1.5 495.00$ Travel from trial (billed half time) 742.50$ Erika Turner

11/7/2018 0.4 385.00$
Telephone call with G. Gordon regarding trial and
bankruptcy case issues/Virsenet litigation. 154.00$ Gabby Hamm

11/7/2018 1.6 385.00$
Travel from Reno to Las Vegas. (3 hrs. billed at 1/2
time) 616.00$ Gabby Hamm

11/7/2018 3.2 385.00$ Attend trial, day 8. 1,232.00$ Gabby Hamm
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11/7/2018 2.6 365.00$ Final trial day 949.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/7/2018 0.3 365.00$ Conference with G. Gordon regarding trial summary 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
11/7/2018 1.5 365.00$ Travel from Reno (this is half time) 547.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
11/8/2018 0.5 310.00$ Follow up research re treatment of setoff in BK 155.00$ Erick Gjerdingen

11/8/2018 2.5 385.00$
Analysis of trial notes in preparation for revision of
proposed findings. 962.50$ Gabby Hamm

11/9/2018 0.1 365.00$ Review court minutes 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/11/2018 0.5 495.00$
Telephone conference with team re status and
strategy on how to proceed 247.50$ Erika Turner

11/13/2018 0.4 -$ (NO CHARGE) Coordinate all hands call -$ Teresa Pilatowicz
11/13/2018 0.8 365.00$ Commence review and revisions to FF&CL 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/14/2018 4.2 495.00$
Attend to preparation of amended FFCL to reflect
evidence at trial 2,079.00$ Erika Turner

11/14/2018 0.1 385.00$
Review of email and invoice from Bill Kimmel +
follow-up 38.50$ Gabby Hamm

11/14/2018 1.3 385.00$
Analysis of

500.50$ Gabby Hamm

11/14/2018 0.2 -$ Attention to status of court documents - No Charge -$ Teresa Pilatowicz
11/15/2018 3.3 495.00$ Attend to FFCL 1,633.50$ Erika Turner

11/15/2018 0.4 -$
Meet with A. Dunning regarding further research on
value issue. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

11/15/2018 3.8 385.00$

Research regarding

1,463.00$ Gabby Hamm
11/15/2018 0.1 365.00$ Correspondence from and to Bill Kimmel 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/15/2018 0.8 365.00$
Review and attention to notes re: points for amended
FFCL 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/15/2018 0.1 365.00$
Further communications with all interested parties
regarding strategy for remedies 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/16/2018 0.3 235.00$

Conduct supplemental research regarding

70.50$ Andrew Dunning

11/16/2018 6.2 385.00$

Research regarding

2,387.00$ Gabby Hamm
11/16/2018 0.6 775.00$ conf with G Hamm re finding and conclusions 465.00$ Gerald Gordon

11/18/2018 0.4 365.00$
Review and analysis of memorandum regarding

146.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/19/2018 2.5 235.00$

Continue supplemental research regarding

587.50$ Andrew Dunning
11/19/2018 3.9 495.00$ Attend to preparation of amended FFCL 1,930.50$ Erika Turner
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FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

11/19/2018 3.9 385.00$

Review of trial minutes and final exhibit list (.6);
review of proposed findings and stipulated facts (.7);
gather and begin reviewing marked deposition
transcripts (and validate to changes during trial) in
light of trial transcripts not being received (2.6). 1,501.50$ Gabby Hamm

11/19/2018 0.4 -$
Receipt and brief overview of trial transcript (first 5
days). No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

11/19/2018 0.5 365.00$ All hands call regarding remedy request 182.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/19/2018 3.6 365.00$
Review transcripts for trial days 1 and 2 for closing
citations 1,314.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/20/2018 11.5 495.00$ Prepare for closing arguments 5,692.50$ Erika Turner

11/20/2018 3.5 365.00$ Review and mark transcripts for trials days 3 and 4 1,277.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/21/2018 7.6 495.00$
Review transcripts for evidence to include in
proposed FFCL + research re same 3,762.00$ Erika Turner

11/21/2018 3.5 385.00$

Review of admitted exhibits (1.7); research
regarding miscellaneous legal issues for proposed
conclusions of law (1.8). 1,347.50$ Gabby Hamm

11/21/2018 4.3 365.00$
Commence review and revisions to amended
proposed FF&CL 1,569.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/23/2018 8.2 385.00$

Review of admitted exhibits and trial testimony in
connection with proposed findings (4.4); review of
research from A. Dunning regarding value issue (.2);
research in connection with proposed conclusions
(3.6). 3,157.00$ Gabby Hamm

11/23/2018 0.8 775.00$
assist with

620.00$ Gerald Gordon
11/23/2018 1.9 365.00$ Further review and revisions to FF&CL 693.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
11/24/2018 6.5 495.00$ Review evidence and attend to FFCL 3,217.50$ Erika Turner

11/24/2018 7.4 385.00$
Continue working on proposed findings and
conclusions. 2,849.00$ Gabby Hamm

11/25/2018 14.8 495.00$
Attend to amended FFCL and preparation of closing
arguments 7,326.00$ Erika Turner

11/25/2018 1.5 495.00$
Travel to Reno for closing arguments (billed at half
time) 742.50$ Erika Turner

11/25/2018 10.4 385.00$
Continue working on proposed findings and
conclusions. 4,004.00$ Gabby Hamm

11/25/2018 14 365.00$
Further review and revisions to FF&CL, including
working travel to Reno 5,110.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/26/2018 1.9 310.00$ Research re FFCL issues 589.00$ Erick Gjerdingen
11/26/2018 11 495.00$ Prepare for and attend trial closing arguments 5,445.00$ Erika Turner
11/26/2018 1.5 495.00$ Travel from trial (billed at half time) 742.50$ Erika Turner

11/26/2018 4.3 -$
Continue revising and finalizing proposed findings
and conclusions. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm
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FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL
11/26/2018 0.5 775.00$ conf with assoc attys re bk issues 387.50$ Gerald Gordon
11/26/2018 7 365.00$ Further revise and finalize FF&CL 2,555.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
11/26/2018 7 365.00$ Attend closing arguments 2,555.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
11/26/2018 2.8 365.00$ Travel from Reno (this is half time) 1,022.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/27/2018 0.1 365.00$ Call with C. Kemper regarding closing arguments 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/27/2018 0.8 365.00$
Analysis of remaining issues raised in closing and
method to address same 292.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/30/2018 1.3 365.00$

Review Vacco e-mails regarding additional evidence
of off-shore trusts in light of evidence from
Superpumper trial 474.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

11/30/2018 1 365.00$
Call with J. Murtha and G. Gordon regarding
Superpumper trial and evidence resulting therefrom 365.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

12/9/2018 0.2 495.00$
Review and finalize declaration in support of
Motion to Compel 99.00$ Erika Turner

1/4/2019 0.3 365.00$

Correspondence to W. Leonard regarding expert
payment; Call with J. McGovern regarding same;
Correspondence from and to W. Kimmel regarding
same 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

1/11/2019 0.1 365.00$ Follow up re: expert payment issues 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

1/12/2019 0.2 365.00$
Review status of proceedings and recent updates
regarding bankruptcy case 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

1/16/2019 0.3 365.00$ Attention to fee application 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz
1/16/2019 0.1 495.00$ Email communication with creditor rep re status 49.50$ Erika Turner

1/17/2019 4.5 195.00$

Receive accounting fees and costs for 8/1/2018 -
12/31/2018. Create excel spreadsheet of Fees by
Professional, Fees by Task Code and Expenses.
Draft GTG Fifth Interim Fee Application and
corresponding declarations and order. 877.50$ Michele Pori

1/21/2019 0.9 365.00$ Review and revisions to fee application exhibits 328.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

1/23/2019 0.5 775.00$

conf with assoc atty Erika T re

387.50$ Gerald Gordon

1/23/2019 3.5 195.00$

Receive revised accounting fees and costs for
8/1/2018 - 12/31/2018. Revise excel spreadsheet of
Fees by Professional, Fees by Task Code and
Expenses. 682.50$ Michele Pori

1/23/2019 1 495.00$

Review Frank Gilmore response to post-Judgment
subpoena requests for production +
conference/analysis re strategy on how to proceed to
address same 495.00$ Erika Turner
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June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

1/23/2019 0.2 385.00$

Discuss RSSB subpoena response with E. Turner
and G. Gordon, and motion to reopen Superpumper
matter in connection with same. 77.00$ Gabby Hamm

1/24/2019 0.5 365.00$ Further revise fourth interim fee application 182.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

1/24/2019 0.2 775.00$

t/c with client Leonard re

155.00$ Gerald Gordon

1/24/2019 1.5 195.00$

Receive accounting fees and costs for 8/1/2018 -
12/31/2018. Continue and complete creation of
excel spreadsheet of Fees by Professional, Fees by
Task Code and Expenses. Continue and complete
revised GTG Fifth Interim Fee Application with
corresponding declarations and order. 292.50$ Michele Pori

1/24/2019 0.2 495.00$

Analysis with GHamm re

99.00$ Erika Turner

1/24/2019 6 385.00$

Research regarding motion to reopen (2.9); review
of discovery and trial transcript in connection with
motion to reopen (2.8); discussions with E. Turner
and G. Gordon regarding reopening (.3). 2,310.00$ Gabby Hamm

1/25/2019 0.1 495.00$ Follow up analysis re motion to reopen evidence 49.50$ Erika Turner

1/25/2019 6.6 385.00$

Review trial transcript and discovery in connection
with motion to reopen (5.4); email T. Pilatowicz
regarding same (.1); begin drafting motion to reopen
(1.1) 2,541.00$ Gabby Hamm

1/26/2019 1.3 365.00$
Review and summarize trial testimony regarding
cites for motion to reopen 474.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

1/27/2019 1.6 385.00$
Review trial transcript in connection with motion to
reopen. 616.00$ Gabby Hamm

1/28/2019 5.1 385.00$

Continue drafting motion to reopen and related
review of trial transcript and proposed findings and
conclusions. 1,963.50$ Gabby Hamm

1/29/2019 0.7 775.00$ review and revise motion to reopen evidence 542.50$ Gerald Gordon

1/29/2019 1 365.00$
Further research deposition testimony to support
motion to reopen; Review motion to reopen 365.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

1/29/2019 0.7 365.00$
Finalize fifth interim fee application and supporting
documents 255.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

1/29/2019 1.9 495.00$ Review and revise Motion to Reopen Evidence 940.50$ Erika Turner

1/29/2019 8.7 385.00$

Continue drafting motion to reopen evidence,
including review of trial transcript, trial exhibits,
and discovery. 3,349.50$ Gabby Hamm

50/56

8450



FEES
June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

1/30/2019 0.3 365.00$
Review OST requests for motion to reopen and
respond re: same 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

1/30/2019 0.5 495.00$

Conference with GMG re status and strategy

247.50$ Erika Turner

1/30/2019 3.4 385.00$
Finalize motion to reopen; prepare declaration in
support thereof; gather exhibits; coordinate filing. 1,309.00$ Gabby Hamm

1/30/2019 0.2 -$
Coordinate filing of errata to motion to reopen due
to technical issue with pdf conversion. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

1/30/2019 3.5 385.00$
Prepare motion for order shortening time on motion
to reopen. 1,347.50$ Gabby Hamm

1/31/2019 0.2 365.00$
Review and analysis for ex parte request for
expedited hearing 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

1/31/2019 1.8 -$

Revise motion for order shortening time; draft
declaration in support of same; coordinate filing. No
Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

2/4/2019 2.1 195.00$

Preparation for OST Hearing on Motion to Re-Open
Discovery. Pull all cited references to trial
transcripts and highlight all cited lines for use in
hearing. 409.50$ Michele Pori

2/4/2019 0.2 365.00$

Review OST re: motion to reopen evidence (.1);
Correspondence to J. Murtha and client regarding
same (.1) 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

2/4/2019 0.1 495.00$
Review order from court setting hearing on Motion
to Reopen 49.50$ Erika Turner

2/4/2019 0.2 495.00$

Review FGilmore declaration filed in BK + attend to
preparation of supplement to Motion to Reopen re
same 99.00$ Erika Turner

2/4/2019 0.3 495.00$ Review closing re 148.50$ Erika Turner

2/4/2019 0.1 495.00$
Review Gilmore motion to withdraw filed in other
actions 49.50$ Erika Turner

2/4/2019 3.7 385.00$

Receipt and review of Court's OST and discuss same
with E. Turner (.2); plan for hearing, exhibits,
demonstratives, etc., and begin review/compilation
of same (1.8); discuss same with E. Turner (.2);
review of F. Gilmore declaration regarding RSSB
transaction ledger, and prepare supplement to
motion to reopen and declaration in support of same
to submit declaration (1.5). 1,424.50$ Gabby Hamm

2/4/2019 1.1 385.00$ Review of closing argument transcript. 423.50$ Gabby Hamm

2/4/2019 0.2 775.00$
review ost and email with analysis of various
Gilmore withdrawals and impact on hearing 155.00$ Gerald Gordon
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June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019

DATE HOURS RATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT PROFESSIONAL

2/5/2019 0.4 365.00$
Review and analysis of multiple correspondence
from F. Gilmore related to motion to reopen 146.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

2/5/2019 2.4 495.00$

Multiple communications re Gilmore withdrawal,
emails with a Gilmore re his request to continue
hearing -+ follow up re strategy on

1,188.00$ Erika Turner

2/5/2019 0.5 -$
Emails (3) regarding continuance of hearing. No
Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

2/5/2019 0.4 385.00$

Further correspondence between E. Turner and
opposing counsel regarding his travel and hearing
date, and analysis of response regarding same. 154.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/6/2019 0.7 365.00$

Review and analysis of response re: motion to re-
open; Review closing arguments regarding cites for
use in reply 255.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

2/6/2019 0.9 495.00$

review FGilmore response to Motion to Reopen
Evidence + Research re reopening evidence in
preparation for hearing 445.50$ Erika Turner

2/6/2019 2.8 385.00$

Analysis of Defendants' opposition to motion to
reopen and discuss same with E. Turner and G.
Gordon (.5); research regarding issues raised in
defendants' response and use of depositions for trial
(2.3). 1,078.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/7/2019 0.4 365.00$
Review and revisions to reply in support of motion
to reopen 146.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

2/7/2019 1 495.00$
Revise and finalize Reply in support of Motion to
Reopen Evidence 495.00$ Erika Turner

2/7/2019 2.8 495.00$
Travel to hearing on Motion to Reopen Evidence,
preparing for hearing at airport and during flight 1,386.00$ Erika Turner

2/7/2019 6.3 385.00$

Draft reply in support of motion to reopen and
related research (5.1); incorporate revisions by T.
Pilatowicz and E. Turner, edit and finalize same for
filing (1.2). 2,425.50$ Gabby Hamm

2/7/2019 0.4 -$

Hearing prep, including identifying and gathering
trial exhibits and transcript excerpts needed for
hearing on motion to reopen. No Charge. -$ Gabby Hamm

2/8/2019 0.1 495.00$

Review correspondence from opposing counsel
FGilmore re EBayuk attendance at hearing + court’s
response 49.50$ Erika Turner

2/8/2019 1.7 495.00$ Attend hearing on Motion to Reopen Evidence 841.50$ Erika Turner
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June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019
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2/8/2019 2.5 -$ Travel from hearing - no charge -$ Erika Turner

2/8/2019 1.4 385.00$

Brief research regarding attendance/testimony by
remote transmission in light of Bayuk request to
appear telephonically; email to E. Turner re same. 539.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/8/2019 0.3 385.00$

Telephone call with E. Turner regarding outcome of
hearing on motion to reopen, and discussion with G.
Gordon regarding rebuttal testimony. 115.50$ Gabby Hamm

2/12/2019 0.1 495.00$
Review FGilmore motion to withdraw in
Superpumper case 49.50$ Erika Turner

2/13/2019 0.2 -$ Review Gilmore motion to withdraw (no charge) -$ Andrew Dunning
2/13/2019 0.2 365.00$ Attention to March 1 continued trial matters 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

2/13/2019 0.4 495.00$
Review correspondence from opposing counsel
FGilmore + prepare response and follow up 198.00$ Erika Turner

2/13/2019 0.1 385.00$
Review of emails regarding Bayuk attendance at
March 1 hearing. 38.50$ Gabby Hamm

2/14/2019 0.6 365.00$

Conference with G. Gordon regarding impact of
various documents on Superpumper litigation (.2);
review recent pleadings from Bayuk and Morabito
regarding same (.4) 219.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

2/14/2019 0.2 495.00$
Email communications with opposing counsel
FGilmore re his request for continuation of hearing 99.00$ Erika Turner

2/15/2019 0.1 495.00$
Review Shemano invoice to

49.50$ Erika Turner

2/15/2019 3.1 385.00$
Draft response to motion to withdraw and related
research. 1,193.50$ Gabby Hamm

2/20/2019 0.8 495.00$
Review Motion to Continue March 1 trial and OST
request on the Motion + follow up to address same 396.00$ Erika Turner

2/20/2019 0.4 385.00$
Brief review of defendants' motion to continue and
discuss with E. Turner vis-a-vis strategy. 154.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/20/2019 0.4 385.00$

Review of email from D. Shemano (counsel for
Morabito/Bayuk) regarding Snowshoe checks;
discuss with G. Gordon and M. Weisenmiller vis-a-
vis defendants' positions for March 1 trial date. 154.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/21/2019 0.1 495.00$
Email communications with Court re briefing and
hearing on Motion to Continue March 1 Trial 49.50$ Erika Turner
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June 1, 2016 - March 28, 2019
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2/21/2019 8.2 385.00$

Analysis of motion to continue and related
declarations and exhibits, and review of bankruptcy
court filings relevant to same (1.5); draft opposition
to motion to continue and contemporaneous research
regarding same (6.7). 3,157.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/22/2019 0.3 365.00$
Review and proposed edits to opposition to motion
to continue 109.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

2/22/2019 0.2 365.00$ Review and revise response to motion to withdraw 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz
2/22/2019 1 495.00$ Revise Opposition to Motion to Continue 495.00$ Erika Turner

2/22/2019 2.2 385.00$

Revise opposition to motion to continue hearing and
draft declaration in support of same; identify
exhibits in support of same. 847.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/22/2019 0.4 385.00$
Revise opposition to motion to withdraw and
circulate same for review and comment. 154.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/22/2019 0.2 385.00$
Email to M. Trabert and opposing counsel with
courtesy copy of filing. 77.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/25/2019 0.8 495.00$ Prepare for hearing on Motion to Continue Trial 396.00$ Erika Turner

2/25/2019 0.5 495.00$
Review Chemano/Bayuk productions in the BK case
and analysis re use in cross exam on March 1 247.50$ Erika Turner

2/25/2019 0.3 495.00$ Review and analyze Reply on Motion to Continue 148.50$ Erika Turner

2/25/2019 0.7 385.00$

Review of Defendants' reply in support of motion to
continue and declaration and exhibits in support of
same; analysis of response and discuss same with E.
Turner. 269.50$ Gabby Hamm

2/26/2019 0.2 365.00$

Review and analysis of additional documents and
checks produced by Morabito as they relate to
Superpumper action 73.00$ Teresa Pilatowicz

2/26/2019 0.3 775.00$
conf with EPT re Friday hearing and new snowshoe
petroleum production of checks 232.50$ Gerald Gordon

2/26/2019 0.5 495.00$

Attend telephonic hearing on Motion to Continue
Trial + follow up communications with opposing
counsel FGilmore and with Court re same 247.50$ Erika Turner

2/26/2019 4.6 495.00$

Prepare for trial cross-examination of Sam and Ed
and analysis of FGilmore as surrebuttal witness +
analysis of exhibits to be used in crossexam and
surrebuttal 2,277.00$ Erika Turner

2/26/2019 0.3 385.00$
Prepare for and attend telephonic hearing on
defendants' motion to continue. 115.50$ Gabby Hamm
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2/26/2019 0.2 385.00$

Review of Supreme Court rules on simultaneous
audiovisual transmission, and forward same to E.
Turner in connection with Bayuk remote
appearance. 77.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/26/2019 0.3 385.00$

Review and analysis of correspondence regarding
additional Snowshoe checks and Sam Morabito
travel to the Caribbean. 115.50$ Gabby Hamm

2/26/2019 4.1 385.00$

Identify and gather potential exhibits for hearing,
including review of trial exhibits (admitted and not
offered), including for impeachment or rebuttal. 1,578.50$ Gabby Hamm

2/26/2019 0.4 385.00$

Email to opposing counsel identifying exhibits and
potential exhibits to be provided to defendants in
advance of hearing. 154.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/27/2019 1 495.00$

Multiple email communications with opposing
counsel and Court re FGilmore as witness on
surrebuttal 495.00$ Erika Turner

2/27/2019 0.5 495.00$

Multiple email communications with opposing
counsel re defendants’ waiver of rebuttal + follow
up re same 247.50$ Erika Turner

2/27/2019 1.5 385.00$

Review of emails regarding designation of potential
exhibits and rebuttal/sur-rebuttal testimony by Frank
Gilmore, and analysis of

. 577.50$ Gabby Hamm

2/27/2019 3.2 385.00$

Preparation for continued trial date, including
examination of exhibits, review of trial transcript
and exhibits for impeachment and rebuttal, review of
papers on motion to reopen, and review of
defendants' declarations. 1,232.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/27/2019 0.2 385.00$
Discussion with T. Pilatowicz regarding planning
for hearing and issues to address. 77.00$ Gabby Hamm

2/27/2019 0.1 385.00$
Discussion with E. Turner regarding defendants'
waiver of rebuttal. 38.50$ Gabby Hamm

2/28/2019 0.6 495.00$
Review and revise proposed stipulation and order +
related communications with opposing counsel 297.00$ Erika Turner

2/28/2019 0.2 495.00$

Multiple communications with court re vacating
hearing and amending the proposed FFCL + follow
up with JMurtha and CKemper re status in light of
Defendants’ waiver of rebuttal 99.00$ Erika Turner

3/1/2019 0.1 365.00$
Finalize fifth interim fee order; Correspondence to
N. Strozza regarding same 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

3/1/2019 0.3 385.00$
Brief review of findings and conclusions and
judgment. 115.50$ Gabby Hamm
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3/4/2019 0.1 365.00$
Review and comment on revisions re: FF&CL to
address new evidence 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

3/4/2019 0.1 495.00$ Attend to amended FFCL in light of new evidence 49.50$ Erika Turner

3/4/2019 2.5 385.00$

Revise proposed findings and conclusions to add
findings regarding Snowshoe payments pursuant to
motion to reopen. 962.50$ Gabby Hamm

3/6/2019 0.5 -$
Conferences with co-counsel on how to proceed - no
charge -$ Erika Turner

3/6/2019 1.1 385.00$
Revise and finalize proposed findings and submit to
clerk. 423.50$ Gabby Hamm

3/11/2019 0.3 775.00$
reply to Gilmore re treatment of Snowshoe
Petroleum payments to firm on behalf of Morabito 232.50$ Gerald Gordon

3/11/2019 0.1 -$
Review request for submission re: motion to
withdraw (NO CHARGE) -$ Teresa Pilatowicz

3/11/2019 0.1 495.00$
Review correspondence re RSSB law firm subpoena
response 49.50$ Erika Turner

3/11/2019 0.1 495.00$
Review correspondence from opposing counsel
FGilmore 49.50$ Erika Turner

3/12/2019 0.1 365.00$
Correspondence to B. Leonard regarding fee order
and payment of Kimmel invoice 36.50$ Teresa Pilatowicz

2050.9 TOTAL $731,166.00
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Garman Turner Gordon
650 White Dr., Suite 100

Las Vegas, Nevada 89119
(725) 777-3000

1953
GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ.
Nevada Bar No. 6454
E-mail: eturner@gtg.legal
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ.
Nevada Bar No. 9605
E-mail: tpilatowicz @ gtg.legal
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ.
Nevada Bar No. 11588
E-mail: ghamm@gtg.legal
650 White Drive, Ste. 100
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119
Telephone 725-777-3000
Counsel to Plaintiff

FILED
Electronically
CV13-02663

2019-04-11 06:15:07 PM
Jacqueline Bryant
Clerk of the Court

Transaction # 7215253 : csulezic

IN THE SECOND JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT OF

THE STATE OF NEVADA, IN AND FOR THE COUNTY OF WASHOE

WILLIAM A. LEONARD, Trustee for the
Bankruptcy Estate of Paul Anthony
Morabito,

Plaintiff,

vs.

SUPERPUMPER, INC., an Arizona
corporation; EDWARD BAYUK,
individually and as Trustee of the EDWARD
WILLIAM BAYUK LIVING TRUST;
SALVATORE MORABITO, and individual;
and SNOWSHOE PETROLEUM, INC., a
New York corporation,

Defendants.

CASE NO.: CV13-02663

DEPT. NO.: 4

EMORANDUM OF COSTS AND
ISBURSEMENTS

NRS 18.005 Description' Amount
(1) Odyssey E -File & E -Serve. $200.00
(2) Reporters' fees for depositions, including a reporter's fee for one copy of

each deposition.
$18,200.50

(3) Jurors' fees and expenses, together with reasonable compensation of an
officer appointed to act in accordance with NRS 16.120.

$0.00

(4) Fees for witnesses at trial, pretrial hearings and deposing witnesses,
unless the court finds that the witness was called at the instance of the
prevailing party without reason or necessity.

$515.00

All costs are identified in the attached invoice of costs.

1
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Garman Turner Gordon
650 White Dr., Suite 100

Las Vegas, Nevada 89119
(725) 777-3000

NRS 18.005 Description' Amount
(5) Reasonable fees of not more than five expert witnesses in an amount of

not more than $1,500 for each witness unless the court allows a larger fee
after determining that the circumstances surrounding the expert's
testimony were of such necessity as to require the larger fee.

$77,201.80

(6) Reasonable fees of necessary interpreters. $

(7) The fee of any sheriff or licensed process server for the delivery or service
of any summons or subpoena used in the action, unless the court
determines that the service was not necessary.

$1,552.95

(8) Compensation for the official reporter or reporter pro tempore. $6,071.25

(9) Reasonable costs for any bond or undertaking required as part of the
action.

$

(10) Fees of a court bailiff or deputy marshal who was required to work
overtime.

$

(11) Reasonable costs for telecopies. $

(12) Reasonable costs for photocopies. (.25 per page) $17,961.67
(13) Reasonable costs for long distance telephone calls. $

(14) Reasonable costs for postage. $5,184.05
(15) Reasonable costs for travel and lodging incurred taking depositions and

conducting discovery.
$10,167.61

(16) Fees charged pursuant to NRS 19.0335. $

(17) Reasonable and necessary expense incurred in connection with the
action

$1,795.46

Travel for Hearings and Trial $15,059.78

Messenger Service $1,032.16

TOTAL $154,942.24

Dated this 11th day of April, 2019.

GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP

/s/ Teresa M. Pilatowicz
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ.
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ.
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ.
650 White Drive, Ste. 100
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119
Telephone 725-777-3000
Counsel for Plaintiff
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Garman Turner Gordon
650 White Dr., Suite 100

Las Vegas, Nevada 89119
(725) 777-3000

DECLARATION OF TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ. IN SUPPORT OF
MEMORANDUM OF COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

1. I am an attorney with the law firm of Garman Turner Gordon, LLP, counsel for

Plaintiff, William Leonard ("Plaintiff'), in the above -captioned matter. I am duly licensed to

practice law in the State of Nevada.

2. I make this declaration in support of Plaintiff's Memorandum of Costs and

Disbursements. I am over the age of eighteen and am competent to testify to the matters and facts

set forth herein. I state the following matters and facts upon my own personal knowledge, except

where stated upon information and belief, and as to those statements made upon information and

belief, I believe them to be true.

3. The items contained in the above memorandum are true and correct to the best of

my knowledge and belief; and the said disbursements have been necessarily incurred and paid in

this action.

4. The fees for the experts identified in Section (4), and specifically for James

McGovern (valuation expert), William Kimmel (appraiser), and Ronald Buss (appraiser), are

typical and commensurate of the fees charged by experts of similar experience and expertise,

which experts could not be retained for less than the $1,500 limit Mr. McGovern, and associates

working at McGovern and Greene LLP, bill at an hourly rate of between $350 and $400 for

partners (Mr. McGovern at $400.00), between $200-$250 for managers, between $150 and $175

for senior consultants, $125 for consultants, and between $60 and $75 for paraprofessionals.

McGovern & Greene billed a total of $64,076.80, which included travel associated with trial

testimony. Mr Kimmel billed $2,000 for appraisals of two Nevada properties and completed and

billed additional work and trial testimony at an hourly rate of $300.00, for a total billed of $3,200.

Mr. Buss billed $9,000 for the appraisals of four California properties and completed additional

work at an hourly rate of $350 for additional work, for a total billed of $9,925.00. The rates

charged are prevailing market rates and are the actual costs billed without mark up.

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit 1 is a true and correct copy of a ledger of costs from the

law firm of Garman Turner Gordon, LLP.
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Garman Turner Gordon
650 White Dr., Suite 100

Las Vegas, Nevada 89119
(725) 777-3000

I declare under penalty of perjury under the law of the State of Nevada (NRS 53.045), that

the foregoing is true and correct.

Dated this 11 day of April, 2019.

/s/ Teresa Pilatowicz
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TERESA M. PILATOWICZ
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Garman Turner Gordon
650 White Dr., Suite 100

Las Vegas, Nevada 89119
(725) 777-3000

AFFIRMATION

Pursuant to NRS 239B.030

The undersigned does hereby affirm that the preceding document does not contain the

social security number of any person.

Dated this 11th day of April, 2019.

GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP

/s/ Teresa Pilatowicz
ERIKA PIKE TURNER, ESQ.
TERESA M. PILATOWICZ, ESQ.
GABRIELLE A. HAMM, ESQ.
650 White Drive, Ste. 100
Las Vegas, Nevada 89119
Telephone 725-777-3000
Counsel for Plaintiff
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Las Vegas, Nevada 89119
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INDEX OF EXHIBITS

Exhibit Description

1 Ledger of Costs

2 Exhibit pagination excludes exhibit slip sheets.
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Garman Turner Gordon
650 White Dr., Suite 100

Las Vegas, Nevada 89119
(725) 777-3000

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I certify that I am an employee of GARMAN TURNER GORDON LLP, and that on this

date, pursuant to NRCP 5(b), I am serving a true and correct copy of the foregoing PLAINTIFF'S

MEMORANDUM OF COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS on the parties as set forth below:

XXX Placing an original or true copy thereof in a sealed envelope placed for collection
and mailing in the United States Mail, Reno, Nevada, postage prepaid, following
ordinary business practices addressed as follows:

Edward Bayuk
668 N. Pacific Coast Highway, #517
Laguna Beach, CA 92651

Snowshoe Petroleum, Inc.
10645 N. Tatum Blvd. #200-626
Phoenix, AZ 95028

Salvatore R. Morabito
10645 N. Tatum Blvd. #200-626
Phoenix, AZ 95028

Superpumper, Inc.
14631 N. Scottsdale Road, #125
Scottsdale, AZ 85254-2711

Certified Mail, Return Receipt Requested

Via Facsimile (Fax)

Via E -Mail

Placing an original or true copy thereof in a sealed envelope and causing the same
to be personally Hand Delivered

Federal Express (or other overnight delivery)

X By using the Court's CM/ECF Electronic Notification System addressed to:

Frank C. Gilmore, Esq.
E-mail: fgilmore@rssblaw.com

Lindsay L. Liddell, Esq.
E-mail: lliddell@rssblaw.com

Dated this 11th day of April, 2019.

/s/ Kelli Wightman
An Employee of GARMAN TURNER
GORDON LLP
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FILED
Electronically
CV13-02663

2019-04-11 06:15:07 PM
Jacqueline Bryant
Clerk of the Court

Transaction # 7215253 : csulezic

Exhibit 1
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Amount
Odyssey E -File & E -
Serve

Second Judicial District Court - Washoe
8/18/2017 County - E -Filing $ 200.00

TOTAL $ 200.00
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Date Description Amount
Reporters' fees for depositions,
including a reporter's fee for one
copy of each deposition.

7/13/2015

10/8/2015

10/21/2015

10/30/2015

2/16/2016

Deposition transcript of Spencer
Cavalier (Deposition in Baltimore on
6/19/15) $ 326.40

Litigation Services - Invoice
#1026046 - Original and Certified
Copy of Transcript of Edward
William Bayuk $ 1,579.00

Litigation Services - Invoice
#1032617 - Original and certified
copy of transcript of Salvatore R.
Morabito and Christian Mark
Lovelace $ 2,072.40

Litigation Services - Invoice 1031990
- Original and certified copy of
transcript of Dennis C. Vacco &
Dennis C. Vacco, PMK of Snowshoe
Petroleum, Inc. $ 245.00

Atkinson -Baker, Inc. - Invoice
AA0075B AB - Video Conference
room fee and electronic transcript of
deposition of Mark S. Justmann,
taken 01/27/2016 (7) $ 1,411.55

Litigation Services - Invoice
#1059506 - Original and certified

3/31/2016 copy of Transcript of Paul Morabito $

Litigation Services - Invoice 1060434
- Videography Service of Paul

4/5/2016 Morabito $

Litigation Services - Invoice
#1056846 - Original and certified
copy of transcript of Gary L. Krausz,

4/6/2016 C.P.A. $

Litigation Services - Invoice
#1059928 - Certified copy of William

4/6/2016 A. Leonard Transcript $

Atkinson -Baker, Inc. - Invoice No.
AA028A0 AB - Electronic transcript

4/7/2016 of Michael Sewitz deposition $

Litigation Services - Invoice
#1060728 - Certified copy of James
L. McGovern, CPA/CFF, CVA

4/14/2016 transcript $

Litigation Services - Invoice
#1058104 - Certified copy of Ronald

4/14/2016 L. Buss Transcript

2,355.85

1,485.00

1,262.95

403.40

159.70

731.55

$ 609.35
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Litigation Services - Invoice
#1060235 - Original and certified

4/15/2016 copy of Dennis Banks transcript 349.00

Litigation Services - Invoice
#1062924 - Original and certified

4/26/2016 copy of Jan Friederich transcript 788.00

Sunshine Litigation Services -
Invoice #1126321 - Original and
Certified Copy of Edward Bayuk

1/26/2017 Transcript 295.00

Litigation Services - Invoice
#1153416 - Original and Certified
Copy of Stanton R. Bernstein, CPA

6/6/2017 Transcript (7) 1,423.75

Litigation Services - Invoice
#1164431 - Original and Certified

7/20/2017 Copy of Garry M. Graber Transcript $ 447.75

Jack W Hunt & Associates, Inc. -
Invoice #291295 - ck #3481 -
Original and Copy of Dennis C.

8/9/2017 Vacco Transcript 553.33

Jack W. Hunt & Associates, Inc. -
Invoice #291564 - Transcript of

8/17/2017 Dennis C. Vacco 95.72

Oasis Reporting Services - Invoice
#33913 - Original and Certified Copy
of Transcript and Index of Sujata

5/29/2018 Yalamanchili, Esq. 806.00

Oasis Reporting Services - Invoice
#33912 - Original and Certified Copy
of Transcript and Index of Garry

5/29/2018 Graber, Esq. 799.80
TOTAL 18,200.50
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OJ Description

Fees for witnesses at trial,
pretrial hearings and deposing
witnesses, unless the court
finds that the witness was
called at the instance of the
prevailing party without reason
or necessity

J & L Legal Service Inc. - Invoice
2015344 - Service - Commission to take

8/4/2015 deposition - Witness Fee

J&L Legal Service Inc. - Invoice
#2015344 - Service on William Leonard

$ 65.00

8/27/2015 - Witness Fee

J&L Process Service - Invoice 2016009 -

$ 65.00

3/7/2016 Issue 2 Commissions - Witness Fee

J & L Legal Service Inc. - Invoice
2015344 - Service - Commission to take

$ 65.00

8/4/2015 deposition (7)

J&L Process Service - Invoice 2016025 -
File/issue commission to take deposition

$ 65.00

3/7/2016 (Morabito) - Witness Fee

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice

$ 65.00

1/25/2017 #1126260 - Civil Appearance Fee

J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-2086
- Service on Washoe County Dist. Co. -

$ 60.00

2/3/2017 Witness Fee

J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-2091
- Service on AIG Property Casualty -

$ 65.00

2/10/2017 Witness Fee $ 65.00
TOTAL $ 515.00
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Liiito Description deb Amount

Reasonable fees of not more than five expert
witnesses in an amount of not more than
$1,500 for each witness unless the court
allows a larger fee after determining that the
circumstances surrounding the expert's
testimony were of such necessity as to require
the larger fee.

Advance Payment for McGovern &
Green LLP fees and expenses of
James McGovern, the Trustee's

11/1/2015 valuation expert $ 10,000.00

11/1/2015 Kimmel Payment for Appraisals $ 2,000.00
Buss-Shelger Associates - Invoice

1/6/2016 7405 - Appraisal Services $ 4,500.00
McGovern & Green LLP fees and
expenses of James McGovern, the
Trustee's valuation expert in the
Superpumper Action with respect

7/22/2016 to the value of Superpumper $ 41,000.00
Buss-Shelger Associates fees and
expenses of Ronald Buss, the
Trustee's valuation expert in the
Superpumper Action with respect
to the value of the California real

7/22/2016 properties. $ 5,425.00
McGovern & Greene LLP - Invoice

10/8/2018 #02-18-0206 $ 1,160.00
McGovern & Greene LLP - Invoice

11/5/2018 #02-18-0216 $ 11,796.80

William G. Kimmel - Invoice #15-064
11/8/2018 - Pre -Trial and Trial work $ 1,200.00

McGovern & Greene LLP Invoice
12/4/2018 #02-18-0242 $ 120.00

TOTAL $ 77,201.80
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The fee of any sheriff or
licensed process server for the
delivery or service of any
summons or subpoena used in
the action, unless the court
determines that the service was
not necessary

Nationwide Legal Nevada, LLC -
Invoice 219092 - Service on Compass

2/9/2016 Bank in Phoenix, AZ

SoCal Subpoena Services LLC - Service
on Gursey Schneider LLP, Hancock

2/10/2016 Insurance Services

$

$

200.00

225.33

SoCal Subpoena - Invoice 15122 -
Service on PMK for Gursey Schneider

2/17/2016 LLP $ 7.00
J&L Process Service - Invoice 2016020 -

3/7/2016 Service on Dennis Banks $ 115.00

J&L Process Service - Invoice 2016022 -
3/7/2016 Service on Michele Salazar $ 115.00
3/8/2016 SoCal Subpoena - Invoice 15259 $ 8.62

J&L Process Service - Invoice 2016019 -
3/9/2016 Service on Paul Alves $ 115.00

J&L Process Service - Invoice 2016021 -
3/9/2016 Service on Darryl Noble $ 115.00

3/31/2016 Nationwide Legal - Invoice #219349 $ 102.00

Ryan P. Hanna - Execution & Personal
Service/Subpoena for Hodgson Russ

1/3/2017 LLP $ 550.00
TOTAL $ 1,552.95
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Date Description Amount
Compensation for the official
reporter or reporter pro
tempore

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice
#1126832 - Certified Copy of Hearing -

2/7/2017 Order to Show Cause Transcript
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice
#1273647 - Original Transcript of Trial,

11/20/2018 Non Jury

83.85

653.80

Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice
#1273878 - Original and Certified Copy

11/21/2018 of Nonjury Trial Transcript (8) 314.60
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice
#1274582 - Original and Certified Copy
of Morabito vs. Superpumper

11/26/2018 Transcript 736.00
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice
#1274604 - Original and Certified Copy
of Morabito vs. Superpumper

11/26/2018 Transcript 454.40
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice
#1274593 - Original and Certified Copy
of Morabito vs. Superpumper

11/26/2018 Transcript 788.80
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice
#1274590 - Original and Certified Copy
of Morabito vs. Superpumper

11/26/2018 Transcript 751.20
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice
#1274589 - Original and Certified Copy
of Morabito vs. Superpumper

11/26/2018 Transcript 576.00
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice
#1274598 - Original and Certified Copy
of Morabito vs. Superpumper

11/26/2018 Transcript 788.80
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice

11/26/2018 #1274645 - Trial Non Jury 140.00
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice

11/27/2018 #1275076 20.00
Sunshine Litigation Services - Invoice
#1288019 - Original Transcript of

2/4/2019 Closing Arguments 763.80
TOTAL 6,071.25
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Reasonable costs for
photocopies.

12/31/2015 Photocopies - 45 pgs @ .25/pg $ 11.25

1/31/2016 Photocopies $ 11.25

2/29/2016 Photocopies $ 21.50
3/29/2016 Photocopies $ 47.25

BB VA Compass - Invoice #03-16-0512 -
4/5/2016 Copies of Bank records $ 435.00

4/29/2016 Photocopies $ 1,189.47
5/31/2016 Photocopies $ 19.00
6/30/2016 Photocopies $ 28.75
7/15/2016 Photocopies $ 4.50

Chapman, Glucksman, Dean, Roeb &
Barger - copies of documents produced
by Stanton Bernstein pursuant to the

7/22/2016 Trustee's discovery $ 2,896.24
Photocopies - Second Stipulation

9/12/2016 Motion to Continue Trial $ 3.00

The Litigation Document Group -
Invoice #16-11036 - Blowbacks, 3 -Hole

11/8/2016 Drill, Slip Sheets, 3" 3 -ring binders $ 424.33
11/10/2016 Photocopies $ 77.50
11/15/2016 Photocopies $ 1.00

11/21/2016 Photocopies $ 604.50
11/21/2016 Photocopies $ 536.75
11/28/2016 Photocopies $ 18.50

11/29/2016 Photocopies $ 7.00
11/30/2016 Photocopies $ 7.50

Litigation Document Group - Invoice
11/30/2016 #16-11168 - Copies, Tabs, Binders $ 666.15

12/8/2016 Photocopies $ 7.50
12/14/2016 Photocopies $ 3.75

12/16/2016 Photocopies $ 12.75

12/22/2016 Photocopies $ 41.50
12/23/2016 Photocopies $ 1.50

12/27/2016 Photocopies $ 165.75
12/28/2016 Photocopies $ 115.75

12/29/2016 Photocopies $ 0.50
12/30/2016 Photocopies $ 3.50

1/3/2017 Photocopies $ 9.25
1/23/2017 Photocopies $ 4.25

1/24/2017 Photocopies $ 1.00

1/27/2017 Photocopies $ 1.75

1/30/2017 Photocopies $ 5.00
1/31/2017 Photocopies $ 2.75
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2/3/2017 Photocopies $ 4.00
2/6/2017 Photocopies $ 2.75

2/21/2017 Photocopies $ 15.00

3/7/2017 Photocopies $ 44.50
3/8/2017 Photocopies $ 17.50

3/9/2017 Photocopies $ 234.50
3/10/2017 Photocopies $ 251.25

3/14/2017 Photocopies $ 1.50

3/15/2017 Photocopies $ 5.50

3/16/2017 Photocopies $ 270.25
3/20/2017 Photocopies $ 2.00

3/28/2017 Photocopies $ 1.50

3/29/2017 Photocopies $ 7.25

3/30/2017 Photocopies $ 47.25
4/17/2017 Photocopies $ 1.00

4/27/2017 Photocopies $ 2.00
5/15/2017 Photocopies $ 523.75
5/24/2017 Photocopies $ 8.50

5/25/2017 Photocopies $ 3.00

6/8/2017 Photocopies $ 39.75
6/29/2017 Photocopies $ 0.25

7/6/2017 Photocopies $ 150.00
7/7/2017 Photocopies $ 242.00

7/13/2017 Photocopies $ 23.00
7/13/2017 Photocopies $ 2.75

7/18/2017 Photocopies $ 9.00
7/19/2017 Photocopies $ 3.75

7/20/2017 Photocopies $ 1.00

7/25/2017 Photocopies $ 3.25

8/4/2017 Photocopies $ 2.75
8/9/2017 Photocopies $ 15.25

8/16/2017 Photocopies $ 71.25
8/18/2017 Photocopies $ 432.50
8/21/2017 Photocopies $ 274.25
8/22/2017 Photocopies $ 127.00

8/25/2017 Photocopies $ 234.25
8/28/2017 Photocopies $ 5.25

8/31/2017 Photocopies $ 2.50
9/6/2017 Photocopies $ 8.75

9/13/2017 Photocopies $ 2.25

10/11/2017 Photocopies $ 0.25

10/23/2017 Photocopies $ 2.25

11/10/2017 Photocopies $ 6.25

12/22/2017 Photocopies $ 4.00
1/23/2018 Photocopies $ 0.25

7/6/2018 Photocopies $ 2.00
7/31/2018 Photocopies $ 2.00
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8/9/2018 Photocopies $ 254.50
8/17/2018 Photocopies $ 8.50
8/23/2018 Photocopies - .10/page $ 244.60
8/24/2018 Photocopies $ 0.75
8/28/2018 Photocopies $ 9.50
8/28/2018 Photocopies $ 24.50
9/4/2018 Photocopies $ 23.75

9/6/2018 Photocopies $ 38.75

9/7/2018 Photocopies $ 52.75

9/19/2018 Photocopies $ 43.00
9/20/2018 Photocopies $ 3.00

9/24/2018 Photocopies $ 11.75

9/25/2018 Photocopies $ 21.00
9/25/2018 Photocopies $ 25.25
9/26/2018 Photocopies $ 1.50

9/28/2018 Photocopies - .10/page $ 190.00
10/1/2018 Photocopies (12) $ 564.50
10/2/2018 Photocopies $ 5.25
10/3/2018 Photocopies $ 0.50
10/4/2018 Photocopies $ 105.50
10/5/2018 Photocopies $ 72.25
10/9/2018 Photocopies $ 145.50

10/10/2018 Photocopies $ 17.25

10/11/2018 Photocopies $ 8.25
10/12/2018 Photocopies $ 205.75
10/15/2018 Photocopies - 10/page $ 243.80
10/16/2018 Photocopies $ 54.50
10/17/2018 Photocopies $ 405.25
10/18/2018 Photocopies $ 15.75

10/19/2018 Photocopies $ 794.50
10/22/2018 Photocopies $ 177.00
10/23/2018 Photocopies - 10/page $ 210.70
10/24/2018 Photocopies $ 19.50

10/25/2018 Photocopies $ 244.50
10/31/2018 Photocopies $ 4.00
11/19/2018 Photocopies $ 399.00
11/20/2018 Photocopies $ 35.25

11/27/2018 Photocopies $ 15.00

11/28/2018 Photocopies $ 8.25

11/29/2018 Photocopies $ 5.50

Robison, Sharp, Sullivan & Brust -
Invoice for share of costs for trial

11/30/2018 binders $ 682.63
12/10/2018 Photocopies $ 1.00

1/25/2019 Photocopies $ 0.50
1/30/2019 Photocopies $ 55.25
2/1/2019 Photocopies $ 2.00
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2/4/2019 Photocopies $ 269.25

2/6/2019 Photocopies $ 26.50
2/7/2019 Photocopies (12) $ 146.50

2/7/2019 Photocopies $ 146.50
2/7/2019 Photocopies $ 146.50

2/15/2019 Photocopies $ 1.25

2/21/2019 Photocopies $ 6.50

2/22/2019 Photocopies $ 3.00
2/25/2019 Photocopies $ 486.50
2/26/2019 Photocopies $ 17.75

2/27/2019 Photocopies $ 72.75

2/28/2019 Photocopies $ 0.75

3/2/2019 Photocopies $ 9.75

3/4/2019 Photocopies $ 16.25

3/11/2019 Photocopies $ 1.75

3/14/2019 Photocopies $ 0.25

3/20/2019 Photocopies $ 5.50

3/29/2019 Photocopies $ 655.00
TOTAL $ 17,961.67
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(14)

Reasonable costs for postage.
Federal Express - Invoice 4-969-39499 -

6/11/2015 Tracking #773815064813 $ 25.75
8/20/2015 Postage $ 0.48

Federal Express - Tracking number
10/16/2015 774757741763 - Deposition Exhibits $ 113.12

Federal Express - Tracking:
11/4/2015 774904843624 $ 26.22

Federal Express - Tracking:
11/4/2015 774904824191 $ 17.86
1/28/2016 Postage $ 34.37

United Parcel Service from Laura Mitz-
Roberts to Jenifer Cannon - Tracking

2/3/2016 #1Z18E07VNT92680888 $ 11.55
2/3/2016 Postage $ 2.54
2/5/2016 Postage $ 0.70

2/10/2016 Postage $ 1.06

2/18/2016 Postage $ 6.85
2/19/2016 Postage $ 1.14

2/23/2016 Postage $ 0.96
2/26/2016 Postage $ 0.48
3/8/2016 Postage $ 1.20

3/11/2016 Postage $ 0.48
United Parcel Service - Tracking

3/14/2016 #1Z18E07V0191582204 $ 30.64
United Parcel Service - Tracking

3/14/2016 #1Z18E07V0192737590 $ 30.64
3/17/2016 Postage $ 0.48

United Parcel Service - Invoice
#000018E07V136 - Tracking
#1Z18E07V4490575812 - Delivery to

3/18/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz $ 50.71

United Parcel Service - Invoice
#000018E07V136 - Tracking
#1Z18E07V4493818429 - Delivery to

3/18/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz $ 50.71
3/18/2016 Postage $ 1.64
3/23/2016 Postage $ 11.06
3/31/2016 Postage $ 0.48

4/4/2016 Postage $ 0.70
4/6/2016 Postage $ 0.48

4/29/2016 Postage $ 2.84
5/3/2016 Postage $ 1.57

5/31/2016 Postage $ 46.00
9/12/2016 Postage $ 1.15
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11/15/2016 Postage 1.15

11/21/2016 Postage 3.25

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V0390231313 - Delivery to

11/30/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz 14.95

11/30/2016 Postage 0.46

12/14/2016 Postage 1.36

12/21/2016 Postage 1.15

12/23/2016 Postage 0.46

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V0394144197 - Delivery to

12/29/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz 13.28

12/30/2016 Postage 1.36

1/3/2017 Postage 1.57

1/23/2017 Postage 0.46

1/27/2017 Postage 1.19

1/30/2017 Postage 1.86

2/2/2017 Postage (14) 1.19

2/6/2017 Postage 1.19

2/15/2017 Postage 2.03

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V0193214081 - Delivery to

3/14/2017 John Murtha @ Woodburn & Wedge $ 20.58

3/20/2017 Postage 1.19

3/29/2017 Postage 0.67

4/17/2017 Postage 0.46

4/27/2017 Postage 0.67

5/24/2017 Postage 1.86

6/8/2017 Postage 23.46

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V4496320577 - Delivery to

7/7/2017 Teresa Pilatowicz 75.67

7/25/2017 Postage 2.03

8/9/2017 Postage 0.92

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V0390467140 - Delivery to

8/18/2017 Teresa Pilatowicz 15.68

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V0398698725 - Delivery to

8/25/2017 Second Judicial Court 12.07

9/6/2017 Postage 2.28

9/6/2017 Postage 2.28

1/23/2018 Postage 0.47

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07VP291122210 - Delivery to

8/24/2018 Teresa Pilatowicz 15.65
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8/28/2018 Postage 1.64

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V1391626653 - Delivery to

9/19/2018 Clerk of the Court in Reno, NV 37.38

9/28/2018 Postage 1.63

10/1/2018 Postage 9.59

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V1590109700 - Delivery to

10/2/2018 Teresa Pilatowicz 147.55

10/5/2018 Postage 0.68

10/12/2018 Postage 9.43

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V0796804696 - Delivery to
Dept. 4, Second Judicial District Court

10/17/2018 in Reno, NV 52.72

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V0295235526 - Delivery to

10/19/2018 Teresa Pilatowicz 31.32

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V0298697906 - Delivery to

10/19/2018 John F. Murtha 47.62

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V0299529514 - Delivery to

10/19/2018 John F. Murtha 56.68

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V1399814748 - Delivery to

10/22/2018 Teresa Pilatowicz 22.06

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V1396289983 - Delivery to

10/24/2018 Reno 174.62

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V1397159951 - Delivery to

10/24/2018 Reno 205.33

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V1398041576 - Delivery to

10/24/2018 Reno 174.31

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V1398523564 - Delivery to

10/24/2018 Reno 204.13

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z4708X61592336653 - Deliver trial

11/13/2018 boxes to Las Vegas from Reno 553.28

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z4708X61590001268 - Deliver trial

11/13/2018 boxes to Las Vegas from Reno 285.62
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United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z4708X61591658870 - Deliver trial

11/13/2018 boxes to Las Vegas from Reno

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z4708X61593209486 - Deliver trial

11/13/2018 boxes to Las Vegas from Reno

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z4708X61590553092 - Deliver trial

11/13/2018 boxes to Las Vegas from Reno

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z4708X61594589707 - Deliver trial

11/13/2018 boxes to Las Vegas from Reno

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z4708X61591219317 - Deliver trial

11/13/2018 boxes to Las Vegas from Reno

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z4708X61591341925 - Deliver trial

11/13/2018 boxes to Las Vegas from Reno

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z4708X61590857531 - Deliver trial

11/13/2018 boxes to Las Vegas from Reno

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z4708X61590666149 - Deliver trial

11/13/2018 boxes to Las Vegas from Reno

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V1390887463 - Delivery to

2/1/2019 Washoe County Court

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V1394615070 - Delivery to

2/5/2019 Washoe County Court

294.84

224.16

224.16

553.28

376.73

204.96

235.25

171.14

30.63

17.26

United Parcel Service - Tracking
#1Z18E07V1595608153 - Delivery to

2/25/2019 Washoe County Court, Department 4 $ 72.34

2/28/2019 Postage 0.50

3/29/2019 Postage 66.50

TOTAL 5,184.05
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Amount
Reasonable costs for travel and
lodging incurred taking
depositions and conducting
discovery.

Airfare (835.51), Taxi (64.35, Lodging
6/22/2015 (270.50) and Meals (36.04)

Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare, lodging,
9/28/2015 meals and car for deposition in CA

Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare for

$

$

1,206.40

742.94

10/19/2015 Deposition

Teresa Pilatowicz for Deposition of
Dennis Vacco, S. Morabito and PMK of
Snowshoe - Airfare (1530.30) Taxi
(116.52) Lodging (59.53) and Meals

$ 361.82

10/19/2015 (109.60)
Teresa Pilatowicz - lodging in LA for

$ 1,815.95

3/15/2016 Deposition
Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare for

$ 273.31

3/15/2016 Deposition
Teresa Pilatowicz - Transportation

$ 493.96

3/15/2016 while in Los Angeles for Deposition $ 95.51

3/15/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz - Fed Ex for copies
Teresa Pilatowicz - Lodging for

$ 26.21

3/20/2016 Deposition
Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare for

$ 750.14

3/20/2016 Deposition
Teresa Pilatowicz - Meals while in Los

$ 493.96

3/20/2016 Angeles for deposition
Teresa Pilatowicz - Meals while in Los

$ 34.54

3/21/2016 Angeles for deposition
Teresa Pilatowicz - Transportation

$ 65.67

3/21/2016 while in Los Angeles for Deposition $ 185.63

3/21/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz - Fed Ex for copies

Gabby Hamm - Airfare to Reno for
Deposition of Dennis Banks & Bif

$ 91.77

3/24/2016 Leonard
Gabby Hamm - Lodging while in Reno
for Deposition of Dennis Banks & Bif

$ 499.96

3/24/2016 Leonard
Gabby Hamm - Uber while in Reno for
Deposition of Dennis Banks & Bif

$ 79.95

3/24/2016 Leonard $ 50.56
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Gabby Hamm - Parking at Airport while
in Reno for Deposition of Dennis Banks

3/24/2016 & Bif Leonard

Gabby Hamm - Meals while in Reno for
Deposition of Dennis Banks & Bif

$ 25.00

3/24/2016 Leonard

Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare, Taxi, Hotel,
Meals and Parking while in Los
Angeles, CA for Deposition of Stanton

$ 38.32

5/15/2017 Bernstein

Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare, Lodging,
Taxi and Meals while in Buffalo, NY
for Deposition of Dennis Vacco & PMK

$ 479.28

7/9/2017 of Hodgson Russ
Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare and Parking

$ 1,273.47

12/6/2017 for Settlement conference

Teresa Pilatowicz - Travel expenses to
attend deposition of person most

$ 410.96

4/30/2018 knowledgeable of Hodgson Russ $ 672.30
TOTAL $ 10,167.61
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Reasonable and necessary
expense incurred in connection
with the action - Court costs,
Certified Records for Trial &
Legal Research.

10/14/2015 Pacer $ 3.70
1/7/2016 Pacer $ 12.30

Siena Document Management - Invoice
3/7/2016 MAR 16 012 - document production $ 112.74

3/31/2016 Westlaw Research for March 2016 $ 357.93
3/31/2016 Pacer $ 7.50
6/30/2016 Pacer $ 3.10

9/1/2016 Pacer $ 26.30
10/3/2016 Pacer $ 1.30

11/1/2016 Pacer $ 16.40

New York Dept. of State, Division of
11/7/2016 Corporations $ 20.00
1/3/2017 Pacer $ 7.00
4/3/2017 Pacer (17) $ 10.10

5/31/2017 Pacer (17) $ 6.70
6/30/2017 Pacer $ 11.10

8/1/2017 Pacer $ 3.40

Court Call ID: 8519396 - Motion
8/10/2017 Hearing $ 65.00
10/2/2017 Pacer $ 4.80

Telephonic Conference Court Call - ID:
12/19/2017 8782205 (17) $ 65.00
7/31/2018 Pacer (17) $ 1.40

Teresa Pilatowicz - Obtain California
9/19/2018 Court Records $ 22.50

U.S. Bankruptcy Court Clerk - ck #5335
10/1/2018 - Certified Copies $ 269.00

Orange County - Certified Copies -
10/1/2018 Order #148884 $ 14.00

Riverside County Recorder -
10/1/2018 Transaction #74536076 $ 32.50

Washoe County Recorder - Receipt:
10/2/2018 20181002-063550 - Certified Copies $ 14.49

Nevada Secretary of State - Job:
C20181002-2119 - Entity Copies and

10/4/2018 Certification of Document $ 42.00

Nevada Secretary of State - Job:
C20181002-2128 - Entity Copies and

10/4/2018 Certification of Document $ 50.00
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Clerk of the Court - United States
Bankruptcy Court - ck #5400 - Certified

10/12/2018 Copies $ 298.00

New York Secretary of State - Certified
10/12/2018 Copies $ 85.00

Washoe County Recorder - Receipt
#20181015-066448 - Certified Copy of

10/15/2018 Document $ 6.21

10/19/2018 US Bankruptcy Court - Certified Copies $ 141.00

New York Secretary of State - Certified
10/19/2018 Copies $ 85.00

TOTAL $ 1,795.47
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Messenger
J & L Legal Service Invoice 2015282 -
Service to Washoe 2nd Judicial Court

5/29/2015 (7)
J&L Legal Service - Invoice 2015385 -
File/Sign 3 Commissions @ 2nd

$ 72.50

10/13/2015 Judicial Court

Hot Shot Delivery, Inc. - Invoice
#141344 - Delivery to Superior Court

$ 73.00

12/5/2016 and Compass Bank
J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-1098
- Delivery to Second Judicial Court -

$ 131.16

1/3/2017 Reno (7)

J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-2043

$ 65.00

2/3/2017 - Service on Washoe County Dist. Ct.

J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-2440
- Rush Court Run in Reno and Copies

$ 100.00

6/14/2017 (17)
J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-2599
- Rush Court Run to Reno Discovery

$ 68.50

8/7/2017 Commissioner (17)

J&L Process Service - Invoice #17-2673
- Copies and Delivery to 71 Washington

$ 65.00

9/19/2017 Street, Reno, NV (17)

J&L Process Service - Invoice #18-6542
- CA Secretary of State/Certificate of
Merger, Certified Copy Fees and Over

$ 190.00

10/24/2018 Night Fees (17)

J&L Process Service - Invoice #18-6577
- Certified Copy Fee and Court Run to

$ 152.00

11/3/2018 Washoe County District Court (17)

J&L Process Service - Invoice #18-6541
- Court Run to Washoe County District

$ 60.00

11/3/2018 Court (17) $ 55.00
TOTAL $ 1,032.16
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Tarvel Related to Hearing &
AmountTrial Date Description

2/23/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz - Travel to hearing $ 711.96
Teresa Pilatowicz - Siena Hotel Spar

2/23/2016 Casino for hearing $ 115.50
2/23/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz - Uber $ 9.58

2/24/2016 Teresa Pilatowicz - Uber $ 10.79

Gabby Hamm - Airfare to Reno for
2/24/2016 Pretrial Conference $ 477.96

Gabby Hamm - Transportation while in
2/24/2016 Reno for Pretrial Conference $ 22.61

Gerald Gordon - Ct Appearance, Motion
to Compel 364, 331 - Airfare, Car

4/5/2016 Rental & Parking $ 295.50

Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare, Meals and
Parking for travel to Reno to attend
hearing for App for Order to show cause

1/19/2017 (B ayuk) $ 439.40
9/11/2018 Erika Turner - Airfare to Reno $ 531.96

Teresa Pilatowicz - Travel Expenses to
9/11/2018 Reno to attend Pretrial Conference $ 282.66

Teersa Pilatowicz - Travel expenses to
meet with Client for trial prep in Las

10/15/2018 Vegas $ 303.72

Teresa Pilatowicz - Hotel, Airfare,
Parking, Uber and Meals while in Reno

10/25/2018 for trial $ 1,989.15
10/25/2018 Gabby Hamm - Airfare to Reno $ 511.50

Gabby Hamm - Car Rental while in
10/25/2018 Reno for Trial $ 468.87

Gabby Hamm - Uber while in Reno for
10/25/2018 Trial $ 88.38

Gabby Hamm - Airport Parking while in
10/25/2018 Reno for Trial $ 25.75

Gabby Hamm - Lodging while in Reno
10/25/2018 for Trial $ 1,267.10

Gabby Hamm - Meals while in Reno for
10/25/2018 Trial $ 137.61

Gabby Hamm - Photocopies while in
10/25/2018 Reno for Trial $ 515.18

Gabby Hamm - Office Supplies while in
10/25/2018 Reno for Trial $ 243.83
10/28/2018 Erika Turner - Airfare to Reno $ 531.96
10/28/2018 Erika Turner - Hotel while in Reno $ 1,591.13
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Erika Turner - Car rental while in Reno
10/28/2018 for trial $ 1,100.74

11/4/2018 Erika Turner - Airfare to Reno $ 531.96
Erika Turner - Return flight from Reno

11/6/2018 while attending Trial $ 531.96
Teresa Pilatowicz - Airfare to Reno for

11/25/2018 Closing Arguments at Trial $ 623.56
Teresa Pilatowicz - Uber for Closing

11/25/2018 Arguments at Trial $ 47.95
Teresa Pilatowicz - Meals for Closing

11/25/2018 Arguments at Trial $ 15.35

Teresa Pilatowicz - Lodging for Closing
11/25/2018 Arguments at Trial $ 241.63

Teresa Pilatowicz - Photocopies for
11/25/2018 Closing Arguments at Trial $ 9.52

2/7/2019 Erika Turner - Hotel while in Reno $ 286.12
2/7/2019 Erika Turner - Airfare to Reno $ 541.96

2/10/2019 Erika Turner - Uber in Reno $ 14.97
3/1/2019 Erika Turner - Airfare to Reno $ 541.96

TOTAL $ 15,059.78
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