The Powell Law Firm

Tom W. Stewart, Esq.

Nevada Bar No. 14280

8918 Spanish Ridge Avenue, #100

Electronically Filed
ps Ve Nevada 89148 Sep 28 2021 10:02 a.m.
elephone: (702) 728-5500 Elizabeth A. Brown

tom@tplf.com Clerk of Supreme Court

IN THE SUPREME COURT OF THE STATE OF NEVADA

PARVIZ SAFARI, an individual,;
MANDANA ZAHEDI, an individual; | Docket No. 82279

AND  NOOSHIN ZAHEDI, an NOTICE OF COMPLIANCE

individual,
Appellants,
Vs.
HAMID MODJTAHED, an

individual; and MOHAMMAD
MODJTAHED, an individual,

Respondents.

Appellants Parviz Safari, Mandana Zahedi, and Nooshin Zahedi provide
notice of compliance with the Court’s September 3, 2021 order, requiring
appellants to “to pay the required deposit for the transcripts and provide this court
with written proof of payment” on or before October 4, 2021. Written confirmation
is attached as Exhibit 1 (deposit paid) and Exhibit 2 (deposit received).

Dated this 28th day of September 2021.
The Powell Law Firm

/s/ Tom W. Stewart
Tom W. Stewart, Esq.
Nevada Bar No. 14280

Docket 82279 Document 2021-27849



CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that I electronically filed the foregoing NOTICE OF

COMPLIANCE with the Nevada Supreme Court on the 28th day of September

2021. Electronic Service of the document shall be made in accordance with the

Master Service List as follows:

Jonathan Blum, Esq.
Eric Walther, Esq.
Adam Bult, Esq.

/s/ Tom W. Stewart
An Employee of The Powell Law Firm




Exhibit 1



Tom Stewart

From: TheRecordXchange <noreply@trxchange.com>

Sent: Monday, September 27, 2021 6:49 PM

To: Tom Stewart

Subject: Order 13-004223 Payment Received, Meditex, LLC vs. Hamid Modjtahed

Order 13-004223 Payment Received, Meditex, LLC vs. Hamid Modjtahed
Hello Tom W.,
A payment of $10,678.00 has been received for your order 13-004223.

Please click to see Payments

It is important to review messages related to this order to ensure that you have provided the required information or to seek additional
information.

Please click to review messages.

Production at TheRecordXchange

Contact TheRecordXchange Customer Success team at customersuccess@trxchange.com for assistance or visit our webpage at
www.trxchange.com.




Exhibit 2



Tom Stewart

From: Valori Weber <valori.weber@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 28, 2021 4:38 AM

To: Tom Stewart

Cc: Gerold, Jennifer; Erik Lige

Subject: Re: Meditex v Modjtahed transcripts - ORDER of the Supreme Court

Good morning. Payment has been received. The transcripts will be prepared within 30 days, which is October 28,
2021.

Thank you.
Valori Weber

970.405.3643
valori.weber@gmail.com

On Mon, Sep 27, 2021 at 8:50 PM Tom Stewart <TStewart@tplf.com> wrote:

I made the required deposit of $10,678.00. Please let me know if there’s anything further | need to do.

Thanks,

Tom

From: Valori Weber <valori.weber@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 9, 2021 10:40 AM

To: Gerold, Jennifer <GeroldJ@clarkcountycourts.us>

Cc: Tom Stewart <TStewart@tplf.com>; Erik Lige <erik@trxchange.com>
Subject: Re: Meditex v Modjtahed transcripts - ORDER of the Supreme Court

Jennifer, received and understood.





