IN THE SUPREME COURT OF THE STATE OF NEVADA

LAS VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL, Appellant,

VS.

CLARK COUNTY OFFICE OF THE CORONER/MEDICAL EXAMINER,

Respondent.

Electronically Filed
Sep 14 2021 02:17 p.m.
Elizabeth A. Brown
Clerk of Supreme Court
82908

JOINT APPENDIX - VOLUME VII

Appeal from Eighth Judicial District Court, Clark County The Honorable David M. Jones, District Judge District Court Case No. A-17-758501-W

Margaret A. McLetchie, Nevada Bar No. 10931

MCLETCHIE LAW

602 South Tenth Street Las Vegas, Nevada 89101 Telephone: (702) 728-5300

Fax: (702) 425-8220

Email: maggie@nvlitugation.com

Counsel for Appellant, Las Vegas Review-Journal

INDEX TO JOINT APPENDIX

Vol.	Description	Date	Bates
	Amended Memorandum of Costs and		JA0774-
V	Disbursements	02/02/2021	JA1000
			JA1001-
VI	Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs	02/02/2021	JA1132
	Appendix of Exhibits in Support of Public		
	Records Act Application Pursuant to NRS		
	239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus		
	Expedited Matter Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat.		JA0012-
I	239.011	07/17/2017	JA0143
	Attorney Margaret A. McLetchie's Declaration in		
	Support of Memorandum in Support of		
	Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/		
_	Petition for Writ of Mandamus/ Application for		JA0162-
I	Declaratory and Injunctive Relief	08/17/2017	JA0195
		10/20/2020	JA0579-
III	Court Minutes on Hearing re: Briefs on Remand	10/29/2020	JA0580
	Court Minutes on Hearing re: Plaintiff's		
VI	Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs	03/02/2021	JA1205
	Court Minutes on Hearings re: Respondent Clark		
	County Office of the Coroner/Medical		
	Examiner's Motion to Stay on an Order		
	Shortening Time and Petitioner Las Vegas		
	Review Journal's Motion to Order to Show Cause		
III	on OST	12/10/2020	JA0705
	Errata to Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees		JA1222-
VII	and Costs	03/26/2021	JA1267
	Memorandum in Support of Application Pursuant		
	to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/ Petition for Writ of		
	Mandamus/ Application for Declaratory and		JA0144-
I	Injunctive Relief	08/17/2017	JA0161
		444555	JA0413-
II	Notice of Appeal [Petition]	11/28/2017	JA0414
			JA1301-
VII	Notice of Appeal [Amended Fees]	05/07/2021	JA1302
			JA0470-
II	Notice of Appeal [Fees]	02/05/2018	JA0471

Vol.	Description	Date	Bates
	•		JA0724-
IV	Notice of Appeal [Order on Remand]	12/15/2020	JA0746
	Notice of Entry of Motion for an Order to Show		JA0681-
III	Cause on an Order Shortening Time	12/08/2020	JA0704
	Notice of Entry of Order Granting Petitioner Las		
	Vegas Review-Journal's Amended Motion for		JA1283-
VII	Attorney's Fees and Costs	04/08/2021	JA1300
	Notice of Entry of Order Granting Petitioner Las		
	Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for Attorney's		JA0454-
II	Fees and Costs	02/01/2018	JA0469
	Notice of Entry of Order Granting Petitioner		
	LVRJ's Public Records Act Application Pursuant		
	to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/ Petition for Writ of		JA0398-
II	Mandamus	11/09/2017	JA0412
			JA0619-
III	Notice of Entry of Order on Remand	11/20/2020	JA0637
	Opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order		JA0649-
III	Shortening Time	11/30/2020	JA0671
	Order Denying Petitioner Las Vegas Review		
	Journal's Motion to Order to Show Cause on		JA0763-
IV	Order Shortening Time	12/30/2020	JA0768
	Order Denying Respondent Clark County Office		
	of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion for		JA0747-
IV	Stay on an Order Shortening Time	12/23/2020	JA0762
	Order Granting Petitioner Las Vegas Review-		
	Journal's Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees		JA1268-
VII	and Costs	04/08/2021	JA1282
	Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion		JA0415-
II	for Attorney's Fees and Costs	11/29/2017	JA0453
	101 121101110 J D T COS MILE COSE	11,23,2017	JA0472-
III	Petitioner's Opening Brief on Remand	08/27/2020	JA0506
	Petitioner's Reply in Support of Petitioner's		JA0537-
III	Opening Brief on Remand	10/22/2020	JA0578
111	Public Records Act Application Pursuant to NRS	10/22/2020	0110070
	239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus		
	Expedited Matter Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat.		JA0001-
I	239.011	07/17/2017	JA0011
1	207.011	07/17/2017	0110011

Vol.	Description	Date	Bates
	Recorder's Transcript on Hearing re: Plaintiff's		JA1206-
VI	Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs	03/02/2021	JA1221
	Recorder's Transcript on Hearings re: Respondent		
	Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical		
	Examiner's Motion to Stay on an Order		
	Shortening Time and Petitioner Las Vegas		
	Review Journal's Motion to Order to Show Cause	1 - /1 0 /- 0 - 0	JA0706-
IV	on OST	12/10/2020	
777	Recorder's Transcripts of Hearing re: Briefs on	10/20/2020	JA0581-
III	Remand	10/29/2020	JA0618
	Register of Actions for Las Vegas Review-Journal		
	v. Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner, Eighth Judicial District Court Case No.		JA1303-
VII	A-17-758501-W	09/13/2021	JA1305- JA1306
V 11		07/13/2021	
X 7T	Reply in Support of Amended Motion for	02/22/2021	JA1163-
VI	Attorney's Fees and Costs	02/23/2021	JA1204
	Reply to Response to Petition and Memorandum		
	in Support of Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/Petition for Writ of		
	Mandamus/Application for Declaratory and		JA0238-
II	Injunctive Relief	09/07/2017	JA0319
11		03/07/2017	JA0507-
III	Respondent Clark County Office of the	10/07/2020	JA0536
111	Coroner/Medical Examiner s Answering Brief Respondent Clark County Office of the	10/07/2020	JA0550
	Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion to Stay on		JA0638-
III	an Order Shortening Time	11/20/2020	JA0648
	Respondent Clark County Office of the	11/20/2020	3110010
	Coroner/Medical Examiner's Opposition to		
	Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal s Amended		JA1133-
VI	Motion for Attorney s Fees and Costs	02/16/2021	JA1162
	Respondent Clark County Office of the		
	Coroner/Medical Examiner's Reply in Support of		JA0672-
III	Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time	12/07/2020	JA0680
111	Response to Petition and Memorandum	12/0//2020	2110000
	Supporting Writ for Mandamus for Access to		JA0196-
I	Autopsy Reports of Juvenile Deaths	08/30/2017	JA0237

Vol.	Description	Date	Bates
	Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for		
	Attorney s Fees and Costs and Set Briefing		JA0769-
IV	Schedule	01/27/2021	JA0773
	Supplement to Reply to Response to Petition and		
	Memorandum in Support of Application Pursuant		
	to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/Petition for Writ of		
	Mandamus/ Application for Declaratory and		JA0320-
II	Injunctive Relief	09/25/2017	JA0397

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that the foregoing JOINT APPENDIX – VOLUME VII was filed electronically with the Nevada Supreme Court on the 14th day of September, 2021. Electronic service of the foregoing document shall be made in accordance with the Master Service List as follows:

Craig R. Anderson and Jackie V. Nichols **MARQUIS AURBACH COFFING** 10001 Park Run Drive Las Vegas, Nevada 89145

Steven B. Wolfson and Laura C. Rehfeldt
CLARK COUNTY DISTRICT ATTORNEY'S OFFICE
CIVIL DIVISION
500 S. Grand Central Pkwy., 5th Floor
Post Office Box 552215
Las Vegas, NV 89155-2215

Counsel for Respondent, Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner

/s/ Pharan Burchfield
Employee of McLetchie Law



9 10 11 12 ATTORNEYS AT LAW
701 EAST BRUDCHE AVE., SUITE 520
LAS VEGAS, IVV 89101
(702)728-5300 (T) / (702)A25-8220 (F)
WWW.NVLITIGATION.COM 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20 21 22 23 24 25

26

27

28

Electronically Filed 3/26/2021 12:54 PM Steven D. Grierson CLERK OF THE COURT

ERR

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

MARGARET A. MCLETCHIE, Nevada Bar No. 10931 ALINA M. SHELL, Nevada Bar No. 11711

MCLETCHIE LAW

701 E. Bridger Avenue, Suite 520

Las Vegas, NV 89101

Telephone: (702) 728-5300; Fax: (702) 425-8220

Email: maggie@nvlitigation.com

Attorneys for Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal

EIGHTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA

Case No.: A-17-758501-W LAS VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL,

Petitioner, Dept. No.: XXIX

VS.

CLARK COUNTY OFFICE OF THE CORONER/MEDICAL EXAMINER,

Respondent.

ERRATA TO AMENDED MOTION FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES AND COSTS

Hearing Date: February 25, 2021

Hearing Time: 9:00 a.m.

Petitioner the Las Vegas Review-Journal submits this Errata to correct its Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and supporting exhibits appended thereto filed with this Court on February 2, 2021.

On November 29, 2017, the Review-Journal filed its first Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs seeking compensation for fees and costs incurred between July 10, 2017, and November 29, 2017, for work performed in this action.

On February 2, 2021, the Review-Journal filed an Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs seeking compensation for work performed between November 9, 2017, and February 2, 2021. As indicated at the hearing on the Amended Motion for Fees and Costs conducted on March 2, 2021, in preparing for the hearing on the Motion, the Review-Journal determined that it had inadvertently included time entries in its supporting exhibits which were already requested in the Review-Journal's November 10, 2017, Motion for Attorney's

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

Fees and Costs and addressed in the Court's February 8, 2018, Order granting the Review-Journal's original motion in the total amount of \$2,515.00. Additionally, the Review-Journal noted in its February 23, 2021, Reply that it had erroneously included a December 11, 2020, billing entry for \$600.00 for work performed by counsel in drafting a letter to the Clark County Board of County Commissioners. Attached is an amended declaration correcting the February 2, 2021, Declaration of Margaret A. McLetchie in support of the Amended Motion with a corrected exhibit.

Combined with the \$31,552.50 requested in the Review-Journal's November 10, 2017, Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, the total the Review-Journal sought for fees is \$275,640.00 in attorney's fees, 1 and \$3,581.48 in costs.

DATED this 26th day of March, 2021.

/s/ Margaret A. McLetchie

MARGARET A. MCLETCHIE, Nevada Bar No. 10931 ALINA M. SHELL, Nevada Bar No. 11711

MCLETCHIE LAW

701 E. Bridger Avenue, Suite 520 Las Vegas, NV 89101

Telephone: (702) 728-5300; Fax (702) 728-5300

Email: maggie@nvlitigation.com

Attorneys for Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal

¹ The Amended Motion listed \$246,602.50.

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that on this 4th day of March, 2021, pursuant to Administrative Order 14-2 and N.E.F.C.R. 9, I did cause a true copy of the foregoing ERRATA TO AMENDED MOTION FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES AND COSTS in Las Vegas Review-Journal v. Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner, Eight Judicial District Court Case No. A-17-758501-W, to be served electronically using the Odyssey File&Serve system, to all parties with an email address on record.

/s/ Pharan Burchfield An Employee of McLetchie Law

	INDEX OF EXHIBITS							
Exhibit	Description							
n/a	Amended Declaration of Margaret A. McLetchie							
1	Corrected Fees by Date							
2	Corrected Fees by Biller							

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

AMENDED DECLARATION OF MARGARET A. MCLETCHIE

- I, MARGARET A. MCLETCHIE, declare, pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 53.330, as follows:
- 1. I have personal knowledge of the facts set forth below, and, if called as a witness, could testify to them.
 - 2. I am an attorney duly licensed to practice law in Nevada.
- 3. I am the owner and managing member of the law firm of McLetchie Law Group PLLC dba McLetchie Law, and I am counsel for the Las Vegas Review-Journal ("Review-Journal") Las Vegas Review-Journal v. Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner, Eighth Judicial District Court Case No. A-17-758501-W.
- I am making this declaration to provide information justifying the fee and costs request in this case, to authenticate documents attached as exhibits in support of the Las Vegas Review-Journal's Supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, and to verify factual representations contained in the Supplemental Motion.
- 5. With the exceptions noted below, the work performed by my firm in this case for the time period November 9, 2017 through February 2, 2021 and appellate time is detailed in the summary attached to the Motion as Exhibit 1 (organized by date) and Exhibit 2 (organized by biller). I certify that this accurately reflects work by my firm.
- 6. I manage workflow at my firm and routinely review time entries made by other attorneys and staff at the firm. I attest that the entries listed reflect work in fact conducted by my firm in this matter (other than as noted above), less reductions made in the *spirit of cooperation*, as noted below.
- 7. I billed and structured my firm's work on this matter with an eye to avoiding duplicative work and using lower billing attorneys (or staff people) wherever possible. At the time my office performed work in this matter, I believed the work we were all doing was reasonably necessary to protect and further the interests of this client.

///

28 ///

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

- 8. On January 1, 2020, I increased the hourly rates for of McLetchie Law's attorneys and paraprofessional staff. My rate was increased from \$450.00 per hour to \$500.00 per hour; Alina Shell's hourly rate was increased from \$350.00 per hour to \$375.00 per hour; Leo Wolpert's hourly rate was increased from \$200.00 per hour to \$250.00 per hour; and paraprofessional Pharan Burchfield's hourly rate was increased from \$150.00 per hour to \$175.00 per hour.
- 9. As the owner at my firm responsible for this matter, I have carefully reviewed the billing statement and corrected any errors. I also exercised my billing judgment and deducted and/or removed a number of entries to err on the side of avoiding billing for potentially duplicative work—and in the spirit of cooperation. My additional work on this matter, 254 hours, was billed at a rate of \$450.00 per hour for work performed from November 10, 2017 through December 31, 2019 (109 hours) and at a rate of \$500.00 per hour for work performed after December 31, 2019² (145.0 hours), for a total of \$121,550.00. (See Exhibit 2.)
- 10. The time spent on this case included in the fee request also includes time for work performed by Ms. Shell. I routinely monitor the work performed by all people who work at my firm, including Ms. Shell. I reviewed each of Ms. Shell's entries, resulting in 226.8 additional billed hours in this case. Ms. Shell's work in this matter was billed at a rate of \$350.00 per hour for work from between November 9, 2017 through December 31, 2019 (114.8 hours), and at a rate of \$375.00 per hour for work performed after December 31, 2019 (112 hours), for a total of \$82,180.00. (*Id.*)
- 11. The time spent on this case for which I am seeking compensation also includes work for Leo Wolpert as a research and writing attorney. I reviewed each of Mr. Wolpert's entries, resulting in a total of 91.9 additional hours on this case. Mr. Wolpert's time on this case was billed at a rate of \$200.00 per hour for work performed from November

The hourly rates for the attorneys and senior paraprofessional staff at McLetchie Law increased effective January 1, 2020. (See McLetchie Decl. ¶ 8.)

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

9, 2017 through December 31, 2019 (53.0 hours), and at a rate of \$250.00 per hour for work performed after December 31, 2019 (38.9 hours), for a total billed of \$20,325.00. (Id.)

- 12. The time spent on this case for which I am seeking compensation also includes work for Carly Krygier as a research and writing attorney. I reviewed each of Ms. Krygier's entries, resulting in a total of 0.1 additional hours on this case. Ms. Krygier's time on this case was billed at a rate of \$200.00 per hour, for a total of \$20.00. (*Id.*)
- 13. The time spent on this case for which I am seeking compensation also includes work for Jessica Brown as a research and writing attorney. I reviewed each of Ms. Brown's entries, resulting in a total of 48.3 additional hours on this case. Ms. Brown's time on this case was billed at a rate of \$200.00 per hour, for a total of \$9,660.00. (Id.)
- 14. The time spent on this case for which I am seeking compensation also includes work for Pharan Burchfield, my paralegal. I reviewed each of Ms. Burchfield's entries, resulting in a total of 49.4 additional hours on this case. Ms. Burchfield's time on this case was billed at the rate of \$150.00 per hour for work performed from November 9, 2017 through December 31, 2019 (25.6 hours), and at a rate of \$175.00 per hour for work performed after December 31, 2019 (23.8 hours), for a total billed of \$8,005.00. (Id.)
- 15. The time spent on this case for which I am seeking compensation also includes work for Lacey Ambro, my paralegal. I reviewed each of Ms. Ambro's entries, resulting in a total of 13.2 hours on this case. (*Id.*) Ms. Ambro's paralegal time on this case (9.1 hours) was billed at the rate of \$150.00 per hour, while her time for administrative tasks performed in this matter (4.1 hours) was billed at a rate of \$50.00 per hour, for a total billed of \$1,570.00. (Id.)
- 16. I exercised appropriate billing judgment and structured work on this case to maximize efficiencies, and the hours listed in the fee request are neither duplicative, unnecessary nor excessive.
- 17. To keep billing as low as possible, lower-billing attorneys conducted attorney work where appropriate. Further, I utilized a paraprofessional to perform tasks such as research and organization to assure that attorneys with higher billing rates were not billing

1

2

8 9

10

7

11 12

13 14

15 16

> 18 19

17

20 21

22

23 24

25

26

27

/// 28

for tasks that lower billers could perform.

- 18. The rates I billed in this matter are reasonable. I manage my firm, and set the firm's billing rates, which exceed those charged in this matter. Further, the work performed by my firm in this matter was more complex and required more specialized expertise than in routine matters.
- 19. In all these ways, I have charged a reasonable and reduced rate for the attorneys' time.
- 20. I am also seeking compensation for \$3,581.48 of expenses reasonably and necessarily incurred in this matter, as set forth in the Las Vegas Review-Journal's Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements.
- 21. The Copying Costs reflected in the Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements were reasonably incurred for the purposes of editing, proofread, and preparation for oral argument.
- 22. The E-Filing Fees reflected in the Memorandum of Cost sand Disbursements were reasonably incurred for the purposes of timely filing motions, oppositions, and other papers in this matter.
- 23. The Legal Research Costs reflected in the Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements were reasonably incurred in researching and drafting the legal arguments which ultimately led to the Review-Journal prevailing in this matter.
- 24. The Postage Costs reflected in the Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements were reasonably incurred in sending copies of documents to opposing counsel.
- 25. The Transcript Costs reflected in the Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements were reasonably incurred in obtaining transcripts for hearings held in 2020, which were critical to drafting written orders in this matter.
- 26. The Las Vegas Review-Journal was required to dedicate substantial time to fully litigating this matter at both the district court and appellate levels.

27. On or about December 31, 2020, the Coroner delivered the requested records to my office in electronic format.

I certify and declare under the penalty of perjury under the law of the State of Nevada that the foregoing is true and correct, and this declaration was executed at Las Vegas, Nevada, the 26th day of March, 2021.

/s/ Margaret A. McLetchie
Margaret A. McLetchie, NBN 10931

EXHIBIT 1

Date	Biller	Time	Description	Rate	Tot	:al
11/27/2017	Alina Shell	0.6	Continue drafting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
11/28/2017	Alina Shell	1.2	Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding NRAP 8 and Coroner's obligations regarding complying with court Order to produce documents and/or moving to stay enforcement of Order.	\$ 350.00	\$	420.00
11/28/2017 11/29/2017	Margaret McLetchie		Research re stay issues (Coroner's office has not filed notice of appeal or Motion for stay); consider related strategy to obtain documents; direct Ms. Shell re further research. Further attention to Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00 \$ 350.00		450.00 35.00
				\$ 330.00	Ą	33.00
11/29/2017		_	Draft declaration for Ms. McLetchie in support of Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 350.00		140.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Prepare Ms. McLetchie's declaration and exhibits; finalize Motion for Attorney's Fees and	\$ 450.00	\$	900.00
11/29/2017	Pharan Burchfield	2.2	Costs and file and serve/mail all re same. Download, save, and review file-stamped copy of Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs;	\$ 150.00	\$	330.00
11/30/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	calendar appropriately. Email file-stamped copy of Petitioner's Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs to clients for	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
	Pharan Burchfield		review/records.	\$ 150.00		15.00
12/5/2017	Alina Shell	4.2	Draft opposition to Motion to stay Order pending appeal.	\$ 350.00	\$	1,470.00
12/5/2017	Alina Shell	0.1	Final edit of draft opposition to Motion for Stay; email to Ms. McLetchie for review and comment.	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
12/5/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Circulate/email draft of Opposition to Motion for Stay to clients for review.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
12/6/2017	Alina Shell	0.6	Edit and proofread final draft of opposition to Motion to Stay.	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
12/6/2017	Margaret McLetchie	2.6	Attention to revising draft opposition to Motion to stay. Respond to and address client questions re same. Address client comments.	\$ 450.00	\$	1,170.00
	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Further attention to stay, Motion to expedite strategy. Emails with client.	\$ 450.00		90.00
	Margaret McLetchie	_	Finalize Opposition to Motion to Stay; revise to address comments from client.	\$ 450.00		405.00
12/6/201/	Margaret McLetchie	0.6	Review notice of appeal. Consider case strategy, including possible Motion to expedite. Incorporate final edits, file and serve/mail Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Opposition	\$ 450.00	\$	270.00
12/6/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.4	to Motion for Stay of District Court Order and Order Shortening Time.	\$ 150.00	\$	60.00
12/6/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Download and review Notice of Appeal; create hard-copy, electronic and time-keeping files re same. Calendar as appropriate. Check Nevada Supreme Court website to confirm deadlines re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
12/7/2017	Admin Admin	0.3	Dropped off Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Opposition to Motion for Stay of District Court Order and Order Shortening time at the Las Vegas Regional Justice Center: 200 Lewis Ave. Las Vegas, NV, 89101.	\$ 25.00	\$	7.50
12/7/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	Download, save, and review Notice of Assignment to NRAP 16 Settlement Program. Calendar as appropriate. Add Settlement Judge Israel Kunin's contact information into system; check for conflicts re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
	Margaret McLetchie Lacey Ambro		Review notice of assignment to settlement program; Email to Ms. Rehfeldt re due date for settlement briefs and extending same until after premediation conference call. Prepare Binder for Motion to Stay Hearing.	\$ 450.00 \$ 50.00	\$	90.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Call with Laura Rehfeldt and to chambers re hearing schedule for 12/12. (.2) Email to clients re hearing scheduling. (.1)	\$ 450.00		135.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Communication with client. Prepare for hearing on Motion to Stay.	\$ 450.00	\$	810.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Call with Laura Rehfeldt and to settlement judge re settlement briefs; email to file memorializing same.	\$ 450.00		90.00
12/12/2017			In court for hearing on Coroner's Office's Motion for Stay.	\$ 350.00		280.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Prepare for and attend hearing on Coroner's Motion for Stay.	\$ 450.00	\$	765.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Review and respond to email re pre-mediation telephone conference explaining case status and reasons why not appropriate for settlement.	\$ 450.00		90.00
12/14/2017	-		APPEAL: Prepare to draft Motion for expedited consideration: review Nevada Rules of Appellate Procedure and review other Supreme Court filings to verify necessary contents and structure of Motion.	\$ 350.00		140.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Review Coroner's draft proposed Order granting stay, and provide input re same.	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
12/15/2017			APPEAL: Complete draft Motion to Expedite Appeal and circulate draft to Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 350.00		700.00
, -,			APPEAL: Revise Motion to expedite appeal pursuant to edits and suggestions from Ms.	,	•	
12/15/2017	Alina Shell	0.8	McLetchie.	\$ 350.00	\$	280.00
12/15/2017	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	APPEAL: Revise and edit Motion to Expedite Appeal.	\$ 450.00	\$	225.00
12/15/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.3	APPEAL: Prepare for filing Motion to Expedite Appeal (and exhibit); file and serve re same. Email clients file-stamped copy re same. Calendar response deadlines accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	45.00
12/20/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	APPEAL: Send/mail Settlement Judge a file-stamped copy of the Motion to Expedite Appeal; draft, file, and serve/mail an Amended Certificate of Service re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00

	T					
12/21/2017	Alt CL II		contained therein regarding Coroner's prelitigation confidentiality assertions. Research	4 250 00		400.00
12/21/2017	Alina Shell	1.4	regarding legislative history of NRS 239.011 and state agency interpretations of same. Confer	\$ 350.00	\$	490.00
12/21/2017	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Attention to execution of joint proposed Order on Motion to Stay; correct error in firm name.	\$ 450.00	ċ	90.00
12/21/2017	ivialgaret ivictetcille	0.2	Confer with Ms. Shell re Opposition to Motion for Attorney's Fees and addressing arguments	\$ 430.00	۲	30.00
12/21/2017	Margaret McLetchie	2.0	made by Coroner's Office.	\$ 450.00	Ś	900.00
	. 0		Begin drafting reply to opposition to Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs: draft preliminary	,		
12/22/2017	Alina Shell	2.0	section and section re bad faith.	\$ 350.00	\$	700.00
			Resume drafting reply to Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs: finish drafting response to			
			Coroner's Office argument regarding "bad faith," and respond to arguments regarding			
12/26/2017	Alina Shell	3.8	attorneys' and paralegal's rates, and draft introduction.	\$ 350.00	\$	1,330.00
			APPEAL: Edit and expand reply to Coroner's opposition to Motion to Expedite: Edit sections drafted by Ms. McLetchie and add sections to reply to re (1) First Amendment right of access			
12/27/2017	Alina Shell	1 4	and (2) new litigation in district court.	\$ 350.00	\$	490.00
12/2//2017	7 mile offen		APPEAL: Write Motion for leave to exceed 5-page limit set by NRAP 27 for reply to the	ψ 550.00	Υ	.50.00
12/27/2017	Alina Shell	0.4	Coroner's opposition to Motion to Expedite.	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
12/27/2017	Alina Shell	0.5	APPEAL: Final proofread and edit of reply to opposition to Motion to Expedite Appeal.	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
			APPEAL: Continue drafting Motion for leave to file a reply in excess of page limit to Coroner's			
12/27/2017			opposition to Motion to expedite appeal.	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
12/27/2017	Alina Sheli	0.5	APPEAL: Finalize draft of reply in support of Motion to Expedite Appeal. APPEAL: edit draft reply in support of Motion to Expedite Appeal. Circulate to clients. Direct	\$ 350.00	Ş	175.00
12/27/2017	Margaret McLetchie	1.1	finalization.	\$ 450.00	Ś	495.00
12/2//2017	ivia gar et iviezeteine		APPEAL: Draft and finalize Motion for Excess Pages re Reply to Expedite Appeal; finalize, file	ψ .50.00	Υ	133.00
12/27/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.5	and serve/mail Reply to Opposition to Motion to Expedite Appeal.	\$ 150.00	\$	75.00
12/28/2017	Alina Shell	2.3	APPEAL: Draft confidential settlement statement.	\$ 350.00	\$	805.00
			APPEAL: Email file-stamped copies of Motion for Excess Pages re Reply in support of Motion			
			to Expedite Appeal; finalize, file and serve/mail Reply to Opposition to Motion to Expedite			
12/28/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Appeal and Docketing Statement to clients.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
12/20/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	APPEAL: Finalize and send (mail/email) Respondent Las Vegas Review-Journal's Confidential Statement Regarding Settlement to Settlement Judge.	\$ 150.00	ċ	45.00
12/29/2017	Filaran Burcinielu	0.3	Read opposition to Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, edit and proofread Reply to	\$ 130.00	۲	43.00
1/4/2018	Leo Wolpert	1.1	opposition.	\$ 200.00	Ś	220.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Prepare and attend call with settlement judge; update team re next steps.	\$ 450.00	_	180.00
1/4/2018	Margaret McLetchie	1.8	Revise reply in support of Motion for aAttorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	810.00
			Prepare exhibits and draft declaration re Reply; finalize, file, and serve/mail Reply to			
	Pharan Burchfield		Opposition to Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 150.00	\$	135.00
1/5/2018	Lacey Ambro	0.6	Prepare Judge's Courtesy Copy and Hearing Binder re: Motion for Attorney's Fees.	\$ 50.00	\$	30.00
1/5/2018	Lacey Ambro	0.3	Dropped off Courtesy Copy Binder to Judge Crockett re: Motion for Attorney's Fees.	\$ 50.00	Ś	15.00
				7 00.00	т	
1/5/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Email clients briefing re Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and hearing information.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
1/10/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.8	Prepare for hearing on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	360.00
			Prepare for and attend hearing on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Update clients re			
1/11/2018	Margaret McLetchie	2.5	same, plan next steps (drafting of Order).	\$ 450.00	\$	1,125.00
1 /11 /2010	Pharan Burchfield	0.5	Prepare Blackjack Bonding v LVMPD research/ fees application briefing for today's argument for Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 150.00	<u>ر</u>	75.00
1/11/2018	Filaran Burcinielu	0.5	Draft Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, and email same to Ms. McLetchie	\$ 130.00	۲	75.00
1/17/2018	Alina Shell	2.8	for review and approval.	\$ 350.00	\$	980.00
			Per Ms. McLetchie's request, review and edit her revisions to proposed Order granting		·	
1/17/2018	Alina Shell	0.5	Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
1/17/2018	Margaret McLetchie	1.1	Attention to revising proposed Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	495.00
1/18/2018			Edit and proofread proposed Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs	\$ 200.00	-	160.00
	Leo Wolpert					
	Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie		Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	270.00
1/18/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.6	Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00		
1/18/2018	•	0.6	Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review Order on Motion to Expedite Appeal and confer with Ms. Burchfield re calendaring.			90.00
1/18/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.6	Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00		
1/18/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.6	Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review Order on Motion to Expedite Appeal and confer with Ms. Burchfield re calendaring. Finalize proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; draft and send Ms.	\$ 450.00	\$	
1/18/2018	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	0.6	Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review Order on Motion to Expedite Appeal and confer with Ms. Burchfield re calendaring. Finalize proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; draft and send Ms. McLetchie's letter to Honorable Judge Crockett and opposing counsel re submitting	\$ 450.00 \$ 450.00	\$	90.00
1/18/2018 1/18/2018 1/18/2018	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	0.6	Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review Order on Motion to Expedite Appeal and confer with Ms. Burchfield re calendaring. Finalize proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; draft and send Ms. McLetchie's letter to Honorable Judge Crockett and opposing counsel re submitting competing Orders re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Expedite Appeal; send to clients re same; and calendar accordingly.	\$ 450.00 \$ 450.00	\$	90.00
1/18/2018 1/18/2018 1/18/2018	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield	0.6	Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review Order on Motion to Expedite Appeal and confer with Ms. Burchfield re calendaring. Finalize proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; draft and send Ms. McLetchie's letter to Honorable Judge Crockett and opposing counsel re submitting competing Orders re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Expedite Appeal; send to clients re same; and calendar accordingly. Review letter to Judge Crockett from Ms. Rehfeldt regarding the proposed Order granting	\$ 450.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00	\$	90.00
1/18/2018 1/18/2018 1/18/2018 1/18/2018	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield	0.6 0.2 0.3 0.1	Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review Order on Motion to Expedite Appeal and confer with Ms. Burchfield re calendaring. Finalize proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; draft and send Ms. McLetchie's letter to Honorable Judge Crockett and opposing counsel re submitting competing Orders re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Expedite Appeal; send to clients re same; and calendar accordingly. Review letter to Judge Crockett from Ms. Rehfeldt regarding the proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review proposed Order and revise to address area of	\$ 450.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$	90.00 45.00 15.00
1/18/2018 1/18/2018 1/18/2018	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield	0.6 0.2 0.3 0.1	Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review Order on Motion to Expedite Appeal and confer with Ms. Burchfield re calendaring. Finalize proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; draft and send Ms. McLetchie's letter to Honorable Judge Crockett and opposing counsel re submitting competing Orders re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Expedite Appeal; send to clients re same; and calendar accordingly. Review letter to Judge Crockett from Ms. Rehfeldt regarding the proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review proposed Order and revise to address area of concern in Ms. Rehfeldt's letter re the scope of 239.012.	\$ 450.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00	\$	90.00
1/18/2018 1/18/2018 1/18/2018 1/18/2018 1/19/2018	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell	0.6 0.2 0.3 0.1	Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review Order on Motion to Expedite Appeal and confer with Ms. Burchfield re calendaring. Finalize proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; draft and send Ms. McLetchie's letter to Honorable Judge Crockett and opposing counsel re submitting competing Orders re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Expedite Appeal; send to clients re same; and calendar accordingly. Review letter to Judge Crockett from Ms. Rehfeldt regarding the proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review proposed Order and revise to address area of concern in Ms. Rehfeldt's letter re the scope of 239.012. Attention to submission of proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 350.00	\$ \$	90.00 45.00 15.00
1/18/2018 1/18/2018 1/18/2018 1/18/2018 1/19/2018	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield	0.6 0.2 0.3 0.1	Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review Order on Motion to Expedite Appeal and confer with Ms. Burchfield re calendaring. Finalize proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; draft and send Ms. McLetchie's letter to Honorable Judge Crockett and opposing counsel re submitting competing Orders re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Expedite Appeal; send to clients re same; and calendar accordingly. Review letter to Judge Crockett from Ms. Rehfeldt regarding the proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review proposed Order and revise to address area of concern in Ms. Rehfeldt's letter re the scope of 239.012.	\$ 450.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$	90.00 45.00 15.00

		1		1		
2/2/2019	Margaret Meletchie		Review and assess Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs filed in district court; circulate to clients.	\$ 450.00	خ	540.00
2/2/2016	Margaret McLetchie	1.2	Email clients Notice of Appeal and Case Appeal Statement re Order Granting Attorney's Fees	\$ 450.00	Ş	340.00
2/6/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	and Costs.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			Research, draft opposition to Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees			
2/12/2018	Leo Wolpert	5.5	and Costs.	\$ 200.00	\$	1,100.00
2/12/2018	Margaret McLetchie	1.4	Attention to opposition to Motion for Stay of order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	630.00
2/12/2018	Loo Malaout	2.0	Finish annualities to Mation for Charles for Audion granting Mation for Attenually Food and Cooks	ć 200 00	۰	400.00
2/13/2018	Leo Wolpert	2.0	Finish opposition to Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Finalize opposition to Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and	\$ 200.00	Ş	400.00
2/13/2018	Margaret McLetchie	2.7	Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	1,215.00
2/13/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	Finalize, file, and serve/mail Opposition to Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 150.00	Ś	30.00
2,13,2010	- Haran Baronnela	0.2	Dropped off Opposition to Renewed Motion for Order Shortening Time on Motion for Stay of	ψ 130.00	7	30.00
2/44/2040		0.5	District Court Order at the Las Vegas Phoenix Building: 330 S 3rd St. Las Vegas NV, 89101	d 25.00	_	12.50
2/14/2018	Admin Admin	0.5	Department 24.	\$ 25.00	Ş	12.50
			Prepare Hearing binder regarding Respondent's Renewed Motion for Order Shortening Time			
2/14/2018	Lacey Ambro		on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 50.00	\$	40.00
2/45/2040			Prepare for and attend hearing on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's	4 450 00	,	4 665 00
2/15/2018	Margaret McLetchie	3.7	Fees and Costs. APPEAL: Email to settlement judge re possible settlement conference (not appropriate for	\$ 450.00	\$	1,665.00
2/20/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	mediation) to avoid unnecessary fees.	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
			APPEAL: Download, review, save, and calendar Order Removing from Settlement Program			
2/22/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	(Case No. 75095) and Reinstating Briefing. Attention to Order denying Motion for Stay of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
2/26/2018	Margaret McLetchie	1.2	Costs.	\$ 450.00	Ś	540.00
	0		Continued attention to Order Denying Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for	,		
2/27/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	225.00
2/27/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.4	Begin drafting proposed Order Denying Motion for Stay for Ms. McLetchie's review.	\$ 150.00	Ś	60.00
2,27,2010	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	011	Continued attention to Order denying Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for	ψ 130.00	7	55.55
2/28/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	180.00
			Email communications with Mr. Echols confirming approval of proposed Order denying stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; direct Ms. Lopez to pick-up and			
3/1/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	deliver to Honorable Judge Crockett.	\$ 150.00	Ś	15.00
			Picked up Order Denying Respondent's Renewed Motion on Order Shortening Time for Stay	,	Ė	
0/5/0010			of District Court Order at the Las Vegas Phoenix Building: 330 S 3rd St Las Vegas, NV 89101			
	Admin Admin Margaret McLetchie		Department 24. Emails with chambers recorder for pick up.	\$ 25.00 \$ 450.00		17.50 45.00
3, 3, 2010	margar et mozeteme	0.12	Attention to issues regarding stay, coroner's apparent plan to appeal denial of same. Review	ψ .50.00	7	.5.00
3/7/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	Notice of Entry of Order.	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
			File Order Denying Respondent's Renewed Motion on Order Shortening Time for Stay of			
3/7/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	District Court Order; draft, file, and serve/mail Notice of Entry of Order re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	APPEAL: Review and respond to email regarding appendices.	\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
	Margaret McLetchie		FEES APPEAL: Review and respond to email regarding appendices.	\$ 450.00		45.00
3/8/2018	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	FEES APPEAL: Attention to Motion for Stay filed by coroner's office.	\$ 450.00	\$	450.00
3/13/2018	Alina Shell	0.7	FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit draft version of opposition to Motion to Stay Order re attorney's fees.	\$ 350.00	Ś	245.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Attention to Opposition to Motion for Stay.	\$ 450.00	\$	450.00
3/13/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	FEES APPEAL: Draft Opposition to Emergency Relief Under NRAP 27(e).	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
3/15/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	APPEAL: Revision to Opposition to Motion to Stay. Direction to Ms. Shell regarding same.	\$ 450.00	\$	180.00
3/13/2018	ivial gal et ivictetellie	0.4	APPEAL: Nevision to opposition to Motion to Stay: Oriection to Mis. Shell regarding same. APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, review the Coroner's Office's proposed joint appendix,	Ş 430.00	٧	180.00
			compare to documents filed in district court, and draft brief memorandum regarding			
3/16/2018			additional documents for inclusion.	\$ 350.00	_	105.00
3/16/2018	Alina Snell	1.1	APPEAL: Draft opposition to consolidation.	\$ 350.00	\$	385.00
			APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, email Ms. Dell, paralegal, at Marquis Aurbach Coffing			
3/16/2018	Alina Shell	0.1	regarding addition to proposed joint appendix for Coroner appeal.	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
2/16/2010	Loo Wolsort	<i>c</i> 2	APPEAL: Draft, edit, research Opposition to emergency Motion for Stay at Nevada Supreme	\$ 200.00	۲	1 260 00
5/10/2018	Leo Wolpert	0.3	Court.	\$ 200.00	Ş	1,260.00
3/16/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	APPEAL: Continued attention to Opposition to stay and emails to team regarding same.	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Opposition to Motion to Consolidate.	\$ 450.00		450.00
3/19/2018 3/19/2018			APPEAL: Complete draft of opposition to Motion to consolidate appeals. APPEAL: Edit opposition to Motion for stay of judgment relationary's fees	\$ 350.00		175.00
2/13/2018	Aiiild Sileii	1./	APPEAL: Edit opposition to Motion for stay of judgment re attorney's fees.	\$ 350.00	Ş	595.00

		1	ADDEAL Final are filing adit of appeaition to Mation to consolidate appeals conformith Ma		ı —	
3/19/2018	Alina Shell		APPEAL: Final pre-filing edit of opposition to Motion to consolidate appeals, confer with Ms. McLetchie re same.	\$ 350.00	Ś	35.00
0,13,2010	runia orien		APPEAL: Edit Motion for leave to file excess pages for opposition to Motion for stay of	ψ 050.00	Ť	
3/19/2018	Alina Shell		attorney fee award Order.	\$ 350.00	Ś	140.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Review and revise Opposition to Motion to Consolidate.	\$ 450.00	\$	270.00
	J		APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve (into both cases) Opposition to Motion to Consolidate			
3/19/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	Appeals.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
3/19/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	APPEAL: Draft Motion for Excess Pages re Opposition to Stay.	\$ 150.00		30.00
			APPEAL: Final pre-filing review and edit of opposition to Motion to stay Order re attorney			
3/20/2018	Alina Shell	0.6	fees and Motion for leave to file excess pages.	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
			FEES APPEAL: Finalize and file/serve Motion for Leave to File Response in Excess of			
			Page/Type Volume Limitation and proposed Opposition to Emergency Motion for Relief			
3/20/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.3	Under NRAP 27(e).	\$ 150.00	\$	45.00
			FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and email clients Opposition to Emergency Motion for Stay			
3/21/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Under NRAP 27(e).	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			APPEAL: Confer with client regarding possible Reporters Committee for Freedom of the Press			
3/28/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	("RCFP") amicus brief in the case.	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
			APPEAL: Review Coroner's Office proposed joint appendix list for appeal of writ, and respond			
4/6/2018	Alina Shell		to Ms. Dell re same.	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
			FEES APPEAL: Review en banc Supreme Court opinion regarding Coroner's Motion for stay of			
4/12/2018	Alina Shell	1	attorney fees Order.	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
			FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, research regarding grounds for reconsideration			
4/12/2018	Alina Shell	2.0	of en banc decision re stay of attorney fees Order.	\$ 350.00	\$	700.00
4/12/2018	Alina Shell	0.4	FEES APPEAL: Continue research regarding en banc reconsideration.	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
			FEES APPEAL: Read Supreme Court decision granting stay to Coroner, research post-Nken			
			federal cases regarding whether 62(d) and 62(e) work in tandem to give governmental			
4/12/2018	Leo Wolpert	4.3	entities stays as a matter of right.	\$ 200.00	\$	860.00
	•		FEES APPEAL: Review Order regarding Stay of Fees Award, Consider possible petition for			
4/12/2018	Margaret McLetchie		rehearing and Confer with team regarding same.	\$ 450.00	\$	495.00
			FEES APPEAL: Meeting with Mr. Wolpert to discuss possible petition for rehearing (.4).	-		
			Review Justice Cherry's dissent in Order granting stay to identify potential issues to raise in			
4/13/2018	Alina Shell	0.8	petition for rehearing and conduct research re same. (.4).	\$ 350.00	\$	280.00
			FEES APPEAL: Research and write argument for petition for rehearing of Supreme Court			
4/13/2018	Leo Wolpert	4.5	Order granting stay.	\$ 200.00	\$	900.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Motion for Extension of Time re Appellant's Opening			
4/13/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	Brief and Joint Appendix and Order Granting Extension re same; calendar briefing schedules.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
			FEES APPEAL: Edit and expand Mr. Wolpert's draft of petition for rehearing on stay of award			
			of attorney's fees. Legal research re NRAP 8(a) to include argument re how Order could			
			result in nullification of the rule. Edit opposition to Motion to stay enforcement of award			
4/16/2018	Alina Shell	1.5	Order pending appeal.	\$ 350.00	\$	525.00
4/16/2018	Leo Wolpert	1.8	FEES APPEAL: Finish drafting petition for reconsideration of Order on Motion for Stay.	\$ 200.00	\$	360.00
			FEES APPEAL: Attention to Petition for Rehearing; Direct Ms. Shell regarding strategy			
4/16/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	regarding same.	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
			FEES APPEAL: Complete draft of petition for rehearing and circulate to Ms. McLetchie for			
4/17/2018	Alina Shell	1.0	review and comment.	\$ 350.00	\$	350.00
4/17/2018	Alina Shell	1.1	FEES APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to draft of petition for rehearing.	\$ 350.00	\$	385.00
4/17/2018	Leo Wolpert	0.5	FEES APPEAL: Edit and proofread Supreme Court petition for rehearing.	\$ 200.00	\$	100.00
4/17/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.8	FEES APPEAL: Revise Petition for Rehearing and confer with Ms. Shell regarding same.	\$ 450.00	\$	360.00
4/18/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	FEES APPEAL: Revise Petition for Rehearing and circulate.	\$ 450.00	\$	225.00
			FEES APPEAL: Perform research and provide to Ms. Shell for inclusion in Motion to			
4/19/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	Reconsider.	\$ 450.00	\$	225.00
			FEES APPEAL: Add additional argument to Motion for rehearing pursuant to discussion with			
4/23/2018	Alina Shell	0.4	Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
	Leo Wolpert		FEES APPEAL: edit and proofread petition for rehearing.	\$ 200.00	\$	100.00
			FFES APPEAL: Review and incorporate Mr. Wolpert's edits to petition for rehearing, and do			
4/27/2018	Alina Shell	0.8	additional proofreading/editing.	\$ 350.00	\$	280.00
			FEES APPEAL: pre-final review of petition for rehearing; email same to Ms. McLetchie for final		Ì	
4/30/2018	Alina Shell		review and approval.	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
4/30/2018			FEES APPEAL: Incorporate final edits to petition for rehearing.	\$ 350.00		70.00
	Pharan Burchfield		FEES APPEAL: Finalize and file/serve Petition for Rehearing.	\$ 150.00		45.00
, , 0			,			

			APPEAL: Download and save Clark County Office of Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion for			
			Extension of Time to File Opening Brief. Draft, file, and serve Notice of Non-Opposition to			
E /24 /2040	Dhana Danah Galal	0.2	Petitioner Clark County Office of Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion for Extension of Time	ć 450.00	٠	20.00
5/21/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	to File Opening Brief. FEES APPEAL: Download, save, review, and update calendars re Coroner's Motion (and	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
5/23/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Notice of Approved Motion) for Extension re Opening Brief and Appendix.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
3/23/2016	riiai aii Bui ciiileiu	0.1	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Appellant's Opening Brief. Calendar Answering Brief as	\$ 130.00	۲	13.00
6/6/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	appropriate.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
0,0,2020	That are Dat of the City	0.1	FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Joint Appendix (volumes 1 and 2); send to	ψ 130.00	Ť	25.00
			attorneys re same; and download, save, and review Appellant's Second Motion to Extend			
6/22/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	Opening Brief; calendar response re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
			APPEAL: Email Ms. Nichols regarding intent to file Motion for Extension of Time for Filing			
6/28/2018	Alina Shell	0.1	Answering Brief for appeal.	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
			APPEAL: Review Opening Brief filed by Coroner and conduct preliminary research re			
6/28/2018	Alina Shell	0.6	arguments.	\$ 350.00	_	210.00
6/28/2018	Alina Shell	0.8	APPEAL: Draft Motion for Extension of Time for Filing Answering Brief.	\$ 350.00	\$	280.00
			APPEAL: Begin preparing Unopposed Motion for an Extension re Answering Brief for			
6/28/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.3	attorneys' review/approval.	\$ 150.00	\$	45.00
			APPEAL: Finalize and file Unopposed Motion for Extension to File Respondents' Answering			
6/29/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Brief.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
= /0 /00 4 0				4		
7/2/2018	Carly Krygier	0.1	Review and edit Public Records Act request regarding fees paid to outside counsel in case.	\$ 200.00	\$	20.00
7/2/2010	Dhana Danah Galal	0.1	Finalize and send (email) Public Records Act requests to Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach	ć 450.00	٠	45.00
7/2/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Coffing agreement.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
7/2/2010	Dharan Burchfiold	0.1	FEES APPEAL: Download, review, and update calendars per Order Granting Motion re	¢ 150.00	ب	15.00
//2/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	extension of deadline of Answering Brief.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			FEES APPEAL: Download, review, and update calendars per Order Granting Motion re			
7/2/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	extension of deadline of Opening Brief (and approximate deadline for Answering Brief).	\$ 150.00	خ	15.00
7/2/2010	Tharan Barcinicia	0.1	Review and save Ms. Rehfeldt's response to Public Records Act requests re Marquis Aurbach	7 130.00	7	13.00
7/9/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Coffing agreement.	\$ 150.00	Ś	15.00
77372020	That are Dat of the City	0.1	FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Appellant's Opening Brief; calendar Answering	ψ 130.00	Ť	25.00
7/19/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Brief accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Plan strategy on appeal.	\$ 450.00	_	180.00
7/31/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	APPEAL: Continue appellate planning.	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
8/6/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.5	APPEAL: Prepare shell Answering Brief for attorneys' drafting.	\$ 150.00	\$	75.00
8/7/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	APPEAL: Email conferences with client and with RCFP regarding Amicus Brief.	\$ 450.00	Ś	135.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Attention to Amicus Brief. Email with client regarding status.	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
			APPEAL: Review Coroner Opening Brief and begin researching and outlining response to			
			Coroner's statement of facts and procedural history. Meeting with Ms. McLetchie to discuss			
8/10/2018	Alina Shell	1.5	same, and discuss apportionment of different sections of Answering Brief.	\$ 350.00	\$	525.00
8/10/2018	Margaret McLetchie	5.4	APPEAL: Work on Answering Brief. Review opening brief and meet with Ms. Shelll.	\$ 450.00	\$	2,430.00
			APPEAL: Draft response to statement of facts and procedural history in Coroner's opening			
8/12/2018	Alina Shell	3.1	brief.	\$ 350.00	\$	1,085.00
			APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, draft portion of Answering Brief responding to			
0/15/5			Coroner's Office's previously unasserted argument regarding retroactive application of	4		
8/12/2018	Alina Shell	1.2	changes to NRS made by 2017 AB 57.	\$ 350.00	\$	420.00
0/12/2010	Alina Ch-II		APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, draft argument for Answering Brief regarding	¢ 350.00	_	665.65
8/12/2018			impermissible costs for privilege review and redaction.	\$ 350.00	\$	665.00
0/12/2018	Margaret McLetchie	6.2	APPEAL: Revise draft of Answering Brief. APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and refine response to statement of facts and	\$ 450.00	\$	2,790.00
			procedural history for answering brief; specifically, edit section regarding hearsay and legal			
8/13/2018	Alina Shell	1 1	conclusions in Mr. Fudenberg's declaration.	\$ 350.00	¢	385.00
3/ 13/ 2010	, mila JiiCii	1.1	APPEAL: Additional attention to answering brief: edit Motion for excess pages/type-volume;	00.00 ب	۰	303.00
			editing all arguments and response to statement of facts/procedural history; identify			
			materials needed for Respondent's Appendix; edit and approve tables for same; proofread			
			and check case law and record citations; edit and approve table of contents and table of			
8/13/2018	Alina Shell	12.3	authorities.	\$ 350.00	\$	4,305.00
	Leo Wolpert		APPEAL: Edit, proofread, and cite check Answering Brief.	\$ 200.00	\$	780.00
	·		. <u> </u>			
8/13/2018	Margaret McLetchie	5.0	APPEAL: Work on revising and finalizing Answering Brief; culate draft Brief to client.	\$ 450.00	\$	2,250.00
			APPEAL: Draft shell Unopposed Motion re excess word-count in Answering Brief for			
			drafting/editing by attorneys. Download and save for attorneys' review Orders denying re			
8/13/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.4	same File and serve Motion same.	\$ 150.00	\$	60.00

APPEAL Email Reporters Committee for Freedom of the Press copies of Answering Brief and Staff (2012) Appendix of the Proposition Amounts Brief. 3,150.00 5,15			I			ı	
and sever re same. Prepare Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, Certificate of Complaine (non-complaint re-pending unopposed Motion in evord-count), and certificate of Service re Respondent's Answering Brief, Finalize, file, serve, and email courtery copy to opposing (2000) \$15.00 \$3.45				APPEAL: Draft, prepare, Bates, index, and put into volumes (3) Respondent's Appendix: file			
Respondent's Answering Birst, Finalize, File, Serve, and email courtery copy to opposing							
\$3,34/2018 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Appendix Formation 0.1 Appendi				(non-compliant re pending unopposed Motion re word-count), and Certificate of Service re			
APPEAL Email Reporters Committee for Freedom of the Press copies of Answering Brief and S16/2018 Margaret Miclatrible 0.1 FEES APPEAL: Charles from Motion for Extension of deadlines. 4500.0 5.1				Respondent's Answering Brief; finalize, file, serve, and email courtesy copy to opposing			
\$1,470018 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Appendicts for their potential Amicus Bref. \$1,500 \$1,500 \$4,50 \$1,670018 \$1	8/13/2018	Pharan Burchfield	2.3		\$ 150.00	\$	345.00
\$45,001 \$45,000 \$45,	- 1 1						
### STESS APPEAL: Continue to Grant function for Estension of Time to File Respondent's Answering 0.3 piles for Ms. McLetchie's review/approval. ### STAT/2018 haran Burchfield 0.3 piles for Ms. McLetchie's review/approval. ### STAT/2018 haran Burchfield 0.2 permission to use esignature: file and serve re same. ### APPEAL: Convert draft Unopposed Motion into Stipulation for Estension of Time to File Biological State of the Convert of an International State (Inches) confirms data and and an International State (Inches) confirms data and and an International State (Inches) confirms data and an International State (Inches) confirms data and an International State (Inches) confirms data and an International State (Inches) and International State (Inch							15.00
\$1,000 \$2,000 \$3,000 \$4,000 \$	8/16/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.1		\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
## 17/2018 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 ## 15/2018 FEES APPEAL: Emails with opposing counsel re extension and attention to finalizing same. 5 45/00 5 90.0	0/16/2010	Pharan Purchfiold	0.2		¢ 150.00	خ	45.00
FEES_APPEAL: Convert drift Unopposed Motion into Sipulation for Extension of Time to File Biefing (First Request), email communications with Mr. Echols confirms draft and \$2 permission to use esignature; file and server er same. \$150.00 \$ 30.0 \$	0/10/2018	r ilaran burciniela	0.5	brief for wis. Welleteine 3 review/ approvai.	Ç 130.00	ڔ	43.00
FEES_APPEAL: Convert drift Unopposed Motion into Sipulation for Extension of Time to File Biefing (First Request), email communications with Mr. Echols confirms draft and \$2 permission to use esignature; file and server er same. \$150.00 \$ 30.0 \$	8/17/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	FEES APPEAL: Emails with opposing counsel re extension and attention to finalizing same.	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
\$1,000 \$3,		0			,		
APPEAL Review and analyze Amicus Brief file by RCFP and provide to client with comment. S 450.00 \$ 360.0				Briefing (First Request); email communications with Mr. Echols confirms draft and			
	8/17/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	permission to use esignature; file and serve re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
APPEAL Download, save, and review Order Denying Excess Pages; update calendars \$150.00 \$ 150				APPEAL: Review and analyze Amicus Brief file by RCFP and provide to client with comment.			
### 8/21/2018 Person Burchfield 0.1 accordingly. ### 5.5 SPPEAL: Outline the Coroner's brief and the Las Vegas Review-Journal's corresponding ### 5.5 Segments in the lower court. ### 5.5 Sugments in the lower court. ### 5.	8/21/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.8		\$ 450.00	\$	360.00
FEES APPEAL: Outline the Coroner's brief and the Las Vegas Review-Journal's corresponding 8/23/2018 Jessica Brown S. arguments in the lower court. \$200.00 \$ 1,100.00 \$						١.	
8/22/2018 Jessica Brown	8/21/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1		\$ 150.00	Ş	15.00
8/23/2018 Jessica Brown	0/22/2010	Jossica Brown			¢ 200 00	ب	1 100 00
FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft outline to address Coroner's arguments and case law; begin Stay 2018 Jessica Brown Stay 2018 Jessica							
Session Sess	0/23/2010	Jessica BiOWII	0.5	• •	\$ 200.00	ې	100.00
FEES APPEAL: Review the case law cited by the Coroner regarding whether we have to wait until the substantive appeal has been decided to collect attorney's fees. Report to Ms. 8/23/2018 Margaret McLetchie FEES APPEAL: Review Coroner's brief and work on answering brief. Identify and analyze legal 2, 3 issues. Assign research. \$450.00 \$ 1,035.0 \$	8/23/2018	Jessica Brown	5.4		\$ 200.00	Ś	1.080.00
Until the substantive appeal has been decided to collect attorneys' fees. Report to Ms. \$200.00 \$100.00	0, =0, =0=0				,	7	_,
FEES APPEAL: Review Coroner's brief and work on answering brief. Identify and analyze legal \$ 450.00 \$ 1,035.0							
REES APPEAL: Revise was Coroner's opening brief on attorney's fees, created outline to address Coroner's arguments and case law, began to draft brief based on the action in the septiments. Septiments and case law, began to draft brief based on the action in the septiments. Septiments and case law, began to draft brief based on the action in the septiments. Septiments and case law, began to draft brief based on the action in the septiments. Septiments and case law, begin septiments. Septiment	8/23/2018	Jessica Brown	0.5	McLetchie re same.	\$ 200.00	\$	100.00
FEES APPEAL: Reviewed Coroner's opening brief on attorney's fees, created outline to address Coroner's arguments and case law, began to draft brief based on the action in the source or court. \$200.00 \$ 760.				FEES APPEAL: Review Coroner's brief and work on answering brief. Identify and analyze legal			
address Coroner's arguments and case law; began to draft brief based on the action in the \$,200.00 \$,760.0 \$,7	8/23/2018	Margaret McLetchie	2.3	· ·	\$ 450.00	\$	1,035.00
Sesica Brown 3.8 lower court. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft outline to address Coroner's arguments and case law; begin Sesica Brown 2.4 to draft brief based on the arguments made in the lower court. \$200.00 \$ 480.00 \$ 1,350.00							
FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft outline to address Coroner's arguments and case law; begin \$200.00 \$ 480.00 \$ 8/27/2018 Jessica Brown 2.4 to draft brief based on the arguments made in the lower court. \$200.00 \$ 480.00 \$ 8/27/2018 Jessica Brown 5.20 Coroner's arguments and case law; begin \$200.00 \$ 1,040	0 10 1 10 0 10				4		
8/27/2018 Jessica Brown 2.4 to draft brief based on the arguments made in the lower court. 5 200.00 \$ 480.0 8/27/2018 Margaret McLetchie 3.0 FEE APPEAL: Attention to work on and drafting of answering Brief. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft and revise appellate brief by outlining the case law in the Coroner's arguments and case law. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft and revise appellate brief by outlining the case law in the Coroner's opening brief, responding with the arguments we made in the lower court, and adding case law that is responding with the arguments we made in the lower court, and adding case law that is responsive to the Coroner on appeal. 8/29/2018 Jessica Brown 7.1 adding case law that is responsive to the Coroner on appeal. 8/29/2018 Jessica Brown 1.4 Statutes section 239. 9/4/2018 Jessica Brown 1.5 APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorney's fees, specifically the arguments about the lack of ambiguity between the fees provision and the damages provision in Nevada Revised 9/4/2018 Jessica Brown 1.4 Statutes section 239. 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 2.5 APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 3.1 Same. Approve filling. APPEAL: Revise and shorten Answering Brief, Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfelld re filling 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporate dasection on the background of the Supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. 9/10/2018 Jessica Brown 1.9 Supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the RPPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's	8/24/2018	Jessica Brown	3.8		\$ 200.00	Ş	/60.00
Section Sect	0/27/2010	Jossica Prown	2.4		\$ 200.00	خ	490.00
FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft opening brief regarding attorney's fees by addressing 8/28/2018 Jessica Brown 5.2 Coroner's arguments and case law. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft and revise appellate brief by outlining the case law in the Coroner's opening brief, responding with the arguments we made in the lower court, and 8/29/2018 Jessica Brown 7.1 adding case law that is responsive to the Coroner on appeal. \$ 200.00 \$ 1,420.0 \$ 350.00 \$ 1,420.0 \$ 350.00 \$ 1,420.0 \$ 1,420.0 \$ 350.00 \$ 1,420.0 \$ 200.00 \$ 1,420.0 \$ 350.00 \$ 5,950.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorney's fees, specifically the arguments about the lack of ambiguity between the fees provision and the damages provision in Nevada Revised 9/4/2018 Jessica Brown 1.4 Statutes section 239. 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 2.5 APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. 3.1 same. Approve filing. APPEAL: Revise and shorten Answering Brief, Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfeild re filing 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 3.1 same. Approve filing. APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, update Tables of Authorities, Table of Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/10/2018 Jessica Brown 3.2 NPRA. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown 3.3 fees. FEES APPEAL: Revise Appellate brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack						_	
8/28/2018 Jessica Brown 5.2 Coroner's arguments and case law. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft and revise appellate brief by outlining the case law in the Coroner's opening brief, responding with the arguments we made in the lower court, and adding case law that is responsive to the Coroner on appeal. 8/30/2018 Alina Shell 1.7 FEES APPEAL: Begin review of preliminary draft answering brief in attorney's fees appeal. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorney's fees, specifically the arguments about the lack of ambiguity between the fees provision and the damages provision in Nevada Revised 9/4/2018 Jessica Brown 1.4 Statutes section 239. 5.200.00 \$ 280.0 9/5/2018 Alina Shell 2.5 APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. 5.200.00 \$ 875.0 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 7.2 Email with Mr. Kane re Coroner's current practices re autopsies. APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfell or filling 5.350.00 \$ 1,395.0 4PPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, Direct Ms. Shell and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 Same. APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorney's fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. 9/10/2018 Jessica Brown 1.9 Inspect Appeal: Revise appellate brief for Attorneys' fees. Addressing case law in Nevada that supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. 5. 200.00 \$ 640.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding file for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in PADA. FEES APPEAL: Revise appell	0/2//2010	War Bar Ct WickCtchic	3.0		ÿ +30.00	7	1,550.00
FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft and revise appellate brief by outlining the case law in the Coroner's opening brief, responding with the arguments we made in the lower court, and 38/29/2018 Jessica Brown 7.1 adding case law that is responsive to the Coroner on appeal. \$ 200.00 \$ 1,420.0	8/28/2018	Jessica Brown	5.2		\$ 200.00	\$	1,040.00
8/39/2018 Jessica Brown 7.1 adding case law that is responsive to the Coroner on appeal. 8/30/2018 Alina Shell 1.7 FEES APPEAL: Begin review of preliminary draft answering brief in attorney's fees appeal. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorney's fees, specifically the arguments about the lack of ambiguity between the fees provision and the damages provision in Nevada Revised 9/4/2018 Jessica Brown 1.4 Statutes section 239. \$\frac{9}{5}/2018} Alina Shell 2.5 APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Email with Mr. Kane re Coroner's current practices re autopsies. \$\frac{9}{5}/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. \$\frac{9}{5}/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. \$\frac{9}{5}/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. \$\frac{9}{5}/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. \$\frac{9}{5}/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. \$\frac{9}{5}/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. \$\frac{9}{5}/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. \$\frac{9}{5}/2018} APPEAL: Revise and shorten Answering Brief; Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfell re filing \$\frac{9}{5}/5/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. \$\frac{9}{5}/5/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. \$\frac{9}{5}/5/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. \$\frac{9}{5}/5/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request grief proofread shortened answering brief. \$\frac{9}{5}/5/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request grief proofread shortened answering brief. \$\frac{9}{5}/5/2018} APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request gr	· ·				,		
8/30/2018 Alina Shell 1.7 FEES APPEAL: Begin review of preliminary draft answering brief in attorney's fees appeal. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorney's fees, specifically the arguments about the lack of ambiguity between the fees provision and the damages provision in Nevada Revised 9/4/2018 Jessica Brown 1.4 Statutes section 239. \$ 200.00 \$ 280.0 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Email with Mr. Kane re Coroner's current practices re autopsies. \$ 450.00 \$ 90.0 APPEAL: Revise and shorten Answering Brief; Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfeild re filling same. Approve filling. \$ 450.00 \$ 1,395.0 APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, update Tables of Authorities, Table of Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown 9/10/2018 Jessica Brown 3.2 NPRA. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that 1.9 supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. \$ 200.00 \$ 380.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's \$ 200.00 \$ 760.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's \$ 200.00 \$ 760.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's Opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in				Coroner's opening brief, responding with the arguments we made in the lower court, and			
FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorney's fees, specifically the arguments about the lack of ambiguity between the fees provision and the damages provision in Nevada Revised 9/4/2018 Jessica Brown 1.4 Statutes section 239. 9/5/2018 Alina Shell 2.5 APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Email with Mr. Kane re Coroner's current practices re autopsies. APPEAL: Revise and shorten Answering Brief; Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfeild re filing 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 3.1 same. Approve filing. APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, update Tables of Authorities, Table of Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown 3.2 NPRA. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that 1.9 supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown 3.8 fees. FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in School S	8/29/2018	Jessica Brown	7.1	adding case law that is responsive to the Coroner on appeal.	\$ 200.00	\$	1,420.00
FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorney's fees, specifically the arguments about the lack of ambiguity between the fees provision and the damages provision in Nevada Revised 9/4/2018 Jessica Brown 1.4 Statutes section 239. 9/5/2018 Alina Shell 2.5 APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Email with Mr. Kane re Coroner's current practices re autopsies. APPEAL: Revise and shorten Answering Brief; Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfeild re filing 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 3.1 same. Approve filing. APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, update Tables of Authorities, Table of Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown 3.2 NPRA. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that 1.9 supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown 3.8 fees. FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in School S							
lack of ambiguity between the fees provision and the damages provision in Nevada Revised \$200.00 \$28	8/30/2018	Alina Shell	1.7		\$ 350.00	\$	595.00
9/4/2018 Jessica Brown 1.4 Statutes section 239. 9/5/2018 Alina Shell 2.5 APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie APPEAL: Revise and shorten Answering Brief; Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfeild re filing 3.1 same. Approve filing. APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, update Tables of Authorities, Table of Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown 3.2 NPRA. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that 1.9 supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown 3.8 fees. \$ 200.00 \$ 760.0 \$ 760.0 \$ 760.0 \$ 1,360.0							
9/5/2018 Alina Shell 2.5 APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief. 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Email with Mr. Kane re Coroner's current practices re autopsies. 4PEAL: Revise and shorten Answering Brief; Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfeild re filing 3.1 same. Approve filing. 4PPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, update Tables of Authorities, Table of Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown 3.2 NPRA. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that 1.9 supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. \$ 200.00 \$ 380.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown 3.8 fees. FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute. \$ 200.00 \$ 1,360.0	0/4/2040				4 200 00	,	200.00
9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 3.1 same. Approve filing. APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief; Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfeild re filing 3.1 same. Approve filing. APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, update Tables of Authorities, Table of Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown 1.9 supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. \$ 200.00 \$ 380.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown 3.8 fees. \$ 200.00 \$ 760.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute.	9/4/2018	Jessica Brown	1.4	Statutes section 239.	\$ 200.00	Ş	280.00
9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 3.1 same. Approve filing. APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief; Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfeild re filing 3.1 same. Approve filing. APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, update Tables of Authorities, Table of Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown 1.9 supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. \$ 200.00 \$ 380.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown 3.8 fees. \$ 200.00 \$ 760.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute.	0/5/2018	Alina Shell	2.5	APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofreed shortened answering brief	\$ 350.00	خ	875 NO
APPEAL: Revise and shorten Answering Brief; Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfeild re filing 9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 3.1 same. Approve filing. APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, update Tables of Authorities, Table of Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown 3.2 NPRA. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that 9/10/2018 Jessica Brown 1.9 supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. \$ 200.00 \$ 380.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown 3.8 fees. FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute. \$ 200.00 \$ 1,360.0							
9/5/2018 Margaret McLetchie 3.1 same. Approve filing. APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, update Tables of Authorities, Table of Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown SEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute. \$ 200.00 \$ 1,360.0	3/3/2010	War gar et Wieleteine	0.2		ŷ 430.00	7	30.00
APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, update Tables of Authorities, Table of Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. \$ 150.00 \$ 180.00 FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown 3.2 NPRA. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown 3.8 fees. \$ 200.00 \$ 760.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute. \$ 200.00 \$ 1,360.0	9/5/2018	Margaret McLetchie	3.1		\$ 450.00	\$	1,395.00
Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re 9/5/2018 Pharan Burchfield 1.2 same. FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute. \$ 200.00 \$ 1,360.0	. ,	<u> </u>				Ė	
FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 3.2 NPRA. \$ 200.00 \$ 640.0 \$ 640.0 \$ 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown \$ 1.9 Supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. \$ 200.00 \$ 380.0 \$ FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's \$ 200.00 \$ 760.0 \$ FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in \$ 200.00 \$ 1,360.0 \$ 1,360							
respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. \$ 200.00 \$ 380.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute.	9/5/2018	Pharan Burchfield	1.2		\$ 150.00	\$	180.00
review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 9/8/2018 Jessica Brown FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. \$ 200.00 \$ 380.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute.							
9/8/2018 Jessica Brown 3.2 NPRA. FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. \$ 200.00 \$ 380.00 \$ FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 9/11/2018 Jessica Brown 5 200.00 \$ 760.00							
FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that 1.9 supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. \$ 200.00 \$ 380.00 FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 3.8 fees. \$ 200.00 \$ 760.00 FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute. \$ 200.00 \$ 1,360.00						١.	
9/10/2018 Jessica Brown 1.9 supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. \$ 200.00 \$ 380.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 380.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 380.00 \$ 50	9/8/2018	Jessica Brown	3.2	NPRA.	\$ 200.00	\$	640.00
9/10/2018 Jessica Brown 1.9 supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims. \$ 200.00 \$ 380.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 380.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 380.00 \$ 50				EFEC ADDEAL, Device annuallate brief for attarget of for Addressing and Levin No.			
FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 3.8 fees. \$ 200.00 \$ 760.0 FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute. \$ 200.00 \$ 1,360.0	0/10/2010	Jessica Brown	1 0	, ,	\$ 200.00	۲	300 00
dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's 3.8 fees. \$ 200.00 \$ 760.00 FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute. \$ 200.00 \$ 1,360.00	3/10/2018	JESSICA DI UWII	1.9		200.00 ډ	Ş	360.00
9/11/2018 Jessica Brown 3.8 fees. FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 3.8 fees. FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in \$ 200.00 \$ 1,360.							
FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in \$200.00 \$1,360.00	9/11/2018	Jessica Brown	3.8		\$ 200.00	Ś	760.00
Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 9/15/2018 Jessica Brown 6.8 the same statute. \$ 200.00 \$ 1,360.0	, ,					Ĺ	
9/17/2018 Alina Shell 0.4 FFFS APPFAL: Edit 2nd Motion for Extension of time to file Answering Brief \$ 250.00 \$ 140.0	9/15/2018	Jessica Brown				\$	1,360.00
5/17/2010 planta Shell 0.4pr 2007 1 the East 21th Motion for Extension of Line to the Answering Diff. 3 300.00 3 140.0	9/17/2018	Alina Shell	0.4	FEES APPEAL: Edit 2nd Motion for Extension of time to file Answering Brief.	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00

	T					
			APPEAL: Review LVMPD Motion to Strike Respondent's Appendix and conduct legal research			
			re same. Review appendix materials at issue and our Answering Brief to see how we used the			
9/17/2018	Alina Shell	0.5	materials, and draft memo to Ms. McLetchie outlining potential response.	\$ 350.00	Ś	175.00
	Margaret McLetchie		FEES APPEAL: Attention to Unopposed Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00		180.00
3/17/2010	IVIAI BAI CE IVICECTORIC	0.4	FEES APPEAL: Draft, incorporate Ms. McLetchie's edits, file, and serve Unopposed Motion for	Ş 430.00	7	100.00
0/17/2019	Pharan Burchfield	0.6	Extension of Time to File Answering Brief (Second Request).	\$ 150.00	خ	90.00
3/17/2018	r naran barciniela	0.0	Extension of time to the Answering Brief (Second Request).	7 130.00	۲	30.00
0/10/2019	Alina Shall	2.0	ADDEAL: Draft Opposition to Motion to Strike Appendix and Motion to Stay Printing	\$ 350.00	خ	1 050 00
9/19/2018	Allila Sileli	3.0	APPEAL: Draft Opposition to Motion to Strike Appendix and Motion to Stay Briefing. APPEAL: Edit Opposition / Response to Motion to Strike consistent with directions from Ms.	\$ 350.00	Ş	1,050.00
0/24/2010	Alia - Ch - II	0.4		ć 250.00	,	1.40.00
9/21/2018	Alina Snell	0.4	McLetchie.	\$ 350.00	>	140.00
- 1 1			APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Opposition to Motion to Strike Respondent's Appendix and			
9/21/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	Motion to Stay Briefing.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
			APPEAL: Review Opposition to Reporter's Committee for Freedom Motion for Leave to file			
9/25/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	Amicus Brief. Edit Opposition to Motion to Strike.	\$ 450.00	\$	225.00
			FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order granting extension; update attorneys and			
9/27/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	calendar appropriately.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			FEES APPEAL: Read through Coroner's Opening Brief, begin drafting editing and revising, cite			
10/2/2018	Leo Wolpert	5.5	checking and proofreading and reorganizing Answering Brief.	\$ 200.00	\$	1,100.00
	Pharan Burchfield		APPEAL: Draft, file, and serve Notice of Change of Firm Name.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
	Pharan Burchfield		FEES APPEAL: Draft, file, and serve Notice of Change of Firm Name.	\$ 150.00	•	15.00
.,,		5.1	FEES APPEAL: Review draft of Answering Brief and identify areas that need	,	т.	
10/16/2018	Alina Shell	0.5	expansion/refinement; discuss same with Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
	Pharan Burchfield	0.3		\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
10/10/2018	riiai aii Bui ciiileiu	0.1	FEES APPEAL: Draft argument for Answering Brief regarding Coroner's waiver of claim that	\$ 130.00	Ą	13.00
			Review-Journal failed to submit a memorandum of costs and response to Coroner's			
			argument regarding the award of \$165 in fees for support staff. Edit and refine statement of	١.	١.	
10/17/2018	Alina Shell	2.6	facts; edit statement of case.	\$ 350.00	\$	910.00
			FEES APPEAL: Resume work on Answering Brief: edit standards of review; draft section			
			regarding legislative history; edit and expand section responding to argument that attorneys			
10/18/2018	Alina Shell	7.3	fees are "damages".	\$ 350.00	\$	2,555.00
			FEES APPEAL: Check legal and statutory citations on current draft of brief and correct as			
10/18/2018	Alina Shell	1.6	necessary.	\$ 350.00	\$	560.00
			FEES APPEAL: Research for Review-Journal Answering Brief regarding statutory			
			interpretation of provisions that appear in sequential Order ("back to back"): email memo to			
10/18/2018	Jessica Brown	0.8	Ms. Shell re same.	\$ 200.00	\$	160.00
20, 20, 2020	5055104 5101111	0.0	FEES APPEAL: Research briefing in Blackjack Bonding to see which policy arguments of Las	ψ 200.00	7	200.00
			Vegas Metropolitan Police Department were rejected by the Nevada Supreme Court, email			
10/10/2010	Leo Wolpert	0.7	to Ms. Shell and Ms. McLetchie re same.	\$ 200.00	خ	140.00
10/16/2016	Leo wolpert	0.7	to ivis. Stiell and ivis. ivicletchile re same.	\$ 200.00	Ą	140.00
			EFFC ADDEAL. Decouply access remarking demonstrate their attention of feet and excite in the			
			FEES APPEAL: Research cases regarding damages other than attorney's fees and costs in the			
40/40/2040		2.4	context of good faith (non) production of public records, draft and edit section of brief	4 200 00		620.00
10/18/2018	Leo Wolpert	3.1	opposing argument regarding damages a requester can suffer.	\$ 200.00	\$	620.00
			FEES APPEAL: Edit, research, further draft section of Answering Brief regarding out-of-state	1 .		
10/18/2018	Leo Wolpert	0.9	precedents cited by Coroner in Opening Brief.	\$ 200.00	\$	180.00
				1		
			FEES APPEAL: Revise sections of legal argument responding to Coroner's arguments;	1		
			Research cases cited by Coroner from other jurisdictions and determine how to distinguish;	1		
			develop arguments regarding why we are entitled to fees regardless of outcome of matter	1		
10/18/2018	Margaret McLetchie	7.9	direct work on revising and editings other sections by team.	\$ 450.00	\$	3,555.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Filed Order Granting Motion to File Amicus Brief, To	1		
			Associate Counsel, and Denying Motion to Strike Appendix and the Amici Curiae Brief of The	1		
10/18/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Reporters Committee for Freedom of the Press and 11 Media Organizations.	\$ 150.00	Ś	15.00
10/10/2010	r naran barennela	0.1	incorrects committee for freedom of the fress and 11 media organizations.	7 130.00	7	13.00
			EFFC ADDEAL. Fire and arguments in Anguing Drief regarding the Carenaria consequence			
			FEES APPEAL: Expand arguments in Answering Brief regarding the Coroner's unpreserved			
			arguments re memorandum of costs and administrative staff time; address Coroner's	1		
			arguments regarding the "American Rule;" review opening brief and draft answering brief in	1		
			tandem to make sure each argument addressed; address argument regarding LCB	1		
			recommendations to amend NPRA. Check record and brief citations, proofread in tandem	ĺ.	١.	
10/19/2018	Alina Shell	8.0	with Mr. Wolpert, and review final version of brief.	\$ 350.00	\$	2,800.00
				1		· <u> </u>
			FEES APPEAL: Draft, proofread and edit Answering Brief, particular attention to editing	1		
			subsections C-H in legal argument section; go through Opening Brief Table of Authorities to	1		
10/19/2018	Leo Wolpert	5.5	ensure that we addressed all the Coroner's relevant cases and statutes.	\$ 200.00	\$	1,100.00
	Leo Wolpert		FEES APPEAL: Edit and proofread hard copy of the Answering Brief.	\$ 200.00	\$	500.00
, 15, 2010			and the second s	, 200.00	~	200.00
			FEES APPEAL: Draft sections regarding entitlement to fees; Revise and continued drafting	1		
10/10/2019	Margaret McLetchie	2.2	section regarding why Coroner acted in bad faith, using cases cited by Coroner.	¢ 450.00	۲	1 025 00
10/13/2018	iviaigai et ivictettiile	2.3	pection regarding with coroner acted in bad faith, using cases cited by coroner.	\$ 450.00	ې	1,035.00

			T			
			CEEC ADDEAL languages who was a state of the control of the contro			
			FEES APPEAL: Incorporate attorney edits, prepare/format Table of Contents, Table of			
			Authorities, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service re Respondent's Answering	١.	١.	
10/19/2018	Pharan Burchfield	4.5	Brief; finalize Respondent's Answering Brief, and file/serve re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	675.00
			FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Respondent's Answering Brief; calendar			
10/22/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Appellant's Reply Brief deadline accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
10/24/2018	Alina Shell	0.9	APPEAL: Begin drafting notice of supplemental authorities re recent decision in PERS v. NPRI. APPEAL: Continued drafting notice of supplemental authorities. Edit pursuant to Ms.	\$ 350.00	\$	315.00
10/25/2018	Alina Shell	1 0	McLetchie's direction.	\$ 350.00	ڔ	665.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Revise notice of Supplemental Authorities.	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
			APPEAL: Revise notice of Supplemental Authorities in light of Clark County School District	7 100100	7	
10/29/2018	Alina Shell	0.6	("CCSD") opinion.	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
			APPEAL: Address questions from Mr. Kane regarding arguments in briefs and timeline for			
			resolution of appeal. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, review Coroner's reply brief and conduct			
			research regarding (1) whether factual allegations in the Coroner's reply brief are false; (2) whether we can file a Motion to strike arguments raised in the Coroner's reply that might be			
			false, and (3) whether we should request leave to file a surreply to address the Coroner's			
			arguments regarding the recent Supreme Court decision in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-			
12/4/2018	Alina Shell	1.1	Journal.	\$ 350.00	\$	385.00
			APPEAL: Emails with client re possible factual inaccuracies in Reply Brief and possible issues			
12/4/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	to raise in Answering Brief. Analyze same and direct Ms. Shell re work on same.	\$ 450.00	\$	180.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Appellant's Reply Brief and Appendix; email clients		١.	
	Pharan Burchfield		briefing re same.	\$ 150.00		15.00
12/13/2018	Alina Shell	0.6	APPEAL: Begin drafting Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Attention to Surreply: conduct legal research regarding whether family members	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
12/13/2018	Alina Shell	0.5	can assert personal privacy interest for deceased person.	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
12/13/2016	Allila Sileli	0.5	can assert personal privacy interest for deceased person.	\$ 330.00	۲	175.00
			APPEAL: Resume work on proposed Surreply: draft introduction, factual argument regarding			
			the veloce of subsections are only in Coloredo shill death investigation, and are uncertainty			
			the release of autopsy reports in Colorado child death investigation, and argument regarding			
12/14/2018	Alina Shell	4.4	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal.	\$ 350.00	\$	1,540.00
12/14/2018 12/21/2018		4.4 0.4	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal.	\$ 350.00 \$ 350.00	\$	1,540.00 140.00
12/21/2018		0.4	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal.			
12/21/2018	Alina Shell	0.4	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.]	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie	0.4	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00	\$	140.00 180.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018	Alina Shell	0.4	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.]	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie	0.4	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00	\$	140.00 180.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield	0.4	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00	\$	140.00 180.00 75.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie	0.4	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00	\$	140.00 180.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield	0.4 0.4 0.5	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield	0.4 0.4 0.5	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 350.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 840.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00	\$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 350.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 840.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00	\$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 450.00	\$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 450.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019 1/24/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Leo Wolpert Pharan Burchfield	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4 0.1	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00 180.00 30.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019 1/24/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Leo Wolpert	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4 0.1	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00 180.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019 1/24/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Leo Wolpert Pharan Burchfield	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4 0.1	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Revise Reply in Support of Motion to File Surreply/Provide to Mr. Lipman for input. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Surreply and Surreply; alert attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00 180.00 30.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019 1/24/2019 2/11/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Leo Wolpert Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4 0.1 0.2	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Revise Reply in Support of Motion to File Surreply/Provide to Mr. Lipman for input. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Surreply and Surreply; alert attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and circulate to Order Granting Extension Per Telephonic Request.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00 20.00 30.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019 1/24/2019 2/11/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Leo Wolpert Pharan Burchfield	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4 0.1 0.2	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Revise Reply in Support of Motion to File Surreply/Provide to Mr. Lipman for input. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Surreply and Surreply; alert attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00 180.00 30.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019 1/24/2019 2/11/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Leo Wolpert Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4 0.1 0.2	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Revise Reply in Support of Motion to File Surreply/Provide to Mr. Lipman for input. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Surreply and Surreply; alert attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and circulate to Order Granting Extension Per Telephonic Request.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00 20.00 30.00
12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019 2/11/2019 2/13/2019 3/7/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Leo Wolpert Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4 0.1 0.2 0.1	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Revise Reply in Support of Motion to File Surreply/Provide to Mr. Lipman for input. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Surreply and Surreply; alert attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and circulate to Order Granting Extension Per Telephonic Request. Appellant's Response to Respondent's Sur-Reply; update attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00 20.00 30.00 15.00
12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019 2/11/2019 2/13/2019 2/13/2019 3/7/2019 4/5/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Leo Wolpert Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4 0.1 0.2 0.1 0.1	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Revise Reply in Support of Motion to File Surreply/Provide to Mr. Lipman for input. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Surreply and Surreply; alert attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and circulate to Order Granting Extension Per Telephonic Request. Appellant's Response to Respondent's Sur-Reply; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Response to Surreply; and email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00 20.00 30.00 15.00
12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019 2/11/2019 2/13/2019 2/13/2019 3/7/2019 4/5/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Leo Wolpert Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Margaret McLetchie	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4 0.1 0.2 0.1 0.1	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Revise Reply in Support of Motion to File Surreply/Provide to Mr. Lipman for input. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Surreply and Surreply; alert attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and circulate to Order Granting Extension Per Telephonic Request. Appellant's Response to Respondent's Sur-Reply; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Response to Surreply; and email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Review filing. APPEAL: Review filing. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 450.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00 20.00 30.00 15.00 15.00 90.00
12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019 2/11/2019 2/13/2019 3/7/2019 4/5/2019 5/1/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Leo Wolpert Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4 0.1 0.2 0.1 0.1 0.1	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Final band edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Surreply and Surreply; alert attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and circulate to Order Granting Extension Per Telephonic Request. Appellant's Response to Respondent's Sur-Reply; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Response to Surreply; and email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Review filing. APPEAL: Review filing. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Regarding Oral Argument consolidating and scheduling the two appeals for oral argument; update attorneys and	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 450.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00 20.00 30.00 15.00 15.00 90.00 45.00
12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019 2/11/2019 2/13/2019 2/13/2019 3/7/2019 4/5/2019 5/1/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Leo Wolpert Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Margaret McLetchie	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4 0.1 0.2 0.1 0.1 0.1	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Revise Reply in Support of Motion to File Surreply/Provide to Mr. Lipman for input. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Surreply and Surreply; alert attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and circulate to Order Granting Extension Per Telephonic Request. Appellant's Response to Respondent's Sur-Reply; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Response to Surreply; and email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Review filing. APPEAL: Review filing. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order.	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 450.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 75.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00 20.00 30.00 15.00 15.00 90.00
12/21/2018 12/21/2018 12/24/2018 12/27/2018 1/17/2019 1/23/2019 1/23/2019 1/24/2019 2/11/2019 2/13/2019 3/7/2019 4/5/2019 5/1/2019	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Leo Wolpert Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	0.4 0.5 0.1 0.1 2.4 0.2 0.4 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal. APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply. APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.] APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and draft reply to same. APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Final band edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for Leave to File Surreply. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Surreply and Surreply; alert attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and circulate to Order Granting Extension Per Telephonic Request. Appellant's Response to Respondent's Sur-Reply; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Response to Surreply; and email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Review filing. APPEAL: Review filing. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Regarding Oral Argument consolidating and scheduling the two appeals for oral argument; update attorneys and	\$ 350.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 200.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 450.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	140.00 180.00 15.00 15.00 840.00 40.00 20.00 30.00 15.00 15.00 90.00 45.00

APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Appellant's Motion to Postpone Oral Argument Harring Date and Allow Longer Argument Time; update attorneys and calendars of 15/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.1 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, saved, and review Order Granting Motion rescheduling 5/14/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Oral Arguments; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. \$ 150.00 (5/15/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order; attention to scheduling re hearing on appeal. \$ 450.00 (5/16/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order; attention to scheduling re hearing on appeal. \$ 450.00 (5/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 review and approval. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order; attention to continue Oral Argument for Ms. McLetchie's (5/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 review and approval. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Oral Argument Setting; (5/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 update attorneys and confirm with calendar re same. \$ 150.00 (continue Oral Argument; download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and confirm with calendar re same. \$ 150.00 (continue Oral Argument; download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and paper (continue Oral Argument; download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and (continue Oral Argument; download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and (continue Oral Argument; download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and (continue Oral Argument; download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and (continue Oral Argument; download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and (continue Oral Argument) (continue Oral Argumen
5/8/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 accordingly. 5 150.01
S/14/2019 Margaret McLetchie O.1 APPEAL: Review Order re rescheduling hearing. Update to client re same. S 450.01
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, saved, and review Order Granting Motion rescheduling \$150.00
5/14/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 Oral Arguments; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. 5/15/2019 Margaret McLetchie O.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order; attention to scheduling re hearing on appeal. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Park Motion to Continue Oral Argument for Ms. McLetchie's O.3 Pereka and FEES APPEAL: Draft Motion to Continue Oral Argument for Ms. McLetchie's O.3 review and approval. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Draft Motion to Continue Oral Argument for Ms. McLetchie's O.3 review and approval. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Oral Argument Setting; O.1 update attorneys and confirm with calendar re same. \$ 150.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and O.1 calendars accordingly. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Confer with paralegal re status of unopposed Motion; direct her 5/29/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada 5/29/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada O.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. Motetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada Syloy2019 Pharan Burchfield O.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order re continuing oral argument. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada O.1 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada Syloy2019 Pharan Burchfield O.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada O.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order granting Motion to Continue Oral Argument; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. O.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update O.4 APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update O.5 APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update O.6 APPEAL: Download, s
S/15/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order; attention to scheduling re hearing on appeal. \$ 450.00
Syl16/2019 Margaret McLetchie O.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Revise Motion to continue. \$ 450.00
Syl16/2019 Margaret McLetchie O.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Revise Motion to continue. \$ 450.00
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Oral Argument Setting; 5/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Oral Argument Setting; 5/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 update attorneys and confirm with calendar re same. 5/17/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 calendars accordingly. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Respondent's Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument; download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and O.1 calendars accordingly. 5/29/2019 Margaret McLetchie O.1 to follow up with Court. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Confer with paralegal re status of unopposed Motion; direct her O.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada O.1 Supreme Court re status of outstanding Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument. 5/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie O.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order re continuing oral argument. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 Oral Argument; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. 7/1/2019 Margaret McLetchie APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Motion to Continue O.1 Email with Mr. Lipman re case status. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Motion to Continue O.1 attorneys re same. 8/26/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice S
Syl16/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.3 review and approval. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Oral Argument Setting; Syl16/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 update attorneys and confirm with calendar re same. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Respondent's Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument; download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and Syl17/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 Calendars accordingly. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Confer with paralegal re status of unopposed Motion; direct her Syl29/2019 Margaret McLetchie O.1 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada Supreme Court re status of outstanding Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument. Syl30/2019 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Pownload, save, and review Order or anting oral argument. Syl30/2019 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Motion to Continue O.1 Oral Argument; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Syl50.00 APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order or Granting Motion to Continue O.1 Oral Argument; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Syl50.00 APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order or Granting Motion to Continue O.1 Oral Argument; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Syl50.00 APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update O.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. Syl50.00 APPEAL: Download, save, and review Indicated Notice Scheduling Oral O.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. Syl50.00 O.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. Syl50.00 O.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. Syl50.00 O.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. Syl50.00 O.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. Syl50.00 O.3 APPEAL:
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Oral Argument Setting; 5/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 update attorneys and confirm with calendar re same. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Respondent's Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument, download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and 5/17/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 calendars accordingly. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Confer with paralegal re status of unopposed Motion; direct her to follow up with Court. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada 5/29/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 Supreme Court re status of outstanding Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument. \$ 150.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada O.1 Supreme Court re status of outstanding Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Beview Order re continuing oral argument. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Motion to Continue 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 Dral Argument; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. 7/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral 8/26/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Brie
Sylaplace Syla
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Respondent's Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument; download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and calendars accordingly. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Confer with paralegal re status of unopposed Motion; direct her to follow up with Court. \$ 450.00 calendars accordingly. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada 5/29/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Supreme Court re status of outstanding Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument. \$ 450.00 calendars accordingly. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada 5/29/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Supreme Court re status of outstanding Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument. \$ 450.00 calendars accordingly. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order re continuing oral argument. \$ 450.00 calendars accordingly. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Motion to Continue 9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Email with Mr. Lipman re case status. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update 1/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Email with Mr. Lipman re case status. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Indicated and Spoke with Clerk at Nevada APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update 1/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). 4. 450.00 4. 450.00
Continue Oral Argument; download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and calendars accordingly. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Confer with paralegal re status of unopposed Motion; direct her 5/29/2019 Margaret McLetchie Description of Fees Appeal of the fee
5/17/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 calendars accordingly. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Confer with paralegal re status of unopposed Motion; direct her 5/29/2019 Margaret McLetchie O.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Appelal: Review Institute of Papearance O.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Notice of Appearance O.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 150.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Institute of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update O.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Institute of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update O.5 APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update O.6 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Institute of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. S 150.00 APPEAL: Appeal: Download, save, and review Institute of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. S 150.00 APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of Appearance at Oral Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 450.00
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Confer with paralegal re status of unopposed Motion; direct her to follow up with Court. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada 5/29/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 Supreme Court re status of outstanding Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument. \$ 150.00 \$ 4PPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order re continuing oral argument. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Motion to Continue 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 Oral Argument; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. 7/1/2019 Margaret McLetchie O.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Drawnload, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Drawnload, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Drawnload, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 450.00
5/29/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.1 to follow up with Court. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada 5/29/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Supreme Court re status of outstanding Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument. \$ 150.00 5/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order re continuing oral argument. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Motion to Continue 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Oral Argument; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. \$ 150.00 APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update 7/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 attorneys re same. \$ 150.00 8/26/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL: and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral 8/26/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. \$ 150.00 9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. \$ 150.00 9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.3 APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 9/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada 5/29/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Supreme Court re status of outstanding Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument. 5/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order re continuing oral argument. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Oral Argument; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Email with Mr. Lipman re case status. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Email with Mr. Lipman re case status. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 attorneys re same. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral 8/26/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance at Oral Argument. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Frint and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Frint and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Frint in to notice of appearance. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Frint in the propa
Supreme Court re status of outstanding Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument. \$ 150.00
5/29/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Supreme Court re status of outstanding Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument. 5/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order re continuing oral argument. 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 7/1/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.1 Email with Mr. Lipman re case status. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Motion to Continue 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Email with Mr. Lipman re case status. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update 3/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 attorneys re same. 5/26/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral 8/26/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. 9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. 9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument.
S/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie O.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order re continuing oral argument. \$ 450.00
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Motion to Continue 5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Oral Argument; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. 5/10/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.1 Email with Mr. Lipman re case status. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update 0.1 attorneys re same. \$ 150.00 8/26/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral 8/26/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. 9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. 9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.3 APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. 9/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 50.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00
5/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 7/1/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.1 Email with Mr. Lipman re case status. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update 0.1 APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update 0.1 attorneys re same. 8/26/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral 0.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. 9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. 9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.3 APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00
7/1/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.1 Email with Mr. Lipman re case status. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update 7/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 attorneys re same. \$ 150.00 8/26/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral 0.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. 9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. 9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.3 APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 450.00 \$
APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update 7/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral 8/26/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. 9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. 9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 5
7/16/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 attorneys re same. \$ 150.00 8/26/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral 0.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. 9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. 9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00 \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument.
8/26/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral 0.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. 9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. 9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.3 APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). 9/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument.
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral 8/26/2019 Pharan Burchfield 9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. 9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 450.00 APPEAL: Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. \$ 150.00 APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). 9/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00 \$ 45
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral 8/26/2019 Pharan Burchfield 9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. 9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 450.00 APPEAL: Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. \$ 450.00 APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). 9/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00 \$ 45
8/26/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.2 Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly. 9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.1 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. \$ 150.00 9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie O.3 APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 450.00 APPEAL: Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. \$ 450.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 450.00 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.3 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00 \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield O.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00 \$ 4
9/20/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review. \$ 150.00 9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.3 APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 9/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00
9/23/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.3 APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 9/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 9/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00
9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 9/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument.
9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 9/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument.
9/30/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance. \$ 450.00 9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00
9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.3 APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00
9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument. \$ 150.00
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Oral Argument Reminder Notices;
9/30/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 update attorneys and confirm calendar re same. \$ 150.00
10/2/2019 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of supplemental authority. \$ 450.00
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Voluntary Disclosure from Justice
10/2/2019 Pharan Burchfield 0.1 Abbi Silver; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. \$ 150.00
FEES APPEAL: Draft and distribute response to the Coroner's September 23, 2019 Notice of
10/3/2019 Alina Shell 1.4 Supplemental Authorities regarding the 2019 legislative session. \$ 350.00
zyjoyaez immassa zyjoyaez immassa zyjoyaez zyjoya
FEES APPEAL: Expand response to Coroner's Notice of Supplemental Authorities pursuant to
comments and direction from Ms. McLetchie: add in facts from 1993 legislative session
10/3/2019 Alina Shell 1.8 regarding NRS 239.011 and facts from the 2019 session regarding amendments to the NPRA. \$ 350.00
2-1, 2, 2-2-2 250
FEES APPEAL: Shell draft Response to Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authorities for
TABLE AND SELECTION OF THE PROPERTY OF THE PROPERTY OF THE AND SELVE SAME SHELSHOLDER OF SHIRP (SHIRP (SHIR
10/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 8.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation. \$ 450.00
10/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 8.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with oral argument prep by creating outline
10/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 8.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation. \$ 450.00
10/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 8.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with oral argument prep by creating outline 10/5/2019 Alina Shell 2.4 regarding substantive claims on appeal. \$ 350.00
10/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 8.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with oral argument prep by creating outline regarding substantive claims on appeal. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation
10/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 8.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with oral argument prep by creating outline regarding substantive claims on appeal. \$ 350.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation by reviewing Coroner's Reply Brief and including responses to arguments in outline. \$ 350.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation by reviewing Coroner's Reply Brief and including responses to arguments in outline. \$ 350.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation by reviewing Coroner's Reply Brief and including responses to arguments in outline. \$ 350.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation by reviewing Coroner's Reply Brief and including responses to arguments in outline.
10/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 8.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation. \$ 450.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with oral argument prep by creating outline regarding substantive claims on appeal. \$ 350.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation by reviewing Coroner's Reply Brief and including responses to arguments in outline. \$ 350.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Provide additional assistance to Ms. McLetchie in preparing for
10/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 8.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with oral argument prep by creating outline 10/5/2019 Alina Shell APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation by reviewing Coroner's Reply Brief and including responses to arguments in outline. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Provide additional assistance to Ms. McLetchie in preparing for oral argument: find record citations for possible reference at argument, expand outline at
10/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 8.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with oral argument prep by creating outline 10/5/2019 Alina Shell APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation by reviewing Coroner's Reply Brief and including responses to arguments in outline. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Provide additional assistance to Ms. McLetchie in preparing for oral argument: find record citations for possible reference at argument, expand outline at 10/6/2019 Alina Shell 2.2 Ms. McLetchie's request, and moot Ms. McLetchie. \$ 350.00
10/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 8.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with oral argument prep by creating outline 10/5/2019 Alina Shell APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation by reviewing Coroner's Reply Brief and including responses to arguments in outline. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Provide additional assistance to Ms. McLetchie in preparing for oral argument: find record citations for possible reference at argument, expand outline at 10/6/2019 Alina Shell 2.2 Ms. McLetchie's request, and moot Ms. McLetchie. \$ 350.00 FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in preparation for oral argument, specifically with out-of-
10/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 8.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with oral argument prep by creating outline 10/5/2019 Alina Shell APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation 10/6/2019 Alina Shell APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Provide additional assistance to Ms. McLetchie in preparing for oral argument: find record citations for possible reference at argument, expand outline at 10/6/2019 Alina Shell 2.2 Ms. McLetchie's request, and moot Ms. McLetchie. \$ 350.00 FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in preparation for oral argument, specifically with out-of-state cases. \$ 200.00
10/4/2019 Margaret McLetchie 8.4 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with oral argument prep by creating outline 10/5/2019 Alina Shell APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation 10/6/2019 Alina Shell 1.0 by reviewing Coroner's Reply Brief and including responses to arguments in outline. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Provide additional assistance to Ms. McLetchie in preparing for oral argument: find record citations for possible reference at argument, expand outline at 10/6/2019 Alina Shell 2.2 Ms. McLetchie's request, and moot Ms. McLetchie. \$ 350.00 FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in preparation for oral argument, specifically with out-of-

	T	1 1		1		
10/7/2010	Dhavan Durahfiald		APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist in Ms. McLetchie's preparation re upcoming oral	ć 1F0 00	ے ا	CO 00
	Pharan Burchfield		arguments.	\$ 150.00 \$ 500.00	\$	60.00
1/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Review filing. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Appearance re Mr. Anderson; and update	\$ 500.00	Ş	50.00
1/22/2020	Pharan Burchfield		attorneys re same.	¢ 175.00	خ	17.50
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Update to client re decision being issued 2/27.	\$ 175.00 \$ 500.00		50.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Update to client re decision being issued 2/27. APPEAL: Update to client re pending decision.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
2/20/2020	ivialgaret ivictetcille	0.2	AFFEAL. Opuate to client re pending decision.	\$ 300.00	ې	100.00
			APPEAL: Review/analyze opinion. Emails to clients re same. Consider possible next steps.			
2/27/2020	Margaret McLetchie	2.0	Email re who is lead counsel for Coroner. Confer with Mr. Lipman re case.	\$ 500.00	¢	1 000 00
2/2//2020	ivial garet ivictetcine	2.0	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opinion (Affirmed in Part Reversed in Part and	\$ 300.00	ڔ	1,000.00
2/27/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Remanded); and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	ς	17.50
	Lacey Ambro		Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys.	\$ 50.00		5.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Review Remitittur.	\$ 500.00		50.00
3/2//2020	ivial garet iviezeteine		Review unsigned Remittitur received from Nevada Supreme Court; and update attorneys re	7 300.00	7	30.00
3/27/2020	Pharan Burchfield		same.	\$ 175.00	¢	17.50
3/2//2020	riididii burciiilelu	0.1	Download, save, and review Minute Order re briefing schedule and discovery plan; update	\$ 175.00	ڔ	17.50
4/15/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	¢	17.50
4/13/2020	riididii burciiilelu		Download, save, and review Notice of Appearance and Change of Counsel; update attorneys	\$ 175.00	۲	17.50
4/17/2020	Pharan Burchfield	1	and file accordingly.	\$ 175.00	خ	17.50
4/17/2020	Filaran Burchilelu	0.1	and the accordingly.	\$ 175.00	ې	17.30
4/27/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Pemittitur; and undate atternovs to same	¢ 175.00	خ	17 50
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Remittitur; and update attorneys re same. Draft letter to opposing counsel re scheduling matters.	\$ 175.00 \$ 500.00		17.50 150.00
<u> </u>				\$ 500.00	_	
4/30/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	Plan strategy in case. Email to Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 500.00	\$	250.00
4/20/2020	Dhavan Durahfiald	0.2	Dueft a mass and senfor latter to conscion sourced for Ma. Malatchiele various and conveyed	ć 17F 00	ے ا	25.00
	Pharan Burchfield		Draft a meet and confer letter to opposing counsel for Ms. McLetchie's review and approval.	\$ 175.00		35.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Prepare for and attend call with Mr. Lipman. Draft letter to opposing counsel.	\$ 500.00	\$	350.00
5/5/2020	Margaret McLetchie		Begin compiling arguments/ examples.	\$ 500.00	\$	550.00
E /E /2020	0 10 11		Finalize and send (e-serve) Ms. McLetchie's letter to opposing counsel re scheduling and	4 475 00	,	47.50
5/5/2020	Pharan Burchfield		discovery.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
F /C /2020	Alice Chell		Per Ms. McLetchie's request, work on chart regarding evidence demonstrating public	ć 27F 00	٠	750.00
	Alina Shell		interest in access to autopsy reports.	\$ 375.00		750.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Review emails received from Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00		200.00
5/7/2020	Alina Shell		Resume work on chart regarding interest in access to autopsy reports.	\$ 375.00	\$	637.50
F /7 /2020	Alias Chall		Make additional edits to chart regarding interest in access based on comments and	ć 27F 00	٠	200.00
	Alina Shell		information provided by Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 375.00	\$	300.00
5/7/2020	Margaret McLetchie	3.0	Review examples. Work with Ms. Shell on chart compiling examples.	\$ 500.00	Ş	1,500.00
F /0 /2020	Margarat Malatahia	2.2	Dropage for and attend call with Mr. Linnan, Eurther amaile to example, next stone	¢ 500.00	۲	1 100 00
3/8/2020	Margaret McLetchie		Prepare for and attend call with Mr. Lipman. Further emails re examples, next steps. Email follow-up to opposing counsel to schedule a meet and confer re discovery and	\$ 500.00	Ş	1,100.00
F /0 /2020	Dhavan Durahfiald			ć 17F 00	۲	17.50
	Pharan Burchfield		scheduling in case. Work on review of prior briefs, compiling examples.	\$ 175.00 \$ 500.00		17.50
	Margaret McLetchie		Call with Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00		2,000.00 250.00
3/14/2020	Margaret McLetchie		Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar	\$ 300.00	ې	230.00
E /10 /2020	Lacey Ambro		accordingly.	\$ 150.00	ب	15.00
5/18/2020	Lacey Ambro	0.1	accordingly.	\$ 150.00	Ş	15.00
E /10 /2020	Dharan Burchfiold	0.3	Draft Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval.	¢ 17E 00	ب	E2 E0
	Pharan Burchfield Margaret McLetchie		Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule.	\$ 175.00 \$ 500.00		52.50 100.00
J/ 20/ 2020	iviai gai et ivictettiile		Finalize Stipulation and Order Regarding Briefing Schedule (incorporate Ms. Nichols' edits)	00.000 ډ	ڔ	100.00
5/27/2020	Pharan Burchfield		and submit/email to Department 24.	\$ 175.00	۲	35.00
			Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same.	\$ 500.00	\$	150.00
	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie			\$ 500.00		
6/2/2020	iviargaret ivictettille	0.1	Review Order / briefing schedule.	\$ 500.00	Ş	50.00
			Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order Regarding Briefing Schedule. Draft, file,			
c /2 /2020	Dhavan Durahfiald	0.2	and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order Regarding Briefing Schedule. Update	ć 17F 00	۲	25.00
	Pharan Burchfield		attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	\$	35.00
7/9/2020	Pharan Burchfield		Per Ms. McLetchie, email client re upcoming hearing date.	\$ 175.00	Ş	17.50
7/15/2020	Pharan Purchfiald		Draft Stipulation and Order Extending the Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and	¢ 17E 00	ے	70.00
	Pharan Burchfield Margaret McLetchie		approval. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule.	\$ 175.00 \$ 500.00		70.00 100.00
//1//2020	Margaret McLetchie			00.000 ډ	Ş	100.00
			Finalize draft Stipulation and Order Extending the Briefing Schedule; email communications			
7/17/2022	Dhagan Dought 11		with Ms. Nichols re same. Submit/email Stipulation and Order to Court/Department 24 re	¢ 475.00	,	F2 F6
//1//2020	Pharan Burchfield		same.	\$ 175.00	\$	52.50
			Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order Extending Briefing Schedule; draft, file,			
7/00/5	6		and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order Extending Briefing Schedule; update	A	_	
//20/2020	Pharan Burchfield		attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	\$	35.00
			Attention to post-remand opening brief: complete statement of facts/procedural history,			
0/0/5	A1: C1 "		draft section re NPRA standards, section re CCSD case, and section re interest in access to	A	_	4 6
৪/9/2020	Alina Shell	4.3	juvenile autopsy reports.	\$ 375.00	\$	1,612.50

i i	1			1	1	
			Expand draft of opening brief consistent with direction from Ms. McLetchie: expand section			
			regarding CCSD test, conduct legal research and draft section regarding limited application of			
0/40/2020	Alias Chall	- 0	CCSD/Cameranesi test, restructure argument regarding public interest in access to autopsy	ć 27F 00	٠	2.475.00
8/10/2020	Alina Shell	5.8	reports.	\$ 375.00	\$	2,175.00
8/10/2020	Margaret McLetchie	2 0	Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same.	\$ 500.00	\$	1,000.00
0/10/2020	ivial garet ivictetcine	2.0	neview initial draft of coroner brief prepared by MS. Shell and propose restructuring resame.	7 300.00	۲	1,000.00
			Continued attention to opening brief: draft facts regarding the sample redacted autopsy			
8/12/2020	Alina Shell	2.2	reports provided by the Coroner pre-litigation and expand argument re those redactions.	\$ 375.00	Ś	825.00
	Leo Wolpert		Review, edit, proofread first draft of opening brief of petition on remand.	\$ 250.00	\$	200.00
			Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/	,		
			reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to			
8/13/2020	Margaret McLetchie	3.8	use declaration.	\$ 500.00	\$	1,900.00
			Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what			
			is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should			
8/14/2020	Margaret McLetchie	6.8	be provided. Email to client re status of draft.	\$ 500.00	\$	3,400.00
			Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public			
			disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and			
8/15/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.2	send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread.	\$ 500.00	\$	2,100.00
					١.	
	Leo Wolpert		Review Ms. McLetchie's rewrite of opening brief on remand and make edits thereto.	\$ 250.00		200.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Finish initial draft of Opening Brief to send to Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00		900.00
8/21/2020			Address Mr. Lipman's edit's to draft of opening brief on remand.	\$ 375.00	_	525.00
8/23/2020			Resume editing opening brief on remand.	\$ 375.00	\$	1,050.00
8/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Confer with Ms. Shell re expanding opening brief.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
			Address NAs NAs stabilists from the angular builds and in facts about the 1 October			
			Address Ms. McLetchie's further edits to opening brief: add in facts about the 1 October coroner case, add in additional facts relevant to requests in this matter, add in case law			
8/24/2020	Alina Shall	20	regarding other courts' approach to balancing tests for FOIA Exemption 6.	\$ 375.00	خ	1,425.00
6/24/2020	Allila Sileli	5.0	Revise second version to send to Mr. Lipman - send back to Ms. Shell to identify citations etc.	\$ 373.00	Ş	1,425.00
8/24/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	and address various comments. Confer with Ms. Shell re same.	\$ 500.00	¢	500.00
0/24/2020	ivial garet ivictetcine	1.0	Address Mr. Lipman's and Ms. McLetchie's edits, comments, and directions regarding post-	\$ 300.00	ڔ	300.00
8/26/2020	Alina Shell	2.4	remand opening brief.	\$ 375.00	Ś	900.00
0,20,2020	7 time orien		Opening Brief on remand: Attention to addressing edits from Mr. Lipman and proofreading.	ψ 075.00	~	300.00
			Revise intro and review further edits from Ms. Shell; emails and call with Mr. Lipman re brief;			
8/26/2020	Margaret McLetchie	2.3	send latest draft to Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00	Ś	1,150.00
			Incorporate additional edits from Ms. McLetchie and Mr. Lipman into pre-final draft of	,	Ė	,
8/27/2020	Alina Shell	6.1	opening brief on remand; finalize and file same.	\$ 375.00	\$	2,287.50
8/27/2020	Alina Shell	0.6	Proof and edit tables of opening brief and approve for filing.	\$ 375.00	\$	225.00
			Review further edits from Mr. Lipman and confer with Ms. Shell re same/ finalizing. Consider			
			equal protection issue. Confer with Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfield re finalizing brief. Review/			
8/27/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.8	edit prefinal version.	\$ 500.00	\$	900.00
			Draft Motion for Leave re excess pages for attorneys' review and approval. Prepare Table of			
			Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Petitioner's Opening Brief on			
	Pharan Burchfield		Remand; prepare/finalize for filing; file and serve re same.	\$ 175.00		227.50
	Margaret McLetchie		Attention to request from Ms. Nichols re extension.	\$ 500.00		50.00
9/25/2020	Alina Shell	0.1	Review and approve stipulation re briefing schedule.	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
			Described and advantage (4) City Live 10 Live 5 in 15 in 25 in 15			
0/20/2022	Dhavan Darish fill	~ -	Download, save, and review (1) Stipulation and Order to Extend Briefing Schedule; and (2)	ć 47F 00	_	47.50
	Pharan Burchfield		Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order; update attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00		17.50
10/ // 2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.9	Preliminary review and analysis of Coroner's brief. Download, save, and review Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical	\$ 500.00	\$	450.00
			Examiner's Answering Brief; update attorneys and confirm calendar accordingly. Email Mr.			
10/7/2020	Dharan Burchfiold	0.1	Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	۲	17 50
10/7/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Review answer filed by Coroner to supplemental opening brief and begin drafting reply, with	\$ 175.00	Ş	17.50
10/15/2020	Alina Shell	4.4	focus on analyzing cases cited by Coroner regarding redaction	\$ 375.00	\$	1,650.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Confer with Ms. Shell re extraordinary use argument.	\$ 500.00	\$	250.00
10/15/2020			Resume work on reply in support of post-remand brief.	\$ 375.00		487.50
	Margaret McLetchie		Update email to client.	\$ 500.00		50.00
-, -, -, -020	. 5. 3	3.1		, ,,,,,,,,	Ť	
,	Alina Shell	6.2	Additional attention to draft of reply in support of supplemental opening brief on remand.	\$ 375.00	Ś	2,325.00
10/18/2020			Complete draft of reply in support of supplemental brief on remand.	\$ 375.00		487.50
10/18/2020 10/19/2020	Alina Shell				_	
10/19/2020	Margaret McLetchie		Revise and send client draft of reply.	\$ 500.00	Ş	650.00
10/19/2020			Revise and send client draft of reply.	\$ 500.00	Ş	650.00
10/19/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.3	Revise and send client draft of reply. Address Mr. Lipman's edits to reply in support of supplemental opening brief on remand.	\$ 500.00		562.50
10/19/2020 10/19/2020 10/20/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.3				
10/19/2020 10/19/2020 10/20/2020	Margaret McLetchie Alina Shell	1.3	Address Mr. Lipman's edits to reply in support of supplemental opening brief on remand.	\$ 375.00	\$	562.50

			Review and address Mr. Lipman's comments to second draft of reply in support of opening		T	
10/22/2020	Alina Shell	2.1	brief on remand. Edit and expand draft reply consistent with comments and case law	\$ 375.00	Ś	787.50
10/12/1010	7 mild offen		Proofread and correct table of content and table of authorities for reply in support of	ψ 075.00	Ť	707.50
10/22/2020	Alina Shell	0.3	opening brief on remand. Approve brief for filing.	\$ 375.00	Ś	112.50
	Leo Wolpert		Proofread and edit reply in support of opening brief.	\$ 250.00	Ś	275.00
,,			Attention to further revisions to reply; further research re immediate repeal. Emails with Mr.	7	-	
10/22/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.6	Lipman.	\$ 500.00	\$	800.00
	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Per Ms. McLetchie, send hearing reminder email to Mr. Lipman.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
<u> </u>						
			Create Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service; prepare for filing			
			the Petitioner's Reply in Support of Petitioner's Opening Brief on Remand for attorneys'			
10/22/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.9	review and approval. Finalize, file, and serve re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	Ś	157.50
	Admin Admin			\$ 25.00	_	52.50
	Margaret McLetchie		Attention to docket discrepancy re 10/29/2020 hearing.	\$ 500.00	_	100.00
	0			,	Ė	
			Phone call with Mr. Simeon (law clerk in Department 24) re docket showing 10/29/2020 as a			
10/23/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	"Status Check" rather than a "Hearing" and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	Ś	17.50
	Admin Admin		Continued updating the Nevada Public Records Act binder for Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 25.00		22.50
	Margaret McLetchie		Begin hearing preparation. Review binders.	\$ 500.00	\$	700.00
10/20/2020	ivialgalet ivictettille	1.4	begin hearing preparation, neview binders.	\$ 300.00	٠	700.00
			Review correspondence from opposing counsel's office to chambers. Direct paralegal to			
10/27/2020	Mayaayat Malatabia	0.1	follow up with chambers re whether email courtesy copies are needed, Blue Jeans info.	\$ 500.00	۲.	FO 00
10/2//2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.1		\$ 500.00	Ş	50.00
			Download, save, and review Notification of Appearance by Blue Jeans re Thursday, October			
/ /			29, 2020 hearing; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman and Mr.			
	Pharan Burchfield		Kane re same.	\$ 175.00	_	17.50
10/28/2020	Margaret McLetchie	2.3	Hearing preparation.	\$ 500.00	\$	1,150.00
			Phone call with Mr. Simone, law clerk in Department 24, confirming BlueJeans invite (not in-			
10/28/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	person) and no courtesy copies requested. Update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
10/29/2020	Admin Admin	0.4	Scanned and saved Ms. McLetchie's notes from the hearing. Updated the hearing binder.	\$ 25.00	\$	10.00
			Assist Ms. McLetchie with preparation for argument: conduct legal research re law of the			
10/29/2020	Alina Shell	1.1	case doctrine and summarize same.	\$ 375.00	\$	412.50
			Hearing (prepare and attend). Emails and other calls with client. Direct paralegal re obtaining			
10/29/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.2	transcript on expedited basis.	\$ 500.00	\$	2,100.00
	0			,	Ė	,
			Email communications with Ms. Nichols re splitting costs of today's hearing transcript; draft			
10/29/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	transcript request for attorneys' review and approval; and email to Court re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
	Margaret McLetchie		Preparation work for Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review last filing.	\$ 500.00		250.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Emails re obtaining transcript.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
11/4/2020	ivial garet iviezeteine	0.2	Email communications with Ms. Maldonado (court recOrder in Department 24) and Ms.	7 300.00	7	100.00
			Nichols re splitting costs of 10/26/2020 transcript and requesting updated invoices reflecting			
11/4/2020	Dhavan Durahfiald	0.1		ć 17F 00	۲.	17.50
11/4/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	such; payment made accordingly.	\$ 175.00	Ş	17.50
/ . /			Check court docket to confirm that no Minutes have been updated re 10/29/2020 hearing;		_	
	Pharan Burchfield		and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00		17.50
11/5/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.7	Review transcript.	\$ 500.00	\$	350.00
			Download, save, and review RecOrders Transcript of 10/29/2020 Hearing re Briefs on			
11/5/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Remand; and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			Begin drafting Order regarding supplemental briefing on remand. Confer with Ms. McLetchie			
11/9/2020	Alina Shell	1.8	re same.	\$ 375.00	\$	675.00
11/10/2020	Alina Shell	3.8	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing.	\$ 375.00	\$	1,425.00
11/12/2020	Alina Shell	2.1	Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand	\$ 375.00	\$	787.50
			Edit draft to send to client. Address client's edits and send to Ms. Shell for polishing and			
11/12/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.8	finalization.	\$ 500.00	\$	900.00
	Ü		Email Department 24 requesting extension of time to submit proposed Order. Update			
11/12/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
11/13/2020			Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand.	\$ 375.00	_	112.50
11/13/2020			Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order.	\$ 375.00		75.00
	Leo Wolpert		Proofread Order on remand.	\$ 250.00	-	325.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Approve final draft Order to send to Ms. Nichols.	\$ 250.00		
	Pharan Burchfield		Email Mr. Lipman the revised proposed Order on remand for his review.	\$ 175.00		100.00 17.50
11/13/2020	r naran burumetu	0.1	Email wit. Lipinan the revised proposed Order Officinatio for his feview.	00.511 ډ	ڔ	17.50
11/12/222	Dharan DLf. 11	~ ~	Finalize dueft museused Ouder on research and small to Ata Att At	¢ 475.00	۲	F2 F2
	Pharan Burchfield		Finalize draft proposed Order on remand and email to Ms. Nichols for review and approval.	\$ 175.00		52.50
11/1//2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	Emails re Ms. Nichols' request for more time to submit proposed Order.	\$ 500.00	\$	50.00
	i l		Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie	1	1	4.0=
44/40/				4		
11/18/2020	Alina Shell	0.3	re same.	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
	Alina Shell Margaret McLetchie		re same. Assess proposed changes from Ms. Nichols. Edit final proposed Order/ approve same.	\$ 375.00		400.00

1/13/2000 Margaret Miciarchie 0.3 Corbert er same. 575.00 5.00.0 5.00.0 10.00 11/13/2000 Margaret Miciarchie 0.3 Beview emails with chambers re-competing proposed Orders. 5.00.0 5.00							1
11/19/2000 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Confer with paralegal restatory of Order 5.000 5.0	44/40/2020	0 0 10 11		Draft letter re competing Orders for review/approval. Finalize and send (email) to Judge	4 475 00	,	52.50
11/19/2020 Dargaret McLetchie 0.2 Review emils with chambers re competing proposed Orders 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 100.01							
Phone call with Mr. Semons (bux derix in Department 24), requesting re-emid proposed 5,175.00 5,175.00 17.9				, ,	-	_	
11/19/2002 Pheran Burchfield 0.1 Order, update attorney and email re same. \$.175.00 \$.1	11/19/2020	Margaret McLetchie			\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
Downhadd, sive, and circulate (1) Gromer's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (a) hearing date); 2) Cornore's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay and Order on Remand. Draft and Intelligence of Coroner's Coroner's Motion to Stay and Filings re-same. Email conference with Ms. Burchfield re-filings and Coroner's Motion to Stay and Filings re-same. Email conference with Ms. Burchfield re-filings and Coroner's Motion to Stay and Filings re-same. Email conference with Ms. Burchfield re-filings and Coroner's Motion to Stay and Filings re-same. Email conference with Ms. Burchfield re-filings (Coroner's Motion to Stay and Filings re-same. Email conference with Ms. Burchfield re-filings (Coroner's Motion to Stay and Filings re-same. Email conference with Ms. Burchfield re-filings (Coroner's Motion to Motion to Stay by precuring documents. Stay 50000 \$ 75000 \$	44 /40 /2020	01 0 10 11		, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	A 475 00	,	47.50
	11/19/2020	Pharan Burchfield			\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
1/20/2020 Lacey Ambro							
11/20/2002 Jacey Ambro							
Download.save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Orders on Remand. Effective seame. Download, save and circulate finalize Notice of Entry of Orders on Remand. Effective review same. Download, save and circulate finalize Notice of Entry of Orders on Remand. Effective review same. Download, save and circulate finalize Notice of Entry of Orders on Remand. Effective review same. Download, save and circulate finalize Notice of Entry of Orders.	/22 /222				4		
11/20/2000 Lacey Ambro O. Same. Calendar accordingly Assame. Same	11/20/2020	Lacey Ambro		<u> </u>	\$ 150.00	Ş	60.00
1/12/07/200 Lacy Ambro							
11/20/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 Seadleines resume Email Conference with Ms. Burchfield re 1.5 Seadleines resume and those triggered by notice of entry of Order. 5.500.00 5.75.00	/00/0000				4		
11/20/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 decadines re same and those triggered by notice of entry of Order. \$ 500.00 \$ 750.00	11/20/2020	Lacey Ambro			\$ 150.00	\$	60.00
11/22/2020 Bargaret McLetchie 0.2 Review approve Notice of Entry of Order. 5.00.00 \$.100.00	/22 /222				4 =====		
1/21/2020 Leo Wolpert 0.2 Assist Ms. McLetchie in drafting Motion for stay by procuring documents. 5.250.0 \$.50.0 \$		·					
Review sample successful opposition to Motion to stay from 1 October NPRA litigation 0.5 against at sur yeaps Metropolitary Police Department. 5,000 5,250.0 5,250.0 11/22/2020 Alina Shell 5.8 respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. 5,375.0 5,2175.0 11/22/2020 Margaret McLetchie 7.6 Draft legal standard and introduction sections and begin drafting sections re factors. 5,375.0 5,380.0 5,380.0 11/23/2020 Margaret McLetchie 7.6 Draft legal standard and introduction sections and begin drafting sections re factors. 5,375.00 5,380.0 5,380.0 11/23/2020 Alina Shell 0.2 Stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's sasertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 1.6 Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. 5,375.00 5,375.0						_	
11/22/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0. slagainst Las Vegas Metropolitan Police Department. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and procedural and related issues re delay vs no appeal filed. Further research pertient to stay. Expland littleshind of success full procedural and related issues red delay vs no appeal filed. Further research pertient to stay. Expland littleshind of success section to address harmon and procedural and related issues red delay vs no appeal filed. Further research pertient to stay. Expland littleshind of success section to address harmon and procedural and related issues red delay vs no appeal filed. Further research pertient to stay. Expland littleshind of success section to address harmon and procedural and related issues red delay vs no appeal filed. Further research pertient to stay. Expland littleshind of success section to address harmon and procedural and related issues red delay vs no appeal filed. Further research pertient to stay. Expland littleshind of success section to address harmon and procedural and related issues red delay vs no appeal filed. Further research pertient to stay. In procedural and related issues red delay vs no appeal filed. Further research pertien	11/21/2020	Leo Wolpert	0.2		\$ 250.00	Ş	50.00
Syand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeals: complete procedural history and \$375.00 \$ 2,175.00							
11/22/2020 Alina Shell S.8 Respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. \$375.00 \$ 2,2175.0	11/21/2020	Margaret McLetchie			\$ 500.00	\$	250.00
Research and draft opposition to Motion to stay. Review successful similar oppositions in 1 October case. Research legal standard. Review Order. Consider abuse of discretion issue. 11/22/2020 Margaret McLetchie 12/24/2020 Alina Shell 12/24/2020 Alina Shell 1.6 Motion by researching prior stay Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 5 assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 5 assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 6 assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 6 assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 6 assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 6 assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 6 assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 6 assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 6 assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 6 assertion and assist Ms. McLetchie with 6 assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 6 assertion and assist Ms. McLetchie with 6 assertion and assist Ms. McLetchie view for assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie view for assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 6 assertion and 6 assertion ass							
October case. Research legal standard and introduction sections and begin drafting sections restores. 7. 6) Forfit legal standard and introduction sections and begin drafting sections restores. 8. 550.00 \$ 3,800.0	11/22/2020	Alina Shell	5.8	respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors.	\$ 375.00	\$	2,175.00
October case. Research legal standard and introduction sections and begin drafting sections restores. 7. 6) Forfit legal standard and introduction sections and begin drafting sections restores. 8. 550.00 \$ 3,800.0							
11/23/2020 Alina Shell 0.2 stay. Craft legal standard and introduction sections and begin drafting sections re factors. \$ 5,00.00 \$ 3,800.00 \$ 11/23/2020 Alina Shell 0.2 stay. Craft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 11/23/2020 Alina Shell 1.6 Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district ords. \$ 375.00 \$ 600.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 575.00							
Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to 1/12/3/2020 Alina Shell 0.2 stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 1.16 Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. \$ 375.00 \$ 600.0 \$ 6							
11/23/2020 Alina Shell 0.2 stay. 5 375.00 \$ 75.00 Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 11/23/2020 Alina Shell 1.6 Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. 5 375.00 \$ 600.00 Continue drafting and refining opposition to Motion to Stay. Incorpporate AS edits and her rewrite of my skeletal "defeat purpose of appeal" section. Expand / draft and address in procedural and related issues re delay vs no appeal filed. Further research pertient to stay. Expland lilkelihold of success section to address Hansen argument. Complete initial draft to send to Mr. Lipman. Reviere/ consider experience re stay in initial litigation into its case and to send to Mr. Lipman. Reviere/ consider experience re stay in initial litigation into its case and to Mr. Lipman. Reviere/ consider experience re stay in initial litigation into its case and 11/24/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.0 call with Mr. Lipman. Begin revising opposition to Motion to stay accordingly. 5 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 100.00 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.0 call with Mr. Lipman. Begin revising opposition to Motion to stay accordingly. 5 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 100.00 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Research/ check records re amounts paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing by County. 5 500.00 \$ 100.00 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Opposition to Motion to Stay logistic; confer with Ms. Ambro re same. 5 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce 13 autopsy reports. Revise introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and Science introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and Science introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and Science introduction, procedural history, and legal st	11/22/2020	Margaret McLetchie	7.6		\$ 500.00	\$	3,800.00
Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 1.6 Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. \$ 375.00 \$ 600.0 \$ 60					l .		
assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 1.6 Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. Continue drafting and refining opposition to Motion to stay, Incorpoprate AS edits and her rewrite of my skeletal "defeat purpsee of appeal" section. Expand / draft section addressign procedural and related issues re delay so na oppeal flief. Further research pertient to stay, Expland likelihhod of sucess section to address Hansen argument. Complete initial draft to send to Mr. Lipman. Review/ consider experience re stay in initial litigation in this case and 11/23/2020 Margaret McLetchie 5.9 in 1 October. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.0 Zelfit NPRA request re fees paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing prepared by paralegal. 5.00.00 \$ 5	11/23/2020	Alina Shell	0.2	stay.	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with 1.6 Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. Continue drafting and refining opposition to Motion to stay, Incorpoprate AS edits and her rewrite of my skeletal "defeat purpsee of appeal" section. Expand / draft section addressign procedural and related issues re delay so na oppeal flief. Further research pertient to stay, Expland likelihhod of sucess section to address Hansen argument. Complete initial draft to send to Mr. Lipman. Review/ consider experience re stay in initial litigation in this case and 11/23/2020 Margaret McLetchie 5.9 in 1 October. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.0 Zelfit NPRA request re fees paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing prepared by paralegal. 5.00.00 \$ 5							
11/23/2020 Alina Shell 1.6 Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. \$ 375.00 \$ 600.0 Continue drafting and refining opposition to Motion to stay. Incorporate As edits and her rewrite of my skeletal "defeat purpose of appeal" section. Expand / draft section addressing procedural and related issues re delay vs no appeal flied. Further research pertient to stay. Expland flikelihhood of sucess section to address Hansen argument. Copie initial draft to send to Mr. Lipman. Revierw/ consider experience re stay in intial litigation in this case and 5 500.00 \$ 2,950.0 Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 0.4 and email. 9 1.0 Call with Mr. Lipman. Begin revising opposition to Motion to stay accordingly. \$ 500.00 \$ 500.0 \$ 500.0 \$ 500.0 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.0 Call with Mr. Lipman. Begin revising opposition to Motion to stay accordingly. \$ 500.00 \$ 500.0 \$ 500.0 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Opposition to Motion to Stay accordingly. \$ 500.00 \$ 500.0 \$ 100.0 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Opposition to Motion to Stay logistic; confer with Ms. Ambror re same. \$ 500.00 \$ 100.0 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Opposition to Motion to Stay logistic; confer with Ms. Ambror re same. \$ 500.00 \$ 100.0 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Opposition to Motion to Stay logistic; confer with Ms. Ambror re same. \$ 500.00 \$ 1,800.0 \$ 11/29/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce 11/29/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Caroner's Motion to Stay logistic; confer with Ms. Ambror re same. \$ 500.00 \$ 1,800.0 \$ 1,8							
Continue drafting and refining opposition to Motion to stay. Incorpporate AS edits and her rewrite of my skeletal "defeat purpsoe of appeal" section. Expand / draft section addressign procedural and related lissues re delay vs no appeal filed. Further research pertient to stay. Expland lilkelihhod of sucess section to address Hansen argument. Complete initial draft to send to Mr. Lipman. Revierw/ consider experience re stay in initial litigation in this case and section 11/24/2020 (Lacey Ambro							
rewrite of my skeletal "defeat purpsoe of appeal" section. Expand / draft section addressign procedural and related issues re delay v. on appeal filed. Further research pertient to stay. Expland ilikelihhod of sucess section to address Hansen argument. Complete initial draft to send to Mr. Lipman. Revierw/ consider experience re stay in initial litigation in this case and 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro	11/23/2020	Alina Shell	1.6		\$ 375.00	\$	600.00
procedural and related issues re delay vs no appeal filed. Further research pertient to stay, Expland lilikelihhod of sucess section to address Hansan argument. Complete initial draft to send to Mr. Lipman. Revierw/ consider experience re stay in initial litigation in this case and 11/23/2020 Margaret McLetchie Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Margaret McLetchie 10. Call with Mr. Lipman. Begin revising opposition to Motion to Stay accordingly. \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 100.00 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1. Call with Mr. Lipman. Begin revising opposition to Motion to Stay accordingly. \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 100.00 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Research/ check records re amounts paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing by County. \$ 500.00 \$ 100.00 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Research/ check records re amounts paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing by County. \$ 500.00 \$ 100.00 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Opposition to Motion to Stay logistic; confer with Ms. Ambror re same. \$ 500.00 \$ 100.00 \$ 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce 11/29/2020 Alina Shell 1.5 autopsy reports. Revise introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and 11/29/2020 Alina Shell 1.1 Motion to stay. Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to 11/30/2020 Alina Shell 0.5 appeal. Secure of versed draft to Mr. Lipman for his review & consideration. \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 12/10/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1. Individual of the stay of the secure							
Expland lilkelihhod of sucess section to address Hansen argument. Complete initial draft to send to Mr. Lipman. Revierw/ consider experience re stay in initial litigation in this case and in 1/23/2020 Margaret McLetchie 5.9. in 1 October. 5.90.00 \$ 2,950.0 \$ 1/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.2 Edit mAin. 1 October. 5.90.00 \$ 1.00.0 \$ 1							
send to Mr. Lipman. Revierw/ consider experience re stay in initial litigation in this case and specific process. Spool 5 2,950.0 \$ 2,95							
11/23/2020 Margaret McLetchie 5.9 in 1 October. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 and email. \$5.00.00 \$ 2,950.00 \$ 11/24/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Edit NPRA request re fees paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing prepared by paralegal. \$500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 10/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.0 Call with Mr. Lipman. Begin revising opposition to Motion to stay accordingly. \$500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 10/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Commissioners. \$500.00 \$ 10/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Commissioners. \$500.00 \$ 10/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Research/ check records re amounts paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing by County. \$500.00 \$ 10/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Opposition to Motion to Stay logistic; confer with Ms. Ambro re same. \$500.00 \$ 10/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 autopsy reports. \$375.00 \$ 562.5 Revise introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and 11/29/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 autopsy reports. Revise introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and 11/30/2020 Alina Shell 1.1 Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to draft opposition to 11/30/2020 Alina Shell 1.1 Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 11/30/2020 Alina Shell 0.5 appeal. Opposition to Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time final edits; confer with client. Attention to case strategy and planning. Review Board of County Commissioners 11/30/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.2 agenda. Finalize, file, and serve Opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr. 11/30/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has fyllip provide reports in at least redacted form. \$500.00 \$ 500.00							
Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 11/24/2020 Margaret McLetchie 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 11/29/2020 Alina Shell 11/29/2020 Margaret McLetchie 11/29/2020 Margaret McLetchie 11/29/2020 Margaret McLetchie 11/29/2020 Alina Shell 11/29/2020 Margaret McLetchie 11/29/2020 Margaret				send to Mr. Lipman. Revierw/ consider experience re stay in intiial litigation in this case and			
11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro	11/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie			\$ 500.00	\$	2,950.00
11/24/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.0 Call with Mr. Lipman. Begin revising opposition to Motion to stay accordingly. 5 00.00 \$ 0.00.0							
11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.0 Call with Mr. Lipman. Begin revising opposition to Motion to stay accordingly. Emails with Ms. Miller and counsel for Coroner re communications with Board of County 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 11/29/2020 Alina Shell 11/29/2020 Alina Shell 11/29/2020 Margaret McLetchie 11/20/2020 Margaret McLetchie 12/2020 Margaret McLetchie 12/2020 Margaret McLetchie 12/2020 Margaret McLetchie 13/2020 Margaret McLetchie 14/2020 Margaret McLetchie 15/2020 Margaret McLetchie 16/2020 Margaret McLetchie 17/2020 Margaret McLetchie 18/2020 Margaret McLetchie 19/2020 Margaret McLetchie 19/2020 Margaret McLetchie 10/2020 Margare						_	60.00
Emails with Ms. Miller and counsel for Coroner re communications with Board of County 11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Commissioners. 0.2 Research/ check records re amounts paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing by County. 0.2 Research/ check records re amounts paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing by County. 0.2 Research/ check records re amounts paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing by County. 0.3 Attention to Opposition to Motion to Stay logistic; confer with Ms. Ambro re same. 0.4 Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce 0.5 375.00 \$ 100.0 0.7 Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce 0.6 Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce 0.7 Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce 0.8 Revise introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and 0.8 send revised draft to Mr. Lipman for his review & consideration. 0.8 Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to 0.1 Motion to stay. 0.1 Motion to stay. 0.2 Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 0.5 appeal. 0.5 appeal. 0.5 appeal. 0.5 appeal. 0.5 poposition to Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time final edits; confer with client. Attention to case strategy and planning. Review Board of County Commissioners 0.4 Lipman re same. 0.5 175.00 \$ 2,100.0 0.7 Lipman re same. 0.6 Edit opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr. 0.4 Lipman re same. 0.5 175.00 \$ 25.00.0 \$ 2,100.0 0.7 Lipman re same. 0.8 Edit opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr. 0.4 Lipman re same. 0.5 175.00 \$ 70.0 0.7 Lipman re same. 0.8 Emails with Mr. Lipman researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 0.7 Lipman researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 0.8 Emails with Mr. Lipman reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion							100.00
11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Commissioners. \$500.00 \$ 100.0 \$10/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Research/ check records re amounts paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing by County. \$500.00 \$ 100.0 \$10/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Opposition to Motion to Stay logistic; confer with Ms. Ambro re same. \$500.00 \$ 100.0 \$10/25/2020 Alina Shell 1.5 autopsy reports. \$375.00 \$ 562.5 \$10/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 3.6 send revised draft to Mr. Lipman for his review & consideration. \$500.00 \$ 1,800.0 \$1/25/2020 Alina Shell 1.1 Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to draft opposition to 1.1 Motion to stay. \$375.00 \$ 187.5 \$1/25/2020 Alina Shell 0.5 appeal. \$375.00 \$ 187.5 \$1/25/2020 Alina	11/25/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.0		\$ 500.00	\$	500.00
11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Research/ check records re amounts paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing by County. \$500.00 \$100.0 \$11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Attention to Opposition to Motion to Stay logistic; confer with Ms. Ambro re same. \$500.00 \$100.0 \$10/29/2020 Alina Shell 1.5 actions of Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce autopsy reports. Revise introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and send revised draft to Mr. Lipman for his review & consideration. \$500.00 \$1,800.0 \$1,800.0 \$1,000.0 \$1,				•	l .	١.	
11/25/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 attops reports. Revise introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to Stay and send revised draft to Mr. Lipman for his review & consideration. Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to 1.1 Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal. Opposition to Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time final edits; confer with client. Atternion to case strategy and planning. Review Board of County Commissioners 11/30/2020 Leo Wolpert 2.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. Board of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client a soon as possible to Corfer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client a soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after					-		100.00
Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce 11/29/2020 Alina Shell 1.5 autopsy reports. Revise introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and send revised draft to Mr. Lipman for his review & consideration. Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 11/30/2020 Alina Shell 1.1 Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 11/30/2020 Alina Shell 0.5 appeal. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 0.5 appeal. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 11/30/2020 Margaret McLetchie 11/30/2020 Margaret McLetchie 12/1/2020 Pharan Burchfield 12/1/2020 Leo Wolpert 12.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. Sound \$500.00 \$ 750.0	11/25/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Research/ check records re amounts paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing by County.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce 11/29/2020 Alina Shell 1.5 autopsy reports. Revise introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and send revised draft to Mr. Lipman for his review & consideration. Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 11/30/2020 Alina Shell 1.1 Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 11/30/2020 Alina Shell 0.5 appeal. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 0.5 appeal. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 11/30/2020 Margaret McLetchie 11/30/2020 Margaret McLetchie 12/1/2020 Pharan Burchfield 12/1/2020 Leo Wolpert 12.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. Sound \$500.00 \$ 750.0					l .	١.	
11/29/2020 Alina Shell 1.5 autopsy reports. Revise introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and service with and service with a serv	11/25/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2		\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
Revise introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and 3.6 send revised draft to Mr. Lipman for his review & consideration. Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to 11/30/2020 Alina Shell 1.1 Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 0.5 appeal. Opposition to Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time final edits; confer with client. Attention to case strategy and planning. Review Board of County Commissioners 4.2 agenda. 11/30/2020 Pharan Burchfield O.4 Lipman re same. Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 2.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. Sound of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript.							
11/29/2020 Margaret McLetchie 3.6 send revised draft to Mr. Lipman for his review & consideration. \$500.00 \$1,800.00	11/29/2020	Alina Shell			\$ 375.00	\$	562.50
Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 11/30/2020 Alina Shell Opposition to Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time final edits; confer with client. Attention to case strategy and planning. Review Board of County Commissioners Agenda. Finalize, file, and serve Opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Finalize, file, and serve Opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr. Lipman re same. S 500.00 \$ 2,100.0 Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 2.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. Board of County Commissioners \$ 175.00 \$ 70.0 Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 2.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. Board of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. \$ 500.00 \$ 750.0 Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript.					l .	١.	
11/30/2020 Alina Shell 1.1 Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending 11/30/2020 Alina Shell 0.5 appeal. Opposition to Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time final edits; confer with client. Attention to case strategy and planning. Review Board of County Commissioners 11/30/2020 Margaret McLetchie 11/30/2020 Pharan Burchfield 1.1 Einalize, file, and serve Opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr. 11/30/2020 Pharan Burchfield 0.4 Lipman re same. S 175.00 \$ 70.0 Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 12/1/2020 Leo Wolpert 2.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. S 250.00 \$ 575.0 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. S 500.00 \$ 750.0 Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript. \$ 500.00 \$ 550.0	11/29/2020	Margaret McLetchie			\$ 500.00	\$	1,800.00
Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal. \$ 375.00 \$ 187.5 Opposition to Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time final edits; confer with client. Attention to case strategy and planning. Review Board of County Commissioners agenda. \$ 500.00 \$ 2,100.0 Finalize, file, and serve Opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr. Lipman re same. \$ 175.00 \$ 70.0 Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. \$ 250.00 \$ 575.0 Board of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. \$ 500.00 \$ 750.0 Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after reviewing transcript. \$ 500.00 \$ 550.00							
11/30/2020 Alina Shell 0.5 appeal. 0.5 Opposition to Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time final edits; confer with client. Attention to case strategy and planning. Review Board of County Commissioners agenda. \$500.00 \$2,100.00 \$175.00 \$70.00 \$175.00 \$70.00 \$175.00 \$70.00 \$175.00 \$175.00 \$70.00 \$175.00 \$1	11/30/2020	Alina Shell	1.1	,	\$ 375.00	\$	412.50
Opposition to Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time final edits; confer with client. Attention to case strategy and planning. Review Board of County Commissioners 4.2 agenda. \$500.00 \$2,100.00 Finalize, file, and serve Opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr. 11/30/2020 Pharan Burchfield 0.4 Lipman re same. \$175.00 \$70.00 Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 12/1/2020 Leo Wolpert 2.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. \$250.00 \$575.00 Board of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. \$500.00 \$750.00 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Emails with Mr. Lipman. \$500.00 \$100.00 Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript. \$500.00 \$550.00					l .	١.	
client. Attention to case strategy and planning. Review Board of County Commissioners 4.2 agenda. \$500.00 \$2,100.00 Finalize, file, and serve Opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr. 11/30/2020 Pharan Burchfield 0.4 Lipman re same. \$175.00 \$70.00 Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 12/1/2020 Leo Wolpert 2.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. \$250.00 \$575.00 Board of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. \$500.00 \$750.00 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Emails with Mr. Lipman. \$500.00 \$100.00 Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript. \$500.00 \$550.00	11/30/2020	Alina Shell	0.5		\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
11/30/2020 Margaret McLetchie 4.2 agenda. \$500.00 \$2,100.00 Finalize, file, and serve Opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr. 1/30/2020 Pharan Burchfield 0.4 Lipman re same. \$175.00 \$70.00 Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 2.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. \$250.00 \$575.00 Board of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. \$500.00 \$750.00 \$750.00 \$750.00 \$12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Emails with Mr. Lipman. \$500.00 \$100.00 Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript. \$500.00 \$550.00							
Finalize, file, and serve Opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr. 11/30/2020 Pharan Burchfield 0.4 Lipman re same. Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 2.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. Board of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. \$500.00 \$750.0 Emails with Mr. Lipman. Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript.					l .	١.	
11/30/2020 Pharan Burchfield O.4 Lipman re same. Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 12/1/2020 Leo Wolpert 2.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. Board of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. \$500.00 \$750.0 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Emails with Mr. Lipman. Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript.	11/30/2020	Margaret McLetchie			\$ 500.00	\$	2,100.00
Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for 12/1/2020 Leo Wolpert 2.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. Board of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. 500.00 \$ 750.00 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Emails with Mr. Lipman. Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript.							
12/1/2020 Leo Wolpert 2.3 Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same. Board of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. \$500.00 \$750.00 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Emails with Mr. Lipman. Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript. \$500.00 \$500.00 \$500.00	11/30/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.4		\$ 175.00	\$	70.00
Board of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.5 has / will provide reports in at least redacted form. 500.00 \$ 750.0 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Emails with Mr. Lipman. Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript. \$500.00 \$ 500.00 \$500.00 \$ 550.00				5 5	l		
12/1/2020Margaret McLetchie1.5has / will provide reports in at least redacted form.\$ 500.00\$ 750.0012/1/2020Margaret McLetchie0.2Emails with Mr. Lipman.\$ 500.00\$ 100.00Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after\$ 500.00\$ 550.0012/1/2020Margaret McLetchie1.1reviewing transcript.\$ 500.00\$ 550.00	12/1/2020	Leo Wolpert			\$ 250.00	\$	575.00
12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie O.2 Emails with Mr. Lipman. Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript. \$ 500.00 \$ 100.0							
Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript. \$ 500.00 \$ 550.0							750.00
soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after 12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript. \$500.00 \$550.00	12/1/2020	Margaret McLetchie			\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 1.1 reviewing transcript. \$ 500.00 \$ 550.0							
12/1/2020 Margaret McLetchie 0.2 Check Coroner's appellate deadline. \$ 500.00 \$ 100.0							550.00
	12/1/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Check Coroner's appellate deadline.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00

12/1/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Plan work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and confer with Mr. Wolpert re same.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
12/2/2020	Loo Wolport	2 0	Continue drafting, researching supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs including research re Laffey Matrix and other fees.	\$ 250.00	ć	050.00
	Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie		Confirm time / date for Stay hearing with paralegal and client.	\$ 500.00		950.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Follow up with Ms. Nichols re request re redacted copies of report.	\$ 500.00		50.00
12, 2, 2020	margaret mezeterne		Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing	ψ 300.00	Υ	30.00
12/3/2020	Lacey Ambro	2.0	Fees/costs. Begin charting information.	\$ 150.00	\$	300.00
12/3/2020	Leo Wolpert	2.8	Continue drafting, researching supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 250.00	\$	700.00
12/3/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.8	Preliminary research re possible Order to Show Cause. Consider issues re same.	\$ 500.00	\$	400.00
			Review fees information re payments to Marquis Aurbach Coffing provided by Coroner.			
	Margaret McLetchie		Emails with Ms. Ambro re same.	\$ 500.00		100.00
	Margaret McLetchie			\$ 500.00		100.00
12/3/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Emails with client.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
12/4/2020	Alina Shell	0.8	Edit and provide comments and suggestions regarding Mr. Wolpert's draft Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 375.00	\$	300.00
12/4/2020	Alli la Sileli	0.0	Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms.	Ç 373.00	7	300.00
			Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of			
12/4/2020	Lacey Ambro	1.2	information referenced to attorneys.	\$ 150.00	Ś	180.00
				7	7	
12/4/2020	Leo Wolpert	1.7	Final edits and updates to initial draft of supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 250.00	\$	425.00
	·		Confirm plans re Order to Show Cause. Confer with Mr. Wolpert re Motion for Attorney's			
12/4/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	Fees and Costs.	\$ 500.00	\$	200.00
			Confer with Ms. Shell and Mr. Wolpert re strategy, plans re Motion for Attorney's Fees and			
			Costs. Review preliminary draft and provide feedback/direct Mr. Wolpert re			
			factual/procedural history to add. Approve final draft to send to client of substantive			
12/4/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.6	sections re brief.	\$ 500.00	\$	800.00
			Begin researching and drafting Motion for Order to Show Cause re contempt of disclosure			
12/5/2020	Leo Wolpert	1.3	Order.	\$ 250.00	\$	325.00
			Continue researching and drafting Motion for Order to Show Cause re contempt of		١.	
	Leo Wolpert		disclosure Order.	\$ 250.00	_	800.00
12/6/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	Direct work re research re Order to Show Cause and Order shortening time. Expand draft of Motion for Order to Show Cause (re not disclosing autopsy reports as	\$ 500.00	\$	150.00
12/7/2020	Alina Shall	0.0	Ordered) by adding facts re timing of Board meetings.	\$ 375.00	خ	337.50
12/7/2020			Edit draft Motion for Order to Show Cause.	\$ 375.00		337.50
12/1/2020	7 till a Strell	0.5	Complete researching and drafting Motion for Order to Show Cause re contempt of	7 373.00	7	337.30
12/7/2020	Leo Wolpert	2.8	disclosure Order, including declarations, etc.	\$ 250.00	Ś	700.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Review reply in support of Motion to stay filed by Coroner.	\$ 500.00		200.00
			Research re interplay between Order to Show Cause and stay. Direct work and make edits to			
			draft; break up argument section into separate section. Emails with client. Review client			
			edits; coordinate finalization of Order to Show Cause/ perform final substantive review			
	Margaret McLetchie	_	before finalization.	\$ 500.00		2,300.00
12/7/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	Hearing logistics re 12/10/2020 Motion to stay; review hearing notice.	\$ 500.00	\$	50.00
			Gather, create, prepare, and redact district court expenses and appeal expenses for		١.	
12/7/2020	Pharan Burchfield	2.0	Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements.	\$ 175.00	\$	350.00
			Developed and analysis of Developed and Clark County Office of the County Madical			
			Download, save, and review Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical			
12/7/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Examiner's Reply in Support of Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time; update attorneys and confirm calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	خ	17.50
12///2020	Pilaran Burchilelu	0.1	Download, save, and review Notification of Appearance via BlueJeans re upcoming	\$ 175.00	Ş	17.50
			12/10/2020 hearing on Coroner's Motion for Stay; update attorneys and calendar			
12/7/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	Ś	17.50
12/1/2020	Tharam Barennela	0.1	Finalize and submit/email Motion for Order to Show Cause on an Order Shortening Time to	7 175.00	7	17.5
12/7/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.3	Department 24.	\$ 175.00	\$	52.50
			Attention to Motion for attorney's fees: review and accept Mr. Lipman's changes to Motion.			
12/8/2020	Alina Shell	0.8	Add in argument and exhibit re fee award in CIR v. LVMPD matter.	\$ 375.00	\$	300.00
12/8/2020	Alina Shell			\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
			Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and			
12/8/2020	Lacey Ambro	0.4	filing fees sections and provide input.	\$ 150.00	\$	60.00
			Attention to substantive edits to fees app/ finalization of same (minus fees / rate detail).]		
	Margaret McLetchie		Confer with Mr. Lipman re his proposed edits and next steps.	\$ 500.00		300.00
12/8/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Review courtesy copy email from opposing counsel's office re Motion to stay.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
10/0/0			Review Order to Show Cause on Order shortening time Order. Plan accordingly. Direct	A ====	_	455 :
12/8/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	paralegal to update client.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
			Continue to create propers and reduct district court supers and several supers			
42/0/2020	Pharan Burchfield	3.0	Continue to create, prepare, and redact district court expenses and appeal expenses. Draft	¢ 17F 00	۲,	400.0
	POSTSO BUTCOTION	こしている	Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements for attorneys review and approval.	\$ 175.00	ı >	490.0

				Т		
			Download, save, and review Motion for an Order to Show Cause on an Order Shortening			
			Time; draft Notice of Entry of Motion for an Order to Show Cause on an Order Shortening			
42/0/2020	0 1011	0.0	Time, file and serve re same; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re	A 475 00	_	25.00
12/8/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	same.	\$ 175.00	>	35.00
12/9/2020	Alina Shell	1.0	Per Ms. McLetchie's request, review Coroner opposition to Order to Show Cause and provide suggested responses to same.	\$ 375.00	خ	375.00
	Lacey Ambro		Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions.	\$ 150.00		75.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Attention to hearing preparation binder. Ensure clients have call-in information.	\$ 500.00	_	100.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Attention to fees application. Confer with Ms. Burchfield re same.	\$ 500.00		100.00
12/3/2020	ivia garet mezeteme	0.2	Review and analyze opposition to Order to Show Cause. Direct research re same. Confer with	ψ 500.00	Ť	200.00
12/9/2020	Margaret McLetchie	2.3	client. Further preparation for 12/10/2020 hearings.	\$ 500.00	Ś	1,150.00
, -,	. 0		Create, prepare, and edit fees by date for attorneys' review and approval for the upcoming	,		,
12/9/2020	Pharan Burchfield	1.4	Motion for Attorney's Fees.	\$ 175.00	\$	245.00
			Per Ms. McLetchie, email hearing reminder and BlueJeans details to Mr. Lipman and Mr.			
			Kane re 12/10/2020 hearings on Coroner's Motion for Stay and Las Vegas Review-Journal's			
12/9/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Motion for an Order to Show Cause.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			Download, save, and review Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical			
			Examiner's Opposition to Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for Order to Show			
			Cause on Order Shortening Time; update attorneys and confirm calendar accordingly. Email			
12/9/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			Attention to hearing on Motion for Order to Show Cause: research Nevada case law		١.	
12/10/2020			regarding contempt proceedings.	\$ 375.00		375.00
12/10/2020	Alina Shell	0.6	Observe hearing on Motion for stay and Motion for Order to Show Cause.	\$ 375.00	\$	225.00
/ /				4		
12/10/2020	Leo Wolpert	1.3	Research regarding court reassignment potential contempt hearing against Coroner.	\$ 250.00	Ş	325.00
			Prepare for and attend hearing on Motion to Stay, Order to Show Cuase. Review related			
12/10/2020	Margaret Mel etchie	6.3	research provided by Ms. Shell and Mr. Wolpert. Calls with client. Update paralegal re outcome, calendaring next steps, Ordering transcript.	¢ 500.00	ب	2 100 00
	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie		Work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, memorandum of costs.	\$ 500.00		3,100.00 800.00
12/10/2020	ivialgalet ivictetcille	1.0	Per Ms. McLetchie, prepare and send/email Ms. Maldonado (court recOrder in Department	\$ 300.00	۲	800.00
12/10/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	24) expedited transcript request.	\$ 175.00	¢	17.50
12/10/2020	i naran barennela	0.1	24) expedited transcript request.	ŷ 175.00	7	17.50
12/11/2020	Alina Shell	0.1	Attention to Motion for attorney fees: verify prior rates for attorney and staff time.	\$ 375.00	Ś	37.50
12, 11, 1010	/ IIII d direii	0.12	Attention to Motion for attorney's fees: review supporting documentation and fees	ψ 075.00	Ť	07.50
12/11/2020	Alina Shell	1.1	information.	\$ 375.00	\$	412.50
			Draft letter on behalf of Nevada Open Government Coalition to County Commission re			
12/11/2020	Alina Shell		coroner request for approval of appeal.	\$ 375.00	\$	600.00
12/11/2020	Alina Shell	0.7	Attention to fees Motion: review and edit spreadsheet of fees.	\$ 375.00	\$	262.50
12/11/2020	Alina Shell	0.5	Edit and proofread final draft of Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
			Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and			
12/11/2020	Lacey Ambro	0.6	Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill.	\$ 150.00	\$	90.00
12/11/2020	Leo Wolpert	1.0	Edit Supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees; confirm fees and costs.	\$ 250.00	\$	250.00
			Work on Motion for Attorney's Fees with paralegals. Review all time and costs and finalize			
	Margaret McLetchie		Declaration.	\$ 500.00		
12/11/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	Planning regarding Clark County Board of County Commisioners BCC hearing.	\$ 500.00	\$	500.00
			Finalize Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements; file and serve re same. Draft Ms.			
			McLetchie's Declaration in Support of Supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.			
			Continue editing fees (create exhibits re by date and by biller) for attorneys' review and			
12/11/2020	Dharan Burchfield	2.2	approval. Finalize Supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; file and serve re same. Update attorneys, calendar, and email Mr. Lipman accordingly.	\$ 175.00	ب	560.00
12/11/2020	Pharan Burchfield	3.2	Attention to scheduling re hearing on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Attention to BCC	\$ 175.00	Ş	300.00
12/14/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	issues. Call with Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00	\$	500.00
12/14/2020	ivial garet ivictetcine		Download, save, and review Clerk's Notice of Hearing re supplement Motion for Attorney's	\$ 300.00	۲	300.00
			Fees and Costs. Update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Per Ms. McLetchie, phone call			
			with Master Calendar re request for no hearing/in chambers; and email Department 24 re			
12/14/2020	Pharan Burchfield		same.	\$ 175.00	\$	35.00
	Pharan Burchfield		Follow-up email to court reporter re expedited transcript request.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			Attention to Order Denying Motion for stay: review transcript of hearing on Motion for stay			
12/15/2020	Alina Shell	2.3	pending appeal and begin drafting Order.	\$ 375.00	\$	862.50
			Review transcript. County hearing. Attention to preparing for anticipated Emergency Motion			
12/15/2020	Margaret McLetchie	3.1	to Stay.	\$ 500.00	\$	1,550.00
			1	i	l	
			Download, save, and review Transcript re 12/10/20 (Coroner's Stay and Las Vegas Review-			
12/15/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Journal's Order to Show Cause); update attorneys and email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
12/15/2020 12/16/2020			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	\$ 175.00 \$ 375.00		17.50 975.00

			Download, save, and review Notice of Appeal and Case Appeal Statement; update attorneys			
12/16/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	and calendar potential cross-appeal accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
	Margaret McLetchie		Attention to Order granting petition.	\$ 500.00	_	500.00
	Margaret McLetchie	_	APPEAL: Review Emergency Motion for Stay.	\$ 500.00	-	150.00
42/47/2020	Dhawa Dawah Sala	0.1	Day Ma. Mal atabia, amail Ma. Limmon the duaft Dranged Order Danging Ctoy for his region.	ć 175 00	,	17.50
12/17/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Per Ms. McLetchie, email Mr. Lipman the draft Proposed Order Denying Stay for his review. APPEAL: Prepare draft Response to Emergency Motion for Relief Under NRAP 27(e) [Stay] for	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
12/17/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	attorneys' use.	\$ 175.00	\$	35.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review (1) Docketed Notice of Appeal; (2) Filed Copy of District			
			Court Minutes Addendum to Notice of Appeal Packet submitted 12/16/2020 - A758501; and			
			(3) Notice of Referral of Settlement Program and Suspension of Rules; update attorneys and	1.		
12/17/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Emergency Motion for Relief Under NRAP 27(e) [Stay];			
	Pharan Burchfield		and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00		17.50
12/18/2020			Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Order Denying Motion for stay.	\$ 375.00	_	75.00
12/18/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.2	Attention to revisions to Order Denying stay; address client edits.	\$ 500.00	\$	600.00
12/18/2020	Dhaman Dunahfiald	0.1	Prepare draft proposed Order Denying the Motion for stay on an Order shortening time for Ms. Nichols's review and email re same.	\$ 175.00	۲.	17.50
12/18/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	APPEAL: Edit draft of response to Motion for stay pending appeal: update draft to include	\$ 175.00	Ş	17.50
			record and case citations, expand arguments, edit for content and clarity, and review for			
12/20/2020	Alina Shell	12	proposed changes to reduce page count.	\$ 375.00	خ	1 612 50
12/20/2020	Allila Sileli	4.5	APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with citation format for articles cited in opposition to Motion	\$ 373.00	۲	1,012.30
12/21/2020	Alina Shell	0.3	for stay.	\$ 375.00	¢	112.50
12/21/2020			APPEAL: Edit latest draft of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal.	\$ 375.00		1,575.00
12/21/2020	7 time stren	1.2	APPEAL: Finalize first draft of response to emergency petition (and attention to cutting	7 373.00	7	1,373.00
12/21/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.2	down) and send to Mr. Lipman for review.	\$ 500.00	Ś	2.100.00
12/21/2020	ina garet mezeteme		APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice re Exemption from Settlement Program; update	ψ 500.00	Ť	2,200.00
12/21/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
		1	Attention to proposed Order Denying Motion for stay: proofread and edit Order, proofread	7	7	
			letter to court re competing Orders, and direct staff re submission to court. Email opposing			
12/22/2020	Alina Shell	0.5	counsel re same.	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
			APPEAL: Address Mr. Lipman's edits to response to emergency Motion for stay pending			
12/22/2020	Alina Shell	1.6	appeal.	\$ 375.00	\$	600.00
			Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying			
12/22/2020	Lacey Ambro	0.6	Coroner's Motion for Stay. Email chambers letter and proposed Order.	\$ 150.00		90.00
12/22/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.6	Review Ms. Nichols' edits to Order denyin Motion to Stay.	\$ 500.00	\$	300.00
			APPEAL: Address additional edits from Mr. Lipman to response to emergency Motion for stay			
12/23/2020	Alina Shell	1.2	pending appeal. Draft Motion for leave to exceed page limit.	\$ 375.00	\$	450.00
12/22/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	Follow up with Ms. Nichols re her work on Order to Show Cause Order/ status of same.	\$ 500.00	خ	50.00
12/23/2020	ivial garet ivictetchie	0.1	APPEAL: Attention to work on substantive revisions to Response to Emergency Motion for	\$ 300.00	ې	30.00
12/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie	2.6	Stay and addressing edits from Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00	¢	1 300 00
12/25/2020	ivial garet ivieleteine	2.0	Stay and dud cosing carte normal Epinam	7 300.00	7	1,500.00
12/23/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	APPEAL: Email Mr. Lipman a copy of the Notice Of No Transcripts To Be Requested.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
12/23/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	APPEAL: Draft Motion for Leave to File in Excess Pages for attorneys' review and approval.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			APPEAL: Attention to response to emergency Motion for stay: make additional edits to draft			
12/24/2020	Alina Shell	2.3	response. Edit Motion for excess pages. Assist Ms. Burchfield in locating exhibits.	\$ 375.00	\$	862.50
			APPEAL: Proof and cite check table of authorities. Correct errors in same and send to Ms.			
12/24/2020			Burchfield for finalization and filing.	\$ 375.00		112.50
12/24/2020	Leo Wolpert	0.3	APPEAL: Edit, proofread Motion for excess pages on appeal.	\$ 250.00	\$	75.00
			APPEAL: Revisions to Response to Emergency Motion to Stay/ address further client edits			
			and proof, and confirm related filings with team. Review final Order and direct team to			
12/24/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.5	include as exhibit to Response.	\$ 500.00	\$	750.00
			Download, save, and review Order Denying Respondent Clark County Office of the			
			Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion for Stay on an Order Shortening Time; update attorneys	1		
			re same. Draft, finalize, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Order Denying Respondent Clark			
12/24/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion for Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	خ	35.00
12/24/2020	i naran bartiniela	0.2	Time. Email ivi. Lipinali re same.	1/3.00	ڔ	33.00
			APPEAL: Finalize Motion for Leave to File Response in Excess Page/Type Volume Limitation.	1		
			Create Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, Certificate of Service, finalize, file and serve all	1		
12/24/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.9	re same. Update attorneys and email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	Ś	157.50
12, 23, 2020	a.a Sarcinicia	5.5	Download, save and circulate Coroner's Opposition to LVRJ's Supplemental Motion for	7 273.00	7	237.30
12/28/2020	Lacey Ambro	0.2	Attorney's Fees and Costs. Circulate to Mr. Lipman.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
. ,	, -		Email Dept. 24 chamber to request extension on Order on Show Cause. Review court's		Ė	
12/28/2020	Lacey Ambro	0.2	response granting extension to 1/5/2021. Update calendar.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00

12/28/2020	Margaret McLetchie		Update to client. Attention to plan re work on proposed Orders.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
12/20/2020	Alina Shall		Attempt to contact Ms. Nichols regarding Order on Motion for Order to Show Cause and	¢ 275 00	,	27.50
12/29/2020	Alina Shell	0.1	production of autopsy records.	\$ 375.00	Ş	37.50
			APPEAL: Review Order Denying Motion for a stay. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, research			
12/29/2020	Alina Shell		whether Coroner could seek rehearing of the Motion, and draft short memo re same.	\$ 375.00	Ś	225.00
	Lacey Ambro		APPEAL: Download, save and circulate Order Denying Stay. Calendar accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	7	7	
		l	Review Supreme Court's denial of a stay. Related procedural research. Update client. Confer			
		l	with client. Emails to opposing counsel re obtaining records. Updates to client. Review			
12/29/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.3	petition for rehearing and confer with Ms. Shell re same/ prepare for next steps.	\$ 500.00	\$	2,150.00
12/30/2020	Alina Shell	6.7	APPEAL: Begin drafting response to emergency petition for rehearing.	\$ 375.00	\$	2,512.50
12/30/2020	Lacey Ambro	0.1	APPEAL: Download, save and circulate Emergency Petition for Rehearing.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			APPEAL: Continue review of petition for rehearing. Attention to Order on Order to Show			
			Cause. Work with Ms. Shell on response to petition; review and begin revising draft. Calls			
			with client. Review decision denying petition and circulate to client. Plan work on Order to			
	Margaret McLetchie		Show Cause if needed.	\$ 500.00		2,150.00
12/31/2020	Leo Wolpert	1.2	Research criminal contempt for disobeying court Order.	\$ 250.00	\$	300.00
		l				
			Email to opposing counsel demanding records. Call with client. Plan work re possible Order			
42/24/2020			to Show Cause. Confer with client. Attention to logistics re obtaining records. Review	A 500.00	,	4 600 00
12/31/2020	Margaret McLetchie		correspondence from Ms. Rehfeldt. Review Motion to voluntary dismiss appeal.	\$ 500.00	\$	1,600.00
42/24/2020	Dhanan Donah Galal		Download, save, and review Order Denying Motion for an Order to Show Cause; update	ć 47E 00	٠	17.50
12/31/2020	Pharan Burchfield		attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	<u> </u>	17.50
12/21/2020	Pharan Burchfield		APPEAL: Download, save, and review Motion to Voluntarily Dismiss Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	ب	17.50
	Admin Admin		Travel time to pick-up check from DA's Office for attorney's fees and costs.		\$	10.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Emails re supplemental requests.	\$ 500.00	_	100.00
1/4/2021	ivial gal et ivictetelle		Download, save, and review Notice of Entry of Order Denying Petitioner Las Vegas Review-	7 300.00	ڔ	100.00
			Journal's Motion for Order to Show Cause on Order Shortening Time; update attorneys and			
1/4/2021	Pharan Burchfield		calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	Ś	17.50
1, 1, 2021	- Haran Barannela		Follow up re proposed stipulation / process to streamline briefing on Motion for Attorney's	ψ 1/0.00	Ť	17.50
1/6/2021	Margaret McLetchie		Fees and Costs, supplement re same.	\$ 500.00	Ś	50.00
			Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct research to determine whether to exercise	7 000.00	7	
1/7/2021	Alina Shell		peremptory challenge against newly assigned judge.	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
	Alina Shell		Review and approve Peremptory Challenge.	\$ 375.00	_	37.50
		i l	Draft Peremptory Challenge of a Judge re Honorable Jessica Peterson for attorneys' review			
1/7/2021	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	and approval; finalize, file, and serve re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
		i l	Emails with Ms. Nichols re amending Motion, my efforts to make briefing more efficient.			
	Margaret McLetchie		Plan work accordingly. Update to client.	\$ 500.00	_	150.00
	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	Review and consider notice of reassignment.	\$ 500.00		50.00
1/12/2021	Margaret McLetchie				\$	50.00
		0.1	APPEAL: Review Order Dismissing Appeal.	\$ 500.00	-	
				\$ 500.00	7	
			Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29;	•		
1/12/2021	Pharan Burchfield		Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 500.00 \$ 175.00		17.50
		0.1	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and	\$ 175.00	\$	
	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	•	\$	17.50 17.50
1/12/2021	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$	17.50
1/12/2021		0.1 0.1 0.4	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval.	\$ 175.00	\$	
1/12/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$	17.50 70.00
1/12/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$	17.50
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell	0.1 0.1 0.4 1.9	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$	70.00 712.50
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert	0.1 0.4 1.9	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on supplement.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 250.00	\$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 712.50 375.00
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell	0.1 0.4 1.9	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$	70.00 712.50
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert	0.1 0.4 1.9	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on supplement. Revise stip. Emails to Ms. Nichols re same.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 250.00	\$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 712.50 375.00
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert	0.1 0.4 1.9 1.5	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on supplement. Revise stip. Emails to Ms. Nichols re same. Confer with Mr. Wolpert re work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs reply and/or	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 250.00	\$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 712.50 375.00
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert	0.1 0.4 1.9 1.5	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on supplement. Revise stip. Emails to Ms. Nichols re same. Confer with Mr. Wolpert re work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs reply and/or amended Motion - supplement. Confer with Ms. Shell re related research re fees on appeal	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 250.00	\$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 712.50 375.00
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert	0.1 0.4 1.9 1.5 0.3	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on supplement. Revise stip. Emails to Ms. Nichols re same. Confer with Mr. Wolpert re work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs reply and/or amended Motion - supplement. Confer with Ms. Shell re related research re fees on appeal and review / provide feedback re same. Revise stipulation to address concerns expressed by	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 250.00	\$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 712.50 375.00
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie	0.1 0.4 1.9 1.5 0.3	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on supplement. Revise stip. Emails to Ms. Nichols re same. Confer with Mr. Wolpert re work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs reply and/or amended Motion - supplement. Confer with Ms. Shell re related research re fees on appeal and review / provide feedback re same. Revise stipulation to address concerns expressed by Ms. Nichols. Send to client, then Ms. Nichols and follow up with her re same.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 712.50 375.00 150.00
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	0.1 0.4 1.9 1.5 0.3	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on supplement. Revise stip. Emails to Ms. Nichols re same. Confer with Mr. Wolpert re work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs reply and/or amended Motion - supplement. Confer with Ms. Shell re related research re fees on appeal and review / provide feedback re same. Revise stipulation to address concerns expressed by	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 712.50 375.00 150.00
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	0.1 0.4 1.9 1.5 0.3	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on supplement. Revise stip. Emails to Ms. Nichols re same. Confer with Mr. Wolpert re work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs reply and/or amended Motion - supplement. Confer with Ms. Shell re related research re fees on appeal and review / provide feedback re same. Revise stipulation to address concerns expressed by Ms. Nichols. Send to client, then Ms. Nichols and follow up with her re same. Review Ms. Nichols' edit to proposed Stipulation and Order. Discuss same with Ms.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 712.50 375.00 150.00
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	0.1 0.4 1.9 1.5 0.3	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on supplement. Revise stip. Emails to Ms. Nichols re same. Confer with Mr. Wolpert re work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs reply and/or amended Motion - supplement. Confer with Ms. Shell re related research re fees on appeal and review / provide feedback re same. Revise stipulation to address concerns expressed by Ms. Nichols. Send to client, then Ms. Nichols and follow up with her re same. Review Ms. Nichols' edit to proposed Stipulation and Order. Discuss same with Ms.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 712.50 375.00 150.00
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	0.1 0.4 1.9 1.5 0.3	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on supplement. Revise stip. Emails to Ms. Nichols re same. Confer with Mr. Wolpert re work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs reply and/or amended Motion - supplement. Confer with Ms. Shell re related research re fees on appeal and review / provide feedback re same. Revise stipulation to address concerns expressed by Ms. Nichols. Send to client, then Ms. Nichols and follow up with her re same. Review Ms. Nichols' edit to proposed Stipulation and Order. Discuss same with Ms. McLetchie and circulate to Mr. Lipman for review.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 712.50 375.00 150.00 500.00
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	0.1 0.4 1.9 1.5 0.3 1.0 0.2	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on supplement. Revise stip. Emails to Ms. Nichols re same. Confer with Mr. Wolpert re work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs reply and/or amended Motion - supplement. Confer with Ms. Shell re related research re fees on appeal and review / provide feedback re same. Revise stipulation to address concerns expressed by Ms. Nichols. Send to client, then Ms. Nichols and follow up with her re same. Review Ms. Nichols' edit to proposed Stipulation and Order. Discuss same with Ms. McLetchie and circulate to Mr. Lipman for review. Attention to stip re Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. [Reduced Entry.]	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 712.50 375.00 150.00 500.00
1/12/2021 1/13/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/14/2021 1/15/2021	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield Alina Shell Leo Wolpert Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	0.1 0.4 1.9 1.5 0.3 1.0 0.2	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29; Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal. Draft memo re same. Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on supplement. Revise stip. Emails to Ms. Nichols re same. Confer with Mr. Wolpert re work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs reply and/or amended Motion - supplement. Confer with Ms. Shell re related research re fees on appeal and review / provide feedback re same. Revise stipulation to address concerns expressed by Ms. Nichols. Send to client, then Ms. Nichols and follow up with her re same. Review Ms. Nichols' edit to proposed Stipulation and Order. Discuss same with Ms. McLetchie and circulate to Mr. Lipman for review. Attention to stip re Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. [Reduced Entry.] Incorporate Ms. Nichols' edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 712.50 375.00 150.00 500.00

			Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on			
1/21/2021	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward.	\$ 175.00	Ś	17.50
	Margaret McLetchie		Review message from paralegal re 1/27 hearing.	\$ 500.00	\$	50.00
1/22/2021	War gar et Wieleteine	0.1	Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming	7 300.00	7	30.00
1/22/2021	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	hearing; and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
	Margaret McLetchie		Provide Mr. Wolpert with direction re Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Follow up re hearing.	\$ 500.00	\$	50.00
1/20/2021	ivial gal et ivictettille	0.1	Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. Nichols'	\$ 300.00	ې	30.00
1/26/2021	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	assistant); and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
1/20/2021	Filaran Burchilelu	0.1	assistanty, and update attorneys re same.	٦ 1/3.00	ڔ	17.30
			Attend hearing re Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs to note that parties had submitted a			
4 /27 /2024	Alia - Chall	0.4	, ,	ć 27F 00	,	450.00
1/27/2021	Alina Snell	0.4	Stipulation and Order to extend. Obtain new hearing date and update team.	\$ 375.00	\$	150.00
			Draft, research Consolidated amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, particular			
4 /27 /2024			attention to summarizing events in litigation since November and researching awards in	A 250.00	_	4 075 00
	Leo Wolpert		district court.	\$ 250.00		1,075.00
1/2//2021	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	Check re hearing / stipulation. [Reduced Entry.]	\$ 500.00	\$	50.00
			Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees			
			and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation			
			and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing			
	Pharan Burchfield		Schedule; update attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	-	35.00
1/28/2021			Edit draft of Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 375.00		412.50
1/28/2021	Leo Wolpert	1.5	Finish drafting, researching Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 250.00	\$	375.00
			Revisions to Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; send first draft to client for			
1/29/2021	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	review.	\$ 500.00	\$	200.00
			Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing;			
			and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update			
1/29/2021	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			Edit, proof, implement Mr. Lipman's suggestions regarding Consolidated Motion for			
			Attorney's Fees and Costs, particular attention to researching and drafting arguments for			
2/1/2021	Leo Wolpert	2.7	appeal fees going back to Musso.	\$ 250.00	\$	675.00
			Review revised Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs addressing client edits			
2/1/2021	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	and send to Mr. Lipman for further review.	\$ 500.00	\$	250.00
			Attention to Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs: review and edit spreadsheet			
2/2/2021	Alina Shell	1.0	of time entries for inclusion with Consolidated Motion.	\$ 375.00	\$	375.00
			Review fee detail spreadsheet for exhibit to Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and			
2/2/2021	Lacey Ambro	1.9	Costs.	\$ 150.00	\$	285.00
	Leo Wolpert		Finalize Motion for Attorneys' Fees; work with paralegals re fees and exhibits.	\$ 250.00	\$	750.00
			, , , , , ,			
			Review further revised consolidated motion for attorney's fees and costs addressing further			
2/2/2021	Margaret McLetchie	3.0	client edits and send to Mr. Lipman for review. Work on fee detail.	\$ 500.00	\$	1,500.00
, ,	<u> </u>		Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing;		Ė	,
			and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update			
2/2/2021	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
_, _, _, _		J.1	Prepare updated spreadsheets re fees as exhibits to Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees	, =: 5.55	7	
2/2/2021	Pharan Burchfield	1.8	and Costs; finalize with attorneys; file and serve re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	315.00
_, _, _, _	Sur difficia	1.0	TOTAL ATTORNEY'S FEES	\$ 173.00	_	44,087.50
			. CITETITIONIE TO LEG	7	_	. 1,007.00

EXHIBIT 2

Date	Biller		Description	Rate	Tot	al
			Dropped off Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Opposition to Motion for Stay of District			
			Court Order and Order Shortening time at the Las Vegas Regional Justice Center: 200 Lewis			
12/7/2017	Admin Admin	0.3	Ave. Las Vegas, NV, 89101.	\$ 25.00	\$	7.50
			Dropped off Opposition to Renewed Motion for Order Shortening Time on Motion for Stay of			
			District Court Order at the Las Vegas Phoenix Building: 330 S 3rd St. Las Vegas NV, 89101		١.	
2/14/2018	Admin Admin		Department 24.	\$ 25.00	\$	12.50
			Picked up Order Denying Respondent's Renewed Motion on Order Shortening Time for Stay			
			of District Court Order at the Las Vegas Phoenix Building: 330 S 3rd St Las Vegas, NV 89101		١.	
	Admin Admin		Department 24.	\$ 25.00		17.50
10/21/2020	Admin Admin	0.9	Prepare binder for the 10/29/2020 status check hearing for Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 25.00	\$	22.50
			Began updating the Nevada Public Records Act case law binder for Ms. McLetchie's hearing			
	Admin Admin		on 10/29/2020.	\$ 25.00		22.50
· ·	Admin Admin		Continue updating the Nevada Public Records Act binder for Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 25.00	\$	52.50
10/26/2020	Admin Admin	0.9	Continued updating the Nevada Public Records Act binder for Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 25.00	\$	22.50
/ /				4		
	Admin Admin		Scanned and saved Ms. McLetchie's notes from the hearing. Updated the hearing binder.	\$ 25.00		10.00
1/4/2021	Admin Admin		Travel time to pick-up check from DA's Office for attorney's fees and costs.	\$ 25.00	\$	10.00
			Totals for Admin Admin	\$		177.50
11/27/2017	Alina Shell		Continue drafting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
			Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding NRAP 8 and Coroner's			
			obligations regarding complying with court Order to produce documents and/or moving to			
11/28/2017			stay enforcement of Order.	\$ 350.00		420.00
11/29/2017	Alina Shell	0.1	Further attention to Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
11/29/2017			Draft declaration for Ms. McLetchie in support of Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 350.00		140.00
12/5/2017	Alina Shell		Draft opposition to Motion to stay Order pending appeal.	\$ 350.00	\$	1,470.00
			Final edit of draft opposition to Motion for Stay; email to Ms. McLetchie for review and			
12/5/2017	Alina Shell		comment.	\$ 350.00	_	35.00
12/6/2017		0.6	Edit and proofread final draft of opposition to Motion to Stay.	\$ 350.00		210.00
12/12/2017	Alina Shell		In court for hearing on Coroner's Office's Motion for Stay.	\$ 350.00	\$	280.00
			APPEAL: Prepare to draft Motion for expedited consideration: review Nevada Rules of			
			Appellate Procedure and review other Supreme Court filings to verify necessary contents and			
12/14/2017	Alina Shell	0.4	structure of Motion.	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
12/15/2017	Alina Shell	2.0	APPEAL: Complete draft Motion to Expedite Appeal and circulate draft to Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 350.00	\$	700.00
			APPEAL: Revise Motion to expedite appeal pursuant to edits and suggestions from Ms.			
12/15/2017	Alina Shell		McLetchie.	\$ 350.00	\$	280.00
			Review opposition to Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, and investigate factual allegation			
			contained therein regarding Coroner's prelitigation confidentiality assertions. Research			
			regarding legislative history of NRS 239.011 and state agency interpretations of same. Confer			
12/21/2017	Alina Shell	1.4	with Ms. McLetchie re same.	\$ 350.00	\$	490.00
			Davis dustrian and the second state of Adams of Second Second Second state of Second S			
42/22/2047	A1: 61 II	2.0	Begin drafting reply to opposition to Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs: draft preliminary	A 250.00	_	700.00
12/22/2017	Alina Shell		section and section re bad faith.	\$ 350.00	\$	700.00
			Resume drafting reply to Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs: finish drafting response to			
12/25/2017	A1: 61 II	2.0	Coroner's Office argument regarding "bad faith," and respond to arguments regarding	A 250.00	_	4 222 22
12/26/2017	Alina Shell	3.8	attorneys' and paralegal's rates, and draft introduction.	\$ 350.00	Ş	1,330.00
			APPEAL: Edit and expand reply to Coroner's opposition to Motion to Expedite: Edit sections			
			drafted by Ms. McLetchie and add sections to reply to re (1) First Amendment right of access	4		
12/27/2017	Alina Shell	1.4	and (2) new litigation in district court.	\$ 350.00	\$	490.00
			APPEAL: Write Motion for leave to exceed 5-page limit set by NRAP 27 for reply to the	4		
12/27/2017	Alina Shell	0.4	Coroner's opposition to Motion to Expedite.	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
40 /0= /5 = :	A1: 6: "		Appeal of the first of the firs	A 5=5 =		4==
12/27/2017	Alina Shell		APPEAL: Final proofread and edit of reply to opposition to Motion to Expedite Appeal.	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
1015-1			APPEAL: Continue drafting Motion for leave to file a reply in excess of page limit to Coroner's	4		
12/27/2017			opposition to Motion to expedite appeal.	\$ 350.00		210.00
12/27/2017			APPEAL: Finalize draft of reply in support of Motion to Expedite Appeal.	\$ 350.00		175.00
12/28/2017	Alina Shell		APPEAL: Draft confidential settlement statement.	\$ 350.00	\$	805.00
			Draft Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, and email same to Ms. McLetchie	١.	1.	
1/17/2018	Alina Shell		for review and approval.	\$ 350.00	\$	980.00
			Per Ms. McLetchie's request, review and edit her revisions to proposed Order granting		1.	
1/17/2018	Alina Shell		Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
			Review letter to Judge Crockett from Ms. Rehfeldt regarding the proposed Order granting			
			Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review proposed Order and revise to address area of			
1/19/2018	Alina Shell	0.4	concern in Ms. Rehfeldt's letter re the scope of 239.012.	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
			FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit draft version of opposition to Motion to Stay			
	Alina Shell		Order re attorney's fees.	\$ 350.00	1 .	245.00

					1	
			APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, review the Coroner's Office's proposed joint appendix,			
2/46/2040	A1: C1 II		compare to documents filed in district court, and draft brief memorandum regarding	4 250 00	_	405.00
3/16/2018			additional documents for inclusion.	\$ 350.00		105.00
3/16/2018	Alina Shell	1.1	APPEAL: Draft opposition to consolidation.	\$ 350.00	\$	385.00
			ADDEAL Double Malabelials assured assell Malabelia assured Assels at Malabelia Assels at Coffine			
2/16/2019	Alina Chall	l I	APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, email Ms. Dell, paralegal, at Marquis Aurbach Coffing	¢ 250.00	۲	25.00
3/16/2018	Alina Sheli	0.1	regarding addition to proposed joint appendix for Coroner appeal.	\$ 350.00	>	35.00
3/19/2018	Alina Shall	0.5	APPEAL: Complete draft of opposition to Motion to consolidate appeals.	\$ 350.00	خ	175.00
3/13/2016	Allila Sileli	0.5	AFFLAL. Complete draft of opposition to Motion to consolidate appears.	\$ 330.00	۲	173.00
3/19/2018	Alina Shell	1 7	APPEAL: Edit opposition to Motion for stay of judgment re attorney's fees.	\$ 350.00	ć	595.00
3/13/2010	Allila Sileli		APPEAL: Final pre-filing edit of opposition to Motion to consolidate appeals, confer with Ms.	ÿ 330.00	7	333.00
3/19/2018	Alina Shell	l I	McLetchie re same.	\$ 350.00	Ś	35.00
0, -0, -0-0			APPEAL: Edit Motion for leave to file excess pages for opposition to Motion for stay of	7 000.00	т.	
3/19/2018	Alina Shell	l l	attorney fee award Order.	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
			APPEAL: Final pre-filing review and edit of opposition to Motion to stay Order re attorney			
3/20/2018	Alina Shell		fees and Motion for leave to file excess pages.	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
			APPEAL: Review Coroner's Office proposed joint appendix list for appeal of writ, and respond			
4/6/2018	Alina Shell		to Ms. Dell re same.	\$ 350.00	\$	105.00
		l l	FEES APPEAL: Review en banc Supreme Court opinion regarding Coroner's Motion for stay of			
4/12/2018	Alina Shell		attorney fees Order.	\$ 350.00	Ş	70.00
4/12/2010	Alina Chall	l l	FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, research regarding grounds for reconsideration of en banc decision re stay of attorney fees Order.	¢ 250.00	خ	700.00
4/12/2018 4/12/2018			FEES APPEAL: Continue research regarding en banc reconsideration.	\$ 350.00 \$ 350.00		700.00 140.00
4/12/2018	Allila Sileli		FEES APPEAL: Meeting with Mr. Wolpert to discuss possible petition for rehearing (.4).	Ç 330.00	۲	140.00
		l I	Review Justice Cherry's dissent in Order granting stay to identify potential issues to raise in			
4/13/2018	Alina Shell		petition for rehearing and conduct research re same. (.4).	\$ 350.00	\$	280.00
			FEES APPEAL: Edit and expand Mr. Wolpert's draft of petition for rehearing on stay of award			
			of attorney's fees. Legal research re NRAP 8(a) to include argument re how Order could			
			result in nullification of the rule. Edit opposition to Motion to stay enforcement of award			
4/16/2018	Alina Shell		Order pending appeal.	\$ 350.00	\$	525.00
		l I	FEES APPEAL: Complete draft of petition for rehearing and circulate to Ms. McLetchie for		١.	
4/17/2018	Alina Shell	1.0	review and comment.	\$ 350.00	\$	350.00
4/47/2040	Alia - Chall	1.1	FEEC ADDEAL Address No. No. No. No. Inches of the conference of th	ć 250.00	,	205.00
4/17/2018	Alina Snell		FEES APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to draft of petition for rehearing. FEES APPEAL: Add additional argument to Motion for rehearing pursuant to discussion with	\$ 350.00	>	385.00
4/23/2018	Alina Shell		Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
1/23/2010	7 tima Srien		FFES APPEAL: Review and incorporate Mr. Wolpert's edits to petition for rehearing, and do	ŷ 330.00	7	140.00
4/27/2018	Alina Shell	l I	additional proofreading/editing.	\$ 350.00	\$	280.00
			FEES APPEAL: pre-final review of petition for rehearing; email same to Ms. McLetchie for final			
4/30/2018	Alina Shell	0.1	review and approval.	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
4/30/2018	Alina Shell	0.2	FEES APPEAL: Incorporate final edits to petition for rehearing.	\$ 350.00	\$	70.00
			APPEAL: Email Ms. Nichols regarding intent to file Motion for Extension of Time for Filing			
6/28/2018	Alina Shell		Answering Brief for appeal.	\$ 350.00	\$	35.00
6/20/2040	A1: CL II	l I	APPEAL: Review Opening Brief filed by Coroner and conduct preliminary research re	4 250 00	_	240.00
6/28/2018 6/28/2018			arguments. APPEAL: Draft Motion for Extension of Time for Filing Answering Brief.	\$ 350.00 \$ 350.00	\$	210.00
0/20/2010	Allila Sileli	0.6	AFFLAL. DIGIT MOUNT OF EXTENSION OF TIME OF FINING ANSWERING BITET.	\$ 330.00	Ş	260.00
			APPEAL: Review Coroner Opening Brief and begin researching and outlining response to			
		l l	Coroner's statement of facts and procedural history. Meeting with Ms. McLetchie to discuss			
8/10/2018	Alina Shell	1.5	same, and discuss apportionment of different sections of Answering Brief.	\$ 350.00	\$	525.00
			APPEAL: Draft response to statement of facts and procedural history in Coroner's opening			
8/12/2018	Alina Shell		brief.	\$ 350.00	\$	1,085.00
			APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, draft portion of Answering Brief responding to			
			Coroner's Office's previously unasserted argument regarding retroactive application of		١.	
8/12/2018	Alina Shell		changes to NRS made by 2017 AB 57.	\$ 350.00	\$	420.00
0/12/2010	Alina Shall	l I	APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, draft argument for Answering Brief regarding	¢ 250.00	۲	665.00
8/12/2018	Aillia Sileli		impermissible costs for privilege review and redaction. APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and refine response to statement of facts and	\$ 350.00	\$	665.00
			procedural history for answering brief; specifically, edit section regarding hearsay and legal			
8/13/2018	Alina Shell	l I	conclusions in Mr. Fudenberg's declaration.	\$ 350.00	\$	385.00
-, -,			APPEAL: Additional attention to answering brief: edit Motion for excess pages/type-volume;	,	Ĺ	
		l I	editing all arguments and response to statement of facts/procedural history; identify			
		l I	materials needed for Respondent's Appendix; edit and approve tables for same; proofread			
			and check case law and record citations; edit and approve table of contents and table of			
8/13/2018	Alina Shell	12.3	authorities.	\$ 350.00	\$	4,305.00
0.10 - 1-				4 ===		
8/30/2018	Alina Shell	1.7	FEES APPEAL: Begin review of preliminary draft answering brief in attorney's fees appeal.	\$ 350.00	\$	595.00

1		1	T	T	_	
9/5/2018	Alina Shell	2.5	APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie's request, edit and proofread shortened answering brief.	\$ 350.00	\$	875.00
9/17/2018			FEES APPEAL: Edit 2nd Motion for Extension of time to file Answering Brief.	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
			APPEAL: Review LVMPD Motion to Strike Respondent's Appendix and conduct legal research			
- 4 4			re same. Review appendix materials at issue and our Answering Brief to see how we used the			
9/17/2018	Alina Shell	0.5	materials, and draft memo to Ms. McLetchie outlining potential response.	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
9/19/2018	Alina Shell	3.0	APPEAL: Draft Opposition to Motion to Strike Appendix and Motion to Stay Briefing.	\$ 350.00	\$	1,050.00
5, -5, -5-5			APPEAL: Edit Opposition / Response to Motion to Strike consistent with directions from Ms.	7	7	
9/21/2018	Alina Shell	0.4	McLetchie.	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
			FEES APPEAL: Review draft of Answering Brief and identify areas that need			
10/16/2018	Alina Shell		expansion/refinement; discuss same with Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
			FEES APPEAL: Draft argument for Answering Brief regarding Coroner's waiver of claim that			
			Review-Journal failed to submit a memorandum of costs and response to Coroner's argument regarding the award of \$165 in fees for support staff. Edit and refine statement of			
10/17/2018	Alina Shell	2.6	facts; edit statement of case.	\$ 350.00	ς	910.00
10/1//2010	Aunia Silen		FEES APPEAL: Resume work on Answering Brief: edit standards of review; draft section	7 330.00	_	310.00
			regarding legislative history; edit and expand section responding to argument that attorneys			
10/18/2018	Alina Shell		fees are "damages".	\$ 350.00	\$	2,555.00
			FEES APPEAL: Check legal and statutory citations on current draft of brief and correct as			
10/18/2018	Alina Shell	1.6	necessary.	\$ 350.00	\$	560.00
			FFFC ADDITAL. Fundand arguments in Anguaring Drief regarding the Covernal contraction			
			FEES APPEAL: Expand arguments in Answering Brief regarding the Coroner's unpreserved arguments re memorandum of costs and administrative staff time; address Coroner's			
			arguments regarding the "American Rule;" review opening brief and draft answering brief in			
			tandem to make sure each argument addressed; address argument regarding LCB			
			recommendations to amend NPRA. Check record and brief citations, proofread in tandem			
10/19/2018	Alina Shell	8.0	with Mr. Wolpert, and review final version of brief.	\$ 350.00	\$	2,800.00
					١.	
10/24/2018	Alina Shell	0.9	APPEAL: Begin drafting notice of supplemental authorities re recent decision in PERS v. NPRI.	\$ 350.00	\$	315.00
10/25/2019	Alina Chall	1.0	APPEAL: Continued drafting notice of supplemental authorities. Edit pursuant to Ms. McLetchie's direction.	\$ 350.00	ے	665.00
10/25/2018	Allila Sileli	1.9	APPEAL: Revise notice of Supplemental Authorities in light of Clark County School District	\$ 330.00	Ş	665.00
10/29/2018	Alina Shell	0.6	("CCSD") opinion.	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
			APPEAL: Address questions from Mr. Kane regarding arguments in briefs and timeline for			
			resolution of appeal. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, review Coroner's reply brief and conduct			
			research regarding (1) whether factual allegations in the Coroner's reply brief are false; (2)			
			whether we can file a Motion to strike arguments raised in the Coroner's reply that might be false, and (3) whether we should request leave to file a surreply to address the Coroner's			
			arguments regarding the recent Supreme Court decision in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-			
12/4/2018	Alina Shell	1.1	,	\$ 350.00	\$	385.00
12/13/2018	Alina Shell	0.6	APPEAL: Begin drafting Motion for Leave to File Surreply.	\$ 350.00	\$	210.00
			APPEAL: Attention to Surreply: conduct legal research regarding whether family members			
12/13/2018	Alina Shell	0.5	can assert personal privacy interest for deceased person.	\$ 350.00	\$	175.00
			ADDEAL Paguma work on proposed Corresponded introduction for the language			
			APPEAL: Resume work on proposed Surreply: draft introduction, factual argument regarding the release of autopsy reports in Colorado child death investigation, and argument regarding			
12/14/2018	Alina Shell	4.4	application of the new balancing test set forth in CCSD v. Las Vegas Review-Journal.	\$ 350.00	\$	1,540.00
12/21/2018			APPEAL: Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Surreply.	\$ 350.00	\$	140.00
			APPEAL: Review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Conduct legal research and			
1/23/2019	Alina Shell		draft reply to same.	\$ 350.00	\$	840.00
Ι., Τ			FEES APPEAL: Draft and distribute response to the Coroner's September 23, 2019 Notice of	.	١. ً	_
10/3/2019	Alina Shell	1.4	Supplemental Authorities regarding the 2019 legislative session.	\$ 350.00	\$	490.00
			FEES APPEAL: Expand response to Coroner's Notice of Supplemental Authorities pursuant to			
			comments and direction from Ms. McLetchie: add in facts from 1993 legislative session			
10/3/2019	Alina Shell	1.8	regarding NRS 239.011 and facts from the 2019 session regarding amendments to the NPRA.	\$ 350.00	\$	630.00
,			APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with oral argument prep by creating outline	1	Ė	
10/5/2019	Alina Shell	2.4	regarding substantive claims on appeal.	\$ 350.00	\$	840.00
10/-/-			APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue assisting Ms. McLetchie with oral argument preparation			
10/6/2019	Alina Shell	1.0	by reviewing Coroner's Reply Brief and including responses to arguments in outline.	\$ 350.00	\$	350.00
			APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Provide additional assistance to Ms. McLetchie in preparing for	l .	l	
			1			
10/6/2019	Alina Shell		oral argument: find record citations for possible reference at argument, expand outline at Ms. McLetchie's request, and moot Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 350.00	Ś	770.00

			Per Ms. McLetchie's request, work on chart regarding evidence demonstrating public		١.	
	Alina Shell		interest in access to autopsy reports.	\$ 375.00		750.00
5/7/2020	Alina Shell		Resume work on chart regarding interest in access to autopsy reports.	\$ 375.00	\$	637.50
			Make additional edits to chart regarding interest in access based on comments and			
5/7/2020	Alina Shell	0.8	information provided by Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 375.00	\$	300.00
			Attention to post-remand opening brief: complete statement of facts/procedural history,			
			draft section re NPRA standards, section re CCSD case, and section re interest in access to			
8/9/2020	Alina Shell		juvenile autopsy reports.	\$ 375.00	\$	1,612.50
			Expand draft of opening brief consistent with direction from Ms. McLetchie: expand section			
			regarding CCSD test, conduct legal research and draft section regarding limited application of			
			CCSD/Cameranesi test, restructure argument regarding public interest in access to autopsy			
8/10/2020	Alina Shell	5.8	reports.	\$ 375.00	\$	2,175.00
			Continued attention to opening brief: draft facts regarding the sample redacted autopsy			
8/12/2020			reports provided by the Coroner pre-litigation and expand argument re those redactions.	\$ 375.00		825.00
8/21/2020	Alina Shell		Address Mr. Lipman's edit's to draft of opening brief on remand.	\$ 375.00	\$	525.00
8/23/2020	Alina Shell	2.8	Resume editing opening brief on remand.	\$ 375.00	\$	1,050.00
			Address Ms. McLetchie's further edits to opening brief: add in facts about the 1 October			
			coroner case, add in additional facts relevant to requests in this matter, add in case law			
8/24/2020	Alina Shell	3.8	regarding other courts' approach to balancing tests for FOIA Exemption 6.	\$ 375.00	\$	1,425.00
			Address Mr. Lipman's and Ms. McLetchie's edits, comments, and directions regarding post-			
8/26/2020	Alina Shell	2.4	remand opening brief.	\$ 375.00	\$	900.00
			Incorporate additional edits from Ms. McLetchie and Mr. Lipman into pre-final draft of			
8/27/2020	Alina Shell	6.1	opening brief on remand; finalize and file same.	\$ 375.00	\$	2,287.50
8/27/2020	Alina Shell	0.6	Proof and edit tables of opening brief and approve for filing.	\$ 375.00	\$	225.00
9/25/2020	Alina Shell	0.1	Review and approve stipulation re briefing schedule.	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
			Review answer filed by Coroner to supplemental opening brief and begin drafting reply, with			
10/15/2020	Alina Shell		focus on analyzing cases cited by Coroner regarding redaction	\$ 375.00	\$	1,650.00
10/16/2020			Resume work on reply in support of post-remand brief.	\$ 375.00	\$	487.50
10/18/2020	Alina Shell	6.2	Additional attention to draft of reply in support of supplemental opening brief on remand.	\$ 375.00	Ś	2,325.00
10/19/2020			Complete draft of reply in support of supplemental brief on remand.	\$ 375.00		487.50
				7 0.0.00	7	
10/20/2020	Alina Shell	1 5	Address Mr. Lipman's edits to reply in support of supplemental opening brief on remand.	\$ 375.00	Ś	562.50
10/20/2020	7 till to Stren		Review and address Mr. Lipman's comments to second draft of reply in support of opening	ŷ 373.00	~	302.30
			brief on remand. Edit and expand draft reply consistent with comments and case law			
10/22/2020	Alina Shell		provided by Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 375.00	¢	787.50
10/22/2020	Allila Sileli	2.1	Proofread and correct table of content and table of authorities for reply in support of	J 373.00	۲	767.50
10/22/2020	Alina Shall	0.2	opening brief on remand. Approve brief for filing.	\$ 375.00	ė	112.50
10/22/2020	Allila Sileli	0.3	Assist Ms. McLetchie with preparation for argument: conduct legal research re law of the	373.00	ې	112.30
10/20/2020	Alina Chall	1 1	case doctrine and summarize same.	ć 27F 00	۲.	412 50
10/29/2020	Allila Sileli		Begin drafting Order regarding supplemental briefing on remand. Confer with Ms. McLetchie	\$ 375.00	<u>ې</u>	412.50
11/0/2020	Alia - Chall		Begin draiting Order regarding supplemental briefing on remand. Confer with Ms. McLetchie			
11/9/2020				ć 27F 00	,	675.00
44 /40 /2020		1.8	re same.	\$ 375.00		675.00
11/10/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing.	\$ 375.00	\$	1,425.00
11/12/2020	Alina Shell Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$	1,425.00 787.50
11/12/2020 11/13/2020	Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand.	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50
11/12/2020	Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order.	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020	Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020	Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same.	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020	Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020	Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors.	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020	Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors.	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	675.00 1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to stay.	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020 11/23/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8 1.6	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020 11/23/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8 0.2	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts.	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00 75.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020 11/23/2020 11/23/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8 0.2	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00 75.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020 11/23/2020 11/23/2020 11/29/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8 0.2	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce autopsy reports.	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00 75.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020 11/23/2020 11/23/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8 0.2	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand. Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce autopsy reports. Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to Motion to stay.	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00 75.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020 11/23/2020 11/23/2020 11/29/2020 11/30/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8 0.2 1.6 1.5	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce autopsy reports. Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00 75.00 600.00 562.50
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020 11/23/2020 11/23/2020 11/29/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8 0.2 1.6 1.5	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce autopsy reports. Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal.	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00 75.00 600.00 562.50
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020 11/23/2020 11/29/2020 11/30/2020 11/30/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8 0.2 1.6 1.5 1.1	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce autopsy reports. Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal. Edit and provide comments and suggestions regarding Mr. Wolpert's draft Motion for	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00 75.00 600.00 562.50 412.50
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020 11/23/2020 11/23/2020 11/29/2020 11/30/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8 0.2 1.6 1.5 1.1 0.5 0.8	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce autopsy reports. Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal. Edit and provide comments and suggestions regarding Mr. Wolpert's draft Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00
11/12/2020 11/13/2020 11/13/2020 11/18/2020 11/22/2020 11/23/2020 11/29/2020 11/30/2020 11/30/2020	Alina Shell	1.8 3.8 2.1 0.3 0.2 0.3 5.8 0.2 1.6 1.5 1.1 0.5 0.8	Resume drafting proposed Order regarding remand briefing. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to first draft of proposed Order on remand Review and make additional edits to draft proposed Order on remand. Review and accept changes to draft proposed Order. Review and assess Ms. Nichols' redline of proposed Order on remand; email Ms. McLetchie re same. Expand opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal: complete procedural history and respond to Coroner's arguments re NRAP 8 stay factors. Locate and provide record citations to Ms. McLetchie for inclusion in opposition to Motion to stay. Draft section of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal to address the Coroner's assertion that the absence of a stay would moot its claims and assist Ms. McLetchie with Motion by researching prior stay Motions granted or denied by other district courts. Edit opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal of Order directing Coroner to produce autopsy reports. Review, address, and incorporate Mr. Lipman's edits and comments to draft opposition to Motion to stay. Address Ms. McLetchie's edits and comments to opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal. Edit and provide comments and suggestions regarding Mr. Wolpert's draft Motion for	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	1,425.00 787.50 112.50 75.00 112.50 2,175.00 75.00 600.00 562.50 412.50

	T					
42/0/2020	Alice - Chall		Attention to Motion for attorney's fees: review and accept Mr. Lipman's changes to Motion.	ć 27F 00	_	200.00
12/8/2020			Add in argument and exhibit re fee award in CIR v. LVMPD matter.	\$ 375.00	_	300.00
12/8/2020	Alina Shell		Attention to verifying information for December 15 County Commission meeting.	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
42/0/2020	A1: C1 II		Per Ms. McLetchie's request, review Coroner opposition to Order to Show Cause and provide		_	275.00
12/9/2020	Alina Shell	1.0	suggested responses to same.	\$ 375.00	Ş	375.00
			Attention to hearing on Motion for Order to Show Cause: research Nevada case law	4	_	
12/10/2020			regarding contempt proceedings.	\$ 375.00		375.00
12/10/2020	Alina Shell	0.6	Observe hearing on Motion for stay and Motion for Order to Show Cause.	\$ 375.00	\$	225.00
					١.	
12/11/2020	Alina Shell	0.1	Attention to Motion for attorney fees: verify prior rates for attorney and staff time.	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
			Attention to Motion for attorney's fees: review supporting documentation and fees		١.	
12/11/2020	Alina Shell		information.	\$ 375.00	\$	412.50
			Draft letter on behalf of Nevada Open Government Coalition to County Commission re	4	_	
12/11/2020			coroner request for approval of appeal.	\$ 375.00	_	600.00
12/11/2020			Attention to fees Motion: review and edit spreadsheet of fees.	\$ 375.00	\$	262.50
12/11/2020	Alina Shell	0.5	Edit and proofread final draft of Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
			Attention to Order Denying Motion for stay: review transcript of hearing on Motion for stay			
12/15/2020	Alina Shell		pending appeal and begin drafting Order.	\$ 375.00	\$	862.50
			Complete draft of Order Denying the Coroner's Motion for stay pending appeal. Circulate			
12/16/2020			same to Ms. McLetchie for review.	\$ 375.00		975.00
12/18/2020	Alina Shell		Address Ms. McLetchie's edits to Order Denying Motion for stay.	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
			APPEAL: Edit draft of response to Motion for stay pending appeal: update draft to include			
			record and case citations, expand arguments, edit for content and clarity, and review for			
12/20/2020	Alina Shell		proposed changes to reduce page count.	\$ 375.00	\$	1,612.50
			APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie with citation format for articles cited in opposition to Motion			
12/21/2020			for stay.	\$ 375.00	\$	112.50
12/21/2020	Alina Shell		APPEAL: Edit latest draft of opposition to Motion for stay pending appeal.	\$ 375.00	\$	1,575.00
			Attention to proposed Order Denying Motion for stay: proofread and edit Order, proofread			
/ /			letter to court re competing Orders, and direct staff re submission to court. Email opposing	4	_	
12/22/2020	Alina Shell		counsel re same.	\$ 375.00	\$	187.50
			APPEAL: Address Mr. Lipman's edits to response to emergency Motion for stay pending			
12/22/2020	Alina Shell		appeal.	\$ 375.00	\$	600.00
			APPEAL: Address additional edits from Mr. Lipman to response to emergency Motion for stay			
12/23/2020	Alina Shell	1.2	pending appeal. Draft Motion for leave to exceed page limit.	\$ 375.00	Ş	450.00
			ADDEAL AND AT A COLUMN AS A CO			
/ /			APPEAL: Attention to response to emergency Motion for stay: make additional edits to draft	4	_	
12/24/2020	Alina Shell	2.3	response. Edit Motion for excess pages. Assist Ms. Burchfield in locating exhibits.	\$ 375.00	Ş	862.50
/ /			APPEAL: Proof and cite check table of authorities. Correct errors in same and send to Ms.	4	_	
12/24/2020	Alina Shell	_	Burchfield for finalization and filing.	\$ 375.00	Ş	112.50
12/20/2020	A1: C1 II		Attempt to contact Ms. Nichols regarding Order on Motion for Order to Show Cause and	d 275 00	_	27.50
12/29/2020	Alina Shell	0.1	production of autopsy records.	\$ 375.00	\$	37.50
12/20/2020	A1: C1 II		APPEAL: Review Order Denying Motion for a stay. Per Ms. McLetchie's request, research	d 275 00	_	225.00
12/29/2020			whether Coroner could seek rehearing of the Motion, and draft short memo re same.	\$ 375.00	-	225.00
12/30/2020	Alina Shell		APPEAL: Begin drafting response to emergency petition for rehearing.	\$ 375.00	\$	2,512.50
1/7/2021	Alina Chall		Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct research to determine whether to exercise	ć 27F 00	۲.	75.00
	Alina Shell Alina Shell		peremptory challenge against newly assigned judge. Review and approve Peremptory Challenge.	\$ 375.00 \$ 375.00	_	75.00 37.50
1///2021	Allila Sileli		Per Ms. McLetchie's request, conduct legal research regarding entitlement to fees on appeal.	\$ 373.00	ې	37.30
1/14/2021	Alina Shell		Draft memo re same.	\$ 375.00	\$	712.50
1/14/2021	Allila Sileli		Review Ms. Nichols' edit to proposed Stipulation and Order. Discuss same with Ms.	\$ 373.00	۲	712.50
1/15/2021	Alina Shell		McLetchie and circulate to Mr. Lipman for review.	\$ 375.00	\$	75.00
1/15/2021	Allila Sileli	0.2	Medeterne and circulate to Mr. Elpinari for Teview.	7 373.00	7	75.00
			Attend hearing re Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs to note that parties had submitted a			
1/27/2021	Alina Shell		Stipulation and Order to extend. Obtain new hearing date and update team.	\$ 375.00	ć	150.00
1/28/2021			Edit draft of Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 375.00	\$	412.50
1/20/2021	Allia Sileli	1.1	Attention to Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs: review and edit spreadsheet	-	7	412.50
2/2/2021	Alina Shell	1.0	of time entries for inclusion with Consolidated Motion.	\$ 375.00	Ś	375.00
2/2/2021	7 tillia Sileli		Totals for Alina M. Shell (2020-2021)	\$ 373.00		42,600.00
			Grand Total for Alina M. Shell	\$		82,780.00
						,
7/2/2018	Carly Krygier	0.1	Review and edit Public Records Act request regarding fees paid to outside counsel in case.	\$ 200.00	\$	20.00
. ,	, ,,,,,		FEES APPEAL:Outline the Coroner's brief and the Las Vegas Review-Journal's corresponding		Ĺ	
8/22/2018	Jessica Brown		arguments in the lower court.	\$ 200.00	\$	1,100.00
	Jessica Brown		FEES APPEAL: Discuss Reply brief with Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 200.00	\$	100.00
			FEES APPEAL: Copy edit text, review the content of citations, and copy edit citations for the		Ĺ	
8/23/2018	Jessica Brown	5.4	LVRJ's response to the LVMPD's Writ of Mandamus.	\$ 200.00	\$	1,080.00

##55.PFFAL Review the case law cited by the Coroner regarding whether we have to wait unit the auditativity expend has been decided to collect advisory Fees. Report to Ms. \$ 200.00 \$ 100.00 \$							
PESS APPEAL Reviewed Coroner's opening brief on attorney's fees, created outline to soldiness Coroner's agruments and case law; largest to draft brief based on the action in the soldiness Coroner's agruments and case law; largest to draft brief based on the action in the soldiness Coroner's agruments and case law; largest to draft brief based on the action in the soldiness coroner's agruments and case law; begin to draft brief based on the action in the soldiness coroner's agruments and case law; begin to draft brief based on the agruments and case law; begin to draft brief based on the agruments and case law; begin to draft brief based on the agruments and case law; begin to draft brief based on the agruments and case law; begin to draft brief based and case law; begin to draft brief based and case law; begin to coroner's opening brief reparting attorney's fees; by addressing \$2,000.0 \$ 1,040.00 \$				FEES APPEAL: Review the case law cited by the Coroner regarding whether we have to wait			
FEES APPEAL Reviewed Coroner's opening brief on attorney's fees, created outline to address Coroner's arguments and case law; began to draft brief based on the action in the address Coroner's arguments and case law; began to draft brief based on the action in the APPEAL Counter of the APPEAL COUNTER COUNTER OF THE APPEAL COUNT	0 /00 /00 4				4	_	
Address Coroner's arguments and case law, began to draft brief based on the action in the section in the section of the sect	8/23/2018	Jessica Brown	0.5	McLetchie re same.	\$ 200.00	Ş	100.00
Address Coroner's arguments and case law, began to draft brief based on the action in the section in the section of the sect				FEES APPEAL: Reviewed Coroner's opening brief on attorney's fees, created outline to			
\$2,72,018 lessica Brown 2,4 10 of art burst 10 of any pure training to the lower court. \$2,000 \$2,000 \$3,000 \$4				· · · ·			
\$2,270.18 Jessica Brown 2.4 for darb fired based on the arguments made in the lower court. \$2,00.00 \$ 4,00.00	8/24/2018	Jessica Brown	3.8		\$ 200.00	\$	760.00
				FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft outline to address Coroner's arguments and case law; begin			
\$2,00,00 \$1,040,00	8/27/2018	Jessica Brown	2.4	to draft brief based on the arguments made in the lower court.	\$ 200.00	\$	480.00
FEES_APPEAL: Continue to draft and review appellate brief by outlining the case law in the Coroner's opening brief, responding with the arguments we made in the Womer court, and FEES_APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorney's less, specifically the arguments about the lack of ambiguity between the fees provision and the damages provision in Nevada Revised				FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft opening brief regarding attorney's fees by addressing			
Coroner's opening brief, responding with the arguments we made in the lower court, and 1 adding case law that is responsive to the Coroner on appeal.	8/28/2018	Jessica Brown	5.2	_	\$ 200.00	\$	1,040.00
2.1 adding case law that is responsive to the Coroner on appeal. \$20.00 \$ 1,420.00				FEES APPEAL: Continue to draft and revise appellate brief by outlining the case law in the			
FEES APPEAL (Continue to draft appellate brief for attorney's fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPAA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPAA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the review for factual disputes in lower for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that 1 supports a plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly controldicts the Coroner's Colonium, 200 plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly controldicts the Coroner's Colonium, 200 plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly controldicts the Coroner's Colonium, 200 plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly controldicts the Coroner's Colonium, 200 plain reading of the NPRA - case law that directly controldicts the Coroner's Opening brief reparding attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's Opening brief reparding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 6. He has are statute. PEES APPEAL Review Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's Opening brief reparding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 6. He has are statute. PEES APPEAL Review Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's Opening brief reparding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 6. He has are statute. PEES APPEAL Review Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's							
Jack of ambiguity between the fees provision and the damages provision in Newda Revised \$200.00 \$ 280.00	8/29/2018	Jessica Brown	7.1		\$ 200.00	\$	1,420.00
1.4 Statutes section 239. \$ 200.00 \$ 280.00 \$							
FEES APPEAL Continue to draft appellate brief for attorneys' fees. Incorporate case law to respond to Coroner's scale and on the standard of review for the NRAA, and the standard of review for the NRAA, and the standard of review for factual disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the 3.2 NPRA.	0/1/0010				4	_	
exepond to Coroner's case law on the standard of review for the NPRA, and the standard of review for for forcial disputes regarding fees. Incorporated a section on the background of the provided in the pr	9/4/2018	Jessica Brown	1.4		\$ 200.00	\$	280.00
1,9/8/2018 Jessica Brown 3.2 A PRPA.							
Sessica Brown 3.2 APRA							
FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that 1.9 supports a plain reading of the NPPA - case law that directly contradicts the Coroner's claims 5 200.00 \$ 380.00 \$	0/0/2010	Jossica Prown	2.2		\$ 200.00	خ	640.00
9/10/2018 Jessica Brown	9/0/2010	Jessica Brown	3.2	INFRA.	\$ 200.00	Ş	640.00
9/10/2018 Jessica Brown				FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief for attorneys' fees Addressing case law in Nevada that			
FEES APPEAL: Revise appellate brief by including further facts and arguments from the dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's \$200.00 \$ 760.00	9/10/2018	Jessica Brown	1.9		\$ 200.00	Ś	380.00
dispute in lower courts for the Reply to the Coroner's Opening Brief regarding attorney's \$ 200.00 \$ 760.00 \$ 760.00 \$ 750.00 \$ 7	3/10/2010	500000 510 1111	1.0		ψ 200.00	Ť	550.00
FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in 10/18/2018 Jessica Brown	9/11/2018	Jessica Brown	3.8		\$ 200.00	\$	760.00
9/15/2018 Jacey Ambro 6.8 the same statute. 5.200.00 5.1,360.00				FEES APPEAL: Revise Answering brief for Attorney's fees. Address specific case law in the			
FEES APPEAL: Research for Review-Journal Answering Brief regarding statutory interpretation of provisions that appear in sequential Order ("back to back"): email memo to 0.8 Ms. Shell re same. \$200.00 \$ 160.00				Coroner's opening brief regarding the NPRA and the lack of conflict between provisions in			
Interpretation of provisions that appear in sequential Order ("back to back"): email memo to 10,18/2018 Ms. Shell re same.	9/15/2018	Jessica Brown	6.8	the same statute.	\$ 200.00	\$	1,360.00
10/18/2018 Lessica Brown				FEES APPEAL: Research for Review-Journal Answering Brief regarding statutory			
12/11/2017 Lacey Ambro				interpretation of provisions that appear in sequential Order ("back to back"): email memo to			
12/11/2017 Lacey Ambro	10/18/2018	Jessica Brown			-		
1/5/2018 Lacey Ambro				·	т		-
1/5/2018 Lacey Ambro 0.3 Dropped off Courtesy Copy Binder to Judge Crockett re: Motion for Attorney's Fees. \$ 50.00 \$ 15.00 Prepare Hearing binder regarding Respondent's Renewed Motion for Order Shortening Time 2/14/2018 Lacey Ambro 0.8 on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. \$ 50.00 \$ 40.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 \$ 95.00 3/2/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.1 Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. \$ 50.00 \$ 5.00 4.1 Totals for Lacey Ambro (0.1 Process) Incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar 5/18/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.1 accordingly. \$ 205.00 Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 accodingly. \$ 150.00 \$ 60.00 Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Effle/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 2. Dees/costs. Begin charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. \$ 150.00 \$ 50.00 12/8/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs breakdown and redactions					·	_	
Prepare Hearing binder regarding Respondent's Renewed Motion for Order Shortening Time 2/14/2018 Lacey Ambro 0.8 on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. \$ 50.00 \$ 40.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 \$ 95.00 3/2/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.1 Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. 4.1 Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar 1.5/18/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.1 accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar 1.1/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Effile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate Same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 12/3/2020 Lacey Ambro 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. S 150.00 \$ 60.00 12/8/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 filing fees sections and provide input. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filing fees sections and provide input. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Fees sections and provide input. Download, save and circulate to Judge Crockett. Finalize Same. Finalize Order Denying	1/5/2018	Lacey Ambro	0.6	Prepare Judge's Courtesy Copy and Hearing Binder re: Motion for Attorney's Fees.	\$ 50.00	\$	30.00
Prepare Hearing binder regarding Respondent's Renewed Motion for Order Shortening Time 2/14/2018 Lacey Ambro 0.8 on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. \$ 50.00 \$ 40.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 \$ 95.00 3/2/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.1 Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. 4.1 Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar 1.5/18/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.1 accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar 1.1/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Effile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate Same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 12/3/2020 Lacey Ambro 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. S 150.00 \$ 60.00 12/8/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 filing fees sections and provide input. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filing fees sections and provide input. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Fees sections and provide input. Download, save and circulate to Judge Crockett. Finalize Same. Finalize Order Denying	1/5/2010	Lacov Ambro	0.2	Dropped off Courtesy Copy Rinder to Judge Crockett re: Motion for Attorney's Fees	\$ 50.00	خ	15.00
2/14/2018 Lacey Ambro 0.8 on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. \$ 50.00 \$ 40.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 \$ 95.00 \$ 4.1 Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar 0.1 accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (W/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar (3) Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Effle/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 same. Calendar accordingly. 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPAR letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 5.00.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 filling fees sections and provide input. 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Regin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and provide input. 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 0.6 Costs. Generate and provoferad draft bill. Position of the provided in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 0.6 Costs. Generate and provide input. 1.2 information of the provided input. 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Review time entry to ensure correct entrie	1/3/2018	Lacey Ambro	0.5	propped on courtesy copy billion to studge crockett re. Motion for Attorney 5 rees.	ÿ 30.00	۲	13.00
2/14/2018 Lacey Ambro 0.8 on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. \$ 50.00 \$ 40.00 APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 \$ 95.00 \$ 4.1 Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar 0.1 accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (W/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar (3) Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Effle/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 same. Calendar accordingly. 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPAR letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 5.00.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 filling fees sections and provide input. 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Regin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and provide input. 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 0.6 Costs. Generate and provoferad draft bill. Position of the provided in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 0.6 Costs. Generate and provide input. 1.2 information of the provided input. 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Review time entry to ensure correct entrie							
APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 1.9 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). \$ 50.00 \$ 95.00 \$ 5.				Prepare Hearing binder regarding Respondent's Renewed Motion for Order Shortening Time		ļ	
9/26/2019 Lacey Ambro	2/14/2018	Lacey Ambro	0.8		\$ 50.00	\$	40.00
3/2/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.1 Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. 4.1 Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) \$ 205.00 5/18/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.1 accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Effle/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and 12/9/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/1/1/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize order Denying	2/14/2018	Lacey Ambro	0.8		\$ 50.00	\$	40.00
4.1 Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save, and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing \$150.00 \$ 60.00 Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing \$150.00 \$ 300.00 Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of 12/2 information referenced to attorneys. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and 12/8/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 filing fees sections and provide input. \$150.00 \$ 60.00 Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. Download. Save and circulate to 10 dege Crockett. Finalize Same. Finalize Order Denying	2/14/2018	Lacey Ambro	0.8	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 50.00	\$	40.00
Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar 5/18/2020 Lacey Ambro Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro Download, save, and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Effle/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro O.4 same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 12/3/2020 Lacey Ambro Continue charting information. Continue charting information. Continue charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of lacey Ambro 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and lacey Ambro 0.4 filling fees sections and provide input. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and lacey Ambro O.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and lacey Ambro O.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize Same. Finalize Order Denying				on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October	\$ 50.00	\$	
5/18/2020 Lacey Ambro O.1 accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar 1/20/2020 Lacey Ambro O.4 accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Effle/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 1/20/2020 Lacey Ambro O.4 same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 1/2/4/2020 Lacey Ambro O.4 and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 8. Stood 9. S	9/26/2019	Lacey Ambro	1.9	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument).	\$ 50.00	\$	95.00
Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing \$ 150.00 \$ 60.00 Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Begin charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. S 150.00 \$ 180.00 12/8/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 filing fees sections and provide input. \$ 150.00 \$ 60.00 A filing fees sections and provide input. \$ 150.00 \$ 60.00 \$ 12/9/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and Provided the series of the serie	9/26/2019	Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys.	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00	\$	95.00 5.00
hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 12/3/2020 Lacey Ambro 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Segin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and 12/8/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 filling fees sections and provide input. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. Part competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize Same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$	\$	95.00 5.00 205.00
(3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 12/3/2020 Lacey Ambro 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and 12/8/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. \$ 150.00 \$ 90.00	9/26/2019 3/2/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly.	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$	\$	95.00 5.00 205.00
11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 11/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of information referenced to attorneys. 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filing fees sections and provide input. 12/8/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 filing fees sections and provide input. S 150.00 \$ 60.00 12/9/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$	\$	95.00 5.00 205.00
Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 11/20/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 same. Calendar accordingly. \$150.00 \$60.00 Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize 0.4 and email. \$150.00 \$60.00 Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information. \$150.00 \$300.00 Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of 12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. \$150.00 \$180.00 Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and 0.4 filling fees sections and provide input. \$150.00 \$60.00 12/9/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. \$150.00 \$75.00 Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. \$150.00 \$90.00	9/26/2019 3/2/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$	\$	95.00 5.00 205.00
finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate 1/20/2020 Lacey Ambro Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of information referenced to attorneys. Regin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filling fees sections and provide input. \$ 150.00 \$ 180.00 \$ 180.00 \$ 12/9/2020 Lacey Ambro O.4 filling fees sections and provide input. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and O.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. \$ 150.00 \$ 90.00 \$ 90.00	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ \$ 150.00	\$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00
11/20/2020Lacey Ambro0.4same. Calendar accordingly.\$ 150.00\$ 60.0011/24/2020Lacey Ambro0.4Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email.\$ 150.00\$ 60.0012/3/2020Lacey Ambro2.0Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of information referenced to attorneys.\$ 150.00\$ 180.0012/4/2020Lacey Ambro1.2information referenced to attorneys.\$ 150.00\$ 180.0012/8/2020Lacey Ambro0.4filling fees sections and provide input.\$ 150.00\$ 60.0012/9/2020Lacey Ambro0.5Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions.\$ 150.00\$ 75.00Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 0.60.6Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill.\$ 150.00\$ 90.0012/11/2020Lacey Ambro0.6Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill.\$ 150.00\$ 90.00	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly.	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ \$ 150.00	\$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00
Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. \$ 150.00 \$ 60.00 Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 12/3/2020 Lacey Ambro 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information. \$ 150.00 \$ 300.00 Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of information referenced to attorneys. \$ 150.00 \$ 180.00 Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filling fees sections and provide input. \$ 150.00 \$ 60.00 12/9/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. \$ 150.00 \$ 75.00 Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. \$ 150.00 \$ 90.00 Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ \$ 150.00	\$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00
1/24/2020 Lacey Ambro 1/2/3/2020 Lacey Ambro 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of 1/2/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filling fees sections and provide input. \$ 150.00 \$ 180.00 1/2/9/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 filling fees sections and provide input. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. \$ 150.00 \$ 90.00 Parft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00
Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing 12/3/2020 Lacey Ambro Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of information referenced to attorneys. Segin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filling fees sections and provide input. Significant filling fees sections and provide input. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and O.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. Significant from 12/3/2020 Proposition from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Significant from	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (w/Hearing date) and (3) Notice of Entry of Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accordingly.	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00
12/3/2020 Lacey Ambro 2.0 Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of information referenced to attorneys. S 150.00 \$ 180.00 Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filling fees sections and provide input. S 150.00 \$ 60.00 12/9/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1 0.4	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00 60.00
Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Segin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filing fees sections and provide input. \$ 150.00 \$ 180.00 12/8/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 filing fees sections and provide input. \$ 150.00 \$ 60.00 12/9/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. \$ 150.00 \$ 90.00 Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1 0.4	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email.	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00 60.00
Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of 1.2/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filing fees sections and provide input. \$ 150.00 \$ 60.00 12/9/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020 11/20/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1 0.4 0.4	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00 60.00
12/4/2020 Lacey Ambro 1.2 information referenced to attorneys. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filing fees sections and provide input. \$ 150.00 \$ 180.00 \$ 12/8/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 filing fees sections and provide input. \$ 150.00 \$ 60.00 12/9/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020 11/20/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1 0.4 0.4	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Begin charting information.	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00 60.00
Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and 12/8/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.4 filing fees sections and provide input. \$150.00 \$ 60.00 12/9/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. \$150.00 \$ 75.00 Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. \$150.00 \$ 90.00 Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020 11/20/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1 0.4 0.4	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms.	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00 60.00
12/8/2020 Lacey Ambro0.4 filling fees sections and provide input.\$ 150.00\$ 60.0012/9/2020 Lacey Ambro0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions.\$ 150.00\$ 75.00Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill.\$ 150.00\$ 90.00Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020 11/20/2020 11/24/2020 12/3/2020	Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1 0.4 0.4 0.4	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00 60.00 60.00 300.00
12/9/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.5 Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and 12/11/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.6 Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill. Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020 11/20/2020 11/24/2020 12/3/2020	Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1 0.4 0.4 0.4	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accordingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of information referenced to attorneys.	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00 60.00 60.00 300.00
12/11/2020Lacey Ambro0.6Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill.\$ 150.00\$ 90.00Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020 11/24/2020 12/3/2020	Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1 0.4 0.4 0.4 2.0	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of information referenced to attorneys. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00 60.00 60.00 300.00
Draft competing Orders letter to Judge Crockett. Finalize same. Finalize Order Denying	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020 11/24/2020 12/3/2020 12/4/2020 12/8/2020	Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1 0.4 0.4 0.4 2.0	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of information referenced to attorneys. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filling fees sections and provide input.	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00 60.00 60.00 300.00
	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020 11/24/2020 12/3/2020 12/4/2020 12/8/2020	Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1 0.4 0.4 0.4 2.0	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accordingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of information referenced to attorneys. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filling fees sections and provide input. Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions.	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00 60.00 60.00 300.00
12/22/2020 Lacey Ambro 0.6 Coroner's Motion for Stay. Email chambers letter and proposed Order. \$ 150.00 \$ 90.00	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020 11/24/2020 12/3/2020 12/4/2020 12/8/2020 12/9/2020	Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1 0.4 0.4 2.0 1.2 0.4 0.5	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accodingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Begin charting information. Continue charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Circulate chart and breakdown of information referenced to attorneys. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filing fees sections and provide input. Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill.	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00 60.00 60.00 300.00 180.00 75.00
	9/26/2019 3/2/2020 5/18/2020 11/20/2020 11/24/2020 12/3/2020 12/4/2020 12/8/2020 12/9/2020	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro	1.9 0.1 4.1 0.1 0.4 0.4 0.4 2.0 1.2 0.4 0.5	on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Print and prepare binders of Briefings and Appendices for October 7, 2019 Oral Arguments, for both appeals (consolidated to be heard at same Oral Argument). Process incoming mail: Opinion. Circulate to attorneys. Totals for Lacey Ambro (Admin) Download, save, and review Minute Order. Circulate to attorneys and update calendar accordingly. Download, save, and circulate (1) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time (no hearing date); (2) Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time. Calendar accodingly. Download, save and circulate Las Vegas Review-Journal's Order on Remand. Draft and finalize Notice of Entry of Order on Remand. Efile/eserve same. Download, save and circulate same. Calendar accodingly. Update second NPRA letter for fees paid in NPRA litigation re child death autopsies. Finalize and email. Review responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Begin charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Begin charting information from 12/3/2020 responsive NPRA records received from Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach Coffing Fees/costs. Begin quality check of costs breakdown and redactions. Conclude review of copy costs and filling fees sections and provide input. Finish quality check of costs. Email re additional redactions. Review time entry to ensure correct entries are captured in Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Generate and proofread draft bill.	\$ 50.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	95.00 5.00 205.00 15.00 60.00 60.00 300.00 180.00 75.00

					1	
42/20/2020			Download, save and circulate Coroner's Opposition to LVRJ's Supplemental Motion for	d 450.00	_	20.00
12/28/2020	Lacey Ambro		Attorney's Fees and Costs. Circulate to Mr. Lipman.	\$ 150.00	Ş	30.00
12/20/2020	La agus Amalana		Email Dept. 24 chamber to request extension on Order on Show Cause. Review court's	ć 1F0 00	۲	20.00
	Lacey Ambro Lacey Ambro		response granting extension to 1/5/2021. Update calendar. APPEAL: Download, save and circulate Order Denying Stay. Calendar accordingly.	\$ 150.00 \$ 150.00		30.00
	Lacey Ambro		APPEAL: Download, save and circulate Order Denying Stay. Calendar accordingly. APPEAL: Download, save and circulate Emergency Petition for Rehearing.	\$ 150.00		15.00 15.00
12/30/2020	Lacey Ambro		Review fee detail spreadsheet for exhibit to Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and	7 130.00	۲	13.00
2/2/2021	Lacey Ambro		Costs.	\$ 150.00	¢	285.00
2/2/2021	Lucey / anoro		Totals for Lacey Ambro (Paralegal)	\$	7	1,365.00
			Grand Total for Lacey Ambro	\$		1,570.00
			Read opposition to Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, edit and proofread Reply to			
1/4/2018	Leo Wolpert		opposition.	\$ 200.00	\$	220.00
1/18/2018	Leo Wolpert	0.8	Edit and proofread proposed Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs	\$ 200.00	\$	160.00
			Research, draft opposition to Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees			
2/12/2018	Leo Wolpert	5.5	and Costs.	\$ 200.00	\$	1,100.00
2/13/2018	Leo Wolpert	2.0	Finish opposition to Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 200.00	\$	400.00
			APPEAL: Draft, edit, research Opposition to emergency Motion for Stay at Nevada Supreme			
3/16/2018	Leo Wolpert	6.3	Court.	\$ 200.00	\$	1,260.00
			FEES APPEAL: Read Supreme Court decision granting stay to Coroner, research post-Nken			
			federal cases regarding whether 62(d) and 62(e) work in tandem to give governmental			
4/12/2018	Leo Wolpert	4.3	entities stays as a matter of right.	\$ 200.00	\$	860.00
			FEES APPEAL: Research and write argument for petition for rehearing of Supreme Court			
4/13/2018	Leo Wolpert	4.5	Order granting stay.	\$ 200.00	\$	900.00
	Leo Wolpert		FEES APPEAL: Finish drafting petition for reconsideration of Order on Motion for Stay.	\$ 200.00	_	360.00
	Leo Wolpert		FEES APPEAL: Edit and proofread Supreme Court petition for rehearing.		\$	100.00
	Leo Wolpert		FEES APPEAL: edit and proofread petition for rehearing.	\$ 200.00	_	100.00
8/13/2018	Leo Wolpert		APPEAL: Edit, proofread, and cite check Answering Brief.	\$ 200.00	\$	780.00
40/2/2040			FEES APPEAL: Read through Coroner's Opening Brief, begin drafting editing and revising, cite	4 200 00	_	4 400 00
10/2/2018	Leo Wolpert		checking and proofreading and reorganizing Answering Brief.	\$ 200.00	\$	1,100.00
			FEES APPEAL: Research briefing in Blackjack Bonding to see which policy arguments of Las			
40/40/2040	1 14/-l	0.7	Vegas Metropolitan Police Department were rejected by the Nevada Supreme Court, email	ć 200 00	٠	1.40.00
10/18/2018	Leo Wolpert	0.7	to Ms. Shell and Ms. McLetchie re same.	\$ 200.00	\$	140.00
			EFEC ADDIAL December of the december of the state of the			
			FEES APPEAL: Research cases regarding damages other than attorney's fees and costs in the context of good faith (non) production of public records, draft and edit section of brief			
10/10/2010	Leo Wolpert		opposing argument regarding damages a requester can suffer.	\$ 200.00	خ	620.00
10/16/2016	Leo woipert		FEES APPEAL: Edit, research, further draft section of Answering Brief regarding out-of-state	\$ 200.00	Ą	620.00
10/19/2019	Leo Wolpert	l l	precedents cited by Coroner in Opening Brief.	\$ 200.00	\$	180.00
10/10/2010	LCO Worpert	0.5	precedents effect by coroner in opening brief.	7 200.00	7	100.00
			FEES APPEAL: Draft, proofread and edit Answering Brief, particular attention to editing			
			subsections C-H in legal argument section; go through Opening Brief Table of Authorities to			
10/19/2018	Leo Wolpert	l l	ensure that we addressed all the Coroner's relevant cases and statutes.	\$ 200.00	Ś	1.100.00
10/19/2018			FEES APPEAL: Edit and proofread hard copy of the Answering Brief.	\$ 200.00		500.00
	Leo Wolpert		APPEAL: Edit Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply.	\$ 200.00		40.00
, , , , , ,				,		
1/24/2019	Leo Wolpert	0.1	APPEAL: Final hand edits to Reply to Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply.	\$ 200.00	\$	20.00
	,		FEES APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in preparation for oral argument, specifically with out-of-			
10/6/2019	Leo Wolpert	1.5	state cases.	\$ 200.00	\$	300.00
10/7/2019	Leo Wolpert	1.8	APPEAL: Assist Ms. McLetchie in preparation for oral argument.	\$ 200.00	\$	360.00
		53.0	Totals for Leo S. Wolpert (2018-2019)	\$		10,600.00
8/13/2020	Leo Wolpert	0.8	Review, edit, proofread first draft of opening brief of petition on remand.	\$ 250.00	\$	200.00
8/16/2020	Leo Wolpert	0.8	Review Ms. McLetchie's rewrite of opening brief on remand and make edits thereto.	\$ 250.00	\$	200.00
10/22/2020	Leo Wolpert		Proofread and edit reply in support of opening brief.	\$ 250.00	\$	275.00
	Leo Wolpert		Proofread Order on remand.	\$ 250.00	_	325.00
11/21/2020	Leo Wolpert		Assist Ms. McLetchie in drafting Motion for stay by procuring documents.	\$ 250.00	\$	50.00
			Begin outlining, drafting, researching, reviewing materials regarding fees for Motion for			
12/1/2020	Leo Wolpert	2.3	Attorney's Fees. Confer with Ms. McLetchie re same.	\$ 250.00	\$	575.00
			Continue drafting, researching supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs including		١.	
12/2/2020	Leo Wolpert	3.8	research re Laffey Matrix and other fees.	\$ 250.00	\$	950.00
40/0/5				A ===	_	700
12/3/2020	Leo Wolpert	2.8	Continue drafting, researching supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 250.00	\$	700.00
42/4/222	1 Mr. !		etaal adda and andras as totatel do 6 . Co. The selection of the selection	¢ 250 25	_	425.22
12/4/2020	Leo Wolpert		Final edits and updates to initial draft of supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 250.00	\$	425.00
42/F/2022	M/-l :		Begin researching and drafting Motion for Order to Show Cause re contempt of disclosure	¢ 252.00	_ ا	225.00
12/5/2020	Leo Wolpert	1.3	Order.	\$ 250.00	\$	325.00

	T					
			Continue researching and drafting Motion for Order to Show Cause re contempt of			
12/6/2020	Leo Wolpert	3.2	disclosure Order.	\$ 250.00	\$	800.00
			Complete researching and drafting Motion for Order to Show Cause re contempt of			
12/7/2020	Leo Wolpert	2.8	disclosure Order, including declarations, etc.	\$ 250.00	\$	700.00
	Leo Wolpert		Research regarding court reassignment potential contempt hearing against Coroner.		\$	325.00
_ , ,	Leo Wolpert		Edit Supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees; confirm fees and costs.	\$ 250.00		250.00
	Leo Wolpert		APPEAL: Edit, proofread Motion for excess pages on appeal.	\$ 250.00		75.00
12/31/2020	Leo Wolpert		Research criminal contempt for disobeying court Order.	\$ 250.00	\$	300.00
		1	Review previous Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs replies, research concerning fees on	l .	١.	
1/14/2021	Leo Wolpert	1.5	supplement.	\$ 250.00	\$	375.00
			Draft, research Consolidated amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, particular			
			attention to summarizing events in litigation since November and researching awards in			
1/27/2021	Leo Wolpert	4.3	district court.	\$ 250.00	\$	1,075.00
1/28/2021	Leo Wolpert	1.5	Finish drafting, researching Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 250.00	\$	375.00
			Edit, proof, implement Mr. Lipman's suggestions regarding Consolidated Motion for			
			Attorney's Fees and Costs, particular attention to researching and drafting arguments for			
2/1/2021	Leo Wolpert	2.7	appeal fees going back to Musso.	\$ 250.00	\$	675.00
	Leo Wolpert		Finalize Motion for Attorneys' Fees; work with paralegals re fees and exhibits.	\$ 250.00		750.00
	·		Totals for Leo S. Wolpert (2020-2021)	\$	Ė	9,725.00
			Grand Total for Leo S. Wolpert	\$		20,325.00
						•
			Research re stay issues (Coroner's office has not filed notice of appeal or Motion for stay);			
11/28/2017	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	consider related strategy to obtain documents; direct Ms. Shell re further research.	\$ 450.00	Ś	450.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	900.00
11,23,201,			Attention to revising draft opposition to Motion to stay. Respond to and address client	ψ .50.00	7	500.00
12/6/2017	Margaret McLetchie		questions re same. Address client comments.	\$ 450.00	Ś	1 170 00
	Margaret McLetchie		Further attention to stay, Motion to expedite strategy. Emails with client.	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Finalize Opposition to Motion to Stay; revise to address comments from client.	\$ 450.00	\$	405.00
12/0/2017	Wargaret Wezeteine	0.5	Thinking Opposition to Motion to Stay, Texase to address comments from eleme.	7 430.00	7	103.00
12/6/2017	Margaret McLetchie	0.6	Review notice of appeal. Consider case strategy, including possible Motion to expedite.	\$ 450.00	\$	270.00
12/0/2017	IVIAI BAI CE IVICECTORIC	0.0	review floatice of appeals consider case strategy, including possible Motion to expedite.	7 430.00	7	270.00
			Review notice of assignment to settlement program; Email to Ms. Rehfeldt re due date for			
12/8/2017	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	settlement briefs and extending same until after premediation conference call.	\$ 450.00	¢	90.00
12/0/2017	IVIAI BAI CE IVICECTORIC	0.2	Call with Laura Rehfeldt and to chambers re hearing schedule for 12/12. (.2) Email to clients	7 430.00	7	30.00
12/11/2017	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	re hearing scheduling. (.1)	\$ 450.00	خ	135.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Communication with client. Prepare for hearing on Motion to Stay.	\$ 450.00	_	810.00
12/11/2017	IVIAI BAI CE IVICECTORIC	1.0	Call with Laura Rehfeldt and to settlement judge re settlement briefs; email to file	7 430.00	7	010.00
12/11/2017	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	memorializing same.	\$ 450.00	¢	90.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Prepare for and attend hearing on Coroner's Motion for Stay.	\$ 450.00	_	765.00
12/12/2017	Wargaret Wezeteine	1.7	APPEAL: Review and respond to email re pre-mediation telephone conference explaining	7 430.00	7	703.00
12/12/2017	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	case status and reasons why not appropriate for settlement.	\$ 450.00	¢	90.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Review Coroner's draft proposed Order granting stay, and provide input re same.	\$ 450.00		135.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Revise and edit Motion to Expedite Appeal.	\$ 450.00	-	225.00
12/13/2017	ivial garet ivictetcine	0.5	Attention to execution of joint proposed Order on Motion to Stay; correct error in firm	7 430.00	۲	223.00
12/21/2017	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	name.	\$ 450.00	خ	90.00
12/21/2017	IVIAI BAI CE IVICECTORIC	0.2	Confer with Ms. Shell re Opposition to Motion for Attorney's Fees and addressing arguments	7 430.00	7	30.00
12/21/2017	Margaret McLetchie	2.0	made by Coroner's Office.	\$ 450.00	\$	900.00
12/21/2017	IVIAI BAI CE IVICECTORIC	2.0	APPEAL: edit draft reply in support of Motion to Expedite Appeal. Circulate to clients. Direct	7 430.00	7	300.00
12/27/2017	Margaret McLetchie	1 1	finalization.	\$ 450.00	خ	495.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Prepare and attend call with settlement judge; update team re next steps.	\$ 450.00		180.00
			Revise reply in support of Motion for aAttorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	810.00
	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie		Prepare for hearing on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	
1/10/2018	iviaigaiet ivictettille	0.6	Prepare for hearing on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Update clients re	00.00 ب	٠	360.00
1/11/2010	Margaret McLetchie	י ר	same, plan next steps (drafting of Order).	\$ 450.00	خ	1,125.00
				\$ 450.00	\$	
	Margaret McLetchie		Attention to revising proposed Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00		495.00
1/10/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.0	Follow up re submission of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	ڔ	270.00
1/10/2010	Margaret Mel etchic	0.3	Pavious Order on Metion to Evnedite Appeal and confer with Mar Burchfield to color desire	¢ 450.00	۲	00.00
1/10/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Review Order on Motion to Expedite Appeal and confer with Ms. Burchfield re calendaring.	\$ 450.00	٦	90.00
1/10/2012	Managarah Madadatatat		Attention to submission of proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	¢ 450.00	ے ا	100.00
1/19/2018	Margaret McLetchie		Letter to Judge Crockett's chambers.	\$ 450.00	\$	180.00
2/2/2012	Managerst Mart 1 1 1		Review and assess Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs	¢ 450.00	,	F 40 00
2/2/2018	Margaret McLetchie	1.2	filed in district court; circulate to clients.	\$ 450.00	\$	540.00
2/42/5-			Attention to opposition to Motion for Stay of order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and		_	
7/17/2018	Margaret McLetchie	1.4	Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	630.00
2/12/2010						
	Margaret McLetchie		Finalize opposition to Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	1,215.00

	1					
2/15/2018	Margaret McLetchie		Prepare for and attend hearing on Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	Ś	1.665.00
	_		APPEAL: Email to settlement judge re possible settlement conference (not appropriate for			•
2/20/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	mediation) to avoid unnecessary fees. Attention to Order denying Motion for Stay of Order on Motion for Attorney's Fees and	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
2/26/2018	Margaret McLetchie	1.2	Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	540.00
2,20,2010	margaret mezeteme		Continued attention to Order Denying Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for	ψ 130.00	~	3 10100
2/27/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	225.00
			Continued attention to Order denying Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for			
	Margaret McLetchie		Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00		180.00
3/6/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	Emails with chambers recorder for pick up. Attention to issues regarding stay, coroner's apparent plan to appeal denial of same. Review	\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
3/7/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	Notice of Entry of Order.	\$ 450.00	Ś	135.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Review and respond to email regarding appendices.	\$ 450.00	_	45.00
	Margaret McLetchie		FEES APPEAL: Review and respond to email regarding appendices.	\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
3/8/2018	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	FEES APPEAL: Attention to Motion for Stay filed by coroner's office.	\$ 450.00	_	450.00
3/13/2018	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	APPEAL: Attention to Opposition to Motion for Stay.	\$ 450.00	\$	450.00
3/15/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	APPEAL: Revision to Opposition to Motion to Stay. Direction to Ms. Shell regarding same.	\$ 450.00	\$	180.00
3/16/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	APPEAL: Continued attention to Opposition to stay and emails to team regarding same.	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	APPEAL: Opposition to Motion to Consolidate.	\$ 450.00		450.00
3/19/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.6	APPEAL: Review and revise Opposition to Motion to Consolidate.	\$ 450.00	\$	270.00
			APPEAL: Confer with client regarding possible Reporters Committee for Freedom of the Press		١.	
3/28/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	("RCFP") amicus brief in the case.	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
4/12/2019	Margaret Mel etchie	1 1	FEES APPEAL: Review Order regarding Stay of Fees Award, Consider possible petition for rehearing and Confer with team regarding same.	\$ 450.00	خ	405.00
4/12/2018	Margaret McLetchie	1.1	FEES APPEAL: Attention to Petition for Rehearing; Direct Ms. Shell regarding strategy	\$ 450.00	Ş	495.00
4/16/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	regarding same.	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
4/47/2040	N.A	0.0	EFFC ADDEAL Device Detition for Delegation and conformith Mr. Chall according	ć 450.00	,	260.00
	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie		FEES APPEAL: Revise Petition for Rehearing and confer with Ms. Shell regarding same. FEES APPEAL: Revise Petition for Rehearing and circulate.	\$ 450.00 \$ 450.00	\$	360.00 225.00
4/18/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	FEES APPEAL: Revise Petition for Renearing and Circulate. FEES APPEAL: Perform research and provide to Ms. Shell for inclusion in Motion to	\$ 450.00	Ş	225.00
4/19/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	Reconsider.	\$ 450.00	Ś	225.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Plan strategy on appeal.	\$ 450.00	_	180.00
7/31/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	APPEAL: Continue appellate planning.	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Email conferences with client and with RCFP regarding Amicus Brief.		\$	135.00
8/9/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	APPEAL: Attention to Amicus Brief. Email with client regarding status.	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
0/40/2040	N.A	- 4	ADDEAL AND A Challe	ć 450.00	,	2 420 00
	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Work on Answering Brief. Review opening brief and meet with Ms. Shelll. APPEAL: Revise draft of Answering Brief.	\$ 450.00 \$ 450.00	\$	2,430.00
6/12/2016	ivialgalet ivictetchie	0.2	AFFEAL. Nevise draft of Answering brief.	\$ 430.00	٦	2,790.00
8/13/2018	Margaret McLetchie	5.0	APPEAL: Work on revising and finalizing Answering Brief; culate draft Brief to client.	\$ 450.00	\$	2,250.00
	Margaret McLetchie		FEES APPEAL: Attention to Motion for Extension of deadlines.	\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
	_					
8/17/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	FEES APPEAL: Emails with opposing counsel re extension and attention to finalizing same.	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
- 1 1			APPEAL: Review and analyze Amicus Brief file by RCFP and provide to client with comment.			
8/21/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.8	Email local counsel for RCFP.	\$ 450.00	\$	360.00
8/23/2018	Margaret McLetchie	2 2	FEES APPEAL: Review Coroner's brief and work on answering brief. Identify and analyze legal issues. Assign research.	\$ 450.00	\$	1,035.00
	Margaret McLetchie		FEE APPEAL: Attention to work on and drafting of answering Answering Brief.	\$ 450.00	\$	1,350.00
	Margaret McLetchie			\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
	Ü		APPEAL: Revise and shorten Answering Brief; Direct Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfeild re filing		Ė	
9/5/2018	Margaret McLetchie	3.1	same. Approve filing.	\$ 450.00	\$	1,395.00
9/17/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	FEES APPEAL: Attention to Unopposed Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 450.00	\$	180.00
			APPEAL: Review Opposition to Reporter's Committee for Freedom Motion for Leave to file			
9/25/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	Amicus Brief. Edit Opposition to Motion to Strike.	\$ 450.00	\$	225.00
			EFFC ADDIAL Davis costings of local argument responding to Carenay's arguments.			
			FEES APPEAL: Revise sections of legal argument responding to Coroner's arguments; Research cases cited by Coroner from other jurisdictions and determine how to distinguish;			
			develop arguments regarding why we are entitled to fees regardless of outcome of matter	[
10/18/2018	Margaret McLetchie	7.9	direct work on revising and editings other sections by team.	\$ 450.00	\$	3,555.00
			FEES APPEAL: Draft sections regarding entitlement to fees; Revise and continued drafting	l. '		
	Margaret McLetchie		section regarding why Coroner acted in bad faith, using cases cited by Coroner.	\$ 450.00	\$	1,035.00
10/25/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	APPEAL: Revise notice of Supplemental Authorities.	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
			APPEAL: Emails with client re possible factual inaccuracies in Reply Brief and possible issues			
12/4/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	to raise in Answering Brief. Analyze same and direct Ms. Shell re work on same.	\$ 450.00	\$	180.00
			,		<u> </u>	

12/21/2010						
12/21/2018	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	APPEAL: Revise sur-reply. [REDUCED ENTRY.]	\$ 450.00	\$	180.00
1/23/2019	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	APPEAL: Revise Reply in Support of Motion to File Surreply/Provide to Mr. Lipman for input.	\$ 450.00	\$	180.00
4/5/2019	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	APPEAL: Review filing.	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
5/1/2019	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order.	\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
5/8/2019	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Motion to continue. Emails re same. [REDUCED ENTRY.]	\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
5/14/2019	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	APPEAL: Review Order re rescheduling hearing. Update to client re same.	\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
5/15/2019	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order; attention to scheduling re hearing on appeal.	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
5/16/2019	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Revise Motion to continue.	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
			APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Confer with paralegal re status of unopposed Motion; direct her			
5/29/2019	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	to follow up with Court.	\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
5/30/2019	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Review Order re continuing oral argument.	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
7/1/2019	Margaret McLetchie		Email with Mr. Lipman re case status.	\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
8/26/2019	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Review notice re scheduling oral arg. Check date. Direct paralegal to update Mr. Lipman.	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Review Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authority.	\$ 450.00		135.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of appearance.	\$ 450.00	_	90.00
	Margaret McLetchie		FEES APPEAL: Attention to notice of supplemental authority.	\$ 450.00		90.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation.	\$ 450.00		3,780.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Continue oral argument prep.	\$ 450.00	_	3,105.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Oral argument preparation and attendance.	\$ 450.00		
10/7/2019	ivialgaret ivictettille		Totals for Margaret A. McLetchie (2017-2019)	\$ 430.00	_	49,050.00
1/22/2020	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Review filing.	\$ 500.00		50.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Neview Hillig. APPEAL: Update to client re decision being issued 2/27.	\$ 500.00		50.00
	Margaret McLetchie		APPEAL: Update to client re pending decision.	\$ 500.00	_	100.00
2/26/2020	iviargaret ivictettille	0.2	APPEAL. Opuate to client re penuing decision.	\$ 500.00	Ş	100.00
			ADDEAL Deview (analyses entries Empile to eliente ve come Consider necessale next atoms			
2/27/2020	NA	2.0	APPEAL: Review/analyze opinion. Emails to clients re same. Consider possible next steps.	ć 500 00	٠	1 000 00
	Margaret McLetchie		Email re who is lead counsel for Coroner. Confer with Mr. Lipman re case.	\$ 500.00	_	
	Margaret McLetchie		Review Remitittur.	\$ 500.00	_	50.00
	Margaret McLetchie	_	Draft letter to opposing counsel re scheduling matters.	\$ 500.00	_	150.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Plan strategy in case. Email to Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 500.00		250.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Prepare for and attend call with Mr. Lipman. Draft letter to opposing counsel.	\$ 500.00		350.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Begin compiling arguments/ examples.	\$ 500.00	_	550.00
	Margaret McLetchie	_	Review emails received from Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00		200.00
5/7/2020	Margaret McLetchie	3.0	Review examples. Work with Ms. Shell on chart compiling examples.	\$ 500.00	\$	1,500.00
				l .	١.	
	Margaret McLetchie	2.2	Prepare for and attend call with Mr. Lipman. Further emails re examples, next steps.	Γ		1,100.00
5/11/2020						
	Margaret McLetchie	4.0	Work on review of prior briefs, compiling examples.	\$ 500.00	\$	
5/14/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5	Call with Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$	250.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$	250.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/14/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/14/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00 1,900.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/14/2020 8/15/2020 8/16/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread. Finish initial draft of Opening Brief to send to Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00 3,400.00 2,100.00 900.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/14/2020 8/15/2020 8/16/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00 1,900.00 3,400.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/14/2020 8/15/2020 8/16/2020 8/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8 4.2 1.8	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread. Finish initial draft of Opening Brief to send to Mr. Lipman. Confer with Ms. Shell re expanding opening brief. Revise second version to send to Mr. Lipman - send back to Ms. Shell to identify citations etc.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00 1,900.00 3,400.00 2,100.00 900.00 100.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/14/2020 8/15/2020 8/16/2020 8/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8 4.2 1.8	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread. Finish initial draft of Opening Brief to send to Mr. Lipman. Confer with Ms. Shell re expanding opening brief. Revise second version to send to Mr. Lipman - send back to Ms. Shell to identify citations etc. and address various comments. Confer with Ms. Shell re same.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00 3,400.00 2,100.00 900.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/14/2020 8/15/2020 8/16/2020 8/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8 4.2 1.8	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread. Finish initial draft of Opening Brief to send to Mr. Lipman. Confer with Ms. Shell re expanding opening brief. Revise second version to send to Mr. Lipman - send back to Ms. Shell to identify citations etc. and address various comments. Confer with Ms. Shell re same. Opening Brief on remand: Attention to addressing edits from Mr. Lipman and proofreading.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00 1,900.00 3,400.00 2,100.00 900.00 100.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/15/2020 8/15/2020 8/16/2020 8/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8 4.2 1.8 0.2	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread. Finish initial draft of Opening Brief to send to Mr. Lipman. Confer with Ms. Shell re expanding opening brief. Revise second version to send to Mr. Lipman - send back to Ms. Shell to identify citations etc. and address various comments. Confer with Ms. Shell re same. Opening Brief on remand: Attention to addressing edits from Mr. Lipman and proofreading. Revise intro and review further edits from Ms. Shell; emails and call with Mr. Lipman re brief;	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00 1,900.00 3,400.00 2,100.00 900.00 100.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/15/2020 8/15/2020 8/16/2020 8/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8 4.2 1.8 0.2	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread. Finish initial draft of Opening Brief to send to Mr. Lipman. Confer with Ms. Shell re expanding opening brief. Revise second version to send to Mr. Lipman - send back to Ms. Shell to identify citations etc. and address various comments. Confer with Ms. Shell re same. Opening Brief on remand: Attention to addressing edits from Mr. Lipman and proofreading. Revise intro and review further edits from Ms. Shell; emails and call with Mr. Lipman re brief; send latest draft to Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00 1,900.00 3,400.00 2,100.00 900.00 100.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/15/2020 8/15/2020 8/16/2020 8/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8 4.2 1.8 0.2	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread. Finish initial draft of Opening Brief to send to Mr. Lipman. Confer with Ms. Shell re expanding opening brief. Revise second version to send to Mr. Lipman - send back to Ms. Shell to identify citations etc. and address various comments. Confer with Ms. Shell re same. Opening Brief on remand: Attention to addressing edits from Mr. Lipman and proofreading. Revise intro and review further edits from Ms. Shell; emails and call with Mr. Lipman re brief; send latest draft to Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00 1,900.00 3,400.00 2,100.00 900.00 100.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 6/2/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/14/2020 8/15/2020 8/23/2020 8/24/2020 8/26/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8 4.2 1.8 0.2 1.0	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread. Finish initial draft of Opening Brief to send to Mr. Lipman. Confer with Ms. Shell re expanding opening brief. Revise second version to send to Mr. Lipman - send back to Ms. Shell to identify citations etc. and address various comments. Confer with Ms. Shell re same. Opening Brief on remand: Attention to addressing edits from Mr. Lipman and proofreading. Revise intro and review further edits from Ms. Shell; emails and call with Mr. Lipman re brief; send latest draft to Mr. Lipman. Review further edits from Mr. Lipman and confer with Ms. Shell re same/ finalizing. Consider equal protection issue. Confer with Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfield re finalizing brief. Review/	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00 1,900.00 2,100.00 900.00 100.00 500.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/14/2020 8/15/2020 8/23/2020 8/24/2020 8/26/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8 4.2 1.8 0.2 1.0	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread. Finish initial draft of Opening Brief to send to Mr. Lipman. Confer with Ms. Shell re expanding opening brief. Revise second version to send to Mr. Lipman - send back to Ms. Shell to identify citations etc. and address various comments. Confer with Ms. Shell re same. Opening Brief on remand: Attention to addressing edits from Mr. Lipman and proofreading. Revise intro and review further edits from Ms. Shell; emails and call with Mr. Lipman re brief; send latest draft to Mr. Lipman. Review further edits from Mr. Lipman and confer with Ms. Shell re same/ finalizing. Consider equal protection issue. Confer with Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfield re finalizing brief. Review/ edit prefinal version.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00 1,900.00 2,100.00 900.00 100.00 1,150.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/14/2020 8/15/2020 8/23/2020 8/26/2020 8/27/2020 9/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8 4.2 1.8 0.2 1.0	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread. Finish initial draft of Opening Brief to send to Mr. Lipman. Confer with Ms. Shell re expanding opening brief. Revise second version to send to Mr. Lipman - send back to Ms. Shell to identify citations etc. and address various comments. Confer with Ms. Shell re same. Opening Brief on remand: Attention to addressing edits from Mr. Lipman and proofreading. Revise intro and review further edits from Ms. Shell; emails and call with Mr. Lipman re brief; send latest draft to Mr. Lipman. Review further edits from Mr. Lipman and confer with Ms. Shell re same/ finalizing. Consider equal protection issue. Confer with Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfield re finalizing brief. Review/ edit prefinal version.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 3,400.00 2,100.00 900.00 1,150.00 900.00 500.00
5/14/2020 5/26/2020 6/1/2020 7/17/2020 8/10/2020 8/13/2020 8/14/2020 8/15/2020 8/23/2020 8/24/2020 8/26/2020 8/27/2020 9/23/2020 10/7/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.0 0.5 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.2 2.0 3.8 6.8 4.2 1.8 0.2 1.0 2.3	Call with Mr. Lipman. Attention to Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule. Review information re public interest in autopsies. Emails with client re same. Review Order / briefing schedule. Attention to stipulation re briefing schedule. Review initial draft of coroner brief prepared by Ms. Shell and propose restructuring re same. Revise and expand opening brief. Re-review Supreme Court decision and revise introduction/ reorganize accordingly. Consider how to best use to our benefit/ limit ability of Coroner to use declaration. Revise and expand opening brief. Attention to legal standard. Expand factual discussion what is included in chart, redacted samples. Expand / additions re examples of why reports should be provided. Email to client re status of draft. Continue drafting and research re Opening Brief. Review child welfare agency public disclosure form. Further review of sample redacted autopsy reports. Complete draft and send to Mr. Wolpert to proofread. Finish initial draft of Opening Brief to send to Mr. Lipman. Confer with Ms. Shell re expanding opening brief. Revise second version to send to Mr. Lipman - send back to Ms. Shell to identify citations etc. and address various comments. Confer with Ms. Shell re same. Opening Brief on remand: Attention to addressing edits from Mr. Lipman and proofreading. Revise intro and review further edits from Ms. Shell; emails and call with Mr. Lipman re brief; send latest draft to Mr. Lipman. Review further edits from Mr. Lipman and confer with Ms. Shell re same/ finalizing. Consider equal protection issue. Confer with Ms. Shell and Ms. Burchfield re finalizing brief. Review/ edit prefinal version.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	250.00 100.00 150.00 50.00 100.00 1,000.00 1,900.00 2,100.00 900.00 100.00 1,150.00

40/46/2020	NA	0.1	Discher and the alterna	¢ 500.00	۲.	50.00
	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie		Update email to client. Revise and send client draft of reply.	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00	\$	50.00 650.00
10/19/2020	ivial garet ivictetcine	1.3	Attention to further revisions to reply; further research re immediate repeal. Emails with Mr.	\$ 300.00	Ą	030.00
10/22/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.6	Lipman.	\$ 500.00	\$	800.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Attention to docket discrepancy re 10/29/2020 hearing.	\$ 500.00	_	100.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Begin hearing preparation. Review binders.	\$ 500.00	\$	700.00
,,	- Garage at measure			7 000.00	т.	
			Review correspondence from opposing counsel's office to chambers. Direct paralegal to			
10/27/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	follow up with chambers re whether email courtesy copies are needed, Blue Jeans info.	\$ 500.00	\$	50.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Hearing preparation.	\$ 500.00		1,150.00
, ,	J		Hearing (prepare and attend). Emails and other calls with client. Direct paralegal re obtaining			
10/29/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.2	transcript on expedited basis.	\$ 500.00	\$	2,100.00
10/30/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	Preparation work for Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Review last filing.	\$ 500.00	\$	250.00
11/4/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Emails re obtaining transcript.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
11/5/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.7	Review transcript.	\$ 500.00	\$	350.00
			Edit draft to send to client. Address client's edits and send to Ms. Shell for polishing and			
11/12/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.8	finalization.	\$ 500.00	\$	900.00
11/13/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Approve final draft Order to send to Ms. Nichols.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
11/17/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	Emails re Ms. Nichols' request for more time to submit proposed Order.	\$ 500.00	\$	50.00
11/18/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.8	Assess proposed changes from Ms. Nichols. Edit final proposed Order/ approve same.	\$ 500.00	\$	400.00
11/19/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Confer with paralegal re status of Order.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
11/19/2020	Margaret McLetchie		Review emails with chambers re competing proposed Orders.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
			Review Coroner's Motion to Stay and filings re same. Email conference with Ms. Burchfield re			
11/20/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.5	deadlines re same and those triggered by notice of entry of Order.	\$ 500.00	\$	750.00
11/20/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2		\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
			Review sample successful opposition to Motion to stay from 1 October NPRA litigation			
11/21/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	against Las Vegas Metropolitan Police Department.	\$ 500.00	\$	250.00
			Research and draft opposition to Motion to stay. Review successful similar oppositions in 1			
/22 /222			October case. Research legal standard. Review Order. Consider abuse of discretion issue.	4 =	_	
11/22/2020	Margaret McLetchie	7.6	Draft legal standard and introduction sections and begin drafting sections re factors.	\$ 500.00	Ş	3,800.00
			Continue drafting and refining opposition to Motion to stay. Incorpporate AS edits and her			
			rewrite of my skeletal "defeat purpsoe of appeal' section. Expand / draft section addressign			
			procedural and related issues re delay vs no appeal filed. Further research pertient to stay.			
			Expland lilkelihhod of sucess section to address Hansen argument. Complete initial draft to			
			send to Mr. Lipman. Revierw/ consider experience re stay in intiial litigation in this case and		١.	
	Margaret McLetchie		in 1 October.	\$ 500.00		2,950.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Edit NPRA request re fees paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing prepared by paralegal.	\$ 500.00	_	100.00
11/25/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	Call with Mr. Lipman. Begin revising opposition to Motion to stay accordingly.	\$ 500.00	\$	500.00
44 /25 /2020		0.0	Emails with Ms. Miller and counsel for Coroner re communications with Board of County	A 500.00	_	100.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Commissioners.	\$ 500.00		100.00
11/25/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Research/ check records re amounts paid to Marquis Aurbach Coffing by County.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
44 /25 /2020	N 4 + N 4 - 1 - + - - i -	0.3	Attention to Opposition to Marking to Charlesian and Constitution of Constitution and Const	ć 500 00	٠	100.00
11/25/2020	Margaret McLetchie		Attention to Opposition to Motion to Stay logistic; confer with Ms. Ambro re same.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
44 /20 /2020			Revise introduction, procedural history, and legal standard sections of Motion to stay and	A 500.00	_	1 000 00
11/29/2020	Margaret McLetchie	3.6	send revised draft to Mr. Lipman for his review & consideration.	\$ 500.00	\$	1,800.00
			Opposition to Coroner's Motion to Stay on Order Shortening Time final edits; confer with		Ì	
44 /20 /2020	N 4 + N 4 - 1 - + - - i -	4.2	client. Attention to case strategy and planning. Review Board of County Commissioners	ć 500 00	٠	2 400 00
11/30/2020	Margaret McLetchie		agenda.	\$ 500.00	\$	2,100.00
12/1/2020	N 4 + N 4 - 1 - + - - i -		Board of County Commissioners hearing - monitor; next steps. Emails re whether Coroner	ć 500 00	٠	750.00
	Margaret McLetchie		has / will provide reports in at least redacted form.	\$ 500.00		750.00
12/1/2020	Margaret McLetchie		Emails with Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
			Attention to case strategy, next steps re getting as much information as possible to client as		Ì	
12/1/2022	Managanak Martartaria	4.4	soon as possible. Confer with client. Email to Ms. Nichols requesting redacted version after	¢ 500.00	_ ا	FF0 00
	Margaret McLetchie		reviewing transcript.	\$ 500.00	_	550.00
12/1/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Check Coroner's appellate deadline.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
12/1/2020	Margaret Malatahi-	0.3	Dian work on Mation for Attornovic Food and Costs and conformath May Walnest	¢ 500.00	ے ا	100.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Plan work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and confer with Mr. Wolpert re same.	\$ 500.00	_	100.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Confirm time / date for Stay hearing with paralegal and client.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Follow up with Ms. Nichols re request re redacted copies of report.	\$ 500.00	_	50.00
12/3/2020	Margaret McLetchie		Preliminary research re possible Order to Show Cause. Consider issues re same.	\$ 500.00	\$	400.00
12/2/2020	Margaret Malatahi-		Review fees information re payments to Marquis Aurbach Coffing provided by Coroner.	¢ 500.00	ے ا	100.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Emails with Ms. Ambro re same.	\$ 500.00		100.00
	Margaret McLetchie			\$ 500.00		100.00
12/3/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Emails with client.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
	i e					
12/4/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	Confirm plans re Order to Show Cause. Confer with Mr. Wolpert re Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 500.00	۲	200.00

		1	<u> </u>			
			Confer with Ms. Shell and Mr. Wolpert re strategy, plans re Motion for Attorney's Fees and			
			Costs. Review preliminary draft and provide feedback/direct Mr. Wolpert re			
			factual/procedural history to add. Approve final draft to send to client of substantive	l .	١.	
	Margaret McLetchie		sections re brief.	\$ 500.00	_	800.00
	Margaret McLetchie	1	Direct work re research re Order to Show Cause and Order shortening time.	\$ 500.00		150.00
12/7/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	Review reply in support of Motion to stay filed by Coroner.	\$ 500.00	\$	200.00
			Research re interplay between Order to Show Cause and stay. Direct work and make edits to			
			draft; break up argument section into separate section. Emails with client. Review client			
			edits; coordinate finalization of Order to Show Cause/ perform final substantive review			
12/7/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.6	before finalization.	\$ 500.00		2,300.00
12/7/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	Hearing logistics re 12/10/2020 Motion to stay; review hearing notice.	\$ 500.00	\$	50.00
			Attention to substantive edits to fees app/ finalization of same (minus fees / rate detail).			
12/8/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.6	Confer with Mr. Lipman re his proposed edits and next steps.	\$ 500.00	\$	300.00
12/8/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Review courtesy copy email from opposing counsel's office re Motion to stay.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
			Review Order to Show Cause on Order shortening time Order. Plan accordingly. Direct			
12/8/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	paralegal to update client.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
12/9/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Attention to hearing preparation binder. Ensure clients have call-in information.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
	Margaret McLetchie			\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
, , ,			Review and analyze opposition to Order to Show Cause. Direct research re same. Confer with	,	Ċ	
12/9/2020	Margaret McLetchie	2.3	client. Further preparation for 12/10/2020 hearings.	\$ 500.00	\$	1,150.00
12/3/2020	Wargaret Weleterine	2.3	Prepare for and attend hearing on Motion to Stay, Order to Show Cuase. Review related	7 300.00	7	1,130.00
			research provided by Ms. Shell and Mr. Wolpert. Calls with client. Update paralegal re			
12/10/2020	Margaret McLetchie	6.2	outcome, calendaring next steps, Ordering transcript.	\$ 500.00	\$	3,100.00
	Margaret McLetchie	1		1	\$	
12/10/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.6	Work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, memorandum of costs.	\$ 500.00	>	800.00
			Work on Motion for Attorney's Fees with paralegals. Review all time and costs and finalize			
	Margaret McLetchie		Declaration.	\$ 500.00	\$	
12/11/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	Planning regarding Clark County Board of County Commissioners BCC hearing.	\$ 500.00	\$	500.00
			Attention to scheduling re hearing on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. Attention to BCC			
12/14/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	issues. Call with Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00	\$	500.00
			Review transcript. County hearing. Attention to preparing for anticipated Emergency Motion			
12/15/2020	Margaret McLetchie	3.1	to Stay.	\$ 500.00	\$	1,550.00
12/17/2020	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	Attention to Order granting petition.	\$ 500.00	\$	500.00
12/17/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	APPEAL: Review Emergency Motion for Stay.	\$ 500.00	\$	150.00
	Margaret McLetchie	1	Attention to revisions to Order Denying stay; address client edits.	\$ 500.00	\$	600.00
			APPEAL: Finalize first draft of response to emergency petition (and attention to cutting			
12/21/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.2	down) and send to Mr. Lipman for review.	\$ 500.00	Ś	2,100.00
	Margaret McLetchie	1	Review Ms. Nichols' edits to Order denyin Motion to Stay.	\$ 500.00		300.00
12, 22, 2020	Transact Welletonie	0.0	neview marrianess care to order acrifin motion to otal.	ψ 500.00	7	500.00
12/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	Follow up with Ms. Nichols re her work on Order to Show Cause Order/ status of same.	\$ 500.00	¢	50.00
12/23/2020	iviaigalet ivictettiile	0.1	APPEAL: Attention to work on substantive revisions to Response to Emergency Motion for	\$ 300.00	۲	30.00
12/22/2020	Mayaayat Malatahia	2.0	, ,	¢ 500.00	ے	1 200 00
12/23/2020	Margaret McLetchie	2.6	Stay and addressing edits from Mr. Lipman.	\$ 500.00	Ş	1,300.00
			APPEAL: Revisions to Response to Emergency Motion to Stay/ address further client edits			
			and proof, and confirm related filings with team. Review final Order and direct team to	١.	١.	
	Margaret McLetchie		include as exhibit to Response.	\$ 500.00	\$	750.00
12/28/2020	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Update to client. Attention to plan re work on proposed Orders.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
			Review Supreme Court's denial of a stay. Related procedural research. Update client. Confer			
			with client. Emails to opposing counsel re obtaining records. Updates to client. Review			
12/29/2020	Margaret McLetchie	4.3	petition for rehearing and confer with Ms. Shell re same/ prepare for next steps.	\$ 500.00	\$	2,150.00
			APPEAL: Continue review of petition for rehearing. Attention to Order on Order to Show			
			Cause. Work with Ms. Shell on response to petition; review and begin revising draft. Calls			
			with client. Review decision denying petition and circulate to client. Plan work on Order to			
12/30/2020	Margaret McLetchie	43	Show Cause if needed.	\$ 500.00	\$	2,150.00
12/30/2020	iviai gai et ivieleteille	7.5	Show eduse ii needed.	7 300.00	7	2,130.00
1			Email to opposing counsel demanding records. Call with client. Plan work re possible Order			
1			to Show Cause. Confer with client. Attention to logistics re obtaining records. Review	1		
12/21/2022	Managanak Martartaria	2.2		¢ 500.00	ے	1 (00 00
	Margaret McLetchie	1	correspondence from Ms. Rehfeldt. Review Motion to voluntary dismiss appeal.	\$ 500.00		1,600.00
1/4/2021	Margaret McLetchie	0.2	Emails re supplemental requests.	\$ 500.00	\$	100.00
1			Follow up re proposed stipulation / process to streamline briefing on Motion for Attorney's	l .	١.	
1/6/2021	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	Fees and Costs, supplement re same.	\$ 500.00	\$	50.00
1			Emails with Ms. Nichols re amending Motion, my efforts to make briefing more efficient.	1		
1/11/2021	Margaret McLetchie	0.3	Plan work accordingly. Update to client.	\$ 500.00	\$	150.00
1/12/2021	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	Review and consider notice of reassignment.	\$ 500.00	\$	50.00
1/12/2021	Margaret McLetchie	0.1	APPEAL: Review Order Dismissing Appeal.	\$ 500.00		50.00
	Margaret McLetchie	_	Revise stip. Emails to Ms. Nichols re same.	\$ 500.00	\$	150.00
, ,====	U				, (,

	T					
1/14/2021	Margaret McLetchie	1.0	Confer with Mr. Wolpert re work on Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs reply and/or amended Motion - supplement. Confer with Ms. Shell re related research re fees on appeal and review / provide feedback re same. Revise stipulation to address concerns expressed by Ms. Nichols. Send to client, then Ms. Nichols and follow up with her re same.	\$ 500.00	\$	500.00
. /. = /2.22				4		
<u> </u>	Margaret McLetchie	_	Attention to stip re Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. [Reduced Entry.]	\$ 500.00		100.00
	Margaret McLetchie Margaret McLetchie	1	Follow up re stipulation; confer with paralegal re same. [Reduced Entry.]	\$ 500.00 \$ 500.00		100.00 50.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Review message from paralegal re 1/27 hearing. Provide Mr. Wolpert with direction re Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 500.00	_	100.00
	Margaret McLetchie		Follow up re hearing.	\$ 500.00		50.00
	Margaret McLetchie			\$ 500.00	\$	50.00
1,2,,2021	ina garet mezeteme	0.12	Revisions to Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; send first draft to client for	ψ 500.00	Ť	50.00
1/29/2021	Margaret McLetchie	0.4	review.	\$ 500.00	\$	200.00
			Review revised Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs addressing client edits			
2/1/2021	Margaret McLetchie	0.5	and send to Mr. Lipman for further review.	\$ 500.00	\$	250.00
			Review further revised consolidated motion for attorney's fees and costs addressing further			
2/2/2021	Margaret McLetchie		client edits and send to Mr. Lipman for review. Work on fee detail.	\$ 500.00	_	
			Totals for Margaret A. McLetchie (2020-2021)	\$		72,500.00
		254.0	Grand Total for Margaret A. McLetchie	\$	17	21,550.00
44/20/2047	0 0 10 11	2.2	Prepare Ms. McLetchie's declaration and exhibits; finalize Motion for Attorney's Fees and	d 450.00	_	220.00
11/29/201/	Pharan Burchfield	2.2	Costs and file and serve/mail all re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	330.00
11/20/2017	Dhaman Dunahfiald	0.1	Download, save, and review file-stamped copy of Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs;	ć 1F0 00	۲.	15.00
11/30/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	calendar appropriately.	\$ 150.00	>	15.00
11/20/2017	Dharan Burchfiold	0.1	Email file-stamped copy of Petitioner's Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs to clients for review/records.	¢ 150.00	ب	15.00
	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield		Circulate/email draft of Opposition to Motion for Stay to clients for review.	\$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$	15.00 15.00
12/3/2017	Filaran Burchilelu	0.1	Incorporate final edits, file and serve/mail Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Opposition	\$ 130.00	۲	13.00
12/6/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.4	to Motion for Stay of District Court Order and Order Shortening Time.	\$ 150.00	\$	60.00
12/0/2017	riiai aii bui ciiiieiu	0.4	Download and review Notice of Appeal; create hard-copy, electronic and time-keeping files	7 130.00	۲	00.00
			re same. Calendar as appropriate. Check Nevada Supreme Court website to confirm			
12/6/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	deadlines re same.	\$ 150.00	Ś	15.00
		1	Download, save, and review Notice of Assignment to NRAP 16 Settlement Program. Calendar	7	Т.	
			as appropriate. Add Settlement Judge Israel Kunin's contact information into system; check			
12/7/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	for conflicts re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
			APPEAL: Prepare for filing Motion to Expedite Appeal (and exhibit); file and serve re same.			
12/15/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.3	Email clients file-stamped copy re same. Calendar response deadlines accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	45.00
			APPEAL: Send/mail Settlement Judge a file-stamped copy of the Motion to Expedite Appeal;	4		
12/20/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	draft, file, and serve/mail an Amended Certificate of Service re same.	\$ 150.00	Ş	30.00
12/27/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.5	APPEAL: Draft and finalize Motion for Excess Pages re Reply to Expedite Appeal; finalize, file and serve/mail Reply to Opposition to Motion to Expedite Appeal.	¢ 150.00	ب	75.00
12/2//201/	Filaran Burchilelu	0.5	APPEAL: Email file-stamped copies of Motion for Excess Pages re Reply in support of Motion	\$ 150.00	٧	75.00
			to Expedite Appeal; finalize, file and serve/mail Reply to Opposition to Motion to Expedite			
12/28/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Appeal and Docketing Statement to clients.	\$ 150.00	Ś	15.00
		1	APPEAL: Finalize and send (mail/email) Respondent Las Vegas Review-Journal's Confidential	7	Т.	
12/29/2017	Pharan Burchfield	0.3	Statement Regarding Settlement to Settlement Judge.	\$ 150.00	\$	45.00
			Prepare exhibits and draft declaration re Reply; finalize, file, and serve/mail Reply to			
1/4/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.9	Opposition to Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 150.00	\$	135.00
1/5/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Email clients briefing re Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and hearing information.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			Prepare Blackjack Bonding v LVMPD research/ fees application briefing for today's argument			
1/11/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.5	for Ms. McLetchie.	\$ 150.00	\$	75.00
			Finalize proposed Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; draft and send Ms.			
			McLetchie's letter to Honorable Judge Crockett and opposing counsel re submitting	١.	١.	
1/18/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.3	competing Orders re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	45.00
1/10/2012	Dharan Dinahfi-1-1	0.4	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Expedite Appeal; send to clients re same; and	¢ 150.00	۲,	15.00
1/18/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	calendar accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
2/1/2010	Dharan Burchfiold	0.2	File Order Granting Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for Attorney's Fees and	¢ 150.00	ہ	20.00
2/1/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	Costs; draft, file, and serve/mail Notice of Entry of Order re same. Email clients Notice of Appeal and Case Appeal Statement re Order Granting Attorney's Fees	\$ 150.00	ڔ	30.00
2/6/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	and Costs.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
_, 0, 2010	a.a Sarcinicia	5.1	Finalize, file, and serve/mail Opposition to Motion for Stay of Order granting Motion for	7 230.00	Ť	15.00
2/13/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	Attorney's Fees and Costs.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
, ,,,,,,,,,,			APPEAL: Download, review, save, and calendar Order Removing from Settlement Program		Ė	
2/22/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	(Case No. 75095) and Reinstating Briefing.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00

						-
2/27/2018	Pharan Burchfield		Begin drafting proposed Order Denying Motion for Stay for Ms. McLetchie's review.	\$ 150.00	\$	60.00
			Email communications with Mr. Echols confirming approval of proposed Order denying stay			
- 1. 1			of Order granting Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; direct Ms. Lopez to pick-up and	4		
3/1/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	deliver to Honorable Judge Crockett.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			File Order Denying Respondent's Renewed Motion on Order Shortening Time for Stay of			
3/7/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	District Court Order; draft, file, and serve/mail Notice of Entry of Order re same.	\$ 150.00	Ś	30.00
	Pharan Burchfield		FEES APPEAL: Draft Opposition to Emergency Relief Under NRAP 27(e).	\$ 150.00	_	30.00
			APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve (into both cases) Opposition to Motion to Consolidate			
	Pharan Burchfield	_	Appeals.	\$ 150.00		30.00
3/19/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	APPEAL: Draft Motion for Excess Pages re Opposition to Stay.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
			FEES APPEAL: Finalize and file/serve Motion for Leave to File Response in Excess of			
3/20/2018	Pharan Burchfield		Page/Type Volume Limitation and proposed Opposition to Emergency Motion for Relief Under NRAP 27(e).	\$ 150.00	¢	45.00
3/20/2018	riiai aii bui ciiiieiu		FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and email clients Opposition to Emergency Motion for Stay	\$ 130.00	٧	45.00
3/21/2018	Pharan Burchfield		Under NRAP 27(e).	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
				,		
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Motion for Extension of Time re Appellant's Opening			
	Pharan Burchfield		Brief and Joint Appendix and Order Granting Extension re same; calendar briefing schedules.	\$ 150.00		30.00
4/30/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.3	·	\$ 150.00	\$	45.00
			APPEAL: Download and save Clark County Office of Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion for			
			Extension of Time to File Opening Brief. Draft, file, and serve Notice of Non-Opposition to Petitioner Clark County Office of Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion for Extension of Time			
5/21/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	to File Opening Brief.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
3/21/2010	Tharan Barenneia		FEES APPEAL: Download, save, review, and update calendars re Coroner's Motion (and	7 130.00	7	30.00
5/23/2018	Pharan Burchfield		Notice of Approved Motion) for Extension re Opening Brief and Appendix.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Appellant's Opening Brief. Calendar Answering Brief as			
6/6/2018	Pharan Burchfield		appropriate.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Joint Appendix (volumes 1 and 2); send to			
c /22 /2240	0 1011		attorneys re same; and download, save, and review Appellant's Second Motion to Extend	A 450.00		20.00
6/22/2018	Pharan Burchfield		Opening Brief; calendar response re same. APPEAL: Begin preparing Unopposed Motion for an Extension re Answering Brief for	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
6/28/2018	Pharan Burchfield		attorneys' review/approval.	\$ 150.00	¢	45.00
0/20/2010	Tharan Barenneia		APPEAL: Finalize and file Unopposed Motion for Extension to File Respondents' Answering	7 130.00	7	43.00
6/29/2018	Pharan Burchfield		Brief.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			Finalize and send (email) Public Records Act requests to Ms. Rehfeldt re Marquis Aurbach			
7/2/2018	Pharan Burchfield		Coffing agreement.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			FEES APPEAL: Download, review, and update calendars per Order Granting Motion re			
7/2/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	extension of deadline of Answering Brief.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			FEES APPEAL: Download, review, and update calendars per Order Granting Motion re			
7/2/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	extension of deadline of Opening Brief (and approximate deadline for Answering Brief).	\$ 150.00	Ś	15.00
.,_,_,_			Review and save Ms. Rehfeldt's response to Public Records Act requests re Marquis Aurbach	7	т.	
7/9/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Coffing agreement.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Appellant's Opening Brief; calendar Answering			
	Pharan Burchfield		Brief accordingly.	\$ 150.00		15.00
8/6/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.5	APPEAL: Prepare shell Answering Brief for attorneys' drafting.	\$ 150.00	\$	75.00
			APPEAL: Draft shell Unopposed Motion re excess word-count in Answering Brief for			
8/13/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.4	drafting/editing by attorneys. Download and save for attorneys' review Orders denying re same File and serve Motion same.	\$ 150.00	¢	60.00
0/13/2010	riiai aii bui ciiilelu	0.4	Same the and serve Motion same.	\$ 130.00	۲	00.00
			APPEAL: Draft, prepare, Bates, index, and put into volumes (3) Respondent's Appendix; file			
			and serve re same. Prepare Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, Certificate of Compliance			
			(non-compliant re pending unopposed Motion re word-count), and Certificate of Service re			
			Respondent's Answering Brief; finalize, file, serve, and email courtesy copy to opposing			
8/13/2018	Pharan Burchfield	2.3	counsel all re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	345.00
0/11/2010	Dharan Burchfiold	0.1	APPEAL: Email Reporters Committee for Freedom of the Press copies of Answering Brief and	¢ 150.00	خ	15.00
0/14/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Appendices for their potential Amicus Brief. FEES APPEAL: Draft Unopposed Motion for Extension of Time to File Respondent's Answering	\$ 150.00	ڔ	15.00
8/16/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.3	Brief for Ms. McLetchie's review/approval.	\$ 150.00	\$	45.00
, ,			FEES APPEAL: Convert draft Unopposed Motion into Stipulation for Extension of Time to File			
			Briefing (First Request); email communications with Mr. Echols confirms draft and			
8/17/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	permission to use esignature; file and serve re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Denying Excess Pages; update calendars			
8/21/2018	Pharan Burchfield		accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			APPEAL: Format Respondent's Answering Brief, update Tables of Authorities, Table of			
9/5/2010	Pharan Burchfield	1 2	Contents, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service; finalize and file/serve re same.	\$ 150.00	ć	180.00
3/3/2010	i naran burumelu	1.2	parrie.	00.00 ب	ڔ	100.00

		1	EFFC ADDEAU D. G		1	
9/17/2018	Pharan Burchfield		FEES APPEAL: Draft, incorporate Ms. McLetchie's edits, file, and serve Unopposed Motion for Extension of Time to File Answering Brief (Second Request).	\$ 150.00	Ś	90.00
3/17/2018	rilaran burcinielu	0.0	APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Opposition to Motion to Strike Respondent's Appendix and	Ç 130.00	7	30.00
9/21/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	Motion to Stay Briefing.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
			FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order granting extension; update attorneys and			
9/27/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	calendar appropriately.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
10/15/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	APPEAL: Draft, file, and serve Notice of Change of Firm Name.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
	Pharan Burchfield		FEES APPEAL: Draft, file, and serve Notice of Change of Firm Name.	\$ 150.00	_	15.00
10/16/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Draft, file, and serve/mail Notice of Change of Firm Name.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Filed Order Granting Motion to File Amicus Brief, To Associate Counsel, and Denying Motion to Strike Appendix and the Amici Curiae Brief of The			
10/18/2018	Pharan Burchfield		Reporters Committee for Freedom of the Press and 11 Media Organizations.	\$ 150.00	ć	15.00
10/10/2016	riiai aii Bui ciiileiu	0.1	Reporters Committee for Freedom of the Fress and 11 Media Organizations.	\$ 130.00	Ą	13.00
			FEES APPEAL: Incorporate attorney edits, prepare/format Table of Contents, Table of			
			Authorities, Certificate of Compliance, and Certificate of Service re Respondent's Answering			
10/19/2018	Pharan Burchfield		Brief; finalize Respondent's Answering Brief, and file/serve re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	675.00
			FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Respondent's Answering Brief; calendar			
10/22/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Appellant's Reply Brief deadline accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Appellant's Reply Brief and Appendix; email clients			
12/4/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	briefing re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
/ /			APPEAL: Finalize and file Motion for Leave to File Surreply. Format Table of Contents, Table	4 .=		
12/24/2018	Pharan Burchfield	0.5	of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Surreply; finalize and file re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	75.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Telephonic Extension. Appellant's			
12/27/2019	Pharan Burchfield		Opposition to Motion to File Surreply; and update calendars accordingly.	\$ 150.00	¢	15.00
12/2//2016	riiai aii Bui ciiileiu		APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opposition to Motion for Leave to File Surreply; and	\$ 130.00	Ą	13.00
1/17/2019	Pharan Burchfield		calendar accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
, ,			APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Reply to Response Respondent's Reply to Opposition for		•	
1/24/2019	Pharan Burchfield		Leave to File Surreply.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order re Surreply and Surreply; alert attorneys and			
2/11/2019	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	calendar accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and circulate to Order Granting Extension Per Telephonic Request.			
2/13/2019	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Appellant's Response to Respondent's Sur-Reply; update attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
2/7/2010	0 1011	0.4	ADDEAL Developed and an incorporate Company and an all Market and a second	A 450.00	_	45.00
3///2019	Pharan Burchfield		APPEAL: Download, save, and review Response to Surreply; and email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Regarding Oral Argument	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			consolidating and scheduling the two appeals for oral argument; update attorneys and			
5/1/2019	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	calendar accordingly.	\$ 150.00	ς	15.00
3/1/2013	Tharan Barcinicia		APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Appellant's Motion to Postpone Oral	ÿ 130.00	7	15.00
			Argument Hearing Date and Allow Longer Argument Time; update attorneys and calendars			
5/8/2019	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, saved, and review Order Granting Motion rescheduling			
5/14/2019	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Oral Arguments; update attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Draft Motion to Continue Oral Argument for Ms. McLetchie's			
5/16/2019	Pharan Burchfield		review and approval.	\$ 150.00	\$	45.00
E /4.C /2.24.2	Dhama Dan 16 11		APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Oral Argument Setting;	ć 450.00	,	45.00
5/16/2019	Pharan Burchfield		update attorneys and confirm with calendar re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Respondent's Unopposed Motion to			
5/17/2010	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Continue Oral Argument; download, save, and review re same; update attorneys and calendars accordingly.	\$ 150.00	ς	15.00
3,11,2013	aran barannela	0.1	can and accordingly.	7 130.00	7	15.00
			APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Per Ms. McLetchie, called and spoke with Clerk at Nevada			
5/29/2019	Pharan Burchfield		Supreme Court re status of outstanding Unopposed Motion to Continue Oral Argument.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Granting Motion to Continue			
5/30/2019	Pharan Burchfield		Oral Argument; update attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Withdrawal of Amici Counsel; and update			
7/16/2019	Pharan Burchfield		attorneys re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
0 (5 = 1)			APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Notice Scheduling Oral	A		
	Pharan Burchfield		Argument; update team and clients re same; and calendar accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	30.00
9/20/2019	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	APPEAL: Draft Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument for attorneys' review.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
0/20/2010	Dharan Burchfiold	0.3	APPEAL AND FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notices of Appearance at Oral Argument.	\$ 150.00	ć	4E 00
	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield		FEES APPEAL: Finalize, file, and serve Notice of Appearance at Oral Argument.	\$ 150.00 \$ 150.00	\$	45.00 15.00
3/30/2019	. naran burchillelu		APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Oral Argument Reminder Notices;	¥ 130.00	ب	13.00
9/30/2019	Pharan Burchfield		update attorneys and confirm calendar re same.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
-,,			- 12 - 12 - 12 - 12 - 12 - 12 - 12 - 12	,	7	_5.00

	Г		[
10/2/2019	Pharan Burchfield		APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Download, save, and review Voluntary Disclosure from Justice Abbi Silver; update attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
			FEES APPEAL: Shell draft Response to Appellant's Notice of Supplemental Authorities for			
10/3/2019	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	attorney's review. Finalize, file, and serve same after attorney drafting/approval. APPEAL and FEES APPEAL: Assist in Ms. McLetchie's preparation re upcoming oral	\$ 150.00	\$	15.00
10/7/2019	Pharan Burchfield		arguments. Totals for Pharan Burchfield (2017-2019)	\$ 150.00	\$	60.00 3,840.00
			APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice of Appearance re Mr. Anderson; and update	ې	Π	3,040.00
1/23/2020	Pharan Burchfield		attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	Ś	17.50
1/23/2020	Thatan Barennela	0.1	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Opinion (Affirmed in Part Reversed in Part and	ŷ 173.00	7	17.50
2/27/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Remanded); and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			Review unsigned Remittitur received from Nevada Supreme Court; and update attorneys re			
3/27/2020	Pharan Burchfield		same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
4/45/2020	Dhama Danah fiala		Download, save, and review Minute Order re briefing schedule and discovery plan; update	ć 475 00	4	17.50
4/15/2020	Pharan Burchfield		attorneys and calendar accordingly. Download, save, and review Notice of Appearance and Change of Counsel; update attorneys	\$ 175.00	Ş	17.50
4/17/2020	Pharan Burchfield		and file accordingly.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			<u> </u>			
4/27/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Issued Remittitur; and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
4/30/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	Draft a meet and confer letter to opposing counsel for Ms. McLetchie's review and approval.	\$ 175.00	\$	35.00
5/5/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Finalize and send (e-serve) Ms. McLetchie's letter to opposing counsel re scheduling and discovery.	\$ 175.00	ć	17.50
3/3/2020	riiai aii Burciiileiu		Email follow-up to opposing counsel to schedule a meet and confer re discovery and	\$ 175.00	٧	17.50
5/8/2020	Pharan Burchfield		scheduling in case.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
5/19/2020	Pharan Burchfield		Draft Stipulation and Order re Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval.	\$ 175.00	\$	52.50
			Finalize Stipulation and Order Regarding Briefing Schedule (incorporate Ms. Nichols' edits)	.	١.	
5/27/2020	Pharan Burchfield		and submit/email to Department 24.	\$ 175.00	\$	35.00
			Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order Regarding Briefing Schedule. Draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order Regarding Briefing Schedule. Update			
6/2/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	Ś	35.00
	Pharan Burchfield		Per Ms. McLetchie, email client re upcoming hearing date.	\$ 175.00		17.50
			Draft Stipulation and Order Extending the Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and			
7/15/2020	Pharan Burchfield		approval.	\$ 175.00	\$	70.00
			Finalize draft Stipulation and Order Extending the Briefing Schedule; email communications			
7/17/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.3	with Ms. Nichols re same. Submit/email Stipulation and Order to Court/Department 24 re same.	\$ 175.00	ć	52.50
7/17/2020	Tharam Burennela		Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order Extending Briefing Schedule; draft, file,	ÿ 173.00	7	32.30
			and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order Extending Briefing Schedule; update	ļ		
7/20/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	\$	35.00
			Draft Motion for Leave re excess pages for attorneys' review and approval. Prepare Table of	ļ		
8/27/2020	Pharan Burchfield	1 3	Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service re Petitioner's Opening Brief on Remand; prepare/finalize for filing; file and serve re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	227.50
0/2//2020	Thatan Barennela	1.5	nemana, prepare/manze for ming, me and serve to sume.	ÿ 173.00	7	227.50
			Download, save, and review (1) Stipulation and Order to Extend Briefing Schedule; and (2)			
9/28/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order; update attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			Download, save, and review Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical	ļ		
10/7/2020	Dhavan Dunahfiald	0.1	Examiner's Answering Brief; update attorneys and confirm calendar accordingly. Email Mr.	ć 17F 00	۲.	17.50
	Pharan Burchfield Pharan Burchfield		Lipman re same. Per Ms. McLetchie, send hearing reminder email to Mr. Lipman.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$	17.50 17.50
10/22/2020	Tharam Burennela	0.1	Tel Wist Medecenic, seria nearing reminder email to Wit. Elpinan.	ÿ 173.00	7	17.50
			Create Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, and Certificate of Service; prepare for filing			
			the Petitioner's Reply in Support of Petitioner's Opening Brief on Remand for attorneys'			
10/22/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.9	review and approval. Finalize, file, and serve re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	157.50
			Phono call with Mr. Simoon (law clark in Donartment 24) to decket chawing 10/20/2020 as a			
10/23/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Phone call with Mr. Simeon (law clerk in Department 24) re docket showing 10/29/2020 as a "Status Check" rather than a "Hearing" and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	<	17.50
-0, -0, 2020	a.a.ı barcıillelu		Download, save, and review Notification of Appearance by Blue Jeans re Thursday, October	y 1/3.00	7	17.50
			29, 2020 hearing; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman and Mr.			
10/27/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Kane re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
10/20/222	Dhama Dall Call		Phone call with Mr. Simone, law clerk in Department 24, confirming BlueJeans invite (not in-	6 675 55	_	47
10/28/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	person) and no courtesy copies requested. Update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	Ş	17.50
			Email communications with Ms. Nichols re splitting costs of today's hearing transcript; draft	[
10/29/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	transcript request for attorneys' review and approval; and email to Court re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
	•		• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •		•	

		1				1
			Email communications with Ms. Maldonado (court recOrder in Department 24) and Ms.			
11/4/2020	Pharan Burchfield		Nichols re splitting costs of 10/26/2020 transcript and requesting updated invoices reflecting such; payment made accordingly.	\$ 175.00	ć	17.50
11/4/2020	Pridraii Burciiileiu	0.1	Check court docket to confirm that no Minutes have been updated re 10/29/2020 hearing;	\$ 175.00	Ş	17.50
11/4/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00	Ś	17.50
, ,			Download, save, and review RecOrders Transcript of 10/29/2020 Hearing re Briefs on	,	,	
11/5/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Remand; and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			Email Department 24 requesting extension of time to submit proposed Order. Update			
11/12/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
11/13/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Email Mr. Lipman the revised proposed Order on remand for his review.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
				١.	١.	
11/13/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.3	Finalize draft proposed Order on remand and email to Ms. Nichols for review and approval.	\$ 175.00	\$	52.50
14 /40 /2020	Dhama Danah Galal	0.2	Draft letter re competing Orders for review/approval. Finalize and send (email) to Judge	ć 47F 00	,	52.50
11/18/2020	Pharan Burchfield		Crockett re same. Phone call with Mr. Simeon (law clerk in Department 24), requesting re-send proposed	\$ 175.00	\$	52.50
11/10/2020	Pharan Burchfield		Order; update attorneys and email re same.	\$ 175.00	ć	17.50
11/13/2020	Tharan Barcinicia		Finalize, file, and serve Opposition to Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time. Email Mr.	ÿ 173.00	7	17.50
11/30/2020	Pharan Burchfield		Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	Ś	70.00
			Gather, create, prepare, and redact district court expenses and appeal expenses for	7 -110100	т	
12/7/2020	Pharan Burchfield		Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements.	\$ 175.00	\$	350.00
				,		
			Download, save, and review Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical			
			Examiner's Reply in Support of Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time; update			
12/7/2020	Pharan Burchfield		attorneys and confirm calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			Download, save, and review Notification of Appearance via BlueJeans re upcoming			
			12/10/2020 hearing on Coroner's Motion for Stay; update attorneys and calendar	.	١.	
12/7/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
42/7/2020	0 1011	0.0	Finalize and submit/email Motion for Order to Show Cause on an Order Shortening Time to	A 475 00		52.50
12///2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.3	Department 24.	\$ 175.00	\$	52.50
			Continue to create, prepare, and redact district court expenses and appeal expenses. Draft			
12/8/2020	Pharan Burchfield	2.8	Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements for attorneys review and approval.	\$ 175.00	ς	490.00
12/0/2020	Tharam Barchinela	2.0	Download, save, and review Motion for an Order to Show Cause on an Order Shortening	ŷ 173.00	7	430.00
			Time; draft Notice of Entry of Motion for an Order to Show Cause on an Order Shortening			
			Time, file and serve re same; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re			
12/8/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	same.	\$ 175.00	\$	35.00
			Create, prepare, and edit fees by date for attorneys' review and approval for the upcoming			
12/9/2020	Pharan Burchfield	1.4	Motion for Attorney's Fees.	\$ 175.00	\$	245.00
			Per Ms. McLetchie, email hearing reminder and BlueJeans details to Mr. Lipman and Mr.			
			Kane re 12/10/2020 hearings on Coroner's Motion for Stay and Las Vegas Review-Journal's	١.	١.	
12/9/2020	Pharan Burchfield		Motion for an Order to Show Cause.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			Download, save, and review Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical			
			Examiner's Opposition to Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for Order to Show Cause on Order Shortening Time; update attorneys and confirm calendar accordingly. Email			
12/9/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	ς	17.50
12/3/2020	Tharan Barenneia	0.1	Per Ms. McLetchie, prepare and send/email Ms. Maldonado (court recOrder in Department	ÿ 173.00	7	17.50
12/10/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	24) expedited transcript request.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
				,		
			Finalize Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements; file and serve re same. Draft Ms.			
			McLetchie's Declaration in Support of Supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.			
			Continue editing fees (create exhibits re by date and by biller) for attorneys' review and			
			approval. Finalize Supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; file and serve re same.			
12/11/2020	Pharan Burchfield	3.2	Update attorneys, calendar, and email Mr. Lipman accordingly.	\$ 175.00	\$	560.00
			Download, save, and review Clerk's Notice of Hearing re supplement Motion for Attorney's			
			Fees and Costs. Update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Per Ms. McLetchie, phone call			
12/14/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	with Master Calendar re request for no hearing/in chambers; and email Department 24 re same.	\$ 175.00	ć	35.00
	Pharan Burchfield		Follow-up email to court reporter re expedited transcript request.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
,,,	Dar ominera	0.1	and the second s	7 27 3.00	7	27.50
			Download, save, and review Transcript re 12/10/20 (Coroner's Stay and Las Vegas Review-			
12/15/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Journal's Order to Show Cause); update attorneys and email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
			Download, save, and review Notice of Appeal and Case Appeal Statement; update attorneys			
12/16/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	and calendar potential cross-appeal accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
l ,						
12/17/2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.1	Per Ms. McLetchie, email Mr. Lipman the draft Proposed Order Denying Stay for his review.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
12/17/2022	Dharan Durchfi-1-1	0.0	APPEAL: Prepare draft Response to Emergency Motion for Relief Under NRAP 27(e) [Stay] for	¢ 175.00	۲	35.00
12/1//2020	Pharan Burchfield	0.2	attorneys' use.	\$ 175.00	>	35.00

field 0. field 1.	1 Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same. APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to 2 Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on 1 Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming 1 hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. Nichols' 1 assistant); and update attorneys re same. Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing 2 Schedule; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update 1 attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update 1 attorneys re same. Prepare updated spreadsheets re fees as exhibits to Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; finalize with attorneys; file and serve re same. B Totals for Pharan Burchfield (2020-2021) Grand Total for Pharan Burchfield	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	17.50 17.50 35.00 17.50 17.50 17.50 17.50 35.00 4,165.00 8,005.00
field 0. field 1.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to 2 Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on 1 Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming 1 hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols' 1 assistant); and update attorneys re same. Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing 2 Schedule; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update 1 attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update 1 attorneys re same. Prepare updated spreadsheets re fees as exhibits to Consolidated Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs; finalize with attorneys; file and serve re same.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50 17.50 35.00 17.50
field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols' assistant); and update attorneys re same. Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50 17.50 35.00 17.50
field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols' assistant); and update attorneys re same. Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50 17.50 35.00
field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols' assistant); and update attorneys re same. Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50 17.50 35.00
field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols' assistant); and update attorneys re same. Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50 17.50 35.00
field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols' assistant); and update attorneys re same. Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50 17.50 35.00
field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols' assistant); and update attorneys re same. Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing; and that the continued hearing date is not yet scheduled on the docket; and update	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50 17.50 35.00
field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols' assistant); and update attorneys re same. Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Check docket to confirm that no Court Minutes have been posted re 01/27/2021 hearing;	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50 17.50
field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols' assistant); and update attorneys re same. Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; update attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50 17.50
field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols' assistant); and update attorneys re same. Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; draft, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50
field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols' assistant); and update attorneys re same. Download, save, and review Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50
field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. Nichols' assistant); and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50
field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols'	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50
field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same. Check docket to confirm 01/27/2021 hearing; phone call with Ms. Busch (Ms. NIchols'	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00 17.50
field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming hearing; and update attorneys re same.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00
field 0. field 0. field 0. field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward. Phone call with Ms. Linn, JEA in Department 29, re pending Stipulation and upcoming	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$ \$	17.50 70.00 35.00
field 0. field 0. field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on Attorney's Fees and Costs and confirm whether or not 01/27/2021 hearing is going forward.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$	17.50 70.00 35.00
field 0. field 0. field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same. Follow-up phone call (attempt) and email to Department 29 re pending Stipulation on	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$	17.50 70.00 35.00
field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to Court re same.	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$	17.50 70.00
field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$	17.50 70.00
field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval. Incorporate Ms. Nichol's edits to the draft the Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule; finalize and submit/email to	\$ 175.00 \$ 175.00	\$	17.50
field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule for attorneys' review and approval.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
field 0.	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same. Draft Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and 1 calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same.			
	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Order Dismissing Appeal; update attorneys and			
field 0.		\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
field I 0.	1 Honorable Judge Jones); and update attorneys re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	Ś	17.50
	Download, save, and review Notice of Department Reassignment (Department 29;			
nciu U.	בי מוזים מאָאַריסימו, וווימווציב, וווב, מוזים אברייב דב אמוזיב. בווומוו ועוד. בוטוומוו דב אמוזיב.	1/3.00	ڔ	17.30
field 0.	Draft Peremptory Challenge of a Judge re Honorable Jessica Peterson for attorneys' review 1 and approval; finalize, file, and serve re same. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	¢	17.50
	Draft Peremptony Challenge of a Judge to Henerable Jessies Peterson for attended to the			
field 0.	1 calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
field 0	Journal's Motion for Order to Show Cause on Order Shortening Time; update attorneys and	ć 175 00	_ ا	17.50
	Download, save, and review Notice of Entry of Order Denying Petitioner Las Vegas Review-		ĺ	
field 0.	1 and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Motion to Voluntarily Dismiss Appeal; update attorneys			
field 0.	1 attorneys and calendar accordingly.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
	Download, save, and review Order Denying Motion for an Order to Show Cause; update			
field 0.	re same. Update attorneys and email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	157.50
	Create Table of Contents, Table of Authorities, Certificate of Service, finalize, file and serve all			
	APPEAL: Finalize Motion for Leave to File Response in Excess Page/Type Volume Limitation.			
field 0.	2 Time. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	35.00
	County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion for Stay on an Order Shortening			
	re same. Draft, finalize, file, and serve Notice of Entry of Order Denying Respondent Clark		ĺ	
	Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion for Stay on an Order Shortening Time; update attorneys			
neid 0.	Download, save, and review Order Denying Respondent Clark County Office of the	\$ 175.00	Ş	17.50
field 0.	1 APPEAL: Draft Motion for Leave to File in Excess Pages for attorneys' review and approval.	\$ 175.00	ć	17.50
field 0.	1 APPEAL: Email Mr. Lipman a copy of the Notice Of No Transcripts To Be Requested.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
field 0.	1 attorneys and calendar accordingly. Email Mr. Lipman re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Notice re Exemption from Settlement Program; update			
field 0.	Ms. Nichols's review and email re same.	\$ 175.00	\$	17.50
	Prepare draft proposed Order Denying the Motion for stay on an Order shortening time for	7	Т.	
field 0.		\$ 175.00	Ś	17.50
ricia o.	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	7 173.00	7	17.50
field n		\$ 175 00	Ś	17.50
field	i 0.:	APPEAL: Download, save, and review Emergency Motion for Relief Under NRAP 27(e) [Stay]; 0.1 and update attorneys re same. Prepare draft proposed Order Denying the Motion for stay on an Order shortening time for	Court Minutes Addendum to Notice of Appeal Packet submitted 12/16/2020 - A758501; and (3) Notice of Referral of Settlement Program and Suspension of Rules; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. \$ 175.00 APPEAL: Download, save, and review Emergency Motion for Relief Under NRAP 27(e) [Stay]; and update attorneys re same. \$ 175.00 Prepare draft proposed Order Denying the Motion for stay on an Order shortening time for	Court Minutes Addendum to Notice of Appeal Packet submitted 12/16/2020 - A758501; and (3) Notice of Referral of Settlement Program and Suspension of Rules; update attorneys and calendar accordingly. \$ 175.00 \$ APPEAL: Download, save, and review Emergency Motion for Relief Under NRAP 27(e) [Stay]; and update attorneys re same. \$ 175.00 \$ Prepare draft proposed Order Denying the Motion for stay on an Order shortening time for

ELECTRONICALLY SERVED 4/8/2021 8:28 AM

Electronically Filed 04/08/2021 8:28 AM CLERK OF THE COURT

MARQUIS AURBACH COFFING 10001 Park Run Drive Las Vegas, Nevada 89145 (702) 382-0711 FAX: (702) 382-5816
--

1	Marquis Aurdach Colling
	Craig R. Anderson, Esq.
2	Nevada Bar No. 6882
	Jackie V. Nichols, Esq.
3	Nevada Bar No. 14246
	10001 Park Run Drive
4	Las Vegas, Nevada 89145
	Telephone: (702) 382-0711
5	Facsimile: (702) 382-5816
	canderson@maclaw.com
6	jnichols@maclaw.com
7	Steven B. Wolfson, Esq.
	District Attorney
8	Laura C. Rehfeldt, Esq.
	Deputy District Attorney
9	Nevada Bar No. 5101
	500 South Grand Central Pkwy, 5th Flr.
10	P.O. Box 552215
	Las Vegas, Nevada 89155-2215
11	Telephone: (702) 455-4761
	Facsimile: (702) 382-5178
12	laura.rehfeldt@clarkcountyda.com

Attorneys for Respondent, Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner

DISTRICT COURT

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA

LAS VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL,

Petitioner,

Case No.:

A-17-758501-W

Dept. No.: 29

VS.

CLARK COUNTY OFFICE OF THE CORONER/MEDICAL EXAMINER,

Respondent.

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

ORDER GRANTING PETITIONER LAS VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL'S AMENDED MOTION FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES AND COSTS

Petitioner the Las Vegas Review-Journal's Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, having come on for hearing on March 2, 2021, the Honorable Judge David Jones presiding, Petitioner the Las Vegas Review-Journal (the "Review-Journal") appearing by and through its counsel, Margaret A. McLetchie and Alina M. Shell, and Respondent the Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner (the "Coroner") appearing by and through its Page 1 of 14

MAC:15090-001 4323867_1 4/1/2021 4:05 PM

counsel, Jackie V. Nichols, and the Court having read and considered all of the papers and pleadings on file, hearing oral argument, and being fully advised, and good cause appearing therefore, the Court hereby makes the following findings of fact and conclusions of law:

I. PROCEDURAL HISTORY AND FINDINGS OF FACT

The Records Request and The Coroner's Response

- 1. On April 13, 2017, the Review-Journal sent the Coroner a request (the "Request") pursuant to the Nevada Public Records Act, Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.001 et seq. (the "NPRA") seeking all autopsy reports of all autopsies conducted on anyone under the age of 18 from 2012 through the date of the Request.
- 2. The Coroner responded via email on April 13, 2017. It provided a spreadsheet with information consisting of the Coroner case number, name of decedent, date of death, gender, age, race, location of death, and cause and manner of death, but refused to provide "autopsy reports, notes or other documents." In its April 13, 2017 email, the Coroner stated it would not disclose the autopsy reports because they contain medical information and confidential information about a decedent's body. The Coroner relied on Attorney General Opinion, 1982 Nev. Op. Atty. Gen. No. 12 ("AGO 82-12") and its legal analysis as the legal basis for non-disclosure.
- 3. The Review-Journal followed up by emailing the Clark County District Attorney's Office on April 13, 2017, requesting additional legal support for the Coroner's refusal to provide records.
- 4. The District Attorney's Office, Civil Division, on behalf of the Coroner, responded via email on April 14, 2017, again relying on AGO 82-12 and also relying on Assembly Bill 57, 79th Sess. (Nev. 2017) as the legal bases for its refusal to disclose the requested records.
- 5. On May 9, 2017, following a meeting between the Coroner and the Review-Journal, the Coroner emailed a second spreadsheet to the Review-Journal listing child deaths dating back to 2011 in which the Coroner conducted autopsies.

- 6. On May 23, 2017, counsel for the Review-Journal wrote to the Coroner to address concerns with the Coroner's refusal to provide access to any of the requested juvenile autopsy reports.
- 7. On May 26, 2017, the Coroner (via the District Attorney) responded to the May 23, 2017, letter, again relying on the legal analysis in AGO 82-12, and agreed to consider providing redacted versions of autopsies of juveniles if the Review-Journal provided a specific list of cases it wished to review.
- 8. In its May 26, 2017 response, the Coroner for the first time also asserted that the records may be protected by Nev. Rev. Stat. § 432B.407, which makes documents, including autopsy reports, reviewed by the Child Death team, of which the Coroner is a representative, confidential, and that privacy interests outweighed public disclosure, consistent with the legal analysis articulated in AGO 82-12.
- 9. The Review-Journal provided the Coroner with a list of specific cases it wanted reports for via email on May 26, 2017.
 - 10. The Coroner responded to the May 26, 2017 email on May 31, 2017.
- 11. In its May 31, 2017 response, the Coroner stated that due to the magnitude of the request and the review involved, the records would not be made available by the end of the fifth business day. The Coroner further explained that each record would need to be reviewed individually for privileged material and the information subject to privileges would not be disclosed.
- 12. The Coroner also asked the Review-Journal to specify the records it wanted to receive first, which the Review-Journal did on June 12, 2017.
- 13. On July 9, 2017, in a response to a further email from the Review-Journal inquiring on the status of the records, the Coroner indicated it would not produce any records that pertained to any case that was subsequently handled by a child death review team pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 432B.407. By that time, the Coroner had determined which cases were not handled by the child death review team and provided a list to the Review-Journal.

14. On July 11, 2017, the Coroner provided sample files of redacted autopsy reports of juveniles that were not handled by a child death review team. The sample files were heavily redacted; the Coroner asserted that the redacted language consisted of information that was medical, related to the health of the decedent's mother, could be marked with stigmata [sic], or considered an invasion of privacy. Statements of diagnosis or opinion that were medical or health related that went to the cause of death were not redacted.

15. On July 11, 2017, the Coroner also demanded that the Review-Journal commit to payment for further work in redacting files for production and declined to produce records without payment. The Coroner indicated it would take two persons 10-12 hours to redact the records it was willing to produce, and that the Review-Journal would have to pay \$45.00 an hour for the two reviewers, one of which would be an attorney. The Coroner contended that conducting a privilege review and redacting autopsy reports required the "extraordinary use of personnel" under Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.055. The Coroner stated it did not intend to seek fees for the work associated with the previously provided spreadsheets and redacted reports.

The Initial Litigation Over the Petition

16. On July 17, 2017, the Review-Journal filed its Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.001/Application for Writ of Mandamus/Application for Declaratory and Injunctive Relief (the "Petition") and requested expedited consideration pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2).

17. On August 17, 2017, the Review-Journal submitted a Memorandum in support of its Petition. The Coroner submitted its Response on August 30, 2017, asserting a number of arguments in support of confidentiality of personal health and medical information unrelated to the cause or manner of death. The Review-Journal submitted its Reply on September 7, 2017.

- 18. The Court held a hearing on the Review-Journal's Petition on September 28, 2017.
- 19. On November 9, 2017, the Court entered an Order rejecting each of the Coroner's arguments and granting the Review-Journal's Petition, requiring the Coroner to produce the requested records (the "Petition Order"). The Court also ordered that the Coroner was not Page 4 of 14

MAC:15090-001 4323867 1 4/1/2021 4:05 PM

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

entitled to any fees or costs for producing the records, other than the cost of the medium on which the records were to be electronically provided.

The Initial Litigation Regarding Fees and Costs

- On November 26, 2017, the Review-Journal timely filed a Motion for Attorney's 20. Fees and Costs (the "Fees Motion") pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2).
- In its Fees Motion and supporting exhibits, the Review-Journal requested 21. compensation at the following rates for work performed by its attorneys and support staff between July 10, 2017, and November 29, 2017:

	Billing Rate	Total Billed
27.9	\$450.00	\$12,465.001
51.3	\$350.00	$$17,220.00^2$
2.1	\$175.00	\$367.50
8.9	\$150.00	\$1,335.00
6.6	\$25.00	\$165.00
	Total Fees Requested	\$31,552.50
	51.3 2.1 8.9	51.3 \$350.00 2.1 \$175.00 8.9 \$150.00 6.6 \$25.00

- 22. The Review-Journal also requested \$825.02 in costs associated with the litigation, for a combined total request for \$32,377.52 in fees and costs.
- 23. The Review-Journal provided detail for the work performed, as well as declarations supporting the reasonableness of the rates and the work performed.
- 24. The Coroner's Office filed an Opposition to the Fees Motion on December 14, 2017, and the Review-Journal filed a Reply on January 4, 2018.
- 25. In its Opposition, the Coroner's Office asserted that pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.012—a provision of the NPRA which provides immunity from damages for public officers who act in good faith in disclosing or refusing to disclose records—the Review-Journal had to

This total reflected voluntary reductions for some time entries, made by counsel for the Reviewournal in her billing discretion.

See supra n.1.

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

establish the Coroner's Office acted in bad faith in refusing to disclose the requested records to obtain attorney's fees and costs.

- 26. The Court conducted a hearing on the Fees Motion on January 11, 2018.
- 27. On February 1, 2018, the Court entered an Order granting the Review-Journal the entirety of the fees and costs it requested (the "Fees Order").

The Coroner's Appeal of the Petition Order

- 28. On November 28, 2017, the Coroner filed a Notice of Appeal from Petition Order.
- 29. On November 29, 2017, the Coroner filed a Motion for Stay on an Order Shortening Time requesting that the Court stay the Petition Order pending its appeal.
- 30. The Review-Journal filed an Opposition to the Motion for Stay on December 6, 2017, and the Coroner filed a reply on December 8, 2017.
- 31. Following a December 12, 2017, hearing on the Coroner's motion, the Court entered an order on January 11, 2018, granting the Coroner's request for a stay.
- 32. The Coroner filed its Opening Brief in Clark Cty. Office of the Coroner/Med. Exam'r, Nevada Supreme Court Case No. 74604, on June 6, 2018.
 - 33. The Review-Journal filed an Answering Brief on September 6, 2018.

The Coroner's Appeal of the Fees Order

- On February 5, 2018, the Coroner filed a notice of appeal from the Fees Order. 34.
- 35. The Coroner also filed a Renewed Motion for Stay on an Order Shortening Time on February 5, 2018.
- 36. The Review-Journal filed an opposition to the Coroner's Renewed Motion for Stay on February 13, 2018.
- 37. The Court conducted a hearing on the Coroner's Renewed Motion for Stay on February 15, 2018, and orally denied the request for a stay. The Court subsequently entered a written order denying the stay on March 7, 2018.
- 38. The Coroner filed an Emergency Motion for Stay with the Nevada Supreme Court on March 8, 2018.

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

39.	The Review-Journal	filed an	Opposition to	the	Emergency	Motion	for	Stay	or
March 21, 201	8.								

40. On April 12, 2018, the Supreme Court entered a decision and order granting the Coroner's request for a stay pending appeal. See Clark Cty. Office of the Coroner/Medical Exam'r v. Las Vegas Review-Journal, 415 P.3d 16, 17 (Nev. 2018).

The Outcome of the Coroner's Appeals

- 41. The Nevada Supreme Court conducted a consolidated oral argument on the Coroner's appeals of the Petition Order and the Fees Order on October 7, 2019.
- 42. On February 27, 2020, the Supreme Court issued a written opinion affirming in part and reversing in part the Court's orders and remanding the case back to this Court. See Clark Cty. Office of the Coroner/Medical Exam'r v. Las Vegas Review-Journal, 458 P.3d 1048, 1050 (2020).
- 43. In its opinion, the Supreme Court found, in favor of the Review-Journal, that juvenile autopsy reports are public records and cannot be withheld, as the Coroner argued, in their entirety. See generally Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner v. Las Vegas Review-Journal, 136 Nev. 44, 59-60, 458 P.3d 1048, 1061 (2020). The Supreme Court also found that the Coroner properly relied on AGO 82-12 and had established a nontrivial privacy interest with respect to certain health and medical information contained in the records and remanded the matter to this Court to apply the two-part balancing test adopted in Clark Cty. School Dist. v. Las Vegas Review-Journal, 134 Nev. 700, 429 P.3d 313 (2018).
- 44. The Supreme Court further reversed the district court's ruling and concluded that the Coroner did not waive its ability to rely on NRS 432B.407(6) simply because it did not assert the privilege within the first five (5) business days. Coroner, 136 Nev. at 49-50, 458 P.3d 1053-54.
- 45. With regard to the Coroner's appeal of the Fees Order, the Supreme Court held that, in light of its remand order, it was "premature to conclude whether [the Review-Journal would] ultimately prevail in its NPRA action" because "[t]he district court must decide the extent

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

to which the juvenile autopsy reports contain private information that the Coroner's Office should redact." Coroner, 136 Nev. at 61, 458 P.3d at 1061.

Proceedings on Remand

- 46. On August 27, 2020, the Review-Journal filed its Opening Brief on Remand.
- 47. The Coroner filed an Answering Brief on Remand on October 7, 2020, and the Review-Journal filed a Reply Brief on October 22, 2020.
- 48. The Court conducted a hearing on remand on October 29, 2020, and again ruled in the Review-Journal's favor, mandating the Coroner's Office provide "all of the juvenile autopsy reports that were originally requested by the Plaintiff." (Transcript of October 29, 2020, Hearing, p. 37:1-3.) The Court also noted that "based upon today's ruling, the Court finds that the Plaintiff is the prevailing party and will consider its supplemental application for fees and costs, including those that were previously awarded." (*Id.*, p. 37:15-18.)
- 49. On November 20, 2020, the Court entered a written order directing the Coroner to produce the autopsy reports (the "Order on Remand").
- 50. Also on November 20, 2020, the Coroner filed a Motion for Stay on Order Shortening Time.
- 51. The Review-Journal filed an Opposition to the Motion for Stay on November 30, 2020, and the Coroner filed a Reply on December 7, 2020.
- 52. The Court conducted a hearing on the Motion for Stay on Order Shortening Time on December 10, 2020, and entered a written order denying the motion on December 15, 2020.
 - 53. On December 15, 2020, the Coroner filed an appeal from the Order on Remand.
- 54. On December 17, 2020, the Coroner filed an Emergency Motion with the Nevada Supreme Court seeking a stay of the Order on Remand pending appeal.
- 55. The Review-Journal filed an opposition to the Emergency Motion on December 24, 2020.
- 56. On December 29, 2020, the Supreme Court entered an order denying the Coroner's Emergency Motion.

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

- 57. The Coroner filed an Emergency Motion for Reconsideration with the Supreme Court on December 29, 2020. The Supreme Court issued an order denying the request for reconsideration on December 30, 2020.
- 58. On December 31, 2020, the Coroner moved to voluntarily dismiss its appeal of the Order on Remand.
- 59. On January 12, 2020, the Supreme Court issued an order dismissing the Coroner's appeal.

The Review-Journal's Amended Motion for Fees and Costs

- On February 2, 2021, the Review-Journal filed an Amended Motion for 60. Attorney's Fees and Costs seeking an award of all fees and costs it accrued in this matter, including the fees previously addressed in the Court's Fees Order.
- 61. In its Motion and supporting Exhibits, the Review-Journal requested compensation at the following rates for additional work performed by its attorneys and support staff between November 9, 2017, and February 2, 2021:

November 9, 2017 – December 31, 2019 ³				
Biller	Hours	Billing Rate	Total Billed	
Margaret McLetchie	109.0	\$450.00	\$49,050.00	
Alina Shell	114.8	\$350.00	\$40,180.00	
Leo Wolpert	53.0	\$200.00	\$10,600.00	
Carly Krygier	0.2	\$200.00	\$20.00	
Jessica Brown	48.3	\$200.00	\$9,680.00	
Pharan Burchfield	25.6	\$150.00	\$3,840.00	
Lacey Ambro	4.0	\$50.00	\$200.00	
(administrative work)				
	January 1	, 2020 – February	2, 2021	
Biller	Hours	Billing Rate	Total Billed	
Margaret McLetchie	145.00	\$500.00	\$72,500.00	
Alina Shell	113.6	\$375.00	\$42,600.00	
Leo Wolpert	38.9	\$250.00	\$9,725.00	
Pharan Burchfield	23.8	\$175.00	\$4,165.00	
Lacey Ambro	9.1	\$150.00	\$1,365.00	

³ During the March 2, 2021, hearing on the Review-Journal's Amended Motion, counsel for the Review-Journal noted that the Amended Motion inadvertently sought compensation for time expended by attorneys and staff that was previously included in its November 29, 2017, Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. The hours listed above reflected the corrected time expended by counsel and staff.

(paralegal work)				
Administrative staff	7.1	\$25.00	\$177.50	
Total Fees Requested			\$244,087.50	

- 62. The Review-Journal provided detail for the work performed, as well as a declaration supporting the reasonableness of the rates and the work performed.
- 63. Combined with the \$31,552.50 it requested in the Fees Motion, the Review-Journal requested \$275,640.00 in attorney's fees.
- 64. The Review-Journal also requested \$3,581.48 in costs associated with the litigation.
- 65. The Coroner filed an Opposition to the Review-Journal's Amended Motion on February 16, 2021, and the Review-Journal filed a Reply on February 23, 2021. In its Reply, the Review-Journal acknowledged that it erroneously included a \$600 time entry for work performed by counsel in drafting a letter to the Clark County Commission Board of County Commissioners and agreed not to see fees associated with that work.
- 66. This Court conducted a hearing on the Review-Journal's Amended Motion on March 2, 2021.
- 67. At the hearing, counsel for the Review-Journal indicated that there was a \$2,515.00 inadvertent entry of time covered by the Review-Journal's November 27, 2017, Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.

II. CONCLUSIONS OF LAW AND FACT

The Review-Journal is the Prevailing Party.

- 68. Recovery of attorney's fees as a cost of litigation is permissible by agreement, statute, or rule. *See Sandy Valley Assocs. v. Sky Ranch Estates Owners Ass'n*, 117 Nev. 948, 956, 35 P.3d 964, 969 (2001).
- 69. Here, recovery of attorney's fees is authorized by the NPRA, which provides in pertinent part that, "[i]f a requester prevails [on a petition brought pursuant to the NPRA], the requester is entitled to recover his or her costs and reasonable attorney's fees in the proceeding

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

from the governmental entity whose officer has custody of the book or record." Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2).

- 70. The Nevada Supreme Court has explained that "by its plain meaning, [Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2)] grants a requester who prevails in NPRA litigation the right to recover attorney fees and costs." LVMPD v. Blackjack Bonding, 131 Nev. 80, 89, 343 P.3d 608, 615 (2015); accord Clark Cty. Office of Coroner/Med. Exam'r v. Las Vegas Review-Journal, 136 Nev. 44, 60, 458 P.3d 1048, 1061 (2020).
- 71. A party seeking records need not succeed on all its claims in order to be entitled to an award of fees. Instead, a party "prevails" for the purposes of a fees award "if it succeeds on any significant issue in the litigation which achieves some of the benefit it sought in bringing suit." Valley Elec. Ass'n v. Overfield, 121 Nev. 7, 10, 106 P.3d 1198, 1200 (2005) (internal citations omitted); accord Blackjack Bonding, 131 Nev. at 90, 343 P.3d at 615.
- 72. A party who substantially prevails is entitled to recoup all attorney's fees and costs, even if that party did not ultimately succeed on all claims. University of Nevada v. Tarkanian, 110 Nev. 581, 595-598, 879 P.2d 1180, 1189-90 (1994).
- 73. The Review-Journal prevailed on a significant issue, in which was obtaining unredacted copies of the records.
- 74. Accordingly, the Review-Journal is the prevailing party in this matter and is entitled to an award of reasonable attorney's fees and costs.

The Brunzell Factors Support an Award of Fees and Costs to the Review-Journal.

- 75. The Review-Journal is entitled to its "reasonable" attorney's fees and costs in this matter.
- 76. Pursuant to Brunzell v. Golden Gate Nat. Bank, 85 Nev. 345, 455 P.2d 31 (1969), a court must consider four elements in determining the reasonable value of attorneys' services:
 - (1) the qualities of the advocate: his ability, his training, education, experience, professional standing and skill; (2) the character of the work to be done: its difficulty, its intricacy, its importance, time and skill required, the responsibility imposed and the prominence and character of the parties where they affect the importance of the litigation; (3) the work actually performed by the lawyer: the skill, time and attention given to the work; (4) the result: whether the attorney was successful and what benefits were derived.

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

Brunzell, 85 Nev. at 349, 455 P.2d at 33 (citation omitted); accord Shuette v. Beazer Homes Holding Corp., 121 Nev. 837, 864-65, 124 P.3d 530, 548-49 (2005).

- 77. After a court has determined that attorney's fees are appropriate, it must then multiply the number of hours reasonably spent on the case by a reasonable hourly rate to reach the lodestar amount. Herbst v. Humana Health Ins., 105 Nev. 586, 590, 781 P.2d 762, 764 (1989) (citations omitted). There is a strong presumption that the lodestar rate is reasonable. Id.
- Alternatively, "in determining the amount of fees to award, the court is not 78. limited to one specific approach; its analysis may begin with any method rationally designed to calculate a reasonable amount, including those based on a 'lodestar' amount." Shuette v. Beazer Homes Holdings Corp., 121 Nev. 837, 864, 124 P.3d 530, 549 (2005); accord Haley v. Eighth Judicial Dist. Court of Nev., 128 Nev. 171, 178, 273 P.3d 855, 860 (2012). Regardless of which method is chosen as a starting point, however, the court must continue its analysis by considering the requested amount in light of the *Brunzell* factors. *Shuette*, 121 Nev. at 865, 124 P.3d at 549.
- 79. As to the first Brunzell factor, the "qualities of the advocate," the Court finds that the rates sought for the Review-Journal's counsel and support staff are reasonable in light of their ability, training, education, experience, professional standing and skill. The rates sought for staff are also reasonable and compensable.
- 80. The Court also finds that the second *Brunzell* factor, the "character of the work" performed in this case, Brunzell, 85 Nev. at 349, 455 P.2d at 33, weighs in favor of a full award of fees and costs to the Review-Journal. This case involved an unsettled and contentious area of public records law with serious legal questions of public importance. The Coroner asserted a number of claims of confidentiality requiring versatility and comfort with various areas of state and federal law. And, as the NPRA reflects, the work involved in seeking access to public records is important: access to public records fosters democratic principles. Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.001(1). Representing the newspaper of record also necessarily involves a high level of responsibility and immediate attention. Further, NPRA matters involve matters of high prominence.

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

- 81. As to the third factor, the work actually performed by counsel, litigation of this matter required a firm understanding and application of the NPRA, as well as state and federal laws. As demonstrated by the record of this case and the fees detail provided by the Review-Journal, counsel for the Review-Journal dedicated substantial time and resources to thoroughly researching and briefing each issue in this matter at both the district court and appellate levels and demonstrated substantial skill in the work performed. This factor therefore weighs in favor of awarding the Review-Journal attorney's fees and costs.
- 82. The final Brunzell factor requires this Court to consider "the result: whether the attorney was successful and what benefits were derived." Brunzell, 85 Nev. at 349, 455 P. 2d at 33.
- 83. As set forth above, the Review-Journal is the prevailing party in this public records litigation, and as a result of its counsel's efforts, obtained an order from this Court directing the Coroner's Office to produce all of the requested autopsy records.
- 84. Thus, this final factor weighs in favor of an award of fees and costs to the Review-Journal.
- 85. Based upon the Court's review of the documentation provided by the Review-Journal and the Court's experience in insurance litigation, the Court finds the Review-Journal is awarded \$167,200.00 in attorneys' fees.
- 86. As noted above, the Court has reduced the award to reflect the inadvertent entry of time covered by the Review-Journal's November 27, 2017, Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs in the amount of \$2,075.00, which was raised for the first time at oral argument.
- 87. In addition, the Court notes that the Review-Journal acknowledged in its filings and at the hearing that it had erroneously sought \$600 in fees for work performed by counsel in drafting a letter to the Clark County Board of County Commissioners and agreed not to seek the fees associated with that entry.
- 88. Subsequently, however, the Review-Journal filed an Errata that provided that the Review-Journal inadvertently included time entries which were initially part of the 2017

application amounting to \$2,515.00, a difference of \$440.00 from what the Court considered at the hearing.

- 89. Accordingly, with the additional \$440.00 reduction, the Review-Journal is entitled to an award of attorney fees in the amount of \$166,760.00.
- 90. As noted above, the Review-Journal also requested \$3,581.48 in costs associated with this matter. After reviewing the documentation provided by the Review-Journal in support of its costs, the Court finds that a reduction is necessary to ensure that the costs are reasonable.
- 91. The Court therefore finds the Review-Journal is entitled to an award of costs in the amount of \$2,472.00.

III. **ORDER**

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

Based on the foregoing findings of fact and conclusions of law, the Court hereby ORDERS as follows:

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that the Coroner must pay the Review-Journal \$166,760.00 for the reasonable attorney's fees the Review-Journal expended in litigating this matter within 30 days of the entry of this Order.

IT IS HEREBY FURTHER ORDERED that the Coroner must pay the Review-Journal \$2,472.00 for the costs the Review-Journal incurred in this slittigation within 30 days of entry of this Order.

DISTRICT COURT JUDGE

Respectfully Submitted By:

MARQUIS AURBACH COFFING

F7A 9C3 0126 B89C **David M Jones District Court Judge**

By: /s/ Jackie V. Nichols

Craig R. Anderson, Esq.

Nevada Bar No. 6882

Jackie V. Nichols, Esq.

Nevada Bar No. 14246

10001 Park Run Drive

Las Vegas, Nevada 89145

Attorneys for Respondent, Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner

Page 14 of 14

MAC:15090-001 4323867 1 4/1/2021 4:05 PM

1	CSERV							
2	DISTRICT COURT							
3	CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA							
4								
5		GAGENO A 15 550501 W						
6	Las Vegas Review-Journal, Plaintiff(s)	CASE NO: A-17-758501-W						
7	VS.	DEPT. NO. Department 29						
8	Clark County Office of the							
9	Coroner/ Medical Examiner,							
10	Defendant(s)							
11								
12	AUTOMATE	D CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE						
13	This automated certificate of service was generated by the Eighth Judicial District							
14	Court. The foregoing Order Granting Motion was served via the court's electronic eFile system to all recipients registered for e-Service on the above entitled case as listed below:							
15								
16		lebysoch @magalovy agma						
17		kbusch@maclaw.com						
18	Alina Shell	alina@nvlitigation.com						
19	Margaret McLetchie	maggie@nvlitigation.com						
20	Jackie Nichols	jnichols@maclaw.com						
21	Leah Dell	ldell@maclaw.com						
22	Sherri Mong smong@maclaw.com							
23								
24		canderson@maclaw.com						
25	LAURA Rehfeldt	laura.rehfeldt@clarkcountyda.com						
26	Shannon Fagin	shannon.fagin@clarkcountyda.com						
27								

Electronically Filed 4/8/2021 8:48 AM Steven D. Grierson **CLERK OF THE COURT**

MAC:15090-001 4330685_1 4/8/2021 8:39 AM

A-17-758501-W

MARQUIS AURBACH COFFING 10001 Park Run Drive Las Vegas, Nevada 89145 (702) 382-0711 FAX: (702) 382-5816

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that an Order Granting Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's
Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs was entered on the 8th day of April, 2021, a
copy of which is attached hereto.
Dated this 8th day of April, 2021.
MADOUIS AUDDACH COEFING

By:_	/s/ Jackie v. Nichols
\overline{C}	Craig R. Anderson, Esq.
N	Jevada Bar No. 6882
Ja	ackie V. Nichols, Esq.
N	Jevada Bar No. 14246
1	0001 Park Run Drive
L	as Vegas, Nevada 89145
A	attorneys for Respondent, Clark County
O	Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner

10001 Park Run Drive Las Vegas, Nevada 89145 (702) 382-0711 FAX: (702) 382-5816

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that the foregoing **NOTICE OF ENTRY OF ORDER** was submitted electronically for filing and/or service with the Eighth Judicial District Court on the <u>8th</u> day of April, 2021. Electronic service of the foregoing document shall be made in accordance with the E-Service List as follows:¹

Margaret A. McLetchie, Esq.
Alina M. Shell, Esq.
McLetchie Law
701 E. Bridger Avenue, Suite 520
Las Vegas, Nevada 89101
maggie@nvlitigation.com
alina@nvlitigation.com

Attorneys for Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal

Laura C. Rehfeldt, Esq.
Deputy District Attorney
500 South Grand Central Pkwy, 5th Flr.
P.O. Box 552215
Las Vegas, Nevada 89155-2215
laura.rehfeldt@clarkcountyda.com
shannon.fagin@clarkcountyda.com

Attorney for Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner

I further certify that I served a copy of this document by mailing a true and correct copy thereof, postage prepaid, addressed to:

N/A

/s/ Krista Busch
An employee of Marquis Aurbach Coffing

Page 3 of 3

MAC:15090-001 4330685_1 4/8/2021 8:39 AM

¹ Pursuant to EDCR 8.05(a), each party who submits an E-Filed document through the E-Filing System consents to electronic service in accordance with NRCP 5(b)(2)(D).

ELECTRONICALLY SERVED 4/8/2021 8:28 AM

Electronically Filed
04/08/2021 8:28 AM
CLERK OF THE COURT

MARQUIS AURBACH COFFING
10001 Park Run Drive
Las Vegas, Nevada 89145
(702) 382-0711 FAX: (702) 382-5816

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

Marquis Aurbach Coffing
Craig R. Anderson, Esq.
Nevada Bar No. 6882
Jackie V. Nichols, Esq.
Nevada Bar No. 14246
10001 Park Run Drive
Las Vegas, Nevada 89145
Telephone: (702) 382-0711
Facsimile: (702) 382-5816
canderson@maclaw.com
jnichols@maclaw.com
G: D 74.10 D
Steven B. Wolfson, Esq.
District Attorney
Laura C. Rehfeldt, Esq.
Deputy District Attorney
Nevada Bar No. 5101
500 South Grand Central Pkwy, 5th Flr.
P.O. Box 552215
Las Vegas, Nevada 89155-2215
Telephone: (702) 455-4761

Facsimile: (702) 382-5178

laura.rehfeldt@clarkcountyda.com

Attorneys for Respondent, Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner

DISTRICT COURT

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA

LAS VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL,

Petitioner,

Case No.:

A-17-758501-W

Dept. No.:

29

vs.

CLARK COUNTY OFFICE OF THE CORONER/MEDICAL EXAMINER,

Respondent.

ORDER GRANTING PETITIONER LAS VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL'S AMENDED MOTION FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES AND COSTS

Petitioner the Las Vegas Review-Journal's Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs, having come on for hearing on March 2, 2021, the Honorable Judge David Jones presiding, Petitioner the Las Vegas Review-Journal (the "Review-Journal") appearing by and through its counsel, Margaret A. McLetchie and Alina M. Shell, and Respondent the Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner (the "Coroner") appearing by and through its Page 1 of 14

MAC:15090-001 4323867_1 4/1/2021 4:05 PM

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

counsel, Jackie V. Nichols, and the Court having read and considered all of the papers and pleadings on file, hearing oral argument, and being fully advised, and good cause appearing therefore, the Court hereby makes the following findings of fact and conclusions of law:

I. PROCEDURAL HISTORY AND FINDINGS OF FACT

The Records Request and The Coroner's Response

- On April 13, 2017, the Review-Journal sent the Coroner a request (the "Request") 1. pursuant to the Nevada Public Records Act, Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.001 et seq. (the "NPRA") seeking all autopsy reports of all autopsies conducted on anyone under the age of 18 from 2012 through the date of the Request.
- The Coroner responded via email on April 13, 2017. It provided a spreadsheet 2. with information consisting of the Coroner case number, name of decedent, date of death, gender, age, race, location of death, and cause and manner of death, but refused to provide "autopsy reports, notes or other documents." In its April 13, 2017 email, the Coroner stated it would not disclose the autopsy reports because they contain medical information and confidential information about a decedent's body. The Coroner relied on Attorney General Opinion, 1982 Nev. Op. Atty. Gen. No. 12 ("AGO 82-12") and its legal analysis as the legal basis for non-disclosure.
- The Review-Journal followed up by emailing the Clark County District 3. Attorney's Office on April 13, 2017, requesting additional legal support for the Coroner's refusal to provide records.
- The District Attorney's Office, Civil Division, on behalf of the Coroner, 4. responded via email on April 14, 2017, again relying on AGO 82-12 and also relying on Assembly Bill 57, 79th Sess. (Nev. 2017) as the legal bases for its refusal to disclose the requested records.
- On May 9, 2017, following a meeting between the Coroner and the Review-5. Journal, the Coroner emailed a second spreadsheet to the Review-Journal listing child deaths dating back to 2011 in which the Coroner conducted autopsies.

Page 2 of 14

MAC:15090-001 4323867 1 4/1/2021 4:05 PM

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

- 6. On May 23, 2017, counsel for the Review-Journal wrote to the Coroner to address concerns with the Coroner's refusal to provide access to any of the requested juvenile autopsy reports.
- 7. On May 26, 2017, the Coroner (via the District Attorney) responded to the May 23, 2017, letter, again relying on the legal analysis in AGO 82-12, and agreed to consider providing redacted versions of autopsies of juveniles if the Review-Journal provided a specific list of cases it wished to review.
- 8. In its May 26, 2017 response, the Coroner for the first time also asserted that the records may be protected by Nev. Rev. Stat. § 432B.407, which makes documents, including autopsy reports, reviewed by the Child Death team, of which the Coroner is a representative, confidential, and that privacy interests outweighed public disclosure, consistent with the legal analysis articulated in AGO 82-12.
- The Review-Journal provided the Coroner with a list of specific cases it wanted 9. reports for via email on May 26, 2017.
 - 10. The Coroner responded to the May 26, 2017 email on May 31, 2017.
- 11. In its May 31, 2017 response, the Coroner stated that due to the magnitude of the request and the review involved, the records would not be made available by the end of the fifth business day. The Coroner further explained that each record would need to be reviewed individually for privileged material and the information subject to privileges would not be disclosed.
- 12. The Coroner also asked the Review-Journal to specify the records it wanted to receive first, which the Review-Journal did on June 12, 2017.
- On July 9, 2017, in a response to a further email from the Review-Journal 13. inquiring on the status of the records, the Coroner indicated it would not produce any records that pertained to any case that was subsequently handled by a child death review team pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 432B.407. By that time, the Coroner had determined which cases were not handled by the child death review team and provided a list to the Review-Journal.

Page 3 of 14

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

15. On July 11, 2017, the Coroner also demanded that the Review-Journal commit to payment for further work in redacting files for production and declined to produce records without payment. The Coroner indicated it would take two persons 10-12 hours to redact the records it was willing to produce, and that the Review-Journal would have to pay \$45.00 an hour for the two reviewers, one of which would be an attorney. The Coroner contended that conducting a privilege review and redacting autopsy reports required the "extraordinary use of personnel" under Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.055. The Coroner stated it did not intend to seek fees for the work associated with the previously provided spreadsheets and redacted reports.

The Initial Litigation Over the Petition

- 16. On July 17, 2017, the Review-Journal filed its Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.001/Application for Writ of Mandamus/Application for Declaratory and Injunctive Relief (the "Petition") and requested expedited consideration pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2).
- 17. On August 17, 2017, the Review-Journal submitted a Memorandum in support of its Petition. The Coroner submitted its Response on August 30, 2017, asserting a number of arguments in support of confidentiality of personal health and medical information unrelated to the cause or manner of death. The Review-Journal submitted its Reply on September 7, 2017.
- 18. The Court held a hearing on the Review-Journal's Petition on September 28, 2017.
- 19. On November 9, 2017, the Court entered an Order rejecting each of the Coroner's arguments and granting the Review-Journal's Petition, requiring the Coroner to produce the requested records (the "Petition Order"). The Court also ordered that the Coroner was not Page 4 of 14

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

entitled to any fees or costs for producing the records, other than the cost of the medium on which the records were to be electronically provided.

The Initial Litigation Regarding Fees and Costs

- 20. On November 26, 2017, the Review-Journal timely filed a Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs (the "Fees Motion") pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2).
- In its Fees Motion and supporting exhibits, the Review-Journal requested 21. compensation at the following rates for work performed by its attorneys and support staff between July 10, 2017, and November 29, 2017:

Attorney/Biller	Hours	Billing Rate	Total Billed
Margaret A. McLetchie	27.9	\$450.00	\$12,465.00 ¹
Alina M. Shell	51.3	\$350.00	\$17,220.00 ²
Leo Wolpert	2.1	\$175.00	\$367.50
Pharan Burchfield	8.9	\$150.00	\$1,335.00
Administrative Support	6.6	\$25.00	\$165.00
		Total Fees Requested	\$31,552.50

- 22. The Review-Journal also requested \$825.02 in costs associated with the litigation, for a combined total request for \$32,377.52 in fees and costs.
- The Review-Journal provided detail for the work performed, as well as 23. declarations supporting the reasonableness of the rates and the work performed.
- 24. The Coroner's Office filed an Opposition to the Fees Motion on December 14, 2017, and the Review-Journal filed a Reply on January 4, 2018.
- In its Opposition, the Coroner's Office asserted that pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. § 25. 239.012—a provision of the NPRA which provides immunity from damages for public officers who act in good faith in disclosing or refusing to disclose records—the Review-Journal had to

This total reflected voluntary reductions for some time entries, made by counsel for the Reviewournal in her billing discretion.

See supra n.1.

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

establish the Coroner's Office acted in bad faith in refusing to disclose the requested records to obtain attorney's fees and costs.

- 26. The Court conducted a hearing on the Fees Motion on January 11, 2018.
- 27. On February 1, 2018, the Court entered an Order granting the Review-Journal the entirety of the fees and costs it requested (the "Fees Order").

The Coroner's Appeal of the Petition Order

- On November 28, 2017, the Coroner filed a Notice of Appeal from Petition Order. 28.
- 29. On November 29, 2017, the Coroner filed a Motion for Stay on an Order Shortening Time requesting that the Court stay the Petition Order pending its appeal.
- 30. The Review-Journal filed an Opposition to the Motion for Stay on December 6, 2017, and the Coroner filed a reply on December 8, 2017.
- Following a December 12, 2017, hearing on the Coroner's motion, the Court 31. entered an order on January 11, 2018, granting the Coroner's request for a stay.
- 32. The Coroner filed its Opening Brief in Clark Cty. Office of the Coroner/Med. Exam'r, Nevada Supreme Court Case No. 74604, on June 6, 2018.
 - 33. The Review-Journal filed an Answering Brief on September 6, 2018.

The Coroner's Appeal of the Fees Order

- On February 5, 2018, the Coroner filed a notice of appeal from the Fees Order. 34.
- The Coroner also filed a Renewed Motion for Stay on an Order Shortening Time 35. on February 5, 2018.
- 36. The Review-Journal filed an opposition to the Coroner's Renewed Motion for Stay on February 13, 2018.
- The Court conducted a hearing on the Coroner's Renewed Motion for Stay on 37. February 15, 2018, and orally denied the request for a stay. The Court subsequently entered a written order denying the stay on March 7, 2018.
- The Coroner filed an Emergency Motion for Stay with the Nevada Supreme Court 38. on March 8, 2018.

Page 6 of 14

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

- 39. The Review-Journal filed an Opposition to the Emergency Motion for Stay on March 21, 2018.
- 40. On April 12, 2018, the Supreme Court entered a decision and order granting the Coroner's request for a stay pending appeal. See Clark Cty. Office of the Coroner/Medical Exam'r v. Las Vegas Review-Journal, 415 P.3d 16, 17 (Nev. 2018).

The Outcome of the Coroner's Appeals

- 41. The Nevada Supreme Court conducted a consolidated oral argument on the Coroner's appeals of the Petition Order and the Fees Order on October 7, 2019.
- 42. On February 27, 2020, the Supreme Court issued a written opinion affirming in part and reversing in part the Court's orders and remanding the case back to this Court. See Clark Cty. Office of the Coroner/Medical Exam'r v. Las Vegas Review-Journal, 458 P.3d 1048, 1050 (2020).
- 43. In its opinion, the Supreme Court found, in favor of the Review-Journal, that juvenile autopsy reports are public records and cannot be withheld, as the Coroner argued, in their entirety. See generally Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner v. Las Vegas Review-Journal, 136 Nev. 44, 59-60, 458 P.3d 1048, 1061 (2020). The Supreme Court also found that the Coroner properly relied on AGO 82-12 and had established a nontrivial privacy interest with respect to certain health and medical information contained in the records and remanded the matter to this Court to apply the two-part balancing test adopted in Clark Cty. School Dist. v. Las Vegas Review-Journal, 134 Nev. 700, 429 P.3d 313 (2018).
- 44. The Supreme Court further reversed the district court's ruling and concluded that the Coroner did not waive its ability to rely on NRS 432B.407(6) simply because it did not assert the privilege within the first five (5) business days. Coroner, 136 Nev. at 49-50, 458 P.3d 1053-54.
- With regard to the Coroner's appeal of the Fees Order, the Supreme Court held 45. that, in light of its remand order, it was "premature to conclude whether [the Review-Journal would] ultimately prevail in its NPRA action" because "[t]he district court must decide the extent

Page 7 of 14

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

to which the juvenile autopsy reports contain private information that the Coroner's Office should redact." Coroner, 136 Nev. at 61, 458 P.3d at 1061.

Proceedings on Remand

- 46. On August 27, 2020, the Review-Journal filed its Opening Brief on Remand.
- 47. The Coroner filed an Answering Brief on Remand on October 7, 2020, and the Review-Journal filed a Reply Brief on October 22, 2020.
- 48. The Court conducted a hearing on remand on October 29, 2020, and again ruled in the Review-Journal's favor, mandating the Coroner's Office provide "all of the juvenile autopsy reports that were originally requested by the Plaintiff." (Transcript of October 29, 2020, Hearing, p. 37:1-3.) The Court also noted that "based upon today's ruling, the Court finds that the Plaintiff is the prevailing party and will consider its supplemental application for fees and costs, including those that were previously awarded." (*Id.*, p. 37:15-18.)
- 49. On November 20, 2020, the Court entered a written order directing the Coroner to produce the autopsy reports (the "Order on Remand").
- 50. Also on November 20, 2020, the Coroner filed a Motion for Stay on Order Shortening Time.
- The Review-Journal filed an Opposition to the Motion for Stay on November 30, 51. 2020, and the Coroner filed a Reply on December 7, 2020.
- 52. The Court conducted a hearing on the Motion for Stay on Order Shortening Time on December 10, 2020, and entered a written order denying the motion on December 15, 2020.
 - 53. On December 15, 2020, the Coroner filed an appeal from the Order on Remand.
- 54. On December 17, 2020, the Coroner filed an Emergency Motion with the Nevada Supreme Court seeking a stay of the Order on Remand pending appeal.
- The Review-Journal filed an opposition to the Emergency Motion on December 55. 24, 2020.
- On December 29, 2020, the Supreme Court entered an order denying the 56. Coroner's Emergency Motion.

Page 8 of 14

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

- 57. The Coroner filed an Emergency Motion for Reconsideration with the Supreme Court on December 29, 2020. The Supreme Court issued an order denying the request for reconsideration on December 30, 2020.
- 58. On December 31, 2020, the Coroner moved to voluntarily dismiss its appeal of the Order on Remand.
- 59. On January 12, 2020, the Supreme Court issued an order dismissing the Coroner's appeal.

The Review-Journal's Amended Motion for Fees and Costs

- 60. On February 2, 2021, the Review-Journal filed an Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs seeking an award of all fees and costs it accrued in this matter, including the fees previously addressed in the Court's Fees Order.
- In its Motion and supporting Exhibits, the Review-Journal requested 61. compensation at the following rates for additional work performed by its attorneys and support staff between November 9, 2017, and February 2, 2021:

November 9, 2017 – December 31, 2019 ³				
Biller	Hours	Billing Rate	Total Billed	
Margaret McLetchie	109.0	\$450.00	\$49,050.00	
Alina Shell	114.8	\$350.00	\$40,180.00	
Leo Wolpert	53.0	\$200.00	\$10,600.00	
Carly Krygier	0.2	\$200.00	\$20.00	
Jessica Brown	48.3	\$200.00	\$9,680.00	
Pharan Burchfield	25.6	\$150.00	\$3,840.00	
Lacey Ambro	4.0	\$50.00	\$200.00	
(administrative work)				
January 1, 2020 – February 2, 2021				
Biller	Hours	Billing Rate	Total Billed	
Margaret McLetchie	145.00	\$500.00	\$72,500.00	
Alina Shell	113.6	\$375.00	\$42,600.00	
Leo Wolpert	38.9	\$250.00	\$9,725.00	
Pharan Burchfield	23.8	\$175.00	\$4,165.00	
Lacey Ambro	9.1	\$150.00	\$1,365.00	

³ During the March 2, 2021, hearing on the Review-Journal's Amended Motion, counsel for the Review-Journal noted that the Amended Motion inadvertently sought compensation for time expended by attorneys and staff that was previously included in its November 29, 2017, Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs. The hours listed above reflected the corrected time expended by counsel and staff.

Page 9 of 14

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

(paralegal work)				
Administrative staff	7.1	\$25.00	\$177.50	
Total Fees Requested			\$244,087.50	

- 62. The Review-Journal provided detail for the work performed, as well as a declaration supporting the reasonableness of the rates and the work performed.
- 63. Combined with the \$31,552.50 it requested in the Fees Motion, the Review-Journal requested \$275,640.00 in attorney's fees.
- 64. The Review-Journal also requested \$3,581.48 in costs associated with the litigation.
- 65. The Coroner filed an Opposition to the Review-Journal's Amended Motion on February 16, 2021, and the Review-Journal filed a Reply on February 23, 2021. In its Reply, the Review-Journal acknowledged that it erroneously included a \$600 time entry for work performed by counsel in drafting a letter to the Clark County Commission Board of County Commissioners and agreed not to see fees associated with that work.
- This Court conducted a hearing on the Review-Journal's Amended Motion on 66. March 2, 2021.
- At the hearing, counsel for the Review-Journal indicated that there was a 67. \$2,515.00 inadvertent entry of time covered by the Review-Journal's November 27, 2017, Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs.

CONCLUSIONS OF LAW AND FACT II.

The Review-Journal is the Prevailing Party.

- 68. Recovery of attorney's fees as a cost of litigation is permissible by agreement, statute, or rule. See Sandy Valley Assocs. v. Sky Ranch Estates Owners Ass'n, 117 Nev. 948, 956, 35 P.3d 964, 969 (2001).
- Here, recovery of attorney's fees is authorized by the NPRA, which provides in 69. pertinent part that, "[i]f a requester prevails [on a petition brought pursuant to the NPRA], the requester is entitled to recover his or her costs and reasonable attorney's fees in the proceeding

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

from the governmental entity whose officer has custody of the book or record." Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2).

- 70. The Nevada Supreme Court has explained that "by its plain meaning, [Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.011(2)] grants a requester who prevails in NPRA litigation the right to recover attorney fees and costs." LVMPD v. Blackjack Bonding, 131 Nev. 80, 89, 343 P.3d 608, 615 (2015); accord Clark Cty. Office of Coroner/Med. Exam'r v. Las Vegas Review-Journal, 136 Nev. 44, 60, 458 P.3d 1048, 1061 (2020).
- A party seeking records need not succeed on all its claims in order to be entitled 71. to an award of fees. Instead, a party "prevails" for the purposes of a fees award "if it succeeds on any significant issue in the litigation which achieves some of the benefit it sought in bringing suit." Valley Elec. Ass'n v. Overfield, 121 Nev. 7, 10, 106 P.3d 1198, 1200 (2005) (internal citations omitted); accord Blackjack Bonding, 131 Nev. at 90, 343 P.3d at 615.
- A party who substantially prevails is entitled to recoup all attorney's fees and 72. costs, even if that party did not ultimately succeed on all claims. University of Nevada v. Tarkanian, 110 Nev. 581, 595-598, 879 P.2d 1180, 1189-90 (1994).
- The Review-Journal prevailed on a significant issue, in which was obtaining 73. unredacted copies of the records.
- Accordingly, the Review-Journal is the prevailing party in this matter and is 74. entitled to an award of reasonable attorney's fees and costs.

The Brunzell Factors Support an Award of Fees and Costs to the Review-Journal.

- The Review-Journal is entitled to its "reasonable" attorney's fees and costs in this 75. matter.
- Pursuant to Brunzell v. Golden Gate Nat. Bank, 85 Nev. 345, 455 P.2d 31 (1969), 76. a court must consider four elements in determining the reasonable value of attorneys' services:
 - (1) the qualities of the advocate: his ability, his training, education, experience, professional standing and skill; (2) the character of the work to be done: its difficulty, its intricacy, its importance, time and skill required, the responsibility imposed and the prominence and character of the parties where they affect the importance of the litigation; (3) the work actually performed by the lawyer: the skill, time and attention given to the work; (4) the result: whether the attorney was successful and what benefits were derived.

Page 11 of 14

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

Brunzell, 85 Nev. at 349, 455 P.2d at 33 (citation omitted); accord Shuette v. Beazer Homes Holding Corp., 121 Nev. 837, 864-65, 124 P.3d 530, 548-49 (2005).

- After a court has determined that attorney's fees are appropriate, it must then multiply the number of hours reasonably spent on the case by a reasonable hourly rate to reach the lodestar amount. Herbst v. Humana Health Ins., 105 Nev. 586, 590, 781 P.2d 762, 764 (1989) (citations omitted). There is a strong presumption that the lodestar rate is reasonable. Id.
- Alternatively, "in determining the amount of fees to award, the court is not 78. limited to one specific approach; its analysis may begin with any method rationally designed to calculate a reasonable amount, including those based on a 'lodestar' amount." Shuette v. Beazer Homes Holdings Corp., 121 Nev. 837, 864, 124 P.3d 530, 549 (2005); accord Haley v. Eighth Judicial Dist. Court of Nev., 128 Nev. 171, 178, 273 P.3d 855, 860 (2012). Regardless of which method is chosen as a starting point, however, the court must continue its analysis by considering the requested amount in light of the Brunzell factors. Shuette, 121 Nev. at 865, 124 P.3d at 549.
- As to the first Brunzell factor, the "qualities of the advocate," the Court finds that 79. the rates sought for the Review-Journal's counsel and support staff are reasonable in light of their ability, training, education, experience, professional standing and skill. The rates sought for staff are also reasonable and compensable.
- The Court also finds that the second Brunzell factor, the "character of the work" 80. performed in this case, Brunzell, 85 Nev. at 349, 455 P.2d at 33, weighs in favor of a full award of fees and costs to the Review-Journal. This case involved an unsettled and contentious area of public records law with serious legal questions of public importance. The Coroner asserted a number of claims of confidentiality requiring versatility and comfort with various areas of state and federal law. And, as the NPRA reflects, the work involved in seeking access to public records is important: access to public records fosters democratic principles. Nev. Rev. Stat. § 239.001(1). Representing the newspaper of record also necessarily involves a high level of responsibility and immediate attention. Further, NPRA matters involve matters of high prominence.

Page 12 of 14

MARQUIS AURBACH COFFING

Las Vegas, Nevada 89145 (702) 382-0711 FAX: (702) 382-5816

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

81. As to the third factor, the work actually performed by counsel, litigation of this
matter required a firm understanding and application of the NPRA, as well as state and federal
laws. As demonstrated by the record of this case and the fees detail provided by the Review-
Journal, counsel for the Review-Journal dedicated substantial time and resources to thoroughly
researching and briefing each issue in this matter at both the district court and appellate levels
and demonstrated substantial skill in the work performed. This factor therefore weighs in favor
of awarding the Review-Journal attorney's fees and costs.

- 82. The final Brunzell factor requires this Court to consider "the result: whether the attorney was successful and what benefits were derived." Brunzell, 85 Nev. at 349, 455 P. 2d at 33.
- As set forth above, the Review-Journal is the prevailing party in this public 83. records litigation, and as a result of its counsel's efforts, obtained an order from this Court directing the Coroner's Office to produce all of the requested autopsy records.
- 84. Thus, this final factor weighs in favor of an award of fees and costs to the Review-Journal.
- 85. Based upon the Court's review of the documentation provided by the Review-Journal and the Court's experience in insurance litigation, the Court finds the Review-Journal is awarded \$167,200.00 in attorneys' fees.
- As noted above, the Court has reduced the award to reflect the inadvertent entry 86. of time covered by the Review-Journal's November 27, 2017, Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs in the amount of \$2,075.00, which was raised for the first time at oral argument.
- In addition, the Court notes that the Review-Journal acknowledged in its filings 87. and at the hearing that it had erroneously sought \$600 in fees for work performed by counsel in drafting a letter to the Clark County Board of County Commissioners and agreed not to seek the fees associated with that entry.
- Subsequently, however, the Review-Journal filed an Errata that provided that the 88. Review-Journal inadvertently included time entries which were initially part of the 2017

Page 13 of 14

application amounting to \$2,515.00, a difference of \$440.00 from what the Court considered at the hearing.

- 89. Accordingly, with the additional \$440.00 reduction, the Review-Journal is entitled to an award of attorney fees in the amount of \$166,760.00.
- 90. As noted above, the Review-Journal also requested \$3,581.48 in costs associated with this matter. After reviewing the documentation provided by the Review-Journal in support of its costs, the Court finds that a reduction is necessary to ensure that the costs are reasonable.
- 91. The Court therefore finds the Review-Journal is entitled to an award of costs in the amount of \$2,472.00.

III. **ORDER**

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

Based on the foregoing findings of fact and conclusions of law, the Court hereby ORDERS as follows:

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that the Coroner must pay the Review-Journal \$166,760.00 for the reasonable attorney's fees the Review-Journal expended in litigating this matter within 30 days of the entry of this Order.

IT IS HEREBY FURTHER ORDERED that the Coroner must pay the Review-Journal \$2,472.00 for the costs the Review-Journal incurred in this alitication within 30 days of entry of this Order.

DISTRICT COURT JUDGE

Respectfully Submitted By:

MARQUIS AURBACH COFFING

F7A 9C3 0126 B89C David M Jones District Court Judge

By: /s/ Jackie V. Nichols

Craig R. Anderson, Esq.

Nevada Bar No. 6882

Jackie V. Nichols, Esq.

Nevada Bar No. 14246

10001 Park Run Drive

Las Vegas, Nevada 89145

Attorneys for Respondent, Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner

Page 14 of 14

1	CSERV		
2	DISTRICT COURT		
3	CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA		
4			
5	Las Vegas Review-Journal,	CASE NO: A-17-758501-W	
6	Plaintiff(s)		
7	vs.	DEPT. NO. Department 29	
8	Clark County Office of the		
9	Coroner/ Medical Examiner,		
10	Defendant(s)		
11			
12	<u>AUTOMATED CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE</u>		
13	This automated certificate of service was generated by the Eighth Judicial District		
14	Court. The foregoing Order Granting Motion was served via the court's electronic eFile system to all recipients registered for e-Service on the above entitled case as listed below:		
15	Service Date: 4/8/2021		
16	Krista Busch	kbusch@maclaw.com	
17	Alina Shell	alina@nvlitigation.com	
18			
19	Margaret McLetchie	maggie@nvlitigation.com	
20	Jackie Nichols	jnichols@maclaw.com	
21	Leah Dell	ldell@maclaw.com	
22	Sherri Mong	smong@maclaw.com	
23	Craig Anderson	canderson@maclaw.com	
24	LAURA Rehfeldt	laura.rehfeldt@clarkcountyda.com	
25			
26	Shannon Fagin	shannon.fagin@clarkcountyda.com	
27			
28			



ATTORNEYS AT LAW
701 EAST BRIDGER AVE., SUITE 520
LAS VEGAS, NV 89101
(702)728-5300 (T) / (702)425-8220 (F)

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

Electronically Filed 5/7/2021 5:24 PM Steven D. Grierson CLERK OF THE COURT

NOAS

1

2

3

MARGARET A. MCLETCHIE, Nevada Bar No. 10931 ALINA M. SHELL, Nevada Bar No. 11711

MCLETCHIE LAW

701 E. Bridger Avenue, Suite 520

Las Vegas, NV 89101

Telephone: (702) 728-5300; Fax: (702) 425-8220

Email: maggie@nvlitigation.com

Counsel for Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal

EIGHTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA

LAS VEGAS REVIEW-JOURNAL,

Petitioner,

VS.

CLARK COUNTY THE OFFICE OF CORONER/MEDICAL EXAMINER,

Respondent.

Case No.: A-17-758501-W

Dept. No.: XXIX

NOTICE OF APPEAL

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal (the "Review-Journal"), pursuant to Nevada Rule of Appellate Procedure 4(a)(1), hereby timely appeals to the Supreme Court of Nevada from the Order Granting Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs entered in this case on April 8, 2021.

DATED this 7th day of May, 2021.

/s/ Margaret A. McLetchie

MARGARET A. MCLETCHIE, Nevada Bar No. 10931

ALINA M. SHELL, Nevada Bar No. 11711

MCLETCHIE LAW

701 E. Bridger Avenue, Suite 520

Las Vegas, NV 89101

Telephone: (702) 728-5300; Fax (702) 728-5300

Email: maggie@nvlitigation.com

Counsel for Petitioner, Las Vegas Review-Journal

1

MCLETCHIE LAW

ATTORNEYS ATLAW 701 EAST BRIDGER AVE., SUITE 520 LAS VEGAS, IVY 89101 (702)28-5300 (T)/(702)42-8220 (F) WWW.NULIIGATION.COM

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that on this 7th day of May, 2021, pursuant to Administrative Order 14-2 and N.E.F.C.R. 9, I did cause a true copy of the foregoing NOTICE OF APPEAL in *Las Vegas Review-Journal v. Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner*, Eighth Judicial District Court Case No. A-17-758501-W, to be served electronically using the Odyssey File&Serve system, to all parties with an email address on record.

/s/ Pharan Burchfield An Employee of McLetchie Law

Skip to Main Content Logout My Account Search Menu New District Civil/Criminal Search Refine Search Back

Location: District Court Civil/Crimi

R. GISTER OF ACTIONS Case No. A-17-758501-W

Las Vegas Review-Journal, Plaintiff(s) vs. Clark County Office of the Coroner/ Medical Examiner, Defendant(s)

Case Type: Date Filed: Location: Cross-Reference Case Number: Supreme Court No .:

Writ of Mandamus 07/17/2017 Department 29 A758501 74604 75095 82229 82908

> Laura C Rehfeldt 702-455-4761(W)

Margaret A. McLetchie 702-728-5300(W)

PARTY INFORMATION Defendant Clark County Office of the Coroner/ Medical Examiner Plaintiff Las Vegas Review-Journal EVENTS ORDERS OF THE COURT DISPOSITIONS Order (Judicial Officer: Crockett Jim) 02/01/2018 Debtors: Clark County Office of the Coroner/ Medical Examiner (Defendant)
Creditors: Las Vegas Review-Journal (Plaintiff)
Judgment: 02/01/2018, Docketed: 02/01/2018 Total Judgment: 32,377.50 Clerk's Certificate (Judicial Officer: Crockett, Jim)
Debtors: Clark County Office of the Coroner/ Medical Examiner (Defendant) 04/01/2020 Creditors: Las Vegas Review-Journal (Plaintiff) Judgment: 04/01/2020, Docketed: 04/02/2020 Comment: Appeal Affirmed - Supreme Court No 74604 (In Part)
Debtors: Las Vegas Review-Journal (Plaintiff)
Creditors: Clark County Office of the Coroner/ Medical Examiner (Defendant) Judgment: 04/01/2020, Docketed: 04/02/2020 Comment: Appeal Reversed - Supreme Court No 75095 (In Part) Amended Order (Judicial Officer: Jones, David M) Reason: Amended Debtors: Clark County Office of the Coroner/ Medical Examiner (Defendant) Creditors: Las Vegas Review-Journal (Plaintiff) Judgment: 04/22/2021, Docketed: 04/09/2021 04/22/2021 Total Judgment: 169,232.00
Satisfaction: Satisfaction of Judgment 04/08/2021 **Order** (Judicial Officer: Jones, David M)
Debtors: Clark County Office of the Coroner/ Medical Examiner (Defendant)
Creditors: Las Vegas Review-Journal (Plaintiff)
Judgment: 04/08/2021, Docketed: 04/09/2021 Total Judgment: 169,232.00 08/09/2021 Order (Judicial Officer: Jones, David M) Debtors: Clark County Office of the Coroner/ Medical Examiner (Defendant)
Creditors: Las Vegas Review-Journal (Plaintiff)
Judgment: 08/09/2021, Docketed: 08/10/2021 Total Judgment: 36.504.29 OTHER EVENTS AND HEARINGS Petition Doc ID# 1
[1] Public Records Act Application Pursuant to NRS 239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus Expedited Matter Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.011 07/17/2017 07/17/2017 Exhibits Doc ID# 2 [2] Appendix of Exhibits in Support of Public Records Act Application Pursuant to NRS 239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus Expedited Matter Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.011 Initial Appearance Fee Disclosure Doc ID# 3
[3] Initial Appearance Fee Disclosure (NRS Chapter 19)
Summons Doc ID# 4 07/17/2017 07/18/2017 [4] Summons - Civil Stipulation and Order Doc ID# 5 [5] Stipulation and Order Regarding Briefing Schedule otice of Entry of Order Doc ID# 6 Notice of Entry of Order
[6] Notice of Entry of Order
Memorandum Doc ID# 7 08/04/2017 08/17/2017 [7] Memorandum in Support of Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus/ Application for Declaratory and Injunctive Relief Doc ID# 8 08/17/2017 Declaration ectal action Doc 1549 6 [8] Attorney Margaret A. McLetchie's Declaration in Support of Memorandum in Support of Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus/ Application for Declaratory and Injunctive Relief Response Doc ID# 9
[9] Response to Petition and Memorandum Supporting Writ for Mandamus for Access to Autopsy Reports of Juvenile Deaths
Reply Doc ID# 10 08/30/2017 Reply Doc ID# 10
[10] Reply to Response to Petition and Memorandum in Support of Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/Petition for Writ of Mandamus/Application for Declaratory and Injunctive Relief
Supplement Doc ID# 11

Supplement Doc ID# 11 09/07/2017 09/25/2017 [11] Supplement to Reply to Response to Petition and Memorandum in Support of Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/Petition for Writ of Mandamus/ Application for Declaratory and Injunctive Relief
Petition for Writ of Mandamus (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Crockett, Jim) 09/28/2017 Plaintiff's Petition for Writ of Mandamus **Parties Present** esult: Matter Hear 11/09/2017 Doc ID# 12 Order Doc 11# 12
[12] Order Granting Petitioner LVR./'s Public Records Act Application Pursuant to Nev. Rev. Stat. 239.001/ Petition for Writ of Mandamus
Notice of Entry of Order Doc ID# 13
[13] Notice of Entry of Order
Notice of Appeal Doc ID# 14
[14] Notice of Appeal 11/09/2017 11/28/2017 11/28/2017 Case Appeal Statement [15] Case Appeal Statement Doc ID# 15 Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs Doc ID# 16 11/29/2017 [16] Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs
Motion to Stay Doc ID#17
[17] Defendant's Motion for Stay of District Court Order and Order Shortening Time
Opposition to Motion Doc ID#18 11/29/2017

[18] Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Opposition to Motion for Stay of District Court Order and Order Shortening Time

12/06/2017

```
12/08/2017 Reply to Opposition
                                                                 Doc ID# 19
                     [19] Reply to Petitioner Las Vegas Review Journal's Opposition to Motion for Stay of District Court Order and Order Shortening Time

Motion For Stay (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Crockett, Jim)

Defendant's Motion for Stay of District Court Order and Order Shortening Time
12/12/2017
                         Parties Present
                         Minute
                       Result: Granted
                      Opposition to Motion
                                                                    Doc ID# 20
                     Upposition to Motion Doc ID# 20
[20] Respondent's Opposition to Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for Attorneys' Fees and Costs
Reply to Opposition Doc ID# 21
[21] Reply to Respondent's Opposition to Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs
Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Crockett, Jim)
Plaintiff Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs
01/04/2018
01/11/2018
                         Parties Present
                         Minutes
                      Result: Granted
Order Doc ID# 22
01/11/2018
                      Order
                      Order Doc ID# 22
[Order] Granting Defendant's Motion for Stay of District Court Order and Order Shortening Time
Notice of Entry of Order Doc ID# 23
[23] Notice of Entry of Order
Motion to Stay Doc ID# 24
[24] Respondent's Motion for Stay of District Court Order and Order Shortening Time
01/12/2018
01/29/2018
                      | Z4| Respondent's Motion for stay of District Court Order and Order Shortening Time
Order Doc 10# 25
| [25] Order Granting Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs
Notice of Entry of Order Doc 10# 26
| [26] Notice of Entry of Order
Request Doc 10# 27
| [27] Request for Transcript of Proceedings
02/01/2018
02/01/2018
                     Notice of Appeal Doc ID# 28
[28] Notice of Appeal
Case Appeal Statement Doc
02/05/2018
02/05/2018
                                                                         Doc ID# 29
                     Case Appeal Statement Doc ID# 29
[29] Case Appeal Statement
Motion to Stay Doc ID# 30
[30] Respondent's Renewed Motion for Order Shortening Time on Motion for Stay of District Court Order
Opposition to Motion Doc ID# 31
[31] Opposition to Renewed Motion for Order Shortening Time On Motion for Stay of District Court Order
02/12/2018
02/13/2018
02/13/2018
                       Supplement
                                                  Doc ID# 32
                         (32) Supplement to Respondent's Renewed Motion for Order Shortening Time on Motion for Stay of District Court Order 
otice of Appearance Doc ID# 33
                       Notice of Appearance I
[33] Notice of Appearance
02/13/2018
                      Motion to Stay (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Crockett, Jim)
Respondent's Motion for Stay of District Court Order and Order Shortening Time
02/15/2018
                         Parties Present
                         Minutes
                            03/22/2018 Reset by Court to 02/15/2018
                       Result: Denied
                     Order Denying Motion Doc ID# 34
[34] Order Denying Respondent's Renew
Notice of Entry of Order Doc ID# 35
03/07/2018
                                                                                                  red Motion on Order Shortening Time for Stay of District Court Order
03/07/2018
                     04/01/2020
                          (Docket NO. 75095)
                      Status Check (3:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Crockett, Jim)
Supreme Court Appeal
04/15/2020
                            04/21/2020 Reset by Court to 04/15/2020
                     Result: Minute Order - No Hearing Held
Notice of Appearance Doc ID# 38
[38] Notice of Appearance and Change of Counsel
Status Check (3:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Crockett, Jim)
STATUS CHECK: FILING OF STIPULATION AND ORDER
04/17/2020
05/18/2020
                            05/21/2020 Reset by Court to 05/18/2020
                       Result: Matter Continued
06/01/2020
                      Stipulation and Order
                                                                    Doc ID# 39
                      Suppristion and order DOC ID# 39
[39] STIPULATION AND ORDER REGARDING BRIEFING SCHEDULE
Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order Doc ID# 40
06/02/2020
                     Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order

[40] Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order Regarding Briefing Schedule

Stipulation and Order Doc ID# 41

[41] Stipulation And Order Extending the Briefing Schedule

Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order Doc ID# 42

[42] Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order Extending Briefing Schedule

Petitioners Opening Brief Doc ID# 43

[43] Petitioner's Opening Brief on Remand

CANCELED Status Check (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Crockett, Jim)

Vacated, page Stimulation and Order
07/20/2020
07/20/2020
08/27/2020
09/24/2020
                     VACALED STATUS CHECK (9:30) AM) (Judicial Officer Croc Vacated - per Stipulation and Order Status of Case / Application (RE: SAO filed 6/1/20)
Stipulation and Order Doc ID# 44
[44] Stipulation and Order Extending the Briefing Schedule Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order Doc ID# 45
[45] Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order Answering Brief Doc ID# 45
09/27/2020
09/28/2020
                      Answering Brief Doc ID# 48

[46] Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Answering Brief

Petitioner's Reply Brief Doc ID# 47

[47] Petitioner's Reply in Support of Petitioner's Opening Brief on Remand

Hearing (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Crockett, Jim)

Hearing re: Briefs on Remand
10/07/2020
10/22/2020
10/29/2020
                         Parties Present
                         Minutes
                            10/15/2020 Reset by Court to 10/15/2020
                            10/15/2020 Reset by Court to 10/29/2020
                      Result: Matter Heard
                     Result: Matter reard

Recorders Transcript of Hearing Doc ID# 48

[48] Recorders Transcript of Hearing Re:

Motion to Stay Doc ID# 49

[49] Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time

Order Doc ID# 50

[60] Order Doc ID# 50
11/04/2020
11/20/2020
11/20/2020
                         [50] Order on Remand
                        order Shortening Time Doc ID# 51
[51] Respondent Clark County of the Oorner/ Medical Examiner's Motion to Stay on and Order Shortening Time
11/20/2020
11/20/2020
                      Notice of Entry of Order
                                                                         Doc ID# 52
                     11/20/2020
11/24/2020
                      Opposition Doc ID# 55
[55] Opposition t o Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time
11/30/2020
```

```
Doc ID# 56
12/07/2020 Reply in Support
                   [56] Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Reply in Support of Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time
Order Shortening Time Doc ID# 57
12/08/2020
                      [57] Petitioner Las vegas Review- Journal's Motion for Order to Show Cause on an Order Shortening Time
                   [57] Petitioner Las vegas Review- Journal's Motion for Order to Snow Cause on an Order Snortening Time

Notice of Entry Do Dib# 58

[58] Notice of Entry of Motion for an Order to Snow Cause on an Order Shortening Time

Opposition to Motion Doc ID# 59

[59] Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Opposition to Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for Order to Snow Cause on Order Shortening Time

Motion to Stay (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Crockett, Jim)
12/08/2020
12/09/2020
12/10/2020
                   Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion to Stay on an Order Shortening Time Result: Denied
                   Motion for Order to Show Cause (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Crockett, Jim)
Petitioner Las Vegas Review Journal's Motion to Order to Show Cause on OST
12/10/2020
                     Result: Denied
                   All Pending Motions (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Crockett, Jim)
12/10/2020
                      Parties Present
                      Minutes
                   Result: Matter Heard
Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements
12/11/2020
                   [60] Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements

Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs Doc ID# 61
[61] Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Supplemental Motion for Attorney s Fees and Costs
12/11/2020
                  [61] Notice of Appeal

Doc ID# 63

Recorders Transcript of Hearing Doc ID# 63

[63] Recorders Transcript of Hearing Re: 12/10/20

Notice of Appeal Doc ID# 64

[64] Notice of Appeal
12/14/2020
12/15/2020
12/15/2020
                   Case Appeal Statement D
[65] Case Appeal Statement
Order Denying Motion Do
12/15/2020
                                                                Doc ID# 65
12/23/2020
                                                             Doc ID# 66
                      [66] ORDER DENYING RESPONDENT CLARK COUNTY OFFICE OF THE CORONER/MEDICAL EXAMINER'S MOTION TO STAY ON ORDER SHORTENING TIME
                   Notice of Entry of Order Doc ID# 67
[67] Notice of Entry of Order Denying Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion for Stay on an Order Shortening Time
12/24/2020
                  Opposition Doc ID# 68
[68] Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Opposition to Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Supplemental Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs
Order Denying Motion Doc ID# 69
[69] Order Denying Petitioner Las Vegas Review Journal's Motion to Order to Show Cause on Order Shortening Time
Case Reassigned to Department 8
12/28/2020
12/30/2020
01/04/2021
                   Judicial Reassignment to Judge Jessica K. Peterson

Notice of Entry of Order Doc ID# 70

[70] Notice of Entry of Order Denying Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal s Motion for Order to Show Cause on Order Shortening Time
                   [70] Notice of Entry of Order Denying Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Mot Peremptory Challenge Doc ID# 71
[71] Peremptory Challenge of a Judge
Notice of Department Reassignment Doc ID# 72
[72] Notice of Department Reassignment
Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Jones, David M) 01/27/2021, 02/25/2021, 03/02/2021
01/07/2021
01/12/2021
01/27/202
                      Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Supplemental Motion for Attorney s Fees and Costs
                      Parties Present
                      Minutes
                        01/26/2021 Reset by Court to 01/26/2021
                        01/26/2021 Reset by Court to 01/27/2021
                    Result: Matter Continued
                   Result: Matter Continued

Stipulation and Order Doc ID# 73

[73] Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Set Briefing Schedule
01/27/2021
                   To superlation and Order to Supplement Motion of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Set Briefing Schedule

[74] Notice of Entry of Stipulation and Order to Supplement Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs and Setting a Briefing Schedule

Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements Doc ID# 75
01/27/2021
02/02/202
                   memorandum of Costs and Disbursements Doc

[75] Amended Memorandum of Costs and Disbursen

Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs Doc ID# 76

[76] Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs

Clerk's Notice of Hearing Doc ID# 77

[77] Notice of Hearing Doc ID# 77
02/02/202
02/03/202
02/16/202
                   Opposition to Motion
                                                            Doc ID# 78
                      [78] Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner s Opposition to Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal s Amended Motion
                   [7] Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Opposition for Attorney's Fees and Costs

Reply in Support Doc ID# 79

[79] Reply in Support of Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs

Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Jones, David M)

Plaintiff's Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs

Result: Motion Granted
02/23/2021
03/02/202
                   All Pending Motions (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Jones, David M)
03/02/2021
                      Parties Present
                      Minutes
                   Result: Matter Heard
Recorders Transcript of Hearing Doc ID# 80
[80] Recorders Transcript of Hearing Re: March 2, 2021
03/19/2021
                      rrata Doc ID# 81
[81] Errata to Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs
                   Order Granting Motion Doc ID# 82
[82] Order Granting Petitioner Las Vegas Review - Journal's Amended Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs
Notice of Entry of Order Doc ID# 83
04/08/2021
04/08/202
                  04/22/202
04/30/2021
04/30/202
                   [86] Second Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements

Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs Doc ID# 87
[87] Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal, Inc.'s Motion for Supplemental Attorney's Fees and Costs
04/30/202
                   Clerk's Notice of Hearing
[88] Notice of Hearing
05/03/2021
                                                                  Doc ID# 88
                                                  Doc ID# 89
05/03/2021
                   Motion to Strike Doc ID# 89
[89] Respondent Clark County Office of The Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion to Strike or, in the Alternative, Motion to Retax Memorandum of
                   Clerk's Notice of Hearing Doc ID# 90
[90] Notice of Hearing
Notice of Appeal Doc ID# 91
[91] Notice of Appeal
05/04/2021
05/07/202
                   Case Appeal Statement [92] Case Appeal Statement
05/07/202
                                                           Doc ID# 93
                   Opposition to Motion Doc ID# 93
[93] Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Opposition to Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for
05/14/202
                      Supplemental Attorney's Fees and Costs
                   Opposition to Motion Doc ID# 94
[94] Opposition to Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion to Strike or, in the Alternative, Retax Memorandum
05/17/2021
                      of Costs
                                  Doc ID# 95
05/19/2021 Errata
```

[95] Errata to Satisfaction of Judgment [95] Errata to Sausiavas...

Request Doc ID# 96
[96] Request for Transcripts of Proceedings
Change of Address Doc ID# 97 05/28/2021 [96] Request for Transcripts of Proceedings
Notice of Change of Address Doc ID# 97
[97] Notice of Change of Firm Address
Reply to Motion Doc ID# 98
[98] Respondent Clark County Office of The Coroner/Medical Examiner's Reply in Support of Motion to Strike or, in the Alternative, Retax 06/02/202 [98] Respondent Clark County Office of The Corune/investical Examines a Neply in Support of Memorandum of Costs

Reply in Support Doc Ib# 99
[99] Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Reply in Support of Motion for Supplemental Attorney's Fes and Costs

Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Jones, David M)

Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal, Inc.'s Motion for Supplemental Attorney's Fees and Costs 06/10/2021 06/30/2021 06/01/2021 Reset by Court to 06/17/2021 06/17/2021 Reset by Court to 06/30/2021 Result: Motion Granted

Motion to Strike (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Jones, David M)

Respondent Clark County Office of The Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion to Strike or, in the Alternative, Motion to Retax Memorandum of Costs 06/30/2021 06/15/2021 Reset by Court to 06/17/2021 06/17/2021 Reset by Court to 06/30/2021 Result: Motion Denied

All Pending Motions (9:00 AM) (Judicial Officer Jones, David M) 06/30/2021 Result: Matter Heard Result: Matter Heard

Reporters Transcript Doc ID# 100
[100] Reporter's Transcript of Proceedings - Thursday, September 28, 2017, 9:00 a.m.

Reporters Transcript Doc ID# 101
[101] Reporter's Transcript of Proceedings - Thursday, January 11, 2018, 9:00 a.m.

Order Granting Motion Doc ID# 102
[102] Order Granting Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for Supplemental Attorney's Fees and Costs and Denying Respondent Clark
County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion to Strike

Notice of Entry of Order Proces Processing 139. 07/22/2021 07/22/2021 08/09/202 Notice of Entry of Order Doc ID# 103

[103] Notice of Entry of Order Granting Petitioner Las Vegas Review-Journal's Motion for Supplemental Attorney's Fees and Costs and Denying Respondent Clark County Office of the Coroner/Medical Examiner's Motion to Strike

Order to Statistically Close Case

[104] Civil Order to Statistically Close Case 08/09/2021 09/10/2021

FINANCIAL INFORMATION

	Defendant Clark County Office of the C Total Financial Assessment Total Payments and Credits Balance Due as of 09/13/2021	Coroner/ Medical Examiner		79.00 79.00 0.00
11/28/2017 02/06/2018 02/06/2018 12/07/2020 12/07/2020 12/15/2020 12/15/2020 12/28/2020	Transaction Assessment Fee Waiver Transaction Assessment Fee Waiver Transaction Assessment Efile Payment Transaction Assessment Fee Waiver Transaction Assessment Fee Waiver Transaction Assessment Efile Payment	Receipt # 2020-68690-CCCLK Receipt # 2020-72663-CCCLK	Clark County Office of the Coroner/ Medical Examiner Clark County Office of the Coroner/ Medical Examiner	24.00 (24.00) 24.00 (24.00) 3.50 (3.50) 24.00 (24.00) 3.50 (3.50)
	Plaintiff Las Vegas Review-Journal Total Financial Assessment Total Payments and Credits Balance Due as of 09/13/2021			744.00 744.00 0.00
07/18/2017 01/07/2021 01/07/2021 05/07/2021	Transaction Assessment Efile Payment Transaction Assessment Efile Payment Transaction Assessment Efile Payment	Receipt # 2017-58007-CCCLK Receipt # 2021-01138-CCCLK Receipt # 2021-28728-CCCLK	Las Vegas Review-Journal Las Vegas Review-Journal Las Vegas Review-Journal	270.00 (270.00) 450.00 (450.00) 24.00 (24.00)