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Attorneys for Respondent 

 

    
   

      
    

 

/s/ Cynthia Kelley         
An Employee of Lewis Roca Rothgerber Christie LLP 
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EDUCATION: 

BAR MEMBERSHIP: 

EXPERIENCE: 

2002 - PRESENT 

1995-2002 

1985-1995 

JOHN HOUSTON SCOTT 
SCOTT LAW FIRM 

1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715, San Francisco> CA 94109 
Tel.: (415) 561-9601 ° E~MAIL: jolm@scottlawfinn.net 

Golden Gate University 
San Francisco, California 
J.D., 1976 

University of California, Santa Barbara 
Santa Barbara, California 
B.A, Religious Studies, 1970 

Supreme Court of the St.ate of California 
Supreme Court of the United States of America 
United States Court of Appeals, Ninth Circuit 
United States District Court, Northern District of California 
lJnited States District Court, Southern District of California 
United States District Court, Eastern District of California 
United States District Court, Central Distri~t of California 

SCOTT LAW FIRM 
13 88 SUTIER STREET, St:!TE 715 
SAN FRANCISCO, CAI.JFORNIA 

In 2003 Liza de Vries joined the firm and we have focused on 
complex civil rights and elder financial abuse litigation. 

PRE~TICE & SCOTT 
433 TURK STREET 

SAN FRANCtSCOt CALIFORNIA 

Partner and fmmder of small general practice firm with emphasis on civil­
rights Htigation. 

LAW OFFICE OF JOHN HOUSTON SCOTT 
433 TuRK STREET 

SAN FRANCJSCO, CALtFORNIA 

Private practice with emphasis in civil-rights litigation. 
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REPORTED 
DECISIONS: 

MAJOR 
ACCOMPLISHMENTS: 

COLE A'!llD SCOTT 
2256 VAN NESS A VENUE 
SAN FRA-:-.ICISCO, CALIFORNIA 

Partner and founder of small general practice firm with emphasis on civil­
rights litigation. 

(Attached) 

co.Counsel with the Regional CounseJ for the NAACP, Western 
Region> representing Plaintiffs in major civil-rights litigation 
against the City ofRiclunond. White v. City ofRiclunond, 713 
F .2d 458{9th Cir. 1983); 599 F. Supp. 127 (N.D. Cal. 1982) and 
Roman v. City of Richmond, 570 F. Supp. 1544 and 570 F. Supp. 
1554 (N.D. Cal. 1983). In June 1983 that litigation culminated in a 
$3million dollar jury verdict arising out of a pattern and practice/ 
wrongful death case. As a result of this litigation significant 
refonns were implemented in the Richmond Police Department 
and the Chief of Police resigned. 

In Estate of Adams v. Gomez, N.D. Cal No. C 95-0701 WHO the 
plaintiffs brought a lawsuit claiming that the shooting death of an 
inmate at San Quentin State Prison resulted from the 
implementation of an unconstitutional shooting policy. In 
November 1998 a federal jury retumed a $2.3 million dollar 
verdict against three defendants including $1.5 million dollars in 
punitive damages against the former Director of the Department of 
Corrections. Shortly after the verdict the Department of 
Corrections significantly changed its shooting policy resulting in 
the number of shootings and shooting deaths to drop dramatically. 

I was co-counsel with John Burris and James Chanin in the 
Oakland "Riders" litigation (Delphine Allen, et. al. v, City of 
Oakland> et al., N.D. Cal. No. 00-4599 THE), where we 
represented 119 victims of a cadre of corrupt OPD officers who 
subjected numerous citizens, most of them African-American, to 
violations of their civil-rights. In 2003, after over two years of 
litigation) the City of Oakland agreed to a monetary settlement in 
excess of ten million dollars and a consent decree intended to 
substantially reform the OPD's Internal Affairs Division and the 
manner in which the OPD monitors and supervises its officers. 

References available upon request -- revised May 2013 
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F:\JHS Personal\John Houston Scott CV· revised July 25, 2017.doc 
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Scott Law Firm 
1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715 San Francisco, CA 94109 (415) S61-9600 

John Scott's Hours re: Mary Bryan and Arny Ha!rt 
l:1mil:l 

3/16/2015 JHS Telephone conference wlth Affen Lichtsnstaln re poss!ble a&SOclaUon. 0.50 

419/2015 JHS Telephone COJ'lfemnce with Atlsn Lichtenstein ts potenUal fee agreement. 0.30 

4/10/2015 JHS Review pleadiflDS. 1.30 

4/15/2015 JHS Email from Allen Lichtenstein re fee agreement. 0.20 

4/20/2015 JHS Telephorte oonl'8rence with Allen Lichtenstein re background and history of c&6e. 0.80 

5/13/2015 JHS Association of counsel. 0.20 

5/27/2015 JHS Telephone confervnce with Allan Uchten&tain. 0.30 

6/1812015 JHS Telephon& confer81'\ce with Allen Uchtenstaln re initial disclosures. 0.50 

6122/2015 JHS Review Initial disclosures. 0.70 

7114/2015 JHS Emalt re sdl8dullng of deposl!Jon&. 0.20 

7/20/2015 JHS EmaD re echedullng of deposfflons. 0.20 

7/27/2015 JHS Review Joint Case Conrswu:;e Report. 0.30 

8/13/2015 JHS .Telapl'K)n& conference with Allen Lichtenstein re: sclledullng depositions 0.40 

8/1712015 JHS Telephone oonferenc:e with Allen Lichtenstein re: schedullng depositions. 0.20 

9/2812015 JHS Emal re deposition schodule. 0.20 

10/1/2015 JHS Email re deposition schedule. 0.20 

10/2/2015 JHS Eman re deposltlon schedule. 0.20 

10/14/2015 JHS Telephone conference with A.lien Uch~nstefn re: dllcovery and dQPOSltlona. 0.80 

10/16/2015 JHS Telephone confarence with Aikin Uchtenste1r1 review document& 2.30 

10/20/2015 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Uchtensteln re statutes end ~ulatlons. 0.50 

10/23/2015 JHS Telephone conference with ADen Uchteneteln re school dlstrlct and parallel lltlgatlon. 0.40 

10/25/2015 JHS Obtain Information and tlmellnes from clients, 1.50 

10/28/2015 JHS Emal! • confirm depo,ltlons; prep for deposition&.. 1.80 

10/29/2015 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Uchtensteln; email from Allen; prep for Winn. deposition. 3.50 

10/30/2015 JHS Emalls with Allen Lichtenstein; travel to Las Vegas; for depositions. 5.20 

11/1/2015 JHS Prep for daposltJons; telephone conference wlth cl!ants: m&et with Allen. 6.50 

11/0212015 JHS Prep for deposition; deposition of Warren McKay; confer with ARen Lichtenstein. 10.50 

11/03/2015 JHS Prep for deposition; deposition of Cheryl Winn; oonfer with Allen Lichtenstein; return to 11.50 

11/04/2015 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein; obtain Information from c:lfente. 1.30 

11/0512015 JHS Emalia re settlement potential and strategy. 0.40 

11/06/2015 JHS Telephone conferenca with Allan llcht&nsteln; emlla from clients ,e verdicts In e!mllar cases. 0.70 

11/07/2015 JHS Review and revise timeUne. 0.50 

11/09/2015 JHS Telepttone eonfereru::e with Allan Uctrtensteln re dlscovefY responses. 0.30 

11/10/2015 JHS Review draft of discovery responses; telephone conferance with AUen Llchtensteln. 1.20 
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11/11/2015 JN:::1 Murupie ernans re oISOOvery respon68S; telephone conterence wlttl Allen Llcfltanstetn. :l.CIO 

11/12/2015 JHS T e!ephone conference with AHen Uchtenataln el'\d email re achaduUng d9?caltlons and strategy. o.so 

11/13/2015 JHS Tetephone conference wi1h Allen Lichtenstein and email re protective ordar re medical records. 0.30 

11/15/2015 JHS Summar1%e Winn dep08ltlon; email to Alfao Llchtenst&ln. 4.40 

11/18/2015 JHS Teleptione confoosnce with Allen Ucht&r\Slein. 0.50 

11/1912015 JHS Emal! re scheduling of Ethan's and Nolan's deposfflon&. 0.20 

11/20/2015 JHS Slipuletlon re expert dlaeovefY. 0.20 

11/2412016 JHS Telephone confarence with Allan Lichtenstein. 0.20 

11/30/2015 JHS Review tran80'ipt of Wtighl deposltlon and responses to discovery requests. 3.20 

12/0112.015 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Uchtenst.eln. 0.20 

12/02/2015 JHS Emall. re eehedullng of deposlliona; telephone conf8fem;e with Allen Uchtaneteln. 0.'30 

12/03/2015 JHS Notice depositions. 0.40 

12/0412015 JHS Telephone confersnca with AUen Lichten~. 0.50 

12/07/2015 JHS Request defe counsel to Include me In emails. 0.20 

12/0912015 JHS Emaile re discovery !saues. 0.20 

12/10/2015 JHS Schedule deposition& of Connor and Dant&. 0.20 

12/11/2015 JHS Telephone ccnferenc~ with All9!'1 Lichtenstein. Q.20 

12/1512015 JHS Ernalrs re d eposltlons of trvstlng doctora and p!alntiffa . 0.20 

12/20/2015 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein. 0.30 

12122/2015 JHS Telephone conference wlth Allen Lichtenstein. 0.20 

12/24/2015 JHS Email re damage calculation dlspula; telephone conf919nce \Nl1h Allen Lichtenstein 0.50 

12/2812015 JHS Review allpulatlon re dlaeovery dispute. 0.20 

01I04/2016 JHS Telephone conference wlth Allen Llehten&teln. 0.20 

01/0512016 JHS Review d111poell!on of Nolan Hairr, telephons confl\ll'ence with Allen Uehtenstein. 2.60 

01/08/2016 JHS Consult with Allen Uchtensteln re discovery dispute re medical records. 0.50 

01/0812016 JHS Telephone confeNnce with Allen Uchtenatefn re discovery matteni. 0.30 

01/11/2016 JHS Multiple emaHs re sdlectul!ng of deposition and dl8covery Issues and motion to ccimpel. 0.60 

01/13/2016 JHS Multlpl9 emails re motion to oompet damage calcula1fon. 0.30 

01/14/2016 JHS Telephone conlertrn:e with Allan Llchtenateln and emalle re discovery Issues. 0.50 ' 

01/19/2016 JHS Multiple emalls re discovery Issues; telephone conference with A!ten Uchtensteln re upcoming depositions; 2.30 
review depositions of Connor and Dante. 

01/20/2016 JHS Review reepONe lo motion to compel; legal research; prep for depositions. 3.50 

01/21/2018 JHS Emalia regarding scheduling of depostllons; prep for depoaltl00&. 3.00 

01/22/2016 JHS Multiple emails: lalephona confeteneoe with Allen Lletrter\Stein; prep for depoailions. 4.80 

01/2412.016 JHS Travel to Las Vegas; meet with Allen L and ctlents; prep for depositions. 9.00 

01/25/2016 JHS Prep fo, depositions; daposltlon of Leonard DePlaua; meet with Allan Lichtenstein. 8.30 

01/2612016 JHS PJep for depe>sltlons; deposltlon of Robert Beastey; meet wllh Allen Lichtenstein. 7.50 

01/2712016 JHS Prep for depositions; deposlllon of John Helpln; meet with Allen Lichtenstein. 6.50 

01/28/2016 JHS Prep f0t deposition; deposition of Andre Long; meat with Allen Lichtenstein; travel to SF. 9.50 

01/2912017 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Uchlenatafn: review supplemental dlsclosures 0.50 

02/01/2016 JHS Multiplet emails; telephone conference with Allan tlchtensteln. 0.60 

02/02/2016 JHS Multiple emalfs; review Information from cflents; telephone conference w!th Allen Uchtensteln 1.20 
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02/12/2016 JHS Telephone conference w!lh Allen Llcht&neteln. 0.20 

02/16/2016 JHS T etephcne c:cnfereno& with AUeri Lichtell8teln. 0.50 

02/17/2016 JHS Telephone conference with Allan Lichtenstein. 0.20 

02122/2016 JHS Revl&N demand letter; 1elephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein. 0.70 

02/24/2016' JHS Talephcme oonfetence with Allen Uchlansteln. 0.20 

02125/2016 JHS Review and revise letter; tetephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein. 0.80 

0212612016 JHS Telephone conference with Alteri LlchtaMtain. 0.30 

03/02/2016 JHS Telephone oonfefflnce wllh Allen Llchtenst.eln re MSJ. 0.50 

03/0312016 JHS Emails re Oefendents MSJ; l&Qal research; summarlze depositions. 8.50 

03/07/2016 JHS lnltlel draft of facls In opposlllon to MSJ; review tranacfipts. 5.30 

03/Q&/2016 JHS MulUp!e emails; telephone confeJOOce with Allen Uchtenstefn. 0.80 

03/09/2016 JHS Prep memo re factual draputes; mulOple emails; telephone conferance with Allan Uchtensteln. 4.80 

03/10/2016 JHS Draft opPQ$lllon. to MSJ; mulUpk, email&; telephone conference with Allen Llehtensu,!n. 5.00 

03/11/2018 JHS Draft opposition to MSJ; multlple emails. 6.40 

03/14/2016 JHS Multlp!e emails; telephone conference with Allen Uc:htensie!n r& MSJ, discovery and trial date 3.-50 

03/15/2016 JHS Telephone conforam,, with Allen Lichtenstein. 0.20 

03/16/2016 JHS Telephone conference wllh Allen llchteos1eln. 0.20 

03/17/2016 JHS Stipulatlort re trlal date; review tranecr1pts. 2.-50 

03118/2016 · JHS Telephone conference with Allen Uchkl118te!n; small from Aikin; prep for Winn deposltlon. 3.30 

03/21/2016 JHS Telephone conferenoe w11h Allen Lichtenstein re discovery order and MSJ; telephone conference with dfents re 3.50 
key events; review lrartiCl'ipts. 

03/24/2016 JHS Telephone conference Dan Siegel; telephone conference wtth Jm Quadra; google rsseareh re bullyln~ and 2.80 
gender Issues. 

03/2512016 JHS Review tranacrlpts of E1han, Nolan, Connor and Dante - compare to Beasley and Winn. 4.50 

03128/2016 JHS Revise and expand statement of fact& In opposition to MSJ; prep declara11on and review exhlbHs. 6.00 

03/29/2016 JHS Telephone conference wlth Allen Lichtenstein; opposition to MSJ. 5.50 

03130/2()16 JHS Multtpl& emalls; telephone conference wllh Allen Lichtenstein; review and N:Jvlse opposition to MSJ. 4.20 

03/3112016 JHS Mcillfpts emails; review and revlS& opposftlon to MSJ. 2.50 

04/01/2016 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein; multiple emails re MSJ; final edlte and revisions. 3.50 

04102/2016 JHS Mulllple ematts. 0.30 

04/11/2016 JHS Telephone conference \\4th Allen Ueht8n$!eln. 0.20 

04/1312016 JHS Telephone cooferern:e with Allen Uchtenateln. 0.20 

04/19/2016 JHS Telephono conference wllh Allen Uchteneteln; review reply brief. 1.80 

04121/2016 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein. 0.50 

04/28/2016 JHS Telephone conference wilh Allen Lichtenstein: multlpfe emalls. 0.50 

05/04/2016 JHS Mulllple emails. 0.30 

05/05/2016 JHS Multiple emails; telephone conference Yllth Allen Lichtenstein. 0.50 

05/06/2016 JHS Multiple emails. 0.40 

05/09/2018 JHS Multlple emaHs; telephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein. 0.40 

05/10/2016 JHS Multiple emalls. 0.30 

05/13/2016 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein; multlple emaifs. 0.50 

05/17/2016 JHS Telephone conference with AUen Lichtenstein. 0.20 

0511812016 JHS Telephone conference w!lh Allen Lichtenstein. 0.20 

011251201e JHS Telephone conference with Allen Llchtenste!nre order on MSJ; review order. 1.50 
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07/28/2016 JHS Tetepllone conference wlth Allen Uchtenslsln. 0.20 

06105/2016 JHS ·Telephone conference wnh Allen LichteJ'lsleln. 0.20 

08/12/2018 JHS Telept!one conference wilh Allen Lichtenstein re motion for reconsideration. 0.50 

08/24/2016 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein. 0.20 

08130/2016 JHS Email re monon to consider. 0.20 

08/31/2016 JHS Emal!; telephona conference wMh AJren Llchtenst.eln. 0.50 

10/16/2016 JHS Mulllpl& emails re lnal aruf trial pttiparatlon. -0.40 

10/16/2016 JHS Tefephona conference wUh AUen Lichtonstem; multiple emails. 0.80 

10/17/2016 JHS Telephone conference with All8n Lichtenstein; multiple emails; trial preparation. 2.30 

10/18/2016 JHS Telephone conference with Alten Uchtensteln; mutttpla emall8: tr!al preparatkJn. 2.50 

10/19/2016 JHS Telephone conference with ARan llc:htenateln. 0.20 

10/21/2016 JHS Trial preparaUcn; teJephone confenlnce wlth A!len Uchten&teln; mu!Uple eman.. 2.70 

10/2412016 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Llchtenstetn: trlal preparation; mulUple emalts. 3.80 

10/2612016 JHS Telephone conference with AUan Lichtenstein; trial preparation; multiple emails. 2.20 

10/27/2018 JHS Telephone conference with Allan Liclltensteln; trial preparation; mull!ple emaUs. 3.00 

10/28/2016 JHS Conference call; m\Jtlpla emaHs; trfal preparallon. 4.50 

11101120·10 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein. 0.40 

11/02/2016 JHS Trial preparatlon; multiple emails. 2.50 

11/03/2016 JHS Telephcn.e conference with AUan Lichtenstein. 0,20 

11/0812016 JHS Trial p,eparatton; mu!llple emab: telephone cooferenca v.(th Allen Uchtenstef,-. 3.80 

11/0912016 JHS Trial p19pata1io/'I; multiple emalt&. 3.00 

11/1012016 JHS Trial preparation; mulllple ema:116. 4.50 

11/1112016 JHS Trial preparation; mulllple emal!s. 3.30 

11/1312018 JHS Trial preparallon. 5.50 

11/1412016 JHS Travel to Las Vegas; trial preparation, 8.50 

11/15/2016 JHS Trial preparation and trfal. 11.50 

11116/2018 JHS Trial preparation and trial. 11.00 

11/1712016 JHS Trial preparation and triel. 11.50 

11/1812018 JHS Trial preparalfon and trlal. 9.50 

11120/2016 JHS Trial preparation. 2.30 

11/21/2016 JHS Trial preparation. 3.80 

11/2212016 JHS Trial preparation and trial; travel to SF. 7.50 

01/03/2017 JHS Telephone oonference wnh Allen Uchteneteln. 0.2.0 

01/0512017 JliS Telephone conference wllh Allen Lichtenstein Ill delay In get11ng trial iranec.rlpta. 0.20 

01/08fl017 JHS Multlple emails re atlpulaflon to extend briefing schedule. 0.30 

01/0912017 JHS Email re delay In tl'9nserlpte. 0.20 

01/10/2017 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Llohtensteln. 0.20 

01/1112017 JHS Emalls re slipu!atlon to extend briefing schedule. 0.30 

01/13/2017 JHS Review 611pulallon to a>Ctend briefing schedule. 0..20 

02/1412017 JHS Telephone conference llllith Allen Lichtenstein. 0.20 

02/1612017 JHS Receive trial tran1C11pts and commence review. 1.20 

02/20/2017 JHS Telephone conferance wHh Allen Llchle0$telnre division of labor. 0.50 

02/22/2017 JHS Telephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein. 0.20 
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02/23/2017 JHS 

03/06/2017 JHS 

03/07/2017 JHS 

03/08/2017 JHS 

03/09/2017 JHS 

09/10/2017 JHS 

03/19/2017 JHS 

03/20/2017 JHS 

04/0712.017 JHS 

04/13/2017 JHS 

04/17/2017 JHS 

04/20/2017 JHS 

0412112.017 JHS 

05101/2017 JHS 

05/0312017 JHS 

05/09/2017 JHS 

05/23/2017 JHS 

0512412017 JHS 

0512512017 JHS 

05(2612017 JHS 

06/04/2017 JHS 

06!17/2017 JHS 

06/12/20(7 JHS 

08122/2017 JHS 

06/30/2017 JHS 

07/0612017 JHS 

07/10/2017 JHS 

07/13/2017 JHS 

07/14/2017 JHS 

07116/2017 JHS 

07/17/2017 JHS 

Timekeeper Summary 
Jotin Houston Scott 

Terepnone conterenca) w1Ul AU&n LlcntensteJn. 

Review amt summarize trial trantcnpta: 

Revfew and sunm,arl2e tdal transcripts. 

Review and summari;-.& trial transcripts. 

Compare end contrast Crlal teslfmony. 

T elephon& conferen~ with Alten Llchteneteln re Closing Brief. 

Review and revl~ Closing .Argument 

Telephone conf618nc.e wllh Allan Lichtenstein; review and revise Closln9 Argument. 

Telephone conference with Allen Uchtenstetn. 

Telephoc,e eonfereooe with Allen Lithtenetein. 

Emalla regarding extenslon to tire Oefenclant's Ctostng; telephone conference wfth Allen Lichtenstein 

Telephone conferenC9 with Allen l.lchtensteln. 

Telephone c<Jnfenrmce with Allen Lichtenstein. 

Review Defendant's CIO&lng Brief 

Telephone contorer.ce with Allen Lichtenstein re Reply Brief. 

Telephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein. 

Telephone conference with Allen Llchtvnsieln. 

Review emails; telephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein. 

Review and revlB8 Reply Brlet telephone confenmce with Allen Lichtenstein. 

Multiple email&; review and rewie Reply Brtef. 

Receive and nwlew motion to strike. 

Multlple emails; telephone oonf&tence with Allen Uc.htensteln re oppoa!tlon to motk>n to strike; legal research. 

Mulllple emalla, review oppoelt!on to motion to strike; telephone conference with Atten Uchlsnetein. 

Telephone eonrerence with Allen Lichtenstein. 

Review Oedelon and Order. 

Telephone confemnce with Allen Llchtenalain re Finding of Fact and Conclusions of Law. 

Telephone conference with Allen Lichtenstein. 

Telephone conference with Allen Llchteneleln. 

Tetaphone conference with Allen Lichtenstein re damag~ ts,ue. 

Review and 1'81/ise Fkldlnge of fact and Conclusions of Law. 

Telepl\one conrerence with Allen Lichtemm,!n; revtew and revise Findings of fact and Conclusions of Law. 

v."v 

5.50 

3.80 

4.40 

6.50 

o.so 
1.80 

2.30 

0.20 

0.20 

0.30 

0.20 

0.20 

1.70 

0.60 

0.20 

0.20 

0.50 

2.80 

3.50 

1.50 

3.60 

2.20 

0.20 

1.50 

0.50 

0.20 

0.20 

0.40 

1.30 

2.50 

Hours 
383.50 
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Case3:07-cv-05483-S1 Document192 Filed11127/13 Pagel of 12 

TN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT 

FOR TIIE NORTIIBRN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA 

8 A.D., a minor. et al., No. C 07-5483 SI 

9 

10 v. 

Plaintiffs, ORDER GRANTING PLAINTIFFS~ 
SUPPLEMENTAL MOTION FOR 
AITORNEYS' FEES AND COSTS 

11 STA TE OF CALIFORNIA HIGHWAY 
PATROL, etal., 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

Defendants. 

Now before the Court is plaintiffs' supplemental motion for attorneys' fees and expenses. For 

the reasons set forth below, the Court GRANTS plaintiffs' motion. Docket No. 173. 

BACKGROUND 

Ajury trial was held in this wrongful death case from April 27 - May 7, 2009. The jury found 

in favor of plaintiffs A.D. and J.E. on their claim that defendant Markgraf violated their Fourteenth 

Amendment rights by unlawfully depriving them of their liberty interest in their family relationship with 
21 

their mother, Karen Eklund. In a bifurcated damages phase. the jury awarded $30,000 to each plaintiff. 
22 

The Court entered final judgment on May 8, 2009, and by order filed June 23, 2009, denied defendant's 
23 

renewed motion for judgment as a matter of law and motion for a new trial. On July 9, 2009, defendant 
24 

filed a notice of appeal. 
25 

26 
In an order filed November 10, 2009, the Court granted plaintiffs, motion for attorneys' fees and 

costs. The Court !'ejected defendant's argument that the fee award should be reduced because plaintiffs 
27 

had achieved "limited success" at trial: 
28 
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Case3:07-cv-05483-S1 Document192 Filedll/27113 Page2 of 12 

Although plaintiffs did not obtain substantial monetary damages. they received 
much more than the nominal damages urged by defendant. Moreover, "[s]uccess is 
measured not only by the amount of the recovery but also in terms of the significance 
of the legal issue on which the plaintifff.revailed and the public purpose the Litigation 
served." Morales v. City of San Rajae , 96 F.3d 357, 365 (9th Cir. 1996). Plaintiffs 
fully prevailed on their clanns at tnal, and in so doing vindicated their constitutional 
rights. Wrongful death cases such as the instant one present questions of vital 
importance to the publlc. In addition to obtaining relatively modest damages, plaintiffs 
achieved "significant nonmonetary results" in that the jury's verdict will likely deter 
defendantMark~affrom engaging in future unconstitutional conduct. See id. at 365. 
Because of the significance of the legal issues and the deterrent effect of this case, the 
Court rejects defendant's contention that the lodestar should be reduced due to the 
discrepancy between the damages claimed in the Utigation and the damages awarded. 

Defendant also asserts that "the low verdict amount is not explained by the 
difficulty or complexity ofthe case," and that the lodestar should be reduced because 
this was "a straightforward police shooting case." Defendant's current position that 
this case was simple is belied by the vigorous defense of this case; defendants moved 
to dismiss, moved for summary Judgment, contested liability at trial, and filed post-trial 
motions seekingjudgment as a matter of law and a new trial. Contrary to defendant's 
assertions, this case was factually and legally complicated, and posed numerous 
challenges for plaintiffs. Plaintiffs had to overcome defendants' assertion of qualified 
immunity, and had to establish that defendant Markgraf acted with a purpose to harm 
unrelated to a legitimate law enforcement objective, a very high standard. The only 
witnesses to the incident were law enforcement officers, and there were factual 
disputes about whether Eklund was attempting to run over officers when she was shot. 
Tbe complexity of the case is illustrated by the fact that defendants retained .several 
experts and prepared sophisticated and complicated video and computerized 
reconstructions of the car chase and events leading up to the shooting. 

Docket No. 144 at 3-4 (footnote omitted). Citing McCown v. City of Fontana, 565 F .3d 1097, 1102 (9th 

Cir. 2009), the Court also held that it could not consider the parties' settlement negotiations in 

determining a r~asonable fee. See id. at 4. The Court awarded plaintiffs their lodestar and denied 

plaintiffs' request for a multiplier. Defendant appealed the fee order. 

The merits and fees appeals were briefed, and on November 30, 20 I 0, the Ninth Circuit held oral 

argument. On April 6, 2011, the Ninth Circuit issued its first opinion in this case. Docket No. 157. In 

a published opinion, the Ninth Circuit reversed the judgment and held that defendant was entitled to 

qualified immunity, and vacated the fee order in light of the disposition on the merits. A. D. v. Markgraf, 

636 F.3d 555 (9th Cir. 2011). On April 20~ 2011, plaintiffs filed a petition for rehearing en bane. On 

May 10, 2011. the Ninth Circuit directed defendant to file a response. Docket No. 158. The Ninth 

Circuit granted plaintiffs leave to file a reply, which plaintiffs filed on June 12, 2011. Docket No. 160. 

On April 11, 20 I 2, the Ninth Circuit withdrew its original opinion and issued an order directing 

supplemental briefing. Docket No. 161. The Ninth Circuit directed the parties to answer two questions: 

2 
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l (1) "How should the qualified immunity framework be applied based on the jury's finding that 

2 Defendant-Appe11ant violated Plaintiffs-Appetlees' Fourteenth Amendment right to a familial 

3 relationship?"; and (2) "Does the subjective requirement in this case that the Defendant-Appellant act 

4 with a purpose to hann unrelated to a legitimate law enforcement objective in order to violate the 

5 Plaintiffs-Appellees' Fourteenth Amendment right to familial association affect the qualified immunity 

6 inquiry?" Id. The parties filed supplemental briefs, and on September 18, 2012, the Ninth Circuit held 

7 a second argument on the appeals. 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

On April 3, 2013, the Ninth Circuit issued a new published opinion affirming this Court's denial 

ofdefendant'smotionforjudgmentasamatteroflaw. SeeA.D. v. California Highway Patrol, 712 F.3d 

446(9th Cir. 2013). The Court of Appeals held that there was sufficient evidence to support the jury's 

verdict that defendant shot Karen Eklund with a purpose to harm unrelated to a legitimate law 

enforcement objectives, and therefore that defendant was not entitled to qualified inununity. 

The Ninth Circuit also reversed and remanded the fee award "so that the district court may 

consider the amounts ofMarkgraf's settlement offers in detennininga reasonable fee ... in light ofan 

intervening change in Ninth Circuit law holding that Federal Rule of Evidence 408 does not bar district 

courts in the Ninth Circuit from considering amounts discussed in settlement negotiations as evidence 

of the extenl of the plaintifrs success." Id. at 460-61 (citing In re Kekauoha-Alisa, 674 F .3d 1083, 

l 093.94 (9th Cir. 2012); Ingram v. Oroudjian, 647 F.3d 925, 927 (9th Cir. 2011)). The court further 

19 instructed: 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

On remand, the district court bas the discretion (1) to consider the amounts 
discussed in settlement negotiations, or not; and (2) to give those amounts as much 
or as little wei~ht as it sees fit. See Lohman v. Duryea Borough, 574 F .3d 163, J 69 
(3d Cil'.2009)\acknowledging that settlement offers are "clearly only one factor to 
be considered in the award of fees," and that the district court "is also free to reject 
such evidence as not bearing on success"); cf. In re Kekauoha-Alisa, 674 F.3d at 
1093~94; Ingram, 647 F.3d 925 (adopting Lohman's holding that Federal Rule of 
Evidence 408 does not bar consideration of settlement offers when making 
attorneys' fee awards). It is not our place to opine a.s to how that discretion should 
be exercised. 

Id. at 461. 
26 

27 
The plaintiffs filed a motion to transfer consideration of attorneys' fees for the appeal to this 

28 
Court. 'fhe Ninth Circuit granted the motion as to the merits appeal~ but ruled that plaintiffs are not 

3 
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l entitled to fees for the appeal of the fee award. 

2 In August 2013, defendant filed a petition for writ of certiorari in the United States Supreme 

3 Court. On November 4, 2013, th~ Supreme Court denied the petition. Markgraf v. A.D., No. 13-365, 

4 2013 WL 5297886 (U.S. Nov. 4, 2013). 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

DISCUSSION 

Plaintiffs seek attorneys• fees and expenses, broken down as follows: (1) the original fee award 

pre-appeal of $559,861.45 (merits foes of $489,631.00; merits expenses of $6,402.59; fees for original 

fee petition of $63,490.00; and fees expenses of $337.86); (2} merits appeal work in the amount of 

$288,080.00; (3) work on the supplemental fee petition in the amount of$57,428.90 (fees of$57 ,285.00 

and expenses of $143.90); (4) post·appeal merits work of$580.00; and (5) fees related to defendant's 

petition for certiorari to the United States Supreme Court in the amount of $3,012.50. In support of the 

supplemental foe petition, plaintiffs have incorporated their submissions from the original fee petition, 

and submitted supplemental declarations from John Scott and Thomas Greerty, Arnitai Schwartz., and 

Moira Duvemay. Mr. Scott and Mr. Greerty were trial counsel and the primary lawyers on the merits 

appeal until the Ninth Cir-cuit issued its first decision reversing the judgment. Mr. Schwartz initially 

represented the plaintiffs on the appeal of the fee award, and provided editing and consulting support 

on the first phase of the merits appeal. After the Ninth Circuit reversed the judgment in this case, Mr. 

Schwartz took the lead in drafting the petition for rehearing and on the subsequent merits appeal work. 

Ms. Duvernay is an associate at Mr. Schwartz's office and she worked on both the appeal and the 

supplemental fee petition. The lawyers' declarations describe their professional experience and their 

work on this case, and they have submitted summaries of the time they spent on this case, as well as a 

listing of expenses incurred. In support of the hourly rates sought, plaintiffs have also submitted the 
declaration of Steven Mayer, a director of the finn of Howard, Rfoe, Nemerovski, Canady, Falk & 

Rabin, evidence regarding hourly rates charged by Bay Area lawyers, and recent court decisions 

26 awarding Bay Area lawyers fees. 

27 Under 42 U.S.C. § I 988(b), the Court has discretion to award plaintiffs their reasonable 

28 , attorneys' fees and expenses. Reasonable attorneys' fees are determined by the "lodestar method," 

4 
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1 which is obtained by multiplying the number of hours reasonably expended on litigation by a reasonable 

2 hourly rate. Hensley v. Eckerhart, 461 U.S. 424 ( 19$3). In determining the appropriate number of hours 

3 to be included in a lodestar calculation, the Court should exclude hours "that are excessive> redundant. 

4 or otherwise unnecessary." Id. at 434. ''The party seeking the award should provide documentary 

5 evidence to the court concerning the number of hours spent, and how it detennined the hourly rate(s) 

6 requested.', McCown v. CIJy of Fontana, 565 F .3d 1097, I I 02 (9th Cir. 2009). 

1 

8 I. Level of success/consideration of settlement negotiations 

9 In opposition to the supplemental fee petition, defendant argues that the previous fee award 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

should be reduced because plaintiffs' level of success at trial "never came close to exceeding any of their 

pretrial demands or the settlement negotiations." Docket No. 181 at 4:6-7. Defendant relies on the 

declaration of Tom Blake, who represented defendant throughout the pretrial proceedings and at trial. 

Mr. Blake describes the parties' negotiations and settlement demands made by plaintiffs, and states that 

the parties discussed settlement in the range of$100,000 to $300,000, and that Mr. Scott "indicated an 

interest" in a settlement of $75,000 per plaintiff and $100,000 in attorneys' fees. Blake Dec1.1'iJ 5-6. 

It is ~ndisputed that defendant never made plaintiffs a settlement offer. However, defendant argues that 

plaintiffs never agreed to a «potential settlement" that was more than double the amount that each 

plaintiff received at trial, and th.us their lodestar should be reduced to reflect their limited monetary 

19 success. 

20 Plaintiffs respond that the Court should exercise its discretion and give no weight to amounts 

21 discussed in the settlement negotiations for two reasons. First, plaintiffs argue that this Court has 

22 already detennined that plaintiffs achieved significant nonmonetary success vindicating their 

23 constitutional rights and serving the public purpose of deterring the unlawful use of deadly force, and 

24 they cite numerous cases for the proposition that the lodestar should not be reduced when civil rights 

25 plaintiffs achieve modest monetary success but significant nonmonetary success. Second, plaintiffs 

26 argue that the Couit should not reduce the lodestar on account of the patties' settlement negotiations 

27 because defendant never made a settlement offer. Plaintiffs note that the Ninth Circuit's instructions 

28 on remand were explicit: "We reverse and remand the fee award so that the district court may consider 

5 
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I the amounts ofMarkgrafs settlement offers in detennining a reasonable fee." A.D., 712 F.3d at 460 

2 ( emphasis added). Plaintiffs argue that defendant cannot now claim that this case could have settled for 

3 an amount that he never offered, and they argue that the cases cited in the Ninth Circuit's decision and 

4 relied on by defendant are all distinguishable booause they involved plaintiffs who rejected settlement 

5 offers. See Lohman v. Duryea .Borough, 574 F.3d 163, 169 (3d Cir. 2009) (plaintiff rejected three 

6 settlement offers, one of which was six times the amount ultimately awarded by the jury); see also In 

7 re Kekauoha-Alisa, 674 F .3d at 1094 ( .. Therefore, the bankruptcy court may consider evidence of a 

8 settlement offer to the degree such evidence is relevant to the calculation of reasonable attorneys' fees 

9 under Hawaii law."); Ingram, 647 F.3d at 927 (plaintiff rejected $30,000 settlement offer, leading to 

10 further litigation, and ultimately settled for $30,000) . 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 1 

16 1 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

The Court exercises its discretion and concludes that amounts discussed in the parties' settlement . 

negotiations do not bear on an evaluation of plaintiffs' success in this case. See Lohman, 514 F.3d at 

169 (acknowledging that settlement offers are "clearly only one factor to be considered in the award of 

fees," and that the district court "is also free to reject such evidence as not bearing on success"). As the 

Court found in its original fee order, plaintiffs :futly prevailed on their constitutional claims at trial and • 

the verdict serves the important public purpose of deterrence. "Success is measured not only by the 

amount of the r~overy but also in tenns of the significance of the legal issue on which the plaintiff 

prevailed and the public purpose the litigation served." MJJra/es v. City of San Rafael, 96 F.3d 357,365 

(9th Cir. 1996). The Ninth Circuit has expressed "difficulty imagining a more important issue than the 

legality of state-sanctioned force resulting in death. It is obviously of supreme importance to anyone 

who might be subject to such force. But it is also of great importance to a law enforcement officer who 

is placed in a situation where deadly force may be appropriate." Mahach-Watkins v. Depee, 593 F.3d 

I 054, l 062 (9th Cir.2010) (affirming attorneys' fee award in wrongful death case where the jury found 

in favor of the plaintiff but awarded only nominal damages). Because this case was about much more 

than money damages, the Court finds that the parties' settlement negotiations are not probative of 

26 evaluating plaintiffs' success at trial. 

27 Further, to the extent that the Court assesses success by looking at plaintiffs' monetary re<:overy, 

28 the parties' settlement negotiations are not helpful because defendant did not actually make a settlement 

6 
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1 offer, and thus defendant's assertion that this case could have settled for $75,000 per plaintiffis entirely 

2 speculative. 

3 Accordingly, the Court reaffirms the previous pre-appeal fee award in its entir~ty. Interest is 

4 awarded on the original award of merits fees and expenses from tvfay 8, 2009, the date of the judgment, 

5 and on the fees for the fee petition from November !Ot 2009, when the order awarding fees was filed. 

6 

7 II. 

8 

Merits Appeal 

Plaintiffs seek $288,080.00 for time spent on the merits appeal. Defendant objects to counsel's 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

requested hourly rates, and contends that some of the time spent was unnecessary and duplicative. 

A. Hourly rates 

A court awarding attorney fees must look to the prevailing mark.et rates in the relevant 

community. See Blum v. Stenson, 465 U.S. 886, 895 (1984); Bell v. Clackamas County, 341 F .3d 858; 

860 (9th Cir. 2003). Plaintiffs seek to be compensated at their 2013 hourly rates for the time spent on 

the merits appeal beginning in 2010. Plaintiffs seek $725 per hour for Mr. Greerty, Mr. Scott and Mr • 

Schwartz, and $425 per hour for Ms. Duvernay. In 2009, the Court awarded $600 per hour for each of 

the senior attorneys, and $300 per hour for Ms. Duvemay. 1 Mr. Greerty has 34 years experience 

practicing law, Mr. Scott has 37 years experience, Mr. Schwartz has over 40 years experience, and Ms. 

19 Duvemay has 9 years of experience. 

20 Defendani contends that it is unreasonable to award 2013 rates for work largely perfonned in 

21 201 O and 2011. However, the Supreme Court has held that an enhancement for delay in payment, where 

22 appropriate, is part of calculating a "reasonable" fee under Section 1988: 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

Clearly, compensation received several years after the services were rendered - as it 
frequent ly is in complex civil rights I itigation - is not equivalent to the same dollar 
amount received reasonably promptly as the legal services are performed, as would 
normally be the case with private billings. We agree, therefore, that an appropriate 
adjustment for delay in payment - whether by the application of current rather than 
historic hourly rates or otherwise - is within the contemplation of the statute. 

28 
1 By reaffirming the previous fee award, the Court awards fees for that portion of counsel's work 

at the 2009 rates. 

7 
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Missouri v. Jenkins, 491 U.S. 274, 283-84 (1989); see also Bell, 341 F.3d at 868 (citing Jenkins and 

2 holding that "[tJhe court may also award rates at an attorney's current rate where appropriate to 

3 compensate for the lengthy delay in receiving payment"). Here, the Court finds it appropriate to award 

4 2013 rates for the merits appeal work because of the substantial delay in payment. 

5 Defendant also contends that the 2013 rates sought are unreasonable because those rates are 

6 twenty and forty percent above the 2009 rates. Defendant cites the Laffey Matrix, the formulaic 

7 attorneys' fees schedule used in the District of Columbia, to argue that "reasonable rate increases do not 

8 exceed ten to fifteen percent over a period offouryears.n Docket No. 181 at 9:10-12. However, the 

9 Ninth Circuit has questioned the relevance of the Laffey Matrix to determining a reasonable rate in the 

lO Bay Area. See Prison Legal News v. Schwarzenegger, 608 F.3d 446. 454 (9th Cir. 2010) ("But just 

11 because the Laffey matrix has been accepted in the District of Columbia does not mean that it is a sound 

12 basis for determining rates elsewhere, let alone in a legal market 3,000 miles away. It is questionable 

13 whether the matrix. is a reliable measure ofrates even in Alexandria, Virginia,just across the river from 

14 the nation's capital."). 

15 In any event, the question is not whether the percentage increase from 2009 to 2013 is too great, 

16 but rather whether the 2013 rates sought are reasonable and within the prevailing market rates. Plaintiffs 

17 have shown that those rates are reasonable for attorneys with similar or less experience than plaintiffs' 

18 counsel. See Supp. Mayer Deel. 91,r 2-6 (1974 law school graduate practicing at Arnold & Porter, LLP 

19 in San Francisco charges $910 per hour; current hourly rates for attorneys who graduated between 1972 

20 and 1978 range between $800-$875; standard rate for 2004 graduate is $625 per hour); Supp. Req. for 

21 Judicfal Notice, Ex. 4 (exhibit to declaration filed in Apple Inc. v. Samsung Elec. Co., Case No. l l-cv-

22 01846-LHK (PSG), showing that "average partner raten at Quinn Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP 

23 is $821 per hour and "average associate rate" is $448 per hour). The requested rates are also in line with 

24 those awarded in recent fee awards, and indeed some of those fee awards show that the rates sought are 

25 comparable to market rates approved for work perfonned in 2010 and 2011, and earlier. See Recouvreur 

26 v. Carreon, 940 F. Supp. 2d l 063, 1070 (N.D. Cal.2013) (approving $700 hourly rate for public interest 

27 lawyer with 20 years of experience);Armstrong v. Bmwn, 805 F. Supp. 2d 918, 921 (N.D. Cat 2011) 

28 (approving 2010 rat.es of $700 per hour for 1978 and 1980 law graduates and between $325-$480 for 

8 
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1 attorneys graduating between 2003-2008); Campbell v. Nat'/ Passenger R.R. Corp., 718 F. Supp. 2d 

2 l093, 1099-1100 (N.D. Cal. 2010) (finding reasonable $700 hourly rate for civil rights attorney 

3 practicing since 1982); see also Prison Legal News, 608 F.3d 455 (holding district court did not abuse 

4 its discretion in awarding 2008 hourly rates of $875 for a partner, $700 for an attorney with 23 years of 

5 experience, and $425 for a 2003 law graduate). 

6 

7 

8 

B. "Unnecessary or redundantn time 

Next, defendant challenges as unnecessary or redundant the following time spent on the merits 

9 appeal: (I) time spent by Scott, Greerty and Schwartz reviewing the excerpts of record; (2) time spent · 

10 by Schwartz and Greerty editing the original answering brief written by Scott; and (3) time spent by 

11 Scott and Greerty preparing for the original appellate argument and by Schwartz preparing for the 

12 supplemental oral argument. Defendant argues that some of this "redundant" time was expended as a 

13 result of the switcJi from Scott to Schwartz as the lead counsel handling the merits appeal ( such as the 

14 time spent reviewing the excerpts of record), and other time is simply excessive and unnecessary (such 

15 as the time spent editing and preparing for oral argument). 

16 "Participation of more than one attorney does not necessarily amount to unnecessary duplication 

17 of effort." Democratic Party of Washington State v. Reed, 388 F .3d 1281, 1286 (9th Cir. 2004). As the 

18 Ninth Circuit has instructed, 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

The court may reduce the number of hours awarded because the lawyer 
performed unnecessarily duplicative work, but determining whether work is 
unnecessarily duplicative is no easy task. When a case goes on for many years, a lot of 
legal work product will grow stale; a competent lawyer won'treJy entirely on last year's, 
or even last month's, research: Cases are decided; statutes are enacted; regulations are 
promulgated and amended. A lawyer also needs to get up to speed with the research 
_previously pe.rformed. All this is duplication, of course, but it's necessary duplication; 
1t is inherent in the process of litigating over time. Here, there was a previous appeal ( of 
the district court's grant of summary judgment) which would have added to the delay 
and rendered much of the research stale. One certainly expects some degree of 
duplication as an inherent part of the process. There is no reason why the lawyer should 
perform this necessary work for free. 

It must also be kept in mind that lawyers are not likely to spend unnecessary time 
on contingency fee cases in the hope of inflating their fees. The payoff is too uncertain, 
as to both the result and the amount of the fee. It would therefore be the highly atypical 
civil rights case where plaintiffs lawyer en~ages in churning. By and large, the court 
should defer to the winning lawyer's professional judgment as to bow much time he was 
required to spend on the case; a~r all, he won, and might not have, had he been more 

9 
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of a slacker. 

Moreno v. City of Sacramento, 534 F .3d 1106, 1112 (9th Cir. 2008). 

The issues in this case were difficult and complex. and Htigation of the appeal was especially 

oomplicated. The decision to change lead counsel after the initial loss on appeal was a strategic choice 

that brought a fresh perspective to the issues raised on rehearing and in the supplemental briefing. After 

the Ninth Circuit's initial 3-0 decision reversing the judgment, plaintiffs faced the fonnidable task of 

persuading the Ninth Circuit to reconsider its decision. That plaintiffs were successfu) in doing so, 

resulting in a 3-0 published decision affinning the judgment, validates plaintiffs' coWlsel's decisions 

about how to staff and litigate the appeal. The Court also notes that Schwartz and Duvernay do not seek 

to be compensated for all ofthe time they spent on the merits appeal. See Second Supp. Schwarz Deel. 

11[17-18. Defendant has not shown that any of the work perfonned was unnecessary. and considering 

the complexity of this case it is reasonable that plaintiffs' counsel would need to ensure that they were 

familiar with the district court record, review and edit pleadings prepared by others, and prepare 

assiduously for important oral arguments. The Court is satisfied that the fees requested are reasonable 

and justified by the results obtained, and finds it inappropriate and unnecessary to speculate about 

whether different staffing decisions would have led to the same results at a lower cost. 

Accordingly. the Court grants plaintiffs' request for fees for the merits appeal, and interest is 

18 awarded on the merits appeal fees from May 24, 2013, the date the mandate of the Court of Appeals was 

19 tiled in this Court Docket No. 169. 

20 

21 III. Supplemental fee petition 

22 Plaintiffs seek $57,428.90 in fees and expenses incurred in litigating the supplemental fee 

23 petition. Defendant generally objects that the amount of time spent on the supplemental fee petition 

24 "appears distorted" because counsel spent at as much time on the supplemental fee petition as Scott and 

25 Greerty spent on the merits appeal. Defendant does not identify any specific time that he contends was 

26 unnecessary or unreasonable. 

27 As an initial matter, the Court notes that the vast majority of the time spent on the supplemental 

28 fee petition was performed by Ms. Duvernay, the attorney with the lowest howly rate. The Court also 

10 
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1 finds that simply comparing the time spent on the foe motion and time spent on one part of the merits 

2 appeal does not establish that the time spent on the supplemental fee motion was excessive. See Golden 

3 Gate Audubon Soc., Inc. v. U.S. Army Corps of Engineers, 732 F. Supp. 1014, 1022 (N.D. Cal. 1989) 

4 (rejecting as unpersuasive "summary opposition" that fees on fees were excessive based solely on 

5 comparison to merits tune because "[r ]igid comparisons with the amount of fees for the merits shed little 

6 light" on determining•"wh~ is a reasonable number of hours in light of the issues and tasks involved.''). 

7 The Court finds that the time spent litigating the supplemental fee petition was reasonable because 

8 plaintiff's have the burden of supporting the rates sought and time spent, and they were required to 

9 review pertinent legal authority, obtain declarations, gather and present time records, research current 

l O hourly rates for Bay Area attorneys, and prepare the motion papers. The Court finds it noteworthy that 
~ ·e 11 defendant did not identify any particular time spent as excessive or unnecessary, instead relying on a 

t: J:? 
g 8 12 blanket objection. Further, due t.o defendant's tenacious litigation of the fee issue, plaintiffs' counsel 
c; c... J ~ 13 was required "to expend significantly more time on fee issue.s than would have otherwise been 

i5 :i 14 required." id. 
1A 
~ e 1s 
.... Q) j ~ 16 IV. Other fees and expenses 
.... z ! ,s 17 Plaintiffs seek post-appeal merits work of$580.00, and fees related to defendant's petition for 

~ 18 certiorari to the United States Supreme Court in the amount of $3,012.50. Defendant does not object 

19 to these amounts. and the Court finds that these fees are reasonable and recoverable. 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 Ill 

28 /// 

1 1 
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CONCLUSION 

For the foregoing reasons, the Court GRANTS plafotiffs' motion for attorneys' fees and 

3 expenses as follows: (1) the original fee award pre-appeal of $559,861.45 (merits fees of $489 ,631.-00; 

4 merits expenses of $6,402.59; fees for original fee petition of $63,490.00; and f ecs expenses of 

5 $337.86); {2) merits appeal fees in the amount of $288,080.00; (3) fees and expenses for the 

6 supplemental fee petition in the amount of $51 A28. 90; (4) post-appeal merits work of $580.00; and (5) 

7 fees related to defendant's petition for certiorari to the United States Supreme Court in the amount of 

8 $3,012.50. 

9 

10 IT IS SO ORDERED. 

11 

12 Dated: November 27, 2013 
SUSAN ILLSTON 

13 United States District Judge 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

12 
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1 Allen Lichtenstein (NV State Bar No. 3992) 
ALLEN LICHTENSTEIN, LTD. 

2 3315 Russell Road, No. 222 
Las Vegas, NV 89120 

3 Tel: 702.433-2666 
Fax: 702.433-9591 

4 allaw@lvcoxmail.com 

5 John Houston Scott (CA Bar No. 72578) 
Admitted Pro Hae Vice 

6 SCOTT LAW FIRM 
1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715 

7 San Francisco, CA 94109 
Tel: 415.561-9601 

8 john@scottlawfirm.net 

9 Attorneys for Plaintiffs, Mary Bryan, Ethan Bryan, 
Aimee Hairr and Nolan Hairr 

10 

11 

12 

DISTRICT COURT 

CLARK COUNTY, NEV ADA 

13 MARY BRYAN, mother of ETHAN BRYAN; Case No. A-14-700018-C 

14 

15 

16 

AIMEE HAIRR, mother of NOLAN HAIRR, 

Plaintiffs, 

vs. 

Dept. No. XXVII 

DECLARATION OF ALLEN 
LICHTENSTEIN 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
17 (CCSD 

Department: XXVII 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

Defendant. 
Trial Dates: Day I, 11/15/16; Day 2, 
ll/16/16;Day3, 11/17/16; Day 4, 11/18/16; 
Dav 5, 11/22/16 

Allen Lichtenstein, declares under perjury pursuant to the laws of Nevada as follows: 

1. 

2. 

I am an attorney licensed to practice law in the State of Nevada. 

I have personal knowledge of the matters set forth herein, except for those matters 

24 known on information and belief, and for those matters, I believe them to be true. 

25 3. I am competent to testify to the same; and, I make this Declaration in support of the 

26 foregoing Motion for Attorney Fees and Cost of which this Declaration is made a part. 

27 

28 
4. I worked with co-counsel in the preparation of the foregoing Motion 

I 
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1 for Attorney Fees and Costs; and all the facts set forth therein are true and correct to the best of 

2 my knowledge, information and belie£ 

3 

4 

5 

6 

5. I have been practicing law for 27 years. I was admitted to practice in Nevada in 

1990, and my Bar Number is 3992. I am also licensed to practice law in California. 

6. After being admitted to practice. I have maintained a practice of law with an 

7 
emphasis on constitutional law and civil rights matters. 

8 

9 

7. 

8. 

I was also General Counsel for the ACLU of Nevada for 17 years, starting in 1997. 

I have practiced in federal and state courts in Nevada and California, including: 

10 Federal District Courts, Nevada State District Courts, Justice Courts and Municipal Courts. 

11 

12 

13 

14 

9. I have also argued before the Nevada Supreme Court, the Ninth Circuit Court of 

Appeals, and the United State Supreme Court. 

10. I was retained by Plaintiffs since the onset of this case: first as General Counsel for 

15 
the ACLU of Nevada, then as a private attorney 

16 11. From the beginning of the case until July 31, 2014, while the ACLUN was 

17 representing Plaintiffs, I was in charge of the case in my capacity as General Counsel. 

18 12. For the time the ACLUN was representing Plaintiffs the attorney hours and rates 

19 
were as follows: (See Attachment 3) 

20 
rate per hr. hrs expended total 

21 

22 
Fees for the ACLUN var 70.45 $19,356.25 

23 Lichtenstein $600 9.6 $5,670.00 

24 Pratt $450 8.6 $3,870.00 

25 Morgan $225 31.95 $7,188.75 

26 Interns $125 20.3 $2,537.50 

27 

28 

-2-
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1 13. After July 31, 2014, I represented Plaintiffs as a private attorney. I worked 690.77 

2 hours as a private attorney on the case at a rate of $600 per hour, totaling $414,460.00. From July 

3 31, 2014, Staci Pratt worked 20.8 hours on the case at a rate of $450 per hour, totaling 

4 

5 

6 

$10,980.00. 

14. Ms. Pratt left the case and changed her Nevada Bar membership to inactive status 

7 
in early December 2014. 

8 15. Attached hereto as Attachment l is a true and correct copy of the billing on this 

9 case by Allen Lichtenstein, as a private attorney from July 31, 2014 to present. Attachment 2 is a 

10 true and correct of copy of the billing by Staci Pratt for work done as a private attorney on this 

11 case from. Attachment 3 is a true and correct copy of the billing for this case by the ACLUN. 

12 

13 

14 

15 

Attachment 4 states the adjusted cost along with supporting documentation. 

16. 

17. 

On July 7, 2015, John H. Scott entered the case as co-counsel, pro hac vice. 

From the time Mr. Scott entered the case, I was the primary person involved with 

t 6 motion work, briefing and legal analysis. Mr. Scott, however, was also involved in briefing, 

17 particularly with Opposition to Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment. We both were 

l 8 involved with discovery and trial preparation. 

19 

20 
18. At trial, Mr. Scott did all of the wimess examination. I took the role of second 

chair. I was primarily responsible for the closing statement briefs. 
21 

22 
19. The services rendered as reflected on Exhibit 2 were reasonable and necessary to 

23 provide legal representation for Plaintiffs. 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

20. The total fees and costs accrued in this case are as follows: 

Fees for John H. Scott: 

Fees for Allen Lichtenstein: 
(as a private attorney) 

rate per hr. hrs expended total 

$650 

S600 

-3-

383.50 

690.77 

$249,275.00 

$414,460.00 
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l 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

Staci Pratt 
(as a private attorney) 

Fees for the ACLUN 

Total fees 

Costs: 

Total 

Lichtenstein 

Pratt 

Morgan 

Interns 

$450 

var 

$600 

$450 

$225 

$125 

20.80 $ 10)980.00 

70.45 $ 19)356.25 

9.6 $5,670.00 

8.6 $3,870.00 

31.95 $7,188.75 

20.3 $2)537.50 

$694. 071.25 

$22,619.81 

$716,691.06 

10 

11 

12 

13 I affirm that the foregoing is true and correct, and this Declaration is executed under 

14 penalty of perjury this 9th day of August, 2017 in Las Vegas, Nevada. 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 
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EXHIBIT 2 

ATTACHMENT 1 

ALLEN LICHTENSTEIN HOURS AS A PRIVATE 

ATTORNEY 
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4:11 PM Slip Listing Page 1 

Selection Criterla 

Slip.Date 7/31/2014 - Latest 
Slip. Classification Open 
Clie. Selection Include: Bryan and Halrr 

Rate Info - identifies rate source and level 

Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
Descri2tion Reference Variance 

2798 TIME Allen 0.60 600.00 360.00 
7/31/2014 document draft 0.00 T 

WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Substitution of Plaintiffs' Attorneys 0.00 

2799 TIME Allen 0.10 600.00 60.00 
8/1/2014 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Stipulation to Continue hearing 0.00 

2280 TIME Allen 1.30 600.00 780.00 
8/9/2014 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Reply to Plaintiffs' 0.00 
Response to Defendants' Motion to Dismiss 
Plaintiffs' Complaint 

2281 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
8/12/2014 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with NERC attorney 0.00 

2282 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
8/15/2014 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review of Alicia Lerod email 0.00 

2283 TIME Allen 5.90 600.00 3540.00 
8/20/2014 Court Preparation 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for oral argument 0.00 

2284 TIME Allen 3.10 600.00 1860.00 
8/21/2014 hearing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Hearing on motion to dismiss 0.00 

2285 TIME Allen 1.10 600.00 660.00 
8/23/2014 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review transcript of hearing on Motion to Dismiss 0.00 
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Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
DescriQtion Reference Variance 

2286 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
8/25/2014 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Reviewed letter from Lerod 0.00 

2800 TIME Allen 0.90 600.00 540.00 
9/4/2014 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review proposed order 0.00 

2801 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
9/10/2014 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Court Order on Motion to Dismiss 0.00 

2802 TIME Allen 4.30 600.00 2580.00 
10/10/2014 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft Amended Complaint 0.00 

2803 TIME Allen 6.10 600.00 3660.00 
10/15/2014 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft and file Plaintiffs' First Amended Complaint 0.00 
and Exhibits 

2804 TIME Allen 0.70 600.00 420.00 
11/17/2014 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft and file Errata 0.00 

2805 TIME Allen 1.20 600.00 720.00 
11/18/2014 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Motion to Dismiss Plaintiffs' 0.00 
First Amended Complaint 

2806 TIME Allen 0.10 600.00 60.00 
11/20/2014 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Notice of Hearing 0.00 

2807 TIME Allen 0.10 600.00 60.00 
12/9/2014 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Stipulation and Order to Continue Hearing 0.00 

2377 TIME Allen 7.30 600.00 4380.00 
12/24/2014 12/31/2014 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Researched EDCR 2.24(b) and law of the case 0.00 
and use of case citations; draft brief 
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Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
DescriQtion Reference Variance 

2808 TIME Allen 6.70 600.00 4020.00 
12/25/2014 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research qualified and discretionary immunity; 0.00 
draft brief 

2809 TIME Allen 7.90 600.00 4740.00 
12/26/2014 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research Monell and punitive damages; draft 0.00 
brief 

2810 TIME Allen 8.40 600.00 5040.00 
12/27/2014 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research Title IX, negligence, deliberate 0.00 
indifference; draft brief 

2812 TIME Allen 7.70 600.00 4620.00 
12/29/2014 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft brief 0.00 

2813 TIME Allen 9.20 600.00 5520.00 
12/30/2014 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft and edit brief 0.00 

2814 TIME Allen 10.20 600.00 6120.00 
12/31/2014 editing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Finalized and filed Plaintiffs' Response to 0.00 
Defendants' Motion to Dismiss Plaintiffs' First 
Amended Complaint 

2815 TIME Allen 1.40 600.00 840.00 
1/15/2015 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Reply to Plaintiffs' Motion to 0.00 
Dismiss Plaintiffs' Amended Complaint 

2816 TIME Allen 0.10 600.00 60.00 
1/27/2015 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Stipulation to Continue Hearing 0.00 

2817 TIME Allen 2.30 600.00 1380.00 
1/28/2015 Court Preparation 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for Hearing 0.00 
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Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
DescriQtion Reference Variance 

2818 TIME Allen 1.70 600.00 1020.00 
1/29/2015 hearing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Hearing on Defendants' Motion to Dismiss 0.00 
Amended Complaint 

2819 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
2/10/2015 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Court's Order on Defendants' Motion to 0.00 
Dismiss 

2820 TIME Allen 0.90 600.00 540.00 
2/25/2015 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Answer 0.00 

2385 TIME Allen 1.20 600.00 720.00 
3/16/2015 meeting 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Meeting with clients 0.00 

2384 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
3/16/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: 0.00 
possible association 

2387 TIME Allen 1.20 600.00 720.00 
3/19/2015 legal services 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
16.1 conference 0.00 

2947 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
4/9/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: 0.00 
potential fee agreement 

2951 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
4/15/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email to John Scott Re: fee agreement 0.00 

2821 TIME Allen 1.20 600.00 720.00 
4/20/2015 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft Request for Exemption from Arbitration 0.00 

2948 TIME Allen 0.80 600.00 480.00 
4/20/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
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Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
DescriQtion Reference Variance 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re; 0.00 
background and history of case 

2822 TIME Allen 0.10 600.00 60.00 
5/21/2015 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Commissioner's Decision on Request for 0.00 
Exemption from Arbitration 

2949 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
5/27/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2823 TIME Allen 0.80 600.00 480.00 
6/4/2015 document draft 0.00 T 

WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft and file Motion on Plaintiffs' Request to 0.00 
Associate Counsel 

2950 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
6/18/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: initial 0.00 
disclosures 

2444 TIME Allen 8.10 600.00 4860.00 
6/18/2015 legal services 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Initial Disclosures 0,00 

2952 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
7/14/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email from John Scott Re: scheduling of 0.00 
depositions 

2953 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
7/20/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email from John Scott Re: scheduling of 0.00 
depositions 

2824 TIME Aflen 2.10 600.00 1260.00 
7/21/2015 Court Preparation 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for Early Case Conference 0.00 
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Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
DescriQtion Reference Variance 

2825 TIME Allen 0.90 600.00 540.00 
7/22/2015 hearing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Early Case Conference 0.00 

2826 TIME Allen 1.00 600.00 600.00 
7/27/2015 Court Preparation 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Joint Case Conference Report 0.00 

2954 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 
8/13/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2955 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
8/17/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2827 TIME Allen 1.20 600.00 720.00 
8/31/2015 Court Preparation 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Scheduling Order 0.00 

2828 TIME Allen 0.10 600.00 60.00 
9/25/2015 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Order setting bench trial and calendar call 0.00 

2956 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
9/28/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email Re: deposition schedule 0.00 

2957 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
10/1/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email Re: deposition schedule 0.00 

2958 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
10/2/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email Re: deposition schedule 0.00 

2959 TIME Allen 0.80 600.00 480.00 
10/14/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: 0.00 
discovery and depositions 
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Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity ON8Time Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
DescriQtion Reference Variance 

2960 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
10/16/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2961 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
10/20/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: 0.00 
statutes and regulations 

2937 TIME Allen 2.50 600.00 1500.00 
10/22/2015 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Discovery Requests 0.00 

2962 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 
10/23/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: 0.00 
school district and parallel litigation 

2963 TIME Allen 1.50 600.00 900.00 
10/25/2015 Court Preparation 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Obtain information and timelines from clients 0.00 

2964 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
10/28/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email Re: confirm depositions 0.00 

2965 TIME Allen 0.80 600.00 480.00 
10/29/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email to John Scott; telephone conference with 0.00 
John Scott 

2559 TIME Allen 4.50 600.00 2700.00 
10/29/2015 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for Winn and McKay depositions 0.00 

2966 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
10/30/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails with John Scott 0.00 

2563 TIME Allen 6.05 600.00 3630.00 
11/1/2015 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for deposition; telephone conference 0.00 
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Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
Descri2tion Reference Variance 
with clients; meeting with John Scott 

2564 TIME Allen 10.50 600.00 6300.00 
11/2/2015 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for McKay deposition; McKay 0.00 
deposition; confer with John Scott 

2566 TIME Allen 7.90 600.00 4740.00 
11/3/2015 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Winn Deposition; confer with John Scott 0.00 

2829 TIME Allen 5.20 600.00 3120.00 
11/4/2015 Court Preparation 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Prepared Aimee Hairr Discovery Response 0.00 

2967 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 

11/4/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2968 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 
11/5/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails Re: settlement potential and strategy 0.00 

2969 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 

11/6/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2970 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
11/9/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: 0.00 
discovery responses 

2971 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 

11/10/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2832 TIME Allen 4.20 600.00 2520.00 
11/11/2015 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Prepared Mary Bryan written discovery response 0.00 

2972 TIME Allen 2.50 600.00 1500.00 
11/11/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
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Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
Descri12tion Reference Variance 
Multiple emails and telephone conference with 0.00 
John Scott Re: discovery responses 

2938 TIME Allen 1.20 600.00 720.00 
11/12/2015 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft Plaintiffs' Request for Documents 0.00 

2973 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
11/12/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference and email with John Scott 0.00 
Re: scheduling depositions and strategy 

2974 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
11/13/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference and email with John Scott 
Re: protective order Re: medical records 

0.00 

2830 TIME Allen 2.10 600.00 1260.00 
11/15/2015 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for Wright deposition 0.00 

2975 TIME Allen 0.80 600.00 480.00 
11/15/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email from John Scott 0.00 

2976 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
11/16/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2831 TIME Allen 1.20 600.00 720.00 
11/16/2015 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Deanna Wright deposition 0.00 

2977 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
11/19/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email from John Scott Re: Ethan's and Nolan's 0.00 
depositions 

2978 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
11/24/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 
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Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
DescriQtion Reference Variance 

2979 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
12/1/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2980 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
12/2/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email and telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 
Re: Scheduling depositions 

2981 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
12/4/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2982 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
12/9/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails with John Scott Re: discovery issues 0.00 

2983 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
12/11/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2833 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
12/14/2015 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Stipulated Protective Order 0.00 

2984 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
12/15/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails from John Scott Re: depositions of 0.00 
treating doctors and plaintiffs 

2985 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
12/20/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2834 TIME Allen 4.70 600.00 2820.00 
12/21/2015 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for Nolan Hairr deposition 0.00 

2835 TIME Allen 7.82 600.00 4690.00 
12/22/2015 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Nolan Hairr deposition 0.00 
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Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
Descri~tion Reference Variance 

2986 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
12/22/2015 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2987 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
12/24/2015 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email and telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 
Re: damage calculation dispute 

2836 TIME Allen 0.90 600.00 540.00 
1/4/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for CL deposition 0.00 

2988 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
1/4/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2839 TIME Allen 2.30 600.00 1380.00 
1/5/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
CL deposition 0.00 

2838 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
1/5/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2837 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
1/5/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Stipulation and Order to permit Defendants to 0.00 
extend time for Defendants to make initial expert 
disclosures; Review Defendants' Motion to 
Compel Rule 35 Exam 

2989 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
1/6/2016 Consultation 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Consult with John Scott Re: discovery dispute 0.00 
Re: medical records 

2840 TIME Allen 2,90 600.00 1740.00 
1/7/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for Aimee Hairr deposition 0.00 



001790

001790

00
17
90

001790

8/8/2017 Allen Lichtenstein 
4:11 PM Slip Listing Page 12 

Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
DescriQtion Reference Variance 

2990 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
1/8/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: 0.00 
discovery matters 

2841 TIME Allen 6.70 600.00 4020.00 
1/8/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Aimee Hairr deposition 0.00 

2991 TIME Allen 0.60 600.00 360.00 
1/11/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Multiple emails with John Scott Re: depositions, 0.00 
discovery issues, and motion to compel 

2599 TIME Allen 1.10 600.00 660.00 
1/11/2016 meeting 0.00 T 

WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Meeting with Mary Bryan Re: written discovery 0.00 

2598 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
1/11/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Reviewed Motion to Compel damages 0.00 
categories and calculations from Plaintiff Aimee 
Hairr 

2939 TIME Allen 2.10 600.00 1260.00 
1/11/2016 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft Bryan Amended Responses 0.00 

2842 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
1/12/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for DM deposition 0.00 

2992 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
1/13/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails from John Scott Re: motion to compel 0.00 
damage calculation 

2600 TIME Allen 2.00 600.00 1200.00 
1/13/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
DM deposition 0.00 
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Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
Descri2tron Reference Variance 

2622 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
1/14/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with therapist Gina 0.00 
Abbeduto. 

2993 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
1/14/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails and telephone conference with John 0.00 
Scott Re: discovery issues 

2843 TIME Allen 4.50 600.00 2700.00 
1/18/2016 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research Rule 35 examination issue 0.00 

2994 TIME Allen 0.60 600.00 360.00 
1/19/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails and telephone conference with John 0.00 
Scott Re: discovery issues and upcoming 
depositions 

2844 TIME Allen 3.40 600.00 2040.00 
1/19/2016 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft Plaintiffs' Response to Defendants' Motion 0.00 
to Compel Rule 35 Exam 

2845 TIME Allen 4.50 600.00 2700.00 
1/20/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for Ethan Bryan deposition 0.00 

2995 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
1/21/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails Re: scheduling of depositons 0.00 

2847 TIME Allen 0.10 600.00 60.00 
1/21/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Order Shortening Time Re: Defendants' Motion 0.00 
to Compel Rule 35 

2846 TIME Allen 7.60 600.00 4560.00 
1/21/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Ethan Bryan deposition 0.00 
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2996 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 
1/22/2016 phone 0.00 T 

WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference and emails with John 0.00 
Scott Re: upcoming depositions 

2848 TIME Allen 0.10 600.00 60.00 
1/22/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Stipulation to extend date for hearing on Rule 35 0.00 
Motion 

2997 TIME Allen 3.50 600.00 2100.00 
1/24/2016 meeting 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Meeting with John Scott and clients; preparation 0.00 
for depositions 

2998 TIME Allen 1.80 600.00 1080.00 
1/25/2016 meeting 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Meeting with John Scott 0.00 

2849 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
1/27/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Repyl Re: Motion to Compel 0.00 
Rule 35 examinations 

2850 TIME Allen 5.40 600.00 3240.00 
1/28/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for deposition; Andre Long 0.00 
deposition; meeting with John Scott 

2999 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
1/29/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2940 TIME Allen 1.00 600.00 600.00 
1/30/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' 1st supplement to NRCP 0.00 
16.1 (A)( 1) Disclosures 

2851 TIME Allen 6.70 600.00 4020.00 
1/31/2016 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research and draft Plaintiffs' Opposition to 0.00 
Motion to Compel 1/11/16 Motion to Compel 
Damages Categories and Calculations from 
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Plaintiff Aimee Hairr 

3000 TIME Allen 0.60 600.00 360.00 
2/1/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails and telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3001 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 
2/2/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails and telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2852 TIME Allen 3.90 600.00 2340.00 
2/3/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for Mary Bryan deposition; telephone 0.00 
conference with John Scott 

2853 TIME Allen 0.90 600.00 540.00 
2/4/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Deposition of Dr. Moore 0.00 

2854 TIME Allen 6.30 600.00 3780.00 
2/5/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Deposition of Mary Bryan 0.00 

2856 TIME Allen 0.80 600.00 480.00 
2/8/2016 Court Preparation 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for Rule 38 Hearing 0.00 

2857 TIME Allen 1.00 600.00 600.00 
2/10/2016 hearing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Hearing denying Defendants' Motion to compel 0.00 
Rule 35 Examination 

2855 TIME Allen 2.30 600.00 1380.00 
2/10/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Reply Re; Motion to Compel 0.00 
Categories and Calculations 

2858 TIME Allen 0.10 600.00 60.00 
2/11/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Order setting Civil Jury Trial, Pretrial and 0.00 
Calendar Call 
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2859 TIME Allen 0.70 600.00 420.00 
2/12/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Motion to Compel Damages Categories 0.00 
and Calculations from Plaintiff Mary Bryan on 
Shortening Time; telephone conference with 
John Scott 

2941 TIME Allen 0.80 600.00 480.00 
2/13/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' 2nd 16.1 Supplement 0.00 

2860 TIME Allen 1.20 600.00 720.00 
2/15/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for Heath Hairr and Gina Abbeduto 0.00 
depositions 

2861 TIME Allen 4.80 600.00 2880.00 
2/16/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Depositions of Heath Hairr and Gina Abbeduto 0.00 

2862 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
2/16/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2863 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
2/17/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2864 TIME Allen 2.50 600.00 1500.00 
2/17/2016 hearing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for hearing; Hearing with Discovery 0.00 
Commissioner Re: Defendants' Motions to 
Compel Damages Categories and Calculations 

2865 TIME Allen 1.40 600.00 840.00 
2/19/2016 Deposition 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Depositions of Dr. Edmund Faro and Dr. 0.00 
Asheesh Dewann 

2866 TIME Allen 0.70 600.00 420.00 
2/22/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: 0.00 
demand letter 
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3002 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
2/24/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3003 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 
2/25/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: 0.00 
demand letter 

2942 TIME Allen 1.30 600.00 780.00 
2/26/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' 3rd 16.1 Supplement; 0.00 
telephone conference with John Scott 

2867 TIME Allen 3.90 600.00 2340.00 
3/2/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Motion for Summary 0.00 
Judgment; telephone conference with John Scott 

2868 TIME Allen 1.70 600.00 1020.00 
3/7/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review "facts" in dispute Re: depositions for 0.00 
Defendants' Summary Judgment motion 

3004 TIME Allen 0.60 600.00 360.00 
3/8/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails and telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3005 TIME Allen 0.80 600.00 480.00 
3/9/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails and telephone conference with John 0.00 
Scott Re: factual disputes 

3006 TIME Allen 1.00 600.00 600.00 
3/10/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails and telephone conference with John 0.00 
Scott Re: Motion for Summary Judgment 

3007 TIME Allen 3.50 600.00 2100.00 
3/14/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails and telephone conference with John 0.00 
Scott Re: Motion for Summary Judgment, 
discovery and trial date 
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3008 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
3/15/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3009 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
3/16/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3010 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
3/18/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2869 TIME Allen 0.60 600.00 360.00 
3/21/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Order denying Defendants' Motion to 0.00 
Compel a Rule 35 Examination; telephone 
conference with John Scott 

2870 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
3/23/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Stipulation and Order to continue trial and 0.00 
Defendants' Summary Judgment Motion 

2871 TIME Allen 7.80 600.00 4680.00 
3/24/2016 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research Title IX and Title VII case Re: sexual 0.00 
discrimination perceived sexual orientation and 
gender stereotyping 

2872 TIME Allen 0.10 600.00 60.00 
3/25/2016 document review 0.00 T 

WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Order setting Civil Bench Trial 0.00 

2873 TIME Aflen 6.80 600.00 4080.00 
3/27/2016 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research loss of educational opportunity and 0.00 
draft Summary Judgment brief 

2874 TIME Allen 6.50 600.00 3900.00 
3/28/2016 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research failure to comply with statutory duties 0.00 
and draft brief; telephone conference with John 
Scott 
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2875 TIME Allen 6.50 600.00 3900.00 
3/29/2016 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Further research on discrimination on the basis 0.00 
of sex (Title IX} and deliberate indifference; 
telephone conference with John Scott 

2876 TIME Allen 8.40 600.00 5040.00 
3/30/2016 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft brief; emails and telephone conference 0.00 
with John Scott 

2877 TIME Allen 9.20 600.00 5520.00 
3/31/2016 editing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft, edit brief 0.00 

2878 TIME Allen 9.30 600.00 5580.00 
4/1/2016 editing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Finalized and filed Plaintiffs' Opposition to 0.00 
Defendants' Summary Judgment Motion; emails 
and telephone conference with John Scott 

3011 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
4/2/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails from John Scott 0.00 

3012 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
4/11/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3013 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
4/13/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2879 TIME Allen 2.60 600.00 1560.00 
4/19/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Reply Re: Defendants' 0.00 
Summary Judgment Motion; telephone 
conference with John Scott 

2881 TIME Allen 1.70 600.00 1020.00 
4/20/2016 Court Preparation 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for Hearing on Defendants' Motion 0.00 
for Summary Judgment 
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2880 TIME Allen 0.10 600.00 60.00 
4/20/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Discovery Commissioner's Report and 0.00 
Recommendation 

2882 TIME Allen 3.00 600.00 1800.00 
4/21/2016 hearing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Hearing on Defendants' Motion for Summary 0.00 
Judgment; telephone conference with John Scott 

2883 TIME Allen 0.70 600.00 420.00 
4/26/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review transcript on Defendants' Motion for 0.00 
Summary Judgment 

3014 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
4/28/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with and emails from 0.00 
John Scott 

3015 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
5/4/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails from John Scott 0.00 

3016 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
5/5/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails and telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3017 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 
5/6/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails from John Scott 0.00 

3018 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 
5/9/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails and telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3019 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
5/10/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails from John Scott 0.00 

2884 TIME Allen 1.30 600.00 780.00 
5/13/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
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Review Defendants' Proposed Order Re: 0.00 
Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment; 
emails and telephone conference with John Scott 

2886 TIME Allen 2.00 600.00 1200.00 
5/17/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Reply to Plaintiffs' Objection 0.00 

2885 TIME Allen 1.70 600.00 1020.00 
5/17/2016 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft Plaintiffs' Objection to Defendants' 0.00 
Proposed Order Re: Summary Judgment; 
telephone conference with John Scott 

3020 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
5/18/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2887 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
7/23/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Order Re: Defendants' Motion for Summary 0.00 
Judgment 

3021 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
7/25/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: order 0.00 

3022 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
7/26/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3023 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
8/5/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2888 TIME Allen 2.50 600.00 1500.00 
8/7/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Motion for Partial 0.00 
Reconsideration 

2889 TIME Allen 0.10 600.00 60.00 
8/11/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Defendant's Motion for Oral ARgument Re: 0.00 
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Defendants' Motion for Reconsideration 

3024 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
8/12/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: 0.00 
Motion for reconsideration 

2890 TIME Allen 4.70 600.00 2820.00 
8/15/2016 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research Rules for: Motions for 0.00 
Reconsideration, NRCP 59(e), NRCP 60(b), and 
Motions in Limine 

2891 TIME Allen 2.70 600.00 1620.00 
8/17/2016 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Further research on gender stereotyping and 0.00 
perceived sexual orientation discrimination 

2892 TIME Allen 1.50 600.00 900.00 
8/19/2016 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research on prejudice 0.00 

2893 TIME Allen 5.20 600.00 3120.00 
8/20/2016 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft Brief Re: Defendants' Motion for 0.00 
Reconsideration 

2894 TIME Allen 2.90 600.00 1740.00 
8/22/2016 editing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Finalized and filed Plaintiffs' Response to 0.00 
Defendants' Motion for Reconsideration 

3025 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
8/24/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2895 TIME Allen 4.20 600.00 2520.00 
8/30/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Reply Re: Motion for 0.00 
Reconsideration; preparation for hearing on 
motion 
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2896 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
8/30/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email from John Scott 0.00 

2897 TIME Allen 2.20 600.00 1320.00 
8/31/2016 hearing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Hearing denying Defendants' Motion for 0.00 
Reconsideration; telephone conference with 
John Scott 

2898 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
10/12/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Offer of Judgment with 0.00 
clients 

2899 TIME Allen 1.10 600.00 660.00 
10/14/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Pre-trial disclosures 0.00 

3026 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 
10/15/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails from John Scott Re: trial and trial 0.00 
preparation 

3027 TIME Allen 0.80 600.00 480.00 
10/16/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Multiple emails and telephone conference with 0.00 
John Scott 

3028 TIME Allen 2.30 600.00 1380.00 
10/17/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails and telephone conference with John 0.00 
Scott Re: trial preparation 

3029 TIME Allen 2.50 600.00 1500.00 
10/18/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference and emails from John 0.00 
Scott Re: trial preparation 

3030 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
10/19/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 



001802

001802

00
18
02

001802

8/8/2017 Allen Lichtenstein 
4:11 PM Slip Listing Page 24 

Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
DescriQtion Reference Variance 

3031 TIME Allen 2.70 600.00 1620.00 
10/21/2016 Court Preparation 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Multiple emails and telephone conference with 0.00 
John Scott; trial preparation 

3032 TIME Allen 1.80 600.00 1080.00 
10/24/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott and 0.00 
multiple emails 

2900 TIME Allen 1.40 600.00 840.00 
10/26/2016 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft and file Order denying Defendants' Motion 0.00 
for Reconsideration; telephone conference with 
John Scott 

3033 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
10/27/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3034 TIME Allen 2.30 600.00 1380.00 
10/28/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Conference call and emails with John Scott 0.00 

3035 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 
11/1/2016 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3036 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 
11/2/2016 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails from John Scott 0.00 

2901 TIME Allen 1.20 600.00 720.00 
11/3/2016 Court Preparation 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Pre-trial Calendar call; telephone conference 0.00 
with John Scott 

2902 TIME Allen 0.90 600.00 540.00 
11/7/2016 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Individual Pre-trial 0.00 
Memorandum 
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3047 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
1/9/2017 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Email from John Scott Re: transcripts delay 0.00 

3048 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
1/10/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2911 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
1/23/2017 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Stipulation and Order Re: Closing argument 0.00 
briefing 

3049 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
2/14/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2912 TIME Allen 9.20 600.00 5520.00 
2/20/2017 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review trial transcripts; telephone conference 0.00 
with John Scott 

3050 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
2/22/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3051 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
2/23/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2913 TIME Allen 7.90 600.00 4740.00 
3/8/2017 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review trial transcripts; draft closing brief 0.00 

3052 TIME Allen 0.50 600.00 300.00 
3/10/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: 0.00 
Closing Brief 
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2914 TIME Allen 6.40 600.00 3840.00 
3/17/2017 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review trial transcript; draft closing brief 0.00 

2915 TIME Allen 8.40 600.00 5040.00 
3/18/2017 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft closing argument 0.00 

2916 TIME Allen 9.90 600.00 5940.00 
3/19/2017 editing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft and edit closing argument 0.00 

2917 TIME Allen 10.30 600.00 6180.00 
3/20/2017 editing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Finalized and filed Plaintiffs' Closing Argument 0.00 
brief; telephone conference with John Scott 

3053 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
4/7/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3054 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
4/13/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3055 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
4/17/2017 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Emails and telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2918 TIME Allen 0.30 600.00 180.00 
4/20/2017 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Stipulation and Order to extend the deadline for 0.00 
Defendant to file its Post trial Closing Argument 
Brief; telephone conference with John Scott 

3056 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
4/21/2017 phone 0.00 T 

WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 
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8/8/2017 Allen Lichtenstein 
4:11 PM Slip Listing Page 29 

Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
DescriQtion Reference Variance 

2919 TIME Allen 3.70 600.00 2220.00 

4/30/2017 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Closing Argument Brief 0.00 

2920 TIME Allen 8.70 600.00 5220.00 
5/2/2017 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research CCSD liability, actual notice issued 0.00 

3057 TIME Allen 0.60 600.00 360.00 
5/3/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: Reply 0.00 
Brief 

2921 TIME Allen 6.50 600.00 3900.00 
5/7/2017 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research claim of special relationship applying 0.00 
only to negligence and Defendants' "negligence 
per se" deliberate indifference claim 

3058 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 

5/9/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2922 TIME Allen 6.20 600.00 3720.00 
5/22/2017 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research deliberate indifference; draft rebuttal 0.00 

2923 TIME Allen 4.90 600.00 2940.00 
5/23/2017 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research constitutionally protected interest; draft 0.00 
rebuttal; telephone conference with John Scott 

2924 TIME Allen 6.00 600.00 3600.00 
5/24/2017 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research Title IX; pervasive severe and 0.00 
objectively unreasonable; loss of educational 
opportunity; draft rebuttal; emails and telephone 
conference with John Scott 

2925 TIME Allen 7.70 600.00 4620.00 
5/25/2017 editing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft and edit rebuttal; telephone conference 0.00 
with John Scott 
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8/8/2017 Allen Lichtenstein 
4:11 PM Slip Listing Page 30 

Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNBTime Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
Descri!;1tion Reference Variance 

2926 TIME Allen 9.70 600.00 5820.00 
5/26/2017 editing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Finalized and filed Plaintiffs' Closing Rebuttal 0.00 
brief 

2927 TIME Allen 5.30 600.00 3180.00 
6/5/2017 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' Motion to Strike Portions of 0.00 
Plaintiffs' Closing Rebuttal brief; Research Re: 
Motion to Strike 

2928 TIME Allen 4.20 600.00 2520.00 
6/6/2017 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review Defendants' cited cases 0.00 

2786 TIME Allen 3.60 600.00 2160.00 
6/7/2017 Email 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Multiple emails and telephone conference with 0.00 
John Scott Re:Motion to Strike 

2929 TIME Allen 5.30 600.00 3180.00 
6/8/2017 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research difference between appellate briefs 0.00 
and written closing arguments 

2930 TIME Allen 3.10 600.00 1860.00 
6/9/2017 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research prejudice in closing arguments in 0.00 
bench trial and court discretion; review record for 
prior rulings on legal issues 

2931 TIME Allen 4.80 600.00 2880.00 
6/11/2017 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft Plaintiffs' Opposition to Motion to Strike 0.00 

2932 TIME Allen 5.50 600.00 3300.00 
6/12/2017 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft Plaintiffs' Opposition to Motion to Strike; 0.00 
emails and telephone conference with John Scott 

2933 TIME Allen 6.80 600.00 4080.00 
6/13/2017 editing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Edited and finalized Response to Defendants' 0.00 
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8/8/2017 Allen Lichtenstein 
4:11 PM Slip Listing Page 31 

Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Dates and Time Activity DNB Time Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
DescriQtion Reference Variance 
Motion to Strike Plaintiffs' Rebuttal Defendants' 
Reply 

3059 TIME Atlen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
6/22/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

2934 TIME Allen 1.70 600.00 1020.00 
6/29/2017 document review 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Review decision and order 0.00 

2935 TIME Allen 5.20 600.00 3120.00 
7/6/2017 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft findings of fact, conclusions of law; 0.00 
telephone conference with John Scott 

2936 TIME Allen 3.80 600.00 2280.00 
7/7/2017 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft finding of fact and conclusions of law and 0.00 
judgment 

3060 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
7/10/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3061 TIME Allen 0.20 600.00 120.00 
7/13/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott 0.00 

3062 TIME Allen 0.40 600.00 240.00 
7/14/2017 phone 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Telephone conference with John Scott Re: 0.00 
damage issue 

3063 TIME Allen 4.70 600.00 2820.00 
7/15/2017 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Draft proposed finding of fact and conclusions of 0.00 
law and judgment 

3064 TIME Allen 6.90 600.00 4140.00 
7/17/2017 editing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Edited and finalized findings of fact and 0.00 
conclusions of law and judgment; telephone 



001808

001808

00
18
08

001808

8/8/2017 Allen Lichtenstein 
4:11 PM Slip Listing Page 32 

Slip ID Timekeeper Units Rate Slip Value 
Oates and Time Activity DNBTime Rate Info 
Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status 
Descri12tion Reference Variance 
conference with John Scott 

3066 TIME Allen 3.10 600.00 1860.00 
7/19/2017 hearing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Preparation for Hearing; Hearing on Motion to 0.00 
Strike; telephone conference with John Scott 

3067 TIME Allen 2.10 600.00 1260.00 
7/27/2017 document draft 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Memorandum of Costs and Disbursements 0.00 

3068 TIME Allen 7.60 600.00 4560.00 
8/7/2017 research 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Research and prepare fee petition 0.00 

3069 TIME Allen 6.30 600.00 3780.00 
8/8/2017 editing 0.00 T 
WIP Bryan and Hairr 0.00 
Edited and finalized fee petition 0.00 

Grand Total 
Billable 690.77 414460.00 
Unbillable 0.00 0.00 
Total 690.77 414460.00 
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STACI PRATT HOURS AS A PRIVATE ATTORNEY 
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STACI PRATT BRYAN/HAIRR HOURS 

Date Time ActMty Activity Type Rate Slip Value 

7/23/2014 0.50 Client communication-substitution of counsel Communication 450.00 $225.00 

7/26/2014 0. 70 Review of com plaint for editing Document draft 450.00 $315.00 

Client communication--receipt of letter from NERC and review 

7/30/2014 0.80 of correspondence Document review 450.00 $360.00 

7/31/2014 0.10 Review of substitution of counsel Document review 450.00 $45.00 

Review of Defendants' Reply to Plaintiffs' Response to 

8/9/2014 1.20 Defendants' Motion to Dismiss Plaintiffs' Complaint Document review 450.00 $540.00 

8/12/2014 0.10 Client communcation--Almee Hairr Communication 450.00 $45.00 

8/15/2014 0.20 Review of Alicia Lerod email Document review 450.00 $90.00 

8/20/2014 2.60 Prepare background materials for oral argument Document preparation and review for court 450.00 $1,170.00 

Support Allen Lichentenstein in oral argument in hearing on 

8/21/2014 3.10 Bryan and Hairr Hearing on Motion to Dismiss 450.00 $1,395.00 

8/21/2014 1.20 Client communication regarding oral argument Conversation 450.00 $540.00 

8/22/2014 0.30 Review transcript Document review 450.00 $135.00 

8/22/2014 0.50 Client communication with Mary Bryan Conversation 450.00 $225.00 

8/25/2014 0.20 Review email from Alicia lerod dated 8/21/2014 Document review 450.00 $90.00 

Research and draft letter response to Alicta Lerod related to 

8/25/2014 1.30 communication and substrtutlon of counsel Document draft 450.00 $585.00 

8/26/2015 0.30 Finalize draft and send letter reply to Alicia Lerod Document draft and Email 450.00 $135.00 

Review draft order from hearing on motion to dismiss--as sent 

9/2/2014 0.60 by Dan Waite, opposing counsel Document review 450.00 $270.00 

9/5/2014 0.10 approve draft order Communication 450.00 $45.00 

10/9/2014 4.20 Prepare First Amended Complaint Document draft 450.00 $1,890.00 

10/10/2014 0.60 Discuss litigation strategy with co-counsel Analysis 450.00 $270.00 

Review Nov. 6 letter from opposing counsel regarding First 

11/6/2014 0. 70 Amended Complaint Document review 450.00 $315.00 

11/10/2014 1.80 Prep-are motion to correct errata and amend complaint Document draft 450.00 $810.00 

11/17/2014 0.20 Review client communication--Aimee Hairr Document review 450.00 $90.00 

Prepare draft of proposed changes to NRS Chapter 388 to 

11/25/2014 2.60 address client concerns Document draft 450.00 $1,170.00 

11/30/2014 0.30 Review final proposal Document review 450.00 $135.00 

12/2/2014 0.20 Review client communication·-Mary Bryan Communication 450.00 $90.00 

Total: 20.80 $10,980.00 
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ACLU of Nevada 
60 I Sooth Rnncho Dr. 

Suite 8-1 l 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 

702· 366--1536 

August 08, 2017 

Invoice# 10000 

Biiling for: i/1/2014 to 

Client ID:Bryan et al. v. 

Professional Services 

1/10/2014 S. Pr Review all refevant emails on timcfine. 
0.90 

J/21/2014 S. Pr Review a.nd analyze Clark County School District non-discrimination policy. 
l.10 

1/23/2014 AM Research school discrimination section for complaint. 
1.50 

1/24/2014 AM Continue to research aud analyze cases and arguments regarding discrimination and public 
2.00 accommodahons for incorporation into complaint. 

AM Research Nevada Equal Rights Commission, pow~rs and duties. 
l.50 

1/27/2014 S. Pr Email plaintiffs and address concerns regarding litigation. 
0.30 

AM Research and analysis regarding anti-bullying statutes in ~evada and CCSD policies. 
2.50 

AM Draft outline for complaint. 
1.50 

1/3 t/2014 AM Begin initial draft of Complaint. 
2.50 

To ensure proper credit, please inctude your c:ierit id and invoice number on your payment. Thank you. 

Rate 

$4S0.00/hr 

$450.00/hr 

$225.00/hr 

$22S.OO/hr 

$225.00/hr 

$450.00/hr 

$225.00/hr 

$225.00/hr 

$225.00/hr 
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ACLU of Nevada 

Client ID: Bryan et al. v. Page 2 

August 08, 2017 

2/7/2014 AM Review dicnt correspondence with trustees. 
1.50 $225.00/hr 

AM Make revisions and additions to the factual background section of the NERC complaint. 
1.75 $22S.00/hr 

2/13/2014 TS Review and respond to multiple correspondence to and from ciicnts. 
0.40 $125.00/hr 

2/14/2014 AM Continue to make revisions and additions to the factual background for the complaint. 
2.25 $225.00/hr 

2/21./2014 AM Draft c~w~es of action for complaint regarding the Fourteenth Amendment 
3.00 $225.00/hr 

AM Cont"inue drafting causes of action section for complaint. 
1.25 $225.00/hr 

2/23/2014 AM Continue revisions to both plaintiffs' facluul background sections of the complaint. 
2.25 $225.00/hr 

2/24/2014 AM Incorporate S. Pratt edits into the complaint. 
0.75 $225.00/hr 

AM Meeting with Plaintiffa to discuss complaint. 
2.00 $225.00/hr 

AM Continue edits and research on the negligence cause of action of the complaint. 
2.00 $225.00/hr 

2/25/2014 AM Telephone call with head ofN.ERC and draft noies for complaint. 
t .00 $225.00/hr 

AM Make final edit,;; to the negligence cause of action and public accommodation sections of the 
2.00 complaint. 

2/26/2014 AM Review and respond to multiple e-mails from clients. 
0.50 

$225.00/hr 

$225.00ihr 

3/1 7 /20 l 4 S. Pr Telephone conference with legal staff regarding pending investigation of client's complaints. 
1.00 $450.00/hr 

S. Pr Meeting with clients. 
1.20 

To ensure proper c:eclit. please inc.lode your cller:t 'd snd Invoice number on your payment. Thank you. 

$450.00/hr 
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ACLU of Nevada 

Client ID: Bryan et al. v. Page 3 

August 08, 2017 

Hours ----------- -------------------- -----'R'"""'"at=e 

3/17/20)4 S. Pr Review complaint and research potential causes of action. 
1.60 

4/28/2014 TS Email correspondence with A. \<1organ regarding complaint and filing timcline. 
0.20 

AM Draft civil cover sheet. 
0.20 

AL E>mail Paige regarding press conference timeline. 
0.20 

4/29/2014 TS File the complaint and appropriate documents. 
0.30 

5/14/2014 TS Draft summonses and coordinate the service of the summonses. 
I.SO 

5/27/20!4 AL Meeting with KNPR and parents 
1.20 

6/5/2014 AL Meeting with A. Lerud and A.G. attomeys regarding case. 
1.20 

6/10/2014 JZ Review of entire case materials. 
3.00 

$450.00/hr 

$125.00/hr 

$225.00/hr 

$600.00/hr 

$125.00/hr 

$12S.OO/hr 

$600.00/hr 

$600.00/hr 

$125.00/hr 

JZ Review case materials with A. Morgan and discuss issues an<l concerns, found during research and 

l .20 analy~is. 
$125.00/hr 

6/11/2014 JZ Research. issues regarding ~evada Equal Rights Commission duties. 
2.00 $125.00/hr 

6/13/2014 JZ Continue research regarding NERC duties and po wen:. 
1.50 $125.00/hr 

6/l 7/2014 JZ Review and analyze motion to dismiss. 
1.50 $125.00/lir 

.rz Continue research regarding issues raised in \.1'.otion to Dismiss and damage cases for use in written 
4.00 opposition. 

$125.00/hr 

JZ Begin research on issues rajsed in motion to dismiss. 
3.00 $125.00/hr 

To ensure proper credit. please include your client id and fr,vo'ce number on your payment Thank you. 
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ACLU of Nevada 

Client ID: Bryan et al. v. Page 4 

August 08, 2017 

Hours -----------------------------------:..:R.=.at:.:::e 

7/1/2014 TS Research Rule 2.2 regarding time and response to motions and email the team regarding the same. 
O.SO $125.00/hr 

7/2/2014 TS Review and calendar opposition deadline dates to motion ro dismiss. 
0.20 $125.00/hr 

7/8/2014 S. Pl' Review the arguments for opposition to motion to dismiss related to 42 USC I 983, for violations of 
2.50 state and US Constitutions. 

$450.00/hr 

AL Respond to all the Negligence Per Se arguments (addressing all arguments made in pages 12-19 of the 
2.30 Motion to Dismiss). Draft response !o the argument that we cannot sue an individual school within a 

district. 
$600.00/hr 

TS Create hearing Binder for attys regarding Motion to Dismiss and hearing on Motion to Dismiss. 
0.50 $125.00/hr 

7/9/2014 TS Calendar and review dates regarding opposition to motion. 
O.IO 

TS Research mies for service via mail. 
0.20 

7/11/2014 AL .Media discussions regarding the case. 
1.00 

7/18/2014 AL Review and make edits to opposition to the motion to dismiss. 
1.20 

7/J li20{4 AL Attend hearing on Motion to Dismiss 
2.50 

9/9/20\ 4 TS Review email and correspond with A. Lichtenstein regarding the same. 
0.20 

Total for professional services rendered 

Balance due 

70.45 

Tc eosure proper credit. please lncluce your cl'ent 'd and invoice m.:moer on your paymen:. Thank you. 

$ J 25.00/hr 

$l25.00/hr 

$600.00/hr 

$600.00/hr 

$600.00/hr 

$12 5 .00/lu 

$19,356.25 

$19,356.25 
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COSTS WITH SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION 
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Plaintiffs' Costs and Disbursements 

In Reference To: Mary Bryan and Amy Hairr v Clark County School District (CCSD) et. al, 

(Case No. A-14-700018-C} 

COSTS 

5/19/2014 Messenger service to Attorney General (ACLU) 

8/22/2014 Hearing transcript (Lichtenstein). 

5/12/2015 Association of Counsel application fee (State Bar of Nevada CK #1643). 

6/18/2015 Mailing disclosures (Lichtenstein). 

6/19/2015 Printing disclosures (Lichtenstein}. 

6/22/2015 Mailing disclosures (Lichtenstein). 

6/30/2015 Copies and Faxes made in office 06/01/2015·06/30/2015. 

8/31/2015 Copies and Faxes made in office 08/0l/2015-08/31/2015. 

10/23/2015 Discovery CD (Lichtenstein). 

11/2/2015 Deposition of Warren McKay {Depo International Inv #23223). 

Deposition transcript of Warren McKay (Oepo International Inv #23293). 

Roundtrip travel to from SNA to LA.S to SFO for Bryan/Hairr depositions (Southwest). 

Meals during travel to Las Vegas for Bryan/Hairr depositions (The Sicilian Ristorante). 

11/3/2015 Deposition of Cheryl Winn (Depo International Inv #23263}. 

Deposition transcript of Cheryl Winn (Depo International lnv #23417). 

Taxi service in Las Vegas for Bryan/Hairr depositions (Thanh Ngoc). 

Meals during travel to Las Vegas for Bryan/Hairr depositions (Arawan Thai Bistro). 

Meals during travel to Las Vegas for Bryan/Hairr depositions (Gandhi India Cuisine). 

11/16/2015 Deposition of Deanna Wright (Depo International Inv #23637). 

Deposition transcript of Deanna Wright (Depo International Inv #23662). 

Wright deposition transcript (Lichtenstein). 

11/30/2015 Copies and Faxes made in office 10/0l/2015-11/30/2015. 

12/22/2015 Deposition of Nolan Michael Hairr (litigation Services, Inv #1044327}. 

1/5/2016 Deposition of CL (Western Reporting Services, Inv #49962). 

1/6/2016 Deposition of Aimee Olivia Hairr (Litigation Services, Inv #1046125). 

1/13/2016 Deposition of D M (Western Reporting Services, Inv #49981). 

1/21/2016 Deposition of Ethan Bryan (Litigation SeNices, Inv #1048764). 

1/24/2016 Travel to from New Orleans to LAS for Bryan/Hairr depositions (Southwest). 

1/25/2016 Deposition of Leonard Depiazza (Depo International Inv #24752). 

Amount 

116.88 

60.00 

550.00 

5.75 

63.77 

5.95 

27.20 

4.00 

10.80 

1,534.68 

877.98 

209.20 

126.48 

1,590.00 

928.73 

52.00 / .,· 

25.51 

25.84 

603.42 

416.15 

19.46 

210.40 

1,183.05 

372.80 

960.S8 

379.30 

1,138.50 

221.23 

815.00 
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1/26/2016 Deposition of Robert Beaseley {Depo International Inv #24805}. 

1/27/2016 Deposition transcript of John Edwin Halpin (Depo International Inv #24899). 

Deposition of John Edwin Halpin (Depo International Inv #24897}. 

1/28/2016 Deposition transcript of Andre Joseph Long (Depo International Inv #24902). 

Deposition of Andre Joseph Long (Depo International Inv #24901). 

Travel from LAS to SFO - Bryan/Hairr depositions (Southwest). 

1/31/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office Ol/Ol/2016-01/31/2016. 

2/5/2016 Deposition of Mary Bryan (Litigation Services, Inv #1051615}. 

2/16/2016 Deposition of Heath Hairr (Litigation Services, Inv #1051615). 

Deposition of Gina Abbaduto (Litigation Services, Inv #1053295). 

2/19/2016 Deposition of Asheesh Dewan, MO (Litigation Services, Inv #1053578). 

Deposition of Edmond Faro, MD (litigation Services, Inv #1053610). 

2/24/2016 Deposition of Dennis Moore, MD (Litigation Services, Inv #1052063). 

2/29/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 02/0l/2016-02/29/2016. 

3/17/2016 Federal Express shipment to Allen Lichtenstein, Las Vegas, NV (FedEx #775904967564). 

3/28/2016 Documents scanned to PDF (Lichten5teln) 

4/1/2016 Documents scanned to PDF (Lichtenstein). 

4/21/2016 Eflle transactions for Mary Bryan - 04/30/2014-04/21/2016 (Lichtenstein). 

4/29/2016 lewis Roca transcript fee !Lichtenstein). 

8/31/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 08/01/2016-08/31/2016. 

10/31/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 10/01/2016-10/31/2016. 

11/9/2016 Federal Express shipment to Allen Lichtenstein, Las Vegas, NV (FedEx #7777679212411). 

Depo transcript of Robert Beasley, taken 1/26/2016 (Depo International Inv #30045). 

Depo transcript of Cheryl Winn, taken 11/16/2015 (Depo International Inv #30044). 

Depo transcript of Warren McKay, taken 11/2/2015 (Oepo International Inv #30046). 

11/9/2016 Depo transcript of Deanna Wright, taken 11/16/2015 (Depo International Inv #30047). 

Binders and tabs for trial (Lichtenstein). 

11/15/2016 District Court Transcript of Trial 11/15/16-11/18/16, 11/22/16 

11/28/2016 Court reporter deposit and service (Kimberly Lawson Karr Reporting Inv #11/28/2016. 

12/31/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 12/01/2016-12/31/2016. 

533.00 

325.76 

589.50 

556.83 

947.50 

114.60 

190.60 

1,031.40 

160.00 

607.25 

135.95 

182.10 

236.35 

67.40 

32.49 

37.63 

42.39 

280.50 

90.14 

6.40 

Sl.80 

115.11 

46.00 

151.00 

137.00 

51.00 

47.48 

440.00 

2000.00 

182.80 
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3/15/2017 Copies and binding. (Lichtenstein). 

3/16/2017 Copies and binding. (Lichtenstein). 

3/31/2017 Copies and Faxes made in office 03/01/2017-03/31/2017. 

5/31/2017 Copies and Faxes made In office during 05/0l/2017-05/31/2017. 

Assoc. of Counsel Renewal - Case A-14-700018 C (State of Nevada) 

Total Costs 

92.95 

34.22 

23.60 

44.40 

500.00 

$22,619.81 
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Reno/Carson Messenger Service, [nc. 
185 Martin Street 
Reno, NV 89509 
tel '175.322.2424 fax 775.322.3408 
p~ocess@renocarson.com 
Federal Tax ID: 88-0306306 
NV STA TE LIC#322 

INVOICE EQR SERVICE; 
AMERICAN CIVIL LIBERTIES UNION 01· NEVADA 
601 S RANCHO DR, SUITE BIJ, 
LAS VEGAS, NV 89106 

Requesror: TAMIKA SHAUNTEE 
Your File# BRYAN V. CCSO 

Service #49261: KARA JENKINS IN HER Il'1DIVIDUAL AND OFFICIAL 
CAPACITY AS COMMISSION ADMINISTRATOR OF NERC 
Manner of Service: CORP/BUSINESS 

Completion Infunnation/Recieved by:AMANDA WHITE 
Service Datc/l'ime:05/16/2014 10:55 AM 
Service address: 100 N. CARSON ST NEVADA ATI'ORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICE CARSON 
CITYNV 89705 

Served by:W ADB MORLAN R-006823 

Invoice#: 48.398 
Date: 05/19/2014 

~ 
Amount Due: $90.44 

Phone number. 702 366-9109 
Fax number: 702 366-1331 
Email Addre.ss: 

EIGHTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT ..STA TE OF NEVADA, CLARK COUNTY 
MARY BRYAN, ET AL v. CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT (CCSD); ET AL 

Service Documents: SUMMONS; COMPLAINT FOR DECLARATORY RELfEF, INJUNCTIVE 
RP.LWF. AND DAMAGES: CIVIL COVER SHEET 

Service Commenl.S: 

Copy/Print/Fax Service 
Standard Service 
RUSH CHARGE 
SPECIAL MILEAGE 

TOTAL CHARGES: 

BALANCE: 

CASE#: A-14-700018·C 

$6.44 
$40.00 
$20.00 
$24.00 

$90.44 

$90.44 

CREDIT TERMS ARE NET 30. INVOICES NOT PAID WITHIN TERMS WILL BE ASSESSED A 1.5% PE.R MONTH 
FINANCE CHARGE 

1 
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Reno/Carson Messenger Service, Inc. 
185 Martin Street 
Reno, NV 89509 
tel 775.322.2424 fax 775.322.3408 
process@renocarson.com 
Federal Tax ID: 88-0306306 
NV STATE LIC#322 

INVOICE FOR SERVICE; 
AMERICAN Civn, LIBERTIES UNION OF NEVADA 
601 S RANCHO DR, SUITE Dll, 
LAS VEGAS, NV 89106 

Requestor: TAMIKA SHAUNTEE 
Your File# BRYAN V. CCSD 

Service #49263: NEV ADA EQUAL RIGHTS CO:MMISS10N (NERC) 
Manner of Service: CORP/BUSINBSS 

Completion lnformation/Recieved by:AMANDA WHITE 
ScrviccDate/Time:05116/20J4 l0:55 AM 
Service nddress: 100 N. CARSON ST NEVADA A 1TORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICE CARSON 
CITYNV 89705 
Served by:WADE MORLAN R--006823 

Invoice#: 48396 
Date: 05119n014 

~ 
Amount Due: $26.44 

Phone number: 702 366-9109 
Fax number: 702 366-1331 
Email Address: 

El:GHTH JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT-STA TE OF NEVADA, CLARK COUNTY 
MARY BRYAN, ET AL v. CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DlSTRICT (CCSD); ET AL 

Service Oocumcn!$: SUMMONS; COMPLAINT FOR DECLARATORY RELIEF, INJUNCTIVE 
RELIEF, AND DAMAGES; CIVIL COVER SHE~'f 

S~rvicc Comments: 

Copy/Print/Fax Service 

2nd Def 

TOTAL CHARGES: 

BALANCE: 

CASE#: A-14-700018-C 

$6.44 

$20.00 

$26.44 

$26.44 

CREDIT TERMS ARE NET 30. INVOICES NOT PAID WITHIN TERMS WILL BE ASSESSED A 1.5% PER MONTH 
FINANCE CHARGE 

1 
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TRANSCRIBER'S BILLING JNFOR}1ATlON 
DISTRICT COURT XXVII 

DATE OF INVOICE: 8/22/14 

CASE# A700018 

CASE NAME: Mary Bryan vs. Clark County School District, et al 

HEARING DATE: 8/21/14 

DEPARTMENT# DlSTRICT COURT 27 

ORDERED BY: Allen Lichtenstein, Esq. 
FIRM: 
EMAIL: allaw@lvcoxmail.com 

COURT RECORDER: Traci Rawlinson 
"' 

PHONE NUMBER: 702-671·0883 
PAYABLE TO: :\fake check payable to: 

Clark County Treasurer 
County Tax ID#: 88-6000028 
Include case number on check 

Mailing Address: 
Regional Justice Center 
Fiscal Services 
A.ttn: Kim Ockey 
200 Lewis Ave. 
Las Ve2as, NV 89155 

BILL AMOUNT: CDs @ S25 each = 
1 hours @ S30 an hour recordin2 fee = 
4 oa2es @ I $ 7 .50 I per page of trans. 
TOTAL 

PAYABLE TO Make check payable to: 
OUTSIDE 
TRANSCRIBER: 
BILL AMOUNT: l pages@ 1$ I per page of trans 

DATE PAID: 

$ 
$30 
$ 30 
$ 60 

1$ 

TR1\,,SCRJJ>TS \\'!LL ~OT BE FILED OH IH:LEASED 
t\TIL Pc\ Y\{E'-:T IS RECEJVl~H 
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EAST LAS VEGAS BR 
i 1\S VFGAS, l~e·,:trl(> 

89121999~ 
: , 1488300()9 0\)98 

uof1i5:'2Ul~; rnUOJ27~ 3Jl! lk\ ~:!:Li~ l'M 

P1 ,,duct 
D<=~,(.,1 \ !J l i ,;II 
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(: lht'I In fo!'nlt.t t I Oil (.o l l 
I 80U ASK U~PS. 
A·11. ,c.'A .,_.,_)( K'J.. ·~~A·AJ.'kX,X. l\'-K"' ~·1,,.,11 :\ 1>; ,-:-.~• .(J A. A Jo 4. .~ 

A~X~jAA~·~K~X~AX~A~A,*A~A~l~AA~~~~~A~ 

i1e1 y,11JI moil when a11d wl11:1"' '10ll 
wa11t ti 1vilh ,1 -..1:;Clh:! Po";>I (Jffid, 
Bo>-. S1 qn 111) f,11 ,:; t ,1)', ,11·il i 1,t .-11 

. .(__ ' 1_.h /~,' . . /~.I'· If/"-• 

'' ,J 

I • 

r i~-u ,/f. 
, •"' v •" V 

EAST LAS VEGAS BR 
l. A<; VE GAS , Mt!II a: l,i 

B91219995 
3148830()09 0(09 

u6122n01~ Wu0)27~ i:.,J ii i_l:J.;J'.l:U•l PM 

Pr oduc: t 
Oc-;;,,;1'; p li u11 

Sa I es f!ece pt 
$.-d 1; Un I 
Qty 111 (A' 

f ii t<ll 
P1 iu; 

00 .. .. LAS VEGAS NV $0. 95 
89169 -~996 Zorn~ l 
Pr·iori t.,.- Mai I 1 D,w Lv 
W,;1i ~1h t 
1 I b. r,. 50 OL . 

Expe< 10d fit:: I i v~r ·1,: I 11,; Ot,/JJ, I"; 
USPS l racki 11n #: 
91 M CJ~!) il<'J3 1 ... 1~:.:11 1 hl:1'.i -l!i 
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f SSUC Po-., I <l! 11· : 
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FedEx Off icf is y-our .Jest nan on 
for prj1·:ting and ~hi;:m ng. 

3% Hughes Center Dr 
LilS Vegas, NV 89159 
rel: (702) 951 :?40(! 

6/19/2015 4:07:1.1 Pt,~ PSl 
Team Membe ,·: H ~ rokD -r . 

SAlt 

::·. Ii! Vi.Jr 200 )) 
l.J<.1 •. sitlL Reg Pr j ce I' ,,, 

Cliplt Flash ~lk 4GB I~ 
01fi,...:3F · :J. !1 r i C.:" 8 . ~JS 

;;:e~Ji· :,· l 11ti:l 
l!b:A,,1r.ts 

Total 

~:ub··k;;-:,, 
Tax 
Oepo~ 1 :. 

·) 1 ~.,:t 

~ .• :;\::.Jt ii~ t : ~, 130 
Auth; fl81408 (Ai 

Total Tender 
Change Due 

P;6. ~j:1 
128.00 

58.9!} 

U .?~·,._; ; 

83};)0 ·: 

58 9E1 
4.78 
0.00 

63.77 

63.77 

'I"'\ 77 
OJ,! I 

o.ou 
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l 
i THANH NGOC PHAN TA.I, 
' 1398 PLYMOUTH AVE. 

SAri FRANCISCO CA 9~ 1~ '11/03/2015 I 

! Nermait ID; ooooo 
TemmaJ IO: 

• 372238S62S81 . 

CARO ;1 

INVOICE 
Balzh if: 

O!fOITCARO 

VISA SAI.E 

I 

TtlE SiguAN R1S10RANT 
352.o·E"lROOCANA AVf. "A 

~S VEGAS, NV 89121 

U/Ol/201S 
21\:U:Sl 

ithwestAirlines@luv.southwest.com> 
15 5:45 PM 1 j 

\, i , 

CREOli CARO 
V1SASA1f 

'J:t:IY.fJPfJ:J'JmO on (HZ2PYY) j 300CT15 I SFO-SNA-LAS I Scott/John 
0026 
om 

001282 
on~9 

045&70 

App,o>1al Code: 
~ Method: 

Swiped 
Oline & lo·e lri I View mv Itinerary 

Mode: 

MDSE/SERVICES 

TIP 

S1:cc1c11 Hole I Cir 
OHf?r~ Oftc,r ..s OFi,,rs 

TOTAl AOOUNT 

CUSTOME~ COPY 

$52.00 WE. APPREID."TE ~OUR BUSlffi:SSl 

CIJSTOMtR COi'( 

AIR Conflnnation: HZ2PYY 

Rapid Rewards# Ticket tJ. 

s\18l'ythtng you need to 

Confirmation Date: 10/13/2015 

Expiration Est. Pornte 
Eamed 

Passenger(•) 

SCOTT/JOHN 217859913 52a215D860085 Oct 8. 2016 0 

Rapid Rewards poinle from youroxlginal booking have been redeposited In account 00000217869913 
18802 Rapid Rewaros points have been redeemed fur new ticket 5202150860085 

Date Flight Oeparture/Arrival 

Date 
• • • • • • • • • • 4 • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • . . • 

Fllght Departure/Arrival 

1 

' 
' ' 

• ' < '1 ' • 

. . - ' 
-- • '·J; 

Lat us t!tke al'li,, 

careof s12so 
check-In 
for you. omrww 

Getitnow > 

.Addahotel 

~ E.a.m Rapid RE!',..ards1
1) pci11ts 

~ Best rate guarantee 

~ Fraecancelfatlon 

Bn0k ;, hate! > 
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Sun Nov 1 4049 
( ""') :·-) 

Depart Ofv.tt.lGE COUNTY/SANTA ANA, CA (SNA) on Southwest 
Ah1fnes at 12:3! PM 
Arrive in LAS VEGAS, NV (!AS) at 1:-40 PM 
Travel Time 1 hra 5 mins 
Wanna Get Away 

Check In for yo1,1r fllght(s): 24 hours before your trip on Southwest.com 
or your mobile device to secure your boarding position. You'll be 
assigned a boarding position based on your check-In time. The earner 
you check in within 24 hours of your flight, the earfier you get to board. 

liil Sags fly free®: First and second checked bags. Weight and size limits 
ru;m!y. One small bag and one personal item are permitted as carrynn 
items, free of charge. 

(9 30 minutes before departure: We encourage you to arrive in the gate 
area no later than 30 minutes prior to your ~ht's scheduled departure as 
we may begin boarding as early as 30 minutes before Y9Ur flight. 

(9 

0 

10 mlnut8$ before departure; You must obtain your boardil'ig pass(es) 
and be in the gate area·for boarding at least 1 O minutes prior to your 
flighfs scheduled departure time.· If not, Southwest may cancel your 
reserved space and you will not be eligible for denied boarding 
oompensatlon. 

If you do not plan to travel on your fllght: In accordance with 
Southwesfs No Show Policy, you must notify Southwest at least 10 
minutes prior to your flighfs scheduled departure if you do not plan to 
travel on the flight If not, Southwest will cancel your reservation and au 
funds wlll be forfeited. 

Air Cost: 11.20 

Fare Rule(s): Valid only on Southwest Airlines. All travel involving funds from 
!his Confirmation Number must be completed by the expiration date. Unused 
travel funds may only be applied toward the purchase of future travel for the 
individual named on the ticket. Any changes to this itinerary may result in a fare 
increase. Failure to cancel reservations for a Wanna Get Away fare segment at 
least 1 O minutes prior to travel will result in the forfeiture of all remaining unused 
funds. 

SFO WN SNAO.OOMJMFF WN LASO.OOR/RFF 0.00 END AY11.20$SF05.60 
SNA6.60 

• Learn about our 
~ boarding process...11 

~ Learn about inflight 
~ WlFi & entertainment..Jt 

Coat and Payment Summary 

~ AIR - HZ2PYY 

2 

~ Add a rental car 

~ Earn Rapid Revllllrds•'tl points 

~ Guaranteed ioiN rates 

~ Free cancelJation 

fk,·~k ·\Of > 

I i 
I 
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J~hn H. Scott 

r \ 

/ 
,·· ,,. . ' • i 

From: 
1 Sent: 

Southwest Airlines <SouthwestAirlines@luv.southwest.com> 
Tuesday, October 13, 2015 5:52 PM 

' To: John H. Scott 
Subject: Flight reservation (H35E07) I 03NOV15 j lAS-SfO l Scott/John 

Thanks for choosing Southwes© fer your tr1p. 

& ~ 1 View my itinerary 

CllF:ck In ,:·111~:;;.. Fl1\;ltt Chc11;uc ~:De•;ia: Hotol Car 
Onli,h' St<1tos Fli~;ht ~ffers Offer:, Off Pr~ 

Ready for takeoff! 

f!) Thanks for choosing Southwest® for your trip_ You'U find everything you need to 
.-,,,,,-- know about your M$8rvation below. Happy travels! 

Upcoming Trip: 11/03115 -San Francisco 

:X Air ,tincrnry 

AIR Confirmation: H.35ED7 Cominnation Date: 10/13/2015 

Passenger{s) 

SCOTIJJOHN 

Rapid RewardB # Ticket# Expiration Eltt. Points 
Eamed 

217859913 52&2150862870 Oct 12, 2018 0 

Dat.e Fllght Oaparture/Arrlval 

Tue Nov3 2054 Depart LAS VEGAS, NV (LAS} on Southwest Airllnee at 7;40 PM 
Arrlva In SAN FRANCISCO, CA (SFO) at l:1S PM 

0 

Travel Time 1 hrs 35 mins 
Wanna Get Away 

Check In for your fUght(e): 24 hours before your trip on Southwest com 
or your mobile device to secure your boarding positlon. You'll be 
assigned a boarding position based on your check•in time. The earlier 
you check in within 24 hours of your flight, the earlier you get to board. 

1 

GsUtnow > 

.Addahotel 

.,,f Eam Rapid Rewards''' points 

..t Best rate guarantee 

.., ~ree cancellation 

Bud ;i I 1otd ) 
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I 

·~ 

• 
1 

1i11 

(9 

(9 

• 

Bags fjy free®: First and second checked bags. Weight and size limits 
~-One small bag and one personal item are pennitted as carryon 
items, tree of charge. 

30 minute& before departure: We encourage you to arrive in the gate 
area no later than 30 minutes prior to your flight's scheduled departure as 
we may begin boarding as early as 30 minutes before your fllght. 

10 mJnutes before departur.: You must obtain your boarding pass(es) 
amt be In the gate area for boarding at least 10 minutes prior to your 
flight's scheduled departure time. If not, Southwest may canc&I your 
reserved space and you will not be eligible for denied boarding 
compensation. 

If you do not plan to travel on your flight: In accordance with 
Southwest's No Show Policy, you must notify Southwest at least 10 
minutes prior to your flight's scheduled departure if you do not plan to 
travel on the flight. If not, Southwest will cancel your reseivatton and all 
funds will be forfeited. 

Air Coat: 5.60 

Fare Rule(s); 5262150862870; 1234. 
Valid only on Southwest Airlines. All travel involving funds from this 
Confirmation Number must be completed by the expiration date. Unused travel 
funds may only be applied toward the purchase of future travel for the individual 
named on the ticket. Any changes to this itinerary may result in a fare increase. 
Failure to cancel reservations for a Wanna Get Away fare segment at least 1 O 
minutes prior to travel will result in the forfeiture of all remaining unused funds. 

LAS WN SFOO.OOT/TFF 0.00 END AY5.60$LAS5.60 

• Learn about our 
._. boarding process..-

~ Learn about infllght 
-;'> WiFi & entertainment.. 

Cos~ and Payment Summary 

~ AIR · H3SE07 

Base Fare 
Excise T8lCes 
Segment Fee 
Passenger Facility Charge 
September 11th Security Fee 
Total Air Cost 

$ 0.00 
$ 0.00 
$ 0.00 
$ 0.00 
$ 5.60 
$ 6.60 

Payment lnfonnatlon 
Payment Type: 1947 Rapid Rewards Points 
00000217859913 
Date: Oct 13, 2015 

A 1 ..i> Payment Type: Visa XXXXXXXXXXXX.2430 
~Date: Oct 13, 2015 
I ()q. <,()Payment Amount: $5.80 

II» '1· :2)) 

2 

fiia Add a rental car 

~ Earn Rapid Rewards"' potnts 
~ Guaranteed low nstes 

~ Faoocanc~tattt)l'I 
f r 

: ' . . 
' 
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Basc!Fare 
Excise Taxes 
Segment Fee 
Passenger Facility Charge 
September 11th Security Fee 
Total Afr Coet 

~ ' ') 
$ bXIO 
$ 0.00 
$ 0.00 
$ 0.00 
$ 11.20 
$ 11.20 

Payment lnfonnatlon C) 
Payment Type: 18802 Rapid Rewards Points 
00000217859913 
Date: Oct 13, 2015 

Payment Type: Ticket Exchange 
Date: Oct 13, 2015 
Payment Amount $11.20 

Exchange DetaU 
Oct 9, 2015 From ticket# 5262149771424 to ticket 
# 5262150860085 

. . . ........ -... .... . -. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . ... . .. . - . . . . . . . . . . ....... ........... .. 

., ... ., .... . .. .. .. . .. -
; 

Useful TooJE;. Know Before You Go .Specl~I :rl'ilvel Needs ( 
~:!tr~:~:~~~t~,i{'!:,¥i~~~;. ~\ r\ ~ 

~hetk rn Onl!ne . 
'¥3rly Bird Check-In 

> Vfew/Shate Itinerary 

Change Air' Reservallon. 

¢ance1 Afr Reseryatlon 

.CMck.FHghLSta1us . 

fHgl'I~ status Notttfoauon 
Book a Car 

Book aHol@I 

In the Airport · 

Baggage PoUcies 

Suggesled Airport Arrival Times 

SeQurtty Procedures 
Customers of Sil§ 

~ 

Purchasing and Refunds 

Legal Policies & ttelpful lnformatiQn 

Prtvacy Polley 

Notice of Incorporated ToQIJs 
Customer Ser'Jice commitment 

~ 

Tl,§vellp@ with Children 
Travellqg \\<1th Pets 

Uniloooinoanled Minors 

Baby on Board 

Customers with DlsabllUles 

.. ... ". 

Contact Us 

~ I Book Hotel I ~ l Book YacaUon Packages I see Speclal Offers I Manage My Account 

This Is a post-only rnailing from S0uthwE1sl Airlines. Please do nol attempt to re~pond 10 !his massage. Yo~, 

privacy is important LO us, Please rea(l our privacy Polley. 

1 All travel invoflling funds trom lhi& Confirmation Number rr,usl be completed by the expiration date. 

'Security Fee is thegoveromenl-imposed Septe'noer 11th Security Fee 

See Southwe41 8 frlines Co. Notice of Incorporation 
see southwest Atrllnes Limit of Llabilltv 

Southwest Att1Jnes 
P.O. Box36647·1CR 

3 

: I 
I 

: ~ 
I ls 
I ~ 

s 
I'< 
s 

· I 
r-



001830

001830

00
18
30

001830

Depo International 
703 South Eighth Street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 
Phone:702-386-9322 Fax:702-386-9825 

Accounts Payable 
Allen Lichtenstein, Attorney at Law, Ltd. 
No.222 
3315 Russel Road 
Las Vegas, NV 89120 

Invoice Invoice Balance 
Date No. 

11/10/2015 23223 1,534.68 

11/11/2015 23263 1,590.00 

11/12/2015 23293 877.98 

11/18/2015 23417 928.73 

11/30/2015 23637 603.42 . 

11/30/2015 23662 416.15 

Tax ID: 45-0581340 

Job Date 

11/2/2015 

11/3/2015 

11/2/2015 

11/3/2015 

11/16/2015 

11/16/2015 

STATEMENT 
Account No. Date 

F2961 1/8/2016 

Current 30 Days 60 Days 

$0.00 $5,950.96 $0.00 

90 Days 120 Days &. Over Tot~I Due-- .. 

$0.00 $0.00 ( $5,950.,~, 

'. \Y)\!T 
Page 1 of 1 

Witness Case Name 

Warren McKay Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Cheryl Winn Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Warren McKay Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Cheryl Winn Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Deanna Wright Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Deanna Wright Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

~~t, 
s~-':, ~i 

,e\.~~ ~~~ 
'Q~ 

Phone: (702} 433-2666 Fax:(702) 433-9591 

!'lease detach botto.m portion a11d re;11r11 1vitli paymellt. 

Accounts Payable 
Allen Lichtenstein, Attorney at Law, Ltd. 
No. 222 
3315 Russel Road 
las Vegas, NV 89120 

Remit To: Depo International 
703 South Eighth Street 
tas Vegas, NV 89101 

Account No. 

Date 

Total Due 

F2961 

1/8/2016 

$ 5,950.96 

PAYMENT WITH CREDIT CARD ~ex E I VISA' .I 
cardholder's Name: 

Card Number: 

Exp. Date: Phone#: 

Billing Address: 

Zip: Card Security Code: 

Amount to Charge: 

Cardholder's Signature: 

Email : 
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$ 
~Office .. 

November 16, 201512:51 
Receipt#: 0741219978 
MasterCard#: XXXXXXXXXXXX8461 
2.015/11/16 12:36 

Oty Description 

150 ES B&W $/$ White 8.5 xt 1 

SubTotal 
Taxes 
Total 

Page: 1 

Amount 

18.00 

18.00 
1.46 

19.46 

The Cardholder ag!'ffs to pay the Issuer of the charge 
card in accordance with the agreement between the 
Issuer and the Cardholder. 

FedEx Office Print & Ship Centers 

395 Hughes Ctr Or. 
Las Vegas,NV 89109 
(702) 951·2400 
www.fedExOfflce.com 

Tell us how we're doing and receive 
20% off your next $3S print order 
fedex.com/wellsten or 1 ·80Q.39S-0242 
Offer Code: __ Offer expires 12/31/2015 

Please Recycle This Receipt 

l 
() , r1 J 
·. "'1r 

C
. '/ !) . •' ( . 
. -· ~ V , 
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.. 04/JJ]/2016 04: 33 7024339591 

1Dl WESTERN RlPORTINO 
S E RVI C: E $ " IN C . 

500 south Rancho Drive • Suite SA.· Las Vegas, NV 89f OS 
TM 702/474-6255 ' fax 70~474•6267 

www.wesremreportingservices.com 
Fet!llrtl 1D No. 88·0263740 

Allen K. Lichtenstein, Eeq. 
3315 East Russel( Road 
Suite 222 
La& Veges, Nevada 89120 

ALLEN Lla-tTENSTEIN PAGE 08/09 

BRYANV CCSD 

TF.RMS; N:E1' 30 DAYS · A. l..:ltc Payment 
Chnrg0ofl l/2% per month (18% poi· 
nnnum) will be nsscs..~d on bAlonccs 30 
cfo)'J. or more OVt.'l°duc. 

·:a~le .;;.: ..... · 1NV9tce ., 

1119/2018 49962 

•. ·~·;:·,·i·, ?/~?iii·/~{~f;~~?~l~~~~:~e:.<f:~i;•.~.: ·'.·{~}~':j'/:.>· :.:·, :.::, r··:,;: .~,'•. 

DEPOSITION OF C Q f,/5116 
Transcript, Copy 
(Electronfc Format) 

Statutory administration of transcript subsequent to pubtlcatfon 
Standard/Bleck and White Exhibit(s) -Electronic fotmat 

ReP.~RTER::·:.; 
L. Unruh 

348.10 

19.50 
7.20 

$372.80 

~1~ ,~~·""b 
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04/07/2016 04:33 7024339591 ALLEN LIOiTENSTEIN PAGE 09/09 
.. -... - .. -·· - -·-· -

/(DJ WfSTERN Hf POHTIN6 
SERVI Ce. s. I N C. 

1 
500 $()(Ith Rancho Drive • Suito BA • 1.88 Vegas, NV 89106 

lM 102/474--6255 • fax 7021474-6257 
www.westemreportingson1lce&.com 

Fee19n,I IO No. 88-0283740 

Allen K. Uchtenstein, Esq. 
3315 Esst Russell Ro8d 
Suite 222 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89120 

TITRMS: NET 30 DA VS • A J,.nto Payment 
Ch1wi;e of l 11.2% per r,,onth (IS% 11oi· 

nnn\lm) wlll be nssesscd Ol\ bnlanccs 30 
dnys or more overd1.10. 

1!22/2D16 

····~~-· .... r·tJ ~- GE•':, ~· t .. ~. • , • • . . ... . 

49981 

349.15 

19.50 
8.40 
2.25 

$379.30 
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AIR Confirmation: R4MXTP Confirmation Date: 12/1/2015 

Pa&Senger(s) Rapid Reward•# Ticket# Expiration Est. Points 
Earned 

SCOTI/JOHN HOUS 217859913 
TON 

5262163210458 Nov 30, 2016 2290 

Rapid Rewards points earned aia only estimates. Visit your {MySoutnwest, Soylhwest.com or Rapld Rewards) 
account tor ttle most accvra\e tolals. induding A-List & A-Lisi Preterrtid bor.u& points. 

Date 

Date 

Flight Departure/Arrival 

Flight Departure/Arrival 

Depart NEW ORI.EANS, L,\ (MSY) on Southwest Airlinesat 4:30 
PM 
Arrive In LAS VEGAS, NV (LAS) at 6:30 PM 
Travel Time 4 hrs O mins 
Wanna Get Away 

'-·····- ·-·· 

Check In for your fllght(s): 24 hours before your trip on 
Southwest.com or your mobile device to secure your 
boarding position. You'll be assigned a boarding position 
based on your check-in time. The earlier you check in within 
24 hours of your flight, the earlier you get to board. 

Saga fly free®: First and second checked bags. Weight 
and size limits apply. One small bag and one personal item 
are permitted as carryon items, free of charge. 

30 minutes before departure: We encourage you to arrive 
in the gate area no later than 30 minutes prior to your flight's 
scheduled departure as we may begin boarding as early as 
30 minutes before your flight. 

2 

0 

.:· ... 
. . 
. ! 

• r •, I · .. ) 

• 'f' 

.! 
·: '• '": ... 

. .. . 
.. 

.... ···.·. · ... 

:• ,, ·. 

•, ... 
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I. : 

10 minutes before departure: You must obtain your 
boarding pass(es) and be in the gate area for boarding at 
least 10 minutes prior to your flight's scheduled departure 
time. If not, Southwest may cancel your reserved space and 
you will not be eligible for denied boarding compensation. 

If you do not plan to travel on your flight: In accordance 
with Southwest's No Show Policy, you must notify 
Southwest at least 10 minutes prior to your flight's 
scheduled departure if you do not plan to travel on the flight. 
If not, Southwest will cancel your reservation and all funds 
will be forfeited. 

Air Coat: 442.46 

Fare Rule(s): 5262163210458: NONREF/NONTRANSFERABLE/STANDBY 
REQ UPGRADE TOY. 
Valid only on Southwest Airlines. All travel involving funds from this 
Confirmation Number must be completed by the expiration date. Unused t,avel 
funds may only be applied toward the purchase of future travel for the individual 
named on the ticket Any changes to·this itinerary may result in a fare increase. 
Failure to cancel reservations for El Wanna Get Away fare segment at least 10 
minutes prior to travel will result in the forfeiture of all remaining unused funds. 

SFO WN X/PHX WN MSY184.540LAVHNRO WN LAS197.10WLNVHNR 
381.64 END ZPSFOPHXMSY XFSF04.5PHX4.5 AY11.20$SF05.60 MSYS.60 

· Learn about our 
• boarding process 

I• 

Learn about inflight 
WiFi & entertainment 

Cost and Payment Summary 

, AIR • R4MXTP 

Base Fara 
Excise Taxes 
Segment Fee 
Passenger Facility Charge 
September 11th Security Fee 
Total Air Cost 

$ 381.64 Payment Information 
$ 28.62 Payment Type: Visa XXXXXXXXXXXX2430 
$ 12.00 Date: Dec 1, 2015 
$ 9.00 Payment Amount: $442.46 
$ 11.20 

3 
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Oepo tntematlonal 
103 Souttl Eighth Street 
Las Vt?4)BS, NV 89101 
Phone:702·386-9322 Fax:702*386-9825 

John HoUSlOO Stott 
Scott Law Firm 
1388 Sutter Street 
SU1ba715 
58n F.ranctsco, CA 94109 

C>RJGtNAL & ONE CEltTIFieD 'JMNSCRlf>T 
Leonard beplazza 

If you hsve any questions, you may contact our blUing department: 
1 Bllllng@depo/ntematlonat.oom 

ThanJc you for yaui: buslnessl 

INVOICE 
-

tnvolc:e No. InvokaDal8 .Job No. 

24752 1/28/2016 20056 

lol> Dat.-e case No. 

1/25/2016 A·14-700018·C 

casett,me 

Mary Bryan, et a!, vs. Clark COUntv School Distrlct, et at. 

Pi\vmen\ Terms ·. 
Due upon receipt 

TOTAL DUE >>> $81$,00 

iF~ 

8 --=.---· -='~ 

ilX ID: 45·0581340 Phone: (415} 561~9601 Fax:( .. 15) 561.g6()9 

Ploasu detaoh bot/Om purffcn and rrtum wtrh paytnant. 

IO:hn Houston Scott 
3oott taw Arm 
i38B SUtter Street 
iui. 715 
ian Francisco, CA 94109 

nit To: Qepo lnternatlonal 
,os south Etohth Street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 

Job No. : 20056 8UI0 :2-0lLV 
Ci.Se No. : A-1+700018-C 
case Name : MaIY Bryan, et al. vs. C!atk C.Ounty School 

Dl&'trlct, el: at~ 
Invoice No. : 24752 , Invoice Date : 1/28/2016 
Total Due : $ 81UIO 

PAYMENT WUH CREDIT CARD 
CBrdholder's Name: 
card Number: 
~p. Qat,a: Phone#: 
Bllflng Address: 
Zip: Card Security Code: 
Amount tQ Charge: 
cardholder1s Signature: 
Emall: 

. .. 'l:~ 
-:-o."~· 
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Oepo lnternatfonal 
703 South Eighth Street 
Las Vege,s, NV 89101 . 
Phone:702"386·9322 Fax:702·386·982S 

John Housmn Scott 
Scott Law Ftrm 
1388 Sutter Street 
Sulte715 
san Francisco, CA 94109 

QRIGINAL & ONE ELECTRONIC CeRTIFiEO TRANSCRIPT' 
'John Ed~lo Harpin 

It you _haye any (l~oos, you may contact our bllllng department: 
Bllllng@depolnter(1atlonal.com · 

,:hank you for}'Ol!r bustnessl 

....... ~ .. ~-
lnv4f tie No. . . . ~ ~· . Invol~·Dal:8 Job,Nq. 

24897 2/4/2016 200S8 
·Joh~a~ CaseNo. 

·-
1/27/2016 A-1+700018.C 

~ff~~ 
Marv B,yan, et et. vs. Clark Counw Schoof O!SWci:, et al. 

hyment:remts 
. ' 

Dua upon receipt 

~TA~ puE >~> :, 

S<> ~I 

·~:~t 
~9-.</-.~:.;?I. 

ax JO: 4S-05813'40 Phone: {415) 561-9601 Fax:(415) 561"9609 

Pkast: detach hothJm por/Jon md return with JHlYITHmt. 

John Houston Scott 
Scott Law Frrm 
1388 Sutter street 
SU1te71S 
san Fiancisco, CA 94109 

em~To: De,polnternaUonal 
703 SOut;JI Eighth Street 
LU Vegat, NV· 89101 

Joo No, : 200S8 8UID :2.:0I LV 
Olse No. : A·1+700018·C 
case Name : Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark county Schoof 

Olstr!c:t, et al. 
trwotce No. : ,24897 ~ lnvoice Dam :2/4/2016 

T~I D~-t~ ~ ~·~ ... 
PAYMENT WffHCREQI[ CARD 
cardholder's Name: 
card Number. 
Exp. Date: Phone#: 
Bllllng Address: 

cam security COde: 
Amount to Cilarge: 
Cardholder's Signature: 
Email: 

,, 

i 
f 
: 
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... I W "!' y ,& :~ liii: . . .... .. . ... 

1 . lf\y6J~;~bi' .i~~.' ' \ Jp~. · -~~tfrJo,. ·· .. 
i1tP~ .· 2111~f!J"t :.iq9~1. 

' · .. · · :r.4'sl.wa · ... · · -. .· ·· ._ ... 
• ... • ' • ..... ~ ~ ... ~, ~ff • • • 

I . 
'·' 

: ' 

I 

EJt,y9u .. naV«My1,qtl~~o~s,;you~m~1 c:e·n1act·our bl)ilo~'departiYteilt: 
·· alJrrhg@dePQrnternauonal:Mnr '· · "· · 

:;,;;, . .. ... ··~""' w.. .. 

· Thank: yojj· for. YO!Jt:UU§ln'es$1 . . ~ . 

. ~·e---,..--,-.:-"""!'.....__,...,.....,..;..,.......,___--'-......,....--.,,-,,;-........,~-:--;---:--,----~ ....,._,- - -=----....::·:.....· -~,...:..,.......,.·~-~~· · . . 
• • • • ~ I A I •••o , "' • ... •, • :I•• • • t .. 

,Ph_Q(le1 c 4l~)i5't:-'96'0'1 1:ax~(Aistsati9.609. . ,~. . . 
. Dle'iis11 ifeta~hbr,~if[li),qrtto1yn 1:.riil!wn1t!f !i Tftl)l!11111t 

r ... 
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, l., f 

04/07/2016 .. 04:33 7024339591 

Dtpa lflt.na\tonal 
70lSoD11i B!ghth Street 

Las Veg:i,, NV.8911U 
Ptnm~: 702.306.CJ~22 114,t; 102.386-.9112& 

Accounts Payable 
Allen Lichtenstein, Attorney at Lbw, Ltd. 
3806 FCrestcrest Drlw 
I.es Vegas, NV 89121 

Invol~ 
~ 
~ 

·N~ 
ll]anc.,e :s~:oate 

I 
• I 

ALLEN LIO-HENSTEIN PAGE 07/0'3 

CUr~1'1 tOC&ts . 60 Dlys 
$0,00 $882.S9 $0,00 

,0 Days ~ -011ys· &Oller Tobil·Pue 
$0.00 $0:00 $882,!it 

Wtttaeas Qlse.r,tama 
.. 

f 2/4/2016 2~99.. 32$l7.~ ~ 1!.f~'J./201G ronn emrn'Hatt;,111 . Mar; f!rWrf, et al. 1JS. G11;1~ county 

'; 

,, 

,( - ~ . scrtoor 01strttt; er al. · 
Z/4/20t6 24902 ' ~.83 I 1/2$/2016 Al'\dre Josepti Long Mary.Bryan, et al, vs. Clar1< County 

- , , . >b 
SChOOI District, at al. 

• u 

.. s~"',o 
\'\,'E.~ ~~t.~1 

'" I 

Tax tD145-0581340 "flone: (702) 433-2666 FaX:{702) 433-9591 

PIM$tl rltlach bottom porli()Jl amf rffllm wilh JW)lmcnt. 

Accounts Payable 
Allen Llcht'en~ln, Attomev at Law, Ltd. 
3806 For8StcreSt DriVe 
Las Vegas. NV $9121 

~mlt 'to: r>upo tnteniatJortaJ 
10.3 5011th Efohth Stieet 
&.as veoas, NV MJ.Gl 

Account No, 
Cate 

... 
PAYMENJ'. Wflt CREDIT'CABP 
cardholders Name! . 
Cettl Number: 

Exp. oat.e: . Pl'ione#: 

AmDtlnt tn Cha roe: 

Email; 
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Depo International 
703 South Eighth Streat 
Les Vegas, NV 89101 
Phone.:702-386-9322 Fax:702-385-9825 

John Houston Scott 
Scott Law Arm 
1388 Su!i!r Street 
SUlte71S 
Sail FranciSCo, CA 94109 

ORIGINAL & ONE,EI.ECTRONIC CeRTIFIEO TRANSCRlPT 
Anene.Joseph Long 

!f you havetany qu~ons,. you may mnmtt o.ur bllltng department: 
Bflllng@depolnternatlonal.com 

Thank.you forya~r bUSfn~I 

By_·-···---­....,._,. .... ·-·Wot--~~ 

& 111 W V ,& '- a. 
l!'VOlte No, Invo~-Date :robNi>~ · 

24901 2/4/2016 200S9 
Jol)Date Cn,seNo. 

1/26/2016 A-14·700018-C 

Qt~NIO!e .. . . 
Mary Bryan, et al. YS, Clark County School Olstrfct, et al. 

P"@Yment terms : 

Due upon receipt 

TOTAL DU! >>> 

,. 

Phone: (415) 561"9601 Fax:(415) 561•9609 

Pkwtt ikt«® hotfom portion tmd ni111m with pfT)'trtent. 

John HoUston SCOtt 
SOott: law Arm 
1388 SUtter s~ 
Sults71S 
SI.In Frarn:l!i'CO, CA 94109 

emit lb: Depo lnt:araatfonal 
703 SOUth Etghth Street 

.Las Vegas, NV 89101 

.Job No. : 20059 BUlD :2-DILV 

C8se No. : A•14-70001&<: 
Case Name : Mary Bryan, et el. vs. Clark County School 

OTstrlct,, et al. 
Invotce No. : 24901 Invoice Date : 2/4/2016 

.Tota1Du_e~ 

- + • • • ' 

!AYMENT WlTtt CREDIT CARD 
C:artlholdef s Name: 
Qlrd Number: 
Exp.Date: Phone#: 

• 61111ng Address: 
tie: card Security Code: 
Amount lu Charge: 
cardholder's Signature: 
Ernall: 
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John H. Scott 

From: 
Sent: 

Southwest Airlines <SouthwestAirlines@luv.southwestcom> 
Monday, January 11, 2016 7:30 PM 

To: John H. Scott 
Subject: Flight reservation (RYNHEH) I 28JAN16 I LAs-SFO I Scott/John 

Thanks for choo.<,ino Southwest® for you· trip . 

Southwest'• & Log In I View my itinerary 

Checl< In ChP.r.k Flight Change Special Hotel Car 
Online Status Flight Offers Offers Offers 

Ready for takeoff! 

Thanks for choosing Southwest® for your trip. You'll find everything you need to 
know about your reservation below. Happy travels! 

~ Air itinerary 

AIR Confirmation: RYNHEH Confirmation Date: 01/11/2016 

Passenger(a) 

SCOTT/JOHN 

Rapid Rewards # Ticket# Expiration Est. Points 
· Earned 

217859913 5262173005456 Jan10,2017 0 

Date Fllght Departure/Arrival 

Thu Jan 28 595 Depart LAS VEGAS, NV (L6.S) on Southwest Airlines at 4:40 PM 
Arrive in SAN FRANCISCO, CA (SFO) at 6:10 PM 

e 

Trav~I Time 1 hrs 30 mins 
Wanna Get Away 

Check in for your flight(s): 24 hours before your trip on Southwest.com 
or your mobile device to secure your boarding position. You'll be 
assigned a boarding position based on your check-in ttme. The earlier 
you check in within 24 hours of your flight, the earlier you get to board. 

liil Bags fly free®: First and second checked bags. Weight and size limits 
film!Y. One small bag and one personal item are permitted as ·carryon 
items, free of charge. 

30 minutes before departure: We encourage you to arrive in the gate 
area no later than 30 minutes prior to your flight's scheduled departure as 
we may begin boarding as early as 30 minutes before your flight. 

1 

Rentals as low 
as $15 per day. 
+eam'll,200 
'Rapl<,1 Rtward~· 
poEnt& 

dollar.· 
BoQk now> 

l 
. ~~ 

I·:· , a·; .. EarlyBird: j 
I• • • • Ch" •• , 0 · 
i .·- ,., @CK.· A · 

Let us take C(lfe of 
checHn ror you. 

Get It now 

Ile Add a hotel 

..;, Earn !Rapid Re·ua1rds1~ poi rits 

../' Best r.ate guarantee 

../' Free .:ancdlation 

Book ii hotel > 

I • 
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(9 

0 

10 minutes before departure: You must obtain your boarding pass(es) 
and be in the gate area for boarding at least 10 minutes prior to your 
flight's scheduled departure time. If not, Southwest may cancel your 
reserved space and you will not be eligible for denied boarding 
compensation. 

If you do not plan to travel on your flight: In accordance with 
Southwest's No Show Policy, you must notify Southwest at least 1 O 
minutes prior to your flight's scheduled departure if you do not plan to 
travel on the flight. lf not, Southwest will cancel your reservation and all 
funds will be forfeited. 

Air Cost: 5.60 

Fare Rule( s ): 5262173005456: 1234. 
Valid only on Southwest Airlines. All travel involving funds from this 
Confirmation Number must be completed by the expiration date. Unused travel 
funds may only be applied toward the purchase of future travel for the individual 
named on the ticket. Any changes to this itinerary may result in a fare Increase. 
Failure to cancel reservations for a Wanna Get Away fare segment at least 10 
minutes prior to travel will result in the forfeiture of all remaining unused funds. 

LAS WN SFOO.OON/NFF 0.00 END AY5.60SLAS5.60 

• . Learn about our 
.-.. boarding process~ 

~, Learn a~out inflight 
~ WiFi & entertainment~ 

Coat and Payment Summary 

~ AIR · RYNHEH 

Base Fare 
Excise Taxes 
Segment Fee 

S 0.00 Payment Information 
S 0.00 Payment Type: 4746 Rapld Rewards Poi.1ts 
$ 0.00 00000217859913 

Passenger Faclllty Charge 
September 11th Security Fee 
Total Air Cost 

$ 0.00 Date: Jan 11, 2016 
$ 5.60 
S 5.60 

Payment Type: Visa XXXXXXXXXXXX2430 
>. 0 r)) Date: Jan 11, 2018 

~ e,tAmo""t $5.60 

( { .f. 

2 

I 

{iiQ Add a rental car 

.,, Earn Rapid Rewzrdill' points 

.,, Guatqnteed IQW rates 

.,, Fro~ c,m::eHatlcn 

Boe>k acor > 

·,:., . HJ~: 

:>Travel .more.:) 
·· forless. · 

Exdusl.ve deals for your . ' 
· ·(a~o.i:lte~.sUna.tioris': · 

Sign tJp and ,;:=vi" > 

?s.outhwesf•'. :: \ 
·.~ ·1 .~. ·Rapid Rewards" 1 ;: 

' . 
. : ~ -l'.JnUmlted rew.ard seats<· 
~ No blackout dates 

· ··~ ·Redeem for 1n,ernatfomi.\ : 
·frtghts ~nd mQre · 

lmol l 1r)t.'.r > 
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Shipment Receipt 

Address Information 
Ship to: 
Allen Lichtenstein 

3315 Russell Road, No. 222 

LAS VEGAS, NV 
89120 
us 
(702) 433-2666 

Shipment Information: 
Tracking no.: 775904967664 
Ship date: 03/17/2016 

Ship from: 
John Houston Scott 
Scott Law Finn 
1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715 

San Francisco, CA 
94109 
us 
4155619601 

Estimated shipping charges: 32.49 

Package Information 
Pricing option: FedEx Standard Rate 
Service type: Priority Overnight 
Package type: FedEx Envelope 
Number of packages: 1 
Total weight: 0.80 LBS 
Declared Value: 0.00 USD 
Special Services: Residential Delivery 
Pickup/Drop-off: Drop off package at FedEx location 

Billing Information: 
Bill transportation to: MyAccount-722 
Your reference: Bryan/Hairr 
P.0.no.: 
Invoice no.: 
Department no.: 

. . . .. . ... _. ·-··-· ·- .. - . -· ..... ·····-···· .. -·- ·-··-.. ---··· -... .. ·-··-·--·· .. --.. ······ -··---·-···---·1 
1 Thank you for shipping onllne with FedEx ShlpManager at fedex.com. 

Please Note .. 
FedEx wtll not be ,.,spon1ible for any C!alm rn oxcon or $100 par package. whether lhG resull Of loss, damage, delay, non-deDvary, ffllsdellwry. or mls!nfonnaUon, Ullless you dec!are a 
hlghor value, pay on addltlonBI chorgo, documonl you1 actual 1011 and me a Umely Claim. UmllaUons found In Iha curronl FedEx Sar;fce Guida apply. Your r!ghl 10 reooverftom FedEX 
for any loss. lnclUdlng ln1lln1lcvoluo of lho packego, lou of sales. tncome 1111ero,1, prom. attomoy·a fees. cosls, ;ind ollier fonns cf damoge wholhor dlrect. lneldon!el, consoo,11enUol. or 
6pcclal le Jlmllod lo lho groalorol $100 or lho aulho112;o(f doctered vilue. Ret~vary caMol exceed 11.ctu1J d()Cj,lfflenla~ Illas. Ml!l<lmum f!lr llama of em ordinary value Is $1000, &,9., 
)11V1olry, preclou, melllla, ne~o\fable lnelnim.en~ end other llama nuoo In cur Sar,i(e,, Gulde. Wlil!en clalmr muat ba ft,adwtlhln alrllll tima llmlla; Consult !he appfleebl~ fad Ex SeNfce 
Ouldo lor dela}ls. 
Th& 01um,1e~ shipping charge moy be dlllorenl lhan lho aclual ctiargoa for your ahlpment. Offloroncos may oc:c<,rbu~ on actual "'•li;ht, dlmon,olono, and olharfOKtore. Con,uH the 
1pp11cable FgdEx Setyfe.e Guido or lha fed.Ex Rate Sha Git for dolallt on hc>w a~plng charges are calc:u!alod 

https://www.fedex.com/shipping/html/en/PrintIFrame.html 3/17/2016 

' : I 

' I I 

} I 
j 

' i 
I 

I • 
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Financial 

Bryan. Mary 
Total Financial Assessme,i t $280.50 
Total Payments and Credits $280.50 

4/30/2014 ltansactton Assessment $270.00 

4/30/2014 Efile Payment .~eceip; # 2014-50310-CCCLK Bryan, Mary ($270.00) 

7/27/2015 ll'ansactlon Assessmer,: $3.50 

7/27/2015 Efile Payment Receipt ;1 2015·78718-a:CLK Bryan, Mary ($3.50) 

3/21/2016 Transaction Assessment $3.50 

3/21/2016 Efile Payment Rete'.pt # 2016·28459-CCCli< Bryan, Mary ($3.50) 

4/21/2016 Transaction Assess'.'Ylent $3.50 

4/21/ZCl6 :=file Payment Receipt # 2n6-38796·CCCLK Bryan, Mary ($3.50) 

:ltuk. Col;(.!y S:.:;'.;:>~! Di~lf,cl w ~I 

To~;aJ "lnanc'al Asressment $182.00 

Total Payments and Credits $182,00 

6/30/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

6/30/2014 Efile Payment Receipt# 20~4-75526-CCCLK Clark County School District, ($3.50) 

7/1/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

7/1/2014 Efile Payment ll.ecelpt # 2014-75611-C:::CLK Clerk C:>~nty School District, ($3.50) 

8/1/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

8/1/2014 Efile Payment Receipt# 2014-88628-CCCli< Clark County School District, ($3.50) 

B/1/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

8/1/2014 Efile Payment Receipt # 2014-88 733-CCOJ< Clark CoLnty School District, ($3,50) 

8/7/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

8/7/i014 Eflle Payment Rece:pt ;t 2014-90709-CCCLK Clark County School District, ($3.50) 

9/10/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

9/10/2014 Efile Payment Re<"elpt # 20l4·1J3B62· O.:tk Coun:y School District, ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

9/10/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

9/10/2014 Eflle Payment Receipt ft 2C 14·104055· Clar~ Coi.;nty School District, ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

11/18/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

11/18/2014 Efile Payment Receipt if. 2014·129961· Clark County School District, ($3.50) 

CCC:.K 

11/20/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

11/20/2014 Efile Payment Receipt ;t 2014·130847· Clark Coun:y School District, ($3.50) 

CCCLX 

12/9/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

12/9/2014 Efile Payment Receipt# 2014·137192· Clar!< Cocnty School District, ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

12/10/2014 Ttansactlon $3.50 

Assessment 

12/10/2014 Efile Payment Receipt e 2014-137325- Clark County School District, ($3.50) 

CCCLI( 

1/16/2015 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 
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1/16/2015 Eflle Payment Receipt# 2015-05163-CCCLK Clark Coun:v School District, ($3.50) 

1/27/2015 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

1/27/2015 Efile Payment Receipt# 2015-08735-CCCLK aark County School District, ($3.50) 

1/27/2015 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

1/27/2015 Efile Payment Rec.eipt # 2015-06914-CCCLK Clar'~ Cocnty School District, ($3.50) 

2/25/2015 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

2/25/2015 Efile Payment Receipt# 2015-19983-CCCLK Clark Ccunty School District, ($3.50) 

10/8/2015 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

10/B/2015 EFlle Payment Receipt If. 2015-'.06564· Clark Coun':y School District, et al ($3.50} 

CCCLK 

12/2/2015 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

12/2/2015 Eflle Payment Receipt# 2015-124835- dark County School District, et al ($3.50} 

CCC~K 

12/2/2015 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

12/2/2015 Eflle Payment 'leceipt # 2015·125157· Clark C(;unty School District, et al ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

12/17/2015 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

12/17/2015 Etile Payment Receipt # 201S<3C46S· Clark Co:.mty School District, et al ($3.50} 

CCCLK 

1/5/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

1/5/2016 Efile Payment Receipt It 2016·00757-CCCLK Clark County School District, et al ($3.50) 

1/5/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

1/5/2016 Eflle Paymer, t Receipt# 2016·00877·CCCLK Clark Coun:y School District, et al ($3.50) 

1/5/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Asses~ment 

1/5/2016 Efole Payment Receipt # 2016·00906-CCCLK Clark Co~nty School District, et al ($3.50) 

1/11/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

1/11/2016 Etite Payment Receiot # 2016·(12616-CCCLK Clark Ccunty School District, et al ($3.50) 

1/13/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

1/13/2016 Efile Payment ~eceipt it 2016-03788-CCCli< Cark County School District, et al ($3.50) 

1/21/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

1/21/2016 Eflle Payment Receipt# 2016·06717-CCCLK Clark County SChool District, et al ($3.50) 

1/27/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

1/27/2016 Eme Payment Receipt It 2016-06613-CCCLK Clerk Coun:y School District, ct al ($3 .50) 

2/9/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

2/9/2016 Eflle Payment Receipt # 20:6-:3414-CCCLK Clan< Co1-nty School District, et al ($3.50) 

2/12/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

2/12/2016 Eflle Payment Receipt if. 2016·15079·CCCLK Clark County School District, et al ($3.50} 

2/16/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

2./16/2016 Efile Payment Receipt It 2016-1.5142-CCCLK Clark Co·Jn:y School District, et al ($3 .50) 

3/1/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

3/1/2016 Eflle Payment Receipt # 2016·21162-CCCLK Clark Coe nty School District, et al ($3.50) 

3/1/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 
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3/1/2016 Eflle Payment Rece;pt # 2016·21168-CCCLK Clark eou,ty School District, et al ($3.50) 

3/2/2016 Transaction $3.50 
Assessment 

3/2/2016 Efile Payment Receipt# 2016·21394·CCCLK Cark County School District, et al ($3.50) 

3/23/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

3/23/2016 Efile Payment Receipt# 2016·29482·CCCLJ< Clark ::::oun:y School District, et al ($3.50) 

3/24/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

3/24/2016 Efile Payment Receipt# 2016-29855-CCCLK Oark Covnty School Dislrlct, el al ($3.50) 

3/24/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

3/24/2016 Eflle Payment Receipt# 2016-29902<:CCLK Clark Cot:nty School District, et al ($3.50) 

4/6/2016 Transaction $3.SO 

Assessment 

4/6/2016 Eftle Payment Re::eipt # 2016·33970-CCCL,< Clark Cousty School District, et al ($3.50) 

4/7/2016 Transaction $3.SO 
Assessment 

4/7/2016 Efile Payment Receipt # 2016·3454S·CCCLK C,ark Coun:y School District, et al ($3.50) 

4/14/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

4/14/2016 Efi1e Payment Receipt Ii 2016-36878-CCCLK dark County School District, et al ($3.50) 

4/18/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

4/18/2016 Efile Payment Receipt# 2016·37752-CCCLK Clark Cou,1ty SchOol District, et al ($3.SO) 

5/16/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

5/16/2016 Efile Paymeflt Receipt# 20:6-47125-CCCLK C!ark Cou n:y School District, et al ($3.50) 

5/17/2.016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

5/17/2016 Efile Payment Receipt# 2016-47876·CCCLK Clari< Counw School District, et al ($3.50) 

7/25/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

7/25/2016 Efite Payment Rerelpt ii 2016·71205-CCCLK Clark an.nty School District, et al ($3.50) 

7/26/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

7/26/2016 Efile Payment Receipt# 2016·71557-CCC.K C.ark Coun:y SchOol District, et al ($3.50) 

8/5/2016 Transaction $3.50 
Assessment 

B/5/2016 Eflle Payment Receipt # 2016-7555:-c::o.K dark County Sdiool District, et al ($3.50) 

8/11/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

8/11/2016 Efile Payment Receipt # 2016·77728-CCCLK Clark County School District, et al ($3.50) 

8/31/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

8/31/2016 Efile Payment Receipt# 2016·84C35·CCCLJ< Clark Cou r,:y School District, et al ($3.50) 

11/8/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

11/8/2016 Efile Payment Re::eipt 1; 2016-:089·.s- Clark Coe nty Sdiool District, et al ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

11/10/2016 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

11/10/2016 Efile Payment Receipt # 2016-110202· Clark Coun~y School District, et al ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

1 l/lS/2016 Transaction p.50 

Assessment 

11/15/2016 Efile Payment Receipt# 2016-111279· Clark County School District, et al ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

4/20/2017 Transaction $3.50 
Assessment 
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FW: Bryan and Hairr v. CCSD - MSJ Order https://email.coxbusiness.comic!oud-lzmail/viewmessage?r=<reque. 

I of l 

From: "Allen Lichtenstein" <allaw~lvcoxmau.com> 
To: "Paula Newman" <paula.allaw@:vcoxmail.com> 
Oilte: 04/28/2016 06:39:12 EDT 
Subject: FW: Bryan and Hairr v. CCSD - MSJ Order 
Attachments: •·,;: _. ... : . .- · • · .. :;< ·,. 

Allen Lichtenstein 
Attorney at Law, Ltd. 
3315 Russell Road, No. 222 
Las Vegas, NV 89120 
(702) 433-2666 phone 
(702} 433-9591 fax 

IMPORTANT NOTICE: Privileged and/or confldentlal information, including attorney-client communication and/or attorney work 
product may be contained Jo this message. ThJs message Is intended only for the individual or lndlvlduafs to whom it is directed. If 
you are not an intended recipient of this message (or responsible for deliver; of this message to such person), any dissemination, 
distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited and may be a crime. No confidentiality or privilege Is waived or 
lost by any misdirection of this message. If you received this message In error, please immedtately delete it and all copies of it 
from your system, destroy any hard copies of ft and notify the sender by retum e-matr. 

•••••••• Begin forwardeo message ····•··· 
Subject: Br;an and Hairr v. CCSD - MSJ Order 
Date: 4/28/16 12:~7:35 ?:vi 
From: ''Horvath, ;.uz·· < 
To: "Waite, Dan R." <, 
Cc: "Allen Lichtenstein" <, > 

> 

>, "John Scott" <, . 

Dan, half the fees for recording and transcri,:,t are $90.14. Thank you. 

Luz Horvath 

Legat Secretary 

702.474.2649 office 

(702) 216-6169 tax 

Lewis Roca Rothgerber Christie LLP 

3993 Howard Hughes Parkway, Suite 600 

Las Vegas, Nevada 89169-5996 

lrrc.com<· .. · :> 

> 

' i. 
i 

\ ' · 

' • :> 

This message and any attachments are intended only for the use of the mdtvidual or entity to which they are addressed. If the 
reader of this message or an attachment Is not the intended recipient or the employee or agent responslble for delivering the 
message or attachment to the Intended recipient you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this 
message or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication In error, please notify us Immediately 
by replying to the sender. "!'he Information transmitted In this message and any attachments may be orivlleged, is intended only 
for the personal and confl<!ential use of the intended recipients, and is ccvered by the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 
u.s.c. §2510-2521. 

,i ("\(\l"'\1\1 r. A,A \ n., 
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FedEx H1lltng Unlme 1mps:1 rwww. tea ex .com11eoex m 111ngonune, pagt:s1 pn mc:111,c:1,m y, p1 m ... 

FedEx Billlng Online r--·~ *·--~-.,....,,--.,.,,.._...,...,,..._......,. __ ~~ .... ---'"'-.... .,. __ .. _______ .., ....... u;s ... :rlllf.. 

I of I 

I "Tracking 10 Details 

Tracking 10 Summ;,ry 

Bllllng Information 

Tr•<;king 10 no. 

lnvoJce no, 

Account no. 
8illdalo 

ToLel 8111e~ 

Tracking ID 8$llinte due 

Slafus. 

.V.i"t"r. ,~~ ~.i.C:t). .~ ~.,5.!~,l,',l; 

.Y~'~. f~W~!•.1!~f~1 f!~'\J! ~.1.~~~.1.i~~HY 

Tr.msaction D&tails 

Sandor lnlormallon 

John HOU$10n $(:OR 

Scull \.sw FW"m 

1368 Suller Sln,et, Suilo 715 

SAN FRANCISCO CA 94109 

us 

Shipment Details 

Ship d•I• 

Paym•ntly('lc 

Se-rviet!' lype 

Zotti:, 

Pecka9e lype 

' wei9hl 

f'i41ces 

Motet No. 

Oaclarod vah,e 

Orlulnel R9tsrence 

Cu61omer reforone., no. 
Oopartment no. 
R~reun~c4' N2 

Rororeneu 113 

Proof of Delivery 

Oclh,&ry dais 

Scrvlc:A erea c:.ode 

Slgnod by 

~;l!l>t.i.;.f.:1!~~t•m i!H.l~J.~( 29.lt.:f:!fY. 

.:!~ 77?6'9412111 ~~ 

A-<a<-4350'. 

25>9-5•72·2 

f"/(l(l/2016 

S115.11 

so.oo 
PoidCC 

'.1/0912016 
Shiope· 

~es:tE.x Psi-;-ri~y OvemigM 

C< 
C•J&len'er f,>sd~ag'ng 

16.00 lbs 

14<:1208 

SO.DO 

un:110,s c9:<8 

A'. 

M.MAA . .JZ 

Meuages 

Fo'.lEx t,;,s asol!•J lhl~ sh'pr:,er~ f-<:rcorrec1 pscksg ~1!!£9.. 
o:s1a°'ce 9asc:i Pclcing, Zo"'te 4 
F .Jtl St.cch,·ga • !='edE"X 1\8:S eo'!lfil!C a fl•e: stu'th~f9 Hr.e.r.t t<l»:!t.. •• 
iie pa-¢ko9e w$'.9h( uoeeds lhe n:1xU'0..1cn for tho pac B~!~.11..~!>.'!.:., 

Recipient lnforTT1allo~ 

A.len lichle'1sklf'l 

33! 5 R\,~ell Ros~. No. m 

LA$VECAS NII $012~ 

"JS 

Chargos 

lri."1:t~r18lion Charge 

Feel Strchargo 

·~•.,da)' O~(l.,ocy 

AJ\011ali0"1 D0r11.:s Jiscoc.-nt 

Tole ehtr9os 

125.09 
2.53 

o.oo 
-1'2.51 

$115.11 

11/21/2016 11:33 AM 
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Depo llltem.aUauJ 
703. Soll1h Eighth Stlfft 

l.vVegu,NV89101 
Ph! 80059L9722 Pa: 702.386.98ZS 

John Houston Stott 
SCOtt Law Rnn 
1388 SUtter Sb"eet 
Suite 715 
san Francisco, CA 94109 

ORIGINAL TRANSCRIPT 
Robert Beastey 

·If you t.tave anv que.suons, vou may comet our bTinng department: 
Bllllng@depolntB'natfomil.com 

Thank you·for·yaurbuslness! 

I<~ VOICE 
In~ce:~~~ Invoi~ Data lob.l~O, 

30045 11/9/2016 20057 

JohDa~ qtseNo. 

1/26/2016 A-14-700018-C 

~seNaine 

Mary Bryan, et al. vs. aark County School Dlstrtct, et al, 

Payme1_1tTen1JS 

Due upon rt!a!lpt (l.5%/mO·& ool!ectton) 

TOTAL DUE >>> 

By --::::::=:==-.-:----····w 

Tu JD: 45·0581340 Phone: (415) 561·9601 Fax:(415) 561-9609 

Ple<JNe detach bottom portion and tvtum wtth payment. 

John Housmn Scott 
Soott Law Firm 
1388 Sutter Street 
Suite 715 
San Francisco, CA 94~09 

Remit To: Depa Jntematlonal 
703 Sout.11 Eighth Street 
Las Vegu, NV 89101 

: 20057 BUID :2-DI LV 

: A-14-700018.C 

Job No. 
case No. 
0!5eName : Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark Coontv. School 

District, et al. 
lnvok:e No. 
Total Due 

: 30045 Invoice Date : 11/9/2016 
: $ 46.00 

PAYMENT WIIH CREDIT CARD ~~ 11111.-~M-J 
carohotdel's Nam~ 

card Number: 
Exo. Date: Phone#: 
BIiiing Address: 
Zip: caro Security Code: 
Amount to Charge: 

c.ardho!der's Signature: 

Emalf: 

l I 

~ l 
I 

I ! 

. 
I 

I I 
I 
I 

I 
I ! 

I 
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Depo Intematfonal 
703 Sauth l!lgbth Street 

Las Vegas, NV 89101 
Ph! 800.591.9722 Fax: 702.386.9825 

John HoustDn Scott 
Scott law Finn 
1388 Sutter street 
Suite71S 
san Frandsco, CA 94109 

ORIGJNAL lRANSCRIPT 
Cheryl Winn 

If you have any questk>ns, you may <Xlntact our bllllng departn!ent: 
Bllllng@d~nb:!matfonal.ccm 

I(~ VOICE 
In.voice No., :rnvo~~ Date lob."o, 

30044 . 11/9/2016 19283 
lob~ ~No. 

11/3/2015 A-14-700018-C 

~N.a.~e .. 
Mary Bryan, et at. vs. Clark county school District, et. al. 

p~ymt!ltt Tl!lrtns 
Due upon rea!lpt (1.So/o/mo & mrection} 

151.00 ·.. . ~· .· 

Tax 1D: 45-0581340 Phone: (415} 561-9601 Fax:(415) 561-9609 

Please dBt«ch bottom portion and retum with paymem. 

John Hoostnn SCOtt 
Sc.ott law Arm 
1388 Sutter Street 
Sulte715 
San Francisco, CA 94109 

Remit To: Depo lntematlonal 
703 South Eigllth Street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 

Job No. : 19283 BU ID :2-DI LV 
Case No. : A-14-700018-C 
Case Name : Marv Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County School 

District, et al. 

Invoice No. : 30044 Invoice Date : 11/9/2016 
Total Due : $ 151.00 

PAYMENT WJIH CREDIT CARD 
Cardho!der's Name: 
card Number: 
Elq:). Date: Phone#: 
BIiiing Address: 
Zip: Card Security Olde: 
Amount t'o Charge: 
cardholders Stgnature: 
Email: 

• . . 
' I I 

t 
~ 
f 
I 
! I 

' I l 

I 

f , 

! I 
i l 
' 
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Depo lntamatronal 
703South!iablh5m!d: 

Les Vegas., NV89101 
P.11:800591.9722 FM! 702.38&.9825 

John Houm,n Scott 
SCOtt Law ffm'I 
13S8 Sutter street 
Sufte71S 
san Francisco, CA 94109 

ORIGJNAL TRANSCRJF'f 
Warren McKay 

~f y.ou,have anv.qu~ons, you may cxintactourb!Ulng department: 
Bllllng@depolntemattonal.mm 

Thank you tor your business, -

Tax IO: 45-0581340 

JC~1 VOICE 
JnvolceNo. Involr;e Date :iotilio: 

30046 11/9/2016 19282 
Job Dale CBseNo. 
1l/2/201S A· 14--700018-C 

~NBIJ'!e 

Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Oark. County Sdlool District, et al. 

PaYIIW!n~ Terms 

Due upon receipt (1.5%/mo Sc. colfectfon) 

. 

l3too . .... . 
TOTAL DUi: >>> 

Phone: (415) 561-9601 Fax:(415) 561·9609 

Please detach bottom portion and return with payment. 

John Houston Scott 
Scott Law Ftrm 
1388 Sutter Street 
Sulte715 
San Francisco, CA 94109 

Remit To: Depo International 
703 South Eighth Street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 

Job No. ; 19282 BU 10 : 2-DJ LV 
Case No. : A-14--700018-C 
case Name : Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark Counly School 

D1sb1ct, et al. 
Invoke No. : 30046 Invoice Dat:e : 11/9/2016 
Total Due : $ 137.00 

PAYMENT WUH CREDIT CARD 
cardholders Name: 
Card Number; 
exp. Date: Phone#; 
B!ll!ng Address: 
Zip: Card Security Code: 
Amount to Charge: 
cardholc:ler's Signature: 
email: 

. i 
r I 

~ 
t I 

[ 
i 
t 
i I 

i 
~ 
~ 

t 
l 
j 

f. 
i 
I 

. . 
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IJepo Jntemalfmial 
703 South Eighth Street 

LasVegas,NV89101 
Ph: 800591.972Z Fax: 702.386.9825 

John Housmn Stott 
Scott Law Firm 
1388 Sutter Street 
Sulte71S 
San Francisco, CA 94109 

ORIGINAL TRANSCRlPr 
Deanna Wright 

If you have any questions, you mav contact our bllling department: 
Bllllng@depolmematronal.com 

11tank .you "for' youf"oos1ness1 · 

lnvMc:e: No. J nvofi::le Dal'e JobN~~ 
30047 11/9/2016 19639 

Job Date case No. 

11/16/2015 A~1+700018-C 

~Name 
Mary Bryan, et: al. vs. aark County School District, et al. 

PaymantTemu; 

Due upon receipt (1.5%/mo & ootlection) 

TOTAL DUE >>> · · ·' '" $5l~C.)'O 

Tax ID: 45--0581340 Phone: (415) 5'61-9601 Fax:(415) S61-9609 

Please riet'1ch bottom portion and re/um with payment. 

John Houston Soott 
Scott Law Firm 
1388 Sutter Street 
Sulte715 
San Francisco, CA 94109 

Remit To: Depo International 
703 SouUt Eighth street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 

Job No. : 19639 BUID :2-DI LV 
Case No. : A~l4-700018-C 
case Name : Mary Bryan, et al. vs. aark c.ounty School 

Dlstrtct, et al. 
Invoice No. : 30047 Invoice Date : 11/9/2016 
Total Due : $ 51.00 

PAYMENT WUH CREDIT CARD ~I • [;rtffl1.I 
cardholdets Name: 
card Number. 

Phone#: 
Bl!Qng Address: 
Zip: card Security Code: 
Amount t:o Charge: 
can:1ho!der's Signature: 
Email: 

! I 

I 
i 
I 

I 
·, 

I 

.. 

. . 
' 

l ? 

' 

' I 
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Office DEPOT 
r OfficeMax= '~ 

\. 

OFFICE DEPOT SlORE #271b 
5915 S. EASTERN AVE 

LAS VEGAS NV 89119 
C 702) 736-1427 

11/09/2016 16 . 8 . 2 
STR 2715 REG 1 TRN 796 

SALE 

5;25 PH 

EMP 7<15904 

Product ID Descr1pt1on Total 
998112 INDEX,READY,1-

5 ~ 5.79 
Yau Pe~ 

Subtotal : 

Sales Ta:.<: 
Toic1l : 

MasterCard 8<161 : 

f!Ul II com: 76832P 
TDS r.1,;.p Read 

28.% 
28.965S 

28.9b 
2.J6 

31. 31 
31. 31 

AID A000000004\010 MasterCard 
TVR 0800008000 
CVS No S19n<1ture Required 
XXXXXXXll~XX~~XXX~X~IXXl~XJKX~xx•l•~1,xxx1 

Al.I rN LI CH l ENS l 1::: IN Al. TURNEY A 3 3261 0 I 98 
Please crea1e ~our online rewards 
account at oH 1 <:eoP.pot co111/r·ewarcb 
You l'lU&f complete ~our <1r.cmmt i·a 
t: la 1111 your· r·e~,.,rds and v I ew ';lour 

st,rtus. 

Shop on l 111!! at www. off i cedero t coni 

xxxx)xxxxx~xxx~xx1.x,x,xr~xxxx•xxxxxxxxx~xx 
WE WANT TO HEAR FROM YOU! 

Part 1c1pate in our onl ine custulller 

$Urve~ and receive a c:OUf'Dfl for 

$10 off ~our next ~ualif~ins 
purchase af $50 or ~ore on 

,..er ......... .,. •• """'' ,__ t-.. --' .1 

--...-....:.--;: .... 

Fed~~{Office .. t; 
l : • ) 

,· 
~: . . f ,: :ell r. ill I ; , ,r, : . ·/i ;1; r I I•':, i i, 1< !I i n'I 

f ! or I H i I !! i 1!!) ,111:I .. II I i ;; ; i 11, l . 

1
)/ :

1
·, \ I .i:.t,;111 1'."': 

I.•:, ',i; fJ,::,. tN WI i l!! 
I c t . { IU'! i /'.)!1 ,1,11 i) 

'.l 9!2016 5:33:06 PM PSi 
1 E: am MrnlJ2 r : l f:B '· e , M . 
Cus: Dmor : Ai ·! ,:;r; Lichte. i:. t8 in 

IJlliMi 

De:;; i,;:;n Paper/S112et 
uOfJ 700 Reg. Pr 1 cf. 
r-'.etla n8rl I tern 

Suti--Total 
Tax 
Oepo:> it 

Iota l 

MasterCar.:l (Si 
Account: B46: 

:?.!i l~ 
n 'lh ..., ;L,., 

.l\U~h: Sy:; . .:.i1tiiC11.i:: ! !, ) 

Iota! TPr1!b 
lt)i\rlJE; ill It: 

i 1.L5UO T 

(fi. ?:i) 
( il. !', I I 

u.uu 

(G.(6) 

~i:i.76) 

l [; {!I) 

l).110 

l llllll lllll 1li!l 11111 lil!l lllll llill iitll l!l!! lllll !llli llll 1111 
* I 3 O 1 O O 3 3 4 9 5 * 

jJ .,, 

"' Fed. . l . or··· ....l"'\-. v · . . Ir-.. :.::i )1' , ~ A{. I .L,L. I ..,t15 

f edf:.i. (it f L8 is fi• Jr Ub t i 11£1. t L,n 
I !)t' i)i n ti, 19 ar11.:: :;it if,µ i riu. 

5775 S Eastern A~o 
:. as Vf.g1s, NV 891 i 9 
iel: 17W) ?3S·4402 

d !S/2iJ lfi 4 :40:0'.1 PM FS: 
·r 8du~ Mr:mLiP. r : Le:, i u M . 

!·;/iLF 

ksi}n Paper/~neet 
OOU !OU Heg , i=I r ic:., 

Bnd rF~·::oV :·!. :) i ni~ln 1 C: 
004413 Re~~- !-'•·ice 

f<2guiar fu'l<.1 i 
f.! i S (.:()I 11 ii '.'~ 

'lotal 

~t rota! 
r~ 
Daposit 

IOI.ii I 

Mt1:; l i!I i'.,1;, l { ;,; i 
ACCi!i.111 t : 84l.i I 
l1ut h: H8b/fjl' i /i) 

T uta l T ende, 
rl1imge Due 

lotal Discounts 

2:1 :1 
0.2~ 

~I ~t 

2,q9 

:)1 lD 
L1.t)O 

2 l .7.0 

( 

(J.00 

0 .i:.~t}j ·1 

2 .'.fi((! l 

21.lO 
1.n 
n.,.i\ 

22.83 

~J~l .. 
'· ·;; ']\ 

1 11 ~ 

'22.82 
U. •)!' 

,l~V 
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TRA.~SCRIBER'S BILLING INFORMATION 
DISTRICT COURT XXVII 

DATE OF INVOICE: 11/22/16 

CASE# A700018 

CASE NAME: Mary Bryan vs. Clark County School District, et al 

HEARING DATE: 11 /1 5/16-1 1 /18/16, 11/22/15 

DEPARTMENT # DISTRICT COURT 27 

ORDERED BY: Allen Lichtenstein, Esq. 
FIRM: 
EMAIL: allaw@lvcoxmail.com 

COURT RECORDER! Trad Rawlinson 

PHONE NUMBER: 70.2-671-0883 
PAYABLE TO: Make check payable to: 

Clark County Treasurer 
County Tax ID#: 88-6000028 
Include cits~ number on check 

Mailin,: Address: 
Regional Justice Center 
Fiscal Services 
Attn: Kim Ockey 
200 Lewis Ave. 
Las Ve2as, NV 89155 

BILL AMOUNT: CDs @ S25 each = 
22 hours @J S40 an hour record int? f ce = 

pages (@ I S3.80 I per pa~e of trans.= 
TOT AL: (50/50 split between Plaintiff and 

Defeodant) = 

PAYABLE TO Make check payable to: 
OUTSIDE 
TRANSCRIBER: 
BILL AMOUNT: pages@ s per page of trans 

DATE PAID: 

$ 

$ 880.00 
$ 

S 440.00 

$ 

I ;:,\\\(',(d' l .• \', H '. '\~~-: ;,, I q l ' } { ~ l ( 1 ~ I : I I° \ .~~ 

I '\ rt I. P \ \ \ II '\ I l , I< I < I I I I) 

I 

I 

I 
l 
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. DEPOSIT ll~!"·yo1cE 
KIMBERLY LAWSON 
KARR REPORTING, INC. 
25730 East Euclid Drive 
Aurora; CO 80016 

CLIENT 

ALLEN K. LICHTENSTEIN, ESQ. 
33l5 Russon Road 
N'o. 222 
Las Vegas, NV. 89120 

••-*DEPOSIT ...... 
MARY BRYAN V CCSD 

CASE NO. A700018 
DEPT NO. XXVIJ 
JUDGE: NANCY ALLF 

,' ·, 
•, j 
. ' 

Due Date 
Other 

Subtotal 

Date 11/28/2016 

11/30/2016 

2,000.00 2,000.00 

Sales Tax (0.0%) 

'------·--------------------' Total 

$2,000.00 

$0.00 

$2,000.00 
KIMBERLY LAWSON 
karreportlng@comcast.net 
Tax ID No. 27-2346646 

720-244-3978 
Fax 720-524-7785 

r 

' 
' . 

I 

j 

I 
I I 

I 
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·-1 I~-, - tT·"C.\/ I 

FedmOffice, .. $ 
'v 

FedEx Off 1 en is ,our cest '1 :1at 101 
fc; pr 1nt i ng and sti ';::r: irs, 

S775 S Easter~ Ave 
Las Vegas, NV \3S~i3 
Tal: (7~12) 735.44:2 

3/1S/20i7 4: 52: C5 P~' i::s T 

Team Memner: ~ichael S. 
:usto1r.e;·: t.aL;r a L ictr::f:nst1:dn 

SA~E 

A-Day 2 A·· 14·.-100018-

B('l 
1 ., 
~~ ()n 24# i·lnt 

000330 Reg. Price 
CJil Mixed Covers 

D00887 Reg. Price 

Price per piece 
Re~rJ 1 ar 1 O!~ l 
Discount$ 

B·Day 2 A-l4-'f00018-

Bi·I lS Jr' 24# ~'f!1 t 
00033Q Reg. Pr~ce 

Coil Mixed Covers 
000887 Reg. Price 

Price per piece 
Regular Total 
Discounts 

l>Day 2 A-14- 700018-

m·i IS on 2411 l•Jht 
000330 Reg. Pr tee 

:oil Mixed Covers 
00~887 Reg. PriGe 

P !. ~ Ge pet p it~Ce 

Reg~i 1 a~ T Dtc. '. 
D: scc~1r::s 

0~b-Tutal 
Tax 
Deposit 

Qty 1 

166 ~ 
0. 14 

1 (1 
4.99 

zc.57 
28.23 

·1.66 

Qty 1 

160 
,.. 
~ 

J.14 
1 

;,;. 
·~ 

4.93 

25. 79 
27.33 

~. ec 

Qty l 

220 1 
G. '. 4 

< l 
t ~·o . ·~'"' 

33 r;c 
-;i; ·~-,w 
-- I ••..< 

2 ~{". 

L;.; 

26.57 

J.13CC 

4 .~90(i 

25.79 

r:. 12cc 

4.99~0 

33.59 

:J. 13CC 

4 .9SQ(j 

fl:i . 95 
7 .·.Jn 
~.JC 

•,• 

T 

' 

T 

i 

T 

T 

-

Total 92.95 

FedEx Cf f •,ce i.s your dest inat '1 on 
for printing and shipping. 

6775 S Eastern Ave 
Las Vegas, NV 89119 
Te!: {702) 735~4402 

3/28/20i5 2:37: 15 PM PST 
Team Me!1i::e :- : ~n chae l s . 

SALE 

A~to Scan-To-PDF 
002662 Reg. Pr1ce 

Regu;ar Total 
Oisc::..:r.ts 

Total 

SJb-Tctal 
Tax 
Ceposi~ 

Total 

>,1as:arCan:i {S) 
:l:;::OJ'";1:: 84e 1 
. • ~ · ;:, 'ii:;.PO I ' ) ....... ., : .., : . ...,..;, \A 

:::. en;:3er 
Char:ge Due 

71 ~ 0 .4800 T 
0.89 

63.19 
28.40 

34.79 

34.79 
2.84 
0.00 

37.63 

37.63 

37.63 
0.00 
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~Office ... $ 
/I 

ccsD . r·c._l-{ , /) .•. _) J t,1,~ l 

dt '., t ~.if 4. 
Fellfx Gffice is your dest ina~ ion 

for printing and shippir\, 

5Ti5 S tastern A-1e. 
Las Vegas, NV 89119 
Tel: (1021 73~·4402 

10/23i201!:i 1 :5S:53 PN PS1 
1 eam Member: Lester tt 

S.~LE 

CO Burn ·· Add' 1 
0.03025 Ren. ?rice 

Regular Total 
OiscoL1nts 

Total 

Sut· feta I 
Tax 
Deposit 

Total 

MasterCard (S) 
Account : 8461 
Auth: 91125P (A) 

Total ·render 
Change Due 

1 (I!! 9.9900 ., 
9.99 

9.99 
0.00 

9.99 

S.99 
0.81 
0.00 

10.80 

10.80 

10.80 
0.00 

,-?f!lvr· 1U --~ 
) 

\I 
\j 

Fecf~{Offtce, .. $ 

Fedtx Off i(;e is ~'our ciE:st inat ion 
for P• i,it ing and sbiprir:g. 

577.5 S Eastern A-1e 
las Vegas, tN 89119 
,fd: (702) ns--441l2 

3/16/2017 1 :5/:17 PH PSI 
Team Member : Dust in D . 
f:u5torner; Leura L id:tenstP-ill 

SALE 

Quick Order 

5~! iS on ~'.4# \·Jht 
000330 Reg. Price 

fail Mixed Covers 
000881 Reg. Price 

Pr ice pn rri ew 
Regular Total 
Oiscounts 

::;utJ Total 
lax 
Deposit 

lotal 

MasterCcmj lS) 
Ar-cm.mt : 8461 
Aut h: o3686P l ;\ l 

lotal Tender 
Change Due 

Qty 1 

205 ~ 
0. 14 

1 l! 
4.m) 

31 . 6-1 
'.3:i.69 
2.05 

3l.H4 

U.1300 T 

4.9900 1 

31.64 
2 .58 
0.00 

:i4.22 

34.22 

34,22 
0.00 

Fed _.J - , rr·· " ::r· "' . a L.1---) 

J ~"'· ( J f( .{ , ~) 

~X,,,'l./ 1 /tt'.t.~ 

Fe&;., 11 f f ! Ct-: js ;did:· ;jt-S ti 11a ti :.if! 
f ;';[ il! i, ·,t hJ i:11 Ki :·J: h:i~iif"IQ. 

., .......... . 
-+/ : / Ll.l ib 

YU':J ~ raster n A.1~: 
l d5 \'egos, N'/ 8!) 119 
re:. U02) t35·4402 

7 :S0:~2 !)l ?)i 
Te;r l4er.ibt:; . ;-11:.ha:::: i S. 

SALE 

:~ 

Au D Sen', T.1 P; 1;: en ll C .!i80n T 
001.862 Pen P··icE IUJ~· 

f<e::iu I (1: : , , t i.il 
fl i s;::,t 1111 :, 

Total 

'.,ub Tut n l 
I ,.!1 

I 11:P(,:, 1 I 

lot11 I 

V i ~,i~ { ~~ 1 

/\( '(I JI /i ii ; 1 t !.!, I 

/iut ii: l•tj; 1 )fi ;_ ·" :, 

Total : cndf. r 
Chan;;ie r;,1£· 

il./G 
1? .1lG 

a9.20 

3!l. ?.O 
3.19 
.I. (Ji_; 

42.39 

42.3~ 

4/.39 
u.00 / 
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·, Oe~or 
'fr@M<:Uon 

!0/12 

JO!l 1 

10}13 

l(l/'l,'3 

tO/i!:I 

10i12 

1011a 

10/17 

t0f15 

10/1fl 

10/19 
)0/19 

10(19 

IOJ19 

10/i9 

10/01 

TO/~'.) 

10/20 

!0/20 

f0/20 

10/22 

!0/22 

10/?.3 

10/24 

10124 
10/?.0 

10.127 

l(.VU 

!OJ31 

I 1/02 

·11102 

11/02 

11103 

11/04 

11/0,1 

11/0.'I 
j flf\A 

Mos.i~e-your ~C'1<:1unr ()('!!Joo: 
~~:@fil 

M~rcflanl' N11m-o ()( T rllt\~BCUOll L>i!SClif)li-On 

RIVERSIDE SF.A.FOOD RESTAVR SAN FRANO!SCO CA 

lHRIHY CA!=l RENTAL BOSTON MA 

CC Sf MTA IP$ PRKNG METER SAt~ t'AANCISCO CA 

SAM TRUONGS 78 SAN FRANCISCO CA 

EMO/\SSY surri::s BOSTON BOSTON Ml\ 
NEWSL!NK28 803 E BfJSTON MA 

SQUT~IWES 5262 f5()8G2$70 600-'135-9792 TX 
1'0315 I T LAS SFO 

CHEAP PETE'S SF SAN FRANCISCO CA 

HARSOH COMPOLJ.NDING&HOM 84!Hl>12010B CA 

ANDREW PALL08 DDS t.AfllJNA NIGUIEL GA 

FOINH3 AAPID RF.WAROS 800-,K!E-$79~ IL 

CASA LAGUNA INN & LAGUNA BEACH GA 

SOUTMW£S 5262152008162 800-435 9792 TX 
121215 t S SFO $NA 

2 S .!.:!NA SFO 

SOUTHWES 621.)'2162-567976 800"135-979.2 TX 
112~16 I O SfO SNA 

2 S $NA SFO 

SOUTllWe3 5262t~543670 000-4.'-\S-9792 TX 
IWIS 1 S SFO SNA 

l!M SNA SFO 

F&O·Fronk&<>uk 855-5765626 DE 

SOUTHWF..5 5252 IG/!62()~16 800-43!i·9782 l'X 
1~616 f S SN,\ 8FO 

2 T SFO SNA 

SOIJl"HWES 62621ii2aa8308 000·4~·970~ iX 
111716 1 T $NA SFO 

2 M $FO $NA 

SOUTHWES 62i215.2827685 800'435-9'7~ TX 
1110Hi IT SNA SFO 

2 M SF.O SNA 

,IETSlUE 270214000l7S5 SALT LAl<F. CTY UT 
121915 1 Y BTV JFK 

2 Y JFK SF-0 

3 YO SfO ,lFK 

4 YX Jf'K BTV 

LUX SALON FUUERTON CA 

CCSF MTA IPS PRKNG METER SAN FRANCISCO CA 

AU:lORZ RESTAORANl' SAN FRANCISC() CA 

SHEU. OIL 5744421!>204 SAN FAANClsr",O CA 

FULLERTON PHOTOGRAPHIC FUilERrQN CA 
f'P'ONEOC .402-005-?.2<14 CA 

Tt-1/:IIFTYRENTAI.Flt-.lECOM 1>77.759..SSZB AZ 

Tl-IE BONE ADVENTURE COSTA MESA CA 
76 100984&"1 COSTA MESA CA 

FEOEXOFFU)E 000074 ll:l LAS VeOAS NV 

THE SICILIAN RISfORANTl: LAS VEGAS NV 

Gf\NDI II INDIAS CU!S!Nl:' LAl.l Vt:GAS NV 

ANDREW PAlLOS DDS LAGUNA NIGUEL CA 

THMIH NGOC PHAN TAXICAB SAN FRANCISCO CA 

OAl<I.AND P1\Rl(ING ME.TF.R 800-500-6484 CA 

ARAWAN THAI BISTRO DESS!:: LAS VEGAS NV 

CL/lllOlll~? S&t\ile&; 
1·800•'/li):l!-0001 

$/1niounl 

125.92 

I, 165.26 

2.77 

45.4~ 

.200.!M 

.23.20 

6.60 

66.70 

216.00 

600.00 

166.00 

800.-00 

1120 

! 1,:20 

H)7.00 

lti6.96 

186.96 

100.06 

6!!8.5.?. 

369.24 

t1.n 
47.G4 

3iMe 
.217.30 

650.00 

20.2G 

84..00 

4i'.94 

IOJ:lO 

fOOA& 
25.64 

aoo.oo 
S2.00 

,too 
25.61 -
A<:tl 

.. 
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L 
DEPARTMENT CODE LIST 

TIME : 06-26-2015 13:01 

DEPARTMENT 

~ I NT COUNTER 

FULL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

SMALL 0 20 20 SMALL 0 o· 0 
I.AAGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 20 20 0 0 0 0 

Bl.ACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 I 0 0 0 0 0 0\ I 

\ I FAX COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK ' - I TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NElWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

I 
SMALL 0 0 SMAU. 0 0 0 0 0 0 l i.ARGE 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 • J 0 0 0 . I ., l I IEPT NO. DEPARTMENT I 

I Bryan, Mary/Hairr -1~1.~ 
!' 

I 42 f 
' I 

RI NT COUNTER 
r 

JLL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LlMtT COPY PRINT .TOTAL 

'1ALL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

I 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

f\CK \ 
COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT I 

ALL 0 0 136 0 136 
tGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 136 0 136 0 

COMMUN I CA Tl ON SCAN COUNTER 
•r FULL COLOR TWIN/ MONO COLOR BL.ACK I 

I 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NE"TWORK COPY COPY FAX NETIVORK I 
LL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 I 
3E 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 \ t 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 I . 
\ 
I 
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OEPARlMENT CODE UST 
TIME : 09· 14-2015 09:28 

:~· 0. DEPARTMENT .,_,. 
IT COUNTER 

• COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

LL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
iE 0 Q 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

;K 
COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

LL 0 0 0 0 0 
;E 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 ' 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER ,, ; 

FULl COLOR TIVI N/MONO COLOR BlACK ! 

i 
TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NElWORK t 

1 

LL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 ' l 

;e 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 ! 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

. NO. OEPARTIAENT 
d~ 12 Bryan, Mary/Hairr I 'f, . , 

fT COUNTER 

• COLOR. TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

..l 0 20 20 SMALL 0 0 0 
;E 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 20 20 0 0 0 0 I , , I 
:K 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 
_L 0 0 0 0 0 
iE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK -TRANSMIT ,RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

~ 

LL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
;e 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 -

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

. 
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DEPARTMENT CODE LIST 
TIME : 12·07•2015 11 :38 

DEPARTMENT 
Bryan, Mary/Hairr _ 1/, d..! o . c../0 

t I NT COUNTER \ 
l 

LL COLOR· lWIN/ MONO COLOR 
I 

' COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL I I ' 
ALL 0 27 27 SMALL 0 0 0 I I 
tGE 0 -0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 i I 

! 

0 27 Zl 0 0 0 0 
I 

i . 
CK 

\ COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIM IT 

Ll 237 0 788 0 1025 
i 

I 
,E 0 0 0 0. 0 

237 0 788 0 1025 0 ' '•. 
'· 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR BLACK I -

-mANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NElWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK r 
0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 118 0 0 
0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 ·118" 0 0 

NO . DEPARTMENT ., n . . . .._.. 
COUNTER I I 

I I 
OLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR i i 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL I \ 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 a 
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 '\ \ 

I 
: 

COPY FAX PRINT L I ST TOTAL UMlT 

0 0 0 0 0 
0 0 a 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

IUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
!K -

FULL COLOR 1WfN/ MONO COLOR BLACK ·o • I - 0 
RANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NElWORK COPY COPY FAX NElWORK -0 

0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 a 0 0 
0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
; 

1 -
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.. ·~:·i"."';"~~~=~~~~;.F~~~~~-~~·.;;;-·~_;_:..:.~~'-.. ~~~~6-~~::_~::.:.:;:--:::.~.::~~,·)~ .. 

DEPARTMENT CODE LIST 
TIME : 02-04-2016 11 :59 

DEPARTMENT 1. 
Bryan, Mary/Hairr / "j/J t. (.QQ 

PRINT COUNTER 

FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY •PRINT TOTAL 

SMALL 0 33 33 SMALL 0 0 0 

LARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 33 33 0 0 0 0 

BLACK 

COPY FAX PRJNT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

SMALL 82 0 838 0 920 

LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

82 0 838 0 920 ~ 

FAX COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FU{.L COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR SLACK --

~SMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NE'TWORK 

SMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 42 0 0 

LARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 /' 42 0 0 

" 
DEPT NO. DEPARTMENT 

D 43 1111 
PRINT COUNTER 

FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

SMALL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 

LARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

B
1
LACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

FAX COMMUNICATJON SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

SMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 

LARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 ·o 

0 0 
~ 

0 0 0 0 0 0 
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PARTMENTCOOE LIST 
TIME : 03-03-2016 17:53 

DEPARTMENT 

,::ULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

SMALL 0 39 39 SMAU 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 39 39 0 0 0 0 

3LACK 
i 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT I 
;MALL 0 0 0 0 0 ' I 

I 
ARGE 0 0 0 0 0 I 

0 0 0 0 0 0 
l 

\, 

i I f\X COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR nv, N/MONO COLOR BLACK 

\ I TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NEnVORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

4All 0 0 SMALl 0 0 0 0 0 0 l \ 
RGE 0 0 l.ARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 I I 0 0 0 0 0 .,. 0 0 0 

I 

I· ' PT NO. DEPARTMENT 

~f&,'1· io I I 42 Bryan, Mary/Ha Irr 

NT COUNTER I i .L COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL llMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

J.L 0 13 13 SMALL 0 0 0 i 
:;e 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

1, 

!' I 

0 13 13 0 0 0 0 ! 
i~ 

~K \\ - COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL l.lMlT it 

.L 21 0 303 0 324 
1; 
~·. 

E 0 0 0 0 0 
;1 
I 

21 0 303 0 324 0 

:OMMUN I CAJ' I ON SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR lWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK .. 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NElWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK ' 
! 

0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 21 0 0 
0 0 LAAGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 . 
0 0 a 0 0 21 0 0 i : 

i I 
I • 
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L.l.. 

TIME . : 04-03·2017 11 :00 

INT COUNTER 

LL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

IALL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 

RGE 0 .o 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

ACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

!ALL 0 a 0 0 0 

RGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

X COMMUN I CATI ON SCAN COUNTER \ 
FULL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR l3LACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

IALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 

RGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

PT NO. OEJ:>ARTMENT 
'I 

42 Bryan, Mary/Hairr -1;2.3. <,O 

INT COUNTER 

LL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY 'PRINT TOTAL 

!ALL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 

RGE 0 0 0 . LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

ACK 

COPY FAX PRINT 'LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

tALL 0 0 118 0 118 

RGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 118 0 118 0 

.X COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR BLACK --

TRANSMIT I RECEPTION COPY NEnYORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

~ALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 

.RGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

.. 
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'"'"" .... ~ 'I' ~ -.:~::.-.·:· .. --=·· 

ARTMENT CODE LIST 
TIME . : 06-08·2017 l 0:33 

I 
DEPARTMENT I 

I ._.. 
I 
I 

I 
LL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR I 

I 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

\ ALL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
iGE 0 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 

I 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

\CK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

\LL 0 0 0 0 0 
GE 0 0 0 0 0 

~ 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
\ 

FULL COLOR "TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NElWORK 

LL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
3E 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
! ., 

. NO. DEPARTMENT ., t tf'I- {o -2 Bryan, Mary/Hairr 

T COUNTER 
I 

COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR r 
! 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL I 

L 0 141 141 SMALL 0 0 0 I - 0 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 

0 141 141 0 0 0 0 I 
I 

' 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL UM!T 

0 0 81 0 81 
,. 

0 0 0 0 a 
0 0 81 0 81 0 

JMMUNJCATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR lWI N/MONO COLOR Bl.ACK - < TRANSMIT R~CEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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DEPARTMENT CODE UST 
TIME :09-01-201614:18 

0 . DEPARTMENT ........... 
NT COUNTER 

>. 

L COLOR lWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL. LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

.LL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
3E 0 Q 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

:K --
COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

LL 0 0 0 0 0 
:;e 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER ' • 
FULL COLOR lWIN/MONO COLOR . BlACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NElWORK 
LL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
,E 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
, . 

• NO. DEPARTMENT 

A"'·" o 
~2 Bryan, Mary/Hairr 

~· .. 
IT COUNTER 

. COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

.L 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
iE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

:K 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 
.L 0 0 32 0 32 
iE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 32 0 32 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT ·,RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
J. 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
E 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 
< 

0 0 0 0 
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DEPARTMENT CODE LIST 
.1 

TIME- : 10-31-201611 :04 I 
DEPARTMENT 

l 
) 42 Bryan, Mary/Hairr -If$/· 8' () 

1R I NT COUNTER 

:uLL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

,MALL 0 47 47 SMALL 0 0 0 

.ARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 47 47 0 0 0 0 

lLACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

iMALL 55 0 157 0 212 
.ARGE 0 0 0 0 0 -

55 0 157 0 212 0 

=AX COMMUN I CAT I ON· SCAN COUNTER \ 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR \ BLACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

iMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 5 0 55 0 8 

.AROE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 5 0 55 0 8 

lEPT' NO. DEPARTMENT ., 
)' 44 

'R l NT COUNTER 

:uLL COLOR TIVIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

iMALL 0 59 59 SMALL 0 0 0 

.ARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 59 59 0 0 0 0 

iLACK 
COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

,MALL 16 0 105 0 121 
.ARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

.,s 0 105 0 121 0 

:AX COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR iWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT' RECEPTION COPY NElWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

iMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 16 0 16 

.ARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 16 0 16 
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DEPARTMENT CODE LIST 
TIME : 01-04-201716:18 

T NO • DEPARTMENT 
37 

.._._.. 
INT COUNTER 

LL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

IAU 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

ACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

IALL 0 0 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 ,o 

IX COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
~ 

FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR \~ 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY Nrn'ORK COPY COPY FAX NElWORK 

MU 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
\RGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 {) 0 0 0 0 0 0 

·' 
:PT NO. DEPARTMENT ,. 

42 Bryan, Mary/Hairr ~ro2. p-o 
RINT COUNTER .j I r . • 

! ULL COLOR lWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

' MALL 0 20 20 SMALL 0 0 0 I 
ARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 

i 
0 0 1 

0 20 20 0 0 0 0 .. 
·1 

! 

ILACK 
•. 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 
;MALL 31 0 863 0 894 
.ARGE 0 0 0 a 0 

31 0 863 0 894 0 

=AX COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER ·1 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK .. - .. 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

SMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 2 0 31 0 49 
' LARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 ~ ~ 

0 0 0 2 0 31 0 49 
r.l 
r 
!; 
~· 
I' 
1 
t 
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STATE BAR OF NEVADA COPY 
YOUR ACCOUNT IS PAST DUE 

ANNUAL RJ3Nl!W AL INVOICE FOR ASSOCIATION OF COUNSEL 
RETURN THIS FORM WITB ANY CORRESPONDENCE 

May 30, 2017 

Out of State Counsel ID: 39419 
John Houston Scott 
Scott Law Finn . 
1388 Sutter Stmet 
Suite 71S 
San Francisco, CA 94109 

~ Name: MIIy Btyan V Clark CoUD1Y School District 

Cese Number: A-14-700018-C 

Date of Application: May 2~, 201S Re'.liwal Pel'io'd::51l8.1%016-5/lf/l017 · 
'. " . 

• . 
. 

3100 w. Clwlertoo Bml. 
Sulte100 
La.V.·NV.85'102 
P"'- 702.382.2200 
a,8 r- 80!}.254.2797 
ru 702.38S.2878 

.9456-D'))lblc R.Bivil, Si:t. B 
lmo. NV'B!J52l•ffl7 
p~ oe 7i'.5.329.4100. 
Eu 775.329.0522 

Due Date: Payment is ~ anmia1ly on application~-
. WUllll.nvbtirmg 

YOU ARE REQUIRED TO NOTIFY THE StATE BAB-0:F lF TBIS CASE IIAS CLOSED ORIF 
· YOU HAVE WITHDRAWN. 

Your 8.Dlloal nnewal fee pmnant to SCR42(9) Is PAST DUE. It your admladon statJJs ls not 
resolved wlth1n 14 clays of this letter, the State Bar of will SUIJlend you. 

·.· . . . . . . 
Check those th&tiP.PlYAAd cmuplet.e.alhubsections RP.PJir.able. 

1.XThe case remains pending befOI\'I a state court. A check payable to the S~ Bar of Nevada in fhc 
~ount of $500 ~eJlting ~ annual renewal fee ~t to SCR. 42 (9) is enclosed. 

2. __ The above-referenced out-of-state attorney has withdrawn from 1his cue. Therefore, no renewal 
fee under SCR 42 is applicable. 

Date out-of-state CO'IJlllel witbdmv:......__...._ ...................... _ 

3. ___My party, ------------....1 was dismissed. therefore! will.no longer be 

pIIClicing on this case. Date dismissed! ____ .......___.__.... 

4. _The cauac hes been tinal1y adjudicated SCR. 42(9)(a)(2). Date case cloaed:._ ______ _ 

5. __Attorney is now licensed within the state of. Please provide bar number. No ten.ewal fee due. 

Please return only ONE reapgn.se vi0,etnail, fax QR mail. Please do not aubtnit dyplicate re!iPQDSes. 

Payments/Responses 1ho'1d be ,:nalled·or·tmallecl to:· .. 
State Bar of Nevada, 3100 W. Charleston Blvd., Suite 100 
Las Vegas,NV89102 
l'hone.702-31'7-1424, rtuu:yJ@nvbat.org 

I 
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' . • I I 
: I 

, l I 

t t l 
t t ! 
l ! i 
1 I 
I • 

f f 
' • 
i 
; 



001872

001872

00
18
72

001872

COTt' LAW FIRM . 
, State.Bat of-Nevada 

Client Costs 
. 6/812017' 

Assoc. of Coitnsel· Renewal- Case A-14-700018 C ( . . . . . . . . . 

Gena~I Ch99klng ace Assac.- of Counsel ~ newal- Case A-14-700018 

con iiAW FIRM 

$tale Bar of Nevada 
Client Costs 

GENl!RAL ACCOUNT 

6/812017 
Aa·soc. of Counsel Renewal- Case A-14-700018 C ( . ', . 

General Checking ace Assoc. of Counsel Renewal- c·ase A-14-700018 

, ..... 
, soo.oo·· .. 

500.00 

2153 

500.00 

500.00 

I 
I l I I 

l I I 
·I ! I I i I . 
! 
I 

i ... t 

I : 

• 
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DECLARATION OF CLYDE DEWITT 
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l C lyde DeWitt 
Nevada State Bar No. 9791 

2 Califomia State Bar No. 1179 l l 
Texas State Bar No. 05670700 

3 Law Offices of Clyde De Witt, 
A Nevada Professional Corporation 

4 410 South RamRart Boulevard, Suite 420 
Las Vegas, NV 89145-5719 

5 (702) 386-1756; fax (702) 441-0308 
clydedewitt@earthlink.net 

6 

7 

8 

9 

IN THE DISTRICT COURT COURT 

FOR THE EIGHT JLDICIAL DISTRICT 

l O MARY BRYAN mother of ETHAN 

11 
BRYAN; AIMEE HAIRR, mother of 
NOLAN HAIRR, 

12 

13 

14 
v. 

Plainti ffs, 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTIUCT, 
15 

Defendant. 

Case Number A-14-700018-C 

Dept. 27 

l lon. Nancy L All:f 

DECLARATION OF CLYDE 
De\VITT IN SUP.PORT OF 
PLAINTIFF'S APPLICATION 
FOR ATTOR1'11EYS FEES 

(281.:.S.C. § 1756; 42 U.S.C. § 1988) 
16 

I7 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

Paget 

OECLARATlON OF CLYDE DeWJTI' 

Cnse Number A-14-700018-C 
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1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

DECLARATION OF CLYDE DeWITT 

IN SUPPORT 01<"" PLAINTIFF'S 

APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS :FEES 

(28 u.s.c. § 1756; 42 u.s.c. § 1988) 

I, CLYDE De\VITT, declare as follows: 

7 1. I am an attorney, practicing in Clark County, Nevada as indicated above, 

8 in connection with which I have, unless otherwise b.dicated, personal knowledge of 

9 the following: 

10 

11 Declarant'~· Backgro1tnd 

12 2. l have been an attorney for just under 44 years, first admitted in Texas 

13 in 1973 after graduating from the University of Houston Law Center, where l served 

14 on the Board of Editors of the Houston Law Review and received other honors.1 

15 3. I served as an assistant district attorney in Houston (Office of the Harris 

16 County District Attorney) for over seven years after graduating from law school, 

17 spending approximately three years in the appellate division and the last 

18 approximately two years as general counsel for the district attorney. In the latter 

19 position, I was responsible for defending lawsuits against the district attorney and 

20 members of his office, as well us some against the Harris County SherifPs 

21 Department. Most all of those those lawsuits were brought pursuant to 42 U.S.C. 

22 § 1983 ("section 1983"). 

23 

2 
1 I was admitted in California 1985 practicing there from then until 4 ai:mroximately 2012. I was admitted in Nevada in 2006; and nave practiced here since 

25 2U07. (From 2007 to 2012, I maintained offices in both California and Nevada.) 

26 

27 

28 

Page 2 

1n:CLARATTO~ Olt CLYDE DeWITT 

Case Number A-14-700018-C 
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l 4. From 1980 to 2008, I was associated in one form or another with the 

2 Beverly Hills, California firm of Brown, \Veston & Sarno and its successor firms.2 

3 The focus of that finn was the defense of constitutional rights of individuals and 

4 businesses engaged in erotic expression of one fonn or another. That largely 

5 cons.istcdofsuits pursuant to section 1983) charging local governments with violation 

6 of First Amendment rights or threats to enforce ordinances that would do so. 

7 During my tenure with that finn, Mr. Weston argued six cases that were 

8 granted plenary review in the United States Supreme Court, all involving First 

9 Amendment rights and all but unc filed under section 1983.3 With the exception of 

10 the Brockett case, I was substantially involved in the preparation of the petition for 

1 1 certiorari or opposition thereto, the briefs on the merits and the oral argument in each 

12 of those cases. 

13 6. As lead counsel, while in the districtattomeys office, I defended lawsuits 

14 based primarily on section 1983 in courts in Houston, primarily United States District 

15 Court for the Southern District of Texas~ including at least several court trials and one 

16 jury trial. In private practice since then (both when with a firm and as a sole 

17 practitioner), I have been lead plaintiff counsel in dozens of section 1983 actions, 

18 

19 2 Some dates being a_pproximate, the firm was Brown, Weston & Sarno 
20 from 1980 to 1988; Weston & Samo from 1988 to 1992, Weston Sarno Garrou & 

DeWitt from 1991 to 1994· Weston, Garrou & DeWitt from 1994 to 2003; and 
21 Weston, Garrou, DeWitt & Walters from 2003 until my departure in early 2008. 

"2 3 Brockett v. SJ:lokane Arcades Inc. 472 U.S. 491 (1985); Fort Wayne 
... Books Inc. v. Indiana 489 U.S. 46 0989\ FWIPBS, Inc. v. Dallas, 493 U.S. 215 
23 (1990)b· Alexander v. United States1 509 tJ.S. 544 (1993); Erie v. Pa,p) AM, 529 U.S. 

277 (2 00); and City of Los Ange1es v. Alameda Books, Inc., 5351J.S. 425 (2002). 
24 All of those cases were brought under section 1983 except Alexander, which was a 

First Amendment challenge to a criminal forfeiture in connection with RIC0-
25 obscenity convictions. 

26 
27 Page3 @) 
28 

DECLARATION OF CLYDE DeWrTT 

Cus~ Number A-14-700018-C 
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almost all challenging violations of the First and Fourteenth Amendments by local 

2 govenunental bodies. As to the latter} those lawsuits have been brought in at least ten 

3 United States districts4 and in several state courts. As lead counsel, 1 have briefed and 

4 argued section-1983 cases in the United States Courts of Appeals for the Fifth, 

5 

6 

Seventh, Ninth and Eleventh Circuits, as well as several state appe11ate courts. 

7. I am a fonuer president and national chair of the First Amendment 

7 Lawyers Association.5 Over the last 30 years, I have lectured about constitutional 

8 rights, regularly to that organization and periodically to others.6 

9 8. Pursuant to 42 U.S. C. § 1988, J have been awarded in the neighborhood 

10 of a million dollars in attorneys fees over the years in various cases, including by 

11 settlement. 7 

12 9. Based upon the above, I have become familiar with the rates charged by 

13 attorneys in both Southern California and the Las Vegas community, which I have 

14 

15 11 The ones I can Qresently recall are the Central, Northern and Southern 
Districts of California; the Southern District of Florid~ the Northern District of 

16 Illinois; the District of Arizona; the N01thern District of 1 exas; the Western District 
of Missouri; the North en District of Ohio; and the District of Nevada. 

17 5 The First Amendment Lawyers Association ("FALA,,) is a national 
18 group that has been in existence since the 1960s. Its membership has varied over the 

years, averaging about 150 attorneys whose practice substantially jnvolves First 
19 Amendment rignts. I was an officer of FALA from approximately 1987 to 1992, 

being the presiaent and national chair between 1990 and 1992. 
20 6 Some that come to mind are the Beverly Hills Bar Association- Western 
21 Michigan University Cooley Law School ia Grand Rapids, MI; Cal. State University 

- Fullertoo; and the Free Speech Coalition. 
22 i The most recent such case that was contested was Seven Cities 
23 Enterprises, Inc. v. City of Salinas, Case No. 5:08-cv-01563-JW ECF Docket 

Document No. 57 (N.D. Cal. June 3, 2009). There, I sought $425/hour, my then 
current rate; and was awarded $400/hour, a total of $81 ,064.00. Notably, the court there 24 considered, incorrectly l believe, the fact that 1 was representing a longstandLng client at a reduced 

25 $390/hour rate. 

26 

27 

28 

Page 4 
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I found are not materially different. In particular, lam familiar with the fees awarded 

2 in scction-1983 cases pursuant to 42 U.S.C. § 1988. 

3 10. Additionally, I am familiar with the general market for experienced 

4 attorneys in the Southern Nevada and Southern California markets. 

5 l L Accordingly, believe that I am capable of evaluating the value of 

6 attorney services provided in section-1983 cases in Clark County, Nevada. 

7 12. Constitutional law in general and lawsuits under section 1983 m 

8 particular are substantial specialties, as much as patent law, trademark law, copyright 

9 law and so on. Because the conflict between govemmentt with its instinct to maintain 

10 order and the individual liberties granted under the Bill of Rights and federal statutes, 

11 many conflicts .in this area (including quite a few) are associated with strong political 

12 and emotional issues. As such, appellate courts, and particularly the Supreme Court, 

13 many times tend to decide cases influenced by political beliefs. Accordingly, analysis 

14 of precedent in this area is remarkably complex. 

15 

16 

17 

Declarant's Familiarity with Plaintiff's Counsel, Allen Lichtenstein 

13. l hav~ known Allen Lichtenstein for at least 15 years. During those 

18 years, I have on many occasions discussed issues concerning constitutional rights 

19 with him as we each are involved with such litigation; and, accordingly, we often 

20 seek ideas from each other about such matters. Additionally, we each are members 

21 of FALA, where I have attended quite a few of his lectures. Those impressed me as 

22 being thorough, well·researched and including insightful analysis. 

23 14. Most significantly~ Mr. Lichtenstein and l were involved together in the 

24 trial of S.O.C., Inc., et al. v. Clark County, No. 2:97-cv-00123-LDG-RJJ, in the 

25 

26 

27 

28 
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DECLARATION Of CLYDJ<: DeWITT 

Case Number A-14-70001S..C 
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1 United States District Court for the District of Nevada. There, I represented Plaintiff 

2 Hillsboro Enterprises, Inc.; Mr. Lichtenstein represented Intervener American Civil 

3 Liberties Union of Xevada. Accordingly, we worked together, as we were aligned 

4 with the same objectives. 

5 15. I had the opportunity to review f\.1r. Lichtenstein's written work in that 

6 case, which was absolutely outstanding, and his conduct of the trial, which also was 

7 excellent. Particularly, his written work was as thorough and concise as any I have 

8 seen. 

9 

10 This Case 

11 16. In the above-captioned matter, I have reviewed the First Amended 

12 Complaint (October 10, 2014), Plaintiffs' Pre-Trial ·Memorandum (November 8, 

13 2016); the Court's Decision and Order (June 29, 2017); and the Findings of Fact and 

14 Conclusions of Law (July 20, 2017). 

15 17. Having done so1 I find that Plaintiffs' counsel has accomplished an 

16 ex.cellent result in vindicating the rights of victims of violations of the Constitution 

17 and federal law. The written work is excellent, typifying Mr. Lichtenstein1s abilities. 

18 / 

19 I 

20 I 

21 I 

22 I 

23 I 

24 I 

25 

26 

27 

28 

l':\lh«$\(tDlDe.ik1op~Witt ll~l~roi,on "'pd 
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1 18. I am told that Mr. Lichtenstein seeks $600/hour pursuant to 42 U.S.C. 

2 § 1988. Based upon the above, I believe that to be a reasonable request.8 

3 J declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the United States of 

4 America that the foregoing is true and correct. 

5 Signed this "6'j.J~ay of August, 2017. 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 8 I note as an as ide, that the Laffey Matrix assig_ns rates well over 
$500/hour for Washington D.C. and.i.particularly Southern Calilomia for attorneys, 

22 such as Mr. Lichtenstein, with over LO years experience. 

23 www.justice.gov/usaoldcldivisionslciyil.html 

24 htt :/lwww.ca!law er.com/ 2015/ / I/how-to- rove-an-attorne s-reasona le-
hourlv-rates 

25 

26 

27 

28 

. 
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1 Allen Lichtenstein (NV State Bar No. 3992) 
ALLEN LICHTENSTEIN, LTD. 

2 3315 Russell Road, No. 222 
Las Vegas, NV 89120 

3 Tel: 702.433-2666 
Fax: 702.433-9591 

4 allaw@lvcoxmail.com 

5 John Houston Scott (CA Bar No. 72578) 
Admitted Pro Hae Vice 

6 SCOTT LAW FIRM 
1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715 

7 San Francisco, CA 94109 
Tel: 415.561-9601 

8 john@scottlawfirm.net 

9 Attorneys for Plaintiffs, Mary Bryan, Ethan Bryan, 
Aimee Hairr and Nolan Hairr 

Electronically Filed 
8/14/2017 5:54 PM 

10 

11 

12 

DISTRICT COURT 

CLARKCOUNTY,NEVADA 

13 MARY BRYAN, mother of ETHAN BRYAN; 
AIMEE HAIRR, mother of NOLAN HAIRR, 

14 

15 

16 
vs. 

Plaintiffs, 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
17 (CCSD 

Defendant. 

Case No. A-14-700018-C 

Dept. No. XX.VII 

PLAINTIFFS' RESPONSE TO 
DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO RETAX 
COSTS 

Department: XXVII 

18 

19 

20 Plaintiffs have reviewed Defendant's Motion to Retax Costs that have made the following 

21 adjustments, resulting in a revised total cost amount of $20, $672.32, as reflected in attached 

22 
Exhibit 1. Defendants' motion listed ten separate areas. Plaintiffs' response to each is as follows. 

23 

24 
A. The e-file fee has been adjusted to $280.50. As for the question of an additional 

$30 fee for Aimee Hairr, Plaintiffs are willing to forgo that. 
25 

26 B. The supporting documentation for in house copies and faxes can be found in the 

27 attached Exhibit 2. 

28 

1 
Case Number: A-14-700018-C 
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1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

J. Costs paid by CCSD in the amount of $182 has been removed. 

Dated this 14th day of August 2017 

Respectfully submitted by: 

ls/Allen Lichtenstein 
Allen Lichtenstein 
Nevada Bar No. 3992 
ALLEN LICHTENSTEIN LTD. 
3315 Russell Road> No. 222 
Las Vegas) NV 89120 
Tel: 702.433-2666 
Fax: 702.433-9591 
alJaw@lvcoxmail.com 

John Houston Scott (CA Bar No. 72578) 
Admitted Pro Hae Vice 
SCOTT LAW FIRM 
1388 Sutter Street) Suite 715 
San Francisco, CA 94109 
Tel: 415.561.9601 
john@scottlawfirm.net 
Attorneys for Plain.tiffs, Mary Bryan, Ethan Bryan, 
Aimee Hairr and Nolan Hairr 
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18 

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE 

I hereby ce11ify that I served the following Plaintiffs' Response to Defendants' Motion to 

Retax Costs via Court's electronic filing and service system and/or United States Mail and/ore-
19 

mail on the 14th day of August 2017, to: 
20 

21 Dan Polsenberg 
Dan Waite 

22 Lewis Rocha Rothgerber Christie 
3993 Howard Hughes Pbvy., Suite 600 

23 Las Vegas, NV 89169-5996 

24 DPolsenberg@lrrc.com 
DWaite@lrrc.com 

25 

26 

27 

28 

/s/ Allen Lichtenstein 
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Plaintiffs' Costs and Disbursements 

In Reference To: Mary Bryan and Amy Hairr v Clark County School District (CCSD) et. al, 

{Case No. A-14-700018-C} 

COSTS 

8/22/2014 Hearing transcript (Lichtenstein). 

6/19/2015 Printing disclosures (Lichtenstein). 

6/22/2015 Mailing disclosures (Lichtenstein). 

6/30/2015 Copies and Faxes made in office 06/01/2015-06/30/2015. 

8/31/2015 Copies and Faxes made In office 08/0l/2015-08/31/2015. 

10/23/2015 Discovery CD (Lichtenstein). 

11/2/2015 Deposition of Warren McKay (Depo International Inv #23223). 

Deposition transcript of Warren McKay (Oepo International Inv #23293). 

11/3/2015 Deposition of Cheryl Winn (Depo International Inv #23263). 

Deposition transcript of Cheryl Winn (Depo International Inv #23417). 

11/16/2015 Deposition of Deanna Wright (Oepo International Inv #23637). 

Deposition transcript of Deanna Wright (Depo International Inv #23662). 

Wright deposition transcript (Lichtenstein). 

11/30/2015 Copies and Faxes made in office 10/01/2015-11/30/2015. 

12/22/2015 Deposition of Nolan Michael Hairr (Litigation Services, Inv #1044327). 

1/5/2016 Deposition of CL (Western Reporting Services, Inv #49962). 

1/6/2016 Deposition of Aimee Olivia Hairr (Litigation Services, Inv #1046125). 

1/13/2016 Deposition of D M (Western Reporting Services, Inv #49981). 

1/21/2016 Deposition of Ethan Bryan (Litigation Services, Inv #1048764). 

1/25/2016 Deposition of Leonard Depiazza (Oepo International Inv #24752). 

1/26/2016 Deposition of Robert Beaseley (Depo International Inv #24805). 

1/27/2016 Deposition transcript of John Edwin Halpin (Depo International Inv #24899}. 

Deposition of John Edwin Halpin (Depo International Inv #24897). 

1/28/2016 Deposition transcript of Andre Joseph Long (Oepo International Inv #24902). 

Deposition of Andre Joseph Long {Depo International Inv #24.901). 

1/31/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 01/01/2016-01/31/2016. 

2/5/2016 Deposition of Mary Bryan (Litigation Services, Inv #1051615}. 

2/16/2016 Deposition of Heath Hairr (Litigation Services, Inv #1051615). 

Amount 

60.00 

63.77 

. S.95 

27.20 

4.00 

10.80 

1,534.68 

877.98 

1,590.00 

928.73 

603.42 

416.15 

19.46 

210.40 

1,183.05 

372.80 

960.SS 

379.30 

1,138.50 

815.00 

533.00 

325.76 

589.50 

556.83 

947.50 

190.60 

1,031.40 

160.00 
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Deposition of Gina Abbaduto (Litigation Services, Inv #1053295). 

2/19/2016 Deposition of Asheesh Dewan, MD (Litigation Services, Inv #1053578). 

Deposition of Edmond Faro, MD (Litigation Services, Inv #1053610). 

2/24/2016 Deposition of Dennis Moore, MD (Litigation Services, Inv #1052063). 

2/29/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 02/01/2016-02/29/2016. 

3/17/2016 Federal Express shipment to Allen Lichtenstein, Las Vegas, NV (FedEx #775904967664). 

3/28/2016 Documents scanned to PDF (Lichtenstein) 

4/1/2016 Documents scanned to PDF (Lichtenstein). 

4/21/2016 Efile transactions for Maiy Bryan - 04/30/2014-04/21/2016 (Lichtenstein). 

4/29/2016 lewis Roca transcript fee (Lichtenstein}. 

8/31/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 08/01/2016-08/31/2016. 

10/31/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 10/0l/2016-10/31/2016. 

11/9/2016 Federal Express shipment to Allen Lichtenstein, Las Vegas, NV {FedEx #7777679212411). 

Oepo transcript of Robert Beasley, taken 1/26/2016 (Depo lnternational Inv #30045). 

Depo transcript of Cheryl Winn, taken 11/16/2015 {Depo International lnv #30044). 

Depo transcript of Warren McKay, taken 11/2/2015 (Depo International Inv #30046), 

11/9/2016 Depo transcript of Deanna Wright, taken 11/16/2015 (Depo International Inv #30047). 

Binders and tabs for trial {Lichtenstein). 

11/15/2016 District Court Transcript ofTrial 11/15/16-11/18/16, 11/22/16 

11/28/2016 Court reporter deposit and service (Kimberly Lawson Karr Reporting Inv #11/28/2016. 

12/31/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 12/01/2016-12/31/2016. 

3/15/2017 Copies and binding. (Lichtenstein). 

3/16/2017 Copies and binding. (Lichtenstein). 

3/31/2017 Copies and Faxes made in office 03/0l/2017-03/31/2017. 

5/31/2017 Copies and Faxes made in office during OS/01/2017-05/31/2017. 

Total Costs 

607.25 

135.95 

182.10 

236.35 

67.40 

32.49 

37.63 

42.39 

280.50 

90.14 

6.40 

51.80 

115.11 

46.00 

151.00 

137.00 

51.00 

47.48 

440.00 

2000.00 

182.80 

92.95 

34.22 

23.60 

44.40 

$20.672.32 
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Financial 

i1r~·An M:uy 
Total Financial Assessment $280.50 

Total Payments and Credits $280.SO 

4/30/2014 Transaction Asse..<sment $270.00 

4/30/2014 Efile Payment Receipt# 2014-50310-CCCLK Bryall, Mary ($270.00) 

7/27/2015 Transaction Assess'.T'ent $3.50 

7/27/2015 Eflle Payment Receipt # 201 5-78 71 8-CCCI. !< Bryan. Mary ($3.50) 

3/21/2016 Transaction Assessmen~ $3.SO 

3/21/2016 Eflle Payment Receip: # 2016-2845:l-CCCU< Bryan, Mary ($3.50) 

4/21/2016 Tr,msaction Assessmeo: $3.50 

4/21/2016 Elile Payment Receipt-# 2016-38796-CCO.'< Bryan, Mary ($3.50) 

~;k):!'\ ~;;,.~;1\~!' Sr:r.~o' Dis.tr:"',I /!? ~; 

Total Financial Assessmer.t $182.00 

Total Payments anel Credits $182.00 

6/30/2014 Transaction $3.SO 

AsseGsment 

6/30/2014 Efile Payment Receipt # 2014· 75526-CCCLi< Clari< Couow School Oistrict, ($3,50) 

7/1/2014 Transaction $3.SO 

Assessment 

7/1/2014 Efile Payment Receipt 'I' 2014·751111-CCCLK Clark Co'Jn~y School District, ($3.SO) 

8/1/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

8/1/2014 Efile Payment Receipt # 2014-88628-CCCLK Clark County School District, ($3.50) 

8/1/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

8/t/2014 Efile Payment Receipt # 2014·86733·CCCLK Clerk County School District, ($3.50) 

8/7/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

8/7/2014 Efile Payment .lece,pt # 2014-90709-CCCLK Clark CoLnty SchOol District, ($3,50) 

9/10/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

9/10/2014 Efile Payment Receipt II 2014-103862· Oark C01..n:y School District, ($3.SO) 

CCCLK 

9/10/2014 Tra.l\saction $3.50 

Assessment 

9/10/2014 EN1e Payment Receipt # 2014-104055- Clark County Sct\ool District, ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

11/18/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

11/18/2014 Efile Payment Receipt ;, 2014·t2996l- Clark C'Ovnty School District, ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

11/20/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

l 1/?0/2014 Efile Payment Receipt t: 2014-130847· Oar,< County SchOol District, ($3,50) 

CCCL,< 

12/9/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

12/9/2014 E'file Payment lleceipt # 2:!14-137192· Clark Cot;ntv School District, ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

12/10/2014 Transaction $3,50 

Assessment 

12/10/2014 E'file Payment ~eceipt # 2014-:37325· Clark Coanty School Olstri~t. ($3.SO) 

CCCLK 

1/16/2015 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 
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' ' · 

DEPARlMENT CODE UST 
TIME : 06-26·2015 13:01 

DEPARTMENT 

TWIN/MONO COLOR 

PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

SMALL 0 20 20 SMAl..l 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 20 20 0 0 0 0 

BLACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 O·. 

FAX COMMUNICATION SCAM COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK -TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NE1WORK COPY COPY FAX NElWO~K 

SMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
:ARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
., 

IEPT NO. DEPARTMENT 

-1~7-J-O 
~ . 42 Bryan, Mary/Hairr I 

RI NT COUNTER 

JLL COLOR lWIN/ MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT 

0

TOTAL 
MLL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

I\CK 

COPY FAX PR INT U ST TOTAL UMIT 
All 0 0 136 0 136 
!GE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 136 0 136 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NElWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
LL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
;e 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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DEPARTMENT CODE UST 
TIME : 09-14-2015 09:28 

DEPARTMENT __...,. 
ff COUNTER 

• COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

LL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 

;e 0 Q 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

:K 
COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAt. LIMIT 

LL 0 0 0 0 0 

iE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 ' 

COMMUN I CAT f ON SCAN COUNTER ·-. 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BlACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

LL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 

lE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

- NO. OEPARTIAENT oo ~2 Bryan, Mary/Hairr I Lf, 
} IT COUNTER 
I 

, COLOR lWIN/MONO COLOR 
I 
I 

COPY PRltIT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL I 
I 

_L 0 20 20 SMALL 0 0 0 I 

;E 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 I 
0 20 20 0 0 0 0 

:K 
COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

_L 0 0 0 0 0 

;e 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR lW!N/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT , RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

:..L 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 

;e 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Docket 73856   Document 2018-21012
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DEPARTMENT CODE LIST 
TIME : 12·07-201511:38 

DEPARTMENT 
Bryan, Mary/Hairr - 1J d...l o · ~ 0 

II NT COUNTER 

ll COLOR· "TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY 

ALL 0 27 27 SMALL 0 
lGE 0 ·O 0 tARGE 0 

0 27 27 0 0 

CK 
COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

LL 237 0 188 0 1025 
;e 0 0 0 0 0 

237 0 788 0 1025 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY 

0 0 SMALl 0 0 0 
0 0 tARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 

NO • DEPARTMENT .._.. 
COUNTER 

OLOR lWlN/ MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY 

0 0 0 SMALL 0 
0 0 0 LARGE 0 

0 0 0 0 0 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

0 
0 

0 

IUNICATION 

RANSMIT 

0 
0 

0 

0 0 0 
0 0 0 
0 0 0 

SCAN COUNTER 

RECEPTION 

0 SMALL 
0 LARGE 

0 

FULL COLOR 

COPY NE1WORK 

0 0 
0 0 
0 0 

0 
0 

0 0 

TWIN/ MONO COLOR 
COPY 

0 
0 

0 

PRINT 
0 
0 

0 

-;., 

BLACK 

COPY 
118 

0 

118' 

PRINT 
0 
0 

0 

BLACK -COPY 

0 
0 

0 

TOTAL 

0 
0 

0 

I 

I 
I I 

\ I 

I FAX NElWORK ~ I 
0 0 
0 0 

0 0 

TOTAL 

0 
0 

0 

1K -·o 
0 

FAX NETWORK -
0 

0 
0 
0 0 

0 0 

I • 
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. ..... ---···- -- . ·- - -- 1··-.. 
_;~~-. .. -. . ~-;.~_:::.::· ~~-..... ~~:; ~· -· ·- " . ' 

:-·.-:- .... ;,..!- • ·--· · ~.:.:..:;......- ~· · _ · _ , ... e i, 

DEPARTMENT CODE UST 
TIME : 02·04-2016 11 :59 

DEPARTMENT ~ 
Bryan, Mary/He i rr · / 10 L /.J;Q 

PRINT COUNTER 

FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY I PRINT TOTAL 

SMALL 0 33 33 SMALL 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 33 33 a 0 0 0 

BLACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

SMALL 82 0 838 0 920 
LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

82 0 838 0 920 0. 
'• 

FAX COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TW I NJ MONO COLOR BLACK --

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
SMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 42 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 42 0 0 ., 
DEPT NO. DEPARTMENT 
D 43 ~ 
PRINT COUNTER 

FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

SMALL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

81LACK 
COPY FAX PR I NT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

FAX COMMUNICATjON SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK -TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NEnvDRK 

SMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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PARTMENT CODE LIST 
TIME : 03-03-2016 17:53 

DEPARTMENT 
§ • 

FULL COLOR lWIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

SMALL 0 39 39 SMALL a 0 0 
lARGE 0 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 

0 39 39 0 0 0 0 

3LACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

:MALL 0 0 0 0 0 
ARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

~ COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR Bl.ACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK ' COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

~ALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 i 

I 
0 0 0 0 0 ! 0 0 0 . 

i 
PT NO. DEPARTI.iENT 

!ro~- iu Bryan, Mary/Halrr 
!. 

42 ' 
' I NT COUNTER 

.l COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 
,LL 0 13 13 SMALL 0 0 0 
3E 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 13 13 0 0 0 0 

:K - COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 
I 

.L 21 0 303 0 324 :i 
E 0 0 0 0 0 

21 0 303 0 324 0 

:oMMUN I CAT I ON SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR lWIN/ MONO COLOR BLACK ,_ 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 21 0 0 
0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 21 0 0 
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LL. 

llME : 04-03-2017 11 :00 

INT COUNTER 

LL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

!All 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

ACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

IALL 0 0 0 0 0 
RGE a 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

X COMMUN I CATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR "TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK -

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NElWORK 
IALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 a 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

PT NO. DE~ARTMENT 

-7 -2-3. (eO 
42 Bryan, Mary/Hairr 

INT COUNTER 

LL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

IALL 0 0 0 SMAU 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

ACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 
1ALL 0 0 118 0 118 
RGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 118 0 118 0 

.X COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT ' RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NElWORK 
~ALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
.RGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

• 
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__ ., .. . .. .. -
ARTMENT CODE UST 

TIME· : 06-08-2017 10:33 

DEPARTMENT ._... 
: I NT COUNTER 

LL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

ALL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
\GE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

~CK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 
\LL 0 0 0 0 0 
GE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
LL 0 0 SMALL. 0 0 0 0 0 0 
;E 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 a 0 0 0 0 0 0 

• NO. DEPARTMENT _, qf. r(o 2 Bryan, Mary/Hairr 

T COUNTER 

COLOR TIYIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

L 0 141 141 SMALL 0 0 0 l 
. 0 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 I 

0 141 141 0 0 0 0 
I 

l 

COPY FAX PRINT l.lST TOTAL LIMIT 

0 0 81 0 81 
0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 81 0 81 0 

JMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR nv1 N/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT Rl;CEPTION COPY NE'TWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK { 

0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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TIME . :09-01-201614:18 

NT COUNTER 

l COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

.LL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
3E 0 () 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

:K 
COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

LL 0 0 0 0 0 
,E 0 0 0 0 0 ~ 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER •, 

FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR . 81:.ACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
LL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
;E 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

. NO. DEPARTMENT 

"'"' !( t) 

I 
12 Bryan, Mary/Hairr 

I 
IT COUNTER I 

I 
' . COLOR iWIN/MONO COLOR 
t COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 
• .L 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 l iE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

:K 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 
.L 0 0 32 0 32 
;E 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 32 0 32 0 

COMMUN f CA Tr ON SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR T\!IIN/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT ·•RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NE'N/ORK 
.1. 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
E 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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l 

DEPARTMENT CODE LIST 
· l 

TIME. : 10-31-2016 11 :04 I 
I 

DEPARTMENT 
-If SI- r 0 ! 

l 42 Bryan, Mary/Hairr ! 
I 

1RINT COUNTER I 
=ULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR I 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL I 
I 

;MALL 0 47 47 SMALL 0 0 0 I 

ARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 I 
0 47 47 0 0 0 0 

ILACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

iMALL 55 0 157 0 212. 
ARGE 0 0 0 0 0 ' 

55 0 157 0 212 0 

=AX COMMUN I CAT I ON SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR ··. Bl.ACK -

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

,MALL 0 0 SMAU. 0 5 0 55 0 8 

ARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 5 0 55 0 8 

>EPT NO. DEPARTMENT ., 
) 44 

>RI NT COUNTER 

=ULL COLOR 'TV/IN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

iMALL 0 59 59 SMALL 0 0 0 

.ARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 59 59 0 0 0 0 

lLACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

iMALL 16 0 105 0 121 

.ARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

16 0 105 0 121 0 

=AX COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK -

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

iMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 16 0 16 

.ARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 16 0 16 
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r. DEPARTMENT CODE UST 
TIME ; 01 -04-2017 16:18 

T NO. DEPARTMENT 
37 .__ 

INT COUNTER 

LL COLOR TWIN/ MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 
IALL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

ACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAl. LIMIT 

•ALL 0 0 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 •O 

J< COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR • BLACK ·-

TRANSM IT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

MLL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
\RGE 0 0 LAROE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

:PT NO. DEPARTMENT 
42 Bryan, Mary/ Ha i rr :.I; r .J . p-o 

RINT COUNTER 

ULL COLOR lWIN/ MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

MALL 0 20 20 SMALL 0 0 0 ( ARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 20 20 0 0 0 0 [ 
.. 

;LACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

iMALl 31 0 863 0 894 
.ARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

31 0 863 0 894 0 

=AX COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR 1Wf N/ MONO COLOR BLACK 

I 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETIIORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
SMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 2 0 31 0 49 
LARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 I 

0 0 0 2 0 31 0 49 
1 

l • 

I 
I. 
{ .. 
I 
I 
I 
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November 16, 201512:51 
Receipt#: 0741219978 
MasterCard #: XXXXXXXXXXXX8461 
2015/11/1612:36 

Qty Description 

150 ES B&W SIS White 8.5 x11 

SubTotal 
Taxes 
Total 

Page: 1 

Amount 

18.00 

18.00 
1.46 

19.46 

The Cardholder agrees to pay th& Issuer of the charge 
card In accordance with the agreement between the 
Issuer and the Caroholder. 

FedEx Office Print & Ship Centers 

395 Hughe& Ctr Or. 
Las Vegas,NV 89109 
(702) 951·2400 
www.FedExottice.com 

Tell us how we're doing and receive 
20% off your next $35 print order 
fedax.com/welisten or 1 ·800-398--0242 
Offer Code: __ Offer expires 12/3112015 

Please Recycle This Receipt 

f .,, /'') 

i_ .. -· -r G 
I 
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Address Information 
Ship to: 
Allen Lichtenstein 

Shipment Receipt 

Ship from: 
John Houston Scott 
Scott Law Finn 

O~f-'t'- l rf"' - · ~age 1 of 1 
e ,'(... vi. , ... .. 1. o ~ ;4{ lm11t :s 
'Dec larA-ti~ r~~r~<-,t.t> -f:~ 

i.e. /vt~ ..f..t.,ii,..., T&) D~ gu..4-l ,~ ~ v 

3315 Russell Road, No. 222 

LAS VEGAS. NV 

1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715 

89120 
us 
(702) 433-2666 

Shipment Infonnation: 
Tracking no.: 775904967664 
Ship date: 03/17/2016 

San Francisco, CA 
94109 
us 
4155619601 

Estimated shipping charges: 32.49 

Package Information 
Pricing option: FedEx Standard Rate 
Service type: Priority Overnight 
Package type: FedEx Envelope 
Number of packages: 1 
Total weight: 0.80 LBS 
Declared Value: 0.00 USD 
Special Services: Residential Delivery 
Pickup/Drop-off: Drop off package at FedEx location 

Billing Information: 
Bill transportation to: MyAccount-722 
Your reference: Bryan/Hain· 
P.0.no.: 
Invoice no.: 
Department no.: 

; _ .~~~~.~ !ou.~o~ shi~~I~~ :~n~ne. ~i:h '.~.dE~:s.hi~~~~~;~r ;;~~~~.c~~· .. · · -:· ··:·:~~:·.·.:~~·-~~:-:~~~:~~:~:.~:·=-~=---~-~::.:] 
Please Note 
Fed6x win not bo raapoosib!e for any claim In oxcoas or S100 par pnckagn, whelller U'lo resun or loss, damage, <!Olay, non,daHvary, m1,ae11vary, or mllln!ormoUon, unless you dacWo a 
hlghor val\Ja, pay an eddlllonal chargo, clo~menl your actual Ion and tla a timely claim. UmltoUons (ound In the wrronl FedEK Servico Gulde opply. Your right to 1ecover from FedEx 
!or any lose, Including lntnnslo votuo of lho packago, loss of 1a!e1. Income lnte1011, profit, altomoy'e feoa. costs. ~od o:l)er form, o/ dumaga wholho, direct, lncl<lonlal, oonsequendol, or 
apeclol le llmltod to tho greater or $100 or tho outhonzed daclarod vnluo. Rocovory cannot oxcood actual dOOlU!lented Jon. Malcimum for Homs ol e)!1raoralnary valt1t1 Is $1000, e.g., 
1owa1ry, p1edous molllls. negoUab(e ln, lrumahts end oilier Item, Uelad In ovr Service Guido. Writton dalm, must bo filad wllhln otrict uma llmlte; Cansull tho apptlaib!e Fad6x S8'111ce 
Oukle for detalls. 
Tho o,umalod •hipping chargo may bo dllfoltllll I/Ian 11\t oc1ue1 e!laf8H tor your ahlpmonJ. O!f!oroncoa may =r buad an •e1ve1watg·~t. dlmenllion,. &n<I olh&r factora. Conslf!t Ill• 
•Ppllcab:O F,s!Ex Sorvtce Gylge or lho FollE>< Rate Shoat a for do!1l1 oo llow shipping r:htrnes ore 04!c"811ld. 

., 
https://www.fedex.com/shippinglhtml/en/PrintIFrame.html 3/17/2016 
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l'cdEx B1lllng Vnlme 

I of I 

FedE)( Billlng Onlhio 

l'r.,ckill!J IU Oetalh; 

Tr~cking ID Summary 

Blllln!) ln!o,maUon 

Troolong IP no. 

Invoice ro~ 

Accoun,no. 
8illcft1IC 

Tolal e11rco 

Trt.ckfng 10 aila"co dve 

Sl•tvs 

Vi..'l~'t' Jt:~.~;,•:l1 ~ li;t.lC~t{ 

\J,"f.:.\'( J/r;1m111u,> rJ-:')~\r ~.1. ~h\l.i•,,,t..,., 

T n"1snction Details 

S~r,dor lnlorm•tlon 

Joh11 Houslon Seou 
Scoll lavt Fi•m 

1388 Soller s1,ea1, su;ie 7:5 

SAN FR/lNC<SCO CA 94109 

vs 

Stiip<lato 

P-'yf\l$nt lypc 

Sel\'tCIJ lypo 

Zone 

P..s<:k1ge 1-,pe 

Wei9hl 

'"'iec~, 
Mth:HNO, 

Oecl~rco vatut: 

OrlglnAI Reference 

C\Js.lome, retort4\t• 110. 

Oer>ar1menl no. 

Roterotteo H2 

Rolerenco h3 

Proof of Oollvo,y 

Oe!ivc,y llate 

Service a1ee code 

Signed b~ 

y:~i:.-.: ~;il''t~t,.;1•; ~r,J9f l•f. ,J,}lt~r~r;: 

:5 !!!l!l! 7}7679212411 fiflz,! ! 

~·~8•-<!3301 

2519-5<72-t 
H/OS/2918 

$115.1'. 

$C.OC 

P•'.dC:: 

11139,io,o 

Shlpper 

Fede~ Prior'rty' ove,n;siiH 
04 

C"Jalo:ne, Pac.kaol!lg 

IS.00 lbs 

\!/10/20'6 OS.48 

Al 

M.M'IRIUZ 

1mps:1Jwww. ceaex.conl/1eaexo111mgo111me, pugc~1p11m1:1111cm11y, p1111 ••• 

----- ----

Meuages 

FadEx ~., ,Jd.led 1~:s tl'iomer: ,.,. correcl packeg ~~ 

O~s~ar . .;.e B3scd F1:ti."19. Zena 4 
P'JtlSurctta:rJa · '?soEx ha;: a~:ic:u a h1~i ~nrthar9 H~.~.~ t"~~ro.,. 
T;,e ptckD!;ct ¥teigtil exceeds cht rrexJl).:Jr.. for fho pac !~!!:~~L~r.~1.,~:., 

R$e'.pltnl 1nio1ma11on 

Alrrn Uciila."lstei:i 

3315 Ro, .. :1 Roae, No, 222 

,AS V€CAS NV J9l20 

us 

C~argos 

Trer.,poMJ:#r Chor~• 
fc,;et Surcharga 

Wn~d.sy Oo.Nv<?ry 
A11b.,,a1io1 6011u$ Oi1ce1..n: 

Tole( ~n•<oes 

125J)9 

2.53 

0.00 

•12.51 
mm 

ll/21/2016 11:33 AM 
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Office DEPOT 

OfficeMax 
O!-FICE DtPUI SIOR[ 1127\!) 

591S $ fA~lfRN AVf 
Lns V[GAS NV 89119 

< 10?.) 736·· H27 

'\.: 

11/09/2016 16 8.2 b:25 PH 
SfR 271 b RE.G 1 rnN -,% LMP 745go4 

SAl.l 
Product lU !le!>c.;r 1f> i 1 on 
99811? INUfX,RrAOY, 1 

!., @ 5.79 
You Pall 

Sllbl()tal 

Sa lei, la·..:: 
Total 

Ma& I c.,rCartJ !M6 l · 

AUrn com: ·r683;>P 
ms Ch II" RP au 

f o t ,, I 

28 % 
28.96SS 

28 . % 
2.3e 

31.3i 
31 31 

Arn fi00000000-11010 l1dS1!!rCard 

"fVR 080000800D 
CVS No S\9nat11rt> l~t'~u1rrd 
•XkXXl~XXXlXX~~-~A~XJ~K,XX~XXl)A~~AA~•~~Ai 

Al IJ N l I cm El4S 1 l Hl A! l()HNI: Y Cl :B?(, 1(! l 'J8 
PI ca,;t? ct'Pd t t' '.JIHJf' m, I t Ill' r· t'.w,~1·1!~. 

accminl di off1cedepot. r;on,/reward!:> 
You P11Ji;f complete ':Jf,1;r ,1n:uunl to 

r: ! d 11~ ~01:1· rpw,:1rds .-.11d v I Clo.I ~our· 

statu::.. 

Shop cH1l 1ne dt wt~w.oft'1c:ederol 1.om 

IIAIAikXXIIXIXXXXll)X~IIIIX~XJillilXa•o,Xi 

WE WANT TO HE~ FROM YOU! 

P di. t I c I po I e 111 uur nn I 111e c.:u~, I 111'1er· 

.surve~ and r-f't:~ 1 ve d cotW!.,r, ror 
$10 otf your next ~UlllitYing 
purchase of $50 or ~ore on 

,.._t t" I ,-.-. ,..,. , __ 1 s _,.. ,. ...... 1 .l 

_, 

'-:r .. - , ... Fed I r··, f · 
,;>_:.,t) f !(_:t-; 

.. 
... f .~ ; 
,,, I . ; , 
' ... l : ·• ' ·-· 

.. , , ... H. 'I Ii! I!• • .~: ~ I b l: . t : ' ~\ ·: i I : •• i 

i •.•: ;.•I i:d Ji·'! !~ i· ~ . JI i I '. ~ r.·: 

• :' ~ I I ~ 'i 11 i I l 1 ; ... , 

! ~: .:;.: ~r., ,~:! ! ~··1 

t(:l ~. r·~L· .1 i"PJ ·I i1i.' 

. 1 ',:Dit, h:Jl:!l!i ! M :'.'.i 
~ : .. ~~ii: f,k.;::t;(:: : ! t;~~ t ~ .. , M 
(.:. ~·~ ~ bfl!~ i : /,: ~ ~·~;: Lil:~ l ~ ~~~ ;~; t ~:· i ~] 

i ill;Nf, 

i f=:~:. i ~:i P~H)~::i· (3!1~t;! :l:: (.; 
· ;: : u ! C.P ;·(e· ... : Pr ~ ~- r~· i ·• • :;· ~. 

,·t-:t.·.li :isd I l t;l!l 

lt i:.t 1_i~ cl f 

I J" 
I 11•p,1:. it 

lol a I 

~.;,..1~·.:f f:r-Car.j \. :·· ·~ 
?. Cl.i;L II : ii,: i1 : 

:,:J;-h: ··,:) .. iltf;.:, 

;iJt('. ! li:'i'h 
)1:l[]'.I\· \ 111i· 

j ~ii 

l ::,.··=} 

\ il_!,i J 

~ I • t .I, J 

(0. /6) 

:. !~ /f; .; 

: I· [h ~ 
:;_1.1;:, 

'If l'lq'lll ''Ir 11·1· Fl 11·· ll'f lmll "I' l'l'l '1:1 1·:i ilt 
l1 I !11 ;ii!! I! ii ;I l1: I !Ii 1

:!l! 1 l ;j ! !!1! I 
* : l U ; U ) '.) '.l 4 J '.: 4 

/! 
ti! 

-
'.:::J'\· ·,, • J , ··,,~ > ,.,., Fed .l ('f ·• , .. '· 
.,_.) •.\ ,, I !\ . \ ~ ' \ I~;~) 

: {.~.-f .... 1.~~: l: ~~-, .,..,.,~ .• : :.!t:;.,; ir~.:--J :,··~ 
1 l;; ~ . : L : i ·; ;' -~:J i1; ~ti ::I ~ ! Pi:· ; ~ ;~j 

:,{.':~:. ,, f~i:~tc::-~·t A/~ 
· . .:~~·. ··ft;:_jJ!:: MV H~J i i 9 
it' .l ~ ,: /:(·. /~i~; .{4(1/ 

:j·:).J:J:. 
if:h l,\r_~;';; .;,· i r::;; ( r (·1 .1 ~h :ti:· !'M 

::;;,;J 

! ·.,: -~ I :·.!i ': ~- .;: )~ I .... ::~: ,f, ; ! 
( 111' : /()l ! h t:~J i-·, i; ·:: 

!~1 i:Ji ·: : :0\1 .·: :> L :\·~I, ~ H.: 
~ :,·~.,,A: i.] P.Gt~. F: ; 1:t; 

hitJliii!: f, . .idl 

u: ~);:,~qp! ~·. 

Iola! 

:~~ :l ~1 : ! o t ,:\ ~ 
id.­
i<1;,~;il 

loi .i I 

M,,,,; !'I! .,I' ;j '· '.:; 

i,1:,.:11;1:,:. h-11., 1 

iHI :I 1: HbL,,':W i .'·,: 

! iJ t:1 "l i ,.'i '1{ !:: : 
r 11c1n·.JL. I\ i•: 

Iola l D h:t:oun I~ 

·1 1,. . ' \"' 

'~ 
> • ..J 

1 1 ~ l 

~ •:)j 

/! /.: 
11.!lU 

?Lt(i 

( 

/J . i)ll 

t: ; ~ .. L: 

.. . .•:• '~) ' 

. I 

L' /!) 
, ?? 

!.; 'JH 

'!'!. !l'.l 
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~Id' ~(~ 
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. - / I V \ - I J""t. V I 

~~s ~b;~~ ~.y 8S~1S 
; 2 ~ 7 ,.:2 :: :3;::-:..!~2 

. ' . , .. ~ 
C)CJ2: ~e0, ,~ ~~~ 

['::: <\ : '·~ ~ '.< E(: :·: :: ~· e :· 5 
C:)~~id7 Re; ;;..-1.:-:c 

I ~::: ,: • ._ W 

, ·.~ \,• 

- ) \J..., 

28.23 
~ .G5 

8·0cty 2 ~-14-/00UiH· Qt~ 

t .. · 1 cf·~ ~:·s :' ~ 1 c~~e 
~a;~·ic: ;;}ta, 

• A• · .ol 

G-Oay 2 A-14-70001S ~ty l 

; __ .·.~<·::~:;·.~~ ~t:·J ~ ~ .. ~~Cf: 
~:~. ~ ~ i.~~xe~1 ::s,:ers 

., ....... :; 

~·.~~-.~ ~ ~· 
•.• , .. JJ "' ~~ .. 

ro1 al 

.:. 

·.~··....,, 
( r-·, .. ~ ... 

\ 

'.1.8.hf 

·' ... ·,;-~ 

21>. 79 

....... "\,", -... :;::: .... 

. . ,. ,~ .. 
:, : C!••: ·- ' • ~.,v.,, 

'"I. :·: • .:: .. ' 

'· 

;:e:!Ex Off,c:e i.s yc:ur dest\nat\011 
fur v1 1:t",~g cino s11iop1n~. 

577E 5 Eastern Ave 
Las Vegas, NV 891;9 
Te1: (702) 735-4402 

3i28/2016 2; 37; 15 PH ?ST 
'8ar'.1 M;:::be• , '·'i:::nde: S. 

Autc S:an-:o-?DF 
OC28e2 Reg. Pr'ce 

Total 

Totai 

··'-~.:-·Q•·""'~ ·'""" : :: ; 
.._.V ~ .... "'- ,., ..... \ ._. I 

. ,. ......... -. : ·: ... ..., ' .. 
',..,: 

71 '.; 
D.89 

63 .19 
28.40 

34.79 

D.49GO , 

34. 79 
2.S& 
r\ f'l"o 

",J .:....v 

37.63 

?.7 .63 

37 ~52 
o.:c: 
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Fed J Off. 'JJ;'\,) ':r-: ·'.7 . ., ' Y. ..,;,:.., . K ~e .. ( "' 

Cl<;D 
.,. 

• 'l. 
J '/ --I ,• ....... ; ! ·,v1 

. clt ~ t (Y.{,, -1 
H~dt\ G[h;e ·is yut11 tlesl \m,1 il,•1 

for pr11 1t iilY dit'~ ~lripµil,·: 

5m; S Eastern Ave 
Las VeGaS. NV 8911S 
i e ·i : i'/ LJ:) i 13:.-4402 

ilt/?.'J .:.1115 
1 :~~:5:~ PM ~·Sl 

iea111 Membe1: Lf.s1er 1-L 

S~LE 

;:\.l Bum - A,id' i 
Ol',302~. Reg . 11 r ice 

Re9u·1 aJ rota ·1 

DiscoU!J!'s 

1otal 

~.iul.: · [ ,Jta: 
fo:-. 
IH:pns i I 

lotal 

Hasi tt Card \ :-;i 
ACC(•llll l : f)4b 1 
Auth: jt L3P ti;,• 

rot a 1 fend:-;! 
t~hanQt! Due 

1 ~1 
3.98 

9 .!fi 
0.00 

9.00 

~-'~\JO I 

H.99 
0.81 
11 .uo 

10.80 

10 .8(! 

hJ.80 
0.00 

\ 
II ,, 
J 

\ 

i/)V ~ <fp-C,fJ -· /f Olt>Vl./ 
\J 

,:J", ··? ,,·, . 
-,1 •. ·. _)l !\ ,e .. Fed I r· ''f' 

\ ; 
•.) 

r .,. ,. 
' Y,.) 1..• 

h:dl , ,.11 t 1, c ; : , : . •t.: ;li~:. l 1 Pii I :. ,r· 
{ {L ~H :~]ti~ l:J ~UlJ :.,{ ~ 1 ;Ji .. ~ .·!::j. 

:~rt:j 1

~ t d~~r ('!r l: -.t 
; d~ \fega~~: [·J\' a~J 1 ·~, 
l~l: ,. /(l~i) {'t~ .. 4 !\· 

H~; .... ~·l.d / i: ~. (: j ... · 

fhilii MuliLH•: :;u~:t ,1 11 
C:i:: k,M!! : 1 ::c:t·a i l:U r.n~.I ,: \11 

0t.~ L 
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tll'.i~:f~·i~f!: ;:;; 
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Depo International 
703 South Eighth Street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 
Phone: 702-386-9322 Fax: 702-386-9825 

Accounts Payable 
Allen Lichtenstein, Attorney at Law, Ltd. 
No. 222 
3315 Russel Road 
Las Vegas, NV 89120 

Invoice Invoice Balance 
Date No. 

11/10/2015 23223 1,534.68 

11/11/2015 23263 1,590.00 

11/12/2015 23293 877.98 

11/18/2015 23417 928.73 

11/30/2015 23637 603.42 

11/30/2015 23662 416.15 

Tax ID: 45-0581340 

Accounts Payable 
Allen Lichtenstein, Attorney at Law, Ltd. 
No. 222 
3315 Russel Road 
Las Vegas, NV 89120 

Remit To: Depo International 
703 South Eighth Street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 

lob Date 

11/2/2015 

11/3/2015 

11/2/2015 

11/3/2015 

11/16/2015 

11/16/2015 

STATEMENT 
Account No. Date 

F2961 1/8/2016 

Current 30 Days 60 Days 

S0.00 $5,950.96 $0.00 

90 Oays 120 Days & Over Totat Due 

$0.00 $0.00 / $5,9S0.~6 
• , · \ ti ) 

Page 1 of 1 

Witness Case Name 

Warren McKay Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Cheryl Winn ~Jlary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Warren McKay Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Cheryl \"Jinn Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Deanna Wright Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 

Deanna wr:ght 

Account No. 

Date 

Total Due 

School District, et al. 
r•iary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Phone: (702) 433-2666 Fax:(702) 433-9591 

f2961 

1/8/2016 

$ 5,950.96 

PAYMENT WITH CREDIT CARD AM~ ~ I VISA: _J 

Cardholder's Name: 

card Number: 

Exp. Date: Phone#: 

Billing Address: 

Zip: Card Security Code: 

Amount to Charge: 

(arrlholder's Signature: 
r- _.,_ • • 
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Depo lntmnatfonal 
703 SoUlh BlghthSUHt 
laa\fi!gu,NV89101 

Ph:800S91.9722 Pu: 7ll2.386.982S 

John Houston SCOtt 
Scott Law Firm 
1388 Sutter street 
Sulte715 
San Francfst0, CA 94109 

ORIGINAL TRANSCRIPT 
Deanna Wright 

If you have any questions, ycu may contact our b!fllng department: 
Bllllng@depolntematronal.com 

lhank yo,Hor your oosrnessr 

·I<l VOICE 
Invoice No. Invoice Date lObN,. 

30047 11/9/2016 19639 
Job Data Case No. 

11/16/2015 A-1+700018-C 

Q,ase,-me 
Marv &yan, et al. vs. Qark County Sdlool D!sttict, et al. 

PaymentTenra., 

Oue upon receipt (1.5%/mo & collection) 

51~00 .. •,; . 

TOTAL DUE >>> 

Tax 1~ 45-0581340 Phone: (415) 561·9601 Fax:(41S) S61-9609 

Please detach bottom portion m,d rstum with payment. 

John Houston Scott 
Scott Law Firm 
1388 Sutter StJeet 
Suite715 
san Francisco, CA 94109 

Remit To: Depo Intemattonltl 
703 South Eighth Stnel: 
Lal Vagas, NV 89101 

Job No. : 19639 SUID :2-DI LV 
Oise No. : A-1+7000Ul-C 
Case Name : Masy Brvan, et at. vs. Oark County School 

District, et al. 
Invotce No. : 30047 Invoice Date : 11/9/2016 
Total Due : $ 51.00 

eAYMENT WITH CREDU CARD 
carul'lolder's Name: 
Card Number: 
Exp. Date: Phone#: 
Bllllng Address: 
Zip: Card Security Code: 
Amount ro Charge: 
t.ardholder's Signature; 
Emall: 
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D,po fllmm&Uood 
70Uollth!WJth!met 

Las Vegas,NV89101 
P.h: 800.$91.'»22 Par: 702.386.9825 

John Houston Scott 
SCOtt Law Ann 
1388 Sutler Street 
Sulm 715 
San Frandsco, CA 94109 

ORIGJNAL 'TRANSCRlPT 
Warren McKay 

Jf you.have any,qu~ons, you may contact our bl!llng dep,rtment: 
Bllllng@depolntematfonal.oom 

Thank you for vaui' tius·1nes.;1 

Invoice No. Involc:!e Date lob:No. 
30046 11/9/2016 19282 

lob Date CUeNo. 

11/2/201S A·l4-700018-C 

CaseNa~ 
Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County Sdlool Olstrfct, et at. 

Payment Terms 

Due upon recelpt {1.5%/mo & ex>lfectfon) 

~37.0.0 

Tax ID: 45-0581340 Phone: (415) 561-9601 Fa>c:(415} 561·9609 

Please d,uach bottom portion and retum with payment. 

John Houston Scott 
Scott Law Firm 
1388 Sutter Street 
Sulte715 
San FtantlSClO, CA 94109 

Remit To: Depo Jntematfonal 
703 SOuth Eighth Street 
Lis Vega1, NV 89101 

Job No. : 19282 SUID :2-01 LV 
Oise No. : A-14-700018-C 

case Name : Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark countv School 
District, et al. 

Invoice No. : 30046 Invoice Date : 11/9/2016 
Total Due : $ 137.00 

PAYMENT WITH CREDIT CARD 
cardhofdet's N!me: 
card Number: 

Exp. Date: Phone#: 
BIiiing Address: 
Zip: Card Security Code: 
An'lmJnt to Charge: 
0,rdholder's Signature: 
Email: 
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Depo lllfenlatfonal 
703South l!lgbthStteet 

Las Vegas, NV89101 
Ph: 800.591.9722 Far: 702l86.98ZS 

John Houstx,n SCOtt 
scott Law Ann 
1388 Sutter street 
Sulte715 
san Francfsco, CA 94109 

ORIGINAL TRANSaUPT 
Che.ryl Wfnn 

If you have anv questtons, you may contact our blfflng department: 
Bllllng@del,)Olntl!mattonal.com 

Thank you for your bustnessl 

JCl VOICE 
Invoice No. tnvolceDa~ J~~~ 

30044 11/9/2016 19283 
Jolt D!d8. ~seNo. 
11/3/2015 A-14-700018-C 

~N ~.me 
Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark C.Ountv SChool DIStrict, et al. 

Pl~Terms 
Due upon receipt (1.So/o/mo & collection) 

1s~ ... oo 
TOTAL DUE >>> t1Sl,OO 

Sy_ 
-::::-::.__:::::h::::,~:-_:-~----~--

Tax 1D: 4S-0581340 Phone: (415) 561-9601 Fax:(415) 561-9609 

Please <htach bottom po'l'tfon and rvtum with payment. 

John Housb:ln Sa'1:t 
Sc.ott Law Arm 
1388 Sutter Street 
Sulte715 
San Francisco, CA 94109 

Remit To: Depo lntamatlonal 
703 SoUUa Elahth Street 
us Vega,, NV 89101 

JabNo. : 19283 BUID :2-DI LV 
case No.. : A-14-700018·C 
Case Name : Marv Bryan, et al. vs. Clal1c County SChoot 

Dlst:rltt, et al. 
Involee No. : 30044 Invoice Date : 11/9/2016 
To18l Due : $ 151.00 

PAYMENT WITH CREDO: CARD ~~ II] ~'f PAp, 
Cardholder's Name: 
Card Number: 
l;)(p. Date: Phone#: 
Billing Adelres.s: 
Zip: card security COde: 
Amount to Charae: 
C.ardholder's Slgnarure: 

Emall: 
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Depo lanlatinul 
703. SttKth Blghlh Street 
Lu Vegas, NVS9101 

Ph: 800.5919122 Far: 70U86.9S2S 

John HotrstDn SCOtt 
Scott law Finn 
1388 Slitter Street 
Suite 715 
San Frclndsoo, CA 94109 

ORIGINAL lRANSCRIPT 
RobeJt Beasley 

·If you haVe any q~os. you may c:ontact our billing department: 
e1111ng@depo1ntemat1ona1.com 

Thank you forvourtusinest 

IC~ VOICE 
In:volce· Nb, IOYOi'l9 Date . ~ob.ijo, 

30045 11/9/2016 200S7 

lab~ CaseNo. 

1/26/2016 A--14700018-C 

case Name 

Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Oar!< CCunty School OJstrtct; et al. 

Paymei,t Terna 

Due upon receipt (1.S%/mo·& colledion) 

TOTAL DUE >>> $41.00 

~~N;~~-~t~ 
lB y -=---" .. .:=::;:::::::=::=:.I 

Tax ID: 45-0581340 Phone! (415) 561-9601 Fax:(415) 561-9609 

Please detrxch bottom portion (llld mum with ptlJ'ln1mt. 

John Hou&1Xln Scott 
Scott Law Finn 
1388 Sutter Street 
Sutte715 
San Francisco, CA 94~09 

Remit To: Depo lntiematlonat 
703 South Efohtll Street 
Las Vegu, NV 89101 

Job No. : 20057 BUIO 
Case No. : A-14700018..C 
Case Name : Ma,y Bryan, et at. vs. Oark COUntv. SChool 

District, et al 
Invoice No.. ! 30045 Invoice Date : 11/9/2016 
Total Due : $ 46.00 

PAYMENT WITH CREDIT CARD ~lai • -'!J!I\ 
Cardholder's N!me: 
card Number: 
Exp.Date~ Phone#: 
Bllllng Address: 
Zlo: Qsrd Security Code: 

AmolJTlt to Cherge: 
cardholder's S!Qnature: 

Emall: 

• I 
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Depo International 
703 South Eighth Street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 
Phone:702-386-!)322 Fax:702·386-982S 

John Houston 5cott 
Scott Law Firm 
uas suuer Street 
Sulte715 
San FrandSCo, CA 94109 

ORIGINAL & ONE ELECf'RONtC CERTlFlEC TRANSCRIPT 
Andrejoseph Long 

If you have:anv qu~lons, _ vou may contact oµr bll»ng departmenr. 
Bllllng@depolnte.matJonaLoom 

Thank you foryo~r business! 

& •• V V & '- I. 
~voice No. tnvolce Date: lob No. 

24901 2/4/2016 20059 
lobOate Ol,,eNo. 

1/.28/2016 A:-14700018-C 

ca~Hame . ' 

Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County School Ofsttld:, Et al. 

P';,ment Terms 
Oue upon recalpt 

TOTAL DUE >>> 

rax JO: 45-0581340 Phone: (415) 561~9601 fax:(415) S61·9509 

Pl~u detach hqtt<m1 portlan and 1'1!111r11 with payment, 

John Houston Scott 
S<:ott Law Firm 
1388 SUtter Street 
Suite 715 
San Francisco, CA 94109 

.emit To: Depo lntarnatfonal 
703 SOllth Sghth StrHt 
LH Vegas, NV 89101 

Job No. : 20059 8UlD 
Cese No. : A-14·700018-C 
case Name : Mary Bryan, et el. vs. Clark County School 

Olstritt, et al. 
Invoice No. : 24901 Invoice oate : 2/4/2016 

Tota1Du,e~ 

PAYMENT WUH CReDJTCARQ 
Cardholdets Name: 
and Number: 
Exp, Date: Phone#: 
Billing Address: 

card Security Code: 
Amount to Charge: 
C'.ardholdel"s Sl9nat;ure: 
Email: 
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.~. f f 

' 

04/07/2016~ .. 04:33 7024339591 

Depo 11\ternatlonal 
703' Sooth Eighth Street 

Les Vegas, NV 89101 
Pllcme: 702.386.93.2?. Fax: 702.386-,91126 

Accounts P&yable 
Allen Uehtensteln, Attorney at Law, Ltd. 
3806 FO~ Dttve 
Las Vegas, NV 89121 

n,..ot• ltMikli Balance 
081» ·No. 

,toli:oate 

' 
2141io1e 248'99., ,' 32Si7.6 . 1/17-/2016 

,< -

"14/2016 24902 r5'S?;,s3 

~ ' 
r . ., u 

Tax XOt 4S-OS813<!0 

Accounts Payable 
Allen Lichrenstelll, Attorney at~. lb:!. 
3806 forestcrest 0(,ve 
las Vegas, NV S!U21 

R~JTIJI; ro: ~po tnt,im;nl'ionaJ 
'103 SOUth flghth Stnet 
Las veoai. ftV a~u.01 

L- "Pf 
1 

1/2S/2016 

~ 

'Ii D 

' 

ALLEN LICHTE~STEIN PAGE 07/09 

STATE·ME·NT 
Account No. 

F2961 

cur~nt ,OQl,S . 60 Days 
$0.00 $862.59 $0,00 

00 Days 120 o.ys· & O\ler Totnl·Due 
$0.00 $0,00 $882,S9 

• I 

Page 1 of 1 

Witness C4seName 
.. 
Jolirt f!dwM 'HatP!n . -Mary Bryan, et 211. vs. Cliatt County 

sctroor t51sb1tt, e.t a1. · 
Andre Joseph Long Mery.Bryan, et al, 11s. Clark County 

SChOOI Olstria, at al. 

' 

.. s~\"o 
f\..~~. 

l)'t, y ~ 

{~~~t. 
,P-

I 

!)hone: (702) 433-2665 Fa,c:(7oi) 433.9591 

Account No. 
Data 

Total Dae 

cardhOldet's Name: . 

Exp. oar.e: . Ption'3#: 

•• e 

Zip: ., ., " card Security Code: . 
I 

Amount tn Charge: 
Cerdholder's Signature: 
Email: 

lt .. 
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Qepo I,ntel'1)aijQra1 · 
703 South Eighth street 
Las Vegas, .NV ·s~101 
Phone:102·386,9322 Fax:702~386~9825 

J9llr) Hou5!on Scott 
Scott Law Flan 
1388 Sutter Street' 
Su11:e·11s 
·san ·i=ranclsco, CA 94109 

jdkIG(NAL_& ONE C~RllFlEO TAANSCRIPT 

1 
RobertB®sfey 

I 

: If' you have·any .QU~t101'!S,. you may contact our b!ltrng 'department: 
. e1.11111g@depolntemattonal.coin 

Thank you for yaur business! 

~ trcrrr1rn~1 
. w FEB ~ 6 20,s ~ 

Bv. _ __ ..__ __ _ 
..... ~~-,,.,,,._ ... ~ ·"·_....... . 

I 

.... .. ._, ... "' .. 
Invoice No. i~v~t~e~te J,ob~o. 

24805 2/1/201f!, ~0~7 
Job.patQ qtse~o. 
11261io1ir A-1~~100018..c 

C'J.~Na~e 
; 

·Mary Bryan, et al. vs. ClaYk County School 01$1¢, ~t al. 

•: 

~ay~f,,"nt Ter;ns. 
Qu~ upon receipt 

TOTAl:.-Dli°E·.>>> . . 

¢2 

'tss.~·.oo 
&~ 

Phone: (415) 561~·01 Fax:(~15) 56'1·9609 

PlenStJ deiack b(lttbm porl/011 <mcfrelum with paylf/eui. 

John Houston·Scolt 
~ott Law·flrin 
1388 $titter. Street 
Sutte:Z15 . 
S~n Fr<lnclsco, CAA)4109 

emit To: _OeP,~ •n,~natif'mll 
703 South Eigt\th Street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 

J?b. No. : 20051 :au ID :;?;-DlLV 
case No. : A~14-700018.;c 
C:ase Nam1; >; Marv B1Yan, et,al, vs; Ciark:COunw School 

· · · · : District, et al. · 

In.voJceNo .. . : l480S: .Invoice Date· :2/,1/201.6 
Total Due : $ S3$,00 

Pt\YMENl: Wm ts1;prr CARD 
·cardholde~~ (iJ~me: 
card Numbi?r: 
Exp, D,ate:. Phone#: . 
Bllllng Add~ess: 

Amqunt._to Charge: 
cardholder.'s·SJgi1ature: 
1:rrrail: 



42 42
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1 Allen Lichtenstein (J\iV State Bar No. 3992) 
ALLEN LICHTENSTEIK, LTD. 

2 3315 Russell Road, No. 222 
Las Vegas, NV 89120 

3 Tel: 702.433-2666 
Fax: 702.433-9591 

4 allaw@lvcoxmail.com 

5 John Houston Scott (CA Bar No. 72578) 
Admi tted Pro Hae Vice 

6 SCOTI LAW FIRM 
1388 Sutter Street, Suite 7 15 

7 San Francisco, CA 94109 
Tel: 41 5.561-9601 

8 john@scotllawfirm.net 

9 Attorneys/or Plaintiffs, Mary B,yan. F:than Bryan, 
Aimee !lairr and Nolan Jlairr 

Electronically Filed 
8/1 512017 9:27 AM 

10 

11 

12 

DISTRICT CO"LlRT 

CLARK COUNTY, NEV ADA 

13 MARY BRYAK, mother of ETHAN BRYM; Case Ko. A-14-700018-C 

Dept. No. xxvn 

ERRATA TO 

14 

15 

16 

AlMEE HAIRR. mother of NOLAN HAIRR, 

Plaintiffs, 

vs. 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DlSTRlCT 
17 (CCSD 

PLAINTWFS' RESPONSE TO 
DEFENDANTS MOTION TO RETA 
COSTS 

18 

19 

20 

21 

Defendant _ 
Department: XXVTT 

Trial Dates: Day I, I 1/ 15/ 16; Day 2, 
11 / 16/ 16; Day 3, 11/ 17/16; Day 4, 11/1 8/16; 
Dav 5, 11 /22/16 

Plaintiffs' Response to Defendants 'Motion to R~tax Costs1 filed August 14, 2017 

22 inadvertently omitted page 2. A corrected version with page 2 is attached. 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

Dated this 15th day of August 2017, 

Respectfully submitted by; 

/s/ Allen Lichtenstein 
Allen Lichtenstein 
:'Jevada Bar No. 3992 
ALLEK LICHTENSTEIN LTD. 

1 
Case Number: A-14-700018-C 
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3315 Russell Road, No. 222
Las Vegas, NV 89120
Tel: 702.433-2666
Fax: 702.433-9591
allaw@lvcoxmail.com

John Houston Scott (CA Bar No. 72578)
Admitted Pro Hac Vice
SCOTT LAW FIRM
1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715
San Francisco, CA 94109
Tel: 415.561.9601
john@scottlawfirm.net
Attorneys for Plaintiffs, Mary Bryan, Ethan Bryan,
Aimee Hairr and Nolan Hairr

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that I served the following Errata to Plaintiffs Response to Defendants

Motion to Retax Costs via United States Mail

and/or e-mail on the 15th day of August 2017, to:

Dan Waite
Lewis Rocha Rothgerber Christie
3993 Howard Hughes Pkwy., Suite 600
Las Vegas, NV 89169-5996

DWaite@lrrc.com

/s/ Allen Lichtenstein
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1 Allen Lichtenstein (NV State Bar No. 3992) 
ALLEN LICHTENSTEIN, LTD. 

2 3315 Russell Road, No. 222 
Las Vegas, NV 89120 

3 Tel: 702.433-2666 
Fax: 702.433-9591 

4 allaw@lvcoxmail.com 

5 John Houston Scott (CA Bar No. 72578) 
Admitted Pro Hae Vice 

6 SCOTT LAW FIRM 
1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715 

7 San Francisco, CA 94109 
Tel: 415.561-9601 

8 john@scottlawfirm.net 

9 Attorneys for Plaintiffs, Ma,y Bryan, Ethan Bryan, 
Aimee Hairr and Nolan Hairr 

10 

11 

12 

DISTRICT COURT 

CLARK COUNTY, NEV ADA 

13 MARY BRYAN, mother of ETHAN BRYAN; 
AIMEE HAIRR, mother of NOLAN HAIRR, 

14 

15 

16 
vs. 

Plaintiffs, 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
17 (CCSD 

Defendant . 

Case No. A-14-700018-C 

Dept. No. XXVII 

PLAINTIFFS' RESPONSE TO 
DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO RET AX 
COSTS 

Department: XXVII 

18 

19 

20 Plaintiffs have reviewed Defendant's Motion to Retax Costs that have made the following 

21 adjustments, resulting in a revised total cost amount of $20, $672.32, as reflected in attached 

22 
Exhibit 1. Defendants• motion listed ten separate areas. Plaintiffs' response to each is as follows. 

23 

24 
A. The e-file fee has been adjusted to $280.50. As for the question of an additional 

$30 fee for Aimee Hairr, Plaintiffs are willing to forgo that. 
25 

26 B. The supporting documentation for in house copies and faxes can be found in the 

27 attached Exhibit 2. 

28 
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C. The May 13, 2015 FedEx bill for $41.74 has been removed for lack of

documentation, as has any fees for meals. All further documentation for Fedex services has now

been provided in the attached Exhibit 3.

D. The cost of the November 28, 2016 Court Reporter deposit and service has been

adjusted to reflect the $2000 paid by Plaintiffs, documentation of which has already been

provided.

E. Pursuant to Kalitta Air L.L.C. v. Cent. Tex. Airborne Sys. Inc., 741 F.3d 955, 958

vice, and the travel associated with that status. Costs for copying remain pursuant to NRS 18.005

(12), Costs for postage remain pursuant to NRS 18.005 (14).

F. Costs for serving NERC have been removed.

G. The costs for scanning copying and compiling exhibits remain pursuant to

NRS.005 (12) and (14). These are not routine overhead costs but were done specifically to

produce exhibits in this case. The fact that they were not done in-house is irrelevant to NRS

18.005. Lewis Rocha Rothgerber and Christie, LLP is a large multistate law firm with three

locations in Nevada alone. The fact that it finds doing its large-scale copying and scanning in the

house to be financially advantageous does not mean that the same is true for a sole practitioner. In

any case, Defendants cite no legal authority to suggest that NRS 18.005 views these items as

routine overhead.

H. The $75.47 June 18 19th and 22nd and printing of disclosures are clearly items that

listed as costs under NRS 18.005 (12) and (14).

I. All charges from Depo International referred to in this section are documented by

invoices set forth in the attached Exhibit 4. Depositions utilized a Reporter and a Videographer.
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1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

J. Costs paid by CCSD in the amount of $182 has been removed. 

Dated this 14th day of August 2017 

Respectfully submitted by: 

ls/Allen Lichtenstein 
Allen Lichtenstein 
Nevada Bar No. 3992 
ALLEN LICHTENSTEIN LTD. 
3315 Russell Road> No. 222 
Las Vegas) NV 89120 
Tel: 702.433-2666 
Fax: 702.433-9591 
alJaw@lvcoxmail.com 

John Houston Scott (CA Bar No. 72578) 
Admitted Pro Hae Vice 
SCOTT LAW FIRM 
1388 Sutter Street) Suite 715 
San Francisco, CA 94109 
Tel: 415.561.9601 
john@scottlawfirm.net 
Attorneys for Plain.tiffs, Mary Bryan, Ethan Bryan, 
Aimee Hairr and Nolan Hairr 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE 

I hereby ce11ify that I served the following Plaintiffs' Response to Defendants' Motion to 

Retax Costs via Court's electronic filing and service system and/or United States Mail and/ore-
19 

mail on the 14th day of August 2017, to: 
20 

21 Dan Polsenberg 
Dan Waite 

22 Lewis Rocha Rothgerber Christie 
3993 Howard Hughes Pbvy., Suite 600 

23 Las Vegas, NV 89169-5996 

24 DPolsenberg@lrrc.com 
DWaite@lrrc.com 

25 

26 

27 

28 

/s/ Allen Lichtenstein 

-3-
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Plaintiffs' Costs and Disbursements 

In Reference To: Mary Bryan and Amy Hairr v Clark County School District (CCSD) et. al, 

{Case No. A-14-700018-C} 

COSTS 

8/22/2014 Hearing transcript (Lichtenstein). 

6/19/2015 Printing disclosures (Lichtenstein). 

6/22/2015 Mailing disclosures (Lichtenstein). 

6/30/2015 Copies and Faxes made in office 06/01/2015-06/30/2015. 

8/31/2015 Copies and Faxes made In office 08/0l/2015-08/31/2015. 

10/23/2015 Discovery CD (Lichtenstein). 

11/2/2015 Deposition of Warren McKay (Depo International Inv #23223). 

Deposition transcript of Warren McKay (Oepo International Inv #23293). 

11/3/2015 Deposition of Cheryl Winn (Depo International Inv #23263). 

Deposition transcript of Cheryl Winn (Depo International Inv #23417). 

11/16/2015 Deposition of Deanna Wright (Oepo International Inv #23637). 

Deposition transcript of Deanna Wright (Depo International Inv #23662). 

Wright deposition transcript (Lichtenstein). 

11/30/2015 Copies and Faxes made in office 10/01/2015-11/30/2015. 

12/22/2015 Deposition of Nolan Michael Hairr (Litigation Services, Inv #1044327). 

1/5/2016 Deposition of CL (Western Reporting Services, Inv #49962). 

1/6/2016 Deposition of Aimee Olivia Hairr (Litigation Services, Inv #1046125). 

1/13/2016 Deposition of D M (Western Reporting Services, Inv #49981). 

1/21/2016 Deposition of Ethan Bryan (Litigation Services, Inv #1048764). 

1/25/2016 Deposition of Leonard Depiazza (Oepo International Inv #24752). 

1/26/2016 Deposition of Robert Beaseley (Depo International Inv #24805). 

1/27/2016 Deposition transcript of John Edwin Halpin (Depo International Inv #24899}. 

Deposition of John Edwin Halpin (Depo International Inv #24897). 

1/28/2016 Deposition transcript of Andre Joseph Long (Oepo International Inv #24902). 

Deposition of Andre Joseph Long {Depo International Inv #24.901). 

1/31/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 01/01/2016-01/31/2016. 

2/5/2016 Deposition of Mary Bryan (Litigation Services, Inv #1051615}. 

2/16/2016 Deposition of Heath Hairr (Litigation Services, Inv #1051615). 

Amount 

60.00 

63.77 

. S.95 

27.20 

4.00 

10.80 

1,534.68 

877.98 

1,590.00 

928.73 

603.42 

416.15 

19.46 

210.40 

1,183.05 

372.80 

960.SS 

379.30 

1,138.50 

815.00 

533.00 

325.76 

589.50 

556.83 

947.50 

190.60 

1,031.40 

160.00 
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Deposition of Gina Abbaduto (Litigation Services, Inv #1053295). 

2/19/2016 Deposition of Asheesh Dewan, MD (Litigation Services, Inv #1053578). 

Deposition of Edmond Faro, MD (Litigation Services, Inv #1053610). 

2/24/2016 Deposition of Dennis Moore, MD (Litigation Services, Inv #1052063). 

2/29/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 02/01/2016-02/29/2016. 

3/17/2016 Federal Express shipment to Allen Lichtenstein, Las Vegas, NV (FedEx #775904967664). 

3/28/2016 Documents scanned to PDF (Lichtenstein) 

4/1/2016 Documents scanned to PDF (Lichtenstein). 

4/21/2016 Efile transactions for Maiy Bryan - 04/30/2014-04/21/2016 (Lichtenstein). 

4/29/2016 lewis Roca transcript fee (Lichtenstein}. 

8/31/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 08/01/2016-08/31/2016. 

10/31/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 10/0l/2016-10/31/2016. 

11/9/2016 Federal Express shipment to Allen Lichtenstein, Las Vegas, NV {FedEx #7777679212411). 

Oepo transcript of Robert Beasley, taken 1/26/2016 (Depo lnternational Inv #30045). 

Depo transcript of Cheryl Winn, taken 11/16/2015 {Depo International lnv #30044). 

Depo transcript of Warren McKay, taken 11/2/2015 (Depo International Inv #30046), 

11/9/2016 Depo transcript of Deanna Wright, taken 11/16/2015 (Depo International Inv #30047). 

Binders and tabs for trial {Lichtenstein). 

11/15/2016 District Court Transcript ofTrial 11/15/16-11/18/16, 11/22/16 

11/28/2016 Court reporter deposit and service (Kimberly Lawson Karr Reporting Inv #11/28/2016. 

12/31/2016 Copies and Faxes made in office 12/01/2016-12/31/2016. 

3/15/2017 Copies and binding. (Lichtenstein). 

3/16/2017 Copies and binding. (Lichtenstein). 

3/31/2017 Copies and Faxes made in office 03/0l/2017-03/31/2017. 

5/31/2017 Copies and Faxes made in office during OS/01/2017-05/31/2017. 

Total Costs 

607.25 

135.95 

182.10 

236.35 

67.40 

32.49 

37.63 

42.39 

280.50 

90.14 

6.40 

51.80 

115.11 

46.00 

151.00 

137.00 

51.00 

47.48 

440.00 

2000.00 

182.80 

92.95 

34.22 

23.60 

44.40 

$20.672.32 
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Financial 

i1r~·An M:uy 
Total Financial Assessment $280.50 

Total Payments and Credits $280.SO 

4/30/2014 Transaction Asse..<sment $270.00 

4/30/2014 Efile Payment Receipt# 2014-50310-CCCLK Bryall, Mary ($270.00) 

7/27/2015 Transaction Assess'.T'ent $3.50 

7/27/2015 Eflle Payment Receipt # 201 5-78 71 8-CCCI. !< Bryan. Mary ($3.50) 

3/21/2016 Transaction Assessmen~ $3.SO 

3/21/2016 Eflle Payment Receip: # 2016-2845:l-CCCU< Bryan, Mary ($3.50) 

4/21/2016 Tr,msaction Assessmeo: $3.50 

4/21/2016 Elile Payment Receipt-# 2016-38796-CCO.'< Bryan, Mary ($3.50) 

~;k):!'\ ~;;,.~;1\~!' Sr:r.~o' Dis.tr:"',I /!? ~; 

Total Financial Assessmer.t $182.00 

Total Payments anel Credits $182.00 

6/30/2014 Transaction $3.SO 

AsseGsment 

6/30/2014 Efile Payment Receipt # 2014· 75526-CCCLi< Clari< Couow School Oistrict, ($3,50) 

7/1/2014 Transaction $3.SO 

Assessment 

7/1/2014 Efile Payment Receipt 'I' 2014·751111-CCCLK Clark Co'Jn~y School District, ($3.SO) 

8/1/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

8/1/2014 Efile Payment Receipt # 2014-88628-CCCLK Clark County School District, ($3.50) 

8/1/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

8/t/2014 Efile Payment Receipt # 2014·86733·CCCLK Clerk County School District, ($3.50) 

8/7/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

8/7/2014 Efile Payment .lece,pt # 2014-90709-CCCLK Clark CoLnty SchOol District, ($3,50) 

9/10/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

9/10/2014 Efile Payment Receipt II 2014-103862· Oark C01..n:y School District, ($3.SO) 

CCCLK 

9/10/2014 Tra.l\saction $3.50 

Assessment 

9/10/2014 EN1e Payment Receipt # 2014-104055- Clark County Sct\ool District, ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

11/18/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

11/18/2014 Efile Payment Receipt ;, 2014·t2996l- Clark C'Ovnty School District, ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

11/20/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

l 1/?0/2014 Efile Payment Receipt t: 2014-130847· Oar,< County SchOol District, ($3,50) 

CCCL,< 

12/9/2014 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 

12/9/2014 E'file Payment lleceipt # 2:!14-137192· Clark Cot;ntv School District, ($3.50) 

CCCLK 

12/10/2014 Transaction $3,50 

Assessment 

12/10/2014 E'file Payment ~eceipt # 2014-:37325· Clark Coanty School Olstri~t. ($3.SO) 

CCCLK 

1/16/2015 Transaction $3.50 

Assessment 
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DEPARlMENT CODE UST 
TIME : 06-26·2015 13:01 

DEPARTMENT 

TWIN/MONO COLOR 

PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

SMALL 0 20 20 SMAl..l 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 20 20 0 0 0 0 

BLACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 O·. 

FAX COMMUNICATION SCAM COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK -TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NE1WORK COPY COPY FAX NElWO~K 

SMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
:ARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
., 

IEPT NO. DEPARTMENT 

-1~7-J-O 
~ . 42 Bryan, Mary/Hairr I 

RI NT COUNTER 

JLL COLOR lWIN/ MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT 

0

TOTAL 
MLL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

I\CK 

COPY FAX PR INT U ST TOTAL UMIT 
All 0 0 136 0 136 
!GE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 136 0 136 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NElWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
LL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
;e 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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DEPARTMENT CODE UST 
TIME : 09-14-2015 09:28 

DEPARTMENT __...,. 
ff COUNTER 

• COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

LL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 

;e 0 Q 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

:K 
COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAt. LIMIT 

LL 0 0 0 0 0 

iE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 ' 

COMMUN I CAT f ON SCAN COUNTER ·-. 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BlACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

LL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 

lE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

- NO. OEPARTIAENT oo ~2 Bryan, Mary/Hairr I Lf, 
} IT COUNTER 
I 

, COLOR lWIN/MONO COLOR 
I 
I 

COPY PRltIT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL I 
I 

_L 0 20 20 SMALL 0 0 0 I 

;E 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 I 
0 20 20 0 0 0 0 

:K 
COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

_L 0 0 0 0 0 

;e 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR lW!N/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT , RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

:..L 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 

;e 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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DEPARTMENT CODE LIST 
TIME : 12·07-201511:38 

DEPARTMENT 
Bryan, Mary/Hairr - 1J d...l o · ~ 0 

II NT COUNTER 

ll COLOR· "TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY 

ALL 0 27 27 SMALL 0 
lGE 0 ·O 0 tARGE 0 

0 27 27 0 0 

CK 
COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

LL 237 0 188 0 1025 
;e 0 0 0 0 0 

237 0 788 0 1025 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY 

0 0 SMALl 0 0 0 
0 0 tARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 

NO • DEPARTMENT .._.. 
COUNTER 

OLOR lWlN/ MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY 

0 0 0 SMALL 0 
0 0 0 LARGE 0 

0 0 0 0 0 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

0 
0 

0 

IUNICATION 

RANSMIT 

0 
0 

0 

0 0 0 
0 0 0 
0 0 0 

SCAN COUNTER 

RECEPTION 

0 SMALL 
0 LARGE 

0 

FULL COLOR 

COPY NE1WORK 

0 0 
0 0 
0 0 

0 
0 

0 0 

TWIN/ MONO COLOR 
COPY 

0 
0 

0 

PRINT 
0 
0 

0 

-;., 

BLACK 

COPY 
118 

0 

118' 

PRINT 
0 
0 

0 

BLACK -COPY 

0 
0 

0 

TOTAL 

0 
0 

0 

I 

I 
I I 

\ I 

I FAX NElWORK ~ I 
0 0 
0 0 

0 0 

TOTAL 

0 
0 

0 

1K -·o 
0 

FAX NETWORK -
0 

0 
0 
0 0 

0 0 

I • 
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DEPARTMENT CODE UST 
TIME : 02·04-2016 11 :59 

DEPARTMENT ~ 
Bryan, Mary/He i rr · / 10 L /.J;Q 

PRINT COUNTER 

FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY I PRINT TOTAL 

SMALL 0 33 33 SMALL 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 33 33 a 0 0 0 

BLACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

SMALL 82 0 838 0 920 
LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

82 0 838 0 920 0. 
'• 

FAX COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TW I NJ MONO COLOR BLACK --

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
SMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 42 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 42 0 0 ., 
DEPT NO. DEPARTMENT 
D 43 ~ 
PRINT COUNTER 

FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

SMALL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

81LACK 
COPY FAX PR I NT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

FAX COMMUNICATjON SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK -TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NEnvDRK 

SMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
LARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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PARTMENT CODE LIST 
TIME : 03-03-2016 17:53 

DEPARTMENT 
§ • 

FULL COLOR lWIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

SMALL 0 39 39 SMALL a 0 0 
lARGE 0 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 

0 39 39 0 0 0 0 

3LACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

:MALL 0 0 0 0 0 
ARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

~ COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR Bl.ACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK ' COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

~ALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 i 

I 
0 0 0 0 0 ! 0 0 0 . 

i 
PT NO. DEPARTI.iENT 

!ro~- iu Bryan, Mary/Halrr 
!. 

42 ' 
' I NT COUNTER 

.l COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 
,LL 0 13 13 SMALL 0 0 0 
3E 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 13 13 0 0 0 0 

:K - COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 
I 

.L 21 0 303 0 324 :i 
E 0 0 0 0 0 

21 0 303 0 324 0 

:oMMUN I CAT I ON SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR lWIN/ MONO COLOR BLACK ,_ 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 21 0 0 
0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 21 0 0 
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LL. 

llME : 04-03-2017 11 :00 

INT COUNTER 

LL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

!All 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

ACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

IALL 0 0 0 0 0 
RGE a 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

X COMMUN I CATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR "TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK -

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NElWORK 
IALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 a 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

PT NO. DE~ARTMENT 

-7 -2-3. (eO 
42 Bryan, Mary/Hairr 

INT COUNTER 

LL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

IALL 0 0 0 SMAU 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

ACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 
1ALL 0 0 118 0 118 
RGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 118 0 118 0 

.X COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT ' RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NElWORK 
~ALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
.RGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

• 
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__ ., .. . .. .. -
ARTMENT CODE UST 

TIME· : 06-08-2017 10:33 

DEPARTMENT ._... 
: I NT COUNTER 

LL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

ALL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
\GE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

~CK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 
\LL 0 0 0 0 0 
GE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
LL 0 0 SMALL. 0 0 0 0 0 0 
;E 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 a 0 0 0 0 0 0 

• NO. DEPARTMENT _, qf. r(o 2 Bryan, Mary/Hairr 

T COUNTER 

COLOR TIYIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

L 0 141 141 SMALL 0 0 0 l 
. 0 0 0 lARGE 0 0 0 I 

0 141 141 0 0 0 0 
I 

l 

COPY FAX PRINT l.lST TOTAL LIMIT 

0 0 81 0 81 
0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 81 0 81 0 

JMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR nv1 N/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT Rl;CEPTION COPY NE'TWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK { 

0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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TIME . :09-01-201614:18 

NT COUNTER 

l COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

.LL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
3E 0 () 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

:K 
COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

LL 0 0 0 0 0 
,E 0 0 0 0 0 ~ 

0 0 0 0 0 0 

COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER •, 

FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR . 81:.ACK 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
LL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
;E 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

. NO. DEPARTMENT 

"'"' !( t) 

I 
12 Bryan, Mary/Hairr 

I 
IT COUNTER I 

I 
' . COLOR iWIN/MONO COLOR 
t COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 
• .L 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 l iE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

:K 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 
.L 0 0 32 0 32 
;E 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 32 0 32 0 

COMMUN f CA Tr ON SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR T\!IIN/MONO COLOR BLACK 

TRANSMIT ·•RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NE'N/ORK 
.1. 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
E 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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l 

DEPARTMENT CODE LIST 
· l 

TIME. : 10-31-2016 11 :04 I 
I 

DEPARTMENT 
-If SI- r 0 ! 

l 42 Bryan, Mary/Hairr ! 
I 

1RINT COUNTER I 
=ULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR I 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL I 
I 

;MALL 0 47 47 SMALL 0 0 0 I 

ARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 I 
0 47 47 0 0 0 0 

ILACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

iMALL 55 0 157 0 212. 
ARGE 0 0 0 0 0 ' 

55 0 157 0 212 0 

=AX COMMUN I CAT I ON SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR ··. Bl.ACK -

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

,MALL 0 0 SMAU. 0 5 0 55 0 8 

ARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 5 0 55 0 8 

>EPT NO. DEPARTMENT ., 
) 44 

>RI NT COUNTER 

=ULL COLOR 'TV/IN/MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

iMALL 0 59 59 SMALL 0 0 0 

.ARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 59 59 0 0 0 0 

lLACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

iMALL 16 0 105 0 121 

.ARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

16 0 105 0 121 0 

=AX COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR TWIN/MONO COLOR BLACK -

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

iMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 16 0 16 

.ARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 16 0 16 
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r. DEPARTMENT CODE UST 
TIME ; 01 -04-2017 16:18 

T NO. DEPARTMENT 
37 .__ 

INT COUNTER 

LL COLOR TWIN/ MONO COLOR 

COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 
IALL 0 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

ACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAl. LIMIT 

•ALL 0 0 0 0 0 
RGE 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 •O 

J< COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR 1WIN/MONO COLOR • BLACK ·-

TRANSM IT RECEPTION COPY NETWORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 

MLL 0 0 SMALL 0 0 0 0 0 0 
\RGE 0 0 LAROE 0 0 0 0 0 0 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

:PT NO. DEPARTMENT 
42 Bryan, Mary/ Ha i rr :.I; r .J . p-o 

RINT COUNTER 

ULL COLOR lWIN/ MONO COLOR 
COPY PRINT TOTAL LIMIT COPY PRINT TOTAL 

MALL 0 20 20 SMALL 0 0 0 ( ARGE 0 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 

0 20 20 0 0 0 0 [ 
.. 

;LACK 

COPY FAX PRINT LIST TOTAL LIMIT 

iMALl 31 0 863 0 894 
.ARGE 0 0 0 0 0 

31 0 863 0 894 0 

=AX COMMUNICATION SCAN COUNTER 
FULL COLOR 1Wf N/ MONO COLOR BLACK 

I 

TRANSMIT RECEPTION COPY NETIIORK COPY COPY FAX NETWORK 
SMALL 0 0 SMALL 0 2 0 31 0 49 
LARGE 0 0 LARGE 0 0 0 0 0 0 I 

0 0 0 2 0 31 0 49 
1 

l • 

I 
I. 
{ .. 
I 
I 
I 
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November 16, 201512:51 
Receipt#: 0741219978 
MasterCard #: XXXXXXXXXXXX8461 
2015/11/1612:36 

Qty Description 

150 ES B&W SIS White 8.5 x11 

SubTotal 
Taxes 
Total 

Page: 1 

Amount 

18.00 

18.00 
1.46 

19.46 

The Cardholder agrees to pay th& Issuer of the charge 
card In accordance with the agreement between the 
Issuer and the Caroholder. 

FedEx Office Print & Ship Centers 

395 Hughe& Ctr Or. 
Las Vegas,NV 89109 
(702) 951·2400 
www.FedExottice.com 

Tell us how we're doing and receive 
20% off your next $35 print order 
fedax.com/welisten or 1 ·800-398--0242 
Offer Code: __ Offer expires 12/3112015 

Please Recycle This Receipt 

f .,, /'') 

i_ .. -· -r G 
I 
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Address Information 
Ship to: 
Allen Lichtenstein 

Shipment Receipt 

Ship from: 
John Houston Scott 
Scott Law Finn 

O~f-'t'- l rf"' - · ~age 1 of 1 
e ,'(... vi. , ... .. 1. o ~ ;4{ lm11t :s 
'Dec larA-ti~ r~~r~<-,t.t> -f:~ 

i.e. /vt~ ..f..t.,ii,..., T&) D~ gu..4-l ,~ ~ v 

3315 Russell Road, No. 222 

LAS VEGAS. NV 

1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715 

89120 
us 
(702) 433-2666 

Shipment Infonnation: 
Tracking no.: 775904967664 
Ship date: 03/17/2016 

San Francisco, CA 
94109 
us 
4155619601 

Estimated shipping charges: 32.49 

Package Information 
Pricing option: FedEx Standard Rate 
Service type: Priority Overnight 
Package type: FedEx Envelope 
Number of packages: 1 
Total weight: 0.80 LBS 
Declared Value: 0.00 USD 
Special Services: Residential Delivery 
Pickup/Drop-off: Drop off package at FedEx location 

Billing Information: 
Bill transportation to: MyAccount-722 
Your reference: Bryan/Hain· 
P.0.no.: 
Invoice no.: 
Department no.: 

; _ .~~~~.~ !ou.~o~ shi~~I~~ :~n~ne. ~i:h '.~.dE~:s.hi~~~~~;~r ;;~~~~.c~~· .. · · -:· ··:·:~~:·.·.:~~·-~~:-:~~~:~~:~:.~:·=-~=---~-~::.:] 
Please Note 
Fed6x win not bo raapoosib!e for any claim In oxcoas or S100 par pnckagn, whelller U'lo resun or loss, damage, <!Olay, non,daHvary, m1,ae11vary, or mllln!ormoUon, unless you dacWo a 
hlghor val\Ja, pay an eddlllonal chargo, clo~menl your actual Ion and tla a timely claim. UmltoUons (ound In the wrronl FedEK Servico Gulde opply. Your right to 1ecover from FedEx 
!or any lose, Including lntnnslo votuo of lho packago, loss of 1a!e1. Income lnte1011, profit, altomoy'e feoa. costs. ~od o:l)er form, o/ dumaga wholho, direct, lncl<lonlal, oonsequendol, or 
apeclol le llmltod to tho greater or $100 or tho outhonzed daclarod vnluo. Rocovory cannot oxcood actual dOOlU!lented Jon. Malcimum for Homs ol e)!1raoralnary valt1t1 Is $1000, e.g., 
1owa1ry, p1edous molllls. negoUab(e ln, lrumahts end oilier Item, Uelad In ovr Service Guido. Writton dalm, must bo filad wllhln otrict uma llmlte; Cansull tho apptlaib!e Fad6x S8'111ce 
Oukle for detalls. 
Tho o,umalod •hipping chargo may bo dllfoltllll I/Ian 11\t oc1ue1 e!laf8H tor your ahlpmonJ. O!f!oroncoa may =r buad an •e1ve1watg·~t. dlmenllion,. &n<I olh&r factora. Conslf!t Ill• 
•Ppllcab:O F,s!Ex Sorvtce Gylge or lho FollE>< Rate Shoat a for do!1l1 oo llow shipping r:htrnes ore 04!c"811ld. 

., 
https://www.fedex.com/shippinglhtml/en/PrintIFrame.html 3/17/2016 
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l'cdEx B1lllng Vnlme 

I of I 

FedE)( Billlng Onlhio 

l'r.,ckill!J IU Oetalh; 

Tr~cking ID Summary 

Blllln!) ln!o,maUon 

Troolong IP no. 

Invoice ro~ 

Accoun,no. 
8illcft1IC 

Tolal e11rco 

Trt.ckfng 10 aila"co dve 

Sl•tvs 

Vi..'l~'t' Jt:~.~;,•:l1 ~ li;t.lC~t{ 

\J,"f.:.\'( J/r;1m111u,> rJ-:')~\r ~.1. ~h\l.i•,,,t..,., 

T n"1snction Details 

S~r,dor lnlorm•tlon 

Joh11 Houslon Seou 
Scoll lavt Fi•m 

1388 Soller s1,ea1, su;ie 7:5 

SAN FR/lNC<SCO CA 94109 

vs 

Stiip<lato 

P-'yf\l$nt lypc 

Sel\'tCIJ lypo 

Zone 

P..s<:k1ge 1-,pe 

Wei9hl 

'"'iec~, 
Mth:HNO, 

Oecl~rco vatut: 

OrlglnAI Reference 

C\Js.lome, retort4\t• 110. 

Oer>ar1menl no. 
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Depo International 
703 South Eighth Street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 
Phone: 702-386-9322 Fax: 702-386-9825 

Accounts Payable 
Allen Lichtenstein, Attorney at Law, Ltd. 
No. 222 
3315 Russel Road 
Las Vegas, NV 89120 

Invoice Invoice Balance 
Date No. 

11/10/2015 23223 1,534.68 

11/11/2015 23263 1,590.00 

11/12/2015 23293 877.98 

11/18/2015 23417 928.73 

11/30/2015 23637 603.42 

11/30/2015 23662 416.15 

Tax ID: 45-0581340 

Accounts Payable 
Allen Lichtenstein, Attorney at Law, Ltd. 
No. 222 
3315 Russel Road 
Las Vegas, NV 89120 

Remit To: Depo International 
703 South Eighth Street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 

lob Date 

11/2/2015 

11/3/2015 

11/2/2015 

11/3/2015 

11/16/2015 

11/16/2015 

STATEMENT 
Account No. Date 

F2961 1/8/2016 

Current 30 Days 60 Days 

S0.00 $5,950.96 $0.00 

90 Oays 120 Days & Over Totat Due 

$0.00 $0.00 / $5,9S0.~6 
• , · \ ti ) 

Page 1 of 1 

Witness Case Name 

Warren McKay Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Cheryl Winn ~Jlary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Warren McKay Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Cheryl \"Jinn Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Deanna Wright Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 

Deanna wr:ght 

Account No. 

Date 

Total Due 

School District, et al. 
r•iary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County 
School District, et al. 

Phone: (702) 433-2666 Fax:(702) 433-9591 

f2961 

1/8/2016 

$ 5,950.96 

PAYMENT WITH CREDIT CARD AM~ ~ I VISA: _J 

Cardholder's Name: 

card Number: 

Exp. Date: Phone#: 

Billing Address: 

Zip: Card Security Code: 

Amount to Charge: 

(arrlholder's Signature: 
r- _.,_ • • 
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Depo lntmnatfonal 
703 SoUlh BlghthSUHt 
laa\fi!gu,NV89101 

Ph:800S91.9722 Pu: 7ll2.386.982S 

John Houston SCOtt 
Scott Law Firm 
1388 Sutter street 
Sulte715 
San Francfst0, CA 94109 

ORIGINAL TRANSCRIPT 
Deanna Wright 

If you have any questions, ycu may contact our b!fllng department: 
Bllllng@depolntematronal.com 

lhank yo,Hor your oosrnessr 

·I<l VOICE 
Invoice No. Invoice Date lObN,. 

30047 11/9/2016 19639 
Job Data Case No. 

11/16/2015 A-1+700018-C 

Q,ase,-me 
Marv &yan, et al. vs. Qark County Sdlool D!sttict, et al. 

PaymentTenra., 

Oue upon receipt (1.5%/mo & collection) 

51~00 .. •,; . 

TOTAL DUE >>> 

Tax 1~ 45-0581340 Phone: (415) 561·9601 Fax:(41S) S61-9609 

Please detach bottom portion m,d rstum with payment. 

John Houston Scott 
Scott Law Firm 
1388 Sutter StJeet 
Suite715 
san Francisco, CA 94109 

Remit To: Depo Intemattonltl 
703 South Eighth Stnel: 
Lal Vagas, NV 89101 

Job No. : 19639 SUID :2-DI LV 
Oise No. : A-1+7000Ul-C 
Case Name : Masy Brvan, et at. vs. Oark County School 

District, et al. 
Invotce No. : 30047 Invoice Date : 11/9/2016 
Total Due : $ 51.00 

eAYMENT WITH CREDU CARD 
carul'lolder's Name: 
Card Number: 
Exp. Date: Phone#: 
Bllllng Address: 
Zip: Card Security Code: 
Amount ro Charge: 
t.ardholder's Signature; 
Emall: 
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D,po fllmm&Uood 
70Uollth!WJth!met 

Las Vegas,NV89101 
P.h: 800.$91.'»22 Par: 702.386.9825 

John Houston Scott 
SCOtt Law Ann 
1388 Sutler Street 
Sulm 715 
San Frandsco, CA 94109 

ORIGJNAL 'TRANSCRlPT 
Warren McKay 

Jf you.have any,qu~ons, you may contact our bl!llng dep,rtment: 
Bllllng@depolntematfonal.oom 

Thank you for vaui' tius·1nes.;1 

Invoice No. Involc:!e Date lob:No. 
30046 11/9/2016 19282 

lob Date CUeNo. 

11/2/201S A·l4-700018-C 

CaseNa~ 
Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County Sdlool Olstrfct, et at. 

Payment Terms 

Due upon recelpt {1.5%/mo & ex>lfectfon) 

~37.0.0 

Tax ID: 45-0581340 Phone: (415) 561-9601 Fa>c:(415} 561·9609 

Please d,uach bottom portion and retum with payment. 

John Houston Scott 
Scott Law Firm 
1388 Sutter Street 
Sulte715 
San FtantlSClO, CA 94109 

Remit To: Depo Jntematfonal 
703 SOuth Eighth Street 
Lis Vega1, NV 89101 

Job No. : 19282 SUID :2-01 LV 
Oise No. : A-14-700018-C 

case Name : Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark countv School 
District, et al. 

Invoice No. : 30046 Invoice Date : 11/9/2016 
Total Due : $ 137.00 

PAYMENT WITH CREDIT CARD 
cardhofdet's N!me: 
card Number: 

Exp. Date: Phone#: 
BIiiing Address: 
Zip: Card Security Code: 
An'lmJnt to Charge: 
0,rdholder's Signature: 
Email: 
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Depo lllfenlatfonal 
703South l!lgbthStteet 

Las Vegas, NV89101 
Ph: 800.591.9722 Far: 702l86.98ZS 

John Houstx,n SCOtt 
scott Law Ann 
1388 Sutter street 
Sulte715 
san Francfsco, CA 94109 

ORIGINAL TRANSaUPT 
Che.ryl Wfnn 

If you have anv questtons, you may contact our blfflng department: 
Bllllng@del,)Olntl!mattonal.com 

Thank you for your bustnessl 

JCl VOICE 
Invoice No. tnvolceDa~ J~~~ 

30044 11/9/2016 19283 
Jolt D!d8. ~seNo. 
11/3/2015 A-14-700018-C 

~N ~.me 
Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark C.Ountv SChool DIStrict, et al. 

Pl~Terms 
Due upon receipt (1.So/o/mo & collection) 

1s~ ... oo 
TOTAL DUE >>> t1Sl,OO 

Sy_ 
-::::-::.__:::::h::::,~:-_:-~----~--

Tax 1D: 4S-0581340 Phone: (415) 561-9601 Fax:(415) 561-9609 

Please <htach bottom po'l'tfon and rvtum with payment. 

John Housb:ln Sa'1:t 
Sc.ott Law Arm 
1388 Sutter Street 
Sulte715 
San Francisco, CA 94109 

Remit To: Depo lntamatlonal 
703 SoUUa Elahth Street 
us Vega,, NV 89101 

JabNo. : 19283 BUID :2-DI LV 
case No.. : A-14-700018·C 
Case Name : Marv Bryan, et al. vs. Clal1c County SChoot 

Dlst:rltt, et al. 
Involee No. : 30044 Invoice Date : 11/9/2016 
To18l Due : $ 151.00 

PAYMENT WITH CREDO: CARD ~~ II] ~'f PAp, 
Cardholder's Name: 
Card Number: 
l;)(p. Date: Phone#: 
Billing Adelres.s: 
Zip: card security COde: 
Amount to Charae: 
C.ardholder's Slgnarure: 

Emall: 
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Depo lanlatinul 
703. SttKth Blghlh Street 
Lu Vegas, NVS9101 

Ph: 800.5919122 Far: 70U86.9S2S 

John HotrstDn SCOtt 
Scott law Finn 
1388 Slitter Street 
Suite 715 
San Frclndsoo, CA 94109 

ORIGINAL lRANSCRIPT 
RobeJt Beasley 

·If you haVe any q~os. you may c:ontact our billing department: 
e1111ng@depo1ntemat1ona1.com 

Thank you forvourtusinest 

IC~ VOICE 
In:volce· Nb, IOYOi'l9 Date . ~ob.ijo, 

30045 11/9/2016 200S7 

lab~ CaseNo. 

1/26/2016 A--14700018-C 

case Name 

Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Oar!< CCunty School OJstrtct; et al. 

Paymei,t Terna 

Due upon receipt (1.S%/mo·& colledion) 

TOTAL DUE >>> $41.00 

~~N;~~-~t~ 
lB y -=---" .. .:=::;:::::::=::=:.I 

Tax ID: 45-0581340 Phone! (415) 561-9601 Fax:(415) 561-9609 

Please detrxch bottom portion (llld mum with ptlJ'ln1mt. 

John Hou&1Xln Scott 
Scott Law Finn 
1388 Sutter Street 
Sutte715 
San Francisco, CA 94~09 

Remit To: Depo lntiematlonat 
703 South Efohtll Street 
Las Vegu, NV 89101 

Job No. : 20057 BUIO 
Case No. : A-14700018..C 
Case Name : Ma,y Bryan, et at. vs. Oark COUntv. SChool 

District, et al 
Invoice No.. ! 30045 Invoice Date : 11/9/2016 
Total Due : $ 46.00 

PAYMENT WITH CREDIT CARD ~lai • -'!J!I\ 
Cardholder's N!me: 
card Number: 
Exp.Date~ Phone#: 
Bllllng Address: 
Zlo: Qsrd Security Code: 

AmolJTlt to Cherge: 
cardholder's S!Qnature: 

Emall: 

• I 
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Depo International 
703 South Eighth Street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 
Phone:702-386-!)322 Fax:702·386-982S 

John Houston 5cott 
Scott Law Firm 
uas suuer Street 
Sulte715 
San FrandSCo, CA 94109 

ORIGINAL & ONE ELECf'RONtC CERTlFlEC TRANSCRIPT 
Andrejoseph Long 

If you have:anv qu~lons, _ vou may contact oµr bll»ng departmenr. 
Bllllng@depolnte.matJonaLoom 

Thank you foryo~r business! 

& •• V V & '- I. 
~voice No. tnvolce Date: lob No. 

24901 2/4/2016 20059 
lobOate Ol,,eNo. 

1/.28/2016 A:-14700018-C 

ca~Hame . ' 

Mary Bryan, et al. vs. Clark County School Ofsttld:, Et al. 

P';,ment Terms 
Oue upon recalpt 

TOTAL DUE >>> 

rax JO: 45-0581340 Phone: (415) 561~9601 fax:(415) S61·9509 

Pl~u detach hqtt<m1 portlan and 1'1!111r11 with payment, 

John Houston Scott 
S<:ott Law Firm 
1388 SUtter Street 
Suite 715 
San Francisco, CA 94109 

.emit To: Depo lntarnatfonal 
703 SOllth Sghth StrHt 
LH Vegas, NV 89101 

Job No. : 20059 8UlD 
Cese No. : A-14·700018-C 
case Name : Mary Bryan, et el. vs. Clark County School 

Olstritt, et al. 
Invoice No. : 24901 Invoice oate : 2/4/2016 

Tota1Du,e~ 

PAYMENT WUH CReDJTCARQ 
Cardholdets Name: 
and Number: 
Exp, Date: Phone#: 
Billing Address: 

card Security Code: 
Amount to Charge: 
C'.ardholdel"s Sl9nat;ure: 
Email: 
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.~. f f 

' 

04/07/2016~ .. 04:33 7024339591 

Depo 11\ternatlonal 
703' Sooth Eighth Street 

Les Vegas, NV 89101 
Pllcme: 702.386.93.2?. Fax: 702.386-,91126 

Accounts P&yable 
Allen Uehtensteln, Attorney at Law, Ltd. 
3806 FO~ Dttve 
Las Vegas, NV 89121 

n,..ot• ltMikli Balance 
081» ·No. 

,toli:oate 

' 
2141io1e 248'99., ,' 32Si7.6 . 1/17-/2016 

,< -

"14/2016 24902 r5'S?;,s3 

~ ' 
r . ., u 

Tax XOt 4S-OS813<!0 

Accounts Payable 
Allen Lichrenstelll, Attorney at~. lb:!. 
3806 forestcrest 0(,ve 
las Vegas, NV S!U21 

R~JTIJI; ro: ~po tnt,im;nl'ionaJ 
'103 SOUth flghth Stnet 
Las veoai. ftV a~u.01 

L- "Pf 
1 

1/2S/2016 

~ 

'Ii D 

' 

ALLEN LICHTE~STEIN PAGE 07/09 

STATE·ME·NT 
Account No. 

F2961 

cur~nt ,OQl,S . 60 Days 
$0.00 $862.59 $0,00 

00 Days 120 o.ys· & O\ler Totnl·Due 
$0.00 $0,00 $882,S9 

• I 

Page 1 of 1 

Witness C4seName 
.. 
Jolirt f!dwM 'HatP!n . -Mary Bryan, et 211. vs. Cliatt County 

sctroor t51sb1tt, e.t a1. · 
Andre Joseph Long Mery.Bryan, et al, 11s. Clark County 

SChOOI Olstria, at al. 

' 

.. s~\"o 
f\..~~. 

l)'t, y ~ 

{~~~t. 
,P-

I 

!)hone: (702) 433-2665 Fa,c:(7oi) 433.9591 

Account No. 
Data 

Total Dae 

cardhOldet's Name: . 

Exp. oar.e: . Ption'3#: 

•• e 

Zip: ., ., " card Security Code: . 
I 

Amount tn Charge: 
Cerdholder's Signature: 
Email: 

lt .. 
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Qepo I,ntel'1)aijQra1 · 
703 South Eighth street 
Las Vegas, .NV ·s~101 
Phone:102·386,9322 Fax:702~386~9825 

J9llr) Hou5!on Scott 
Scott Law Flan 
1388 Sutter Street' 
Su11:e·11s 
·san ·i=ranclsco, CA 94109 

jdkIG(NAL_& ONE C~RllFlEO TAANSCRIPT 

1 
RobertB®sfey 

I 

: If' you have·any .QU~t101'!S,. you may contact our b!ltrng 'department: 
. e1.11111g@depolntemattonal.coin 

Thank you for yaur business! 

~ trcrrr1rn~1 
. w FEB ~ 6 20,s ~ 

Bv. _ __ ..__ __ _ 
..... ~~-,,.,,,._ ... ~ ·"·_....... . 

I 

.... .. ._, ... "' .. 
Invoice No. i~v~t~e~te J,ob~o. 

24805 2/1/201f!, ~0~7 
Job.patQ qtse~o. 
11261io1ir A-1~~100018..c 

C'J.~Na~e 
; 

·Mary Bryan, et al. vs. ClaYk County School 01$1¢, ~t al. 

•: 

~ay~f,,"nt Ter;ns. 
Qu~ upon receipt 

TOTAl:.-Dli°E·.>>> . . 

¢2 

'tss.~·.oo 
&~ 

Phone: (415) 561~·01 Fax:(~15) 56'1·9609 

PlenStJ deiack b(lttbm porl/011 <mcfrelum with paylf/eui. 

John Houston·Scolt 
~ott Law·flrin 
1388 $titter. Street 
Sutte:Z15 . 
S~n Fr<lnclsco, CAA)4109 

emit To: _OeP,~ •n,~natif'mll 
703 South Eigt\th Street 
Las Vegas, NV 89101 

J?b. No. : 20051 :au ID :;?;-DlLV 
case No. : A~14-700018.;c 
C:ase Nam1; >; Marv B1Yan, et,al, vs; Ciark:COunw School 

· · · · : District, et al. · 

In.voJceNo .. . : l480S: .Invoice Date· :2/,1/201.6 
Total Due : $ S3$,00 

Pt\YMENl: Wm ts1;prr CARD 
·cardholde~~ (iJ~me: 
card Numbi?r: 
Exp, D,ate:. Phone#: . 
Bllllng Add~ess: 

Amqunt._to Charge: 
cardholder.'s·SJgi1ature: 
1:rrrail: 
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1 Allen Lichtenstein (J\iV State Bar No. 3992) 
ALLEN LICHTENSTEIK, LTD. 

2 3315 Russell Road, No. 222 
Las Vegas, NV 89120 

3 Tel: 702.433-2666 
Fax: 702.433-9591 

4 allaw@lvcoxmail.com 

5 John Houston Scott (CA Bar No. 72578) 
Admi tted Pro Hae Vice 

6 SCOTI LAW FIRM 
1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715 

7 San Francisco, CA 94 109 
Tel: 41 5.561-9601 

8 john@scotllawfirm.net 

9 Attorneys/or Plaintiffs, Mary B,yan. F:than Bryan, 
Aimee !lairr and Nolan Jlairr 

Electronically Filed 
8/1 512017 9:54 AM 

10 

11 

12 

DISTRICT CO"LlRT 

CLARK COUNTY, NEV ADA 

13 MARY BRYAK, mother of ETHAN BRYM; Case Ko. A-14-700018-C 

Dept. No. xxvn 14 

15 

16 

AlMEE HAIRR. mother of NOLAN HAIRR, 

Plaintiffs, 

vs. 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DlSTRlCT 
17 (CCSD 

NOTICE OF ENTRY OF FINDINGS OF 
FACT, COXCLUSIONS OF LAW AND 
JUDGMENT IN FAVOR OF 
PLAINTWFS 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

Defendant _ 

TO: ALL INTERESTED PARTIES AND THEIR RESPECTIVE ATTORNEYS OF 

RECORD 

Please take notice that Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law and Judgment in Favor of 

Plaintiffs were entered in this case, a copy of which is attached .. 

Dated this 15th day of August 2017, 

Respectfully submitted by: 

Isl Allen Lichtenstein 

1 
Case Number: A-14-700018-C 
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Allen Lichtenstein
Nevada Bar No. 3992
ALLEN LICHTENSTEIN LTD.
3315 Russell Road, No. 222
Las Vegas, NV 89120
Tel: 702.433-2666
Fax: 702.433-9591
allaw@lvcoxmail.com

John Houston Scott (CA Bar No. 72578)
Admitted Pro Hac Vice
SCOTT LAW FIRM
1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715
San Francisco, CA 94109
Tel: 415.561.9601
john@scottlawfirm.net
Attorneys for Plaintiffs, Mary Bryan, Ethan Bryan,
Aimee Hairr and Nolan Hairr

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that I served the following Notice of Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law

and Judgment in Favor of Plaintiffs via United

States Mail and/or e-mail on the 15th day of August 2017, to:

Dan Waite
Lewis Rocha Rothgerber Christie
3993 Howard Hughes Pkwy., Suite 600
Las Vegas, NV 89169-5996

DWaite@lrrc.com

/s/ Allen Lichtenstein
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Electronically Filed 
7/20/2017 2:54 PM 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

DISTRICT COURT 

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA 

7 MARY BRYAN, mother of ETHAN BRYAN; 
AIMEE HAIRR, mother of NOLAN HAIRR, . 

8 

9 

10 
vs. 

Plaintiffs, 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
11 (CCSD 

12 

13 

14 

15 I. Introduction 

Defendant. 

Case No. A-14-700018-C 

Dept. No. XXVII 

FINDINGS OF FACT, 
CONCLUSIONS OF LAW, AND 
JUDGMENT INF A VOR OF 
PLAINTIFFS 

16 On June 29, 2017, the Court issued its Decision and Order in favor of Plaintiffs Ethan 

17 

18 

19 

Bryan and Nolan Hairr and against Defendant Clark County School District (CCSD) on the 

claims that Defendant violated Plaintiffs' rights under Title IX, 20 USC§ 1681(A) and Plaintiffs' 

rights to Substantive Due Process under the Fourteenth Amendment to the United States 
20 

21 
Constitution and pursuant to 42 U.S.C. 1983. The Court also ruled that, "Plaintiffs are entitled to a 

22 judgment for all damages sought under these two claims asserted in the Complaint, and proven at 

23 trial." 

24 II. 

25 

26 

Procedural History 

Plaintiffs filed their Amended Complaint on October 10, 2014 against Defendants: Clark 

County School District (CCSD), Pat Skorkowsky, in his official capacity as CCSD 
27 

28 

Case Number: A-14-700018-C 
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l Superintendent; CCSD Board of School Trustees; Erin A. Cranor, Linda E. Young, Patrice Tew, 

2 Stavan Corbett, Carolyn Edwards, Chris Garvey, Deanna Wright, in their official capacities as 

3 CCSD Board of School Trustees, Greenspun Jr. High School (GJHS); Principal Warren P. 

4 

5 
McKay, in his individual and official capacity as principal of GJHS; Leonard DePiazza, in his 

individual and official capacity as assistant principal at GJHS; Cheryl Winn, in her individual and 
6 

7 
official capacity as Dean at GJHS; John Halpin, in his individual and official capacity 

8 as counselor at GJHS; Robert Beasley, in his individual and official capacity as instructor at 

9 GJHS. The Amended Complaint listed five claims for relief: 1) Negligence; 2) Negligence Per 

IO Se; 3) Violation of Title IX; 4) Violation of the Right to Equal Protection; 5) Violation of 

11 
Substantive Due Process. 

12 

13 
In its February 5, 2015 Order, the Court Dismissed Plaintiffs' Claims for Relief No. ·1, 

Negligence, and No. 2, Negligence Per Se. Plaintiffs abandoned their Fourth Claim for Relief, 
14 

15 Equal Protection, leaving the Third Claim for Relief, Title IX, and Fifth Claim for Relief, 

16 Substantive Due Process, for trial. Defendants filed their Answer on February 25, 2015. 

17 On March 1, 2016, Defendants filed a Motion for Summary Judgment, which was granted 

18 in part and denied in part by the Court in its July 22, 2016 Order. The Court denied Defendants' 

19 

20 

21 

Motion to dismiss Plaintiffs' Title IX claim against Defendant CCSD. It dismissed the 42 USC 

1983 Equal Protection claims, which had been abandoned by Plaintiffs. The Court granted 

22 
Defendants' Motion to dismiss all Defendants except CCSD from the 42 USC 1983 Substantive 

23 Due Process claim. Overall, the Court ruled the two remaining claims against CCSD, 1) Title IX; 

24 and 2) Substantive Due Process would proceed to trial. 

25 

26 

27 

28 

On or about March 20, 2016, Discovery Commissioner Bulla denied Defendants' Motion 

to Compel Damages Categories and Calculations, allowing such calculations to be determined by 

-2-
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1 the Court at trial. The Discovery Commissioner's Report and Recommendations were affirmed 

2 and adopted by the Court on April 6, 2016. 

3 

4 

5 

On August 5, 2016, Defendant CCSD filed a Motion for Partial Reconsideration, or in the 

Alternative, Motion for Relief Pursuant to NRCP 59(E), 60(A) and 60(8), or Motion in Limiting. 

On October 26, 2016 the Court denied Defendant's Motion. 
6 

7 
On November 15, 2016, a five-day bench trial was held in Department 27 before the 

8 Honorable Judge Nancy L. Allf. Allen Lichtenstein, Esq. and John Houston Scott, Esq. appeared 

9 for and on behalf of Plaintiffs Mary Bryan ("Mrs. Bryan") and Aimee Hairr ("Mrs. Hairr"), 

lO (collectively Plaintiffs"). Daniel Polsenberg, Esq., Dan Waite, Esq., and Brian D. Blakley, Esq. 

11 
appeared for and on behalf of Defendant CCSD, ("Defendant") on the Title IX and 42 USC 1983 

12 

13 
Substitute Due Process claims. Testimony was given by: Nolan Hairr, Ethan Bryan, Aimee Hairr, 

Mary Bryan, Principal Warren McKay, Vice Principal Leonard DePiazza, Dean Cheryl Winn, 
14 

15 Counselor John Halpin and band teacher Robert Beasely. Although neither one of the alleged 

16 bullies testified, CL's deposition was introduced into evidence. (For privacy purposes, only the 

17 initials of CL and DM are used.) 

18 Closing arguments were done via written briefs. Briefing was completed on May 26, 2017. 

19 
On June 29, 2017, the Court issued its Decision and Order, concluding that Defendant CCSD 

20 
violated both Title IX of the Civil Rights_ Act and also violated Plaintiffs' Substantive Due Process 

21 

22 
rights as guaranteed by the Fourteenth Amendment to the United States Constitution pursuant to 

23 42 USC 1983. The Court further ordered that after review, "Judgment shall be entered in favor of 

24 Plaintiffs Mary Bryan, on behalf of Ethan Bryan and Aimee Hairr on behalf of Nolan Hairr, and 

25 that Plaintiffs are entitled to a judgment for all damages sought under these two claims asserted in 

26 the Complaint, and proven at trial." 

27 

28 

-3-
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1 III. 

2 

Findings of Fact 

A. Ethan Bryan and Nolan Hairr started being bullied almost from the time 

3 
they began attending Greenspun Jr. High School. 

4 In late August 2011, two friends, Ethan Bryan and Nolan Hairr began sixth grade at 

5 Greenspun Jr. High School. Both Ethan and Nolan enrolled in Mr. Beasley's third period band 

6 class in the trombone section. 

7 

8 

9 

Almost from the beginning of the school year, Ethan and Nolan began to be bullied by two 

other trombone students, CL and DM. In sixth grade, at age 11, Nolan was small for his age with 

long blonde hair. CL and DM taunted him with names like gay and faggot, and called him a girl. 
10 

11 
CL also touched, pulled, ran his fingers through Nolan's hair and blew in Nolan's face. 

12 Nolan, following what he believed was proper procedure, went to the Dean's office and 

13 filled out a complaint report. He was, however, too embarrassed to mention the homophobic and 

14 sexual content of the slurs that he was enduring. Nolan was subsequently called into the Dean's 

15 
office and met with Dean Winn. He did not feel that she was either sympathetic or even interested, 

16 

17 

18 

and therefore was reluctant to discuss the homophobic sexually-oriented nature of the bullying. 

Within a day or two of Nolan's meeting with the Dean, on or about September 13, 2011, 

19 CL, who was sitting next to Nolan in band class, reached over and stabbed Nolan in the groin 

20 with the sharpened end of the pencil. CL said he wanted to see if Nolan was a girl, and also 

21 referred to Nolan as a tattletale. Nolan took the tattletale reference as a sign that the stabbing was, 

22 at least in part, retaliation for Nolan complaining about the bullying. Because of this fear of 

23 

24 

25 

26 

retaliation, Nolan decided not to tell any adults about any further bullying directed at him, and 

instead, to endure the torment in silence. 

A day or two after the stabbing incident, while Nolan was at Ethan's house, Ethan's 

27 mother, Mary Bryan overheard Ethan and Nolan talking about some problem taking place at 

28 school. After Nolan had gone home, Mary Bryan confronted her son and questioned him 

-4-
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1 concerning what Ethan and Nolan had been discussing. Ethan described to his mother the incident 

2 where CL stabbed Nolan in the groin with a pencil, and about the overall bullying occurring in Mr. 

3 Beasley's band class. 

4 

5 

6 

B. Mary Bryan's September 15, 2011 email 

In response, Mary Bryan decided to contact the school officials to report the bullying .in 

7 
general and the stabbing in particular. 

8 On September 15, 2011, she attempted to telephone Greenspun Principal Warren P. 

9 McKay. However, she could not reach him by telephone and was only able to talk to a junior high 

10 student volunteer. Mary did not want to leave such a sensitive message with a junior high student 

11 
and was not transferred to Principal McKay's voicemail. Mary then decided she would email 

12 
the Principal and got an email address for him from the student volunteer. 

13 

14 
On September 15, 2011, Mary Bryan sent an email to three people: 1) Principal Warren 

15 
McKay; 2) band teacher Robert Beasley; and 3) school counselor John Halpin, complaining about 

16 the bullying and specifically about the stabbing. Both Mr. Beasley and Mr. Halpin acknowledged 

17 receiving the September 15, 2011 email from Mary Bryan. Principal McKay said he did not 

18 receive it because the email address for him (which Mary Bryan obtained from his own office) 

19 
was incorrect. 

20 

21 
Both Mr. Beasley and Mr. Halpin were, in 2011, mandatory reporters who were required to 

22 
report any information concerning bullying, to either the Principal or one of his designees, 

23 pursuant to NRS 3.88.1351 (1). In 2011, Principal McKay's designees at Greenspun were Vice 

24 Principal Leonard DePiazza and Dean Cheryl Winn. 

25 Neither Mr. Beasley nor Mr. Halpin fulfilled their statutory duty to report Mary Bryan' s 

26 September 15, 2011 email concerning bullying, explaining that because they saw Principal 

27 

28 

-5-
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1 McKay's name in the address line, they assumed, without verifying, that Dr. McKay, and through 

2 him Vice Principal DePiazza and Dean Winn were aware of the situation. 

3 

4 

5 

These assumptions by Mr. Beasley and Mr. Halpin were incorrect. Moreover, by relying 

on their assumptions, rather than adhering to the statutory requirement to report any information 

concerning bullying they received, they both violated the explicit requirements of NRS 
6 

7 
388.1351(1). 

8 In response to the September 15, 2011 email, Mr. Beasley changed the seating 

9 arrangements in the trombone section of his class. While before, Nolan had been sitting next to 

10 Connor, after the change, Nolan set directly in front of CL. 

11 

12 

13 

While Mr. Beasley attempted to keep an eye on both bullies and the bullied students, he 

admitted that he was unable to constantly watch them and still teach his class. Mr. Beasley said 

that he made the decisions concerning the seating arrangements on his own without consultation 
14 

15 with anyone else. This testimony conflicted with that of Dean Winn, who stated that she was 

16 involved in the decision. 

17 The bullying continued. For Ethan Bryan, at the beginning of the school year, most of the 

l 8 taunts at him by CL and DM had to do with his size. He was large for his age and overweight. 

19 

20 

21 

After the incident where CL stabbed Ethan's friend Nolan with a pencil, the bullying- of 

Ethan began to change. It not only escalated but also shifted from being mostly about his size and 

weight to also involve homophobic slurs and vile and graphic innuendos concerning sexual 
22 

23 relations between Ethan and Nolan. 

24 Like his friend Nolan, Ethan also chose not to report the bullying that he was enduring for 

25 fear of retaliation, and lack of any real interest on the part of Greenspun school officials. Mary 

26 Bryan, believing that the school would contact Nolan' s parents after Mary sent them the 

27 

28 
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1 September 15, 20 11 email about the stabbing of Nolan, did not directly inform Nolan' s parents 

2 herself. 

3 

4 

5 

C. Aimee Hairr's September 22, 2011 phone conversation with Vice Principal 
DePiazza and September 23, 2011 phone call with Counselor Halpin 

On or about September 21, 2011 , while Mary Bryan and Nolan' s mother Aimee Hairr were 

6 at a birthday party for another of Mary's children, Mary casually asked Aimee about the school's 

7 
response to the September 15, 2011 email. Aimee responded that she had received no 

8 

9 

IO 

11 

communication from the school, and that she had no knowledge or information about the bullying 

of her son occurring in Mr. Beasley' s band class. 

After talking to Mary, Nolan's parents then confronted him about the bullying. Nolan 

12 verified the veracity of the substance of the contents of the September 15, 2011 email. He also 

13 admitted to the stabbing incident. 

14 

15 

16 

17 

On September 22, 2011, Nolan's mother made several phone calls to various school 

officials in an attempt to contact the school regarding the September 15, 2011 email about the 

stabbing of their son. She left several messages for different school officials. Finally, Aimee Hairr 

was able to reach Vice Principal DePiazza, and had a phone conversation with him in which she 
18 

19 described the September 15, 2011 email, and the stabbing, including the comment by CL that he 

20 did it to see if Nolan was a girl. 

21 Mr. DePiazza told Aimee Hairr that there were a few options for Nolan, all involving 

22 Nolan either transferring out of band class into another class at Greenspun, or transferring out of 

23 

24 

25 

Greenspun to a different school entirely. 

Aimee found these so-called solutions to be both inadequate and inappropriate because if 

26 
anyone were to be moved, it should be the perpetrator of the bullying who assaulted her son not 

27 the victim, Nolan. 

28 

-7-
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1 Vice Principal DePiazza denied that he ever had a phone conversation with Aimee Hairr. 

2 According to his version of events, some time in either September or October 2011 (he could not 

3 remember when) there was a meeting in his office attended by Aimee Hairr, Dean Cheryl Winn 

4 

5 
and possibly Nolan Hairr. Mr. DePiazza claimed that while there was some generalized discussion 

about the "situation" in the band room, nothing specific about the stabbing or the September 15, 
6 

7 
2011 email was ever mentioned. Neither Aimee Hairr, Nolan Hairr nor Cheryl Winn corroborated 

8 Mr. DePiazza ' s version of events about this supposed meeting, or even that it took place. 

9 On or about September 23, 2011, Mrs. Hairr received a return phone call from counselor 

10 John Halpin. Aimee knew Mr. Halpin because she was his dental hygienist. Mr. Halpin told her he 

11 
had received this September 15, 2011 email and was aware of its contents. He said he had 

12 

13 
previously spoken to Nolan and would do so again to make sure that Nolan made a formal 

complaint about the stabbing to the Dean. He said he believed that Dean Winn knew about it, but 
14 

15 wanted to make sure. 

16 Later that day, Nolan met with Mr. Halpin. Both agreed that the counselor wanted Nolan to 

17 go to the Dean's office to fill out an incident report. Mr. Halpin said that he accompanied Nolan to 

18 Ms. Winn's office, while Nolan said he was sent there and went by himself. Mr. Halpin also said 

19 

20 

21 

that since the Dean was not in the office, he left a message for Dean Winn with Harriet Clark, her 

secretary, recounting the stabbing incident and the bullying. He gave that message to the Dean•s 

22 
secretary with instructions to relay that message to Dean Winn. The Dean did not report receiving 

23 Mr. Halpin's message from her secretary. 

24 Nolan, still trying to "tough it out" and not make more trouble for himself by complaining 

25 and thereby risking further retaliation, wrote a bland and rather innocuous version of what he was 

26 

27 

28 

enduring in band class. He did not mention the stabbing nor the homophobic, sexually-oriented 

slurs. 

-8-



001960

001960

00
19
60

001960

Dean Winn said she could not remember whether she met with Nolan on or after 

2 September 22, 2011. Nolan said that no such meeting took place on or after September 22, 2011. 

3 Aimee Hairr said she never had a meeting with Dean Winn. 

4 

5 
Dean Winn said testified did not learn of the stabbing incident until the following year, 

February 2012. 
6 

7 

8 

9 

D. Mary Bryan's October 19, 2011 email to school officials and October 19, 
2011 meeting with Dean Winn 

On or about October 19, 2011, Mary Bryan noticed that Ethan had come home from school 

with scratches on his leg. When she confronted him about the scratches, he told her that at the end 
10 

11 of band class, while Mr. Beasley was out of the room, one of the bullies who was behind Ethan, 

12 removed a rubber stopper out of a piece of his trombone and started hitting Ethan in the legs with 

13 the remaining sharp piece of the instrument. 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

Upon questioning by his parents, Ethan also disclosed that CL and DM continued to make 

lewd sexual comments including calling both Ethan and Nolan gay, faggots and other similar 

names, and also talked about Ethan and Nolan jerking each other off and otherwise engaging in 

homosexual acts with each other. 

Ethan's parents, enraged that this was going on -- particularly after the September 15, 2011 

20 email -- decided to confront school officials. On October 19, 2011 Mary Bryant sent a second 

21 email addressed to Principal McKay, Mr. Beasley, and Mr. Halpin, describing the continuing 

22 bullying and also the hitting scratching of Ethan's leg. 

23 

24 
Mr. and Mrs. Bryan met with Dean Winn at the Dean's office on October 19, 2011. They 

described the bullying endured by both Ethan and Nolan, specifically mentioning the physical 
25 

26 
assaults as well as the vile homophobic slurs that both boys were subjected to by CL and DM. The 

27 Bryans made it clear that they would not tolerate a continuation of this bullying. 

28 
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1 Dean Winn denied the occurrence of this meeting. She also denied that she knew anything 

2 about the, emails, the physical assaults and the homophobic slurs in October 2011. She said she 

3 
only learned of the October 19, 2011 email the following year, in February 2012. 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

E. The October 19, 2011 Administrator's meeting where John Halpin informed 
Principal McKay and Vice Principal DePiazza of Mary Bryan's emails 

Mr. Halpin, who was a recipient of the October 19, 2011 email, said he forwarded that 

email to Dean Winn to make sure she was aware of the situation. Dean Winn denied having 

received the October 19, 2011 email from Mr. Halpin. 

Also on October 19, 2011, Mr. Halpin attended a weekly administrators meeting. Principal 

11 McKay and Vice Principal DePiazza were at that meeting. Dean Winn, who was a regular 

12 participant in those weekly meetings, did not attend that day. 

13 Mr. Halpin said that he reported on the bullying that was occurring in Mr. Beasley's band 

14 class in considerable detail to both Principal McKay and Vice Principal DePiazza. He also stated 
15 

that everyone at that meeting knew about the two emails that had been sent by Mary Bryan. He 
16 

17 
also made it clear that the two assaults were perpetrated by the same two bullies against the same 

two bullied students. Mr. Halpin specifically recalled Principal McKay telling Vice Principal 
18 

19 DePiazza to take care of the matter. 

20 Dr. McKay stated his recollections from the October 19, 2011, administrators meeting 

21 differently. McKay recalled Mr. Halpin bringing up the subject of bullying in Mr. Beasley's class, 

22 
but without mentioning many specifics. For reasons he did not disclose, McKay stated that he 

23 

24 

25 

26 

really was not interested in the details of such matters and left it to his subordinates to address the 

issue. 

Dr. McKay stated that he told Mr. DePiazza and Mr. Halpin to handle the situation. Dr. 

27 McKay also stated that he subsequently did not ask the Vice Principal about how the investigation 

28 was going or what DePiazza had found out until February 2012. 
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Principal McKay only took action in February 2012 because it was then that he was 

2 ordered by his supervisor at the district level and the Assistant Superintendent to investigate the 

3 bullying of Ethan and Nolan. 

4 

5 
Vice Principal DePiazza stated a vague memory of the October 19, 201 1 administrative 

meeting. He recalled that there may have been some discussion about bullying but didn' t really 
6 

7 
remember much. His position was that he definitely did not remember being told by Dr. McKay to 

8 conduct an investigation into the bullying reports on October 19, 2011. 

9 Principal McKay stated that in 2011 while he never asked his Vice Principal about the 

10 bullying investigation, he did, at some point, have a casual discussion with Dean Winn about the 

11 
matter. He asked her how the investigation was going. Dean Winn replied that she was having 

12 

13 

14 

trouble getting corroborating statements from other students. 

Dean Winn's testimony contradicted the Principal's statements by claiming that she did 

15 not undertake any investigation of the bullying because she was specifically told by Dr. McKay 

16 that it was all being handled by Vice Principal DePiazza. Dr. McKay testified that Dean Winn told 

17 him she was investigating by trying to get statements from other students. 

18 

19 

20 

21 

F. Although by October 19, 2011, all members of the Greenspun Junior High 
School administration were aware of physical, and discriminatory bullying that 
Ethan and Nolan were experiencing, no investigation was conducted until February 

2012, after both boys had left the school. 

Although the school officials all pointed fingers at each other, the one thing that they all 

22 
agreed upon is that contrary to Nevada statutes, no investigation of the reports of bullying, 

23 

24 

25 

described in the September 15, 201 1, and October 19, 2011 emails from Mary Bryan and the 

September 22, 2011 phone conversation between Aimee Hairr and Vice Principal DePiazza, the 

26 
September 23, 2011 phone conversation between Aimee Hairr and Mr. Halpin, and the October 

27 19, 2011 meeting between Mr. and Mrs. Bryan and Dean Winn, ever occurred in 2011. 

28 
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1 Throughout the rest of 2011 , the bullying of Ethan and Nolan by CL and DM continued 

2 out of the sight of Mr. Beasley. 

3 

4 

5 

6 

Ethan and Nolan continued to employ the strategy of trying to ignore the problem, feeling 

that any further complaints would just lead to greater retaliation. 

When Ethan and Nolan came back to Greenspun for in January 2012, their resolve began 

7 to waver. Each boy tried to avoid band class or even school altogether. Ethan feigned illness, and 

8 even tried to make himself sick by eating cardboard. Nolan would hang out in the library or in the 

9 halls. By the middle of January, both boys had essentially stopped going to school in order to 

10 avoid further bullying. 

11 

12 

13 

In January 2012, Ethan Bryan was prevented from attempting to commit suicide by 

drinking household chemicals, because of a fortuitous intervention from his mother. Ethan's 

parents refused to send him back to Greenspun after that. 
14 

15 On or around January 21 , 2012 Nolan had, what his mother described as something ·close 

16 to a breakdown because of the bullying that he and others were enduring at Greenspun. Mrs. Hairr 

17 decided to pull Nolan out of the school at that time. She also made a report to the police. 

18 

19 

20 

21 

By early February 2012, both Ethan and Nolan had been removed from Greenspun Jr. 

High School. 

Subsequent to the removal of Ethan and Nolan from Greenspun, and also subsequent to the 

filing of the police report, Principal McKay, on or about February 7, 2012, was contacted by 
22 

23 officials from the school district, specifically his direct supervisor Andre Long and the Assistant 

24 Superintendent Jolene Wallace. He was ordered by Ms. Wallace to conduct an investigation into 

25 the bullying of Ethan Bryan and Nolan Hairr. 

26 

27 

28 

Because he was ordered by his superiors to investigate, Principal McKay directed Vice 

Principal DePiazza to conduct a "second" investigation. 
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1 This was, in fact, the only investigation done at Greenspun into the bullying of Ethan and 

2 Nolan. At trial, no one from the school or the school district testified to seeing any results of any 

3 
earlier investigation. Nor was any evidence obtained from any earlier investigation introduced. 

4 

5 
Contrary to the responsibilities under Nevada law, no investigation ever took place while Ethan 

and Nolan were attending Greenspun Junior High School. 
6 

7 
IV. 

8 

Conclusions of Law 

A. The Evidence and Testimony at Trial shows a Title IX Violation. 

9 1. Title IX Standards 

10 Section 901(a) of Title IX provides, "No person in the United States shall, on the basis of 

11 
sex, be excluded from participation in, be denied the benefits of, or be subjected to discrimination 

12 

13 
under any education program or activity receiving Federal financial assistance." 20 USC § 

168l(a). Based on the receipt of federal funds, CCSD is subject to Title IX requirements. 20 USC 
14 

15 § 1681(a). Under Title IX, student on student harassment and bullying based upon perceived 

16 sexual orientation is actionable. 

17 For liability under Title IX for student on student sexual harassment: (1) the school district 

18 "must exercise substantial control over both the harasser and the context in which the known 

19 

20 

21 

harassment occurs", (2) the plaintiff must suffer "sexual harassment ... that is so severe, pervasive, 

and objectively offensive that it can be said to deprive the victims of access to the educational 

22 
opportunities or benefits provided by the school", (3) the school district must have "actual 

23 knowledge of the harassment", and (4) the school district's "deliberate indifference subjects its 

24 students to harassment". Reese v. Jefferson School District No, 14J, 208 F.3d 736, 739 (9th Cir. 

25 2000) (quoting Davis, 526 U.S. 629, 119 S. Ct. 1661, 1675 (1999)). See also, Henkle v. Gregory, 

26 
150 F.Supp.2d 1067, 1077-1078 (D. Nev. 2001). The Ninth Circuit defines deliberate indifference 

27 

28 
as "the conscious or reckless disregard of the consequences of one's acts or omissions," Henkle v, 
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1 Gregory, 150 F.Supp. 2d 1067,1077-78 (D. Nev. 2001); See also 9th Cir. Civ. Jury Instr. 11.3.5 

2 (1997)(citing Redman v. County of San Diego, 942 F.2d 1435, 1442 (9th Cir. 1991), cert. denied, 

3 
502 U.S. 1074 (1992). A Plaintiff bringing a claim under Title IX must prove his or her claim by a 

4 

5 

6 

preponderance of the evidence. Whether conduct rises to the level of actionable "harassment" 

thus "depends on a constellation of surrounding circumstances, expectations, and 

7 relationships," Oncale v. Sundowner Offshore Services, Inc., 523 U.S. 75, 82 (1998). 

8 In the instant case, the testimony at trial showed that: 1) Greenspun Junior High School 

9 exercised substantial control over both the students involved in the bullying and the context in 

10 which the harassment occurred; 2) both Ethan and Nolan were bullied at school; 3) the harassment 

11 
they endured was sexual in nature; 4) the harassment was so severe, pervasive, and objectively 

12 

13 
offensive that it deprived Ethan and Nolan of access to the educational opportunities and benefits 

provided by the school; 5) the appropriate school officials had actual knowledge of the bullying 
14 

15 and sexual discrimination suffered by Ethan and Nolan; and, 6) the appropriate school officials 

16 demonstrated deliberate indifference to the bullying endured by Ethan and Nolan. 

17 

18 

2. Ethan and Nolan were bullied in Mr. Beasley's band class. 

Ethan and Nolan were bullied in Mr. Beasley's band class by two other students. They 

19 were not only called names, but both were physically assaulted by the bullies. On September 13, 

20 

21 

22 

2011, CL stabbed Nolan in the groin with a pencil during Mr. Beasley's band class. On October 

18, 2011 Ethan was physically assaulted by one of the bullies at the end of band class by having 

23 
his legs hit and scratched with a trombone from which the rubber stopper had been removed. 

24 

25 

3. The bullying was sexual in nature. 

From the very beginning of the school year Nolan was called names such as "faggot, 

26 fucking fat faggot, fucking faggot, gay, gay boyfriend, cunt." This began when he was 11 years 

27 
old at the beginning of sixth grade. Nolan was a small child who had blonde hair down to his 

28 
shoulders. 
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1 While Ethan had been bullied by CL and DM from the beginning of the school year, their 

2 comments had started off being directed at his size and weight, after the stabbing incident, the 

3 
bullies also began directing their homophobic slurs against Ethan as well. The bullies continuously 

4 

5 
taunted Ethan and Nolan with homophobic slurs and innuendo, and specifically made statements 

concerning homosexual relations and explicit sexual acts between Ethan and Nolan in vile and 
6 

7 
graphic terms. 

8 

9 

10 

4. The bullying of Ethan and Nolan was severe, pervasive, and objectively 
unreasonable, and deprived them of significant educational opportunities. 

The nature of the bullying was severe, pervasive, and objectively unreasonable. It involved 

11 verbal abuse of a sexual and homophobic nature beginning from the start of the school year and 

12 only ceased when Ethan and Nolan were forced to stop attending Greenspun. Both boys suffered 

13 so severely from the bullying that they did whatever they could to not attend school in order to 

14 avoid the bullying. In January 2012, Ethan feigned illness in order to stay home from school. He 

15 
would eat paper in order to make himself sick. For Ethan, the bullying was so severe and 

16 

17 
pervasive that he saw suicide as his only way out. Fortunately, he was prevented from doing so 

by his mother's intervention. At that point, she was forced to take him out of Greenspun. 
18 

19 In January 2012, Nolan stopped going to band class in order to avoid the bullying by CL. 

20 Nolan then had a breakdown due to the constant bullying that forced his parents also to remove 

21 him from Greenspun. The creation of a sufficiently hostile environment forced Ethan and Nolan's 

22 parents to remove them from Greenspun Jr. High School and thus deprived them of educational 

23 

24 

25 

opportunities. 

The severity of the hostile environment forced both Nolan and Ethan to quit Greenspun to 

26 
escape both verbal and sometimes physical harassment from CL and DM that school officials were 

27 aware of, and allowed to continue. This was clearly a loss of educational opportunity. 

28 
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1 

2 

3 

5. Appropriate school officials had actual notice of the existence and the 
discriminatory nature of the bullying. 

Appropriate school officials had notice of the existence and nature of the bullying suffered 

4 by Ethan and Nolan. See, Gebser v. Lago Vista Indep. Sch. Dist., 524 U.S. 274, 290 (1998). 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

[I]n cases like this one that do not involve official policy of the recipient entity, we 
hold that a damages remedy will not lie under Title IX unless an official who at a 
minimum has authority to address the alleged discrimination and to institute 
corrective measures on the recipient's behalf has actual knowledge of 
discrimination in the recipient's programs and fails adequately to respond. 

524 U.S. at 290. 

The Court in Warren v. Reading Sch. Dist., 278 F.3d 163 (3rd Cir. 2002) stated that the 

school principal was the appropriate person for Title IX purposes, while in Murrell v. Sch. Dist. 

No. 1, 186 F.3d 1238, 1247 (10th Cir. 1999) the Court considered an individual who exercises 

substantial control, for Title IX purposes, to be anyone with the authority to take remedial action. 
14 

15 Several Greenspun personnel had authority to take remedial disciplinary actions when appropriate, 

16 including, band teacher Beasley, Principal McKay, Vice Principal DePiazza, and Dean Winn. 

17 Both Mr. Beasley and Mr. Halpin admitted to receiving Mary Bryan's September 15, 2011 and 

18 October 19, 2011 emails. 

19 

20 

21 

Five separate contacts by Ethan or Nolan's parents to Greenspun personnel put the school 

on actual notice of the verbal, physical and sexual nature of the bullying. On September 15, 2011, 

22 Mary Bryan sent an email to Dr. McKay, Mr. Halpin and Mr. Beasley concerning the stabbing of 

23 Nolan. On September 22, Aimee Hairr spoke to Mr. DePiazza about the general bullying and the 

24 assault on her son. She spoke to Mr. Halpin by phone the next day. 

25 

26 

27 

28 

On October 19, 2011, Mary Bryan sent another email to Dr. McKay, Mr. Halpin and Mr. 

Beasley, this time regarding the assault on Ethan. The same day, she and her husband met with 

Dean Winn to discuss the bullying of Ethan and Nolan, and particularly about its sexual, 
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1 homophobic nature. All of these parental contacts gave the school actual notice to appropriate 

2 persons of the existence and nature of the bullying of both Ethan and Nolan. 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

6. Greenspun school officials acted with deliberate indifference for Title 
IX violation purposes. 

Deliberate indifference is "the conscious or reckless disregard of the consequences of one's 

acts or omissions." Henkle v. Gregory, 150 F. Supp. 2d at 1078. Deliberate indifference occurs 

where the recipient's response to the harassment or lack thereof is clearly' unreasonable in light of 

the known circumstances. Reese v. Jefferson Sch. Dist. No. 14J, 208 F.3d 736, 739 (9th Cir. 

2000). It must, at a minimum, "cause students to undergo harassment or make them liable or 

vulnerable to it." Id., citing Davis, 526 U.S. at 645. "[I]f an institution either fails to act, or acts in 

a way which could not have reasonably been expected to remedy the violation, then the institution 

is liable for what amounts to an official decision not to end discrimination." Gebser v. Lago Vista 

Ind. School Dist., 524 U.S. 274,290 (1998); See, Jane Doe Av. Green, 298 F. Supp.2d 1025, 1035 
13 

(D. Nev. 2004). Greenspun officials' failure to take further action once they received actual notice 
14 

of the bullying and its nature showed deliberate indifference. See, Flores v. Morgan Hill Unified 
15 

School Dist., 324 F.3d 1130, 1136 (9th Cir. 2003), Vance v. Spencer County Public School Dist., 
16 

231 F.3d 253 (6th Cir. 2000). 
17 

18 
Even though NRS 3.88.1351 (1) requires that once a report of bullying is received, the 

Principal or his or her designee begin an immediate investigation, no investigation, much less one 
19 

conforming to statute, was ever undertaken in 2011 . The only time an investigation occurred was 
20 

in February 2012, when it was ordered by the District. This, however, occurred well after both 
21 

22 
Ethan and Nolan had been removed from Greenspun, and a police report had been filed. This 

23 
constituted deliberate indifference on the part of school officials who had actual notice of the 

24 
physical and homophobic bullying to which Ethan and Nolan were subjected. 

25 

26 

27 

B. The Evidence and Testimony at Trial shows a Substantive Due Process 
Violation. 

Under DeShaney v. Winnebago County Department of Social Services, 489 U.S. 189 

(1989), the Due Process Clause of the United States Constitution does not require state actors to 
28 
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1 protect private citizens from harm inflicted by other private citizens. DeShaney, however, is 

2 inapplicable because of the state created danger exception. 

3 

4 

5 

1. Plaintiffs had a constitutionally protected interest in their safety and in 
their education. 

State law can create a liberty or property interest. Vitek v Jones , 445 U.S. 480 (1980); 

6 Carlo v. City of Chino, 105 F.3d 493 (9th Cir. 1997). The Supreme Court stated in Goss v. Lopez, 

7 
419 U.S. 565, 576 (1975), that a student's right to a public education is a property interest 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

protected by the Due Process Clause. See also, Henry A. v. Willden, 678 F.3d 991 (9th Cir. 2012). 

2. Defendant acted with deliberate indifference for substantive due 
process violation purposes. 

The "state-created danger exception" - when "the state affirmatively places the Plaintiff 

in danger by acting with 'deliberate indifference' to a 'known and obvious danger," is manifested 

here. The standard for deliberate indifference does not vary between Title IX and 42 USC 1983 

cases. Doe A. v. Green, 298 F.Supp.2d 1025, 1035 (D.Nev., 2004) see also Willden, supra. 

Deliberate indifference consists of deliberate action or deliberate inaction. Wereb v. Maui County, 

727 F.Supp.2d 898, 921 (D. Haw., 2010) citing, Long v. County of Los Angeles, 442 F.3d 1 I78, 

1185 (91
h Cir., 2006); City of Canton v. Harris, 489 U.S. 378, 388 (1989). 

In other cases, Defendants have been "charged with knowledge" of unconstitutional 

conditions when they persistently violated a statutory duty to inquire about such conditions and to 

be responsible for them. Wright v. McMann, 460 F.2d 126 (2nd Cir. 1972); United States ex rel. 

Larkins v. Oswald, 510 F.2d 583 (2nd Cir. 1975); Doe v. NYC. Dep't of Soc. Servs., 649 F.2d 134 

(2nd Cir. 1981 ). The failure to investigate the reported physical, sexual, and other verbal bullying, 

in the face of clear statutory mandates to do so is significant evidence of an overall posture of 

deliberate indifference toward Ethan's and Nolan's welfare. 

3. CCSD is subject to Monell liability. 

In Menotti v. City of Seattle, 409 F.3d 1113, 1147 (9th Cir. 2005), the Ninth Circuit stated 

28 that there are three distinct alternative theories of municipal liability, by showing: (1) a 
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longstanding practice or custom which constitutes the 'standard operating procedure' of the local 

2 government entity; (2) that the decision-making official was, as a matter of state law, a final 

3 
policymaking authority whose edicts or acts may fairly be said to represent official policy in the 

4 

5 
area of decision; or (3) that an official with final policymaking authority either delegated that 

authority to, or ratified the decision of, a subordinate. See also, Trevino v. Gates, 99 F.3d 911, 918 
6 

7 
(9th Cir. 1996). 

8 Liability can be established by the existence of a government policy or custom that leads 

9 to a constitutional deprivation. Monell v. Department of Social Services of New York, 436 U.S. 

10 658, 694 (1978); Ulrich v. City and County of San Francisco, 308 F.3d 968, 983 (9th Cir. 2002); 

11 
Weiner v. San Diego County, 210 F.3d 1025, 1028 (9th Cir. 2000). The other two theories of 

12 

13 
municipal liability attach when a final policymaker for the government acts in a manner that can 

fairly be said to represent official action. See City of St. Louis v. Praprotnik, 485 U.S. 112, (1988); 
14 

15 Pembaur v. City of Cincinnati, 475 U.S. 469, 479-80 (1986). 

16 Liability may attach either when the final policymaker is a final policymaking authority 

17 who made the allegedly unconstitutional action, or when that action is ratified, or delegated to a 

18 
subordinate. Menotti, 409 F.3d at 1147; Ulrich, 308 F.3d at 984-85. A policy includes "a course 

19 

20 

21 

of action tailored to a particular situation and not intended to control decisions in later situations." 

Pembaur, 475 U.S. at 481. When determining whether an individual has final policymaking 

22 
authority, the pertinent query is whether he or she has authority "in a particular area, or on a 

23 particular issue." McMillian v. Monroe County, 520 U.S. 781 (1997). The individual must be in a 

24 position of authority to the extent that a final decision by that person may appropriately be 

25 attributed to the District. Lytle v. Carl, 382 F.3d 978, 983 (9th Cir. 2004); see also, Christie v. Iopa, 

26 
176 F.3d 1231, 1235 (9

1
h Cir. 1999). A government entity can be liable for an isolated 

27 

28 
constitutional violation. Id. 
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Principals can act as final policymakers for the purposes of Mone/I liability with respect to 

2 student discipline issues. Williams v. Fulton Cnty. Sch. Dist., 181 F. Supp. 3d 1089, 1126-27 (N.D. 

3 
Ga. 2016), citing, Holloman v. Harland, 370 F.3d 1252, 1293 (11th Cir. 2004); see also, Bowen v. 

4 

5 
Watkins, 669 F.2d 979 (5th Cir. 1982); Rabideau v. Beekmantown Cent. Sch. Dist., 89 F. Supp. 2d 

263, 268 (N.D.N.Y. 2000), citing Luce v. Board of Educ., 2 A.D.2d 502, 505, 157 N.Y.S.2d 123, 
6 

7 127 (3d Dep't 1956), affd, 3 N.Y.2d 792, 143 N.E.2d 797, 164 N.Y.S.2d 43 (1957). 

8 

9 

10 

4. NRS 388.1351(2) specifically tasks the school Principal with 
responsibility for investigating reports of bullying. 

The question of whether a particular individual has policymaking authority is a question of 

11 state law. Pembaur, supra, 475 U.S. at 483; St. Louis v. Praprotnik, 485 U.S. 112, 124 (1988); 

12 Lytle, 382 F.3d at 982-83. NRS 388.1351(2) required that once a report of bullying is received, 

13 the Principal or his or her designee shall initiate an investigation not later than one day after 

14 
receiving notice of the violation, and that the investigation must be completed within 10 days after 

15 
the date on which the investigation is initiated. 

16 

17 
The legislature explicitly gave a statutory mandate to investigate reports of bullying in 

school to the school "Principal or his or her designee." There is absolutely no legislative authority 
18 

l 9 for the CCSD to designate somebody else at the District level to override the delegation of 

20 responsibility and authority. Thus, under the NRS 388.1351 (2), because the final policymaker 

21 relating to the failure of Principal McKay or any of his designees to conduct the requisite 

22 
investigation on the reports of the bullying of Ethan and Nolan, was the Principal himself, 

23 

24 

25 

26 

Defendant CCSD is liable for the substantive due process violation under Monell. 

V. Damages 

In its June 29, 2017 Decision and Order, the Court ruled that "Plaintiffs are entitled to a 

27 judgment for all damages sought under these two claims asserted in the Complaint, and proven at 

28 trial." On April 6, 2016, Discovery Commissioner Bulla denied Defendants' Motion to Compel 
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1 Damages Categories and Calculations, thus allowing these calculations to be determined by the 

2 Court at trial. The Discovery Commissioner's Report and Recommendations were affirmed and 

3 
adopted by the Court. Plaintiffs Mary Bryan and Aimee Hairr testified that their out of pocket 

4 

5 
expenses for schooling for Ethan and Nolan outside of CCSD is approximately ten thousand 

dollars ($10,000) per year starting in eighth grade, or approximately fifty thousand dollars 
6 

7 ($50,000) total for each child to date. 

8 Beyond these out of pocket expenses both Ethan and Nolan suffered from physical attacks 

9 and relentless homophobic slurs. A seminal Nevada case can serve as a guideline for damages in 

10 similar school bullying cases. In Henkel, (150 F. Supp. 2d at 1069), "during school hours and on 

11 
school property, he endured constant harassment, assaults, intimidation, and discrimination by 

12 

13 
other students because he is gay and male and school officials, after being notified of the 

continuous harassment, failed to take any action." The Washoe County School District agreed to 
14 

15 pay Mr. Henkel four hundred, fifty-one thousand ($451,000) dollars as damages. Using Henkel as 

16 a guidepost, the $451 ,000 award in 2001 would be equivalent to approximately $625,000 in 

17 today's dollars. Therefore, awards of six hundred thousand dollars ($600,000), apiece to each 

18 
Plaintiff, Mary Bryan on behalf of Ethan Bryan and Aimee Hairr on behalf of Nolan Hairr, is 

19 

20 

21 

22 

appropriate. 

VI. Judgment 

Judgment is hereby entered in favor of Plaintiffs Mary Bryan on behalf of Ethan Bryan and 

23 Aimee Hairr on behalf of Nolan Hairr, and against Defendant Clark County School District on the 

24 Title IX and Substantive Due Process claims. It is further ordered that Defendant shall pay to each 

fwcJ f\fl,.~ <licloo dct:J. 0 fvM 
25 Plaintiff, Ethan Bryan and Nolan Hairr, the sum of--sm-hundred thousand dollars (-$~ M OO} for 

26 

27 

28 

physical and emotional distress damages and costs for alternative schooling. These awards are 

exclusive of any costs or attorneys fees accrued. 
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electronically served pursuant to EDCR 8.05(a) and 8.05(f), through the Eighth Judicial 
District Court's electronic filing system, with the date and time of the electronic service 
substituted for the date and place of deposit in the mail and/or by email to: 

Allen Lichtenstein, Esq. 
aljjc@aol.com 

Dan R. Waite, Esq. 
DWaite@lrrc.com 

Daniel F. Polsenberg, Esq. 
D Polsenberg@LRRC.com 

K en Lawrence 
Judicial Executive Assistant 

23 



44 44



001975

001975

00
19
75

001975

1 NOAS 
D ANtRl. F. P OLSENBER (SBN 2376) 

2 DAN R. WAITE (SBN 407 ) 
B RIAND. BL KLEY (SEN 1307 ) 

3 A BRAHAM G~ MITH (SEN 13 25 -) 
L EWI ROCA R OTH ERBER CHRISTIE LLP 

4 3993 Howard Hughes Pkwy uite 600 
Las Vegas. NV 89169-599 

5 T I~ 702_949.8200 
Fax: 702.949.8398 

6 DPolsenberg@lrrc.com 
DWaite@lrrc.com 

7 BBlakley@lrrc.com 

8 At.torry,eys {01 Defendant lm h Cou.nty School 
Distri ,t (CCSD) 

9 

10 D ISTRICT COURT 

11 CLARI{ COUNTY, N EVADA 

Electronically Filed 
8/23/2017 4!24 PM 

12 MARY B RYA mother of E THAN 
B RYAN; AIMEE HAIRR, mother of 

13 N LAN H AIRR, 

Case o. A-14-700018-C 

Dept. -. XXVII 

14 

15 vs . 

Plaintiffs 

16 CLARI< C OUNTY 8 HOOL DI TRICT 
(CCSD); P RINCIPAL W ARRE P. 

1 7 McKAY, in his individual and offi i 1 
capacity a principal of GJHS· 

18 L EONARD DEPT ZZ , in his inc1ividu . l 
and official capacity a. assistan 

19 principal at GJHS· CHERYL WINN, in 
her individual and official capacity as 

20 Dean at GJHS· · OHN H LPIN, in his 
individual and official capacity as 

21 counselor t :rJHS; ROBERT B EA LEY, 
in his individual and official capacity 

22 as instructor at GJH 

D f 11dants. 23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

NOTICE OF A PPEAL 

Plea. e take not ice that defendant Clark Coun y School Di trict hereby 

appeals to the Sup1·eme Cou 't of Nevada from: 

1. All judgments and order in this case; 

2. 'Decision and Order fil d on Jun 29, 201 7 (Exhibit A); 
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DISTRICT COURT 
CLARK COUNTY, NEV ADA 

MARY BRYAN.mother of ETHAN BRYAN; 
AIMEE HAIRR, mother of NOLI\N HAIRR, 

Ct.ERK OF TllE COURT 

Plaintiffs. 

v. 

CASBNO: A-14-70.0018 

DEPARTMENT 27 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
(CCSD); Pat Skorkowsky, in his official 
capacity as CCSD superintendent; CCSD 
BOARD OF SCHOOL TRUSTEES; Erin A. 
Cranor, Li.ri.da E. Young, Patrice Tew, Stavan 
Corbett, Carolyn Edwards, Chris·Garvcy, 
Deanna Wright, in ihej.r official capacities as 
CCSD BOARD OF SCHOOL "i'RUS1'EES; 
GREENSPUN JUNIOR HIGH SCHOOL 
(GJHS); Principal \Varren P. McKay, in his 
individual and official capacity as principal of 
GJHS; Leonard DePiazz.a, in his individual and 
official capacity os assistant principal at GJHS; 
Cheryl Winn, in her individual and official 
capacity as Dean at GJHS; John Halpin, in his 
individual and official capacity as counselor at 
GJHS; Robert Beasley, in his individual and 
official capacity os instructor aL GJHS; 

Defendants. 

DECISION AND ORDER 

This case arises under Title IX and 42 U.S.C . . § 1983, based on allegations that 

two students (C.L and D.M) verbally and physically mistreated Elhan Bryan and Nolan· 

Hai.tr. sons of the Plaintiffs. based on sex, as defined by Title lX. On November 15, 

2016. a five-day bench f;ial commenced in Departroent 27 before the Honorable Judge 

Nancy L. Allf. Allen Lichtenstein, Esq. and John Houston Scot~ Esq. appeared for and 

on behalf of Plaintiffs Mary Bryan ("Mrs. Bryan") and Aimee Hairr ("Mrs. Hairr"), 
28 • 
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(collectively "Plaintiffs"). Daniel Polsenbcrg, Esq., Dan Waite, Esq., and Brian D. 

Blakley, Esq. appeared for and on behalf of Defendant Clark County School District 

(CCSD), ("Defendant''). 

At trial, Plaintiffs' case was narrowed to two separate claims for relief-{!) a 

violation of Title IX of the Civil Rights Act, and (2) a violation of Plaintiffs' substantive 

due process rights as guaranteed by the Fourteenth Amendment to the United States 

Constitution pursuant to 42 U.S.C. § 1983. To preyail, the claim., require a showing that 

the Defendant was aware of the b.ullying and that CCSD officials, who were required to 

respond to reports of bullying pursuant to Nl{S Chapter 388, failed to act in manner that 

equates to deliberate indifference. 

The Court having heard arguments of counsel, testimony, and being fully briefed 

on the inaner finds as follows: 

.BACKGROUND 

Ethan Bryan and Nolan Hairr entered the sixth grade at Greenspun Jr. High 

School in August of 2011. Both students were enrolled in Mr. Beasley's third period 

band class in the trombone section. Nolan, eleven years old, repo,ted being small for his 

age and wore Jong blonde hair. From almost the outset of their enrollment, both boys 

began to be bullied by C.L and ·o.M. On numerous oocasions, C.L. and D.M. taunted 

Nolan with homophobic s lurs and sexual expletives, touching, pulling.· and running their 

fingers through Nolan's hair and blowing in his face. Nolan reported the behav.ior by 

filling out a complaint report at the Dean's office. Howevcr, .at this time, Nolan did not 

m~ntion the. homophobic and sexual content of the slurs that he was enduring and a 

subsequent meeting with Dean Winn did not proffer resolution. 

2 
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On or about September 13, 201 I, C.L., who was sitting ne~t to Nolan in band 

class, reached over and S!3bbed Nolan in the groin with the shaq,cned end of the pencil 

(the "September 13°' lncidenf'), C.L remarked that he-did so to see if Nolan was a gjrl 

and also referred 10 Nolan as a tattletale. Nolan look the tattletale reference as a sign that 

the stabbing was, at least in pan, retaliation for Nolan filing a complaint report. 

On or about September 15, 20!1, while Nolan was at Ethan's house, Mrs. Bryan 

overheard Ethan and Nolan talking about an issue that took place at sdlool. After Nolan 

went home, Mrs. Bryan questioned Ethan about what the two boys bad been discussing. 

In response, Ethan described to his mother the incident where C.L. stabbed Nolan in the 

groin and about the overall bullying occurring in Mr. Beasley's band class. This 

conversation sparked a series of complaints and reports that is the foundation for the 

claims asserted against CCSD. 

The first parental complaint occurred via emai.l on September 15, 2011 

("September 15'" Email") from Mrs. Bryan, addressed to Nolan's band teacher, Mr. 

Beasley, Counselor Halpin, and Principal McKay-all of whom where mandatory 

reporters under N.R.S. § 388.1351. The September 15"' Email identified C.L. and D.M. 

by name and described the physical as.,aulL< and verbal abuse. Both Mr. Beasley and 

Counselor Halpin acknowledged receiving the September I 5, 201 I Email. However, 

Principal McKay's email address was incorrect, so he did not receive the original 

complaint contained within the September l5"' F..mail. While Mr. Beasley and Counselor 

Halpin admitted that neither of diem followed up on the September 15°' Email, this Court· 

does not find this failure alone deliberately indifferent. However, actual knowledge of 

the bullying was triggered upon the receipt of the September 15"' Email. 

3 
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In response to the September 15,. Email, Mr. Beasley changed the arrangements 

in the trombone section of his band class so that Nolan sat in front of C.L. and not next to 

him. Mr. Beasley made this decision Vlithout consulting with anyone ·else. especially .. 

Principal McKay. 

Like Nolan, Ethan wa., also subjected to bullying by C.L. and D.M. After the 

September 13" Incident, the bullying escalated where C.L. and D.M. taunted him about · 

his weight and made homophobic slurs and vile and graphic innuendos concerning sexual 

relation., between Ethan and Nolan. 

The second parental complaint occurred on September 22, 2011 from Mrs. Hairr, 

via a telephone conversation with Vice Principal DePiazza. During this conversation. 

Mrs. Hairr told Vice Principal DePiaz:za about the stabbing of Nolan's genitals by another 

student in band class. 

On or about October 19. 2011, Ethan told his mother that Cl... and DM. had 

removed the robber stopper out of a piece of his trombone and repeatedly hit Ethan in the 

legs wilh the remaining sharp piece of the instrument leaving scratch marks on his legs. 

Ethan also informed his mother that C.I .. and D.M. continued to make lewd sexual 

comments including calling both Ethan and Nolan "gay," "faggOls," and made references 

about the two boys engaging in gay sex together. 

On or about October 19, 2011. Mrs. Bryan sent a second email (''October 1g<h 

Email") addressed to the same three individuals as the·September JS"' Email. Mr. 

Beasley and Counselor Halpin bolh acknowledged receipt of this email, but because it 

was addre.ssed to the same email addresses, Principal McKay did not receive it. Later 

that day, on October 19, 2011, Mrs. Bryan and her husband went to the school where they 

4 
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met with Dean Winn for approximately one hour to discuss the bullying, specifically the 

physical assaults and homophobic slurs. 

On or about October 19, 2011, Counselor Halpin attended a weekly . 

administrators meeting with Principal McKay and Vice Principal DcPiazza. Counselor 

Halpin testified that he reported the bullying that was occurring in Mr. Beasley's band 

class in considerable detail and disclosed the September IS" Email and the October 19"' 

Email. Counselor Halpin specifically recalled Principal McKay directing Vice Principal 

DePiazza to take care of the matter. Principal McKay testified that he was not interested 

in the details of suclt matters and left it to his subordinates to address the issue. Principal 

McKay further testified that he did not follow up with Vice Principal DePiazza about 

how the investigation wa., going or what the investigation uncovered until February 2012. 

All of the school officials had conflicting testimony about who was tasked with the 

investigation into the bullying, but all testified that no investigation into the bullying was 

conducted until February 2012. 

The bullying and harassment continued throughout the fall and into early 2012. 

Both boys avoided band class and scnool altogether. &ban faked illness to avoid class 

and Nolan would try to avoid C.L. and D.M. by lingering in the halls and in the library. 

By the middle of January, both boys had almost completely s topped going to school 

altogether to avoid the continuous bullying. 

Mrs. Bryan pulled Ethan out of Greenspun Jr. High in January 2012 after Ethan 

contemplated s uicide. On or about January 21, 2012, Mrs. Hair pulled Nolan out of 

Grecnspun Jr. High after Nolan had an emotional breakdown because of the bullying. 

Mrs. Hair filed a polioe report, reporting the bullying and harassment. 
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On or about February 7, 2012, Mrs. Bryan and M,s. Hairr removed the boys from 

Greenspun Jr. High. Subsequently, Assistant Superintendent Jolene Wallace and 

Principal McKay's direct supervisor, ordered Principal McKay to conduct an 

investigation into the bullying of Ethan and Nolan. This is the only investigation that 

took place into the bullying of the Ethan and Nolan. 

J>JSCU5SION 

A. Legal S tandard - Title rx of the Civil Rights Act 

Title IX of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 provides, in pa,t, "[n)o person in the 

United S tates shall, on the basis of sex, be excluded from participation in, be denied the 

benefits of, or be subjected ro discrimination under any education program or activity 

receiving Federal fmancial assistance." 20 U.S.C § I68I(a). A school district in receipt 

of federal funds is liable for monetary damages for violations of Title IX. Davis Next 

Friend l.oShonda D. v. Monroe Cty. Bd. of Educ., 526 U.S. 629. 642, 119 S. Ct. 1661, 

1671, 143 L Ed. 2d 839 (1999) ('\ve concluded lhat Pennhurst does not bar a private 

damages action under Title IX where the funding recipient engages in intentional conduct 

that violates the clear tcnns of the statute."). , 

In Reese v. Jejfer.,on School District No. 141, the Ninth Circuit adopted the 

framework set out in Davis and set forth four requirements for imposition of school 

district liability under Tille IX for student-student sexual harassment: (1) the school 

district "must exercise substantial control over both the harasser and the context in which 

the known harassment occurs," (2) the plaintiff must suffer "sexual harassment ... that is 

so severe. pervasive, and objectively offensive that it can be said to deprive the victims of 

oc-cess to the educational opportunities or benefits provided by the school," (3) dte school 

district must have "actual knowledge of the harassmen~" and (4) the school district's 

6 
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"deliberate indifference subjects its students to harassmeIU.'' 208 F.Jd 736, 739 (9th Cir. 

2090) (quoting Davis, 119 S. Ct. 1661, 1675 (1999)). 

The Ninth Circuit defines deliberate indifference as "the co:n&c.ious or reckless 

disregard of the consequences of ones acts or omissions." Henkle v. Gregory, 150 F. 

Supp. 2d 1067, 1077- 78 (D. Nev. 2001); See also 9th Cir. Civ. Jury Instr. H.3.5 (1997) 

(citing Redman v. County of San Diego, 942 F.2d 1435, 1442 (9th Ch:.l991}. ce.n. denied, 

502 U.S. 1074, 112 S.Ct. 972, ll7 L.Ed.2d 137 (1992)). A plaintiff bringmg a claim 

under Title IX must prove her claim by a preponderance of the evidence. 

B. Legal Standard • 42 U.S.C. § 1983 

A student's right to a public education is a property interest protooted! lby the Due 
. . 

Process Clause. Goss v. Lopez, 419 U.S. 565, 573, 95 S. Ct 729, 735, 42 L F.d. 2d 725 

(1975) ("Here, on the basis of 3tate la~, appellees plainly had legitimate claims of 

entitlement to a public education . . ."). As a general matter, the Fourteen.di Amendment 

to the United States Constitution does not "require[ ] the State to protect die Life, liberty, 

and property of its citizens against invasion by private actors." DeSha,iey 1,1. Winnebago 

County Dep't of Social Servs. , 489 U.S. 189, 195, 109 S.Ct. 998, ]OJ L.Ed.2d 249 

(1989). In fact, "the Fourteenth Amendment's Due Process Clause ... does not confer 

any affirmative right to governmental aid and typically does not impose a. duty on the 

state to protect individuals from third parties." Henry A. v. Willde~ 678 F.3d 991, 998 

(9th Cir.2012) (quotations and citation omitted). 

This rule, however, is subject to two specific exceptiom; (1) th~ special 

relationship exception, and (2) the state-created danger exception. Id. al 99S. Under the 

special relationship exception, the government may be liable for its failure to protect if a 

"special relationship" exists between it and the plaintiff such that the go¥emment has 

7 
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assumed "some responsibility for the plaintiff's safety and well-being." Id. Under the 

state-created dange,: exception, the government may be liable for its failure to protect 

where "the state affinnatively places the plaintiff in danger by acting with 'deliberate 

indifference' to a 'known and obvious danger[.]' "Id. In determining whether the state-

created exception applie.,, the Court assesses: "(I) whether any affirmative actions of the 

official placed the individual in danger he otherwise would not have faced; (2) whether 

the danger was known or obvious; and (3) whether the officer acted witli. deliberate 

indifference to that danger." Id. at 1002. Under either exception, the government's 

failure to protect renders it liable under a§ 1983 claim. Id. 

C. Nevada law mandates pubUc school officu>ls to .. port bullying and 
harassment 

Nevada Revised S tatute § 388.135 provide that 

"(a) member of lhe board of trustees of a school 

district, any employee of the board of trustees, including, 

without limitatio~ an adminis~tor, principal, teacher or 

other staff member . . . Or any pupil shall not engage in 

bullying or cyber-bullying on the premises of any public 

school. at an activity sponsored by a public school or on 

any school bus." 

(Emphasis added). 

Furthermore. Nevada Re,'iscd Statute§ 388.1351(1) provides that: 

"la] teacher ... principal ... or olher staff member who 

witnesses a violation of NRS 388.135 or receives 

infonnation that a violation of NRS 388.135 has occurred 

shall report the violation to the principal . . . as soon a~ 

8 
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~ 

Nevada statutes make it clear that any public school employee who either 

witnesses bullying or is informed ·that btlllying has occmred or is occurring, is obligated 

by statute to report the bullying to the principal of the public school. Upon information 

that bullying has occurred or is occurr.mg. Nevada Revised Statute § 388.1351(2) 

mandate that "the principal or designee shall immediately take any necessary action to 

stop the bullying .. ; and ensure tho safety and well-being of the reported victim or 

victims ... and shall begin an investigation into the report." N.R.S. § 388.1351(1)(2) . 

(emphasis added). 

D. CCSD Officials' conduct was deJJherately indifferent. 

Through the testimony p~ented at trial. Plaintiffs have satisfied the Jour 

requirements of the Davis framework for-imposition of ~-oh-ool district liability under Title 

18 IX for student-student sexual hara~e,nl First, OCSD , as a public high scho.ol, 
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exercised substantial control over both the harassers and the context in which the known 

harassments occurs. In this case, C.L. and D.M. engaged in excessive and continuous 

homophobic slurs and sexual expletives directed at Nolan and Ethan in the band class 

classroom. C.L. and D.M.'s daily references to Nolan and Ethan as ''faggot, fucking fat 

faggot, fucking faggot, gay, gay boyf~ad, and cunt'' were so severe, pervasive, and 

objectively offensive that it deprived the boys of access to school's educational 

opportunities and benefits available to S1Udent._~ Testimony revealed that the bul.lying 

w3:5 so severe that the boys had to avoid gomng to band class altogether just to avoid the 
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victimizaiion. Moroovcr, Ethan contemplated suicide as a result of monlhs of bullying 

and harassment, and Nola~ had an emotional breakdown-both of these evenLs triggered · 

the parents to wilbdraw their children from Greenspun Jr. High. Nolan and Ethan were 

wiable to take advantage of the educational opportunities provided by the school and 

being accessed by students not subjected <O bullying and harassment. 

The third requirement of !he Davis framework requires the school to have actual 

knowledge of the harassment. There were three separate parental complaints, all of 

which should have promp<ed a mandatory investigation wider N.R.S. § 388.135 1(1X2). 

The September 15th Email, Oc1obcr 19th Email, and the October 19th meeting with Dean 

Winn, each put the school officials respon..~ible for reporting the infonnatjon to the 

Principal McKay oo. notice that bullying had occurred and was continuing to occur on 

campus. Counselor Halpin, Mr. Beasley, and Dean Wion all failed to immediately report 

the complaints <o Principal McKay. Notwithstanding, C0wtsclor Halpin did inform 

Principal McKay of the complaints and the bullying al the October 19th administrative 

meeting and yet CCSD offered zero evidence to indicate tha< an investigation was ever 

conducted in 2011. 

The fourth requirement of the Davis ftamewotk requires the school to have acted 

with "deliberate indifference" that subjects its studc'llts 10 !he harassment. As federal 

funding recipients, CCSD officials had a duty wider T ille IX, and under Nevada law, 10 

follow up and investigate any reports of bullying and harassment occurring on school 

property. CCSD's failure to conduct any type of investigation after three separate 

complaints of bullying and an administrative moetiog discussing the bullying, coastitutes 

at the very least, reckless disregard of the consequenc.es of it ·acts or omissions. 

Accordingly, CCSD's failure to timely investigate and take any type of remedial action 

10 
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constitutes deliberate indifference. This deliberate indifference was the causation that led 

to the escalation of the bullying and harassment endured by the Plaintiffs' children. 

Therefore, Plaintiffs have proven their Title IX claim by a preponderance of the evidence 

submitted at trial. 

E. CCSD created the dangerous environment 

CCSD's deliberate indifference to the numerous complaints of bullying forced 

Nolan and Ethan to remain in a known and obviously dangerous environment. which 

further subjected them to severe and pervasive bullying and harassment that was 

objectively offensive. For CCSD to be liable under the state.create,<! exception, this 

Court asked, (1) whether any affirmative actious of the official placed the individual in 

danger he othenvise would not have faced; (2) whether the danger was known or 

obvious; and (3) whether tbe officer acted with deliberate indifference to that danger." 

Henry A. at 1002. This Court finds in the affirmative to all three inquires. 

Here, the fttSt inquiry does not require CCSD to do more than "expose the 

plaintiff to a danger that already existed.'' Id. To the contrary, a test such as this would 

render the state-created doctrine futile. In Henry A., the Ninth Circuit «plained that "by 

its very nature, the doctrine only applies in situations where the plaintiff wac; directly 

harmed by a third party-a danger that, in every case, could be said to have 'already 

existed.' " Id. (internal citations omitted). It follows that to be liable wider the state­

created exception, CCSD was not required to take an affinnative action that made the 

bullying and harassment worse. Instead it was CCSD's failure to take affirmative action 

that subjccled Nolan and Elhan to further bullying and barassmcnL Thus, this Court finds 

the first inquiry is satisfied. 

I I 
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The seoond and third inquiries are more easily ascertainable in this case. CCSD 

knew of the danger because of the three separate parental complaints from the Plaintiffs. 

Complaints CCSD officials adrniued to receiving and testified that they did not inform 

Principal McKay. Each of the complaints gave CCSD officials sufficient details 

necessary to put them on notice of the dangers Nolan and Ethan were exposed to. 

Finally, as stated above. CCSD's failure to oonduct any type of investigation after three 

separate complaints of bullying and an administrative meeting discussing the bullying, 

constitutes deliberate indifference. 

Accordingly, the Plaintiffs have proven their 42 U.S.C. § 1983 claim by a 

preponderance of the evidence subrniUed at trill!. Nolan and Ethan had a constitutional 

right to a public education, and.CCSD is liable under 42 U.S.C. § 1983 for its failw-e to 

protect Nolan and Ethan by acting with deliberate indifference to the known dangers that 

existed in Mr. Beasley's band class. CCSD's deliberate indifference deprived Nolan and 

Ethan of these educational rights secured by Fourteenth Amendment Due Process Clause 

of the United States Constitution. 

CoNCLUSION 

COURT ORDERS for good cause appearing and after review. Defendant CCSD 

violated Title IX of the Civil Rights Act 

COURT FURTHER ORDERS for good cause appearing and after review, 

violated Plaintiffs' substantive due process rights as guaranteed by the Fourteenth 

Amendmeru to die United States Constitution pursuant to 42 U.S.C. § 1983. 

COURT FURTHER ORDERS for good cause appearing and after review 

Judgment shall be entered in favor of Plaintiffs Mary Bryan, on behalf of Ethan Bryan, 

t2 
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and Aimee Hairr, on behalf of Nolan Hairr. Plaintiffs are entitled 10 a judg,nem for all 

damages sought under these two claims asserted in the Complaint. and proven at trial. 

COURT FURTHER ORDERS for good cause appearing and after review that 

Plaintiffs shall prepare Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law and a Judgment consistent 
· -·~ , ... ,. ............. . - . _,.. . . .. . .. 

with this Decision, and submit it the Court for review. They may include all factual 

findings contained in Plaintiffs' post trial briefs. At the time of submission to the Court, 

copies shall be transmitted to D<:fcndant's counsel. 

10 Dated: June 27, 2017 
NANCY t/:=11:J t:Af{ ( 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

DISTRICT COURT JUDGE 

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE 

I hereby certify that on or about the date signed I caused the foregoing document to be 
electronically served pursuant to EDCR 8.05(a) and 8.05(1). through the Eighth Judicial 
District Court's electronic filing system, with the date and time of the electtonic service 
substituted for the date and place of deposit in the mail and/or by email to: 

Allen Lichtenstein, Esq. 
aljjc@aol.com 

Dao R. Waite. Esq. 
DWaite@lrrc.com 

Daniel F. Polsenberg, Esq. 
DPolsenberg@LRRC.com 

Brian D. Blakley, Esq. 
BBlakJey@lrrc.com 

Excxcutive Assistant 

13 



EXHIBIT B

EXHIBIT B

001992

001992

00
19
92

001992



001993

001993

00
19
93

001993

1 Allen Lichtenstein (J\iV State Bar No. 3992) 
ALLEN LICHTENSTEIK, LTD. 

2 3315 Russell Road, No. 222 
Las Vegas, NV 89120 

3 Tel: 702.433-2666 
Fax: 702.433-9591 

4 allaw@lvcoxmail.com 

5 John Houston Scott (CA Bar No. 72578) 
Admi tted Pro Hae Vice 

6 SCOTI LAW FIRM 
1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715 

7 San Francisco, CA 94 109 
Tel: 41 5.561-9601 

8 john@scotllawfirm.net 

9 Attorneys/or Plaintiffs, Mary B,yan. F:than Bryan, 
Aimee !lairr and Nolan Jlairr 

Electronically Filed 
8/1 512017 9:54 AM 

10 

11 

12 

DISTRICT CO"LlRT 

CLARK COUNTY, NEV ADA 

13 MARY BRYAK, mother of ETHAN BRYM; Case Ko. A-14-700018-C 

Dept. No. xxvn 14 

15 

16 

AlMEE HAIRR. mother of NOLAN HAIRR, 

Plaintiffs, 

vs. 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DlSTRlCT 
17 (CCSD 

NOTICE OF ENTRY OF FINDINGS OF 
FACT, COXCLUSIONS OF LAW AND 
JUDGMENT IN FAVOR OF 
PLAINTWFS 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

Defendant _ 

TO: ALL INTERESTED PARTIES AND THEIR RESPECTIVE ATTORNEYS OF 

RECORD 

Please take notice that Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law and Judgment in Favor of 

Plaintiffs were entered in this case, a copy of which is attached .. 

Dated this 15th day of August 2017, 

Respectfully submitted by: 

Isl Allen Lichtenstein 

1 
Case Number: A-14-700018-C 
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Allen Lichtenstein
Nevada Bar No. 3992
ALLEN LICHTENSTEIN LTD.
3315 Russell Road, No. 222
Las Vegas, NV 89120
Tel: 702.433-2666
Fax: 702.433-9591
allaw@lvcoxmail.com

John Houston Scott (CA Bar No. 72578)
Admitted Pro Hac Vice
SCOTT LAW FIRM
1388 Sutter Street, Suite 715
San Francisco, CA 94109
Tel: 415.561.9601
john@scottlawfirm.net
Attorneys for Plaintiffs, Mary Bryan, Ethan Bryan,
Aimee Hairr and Nolan Hairr

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that I served the following Notice of Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law

and Judgment in Favor of Plaintiffs via United

States Mail and/or e-mail on the 15th day of August 2017, to:

Dan Waite
Lewis Rocha Rothgerber Christie
3993 Howard Hughes Pkwy., Suite 600
Las Vegas, NV 89169-5996

DWaite@lrrc.com

/s/ Allen Lichtenstein
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Electronically Filed 
7/20/2017 2:54 PM 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

DISTRICT COURT 

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA 

7 MARY BRYAN, mother of ETHAN BRYAN; 
AIMEE HAIRR, mother of NOLAN HAIRR, . 

8 

9 

10 
vs. 

Plaintiffs, 

CLARK COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
11 (CCSD 

12 

13 

14 

15 I. Introduction 

Defendant. 

Case No. A-14-700018-C 

Dept. No. XXVII 

FINDINGS OF FACT, 
CONCLUSIONS OF LAW, AND 
JUDGMENT INF A VOR OF 
PLAINTIFFS 

16 On June 29, 2017, the Court issued its Decision and Order in favor of Plaintiffs Ethan 

17 

18 

19 

Bryan and Nolan Hairr and against Defendant Clark County School District (CCSD) on the 

claims that Defendant violated Plaintiffs' rights under Title IX, 20 USC§ 1681(A) and Plaintiffs' 

rights to Substantive Due Process under the Fourteenth Amendment to the United States 
20 

21 
Constitution and pursuant to 42 U.S.C. 1983. The Court also ruled that, "Plaintiffs are entitled to a 

22 judgment for all damages sought under these two claims asserted in the Complaint, and proven at 

23 trial." 

24 II. 

25 

26 

Procedural History 

Plaintiffs filed their Amended Complaint on October 10, 2014 against Defendants: Clark 

County School District (CCSD), Pat Skorkowsky, in his official capacity as CCSD 
27 

28 

Case Number: A-14-700018-C 
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l Superintendent; CCSD Board of School Trustees; Erin A. Cranor, Linda E. Young, Patrice Tew, 

2 Stavan Corbett, Carolyn Edwards, Chris Garvey, Deanna Wright, in their official capacities as 

3 CCSD Board of School Trustees, Greenspun Jr. High School (GJHS); Principal Warren P. 

4 

5 
McKay, in his individual and official capacity as principal of GJHS; Leonard DePiazza, in his 

individual and official capacity as assistant principal at GJHS; Cheryl Winn, in her individual and 
6 

7 
official capacity as Dean at GJHS; John Halpin, in his individual and official capacity 

8 as counselor at GJHS; Robert Beasley, in his individual and official capacity as instructor at 

9 GJHS. The Amended Complaint listed five claims for relief: 1) Negligence; 2) Negligence Per 

IO Se; 3) Violation of Title IX; 4) Violation of the Right to Equal Protection; 5) Violation of 

11 
Substantive Due Process. 

12 

13 
In its February 5, 2015 Order, the Court Dismissed Plaintiffs' Claims for Relief No. ·1, 

Negligence, and No. 2, Negligence Per Se. Plaintiffs abandoned their Fourth Claim for Relief, 
14 

15 Equal Protection, leaving the Third Claim for Relief, Title IX, and Fifth Claim for Relief, 

16 Substantive Due Process, for trial. Defendants filed their Answer on February 25, 2015. 

17 On March 1, 2016, Defendants filed a Motion for Summary Judgment, which was granted 

18 in part and denied in part by the Court in its July 22, 2016 Order. The Court denied Defendants' 

19 

20 

21 

Motion to dismiss Plaintiffs' Title IX claim against Defendant CCSD. It dismissed the 42 USC 

1983 Equal Protection claims, which had been abandoned by Plaintiffs. The Court granted 

22 
Defendants' Motion to dismiss all Defendants except CCSD from the 42 USC 1983 Substantive 

23 Due Process claim. Overall, the Court ruled the two remaining claims against CCSD, 1) Title IX; 

24 and 2) Substantive Due Process would proceed to trial. 

25 

26 

27 

28 

On or about March 20, 2016, Discovery Commissioner Bulla denied Defendants' Motion 

to Compel Damages Categories and Calculations, allowing such calculations to be determined by 

-2-
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1 the Court at trial. The Discovery Commissioner's Report and Recommendations were affirmed 

2 and adopted by the Court on April 6, 2016. 

3 

4 

5 

On August 5, 2016, Defendant CCSD filed a Motion for Partial Reconsideration, or in the 

Alternative, Motion for Relief Pursuant to NRCP 59(E), 60(A) and 60(8), or Motion in Limiting. 

On October 26, 2016 the Court denied Defendant's Motion. 
6 

7 
On November 15, 2016, a five-day bench trial was held in Department 27 before the 

8 Honorable Judge Nancy L. Allf. Allen Lichtenstein, Esq. and John Houston Scott, Esq. appeared 

9 for and on behalf of Plaintiffs Mary Bryan ("Mrs. Bryan") and Aimee Hairr ("Mrs. Hairr"), 

lO (collectively Plaintiffs"). Daniel Polsenberg, Esq., Dan Waite, Esq., and Brian D. Blakley, Esq. 

11 
appeared for and on behalf of Defendant CCSD, ("Defendant") on the Title IX and 42 USC 1983 

12 

13 
Substitute Due Process claims. Testimony was given by: Nolan Hairr, Ethan Bryan, Aimee Hairr, 

Mary Bryan, Principal Warren McKay, Vice Principal Leonard DePiazza, Dean Cheryl Winn, 
14 

15 Counselor John Halpin and band teacher Robert Beasely. Although neither one of the alleged 

16 bullies testified, CL's deposition was introduced into evidence. (For privacy purposes, only the 

17 initials of CL and DM are used.) 

18 Closing arguments were done via written briefs. Briefing was completed on May 26, 2017. 

19 
On June 29, 2017, the Court issued its Decision and Order, concluding that Defendant CCSD 

20 
violated both Title IX of the Civil Rights_ Act and also violated Plaintiffs' Substantive Due Process 

21 

22 
rights as guaranteed by the Fourteenth Amendment to the United States Constitution pursuant to 

23 42 USC 1983. The Court further ordered that after review, "Judgment shall be entered in favor of 

24 Plaintiffs Mary Bryan, on behalf of Ethan Bryan and Aimee Hairr on behalf of Nolan Hairr, and 

25 that Plaintiffs are entitled to a judgment for all damages sought under these two claims asserted in 

26 the Complaint, and proven at trial." 

27 

28 

-3-
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1 III. 

2 

Findings of Fact 

A. Ethan Bryan and Nolan Hairr started being bullied almost from the time 

3 
they began attending Greenspun Jr. High School. 

4 In late August 2011, two friends, Ethan Bryan and Nolan Hairr began sixth grade at 

5 Greenspun Jr. High School. Both Ethan and Nolan enrolled in Mr. Beasley's third period band 

6 class in the trombone section. 

7 

8 

9 

Almost from the beginning of the school year, Ethan and Nolan began to be bullied by two 

other trombone students, CL and DM. In sixth grade, at age 11, Nolan was small for his age with 

long blonde hair. CL and DM taunted him with names like gay and faggot, and called him a girl. 
10 

11 
CL also touched, pulled, ran his fingers through Nolan's hair and blew in Nolan's face. 

12 Nolan, following what he believed was proper procedure, went to the Dean's office and 

13 filled out a complaint report. He was, however, too embarrassed to mention the homophobic and 

14 sexual content of the slurs that he was enduring. Nolan was subsequently called into the Dean's 

15 
office and met with Dean Winn. He did not feel that she was either sympathetic or even interested, 

16 

17 

18 

and therefore was reluctant to discuss the homophobic sexually-oriented nature of the bullying. 

Within a day or two of Nolan's meeting with the Dean, on or about September 13, 2011, 

19 CL, who was sitting next to Nolan in band class, reached over and stabbed Nolan in the groin 

20 with the sharpened end of the pencil. CL said he wanted to see if Nolan was a girl, and also 

21 referred to Nolan as a tattletale. Nolan took the tattletale reference as a sign that the stabbing was, 

22 at least in part, retaliation for Nolan complaining about the bullying. Because of this fear of 

23 

24 

25 

26 

retaliation, Nolan decided not to tell any adults about any further bullying directed at him, and 

instead, to endure the torment in silence. 

A day or two after the stabbing incident, while Nolan was at Ethan's house, Ethan's 

27 mother, Mary Bryan overheard Ethan and Nolan talking about some problem taking place at 

28 school. After Nolan had gone home, Mary Bryan confronted her son and questioned him 

-4-
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1 concerning what Ethan and Nolan had been discussing. Ethan described to his mother the incident 

2 where CL stabbed Nolan in the groin with a pencil, and about the overall bullying occurring in Mr. 

3 Beasley's band class. 

4 

5 

6 

B. Mary Bryan's September 15, 2011 email 

In response, Mary Bryan decided to contact the school officials to report the bullying .in 

7 
general and the stabbing in particular. 

8 On September 15, 2011, she attempted to telephone Greenspun Principal Warren P. 

9 McKay. However, she could not reach him by telephone and was only able to talk to a junior high 

10 student volunteer. Mary did not want to leave such a sensitive message with a junior high student 

11 
and was not transferred to Principal McKay's voicemail. Mary then decided she would email 

12 
the Principal and got an email address for him from the student volunteer. 

13 

14 
On September 15, 2011, Mary Bryan sent an email to three people: 1) Principal Warren 

15 
McKay; 2) band teacher Robert Beasley; and 3) school counselor John Halpin, complaining about 

16 the bullying and specifically about the stabbing. Both Mr. Beasley and Mr. Halpin acknowledged 

17 receiving the September 15, 2011 email from Mary Bryan. Principal McKay said he did not 

18 receive it because the email address for him (which Mary Bryan obtained from his own office) 

19 
was incorrect. 

20 

21 
Both Mr. Beasley and Mr. Halpin were, in 2011, mandatory reporters who were required to 

22 
report any information concerning bullying, to either the Principal or one of his designees, 

23 pursuant to NRS 3.88.1351 (1). In 2011, Principal McKay's designees at Greenspun were Vice 

24 Principal Leonard DePiazza and Dean Cheryl Winn. 

25 Neither Mr. Beasley nor Mr. Halpin fulfilled their statutory duty to report Mary Bryan' s 

26 September 15, 2011 email concerning bullying, explaining that because they saw Principal 

27 

28 
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1 McKay's name in the address line, they assumed, without verifying, that Dr. McKay, and through 

2 him Vice Principal DePiazza and Dean Winn were aware of the situation. 

3 

4 

5 

These assumptions by Mr. Beasley and Mr. Halpin were incorrect. Moreover, by relying 

on their assumptions, rather than adhering to the statutory requirement to report any information 

concerning bullying they received, they both violated the explicit requirements of NRS 
6 

7 
388.1351(1). 

8 In response to the September 15, 2011 email, Mr. Beasley changed the seating 

9 arrangements in the trombone section of his class. While before, Nolan had been sitting next to 

10 Connor, after the change, Nolan set directly in front of CL. 

11 

12 

13 

While Mr. Beasley attempted to keep an eye on both bullies and the bullied students, he 

admitted that he was unable to constantly watch them and still teach his class. Mr. Beasley said 

that he made the decisions concerning the seating arrangements on his own without consultation 
14 

15 with anyone else. This testimony conflicted with that of Dean Winn, who stated that she was 

16 involved in the decision. 

17 The bullying continued. For Ethan Bryan, at the beginning of the school year, most of the 

l 8 taunts at him by CL and DM had to do with his size. He was large for his age and overweight. 

19 

20 

21 

After the incident where CL stabbed Ethan's friend Nolan with a pencil, the bullying- of 

Ethan began to change. It not only escalated but also shifted from being mostly about his size and 

weight to also involve homophobic slurs and vile and graphic innuendos concerning sexual 
22 

23 relations between Ethan and Nolan. 

24 Like his friend Nolan, Ethan also chose not to report the bullying that he was enduring for 

25 fear of retaliation, and lack of any real interest on the part of Greenspun school officials. Mary 

26 Bryan, believing that the school would contact Nolan' s parents after Mary sent them the 

27 

28 
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