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Steven D. Grierson
CLERK OF THE COURT

HOWARD & HOWARD ATTORNEYS PLLC
L. CHRISTOPHER ROSE, ESQ.

Nevada Bar No. 7500

KIRILL V. MIKHAYLOV, ESQ.

Nevada Bar No. 13538

3800 Howard Hughes Parkway, Suite 1000
Las Vegas, Nevada 89169

Telephone: 702.257.1483

Fax: 702.567.1568

lcr@h2law.com

kvm@h2law.com

Attorneys for Defendant
Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

DISTRICT COURT
CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA

CASE NO.: A-19-787004-B
DEPT NO.: XI

CONSOLIDATED WITH:
A-18-785818-W
A-18-786357-W
A-19-786962-B
A-19-787035-C
A-19-787540-W
A-19-787726-C
A-19-801416-B

In Re: D.O.T. Litigation,

APPENDIX TO WELLNESS

CONNECTION OF NEVADA, LLC'S
MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES

(Volume 1)
EXHIBIT DOCUMENT BATES NOS.
A Declaration of L Christopher Reg, Ej. WCNO0O0QL-WCNOOG
B Declaration of Kirill V. Mikhaylo/, EQ. WCNOOG-WCNOOG
C Jolley, Urge, Woodbuy, Holthus & Rog Invoices WCNOO0G®G-WCNO0Z7
D Howard & Howad PLL C Invoices WCNO0ZB-WCNO019)
E Excerpts of TGG 30(b)(6) Depositia WCNO15l-WCNO01%H
F Excerpts of THC 30(b)(6) Depositio WCNO01%-WCNO1&
G Excerpts of GBS Nevada 30(b)(6) Depositio WCNO16l-WCNO016

2140566
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EXHIBIT DOCUMENT BATES NOS.
H Excerpts of SerenytWellnes 30(b)(6) Depositio WCNO0167-WCNO0171
I Excerpts of Fidas Holdings 30(b)(6) Depositio WCNO0172-WCNO0175H
J Excerpts of GravitaNevadi 30(b)(6) Depositio WCNO017%6-WCNO018L

DATED this 13" day of October 2020.

2140566

HOWARD & HOWARD ATTORNEYS PLLC

/sl L. Christopher Rose

L. CHRISTOPHER ROSE, ESQ.
KIRILL V. MIKHAYLOV, ESQ.
3800 Howard Hughes Parkway, Suite 1000

Las Vegas, NV 89169

Attorneys for Defendant

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

| hereby certify that | am employed in the County of Clark, State of Nevada, am o}
age of 18 years and not a party to this action. My business address is Howard & Howard A
PLLC, 3800 Howard Hughes Parkway, Suite 1000, Las Vegas, Nevada 89145.
On October 13, 2020, | served the APPENDIX TO WELLNESS CONNECTION ¢

NEVADA, LLC'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS’' FEES (Volume 1) in this action o
proceeding electronically with the Clerk of the Court via the Odyssey E-File system and ¢

the same on all parties listed on the Court’'s Master Service List.

/s/ Julia M. Diaz
An employee of HOWARD & HOWARD ATTORNEYS PLLC

4840-3420-8206, v. 1

2140566
Page 3 of 3
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DECLARATION OF L. CHRISTOPHER ROSE, ESQ. IN SUPPORT OF WELLNESS
CONNECTION OF NEVADA, LLC'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES

1. | am an attorney licensed to practice law in the state of Nevada. | was previc
partner at Jolley, Urga, Woodbury, Holthus & Rose (“*JUWHS”), and joined Howard & Ho
Attorneys PLLC (“H&H”) as a member on January 13, 2020, attorneys of record for Defe
Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC (“Wellness”) in this matter. | am and at all times hav
the responsible attorney at JUWHS and H&H in charge of this case. | make this declar.
support of Wellness’ Motion for Attorneys’ Fees. | have personal knowledge of the matt
forth herein, except as to those matters stated on information and belief, which | believe to
| am competent to testify to the matters set forth herein if called upon to do so.

2. It is JUWHR and H&H'’s policy to track time contemporaneously with the sen
performed for a client by the attorney working on a particular matter describing the st
performed and time spent on a time slip or by entering it directly into JUWHR and H
centralized billing network. The hours arecumulated on a monthly basis. At the end of ¢
month, a work-in-progress (JUWHR) or a proforma (H&H) print out or electronic PDF vers
given to the responsible attorney in each matter, which describes, on a daily basis, tl
performed and the amount of time expended. The responsible attorney reviews the
progress or proforma for any errors and to make any appropriate adjustments to as
reasonableness of the fees charged, applying the appropriate hourly charge, but also ta
consideration the factors described in Nevada Rule of Professional Conduct 1.5. The v
progress or proforma is then returned to the accounting department and administrative
JUWHR and H&H where any necessary changes are made and the finalized bill is ser
client.

3. In connection with this action, | have carefully reviewed the billing statement
amounts billed to Wellness on a monthly basis. In my opinion, the fees charged are co
with the hourly rates then prevailing at JUWHR and H&H and are commensurate with the

charges by other attorneys with similar experience and expertise in southern Nevada.



4, Attached to Wellness’ Motion as Exhibits C and D are true and correct cop
the JUWHR and H&H invoices showing the total amount of fees incurred by Wellness i
lawsuit through September 30, 2020. As indicated in the billing statements, the total am
attorney’s fees incurred was $426,393.20. Wellness will supplement its request for fee
updated billings for October and later months after this Motion has been fully briefed and
proceedings have occurred.

5. Based on my experience as an attorney in Clark County, | am of the opinic
the amount of attorney’s fees incurred and sought is reasonable based on the fa
circumstances of this case, the factual and legal issues presented, the complexity of the «
the results achieved. In fact, although my current hourly rate is $450 for new matters, my
rate for Wellness has been billed at a lower, discounted rate of $400 at H&H. | have on o
made further adjustments and provided additional discounts to Wellness as a courtesy
ensure our billings were reasonable.

6. The attorneys’ fees incurred were actually and necessarily incurred. Wellne
no choice but to defend itself in these consolidated matters and to incur the fees necess:i
so. Wellness is not seeking to recover attorneys’ fees for attending the hearing on Pl
Petition for Judicial Review.

7. My colleague, Kirill V. Mikhaylov, Esq., other attorneys at H&H, and | atten
every noticed 30(b)(6) deposition in this case to confirm that Plaintiffs had no evidenc
Wellness received its license due to any preferential treatment by the Department, no evide
Wellness’ applications were improper or incomplete, and no evidence that Wellness eng
any wrongdoing, collusion, or improper interference during the 2018 Recreational Mar
licensing process.

8. | obtained my bachelor's degree from the University of Nevada, Las Veg:
1997. | obtained my law degree from the University of ldaho in 2000, graduating third
class,magna cum laudel also served on the ldaho Law Review, including as the Editor o

Symposium Edition, and received the Idaho Law Review Editor of the Year award, 1999



In law school, | also received the Faculty Award for Recognition for Outstanding Acade
Achievement.

9. | have been licensed to practice law in Nevada since 2000 and have practic
southern Nevada ever since. | am also admitted in the United States District Court of Nevau
in the Ninth Circuit Court of Appeals. Since graduating in 2000, | practiced exclusively \
JUWHR, an AV-rated law firm with Martindale-Hubbell that emphasizes civil litigation pract
for 20 years. In 2020, | joined H&H, which is also an AV-rated law firm with Martindale-Hubk
that specializes in representing businesses. | hold an AV rating with Martindale-Hubbell. Si
have been practicing law, my experience has been almost exclusively in civil litigation.

10. In March 2008, | accepted an invitation to serve as faculty for the Deposi
Program of the National Institute for Trial Advocacy (NITA), and have served as faculty since
date. In that capacity, | have worked closely with judges and other experienced attorneys
across the nation in teaching and training lawyers in deposition and litigafisn skave been
peer nominated at various times by fellow attorneys in Las Vegas, resulting in me being reco(
by Super-LawyersMountain States, and by Nevada Business Magaaiiegal Elite. Finally, |
also volunteer as a “CAP” attorney (Children’s Attorney Project) with Southern Nevada'’s L
Aid Clinic where | represent and give a voice to neglected or abused childrgamabhano basis.

11. | declare under penalties of perjury under the laws of the state of Nevada the
foregoing is true and correct.

DATED this 13"day of October, 2020.

/s/ L. Christopher Rose, Esq.
L. CHRISTOPHER ROSE, ESQ.

4832-6848-5070, v. 1
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DECLARATION OF KIRILL V. MIKHAYLOV, ESQ. IN SUPPORT OF W ELLNESS
CONNECTION OF NEVADA, LLC'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES

1. | am an attorney licensed to practice law in the state of Nevada. | joined Hi
& Howard Attorneys PLLC (“H&H") on February 3, 2020, attorneys of record for Defen
Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC (“Wellness”) in this matter. | make this declarati
support of Wellness’ Motion for Attorneys’ Fees. | have personal knowledge of the matt
forth herein, except as to those matters stated on information and belief, which | believe to
| am competent to testify to the matters set forth herein if called upon to do so.

2. Based on my experience as an attorney in Clark County, | am of the opinic
the amount of attorney’s fees incurred and sought is reasonable based on the fa
circumstances of this case, the factual and legal issues presented, the complexity of the «
the results achieved. My current hourly rate is $310.

3. The attorneys’ fees incurred were actually and necessarily incurred. Wellne
no choice but to defend itself in these consolidated matters and to incur the fees necess:i
so. Wellness is not seeking to recover attorneys’ fees for attending the hearing on Pl
Petition of Judicial Review.

4. L. Christopher Rose, Esq., other attorneys at H&H, and | attended every n
30(b)(6) deposition in this case to confirm that Plaintiffs had no evidence that Wellness re
its license due to any preferential treatment by the Department, no evidence that Wi
applications were improper or incomplete, and no evidence that Wellness engaged
wrongdoing, collusion, or improper interference during the 2018 Recreational Marijuana lici
process.

5. | obtained my bachelor’'s degree in Finance from the University of Nevada
Vegas (“UNLV”), in 2009. | received several scholarships to attend UNLV and was on the [
Honor Roll in 2008 and 2009. | obtained my law degree from the St. Thomas University ¢
of Law in 2013. | received a merit scholarship and was on the Dean’s List during law scl

2012. | was also a member of the St. Thomas moot court team and became a semi-finall



Duberstein Bankruptcy Moot Court Competition, the largest moot court competition i
country.

6. | have been licensed to practice law in Nevada since 2014 and have pract
southern Nevada ever since. | am also admitted in the United States District Court of Nev:
a young associate, | successfully argued multiple dispositive motions, attended set
conferences and mediations, and conducted over 100 depositions during my first three
Hall Prangle & Schoonveld, LLC, a law firm that specializes in defending hospitals a
professional malpractice. Thereafter, | practiced at Pisanelli Bice, PLLC, for two
concentrating my practice in high stakes commercial litigation. In 2020, | joined H&H, wh
an AV-rated law firm with Martindale-Hubbell that specializes in representing businesses.
| have been practicing law, my experience has been almost exclusively in civil litigation.

7. | have been peer nominated various times by fellow attorneys in Las V
resulting in me being recognized by Super-Lawyers, Mountain States’ Rising Stars, and by
Business Magazinas Legal Elite.

8. | declare under penalties of perjury under the laws of the state of Nevada tl
foregoing is true and correct.

DATED this 13"day of October, 2020.

/s/ Kirill V. Mikhaylov, Esq.
KIRILL V. MIKHAYLOV, ESQ.
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330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145

TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500

FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com

Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077 Invoice Number 1403t

Invoice Date 4/3/201

Robert Lalli

Total Fees This Invoice $1,050.01
Total Expenses This Invoice 0.0C
Total Discount This Invoice 0.0c
Subtotal-This Invoice 1,050.0¢

Beginning Trust Balance
Total Trust Balance Applied to This Invoice

Ending Trust Balance

Unapplied Cash Applied to This Invoice 190.1:
Total Payments Applied Since Last Statement 0.0
Total Past Due Amount 0.0C
Total Now Due $859.8!
APPO



330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380
LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145
TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500
FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com
Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077

Invoice Number 1403I

Invoice Date 4/3/201

Robert Lalli

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
RE: D.H. Flamingo, Inc. dba The Apothecary Shoppe
Client Matter Number: 12098-26001

For Services Rendered through 03/31/2019

Professional Fees Hours  Rate Amount
01/09/201' LCR  Email clients regardin| ]l : Review complaint/petition by 0.6C 375.0( 225.0(
DH Flamingo, et. al
01/14/201' LCR  Further review of petition for judicial review/writ of mandamus; 1.6C 375.0( 600.0(
Email clients; Review email from Attorney Melissa Waite
03/07/201' LCR  Review court docket and status; Review Complaint 0.2C 375.0( 75.0(
03/27/201' LCR  Review court docket and status of case; Review DH Flamingo 0.4C 375.0( 150.0(
Application to extend time for service of complaint, and order
granding petition
Sub-total Fee $1,050.0
Fee Summary
L. Christopher Rose, Esq. 2.8C hours at $375.00/hr 1,050.0t
Total hours 2.8C
Total Current Billing $1,050.0!
Total Now Due: $1,050.0!
Due Date: 05/03/2019
Please make checks payable to Jolley Urga Woodbury Holthus & Rose.
Remember to include our invoice number on your check.
We accept Visa, Mastercard, Discover and American Express.
Credit card payments can be made via our website at www.juwlaw.com
For assistance please call our Accounting Department at 702-699-7500.
APPO



330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380
LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145
TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500
FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com
Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077

Robert Lalli

Total Fees This Invoice
Total Expenses This Invoice
Total Discount This Invoice

Subtotal-This Invoice

Beginning Trust Balance
Total Trust Balance Applied to This Invoice

Ending Trust Balance

Unapplied Cash Applied to This Invoice

Total Payments Applied Since Last Statement

Invoice Number 1445
Invoice Date 6/10/201

$637.5(
6.0C
0.0c
643.5(



Robert Lalli

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
RE: D.H. Flamingo, Inc. dba The Apothecary Shoppe

Client Matter Number; 12098-26001

For Services Rendered through 05/31/2019

Professional Fees
05/07/201' LCR
05/10/201' LCR
05/17/201' LCR

330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145

TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500

FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com
Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077

Telephone conference with Matt McClure regardiiiili]
Review court docket and status of filings

Telephone conference with Matt McClure; Review court docke

Review court minutes from temporary restraining order heariny
Review application for temporary restraining order, Opposition
Review various various other pleadings

05/28/201! LCR

L. Christopher Rose, Esq.
Total hours

Expenses
05/28/2019 Parking at Court

Accounts Receivable Summary
Date
04/03/201!

Inv #
14030

Attend hearing of motion for injunction

Invoice Number 1445.
Invoice Date 6/10/201

Hours
0.2C
0.3C
0.7C

0.5C

Sub-total Fee

Total Fees
Fee Summary
1.7¢
1.7¢
Units
1.0C
Sub-total Expense
Billed Paid Balance Dut
1,050.0( 0.0C 1,050.0¢

Rate Amount
375.0( 75.0(
375.0( 112.5(
375.0( 262.5(
375.0( 187.5(

$637.5(
$637.5(
637.5(
Price Amount
6.0C 6.0C
$6.0(
APPO



Invoice Number 1445.
Invoice Date 6/10/201

Page 2 of
14265 05/08/201! 600.0( 0.0C 600.0(
Total Past Due $1,650.01
Total Current Billing $643.5(
|
I
Due Date: 07/10/2019
Please make checks payable to Jolley Urga Woodbury Holthus & Rose.
Remember to include our invoice number on your check.
We accept Visa, Mastercard, Discover and American Express.
Credit card payments can be made via our website at www.juwlaw.com
For assistance please call our Accounting Department at 702-699-7500.
APPO1377
WCNOO010



330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145

TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500

FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com

Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077 Invoice Number 1487:

Invoice Date 9/5/201

Robert Lalli

Total Fees This Invoice $487.5(
Total Expenses This Invoice 6.0C
Total Discount This Invoice 0.0c
Subtotal-This Invoice 493.5(

Beginning Trust Balance
Total Trust Balance Applied to This Invoice

Ending Trust Balance

Unapplied Cash Applied to This Invoice

Total Payments Applied Since Last Statement (2,518.50

Total Past Due Amount 0.0C

Total Now Due $493.5(
APPO



330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145

TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500

FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com

Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077 Invoice Number 1487:

Invoice Date 9/5/201

Robert Lalli

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
RE: D.H. Flamingo, Inc. dba The Apothecary Shoppe
Client Matter Number: 12098-26001

For Services Rendered through 08/31/2019

Professional Fees Hours Rate Amouni

08/23/201' LCR  Review court docket; Review injunction order, findings of fact, 1.3C 375.0( 487.5(
conclusions of law; Call to Rob Lally; Telephone conference w
Matt McClure; Email Rob Lally, Chris Nevan, Tom McKennie,
Matt McClure

Sub-total Fee $487.5(
Total Fees $487.5(
Fee Summary
L. Christopher Rose, Esq. 1.3C 487.5(
Total hours  1.3C
Expenses Units  Price Amoun
Electronic Print 24.0( 0.2t 6.0C
Sub-total Expense $6.0(
Payments
08/06/2019 Payment Payment received thank you 2,518.5!

Sub-total Payment.  $2,518.5!



Invoice Number 1487.
Invoice Date 9/5/201
Page 2 of .

Total Current Billing $493.5(

Due Date: 10/05/2019
Please make checks payable to Jolley Urga Woodbury Holthus & Rose.
Remember to include our invoice number on your check.
We accept Visa, Mastercard, Discover and American Express.
Credit card payments can be made via our website at www.juwlaw.com
For assistance please call our Accounting Department at 702-699-7500.



330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380
LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145
TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500
FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com

Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077 Invoice Number 1503

Invoice Date 10/3/201

Robert Lalli

Total Fees This Invoice $825.5(
Total Expenses This Invoice 0.0C
Total Discount This Invoice 0.0c
Subtotal-This Invoice 825.5(

Beginning Trust Balance
Total Trust Balance Applied to This Invoice

Ending Trust Balance

Unapplied Cash Applied to This Invoice

Total Payments Applied Since Last Statement (493.50

Total Past Due Amount 0.0C

Total Now Due $825.5(
APPO



330 S. RAMPART BLVD.

SUITE 380

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145
TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500
FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com

Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077

Robert Lalli

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
RE: D.H. Flamingo, Inc. dba The Apothecary Shoppe
Client Matter Number: 12098-26001

For Services Rendered through 09/30/2019

Professional Fees

Invoice Number 1503:

Invoice Date 10/3/201

Hours

09/06/201' MRE  Confer with attorney Kelly Stout regarding service of complain 0.3C

09/07/201' LCR  Conference with Mr. Urga regardi ||| | | Q M A 0.2(
09/07/201' WRU Review of 55 page lawsuit filed by Dennis Kennedy 0.8C
09/10/201' LCR  Conference with Mr. Urga; Conference with Matt McClure 0.3C

09/11/201 LCR  Review emails from opposing counsel; Review and sign accef 0.3C

of service; Conference with Mr. Urga

Fee Summary

Michael R. Ernst, Esq. 0.3C
L. Christopher Rose, Esq. 0.8(
William R. Urga, Esq. 0.8(

Total hours  1.9C
Payments

09/25/2019 Payment Payment Received-Thank You

Sub-total Fee

Total Fee:

Sub-total Payment:

Rate Amount
285.0( 85.5(
375.0( 75.0(
550.0( 440.0(
375.0( 112.5(
375.0( 112.5(

$825.5(

$825.5(
85.5(
300.0(
440.0(
493.5(
$493.5(

APPO



Invoice Number 1503:
Invoice Date 10/3/201

Page 2 of .

Total Current Billing $825.5(
.
I
I

Due Date: 11/02/2019
Please make checks payable to Jolley Urga Woodbury Holthus & Rose.
Remember to include our invoice number on your check.
We accept Visa, Mastercard, Discover and American Express.
Credit card payments can be made via our website at www.juwlaw.com
For assistance please call our Accounting Department at 702-699-7500. APPO



330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380
LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145
TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500
FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com

Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077 Invoice Number 1522

Invoice Date 11/7/201

Robert Lalli

Total Fees This Invoice $1,575.01
Total Expenses This Invoice 0.0C
Total Discount This Invoice 0.0c
Subtotal-This Invoice 1,575.01

Beginning Trust Balance
Total Trust Balance Applied to This Invoice

Ending Trust Balance

Unapplied Cash Applied to This Invoice

Total Payments Applied Since Last Statement (825.50

Total Past Due Amount 0.0C

Total Now Due $1,575.01
APPO



330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145

TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500

FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com
Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077

Robert Lalli

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
RE: D.H. Flamingo, Inc. dba The Apothecary Shoppe
Client Matter Number: 12098-26001

For Services Rendered through 10/31/2019

Professional Fees

10/11/201 LCR

10/22/201' LCR
10/24/201' LCR
10/28/201' LCR

10/29/201' LCR

10/30/201' LCR

10/31/201' LCR

Telephone conference with Attorney Eric Hone; Review
email/article from Mr. Hone; Telephone conference with Matt
McClure

Review DH Flamingo Opposition to motion to consolidate
Conference with Mr. Urga

Brief review of Essence Cannabis Opposition to motion to
consolidate; Conference with Mr. Urga

Review email regarding notice of consolidation; Review court
docket from consolidated cases; Review emails from various
opposing counsel and Judge Gonzalez judicial executive assis
Review various filings from the parties

Review Nevada Wellness Center's supplement to motion to ar
findings and conclusions; Review DH Flamingo peremptory
challenge of Judge Gonzalez; Review Nevada Supreme Court
regarding peremptory challenges

Review recent court filings; Telephone conference with Matt
McClure regardinﬁ

Invoice Number 1522
Invoice Date 11/7/201

Hours
0.7C

0.7
0.2C
0.2C

0.8C

1.2C

0.4C

Sub-total Fee

Total Fee:

Fee Summary

L. Christopher Rose, Esq. 4.2

Total hours 4.2(

Rate Amount

375.0( 262.5(

375.0( 262.5(

375.0( 75.0(C

375.0( 75.0(C

375.0( 300.0(

375.0( 450.0(

375.0( 150.0(
$1,575.01
$1,575.01

1,575.0(
APP01385
WCNOO018



Invoice Number 1522!
Invoice Date 11/7/201

Page 2 of
Payments
10/28/2019 Payment Payment received thank you 825.5(
Sub-total Payment: $825.5(
Total Current Billing $1,575.0
|
I
|
Due Date: 12/07/2019
Please make checks payable to Jolley Urga Woodbury Holthus & Rose.
Remember to include our invoice number on your check.
We accept Visa, Mastercard, Discover and American Express.
Credit card payments can be made via our website at www.juwlaw.com
For assistance please call our Accounting Department at 702-699-7500.
APP01386
WCNO019



330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380
LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145
TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500
FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com
Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077

Robert Lalli

Total Fees This Invoice
Total Expenses This Invoice
Total Discount This Invoice

Subtotal-This Invoice

Beginning Trust Balance
Total Trust Balance Applied to This Invoice

Ending Trust Balance

Unapplied Cash Applied to This Invoice

Invoice Number 1536:
Invoice Date 12/5/201

$6,637.5
13.7¢
0.0C
6,651.2!



330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145

TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500

FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com
Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077

Robert Lalli

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
RE: D.H. Flamingo, Inc. dba The Apothecary Shoppe
Client Matter Number: 12098-26001

For Services Rendered through 11/30/2019

Professional Fees

11/01/201 LCR  Review court docket and hearing calendar; Review notice of
department reassignment; Email Matt McClure

11/04/201 LCR  Travel to court for hearings; Review court docket for consolida
cases; Review pleadings

11/05/201 LCR  Review DH Flamingo First Amended Complaint

11/06/201 LCR  Review court docket and filings; Review hearing calendar;
Telephone conference with Attorney Nathaniel Rulis regarding
status, pending motions, discovery

11/08/201 LCR  Further reivew of DH Flamingo first amended complaint; Revie
Integral Associates' joinder to motion to strike peremptory
challenge; Review stipulated order resetting hearing date of v
motions

11/12/201 LCR  Further review of DH Flamingo first amended complaint; Atten
hearing of motion to strike DH Flamingo peremptory challenge
Begin preparation of answer to first amended complaint; Revie
GreenMart Motion to Dismiss complaint; Review Essence part
joinder to motion to dismiss; Prepare motion and joinder to mc
to dismiss

11/14/201 LCR  Begin review of Governor Finance Office Audit Report
11/15/201 LCR  Review email from Judge's law clerk regarding hearings and
conference call; Review email from opposing counsel; Telephc

conference with Judge Gonzalez and opposing counsel regarc
scheduling; Review various filings; Review court docket

11/18/201 LCR  Attend court hearing of various motions with Judge Gonzalez

Invoice Number 1536
Invoice Date 12/5/201

Hours
0.4C

1.6C

0.7
0.9C

1.0C

5.5C

0.3C
0.8C

2.7C

Rate
375.0(

375.0(

375.0(
375.0(

375.0(

375.0(

375.0(
375.0(

375.0(

Amoun
150.0(

600.0(

262.5(
337.5(

375.0(

2,062.5(

112.5(
300.0(

1,012.5(



Invoice Number 1536.
Invoice Date 12/5/201

Page 2 of
11/19/201 LCR  Review joint stipulation of parties to reschedule hearing of vari ~ 0.2C 375.0( 75.0C
motions; Review amended deposition notice of Rino Tenorio
11/20/201 LCR  Review court docket, filings from DH Flamingo case, Serenity 1.0C 375.0( 375.0(
ETW case
11/21/201 LCR  Review court calendar and docket for Judge Gonzalez and Jui 0.2C 375.0( 75.0(
Denton
11/22/201 LCR  Review email and documents from Judge Gonzalez Judicial 1.8C 375.0( 675.0(
Executive Assistant; Review Clear River motion to dismiss
complaint; Review ETW parties' answer to first amended com
11/25/201 LCR  Review various pleadings and filings; Review Judge Gonzalez 0.4C 375.0( 150.0(
business court order
11/26/201 LCR  Review letter from opposing counsel to court; Review emails fi ~ 0.2C 375.0( 75.0C
law clerk to Judge Gonzalez, opposing counsel
Sub-total Fee $6,637.5!
Total Fee $6,637.5
Fee Summary
L. Christopher Rose, Esq. 17.7C 6,637.5!
Total hours 17.7C
Expenses Units  Price Amount
11/13/2019 E-Filing / Clark County 1.0 3.5C 3.5C
Electronic Print 41.0C 0.2t 10.2¢
Sub-total Expense $13.7¢
Accounts Receivable Summary
Inv # Date Billed Paid Balance Dut
15229 11/07/201 1,575.0( 0.0C 1,575.01
Total Past Due $1,575.01
Total Current Billing $6,651.2!
|
|
Due Date: 01/04/2020
Please make checks payable to Jolley Urga Woodbury Holthus & Rose.
Remember to include our invoice number on your check.
We accept Visa, Mastercard, Discover and American Express.
Credit card payments can be made via our website at www.juwlaw.com
For assistance please call our Accounting Department at 702-699-7500.
APPO



330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145

TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500

FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com

Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077 Invoice Number 1568:

Invoice Date 2/5/202

Robert Lalli

Total Fees This Invoice $12,225.0
Total Expenses This Invoice 1,539.7!
Total Discount This Invoice 0.0c
Subtotal-This Invoice 13,764.7!

Beginning Trust Balance
Total Trust Balance Applied to This Invoice

Ending Trust Balance

Unapplied Cash Applied to This Invoice

Total Payments Applied Since Last Statement (8,226.25

Total Past Due Amount 0.0C

Total Now Due $13,764.7
APPO



Robert Lalli

330 S. RAMPART BLVD.
SUITE 380

LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 89145

TELEPHONE (702) 699-7500

FACSIMILE (702) 699-7555

juwlaw.com

Federal Tax ID: 88-0170077 Invoice Number 1568:

Invoice Date 2/5/202

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
RE: D.H. Flamingo, Inc. dba The Apothecary Shoppe
Client Matter Number: 12098-26001

For Services Rendered through 01/31/2020

Professional Fees
12/02/201' LCR

Hours Rate Amount

Review naotice of hearing of Greenmart motion to dismiss; Review 5.1C 375.0( 1,912.5(
Thrive joinder to motion to dismiss; Review amended notice of
video deposition of Dannette Kluever; Review Organic Remedies
joinder to various motions to dismiss; Review Greenmart's joinder

to various motions to dismiss; Review State of Nevada 10th
supplemental disclosures; Review Wellness Center of Nevada intent
to participate; Review Greenmart first supplemental production
pursuant to NRCP 16.1; Review Green Life Production's motion to
realign as plaintiff; Review Business Court Order; Review Essence
parties' joinder to motion for protective order as to scope of Danette
Kluever deposition; Review DH Flamingo first and second motions
to extend time for service of summons and complaint; Review order
denying MM Development motion to amend findings of fact and
conclusions of law regarding injunction hearing; Review MM
Opposition to motion for protective order regarding Kluever
deposition; Review Serenity Plaintiffs joinder to Opposition to

motion for protective order; Attend hearing of various motions and
Rule 16 conference with Judge Gonzalez; Pr

email to clients; Review Tenorio joinder and supplement to motion
for protective order



12/03/201' LCR

12/04/201' LCR

12/05/201' LCR
12/06/201' LCR

12/09/201' LCR

12/10/201' LCR

12/12/201' LCR
12/15/201' LCR

12/16/201' LCR

12/17/201' LCR

12/18/201' LCR

12/20/201' LCR

12/23/201' LCR

12/24/201' LCR

Review Helping Hand's joinder to various motions to dismiss;
Review Solace Enterprise answer to DH Flamingo first amend
complaint; Review Thrive 7th supplemental list of withesses at
documents; Review Defendant Nevada Wellness Center answ
First Amended Complaint; Review MM parties' notice of intent
serve subpoena duces tecum on Women's Cancer Center of I
Review Nevada Organic Remedies amended application for w
mandamus

Review protective order regarding Tenorio deposition; Review
ETW supplemental production of documents regarding Rino
Tenorio production; Review documents produced by Tenorio

Attend deposition of Rino Tenorio, state auditor

Review Nevada Wellness Center notice of appeal and case aj
statement

Review various demands for prior discovery; Review amendec
deposition notice for Kluever

Review Lone Mountain motion to dismiss Serenity Plaintiffs'
complaint; Prepare joinder to motion and motion to dismiss for
Wellness; Review DH Flamingo interrogatories to Wellness

Review miscellaneous filings

Review various answers of defendants to DH Flamingo amenc
complaint; Review Euphoria Parties' responses to discovery
requests; Review Nevada Organic Remedies responses to dis
requests; Review DH Flamingo Opposition to Clear River moti
dismiss; Review DH Flamingo Opposition to Lone Mountain
motion to dismiss; Review DH Flamingo Opposition to Greenh
motion to dismiss

Review State of Nevada Opposition to Nevada Organic Reme
petition for writ of mandamus; Review Nevada Organic Remec
motion for expedited appeal; Review letter from opposing cout
regarding Tenorio deposition; Attend hearings of motion to dis
DH Flamingo complaint; Review DH Flamingo Opposition to L
Mountain motion to dismiss; Review docket and court minutes
Prepare Wellness first disclosure pursuant to NRCP 16.1

Attend status check and hearing of motion for protective order
Judge Gonzalez

Review Circle Farms 16.1 disclosures; Review letter from Atto
Nate Rulis to former counsel for Rino Tenorio regarding docur
by subpoena; Review Serenity requests for admissions to Stal
Nevada

Attend status check hearing with Judge Gonzalez; Review var
filings from opposing parties; Begin review of DH Flamingo
discovery requests to Wellness

Review minute order of Green Leaf motion to realign as plainti
Review minutes of pending motions, trial date; Review deposil
schedule

Review court minutes and trial schedule; Review deposition
schedule; Email Rob Lally and Matt McClure regarch

; Review Suprme Court order exempting Nevada
Wellness appeal from settlement program and setting briefing
schedule

Invoice Number 1568:
Invoice Date 2/5/202

1.4C

1.0C

8.2C
0.3C

0.4C

0.6C

0.2¢
1.9C

3.4C

2.3C

0.8C

1.7¢

0.4C

0.6C

375.0(

375.0(

375.0(
375.0(

375.0(

375.0(

375.0(
375.0(

375.0(

375.0(

375.0(

375.0(

375.0(

375.0(

Page 2 of .

525.0(

375.0(

3,075.0¢
112.5(

150.0(

225.0(

75.0(
712.5(

1,275.01

862.5(

300.0(

637.5(

150.0(

225.0(



Page 3 of .
12/27/201' LCR  Review Rural Remedies motion for pretrial conference; Revie\ 0.5C 375.0( 187.5(
various additional filings
01/02/2021 LCR  Review Bailey Kennedy motion to withdraw as counsel for 0.6C 375.0( 225.0(
NuVeda; Review Nevada Wellness Center docketing statemet
appeal
01/03/202/ LCR  Review 0.3C 375.0( 112.5(
01/04/2021 LCR  Review court docket and hearing calendar 0.3C 375.0( 112.5(
01/06/2021 LCR  Attend status check hearing and trial readiness hearing with Ji 1.5C 375.0( 562.5(
Gonzalez
01/07/2021 LCR  Review deposition notices from Plaintiffs; Review DH Flaming: 0.6C 375.0( 225.0(
request for production of documents and interrogatories to We
01/09/202/ LCR Teleihone conference with Matt McClure regardii 0.5C 375.0( 187.5(
Sub-total Fee $12,225.0
Total Fees $12,225.0
Fee Summary
L. Christopher Rose, Esq. 32.6( 12,225.01
Total hours ~ 32.6(
Expenses Units  Price Amouni
11/12/2019 Parking 1.0C 15.0C 15.0¢
12/06/2019 Parking 1.0C 6.0C 6.0C
12/11/2019 E-Filing / Clark County 1.0C 3.5C 3.5C
12/16/2019 Deposition Fee- Video deposition Rino Tenorio vol 1 1.0C 1,436; 1,436.2!
12/17/2019 Parking 1.0C  9.0C 9.0C
12/20/2019 Parking 1.0C 6.0C 6.0C
Color Electronic Prints 9.0C 0.5C 4.5C
Electronic Print 238.0C 0.2t 59.5(
Sub-total Expense $1,539.7!
Payments
01/14/2020 Payment Payment Received-Thank You 6,651.2!
01/17/2020 Payment Payment received thank you 1,575.0(
Sub-total Payment:m
Total Current Billing $13,764.7
-
|
APPO

Invoice Number 1568:
Invoice Date 2/5/202




Invoice Number 1568:
Invoice Date 2/5/202
Page 4 of .

Total Now Due: $13,764.7

Due Date: 03/06/2020
Please make checks payable to Jolley Urga Woodbury & Holthus.
Remember to include our invoice number on your check.
We accept Visa, Mastercard, Discover and American Express.
Credit card payments can be made via our website at www.juwlaw.com
For assistance please call our Accounting Department at 702-699-7500. APPO
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March 11, 2020

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

3615 Spring Mountain Road
Las Vegas, NV 89102

Billed through 03/31/20

Bill Number 11888060003 -648047

In re DOT (D.H. Flamingo)

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

01/13/20

01/15/20

01/16/20

01/17/20

LCR

LCR

LCR

LCR

Attend meeting before court and discussions with
Attorney Eric Hone

Begin review of responses to discovery requests;
review status of depositions.

Review Second Amended Complaiyt Serenity
Plaintiffs; Further review of discovery responses by
various defendants; Review statutes and regulations
regardin S
I Begin preparation of

: HOOQHVVT DY ZEERINAVERpAN§EW/to
requests for production of documents from DH
Flamingo

Revise responses to DH Flamingo responses to req
for production of documents; TC with Melissa Waite

0.30 hrs

0.50 hrs

3.40 hrs

1.80 hrs

120.00

200.00

1,360.00

720.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -648047

01/18/20

01/20/20

01/21/20

01/22/20

01/23/20
01/24/20

LCR

LCR

LCR

LCR

LCR
LCR

Review Nevad#@®rganic Remedies motion for
protective order; Review Essence entities motion fo
protective order; Review various deposition notices;
Review various notices of intent to serve subpoena
duces tecum; Review notice of entry of order of
injunction and injungon order; Review State of
IHYDGDY{V WKLUG RMXB\EauHP HZ) B
of Nevada responses to requests for production of
GRFXPHOW\NMNHBHQLW\ 3ODLQWLI
/IRQH OPXQ@WBWOQPRWLRQ WR GLV
amended complaint; RewieMM Development
interrogatories and request for production of docum
to Helping Hands;

Review emails from Melissa Waite; Revise responst
to DH Flamingo request for production of document:
and interrogatories to WCN

Revise responses to DH Flamingo discovery reques
Telephone call with Matt McClure

Review Lone Mountain Partners answers to DH
Flamingo requests for admissions; Appear for
depositions at Litigatioservices, Clark Hill; Review
GHUHQLW\ 3SOCH QWEKIOW QRENVLF ¢
of Essence entity defendants; Review court docket i
calendar; Review DH Flamingo motion to dismiss
parties not wishing to participate

Reviev emails and filings

Attend hearing of State motion for protective order
regarding depositions

3.20 hrs

0.80 hrs

1.50 hrs

1.30 hrs

2.00 hrs
1.40 hrs

PAGE?2

1,280.00

320.00

600.00

520.00

800.00
560.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -648047

01/25/20 LCR SHYLHZ RQVHV WR 30ODU&E WXHN
Essence Parties, Integral Parties, Clear Y/&eview
documents produced by Clear Water; Review State
Nevada supplemental production of witnesses,
documents; Review State of Nevada answer to
interrogatories

01/27/20 LCR Attend hearing of Essence motion for protective ord
Reviewn letter regarding Kluever deposition; Review
order regarding Bailey Kennedy withdrawal as coun
for certain plaintiffs

01/28/20 LCR Revise trial memo; Prepare for deposition of Danne
Kluever; Attend all day deposition of Dannetthi&ver

01/29/20 AVM Discussion with C. Rose regardiliilill S
e
i

01/29/20 LCR Conference with Alexandria von Mohr regard Il

I Review various filings of deposition
notices; Begin review of various amended complaints

01/30/20 AVM Attend deposition of R. Potter; discil l l  lllll  with
C. Rose.

01/30/20 LCR Conference with Alex von MahReview deposition
schedule

02/03/20 AVM Review deposition notice for 30(b)(6) deposition
scheduled for February 4.

02/03/20 LCR Conference with Alexandria Von Mohr; Conference
with Kirill Mikhaylov regardingjiili] ; Reviewtrial
management memorandum

02/04/20 AVM Attend 30(b)(6) deposition of the Department of
Taxation.

2.10 hrs

2.80 hrs

8.60 hrs

1.00 hrs

1.30 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.00 hrs

9.30 hrs

PAGE3

840.00

1,120.00

3,440.00

250.00

520.00

350.00

120.00

50.00

400.00

2,325.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -648047

02/04/20 LCR Review various filings; Telephone conference with
Todd Bice

02/04/20 KVM Analyze ETW Managment's Motion to Amend Order
Pursuant to NRCP 60(a).

02/05/20 AVM Organize, edit, and review notes from 30(b)(6)
deposition.

02/06/20 LCR Review various filings and deposition notices

02/07/20 LCR Attend gatus check hearing with Judge Gonzalez,
hearing of motion to amend findings of fact and
conclusions of law; Conference with Todd Bice;
Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Telephone
conference with David Malley; Review ETW notice ¢
compliance with prior disovery deposits; Review
amended findings of fact and conclusions of law
regarding preliminary injunction

02/07/20 KVM Analyze Department of Taxation's Answer to D.H.
Flamingo's First Amended Complaint; Analyze
multiple notices of depositns, Department of
Taxation's First Set of Interrogatories and First Set «
Requests for Production to MM Development and
LivFree, Department of Taxation Sixth Supplemente
Disclosure, multiple orders, Lone Mountain's limited
opposition to Plaintiffs' Mabn to Voluntarily Dismiss,
Amended Finding of Fact and Conclusions of Law,
Proof of Service, Natural Medicine and Strive
Wellness' Complaints in Intervention

02/10/20 LCR Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov regardinji

I . Conference with
Mr. Mikhaylov regardindiil

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.30 hrs
3.00 hrs

2.60 hrs

0.90 hrs

PAGE4

120.00

93.00

150.00

120.00
1,200.00

806.00

360.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -648047

02/11/20

02/11/20

02/12/20

02/12/20
02/13/20
02/14/20

02/14/20

02/14/20

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM
LCR
LCR

KVM

KVM

Finalize Wellness Connection's Answer to D.H.
Flamingo's Complaint.

Analyze GreenMart's Answer to Nevada Wellness
Center's Amended Complaint, Nevada Wellness's
Notice of Vacating Deposition of D. Continie, K.
Jessee, Joinder to Serenity's Plaintiff's Notice of
Deposition of A. Connor, D.H. FlamingoThird
Amended Joinder to Notice of Deposition of Integral
30(b)(6), DH Flamingo Parties' Response to MM
Development Company, Inc.'s and Livfree Wellness
/1& V ORWLRQ DRWU-BEBPHQMNQ A&
Second Amended Complaint, Essence Entities' Mot
to Dismiss or Alternatively Motion for Judgment on t
Pleadings of all Plaintiffs' Operative Complaints.

Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov regardin]i
I
-
Attend deposition of K. Cronkhite.

Review various filings

Review Serenity motion to dismiss; Telephone
conference with Matt McClure;é¥iew various filings;
Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review draft joinde
to motion to dismiss;

Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada's Joinder to
Essence Entities Motion to Dismiss.

Attend heamg on Department of Taxation's Motion t
Stay which was continued to the following week.

0.90 hrs

1.60 hrs

1.20 hrs

1.30 hrs
0.40 hrs
0.90 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.80 hrs

PAGEG6

279.00

496.00

480.00

403.00
160.00
360.00

93.00

248.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -648047

02/10/20

02/10/20

02/10/20

02/11/20

02/11/20

02/11/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

GJT

LCR

KVM

Analyze Clerk's Notice of Nonconforming Documen
Clear River's privilege log for its first supplemental
Responses to ETW's first request for proaturcof
documents, Lone Mountain's Answer to D.H.
Flamingo's First Amended Complaint, Notice of Inte
to Serve Subpoena to Custodian of Records of Veri.
Communications, The Essence Entities' Second
Supplemental Disclosure of Documents and Witnes
Pursant to NRCP 16.1, Essence Henderson, LLC's
Supplemental Response to DH Flamingo's First Set
Request for Production and First Set of Interrogator
Essence Tropicana, LLC's Supplemental Response
DH Flamingo's First Set of Request for Production &
First Set of Interrogatories.

Analyze the docket to determine which Plaintiffs ha\
sued Wellness Connection and D.H. Flamingo's Fir:
Amended Complaint in preparation to drafting
Wellness Connection's Answers to Plaintiffs'
Complaints.

Draft Wellness Connection's Answer to D.H.
Flamingo's First Amended Complaint

Download copies of PDF files containing Evidentian
Hearing transcripts from Day 1 to 20. Combine into
one3,900 page single document and execute Optic
Character Recognition on pages to make document
searchable. Forward document to J. Diaz for furthe
use.

Review Essence Entities' motion to dismiss/motion 1
judgment onhie pleadings; Begin review of Wellness
answer to DH Flamingo first amended complaint

Attend deposition of D. Hernandez.

1.90 hrs

1.70 hrs

2.20 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.80 hrs

9.60 hrs

PAGES

589.00

527.00

682.00

129.00

320.00

2,976.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -648047

02/14/20

02/14/20

02/15/20

02/15/20

02/17/20
02/18/20
02/19/20

02/19/20

02/19/20
02/20/20

02/20/20
02/20/20
02/20/20

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM
LCR
LCR

KVM

KVM
LCR

LCR
KVM
KVM

Analyze over 150 served and filed documents betw
February 12, 2020 and February 14, 2020 including
various pleadings, motions, noticgfsdepositions,
minute order, discovery requests and responses,
document disclosures, and various correspondence

Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada's Answer to
Serenity Plaintiffs' Second Amended Complaint

Review miscellaneous filings; Review email from
Essence counsel regarding documents

Analyze correspondence from A. Ellison and Essen
( QWLWLHVITHKHQ® 6XSSO

Attend depositiorof Essence 30(b)(6) witness.
Review various filings in case

Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov regardinji
I Review various filings

Analyze over 4&erved and filed documents includin
Motions, Oppositions, Joinders, Notices of Depositic
Pleadings, Orders, and correspondences.

Discussion with C. Rose regardil

Review Nevad®rganic Remedies opposition to
Serenity motion to dismiss; Review various filings;
Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov

Review subpoena duces tecum to Wellness Connec
Attend deposition of R. Ellan.

Analyze over 30 served and filed documents includi
Motion to Strike, Opposition to Motion to Dismiss,
Notices of Depositions, Joinders, and pleadings.

4.20 hrs

1.90 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.40 hrs

8.80 hrs
0.20 hrs
0.90 hrs

2.70 hrs

0.40 hrs
0.90 hrs

0.30 hrs
8.10 hrs
1.80 hrs

PAGE7

1,302.00

589.M

160.00

124.00

2,728.00
80.00
360.00

837.00

124.00
360.00

120.00
2,511.00
558.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -648047

02/20/20 KVM Draft Wellness Connection of Nevadd,C's Joinder tc
Nevada Organic Remedies, LLC's Opposition to
Motion to Voluntarily Dismiss and/or Drop Serenity
Wellness Center, LLC as a Plaintiff.

02/20/20 KDB Review of procedural posture in this matter for
purposes of preparing stiptitan and order to extend
the expert deadlines.

02/21/20 LCR Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov regarding
I . Review court filings

02/21/20 KVM Analyze Rural Remedies' Opposition to J. Pupo's
Motion to Dismiss, Notices of Depositions, various
Notices, DH Flamingo's Reply in Support of Motion
Voluntary Dismissal of Certain Defendants, Errata t
Nevada Wellness Center's Opposition to the
Department of Taxation's Motion to Dismiss,

02/21/20 KVM Attend hearing on the Department of Taxation's Mot
to Stay and Serenity Wellness' Motion to Voluntarily
Dismiss itself.

02/21/20 KVM Attend deposition of D. Lemons.

02/21/20 KVM Discussion with C. Rose regardilllll
¢

02/21/20 KVM Attend deposition of C. Banaszak which resulted in
non-appearance.

02/24/20 KVM Analyze the Department of Taxation's Seventh
Supplemental Disclosure including prege log for K.
Cronkhite's cell phone extraction log, and various
notices of depositions.

0.20 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.40 hrs

1.60 hrs

1.20 hrs

2.60 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.60 hrs

PAGES8

62.00

100.00

160.00

496.00

372.00

806.00

124.00

186.00

186.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -648047

02/25/20 JPW

02/25/20

02/25/20

02/26/20

02/26/20

02/26/20

02/26/20

02/26/20

02/27/20

KVM

KVM

LCR

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

Conference with K. Mikhaylov r{ il  EEEEGN——
.
|
I

Discussion with J. Weiland regardi | N
I

Analyze over 30 filed and served documents including
Plaintiffs" Joint Opposition to Essence Entities' Motion
to Dismiss, Qualcan, MM Development, LivFree,
Compassionate Team, D.H. Flamingo's Oppositions to
Essence Entities' Motion to Dismiss, numerous Notices
of Depositions, and Correspondences.

Review various filings in case; Review deposition
notice of Wellness Connection

Conference with Jason Weiland regardii
Review motion to withdraw as counsel of Charles
Vlasic

Analyze 17 served and filed documents consisting of
Notices of Depositions, Joinders, Pleadings, and
various emails regarding 30(b)(6) depositions.

Analyze Qualcan's Second Amended Complaint in
preparation to Qualcan's 30(b)(6) deposition.

Prepare deposition questions for Qualcan's 30(b)(6)
deposition.

Review various deposition notices; Review various
filings; Review letter from Clear River counsel
regarding objection to Rule 30(b)(6) deposition;
Conference with Jason Weiland regarciillllll

1.30 hrs

0.50 hrs

3.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.20 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.90 hrs

PAGE9

448.50

155.00

1,116.00

120.00

120.00

372.00

341.®

248.00

360.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -648047

02/27/20 KVM Analyze 18 served and filed documents consisting ¢
Nevada Wellness' Opposition to J. Pupo's Motion to
Dismiss, Joinders, Clark Natural's Opposition to
Essence Entities' Motiaiw Dismiss, Notices,
Disclosure Statement, pleadings, minute order, and
correspondence from Rusty Graf.

02/28/20 JPW Attend hearing on various items; Draft email to C. Rose
re: I
02/28/20 LCR Review varioudilings, deposition notices; Review

email from Jason Weiland regardiji N ;
Conference with Mr. Weiland

02/28/20 KVM Analyze correspondences from T. Bice and M.
Dzarnoski regarding 30(b)(6) depositions and 18 file
and served dmments consisting of Greenmart's
Motions to Strike Strive Wellness' Complaint in
Intervention, Natural Medicine's Complaint in
Intervention, Stipulation and Order regarding subpo
served on A. Connor, various pleadings, various
notices, and oppositions.

02/29/20 LCR Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov regarding
I, Review various filings;

Review emails between Todd Bice and Adam Bult
regarding depositions

02/29/20 KVM Receipt correspondees from A. Bult and T. Bice
regarding upcoming 30(b)(6) depositions.

02/29/20 KVM Telephone conference with C. Rose regarding
|

03/01/20 KVM Analyze correspondences from T. Bice @&ndult
regarding upcoming depositions.

1.80 hrs

3.20 hrs

1.00 hrs

1.60 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE10

558.00

1,104.00

400.00

496.00

240.00

93.00

124.00

93.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -648047

03/01/20

03/02/20

03/02/20

03/02/20

03/02/20

03/03/20
03/03/20

03/03/20

KVM

AVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

AVM
KVM

KVM

Analyze Serenity Wellness' Second Amended
Complaint and Fidelis 30(b)(6) deposition notice anc
draft deposition questions in preparation to attendin
Fidelis' deposition.

Prepare for Just Quality 30(b)(6) deposition by:
reviewing applicable documents such as notice of
deposition, relevant portions of complaint, and case
docket; discussinjlllllll \ith K. Mikhaylov;

reviewing I/ oM same; reviewing
e
I

Attend Fidelis Holdings LLC's 30(b)(6) depositions ¢
D. Stewart and J. Thompson.

Discussion with C. Rose regardi I
|

Analyze over 20 served and filed documents consis
of notices of subpoenas, oppositions to motion to
dismiss, joinders to notices of deposition, Jorge Pug
objections and Motion to Gash Subpoena,
supplemental disclosures of witnesses and docume
and plaintiffs' responses to interrogatories

Prepare for and attend Just Quality 30(b)(6) deposit

Analyze ETW Management®hird Amended
Complaint and Herbal Choice's 30(b)(6) Deposition
Notice in preparation to attending Herbal Choice's
deposition.

Attend Herbal Choice's 30(b)(6) deposition of N.
Madrigal.

1.80 hrs

6.30 hrs

7.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.80 hrs

6.10 hrs
0.80 hrs

6.80 hrs

PAGE11

558.00

1,575.00

2,356.00

62.00

558.00

1,525.00
248.00

2,108.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -648047

03/03/20

03/03/20

03/03/20

03/04/20

03/04/20

03/04/20

03/04/20

03/04/20

03/05/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

JPW

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

JPW

Multiple discussions with C. Rose regardiiilill

Analyze correspondences from J. Smith and A. Bult
regarding upcoming depositions.

Analyze Substitution of Counsel of Defendant
Kindibles, Serenity Wellness' Reply in Support of its
Motion to Voluntarily Dismiss, Order Extending
Discovery and Motions in Limine for Expert Witnesses,
Plaintiffs’ Responses to Interrogatories, Notice of
Rescheduling Hearing, and Minute Order on D.H.
Flamingo's Motion to Redact.

Conference with C. Rose NG

I Prepare for deposition of
30(b)(6) witness for Medifarm

Analyze Complaint and 30(b)(6) deposition notice in
preparation to attending Gravitas' 30(b)(6) depositions.

Attend Gravitas Nevada, Ltd.'s 30(b)(6) depositions of
B. Fieldman and J. Thompson.

Discussiorwith C. Rose regardiniilllllllll
I

Analyze K. Jesse and Quantum Mark, LLC's Objections

to Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Deposition
Subpoena, Rural Remedies First Supplemental
Disclosure of Documents, Substitution of Counsel for
Inyo, and Nevada Wellness' multiple deposition
notices.

Deposition of Michael Nahass30(b)(6) witness for
Medifarm

1.40 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.40 hrs

8.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.40 hrs

7.90 hrs

PAGE12

434.00

31.00

186.00

241.50

124.00

2,666.00

62.00

124.00

2,725.50



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -648047

03/05/20

03/05/20

03/05/20

03/05/D
03/05/20

03/05/20

03/05/20

03/06/20

03/06/20

03/06/20

03/06/20

03/06/20

JPW

KVM

KVM

KVM
KVM

KVM

KVM

JPW

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Deposition of Jeremy Thompser30(b)(6) witness for
Medifarm

Analyze Complaint and Serenity Wellness' 30(b)(6)
deposition notice in preparation to attending said
deposition.

Attend Serenity Wellness' 30(b)(6) deposition of B.
Sillito.

Discussion with C. Rose regardil
Discussion with K. Bright regardl_

Discussion with J. Young regardl_

Analyze proposed Trial Protocol, correspondence
regarding Trial Protocol, Rural Remedies Second
Supplemental Disclosure, and Joinders to Depositio
Notices.

Conference with K. Mikhaylov and K. Bright re:

Analyze Complaint and 30(b)(6) deposition notice ir
preparation to attending deposition of Rombough R
Estate, Inc.'s@b)(6) deposition.

Discussions with K. Bright and J. Weiland regarding

Attend Rombough Real Es¢a Inc.'s 30(b)(6)
deposition of C. Rombough.

Discussion with C. Rose regardl_

1.80 hrs

0.30 hrs

3.60 hrs

0.40 hrs
0.40 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.60 hrs

5.90 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE13

621.00

93.00

1,116.00

124.00
124.00

155.00

217.00

103.50

93.00

186.00

1,829.00

93.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -648047

03/06/20 KVM Draft offer of judgment to D.H. Flamingo.

03/06/20 KVM Analyze Objection and Motion for Protective Order
Regarding Subpoenas Duces Tecum to Verizon anc
Cox, MM Development and Livfree's Motion to
Compel Greenmart of Nevada NLV, LLC to Produce
Flores and S. Rutledge for Deposition, Greenmart's
Answers toStrive Wellness and Natural Medicine's
Complaints in Intervention, and multiple joinder to
notices of depositions.

03/07/20 KVM Analyze ETW Management Plaintiffs' Third
Supplemental Disclosure of Withesses and Docume
Pursuant to NRCPaL1.

03/07/20 KVM Telephone conference with M. McClure and C. Rose
regardindi

03/08/20 KVM Analyze Complaints and deposition notices for Nevz
Holistic, THC Nevada, Natural Medicine, Clark Natu
Medicinal, and F. Williams in preparation to attendir
and arranging coverage for said depositions.

03/08/20 KVM Telephone conference with C. Rose regarding

03/08/20 KVM Telephone conference with J. Young regarding

03/08/20 KVM Analyze 13 correspondences from parties counsel
regarding upcoming depositions.

03/09/20 WAG Meeting with Kirill Mikhaylov discussin (il N

0.60 hrs
1.20 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.90 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE14

186.00
372.00

217.00

279.00

465.00

9300

31.00

186.00

53.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -648047

PAGE15

03/09/20 WAG Review Zion Garden LLC's 30(b)(6) Deposition Noti 2.00 hrs 530.00
Plaintiff's Third Amended Complaint, previsly issued
Findings of Facts and Conclusions of Law, and forrr
deposition questions in preparation for the Depositic
of Zion Garden LLC's 30(b)(6) designee
03/10/20 WAG Attendance at deposition for Plaintiff Zion Garden 5.70 hrs 1,510.50
LLC's 30(b)(6) deginee.
03/10/20 WAG Draft interoffice e-mail to Christopher Rose and Kirill 0.10 hrs 26.50
Mikhaylov, I
|
Total Fees For This Matter $ 69,507.00
EXPENSES:
Courier Fee Legal Copy Cats & Printing Pick up signature page. 25.00
Courier Fee Legal Copy Cats & Printing Pick up Stipulation and Order. 40.00
Courier Fee Legal Copy Cats & Printing Rush Delivery of Stipulation and Order 1 37.00
Extend Exp DisclosuretArea B.
Courier Fee Legal Copy Cats & Printing Deliver Joinder to Opposition to Motion 25.00
Dismiss
Parking Rose/Court Parking for DOT's Motion for Protecti ve Order 6.00
Parking Rose/ Lewis St Garage for DH Flamingo hearing re Esddation for 12.00
Protective Order.
Parking Rose/ Lewis St Garage for hearing re Green Thera peutics Motion to 6.00
Withdraw as Counsel
Parking- Kirill Mikhaylov Parking for hearing on DOT Motion for Stay of Order. 6.00
Miscellaneous Litigation Services & Technologies of Nevada DVD Cepy 225.00
Videpgraphy for Robert Potter (Video)
APP01410
WCNO0042



April 10, 2020

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

3615 Spring Mountain Road
Las Vegas, NV 89102

Billed through 03/31/20

Bill Number 11888060003 -651189

In re DOT (D.H. Flamingo)

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

03/02/20

03/03/20

03/04/20
03/04/20

03/04/20

LCR

LCR

JY
LCR

LCR

Review draft outline for deposition questions;
Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review various
filings; Additional conference with Kirill Mikhaylov;
Telephone conference with Rob Lally and Matt
McClure; Reriew Rule 30(b)(6) deposition notice for
Wellness Connection

Review various filings; Various conferences with Kir
Mikhaylov; Review documents produced during
depositions; Conference with Alexandria Von Mohr

Office conference regardi il

Review various filings in case; Review letter from
ETW counsel regarding license applications; Begin
review of draft trial protocol; Conference with Jason
Schwarz

Conference with Jason Weiland regarding depositio
Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review proposed
trial protocol; Review deposition outlines; Review
pleadings, documents; Prepare for deposition of Ne
Wellness Center

1.30 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.20 hrs
1.00 hrs

2.50 hrs

520.00

440.00

98.00
400.00

1,000.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/05/20

03/06/20

03/06/20

03/06/20

03/07/20

03/08/20

LCR

LCR

KDB

KDB

LCR

JY

Attend deposition of Deonn Contine; Attend beginni
of deposition of Nevada Wellness Center, Frank
Hawkins

Review pleadings for Serenity motion to dismiss;
Attend court hearing with Judge Gonzategarding
motion, trial protocol, depositions; Attend continued
deposition of Frank Hawkins, Rule 30(b)(6)
representative of Nevada Wellness; Conference wit
Kirill Mikhaylov

Preparing for attending the NRCP 30(b)(6) déjpms
of Plaintiff GBS Nevada Partners, specifically
reviewing second amended complaint, deposition n
with respective topics, and amended findings of fact
and conclusions of law for granting of preliminary
injunction.

Attending the deposition of the person most
knowledgeable/NRCP 30(b)(6) witness for Plaintiff
GBS Nevada Partners, LLC.

Review filings, various emails from opposing counst
Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov;
Telephoneconference with Matt McClure

Office conference regarding covering deposition.
Receive and review complaint. Receive and review
findings of fact and conclusions of law. Receive ant
review Notice of deposition and areas ofuiiry.

8.40 hrs

7.20 hrs

1.60 hrs

8.60 hrs

1.20 hrs

1.20 hrs

PAGE?2

3,360.00

2,880.00

400.00

2,150.00

480.00

588.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -651189

03/08/20 LCR Message Kirill Mikhaylov; Telephone conference wit
Kirill Mikhaylov; Review and revise stipulation
regarding dismissal of Serenity; Review various emi
from opposing counsel, defense counsel; Review dr
offer of judgment; Review NRCP 16.1 regarding initi
disclosure obligations and NRCP 68 regarding offer
judgment

03/09/20 JY Receive and review correspondence regarding
deposition.

03/09/20 LCR Attend deposition of Natural Median LLC; Various
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review filings;
Prepare letter to Judge Gonzalez; Review revised tr
protocol

03/09/20 KVM Analyze NuVeda's Complaint and 30(b)(6) depositic
notice in preparation to attending NuVedz(gb)(6)
deposition.

03/09/20 KVM Attend NuVeda's 30(b)(6) deposition of P. Bady.

03/09/20 KVM Attend deposition of Natural Medicine's 30(b)(6)
witness.

03/09/20 KVM Discussion with C. Rose regardilllll N
|

03/09/20 KVM Revise Trial Protocol.

03/09/20 KVM Draft correspondence to judge and all counsel regal
Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's proposed
changes to the Trial Protocol.

03/09/20 KVM Discussion with W. Gonzalez regard | | 3 IR
- !

prepare questions for Zion deposition.

1.80 hrs

0.10 hrs

5.20 hrs

0.40 hrs

3.50 hrs

2.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.60 hrs

PAGE3

720.00

49.00

2,080.00

124.00

1,085.00

744.00

93.00

31.00

31.00

186.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/09/20 KVM Discussion with C. Rose regardiliill 0.50 hrs
|
I

03/09/20 KVM Emails from T. Bice regarding S. Sibley, R. Miller 0.20 hrs

regarding Natural Medicine 30(b)(6) witness, N. Rulis
regarding Trial Protocol, and J. Smith regarding
upcoming depositions.

03/09/20 KVM Analyze ETW Management's Fifth Supplemental 0.90 hrs
Disclosure, Amended Notice of Nuveda's 30(b)(6),
Greenmart's Third Supplemental Disclosure, Nevada
: HOOQHVV {TVHRQUIQG\HN BRREERVLWLRQ
of Yemenidjian Trust, Amended Notice of Deposition
of F. Williams, Notice of Hearing on Defendants'
Objections and Motion for Protective Order Regarding
Subpoenas to Verizon and Cox.

03/09/20 KDB Preparation for attending the NRCP 30(b)(6) deposition 1.10 hrs
of Plaintiff THC Nevada, specifically reviewing Notice
of Deposition and topics thereto, lines of questioning,
and THC Nevada's Third Amended Complaint;
Consultation with K. Milkaylov regardinil EEEEE

I review of THC
Nevada's Fourth Supplemental NRCP 16.1 Disclosures.

03/09/20 KDB Attending the deposition of the person most 5.80 hrs
knowledgeable and NRCP 30(b)(6) witness for THC
Nevada.

03/10/20 LCR Attend deposition of Rural Remedies Rule 30(b)(6) 7.20 hrs

witness; Review various letters from opposing counsel
regarding discovery; Conference with various
attorneys; Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov

03/10/20 KVM Analyze Nevada Pure's Complaint and deposition 0.40 hrs
notice of Nevada Pure's 30(b)(6) witness.

PAGEA4

155.00

62.00

279.00

275.00

1,450.00

2,880.00

124.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -651189

03/10/20 KVM Attend deposition of Nevada Pure 30(b)(6) witness |
Thomas.

03/10/20 KVM Attend continued deposition of NuVeda's 30(b)(6)
witness P. Bady.

03/10/20 KVM Emails to M. McClure regardiriiii
I,

03/10/20 KVM Analyze Notices of Deposition of R. Frey and K.
Cronkhite, Lone Mountain Partners's Second
Supplemental Disclosure, correspondences regardil
Lone Mountain's and Gra®lart's Supplemental
Disclosure.

03/11/20 LCR Review various filings and depo notices; Exchange
various emails with opposing counsel regarding
depositions; Review letters from opposing counsel
regarding supplemental productions; Email oppgs
counsel regarding Wellness Connection deposition;
Conference with Karson Bright

03/11/20 KVM Emails from parties' counsel regarding upcoming
depositions.

03/11/20 KVM Analyze over 20 served and filed documents includi
GreenMart's Opposition to MM Development's Motic
to Compel Production of L. Flores and S. Rutledge,
Essence Entities' Motion for Protective Order and tc
Quash Subpoenas to S. Turner, A. Abernathy, and |
Brousseau, Nevada Wellness' Motion to Compel Cls
River to Produce J. Kocer and N. Arbelaez for
Deposition, High Sierra's and Rural Remedies'
Responses to Nevada Organic's Requests for
Production, TGIG First Supplemental Disclosure,
various correspondences, notices of depositions,
joinders to motions andepositions, and order

8.10 hrs

2.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.10 hrs

PAGES

2,511.00

682.00

31.00

93.00

440.00

31.00

341.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/11/20

03/11/20

03/12/20

03/12/20

03/12/20

03/12/20

03/12/20

03/12/20

KDB

KDB

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KDB

Preparation for NRCP 30(b)(6) deposition of Persor
Most Knowledgeable for Paradise Wellness.
Specifically reviewing deposition topics, complaint, ¢

Attending the deposian of the person most
knowledgeable for Paradise Wellness; Waited at
Litigation Services, no representative from Paradise
ever showed up; consulted with Paradise's counsel;
counsel T. Bice took notice of nappearance.

Review various filings regarding depositions; Reviev
various emails from opposing counsel regarding
depositions, motions in limine; Review Wellness drg
supplemental production; Emails with Kirill
Mikhaylov; Review Serenity Plaintiffs’ motion to
modify preiminary injunction

Receipt Notices to Vacate Depositions of F. William
Tryke 30(b)(6), W. Anderson, A. Abernathy,
Yemenidjian Living Trust, N. Glastian, and L.
Brousseau.

Analyze MM Development ifree's Reply in Support
of Motion to Compel Greenmart to Produce L. Flore
and S. Rutledge for Deposition.

Analyze Clear River's Opposition to Plaintiff Nevade
Wellness Center's Motion to Compel.

Analyze GreenMart of Nevada NLV LLC's Oppositic
to Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Motion to Compe
GreenMart to Produce K. Lee and H. Lee for
Deposition.

Preparation for attending the NRCP 30(b)(6) deposi
of TGIG, LLC. Spefically reviewing Essence
Complaint, Deposition topics, etc.

0.80 hrs

1.20 hrs

1.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.60 hrs

PAGEG6

200.00

300.00

480.00

31.00

62.00

93.00

62.00

150.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/12/20

03/13/20

03/13/20

03/13/20

03/14/20

03/14/20

03/16/20

03/16/20

KDB

LCR

KVM

KVM

LCR

KDB

LCR

KVM

Attending the deposition of the NRCP 30(b)(6) perst
most knowledgeable deposition for TGIG, LLC.

Attend court hearing with Judge @Gxalez regarding
various motions to compel, trial protocol, status of
discovery and case; Review documents for Wellnes
second disclosure of documents and witnesses; Re’
Wellness second disclosure; Review various emails
between opposing counsel; Reviearious filings,
motions, deposition notices Conference with Karsor
Bright;

Analyze documents from M. McClure and draft
Wellness Connection' Second Disclosure Pursuant-
NRCP 16.1.

Analyze numeous emails from defense counsel
regarding trial protocol and motion for summary
judgment deadlines and emails from parties' counse
regarding Qualcan's 30(b)(6) deposition.

Review various motions for summary judgment by
NevadaWellness Center; Review Deep Roots motio
for summary judgment; Review Essence reply in
support of motion to dismiss; Review Qualcan petitit
for judicial review regarding ranking

Detailed legal review of Qualcan's Complaartd
notice of deposition topics; Prepare list of questions
attend Qualcan's deposition.

Review various filings; Telephone conference with &
defense counsel; Review revised stipulation for
dismissal; Review various note®f hearings of
motions

Analyze Plaintiff's Motion to Modify Preliminary
Injunction.

9.40 hrs

4.20 hrs

1.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.60 hrs

1.00 hrs

0.60 hrs

PAGE7

2,350.00

1,680.00

403.00

93.00

560.00

150.00

400.00

186.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/16/20

03/16/20

03/16/20

03/16/20

03/16/20

03/16/20

03/16/20
03/16/20

03/16/20

03/16/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM
KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze Qualcan's Second and Third Supplements
Initial List of Witnesses and Production of Documen
Pursuat to NRCP 16.1 including emails with the
Department of Taxation, emails with J. Pupo,
correspondences from the Department, plans of
correction, and letters of intent.

Telephone conference with €@efendants counsel
regardingupcoming depositions and case status.

Analyze Plaintiff's Third Amended 30(b)(6) Notice of
Deposition of Thrive, Joinder to Notice of Videotape
Deposition of G. Archos, Notice of Vacating

Deposition of Custodian of Records fQuantum Mark
and Third Amended Notice of Deposition of K. Jessi

Analyze Nevada Organic Remedies' Motion for Part
Summary Judgment Based on Division of Internal
Audit's Final Report on Impartial and Objective
Licensing Pocess Pursuant to NRS 453D.210(6).

Analyze Rural Remedies' Motion for Partial Summa
Judgment.

Analyze Greenmart of Nevada NLV LLC's Motion fo
Summary Judgment.

Analyze Qualcan's Petition for Writ of Mandamus.

Analyze Qualcan's Motion for Summary Judgment ¢
WKH "2 PBWURSY DXHF R 0X O WHLB\OH
Single Applicant in the Same Jurisdiction.

Analyze Reply in Support of Essence Entities Motio
Dismiss or Alternatively, Motion for Judgment on the
Pleadings of all of Plaintiffs' Operative Complaints.

Analyze Nevada Wellness's Motion for Summary
Judgment on Third, Foth, and Fifth Claims for Reliel

1.20 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.60 hrs
0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.50 hrs

PAGES8

372.00

155.00

31.00

217.00

62.00

155.00

186.00
93.00

93.00

155.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -651189

03/16/20 KVM Analyze ETW Management Group LLC's Motion for
Partial Summary Judgment.

03/16/20 KVM Analyze Defendant J. Pupo's Reply in Support of
Motion to Dismiss Nevada Wellness Centé&ighth
Claim and Reply in Support of Motion to Dismiss Rt
Remedies' Third Claim.

03/16/20 KVM Analyze amended and filed Trial Protocol.

03/17/20 LCR Review summary of summary judgment motions that
were filed, briefs, and prepare task list; Telephone
conference with Judge Gonzalez and all counsel
regarding discovery schedule and trial; Telephone
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov regardinjiil

03/17/20 KVM Analyze Nevada Wellness Gen's Motion for Partial
Summary Judgment on Second Claim for Relief.

03/17/20 KVM Analyze Deep Roots' Motion for Partial Summary
Judgment.

03/17/20 KVM Analyze Nevada Wellness' Motion for Summary
Judgment on First Clainof Relief.

03/17/20 KVM Prepare for telephone conference with Judge Gonz:
03/17/20 KVM Telephone conference with Judge Gonzalez.

03/17/20 KVM Telephone conference with C. Rose regar (il
I

03/17/20 KVM Draft Wellness Connections' Joinder to Reply in
6XSSRUW RI(QMWHWEHVYT ORWLR(

Alternatively, Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings
DOO 30DLQWL&IR/PBSBMUDWLYH

03/17/20 KVM Draft memorandum to file regardi i
-

0.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs
1.70 hrs

0.70 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.30 hrs
0.50 hrs
0.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.20 hrs

PAGEY

186.00

93.00

124.00
680.00

217.00

341.00

124.00

93.00
155.00
186.00

62.00

372.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/17/20

03/17/20
03/17/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

KVM

KVM
KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze Motion to Extend Time for Green
Therapeutics to File Joinder to All Oppositions to
Essence Entities Motion to Dismiss.

Analyze ETW Management's Motion to Compel

Analyze ETW Management's Motion to Compel
Privilege Logs.

Review various emails with court, opposing counsel
Review various filings; Telephor@mnference with

Kirill Mikhaylov; Review Essence motion to dismiss;
Review joint plaintiffs' opposition to motion to dismis

Analyze D.H. Flamingo's Motion for Voluntary
Dismissal with Prejudice of First Amended Complait

Receipt over 30 Joinders to Motions for Summary
Judgment from Plaintiffs and Defendants.

Analyze Nevada Wellness' Motion to Compel
GreenMart to Produce K. Lee and H. Lee for
Deposition on Order Shorterg Time.

Analyze Plaintiff's Opposition to J. Pupo's Motion to
Quash or in the Alternative Motion for Protective Ori
for Subpoena Duces Tecum to the Custodian of
Records of AT&T Wireless.

AnalyzePlaintiff's Opposition to Integral Associates'
Objection and Motion for Protective Order Regardin
Subpoenas Duces Tecum to Verizon Communicatic
and Cox Communications.

Analyze J. Pupo's Reply in Support of Motion to Qui
orin the Alternative Motion for Protective Order
Pursuant to Intent to Serve Subpoena Duces Tecun
the Custodian of Records of AT&T Wireless.

0.20 hrs

0.60 hrs
0.40 hrs

2.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE10

62.00

186.00
124.00

840.00

62.00

62.00

62.00

62.00

31.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20
03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM
KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze GreenMart's Opposition to Nevada Wellnes
Motion to Compel GreenMart to Rioce K. Lee and
Lee for Deposition.

Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada LLC's Joindel
to Deep Roots' Motion for Partial Summary Judgme
GreenMart's Motion for Summary Judgment, and
Nevada Organic's Motion for Summary Jodnt.

Analyze Circle S Farms' NRCP 16.1 First Suppleme
Disclosure

Analyze the Department of Taxation's Responses tc
Rural Remedies First Set of Requests for Admissior
and First Set of Interr@gories.

Analyze Compassionate Team of Las Vegas' Early
Case Conference Witness and Exhibit List.

Analyze Thrive's Ninth Supplemental List of Witnes:
and Documents and privilege log.

Analyze State's Eighth Supplemental Disclosures.

Analyze Herbal Choice's Response to Nevada Orge
First Request for Production of Documents.

Analyze ETW Management's Respons&l&yada
Organic's First Request for Production of Document

$QOH 002)V 5HVSRQMH2ARIDAY
S5SHPHGLHVHTHKWWW YRU 3URGXFW
Documents.

Analyze Nevada Organic Remedies' First @amental
List of Witnesses and Documents.

Analyze Clear River's First Supplemental Disclosure
Pursuant to NRCP 16.1.

0.20 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE11

62.00

186.00

31.00

93.00

31.00

62.00

31.00
62.00

31.00

31.00

31.00

93.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

03/18/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

$QOH *ORE +DUPRQ®Y 5HVSRAVYH!
2UDQLF 5HNHOK )Léhvests For
Production Of Documents.

Analyze Rombough Real Estate Inc. DBA Mother
+HUEF TWBSRQVH 7R WDMLEFEHGL
[1&TV )LHVWHMWYURG XFWLRQ 21

Analyze THC Neva®D // &V 5HVSRQVH 71
2UDQLF SHFNHOEK )LBHYWHS/WV )R
Production Of Documents.

$QOH=LRDUWGHQV //&TV 5HVSRQ
2UDQLF SHFNHO@EK )LBHTYWHS/WV )R
Production Of Documents.

$QOH/LBUHOOQHYWHU //&TV 5H
IHYDBUWDIQ LHEPFHGL //& TV HOXHNREG
Production Of Documents.

$QOH -XVWWAXD/GYV 5HV SRYVIVGE
2UDQLF SHFNHOEK )LBHTYWHS/WV )R
Production Of Documents.

Analyze Nevada Wellness' First Supplement to Earl
Case Conference List of Witnesses and Document
Disclosures Pursuant to NRCP 16.1.

Analyze the Essence Entities' Fourth Sepgental
Disclosure of Documents and Witnesses Pursuant t
NRCP 16.1.

Analyze Qualcan LLC's Responses to Nevada Orge
Remedies, LLC's First Request for Production of
Documents.

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE12

62.00

62.00

62.00

62.00

31.00

31.00

62.00

62.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/19/20 LCR Review Essence repin support of motion to dismiss;
Review DH Flamingo motion to dismiss; Review anc
revise opposition to motion to dismiss; Attend
extensive telephonic hearing with Judge Gonzalez

03/19/20 KVM Telephone conference with C. Rose regarding

03/19/20 KVM Draft Limited NorrOpposition to D.H. Flamingo's
Motion to Voluntary Dismiss.

03/19/20 KVM Attend Telephonic Hearing on the Essence Entities'
Motion to Dismiss, J. Pupo's Motions to Dismiss,
Motion to Quash, or in the Alternative, Motion for
Protective Order, for Subpoena Duces Tecum to the
Custodian of Records of AT&T Wireless, Defendant
Objection and Motion for Protective Order Regardin
Subpoenas D@s Tecum to Verizon Communication:
and Cox Communications, and DH Flamingo, Inc's
Motion For Voluntary Dismissal

03/19/20 KVM Analyze NuVeda's Initial Disclosure of Documents &
Witnesses Pursuant to NRCP 16.1.

03/19/20 KVM Analyze Department of Taxation's Privilege Log to it
Eighth Supplemental Disclosures.

03/20/20 LCR Review various court filings, deposition notices,
joinders

03/20/20 KVM Receipt 11 Joinders to Motions for Summary Judgr

03/20/20 KVM Receipts Notice to Vacate Depositions of R. Seigne
J. Aguero, L. Holifield, and G. Smith.

3.50 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.90 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs
0.10 hrs

PAGE13

1,400.00

31.00

62.00

589.00

62.00

93.00

120.00

31.00
31.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/23/20

03/23/20

03/24/20

03/24/20

03/24/20

03/25/20

03/25/20

LCR

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

Review depo notices, Thrive supplemental disclosui
Strive motion to dismiss, Greenmart opposition t
Qualcan petition for judicial review, various letters a
emails from opposing counsel

Receipt ETW Plaintiffs’ Joinder to Amended Notice
Videotaped Deposition of R. Frey.

Review Letters from gposing counsel regarding
discovery; Review minute order vacating pretrial
conference; Review Greenmart response to Qualca
petition for writ of mandamus; Emails with Kirill
Mikhaylov

Analyze ETW Plaintiffs Sixth Supplemenfaisclosure
of Witnesses and Documents Pursuant to NRCP 16
including over 1,000 pages of correspondences anc
documents produced related to the Department of
Taxation, ETW Management, GATA Il LLC and
GATA Il LLC, Herbal Choice, Libra Wellness,
MedMen, Moher Herb, THC Nevada LLC, Global
Harmony, Just Quality, and N. Puliz and D. Brown.

Analyze CPCM Holdings LLC d/b/a Thrive Cannabi
Marketplace's Tenth Supplemental List of Witnesse:
and Documents.

Review filings; Review deposition notices and updal
deposition schedule; Telephone conference with Kir
Mikhaylov

Analyze Strive Wellness of Nevada LLC's Motion to
Voluntarily Dismiss and/or Withdraw Strive Wellnes:
of Nevada's Complaint in Intervention and Dismiss ¢
Party from Matter Entirely.

1.00 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.80 hrs

4.40 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE14

400.00

31.00

320.00

1,364.00

31.00

320.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/25/20 KVM

03/25/20 KVM

03/25/20 KVM

03/25/20 KVM

03/25/20 KVM

03/25/20 KVM

03/25/20 KVM

Analyze Greenmart of Nevada NLV LLC's Respons:
Opposition to Qualcan LLC's Petition for Writ of
Mandamus.

Receipt corespondence from E. Hone regarding Lor
Mountain Partner's Third Supplemental Disclosure.

Analyze D.H. Flamingo, Inc.'s Opposition to MM
Development Company, Inc.'s Motion to Strike and/
Dismiss D.H. Flamingo, Inc.'s Counteah.

Receipt Lone Mountain's and Clear River's Joinders
GreenMart's Response in Opposition to Qualcan's
Petition for Writ of Mandamus, Minute Order Vacatil
PreTrial Conference, Amended Notice of Depositior
of G. Archos, NMvada Wellness' Joinders to Notices
Deposition for L. Flores, S. Rutledge, and R. Frey,
ETW Management's Joinder to Notice of Deposition
G. Archos, Stipulation and Order for Extension to Fi
Opposition to Motion to Compel and Motion to Com
Privilege Log, and Notice of Hearing for Strive
Wellness' Motion to Voluntarily Dismiss.

Analyze Thrive's Supplemental Responses to Plaint
First set of Interrogatories to CPCM Holdings, LLC
d/b/a Thrive Cannabis Marketplace, Mefs
Supplemental Response to Plaintiffs' First Set of
Interrogatories to Commerce Park Medical, LLC, an
Thrive's Supplemental Responses to Plaintiff's First
of Interrogatories to Cheyenne Medical, LLC.

Analyze Plaintiff§ Joint Initial Expert Disclosure
including L. Holifield, R. Seigneur, G. Smith, and J.
Aguero's expert reports.

Analyze Lone Mountain Partner's Third Supplement
Disclosures Pursuant to NRCP 16(a)(1).

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

2.40 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE15

93.00

31.00

124.00

62.00

93.00

744.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 651189

03/25/20

03/26/20
03/26/20

03/26/20

03/26/20

03/26/20

03/26/20

03/26/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

KVM

LCR
KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar{lllllll
|

Review various court filings

Analyze Rural Remedies LLC's Amended Complaint in
Intervention, Petition for Judicial Review or Writ of
Mandamus.

Analyze K. Lee and H. Lee's Response to Nevada
Wellness Center, LLC's Motion to Compel Greenmart
Nevada NLV, LLC to Produce K. Lee and H. Lee for
Deposition on Order Shortening Time.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Opposition to the
Serenity Plaintiffs' Motion to Modify Preliminary
Injunction.

Analyze Clear River, LLC's Second Supplemental
Responses to Plaintiff ET\Management Group, LLC's
First Set of Requests to Produce Documents.

Analyze Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Second
Amended Complaint and Petition for Judicial Review
or Writ of Mandamus.

Analyze Essence Parties' Opposition to Motion to
Modify Preliminary Injunction.

Review various filings, summary judgment motions,
joinder to motions

Analyze Nevada Organic Remedies' Opposition to
Qualcan's Petition for Writ of Mandamus.

Analyze Plaintiff Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's
Opposition to Qualcan, LLC's Petition for Writ of
Mandamus.

0.50 hrs

0.40 hrs
0.50 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE16

155.00

160.00
155.00

31.00

124.00

31.00

248.00

124.00

200.00

124.00

93.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

$QOH &BUBDUPYV //&TV 5HYV BV
[1& TV itad Yor Writ of Mandamus.

Analyze Nevada Wellness Center's Opposition to
Nevada Organic Remedies' Motion for Partial
Summary Judgment Based on Division of Internal
Audit's Final Report on Impartial and Objective
Licensing Proess.

Analyze Thrive's Supplemental Responses to Plaint
First Set of Requests for Production to Cheyenne
Medical, LLC, Commerce Park Medical, LLC, CPCN
Holdings LLC d/b/a Thrive Cannabis Marketplace,
LLC.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Opposition to ET'
Plaintiffs’ Motion for Partial Summary Judgment anc
Countermotion for Partial Summary Judgment.

Analyze Thrive's Opposition to ETW Management's
Motion to Compel.

Analyze Clear River, LLC's Opposition to Qualcan's
Petition for Writ of Mandamus on Order Shortening
Time.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Motion for
Summary Judgment on Plaintiffs’ Federal aratest
Constitutional Claims.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Opposition to
Qualcan, LLC's Petition for Writ of Mandamus.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Motion for
Summary Judgment on Plaintiffs'ahs for Damages.

$QOH HYDGHOOQHHQYW HU  // &YV 2
'"HHS 5RRAMGML DO //&TV ORWAQRQ
Summary Judgment and All Joinders Thereto.

0.20 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.40 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE17

62.00

279.00

124.00

341.00

62.00

31.00

93.00

62.00

93.00

93.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/27/20

03/30/20

03/30/20

03/30/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

$QOMH HYDGHOOQHYWHU /pEmentél
Brief in Support of its Motion for Partial Summary
Judgment on Second Claim for Relief, Specifically
Related to Clear River, LLC.

Analyze Deep Roots Medical LLC's Opposition to
ETW's Motion for Partial Summary Judgnten

$QOH HYDGHOOQHHQWHU // &YV 2
*UHQPDUWDRKIDAHNY &TV ORWLRQ |
Summary Judgment.

Analyze Qualcan's Opposition to Nevada Organic
SHPHGLHV //&TV ORMArfdGary RU 3LC
-XGIPHIMHGo 2Q 'LYQW.RDOR QD
Report on Impartial and Objective Licensing Proces
Pursuant to NRS 453D.210(6).

Analyze Qualcan LLC's Opposition to Deep Roots
OHGR®6 //&TV 0RWLRWQL DROUBMgMEent.

Analyze Qualcan LLC's Opposition to Greenmart of
IHYDG/B //&TfV ORWLRQ IRU BXR

Receipt nine various Joinders to Motions and
Oppositions.

Review letter from Nevada Wellness counsel to Judge
Gonzalez; Review DH Flamingo order of dismissal,
Review memorandum from Kirill Mikhaylov regarding

I Review Essence Entities'

motion for sanctions

Analyze Lone Mountain Partners, LLC's Motion for
Summary Judgment.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Motion for
Summary Judgment on Plaintiffs' Mandamus Claim:

0.30 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.30 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.70 hrs

PAGE18

93.00

186.00

124.00

31.00

93.00

93.00

31.00

520.00

434.00

217.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/30/20

03/30/20

03/30/20

03/30/20

03/30/20

03/30/20

03/30/20

03/30/20

03/30/20

03/30/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze the Essence Entities' Oppositto ETW
Plaintiffs' Motion to Compel and Motion to Compel
Privilege Logs.

Analyze Essence Entities' Motion in Limine to Prech
Plaintiffs from Admitting Evidence Contrary to their
NRCP 30(b)(6) Designee.

Analyze the Essences Entities' Motion for Summary
Judgment Against All Plaintiffs.

Analyze Essence Entities' Motion for Case Terminai
Sanctions.

Receipt various Orders, Notices of Hags,
correspondence to Judge Gonzalez regarding Neva
Wellness Center's proposed order granting its Motic
Compel, eighth joinders to oppositions and motions.
deposition notices for A. Connor, J. Pupo, and Thriv
30(b)(6).

Analyze Nevada Organic Remedies, LLC's Oppositi
to the ETW Plaintiffs' Motion to Compel.

Analyze Rural Remedies' Opposition to Nevada
Organic's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment.

Analyze Nye Mtural Medicinal Solutions, Clark
NMSD, Clark Natural Responses to Nevada Organi
Remedies' First Request for Production of Documer

Analyze Clark Natural, Nye Natural, and Clark
NMSD's First Supplement to Initial Disclosure
Documents and Witnesses.

Analyze MM Development's Reply in Support of
Motion to Strike and/or Dismiss D.H. Flamingo's
Counterclaim.

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE19

93.00

93.00

124.00

93.00

93.00

62.00

62.00

62.00

31.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -651189

03/31/20

03/31/20

03/31/20

03/31/20

03/31/20

03/31/20

03/31/20

03/31/20

03/31/20

03/31/20

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Review Pupo reply in support of motion to dismiss &
points awl authorities regarding property interests;
Review Qualcann supplemental disclosures; Reviev
Nevada Organic Remedies motion for summary
judgment; Review Rural Remedies motion for partia
summary judgment; Review email from Dominic
Gentile to Judge Gonzalez

Analyze Clear River's Opposition to Plaintiff's Motiol
to Compel Supplemental Responses.

Receipt minute order on Nevada Wellness' Motion t
Compel Greenmart to Produce K. Lee and H. Lee.

Analyze Clear River's Opposition to Plaintiff's Motiol
to Compel Privilege Logs and Counter Motion for
Sanctions Pursuant to NRCP 37.

$QOH/R® ORPQ@WBWQHUV [/&TV

Supplemental Objections A8 $QWZYV 7R 30L
First Set Of Interrogatories and Second Supplemen
Objections and Responses to Plaintiffs' First Set of

Requests for Production of Documents.

$QOH/R® ORPQWBWQHUV //&fV
ETWPODLQWLIIV] ORWLRQ 7R &R

Analyze Rural Remedies' Opposition to Lone Mount
Partner's Motion for Summary Judgment.

Email from D. Gentile to D. Kutinac requesting an
extension to file Oppositits to Motions for Summary
Judgment.

Receipt various Joinders to Oppositions, Motions, a
Notice of Deposition.

Draft memorandum to file regardi i
|

1.00 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.60 hrs

PAGE20

400.00

93.00

31.00

124.00

93.00

124.00

93.00

31.00

62.00

496.00
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Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -651189

Total Fees For This Matter $ 53,943.00
EXPENSES:

Parking- Kirill Mikhaylov Parking for hearing on DOT Mation for Stay of Order 6.00
Parking Mikhaylov/ Lewis St Garage Parking for hearing o n matter. 6.00
Paking Weiland/ Lewis St Garage Dp 12.00
Parking Rose/ Lewis St Garage bpourt hearing. 15.00
Parking Rose/ Lewis St Garage Bpourt heaering. 15.00
Online ResearchWestlaw 503.50

Total Expenses For This Matter $ 557.50

BILLING SUMMARY:

TOTAL FEES: $ 53,943.0C
TOTAL EXPENSES $ 557.50
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL: $ 54,500.5C




May 11, 2020

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

3615 Spring Mountain Road
Las Vegas, NV 89102

Billed through 04/30/20

Bill Number 11888060003 -653321

In re DOT (D.H. Flamingo)

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

04/01/20

04/01/20

04/01/20

04/01/20

04/01/20

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Review various filings; Telephone conference with
Judge Gonzalez and opposing counsel; Review
memorandum from Kirill Mikhaylov regarding

I, Tclephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov;

Review Circle S pleadings

Analyze eight correspondences from parties' counst
and the Court regarding the Governor's Emergency
Order and its effect on the case,

Analyze 31 filed and served documents consisting ¢
Qualcan's Reply in Support of its Petition for Writ of
Mandamus, various Joinders to Motions and
Opposition, Amended Notices of Deposition, and
Orders.

Telephone conference with parties' counsel and Juc
Gonzalez regarding ¢hGovernor's Emergency Order
and its effect on the case.

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar{iillllll

2.00 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

800.00

62.00

403.00

93.00

124.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -653321

04/02/20

04/02/20

04/02/20

04/02/20

04/02/20

04/03/20

04/03/20

04/03/20

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

Review joinders towarious motions; Review governor
order regarding affect of virus on legal proceedings;
Review email from Dominic Gentile and Todd Bice;
Review oppositions to motion to dismiss; Telephone
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov

Recept six correspondences from parties' counsel a
the Court regarding the Governor's Amended
Emergency Order and upcoming hearings.

Analyze Thrive and Department of Taxation's Joindt
to Various Briefs and Plaintiff's Noticd @ithdrawal
of Motion to Modify Preliminary Injunction.

Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's Limite
Opposition to Strive Wellness of Nevada, LLC's
Motion to Voluntarily Dismiss and/or Withdraw Strivi
Wellness of Nevads'Complaint in Intervention and
Dismiss as Party from Matter Entirely.

Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's Joinde
Various Briefs.

Telephonic hearing with Judge Gonzalez and all
counsekegarding various motions, trial status,
discovery; Review DH Flamingo motion for summar
judgment; Review Jorge Pupo motion for protective
order; Review various deposition notices; Review o1
regarding Serenity dismissal

Attend telephone hearing on Plaintiff's Motion to
Strike, Qualcan's Petition for Writ of Mandamus, ant
Status Check.

Analyze Greenmart of Nevada NLV, LLC's Oppositi
to ETW Plaintiffs' Motion to Compel Privilege Logs.

1.00 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.40 hrs

1.60 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE?2

400.00

62.00

62.00

248.00

124.00

640.00

186.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -653321

04/03/20

04/03/20

04/03/20

04/03/20

04/03/20

04/03/20

04/03/20

04/06/20

04/07/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

Analyze Greenmart of Nevada NLV, LLC's Oppositi
to ETW Plaintiffs’ Motion to Compel.

Analyze Clear River, LLC's Motion to Reconsider th
Court's Order Granting Plaintiff Nevada Wellness
Center, LLC's Motia to Compel Clear River to
Produce J. Kocer and N. Arbelaez for Deposition.

Analyze Plaintiff Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's
Motion to Compel Clear River, LLC to Produce
Additional Documents.

Analyze Defendant J. Pupo's Objection and Motion 1
Quash Subpoena Duces Tecum Served on AT&T a
Request for Attorneys' Fees on Order Shortening Ti

Analyze D.H. Flamingo, Inc. and Surterra Holdings,
Inc.'s Motion for Summary Jgghent Against MM
Development Company, Inc.

Analyze Greenmart of Nevada NLV, LLC's
Supplemental Responses to ETW Management Gr¢
LLC's First Set of Interrogatories.

Analyze 37 filed and served dauents consisting of
Joinders to Various Briefs, Joinders to Notices of
Depositions, Notices to Vacate Depositions, Orders
and Notices of Hearing.

Review various filings, including deposition notices,
motion to withdraw as caisel for one of plaintiffs;
Telephone conference with Matt McClure

Analyze Motion to Withdraw as Counsel of Record f
Plaintiff Green Therapeutics LLC.

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.10 hrs

PAGE3

93.00

124.00

62.00

124.00

155.00

62.00

248.00

200.00

31.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -653321

04/07/20

04/08/20

04/08/20

04/08/20

04/08/20

04/08/20

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Receipt Notices of Hearing for DH Flaming®tion
for Summary Judgment and Motion to Withdraw for
Green Therapeutics, Second Amended Notice of
Deposition of R Frey and G. Archos and several
Joinders thereto, and correspondence from GreenV
counsel regarding submission of competing orders (
MM's Motion to Compel.

Review email from Dan Kutinac, Judicial Executive
assistant for Judge Gonzalez; Review court docket

Analyze Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Answer to
Defendant Rural Remedies, LISCAmended Complair
in Intervention, Petition for Judicial Review or Writ o
Mandamus and cross reference said Amended
Complaint.

Analyze Greenmart of Nevada NLV LLC's Answer t
Nevada Wellness Center LLC's Second Amended
Conplaint and Petition for Judicial Review or Writ of
Mandamus and cross reference said Second Amen
Complaint.

Analyze Greenmart of Nevada NLV LLC's Answer t
Defendant Rural Remedies, LLC's Amended Compl
in Intervention Petition for Judicial Review or Writ of
Mandamus and cross reference said Amended
Complaint.

Analyze Defendant Deep Roots Medical LLC's Ans\
to Nevada Wellness Center LLC's Second Amendet
Complaint and Petition for JudiciReview or Writ of
Mandamus and cross reference said Second Amen
Complaint.

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.40 hrs

PAGE4

93.00

80.00

155.00

186.00

124.00

124.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -653321

04/08/20 KVM Analyze Defendant Deep Roots Medical LLC's Ansy
to Rural Remedies LLC's Amended Complaint in
Intervention, Petition for Judicial Review or Writ of
Mandamus and cross reference said Amended
Complaint.

04/08/20 KVM Analyze Plaintiff Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's
Second Supplement to Early Case Conference List
Witnesses and Document Disclosures Pursuant to
NRCP 16.1.

04/08/20 KVM Analyze CPCM Holdings, LLC d/b/a Thrive Cannabi
Marketplace's Ninth Supplemental List of Witnesses
and Documents and Privilege Log.

04/08/20 KVM Analyze Withdrawal of J. Pupo's Objection and Moti
to Quash Subpoena Ducesclisn to AT&T and
Request for Attorney's Fees.

04/08/20 KVM Analyze Department of Taxation's Answer to Rural
Remedies, LLC's Amended Complaint in Interventic
Petition for Judicial Review or Writ of Mandamus an
cross reference said Amendedmplaint.

04/08/20 KVM Analyze Notice of Withdrawal of Attorney for Bionev
Innovations of Carson City, LLC.

04/09/20 KVM Analyze Circle S Farms, LLC's Answer to Rural
Remedies, LLC's Amended Complaint in Interventic
Pettion for Judicial Review or Writ of Mandamus an
cross reference said Amended Complaint.

04/09/20 KVM Analyze Circle S Farms LLC's Answer to Nevada
Wellness Center, LLC's Second Amended Complair
and Petition for Judicial Review or Writ dfandamus
and cross reference said Complaint.

0.30 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.50 hrs

PAGES

93.00

155.00

124.00

31.00

93.00

31.00

124.00

155.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -653321

04/09/20 KVM Analyze Clear River, LLC's Opposition to Plaintiff
Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Motion to Compel
Clear River, LLC to Produce Additional Documents
Order Shortening Time.

04/09/20 KVM $QOH HYDGHOOQHHQW HU // &YV 2
&OHDU 5LYHU //&HWRQRWGRIQ W
Order Granting Plaintiff Nevada Wellness Center,
/1&TV ORWLRQ WR &RPSHO &OHH
J. Kocer and N. Arbelaez fordposition on Order
Shortening Time.

04/10/20 LCR Review various filings; Attend telephonic court heari
with Judge Gonzalez and all counsel; Telephone
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov

04/10/20 KVM Attend telephonic heargnon Clear River, LLC's
Motion to Reconsider the Court's Order Granting
Plaintiff Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Motion to
Compel Clear River, LLC to Produce J. Kocer and M
Arbelaez For Deposition on Order Shortening Time
Plaintiff Nevada Wellness Cesrt LLC's Motion to
Compel Clear River, LLC to Produce Additional
Documents on Order Shortening Time.

04/10/20 KVM Analyze Rural Remedies, LLC's Opposition to
Department of Taxation's Motion for Summary
Judgment on Plaintiff's Federal a8thte Constitutiona
Claims.

04/10/20 KVM Analyze Rural Remedies, LLC's Opposition to
Defendant Nevada Department of Taxation's Motior
for Summary Judgment on Plaintiff's Claims for
Damages.

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.40 hrs

PAGEG6

93.00

124.00

360.00

186.00

124.00

124.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -653321

04/10/20 KVM Analyze Defendanl. Pupo's Answer to Nevada
Wellness Center's Second Amended Complaint,
Petition for Judicial Review or Writ of Mandamus an
cross reference said Second Amended Complaint.

04/10/20 KVM Analyze ETW Management Plaintiffs' Reply in Supp
of Motion to Compel and Motion to Compel Privilege
Logs.

04/13/20 LCR Review minute order from NWC motion to compel,
Review various deposition notices for expert
depositions

04/13/20 KVM Analyze Order Shortening Time on Stig Motion to
Voluntarily Dismiss, Minute Order on Nevada
Wellness' Motion to Compel, Lone Mountain's
Amended Notices of Deposition of J. Aguero, R.
Seigneur, N. Holifield, and G. Smith.

04/15/20 LCR Review various joinders to Rural Remegi@gpposition
to State motion for summary judgment; Review mini
order regarding Clear River motion to dismiss; Brief
review of expert disclosures and reports by Serenity
four expert witnesses

04/15/20 KVM Analyze Rural Remedies' Oppositito Department of
Taxation's Motion for Summary Judgment on Plainti
Mandamus.

04/15/20 KVM Analyze Thrive's Supplemental Brief in Support of
Opposition to ETW Management's Motion to Compe

04/15/20 KVM Analyze J. Pupe'Answer to Rural Remedies' Amenc
Complaint in Intervention and cross reference said
Complaint.

04/15/20 KVM Analyze Clear River's Motion to Dismiss for Failing
Comply with NRS 233B.130(2)(d).

0.80 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE7

248.00

217.00

120.00

93.00

200.00

62.00

31.00

155.00

93.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -653321

04/15/20
04/15/20

04/15/20

04/15/20

04/15/20

04/15/20
04/17/20

04/17/20

04/18/20
04/19/20

04/19/20

04/19/20

KVM
KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM
LCR

KVM

LCR
KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze Euplria's Motion to be Dismissed as a Par

Analyze Rural Remedies' Opposition to Greenmart's
Motion for Summary Judgment.

Analyze Rural Remedies' Opposition to Essence
Entities' Motion for Summary digment.

Analyze Thrive's Eleventh Supplemental List of
Witnesses and Documents.

Analyze minute order denying Clear River's request
Order Shortening Time for its Motion to Dismiss.

Receipt 17 various joinders to motions and oppositi

Attend telephonic conference with Judge Gonzalez,
counsel; Review various filings; Review ETW maotiol
to seal; Review ETW opposition to Essence motion
preclude witnesses from introducing other evidence

Attend hearing on Plaintiff's Motion to Compel and
ETW Management's Motion to Compel.

Review various court filings

Analyze Department of Taxation's Opposition to
Nevada Wellness Center's Motion for Summary
Judgment on its Second, Third, Fourth and Fifth Cle
for Relief.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Opposition to Rui
Remedies' Motin for Partial Summary Judgment.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Opposition to
Qualcan, LLC's Motion for Summary Judgment as t
the DOT's Improper Issuance of Multiple Licenses t
Single Applicant in the Same Jurisdiction.

0.20 hrs
0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs
1.00 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.40 hrs
0.80 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.40 hrs

PAGES8

62.00
93.00

62.00

62.00

31.00

62.00
400.00

248.00

160.00
248.00

155.00

124.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -653321

04/19/20

04/20/20
04/20/20
04/20/20

04/20/20

04/20/20

04/20/20

04/20/20

04/20/20

04/20/20

04/20/20

KVM

LCR
KVM
KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze Greenmart's Opposition to Rural Remedies
Motion for Partial Summary Judgment.

Review various filings
Draft Joinder to Clear River's Motion to Dismiss.

Email from Department 11 regarding electronic exhi
protocol.

Analyze Nevada Wellness Center, LLC'S Motion To
Enlarge Time For Service.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Moii to Seal
Exhibit F to its Opposition to Nevada Wellness Cent
LLC's Motion for Summary Judgment on its First
Claim for Relief.

Analyze Nevada Organic Remedies, LLC's Oppositi
to Plaintiff Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Nwts for
Summary Judgment on Its First and Second Claim 1
Relief.

Analyze Nevada Organic Remedies, LLC's Oppositi
to Plaintiff Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Motion ft
summary Judgment on lIts third, Fourth, and Fifth CI
for Relief; and Countermotion for Summary Judgme

Analyze Deep Roots Medical LLC's Opposition to
Nevada Wellness Center LLC's Motion for Summan
Judgment on First Claim for Relief.

Analyze Thrive's Opposition to Plaintiff Nevada
Wellness Center, LLC's Motion for Partial Summary
Judgment on Second Claim for Relief.

Analyze Thrive's Opposition to Plaintiff Nevada
Wellness Center, LLC's Motion for Summary Judgm
on Fist Claim for Relief.

0.70 hrs

0.30 hrs
0.20 hrs
0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.20 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.70 hrs

PAGEY

217.00

120.00
62.00
31.00

62.00

31.00

372.00

217.00

93.00

186.00

217.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 653321

04/20/20

04/20/20

04/21/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze Department of Taxation's Opposition to
Nevada Wellness' Motion for Summary Judgment o
First Claim for Relief.

Analyze Thrive's Opposition to Qualcan, LLC's Moti
for Summary Judgment as to the DOT's Improper
Issuance of Multiple Licenses to a Single Applicant
the Same Jurisdiction.

Review emails from court clerk; Review emails from
defense counsel Review filings; Email status update
client

Analyze Clear River's Opposition to Rural Remedie:
Motion for Partial Summary Judgment

Analyze Clear River, LLC's Opposition to Plaintiff
Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's 1) Motion For Pérti
Summary Judgment on Second Claim for Relief; an
Supplemental Brief in Support of its Motion For Part
Summary Judgment on Second Claim for Relief,
Specifically Related To Clear River, LLC.

Analyze Deep Roots Medical LLEOpposition to
Plaintiff Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Motion for
Summary Judgment on Third, Fourth, and Fifth Clai
for Relief.

Analyze Essence Parties' Omnibus Opposition to al
Plaintiffs' Motions for Summary Judgment.

Analyze the Essence Parties' Objection to Evidence
Offered in Support of Plaintiffs' Motion for Summary
Judgment.

$QOH/R® ORPQ@WBWQHUV [//&TV
7TKH (7: 3ODLQWLII\AffiaDFuvhaRyQ ) |
Judgment.

0.70 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

PAGE10

217.00

124.00

200.00

62.00

93.00

279.00

217.00

31.00

155.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 653321

04/22/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

04/22/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

$QOH DWXUDRLQHGL&YYV ORWLRC
Voluntary Withdrawal Of Complaint In Intervention
And Dismissal.

Analyze Green Life Productions, LLC's Motion to be
Dismissed as Barty and Withdraw Its Motion for
Intent to Participate and Ex Parte Application for Ort
Shortening Time.

Receipt 85 filed and served documents consisting o
Joinders to various briefs, notices of hearings, ordel
notices of entry of orders, and errata.

TGIG Plaintiffs' Opposition to Essence Entities' Moti
in Limine to Preclude Plaintiffs from Admitting
Evidence Contrary to their NRCP 30(b)(6) Designee

AnalyzeTGIG Plaintiffs' Opposition to Lone Mountai
Partners' Motion for Summary Judgment.

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs’ Opposition to Pure Tonic
Concentrates LLC's Motion for Summary Judgment

Analyze TGIG Paintiffs’ Opposition to Essence
Entities' Motion for Summary Judgment against all
Plaintiffs.

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs' Opposition to Essence Pari
Motion for Terminating Sanctions.

Analyze TGIGPlaintiffs' Opposition to Department o
Taxation's Motion for Summary Judgment on Plainti
Claims for Damages.

$QOMH HYDGHOOQHYWHU // &YV 2
WKHSDUWPHBRWLRIQNY ORWLRQ
Judgmenton ® DLQWLIIV] ODQGDPXV

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.70 hrs

PAGE11

62.00

31.00

279.00

93.00

155.00

93.00

434.00

93.00

62.00

217.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -653321

04/22/20 KVM $QOH HYDGHOOQHHQWHU // &YV 2
Essence Entities Motion in Limine to Preclude
SODLQWLIITfV IURP BGEWW X RQW
Their NRCP 30(b)(6) Designee.

04/23/20 LCR Review various filings; Review court docket and
calendar

04/23/20 KVM $QOH HYDGHOOQHHQWHU // &YV 2
'"HSDUWP QW IRRQ@TY ORWLRQ IR
-XGJPHQW RQ 30DLQ® I6M\DIW)HH @
Claims and All Joinders Thereto.

04/23/20 KVM  $QOH BYDGHOOQHQWHU //& TV 2
'"HSDUWP QW IRRFTV ORWLRQ IR
~XGJPHQW RQ DPQBNQWUHY®P RD

04/24/20 LCR Review various emails frompposing counsel; Reviev
filings from various parties; Review Wellness
Connection draft joinder to various oppositions to
motions for summary judgment

04/24/20 KVM Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada LLC's
substantive Joinder to Variougpgbositions.

04/26/20 KVM $QOH HYDGHOOQHHQYW HU // &YV 2
/IRQH ORXQ@WBWQHUYV //&TV ORWL
Judgment and All Joinders Thereto.

04/26/20 KVM $QOH HYDGHOOQHHQYW HU  //& V@
(VVAHQ(QWLWLHVY ORW\L RXG IRY &
Against All Plaintiffs and All Joinders Thereto.

04/26/20 KVM Analyze ETW Management Plaintiffs' Opposition to
Department of Taxation's Motion for Summary
Judgment on Plaintiff's Claims fordhages.

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

PAGE12

62.00

80.00

93.00

155.00

120.00

279.00

186.00

93.00

124.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 653321

04/26/20

04/26/20

04/26/20

04/27/20

04/27/20

04/27/20

04/27/20

04/27/20

04/27/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs' Opposition to Department (
7TDDWLRQYV ORWIDRYQ- XU BBEX@ W
7*,* 3MLQWLIIDRXOWDRQRGDLPVHQG
Motion For Summary Judgment in Favor of the TGI(
Plaintiffs and Against Téa Nevada Department Of
Taxation.

Analyze ETW Management Plaintiffs' Opposition to
Department of Taxation's Motion for Summary
Judgment on Plaintiff's Mandamus Claims.

Analyze ETW Management Plaiffi$' Opposition to
Department of Taxation's Motion for Summary
Judgment on Plaintiff's Federal and State Constituti
Claims

Review various filings; Review chief judge order
suspending certain rules/discovery pending Gd¥d

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs' Opposition To Department
Taxation's Motion for Summary Judgment on Plainti
Federal and Constitutional Claims.

Analyze ETW Management Plaintiffs' Opposition to
the Essence Entities’ Motion in Limine to Preclude
Plaintiffs From Admitting Evidence Contrary to their
NRCP 30(b)(6) Designee.

Analyze Qualcan LLC's Opposition to the Essence

(QWLWLHVY ORWLRQ HRU\BE®PW
Plantiffs.

Analyze Qualcan LLC's Opposition to Lone Mountai
SBDUWQHUV [//&TV ORWLRXGJIJRHQ®

Analyze Qualcan LLC's Opposition to Department o
7TDDWLRQTV ORWDRQ XU PEKPW F
PODLQWLIIVY] ODQGDPXV &ODLP"

0.80 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE13

248.00

217.00

186.00

120.00

93.00

124.00

93.00

186.00

93.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 653321

04/27/20

04/27/20

04/27/20

04/28/20

04/28/20

04/28/20

04/28/20

04/28/20

04/28/20

04/29/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

Analyze Qualcan LLC's Opposition to Department o
7TDDWLRQYV ORWDRQ XBUPGKPW F
SODLQWLLIPYTIRO 'DPDJHYV

Analyze Qualcan LLC's Opposition to Departmeht
7TDDWLRQTV ORWDRQ XU PEXPW F
SODLQWGHVDPDWR &RRBRQYVWLWXW

$QOH AXOFDQV//ZSSRVLWLRQ QW
Motion in Limine to Preclude Plaintiffs from Admittin
Evidence Contrarto their NRCP 30(b)(6) Designee.

Analyze ETW Management Plaintiffs’ Opposition to
Deep Roots Medical LLC's Motion for Partial
Summary Judgment.

$QOH 6WUHDOQHVB@ID&A&HW 2PQL
Oppostion To All Motions For Summary Judgment
Against Plaintiffs.

Analyze ETW Management Plaintiffs and Nevada
Wellness Center's Joint Opposition to the Essence
Entities' Motion for Case Terminating Sanctions.

Analyze Rural Remedies, LLC's Opposition to Clear
River's Motion to Dismiss.

Analyze Rural Remedies, LLC's Reply in Support of
Motion for Partial Summary Judgment.

Analyze ETW Managemds Opposition to the Essen
Entities' Motion for Summary Judgment.

Review various filings; Review order from Nevada
Supreme Court regarding dismissal of appeal; Revit
district court docket and calendar; Review letter fror
Lone Mountain counsel regard expert costs; Review
court minutes order on Strive motion to dismiss

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.70 hrs

PAGE14

93.00

124.00

62.00

248.00

62.00

279.00

62.00

62.00

248.00

280.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 653321

04/29/20

04/29/20

04/29/20

04/29/20

04/29/20

04/29/20

04/29/20

04/29/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze ETW Management Plaintiffs' Opposition to
Lone Mountain Partners, LLC's Motion for Summary
Judgment.

Analyze ETW Management Plaintiffs' Statement of
Facts in Support of Oppositions to Motions for
Summary Judgment.

Analyze ETW Plaintiffs' Opposition to Greenmart of
Nevada NLV LLC's Motion to Summary Judgment a
Joincer to Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's and Qual
LLC's Oppositions to Greenmart of Nevada NLV LL!
Motion to Summary Judgment.

Analyze MM Development Company, Inc.'s Opposit
to D.H. Flamingo, Inc. and Surterra Holdings,.lec
Motion for Summary Judgment Against MM.

$QOH 30D LIQWILGHDA:O QHHYW HU  // &
ORWLRQ WR bW MHE IDD-\BRXIIR
Answer to Second Amended Complaint.

Analyze Plaintiff NHY D GHDO:O QHHQYW HU [/ &
Motion to Strike Certain Defenses in Department of
7TDPWLRQTV $HFRIHUIWRBGHG &

$QOH HYDGHOOQHHQYW HU  //& TV 2
'"HIHQQWQWQH U Y HDW L5R.Q H& O thd’& 9
to Dismiss.

Analyze ETW Management's Status Report.

Total Fees For This Matter

EXPENSES:

0.80 hrs

1.00 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.40 hrs

PAGE15

248.00

310.00

124.00

186.00

93.00

93.00

62.00

124.00

19,687.00



PAGE16

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -653321

Courier Fee Legal Copy Cats & Printing Pick up Disc from Area C 52.00
Online ResearchWestlaw 407.55
Total Expenses For This Matter $ 459.55

BILLING SUMMARY:

TOTAL FEES: $ 19,687.0C
TOTAL EXPENSES $ 459.55
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL: $ 20,146.5¢




Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -648047

Total Expenses For This Matter

BILLING SUMMARY:
TOTAL FEES:

TOTAL EXPENSES

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL:

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE:

PAGE16

382.00

69,507.0C
382.00
69,889.0C

B B B B

69,889.00




June 12, 2020
Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
3615 Spring Mountain Road
Las Vegas, NV 89102
Billed through 05/31/20

Bill Number 11888060003 -656749

In re DOT (D.H. Flamingo)

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

05/02/20 LCR Review various filings 0.10 hrs 40.00

05/04/20 LCR Review various filings; Review depositionhsdlule; 0.60 hrs 240.00
Review ETW status report; Review Letter from
opposing counsel

05/04/20 KVM Analyze Department of Taxation's Answer to Nevad 0.80 hrs 248.00
Wellness Center, LLC's Second Amended Complair
and Petition for Judicial Review or Writ of Mandamu
and coss reference said Complaint.

05/04/20 KVM Analyze Department of Taxation's Answer to ETW 0.50 hrs 155.00
Management Group, LLC Parties' Third Amended
Complaint and cross reference said Complaint.

05/04/20 KVM Analyze Department of Taxanh's Answer to Qualcan' 0.40 hrs 124.00
Second Amended Complaint and cross reference si
Complaint.
05/04/20 KVM Analyze Clear River's Answer to ETW Plaintiffs’ Thil 0.40 hrs 124.00
Amended Complaint and cross reference said
Complaint.
APPO



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/04/20

05/04/20

05/04/20

05/04/20

05/04/20

05/04/20

05/04/20

05/04/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze Clear River's Answer to MM Development

and LivFree Wellness Second Amended Complaint
Petition for Judicial Review or Writ of Mandamus an
cross reference said Complaint.

Analyze Clear River's Answer to TGIG Plainsff
Second Amended Complaint and cross reference si
Complaint.

Analyze CPCM Holdings, LLC d/b/a Thrive Cannabi
Marketplace's Twelfth Supplemental List of Witness
and Documents.

Analyze MM Develpment and LivFree Plaintiffs' Fift
Supplemental Disclosures of Documents and Witne
Pursuant to NRCP 16.1.

Analyze the Essence Entities' Fifth Supplemental
Disclosure of Documents and Witnesses Pursuant t
NRCP 16.1.

Receipt of 60 filed and served documents consisting
36 various Joinders to Oppositions and Motions,
Notices of Depositions, Joinders to Notices of
Depositions, Notices of Hearing, Orders, Minute
Orders, Nevada Supreme Court OrteShow Cause,
correspondences from parties' counsel, Responses
Requests for Production of Documents, and privileg
logs.

$QOH AXOFDQRSSRVLWILWRGQGLWR W& (
Motion to Dismiss for Failing to Comply with NRS
233B.130(2)(d).

Analyze Department of Taxation's Motion for
Judgment on the Pleadings on all Petitions for Judic
Review.

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE?2

93.00

93.00

62.00

62.00

31.00

372.00

62.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/04/20

05/04/20

05/04/20

05/04/20
05/04/20

05/04/20

05/04/20

05/04/20

05/04/20

05/04/20

05/05/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM
KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs’ Third Supplemental
Disclosure of Witnesses and Doents.

Analyze Clear River, LLC's Second Supplemental
Disclosures Pursuant to NRCP 16.1.

Analyze Nevada Medical Group, LLC's Motion to be
dismissed as a Party and Withdraw Its Notice of Inte
to Participate and Ex Parte Application for Order
Shortening Time.

Analyze ETW Plaintiffs' Supplemental Status Repor

Analyze Nevada organic Remedies, LLC's Reply in
Support of Motion for Partial SummaJudgment
Based on Division of Internal Audit's Final Report.

Analyze Lone Mountain Partners, LLC's Fourth
Supplemental Disclosures of Witnesses and Docurr
Pursuant to NRCP 16.1.

Analyze Deparnent of Taxation's Reply Supporting i
Motion for Summary Judgment on Plaintiffs' Federa
and State Constitutional Claims.

Analyze Clear River, LLC's Reply to Nevada Wellne
Qualcan, and Rural Remedies' Oppositions to Mdtic
Dismiss for Failing to Comply with NRS
233B.130(2)(d).

Analyze Clear River's LLC Third Supplemental
Disclosures Pursuant to NRCP 16.1.

Analyze GreenMart of Nevada NLV LLC's Omnibus
Reply in Supprt of Summary Judgment.

Review filings; Review court minute order; Review
letter from Conant law firm regarding discovery

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE3

31.00

93.00

31.00

62.00
62.00

31.00

93.00

93.00

31.00

217.00

120.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze MM Development Company, Inc.'s and
Livfree Wellness, LLC's Repliy Support of Motion
for Summary Judgment or for Writ of Mandamus an
Opposition to Countermotions.

Analyze Reply in Support of ETW Plaintiffs Motion f
Partial Summary Judgment on Plaintiffs' Mandamus
Claims and Oppositiorotthe Department's
Countermotion for Partial Summary Judgment.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Reply in Support
Motion for Summary Judgment on Plaintiffs’
Mandamus Claims.

Analyze Lone Mounta@ BUWQHUV [/&TV
Reply In Support Of Its Motion For Summary.

$QOH HSO\ WIRU WWBH QDMWRIRDOV 2
to Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Motion for
Summary Judgment on First Claim for Relief.

$QOH BSO\ WR 2SSRVLWLRQV W
ORWLRQ IRU\6XBRPHQW DV WR
Improper Issuance of Multiple Licenses to a Single
Applicant in the Same Jurisdiction.

$QOH HSO\ WR 7KULY 0bPUMBSRY
IHYDGDOO QHHYWHTVY ORWLRQ IR
Judgment on First Claim for Relief.

$QOH/R® ORPQWBWQHUYV [/&TV
6WULNH (7: 30DW § WH. JDPW®R6 88X S S
Of Oppositions To Motionsdf Summary Judgment,
Filed Under Seal.

$QOH BHSO\ WB SHRRH/MG\L DO //& TV
2SSRVLWLRQ WA OGHDAGHEYY ORV
for Summary Judgment on First Claim for Relief.

0.90 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE4

279.00

217.00

248.00

279.00

93.00

62.00

93.00

31.00

93.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

05/05/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze Departmerif Taxation's Reply Supporting it
Motion for Summary Judgment on Plaintiffs’ Claims
Damages.

Analyze Deep Roots Medical LLC's Reply in Suppoil
of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment.

Analyze NHYDGHOOQHYWHU //&MV 5
IHYDBUWDIQ LHPFHOL //&TV 2SSRVL)
Motion for Summary Judgment on Plaintiffs’ Third,
Fourth, and Fifth Claim for Relief and Countermotiol
for Summary Judgment.

Analyze Nevada WelQ HVWQ&8VHU //&YV 5
(VVAHQBUWLHVY 2EMHMN2IBHE W R
6 XSSRUW RI 3ODLQWLIDNY ORWL

$QO\H 30D LIQWILGHDA:O QHHYW HU  // &
5HSO\ WR & OHONW RLSYSRVLWLRQ
Partal Summary Judgment on Second Claim for Re

$QOH HYDGHOOQHHYWHU //&fV 5
'"HSDUWP HDQW IRRQTYVY 2SSRVLWLF
c HOOQHHQYWHLU  //&TV ORWIURQV |
Judgment on its Second, Third, Fourth, &ifth
Claims for Relief.

$QOH HYDGHOOQHHYWHU //&fV 5
IHYDBUDIQ LIHEPFHOL //&TV 2SSRVL)
Plaintiffs' Motion for Summary Judgment on its First
and Second Claim for Relief.

$QOH HYDGHOOQHQYWHU //&TV 5
(VVAHQBUWLHVY 2PQLEXV 2SSRV
Motions for Summary Judgment.

0.30 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.50 hrs

PAGES

93.00

248.00

31.00

31.00

93.00

217.00

62.00

155.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/05/20

05/06/20
05/06/20

05/06/20

05/06/20

05/06/20

05/06/20

05/06/20

05/06/20

KVM

LCR
KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

$QOMH HYDGHOOQHHYW HU //&fV 5
'HHS 5RRA/MGVLFODO //&YV 2SSRVLW
IHYDGDO O HHYWH&NTY ORWLRQ IR
Judgment on Third, Fourth, and Fifth Claims for Rel

Review various deposition notices, filings, joinders

Draft Wellness Connections of Nexad_LC's Joinder
to the Department of Taxation's Motion for Judgmer
on the Pleadings.

$QOH HYDGHOOQHHQYW HU //& YV 5
7TKULYHYV 2SSRVLWLRQDW R X0®RM
on its Second Claim for Relief.

Analyze Essence Entities' Reply in Support of Motic
in Limine to Preclude Plaintiffs from Admitting
Evidence Contrary to their NRCP 30(b)(6) Designee

Analyze Reply in Support of the Essence Parties'
Motion for Summary Judgment against all Plaintiffs.

Analyze The Essence Parties' Objections to The TC
Plaintiffs’ CounteiMotion for Summary Judgment in
favor of the TGIG Plaintiffs and against the Nevada
Department of Taxation witRespect to all Claims
brought by the TGIG Plaintiffs in this Action.

Analyze the Essence Parties Reply in support of Mc
for Case Terminating Sanctions.

Analyze Defendants Augua Street, LL@d&Kindibles,
LLC's Motion to be Dismissed as Parties, and
Kindibles, LLC's Motion to Withdraw Notice of Intent
to Participate.

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGEG6

93.00

120.00
62.00

93.00

93.00

124.00

31.00

217.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/06/20 KVM

05/07/20 LCR

05/08/20 LCR

Receipt and analyze 15 filed and served documents
consisting of Joinder to Briefs, Notices of Dejtioss,
Notices of Hearings, Order, Minute Order, and
correspondence from counsel.

Review ETW supplemental disclosures; Review
Gravitas answers to DOT interrogatories; Review
Serenity reply in support of motion to dismiss; Revi
Nevada Organic Remedies motion for partial summ.
judgment based on State audit report; Review Neva
Wellness Center, Rural Remedies, and Qualcan's
opposition to motions; Review NOR reply in support
motion for partial summary judgment; Review DOT
motion for partial SJ regarding mandamus claim;
Review Nevada Wellness and Rural Remedies
opposition to DOT motion for partial summary
judgment; Review various statutes in NRS 453D;
Review DOT reply in support of motion for partial
summary judgment

Review client documents, emails regarding applicat
process, correspondence with DOT; Attend extensi\
telephone conference with Judge Gonzalez and cot
for the parties; Review list of rankings, award of
licenses

0.20 hrs

5.40 hrs

4.90 hrs

PAGE7

62.00

2,160.00

1,96000



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/08/20

05/08/20

05/12/20

05/12/20

05/12/20

05/12/20

05/12/20

05/12/20

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Attend telephonic hearing Essence Entities’ Motion-
Case Terminating Sanctions, Essence Entities Motis
in Limine to Preclude Plaintiffs from Admitting
Evidence Contrary to their NRCP 30(b)(6) Designee
Nevada Organic Remedies' Motitor Partial
Summary Judgment Based on Division of Internal
Audit's Final Report, Department of Taxation's Motic
for Summary Judgment on Plaintiffs' Mandamus
Claims, Department of Taxation's Motion for Summi
Judgment on Plaintiffs' Claims for Damages] an
Department of Taxation's Motion for Summary
Judgment on Plaintiffs' Federal and State Constituti
Claims.

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar{iiilil

Review notice of hearindgemails with clients; Review
court minutes regarding in camera review; Review
DOT filing of supplemental authority

Analyze Thrive's and the Essence Entities' Notice o
Submission of Materials for In Camera Review.

Analyze letter to Judge Elizabeth Gonzalez regardir
Thrive's response to Minute Order issued on May 1,
2020.

Analyze correspondence from J. Schwarz regarding
experts depositions.

Analyze Plaintiffs' Statement of Undisputed Facts ai
Exhibits.

Analyze GreenMart of Nevada NLV LLC's Fifth
Supplement to Initial List of Witnesses and Docume
Pursuant to NRCP 16.1(a)(1).

4.30 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGES8

1,333.00

186.00

320.00

31.00

31.00

31.00

496.00

93.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/12/20

05/12/20

05/12/20

05/12/20

05/12/20

05/12/20

05/12/20

05/12/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Receip Third Amended Notices of Deposition of G.
Archos and R. Frey, Joinders to said depositions,
correspondence from GreenMart's counsel regardin
GreenMart's Fifth Supplemental Disclosure, and Or
Granting Strive Wellness' Motion to Voluntary
Dismiss.

Analyze Rural Remedies, LLC's Opposition to DOT'
Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Reply in Support
its Countermotion for Partial Summary Judgment
Against the EW Plaintiffs.

Analyze Defendant Pupo's Opposition to Plaintiff
Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Motion to Strike
Certain Defenses in Jorge Pupo's Answer to Secon
Amended Complaint and Rural Remedies, LLC's
Joinder.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Opposition to
Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Motion to Strike
Certain Defenses in Department of Taxation's Answ
to Second Amended Complaint.

Receipt correspondence from J. Sctevagarding
splitting experts deposition costs.

Analyze minute orders regarding Motion to Withdray
as Counsel for Green Therapeutics, LLC, and In
Camera Review and Court's Exhibit 2.

Analyze Deparnhent of Taxation's Notice of
Supplemental Authority.

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGEY

62.00

31.00

155.00

93.0

93.00

31.00

31.00

93.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -656749

05/13/20 LCR Review order of dismissal of party; Review Judge
Gonzalez order denying Clear River motion to dismi
Extensive telephone conference with Rob Lally and
Matt McClure; Conferace with Kirill Mikhaylov;
Review Washoe County case regarding petitions fol
judicial review

05/13/20 KVM Telephone conference with R. Lally, M. McClure, and

C. Rose regardin
I

05/1320 KVM Discussion with C. Rose regardil
05/13/20 KVM Analyze I c-sc "N

I ior the purpose of developing case strategy.

05/13/20 KVM Analyze Order Granting Green Life ProducsohLC's
Motion to be Dismissed as a Party and Withdraw Its
Notice of Intent to Participate.

05/13/20 KVM Analyze minute Order regarding May 8, 2020
Chambers Matters.

05/13/20 KVM Analyze Nevada Organic Remedies, LLC's Neix
Submission of Materials for IN Camera Review.

05/13/20 KVM $QOH 4XOFDQ //&TV 2SSRVLWLR
7TDDWLRQTYV ORWLRQ IR UD-XICQ PV
All Petitions for Judicial Review.

05/13/20 KVM Analyze ETWPlaintiffs' Opposition to Department of
Taxation's Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings or
All Petitions for Judicial Review.

05/13/20 KVM Analyze ETW Plaintiffs' Motion for Order Extending
Time to File NRS 233B.133 Opening Brief on Order
Shortening Time.

1.80 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.30 hrs
0.70 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE10

720.00

279.00

93.00
217.00

31.00

31.00

31.00

62.00

93.00

93.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -656749

05/13/20 KVM $QOMH HYDGHOOQHHYW HU //& TV 2
'"HSDUWP BDQW IRRQTY ORWLRQ IR
Pleadings on All Petitions for Judicial Review and
Countermotion for Extension of Time.

0513/20 KVM Analyze MM Development Company, Inc.'s and
Livfree Wellness, LLC's Opposition to the Departme
of Taxation's Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings
all Petitions for Judicial Review.

05/13/20 KVM Analyze ETW Plaintiffs' Amende@pposition to the
'"HSDUWP QW IRRQTVY ORWLRQ IR
Pleadings on all Petitions for Judicial Review.

05/13/20 KVM SHHLSWDODOWMBLURYY -RLQGHW W
S5SHPHGLHV //&0Q /AXDPWOBQG (7:
Opposition to D.O.T. Motion for Judgment on the
Pleadings and Joinders Thereto.

05/14/20 LCR Review email from Kirill Mikhaylov; Review various
filings; Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov

05/14/20 KVM Analyze Opposition to Lone MountaPartners, LLC's
Motion to Strike ETW Plaintiffs' Statement of Facts i
Support of Oppositions to Motions for Summary
Judgment, Filed Under Seal and Countermotion for
Leave and to Exceed Page Limit re Statement of Fg
in Support of Oppositions to Motis for Summary
Judgment.

05/14/20 KVM Analyze Deep Roots Medical, LLC's Motion for Part
Summary Judgment, GreenMart of Nevada NLV LL
Motion for Summary Judgment, The Essences Entit
Motion for Summary Judgment Against All Plaingiff
Lone Mountain Partners, LLC's Motion for Summary
Judgment, and Oppositions and Replies thereto in
preparation to attending the hearing on said Motion:

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.30 hrs

2.20 hrs

PAGE11

62.00

62.00

62.00

31.00

200.00

93.00

682.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/14/20 KVM

05/15/20 LCR

05/15/20 KVM

Analyze Plaintiff Nevada Wellness Center, LLC s 1.50 hrs
Motion for Summary Judgent on First Claim for

Relief, Motion for Partial Summary Judgment on

Second Claim for Relief, Motion for Summary

Judgment on Third Fourth and Fifth Claims for Relie

and Oppositions and Replies thereto in preparation

attending the hearing on said Muis.

Review summary memo regardijiil 3.70 hrs
I, Review various filings;

Attend telephonic court hearing with Judge Gonzalez

regarding various motions; Telephone conference with

Pete Christiansen; Telephone conference with Kirill

Mikhaylov

Analyze Rural Remedies, LLC's Motion for Partial 1.40 hrs
Summary Judgment, Qualcan LLC's Motion For

Summary Judgment As To The DOT's Improper

Issuance Of Multiple Licenses To A Single Apphta

,Q HKBPH -XFRM/VBQ (7:1V ORWIOR

Summary Judgment, and Oppositions and Replies

thereto in preparation to attending the hearing on se

Motions.

PAGE12

465.00

1,480.00

434.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/15/20

05/15/20

05/15/20

05/16/20

05/18/20

05/18/20

05/18/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

LCR

KVM

KVM

Attend hearing on Rural Remedies, LLC's Motion fo
Partial Sunmary Judgment; Deep Roots Medical,
LLC's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment;
GreenMart of Nevada NLV LLC's Motion for
Summary Judgment; Qualcan LLC s Motion For
Summary Judgment As To The DOT's Improper
Issuance Of Multiple Licenses To A Single Applican
In The Same Jurisdiction; Plaintiff Nevada Wellness
Center, LLC's Motion for Summary Judgment on Fir
Claim for Relief, Motion for Partial Summary
Judgment on Second Claim for Relief, Motion for
Summary Judgment on Third Fourth and Fifth Clain
for Relidf; The Essences Entities' Motion for Summa
Judgment Against All Plaintiffs; Lone Mountain
Partners, LLC's Motion for Summary Judgment; anc
(7:1V ORWLRQDI®R 8 )XRBERJWEGIPHQW

Telephone conferences with C. Rose regarjiiill

Telephone conference with P. Christensen and C. F
regarding Qualcan's claims.

Review filings, notes from hearing with Judge
Gonzalez; Review rankings and scaoriist

Review various filings; Telephone conference with
Matt McClure

Analyze Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC 631
Identified application for the purpose of developing
case analysis and stratefgy further handling.

Analyze Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC 631
Non Identified application for the purpose of
developing case analysis and strategy for further
handling.

4.60 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.50 hrs

2.90 hrs

1.80 hrs

PAGE13

1,426.00

186.00

62.00

80.00

200.00

899.00

558.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/18/20

05/18/20

05/18/20

05/18/20

05/19/20

05/19/20

05/19/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

Receipt correspondeadrom J. Schwarz regarding
splitting the cost of experts' depositions.

Draft correspondence to J. Schwarz regarding expe
cost split.

Analyze 61 filed and served documents including 1Z
Joinders tovarious motions and oppositions, 11
Declarations of attempted service, 23 Declarations «
service, orders, notices of entry of orders, minutes
orders, correspondence regarding G. Archos'
deposition, EDCR 2.34 correspondence regarding
Circle S' productionamended notices of depositions,
and joinders thereto.

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs' Fourth Supplemental
Disclosure of Documents and Witnesses Pursuant t
NRCP 16.1.

Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov regarding

I Review Nevada

Wellness joinders to motion regarding NRS 233 brief

and opposing motion to strike statement of facts;
Review amended notices of depositions for experts;
Review letter from Conant law firm regarding
participating at trial

Analyze Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC 632
Identified application for the purpose of developing
case analysis and strategy for further handling.

Analyze Wellness Carection of Nevada, LLC 632
Non Identified application for the purpose of
developing case analysis and strategy for further
handling.

0.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.60 hrs

PAGE14

31.00

31.00

248.00

31.00

200.00

434.00

186.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -656749

05/19/20 KVM Analyze Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC 633
Identified application for the purpose of deng
case analysis and strategy for further handling.

05/19/20 KVM Analyze Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC 633
Non Identified application for the purpose of
developing case analysis and strategy for further
handling.

05/19/20 KVM Correspondence from P. Conant regarding trial
attendance.

05/19/20 KVM Analyze Plaintiff Nevada Wellness Center, LLCs Re
in Support of Motion to Strike Certain Defenses in

'"HSDUWP DWW IRR TV $ B ROHEHIWE
Conplaint.

05/19/20 KVM $QO\H 30D LIQWILGHDA:O QHHYW HU  // &
Reply in Support of Motion to Strike Certain Defens:

LQ - 3XSRYV $R/QIE BMERERP SO

05/20/20 LCR Review minute order from court regamdidismissal of
Agua Street and Kindables

05/20/20 KVM Analyze D.H. Flamingo, Inc. and Surterra Holdings,
Inc.'s Reply in Support of Motion for Summary
Judgment Against MM Development Company, Inc.

05/20/20 KVM Analyze MM Development Company, Inc. and LivFr
Wellness, LLC's Motion to Release Duplicative Sure
Bond on Order Shortening Time.

05/20/20 KVM Receipt 18 filed and served documents consisting o
four Joinders to Motions and Oppositions, four Notic
of Deposition of four expert witnesses, three Minute
Orders, Substitution of Counsel for Herbal Choice,
three Notices of Deposition of facts witnesses, and
three Joinder to said Notices of Deposition.

1.00 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE15

310.00

93.00

31.00

124.00

93.00

40.00

155.00

62.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -656749

05/20/20 KVM Multiple emails from parés counsel regarding variou
options for conducting trial under the social distancil
guidelines.

05/20/20 KVM Analyze Department of Taxation's Opposition to
Plaintiffs' Motions to Extend Time to file NRS
233B.133 Opening Brief and Reply@orting its
Motion for Judgment on the Pleadings.

05/20/20 KVM Analyze Deep Roots Medical, LLC's Opposition to
Motion for Extending Time to File NRS 233B.133
Opening Brief on Order Shortening Time.

05/20/20 KVM Analyze Dee Roots Medical, LLC's Errata to
Opposition to Motion for Extending Time to File NR¢
233B.133 Opening Brief on Order Shortening Time.

05/21/20 LCR Review Deep Roots opposition to ETW motion to
extend date to file petition; Review Rural Retfies
opposition to Pure motion to dismiss; Review
information for court call; Telephone conference witl
Kirill Mikhaylov; Review chief judge administrative
order; Review notice of Canada bankruptcy filing;
Review various additional filings; Review Twelve
motion to dismiss; Review MM/Liv motion for
summary judgment

05/21/20 KVM Analyze Rural Remedies, LLC's Opposition to Pure
Tonic's Motion for Summary Judgment on all Plainti
Operative Complaints.

05/21/20 KVM Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's Joinde
Deep Roots Medical, LLC's Opposition to Motion fol
Extending Time to File NRS 233B.133 Opening Brie
on Order Shortening Time.

05/21/20 KVM Receipt ten Joinders to various briefs and oppositiol

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.10 hrs

PAGE16

62.00

62.00

93.00

31.00

600.00

93.00

31.00

31.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/21/20

05/21/20

05/21/20

05/21/20

05/21/20

05/21/20

05/21/20

05/21/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Email from N. Rulis regarding telephonic conference
with Judge Gonzalez regarding the impact of recent
Canadian bankruptcy filing.

Analyze Nevada Organic Remedies, LLC's Notice o
Initial Order in Onario Superior Court of Justice.

Analyze Nevada Organic Remedies, LLC's Amende
Notice of Initial Order in Ontario Superior Court of
Justice.

Telephone conference with Judge Gonzalez and pa
counsel regarding impact of recent Canadian
bankruptcy filings.

Analyze Defendant/Respondents’ Twelve Twelve,
LLC's Motion to be Dismissed as a Party and Withd
Its Notice of Intent to Participate and Ex Parte
Application forOrder Shortening Time.

Multiple emails from parties counsel regarding vario
options for conducting the trial under the social
distancing guidelines.

Analyze Clear River's Answer to Nevada Wellness
Center's Second Amended Complaint and Petition f
Judicial Review or Writ of Mandamus and cross
reference said Complaint.

Analyze Pure Tonic's Motion for Summary Judgmer
DH Flamingo and Surtera Holdings' Motion for
SummaryJudgment against MM Development, ETW
Plaintiffs' Motion for Order Extending Time to File
NRS 233B.133 Opening Brief, MM Development an
Livfree Wellness' Motion for Summary Judgment,
Opposition and Replies to said Motions, and draft ni
in preparationd attending hearing on said Motions.

0.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.40 hrs

3.70 hrs

PAGE17

31.00

155.00

31.00

93.00

62.00

62.00

124.00

1,147.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 656749

05/22/20

05/22/20

05/22/20

05/22/20

05/22/20

05/22/20

05/22/20

05/22/20

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Attend
telephonic court hearing with Judge Gonzalez regar
various motions and trial status; Review deposition
schedule; Email Rob Lally aridatt McClure

Telephone conference with C. Rose regarding
I

Attend hearing on Pure Tonic's Motion for Summary
Judgment on all Plaintiffs' Operative Complaints, Dt
Flamingo'sMotion for Summary Judgment against M
Development, ETW Plaintiffs' Motion for Order
Extending Time to File NRS 233B.133, and MM
Development's Motion for Summary Judgment or fo
Writ of Mandamus.

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar{iillill
|
I

Receipt correspondence from Lone Mountain Partn
LLC's counsel regarding Expert Witness Deposition

AnalyzeClear River's Answer to Rural Remedies
Amended Complaint and cross reference said
Complaint.

Analyze Plaintiffs' Joint Initial Expert Disclosure and
prepare brief summary of Plaintiffs' experts' opinion:

Begin drafting Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Answer to Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Second
Amended Complaint and Petition for Judicial Reviev
or Writ of Mandamus.

2.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

2.10 hrs

0.80 hrs

PAGE18

880.00

93.00

465.00

62.00

31.00

93.00

651.00

248.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -656749

05/26/20

05/26/20

05/26/20

05/26/20
05/26/20

05/26/20
05/27/20

05/27/20
05/27/20

05/27/20

05/27/20
05/27/20

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM
KVM

KVM
LCR

KVM
KVM

KVM

KVM
KVM

Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Riew
various filings; Telephone conference with Rob Lally
and Matt McClure; Brief review of supplemental exp
report; Review various deposition notices; Review
summary of Greg Smith expert deposition

Analyze G. Smith's expereport and prepare questior
for his upcoming deposition.

Discussion with C. Rose regardill N
I

Attend deposition of expert withess G. Smith.

Attend meet and confer conference regarding motio
limine regarding G. Smith's testimony.

Draft deposition summary of expert witness G. Smit

Review court filings; Review Jorge Pupo initial
disdosures

Analyze Joint Supplemental Expert Disclosure.

Analyze Clear River's Answer to Natural Medicine
Complaint in Intervention, Petition for Judicial Revie
and/or Writ of Certiorari, Mandamus @Prohibition
and cross reference said Complaint.

Analyze Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Third
Supplement To Early Case Conference List Of
Witnesses And Document Disclosures Pursuant To
NRCP 16.1.

Analyze J. Pupo's Initial Disclosures.

Analyze three orders, two minute orders, five notice
depositions, and five joinders to said notices of
depositions.

0.90 hrs

1.70 hrs

0.40 hrs

4.90 hrs
0.10 hrs

0.40 hrs
0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs
0.40 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.20 hrs
0.20 hrs

PAGE19

360.00

527.00

124.00

1,519.00
31.00

124.00
120.00

93.00
124.00

124.00

62.00
62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -656749

05/28/20 LCR Review Nevada Wellness response to ptdeshow
cause from the Nevada Supreme Court regarding
jurisdiction issue; Review filings; Review Thrive
supplemental disclosure

05/28/20 KVM Analyze Nevada Wellness' Response to Order to St
Cause.

05/28/20 KVM Analyze Thrive's Thirteenth Supplemental List of
Witnesses and Documents.

05/28/20 KVM Analyze GreenMart of Nevada NLV LLC's Sixth
Supplement to Initial List of Witnesses and Docume
Pursuant to NRCP 16.1.

05/28/20 KVM Receipt FAth Amended Notice of Deposition of J.
Pupo.

05/29/20 LCR Review filings; Review email from Judge Gonzalez |
clerk regarding trial date; Review emails from variot
counsel; Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov

05/2920 KVM Receipt 28 emails from parties counsel regarding
depositions, trial protocol, and social distancing
guidelines.

05/29/20 KVM Receipt correspondences from Nevada Wellness'
counsel, Clear River's counsel, and Lone Mountain"
counsekegarding document production and expert
depositions.

05/29/20 KVM Analyze Clear River's Fourth Supplemental Disclost
Pursuant to NRCP 16.1.

05/29/20 KVM Analyze Clear River LLC's Fourth Supplemental
Responses to ETW Priff's First Set of Requests for
Production and Third Amended Privilege Log.

Total Fees For This Matter

0.60 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE20

240.00

31.00

155.00

124.00

31.00

280.00

124.00

62.00

31.00

62.00

$

33,548.00



July 14, 2020

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

3615 Spring Mountain Road
Las Vegas, NV 89102

Billed through 06/30/20

Bill Number 11888060003 -659405

In re DOT (D.H. Flamingo)

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

06/01/20 LCR

06/01/20 KVM

06/01/20 KVM

06/01/20 KVM

Telephone conference with all counsel; Review vari
filings

Analyze Trial Protocol and Court's latest administrat
order in preparation to a telephone conference
regarding proceeding with trial under social distanci
guidelines.

Telephone conference with parties' counsel regardit
trial procedure under social distancing guidelines.

Analyze Pure Tonic Concentrates, LLC's Answers t
ETW Plaintiffs' Third Amended Complaint, MM
Development's Second Amended Complaint, TGIG'
Second Amended Complaint, Nevada Wedis
Center's Second Amended Complaint, and Rural
Remedies' Amended Complaint in Intervention and
cross reference said Complaints.

0.80 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.60 hrs

320.00

155.00

155.00

496.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -659405

06/01/20 KVM Analyze 39 filed and served documents including
deposition notices, joinders thereto, declaratiof
service, declarations of attempted service,
correspondences from counsel, expert J. Aguero's
amended expert report, and Lone Mountain Partner
Fifth Supplemental 16.1 Disclosure.

06/02/20 LCR Review emails and filings, Review dratatus report
from Defendants, Review chief judge administrative
order, Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov;
Review revised status report

06/02/20 KVM Analyze proposed Defense status report regarding ¢
and phases of trial.

06/02/20 KVM Analyze 31 emails from Defense counsel regarding
Defense Status Report and changes thereto.

06/02/20 KVM Telephone conference with C. Rose regar{ i
|

06/03/20 LCR Review emails between counsel, Review various
filings, Telephone conference with Judge Gonzalez
counsel regarding status of case, trial setting, Telep
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov, Review NWC
answers to state interrogatories, Reviarious
deposition notices

06/03/20 KVM Telephone conference with Judge Gonzalez and pa
regarding trial.

0.80 hrs

1.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.00 hrs

0.50 hrs

PAGE?2

248.00

480.00

62.00

217.00

155.00

400.00

155.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -659405

06/03/20 KVM

06/04/20 LCR

06/04/20 KVM

06/05/20 LCR

06/05/20 KVM

Analyze 43 filed and served documents consisting ¢
Rural Remedies' Answer to Natural Medicine's
Complaint, correspondences and emails from partie
counsel regarding discovery and trial logistics, minu
order, Nevada Wellness' responses to requests for
production of documents and interrogatories,
Supplemental Joint Case Conference Report, Plahi
Joint Status Report, Stipulation and Order to Dismis
certain parties, deposition notices, and joinders ther

Review various filings, depo notices; Review Bailey
Kennedy motion to withdraw

Analyze 32 filed and served documents including
Bailey and Kennedy's Motion to Withdraw as Couns
Nevada Organic Remedies' Answer to Strive Wellne
of Nevada's Complaint and Answer to Natural
Medicine's Complaint, Greenmart's Seventh Disclos
to NRCP 161 Disclosure of Witnesses and Documel
Qualcan's Fourth Supplement to NRCP 16.1 Disclo:
of Witnesses and Documents, correspondences frol
counsel, and various joinders to deposition notices.

Review various filings; Reviewpdated deposition
schedule; Emails with Kirill Mikhaylov regardirjiillill
I, Rcview Qualcan motion for

damages

Analyze Thrive, Lone Mountain Partners, Nuveda ai
Inyo, and Department of Taxation's Answéo Natural
Medicine's Complaint in Intervention, and Natural
Medicine's Motion to Enlarge Time to Serve, Nevad
Wellness Center's Limited Opposition to MM
Development's Motion to Release Duplicative Suret
Bond, and Qualcan, LLC's Motion to Admit EvideEn
of Damages on Order Shortening Time.

1.50 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.20 hrs

0.50 hrs

1.70 hrs

PAGE3

465.00

80.00

372.00

200.00

527.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -659405

06/05/20 WAG

06/08/20

06/08/20

06/08/20

06/08/20

06/08/20

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Review e-mail from Kirill Mikhaylo\ il NG 4.70 hrs
I

I Drait Answer to Strive Wellness of

Nevada's Complaint

Review deposition schedule; Review joint case 1.00 hrs
conference report by NWC, Rural Remedies, Jorge

Pupo; Review additional deposition notices; Telephone
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review letter from

DOT regarding deposition issues

Analyze Nevada Wellness, LLC's Motion to Strike 1.10 hrs
Certain Defenses in Department of Taxation's Answer

DQG ORWLRQHWR B WM MNIHPR-V 3XSRYV
Answer, Twelve Twelve, LLC's Motion to be

Dismissed as a Party, MM Development Company,

Inc.'s Motion to Release Duplicative Surety Bond, and

Bailey Kennedy's Motion to Withdraw as Counsel for

D.H. Flamingo, Inc. and Surterra Holdings, Inc. in

preparation to attending hearing on said Motions.

Attend hearing oMNevada Wellness Center, LLC's 0.70 hrs
Motion to Strike Certain Defenses in Department of

Taxation's Answer and Motion to Strike Certain

'"HIHBVY LQ - 3XSRTWHGOGQM ZRZW CRFZ

Motion to be Dismissed as a Party, MM Development

Company, Inc.'s Motion to Release Duplicative Surety

Bond, and Bailey Kennedy's Motion to Withdraw as

Counsel for D.H. Flamingo, Inc. and Surterra Holdings,

Inc.

Telephone conference with S. Shevorski regarding 0.10 hrs
production of record on appeal.

Telephone conference with C. Rose regarding 0.10 hrs
.

I

PAGEA4

1,245.50

400.00

341.00

217.00

31.00

31.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -659405

06/08/20 KVM Receipt various notices of deposition and notices to
vacate depositions.

06/0820 KVM Begin drafting Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Answer to Natural Medicine's Complaint in
Intervention.

06/09/20 LCR Review order releasing MM LiveFree's injunction
bond; Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov;
Review lette from Paul Conant regarding mediation

06/09/20 KVM Finalize Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's
Answer to Natural Medicine's Complaint in
Intervention.

06/09/20 KVM Analyze correspondence regarding proposed medie
various orders, various deposition notices, and High
Sierra's Answer to Natural Medicine's Complaint in
Intervention.

06/10/20 LCR Review various filings, deposition notices; Review
updated deposition schedule

06/10/20 KVM Analyze Inyo Fine Cannabis Dispensary, LLC's
Complaint and draft deposition questions in prepara
to attending Inyo's 30(b)(6) deposition.

06/10/20 KVM Analyze 20 filed and served documents including
Compassionate Team of Las Vegas, L4 Birst
Supplement to NRCP 16.1 Disclosures, TGIG
Plaintiffs' Answer to Natural Medicine's Complaint ir
Intervention, correspondence regarding upcoming
depositions, notice of depositions, notices to vacate
depositions, joinder to said notices, joinder totions,
and declarations of service.

0.20 hrs

2.80 hrs

0.50 hrs

2.60 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.70 hrs

PAGES

62.00

868.00

200.00

806.00

186.00

160.00

279.00

217.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -659405

06/11/20

06/11/20

06/12/20
06/12/20

06/15/20

06/1520

06/15/20

06/15/20

06/15/20

06/15/20

LCR

KVM

LCR
KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Review letter from Paul Conant regarding depositior
Review letter from Diane Welsh regarding Pupo
deposition; Review letter from Max Fetaz regarding
orders; Review miscellaneous filings

Attend deposition of Inyo Fine Cannabis Dispensary
LLC's 30(b)(6) witness D. Goldwater.

Attend deposition of Jorge Pupo

Analyze correspondences regarding Tryke anPupo's
depositions and proposed orders, TGIG's Sixth
Supplemental NRCP 16.1 Disclosure, Department ¢
Taxation's Opposition to Qualcan's Motion to Admit
Evidence of Damages, and joinder thereto.

Review DOT filing of recad on appeal; Review motic
to set trial; Attend telephonic conference hearing wit
Judge Gonzalez; Review deposition schedule; Ema
with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review scoring sheets; Review
draft answer to complaint of Natural Medicine

Attend hearing on Qualcan's Motion to Admit Evider
of Damages.

Analyze the Department of Taxation's Record on
Appeal and Notice Regarding the Filing of the Reco
on Appeal for the purpose of developing case strate
and preparing for trial.

Attend telephone conference with parties' counsel
regarding outstanding depositions.

Analyze Essence Parties' Motion to Set Trial on Orc
Shortening Time.

Receipt Amended Notice for Qualcan 30(b)(6).

0.40 hrs

5.90 hrs

5.30 hrs
1.30 hrs

1.80 hrs

1.00 hrs

2.20 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

PAGEG6

160.00

1,829.00

2,120.00
403.00

720.00

310.00

682.00

124.00

62.00

31.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -659405

06/16/20 LCR

06/16/20 KVM

06/16/20 KVM

06/17/20 KVM

06/18/20 LCR

06/18/20 KVM

06/18/20 KVM

Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review deposition
notices; Review letter from Diane Welsh regarding
Pupo deposition; Email Ms. Welsh; Telephone
conference with Dian@/elsh; Review response to
motion to continue trial

Analyze 30(b)(6) Notice, Qualcan's Second Amende
Complaint, and draft questions in preparation to
attending Qualcan's 30(b)(6) deposition.

Attend Qualcan, LLC's 30(b)(6) deposition of Lorenz
Barracco.

Analyze 41 served and filed documents which inclut
Tryke, ETW Plaintiffs, and Nevada Wellness'
Oppositions to Essence Entities' Motion to Set Trial
Order Shortemg Time, Joinders to said Oppositions
and Motion, Notices of Deposition, Joinders to said
Notices, Department of Taxation's Ninth Supplemer
its NRCP 16.1 Disclosures, Nevada Wellness Cente
Fourth Supplement to NRCP 16.1 Disclosures, Tryk
CompaniesSupplement to NRCP 16.1 Disclosures,
MM Development's Sixth Supplemental Disclosure,
Natural Medicine's Amended 16.1 Disclosures,
correspondences regarding J. Pupo, A. Connor, anc
mediation.

Review various filings; Review ETWésponse
regarding motion to set trial; Attend telephonic heari
with Judge Gonzalez regarding trial date

Attend hearing on Essence Entities' Motion to Set T
on Order Shortening Time.

Reviseand finalize Wellness Connection of Nevada,
LLC's Answer to ETW Plaintiffs' Third Amended
Complaint.

1.00 hrs

0.90 hrs

5.70 hrs

2.40 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.80 hrs

2.70 hrs

PAGE7

400.00

279.00

1,767.00

744.00

360.00

248.00

837.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -659405

06/18/20

06/18/20

06/19/20

06/19/20

06/20/20
06/22/20

06/22/20
06/22/20
06/22/2D

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR
LCR

KVM
KVM
KVM

Revise and finalize Wellness Connection of Nevada
LLC's Answer to Strive Wellness' Complaint in
Intervention.

Analyze 30 filed and served documents including
correspondences from counsel regarding disclosure
detailed score sheets, depositions of G. Archos, anc
Compassionate Team of Las Vegas, Department of
Taxation's 10th Supplement to NRCP11Bisclosures,
deposition notices, declarations of service, attempte
service, and diligence.

Analyze Inyo's Third Supplement to NRCP 16.1
Disclosures.

Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC'sshver
to Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Second Amende
Complaint.

Review various filings and deposition notices

Review deposition schedule; Review filings; Telephone

conference with Kirill Mikhaylowegardindiill ;
Review Wellness answer to complaint of ETW
Plaintiffs and Strive Plaintiff

Attend status check hearing.
Telephone conference with C. Rose regar i

Analyze 22 filed and served documents including th
Department of Taxation's 11th Supplement to NRCF
16.1 Disclosures, correspondence regarding dismis:
of Compassionate Team of Las Vegas, Nevada
Wellness Center, LLC's Motion to Enlarge Time for
Sewice, Minute Order Setting PfErial Conference,
deposition notices, joiners thereto, declarations of
service and attempted service.

0.90 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.50 hrs

2.40 hrs

0.10 hrs
1.50 hrs

0.30 hrs
0.50 hrs
0.90 hrs

PAGES8

27900

186.00

155.00

744.00

40.00
600.00

93.00
155.00
279.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -659405

06/23/20

06/23/20

06/23/20

06/24/20

06/24/20

06/24/20

06/24/20

06/24/20

LCR

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Review deposition notices and filings; Review trial 2.00 hrs
issues, evidence issues; Telephone cenfar with Rok

/IDOO\ DOWWANOOF&DYNWHEZ &R XUWV

protocol; Review MM/Livfree supplemental productit

of documents and witnesses; Review documents frc

Matt McClure

Telephone call with C. Rose, R. Lally, and M. McClure 0.70 hrs
regardindEEEE

Analyze 11 filed and served documents including M 0.60 hrs
Development and LivFree's Seventh Supplemental

NRCP 16.1 Disclosures, correspondence regarding

disclosure of score cards, notiecdgepositions,

joinders thereto, order, and declarations of attempte

service.

Review license rankings; Review electronic exhibit trial  4.40 hrs
protocol; Review MM supplemental disclosures;
Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov regardlng

Review Wellness applications for 2018 dlspensary

PAGEY

800.00

217.00

186.00

1,760.00

CHQVHNYLBZANPHRWLRQ WR GLVPLVV 7HOHSKRQH

conference with Diane Welsh; Telephone conference
with Kirill Mikhaylov

Telephone conference with C. Rose regarding 0.80 hrs
I
Telephone conferences with W. Gonzalez regarding 0.80 hrs

Prepare deposition questions and matcjiiiilill 0.80 hrs

I \lcvada
Holistic 30(b)(6) witness.

Analyze Amended Trial Protocol. 0.50 hrs

248.00

248.00

248.00

155.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -659405

06/24/20
06/24/20

06/24/20

06/24/20

06/24/20

06/25/20

06/25/20

06/25/20

KVM
KVM

KVM

WAG

WAG

LCR

KVM

KVM

0.40 hrs
1.00 hrs

Draft trial deadline schedule.

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar{iiilill

Analyze 39 served and filed documents including Lone 2.30 hrs
Mountain Partner's Motion in Limine to Exclude Expert
Testimony of L. Holifield, Lone Mountain Partner's
Motion in Limine to Limit Trial Testimony of G.

Smith, Joinders to said Motions in Limine,
Compassionate Team of Las Vegas' Motion to be
Dismissed as Party, Tryke's Motion to be Dismissed,
TGIG Plaintiffs’ Seventh Supplement to NRCP 16.1
Disclosures, correspondences regarding Tryke's
dismissal and upcoming depositions, and three-day
notices of intent to take default.

Review Notice of deposition for Nevada Holistic's 0.50 hrs
30(b)(6) deponent, its Second Amended Complaint, and
form questions in preparation for the 30(b)(6)

deposition

Telephone Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov 0.70 hrs

Review trial plan; Review letter from opposing counsel 4.70 hrs
regarding dismissal of MMOF; Attend deposition of
Karalin Cronkite; Review documents for production;

Attend deposition of Jorge Pupo

Gather Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's 1.60 hrs
applications excerpts and redact said documents in

preparation to disclosing the same.

Attend hearing on Nevada Wellness Center's Motion to 0.50 hrs
Enlarge Time for Service and Status Check.

PAGE10

124.00
310.00

713.00

132.50

185.50

1,880.00

496.00

155.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -659405

06/25/20

06/25/20
06/25/20

06/25/20

06/25/20

06/26/20

06/26/20

06/26/20

06/26/20

06/26/20

06/27/20

KVM

KVM
KVM

KVM

WAG

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

Attend deposition of ETW Management's 30(b)(6)
witness P. Thomas.

Continue drafting Opposition to Motion to Dismiss.

Revise Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's Thir
Supplement to its NRCP 16.1 Disclosures.

Telephone conference with M. McClure regarding

Attend and appear for the deposition of Plaintiff
Nevada Holistic's 30(b)6) designee, Scott Sibley; Draft
email to Kirill Mikhaylov and Chris Rose

Review documents, filings, otions; Review
documents for supplemental production; Telephone
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Extensive additiong
telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review
various pretrial disclosures from parties; Telephone
conference with Teddy Parker

Telephone conferences with C. Rose regarding

Gather final exhibits and redact said exhibits in
preparation to pducing Wellness Connection of
Nevada, LLC's Pr&Trial Disclosures.

Telephone conference with J. Smith regarding Rral
Disclosures.

Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's Hral
Discloaures.

Review various filings

6.50 hrs

450 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.40 hrs

4.60 hrs

2.50 hrs

1.70 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE11

2,015.00

1,395.@
62.00

124.00

1,219.00

1,000.00

527.00

341.00

93.00

248.00

120.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -659405

06/27/20

06/27/20

06/28/20

06/28/20

06/28/20

06/28/20
06/29/20

06/29/20

06/29/20
06/29/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM
LCR

KVM

KVM
KVM

Analyze 26 filed and served documents including
Supplement to Record on Review in Accordance wi
the Nevada Administrative Procedure Act, Rural
Remedies' Motion to Ser, Nevada Wellness' Motion
to Serve Through Secretary of State, MM
Development's Eighth Supplemental NRCP 16.1
Disclosures, Joinders to Lone Mountain's Motions ir
Limine, Declarations of Service and attempted servi
correspondences from counsel.

Telephone conference with C. Rose regarding
I

Draft and finalize Wellness Connection of Nevada,
LLC's Answer to Nevada Wellness Center's Seconc
Amended Complain

Prepare deposition designations for D. Kleuver.
Prepare deposition designations for R. Elloyan.
Prepare deposition designations for D. Lemons.

Review filings and emails from parties; Review MMOF
motion to withdraw as plaintiff;, Conference with Kirill
Mikhaylov regardindil . Rc'iew
depositions of scorers, Kluever, Elloyan, Lemons;
Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov regarding deposition
designations for trial

Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's Answe
to MM Development and LivFree's Second Amende
Complaint.

Attend hearing on Lone Mountain's MotionsLimine.

Analyze 30(b)(6) Notice, Complaint, and prepare
questions for LivFree's 30(b)(6) deposition.

1.90 hrs

0.50 hrs

2.70 hrs

3.80 hrs

2.20 hrs

0.90 hrs
1.90 hrs

3.10 hrs

0.60 hrs
0.60 hrs

PAGE12

589.00

155.00

837.00

1,178.00

682.00

279.00
760.00

961.00

186.00
186.00



PAGE13

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -659405

06/29/20 KVM Attend deposition of LivFree's 30(b)(6) witness T. 2.50 hrs 775.00
Harris.

06/29/20 KVM Attenddeposition of LivFree's second 30(b)(6) witne 5.00 hrs 1,550.00
T. White.

06/29/20 KVM Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's 0.90 hrs 279.00
deposition designation pleading.

06/30/20 LCR Review various parties' exhibit list disclosure; Revie 0.40 hrs 160.00

Es®nce response to Rural Remedies motion to sev:
Review various emails and filings; Review and resp
to various emails from Kirill Mikhaylov

06/30/20 KVM Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's Answe 3.60 hrs 1,116.00
to Qualcan, LLC's Second Amend€dmplaint.

06/30/20 KVM Attend hearing on Rural Remedies' Motion to Sever 0.50 hrs 155.00

06/30/20 KVM Attend deposition of MM Development's 30(b)(6) 7.30 hrs 2,263.00

witness L. Koehler.

Total Fees For This Matter $ 50,250.50

BILLING SUMMARY:
TOTAL FEES: $ 50,250.5C

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL: $ 50,250.5C




August 7, 2020

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

3615 Spring Mountain Road
Las Vegas, NV 89102

Billed through 07/31/20

Bill Number 11888060003 -660601

In re DOT (D.H. Flamingo)

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

06/08/20 WAG

07/01/20

07/01/20

07/01/20
07/01/20

07/01/20

07/01/20

LCR

KVM

KVM
KVM

KVM

KVM

Draft Answer to ETW Plaintiffs' Third Amended
Complaint; draft e-mail to Kirill Mikhaylo\ill
e
I

Review various filings; Conference with Kirill
regardind

Analyze Complaint, 30(b)(6) Notice, and draft

deposition questions in preparation to attending
deposition of Global Harmony 30(b)(6) witness.

Attend deposition of Global Harmony 30(b)(6) witne

Discussion with W. Gonzalez regard i IR
|

Gather documents and draft defion questions for
Libra Wellness 30(b)(6) deposition to facilitate
coverage by W. Gonzalez.

Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's Answe
to Rural Remedies, LLC's Amended Complaint in
Intervention.

4.30 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.70 hrs

2.80 hrs
0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

2.90 hrs

1,139.50

200.00

217.@

868.00
31.00

93.00

899.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/01/20

07/01/20

07/01/20

07/02/20

07/02/20

07/02/20

07/02/20

KVM

KVM

WAG

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze PreTrial Disclosures for Rural Remedies,
Nevada Organic Remedies, Herbal Choice, High Si
Thrive, Greenmart, Clear River, Lone Mountain,
Helping Hands, Deep Roots, Qualcan, TGIG Plaintit
MM Development and LivFree, Department of
Taxation, Natural Medicine, Nevada Wellness Cente
Essence Entities, ETW Plaintiffs, Tryke, and Clark
Natural.

Analyze MMOF's Motion for Voluntary Dismissal an
Nevada Organic' and Herbal Choice's Limited
Oppositions thereto.

Telephone Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov

Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov regardinjiilill
I, Rcview various filings; Review

various emails from court and opposing counsel

Attend telephonic hearing on Nevada Wellness Cen
Motion to Serve through SecretaolyState, and MMOF
Vegas Retalil, Inc.'s Motion to be Dismissed.

Attend continued deposition of the Department of
Taxation's 30(B)(6) witness S. Gilbert.

Telephone conference with Judge Gonzaled parties'
counsel regarding logistics of upcoming trial.

3.90 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.70 hrs

1.30 hrs

0.50 hrs

6.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE?2

1,209.00

124.00

185.50

520.00

155.00

1,891.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/02/20

07/02/20

07/02/20

07/03/20

07/03/20

07/03/20

07/05/20

07/06/20

KVM

KVM

WAG

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

Analyze Thrive's Fifteenth Supplemental List of
Witnesses and Documents, Nevada Wellness Centt
Supplement to Pr&rial Disclosures, TGIG Eighth ant
Ninth Supplemetal Disclosures of Witnesses and
Documents, MM Development and LivFree's Tenth
Supplemental Disclosures and First Supplement to
PreTrial Disclosures; Clear River, Nevada Organic,
Greenmart, MM LivFree, Department of Taxation, a
ETW Objections to Prarial Disclosures.

Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's
Objections to PrdTrial Disclosures.

Appear for and attend the deposition of Libra Wellness'

30(b)(6) designee, Erik Nord; Draft e-mail to Kirill
Mikhaylov I

Review various emails and filings from parties; Ema
with Kirill Mikhaylov

Analyze TGIG, MM Development and LivFree,
Nevada Wellness @¢er, Department of Taxation,
Essence Entities, Nevada Organic Remedies, ETW
Plaintiffs, and Helping Hands' Designation of
Deposition Testimony and cross reference the
designated transcripts.

Analyze correspondence from CldRiver's counsel to
Nevada Wellness Center regarding proposed Order

Analyze TGIG's 10th Disclosure of Withesses and
Documents, and Circle S, Essence Entities, Deep R
Qualcan, Lone Mountain Partners, and Helping Har
Obijections to PreTrial Disclosures.

Review exhibit list; Review various filings; Telephon
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov

3.40 hrs

0.40 hrs

3.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.70 hrs

0.20 hrs

2.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE3

1,054.00

124.00

954.00

80.00

527.00

62.00

713.00

120.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/06/20

07/06/20
07/06/20

07/06/20
07/06/20

07/07/20

07/07/20

07/07/20

KVM

KVM
KVM

KVM
KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar{iiilil
!
Analyze the Defendants' Joint Trial Exhibit List.

Receipt emails from parties' counsel regarding trial
exhibits.

Analyze the Second Amended Trial Protocol.

Analyze Thrive's Objections to Plaintiffs' Pre-Trial
Disclosures, Department of Taxation and TGIG
Plaintiffs counter-designations of deposition testimony,
and Department of Taxation's correspondence to
Qualcan regarding its proposed Order.

Review letter from Akke Levine, State attorney;
Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar{iiill
I

Draft allegations chart in preparation to trial.

0.50 hrs

1.10 hrs
0.40 hrs

0.40 hrs
0.80 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.10 hrs

PAGEA4

155.00

341.00
124.00

124.00
248.00

240.00

93.00

341.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/07/20 KVM

07/08/20 LCR

07/08/20 KVM

Analyze ETW Plaintiffs' CountelDesignations of
Deposition Testimony, MM Development and
LivFree's Second Supplement to Hirgal Disclosures,
ETW Plaintiffs’ First Supplement to Pleial
Disclosures, Essence Entities Cousidesignations of
Deposition Testimony, Nevada Organic First
Supplement to Pretrial Disclosure, Defendants' Join
Motion for Summary Judgment Against Clear River,
TGIG 11th Supplement to its NRCP 16.1 Disclosure
and Lone Mountain Partners' Answers to Nevada
Wellness Center's Second Amended Complaint, ET
Plaintiffs' Third Amended Complaint, TGIG Plaintiffs
Second Amended Complaint, Qualcan's Second
Amended Complaint, MM Development and LivFree
Second Amended Corfgint, and Rural Remedies
Amended Complaint.

Telephone conference with Rob Lally and Matt
McClure; Review emails and filings

Telephone conference with Essence Entities' couns
regarding trial ad Defendants' exhibits.

3.80 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGES

1,178.00

240.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/08/20

07/08/20

07/08/20

07/08/20

07/0920
07/09/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR
KVM

Analyze MM Development and LivFree's Third
Supplemental Pré&rial Disclosure, Department of
Taxation Rebuttal Designations of Deposition
Testimony, ETW Plaintiffs' Second Supplement to it
PreTrial Disclosures, Minute Order Denying Joint
Motion for Summary Judgment against Clear River,
Qualcan's First Supplement to its Hmgal Disclosures,
TGIG Plaintiffs' First Supplemental Rigial
Disclosures, Thrive's Counter Deposition Testimony
Designations, Dgartment of Taxation's corresponder
regarding Kara Cronkhite's phone records, Various
Joinders to Motions and Disclosures, Lone Mountail
Partners' Answer to High Sierra's Complaint, Variou
correspondences regarding trial exhibits, Thrive's 1¢
and 17 Suplements to its NRCP 16.1 Disclosures ar
Thrive' Second Supplement to Preal Disclosures,
Natural Medicine's First Supplement to Hnéal
Disclosures, and the Department of Taxation's 12th
Supplement to its NRCP 16.1 Disclosures.

Analyze and gather relevant documents and exhibit:
trial notebooks for C. Rose and K. Mikhaylov.

Analyze Nevada Wellness Center, LLC's Motion for
Case Ending Sanctions on Order Shortening Time,
Development ath TGIG Plaintiffs' Substantive Joinde
to Nevada Wellness Center's Motion.

Analyze the Department of Taxation and Clear Rive
Oppositions to Nevada Wellness Center's Motion fo
Case Ending Sanctions.

Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov

Attend hearing on Nevada Wellness Center's Motiol
for Case Terminating Sanctions.

4.30 hrs

2.50 hrs

1.60 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.80 hrs
1.50 hrs

PAGEG6

1,333.00

775.00

496.00

186.00

320.00
465.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/09/20

07/09/20

07/09/20

07/09/20

07/09/20

07/09/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Telephone conference with C. Rose regarding

Telephone conference with Essence Entities counst
regarding Judge Gonzalez's ruling on Nevada Wellr
Center's Motion for Case Ending Sanctions.

Analyze22 emails regarding Joint Pieial
Memorandum, Trial Exhibits, EDCR 2.67 conferenc:
and trial logistics; Edit proposed Joint Praal
Memorandum; Email to Essence Entities' counsel
regarding proposed changes to JointPial
Memorandum.

"UDIWVHOOQHVAW&LRQOQRED 1M PG -R
WR WEKHW P HQBMWRIRQONV 2SSR)
IHYDGDOO QHHYWHTY ORWLRK IR
Ending Sanctions; (2) the Essence Entities Joinder-
WKHSDUWPHBRWLRIQTYV 26NeRRadd W
: HOOQHHYWHU  //& TV ORWAL RYG LK,
6DQFWLRQV DQG &OHDU 5LY

IHYDGDOO QHHYWHTVY ORWLRK IR
Ending Sanctions.

Analyze the Essence Entities' Motion for Judgment
Matter of Law Due to Lack of Subject Matter
Jurisdiction and Standing by MM Development
Company, Inc. and LivFree Wellness LLC.

Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's Joinde
Essence Entities' Motion for Judgment asattst of
Law Due to Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction and
Standing by MM Development Company, Inc. and
LivFree Wellness LLC.

0.60 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE7

186.00

124.00

279.0

62.00

93.00

62.00



PAGES

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -660601

07/09/20 KVM Email to M. McClure and R. Lally regardijjiilill 0.20 hrs 6200
I
07/09/20 KVM Analyze Department of Taxation's 12th Supplementto 4.70 hrs 1,457.00

NRCP 16.1 Disclosures and Objections to Initial,
Counter, and Rebuttal Deposition Designations;
Thrive's Third, Fourth, and Fifth Supplements to its
Pre-Trial Disclosures and Objections to Deposition
Designations; ETW Plaintiffs' Objections to Deposition
Designations and Third and Fourth Supplements to Pre-
Trial Disclosures; Plaintiffs' Pre-Trial Memorandum
and Defendants' Pre-Trial Memorandum; TGIG
Plaintiffs and Qualcan's Notices of Power Point
Presentation; Nevada Organic and GreenMart's
Objections to Depositions Designations; Essence
Entities' Objections to Deposition Designations;
Essence Entities' Motion to Compel MM Development
and LivFree; MM Development and LivFree's
Oppositions td&ssence Entities' Motion to Compel and
Motion for Judgment as a Matter of Law for Lack of
Standing; and various correspondences with Defense
counsel regarding opening statements.

07/10/20 LCR Prepare for pretrial conference; Telephone conference 2.80 hrs 1,120.00
with Kirill Mikhaylov; Attend pretrial conference with
Judge Gonzalez

07/10/20 KVM Legal research regardij I 0 1.60 hrs 496.00
preparation for trial.
07/10/20 KVM Attend final pre-trial conference. 2.5 hrs 775.00
|
APPO



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/10/20

07/11/20

07/11/20

07/12/20

07/12/20

07/12/20

KVM

LCR

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

Analyze Defendants' proposed Findings of Fact and
Conclusions of Law drafted by counsel for Nevada
Organic Remedies, Plaintiffs' Supplement to Joint
Expert Disclosure, Thrive's Sixth Supplement to its |
Trial Disclosures, TGI@laintiffs' Second Supplemer
to its PreTrial Disclosures, J. Pupo's Motion for
Protective order and to Modify Trial Subpoena.

Review emails from opposing counsel; Emails with
Kirill Mikhaylov

Analyze Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law
regarding MM Development and LivFree's Motion fc
Summary Judgment, Deep Roots' Objections to
Plaintiffs' Supplemental Ps€rial Disclosures, Order
Granting reconsideration of Nevada Wellness Cente
Motion to Compel Clear River to Produced Kocer an
Arbelaez, and various Notices of Entry of Default.

Review various emails from opposition counsel,
Review email from court; Emails with Kirill
Mikhaylov; Review various additional emaftom
opposing counsel regarding CoM8 issue; Telephone
call with Kirill Mikhaylov

Analyze Thrive's Supplemental Brief in Support of
Joinder to Department of Taxation's Opposition to
Nevada Wellness Center's Motion for Cageminating
Sanctions.

Analyze the Essence Entities' Supplemental Authori
and Objection to Sanctions Hearing, Joint Objection
(VVAHQBUWLHVHGHTWHMAW VHYV )R
Evidentiary Hearing, 22 emails regarding Findiraj
Fact and Conclusions of Law and TGIG's Plaintiffs
exposure to Covid9, and Deep Roots' Findings of
Fact and Conclusions of Law.

2.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.30 hrs

2.10 hrs

PAGEY

682.00

40.00

341.00

200.00

93.00

651.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/12/20
07/13/20

07/13/20

07/13/20

07/13/20

07/14/20

07/14/20

07/14/20

KVM
LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

Gather documents for evidentiary hearing.

Attend day 1 of evidentiary hearing; Telephone
conference with Matt McClure regardijjiil

I Review proposed settlement terms from
defendants; Review draft findings of fact and
conclusions of law; Review licensing ranking and
awards; Extensive review and preparation of findings of
fact and conclusions of law

Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's Findin
of Fact and Conclusions of Law.

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar (il
.
I

Analyze 15 emails regarding partial settlement and
proposed drafts of Findings of Fact and Conclusion:
Law.

Review various filings; Review DOT status report
regarding evidentiary hearing; Telephone conference
with Jared Kahn; Telephone conference with Kirill
Mikhaylov; Extensive telephone conference with Rob
Lally and Matt McClure regardiniiil N
Il Telephone conference with Jared Kahn; Review
Thrive supplemental brief on sanctions v. DOT

Telephone conferences with C. Rose, M. McClure, and

R. Lally regardindiil .

Correspondence from MM Development dndFree's
counsel regarding Nevada Supreme Court's decisio
manpower cell phones.

0.50 hrs
9.60 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.10 hrs

4.20 hrs

2.70 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE10

155.00
3,840.00

465.00

93.00

341.00

1,680.00

837.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/14/20

07/15/20

07/15/20

07/15/20

07/15/20

07/15/20

07/15/20

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs' Motion For Order Requirinc
The Dot To Supplement And Recertify The
Administrative Record, to Permit Plaintiffs Tofexf
ExtraRecord Evidence at the Hearing Of Judicial
Review, and To Enlarge Time For Filing Opening
Brief; Plaintiffs' Proposed Findings of Fact and
Conclusions of Law; J. Pupo's Motion for Protective
Order and Request to Testify Remotely; Thrive's Ei¢
Amended Prdlrial Disclosures.

Attend DOT court hearing (telephonic); Review
preparation of opening statement; Begin review of
material for trial preparation; Review court filings;
Review Qualcann findings of fact and conctus of
law; Review DOT opening slides; Review depo
transcripts; Telephone conference with Kirill
Mikhaylov; Review exhibits and exhibit lists; Genera
preparation for trial

Attend hearing on J. Pupo's Motion for Protectiveléd
and Department of Taxation's Motion to Vacate
Evidentiary Hearing.

Telephone conferences with C. Rose and M. McClure
regardin

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar (il
]

Analyze prior pleading of various Nevada marijuana
cases in preparation to opening statements and tria

Analyze Qualcan LLC's Proposed Findings of Fact ¢
Conclusions of Law, correspondence regarding
Qualcan's Opening Statement.

2.50 hrs

9.60 hrs

0.60 hrs

1.00 hrs

1.00 hrs

2.40 hrs

0.60 hrs

PAGE11

775.00

3,840.00

186.00

310.00

310.00

744.00

186.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/16/20

07/16/20

07/16/20

07/16/20

07/17/20

07/17/20
07/18/20

07/18/20

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM
MAL

LCR

Attend Court hearing (supposed to be trial Day 1 but 6.80 hrs
trial was continued to next day); Conference with Jared

Kahn regarding settlement; Conference wthill

Mikhaylov regardindiiEE; Further

preparation of opening statement; Brief review of

Serenity Plaintiffs' opening statement; Telephone

conference with Steve Shevorski; Review pleadings and

filings; Emails with clients; Telephone conference with

Jared Kahn; Email to Rob Lally and Matt McClure;

Review various opening argument slides

Attend beginning of trial with opening statements 2.20 hrs
moved to following day due to partial settlement.

Discussions with C. Rose regard llIIIIIIEENEGEGEGEEE 2.80 hrs

|

Analyze Plaintiffs, Defendants, and Joint trial exhibit 3.30 hrs
in preparation to trial.

Attend Trial Day 1; Telephone coménce with Pete 8.90 hrs
Christiansen

Attend trial. 8.10 hrs
Extensive strategy call with Chris Rose regarding 1.00 hrs
I

Telephone conference with Martin Little; Telephone 7.30 hrs

conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review emails from
counsel; Review Qualcann pleadings; Review rules
regardindii ;. Recview case law
regardindJ ; Extensive additional telephone
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Extensive telephone
conference with Matt McClure; Additional telephone
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov

PAGE12

2,720.00

682.00

868.00

1,023.00

3,560.00

2,511.00
535.00

2,920.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -660601

07/18/20

07/18/20

07/18/20

07/19/20

07/19/20
07/19/20

07/19/20

07/19/20
07/19/20

07/20/20

07/20/20
07/20/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

JY

MAL
LCR

KVM

KVM
KVM

LCR

KVM
KVM

Legal research regard
S ——

Telephone conferences with C. Rose regarding
!
Telephone conference with M. McClure and C. Rose
regardin
I

Prepare for and attend teleconference regarding
.
Extensive conference with Chris Rose and Jay Young

Further review an research of issues relating to

I T clephone conference
with Jay Young, Martin Little, Kirill Mikhaylov

regardindl; Tclephone conference with
board, Tom McKennie, Chris Nevan, Rob Lally, Matt
McClure, Warn Willis, Kirill Mikhaylov

Telephone conference with C. Rose, J. Young, and M.

Little regardindiil .

Telephone conferences with C. Rose.

Telephone conference with Wellness Connection's
owners and board members regardii N

Attend Trial Day 2 (attended full day but billed reduced

hours)
Attend trial.

Email to M. McClure regardiniill
I

4.30 hrs

1.10 hrs

1.80 hrs

1.00 hrs

1.00 hrs
3.20 hrs

1.00 hrs

0.50 hrs
1.60 hrs

4.80 hrs

8.00 hrs
0.40 hrs

PAGE13

1,333.00

341.00

558.00

490.00

535.00
1,280.00

310.00

155.00
496.00

1,920.00

2,480.00
124.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/21/20 LCR Review documents, file; Review various court filings
Emails with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review TGIG plaintiff's
supplemental list of exhibits; Telephone conference
with Kirill Mikhaylov

07/21/20 KVM Attend trial.

07/21/20 KVM Telephone conference with C. Rose regar{iilil
I

07/22/20 LCR Review filings; Messages with Kirill; Outline
strategy/argument points; Attend Trial Day 4
07/22/20 KVM Attend trial.

07/23/20 LCR Review deposition of Steve Gilbert and prepare for
Gilbert examination; Attend Trial Day 5; Telephone
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Telephone
conference with State Attorney Steve Sheviorsk

07/23/20 KVM Attend Trial.

07/24/20 LCR Review various filings; Email to Rob Lally and Matt
McClure regardin(illEEEEEEEEEN /(tcnd

Trial Day 6
07/24/20 KVM Attend trial.
07/25/20 LCR Review emails from Todd Bice; Review emails from

Nate Rulis; Review emails from Dominic Gentile

07/27/20 LCR Review emails from counsel regarding witness orde
Review plaintiff and defense trial exhibits; Attend Tr
Day 7 (Until 3:45pm); Review Exhibits; Review
Kluever testimony transcript

07/27/20 KVM Attend Trial.

0.70 hrs

7.60 hrs
0.40 hrs

4.60 hrs

7.70 hrs
5.60 hrs

3.80 hrs
3.70 hrs

7.40 hrs
0.30 hrs

7.30 hrs

1.20 hrs

PAGE14

280.0

2,356.00
124.00

1,840.00

2,387.00
2,240.00

1,178.00
1,480.00

2,29400
120.00

2,920.00

372.00



PAGE15

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/27/20 KVM Analyze Plaintiffs’ deposition designations, Plaintiffs 2.40 hrs 744.00
exhibits, and trial protocol in preparation toiRtdf
playing video depositions at trial.

07/28/20 LCR Review filings; Review THC motion for preliminary 1.00 hrs 400.00
injunction; Telephone conference with Kirill
Mikhaylov; Review emails regarding witness order

07/28/20 KVM Attend Tiial. 7.10 hrs 2,201.00

07/28/20 KVM Analyze Herbal Choice's Application for Temporary 0.70 hrs 217.00
Restraining Order.

07/29/20 LCR Review Pupo motion for protective order; Review 1.50 hrs 600.00

various filings; Telephone conference with Kirill
Mikhaylov; Telephone @nference with Matt McClure;
Review settlement article, Nevada Current

07/29/20 KVM Attend Trial. 7.40 hrs 2,294.00

07/29/20 KVM Telephone conferences with C. Rose and M. McClure  0.80 hrs 248.00
regardin

07/30/20 LCR Review various emails from opposing counsel; Revi 6.90 hrs 2,760.00

Essence opposition to motion to admit injunction
hearing evidence; Review MM/Live Free opposition
motion for injunction against settlement; Telephone
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review Helping
Hands joinder to opposition to motion for injunction;
Review Thrive and DOT oppositions to motion for
injunction; Review settlement agreement between
settling plaintiffs and defendants; Extensive telepho
call with Matt McClure and Kirill Mikhaylov; Review
THC reply in support of motion for injunction; Revie\
TGIG joinder to motion for injunction; Telephone
conference with Matt McClure, Melissa Waite, Kirill
Mikhaylov



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -660601

07/30/20
07/30/20

07/30/20
07/30/20

07/30/20

07/31/20

07/31/20

KVM
KVM

KVM
KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

Attend Trial.

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar{iiilil

Analyze Partial Settlement Agreement.

Telephone conference with M. McClure and C. Rose
regardind
Telephone conference with M. Waite, C. Rose, and M.

McClure regardin G
L

Prepare for court; Attend DOT Trial Day #11;
Conference with Matt McClure; Attend Tax
Commission hearing

Analyze Herbal Choice's Application for Temporary
Restraining Order and Reply thereto, TGIG's Joinder to
Herbal Choice's Application for Temporary Restraining
Order, Department of Taxation's Opposition to Herbal
Choice's Application; Attend trial; Discussions with M.

McClure and C. Rose regardi il
I, /\ttend Tax Commission

hearing

Total Fees For This Matter

EXPENSES:

Online ResearchWestlaw

Online ResearchWestlaw 7/10/20
Online ResearchWestlaw 7/13/20
Online ResearchWestlaw 7/14/20

4.70 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.90 hrs
1.00 hrs

0.60 hrs

7.80 hrs

9.20 hrs

PAGE16

1,457.00
62.00

279.00
310.00

186.00

3,120.00

2,852.00

98,658.00

135.85
1,182.75
523.45
251.75



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -660601

Online ResearchWestlaw 7/16/20
Online ResearchWestlaw 7/18/20
Online ResearchWestlaw 7/19/20
Online ResearchWestlaw 7/22/20

Total Expenses For This Matter

BILLING SUMMARY:
TOTAL FEES:

TOTAL EXPENSES
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL:

PAGE17

407.55
2,832.90
1,162.80
1,572.25

$ 8,069.30
$ 98,658.0C
$ 8,069.30
$ 106,727.3C




September 11, 2020
Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
3615 Spring Mountain Road
Las Vegas, NV 89102
Billed through 08/31/20
Bill Number 118880 - 00003%6422

In re DOT (D.H. Flamingo)

Balance forward $
Payments received since last bill (last payment 08/20/20) $
Net balance forward $

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

08/01/20 LCR Review various filings 0.20 hrs

08/01/20 KVM Analyze Nevada Wellness Center's Trial Brief Purst 2.10 hrs
to EDCR 7.27.

08/01/20 KVM Analyze Qualcan, LLC's Trial Brief Regarding the 0.40 hrs

'HSDUWPHQWYTV 5DQNLQJ RI $S!

08/01/20 KVM Analyze Nevada Wellness CeviHI& IV 7ULDO 0.20 hrs
Memorandum Regarding Waiver of Attorn€&jient
Privilege, Work Product Doctrine and Mental
Impressions.

08/01/20 KVM $QOH HYDGHOO QHHYWMHEY YV 7ULDO 0.20 hrs
Memorandum Regarding Waiver of the Department
7 DD W L R Qtfd/Dénhahi Claw Back.

211,478.30
211,478.30

0.00

80.0
651.00

124.00

62.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -664292

08/03/20

08/03/20
08/03/20

08/03/20

08/03/20

08/03/20
08/04/20

08/04/20
08/04/20

08/04/20

LCR

KVM
KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM
LCR

KVM
KVM

KVM

Review Nevada Wellness motion to strike GreenMa
supplemental pretrial disclosures; Review MM
Development supplemental pretrial disclosures; Atte
Trial Day 12; Conferences with Matt McClure; Revie
exhbit list from court clerk; Emails with Nate Rulis

Attend Trial.

Analyze Deep Roots Medical, LLC's Trial Brief on
Plaintiffs' Untimely Disclosures.

Analyze Deep Rots Medical, LLC's Objections to M}
Development Company, Inc. and Livfree Wellness,
LLC's Fourth Supplemental Pretrial Disclosures.

Analyze Plaintiffs' MM Development Company, Inc.
and Livfree Wellness LLC's Fifth Supplement to
Pretrial Disclosures.

Email from J. Gutierrez regarding witness schedule.

Attend Trial Day 13; Review exhibit list from court

clerk for exhibits entered Day 13; Review list of client

representatives from each party; Review NRCP 52
regarding motion for judgment on the pleadings;
Review emails from counsel; Research regarjiilil

Email Matt McClure; Telephone conference with Kirill

Mikhaylov; Review Allen Puliz deposition; Begin
preparation of letter to CCB objecting to settlement
agreement

Attend trial.

Prepare list of corporate representative for each par
the case.

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar

5.70 hrs

7.10 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

11.40 hrs

4.10 hrs
0.50 hrs

0.40 hrs

PAGE3

2,280.0C

2,201.0C
62.00

31.00

62.00

31.00
4,560.0C

1,271.0C
155.00

124.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -664292

08/04/20

08/04/20

08/04/20

08/04/20

08/04/20

08/05/20

08/05/20

08/05/20

08/05/20

08/05/20

08/05/20

08/05/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Emails from D. Gentile and T. Bice regarding witnes
order and Plaintiffs resting their case.

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs' Openingrief in Support of
Petition for Judicial Review.

Analyze Clear River, LLC's Opposition to Plaintiffs'
Motion for Order Requiring the DOT to Supplement
and Recertify The Administrative Record.

Analyze Nevada Wellness Center, LLCs Motion to
Strike on an Order Shortening Time.

Analyze Herbal Choice's Motion To Strike MM
Development and Livfree Wellness' Fifth Supplemel
Pretrial Disclosure.

Attend Trial Day #14; Further preparation of letter tc
CCB; Review deposition of Allen Puliz; Prepare for
crossexamination of Allen Puliz

Analyze deposition transcripts of Plaintiffs' 30(b)(6)
witnesses in preparation togsenting testimony at tria

Analyze admitted exhibits to ascertain all evidence
admitted against Wellness Connection of Nevada, L

Analyze Department of Taxation's Opposition to
TGIG's Motion b Supplement the Administrative
Record.

Research of consolidated dockets to determine bon
amounts paid by each Plaintiff.

Legal research regardi il
I
I

Emails from parties counsel regarding W. Anderson
testimony and K. Cronkhite.

0.20 hrs

1.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

9.80 hrs

1.30 hrs

0.90 hrs

0.40 hrs

1.60 hrs

2.80 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGEA4

62.00

372.00

93.00

93.00

124.00

3,920.0C

403.00

279.00

124.00

496.00

868.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -664292

08/06/20

08/06/20

08/06/20

08/06/20

08/06/20

08/06/20

08/06/20

08/06/20

08/07/20

08/07/20

08/07/20

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

Attend Trial Day 15; Review case law for CCB letter
Emails with Melissa Waite; Extensive telephone
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov

Analyze Joint Motion to Release Funds on Order
Shortening Time.

Analyze, edit, and legal research to finalize commer
the Cannabis Compliance Board.

Additional legal research regardi | N
.
I

Telephone conference with C. Rose regarding
|

Analyze Department of Taxation's Response to Nev
Wellness Center, LLC's Trial Memoranda on Allege:
Claw Back Waivers.

Anayze TGIG Plaintiffs' Motion to Preclude
Application of the Equitable Maxim of Unclean Hanc

Emails from M. Waite regardiniii

Review CCB regulations; Revievarious emails from
plaintiff counsel and defense counsel; Attend CCB
meeting for approval of settlement agreement;
Telephone conference with Chris Nevan and Matt
McClure; Telephone conference with all defense
counsel

Analyze the new Nevada Cannabis Compliance
Regulations.

Attend the Cannabis Compliance Board hearing.

10.70 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.40 hrs

1.50 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.10 hrs

4.30 hrs

1.30 hrs

2.20 hrs

PAGES

4,280.0C

93.00

434.00

465.00

217.00

124.00

217.00

31.00

1,720.0C

403.00

682.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -664292

08/07/20

08/07/20

08/07/20

08/07/20

08/07/20

08/07/20

08/09/20

08/09/20
08/10/20

08/10/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM
LCR

KVM

Telephone conference with M. McClure, C. Nevada,

and C. Rose regardi /i
I

Telephone conference with Defendants' counsel
regarding Defendants' case strategy.

Telephone conference with C. Rose regarding exhit
and withesses for Defendants' case.

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs' Opposition to Joint Motion 1
Release Funds on Order Shortening Time.

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs' Reply to the Department of
7TDDWLRQHDQ G L&YAHU //&TV 2SSR
3O0DLQWLIIgrOré& RegiRr@g the Departmel
to Supplement and Recertify the Administrative
Record.

Emails from parties counsel regarding witness sche
and defense strategy.

Analyze ETW Plaintiffs' Replyn Support of Joint
Motion to Release Funds on Order Shortening Time
and Opposition to Countermotion for Order Dispens
With the Bond Requirements for Purposes of the
Preliminary Injunction Order.

Emails regarding S. Gilberttestimony.

Review motion to make CCB party defendant; Revie
draft oppositions to TGIG motion regarding equitabl:
relief, Review Plaintiffs' reply in support of motion to
release bond; Attend Trial Day 16; Review letter froi
Dominic Gentile with proposed order granting partia
summary judgment and finalizing preliminary
injunction

Attend trial.

0.60 hrs

1.00 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.80 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs
7.30 hrs

6.20 hrs

PAGEG

186.00

310.00

155.00

93.00

248.00

62.00

93.00

62.00
2,920.0C

1,922.0C



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -664292

08/10/20

08/10/20

08/10/20

08/10/20

08/10/20

08/10/20

08/10/20

08/11/20

08/11/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

Analyze THC Nevada, LLC's Motion for Partial
Substitution of DefendaRursuant to NRCP 25 on
Order Shortening Time.

Analyze Deep Roots Medical LLC's Limited
Opposition to Motion to Preclude Application of the
Equitable Maxim of Unclean Hands Against the TGl
Plaintiffs.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Opposition to TG
Plaintiffs' Motion to Preclude Application of the
Equitable Maxim of Unclean Hands against TGIG
Plaintiffs.

Analyze the Essence Entities’ Opposition to Motion
PrecludeApplication of the Equitable Maxim of
Unclean Hands Against the TGIG Plaintiffs.

Analyze the Essence Entities' Brief Regarding
Judgment on Partial Findings against Plaintiffs Purs
to NRCP 52(c).

Analyze correspondence from TGIG Plaintiffs' coun:
regarding Order Granting Partial Summary Judgmel
Finding of Undisputed Facts and Conclusions of La\

Analyze Thrive's Motions for Judgment on Partial
Finding as to claimssaerted by remaining Plaintiffs.

Attend DOT Trial Day 17; Review various emails fro
opposing counsel; Review Essence brief on Rule 52
motion; Review Thrive motions on Rule 52(c); Revie
DOT brief on Rule 52(c) motion; Reswv various
witness depositions for designations for testimony

Attend trial.

0.40 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.60 hrs

9.80 hrs

8.30 hrs

PAGE7

124.00

93.00

93.00

62.00

62.00

93.00

186.00

3,920.0C

2,573.0C



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -664292

08/11/20 KVM Analyze Department of Taxation's Brief in Support c
its Motion for Directed Verdict Against All Remaining

Plaintiffs.

08/11/20 KVM Analyze Department of Taxation's Notice of Removi

Entities from Tier 3.

08/11/20 KVM Analyze Nevada Organic Remedies' Motion to Modi

the Preliminary Injunction on Order Shortened Time
08/11/20 KVM
08/12/20 LCR

Prepare deposition designations to play at trial.

Attend Trial Day 18; Further preparation of closing
argument; Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Brief
review of MM Development supplemental disclosure
documents; Bview letter from David Koch; Review
letter and order regarding summary judgment and
permanent injunction from Dominic Gentile; Review
Helping Hands' motion to modify injunction

Attend trial.
Discussion with C. Rose regard il N

Analyze Plaintiffs' MM Development Company, Inc.
and LivFree Wellness LLC's Sixth Supplement to
Pretrial Disclosures Pursuant to NRCP 16.1(a)(3).

Email M. McClure regardiriiill
|

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs' proposed findings of fact ar
conclusions of law.

08/12/20 KVM
08/12/20 KVM
08/12/20 KVM

08/12/20 KVM

08/12/20 KVM

08/13/20 LCR Telephone conference with Matt McClure; Rawi
various filings; Review NOR objection to order;

Review TGIG objection to order

08/13/20 KVM Analyze Department of Taxation's proposed finding:

fact and conclusions of law.

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.90 hrs
5.20 hrs

3.20 hrs

1.00 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.60 hrs

1.40 hrs

PAGES

93.00

93.00

62.00

279.00
2,080.0C

992.00

310.00

186.00

62.00

217.00

240.00

434.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -664292

08/13/20
08/13/20

08/13/20

08/13/20

08/13/20

08/13/20

08/14/20

08/14/20

08/14/20

08/14/20

KVM
KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze Clear River, LLC's TridBrief.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Response to Nev
Wellness Center, LLC's Trial Memorandum on Allec
Waiver of AttorneyClient Privilege, Work Product,
and Mental Impressions.

Analyze Mdion Requesting Judicial Signature on the
Proposed Order for Voluntary Dismissal of Tryke.

Analyze Helping Hands Wellness Center, Inc's Moti
to Modify or Dissolve the Preliminary Injunction.

Analyze Objection to TGIG Plaintiffs' Proposed Orde
Granting Partial Summary Judgment Findings of
Undisputed Facts and Conclusions of Law.

Begin drafting Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Trial Brief.

$QOH HSDUWPHRWLRIQAM[ORWLF
S5 HRQVLGHUDWLRQ RI &&RXUW(YV
on Declaratory Relief on Order Shortening Time.

Analyze THC Nevada, LLC and Herbal Choice, Inc.
Motion to Strike Department dfaxation's Notice
Removing Entities From Tier 3 On Shortening Time

Analyze Order Granting Motion for Partial Substituti
of Defendant Pursuant to NRCP 25 on Order
Shortening Time.

Email to M. McClure regardinjill N

1.90 hrs
0.20 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

2.30 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE9

589.00
62.00

31.00

93.00

31.00

713.00

155.00

124.00

31.00

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -664292

08/14/20

08/14/20

08/14/20

08/15/20

08/15/20

08/15/20

08/15/20

08/15/20

08/15/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze Department of Taxation, TGIGaRitiffs, and
Clear River's supplemental findings of fact and
conclusions of law.

Analyze Nevada Organic Remedies Opposition to
Motion to Strike Department of Taxation's Notice
Removing Entities from Tier 3 on Order Shortening
Time.

Continue drafting Wellness Connection of Nevada,
LLC's Trial Brief.

Further preparation of closing argument; Review trie
transcript

Analyze Order Regardingdmntiff Nevada Wellness
&GHQWHU //&TV ORWLRQ IRU 6XP
Claim for Relief.

Email to M. McClure regardinji N
I
|

Analyze THC Nevada, LLC and Herbal Choice, Inc.’
Opposition to Helping Hands Wellness Center, Inc."
Motion to Modify or Dissolve the Preliminary
Injunction on Order Shortening Time.

Analyze THC Nevada, LLC and Herbal Choice, Inc.'
Reply to Nevada Organic Remedies' Opposition to
Motion to Strike DOT's Notice Removing Entities fro
Tier 3.

Analyze Department of Taxation's Opposition to TH
Nevada, LLC and Herb&hoice, Inc.'s Motion to
Strike Department of Taxation's Notice Removing
Entities from Tier 3 on Order Shortening Time.

0.40 hrs

0.20 hrs

2.80 hrs

4.90 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE10

124.00

62.00

868.00

1,960.0C

93.00

31.00

62.00

62.00

93.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -664292

08/15/20

08/16/20

08/16/20

08/16/20

08/16/20

08/16/20

08/17/20

08/17/20

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

Continue drafting Wellness Connection of Nevada,
LLC's Trial Brief.

Furtherpreparation of closing statement; Review tria
testimony; Review Qualcan trial brief and findings o
fact and conclusions of law; Prepare slide presentat
for closing; Telephone conference with Kirill
Mikhaylov; Review and revise trial brief; Additional
telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review
DOT motion for reconsideration of injunction/summe
judgment; Review THC motion to strike DOT tier
designation; Review Nevada Organic opposition to
motion to strike; Review THC reply in support of
motionto strike; Review Helping Hands' reply in
support of motion to modify injunction

Analyze closing argument outline and Power Point
presentation.

Telephone conferences with C. Rose regardingraos
argument.

Revise and finalize Wellness Connection of Nevada
LLC's Trial Brief.

Analyze Helping Hands' Reply in Support of Motion
modify or Dissolve the Preliminary Injunction.

Review Rural Remedies opposition to state motion;
Review THC reply in support of motion to strike;
Prepare for trial; Attend Day #19

Analyze THC Nevada, LLC and Herbal Choice, Inc.’
Reply to Department ofaxation's Opposition to
Motion to Strike Notice Removing Entities From Tiel
3.

3.90 hrs

8.50 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.50 hrs

3.70 hrs

0.30 hrs

8.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE11

1,209.0C

3,400.0C

186.00

155.00

1,147.0C

93.00

3,320.0C

62.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -664292

08/17/20

08/17/20
08/17/20

08/18/20

08/18/20

08/20/20

08/21/20

08/23/20

08/24/20

08/25/20

KVM

KVM
KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

LCR

LCR

Analyze Lone Mountain Partners, LLC's Opposition
Motion to Strike Department of Taxation's Notice of
Removing Entities from Tier 3.

Attend trial.

Analyze Rural Remedies, LLC's Opposition to
Department of Taxation's Motion for Reconsideratio
of Court's Summary Judgment Order on Declarator
Relief on Order Shortening Time.

Attend Trial Day #20
Attend trial.

Analyze Defendant Criterion Claim Solutions of
Omaha, Inc.'s Opposition to Plaintiff's Motion For
Reconsideration and/or Clarification of t@eurt's July
22, 2020 Order Regarding Criterion Claim Solutions
Omabha, Inc.'s Motion to Compel Arbitration.

Review TGIG parties' opposition to DOT motion for
reconsideration of order granting partial summary
judgment on 5%ule

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs' Opposition to Department ¢
Taxation's Motion for Reconsideration of Court's
Summary Judgment Order on Declaratory Relief.

Review minute order regarding Nevada Wedse
motion for sanctions; Review emails regarding vaca
of DOT motion for reconsideration; Review jury
services invoice; Telephone call with clients/board;
Review minute order setting hearing for petition for
judicial review;

Review order setting Phase 1 trial; Emails with Rob
Lally and Matt McClure; Review injunction order;
Review order granting partial summary judgment

0.20 hrs

7.70 hrs
0.20 hrs

3.70 hrs

3.80 hrs

0.70 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.80 hrs

1.40 hrs

0.50 hrs

PAGE12

62.00

2,387.0C
62.00

1,480.0C

1,178.0C

217.00

160.00

248.00

560.00

200.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 060003 -664292

08/26/20 LCR Review THC motion for release regarding bond;
Telephone conference with MaticClure

08/27/20 KVM Analyze Defendant Deep Roots Medical, LLC's
Answering Brief in Opposition to Petition for Judicial
Review.

08/27/20 KVM Analyze Department of Taxation's Reply Respondin
TGIG Plaintiffs' Petition &r Judicial Review.

08/28/20 LCR Review order denying TGIG motion to supplement
record on review

08/28/20 KVM Analyze Renewed Joint Motion to Release Funds ol
Order Shortening Time.

08/31/20 LCR Review trialnotes, pleadings, and documents; Revie
Circle S notice of final licensure; Review order
dismissing appeal

08/31/20 KVM Analyze Helping Hands' Response in Opposition to
Motion to Renew Joinder to TGIG's Countermotion 1
Order Dispensinghe Bond Requirement for Purpose
of Preliminary Injunction.

Total Fees For This Matter

Professional Courtesy Discount

Net Fees For This Matter

EXPENSES:

Copies- Legal Copy Cats & Printig Copies, Side Tabs and Binders
Filing fee Rose/Business Court Answer Fee

0.50 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.30 hrs

PAGE13

200.00

341.00

186.00

80.00

93.00

200.00

93.00

$

$

68,188.00

(6,818.80)

61,369.20

986.92
1,483.00
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Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 060003 -664292

Online ResearchWestlaw 7/28/20 271.70
Online ResearchWestlaw 7/31/20 135.85
Online ResearchWestlaw 815.10
Online ResearchWestlaw 815.10
Online ResearchWestlaw 8/16/20 2,517.50
Online ResearchWestlaw 8/17/20 135.85

Total Expenses For This Matter $ 7,161.02

BILLING SUMMARY:

TOTAL FEES: $ 68,188.0C
Professional Courtesy Discount (6,818.80)
TOTAL EXPENSES $ 7,161.02
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL: $ 68,530.22
TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE: $ 68,530.22
APPQ



October 12, 2020

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

3615 Spring Mountain Road
Las Vegas, NV 89102

Billed through 09/30/20

Bill Number 118880060003 -666852

In re DOT (D.H. Flamingo)

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

09/01/20

09/01/20

09/01/20

09/03/20

09/03/20

09/0320

LCR

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

Attend telephonic hearing of Motion to release bond
Email clients

Analyze Clear River LLC's Brief to Supplemehet
DOT's Opposition to the Petition for Judicial Review

Analyze Plaintiffs' Renewed Joint Motion to Release
Funds on Order Shortening Time.

Begin review of judge’s ruling, findings of fact,
conclwsions of law, permanent injunction; Telephone
conference with Matt McClure; Telephone conferen:
with Tom McKennie, Chris Nevan, Matt McClure

Attend hearing on Circle S’ Notice to Take Judicial
Notice.

Analyze Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law a
Permanent Injunction.

0.30 hrs

1.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

2.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.00 hrs

120.00

372.00

62.00

1,040.00

62.00

310.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -666852

09/03/20

09/03/20

09/07/20

09/08/20

09/08/20
09/08/20

09/08/20

09/08/20

09/08/20

09/10/20

09/10/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM
KVM

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

Telephone conference with M. McClure regarding

Telephone conference with Wellness Connection of
Nevada, LLC's board, M. McClure, and C. Rose

regardinc

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs' OpenmBrief in Support of
Petition for Judicial Review in preparation to attendi
Petition for Judicial Review phase of trial.

Review TGIG petition for judicial review; Attend
petition for judicial review trial; Telephone call thi
Kirill Mikhaylov; Telephone conference with Matt

McClure

Attend Petition for Judicial Review phase of trial.

Telephone conference with M. McClure and C. Rose
regardin
Telephone conference with C. Rose regar il

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar (il

Legal research regardi GG
I

Review minute order denying TGIG request for OST on
motion to amend; Review TGIG motion to amend;
Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Research

regarding
Legal research regardi il

0.80 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.80 hrs

2.70 hrs

3.80 hrs
0.90 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

1.80 hrs

1.00 hrs

4.10 hrs

PAGE3

248.00

124.00

248.00

1,080.0C

1,178.0C
279.00

62.00

62.00

558.00

400.00

1,271.0C



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -666852

09/10/20
09/10/20

09/11/20

09/13/20

09/14/20

09/14/20

09/15/20

09/15/20

09/15/20
09/16/20
09/16/20

09/16/20

09/16/20

09/17/20

KVM
KVM

LCR

KVM

LCR

KVM

LCR

KVM

SEK
LCR
KVM

KVM

SEK

LCR

Analyze TGIG Plaintiffs' Motion to Amend FFCL.

Telephone conference with C. Rose regar{iillilll
|

Strategize regardinlll ; Brief review of DOT's
proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law on
petition for judicial review

Telephone conference with C. Rose regarding Plaintiff's
Opposition to Motion to Stay and arguments for Six-
Eleven Defendants' Reply in Support of Motion to Stay.

Review minute order regarding DOT proposed findings

Analyze Helping Hands' Objection to the Release of
Bind.

Conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Telephone
conference with Matt McClure; Review various filings

Discussion with S. Kish regardijiil
L

Researc/ G

Review Rural Remedies order to sever case

Analyze Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law for
Petition for Judicial Review phase of trial.

Email to M. McClure, R. Lally, C. Nevan, and T.

McKennie I
|

Researc/ G Ccgin

drafting memo re: same.

Review various joinders to TGIG motion; Review letter
from Circle S counsel; Review stipulation regarding
release of bond; Review draft memorandum of costs

0.40 hrs
0.30 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.50 hrs

0.10 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.60 hrs
0.10 hrs
0.40 hrs

0.10 hrs

1.30 hrs

0.60 hrs

PAGEA4

124.00
93.00

80.00

155.00

40.00

93.00

120.00

124.00

177.00
40.00
124.00

31.00

383.50

240.00



Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -666852

09/17/20 SEK ResearclllllEEEEEEEEEEEE . 'V isc

summary memo of research findings, send same to
Kirill Mikhaylov and discuss

09/18/20 KVM Legal research regardijiill
I

09/18/20 KVM Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's
Memorandum of Costs.

09/19/20 KVM Continue drafting Wellness Connection of Nevada,
LLC's Memorandum of Costs and revieuwpporting
documentation and exhibits.

09/21/20 LCR Review TGIG motion; Conference with Kirill
Mikhaylov

09/21/20 KVM Discussion with C. Rose regardilllll S
|

09/21/20 KVM Revise Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's
Memorandum of Costs.

09/22/20 LCR Review DOT notice of entry of judgment
09/22/20 KVM Attend Nevada Cannabis Compliance Board meetin

09/22/20 KVM Draft Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's Respo
to TGIG Plaintiffs' Motion to Amend FFCL and
Countermotion to Clarify and/or for Additional
Findings.

09/23/20 LCR Telephone conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review
Rural Remedies brief regding costs; Review and
revise Wellness response to TGIG motion; Email
clients

0.30 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.70 hrs

1.60 hrs

1.30 hrs

1.10 hrs

0.40 hrs

0.10 hrs
1.40 hrs
1.10 hrs

1.30 hrs

PAGES

88.50

124.00

217.00

496.00

520.00

341.00

124.00

40.00
434.00
341.00

520.00



PAGEG

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -666852

09/23/20 KVM Continue drafting Wellness Connection of Nevada, 6.90 hrs 2,139.0C
LLC's Response to TGIG Plaintiffs' Motion to Amen
FFCL and Countermotion to Clarify and/or for
Additional Findings.

09/23/20 KVM Telephone conference with C. Rose regar{iilllllli 0.40 hrs 12400

09/24/20 LCR Further preparation of response to TGIG motion and 2.80 hrs 1,120.0C
request for clarification of ruling; Review "judgment”
filing; Review filings from other parties; Telephone
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov regardinjiiilill
I Review Lone Mountain Partners
opposition to motion to amend; Review case law
regarding NRCP 52; Additional telephone conference
with Kirill Mikhaylov; Telephone call with Rob Lally
and Matt McClure; Review DOT opposition to motion
to amend; Review Greenmart Joinder; Review Helping
Hands opposition; Review transcript of motion to strike
notice of realigning tiers hearing; Further revisions to
response and countermotion to clarify or make
additional findings

09/24/20 KVM Telephone conferences with C. Rose regarding 1.00 hrs 310.00




Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC

Attn: Robert Lally

Bill number 118880 60003 -666852

09/24/20

09/24/20

09/24/20

09/25/20

09/25/20

09/25/20

09/25/20

KVM

KVM

KVM

LCR

KVM

KVM

KVM

Analyze Clark Natural's Joinder to TGIG Plaintiffs'
Motion to Amend FFCL; Lone Mountain Partners,

Department of Taxation, and the Essence Entities’
Oppositions to TGIG Plaintiffs' Motion to Amend

FFCL; Greenmart's Joinder to Department of Taxation's
Opposition; transcript for Motion to Strike Department

of Taxation's Notice to Remover Entities from Tier 3;
and legal research regard il N

Finalize Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC's
Response to TGIG Plaintiffs' Motion to Amend FFCI
and Countermotion to Clarify and/or for Additional
Findings.

Telephone conference with M. McClure and R. Lally
regardin
.
. . |
I

Review TGIG motion to retax; Review Tryke motion
release bond; Emails with Kirill Mikhaylov; Telephor
conference with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review

memorandum of costs; Additional telephone confere
with Kirill Mikhaylov; Review draftletter to all counse

Telephone conferences with C. Rose regarding

Telephone conference with J. Smith regarding Well
Connection of Neada, LLC's Memorandum of Costs

Draft correspondences to all parties regarding Wellr
Connection of Nevada, LLC's Memorandum of Cost

2.60 hrs

1.70 hrs

0.30 hrs

1.30 hrs

0.60 hrs

0.20 hrs

0.20 hrs

PAGE7

806.00

527.00

93.00

520.00

186.00

62.00

62.00



PAGES

Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC
Attn: Robert Lally
Bill number 118880 00003 -666852

09/29/20 LCR Review Lone Mountain memorandum of costs; Revi 0.30 hrs 120.00
THC respons to Helping Hands objection to release
bond; Review joinder of settling plaintiffs to DOT
opposition to TGIG motion

Total Fees For This Matter $ 18,615.00
EXPENSES:

Online ResearchWestlaw 9/8/20 3,032.40
Online ResearchWestlaw 9/20/20 407.55
Online ResearchWestlaw 9/22/20 367.65
Online ResearchWestlaw 9/24/20 135.85
Online ResearchWestlaw 9/25/20 135.85

Total Expenses For This Matter $ 4,079.30

BILLING SUMMARY:

TOTAL FEES: $ 18,615.0C
TOTAL EXPENSES $ 4,079.30
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL: $ 22,694.3C
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DISTRICT COURT

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA

In Re: D.O.T. Litigation

DEPT NO: XI

A-18-785818-W
A-18-786357-W
A-19-786962-B
A-19-787035-C
A-19-787540-W
A-19-787726-C
A-19-801416-B

~_— ~— ~— ' ~— ~—

Consolidated with:

VIDEOTAPED DEPOSITION OF DEMETRI KOURETAS

30(b) (6) FOR TGIG, LLC

LAS VEGAS,

NEVADA

THURSDAY, MARCH 12, 2020

REPORTED BY: BRITTANY CASTREJON, RPR, CRR, NV CCR #926

JOB NO. :

607211

CASE NO: A-19-787004-B




DEMETRI KOURETAS, 30 (B(6)

- 03/12/2020

Page 2 Page 3
1 VIDEOTAPED DEPOSITION OF DEMETRI KOURETAS, held 1 APPEARANCES (Continued) :
2 at Litigation Services, located at 3770 Howard Hughes 2 For the ETW Entities:
3 Parkway, Suite 300, Las Vegas, Nevada 89169, on 3 BROWNSTEIN HYATT FARBER SCHRECK
4 Thgrsday, Marchllz, 2020,‘ ?t 9:11 a.m., beforel 4 BY: ﬁiﬁM?E?;’q g:%-\Z, ESQ.
5 Brittany Castrejon, Certified Court Reporter, in and for TROY DOMINA, ESQ.
6 the State of Nevada. 5 100 North City Parkway
7 Suite 1600
8 APPEARANCES : 6 Las Vegas, Nevada 89106
9 For MM Development and LivFree Wellness: . 72213253;;101
abu s.com
10 KEMP, JONES & COULTHARD mfetaz@bhfs.com
BY: NATHANAEL RULIS, ESQ. 8 tdomina@bhfs.com
11 IAN McGINN, ESQ. 9 For the Thrive Entities:
3800 Howard Hughes Parkway 10 MAIER GUTIERREZ & ASSOCIATES
12 Seventeenth Floor BY: JOEY MOTT, ESQ.
Las Vegas, Nevada 89169 11 3816v8pan1s3 nggeg?‘{jgue
as Vegas, Nevada
13 702-385-6000 12 702-629-7900
n.rulis@kempjones.com jnmemgalaw.com
14 i.mcginn@kempjones.com 13
15 For the Essence Entities: 14 PRINCE LAW GROUP
16 PISANELLI BICE, PLLC BY: DENNIS PRINCE, ESQ.
BY: TODD BICE, ESQ. 15 CORRINE MURPHY, ESQ.
10801 West Charleston Boulevard
17 400 South Seventh Street 16 Suite 560
Suite 300 Las Vegas, Nevada 89135
18 Las Vegas, Nevada 89101 17 702-534-7600
702-214-2100 cmurphyethedplg.com
19 tlb@pisanellibice.com 18 )
20 For Nevada Organic Remedies, LLC: 19 For Lone Mountain Partners:
20 H1 LAW GROUP
21 KOCH & SCOW, LLC BY: ELIAS GEORGE, ESQ.
BY: DAVID KOCH, ESQ. 21 ERIC HONE, ESQ.
22 11500 South Eastern Avenue 701 North Green Valley Parkway
Suite 210 22 Henderson, Nevada 89074
23 Henderson, Nevada 89052 70?‘608‘5913
702-318-5040 23 el}sas@hllawgroup.com
eric@hllawgroup.com
24 dkoch@kochscow. com 24
25 25
Page 4 Page 5
1 APPEARANCES (Continued) : 1  APPEARANCES (Continued):
2 For QualCan: 2 For the Serenity Entities:
3 CHRISTIANSEN LAW OFFICES 3 CLARK HILL, PLLC
BY: WHITNEY BARRETT, ESQ. BY: JOHN HUNT, ESQ.
4 810 South Casino Center Boulevard 4 ROSS MILLER, ESQ.
Suite 104 3800 Howard Hughes Parkway
5 Las Vegas, Nevada 89101 5 Suite 500
702-240-7979 Las Vegas, Nevada 89169
6 wbarrett@christiansenlaw.com 6 702-862-8300
7 jhunte@clarkhill.com
For GreenMart of Nevada NLV, LLC: 7 rmiller@clarkhill.com
8 8
McLETCHIE LAW For Nevada Wellness Center:
9 BY: CAYLA WITTY, ESQ. 9
701 East Bridger Avenue PARKER, NELSON & ASSOCIATES
10 Suite 520 10 BY: THEODORE PARKER, III, ESQ.
Las Vegas, Nevada 89101 2460 Professional Court
11 702-728-5300 11 Suite 200
alina@nvlitigation.com Las Vegas, Nevada 89128
12 12 702-868-8000
13 For Clear River, LLC: tparker@pnalaw.net
14 BLACK & LOBELLO 13
BY: BRIGID HIGGINS, ESQ. 14 For Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC:
15 ANDREW DUNNING, ESQ. 15 HOWARD & HOWARD
10777 West Twain Avenue BY: KARSON BRIGHT, ESQ.
16 Suite 300 16 3800 Howard Hughes Parkway
Las Vegas, Nevada 89135 Suite 1000
17 702-869-8801 17 Las Vegas, Nevada 89169
bhiggins@blacklobello.com 702-257-1483
18 adunning@blacklobello. law 18 kdb@h2law.com
19 19
For Helping Hands Wellness Center: For the State of Nevada:
20 20
JK LEGAL & CONSULTING, LLC STATE OF NEVADA ATTORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICE
21 BY: JARED KAHN, ESQ. 21 BY: AKKE LEVIN, ESQ.
9205 West Russell Road 555 East Washington Boulevard
22 Suite 240 22 Suite 3900
Las Vegas, Nevada 89148 Las Vegas, Nevada 89101
23 702-708-2598 23 702-486-3420
jkahnejk-legalconsulting.com alevin@ag.nv.gov
24 24
25 25

Litigation Services
www.litigationservices.com

800-330-1112



DEMETRI KOURETAS, 30(B(6) - 03/12/2020
Page 6 Page 7
1 APPEARANCES (Continued) : 1 INDEX OF EXAMINATION
2 For Jorge Pupo: 2 WITNESS: DEMETRI KOURETAS
3 McDONALD  CARANO 3 EXAMINATION PAGE
BY: DIANE WELCH, ESQ. X
4 By Mr. Bice 10
4 2300 West Sahara Avenue
Suite 1200 5 By Mr. Parker 314
5 Las Vegas, Nevada 89102 6 By Mr. Koch 334
702-873-4100 7 By Mr. Bright 384
6 dwelch@mcdonaldcarano.com 8 By Ms. Levin 391
7 9 By Mr. Kahn 410
8 Also Present: Terrell Holloway, Videographer
10 By Mr. Hunt 414
Frank Hawkins, Nevada Wellness Center
9 11 By Mr. Bice 429
10 12 By Mr. Koch 436
11 13 By Mr. Hunt 440
12 14
13 15
14 16
15
17
16
17 18
18 19
19 20
20 21
21 22
22
23
23
24 24
25 25
Page 8 Page 9
1 INDEX OF EXHIBITS 1 Las Vegas, Nevada; Thursday, March 12, 2020
2 WITNESS: DEMETRI KOURETAS 2 9.11
3 NUMBER DESCRIPTION PAGE : a.m.
4  EXHIBIT 188 TGIG Attachment A (Continued) 22 3 -000-
Recreational Marijuana Establishment 4 THE VIDEOGRAPHER: This is the beginning of
5 Owner (OR), Officer (OF), Board Member o . he d L b
(EM) Names, DOT-TGIG000012-000013 5 Media Number 1 in the deposition 30(b) (6), TGIG, LLC,
6 6 Demetri Kouretas, in the matter of In Re: DOT
EXHIBIT 189 DOT044105-DOT044110 34 | 7 Litigation, held at Litigation Services on
7
EXHIBIT 190 Hand Drawn Organizational Chart 44 8  March 12, 2020, at 9:11 a.m.
8 9 The court reporter is Brittany Castrejon. I
EXHIBIT 191 Notice of Videotaped Deposition of 95 10 am Terrell Holloway, the videographer, an employee of
9 TGIG, LLC, Pursuant to NRCP 30(b) (6) o ) )
10  EXHIBIT 192 Page of Handwritten Notes of 236 |11 Litigation Services.
Mr. Ritter's meeting, lunches, and call 12 This deposition is being videotaped at all
11 with Mr. Pupo . ces .
4 ) 13 times unless specified to go off the video record.
12 EXHIBIT 193 Mr. Pupo's Calendar Entries 247
DOT053015, DOT053017, DOT053018, 14 Would all present please identify themselves
13 DOT053033 15 beginning with the witness.
14 EXHIBIT 194 Governor's Task Force on the 341 .
. . 16 THE WITNESS: Demetri Kouretas.
Implementation of Question 2: The
15 Regulation and Taxation of Marijuana 17 MR. HUNT: John Hunt on behalf of TGIG, Bar
Act, Final Report May 30, 2017 18  Number 1888.
16 AA 011408-AA 011428; AA 011520-AA 011521 19 MR. MILIER R Mill behalf of TQIC
17 EXHIBIT 195 TGIG Binder of Documents 364 : : oss Filler on be ° '
18 20 MS. WELCH: Diane Welch on behalf of
19 21 Jorge Pupo.
20
21 22 MS. LEVIN: Akke Levin for the State
22 23  Department of Taxation.
23 24 MS. WITTY: Cayla Witty on behalf of
24
25 25  GreenMart.

Litigation Services
www.litigationservices.com

| 800-330-1112



DEMETRI KOURETAS, 30(B(6) - 03/12/2020
Page 386 Page 387
1 facts that it showed Wellness Comnection any favoritism, 1 A. I don't have any facts. I've not reviewed their
2 but I do -- from testimony, the facts are the 2 application.
3 applications were never reviewed for their completeness 3 Q. And do you have any evidence to support that
4 or factual truth. 4 Wellness Connection was involved with this alleged
5 Q. And that's from the preliminary injunction 5 corruption?
6 hearing? That's what you're referring to? 6 A. No, I do not.
7 A. Yes, it is. 7 Q. Okay. Do you have any facts or evidence to show
8 Q. Aside from the preliminary injunction hearing, 8 that Wellness Connection did anything improper or
9 you don't have any facts to support -- to support 9 wrongful to taint the influence of the application
10 the kind of -- that the Department showed Wellness 10 process?
11 Connection any favoritism; is that correct? 11 A. No, I do not.
12 A. No. I've not reviewed their applications, so I 12 Q. Okay. And you mentioned that you didn't review
13 wouldn't make that statement. 13  Wellness Connection's application.
14 Q. And as you sit here today, do you have any 14 So do you have any facts or evidence to show that
15 evidence that the Department showed any favoritism 15 Wellness Connection's application was incomplete or
16 towards Wellness Connection? 16 insufficient in some form or manner?
17 A. No, I do not. 17 A. No.
18 Q. In your second amended complaint, you also allege |18 Q. So earlier you mentioned your advisory board. I
19 that there was corruption and/or wrongdoing during the 19 would like to know who -- who was on your advisory
20 application process specifically with regard to the 20 board?
21 reviewing, the scoring, and the approval of the 21 A. I did not have an advisory board in my
22 applicationms. 22 application.
23 As you sit here today, what facts do you have to 23 Q. No, but it -- you did mention that the -- you did
24  show that Wellness Connection was in any way -- was in 24 create an advisory board; correct?
25 any way involved with this alleged corruption? 25 A. Back in the 2014 medical application, we had an
Page 388 Page 389
1  advisory board. 1 MR. BRIGHT: Yeah. I forgot what number it
2 Q. Okay. And who was on that advisory board? 2 was.
3 A. I believe there was a few members on there. 3 MR. BICE: He has it in front of him.
4 John Ritter, Amanda Connor, I believe. There was a few 4 Mr. Koch and I have moved it. Oh, well, that's because
5 people on there. 5 David -- there.
6 Q. And when did the -- so you said it existed in 6 MR. BRIGHT: Thank you.
7 2014. When did that advisory board disband, I guess? 7 MR. BICE: Sorry.
8 A. 2015/'16 time it disbanded. 8 MR. BRIGHT: Not a problem.
9 Q. And what was the purpose of having that advisory 9  BY MR. BRIGHT:
10 board back in 2014? 10 Q. And if -- if I'm not mistaken, I believe -- was
11 A. To help -- to help get the business up and 11 it -- which -- which areas -- scratch that.
12 ruming and consult in the -- since it was new -- since 12 What areas did you -- do you believe that you did
13 marijuana was new for everyone involved, it was just to 13 not score -- score adequately in?
14  help to have some extra opinions about the industry in 14 A. Specifically the first two sections, the
15 operating the business. 15 financial plan and the organizational structure.
16 Q. Okay. And was there any specific reason that you | 16 MR. HUNT: Just for the record, a
17 disbanded that advisory board? 17 clarification. Are you saying what areas did they not
18 A. I believe it was not needed anymore. That was 18  score him adequately?
19  the main reason for it. 19 MR. BRIGHT: In his opinion -- yeah, what
20 Q. Okay. Earlier you testified to the fact that you |20 areas -- what areas did he -- did he feel that he should
21 didn't believe that you received the proper scoring on 21 have received a better score.
22 your application; is that correct? 22 MR. HUNT: Right. Yeah.
23 A. Yes. 23 BY MR. BRIGHT:
24 Q. Specifically with regard to -- excuse me. 24 Q. So for the financial plan, you received a
25 MR. BICE: I know what you're talking about. |25 financial score of 32.67.

Litigation Services
www.litigationservices.com

| 800-330-1112



DEMETRI KOURETAS, 30(B(6) - 03/12/2020
Page 442 Page 443
1 BY MR. HUNT: 1 THE VIDEOGRAPHER: Off the video record at
2 Q. Okay. It also stated that everyone had to be 2 6:11.
3 background checked; correct? 3 (Proceedings concluded at 6:11 p.m.)
4 A. Yes. 4
5 MR. BICE: Object to form. 5
6 MS. LEVIN: Same objection. 6
7 MR. KAHN: Object to form. 7
8 THE WITNESS: Sorry. Yes. 8
9 BY MR. HUNT: 9
10 Q. And you remember in the gaming, it was during the | 10
11  '70s, that they required Lefty Rosenthal to come forward | 11
12 for licensing, and he was not an owner of the Stardust. 12
13 Do you recall that? 13
14 MR. KAHN: Object to form. Relevance. 14
15 MS. LEVIN: Outside the scope of the notice. |15
16 THE WITNESS: Yes, I do and then, obviously, |16
17  through the movie Casino. 17
18 (Laughter. ) 18
19 MR. HUNT: All right. Okay. 19
20 THE WITNESS: For a little laughter there. 20
21 MR. HUNT: I don't have any further 21
22 questions. 22
23 MR. BICE: Thank you, sir. 23
24 THE WITNESS: You're welcome. Thank you. 24
25  Thank you. 25
Page 444 Page 445
1 STATE OF NEVADA ) 1 ERRATA SHEET
) Ss: 2
2 COUNTY OF CLARK ) 3 I declare under penalty of perjury that I have
3 CERTIFICATE OF REPORTER 4 read the foregoing _~ pages of my testimony, taken
4 I, Brittany J. Castrejon, a Certified Court s on (date) at
5 Reporter licensed by the State of Nevada, do hereby
6 certify: That I reported the VIDEOTAPED DEPOSITION OF ¢ feityl, {state),
7 DEMETRI KOURETAS, on Thursday, March 12, 2020, at 7 and that the same is a true record of the testimony
8 9:11 a.m.; 8 given by me at the time and place herein above set
9 That prior to being deposed, the witness was duly 9 forth, with the following exceptions:
10 sworn by me to testify to the truth. That I thereafter 10
11 transcribed my said stenographic notes into written 11 Page Line Should read: Reason for Change:**
12 form, and that the typewritten transcript is a complete, 12 (See below before completion)
13 true and accurate transcription of my said stenographic 13
14 notes. That the reading and signing of the transcript
15 was requested. 1
16 I further certify that I am not a relative, 15 _
17 employee or independent contractor of counsel or of any 16
18 of the parties involved in the proceeding; nor a person e
19 financially interested in the proceeding; nor do I have 18
20 any other relationship that may reasonably cause my 19
21 impartiality to be questioned. 20 -
22 IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have set my hand in my 21
office in the County of Clark, State of Nevada, this 2
23 29th day of March, 2020.
94 23 o
24
25 Brittany J. Castrejon, RPR, CRR, CCR #926 |25

Litigation Services
www.litigationservices.com

| 800-330-1112
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DISTRICT COURT

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA

In Re: D.O.T. Litigation, )
)
)
)
) Case No.
J)A-19-787004-B

)

) Consolidated with:
J)A-18-785818-W
J)A-18-786357-W
J)A-19-786962-B
J)A-19-787935-C
JA-19-787540-W

) A-19-801416-B

)

VIDEOTAPED DEPOSITION OF
30(b) (6) THC NEVADA, LLC
ALLEN J. PULIZ
LAS VEGAS, NEVADA

MONDAY, MARCH 9, 2020

REPORTED BY: KATHERINE M. SILVA, CCR #203
JOB NO: 607006A
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1 VIDEOTAPED DEPOSITION OF 30 (b) (6) THC 1 For the ETW Plaintiffs:
2 NEVADA, LLC, ALLEN J. PULIZ, taken at 3770 Howard 2 BROWNSTEIN HYATT FARBER SCHECK,
3  Hughes Parkway, Suite 300, Las Vegas, Nevada on LLp
4 MONDAY, MARCH 9, 2020 at 9:04 a.m., before 3 BY: MAXIMILIEN D. FETAZ, ESQ.
5 Katherine M. Silva, Certified Court Reporter, in 4 éﬁgtgoiggo(:lty Parkway
g and for the State of Nevada. Las Vegas, Nevada 89106
5
8  APPEARANCES: , For Wellness Connection
9 For Nevada Organic 6 Of Nevada, LLC:
Remedies, LLC: 7 HOWARD & HOWARD ATTORNEYS PLILC
10 KARSEN BRIGHT, ESQ.
KOCH & SCOW, LLC 8 3800 Howard Hughes Parkway
11 BY: DAVID R. KOCH, ESQ. Suite 1000
11500 South Eastern Avenue 9 Las Vegas, Nevada 89169
12 Suite 200 10 For Qualcan LIC:
Henderson, Nevada 89052 11 CHRISTIANSEN LAW OFFICES
13 BY: PETER CHRISTIANSEN, ESQ.
For State of Nevada 12 Zl(.)tSoxilgil Casino Center
14 Department of Tax: ulte
15 OFFICE OF THE NEVADA ATTORNEY 13 Las Vegas, Nevada 89101
14 For MM Development,
GENERAL et al.:
16 AKKE LEVIN 15
Assistant Attorney General KEMP, JONES & COULTHARD, LLP
17 555 East Washington Avenue 16 BY: MADISON ZORNES-VELA, ESQ.
Suite 3900 3800 Howard Hughes Parkway
18 Las Vegas, Nevada 89101 17 17th Floor
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25 Suite 300 Suite 200
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6 Farms, LLC: 9 Ms. DelCarmen 193
7 NAYLOR & BRASTER
1 Mr. hwar 21
BY: ANDREW SHARPLES, ESQ. 0 Schwarz 6
8 1050 Indigo Drive 11
Suite 200 12
9 Las Vegas, Nevada 89145 13
10
11 14 E X H I B I T S
12 15  NUMBER DESCRIPTION PAGE
13 16  Exhibit 263 Notice 6
1? 17 Exhibit 264 CONFIDENTIAL
16 18 Exhibit 265 CONFIDENTIAL
17 19 Exhibit 266 Chart 77
18 20 EBxhibit 267  Email 97
19 i .
20 21 Exhibit 268 Emails 100
21 22 Exhibit 269 Text messages 108
22 23 Exhibit 270 Emails 112
23 24
24
25 25

Litigation Services
www.litigationservices.com

| 800-330-1112

Docket 85314 Document 2024-1%



ALLEN J. PULIZ - 30(B) (6) THC NEVADA, LLC - 03/09/2020
Page 6 Page 7

1 LAS VEGAS, NEVADA; MONDAY, MARCH 9, 2020 1 MS. ZORNES-VELA: Madison Zornes-Vela
2 9:04 a.m. 2 on behalf of MM Development and Live Free.

3 -o0o- 3 MS. DELCARMEN: Jennifer DelCarmen on
4 (The court reporter was relieved 4  behalf of Nevada Wellness Center.

5 of her duties under Rule 5 MR. BRIGHT: Karsen Bright on behalf of
6 30(b) (4) of the Nevada Rules of 6 Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC.

7 Civil Procedure.) 7 MR. SHARPLES: Andrew Sharples on

8 (Exhibit 263 marked.) 8 behalf Circle S. Farms, LIC.

9 THE VIDEOGRAPHER: This is the 9 MR. CHRISTIANSEN: Pete Christiansen
10 beginning of media number one in the deposition 10 for Qualcan.

11  of the 30(b) (6) of THC Nevada, in the matter of 11 MR. KOCH: And David Koch for Nevada
12 in re DOT litigation held at Litigation Services |12 Organic Remedies.

13 on March 9th, 2020 at 9:04. 13 Whereupon --

14 The court reporter is Kathy Silva. I 14 ALLEN J. PULIZ

15 am Dustin Kittleson, the videographer, an 15 having been first duly sworn to testify to the
16 employee of Litigation Services. 16  truth, whole truth, and nothing but the truth,
17 This deposition is being recorded at 17 was examined and testified as follows:

18 all times unless specified to go off the video 18

19 record. Would all present please identify 19 EXAMINATION
20  themselves beginning with the witness. 20 BY MR. KOCH:
21 THE WITNESS: Allen J. Puliz. 21 Q. Mister -- is it Puliz?
22 MR. FETAZ: Maximilien Fetaz 22 Puliz.
23  representing THC Nevada and ETW Plaintiffs. 23 Q. Thank you for being here today.
24 MR. SCHWARZ: Joel Schwarz, H1 Law 24 As I indicated, I represent Nevada
25 Group on behalf of Lone Mountain Partners. 25 Organic Remedies. We have had a number of

Page 8 Page 9

1 depositions and so today I'll try to ask the same | 1 here as a representative of THC Nevada LLC; is

2 questions asked before but I understand -- 2  that right?

3 It sounds like you've had a deposition 3 A. Yes.

4 taken before today? 4 Q. And will there be any other

5 A. I have. 5 representatives of THC Nevada, LLC who will

6 Q. And you understand the process that we 6 testify to the topics designated in the notice?
7 are here, I ask questions, you give answers, the 7 A. Not that I'm aware of. I'm the

8 court reporter takes down your answers? 8 managing partner of the LLC.

9 A. Yes. 9 Q. Very good.
10 Q. And we want to make sure that the 10 Do you have any questions about the
11 record is clear. So I tend to sometimes talk too | 11 deposition process today?
12 fast, I'll try and slow it down -- she's nodding |12 A. No.
13  because she knows, but try to wait until my 13 Q. Very good.
14 question is finished and you give your answer and | 14 I've given you a document that we
15 I'll wait for the answer so we can make a clear 15 marked as Exhibit 263 and, Counsel, like I said
16 record, agreed? 16 earlier, on exhibits, I'm copy deficient on most
17 A. Sure. 17 of these. If you guys want a copy, we'll get
18 Q. And you understand you are under oath 18 one, find a way to get one, but so this notice
19 to give your best and truthful testimony today? 19 Exhibit 263, Mr. Puliz, have you ever this
20 A. I do. 20  document before?
21 Q. Is there anything that would limit your | 21 A. Idon't -- yes, I have.
22  ability to provide full and accurate testimony to | 22 Q. Okay. And did you review this document
23 the best of your recollection and knowledge? 23  in preparation for your deposition today?
24 A. Not to my knowledge. 24 A. I did.
25 Q. All right. And I understand you are 25 Q. I think I got a copy that only has one
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1 MR. SCHWARZ: Join. 1 Puliz.
2 MR. PRINCE: Join. 2 Q. Puliz, excuse me.
3 THE WITNESS: I agree with that. 3 My name is Karsen Bright and I
4 Q. (BY MR. CHRISTIANSEN) just of terms of 4 represent Wellness Connection of Nevada, LLC, one
5 where you are in the process, I think you told 5 of the companies that did receive a license in
6 Mr. Koch you hope to get a license. Is that 6 this case.
7  fair? 7 I only have two or three follow-up
8 A. That's our ultimate goal and, if not, 8 questions just specifically with regard to my
9 have it thrown out and get a license with a new 9 client.
10 application process. 10 In your third amended complaint, you
11 Q. And I guess I want to ask you if you 11 allege that the Department of Taxation issued
12 were to be successful in the first part, to get a |12 conditional licenses to the winning -- the
13 license as part of in this litigation process, 13 winning defendants in an administrative -- with
14 it's not going to change your position about how |14 administrative partiality and favoritism; is that
15 the process that you went through back in 2018 15 correct?
16 was arbitrary and irrational, will it? 16 A. Yes.
17 A. It will not change my views or thoughts |17 Q. As representative of THC Nevada, what
18 that I've given today. 18 facts do you have to show that the Department
19 MR. CHRISTIANSEN: Nothing else for me, |19 showed my client, Wellness Connection, any sort
20  sir. 20 of favoritism?
21 Thank you very much. 21 MR. FETAZ: Object to form.
22 EXAMINATION 22 THE WITNESS: What is the name of your
23 BY MR. BRIGHT: 23 dispensary?
24 Q. I have two or three follow ups. 24 Q. (BY MR. BRIGHT) Wellness Connection of
25 All right. Good afternoon, Mr. Puliz. 25 Nevada, LLC doing business as Cultivate
Page 160 Page 161
1 Dispensary. 1 A. My son Nick handles it. I've had only
2 A. Oh, Cultivate. I have nothing specific | 2 a couple meetings with them. I can't think of
3 on them. My thoughts from that came from 3 their names.
4 depositions and other people that have given 4 Q. Do you know anybody who manages or owns
5 information on it, and I don't recall seeing your | 5 or participates in the operation of either of the
6 client involved in any of it. 6 Thrive Dispensaries?
7 Q. Okay. So as you sit here today, you 7 A. I met with their manager of their one
8 don't have any facts or evidence to show that the 8 on Industrial or whatever, downtown one.
9 Department showed Wellness Connection any sort of | 9 Q. Okay. The Commerce location?
10 favoritism? 10 A. Commerce location.
11 MR. FETAZ: Object to form. 11 Q. Do you know who that person was?
12 THE WITNESS: I don't even know what 12 A. I can't think of their name right now.
13 attorney they used. 13 Q. What information or facts do you have,
14 MR. BRIGHT: Okay. That's all I have. 14 as you sit here today, as a representative of THC
15 Thank you. 15 of any improper conduct by any representative of
16 EXAMINATION 16 Thrive in connection with the 2018 application
17 BY MR. PRINCE: 17 process?
18 Q. Sir, good afternoon, my name is Dennis |18 MR. FETAZ: Object to form.
19 Prince and I represent a dispensary known as 19 THE WITNESS: I have no facts that I
20 Thrive. 20  know of.
21 Have you ever heard of Thrive? 21 Q. (BY MR. PRINCE) Are you aware of any
22 A. I do. I do business with them all the |22 facts from whatever source that would suggest to
23 time. 23  you that Thrive in any way received preferential
24 Q. Okay. Who your point of contact at 24  treatment, tried to unfairly influence the
25 Thrive? 25 application process in 2018?
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1 CERTIFICATE OF REPORTER 1 ERRATA SHEET
2 STATE OF NEVADA ) 2 I declare under penalty of perjury that
)SS 3 I have read the foregoing __ pages of my
3 COUNTY OF CLARK ) 4 testimony, taken on (date)
4 I, Katherine M. Silva, a certified court 5 at (city), (state),
5 reporter, Clark County, State of Nevada, do 6 and that the same is a true record of the
6  hereby certify: That I reported the taking of the 7 testimony given by me at the time and place
7 deposition of the witness, ALLEN J. PULIZ, . . .
] 8 herein above set forth, with the following
8 commencing on MONDAY, MARCH 9, 2020, at 9:04 a.m. 5 exceptions:
9 That prior to being examined the witness was
10 by me duly sworn to testify to the truth. That I | ~°
11  thereafter transcribed my said shorthand notes into L
12 typewriting and that the typewritten transcript 12 Page  Line Should read: Reason for change:
13 of said deposition is a complete, true and L — —
14 accurate transcription of said shorthand notes. 4 -
15 I further certify that I am not a relative 5 o
16 or employee of an attorney or counsel of any of 16 o
17  the parties, nor a relative or employee of an 17 L
18 attorney or counsel involved in said action, nor 18
19 a person financially interested in the action. 19 o o
20 IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my I T
21  hand in my office in the County of Clark, State of " T T
22 Nevada, this 31st day of March, 2020. s - -
23 - -
24 23 . -
Katherine M. Silva, CCR #203 - —
25 25 o o
Page 220 Page 221
1 ERRATA SHEET (Continued) 1 HEALTH INFORMATION PRIVACY & SECURITY: CAUTIONARY NOTICE
2 Page Line Should read: Reason for change: 2 Litigation Services is committed to compliance with applicable federal
3 - - 3 and state laws and regulations (“Privacy Laws”) governing the
4 _ _ 4 protection andsecurity of patient health information.Notice is
5 — — 5 herebygiven to all parties that transcripts of depositions and legal
6 — — 6 proceedings, and transcript exhibits, may contain patient health
7 - - 7 information that is protected from unauthorized access, use and
z - - 8 disclosure by Privacy Laws. Litigation Services requires that access,
10 - - 9 maintenance, use, and disclosure (including but not limited to
11 T T 10 electronic database maintenance and access, storage, distribution/
12 T T 11 dissemination and communication) of transcripts/exhibits containing
13 T T 12 patient information be performed in compliance with Privacy Laws.
14 o o 13 No transcript or exhibit containing protected patient health
15 o o 14 information may be further disclosed except as permitted by Privacy
16 _ _ 15 Laws. Litigation Services expects that all parties, parties’
17 PR P 16 attorneys, and their HIPAA Business Associates and Subcontractors will
18 —_— —_— 17 make every reasonable effort to protect and secure patient health
19 — — 18 information, and to comply with applicable Privacy Law mandates,
20 19 including but not limited to restrictions on access, storage, use, and
2 20 disclosure (sharing) of transcripts and transcript exhibits, and
22 Date:
Signature of Witness 21 applying “minimum necessary” standards where appropriate. It is
23 22 recommended that your office review its policies regarding sharing of
24 23 transcripts and exhibits - including access, storage, use, and
24 disclosure - for compliance with Privacy Laws.
25 Name Typed or Printed 25 © All Rights Reserved. Litigation Services (rev. 6/1/2019)
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)
)
)
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)
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1 VIDEOTAPED DEPOSITION OF MICHAEL 1 For the ETW Plaintiffs:
2 VIELLION, taken at 3770 Howard Hughes Parkway, 2 BROWNSTEIN HYATT FARBER SCHECK,
3 Suite 300, Las Vegas, Nevada on FRIDAY, MARCH 6, e
4 2020 at 11:14 a.m., before Katherine M. Silva, 3 BY: TROY DOMINA, ESQ.
A . 100 North City Parkway
5 Certified Court Reporter, in and for the State of 4 Suite 1600
6 Nevada. Las Vegas, Nevada 89106
7 APPEARANCES : 5
8 For Integral Associates, LLC: For Clear River, LLC:
9 PISANELLI BICE PLLC 6
BY: JORDAN T. SMITH, ESQ. BLACK & LoBELLO
10 400 South Seventh Street 7 BY: ANDREW P. DUNNING, ESQ.
. 10777 West Twain Avenue
Suite 300 8 Suite 300
11 Las Vegas, Nevada 89101 Las Vegas, Nevada 89135
12 For State of Nevada 9
Department of Tax: For Helping Hands
13 10 Wellness Center, Inc.:
OFFICE OF THE NEVADA ATTORNEY 11 JK LEGAL & CONSULTING, LLC
14 GENERAL BY: JARED KAHN, ESQ.
AKKE LEVIN 12 92(?5 West Russell Road
15 Assistant Attorney General Suite 240
X 13 Las Vegas, Nevada
555 East Washington Avenue 14 For Wellness Connect:
16 Suite 3900 15 HOWARD & HOWARD ATTORNEYS PLLC
Las Vegas, Nevada 89101 KARSEN BRIGHT, ESQ.
17 16 3800 Howard Hughes Parkway
For Serenity Wellness Suite 1000
18 Center, LLC: 17 Las Vegas, Nevada 89169
19 CLARK HILI, PLC 18 For GreenMart of Nevada
BY: JOHN HUNT, ESQ. Lo Ve HEC
20 ROSS MILLER, ESQ. MCLETCHTE SHELL, LIC
3800 Howard Hughes Parkway 20 BY: ALINA M. SHELL, ESQ.
21 Suite 500 701 East Bridger Avenue
Las Vegas, Nevada 89169 21 Suite 520
22 Las Vegas, Nevada 89101
For The Thrive Entities: 22 .
For Nevada Organic
23 23 Remedies:
MATER GUTIERREZ & ASSOCIATES 24 KRYSTAL, SAAB, ESQ.
24 BY: DANIELLE BARRAZA, ESQ. 2550 South Rainbow Boulevard
8816 Spanish Ridge Avenue 25 Suite B
25 Las Vegas, Nevada 89148 Las Vegas, Nevada 89146
Page 4 Page 5
1 For Qualcan LLC: 1 I N D E X
2 CHRISTIANSEN LAW OFFICES 2 Witness: MICHAEL VIELLION
BY: KEELY PERDUE, ESQ.
3 810 South Casino Center 3 EXAMINATION PAGE
Suite 104 4 BY: Mr. Smith 8, 293
4 Las Vegas, Nevada 89101 5 Mr. Bright 260
5 For MM Development, )
et al.: 6 Ms. Levin 263
6 7 Mr. Hunt 283, 326
KEMP, JONES & COULTHARD, LLP 8
7 BY: IAN MCGINN, ESQ.
3800 Howard Hughes Parkway ? Ex H I B I T S
8 17th Floor 10 NUMBER DESCRIPTION PAGE
Las Vegas, Nevada 89169 11  Exhibit 259 Score package 79
? . 12 Exhibit 260 Notice 159
The videographer:
10 13 Exhibit 261 Facts 255
CHRISTOPHER BAUGH 14  Exhibit 262 Scoring 258
11 15
12
13 16
14 17
15 18
16
17 19
18 20
19 21
20
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22 23
23 24
24
25 25
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MICHAEL VIELLION - 30(B) (6) OF GBS NEVADA PARTNERS, LLC - 03/06/202
Page 6 Page 7
1 LAS VEGAS, NEVADA; FRIDAY, MARCH 6, 2020 1 GBS. Bar number 1888.
2 11:14 a.m. 2 MR. MILLER: Ross Miller on behalf of
3 -o0o- 3 GBS.
4 (The court reporter was relieved 4 MS. SHELL: Alina Shell on behalf of
5 of her duties under Rule 5 GreenMart of Nevada, LLP.
6 30(b) (4) of the Nevada Rules of 6 MR. MCGINN: Ian McGinn on behalf of MM
7 Civil Procedure.) 7  Development.
8 8 MR. DUNNING: Andrew Dunning on behalf
9 THE VIDEOGRAPHER: Good morning. 9 of Clear River, LIC.
10 This is the beginning of media number 10 MR. DOMINA: Troy Domina on behalf of
11 one in the deposition of Michael Viellion in the |11 the ETW plaintiffs.
12 matter of In Re DOT Litigation, held at 12 MS. BARRAZA: Danielle Barraza on
13 Litigation Services, 3770 Howard Hughes Parkway, 13 behalf of Thrive.
14 Suite 300, Las Vegas, Nevada 89169 on March 6th, 14 MR. BRIGHT: Karsen Bright on behalf of
15 2020 at approximately 11:14 a.m. 15 Wellness Connection of Nevada.
16 The court reporter today is Kathy Silva | 16 MR. WIGHT: Brody Wight on behalf of
17 and I am Christopher Baugh, the videographer, an |17 Nevada Organic Remedies.
18 employee of Litigation Services. 18 MR. SMITH: Jordan Smith on behalf of
19 This deposition is being videotaped 19 the Essence entities.
20 at all times unless specified to go off the 20 MR. KAHN: Jared Kahn on behalf of
21  record. 21  Helping Hands.
22 Would all present please identify 22 THE VIDEOGRAPHER: Thank you,
23 themselves beginning with the witness. 23 counsel.
24 THE WITNESS: Michael Viellion. 24 Will you please swear in the witness,
25 MR. HUNT: Yes, John Hunt on behalf of 25 Kathy?
Page 8 Page 9
1  Whereupon -- 1 under oath though; right?
2 MICHAEL VIELLION 2 A. I do.
3 having been first duly sworn to testify to the 3 Q. And that's the same oath you take if we
4  truth, whole truth, and nothing but the truth, 4 were in a court of law; right?
5 was examined and testified as follows: 5 A. Yes.
6 6 Q. And the penalties associated with that
7 EXAMINATION 7 if it's found out at a later date you are less
8 BY MR. SMITH: 8 than truthful today.
9 Q. Good morning, Mr. Viellion. 9 You understand that; right?
10 A. Good morning, Jordan. 10 A. I do, vyes.
11 Q. I know from other matters you had your |11 Q. If at any time you don't understand one
12 deposition taken before, and you also testified 12 of my questions, please let me know, it's
13 at the preliminary injunction hearing in this 13 probably unartfully asked, but if you answer one
14 case; is that right? 14 of my questions without you telling me you
15 A. Yes, that's correct. 15 misunderstood it, I'm going to assume that you
16 Q. And you are also a licensed attorney; 16 did in fact understand it. Is that fair?
17  correct? 17 A. Sure.
18 A. Nonpracticing, but, yes. 18 Q. You understand you are here testifying
19 Q. Licensed though? 19 today on behalf of GBS Nevada Partners, LLC;
20 A. True. 20 correct?
21 Q. So you know how the depo process goes 21 A. Correct.
22 so I won't read you the whole riot act. 1Is that |22 Q. And that you are the 30(b) (6) witness;
23 fair? 23 correct?
24 A. Do what you got to do. 24 A. Correct.
25 Q. All right. You understand you are 25 Q. What is your understanding of what a
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1 have that Integral entered into an invalid 1 Q. (BY MR. SMITH) All right. Thanks,

2 transfer of an interest in a marijuana 2 Mr. Viellion, about two, two and a half follow-up

3 establishment in its agreement with Green Thumb 3 questions and then I'm done.

4  Industries? 4 A. Yes, sir.

5 A. Again, these weren't one of the topics. 5 Q. Earlier you recall you gave testimony

6 So I didn't review and look into any of this 6 at the preliminary injunction hearing; correct?

7  information. 7 A. I did, yes.

8 Q. But you don't have any evidence to 8 Q. And you recall at the hearing saying --

9 determine whether the statement in paragraph 27 9 this is a quote: I'm not up here crying over
10 is true; correct? 10 sour grapes for my points, I'm here saying the
11 A. I don't have any evidence today, no. 11 process wasn't followed.

12 MR. SMITH: Two-minute break. I think |12 Is that correct still today?

13 I might be finished. Review my notes and I might |13 A. I think so, yeah. The general

14 Dbe done. 14  sentiment has been seeking and fair and impartial

15 THE WITNESS: Thank you. 15 process, sure.

16 THE VIDEOGRAPHER: We are off the 16 Q. So you are not disputing any of the

17  record. 17 specific scores that you received, your complaint

18 The time is approximately 4:59 p.m. 18 1is the process; right?

19 (Exhibit 262 marked.) 19 A. Well, I didn't do the calculations so

20 (Thereupon a brief recess was 20 I'm taking the numbers on the sheet at face

21 taken after which the following 21 value.

22 proceedings were had:) 22 Q. But you have no reason to think that

23 THE VIDEOGRAPHER: The time is 23  those individual numbers are incorrect; right?

24  approximately 5:06 p.m. 24 A. Well, I don't have any reason to think

25 We are back on the record. 25  that they are or they aren't. I didn't look at
Page 260 Page 261

1 anybody's calculations. 1 administrative impartiality and favoritism.

2 Q. That's fair enough. 2 As you sit here as a representative for

3 You would agree with me that you have 3 GBS today, what facts do you have that the

4 no guarantee that you would have received a 4 Department showed favoritism to my client,

5 1license even under a different process; correct? 5 Wellness Connection?

6 A. Certainly no guarantee. 6 A. I don't have any specific facts to your

7 MR. SMITH: All right. That's all I've | 7 <client. Favoritism was shown. I'm not sure to

8 got. 8  who.

9 Just so the record is clear, 262 is 9 Q. But you don't have any facts to support
10 just a copy of a score sheet from the State? 10 that favoritism was shown to Wellness Connection;
11 MR. HUNT: Right. 11  correct?

12 MR. SMITH: Thank you, Mr. Viellion. 12 A. I don't have any to, yeah, unsupport or
13 EXAMINATION 13 support.

14  BY MR. BRIGHT: 14 Q. As the representative of GBS, do you

15 Q. All right. Good evening, my name is 15 have any evidence to show that the Department

16 Karsen Bright and I represent Wellness Connection | 16 showed favoritism towards Wellness Connection?

17 of Nevada. 17 A. Again, I don't have any -- I don't know
18 I just have a couple follow-up 18 the other groups that well so --

19 questions specifically with regard to my client. 19 Q. So you don't have any evidence to show
20 A. Yes, sir. 20 favoritism by the Department to my client;

21 Q. So looking to the topics, we are going |21 correct?

22 to be going back to section six, and in your 22 A. I don't have any to or not to.

23 second amended complaint you allege that the 23 Q. So as you sit here today, you can't

24 Department issued conditional licenses to the 24 identify any facts or evidence that show the

25 defendants in this matter because of 25 Department showed favoritism towards Wellness
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1 Connection; correct? 1 process?

2 A. Who is Wellness Connection, can I ask? 2 A. As I sit here today, it wasn't included
3 Q. I'm one of the defendants in this 3 in my notice, so I don't have any particular
4 matter. 4  information regarding Wellness Connection.

5 A. No, I mean, like, who are the 5 Q. As you sit here today, do you have any

6 principals? 6 facts or evidence to show that Wellness
7 Q. I don't know. 7 Connection's application, that it was incomplete

8 A. Oh, okay. 8 or noncompliant?

9 Q. Sorry, I just stepped in today. 9 A. As I testified earlier, I didn't have
10 Moving on. 10 time to review everyone else's application so I
11 Also in your complaint you alleged that |11 don't think I've ever seen it.

12  there was corruption and wrongdoing on the part 12 Q. So you don't have any facts or evidence
13 of the Department, specifically with respect to 13  to be support that Wellness Connection's
14 the scoring, ranking and approvement of the 14 application was insufficient in any manner;
15 applications. 15 correct?
16 As you sit here today for GBS, what 16 A. I don't have facts or evidence one way
17 facts do you have regarding Wellness Connection 17 or the other.
18 participating in any sort of alleged corruption? |18 MR. BRIGHT: That's all I have.
19 A. I don't have any in particular 19 I'll pass the witness.
20  regarding Wellness Connection as I sit here 20 THE WITNESS: Thank you.
21  today. 21 MR. BRIGHT: Thank you.
22 Q. As you sit here today for GBS, what 22 EXAMINATION
23 facts or evidence do you have to show that 23 BY MS. LEVIN:
24 Wellness Connection had any involvement with any |24 Q. Mr. Viellion, is that how you pronounce
25 improper tainting or influence on the application |25 it, a French name?
Page 264 Page 265

1 A. It was Viellion back in the day. 1 A. Yes.

2 Q. Viellion. 2 Q. And those are the factors that are used

3 A. You can call me Mike now. 3  to rank competing applications, collectively, the
4 Q. All right. My name is Akke Levin and I | 4 factors.

5 represent the Department of Taxation in this 5 Do you see that?

6 case. I have a few follow-up questions. 6 A. Yes.

7 Are -- you referred to some notes here 7 Q. Under section B, it talks about the

8 and I was far away, so I don't know exactly what 8 diversity of the owners, officers or board

9 you had in front of you. 9 members of the proposed marijuana establishments.
10 A. It's these. It's Exhibit 261. 10 Do you see that?

11 Q. 261, right. 11 A. Yes.

12 And I just want to make sure, did you 12 MR. HUNT: Which one did you say?

13 look at anything that was -- that a heading that | 13 MS. LEVIN: B.

14 said facts related to claims by any chance? 14 MR. HUNT: Okay.

15 A. That's this one, 262. 15 Q. (BY MS. LEVIN) And I want to bring this
16 Q. Okay. Can I just look at it and make 16 up because I think that earlier on you said

17 sure we have the same? 17 something to the effect that some people were

18 Yes, absolutely. 18 told that diversity was going to be a tie breaker
19 Q. I think it is. Thank you. 19 and other people were told it was going to be

20 A. Thank you. 20 numerically scored.

21 Q. That will help. 21 Did I summarize that correctly?

22 If you can turn to the third page in to |22 A. Yeah. Somewhere -- I think it was in
23  Exhibit 261, under 17, it says there the factors |23 the -- one of the versions of the application, if
24 set forth in NAC 453B.272. 24 I remember correctly, it talked about diversity
25 Do you see that? 25 as a tie breaker.
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