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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

10/23/2018 - KBC 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith regarding Hearing, Order and
conference with opposing counsel 

- LJW 0.50 130.00
260.00/hr

Review Opposition to Motion to Consolidate Cases; preparation of
Responses to Motion to Consolidate Cases; telephone call to W
Smith regarding Hearing; Research Attorney's Fees

10/24/2018 - WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Notices from Supreme Court; review Lytles' Reply Brief in
Support of Consolidating Cases

- LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Pleadings in Appeal 

10/29/2018 - WJS 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Emails to and from R Haskin regarding Extension of Briefing Dates
and Joint Motion to Consolidate Cases; review draft Stipulations;
review Notice from Supreme Court regarding Filings

- LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Pleadings in Appeal 

11/1/2018 - WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Supreme Court; review Order Denying Motion
to Consolidate with Boulden Appeal 

11/5/2018 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Court Order 

11/7/2018 - WJS 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Email from Counsel for Disman; review letter to Court from
Counsel for Disman regarding proposed Summary Judgment
Orders; telephone call from Counsel for Disman 

11/15/2018 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Court Order regarding Jurisdiction

11/16/2018 - DEM 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith; revise Stipulation to Extend Discovery;
email from W Smith

- ELJ 0.15 39.00
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith and D Martin regarding Emergency
Motion 

- WJS 0.53 136.50
260.00/hr

Review Notices from District Court regarding Motion to Reconsider
and Order Shortening Time; review Motion; Research Caselaw,
Reconsideration and Jurisdiction Issues; email to R Haskin
regarding Hearing; conferences with E James and D Martin
regarding preparation of Response and attending Hearing

11/19/2018 - ELJ 0.95 247.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Opposition to Motion to Reconsider 

- DEM 0.25 65.00
260.00/hr

Research; email to W Smith; conference with E James 

- KBC 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Appeal Order and Order Shortening Time regarding Fees
Hearing; conference with E James; email to L Wolff 
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

11/19/2018 - LJW 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Review Motion to Reconsider and Order Shortening Time; emails
to and from Attorneys

11/20/2018 - ELJ 0.53 136.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Opposition to Motion to Reconsider and review with
L Wolff

- LJW 0.68 175.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Opposition to Motion to Reconsider; telephone call
to E James 

11/21/2018 - LJW 0.30 78.00
260.00/hr

Revisions to Opposition to Motion to Reconsider; emails to and
from E James and Clerk

11/26/2018 - LJW 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Review filed document 

- WJS 0.38 97.50
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Court and Opposition; preparation for Hearing

11/27/2018 - ELJ 0.15 39.00
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith regarding Motion to Reconsider
Attorney's Fees and Finality of Appeal

- WJS 1.08 279.50
260.00/hr

Preparation for Hearing; Appearance at Hearing on Motion to
Reconsider Fees Order and present Arguments in Opposition;
conferences with E James and D Martin re outcome and pending
Appeal Issues; review Order to Show Cause from Supreme Court;
Research Cases cited by Supreme Court; conferences with E
James and D Martin; review possible Dismissal of Appeal; emails
to and from R Haskin regarding Extension of Time for Briefing in
71698 Appeal; review draft Stipulation  

- LJW 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Telephone call with W Smith regarding Hearing and Appeal Issues

11/28/2018 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Stipulation and Order; emails to and from W Smith

12/4/2018 - KBC 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Review Supreme Court Appeal Decision; conference with W Smith
regarding Procedures and Recommendations

- LJW 0.38 97.50
260.00/hr

Review Order from Appellate Court; telephone call to W Smith
regarding Order; preparation of Response to Order to Show Cause

- WJS 0.48 123.50
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Nevada Supreme Court regarding
Boulden/Lamothe Appeal; review Order Affirming District Court;
telephone call from Counsel for Dismans regarding Issues
remaining in District Court; telephone call from L Wolff regarding
Order, coordination and analysis of Actions to resolve remaining
Appeals and Issues; conference with K Christensen

12/5/2018 - LJW 0.40 104.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Response to Order to Show Cause; Research
Consolidation and Appeals; preparation of Motion to Dismiss;
emails to and from W Smith
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

12/5/2018 - WJS 0.45 117.00
260.00/hr

Research Attorney's Fees on Appeal; review Supreme Court's
12/4/18 Order and Arguments; file notes; email to L Wolff regarding
Issues; emails to and from Haskin, Foley and Wang regarding
Supreme Court Order; coordinate Conference Call; emails from L
Wolff

12/6/2018 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Court Order regarding Extension 

- WJS 0.025               6.50
260.00/hr

Emails to and from opposing counsel regarding Conference Call
r
M
A

12/7/2018 - WJS 0.60 156.00
260.00/hr

Teleconference with Counsel (Haskin, Foley, Wang) regarding
Supreme Court Decision and potential Resolution; conference with
K Christensen; telephone call to L Wolff; review Supreme Court
filing; review CC&Rs; draft letter to R Haskin regarding Dismissal of
Appeal and Warning of Sanctions

- KBC 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith; review Appeal and Trial Procedures;
review Negotiations Issues

- LJW 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Telephone call with W Smith regarding Motions

12/10/2018 - LJW 0.50 130.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Response to Order to Show Cause; Research
Consolidation and Appeal

- WJS 0.15 39.00
260.00/hr

Email from L Wolff; review and revise letter to Haskin; email from D
Foley

12/11/2018 - LJW 0.60 156.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Response to Order to Show Cause; Research
Consolidation and Appeal

12/12/2018 - KBC 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review rescheduled Pre-Trial Conference, Calendar Call and Trial
Dates for related Case; review emails regarding Fees Brief and
Continuance Request

- LJW 0.50 130.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Response to Order to Show Cause; Research
Federal and State Rules regarding Consolidation; emails to and
from W Smith; calendar dates for Trial

- WJS 0.60 156.00
260.00/hr

Email to L Wolff; review and redline draft Response to Order to
Show Cause

12/13/2018 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Response and Stipulation

- WJS 0.40 104.00
260.00/hr

Revise and draft Response to Order to Show Cause; prepare for
filing

12/14/2018 - WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Notices from Supreme Court; email from D Foley
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

12/17/2018 - KBC 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Conference with Client regarding Appeal Issues and Lytle's Health
Extension Request 

- WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Supreme Court; review Lytle Response to
Order to Show Cause

12/18/2018 - LJW 0.25 65.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Response to Opposition to Order to Show Cause 

- WJS 0.18 45.50
260.00/hr

Emails to and from L Wolff regarding Order to Show Cause; email
to D Foley and C Wange regarding Attorney's Fee Appeal; email
from D Foley; review Stipulation for Dismissal of Remaining Claims
in District Court Case 

12/19/2018 - LJW 0.70 182.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Response to Lytle Reply to Order to Show Cause;
Research on Hearing and on Frederic case

- WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Email from C Wang regarding Stipulation for District Court Case;
email from R Haskin 

12/20/2018 - LJW 0.50 130.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Response to Lytle Reply to Order to Show Cause;
Research 54(b) Certification

12/21/2018 - LJW 0.30 78.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Response to Lytle's Reply to Order to Show Cause;
emails to and from W Smith

- WJS 0.25 65.00
260.00/hr

Review and revise Response to Lytle's Reply to Order to Show
Cause; review docket in District Court Case; email to L Wolff

12/27/2018 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Order and calendar Due Date 

- WJS 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Email from R Haskin; review proposed changes to Dismissal
Stipulation; review Notice from Supreme Court regarding Briefing
Schedule; calendar Deadlines; conference with D Martin regarding
Pre-Trial Conference

1/3/2019 - WJS 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

E-mails from opposing counsel; review Redlines to draft Stipulation 

1/7/2019 - DEM 0.13 32.50
260.00/hr

E-mails from and to W Smith; telephone calls to and from W Smith;
review file

- WJS 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Review Notice of Hearing; emails to and from and telephone calls
to and from D Martin regarding Pre-Trial Conference; emails to and
from opposing counsel regarding Stipulation; review draft

1/8/2019 - WJS 0.60 156.00
260.00/hr

Prepare for Pretrial Conference; Meeting with D Foley regarding
Stipulation; Appearance for Pre-Trial Conference in Department 9
(D Barker); conference with D Foley regarding Fees and Costs;
telephone call from C Wang regarding Appeal Issues, Fees and
Costs; conference with K Christensen
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

1/8/2019 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Court Order 

1/15/2019 - LJW 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Review Stipulation and Order; telephone call to W Smith regarding
Brief

- WJS 0.18 45.50
260.00/hr

Review Notices from Supreme Court and Opening Brief filed by
Lytle's in Case No. 76198; telephone call to L Wolff regarding
Issues on Appeal, substance of Lytle's Brief; and preparation of
Response Brief

1/16/2019 - LJW 1.03 266.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Appellant's Brief 

- WJS 0.15 39.00
260.00/hr

Review Notices from District Court; review Boulden & Lamothe
Memo of Costs and Motion for Fees

1/17/2019 - WJS 0.30 78.00
260.00/hr

Review and notate Lytle's Opening Brief

1/18/2019 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Court Pleadings 

1/19/2019 - LJW 0.55 143.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Statement of Facts for Reply to Appellate Brief 

1/21/2019 - LJW 1.00 260.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Points and Authorities regarding Law of Case
Doctrine

1/22/2019 - LJW 0.53 136.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Points and Authorities regarding Equitable Orders

1/23/2019 - LJW 0.50 130.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Points and Authorities regarding Macintosh Caselaw

- WJS 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Court; review Disman's Motion for Fees and
Costs; review Docket for Hearing Dates

1/24/2019 - LJW 0.48 123.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Points and Authorities regarding Meaning of Statutes

1/28/2019 - LJW 0.28 71.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Points and Authorities regarding Meaning of
Statutes; Research "Plain Meaning Cases"

- WJS 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Supreme Court regarding Order Consolidating
Appeals; email to L Wolff regarding Response; calendar new
Deadlines

1/29/2019 - LJW 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Court Notice regarding Consolidation; calendar new Due
Dates

- WJS 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from District Court; review Lytle's Opposition to
Boulden/Lamothe Motion for Fees and Costs
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

1/30/2019 - LJW 0.30 78.00
260.00/hr

Review NRED 3 Litigation; review Opposition to Motion for Fees;
preparation of Points and Authorities regarding "Plain Meaning" of
Statutes

2/1/2019 - LJW 0.18 45.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Points and Authorities on Plain Meaning of Statute

2/4/2019 - LJW 0.18 45.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Points and Authorities on Statute; review Opposition
to Motion to Retax Costs

- WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from District Court; review Lamothe/Boulden
Opposition to Motion to Retax Costs

2/5/2019 - LJW 0.33 84.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Points and Authorities on Application of NRS
116.3117

2/7/2019 - LJW 0.58 149.50
260.00/hr

Research NRS 116.3117 and Judgment Liens

2/8/2019 - LJW 0.13 32.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Points and Authorities regarding Application of NRS
116.3117

2/11/2019 - WJS 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

E-mail from R Haskin regarding Order on Motion to Reconsider,
Analysis and Order Issues

- LJW 0.50 130.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Points and Authorities regarding Application of NRS
116.3117

2/12/2019 - ELJ 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith regarding Mootness of Order and Appeal
Issues

- WJS 0.40 104.00
260.00/hr

Conference with E James regarding Haskin's request; Research;
emails to and from R Haskin regarding Motion to Reconsider and
Extension Request; Notice from District Court and review Lytle
Opposition to Disman Fee Motion; review Notice from Supreme
Court and review Lytle Motion for Extension of Time to File Brief in
Fees Case; emails to and from L Wolff regarding Extension
Request

- LJW 0.55 143.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Summary of Facts on Answering Brief; Research
Extension of Time to Answer Attorney's Argument Brief; email to W
Smith; review Motion by Lytle regarding Extension of Time

2/13/2019 - LJW 0.20 52.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Objections to Summary of Facts in Answering Brief;
review Court Order regarding Extension of Time

- WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice and Order from Supreme Court Granting Extension;
calendar new Deadlines

2/14/2019 - LJW 0.45 117.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Objections to Summary of Facts in Answering Brief

2/18/2019 - LJW 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Review Reply to Opposition

000756

000756

00
07

56
000756

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight

wes
Highlight



Gerry R. Zobrist and Jolin G. Zobrist Family Trust 14Page

    Hrs/Rate      Amount

2/20/2019 - LJW 0.25 65.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Statement of Facts for Appellate Response 

- WJS 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Notices from District Court; review Minute Order

2/21/2019 - LJW 0.45 117.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Statement of Facts for Appellate Response

2/27/2019 - WJS 0.08 20.80
260.00/hr

Review Notice from District Court regarding Hearing on Motion for
Fees and Costs; review Docket

3/13/2019 - WJS 0.35 91.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Supreme Court and Motion to Extend;
conference with L Wolff; draft and file Response to Motion to
Extend

3/14/2019 - WJS 0.13 32.50
260.00/hr

Review Notices from Supreme Court; Research Dockets and Court
calendar regarding District Court scheduled Hearings; emails to
and from D Foley and C Wang regarding Hearing on Fees Motion

- LJW 0.20 52.00
260.00/hr

Review Motion to Extend Time; emails to and from W Smith;
telephone call to W Smith regarding Motion 

3/15/2019 - LJW 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Review Reply to Opposition; emails to and from W Smith

- WJS 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Review from Supreme Court; review Reply filed by R Haskin;
emails to and from L Wolff

3/19/2019 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Court 

4/10/2019 - WJS 0.35 91.00
260.00/hr

Preparation for and Appearance at Hearing of Fees and Costs
Motions filed by other Plaintiffs; review Notice from Court regarding
new Hearing Date before Judge Williams; emails to and from
opposing counsel

4/22/2019 - LJW 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Review filings regarding Extensions of Time; emails to and from W
Smith; calendar Due Dates

- WJS 0.20 52.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from District Court regarding Order on Stipulation to
Continue Hearing; review Notice from Supreme Court regarding
Lytle's 3rd Motion to Extend Briefing Schedule; emails to and from
L Wolff; draft and file Opposition to Motion to Continue

4/23/2019 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Motion and Opposition

4/26/2019 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Reply to Opposition

- KBC 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith regarding Extension Motion and
Opposition; calendar Hearing
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

4/26/2019 - WJS 0.15 39.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Supreme Court regarding Lytle Reply Brief;
email from D Foley regarding Issues for Hearing; conference with K
Christensen regarding status of Case and Briefing Schedule

5/2/2019 - LJW 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Court Order regarding Extension; emails to and from W
Smith

- WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Supreme Court; review Order Denying Lytle
Motion for Extension of Briefing Deadlines; emails to and from L
Wolff; email to D Foley and C Wang

5/7/2019 - WJS 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Review Notice from District Court; review Motion to Set Hearing
filed by Lytles

5/15/2019 - WJS 0.15 39.00
260.00/hr

Review emails from R Haskin; emails to and from and telephone
call from D Foley regarding Hearing; review Court Pleadings and
papers and preparation for Hearing

5/16/2019 - WJS 0.88 227.50
260.00/hr

Prepare for and attend Hearing at RJC (Judge Williams) on
Motions for Fees and Costs (other Plaintiffs); case notes; Notices
from Supreme Court regarding Lytle Opening Brief on Fees
Appeal; emails to and from L Wolff

- LJW 0.15 39.00
260.00/hr

Review Opening Brief and Appendices

5/17/2019 - WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from District Court and Minute Order Granting Fee
Motions

5/20/2019 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Court Order 

- WJS 0.38 97.50
260.00/hr

Review and annotate Lytle Opening Brief on Fees 

5/21/2019 - LJW 0.38 97.50
260.00/hr

Telephone call to W Smith regarding Answering Brief; email to
Court Clerk regarding Transcript; preparation of Answering Brief

5/22/2019 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

E-mails to and from Court Clerk 

5/28/2019 - KBC 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Judgment Renewal Notice; emails to and from Attorney 

6/3/2019 - LJW 0.70 182.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply Brief; Research Standard of Review for
Attorney's Fees and Costs on Appeal

6/4/2019 - LJW 0.40 104.00
260.00/hr

Research Law of the Case

6/5/2019 - LJW 1.00 260.00
260.00/hr

Research Law of the Case in the District of Nevada and the 9th
Circuit; preparation of Appellate Reply Brief regarding Law of the
Case
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

6/6/2019 - LJW 0.88 227.50
260.00/hr

Research Law of the Case in the District of Nevada and the 9th
Circuit; preparation of Appellate Reply Brief regarding Law of the
Case

6/7/2019 - LJW 1.75 455.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply Brief; preparation of Reply Statement of
Facts; preparation of Section regarding Reasonableness of
Attorney's Fees

6/10/2019 - LJW 1.25 325.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply Brief; preparation of Reply Statement of
Facts; preparation of Section regarding Reasonableness of
Attorney's Fees; telephone call to W Smith regarding Facts Section

- WJS 0.15 39.00
260.00/hr

Telephone call from L Wolff regarding Arguments for Appeal Brief

6/11/2019 - LJW 1.75 455.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply Brief; review and revise Citations to Law and
Record; review Transcript and add to Brief; preparation of Exhibits
for Appendix; revise Citations to Appendix

6/12/2019 - LJW 1.05 273.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply Brief; preparation of Fact Section; preparation
of Appendix

- WJS 1.93 500.50
260.00/hr

Review and Redline draft Reply Brief; draft Answering Brief on
Consolidated Appeals, Research

6/13/2019 - LJW 0.70 182.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Appendix; Citations to Record; emails to and from W
Smith

- WJS 1.63 422.50
260.00/hr

Research and draft Answering Brief; review Documents for
Respondents' Appendix, preparation of Appendix

6/14/2019 - WJS 0.45 117.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Respondents' Appendix; review and revise
Answering Brief

- LJW 0.70 182.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Appendix; revisions to Citations to Record; emails to
and from W Smith; review Appellate Rules regarding Appendices
and Documents

6/17/2019 - WJS 1.65 429.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Table of Contents; review and revise Answering
Brief; prepare Certifications; sign and prepare Brief and Appendix
for filing

6/18/2019 - WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Court; emails to and from L Wolff; review
Notice form Court

6/19/2019 - WJS 0.15 39.00
260.00/hr

Review Order, make adjustments to Brief and prepare for filing;
conference with Clerk regarding filing; review Court Notices
regarding Acceptance of Filing

- LJW 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Appellate Motion

7/15/2019 - WJS 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Emails to and from R Haskin; review Agreement and Appellant
filings
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

7/17/2019 - WJS 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Email from R Haskin; review draft Extension Stipulation; review
Notices from Supreme Court

8/5/2019 - WJS 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Emails to and from R Haskin; review and approve Stipulation

8/19/2019 - WJS 0.15 39.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Supreme Court; review Motion and Lytle Reply
Brief; email to L Wolff 

8/20/2019 - LJW 0.28 71.50
260.00/hr

Review Motions and Research Brief and Opposition

8/21/2019 - WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Emails to and from L Wolff regarding Response to Lytle Reply Brief

- LJW 0.58 149.50
260.00/hr

Review Motions and Research Brief and Opposition; emails to and
from W Smith

8/22/2019 - LJW 0.65 169.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion and Countermotion to Reply Brief and Motion
to Expand Page Limit

8/23/2019 - LJW 0.55 143.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion and Countermotion to Reply Brief and Motion
to Expand Page Limit 

8/26/2019 - LJW 0.60 156.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion and Countermotion to Reply Brief and Motion
to Expand Page Limit; emails to and from W Smith

- WJS 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Review and revise Opposition and Countermotion; review Notice
from Court  

8/27/2019 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review and download Court Order 

9/3/2019 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review and download Pleading 

9/4/2019 - WJS 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Review Supreme Court filings from Lytles; emails to and from
Counsel for Disman regarding Stay of Execution and Fees Order

9/30/2019 - WJS 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Court regarding Appeal of Attorneys Fee
Order; review Supreme Court Docket regarding Appeal

10/1/2019 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Notice of Appeal 

10/4/2019 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Notice of Appeal 

- WJS 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Court regarding Appeal of Boulden/Lamothe
Fee Order

10/22/2019 - WJS 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Review Notice from District Court regarding Stipulation to Stay
Execution, Posting on Bond; review Notice from Supreme court
regarding Association of Counsel for Lytle  
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

11/26/2019 - WJS 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Notices from Court regarding Appearance for Lytle and
request for Transcripts

12/4/2019 - KBC 0.06 16.25
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith regarding Hearing and Order Appointing
HOA Receiver 

- WJS 0.20 52.00
260.00/hr

Telephone call from K Christensen regarding Appointment of
Receiver over Association, review Case History and Minutes of
Proceedings; email to K Christensen and email to Clerk

1/13/2020 - LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Court order regarding Lamothe 

1/21/2020 - WJS 0.35 91.00
260.00/hr

Review Order from Supreme Court; Research; draft Response

1/24/2020 - WJS 0.30 78.00
260.00/hr

Conference with K Christensen and K Kearl regarding Receiver;
review Case file; email to K Christensen with documents;
conference with K Christensen 

- KBC 0.48 123.50
260.00/hr

Review Orders; Research; telephone call from Client regarding
HOA Judgment and Receiver correspondence; conference with
Client and W Smith; review CCRs, Receiver Documents and
preparation for conference with Client

1/27/2020 - WJS 0.75 195.00
260.00/hr

Research; conference with K Christensen; preparation for
conference with Clients; telephone call from C Wang; conference
with Clients; draft letter to Receiver; email to L Wolff

- KBC 0.63 162.50
260.00/hr

Review Receiver letter and Orders; review Injunction; Research;
conference with W Smith regarding Contempt, Fees, Motion to
Vacate and Sanctions; conference with Clients regarding Demand
and Motions

1/28/2020 - DEM 0.18 45.50
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith; review letter to Receiver

- WJS 0.60 156.00
260.00/hr

Emails to and from L Wolff; draft letter to Receiver; Research;
conference with D Martin regarding revisions; preparation of
Exhibits; email to K Christensen; conference with K Christensen

- KBC 0.06 16.25
260.00/hr

Review letter to Receiver and Attorney; email to Attorney;
conference with W Smith 

- LJW 0.13 32.50
260.00/hr

Review letter to Client and Court filings; email to W Smith

1/29/2020 - LJW 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

E-mails to and from W Smith

- WJS 0.13 32.50
260.00/hr

Emails to and from D Foley regarding letter from Receiver; revise
letter to Receiver; email from J Gegen; email to Clients
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

2/3/2020 - LJW 0.50 130.00
260.00/hr

E-mails to and from W Smith; preparation of Motion for Order to
Show Cause

- WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review follow-up letter from Receiver; conference with K
Christensen; email to L Wolff regarding drafting Motion

- KBC 0.06 16.25
260.00/hr

Review letter from Receiver canceling Meeting; conference with W
Smith; conference with Client

2/4/2020 - KBC 0.06 16.25
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith regarding Motion for OTSC and
Contempt; emails to and from Attorney regarding Motion; review
Hearing Notice

- WJS 0.28 71.50
260.00/hr

Review notification from Court; review Motion to Reduce to
Judgment from old Case; conference with K Christensen;
Research Dockets; conference with L Wolff regarding Motion

- LJW 0.90 234.00
260.00/hr

Telephone call with W Smith; preparation of Motion for Order to
Show Cause; Research Order to Show Cause

2/5/2020 - WJS 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

E-mail from J Gegen; review letters

- LJW 0.38 97.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion for Order to Show Cause; Research Order to
Show Cause

2/6/2020 - LJW 0.28 71.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion for Order to Show Cause; Research Order to
Show Cause

2/10/2020 - WJS 0.40 104.00
260.00/hr

E-mails to and from D Foley; review Renewed Motion to Appoint
Receiver; messages to and from L Wolff; Research

- LJW 0.53 136.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion for Order to Show Cause; Research Order to
Show Cause

2/11/2020 - KBC 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Calendar Hearing; conference with W Smith; review Motion

- WJS 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Messages to and from L Wolff regarding Receiver Report

- LJW 1.00 260.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion for Order to Show Cause; Research Order to
Show Cause

2/12/2020 - LJW 1.93 500.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion for Order to Show Cause; preparation of
Exhibits for Motion for Order to Show Cause; preparation of
Affidavits for Kearl, Zobrist and Gegan; preparation of Affidavit for
W Smith

2/13/2020 - LJW 1.08 279.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion for Order to Show Cause; preparation of
Exhibits for Motion for Order to Show Cause; preparation of
Affidavits for Kearl, Zobrist and Gegen; preparation of Affidavit for
W Smith
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

2/14/2020 - WJS 0.25 65.00
260.00/hr

E-mail from L Wolff; review and revise Motion for Order to Show
Cause

- LJW 1.03 266.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion to Intervene 

2/18/2020 - LJW 0.63 162.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion to Intervene; preparation of Affidavits

2/19/2020 - LJW 0.80 208.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion to Intervene; preparation of Affidavits

2/20/2020 - LJW 0.80 208.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion to Strike Order 

2/21/2020 - WJS 0.80 208.00
260.00/hr

Drafting and revisions to Motion for Order to Show Cause

- LJW 0.55 143.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion to Intervene 

2/22/2020 - LJW 0.45 117.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion to Intervene 

2/24/2020 - WJS 1.05 273.00
260.00/hr

Drafting and revisions to Motion for Order to Show Cause

- LJW 0.73 188.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion to Intervene 

2/25/2020 - WJS 1.30 338.00
260.00/hr

Drafting and revisions to Motion for Order to Show Cause;
Research; email to L Wolff

- LJW 0.45 117.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion to Intervene 

2/26/2020 - WJS 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

E-mails to and from L Wolff

- LJW 0.53 136.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion to Intervene 

3/2/2020 - WJS 1.50 390.00
260.00/hr

Review and revise Motion to Intervene; Research; review Notice
from Nevada Supreme Court; review Order Submitting for
Decision; draft Affidavits; review Notice from NSC; review Order of
Affirmance; conference with K Christensen; revisions to Motion for
Order to Show Cause and Motion to Intervene

3/3/2020 - WJS 0.70 182.00
260.00/hr

E-mails to and from L Wolff; review and revise Motions and
Affidavits; emails to Client regarding Affidavits; preparation of
Exhibits; meet with Zobrist and Kearl; telephone call from L Wolff

- LJW 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Review Affirmance Order from Supreme Court; telephone call to W
Smith
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

3/4/2020 - WJS 0.65 169.00
260.00/hr

Emails to and from D Foley and C Wang; Research Court Rules;
draft Bill of Costs on Appeal; Research Supersedeas Bond; notes
to file; meet with Julie Gegen regarding Affidavits; revisions to
Motions; prepare Motions and Exhibits for filing

3/5/2020 - WJS 0.18 45.50
260.00/hr

Review Notices from Court regarding Hearings, calendar and send
emails to Counsel; draft Bill of Costs; finalize and prepare for filing;
review Notices from Supreme Court

3/6/2020 - KBC 0.09 22.75
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith regarding proposed Motion and Hearing
Stipulation and Issues; review email from new opposing counsel

- WJS 0.20 52.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice; review Joinders filed by C Wang and D Foley; email
to Clients; email from D Waite regarding Stipulation to Intervene;
conference with K Christensen

3/9/2020 - WJS 0.60 156.00
260.00/hr

Research Intervention Rules; telephone call from D Waite
regarding Stipulation to Intervene; telephone call from C Wang;
telephone call from R Disman; email from D Waite and review and
redline draft Stipulation; review Court Notices

- LJW 0.03 6.50
260.00/hr

Review Pleadings; email to W Smith

3/10/2020 - KBC 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith regarding requested Stipulation to
Intervene, OTSC, Attorney's Fees and Receiver Issues; review
Attorney emails  

- WJS 0.35 91.00
260.00/hr

E-mails from D Waite regarding Settlement Offer and Stipulation on
Motion to Intervene; conference with K Christensen; draft revisions
to Stipulation; emails to and from L Wolff; emails to and from D
Waite; telephone call from D Foley; conference with Clerk
regarding Fees Statements

- LJW 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review revised Stipulation and Order; emails to and from W Smith

3/11/2020 - WJS 0.40 104.00
260.00/hr

E-mails from D Waite; review and analysis of Stipulation redline;
preparation for Status Hearing in Receiver Action; check Docket;
email to Counsel for Receiver

- LJW 0.78 201.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion to Set Aside Order 

3/12/2020 - KBC 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Conference with W Smith; preparation of Motion to Vacate Order;
review D Waitz letter to Receiver

- ELJ 0.65 169.00
260.00/hr

Meeting with W Smith regarding opposing Arguments (.7);
Research Caselaw on Unclean Hands and Fraud on Court; email
to W Smith and L Wolff with Caselaw and Arguments

- WJS 1.20 312.00
260.00/hr

Preparation for Hearing; Appearance at Status Hearing in
Receivership Case; telephone call to L Wolff regarding Motion;
email from Receiver's Counsel, review January Status Report;
letter from D Waite - analysis; conference with Clerk regarding
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

Research; conference with E James and analysis of Lytle Trust
Arguments from D Waite; review Cases; emails to and from L
Wolff; conference with K Christensen

3/12/2020 - LJW 1.13 292.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion to Set Aside Order; Research Association
Powers

- DL 0.55 68.75
125.00/hr

Research HOA Issue; email to W Smith

3/13/2020 - WJS 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

E-mails to and from L Wolff; emails to and from Clerk; review
Research notes

- LJW 1.13 292.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion to Set Aside Order; Research exceeding
Authority of CC&Rs and Statutes; emails to and from W Smith

- DL 0.65 81.25
125.00/hr

Research HOA Issues; email to W Smith

3/16/2020 - WJS 0.48 123.50
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Court; review Motion for Instruction filed by
Receiver; emails to and from L Wolff; draft
Opposition/Countermotion

3/17/2020 - WJS 0.85 221.00
260.00/hr

Draft Opposition/Motion for Receivership Case

- LJW 0.15 39.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Opposition to Motion for Receiver Order 

3/18/2020 - LJW 0.30 78.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Opposition to Motion for Receiver Order 

3/19/2020 - WJS 1.20 312.00
260.00/hr

Draft Opposition to Motion for Instruction in Receiver Case; emails
to and from L Wolff

- LJW 1.03 266.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Opposition to Motion for Receiver Order 

3/20/2020 - WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

E-mails to and from L Wolff regarding Arguments for Motion

- LJW 1.25 325.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Opposition to Motion for Receiver Order; email to W
Smith; Research CC&Rs; implied powers for LPA's

3/23/2020 - LJW 1.50 390.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Opposition to Motion for Receiver Order; email to W
Smith; Research CC&Rs; implied powers for LPA's

- WJS 0.68 175.50
260.00/hr

Review redline of Motion to Rescind Receiver Order; draft and
revise Motion; Research for Motion

3/24/2020 - LJW 0.50 130.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Opposition to Order to Show Cause
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

3/24/2020 - WJS 2.15 559.00
260.00/hr

Research, draft and revise Motion to Rescind Receiver Order;
email to L Wolff

3/25/2020 - WJS 0.30 78.00
260.00/hr

Emails to and from L Wolff; review and revise Declaration for
Opposition and Countermotion; revisions of Opposition and
Countermotion and prepare for filing

- LJW 0.80 208.00
260.00/hr

Revisions to Opposition to Receivership Motion; preparation of
Exhibits and Declarations

3/26/2020 - LJW 0.63 162.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Opposition to Order to Show Cause 

3/27/2020 - WJS 0.08 19.50
260.00/hr

Conference with L Wolff regarding Reply in Motion OSC

- LJW 0.48 123.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Opposition to Order to Show Cause;
telephone call to W Smith regarding Arguments

3/30/2020 - LJW 0.70 182.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Opposition to Order to Show Cause;
telephone call to W Smith regarding Arguments

3/31/2020 - LJW 1.23 318.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Order to Show Cause; Research Receiver
and Contempt Orders

4/2/2020 - LJW 0.45 117.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Opposition to Motion for Order to Show
Cause 

- WJS 0.15 39.00
260.00/hr

Review draft Reply on Motion for Order to Show Cause; telephone
calls to and from D Foley regarding Boulden and Lamothe

4/3/2020 - LJW 0.58 149.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Opposition to Motion for Order to Show
Cause

4/6/2020 - LJW 0.53 136.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Opposition to Motion for Order to Show
Cause

4/7/2020 - LJW 0.55 143.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Opposition to Motion for Order to Show
Cause; emails to and from W Smith; email to Clerk

- WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Notice from Receiver Court regarding Hearing Date and
Telephonic Appearance; emails to and from L Wolff; emails to and
from D Waite and P Lee; analysis of timing of Hearings between
Cases

4/8/2020 - LJW 0.75 195.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Opposition to Motion for Order to Show
Cause 

4/9/2020 - LJW 0.85 221.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Opposition to Motion for Order to Show
Cause; emails to and from W Smith; preparation of Reply to Lytle
Trust Countermotion to Receiver Motion

- WJS 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review Notices from Court; emails to and from L Wolff regarding
Reply and preparing for Hearing
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

4/10/2020 - WJS 0.28 71.50
260.00/hr

Telephone calls to and from L Wolff regarding substance of
Oppositions; draft Reply Brief; emails to and from D Waite and P
Lee regarding Hearing Date for Receiver Case; emails to and from
and telephone calls to and from L Wolff regarding Motion to Move
Hearing; review and revise draft Motion and Declaration; prepare
for filing; review Notices from Court; review Opposition from Lytle;
email to L Wolff

- LJW 1.48 383.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Opposition to Motion for Order to Show
Cause; emails to and from W Smith; preparation of Reply to Lytle
Trust Countermotion to Receiver Motion; preparation of Motion
regarding Hearing Date; preparation of Stipulation and Order to
reschedule Hearing Date

4/11/2020 - LJW 0.38 97.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Lytle Trust Countermotion to Receiver
Motion 

4/13/2020 - WJS 2.38 617.50
260.00/hr

Preparation for Oral Argument in Receiver Case; prepare
Argument outline, Research; review Court Notices; emails to and
from L Wolff regarding Appearances; review Lytle Trust's
Opposition in the Receiver Case; conference with L Wolff regarding
Reply Briefs; review and redline Reply Brief for Motion for Order to
Show Cause; emails to and from D Foley

- LJW 1.75 455.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Lytle Trust Countermotion to Receiver
Motion; telephone call to W Smith; telephone call to Court;
telephone call to CourtCall

4/14/2020 - LJW 1.85 481.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Reply to Lytle Trust Countermotion to Receiver
Motion; preparation of Reply to Receiver's Countermotion; emails
to and from W Smith; preparation of Exhibits; preparation of
Declarations; telephone call to Clerk

- WJS 1.25 325.00
260.00/hr

Revise and draft (3) Reply Briefs, Supporting Declaration and
Research in support; emails to and from L Wolff

4/15/2020 - WJS 1.20 312.00
260.00/hr

E-mails to and from Counsel for Lytle Trust and Receiver; emails to
and from L Wolff; preparation for Hearing in Receiver Case;
participate in Telephone Hearing in Receiver Case; participate in
Telephone Hearing with Judge Kishner in Receiver Case, argue
Motions; debrief with K Christensen and L Wolff

- LJW 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review filings and emails; email to W Smith

4/16/2020 - DEM 0.25 65.00
260.00/hr

Research recent Nevada HOA Caselaw; email to W Smith

4/17/2020 - WJS 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

E-mail from D Martin and review new Supreme Court Opinion

4/20/2020 - LJW 0.30 78.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion for Attorney's Fees; preparation of Motion to
Exonerate Bond
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

4/20/2020 - WJS 0.10 26.00
260.00/hr

Review NRAP regarding Remittitur and Bill of Costs; emails to and
from L Wolff regarding Fees and Costs on Appeal

4/21/2020 - WJS 1.63 422.50
260.00/hr

Emails to and from L Wolff regarding Remittitur and Fees Motion
strategy (.3); Notices from Court; review Hearing Exhibits filed by
Lytle Trust (.3); emails to and from P Lee, Counsel for Receiver
regarding participation in Hearing, letter to Court and follow up
emails (.2); prepare for Hearing on Motion for Order to Show
Cause; review Motion, Opposition, and Reply (1.4); draft oral
Argument Statement and notes (1.1); emails to and from L Wolff;
revisions to oral Argument Statement and notes; telephone call
from L Wolff (1.2); telephone call to  C Wang (1.1).; telephone calls
to and from D Foley (.2), oral Argument practice; adjustments to
statement, notes (.7)

- LJW 1.05 273.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion for Attorney's Fees; preparation of Motion to
Exonerate Bond; review outline of Hearing; telephone call to W
Smith regarding Hearing

4/22/2020 - KBC 0.06 16.25
260.00/hr

Conference with Attorney regarding Court Order and Sanctions

- WJS 1.30 338.00
260.00/hr

Prepare for Hearing; attend telephonic Hearing before Judge
Williams on Motion for Order to Show Cause and present
Argument on Motion; file notes regarding Judge's Decision (granted
Motion) for preparing Order; emails to and from C Wang and D
Foley; telephone call to L Wolff; telephone call to K Christensen;
review Docket for Minutes

- LJW 0.18 45.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion for Attorney's Fees; telephone call to W
Smith regarding Hearing

4/23/2020 - LJW 0.13 32.50
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion for Attorney's Fees; emails to and from W
Smith; review Notice

- WJS 1.08 279.50
260.00/hr

Review analysis of notes and structure of Proposed Order; review
Notice from Receiver Court; review Notice of Decision filed by Lytle
Trust; emails to and from D Foley and L Wolff; review prior Orders;
review Motion and notes from oral Argument; draft Order Granting
Motion for Order to Show Cause; emails to and from L Wolff

4/24/2020 - WJS 0.43 110.50
260.00/hr

Review and revise Order Granting Motion for Order to Show
Cause; emails to and from L Wolff; emails to and from D Foley and
C Wang

- LJW 0.95 247.00
260.00/hr

Review and revise Order on Motion to Show Cause; contact Court
Clerk regarding Transcript; preparation of Motion to Release Bond

4/27/2020 - WJS 0.40 104.00
260.00/hr

E-mail from D Foley; review Redline and incorporate changes;
email from C Wang; review Redline and incorporate changes;
revisions to draft Order; email to R Haskins and D Waite

4/28/2020 - LJW 0.05 13.00
260.00/hr

Review emails and revised Order 
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    Hrs/Rate      Amount

4/30/2020 - LJW 0.25 65.00
260.00/hr

Preparation of Motion for Fees and Costs 

For professional services rendered $37,350.80144.28

Additional Charges :

    Qty/Price

5/24/2018 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Order Granting Motion for Summary
Judgment

5/25/2018 - LJW 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Notice of Entry of Order Granting Motion
for Summary Judgment

5/31/2018 - N 0.25 50.14
200.54

WestLaw Research 5/1-5/31/2018

6/4/2018 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Motion for Attorneys Fees and Costs,
Memorandum and Declaration

6/6/2018 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Notice of Hearing on Plaintiffs' Motion for
Attorney's Fees and Costs 

6/11/2018 - N 0.25 9.00
36.00

Clark County District Court Document Downloads - 1. Defendant's
Motion Regarding-Tax Costs ($8.50); 2. Defendants' Reply in
Support of Motion to Regarding-Tax Costs ($9.50); 3. Defendants
Motion Regarding-Tax Costs (7.5); 4. Plaintiffs John Allen Lytle and
Trudi Lee Lytle's Opposition to Motion Regarding-Tax Costs
($6.50); 5. Plaintiffs John Allen Lytle and Trudi Lee Lytle's
Memorandum of Costs ($4.00)

6/15/2018 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Plaintiffs' Opposition to Defendants'
Motion to Retax and Settle Memorandum of Costs and Declaration

6/22/2018 - N 0.25 2.00
8.00

Clark County District Court Download Fee - Releases (4 - filed
June 13, 2018) Case No. A-16-747800-C

6/30/2018 - N 0.25 30.48
121.91

WestLaw Research 6/1-6/30/18

7/5/2018 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - (1.) Reply and (2.) Declaration 

7/26/2018 - N 0.25 1.50
6.00

Court Parking Expense - Motion for Fees and Costs

7/31/2018 - N 0.25 37.49
149.96

WestLaw Research 7/1-7/31/18

8/7/2018 - N 0.25 0.50
2.00

Clark County District Court Download Fee 
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    Qty/Price      Amount

8/31/2018 - N 0.25 8.21
32.85

WestLaw Research 8/1-8/31/18

9/12/2018 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

Clark County District Court - Order Regarding Plaintiffs' Motion for
Attorney's Fees and Costs 

9/13/2018 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

Clark County District Court - Notice of Entry of Order Regarding
Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs

9/24/2018 - N 0.25 1.25
5.00

Clark County District Court - Certified Copy Fee (Order Regarding
Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorneys Fees and Costs)

- N 0.25 12.50
50.00

Recordation Fee - Order Regarding Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorneys
Fees and Costs

9/30/2018 - N 0.25 9.27
37.06

WestLaw Research 9/1-9/30/18

10/1/2018 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Plaintiff's Response to Defendants'
Motion to Stay 

10/31/2018 - N 0.25 25.23
100.93

WestLaw Research 10/1-10/3118

11/21/2018 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Opposition to Defendants' Motion to
Reconsider

11/30/2018 - N 0.25 14.45
57.79

WestLaw Research 11/1-11/30/18

12/18/2018 - N 0.25 3.13
12.50

Clark County District Court Document Download Fee - Transcript of
Hearing on Motion to Reconsider

12/31/2018 - N 0.25 47.34
189.35

WestLaw Research 12/1-12/31/18)

1/31/2019 - N 0.25 9.32
37.27

WestLaw Research (1/1-1/31/19)

2/28/2019 - N 0.25 29.85
119.41

WestLaw Research February 2019

6/10/2019 - N 0.25 110.89
443.54

Reporter's Transcript Fee on Appeal

6/30/2019 - N 0.25 75.39
301.54

WestLaw Research

8/31/2019 - N 0.25 34.63
138.53

WestLaw Research

1/31/2020 - N 0.25 7.95
31.81

WestLaw Research January 2020
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    Qty/Price      Amount

2/4/2020 - N 0.25 1.38
5.50

Clark County District Court Document Download - Order on
Receivership 

2/5/2020 - N 0.25 25.49
101.97

Clark County District Court Document Download - Renewed
Application for Appointment of Receiver 

2/11/2020 - N 0.25 4.75
19.00

Clark County District Court Document Download - Initial Report and
Notice of Intent to Pay Receivers Fees and Expenses 

2/29/2020 - N 0.25 132.15
528.58

WestLaw Research - February 2020

3/4/2020 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Plaintiffs' Motion for Order to Show
Cause Why the Lytle Trust Should Not Be Held in Contempt for
Violation of Court Orders

- N 0.25 89.20
356.79

District Court Filing Fee - Motion to Intervene and Initial
Appearance Fee Disclosure 

3/11/2020 - N 0.25 1.50
6.00

Court Parking Expense at Hearing

3/26/2020 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Opposition to Receiver's Motion for
Instructions and Countermotion to Set Aside or Amend
Receivership Order

3/31/2020 - N 0.25 170.85
683.39

WestLaw Research (March 2020)

4/10/2020 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Interveners' Motion to Move Hearing Date
on Receiver's Motion for Instructions, or in the Alternative, Request
to File a Reply Brief Within Five Days of Hearing (A-18-775843-C)

4/13/2020 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Notice to Appear (A-18-775843-C)

4/14/2020 - N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Reply to Opposition to Plaintiffs' Motion
for an Order to Show Cause Why the Lytle Trust Should Not Be
Held in Contempt for Violation of Court Orders (A-16-747800-C)

- N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Interveners' Reply to Lytle Trust's
Opposition to Countermotion to Set Aside or Amend Receivership
Order  (A-16-747800-C)

- N 0.25 0.88
3.50

District Court Filing Fee - Interveners' Reply to Receiver's
Opposition to Countermotion to Set Aside or Amend Receivership
Order (A-18-775843-C)

4/15/2020 - N 0.25 12.75
51.00

CourtCall Appearance Fee - Hearing on Motion (A-18-775843-C)

4/30/2020 - N 0.25 62.72
250.87

WestLaw Research April 2020
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     Amount

Total costs $1,036.27

     Amount

For professional services rendered $38,387.07144.28

000772

000772

00
07

72
000772



Exhibit 10

Exhibit 10

000773

000773

00
07

73
000773



     1

Peggy Isom, CCR 541, RMR

(702)671-4402 - CROERT48@GMAIL.COM

Pursuant to NRS 239.053, illegal to copy without payment.

    MAY 16, 2019        BOULDEN TRUST V LYTLE TRUST

CASE NO. A-16-747800-C 
 
DOCKET U 
 
DEPT. 16  

 

 

DISTRICT COURT 

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA 

* * * * *  

MARJORIE B. BOULDEN TRUST, )
 )
           Plaintiff, )
 )
      vs. )
                               )
LYTLE TRUST, )
 )
           Defendant. )
__________________________________ )
 
 

REPORTER'S TRANSCRIPT  
OF  

MOTION FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES AND COSTS 
 
 

BEFORE THE HONORABLE JUDGE TIMOTHY C. WILLIAMS 

DISTRICT COURT JUDGE  

 

DATED THURSDAY, MAY 16, 2019 

 
 
 
 
REPORTED BY:  PEGGY ISOM, RMR, NV CCR #541 
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Peggy Isom, CCR 541, RMR

(702)671-4402 - CROERT48@GMAIL.COM

Pursuant to NRS 239.053, illegal to copy without payment.

    MAY 16, 2019        BOULDEN TRUST V LYTLE TRUST

APPEARANCES: 

FOLEY & OAKES, PC  
 

BY:  DANIEL T. FOLEY, ESQ. 
 

626 So. 8th STREET 
 

LAS VEGAS, NV 89101 
 

(702) 384-2070 
 

(702) 384-2128 
 

DAN@FOLEYOAKES.COM  
 
 
 

FIDELITY NATIONAL LAW GROUP 
 
BY:  CHRISTINA WANG, ESQ. 

 
 1701 VILLAGE CENTER CIRCLE 

 
#110 

 
LAS VEGAS, NV 89134 

 
(702) 667-3000 

 
(702) 697-2020 Fax 

 
CHRISTINA.WANG@FNF.COM  
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Peggy Isom, CCR 541, RMR

(702)671-4402 - CROERT48@GMAIL.COM

Pursuant to NRS 239.053, illegal to copy without payment.
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(702) 255-0871 

 
WES@CJMLV.COM  

 
 
 
 
FOR THE DEFENDANT: 
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SUITE 270 
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(702) 836-9800 
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* * * * *  
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LAS VEGAS, NEVADA; THURSDAY, MAY 16, 2019 

9:24 A.M. 

P R O C E E D I N G S  

* * * * * * *  

THE COURT:  All right.  We're going to move on

to the contested calendar.  Next up, page 10.  Marjorie

B. Boulden Trust, plaintiffs, versus Trudi Lytle,

et al.

THE COURT REPORTER:  Does either side want

this reported?

MR. HASKIN:  Yes, please.  Defense.

THE COURT:  Okay.  All right.  Good morning.

Let's go ahead and note our appearances for the record. 

MR. FOLEY:  Dan Foley on behalf of the

plaintiffs, Boulden and Lamothe Trusts.

MS. WANG:  Christina Wang on behalf of the

Dismans.  

MR. SMITH:  Wesley Smith on behalf of the

plaintiffs in the consolidated case.  That's the

Sandoval Trust, September Trust, the Zobrist Trust and

Dennis and Julie Gegen.  

MR. HASKIN:  Good morning, your Honor.

Richard Haskin on behalf of the Lytle Trust defendants.

THE COURT:  All right.  Once again, good09:25:26
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morning.

And it seems like this case keeps coming back.

Anyway, I see we have -- let me see here what we have

on calendar this morning.  We have -- it's my

recollection we have motion for attorney's fees,

plaintiffs' motion.

We have Robert J. Disman and Yvonne Disman's

motion for fees and costs, defendant's motion to retax

and settle memorandum of costs; is that correct?

MR. FOLEY:  That's correct.

MR. HASKIN:  That's correct.

THE COURT:  Let's go ahead and start with the

first motion, the plaintiffs' motion for fees and

costs.

MR. FOLEY:  Good morning, your Honor.  Your

Honor, I appreciate you taking this case back.  We --

obviously, it started here.  And I think the last time

we were in here, you had granted my motion for partial

summary judgment on the merits of the case.  It had

gone up on appeal.

I had a slander of title cause of action

remaining in the case.  My client was actually able to

sell her house.  We have since just dismissed that

slander of title cause of action which resolved in its

entirety my case against the other side.  They09:26:40
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dismissed a later amended counterclaim, newer

counterclaim that they brought against my client so as

to resolve it all.

In selling the house, my client, the Bouldens

sold their house to the Dismans.  And so upon that

sale, the Lytles then sued the Dismans and brought them

in.  The Zobrists and the other trust represented by

Mr. Smith are other homeowners in that same association

that actually contacted me.  I told them I couldn't

represent them because of a conflict.

So Mr. Smith came in, and then in front of

Judge Bayliss filed a similar motion for summary

judgment that you had granted, and Judge Bayliss

granted that.

My case -- your decision in my case went up on

appeal and has been affirmed by the Supreme Court.  So

now I'm back asking for attorney's fees here, and

costs.  The attorney's fees under 18.010 can be awarded

under two circumstances.  One, if there's a contract

between the parties allowing for the same; or, two, if

the Court can find that the suit was brought or

maintained without reasonable ground or to harass the

prevailing party.  We, I believe, prevail on this

motion under both bases.

The contract in this case is actually the09:28:13

 109:26:43

 2

 3

 4

 509:26:57

 6

 7

 8

 9

1009:27:18

11

12

13

14

1509:27:34

16

17

18

19

2009:27:56

21

22

23

24

25

000779

000779

00
07

79
000779



     7

Peggy Isom, CCR 541, RMR

(702)671-4402 - CROERT48@GMAIL.COM

Pursuant to NRS 239.053, illegal to copy without payment.

    MAY 16, 2019        BOULDEN TRUST V LYTLE TRUST

CC&Rs which has a provision in it that allows for the

award of attorney's fees, which provides in any legal

or equitable proceeding --

THE COURT:  For the record, that's paragraph

25?

MR. FOLEY:  Correct.

THE COURT:  Yes, okay.

MR. FOLEY:  

In any legal or equitable proceeding for

the enforcement of or to restrain the violation

of the declaration of covenants, conditions,

and restrictions, or any provisions thereof,

the losing party or parties shall pay such

amount as may be fixed by the Court in such

proceeding.

In this case, the Lytles maintained that under

the CC&Rs they were entitled to attach this judgment

that they had obtained against the association against

my client's property.

Our position and in our complaint was that

under the CC&Rs, this judgment was not recordable

against my client's properties because under the CC&Rs

any action between homeowners had to be between

homeowners directly, not against an association.  So

that, therefore, this judgment against the association09:29:28
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could not attach.

Also, both sides argued, that under the CC&Rs,

and it was found by this Court and by Judge Leavitt in

the underlying case, that this was not a regular

homeowners association.  It was a limited purpose

association.

THE COURT:  And I remember that.

MR. FOLEY:  Right.

THE COURT:  Because I remember -- this -- I

had this case, and I had another construction defect

case specifically dealing with a limited purpose

association.  And you don't see it very often.  It's

somewhat unique.

MR. FOLEY:  Right.

THE COURT:  But I felt it was a very

interesting issue.  As you remember, I kind of dug down

a little deep into it.  I wanted to make sure I had the

right answer.

MR. FOLEY:  We had a couple of very extensive

hearings --

THE COURT:  Yes. 

MR. FOLEY:  -- on this matter.  Yes.  And, of

course, under the limited -- the key under the limited

purpose association is that there's a provision that

says if it's a limited purpose association that the09:30:20
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other provisions within 116, only a few provisions

within 116 apply.  

One of them that doesn't apply is subsection

.3117 which is the provision that they relied on that

says you can record a judgment against the association

against all of the individual homeowners.

THE COURT:  Right.

MR. FOLEY:  And it will attach.  That didn't

work here.

So this action was an action to restrain their

violation of the CC&Rs, and an action on our part to

enjoin and to enforce the CC&Rs for those two reasons.

So on that basis, we're entitled to an award of

attorney's fees under that contract, the CC&Rs.

THE COURT:  Now, here's my question.  And I

guess I want to compare and contrast Chapter 18 as it

relates to prevailing party.  And we kind of -- and I

think you talked about it earlier on.  You said, Look,

Judge, there's no -- there's no reasonable grounds or

unreasonable grounds for a lawsuit.  I understand that.

I know there's another factor I can consider too.  But

it seems to me that when I read paragraph 25, there's

slightly different language there that it's not

prevailing party language.  We talk about loser.

MR. FOLEY:  Right.09:31:41
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THE COURT:  That's what it says; right?

MR. FOLEY:  Right.

THE COURT:  I'm just -- you know, and so here

we have a contract that runs with the land.  And it

says:  

In any legal or equitable proceeding for

the enforcement of or to restrain the violation

of the declaration of covenants, conditions,

and restrictions, or any provision thereof --  

And this is the language that's -- that is

different.  And I just want to get your interpretation

of that.  It says:

"The losing party or parties shall pay in

such amount as may be fixed by the Court in

such proceedings."

And what I find fascinating, number one, what

is losing party.  We'll talk about that.

But, number two, it appears to me the language

is slightly different than Chapter 18 in this regard.

Because it says losing party shall pay; right?  And

that's a slightly different analysis as to making a

determination as to whether a lawsuit was brought for

the purposes of harassment, or whatever, or whether

there was unreasonable grounds for the determination

after you determine who's a prevailing party.  Much09:32:52
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different standard appears to me.

MR. FOLEY:  It is.  It is.  And, again,

it's -- these are the two different bases that are

provided under 18.010 for an award of attorney's fees.

THE COURT:  Right.  

MR. FOLEY:  And on this one, I just got to say

absolutely consistent with this case, someone drafts

language like this that instead of using prevailing

parties, which is the norm, they have to go to losing

party.  I don't think there's any difference between

the two at the end of the day.  You're either the

prevailing party or you're the losing party.  And in

this case I don't think there's any question based on

your summary judgment and the Supreme Court's

affirmance that the Lytles are the losing party in this

battle over these CC&Rs.

THE COURT:  And so once I -- and tell me if

I'm wrong on this, Mr. Foley.  Once I make a

determination as to losing party, there's not

additional analysis, for example, whether there's

unreasonable grounds because the contract or the CC&Rs

says shall pay.

MR. FOLEY:  Well, no.  I think that --

THE COURT:  Do I have to make that

determination?09:34:00

 109:32:55

 2

 3

 4

 509:33:04

 6

 7

 8

 9

1009:33:17

11

12

13

14

1509:33:34

16

17

18

19

2009:33:48

21

22

23

24

25

000784

000784

00
07

84
000784



    12

Peggy Isom, CCR 541, RMR

(702)671-4402 - CROERT48@GMAIL.COM

Pursuant to NRS 239.053, illegal to copy without payment.

    MAY 16, 2019        BOULDEN TRUST V LYTLE TRUST

MR. FOLEY:  I think you can -- I think you can

award attorney's fees.  And I ask you to award

attorney's fees on both bases.  But you could stop it.

You could stop it with either one.  You could find

unreasonableness, and say I don't even need to reach

the issue of the contract.  Or you find it based on the

contract and say I don't need to go to

unreasonableness.  Or I think you can say both.  I'm

going to award attorney's fees on both bases that the

losing party needs to pay under the contract and the

Lytles were unreasonable in bringing and maintaining

this cause of action, or the defense of this case.

THE COURT:  I understand.

MR. FOLEY:  Okay.

So, and again, I've gone through fairly at

nauseam in the brief about the unreasonableness of this

position.  But I want to point out just a couple of

things that when my clients discovered that the

judgments had been recorded against their property,

and, of course, the Bouldens were just in the process

of trying to sell their property, so they had a cloud

on the title, communications were initiated by counsel

prior to me on October 6, 2016, with the Lytles'

counsel.  And said, Look, this is what you've done.

The .3117 limited purpose association, the whole brief,09:35:16
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if you want, was laid out, and then was ignored, and

then there was a claim of a conflict, so I got

involved.

I then wrote to counsel in November.

Basically repeated what Mr. Connaghan had previously

related to them.  And the first response I got was,

Hold on.  We have no intention of clouding title to

this property.  We'll get this resolved by Monday.

So it's okay.  In essence, you know, we're

wrong.  Give us a minute, and we'll take care of this.

Then that didn't happen.  And not only did it not

happen, my clients, because of the litigious history in

this case which goes back to 2006, offered up $50,000

to settle the case.

And then I said I'm going to file a lawsuit if

we don't get this settled.  The response was we

wouldn't settle it for 50.  Actually, my clients didn't

offer 50, but he said they wouldn't even take 50.  And

they said, and if you file a lawsuit, you will be met

with a counterclaim that includes a claim for

initiating judicial foreclosure proceedings to sell

your houses because of the judgment that we've recorded

against them.

So that's how this all starts.  The complaint

gets filed in December.  By February or March, this09:36:46
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Court had granted summary judgment on that issue.

And it was -- it was complicated but, at the

end of the day, I don't think all that difficult.  It's

complicated because the homeowners association statutes

are different and we had to wade through the limited

purpose association thing here.  

But when you look back at the underlying case

that was the Lytles' case where they got the judgment,

they have in the order they prepared for Judge Leavitt

that this was strictly a limited purpose association.

THE COURT:  Well, and I don't mind bringing

this up because I read the points and authorities.  And

one of the issues I found somewhat fascinating in this

regard is the fact that, wasn't it Judge Leavitt that

had NRED Two -- NRED One litigation; right?

MR. FOLEY:  Yes.

THE COURT:  And it appeared to me she awarded

attorney's fees and costs in that litigation based upon

the original CC&Rs and the amended CC&Rs.

And the reason why I'm bringing it up, I'm

wondering I have a question for defense counsel, but if

fees and costs could have been awarded pursuant to

those CC&Rs, why wouldn't I award them pursuant to the

CC&Rs in this case?

Because at the end of the day I think what09:38:03
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you're doing, it appeared to me, and, I guess, this

could be argued, but what you were attempting to do is

essentially enforce the original declaration of

covenants, conditions, and restrictions as set forth.

And, consequently, this was a limited purpose

association.  And as a matter of law under Chapter 116,

the fees and costs that were awarded in the prior

litigation could not attach to your client's home.

MR. FOLEY:  Correct.  And that's -- and that's

exactly what happened.  The Lytles in that underlying

case were maintaining that the original CC&Rs were the

ones that were applicable, and they won.

And the Court declared it was a limited

purpose association.  Which, again, that's their

judgment that says effectively then .3117 doesn't

apply, but they ignore that and record against us.

And then even beyond that, if you'll recall,

your Honor, you granted the summary judgment which

expunged the recorded abstracts of judgment.  At the

moment that a release of these abstracts was -- were

recorded with the Court, with the recorders' office,

the Lytles recorded a lis pendens regarding this case

within a minute after releasing the abstracts, so that

my client still could not sell their house.

Spoke with counsel.  Wrote with counsel and09:39:36
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said get rid of these.  This is nonsense.  You've

absolutely violated the spirit of this order and

everything we were trying to accomplish.  Refused to do

it.  I had to bring another motion, which your Honor

summarily granted and struck the lis pendens.

After that, they bring in the Dismans.  After

that they refuse to recognize your Honor's order in

this case with respect to the Zobrists.  And they have

to go through and file all their motions for summary

judgments.  And so some -- there is NRED Two litigation

that's involved, so there's additional issues.  But, in

essence, it's all still the same.  It's all still the

same as far as the merits of this case.

So I think that there is more than sufficient

basis for this Court to find that the Lytles throughout

the entirety of the case, even prior to my filing the

complaint, have acted unreasonable, unreasonably with

respect to maintaining their defense in this case and

filing their counterclaim against my clients.

For those reasons, your Honor, and I think

my -- there was a -- with respect to my attorney's

fees, the only thing that I think counsel really said

Well, there's a couple of things he said he thought

were unreasonable.  One, there was some duplication,

but there's not.  At a point in time in the case09:40:57
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between the Bouldens and Lamothes, I started dividing

my time so that you'll see -- you'll see duplicative

bills, but they're all for half the hourly rate.

That's my full rate.  Half goes to the Dismans --

excuse me to the Bouldens and half going to the

Lamothes.  

And then otherwise counsel complains about

some things that got filed that maybe had to be redone,

but everything was done in good faith.  Nothing was

ever started from scratch.  I think I filed a motion to

strike the judgments to begin with.  And then kind of

after a short hearing with your Honor, turned it into a

motion for summary judgment.  But all of the fees were

reasonable.  All of them were necessary.

The total of my fees are $74,320.  The total

of my costs are $1,413 and, I believe, 80 cents.

THE COURT:  What is that figure again,

1,000 --  

MR. FOLEY:  -- 413- --

THE COURT:  -- 413- --

MR. FOLEY:  I can't even read my notes.  It's

either 80 or 60 cents.

And, you know, there is quarrel by counsel

about the language with respect to costs and whether

they're awardable.09:42:24
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Language being, is this an action for the

recovery of real property or adjustment right thereto.

Contend that it is, especially based on the Lytles'

threat to judicially foreclose and dispossess my

clients of their property.

Otherwise, I rely on the remainder of my brief

on that point.  Not spending any more of the Court's

time on a $1400 cost bill.

THE COURT:  Okay.  Thank you, sir.

MR. FOLEY:  Thank you, your Honor.

MR. HASKIN:  Good morning, your Honor.  I

think the best place to start is probably in addressing

some of the Court's points that were made during

Mr. Foley's arguing and then address some of the

additional arguments.  

I would start with the premise that this is

not an action that was brought by Boulden and Lamothe

to enforce the original CC&Rs.  It's just not.

In fact, if you read their complaint, their

first amended complaint, there may be even a second

amended complaint, there's not even a mention of the

CC&Rs in there.  This is an action for quiet title,

declaratory relief, and slander of title.  That's it.

There was no mention of the CC&Rs, period.

And I think that's evidenced by the fact that09:43:42
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they did not go through the mandatory process of

Chapter 38 arbitration.  If this were an action to

enforce CC&Rs or even an action to enforce some

provision of 116, they would have had to go through

Chapter 38 ADR.  It's mandatory.

And, your Honor, if you look at the McKnight

case, the Supreme Court case --

THE COURT:  Well, tell me this.  I understand

it's mandatory, but at the end of the day it would be

up to you to make a determination as to whether motion

to dismiss should be filed because they failed to meet

the condition precedent as it relates to NRED.

MR. HASKIN:  Correct, your Honor.  We didn't

file such a motion because there's no mention of the

CC&Rs anywhere in their operative pleadings.  

Not only that, had I filed such a motion, your

Honor, under McKnight, you would have -- you would have

denied the motion to dismiss because the McKnight

ruling by the Supreme Court stands for the proposition

that a homeowner can bring a quiet title action because

it's not an action to enforce CC&Rs.  It's not an

action under Chapter 116.

THE COURT:  Here's my question.  At the end of

the day what was my decision based upon?

MR. HASKIN:  Your decision, your Honor, in the09:44:49
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partial summary judgment motion?

THE COURT:  Yes. 

MR. HASKIN:  Your decision was based on the

fact that we did not have any right to record the

abstracts of judgment pursuant to Chapter 116.

THE COURT:  Right.

MR. HASKIN:  But that was our defense this was

not an action to enforce or to restrain a violation of

the CC&Rs.

In other words, it puts -- if you look at the

language, your Honor, it puts the -- it reads from the

plaintiffs' state of mind.  An action to enforce or the

restrain the violation were they -- were the plaintiffs

seeking to enforce some provision of the CC&Rs?  No,

they weren't.  Were they seeking to restrain a

violation of the CC&Rs?  No, they weren't.  

We recorded an abstract of judgment against

their property.

THE COURT:  I understand that.  But they --

but the position that was taken by Mr. Foley, I guess,

from day one was essentially this:  Look, Judge,

pursuant to the CC&Rs, this was a limited purpose

association.  This was not a Chapter 116 association.

And, Judge -- and the only way I could make that

determination I had to review the CC&Rs in this case.09:45:57
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Then when I reviewed the CC&Rs, ultimately, I came to

the conclusion of a couple of things.  Number one, I

realize there was a decision, ultimately, by

Judge Leavitt; right?  That's controlling.

But just as important too, I read the CC&Rs.

And I say, Well, after digging a little deep and

becoming acquainted with Chapter 116 and some of the

exceptions, that's what I'll call it, I said, yeah,

relying upon the CC&Rs, this is a limited purpose

association.  As a result it would be improper as a

matter of law to file the abstract on the homes.

MR. HASKIN:  Your Honor, with due respect, I

don't think that was your decision.  And you can

revisit your order.  Your decision, your Honor, was

with respect to Judge Leavitt due to our successful

action and the Supreme Court's ultimate affirmance of

that.  Your -- you didn't have to make that decision.

You did have to review the CC&Rs.

THE COURT:  But didn't I --

MR. HASKIN:  You -- Judge Leavitt had already

determined this was a limited purpose association, and

that's where your Honor went straight to.

THE COURT:  I understand.  I respect what

you're saying.  But it's my recollection that I

reviewed the CC&Rs in this case as part of my09:47:07
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decision-making process.  Because one of the things I

do is this, and I -- and I just don't rely upon what

other trial judges do.  I'm pretty much an independent

thinker.  And I realize that was the ruling.  But here

we had a case that came up in front of me.  And I

looked.  Yeah, I looked at the case history.  But I

didn't make my decision like a robot, or automaton, or

whatever.  I think.  

And maybe -- it's been a while but counsel can

probably refresh my recollection on this.  But it's my

understanding this wasn't a scenario where we had very

limited discussion in open court.  I think we had

vigorous discussion on these issues.  You can tell me

if I'm wrong on that in my recollection.  I mean, I'm

getting a little older.

MR. HASKIN:  Your Honor, my suggestion wasn't

that you didn't review everything.

THE COURT:  Right.  

MR. HASKIN:  Again, the original CC&Rs, just

the plain reading in paragraph 25, doesn't take into

account your Honor's perspective in your Honor's

analysis of the case.  It looks at what the plaintiffs

were seeking to do.

Were the plaintiffs seeking to enforce the

CC&Rs?  No.  They weren't.09:48:16
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Were the plaintiffs seeking to restrain some

offense to the CC&Rs?  No, they weren't.

They were doing neither of those things, and

it's evidenced by a few things.  One, there is no

reference to any of these things in any of the

operative pleadings from plaintiff.  

The second thing is, in your Honor's order

that you signed granting partial summary judgment, it

reflects a ruling by Judge Leavitt that found that this

was a limbed purpose association.

And your Honor may have reviewed everything.

And I don't discount that one bit.  But the provision,

your Honor, looks simply at the plaintiffs' state of

mind as to what they were trying to do.  What were they

trying to do?  Were they seeking to -- and they

weren't.  They clearly weren't.  This was a quiet title

action, and that's it.  And a slander of title action.

That's it.

THE COURT:  Okay.  Now, my next question is

this.  In light of Judge Leavitt's ruling in this case

where she made the determination as a matter of law

that this was a limited purpose homeowners

association -- and I do remember.  It's just really

coming back to me now because it's my recollection that

the limited purpose specifically focused on the09:49:27
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entryway.  And I think it dealt specifically with

plants and flowers and gardening; right?

MR. HASKIN:  Yes.

THE COURT:  It's coming back to me.  It is.

But here's my point.  In light of her ruling that this

was a limited purpose association, how could a lien or

abstract be filed on the homeowners that were part of

this limited association?  Because this wasn't -- and

we can all agree now.  The law is pretty clear because

Nevada Supreme Court has basically come down in this

matter a couple of times, right, that this was a

limited purpose association.

And when I reviewed the law, and I understand

maybe I was looking at it from an issue preclusion

claim preclusion standpoint.  But nonetheless, if that

determination is made, my next question is this:  How

could there be reasonable grounds for bringing a

lawsuit -- I'm sorry, for filing abstracts on the

individual homeowners' property?  How would that be

reasonable in light of the statutory scheme?

MR. HASKIN:  Well, your Honor, let me refresh

your recollection a little bit more with respect to the

Leavitt ruling, your Honor.

Leavitt granted attorney's fees pursuant to

three things.  One, the original CC&Rs.  But more09:50:52
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importantly, she granted it pursuant to Chapter 116.

And she granted it pursuant to the amended CC&Rs.  And

in her ruling, your Honor, she found a few things.  But

what she, ultimately, found was that for a period

between, I forget, 1997 -- or I'm sorry 2007 and about

2013, for this almost seven-year period of time this

association acted as a full-blown unit association

pursuant to all the provisions of Chapter 116.

And in her ruling she made an equitable

decision, your Honor.  She made an equitable decision

that here you had an homeowners association saying we

are a full-blown homeowners association.

My clients brought suit to make sure this was

a limited purpose association.  Ultimately prevailed.

Judge Leavitt ruled that because you acted as a

full-blown homeowners association during this entire

time, that the plaintiffs in that case, the Lytles,

should be afforded equitable relief of the attorney

fees provision that the association would have been

entitled to had it prevailed in the same case.

It said, Look, had the association prevailed

in this case, it would have been entitled to attorney's

fees pursuant to the amended CC&Rs in Chapter 116.

The Lytles should be afforded that same

relief.  And, your Honor, when we brought -- when we09:52:13
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recorded the abstracts and maintained our defenses in

this case, it was under that same equitable reasoning

that Judge Leavitt applied in the underlying case.

That here you had a Court that awarded my clients

attorney's fees pursuant to the amended CC&Rs in

Chapter 116, but now we're not going to entitle them to

enforce or collect the attorney's fees pursuant to the

same provisions that we awarded the attorney's fees.

That was the question in this case.  And, your Honor, I

recognize --

THE COURT:  Here's my question, though.  And

I'm going to take another step.  Because at the end of

the day it wasn't equitable -- it wasn't an equitable

decision I made regarding --

MR. HASKIN:  It was not, your Honor.

THE COURT:  You know, and so -- and the reason

why I say that is this because I thought.  I was

listening to you.  And I don't -- the only way --

because understand this, and I think the law is really

clear when it comes to the formation of covenants,

conditions, and restrictions as they run with land.

And we all know how that has to be done vis-à-vis the

declarant and so on.  So I don't have to go into that

history.  We know that.

But here's my next question because without09:53:22
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the agreement of all of the homeowners, which could be

an exception, they all could say, Look -- everyone that

owned the property said, Look, we want to be an

association.  We all sign off.  We agree to have those

covenants that run with the land.  And understand,

number one, that didn't happen.  But just as important

too, and I thought this was a very, very important

point I considered, was the fact that the plaintiffs,

Mr. Foley's clients, specifically opted out of the

litigation.  That's my recollection.

And is that correct, Mr. Foley?  Didn't they

opt out?  Didn't they opt out or didn't want to

participate in the litigation?

MR. FOLEY:  They did not support the other

homeowners when they were asked to do so on behalf of

the association.

THE COURT:  Right.

MR. FOLEY:  That's correct.  There really

wasn't an opting in or out of the litigation per se.

THE COURT:  And I realize this isn't Rule

23(a) and (b).  I get that.  Opt in, opt out.

MR. FOLEY:  Right.

THE COURT:  This isn't a class action.  But I

thought some of the testimony was essentially this.

They didn't want to participate in the -- 09:54:26
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MR. FOLEY:  They did not support it.  That's

correct.  

MR. HASKIN:  Your Honor, that's incorrect.

What happened was -- that's absolutely incorrect.  What

happened, your Honor, was they passed around the

amended CC&Rs to all the homeowners after a meeting

they had and asked everybody to sign them.

Ms. Boulden and Ms. Lamothe elected not to

sign.  However, during the underlying litigation and

during depositions of both Ms. Lamothe and Ms. Boulden,

they both ratified the CC&Rs and said during their

depositions they fully supported them.  They had

initial reservation.  That's why they, ultimately,

didn't sign in the first place, but later on they did

sign on to the CC&Rs.

With respect to the litigation, your Honor,

the litigation was never against the individual

homeowners.  And they were never asked to opt in or opt

out.  However, Ms. Boulden and Ms. Lamothe both

voluntarily gave money to the fund to the association

to prosecute claims against the Lytles.

So they were willing participants in this

association.  They took place in it.  They ratified the

actions of the association as a full-blown homeowners

association.  Had Ms. Lamothe and Ms. Boulden refused09:55:29
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to sign on, the amended CC&Rs never would have

happened.  They wouldn't have had enough votes.

THE COURT:  But they didn't sign on; right?

MR. HASKIN:  No.  They ultimately did.  They

ratified it.

MR. FOLEY:  I don't believe that's the case.

MR. HASKIN:  That's absolutely the case.

THE COURT:  I'm talking about Ms. -- the

plaintiff in this case signed off on the CC&Rs?

MR. HASKIN:  Your Honor, during deposition

they said We came around to support the CC&Rs.

THE COURT:  But that's a different issue.  I

mean. 

MR. HASKIN:  No.  It really isn't, your Honor.

THE COURT:  Well, it is.  Well, I mean, I

don't think that's an issue for me to decide today.

MR. HASKIN:  No, it's not.

THE COURT:  But unless they signed the CC&Rs,

every homeowner, it would not convert to a Chapter 116

full-blown homeowners association.  And I feel -- just

like I felt comfortable in my prior decision in this

matter, I feel fairly comfortable that that's what the

law would provide.  They would have to sign off on it.

It would have to be recorded, et cetera, et cetera.

But let's move on from that.  Tell me -- so09:56:23
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you're saying -- you're saying, Look, Judge, at the end

of the day, this case wasn't about the original CC&Rs;

right?  And you're saying, number two, Judge, the acts

in filing the abstracts resulting in the, I guess,

phase three of the litigation was not unreasonable.

MR. HASKIN:  Okay.  So phase three, this being

phase three, your Honor?  I'm sorry.

THE COURT:  Yes.

MR. HASKIN:  Yeah.  I don't think it was

unreasonable.  And I think, your Honor, when you look

at the Frederic and Barbara Rosenberg Trust case that

was recently handed down by the Supreme Court with

respect to this very issue, I think you can draw

parallels.  

In that case the plaintiff was denied summary

judgment.  Ultimately, lost the case fairly early on.

Similar to this case.  And in that case the district --

the Supreme Court actually held that it -- the

plaintiffs in that case didn't have a, you know, very

good basis for maintaining the action, but the Court --

Supreme Court recognized the fact that what they were

trying to do was they were trying to look into Nevada

law and possibly expand Nevada law with respect to the

legal issues that were involved in that case.  And so

it would recognize that.  I think there are parallels09:57:37
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to that, your Honor, in this case.

Your Honor, I'm around Chapter 116 all the

time because our firm does a lot of homeowners

association law.  It is a very -- with all due respect

to the legislature, it's a very poorly drafted statute.

And there are holes in that statute all over the place.

For instance, we brought another action in

NRED, referred to in this case as NRED Three, where we

asked the Court to enforce an election because the

homeowners association had not maintained an election,

I think, in over five or six years.  In that case

Chapter 116 requires a limited purpose association have

a board, but it doesn't have any provisions with

respect to the election of that board.

So you have to have one, but you can't

theoretically elect one.  So we brought an action

under -- we brought an action before the district

court.  And the district court, ultimately, looked to

other statutes and found that an election had to be had

and ordered an election to take place.  It did so

outside of Chapter 116.  In essence, it fashioned a

statutory remedy after -- out of several different

statutes recognizing the hole in Chapter 116.  

There's other holes.  For instance, you have

to have a reserve budget, but you can't legally assess09:58:47

 109:57:39

 2

 3

 4

 509:57:49

 6

 7

 8

 9

1009:58:04

11

12

13

14

1509:58:18

16

17

18

19

2009:58:33

21

22

23

24

25

000804

000804

00
08

04
000804



    32

Peggy Isom, CCR 541, RMR

(702)671-4402 - CROERT48@GMAIL.COM

Pursuant to NRS 239.053, illegal to copy without payment.

    MAY 16, 2019        BOULDEN TRUST V LYTLE TRUST

anybody fees as a limited purpose association because

there's no assessment provision.  But somehow you're

supposed to get money for reserves.  There are holes

all over the place in the statute.  And really what

our -- what our defense in this action was based on was

that.  

And number two was the fact that Judge Leavitt

in her prior ruling, and also Judge Bare in his prior

ruling, recognized that the homeowners association had

acted as a full-blown homeowners association for about

six years, over six years, and had awarded the Lytles

fees pursuant to the amended CC&Rs and Chapter 116,

which theoretically were not applicable because they

are now a limited purpose association.  And the Lytles

were merely trying to seek out the remedies afforded

under those same -- that same statute and the same

amended CC&Rs and enforcing the judgment it had been

granted.  That, ultimately, was the defense.  I don't

think that's unreasonable.  It's certainly not brought

to harass or annoy.

THE COURT:  Well, you notice I didn't discuss

that.

MR. HASKIN:  Excuse me?

THE COURT:  I didn't discuss that.

MR. HASKIN:  I understand, your Honor.09:59:54
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THE COURT:  I didn't discuss that.

MR. HASKIN:  Yeah.  I think your Honor's focus

is on reasonableness.  And I think there were

reasonable grounds to do that.  And that's -- that's

really -- was the focus of the case.  

And, your Honor, I think in the initial

hearing, if I could take your Honor back to the first

hearing we ever had in this action was for a

preliminary injunction brought by Boulden and Lamothe.

And at that hearing, that hearing was briefed.  They

submitted briefs.  We submitted briefs.  We came before

your Honor.

And your Honor recognized that this was a

complex issue.  So much so that the preliminary

injunction motion was withdrawn by plaintiffs' counsel,

and a summary judgment was put on -- put into calendar

some -- later because your Honor wanted additional and

further and more substantial briefing on the matter.

Your Honor took a look at the briefing on the

preliminary injunction and said, you know what, this is

an interesting issue.  Reading the briefs I have before

me I don't know which way to go.  I want more briefing

on the subject.

And, your Honor, we sat here and I think had

oral argument for over an hour and a half on the issue.10:00:55
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I don't think if the position were so unreasonable, if

the Lytle Trust was so out of their gourde, I don't

think, your Honor, would have made such a comment that

this was an interesting issue and it required

substantial briefing.  And that's exactly what we did.

THE COURT:  Well, there's a lot of reasons I

do that.  And the reason for it is, first and foremost,

I realize the importance of having a significant record

in making a decision.  Because at the end of the day

what guides me is this:  I want to be on the right

side.  That's really what it comes down to.  So I make

sure that we have a significant record.

So what do I do with this?  And this is out of

the decision by the Nevada Supreme Court.  And this on

page 2 of the order of affirmance that came down dated

December 4, 2018.  And this is what our Nevada Supreme

Court said.  And this is, I think, five lines down on

page 2.  It said:  

The district court granted summary judgment

in favor of the Lytles finding that:  The

original CC&Rs did not form a homeowners

association under Chapter 116, but a limited

purpose association.

And so understand this, I can't look back

because this case was on appeal.  The decision didn't10:02:23
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come down in 2008.  But it seems to me the Nevada

Supreme Court recognized that when I made my decision

in this case that the first thing I did was this:  I

made a determination.  And they say it right here.  

Finding that the original CC&Rs did not

form a limited purpose association under

Chapter 116.

So I would think just based upon that language

alone, paragraph 25 of the CC&Rs as it relates to

attorney's fees would control ultimately my decision.

Now, if you disagree with that, that's okay.

But I always like to put my analysis on -- what I'm

thinking about on the record because it always serves

me very well, I think.

So what do I do with that?

MR. HASKIN:  I think, your Honor -- I think

you go back to the fact -- your Honor, you and I just

may butt heads on this, but again --

THE COURT:  It's not the first time.

MR. HASKIN:  No.

THE COURT:  That's okay.

MR. HASKIN:  There will be more.

Paragraph 25, your Honor, looks at the

standpoint from the claimant.  What were they seeking

to do?  Were they seeking to enforce?  And I really10:03:32
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think, your Honor, it comes down to this.  And I

understand the analysis by Leavitt and our defenses.

But what your Honor is really talking about are

defenses in this case.

That's what -- that's what your analysis

focused on.  Your Honor, when they came to you, they

said they have no right to record an abstract of

judgment on this property.  We're seeking to quiet

title.  We're seeking declaratory relief.

THE COURT:  Why did they have no right?

MR. HASKIN:  But, your Honor, here's the

point.

THE COURT:  Why?

MR. HASKIN:  The paragraph 25 looks at their

subjective intent.  It doesn't look at mine.

THE COURT:  I don't --

MR. HASKIN:  It's an action to --

THE COURT:  I don't -- but here's the thing.

I don't think paragraph 25 looks at any intent.

Because this is what it says.  It says:  

In any legal or equitable proceeding for

the enforcement of or to restrain violation of

the declarations of covenants, conditions, and

restrictions or any provision thereof.

And this is what I quoted when Mr. Foley was10:04:38
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up here.

The losing party or parties shall pay in

such an amount as they may -- as may be fixed

by the Court in such proceeding.

And so it says if you lose, the Court is going

to pay attorney's fees.  

MR. HASKIN:  Your Honor, two things.  One, I

hadn't got to the losing provision.  But I haven't

forgot it.  I got my notes.

THE COURT:  You got to come back to that.  

MR. HASKIN:  But we'll come back to that.  But

let me start with the first part.  Okay.  In an 

action ...  Who's action is this?  Theirs.  They

brought it.  They sought it.

THE COURT:  But it doesn't say that, though.

MR. HASKIN:  It's in any --

THE COURT:  It says in any -- in any legal or

equitable proceeding.

MR. HASKIN:  Correct.

THE COURT:  That's what it says.

MR. HASKIN:  Seeking to enforce.  Were they

seeking to enforce the original CC&Rs or amended CC&Rs?

THE COURT:  Well, actually --

MR. HASKIN:  No.

THE COURT:  No, no, no, no.  It says more than10:05:25
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that.  It says to enforce or restrain.  Right?

MR. HASKIN:  Correct.

THE COURT:  And so that -- to me that covers

everything as far as -- you could enforce the CC&Rs or

you can restrain somebody under the CC&Rs.  What they

were doing here was essentially this, they were

restraining your client from filing the abstract

because they had no right pursuant to the CC&Rs to do

such a thing.  Because this was a limited purpose

homeowners association, it wasn't a full-blown

homeowners association, there was no right to do it.

MR. HASKIN:  Your Honor, we were seeking to

enforce a judgment.  That's what they were seeking to

stop -- that's what they were seeking to restrain.

Your Honor, and to play a dangerous game of

hypotheticals, or ask an opposing question to the

judge.  How would you reconciled that with the McKnight

case which provided that in a quiet title action it has

nothing to do with the enforcement of the CC&Rs?

That's what the -- this really comes down to that.  

They filed declaratory relief and quiet title.

Had I brought -- had I brought a motion to dismiss

based on Chapter 38, that would have been denied

because your Honor would have correctly found that

under McKnight it has nothing to do with the CC&Rs.10:06:36
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They have a right to quiet title -- quiet titles of

their property.  That has nothing to do with the CC&Rs.

THE COURT:  But once again, is a quiet title

action -- does it come under any legal or equitable

proceeding for the enforcement of or to restrain

violation of the CC&Rs.  And that's really what it -- I

mean, that's a fairly broad provision.  That's why I

brought it up, first and foremost, to Mr. Foley without

even going to the Chapter 118, which has a different

condition.  I get that.

Because remember Chapter 118 does two things.

It says by contract.  Here we have a contract that runs

with the land.  Or you can look at other factors.  And

so it seems to me we have a very broad attorneys fee

provision here.  I mean, it really is.  And it runs

with the land.  And it controls, I think, the award of

attorney's fees and costs in this case.

And I'm trying to figure out why what's in

front of me today would not fit under paragraph 28 of

the original CC&Rs or declarations of covenants,

conditions, and restrictions that were filed at the

time of declaration back in -- back on the 4th of

January, 1994.  That's what I'm trying to figure out.

MR. HASKIN:  Your Honor, your Honor.  I think

your Honor has already figured it out.  I think it's10:08:16
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just a point of disagreement at this point.

THE COURT:  I understand.  

MR. HASKIN:  Yeah. 

THE COURT:  But that's okay.

MR. HASKIN:  Yeah, I. -- your Honor, our

position remains unchanged.  Their action doesn't even

mention the original CC&Rs.  Never does.  It never --

it -- declaratory relief action has nothing to do with

the CC&Rs.  The quiet title, nothing.  

They merely say this is a limited purpose

association, and that's it.  And they have no right to

enforce an abstract of judgment against our property.

Your Honor, with respect to the second part of

it, the losing party, I think there is an important

aspect of that.  I think that this action, ultimately,

the parties stipulated to dismiss.  If your Honor

recalls --

THE COURT:  No.  I understand that's a

different issue.

MR. HASKIN:  And I'm traversing to the next

issue.

THE COURT:  Yeah.

MR. HASKIN:  Because I think we've beaten the

one previously to death.  I think with respect to the

losing party, your Honor, they brought an action for10:09:09
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two things.  Well, three things.  Declaratory relief

and quiet title, which really can be combined together.

The third one was slander of title.  

Your Honor recalls he -- you initially granted

summary judgment, and I think in what was a scrivener's

error, granted summary judgment as to all causes of

action.  We brought a motion to reconsider.  Your Honor

granted our motion to reconsider and made summary

judgment a partial summary judgment only as to the

quiet title cause of action leaving the slander of

title open in this matter.

The slander of title, we feel, the Lytle Trust

feels would have been defeated at trial.  But once the

Supreme Court decision came down, your Honor, affirming

your prior decision on partial summary judgment with

respect to the quiet title action, your Honor, we were

left in a posture to try a slander of title claim which

I think we would have prevailed on.  However, it would

have been, quite frankly, a waste of judicial

resources.  And they were willing to dismiss the claim

in exchange for us dismissing our counterclaim which

really had been effectively dealt with once the Supreme

Court handed down its decision.

We, ultimately -- all the parties stipulated

to dismiss the case, and on pretty much the eve of10:10:28
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trial.  I think it was about a month before trial,

which I think was, ultimately, the right decision.

However, does that leave us a losing party in

this action?  And, hypothetically speaking, had we

pursued this matter to trial and had we prevailed on a

slander of title cause of action, which I think, quite

frankly, we would have because there was never a

development of any facts through discovery as to

slander of title, I think, quite frankly, the

plaintiffs would have to admit they really, in theory,

abandoned that claim long before, we would have

prevailed on the slander of title cause of action.  

Then, your Honor, would have been posed with a

question they won on their quiet title but lost on

their slander of title, how do I address this matter.

Does that make us, your Honor, the Lytle Trust, a

losing party in this case because we stipulated to

dismiss the case at the point in which we did?  I don't

think your Honor can determine we were losing party in

this action any more than your Honor can determine they

were a prevailing party under law in this action.  I

don't think they are.  I think the Court's

recognized --

THE COURT:  But why can't I?  And the reason

for it is this is a fairly simple concept.  Say,10:11:36
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hypothetically, I have a tort-based case that goes to

trial.  Plaintiff prevails on the negligence claim but

not on the intentional tort claim.  At the end of the

day wouldn't the plaintiff -- and they're awarded a

half a million dollars.  Yeah, they don't get punitive

damages in the intentional torts.  Wouldn't they be the

prevailing party for the purposes of litigation?

Because you don't have to prevail on all

claims; right?  We can all agree.  But if you prevail

on a significant claim that -- and I think the quiet

title is probably one of the most significant claims in

this case, why wouldn't I consider that in ultimately

making my decision?  

Because it's not uncommon in jury trials where

plaintiffs prevail on one, two, or three claims for

relief, and they don't prevail on them all.  It happens

all the time.

MR. HASKIN:  There's a distinction to be made,

your Honor.  And in those claims and specifically the

one you just mentioned that you're looking at now,

there are other grounds for monetary awards.  In other

words, you can prevail on negligence and not prevail on

your punitive damages award and still be awarded

monetary -- in fact, significant monetary damages.  In

this case, there were no monetary damages afforded to10:12:47
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plaintiffs at all with respect to the quiet title or

declaratory relief cause of action.  Whereas, the

slander of title carried both monetary damages and

punitive damages.

THE COURT:  But, I mean, ultimately, didn't

the quiet title action result in the expungement of a

significant abstract lien on the property.  Because

what was the amount of that lien?

MR. HASKIN:  Your Honor, I forget the exact

amount.  I think it was a few hundred thousand dollars.

THE COURT:  That's a lot of money.

MR. HASKIN:  There's no question.

THE COURT:  Right?

MR. HASKIN:  That is a lot of money.  And I

understand your Honor's point that it resulted in the

release of an abstract of judgment.  But, again, an

abstract of judgment is not money, your Honor.  It's a

claim or a lien on property.

And, your Honor, with respect to, again, a --

THE COURT:  That would be a significant

benefit, though, we can all agree, right, to have the

abstract of judgment released.  That would be a

tremendous benefit, I would think, to a homeowner.

MR. HASKIN:  I would agree, your Honor.

Your Honor, with respect to some of the other10:13:53
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issues involved here, I think, your Honor, counsel

brought you the lis pendens matter.  We did admittedly

record a lis pendens.  Lis pendens is different from an

abstract of judgment.  It's not a lien on property.

It's not an effective abstract of judgment.  It's not

even a claim on title.  It's notice of pendency of an

action, your Honor.

And that resulted because under NRS 116, I

think it's 3109, there's a requirement that a homeowner

advise a potential buyer of property of any lawsuit

involving either the association or the property.

Plaintiff's counsel, we asked -- we reached out to him

and asked him for some assurances that he would inform

potential buyers of a lawsuit.  He declined that

request, so we recorded a lis pendens.  

The lis pendens was, ultimately, released

pursuant to your Honor's ruling.  However, they asked

for attorney's fees in that motion for lis pendens.

Your Honor denied them, and didn't believe that the lis

pendens were recorded in bad faith.  I think, frankly,

the lis pendens may have prevented the ultimate sale on

the property to the Dismans.  

The Dismans came into this action as a result

of them being subsequent purchasers of the property.

And had a lis pendens been recorded, I think they may10:15:12
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not have purchased the property, but they wouldn't have

filed a counterclaim against Boulden for not informing

them of the lawsuit in the first place.

And that was, of course, our purpose in

recording the lis pendens was to inform subsequent

purchasers of the property that there was an action

involving that property.

And with respect to any other issues, your

Honor, I'll take questions, but rely on the briefing.  

I would -- one more thing, your Honor, with

respect to the fees, we actually did not dispute

duplicative fees.  That wasn't a ground for anything.

We parsed out fees for the appeal.  We don't believe

those can be included.  They total $11,240 for the

appeal.

They, Boulden and Lamothe, brought an initial

motion for attorney's fees, if your Honor may recall

which was, I think, withdrawn because it was about to

be denied.  That was $6,080.

We also had to bring the motion to reconsider

due to the fact that there was this error in the award,

or the order granting summary judgment that plaintiffs

drafted that we objected to.  And that motion to

reconsider their opposition totaled $4,480.  Those were

our points with respect to the attorney's fees, your10:16:33
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Honor.  We had -- we were able to decipher his split

fees between the parties.

THE COURT:  Okay, sir.  Thank you.

Mr. Foley.

MR. FOLEY:  Your Honor, just a couple quick

points.  This argument that the amended complaint or

the complaint that we filed didn't have anything to do

with the CC&Rs is just false.

If you look at our amended complaint that was

filed on March 10th, 2017, in allegations No. 6 through

11, it recites that there was the original CC&Rs that

controlled this property that was recorded in 1994; 

That pursuant to those CC&Rs this was a

limited purpose association under 116.1201; 

That it had been judicially declared already

by Judge Leavitt to be a limited purpose association; 

And that under 116.1201 subsection .3117,

whereby a judgment can be recorded against the

individual lots does not apply.

That's the entire basis of the complaint.  All

of those allegations are repeated before each cause of

action, and it's the basis for the slander of title

cause of action, the injunction, the quiet title and

the declaratory relief cause of action.

So even though it's not asking for declaratory10:18:20
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relief regarding a particular provision of the CC&Rs,

the declaratory relief that we're asking for is based

entirely on the CC&Rs that prevents them from recording

these abstracts of judgment.

Similarly, I mentioned this briefly in my

opening, it was the Lytles who in their countermotion

for summary judgment that they filed, that argued that

pursuant to the original CC&Rs, a lien or judgment

against the association established under the original

CC&Rs attaches to each lot.  So their defense was based

on the original CC&Rs.  Our cause of action was based

on the original CC&Rs.

As far as this dismissal or the preliminary

injunction that we filed, your Honor, what had happened

in that hearing, I started out the hearing.  I remember

telling the Court I talked to the title officer before

the hearing and said if I get a preliminary injunction

striking these abstracts of judgment will that suffice?

Will you give a title policy?  They said no.  It's

interim relief.

So I told the Court there's no really sense in

going forward with this.  Let me reconstruct this

motion for preliminary injunction and put it in the

form of a motion for summary judgment so we can get on

our way to a final relief that will do some good with10:20:02
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the title company.  That was the reason that that was

modified.

As far as dismissing the slander of title

action, as we said, there was only Mrs. -- the Bouldens

that had the slander of title cause.  They -- once

summary judgment was granted, they were able to sell

the property to the Dismans.

I think there was about a $10,000 difference

between the sales price that they originally had with

the prior buyers that went away, so we were facing the

prospect of going to trial for $10,000.  It was on that

basis that we simply dismissed that cause of action

once the Supreme Court had ruled.

There's, you know, there's never any

evaluation or even discussion between counsel and I as

to the merits of that case.  No discovery was done on

that because we didn't do discovery while the case was

up on appeal.  So this idea that somehow they became a

prevailing party because we dismissed the slander of

title cause of action that is at best disingenuous,

your Honor.

That's all I have.

THE COURT:  Okay.  And we have one other

matter; is that right?

MS. WANG:  Yes.  That's correct, your Honor.10:21:13

 110:20:06

 2

 3

 4

 510:20:19

 6

 7

 8

 9

1010:20:33

11

12

13

14

1510:20:49

16

17

18

19

2010:21:04

21

22

23

24

25

000822

000822

00
08

22
000822



    50

Peggy Isom, CCR 541, RMR

(702)671-4402 - CROERT48@GMAIL.COM

Pursuant to NRS 239.053, illegal to copy without payment.

    MAY 16, 2019        BOULDEN TRUST V LYTLE TRUST

THE COURT:  Okay.

MS. WANG:  I'll keep this brief because both

counsel have addressed extensively the issue raised in

my motion for attorney's fees on behalf of the Dismans.

We also seek attorney's fees on the basis of the

original CC&Rs as well as NRS 18.010 subsection 2.  So

the remarks I want to make are that there was

absolutely no reason that the Lytles should have

recorded the abstracts of judgment in the first place

based upon Judge Leavitt's decision in 2013.

That prompted a course of action by the

plaintiffs in this case which, ultimately, resulted in

this Court granting summary judgment in favor of

plaintiffs stating that based upon Judge Leavitt's

decision, the Lytles wrongfully encumbered the

property, what is now my client's property, without

abstracts of judgment.  But the Lytles didn't stop

there.

The Court granted summary judgment in April of

2017 finding that based upon not only Judge Leavitt's

decision but the Court's analysis of the CC&Rs, that

this was a limited purpose association.  That the

recording of the abstracts were wrongful, and the Court

order that the abstracts be expunged from the record.

Thereafter, the Lytles appealed the Court's10:23:00
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decision in May of 2017.

In August of 2017, the property sold to my

clients, the Dismans.

After that, on August 17, 2017, the Lytles

brought my clients into the litigation through the

filing of a counterclaim which was -- actually should

have been asserted as a third-party complaint because

my clients had been previously uninvolved in the

litigation.

This time, not only did they assert in their

counterclaim that they -- they -- that the Court

declared that they had a right to record the abstracts

of judgment in the Rosemere 1 litigation against my

client's property, but that they also had a right to

record additional abstracts of judgment with respect to

a judgment they obtained on what we call the Rosemere 2

litigation.

Nothing had changed.  The Court had already

rendered a decision that the Lytles could not do what

they were purporting to do, that they could not rely

upon the provision of NRS Chapter 116 that they sought

to rely on in recording the abstracts of judgment.

Nevertheless, they continued with their course

of action, their wrongful course of action not only

against the plaintiffs in this case, but drug my10:24:27
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clients in.  At that time there was no need to expand

the scope of the litigation.  If they disagree with the

Court's decision, they -- you know, they had already

appealed it to the Nevada Supreme Court.  The correct

course of conduct at that point was to await a

determination by the Nevada Supreme Court and further

direction.

But to go against what the Court had already

decided, and then expand the scope of the litigation

unnecessarily by bringing my clients in on an issue

that had already been adjudicated was absolutely

unreasonable.

And in this case, they argue that we were not

the prevailing parties because Judge Bayliss, when he

took up the issue of my motion for summary judgment,

you know, this was a quirky procedural -- the order

that resulted from Judge Bayliss's decision was

interesting in that it granted the relief that we

sought in the motion for summary judgment, but denied

the motion as being moot saying that the Court had

already decided in our favor.

So the Nevada Supreme Court has stated that --

has qualified a prevailing party as a party that

succeeds on any significant issue in litigation which

achieves some of the benefit is sought to -- and bring10:25:59
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a lawsuit.  And they also say prevailing party, the

term is a broad one encompassing plaintiffs,

counter-claimants, defendants, et cetera.

So we absolutely had to file a motion for

summary judgment in order to defend my client's

position in the case.  And the Court did determine that

they were not entitled to be doing what they were

seeking to do in their counterclaim, but did it in the

way that stated that the issue had already been mooted

because your Honor had already decided in April of 2015

on the issue that this was a limited purpose

association.  And that they were not permitted to

record those abstracts of judgment.

So the Court piggybacked off of this Court's

decision as the case -- as the law of the case saying

that the decision had already -- well, I respectfully,

your Honor, disagree that the way that Judge Bayliss

approached his decision because the counterclaim was

brought after your Honor's decision.  If your Honor's

decision had -- I mean, at that time, I believe that

Judge Bayliss was a little confused as to the timing of

everything.  But that being said, nevertheless, he

determined that your Honor's prior decision controlled

the subsequent counterclaim, which begs the question of

why did they even bring the counterclaim?10:27:28
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Judge Bayliss's decision was specific in that regard,

was that your Honor had already rendered a decision

which mooted their claims against my clients.  

Again, I want to emphasize the point what was

the reason for bringing the action against my clients?

I say, at best, they did so without reasonable grounds.

At worse, they did so to harass.  I know that those are

two separate grounds that the Court can use to analyze

a proper award of attorney's fees.  But in this case,

your Honor, I believe, that not only did they not have

reasonable grounds for what they did, but the timing of

what they did was -- appeared punitive in nature.

As far as whether or not the original CC&Rs

control, if -- on -- whether the Court can award

attorney's fees I submit that the -- this action was

absolutely about either the enforcement of or an effort

to restrain the violation of the original CC&Rs.

The Lytles commenced this -- the initial

action called Rosemere 1 in 2007 to enforce the terms

of the original CC&Rs.  They obtained a decision from

Judge Leavitt enforcing the original terms of the CC&Rs

and finding that this was a limited purpose

association.

Thereafter, they decided to glob on to

provisions of NRS 116 that they felt beneficial to10:29:19
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their current position.  And they, in effect, went

against Judge Leavitt's initial determination prompting

plaintiffs in this case to seek their -- to restrain

them from violating the original CC&Rs and

Judge Leavitt's decision with respect to her findings.

So, yes, that forced this Court to again

revisit the issue of the nature of this association as

provided by the original CC&Rs.  So, yes, the original

CC&Rs controlled the entirety of this litigation as

well as all of the previous litigations that have been

brought in up to this point.

So, with that, I would submit this on my

briefs, your Honor.  Thank you.

THE COURT:  Thank you, ma'am.

Sir.

MR. HASKIN:  Your Honor, I'll choose to

incorporate my arguments prior to this one and just

address some of the points brought by Ms. Wang.

Your Honor, with respect to adding the Dismans

they -- again, taking us back.  They were a necessary

party.  So we filed the actions, and your Honor granted

the motion for partial summary judgment.  That

ultimately was appealed.  The house was then sold to

the Dismans.

The Dismans were brought into the case.  And10:30:45
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let's play out the hypothetical, your Honor.  Let's say

we had prevailed before the Nevada Supreme Court, and

the Nevada Supreme Court came back and said the

abstracts are, indeed, enforceable against this

property.  Ms. Boulden did not own the property after

she sold it.  The Dismans did.  The Dismans needed to

be added.  

And with respect to the ongoing case, your

Honor, we had several conversations with the Dismans

leading up to their motion for summary judgment.  And

during those conversations, Ms. Wang called me, said,

Hey, I'm going to file a motion for summary judgment.

And we met and conferred.  And in the meet and confer,

I said the motion is moot.  I said Judge Williams had

already made a determination.  Don't file the motion

for summary judgment.  There's no point.  And,

ultimately, Judge Bayliss correctly agreed.  

He said, Look, this motion for summary

judgment is moot.  Judge Williams had already made a

determination.  And that was -- that was the order of

the Court as we expected it to be, and that was the

thrust of our opposition.  That it didn't -- that they

were brought because they were subsequent owners of the

property.

And if you are a subsequent purchaser of a10:31:52
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property that is involved in litigation, whether there

is an abstract, or lis pendens, or anything, you're

going to be added to that litigation.  You have to.

The owner -- the owner of title has to be

involved in the property or in the litigation in order

to be affected by the outcome of that litigation.

That's why they were added.  They weren't added to

harass, or annoy, or without reasonable grounds.

Ultimately, we did not prevail, and the Dismans were

dismissed from the case.  And it really is as simple as

that from our perspective.

The Dismans chose to file the motion for

summary judgment despite our urging not to.  Our urging

was correct.  That motion cost them $11,894 in fees.

We feel those are unreasonable and should not be

awarded to the extent your Honor is going to award

fees.

The Dismans, like the Boulden and Lamothe

parties included their appeal work which was $5,286.

That should not be included in any fee award.  There is

also an additional $4,000 with respect to a motion they

filed to continue the trial in this matter because they

delayed at the outset of this litigation.  As is

explained in our brief.  

Your Honor, we'll adopt the other arguments10:33:07
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that we made with respect to Boulden and Lamothe for

the rest.  I'll spare the Court's time.  Thank you.

THE COURT:  Thank you, sir.  

Anything else, ma'am?

MS. WANG:  Yes, your Honor.  I'm glad that

counsel brought up the issue of the meet and confer

that we had before I brought my motion for summary

judgment.  I reached out to counsel before filing the

motion for summary judgment.  And that was after the

Court, Judge Bayliss, had already granted summary

judgment in favor of the consolidated case plaintiffs.

And I said based upon Judge Bayliss's

decision, the Court is following, your Honor,

Department 16's original decision saying that the

recording of the abstracts of judgment were wrongful.

Can we agree through a stipulation that your Honor's

decision as well as Judge Bayliss's decision granting

summary judgment controls in this case so as to avoid

me having to bring a motion for summary judgment?  That

was me reaching out to the Lytles' counsel offering to

forego having to bring the motion for summary judgment

and the expenses and the hearing and all of the things

associated therewith.

Mr. Haskin never responded to me in my

proposal.  If the Court -- if this is an issue that is10:34:50
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going to impact the Court's decision, Mr. Haskin's

representation with respect to our meet and confer, I

will submit, your Honor, that I would -- I would -- I

ask permission of leave of court to submit all the

correspondences in which I sought Mr. Haskin's approval

that we enter into a stipulation simply saying that

your Honor's decision as well as Judge Bayliss's

decision saying that your Honor's decision is the law

of the case applies with equal force and measure to my

clients as far as the counterclaim is concerned so as

to obviate the need for me to spend additional of my

client's money in having to bring a motion for summary

judgment.  When Mr. Haskin never got back to me, that

is when I filed my motion for summary judgment, your

Honor.

So it's utterly disingenuous to say that we --

we didn't have any need to even file the motion.  At

that time there was a pending counterclaim against my

clients, and we were on the eve of trial.  So, yes, we

had -- I had to protect my clients' position by

bringing the motion for summary judgment even though I

agree wholeheartedly there was no reason for us to have

even had to do that.  

There was absolutely no reason also for them

to have brought my clients into this case in the first10:36:16
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place.  They say that they did so because my clients

were indispensable parties.  Again, that's disingenuous

on the basis that by the time that they brought my

clients into this case, they had already appealed your

Honor's decision to the Nevada Supreme Court.  They

brought my clients into that by doing a motion with the

Nevada Supreme Court to add them as necessary parties.

I consented to the addition.

We participated in the appeal.  So to start a

new case with respect to another judgment that they had

obtained against the HOA was absolutely unnecessary.

And they should have abided by this Court's decision at

the time and waited on the Nevada Supreme Court if they

felt that further instruction was necessary.

But to, again, expand the scope of the

litigation unnecessarily and then blame us for

expending the necessary attorney's fees and costs to

defend against this brand-new litigation, I think the

argument, frankly, is absurd.

All of the money that was spent in defending

the Dismans were reasonable and necessary in the course

of a two-year litigation, again, that should have never

been brought in the first place.

Thank you, your Honor.

THE COURT:  Okay, ma'am.  And thank you.10:37:37
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I just have a couple of comments, and I think

it's important to really point this out.

Number one, in this case I granted summary

judgment, and it was reviewed by the Nevada Supreme

Court.  And prior to -- I remember when this case first

came to me.  And there's no doubt I thought it was

quite interesting.  But I wanted to make sure that a

full record was developed prior to granting any summary

judgment motion.

Secondly, I think it's important to point out

that when I look at summary judgment motions, I'm very

cautious.  I always want to make sure we have a

complete record.  I want to take any issues regarding

the procedural potential problems in the case off the

record, or I want to take them out of play.

And so under very limited circumstances, and I

don't mind saying this, I do grant summary judgment

motions, but I only do under a circumstance where I

have a high degree of confidence; right?  And so, yes,

this wasn't routine.  This isn't something I saw every

day.

For example, I have a tort-based case in front

of me.  There is a lot of issues that are so routine to

me, sometimes I feel I don't even have to review the

briefing.  But in this case I had to dig a little deep.10:38:46
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But once I got a handle and got my arms around the law,

I thought it was fairly straightforward; right?  

We had a limited purpose association, and as a

result, there's limited statutory rights under Nevada

law.  And that, ultimately, guided my decision.

I think it's important to point out too that

the application of the CC&Rs and Chapter 116 in this

case are not mutually exclusive.  In fact, I have to

conduct -- first before I make a determination as to

the application of the CC&Rs -- I mean, the application

of Chapter 116, I got to look at the CC&Rs.  I really

and truly do.  And any case involving Chapter 116 I am

mandated or required for the most part reviewing the

CC&Rs.  And that's important to point out.

Additionally, the thrust, focus, and essence

of all this litigation stemmed from the original CC&Rs,

I mean, they did, and going back to Judge Leavitt and

her determination, what I did, the comments by the

Nevada Supreme Court, and the affirmance.  And so what

I'm going to do is this.  There's two things.

Number one, I feel fairly clear in this regard

that paragraph 25 of the CC&Rs control, and

specifically as it relate to the award of attorney's

fees.  And I've read it in the record, but I'll just do

it one more time.  It provides as follows:10:40:23
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In any legal or equitable proceeding for

the enforcement of or to restrain the

violations of the declaration of covenants,

conditions, and restrictions, or any provision

thereof, the losing party or parties shall pay

in such amounts as may be fixed by the Court in

such proceeding.

And this is a continuation of such presenting.

I'm going to rule as a matter of law that

based upon the current posture of the case and the

decisions by this Court, that the -- I just want to

make sure I get the proper parties here.  That the

Dismans -- and let me make sure I got it -- and the

plaintiff Marjorie Boulden B. -- I'm sorry, Marjorie B.

Boulden, Trustee of the Marjorie B. Boulden Trust,

they're the prevailing -- not the prevailing party.

They're the winners under the statute.

MR. FOLEY:  And the Lamothe Trust.

THE COURT:  Yes.  Absolutely.  And I want to

make sure I get them all.

And based upon my application of the CC&Rs,

because the losing party --

-- sorry, sir, would be your clients.  I just

want to tell you that.

And just as important, the language says shall10:42:13

 110:40:26

 2

 3

 4

 510:40:41

 6

 7

 8

 9

1010:40:58

11

12

13

14

1510:41:47

16

17

18

19

2010:42:00

21

22

23

24

25

000836

000836

00
08

36
000836



    64

Peggy Isom, CCR 541, RMR

(702)671-4402 - CROERT48@GMAIL.COM

Pursuant to NRS 239.053, illegal to copy without payment.

    MAY 16, 2019        BOULDEN TRUST V LYTLE TRUST

pay; right.  Mandatory.  I don't have to conduct an

analysis as it relates to whether the lawsuit was filed

to harass, and the like, or I don't have to make a

determination as to whether the actions were

unreasonable.  I don't have to go there.  So that's

going to be the basis for the award of attorney's fees.

Secondly, what I'm going to do is this:  I'm

going to go back and just perform a routine review of

the amounts and just as important, any award of

attorney's fees will be based upon the application of

Nevada law as it relates to that specific issue.  And

it will -- I will look at the reputation of the law

firm and all those things that I am required to do

under Nevada law.

What's the name of the case, again, counsel?

I can't think of it.

MR. HASKIN:  Brunzell?

THE COURT:  I'm going to apply the Brunzell

factors and look at the hours.  And that's important to

place on the record.

Last, but not least, I haven't made a

determination as to -- I'm not going to say this was

vexatious or anything like that, sir.  I don't mind

telling you.  

I haven't made a determination as to whether10:43:37
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the actions were unreasonable.  I'll think about it.

I'm not sure I'm going to go that far.  Do you

understand, sir, what I'm saying?

MR. HASKIN:  Yes, I do.

THE COURT:  I just want to tell you that.  But

I'm going to look at it one last time.

Does that cover everything?

MS. WANG:  Yes, your Honor.  

THE COURT CLERK:  Motion to retax.  

MR. FOLEY:  Well, there's the costs.

THE COURT:  What about the motion to retax?

What about the cost issue?  The costs were $1400.  

MR. HASKIN:  $1100, I think.

THE COURT:  $1100.  Any issue on that?

MR. HASKIN:  Well, your Honor, the Dismans

didn't even file a memorandum of costs.  

THE COURT:  Okay. 

MS. WANG:  We didn't seek costs.  Our motion

is just for attorney's fees.

THE COURT:  Okay.  So all I have to do -- I'll

give you your $1400.

MS. WANG:  Thank you.

THE COURT:  Anything else?

MR. HASKIN:  No, your Honor.

MR. FOLEY:  That's it, your Honor.  Thank you.10:44:16
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THE COURT:  Everyone, enjoy your day.

MS. WANG:  Thank you, your Honor.

(Proceedings were concluded.)

* * * * * * * * 
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REPORTER'S CERTIFICATE 

STATE OF NEVADA) 
                :SS 
COUNTY OF CLARK) 

I, PEGGY ISOM, CERTIFIED SHORTHAND REPORTER DO

HEREBY CERTIFY THAT I TOOK DOWN IN STENOTYPE ALL OF THE

PROCEEDINGS HAD IN THE BEFORE-ENTITLED MATTER AT THE

TIME AND PLACE INDICATED, AND THAT THEREAFTER SAID

STENOTYPE NOTES WERE TRANSCRIBED INTO TYPEWRITING AT

AND UNDER MY DIRECTION AND SUPERVISION AND THE

FOREGOING TRANSCRIPT CONSTITUTES A FULL, TRUE AND

ACCURATE RECORD TO THE BEST OF MY ABILITY OF THE

PROCEEDINGS HAD.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I HAVE HEREUNTO SUBSCRIBED

MY NAME IN MY OFFICE IN THE COUNTY OF CLARK, STATE OF

NEVADA.

                           

 

                          /s/ Peggy Isom        
                          PEGGY ISOM, RMR, CCR 541 
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